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The following documentation is an electronically-
submitted vendor response to an advertised
solicitation from the West Virginia Purchasing
Bulletin within the Vendor Self-Service portal at
wvOASIS.gov. As part of the State of West
Virginia’s procurement process, and to maintain the
transparency of the bid-opening process, this
documentation submitted online is publicly posted
by the West Virginia Purchasing Division at
WVPurchasing.gov with any other vendor
responses to this solicitation submitted to the
Purchasing Division in hard copy format.
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Purchasing Division

Post Office Box 50130

2019 Washinton Street East

Charleston, WV 25305-0130

State Of West Virginia
Solicitation Response

Proc Folder : 25724

Solicitation Description : Addendum #1 - Statewide Contract for Exam Gloves.

Proc Type : Central Master Agreement

Date issued Solicitation Closes Solicitation No Version
2014-12-02 SR 0212 ESR12021400000001216 1
13:30:00
VENDOR
000000106999
ADVANCED EDUCATIONAL PRODUCTS
FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Tara Lyle
(304) 558-2544
tara.l.lyle@wv.gov
Signature X FEIN # DATE

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

Page : 1

FORM ID : WV-PRC-SR-001




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue  Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 Vinyl Examination Gloves 2.00000 CASE $42.50
(Powdered) Small
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
42132203
Extended Description :  [Vinyl Examination Gloves (Powdered) Small
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue  Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
2 Vinyl Examination Gloves 4.00000 CASE $42.50
(Powdered) Medium
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
42132203
Extended Description :  [Vinyl Examination Gloves (Powdered) Medium
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue  Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
3 Vinyl Examination Gloves 3.00000 CASE $42.50
(Powdered) Large
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
42132203
Extended Description :  [Vinyl Examination Gloves (Powdered) Large
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue  Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
4 Vinyl Examination Gloves 2.00000 CASE $42.50
(Powdered) X-Large
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
42132203
Vinyl Examination Gloves (Powdered) X-Large

Extended Description :
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue  Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
5 Vinyl Examination Gloves (Powder 63.00000 CASE $31.00
Free) Small
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
42132203
Vinyl Examination Gloves (Powder Free) Small

Extended Description :

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue  Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
6 Vinyl Examination Gloves (Powder 312.00000  CASE $31.00
Free) Medium
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
42132203
Extended Description :  [Vinyl Examination Gloves (Powder Free) Medium
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue  Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
7 Vinyl Examination Gloves (Powder 267.00000  CASE $31.00
Free) Large
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
42132203
Vinyl Examination Gloves (Powder Free) Large

Extended Description :

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue  Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
8 Vinyl Examination Gloves (Powder 671.00000  CASE $31.00
Free) X-Large
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
42132203
Vinyl Examination Gloves (Powder Free) X-Large

Extended Description :
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Unit Issue  Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Qty

Line Comm Ln Desc
82.00000 CASE

9 Latex Examination Gloves (Powder

Free, smooth) Small
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
42132203
Latex Examination Gloves (Powder Free, smooth) Small

Extended Description :

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Qty Unit Issue  Unit Price

Line Comm Ln Desc

10 Latex Examination Gloves (Powder 515.00000  CASE

Free, smooth) Medium
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
42132203
Latex Examination Gloves (Powder Free, smooth) Medium

Extended Description :

Unit Issue  Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Qty

Line Comm Ln Desc
852.00000 CASE

11 Latex Examination Gloves (Powder

Free, smooth) Large
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
42132203
Latex Examination Gloves (Powder Free, smooth) Large

Extended Description :

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue  Unit Price

12 Latex Examination Gloves (Powder 674.00000 CASE

Free, smooth) X-Large
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
42132203
Latex Examination Gloves (Powder Free, smooth) X-Large

Extended Description :
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue  Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

13 Latex Examination Gloves (Powder 75.00000 CASE $51.00
Free, Textured) Small

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

42132203

Extended Description : [Latex Examination Gloves (Powder Free, Textured) Small

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue  Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
14 Latex Examination Gloves (Powder 190.00000  CASE $51.00
Free, Textured) Medium
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
42132203

Extended Description: [Latex Examination Gloves (Powder Free, Textured) Medium

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue  Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
15 Latex Examination Gloves (Powder 202.00000  CASE $51.00
Free, Textured) Large
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
42132203

Extended Description: [Latex Examination Gloves (Powder Free, Textured) Large

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue  Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
16 Latex Examination Gloves (Powder 89.00000 CASE $51.00
Free, Textured) X-Large
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
42132203

Extended Description : [Latex Examination Gloves (Powder Free, Textured) X-Large
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue  Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
17 Nitrile Examination Gloves (Powder 4.00000 CASE
Free, Textured) Small
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
42132203
Nitrile Examination Gloves (Powder Free, Textured) Small

Extended Description :

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue  Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
18 Nitrile Examination Gloves (Powder 4.00000 CASE
Free, Textured) Medium
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
42132203
Nitrile Examination Gloves (Powder Free, Textured) Medium

Extended Description :

Unit Issue  Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Qty

Line Comm Ln Desc
165.00000 CASE

19 Nitrile Examination Gloves (Powder

Free, Textured) Large
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
42132203
Nitrile Examination Gloves (Powder Free, Textured) Large

Extended Description :

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue  Unit Price

20 Nitrile Examination Gloves (Powder 11.00000 CASE

Free, Textured) X-Large
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
42132203
Nitrile Examination Gloves (Powder Free, Textured) X-Large

Extended Description :
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue  Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
21 Nitrile Examination Gloves (Powder 193.00000  CASE $51.00
Free, Smooth) Smal
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
42132203
Nitrile Examination Gloves (Powder Free, Smooth) Smal

Extended Description :

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue  Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
22 Nitrile Examination Gloves (Powder 486.00000  CASE $51.00
Free, Smooth) Medium
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
42132203
Extended Description :  [Nitrile Examination Gloves (Powder Free, Smooth) Medium
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue  Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
313.00000 CASE $51.00

23 Nitrile Examination Gloves (Powder

Free, Smooth) Large
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
42132203
Nitrile Examination Gloves (Powder Free, Smooth) Large

Extended Description :

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue  Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
24 Nitrile Examination Gloves (Powder 232.00000  CASE $51.00
Free, Smooth) X-Large
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
42132203
Nitrile Examination Gloves (Powder Free, Smooth) X-Large

Extended Description :
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue  Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
25 Polyethylene Disposable Gloves 5.00000 CASE
Medium
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
42132203
Polyethylene Disposable Gloves Medium

Extended Description :

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue  Unit Price
26 Polyethylene Disposable Gloves 12.00000 CASE
Large
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
42132203
Polyethylene Disposable Gloves Large

Extended Description :
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CERTIFICATIONAND SIGNATURE PAGE

By signing below, or submitting documentation through wvOASIS, I certify that I have reviewed
this Solicitation in its entirety; understand the requirements, terms and conditions, and other
information contained herein; that I am submitting this bid, offer or proposal for review and
consideration; that I am authorized by the vendor to execute and submit this bid, offer, or
proposal, or any documents related thereto on vendor’s behalf; that [ am authorized to bind the
vendor in a contractual relationship; and that to the best of my knowledge, the vendor has
properly registered with any State agency that may require registration.

Advanced Educational Products
(Company)

. e
) e Leah Butzek

JQ(LJW é/.)\uj/%\“\) Director of Government Contracts
(AuthoriZdd’Si gnature) (Representative Name, Title)

(800-311-1522) (716-446-5642) (12/1/2014)
(Phone Number) (Fax Number) (Date)

Revised 08/08/2014




ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT FORM
SOLICITATION NO.:

Instructions: ~ Please acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued with this solicitation by
completing this addendum acknowledgment form. Check the box next to each addendum
received and sign below. Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification.

Acknowledgment: [ hereby acknowledge receipt of the following addenda and have made the

necessary revisions to my proposal, plans and/or specification, etc.

Addendum Numbers Received:
(Check the box next to each addendum received)

|] Addendum No. 1 [l:l] Addendum No. 6
[l:l] Addendum No. 2 [D] Addendum No. 7
D Addendum No. 3 D Addendum No. 8
[ ] Addendum No. 4 [ ] AddendumNo.9
[ ] Addendum No.5 [ ] Addendum No. 10

[ understand that failure to confirm the receipt of addenda may be cause for rejection of this bid.
I further understand that any verbal representation made or assumed to be made during any oral
discussion held between Vendor’s representatives and any state personnel is not binding. Only
the information issued in writing and added to the specifications by an official addendum is
binding.

Advanced Educational Products

Company
/'\)< tﬂ,‘f‘?&éw /i)\ (/&./i{\)
Atthorized Sighature
12/1/2014
Date

NOTE: This addendum acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite
document processing.

Revised 08/08/2014




Exhibit A - Pricing Pages

Quantity of 100 cotint.
Commodity Manufacturer Part Number Unitof boxes in each case Estimated Quantity of
Line Code Item Description Extended Description Manufacturer Name {Use box part number) Measure {maximum 12 boxes} BoxPrice Boxes. ‘fotalLine Cost
Vinyl ination gl dered) must be vinyl with a beaded cuff,
) o |nv. examination gvoves (powdered) mu ev!n}/ with a beaded cut Dynarex 2601 10
Vinyl Examination Gloves (Powdered) [ambidextrous, medical grade and powdered. Minimum .08 mm
1 42132203 Small thickness, Non-sterile, 100 count box, size small CASE $42.50 $4.25000000 20 $85.00000000
o \nny! examination g]oves {powdered) must be v'in}ll with 3 beaded cuff, Dynarex 2602 10
Vinyl Examination Gloves (Powdered) |ambidextrous, medica! grade and powdered. Minimum .08 mm
2 42132203 Medium thickness, Non-sterile, 100 count box, size medium CASE $42.50 $4.25000000 40 $170.00000000
Vinyl ination gl dered) must be vinyl with a beaded cuff,
) o |ny' examination g oves (powdered} must be vzny with a beaded cu Dynarex 2603 10
Vinyl Examination Gloves (Powdered) |ambidextrous, medical grade and powdered. Minimum .08 mm
3 42132203 Large thickness, Non-sterile, 100 count box, size large CASE $42.50 $4.25000000 30 $127.50000000
Vinyt examination gloves (powdered) must be vinyl with a beaded cuff,
Dyn: 2604
Vinyl Examination Gloves (Powdered) X{ambidextrous, medical grade and powdered. Minimum .08 mm ynarex 60 10
4 42132203 Large thickness, Non-sterile, 100 count box, size X-large CASE $42.50 $4.25000000 20 $85.00000000
) o Vinyl exar'nination gloveﬁ {powder free) must be vinyl vyit»h a beaded Dynarex 2611 10
Vinyl Examination Gloves {Powder cuff, ambidextrous, medical grade and powder free. Minimum .08 mm
5 42132203 Free) Small thickness, Non-sterile, 100 count box, size small CASE $31.00 $3.10000000 630 $1,953.00000000
) o Vinyl exav'nination gloves_ {powder free) must be vinyl vt/ifh 2 beaded Dynarex 2612 10
Viny! Examination Gloves (Powder cuff, ambidextrous, medical grade and powder free. Minimum .08 mm
& 42132203 Free) Medium thickness, Non-sterile, 100 count bax, size medium CASE $31.00 $3.10000000 3,120 $9,672.00000000
o Vinyl exarj-\ination gloves' (powder free) must be viny! vt/it_h a bea(ied Dynarex 2613 10
Vinyl Examination Gloves (Powder cuff, ambidextrous, medical grade and powder free. Minimum .08 mm
7 42132203 Free) Large thickness, Non-sterile, 100 count box, size large CASE $31.00 $3.10000000 2,670 58,277.00000000
Vinyl examination gloves {powder free) must be vinyl with a beaded
Dynare: 2614 1
Vinyl Examination Gloves {Powder cuff, ambidextrous, medical grade and powder free. Minimum .08 mm ynarex & 0
8 42132203 Free} X-Large thickness, Non-sterile, 100 count box, size x-large CASE $31.00 $3.10000000 6,705 $20,785.50000000
Latex examination gloves (powder free, smooth finish) must be made
from natural rubber latex with a beaded cuff, ambidextrous, medical NO BID NO BID NO BID
Latex Examination Gloves (Powder grade, powder free, and smooth finish. Minimum .08mm thickness,
g 42132203 Free, Smooth) Small non-sterile, 100 count box, size small CASE 820
Latex examination gloves (powder free, smooth finish) must be made
from natural rubber latex with a beaded cuff, ambidextrous, medical NOEBID NO BID NO BID
Latex Examination Gloves {Powder grade, powder free, and smooth finish. Minimum .08mm thickness,
10 [42132203 Free, Smooth) Medium non-sterile, 100 count box, size medium CASE 5,145
Latex examination gloves (powder free, smooth finish) must be made
from natural rubber tatex with a beaded cuff, ambidextrous, medical NO BID NO BID NO BID
Latex Examination Gloves (Powder grade, powder free, and smooth finish. Minimum .08mm thickness,
11  [42132203 Free, Smooth) Large non-sterile, 100 count box, size large CASE 8,511
Latex examination gloves {powder free, smooth finish) must be made
from natural rubber latex with a beaded cuff, ambidextrous, medical NOBID NO BID NO BID
Latex Examination Gloves {Powder grade, powder frea, and smooth finish. Minimum .08mm thickness,
12 |42132203 Free, Smooth) X-large non-sterile, 100 count box, size X-large CASE 6,740
Latex examination gloves (powder free, texture grip} must be made
from natural rubber latex with a beaded cuff, ambidextrous, medical Dynarex 2336 10
Latex Examination Gloves (Powder grade, powder free, and have a texture grip. Minimum .08mm
13 (42132202 Free, Textured) Small thickness, non-sterile, 100 count box, size smail CASE $51.00 $5.10000000 735 $3,748,50000000
Latex examination gloves {powder free, textura grip) must be made
from natural rubber latex with a beaded cuff, ambidextrous, medica! Dynarex 2337 10
Latex Examination Gloves {Powder grade, powder free, and have a texture grip. Minimum .08mm
14 |42132203 Free, Textured} Medium thickness, non-sterile, 100 count box, size medium CASE $51.00 $5.10000000 1,890 $9,639.00000000




Exhibit A - Pricing Pages

Quantity of 100 count:
Commodity Manufacturer Part Number boxes in each case Estimated Quantity of
Line Code Jtem Description Manufacturer Name Use box part number) Case Price maximum 12 boxes Box Price Boxes Total Line Cost
Latex examination gloves (powder free, texture grip) must be made
from natural rubber Jatex with a beaded cuff, ambidextrous, medical Dynarex 2338 10
Latex Examination Gloves (Powder grade, powder free, and have a texture grip. Minimum .08mm
15 142132203 Free, Textured) Large thickness, non-sterile, 100 count box, size large CASE $51.00 $5.10000000 2,020 $10,302.00000000
Latex examination gloves (powder free, texture grip} must be made
from natural rubber latex with a beaded cuff, ambidextrous, medical Dynarex 2339 10
Latex Examination Gloves (Powder grade, powder free, and have a texture grip. Minimum .08mm
16 |42132203 Free, Textured) X-large thickness, non-sterile, 100 count box, size X-large CASE $51.00 $5.10000000 830 $4,539.00000000
Nitrile examination gloves {powder free, texture grip) must be made
from nitrile rubber with a beaded cuff, ambidextrous, medica! grade, NG BID NOBID NO BID
Nitrile Examination Gloves (Powder powder free, and have a texture grip. Minimurm .08mm thickness, non-
17 142132203 Free, Textured) Small sterile, 100 count box, size small CASE 20
Nitrile examination gloves (powder free, texture grip) must be made
from nitrile rubber with a beaded cuff, ambidextrous, medical grade, NO BID NO BID NO BID
Nitrile Examination Gloves (Powder powder free, and have a texture grip. Minimum .08mm thickness, non-
18 42132203 Free, Textured} Medium sterile, 100 count box, size medium CASE 20
Nitrile examination gloves (powder free, texture grip) must be made
from nitrile rubber with a beaded cuff, ambidextrous, medical grade, NO BID NO BID NO BID
Nitrile Examination Gloves {Powder powder free, and have a texture grip. Minimum .08mm thickness, non-
19 142132203 Free, Textured) Large sterile, 100 count box, size large CASE 1,654
Nitrile examination gloves (powder free, texture grip) must be made
from nitrile rubber with a beaded cuff, ambidextrous, medical grade, NG BID NOBID NO BID
Nitrile Examination Gloves {Powder powder free, and have a texture grip. Minimum .08mm thickness, non-
20 142132203 Free, Textured) X-Large sterile, 100 count box, size Xtarge CASE 100
Nitrile examination gloves (powder free, smooth finish) must be made
from nitrile rubber with a beaded cuff, ambidextrous, medical grade, Dynarex 2521 10
Nitrite Examination Gloves (Powder powder free, and have a smooth finish. Minimum .08mm thickness,
21 42132203 Free, Smooth) Smail non-sterile, 100 count box, size small CASE $51.00 $5.10000000 1,920 $9,792.00000000
Nitrile examination gloves {(powder free, smaoth finish) must be made
from nitrile rubber with a beaded cuff, ambidextrous, medical grade, Dynarex 2522 10
Nitrile Examination Gloves (Powder powder free, and have a smooth finish. Minimum .08mm thickness,
22 (42132203 Free, Smooth) Medium non-sterile, 100 count box, size medium CASE $51.00 $5.10000000 4,851 $24,740.10000000
Nitrile examination gloves (powder free, smooth finish) must be made
from nitrile rubber with a beaded cuff, ambidextrous, medical grade, Dynarex 2523 10
Nitrile Examination Gloves {Powder powder free, and have a smooth finish. Minimum .08mm thickness,
23 142132203 Free, Smooth) Large non-sterile, 100 count box, size large CASE $51.00 $5.10000000 3,126 $15,942.60000000
Nitrile examination gloves (powder free, smooth finish) must be made
from nitrile rubber with a beaded cuff, ambidextrous, medical grade, Dynarex 2524 10
Nitrile Examination Gloves (Powder powder free, and have a smooth finish. Minimum .08mm thickness,
24 142132203 Free, Smooth) X-Large non-sterile, 100 count box, size x-large CASE $51.00 $5.10000000 2,313 $11,796.30000000
Polyethylene disposable gloves must be made from clear,
Polyethylene Disposable Gloves polyethylene {low or high density}, disposable, powder free, sulfur
25 42132203 Medium free, and ambidextrous, 100 count box, size medium CASE 20
Palyethylene disposable gloves must be made from clear,
polyethylene (Jow or high density), disposable, powder free, sulfur
26 142132203 Polyethylene Disposable Gloves Large |free, and ambidextrous, 100 count box, size large CASE 108
TOTALBID $131,654.50

Vendor should complete these Pricing Pages by providing the case price, and number of 100 count boxes in each case. The box price is equal to the case price divided by the number of 100 count boxes in each case. The total cost is
calculated by multiplying the box price by the estimated quantity of boxes. Total bid should equal the sum of each line's “Total Cost.”

Boxes must be 160 count boxes.

Vendor should provide the M

er Name and A

urer Part Number. Manufacturer Part Number should be the box part number, not the case part number or the individual glove part number .



Exhibit A - Pricing Pages

Line

Commaodity:
Code

Item Description

Price shall include all costs (shipping, packaging, etc.) for each case.

Manufacturer Name

Manufatturer Part Number
{Use box part number)

Unitof
Measure

Case Price

Quantity of 100 Count:
boxesin.each case
{maximurm 12 boxes!

Box Price

Estimated Quantity of
Boxes

TotalLine Cost




RFQ No. ©WC1500000009

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
Purchasing Division

PURCHASING AFFIDAVIT

MANDATE: Under W. Va. Code §5A-3-10a, no contract or renewal of any contract may be awarded by the state or any
of its political subdivisions to any vendor or prospective vendor when the vendor or prospective vendor or a related party
to the vendor or prospective vendor is a debtor and: (1) the debt owed is an amount greater than one thousand dollars in
the aggregate; or (2) the debtor is in employer default.

EXCEPTION: The prohibition listed above does not apply where a vendor has contested any tax administered pursuant to
chapter eleven of the W. Va. Code, workers’ compensation premium, permit fee or environmental fee or assessment and
the matter has not become final or where the vendor has entered into a payment plan or agreement and the vendor is not
in default of any of the provisions of such plan or agreement.

DEFINITIONS:

“Debt” means any assessment, premium, penalty, fine, tax or other amount of money owed to the state or any of its
political subdivisions because of a judgment, fine, permit violation, license assessment, defaulted workers’
compensation premium, penalty or other assessment presently delinquent or due and required to be paid to the state
or any of its political subdivisions, including any interest or additional penalties accrued thereon.

“Employer default” means having an outstanding balance or liability to the old fund or to the uninsured employers'
fund or being in policy default, as defined in W. Va. Code § 23-2¢-2, failure to maintain mandatory workers'
compensation coverage, or failure to fully meet its obligations as a workers' compensation self-insured employer. An
employer is not in employer default if it has entered into a repayment agreement with the Insurance Commissioner
and remains in compliance with the obligations under the repayment agreement.

“Related party” means a party, whether an individual, corporation, partnership, association, limited liability company
or any other form or business association or other entity whatsoever, related to any vendor by blood, marriage,
ownership or contract through which the party has a relationship of ownership or other interest with the vendor so that
the party will actually or by effect receive or control a portion of the benefit, profit or other consideration from
performance of a vendor contract with the party receiving an amount that meets or exceed five percent of the total
contract amount.

AFFIRMATION: By signing this form, the vendor’s authorized signer affirms and acknowledges under penalty of
law for false swearing (W. Va. Code §61-5-3) that neither vendor nor any related party owe a debt as defined
above and that neither vendor nor any relaied pariy are in employer default as defined above, unless the debt or
employer default is permitted under the exception above.

WITNESS THE FOLLOWING SIGNATURE:;
Vendor's Name: Advanced Educahonal Products /)

/
Authorized Signature: / //7/47/// ////jé T Date: 12/2/2014

State of New York
County of Erie , to-wit:
Taken, subscribed, and sworn to before me this i day of December , ZOlA:
My Commission expires December Z 3 ,20/7.
AFFIX SEAL HERE NOTARY PUBLIC ;%zm: L Wy
PATRICIA R. WOLOSZYN Purchasing Affidavit (Revised 07/01/2012)

NOTARY PUBLIC-STATE OF NEW YORK
No. 01W06294829
Qualified In Erie County
My €emmission Expires Beaember 23, 2017




REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
Exam, Nonsurgical Gloves

7.2 The following remedies shall be available to Agency upon default.
7.2.1 Immediate cancellation of the Contract.
7.2.2 Immediate cancellation of one or more release orders issued under this Contract.
7.2.3  Any other remedies available in law or equity.

8. MISCELLANEOUS:

8.1 No Substitutions: Vendor shall supply only Contract Items submitted in response to the RFQ
unless a contract modification is approved in accordance with the provisions contained in this
Contract.

8.2 Vendor Supply: Vendor must carry sufficient inventory of the Contract Items being offered to
fulfill its obligations under this Contract. By signing its bid, Vendor certifies that it can supply
the Contract Items contained in its bid response.

8.3 Reports: Vendor shall provide quarterly reports and annual summaries to the Agency showing
the Agency’s items purchased, quantities of items purchased, and total dollar value of the items
purchased. Vendor shall also provide reports, upon request, showing the items purchased during
the term of this Contract, the quantity purchased for each of those items, and the total value of
purchases for each of those items. Failure to supply such reports may be grounds for cancellation
of this Contract.

8.4 Contract Manager: During its performance of this Contract, Vendor must designate and
maintain a primary contract manager responsible for overseeing Vendor’s responsibilities under
this Contract. The Contract manager must be available during normal business hours to address
any customer service or other issues related to this Contract. Vendor should list its Contract
manager and his or her contact information below.

Contract Manager: Leah Buizek
Telephone Number: _(800) 311-1522 ext. 30
Fax Number: (716) 446-5642

Email Address: bids@aeppersonalcare.com

Revised 6/09/2014




BOOKS & MEDIA

»
OUR STORY

Advanced Educational Products, Inc., headquartered in Western New York, is a HUBZone Certified Small
Business Concern contractor offering personal care, books and multimedia acquisition services to public and
private institutions worldwide. Established in 1992, our company offers a comprehensive suite of fulfillment
services tailored to meet the needs of government and institutional customers and their demanding ordering
and reporting requirements.

Personal Care
Wwww.aeppersonalcare.com

In early 2014, AEP was awarded our second contract with the GSA. With the Schedule 73 contract for
personal care and amenity items, our Personal Care Products division supplies a large variety of sundries,
custom amenity kits, along with corresponding medical products. Our fulfillment services to Federal, State,
intuitional, Retail, and corporate markets include over 5 years of supplying Job Corps, DLA, and Correctional
facilities with Hygiene, Admission, Medical and specialized Amenity kits. With the addition of supplying these
products to the Medical field, we are growing our buying power to reduce our procurement costs while offering
additional brands and items that our customers need.

AEP also offers a range of value-added products and customized services, including online access, EDI, and
customized management reports. We understand what companies want and in our efforts we make the
procurement process more efficient for both the customer and our company

Books & Media
www.aepbooks.com

Our extensive procurement capabilities allow us to acquire millions of book titles in print from thousands of
U.S. and foreign publishers; and countless out-of-print, rare and special order titles through a worldwide
network of specialty dealers. AEP also offers a range of value-added products and customized services,
including online access, EDI, and customized management reports.

AEP strives to provide superior customer service predicated on the assumption that procurement officials from
institutions of all sizes want personalized relationships with their service providers. To that end, all AEP
customers receive one-on-one assistance from a dedicated Account Manager who is responsible for quoting,
answering questions, processing claims, and expediting orders. All contract customers are serviced by a
dedicated Contract Customer Service Team (CCST) comprised of the most experienced AEP service
representatives, each with extensive training in serving that particular market segment. . AEP also offers a
range of value-added products and customized services, including online access, EDI, and customized
management reports

AEP is a personal care supplier, book, and multimedia supplier with a difference, supplying readily
available personal care products going beyond by providing our customers with efficient, accurate,
and professional fulfillment services.

Let us show you Simply Better Service!

2495 Main Street, Suite 230 ¢ Buffalo, NY, 14214 « 1-800-311-1522 « Fax: (716) 446-5642 ¢ www.aepbooks.com

SIMPLY BETTER SERVICE




Purchasing Divison State of West Virginia

2019 Washington Street East i
Bost Office Box 50130 Request for Quotation

Charleston, WV 25305-0130 26 — Medical

Proc Folder: 25724
Doc Description: Statewide Contract for Exam Gloves.

Proc Type: Central Master Agreement

Date Issued Solicitation Closes Solicitation No Version
2014-11-05 2014-12-02 CRFQ 0212 SWC1500000009 1
13:30:00

BID CLERK

DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION

PURCHASING DIVISION

2019 WASHINGTON ST E

CHARLESTON wv 25305
us

Vendor Name, Address and Telephone Number:

Advanced Educational Products
2495 Main Street, Suite 230
Buffalo, NY 14214

(800) 311-1522

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER

Misty Delong
(304) 558-8802
misty.m.delong@wv.gov

Signature X /";‘, ,0/0/‘/ \ ) bk FEIN# 16-1597345

DATE 12/1/2014

All offers subject to all terms andiednditions contained In this solicitation

Page: 1

FORM ID : WV-PRC-CRFQ-001




ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV 99999 No City WV 99999

us us

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

1 Vinyl Examination Gloves 2.00000 CASE $42 .50/cs $85.00
(Powdered) Small

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

42132203 Dynarex 2601

Extended Description :
Vinyl Examination Gloves (Powdered) Small

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV 99999 No City WV 99999

us uUs

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

2 Vinyl Examination Gloves 4.00000 CASE $42.50/cs $170.00
(Powdered) Medium

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

42132203 Dynarex 2602

Extended Description :
Vinyl Examination Gloves (Powdered) Medium

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

(Powdered) Large

No City WV99999 No City WV 99999

us us

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
3 Vinyl Examination Gloves 3.00000 CASE $42.50/cs $127.50

Page: 2




Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

42132203 Dynarex 2603

Extended Description :
Vinyl Examination Gloves (Powdered) Large

ALL STATE AGENCIES STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA

VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City Wv9g999 No City WV 99999

us us

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

4 Vinyl Examination Gloves 2.00000 CASE $42.50/cs $85.00
(Powdered) X-Large

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

42132203 Dynarex 2604

Extended Description :
Vinyl Examination Gloves (Powdered) X-Large

ALL STATE AGENCIES STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA

VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No Gity WV 99999 No City WV 99999

us us

Line Comm L.n Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

5 Vinyl Examination Gloves (Powder 63.00000 CASE $31.00/cs $1,953.00
Free) Small

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

42132203 Dynrex 2611

Extended Description :
Vinyl Examination Gloves (Powder Free) Small

Page: 3




ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV99999 No City WV 99999

us us

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

6 Vinyl Examination Gloves (Powder 312.00000 CASE $31.00/cs $9,672.00
Free) Medium

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

42132203 Dynarex 2612

Extended Description :
Vinyl Examination Gloves (Powder Free) Medium

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV 99999 No City WV 99999

us us

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

7 Vinyl Examination Gloves (Powder 267.00000 CASE $31.00/cs $8,277.00
Free) Large

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

42132203 Dynarex 2613

Extended Description :
Vinyl Examination Gloves (Powder Free) Large

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

Free) X-Large

No City WV99999 No City WV 99999

us us

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

8 Vinyl Examination Gloves (Powder 671.00000 CASE $31.00/cs $20,785.00

Page: 4




Comm Code Manufacturer

Specification Model #

42132203 Dynarex

2614

Extended Description :
Vinyl Examination Gloves (Powder Free) X-Large

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV99999 No City WV 99999
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
9 Latex Examination Gloves (Powder 82.00000 CASE NO BID
Free, smooth) Smalt
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
42132203

Extended Description :
Latex Examination Gloves (Powder Free, smooth) Small

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV99999 No City WV 99999
Us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
10 Latex Examination Gloves (Powder 515.00000 CASE NO BID

Free, smooth) Medium
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
42132203

Extended Description :
Latex Examination Gloves (Powder Free, smooth) Medium

Page: 5




ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV 99999 No City WV 99999
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
11 Latex Examination Gloves (Powder 852.00000 CASE NO BID
Free, smooth) Large
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
42132203

Extended Description :
Latex Examination Gloves (Powder Free, smooth) Large

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV99999 No City WV 99999
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
12 Latex Examination Gloves (Powder 674.00000 CASE NO BID
Free, smooth) X-Large
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
42132203

Extended Description :
Latex Examination Gloves (Powder Free, smooth) X-Large

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

Free, Textured) Small

No City WV 99999 No City WV 99999

uUs us

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
13 Latex Examination Gloves (Powder 75.00000 CASE $51.00/cs $3,748.50

Page: 6




Comm Code Manufacturer

Specification

Model #

42132203 Dynarex

2336

Extended Description :
Latex Examination Gloves (Powder Free, Textured) Small

ALL STATE AGENCIES STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA

VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV 99999 No City WV 99999

us us

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

14 Latex Examination Gloves (Powder 190.00000 CASE $51.00/cs $9,639.00
Free, Textured) Medium

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

42132203 Dynarex 2337

Extended Description :
Latex Examination Gloves (Powder Free, Textured) Medium

ALL STATE AGENCIES STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA

VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV 99999 No City WV 99999

us us

Line Comim Ln Desc Qty Unit lssue Unit Price Total Price

15 Latex Examination Gloves (Powder 202.00000 CASE $51.00/cs $10,302.00
Free, Textured) Large

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

42132203 Dynarex 2338

Extended Description :
Latex Examination Gloves (Powder Free, Textured) Large

Page: 7




ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV99999 No Gity WV 99999

us us

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

16 Latex Examination Gloves (Powder 89.00000 CASE $51.00/cs $4,539.00
Free, Textured) X-Large

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

42132203 Dynarex 2339

Extended Description :
Latex Examination Gloves (Powder Free, Textured) X-Large

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV 99999 No City WV 99999
us us
Line Comim L.n Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
17 Nitrile Examination Gloves (Powder 4.00000 CASE NO BID
Free, Textured) Small
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification NModel #
42132203

Extended Description :
Nitrile Examination Gloves (Powder Free, Textured) Small

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV 99999 No City WV 99999

us us

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
18 Nitrile Examination Gloves (Powder 4.00000 CASE NO BID

Free, Textured) Medium
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Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
42132203

Extended Description :
Nitrile Examination Gloves (Powder Free, Textured) Medium

ALL STATE AGENCIES STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER
No City WV99999 No City WV 99999
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
19 Nitrile Examination Gloves (Powder 165.00000 CASE NO BID
Free, Textured) Large
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
42132203

Extended Description :
Nitrile Examination Gloves (Powder Free, Textured) Large

ALL STATE AGENCIES STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER
No City Wv99999 No City WV 99999
uUs us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
20 Nitrile Examination Gloves (Powder 11.00000 CASE NO BID
Free, Textured) X-Large
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
42132203

Extended Description :
Nitrile Examination Gloves (Powder Free, Textured) X-Large
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ALL STATE AGENCIES STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA

VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV99999 No City WV 99999

us us

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

21 Nitrile Examination Gloves (Powder 193.00000 CASE $51.00/cs $9,792.00
Free, Smooth) Smal

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

42132203 Dynarex 2521

Extended Description :
Nitrile Examination Gloves (Powder Free, Smooth) Smal

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV99999 No City WV 99999

us us

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

22 Nitrile Examination Gloves (Powder 486.00000 CASE $51.00/cs $24,740.10
Free, Smooth) Medium

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

42132203 Dynarex 2522

Extended Description :
Nitrile Examination Gloves (Powder Free, Smooth) Medium

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

Free, Smooth) Large

No City WV99999 No City WV 99999

us us

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
23 Nitrile Examination Gloves (Powder 313.00000 CASE $51.00/cs $15,942.60
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Comm Code Manufacturer

Specification Model #

42132203 Dynarex

2523

Extended Description :
Nitrile Examination Gloves (Powder Free, Smooth) Large

ALL STATE AGENCIES STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA

VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV 99999 No Gity WV 99999

us us

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

24 Nitrile Examination Gloves (Powder 232.00000 CASE $51.00/cs $11,796.30
Free, Smooth) X-Large

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

42132203 Dynarex 2524

Extended Description :
Nitrile Examination Gloves (Powder Free, Smooth) X-Large

ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WvVag9999 No City WV 99999
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
25 Polyethylene Disposable Gloves 5.00000 CASE NO BID
Medium
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
42132203

Extended Description :
Polyethylene Disposable Gloves Medium
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ALL STATE AGENCIES
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV 99999 No City WV 99999
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
26 |Ii’;l)rlyethylene Disposable Gloves CASE NO BID
ge
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
42132203

Extended Description :
Polyethylene Disposable Gloves Large
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ADDITIONAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS

See attached document(s) for additional Terms and Conditions




