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FICATIONA IGNA PAGE

By signing below, I certify that I have reviewed this Solicitation in its entirety; understand the requirements,
terms and conditions, and other information contained herein; that [ am submitting this bid or proposal for
review and consideration; that ] am authorized by the bidder to execute this bid or any documents related
thereto on bidder’s behalf; that I am authorized to bind the bidder in a contractual relationship; and that to the
best of myknowledge, the bidder has properlyregistered with any State agency that may require

registration.

(Company)

lo

(Authoﬁ}d Slgnaturéf’

~J2& Z&h‘f—z V:;,a ﬂz .~,

(Representatlve Name, Title)

DD Lbdiy/ Q9 Fas- 523

(Phone Number) (Fax Number)

/ﬁw/ 2 b/ 4

(Date)

Revised 01/22/2014
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ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT FORM
SOLICITATION NO.; 6614C028

Instructions: Please acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued with this solicitation by completing this
addendum acknowledgment form. Check the box next to each addendum received and sign below.
Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification.

Acknowledgment: Ihereby acknowledge receipt of the following addenda and have made the
necessary revisions to my proposal, plans and/or specification, etc.

(Check the box next to each addendum received)

Addendum No. 1 Addendum No. 6
Addendum No. 2 | |] Addendum No. 7
Addendum No. 3 Addendum No. 8
| Addendum No. 4 [ Addendum No. 9
I Addendum No. 5 [ Addendum No. 10

I'understand that failure to confirm the receipt of addenda may be cause for rejection of this bid. 1
further understand that any verbal representation made or assumed to be made during any oral
discussion held between Vendor’s representatives and any state personnel is not binding. Only the
information issued in writing and added to the specifications byan official addendum is binding.

Muﬁm/ f/m/ / » ﬂpﬂ ,_/)/ wl, Tac_

Company

/j’j ( Authorized Signature

2% D s

Date

NOTE: This addendum acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite document processing.

Revised 01/22/2014



REQUEST FOR QUOTATION 23 .
6614C028 Herbicide Products, Adjuvant Products, Safety Equipment
and Miscellaneous Products

of the representative’s certification, with their bid package, shall result in the total
disqualification of the Vendor’s bid.

Vendors are encouraged to visit the WV Department of Agriculture’s site
www.kellysolutions.com/WV/Applicators to confirm your representative’s
current registration.

Name of Representative Phone Number
27 ZLl il ]

The Vendor should have a valid Category 12 certification in West Virginia.

4. CONTRACT AWARD:

4.1

4.2

Contract Award: The Contract is intended to provide Agencies with a purchase
price on all Contract Items listed on the Pricing Pages. A Contract shall be awarded
to the Vendor that provides the Contract Items meeting the required specifications
for which their bid is low, provided that the Vendor has provided the Product Trade
Name, if bidding an “or equal to” item and the EPA Registration Number for each
product bid. Failure to list this information will result in the disqualification of the
Vendor’s bid on that Contract Item.

4.1.1  The successful Vendor shall furnish two product labels, for each product
awarded, whether Product Name requested or “or equal to”, to the
WVDOH. The labels shall provide pertinent information regarding
product storage and handling.

The successful Vendor shall supply the proper testing procedures to
determine the presence and concentration of the Herbicide in flowing
water. This shall be provided to:

WVDOH

Materials Control, Soil and Testing Division
190 Dry Branch Road

Charleston, WV 25306

Pricing Pages: Vendor should complete the Pricing Pages by providing a Unit
Cost per each Contract [tem bid. Vendors may bid any or all Contract Items.
Vendor shall complete the Pricing Pages according to Section 3.2.2 of these
specifications. Failure to provide the required information may result in Vendor’s
bid being disqualified for any Contract Item bid.



REQUEST FOR QUOTATION 2

6614C028 Herbicide Products, Adjuvant Products, Safety Equipment

and Miscellaneous Products

7. MISCELLANEOQUS:

74

7.2

7.3

7.4

No Substitutions: Vendor shall supply only Contract Items submitted in
response to the RFQ unless a contract modification is approved in accordance
with the provisions contained in this Contract.

Vendor Supply: Vendor must carry sufficient inventory of the Contract Items
being offered to fulfill its obligations under this Contract. By signing its bid,
Vendor certifies that it can supply the Contract Items contained in its bid
response. :

Reports: Vendor shall provide quarterly reports and annual summaries to the
Agency showing the Agency’s items purchased, quantities of items purchased and
total dollar value of the items purchased. Vendor shall also provide reports, upon
request, showing the items purchased during the term of this Contract, the
quantity purchased for each of those items and the total value of purchases for
each of those items. Failure to supply such reports may be grounds for
cancellation of this Contract.

Contract Manager: During its performance of this Contract, Vendor must
designate and maintain a primary contract manager responsible for overseeing
Vendor’s responsibilities under this Contract. The Contract manager must be
available during normal business hours to address any customer service or other
issues related to this Contract. Vendor should list its Contract manager and his or
her contact information below.

T L]
Contract Manager: J e tenlz.
Telephone Numbers: 2/, 2 FY2AH
Fax Number: _2/2 795 5224
Email Address: e or L Pep7 « o




Exhibit A

Pricing Page

RFQ#6614C028

ducts (Div. of Asplundh Tree Expert Co)

Vendors may bid any or all Contract items. If the Vendor does not provide a Product Trade Name, it will be assumed by
the WVDOH, that the Vendor is bidding the requested Product Trade Name. If the Vendor is bidding an "Or Equal To"
Product Trade Name, the Vendor SHALL list the Product Trade Name. For all Contract Items bid, the Vendor shall
provide the EPA Registration number. The WVDOH shall determine all equivalency.

HERBICIDES % Concentration/ Cost Per
Pounds per Gallon | Estimated | Unitof | Unit of | Extended
item # Description of Active Ingredients| Quantity | Measure| Measure | Cost
DOH-1H Water Soluble Emulsifiable Concentrate Containing:
Ammonium Salt of Fosamine with Surfactant 4 Ibs/gallon
Product Trade Name: Krenite S or equal ____ As Specified
EPA Registration Number: ____352-395
A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 3000 gallon 59.96 299.80
B) Supplied in 15 gallon retumable/refillable containers 3000 gallon 55.15 7445.25
DOH-2H Water Soluble Emulsifiable Concentrate Containing:
Isopropylamine Salt of Glyphosate
Phosphate Ester Surfactant 50.20%
Product Trade Name: Roundup Pro Concentrate or equal _Accord XRT II_
EPA Registration Number: ___62719-556
A) Supplied in 30 gallon plastic returnable drums. 6000 gallon 19.50 585.00
B) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 6000 gallon 19.50 48.75
C) Supplied in 15 gallon returnable/refillable containers 135 gal min 6000 gallon 22.00 2970.00
D) Supplied in 250 gallon returnable/refillable shuttle. 6000 gallon 19.50 4875.00
DOH-3H  [Dispersible Granules Containing: Sulfometuron Methyl 75%
Product Trade Name: Qust XP or equal ___ Sulfomet
EPA Registration Number: __352-401-85588
A) Supplied in 3 pound containers in lots of 24 pounds 100 pound 40.00 960.00
B) Supplied in 3 pound jug 100 pound 40.00 120.00
DOH-4H Water Soluble Aqueous Suspension Containing: Oryzalin 4 |bs/gallon
Product Trade Name: Oryzalin 4 Pro or equal ___As Specified
EPA Registration Number: ___72167-15-74477
A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 250 gallon 43.90 219.50




Exhibit A

Pricing Page RFQ#6614C028

Arborchem Products (Div. of Asplundh Tree Expert Co)

HERBICIDES

ltem #

Description

% Concentration/

Pounds per Gallon
of Active Ingredients

Estimated
Quantity

Unit of
Measure

Cost Per

Unit of
Measure

Extended
Cost

DOH-5H

Aqueous Solution Containing: Imazapyr

2 Ibs/gallon

Product Trade Name: Arsenal Powerline or equal __Polaris

EPA Registration Number: 228-534

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons

B) Supplied in 15 gallon drums

150

gallon

69.00

172.50

150

gallon

75.00

11256.00

DOH-6H

Aqueous Carrier Containing: Pendimethalin

Product Trade Name: Pendulum AquaCap or equal _As Specified

EPA Registration Number; ____241-416

3.8 Ibs/gallon

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons

600

gallon

44.00

220.00

DOH-7H

Water Soluble Concentrate Containing: Triciopyr

Product Trade Name: Element 3A or equal ___As Specified

EPA Registration Number: ___ 62719-37

3 Ibs/gallon

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons

500

gallon

39.39

196.95

B) Supplied in 30 gallon containers

500

gallon

40.00

1200.00

DOH-8H

Water Soluble Concentrate Containing: Triciopyr

Product Trade Name: Garlon 3A or equal ___As Specified

EPA Registration Number: 62719-37

3 Ibs/gallon

A) Supplied in 15 gallon continuum returnable/refillable containers
in pallets of 9 containers.

450

gallon

54.31

7331.85

DOH-9H

Water Soluble Concentrate Containing: Triciopyr

4 tbs/gallon

Product Trade Name: Element 4 or equal ____ As Specified

EPA Registration Number: ____62719-40

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons

250

gallon

45.90

229.50

B) Supplied in 30 gallon containers

250

gallon

46.00

1380.00]

DOH-10H

Water Soluble Concentrate Containing: Triciopyr

4 |bs/gallon

Product Trade Name: Garlon 4 Ultra or equal ___As Specified

EPA Registration Number: ____62719-527

A) Supplied in 15 gallon continuum returnable/refillable containers
in pallets of 9 containers.

225

gallon

64.19

8665.65




Exhibit A Pricing Pag_e RFQ#6614C028 Arborchem Products (Div. of Asplundh Tree Expert Co)
HERBICIDES % Concentration/ Cost Per
Pounds per Gallon | Estimated | Unit of | Unit of |Extended
ltem # Description of Active Ingredients | Quantity | Measure| Measure | Cost
DOH-11H  |A Water Soluble Dispersible Granule Containing: Diuron 80.00%
Product Trade Name: Karmex XP or equal
EPA Registration Number: _________
A) Supplied in 5 pound bags in lots of 10 bags 2000 pound No Bid
B) Supplied in 25 pound bags 2000 pound No Bid
DOH-12H  |Water Soluble Liquid Containing: Dimethylamine Salt of 2, 4-D acid 3.8 libs/gallon
Product Trade Name: DM A4 or equal _____As Specified
EPA Registration Number: ___62719-3__
A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 100 gallon 15.00 75.00
B) Supplied in 30 gallon containers 100 gallon 14.00 420.00
C) Supplied in 15 gallon returnable/refillable containers
in pallets of 9 containers. 100 gallon 16.72 2257.20
DOH-13H  |Water Soluble Liquid Containing:
Ammonium Salt of Imazapic 23.60%
Product Trade Name: Plateau or equal ___As Specified
EPA Registration Number: __241-365
A) Supplied in 1 gallon containers in lots of 2 gallons 50 gallon 126.00 252.00
B) Supplied in 1 quart containers in lots of 4 quarts 200 quart  [N/A N/A
C) Supplied in 15 gallon containers 4 containers |  No Bid No Bid
DOH-14H  |A Dispersible Liquid Containing: Hexazinone 2 Ibs/gallon
Product Trade Name: Velpar L or equal ___As Specified
EPA Registration Number: __352-392 =
A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 50 | gallon 69.90 349.00
DOH-15H  |Dry Flowable Containing: Metsulfuron Methyl 60%
Product Trade Name: Escort XP or equal ___As Specified
EPA Registration Number: 352-439
A) Supplied in 16 ounce containers in lots of 8 pounds (8-16 0z ctrs) 2400 ounce 6.00 768.00
B) Supplied in 16 ounce jugs 2400 ounce 6.00 96.00
C) Supplied in 64 ounce jug returnable/refillable 2400 ounce 6.00 384.00
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Pricing Page

RFQ#6614C028

Arborchem Products (Div. of Asplundh Tree Expert Co)

HERBICIDES

ltem #

Description

% Concentration/
Pounds per Gallon
of Active Ingredients

Estimated
Quantity

Unit of
Measure

Cost Per
Unit of
Measure

Extended
Cost

DOH-16H

Dry Flowable Containing: Chlorsulfuron

Product Trade Name: Telar XP or equal __As Specified

EPA Registration Number: 352-654

75%

A) Supplied in 8 x 16 ounce containter to a case

160

ounce

18.20

291.20

DOH-17H

A Liquid Solution Containing:
Isooctyl ester of 2.4 Dichlorophenoxyacetic Acid
2-ethylhrxyl ester of +R-2-(2,4-Dichlorophenoxy Propionic Acid
Dicamba (3, 6-Dicholoro-0-anisic Acid)

32.48%
15.90%
5.38%

Product Trade Name: BK-800 or equal

EPA Registration Number:

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons

100

galion

No Bid

B) Supplied in 30 gallon drums

100

gallon

No Bid

DOR-18H

Dry Flowable Containing: Tebuthiuron

80%

Product Trade Name: Spike 80 DF or equal ____As Specified

EPA Registration Number: ___62719-107

A) Supplied in 4 pound bags in lots of 24 pounds

50

pound

19.57

469.68

B) Supplied in 25 pound bags

50

pound

18.57

464.25

DOH-19H

A Water Soluble Emulsfiable Concentrate Containing: Clopyralid

3 Ibs/gallon

Product Trade Name: Transline or equal As Specified

EPA Registration Number: 62719-259

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons

25

gallon

123.49

617.45

B) Supplied in .5 gallon containers in lots of 2 gallons

25

gallon

123.49

246.98

DOH-20H

Aqueous Solution Containing:
Isopropylamine Salt of Imazapyr

27.60%

Product Trade Name: Stalker or equal ___As Specified

EPA Registration Number: 241-398

A) Supplied in 1 quart containers in lots of 4 quarts

200

quart

80.00

320.00
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RFQ#6614C028

Arborchem Products (Div. of Asplundh Tree Expert Co)

HERBICIDES

item #

Description

% Concentration/

Pounds per Gallon
of Active Ingredients

Estimated
Quantity

Unit of
Measure

Cost Per

Unit of
Measure

Extended
Cost

DOH-21H

Aqueous Solution Containing:
Diglycolamine Salt of 3, 6-Dichloro-0-Anisic Acid

4 |bs/gallon

Product Trade Name: Vanquish or equal ___As Specified

EPA Registration Number. _ 228-397

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons

300

gallon

62.00

310.00

B) Supplied in 15 gallon returnable/refillable containers
in pallets of 9 containers.

300

gallon

62.00

8370.00

DOH-22H

Aqueous Solution Containing: Triciopyr

.75 Ibs/gallon

Product Trade Name: Pathfinder Il or equal ___As Specified

EPA Registration Number: __62719-176

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons

300

gallon

37.00

185.00

DOH-23H

A Water Soluble Emulsfiable Concentrate Containing:
Isopropylamine Salt of Glyphosate

53.80%

Product Trade Name: Rodeo or equal As Specified

EPA Registration Number: 62719-324

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons

100

gallon

20.00

100.00

B) Supplied in 30 gallon plastic returnable drums

100

gallon

20.00

600.00

DOH-24H

A Liquid Containing: Aminopyralid

Product Trade Name: Milestone or equal __As Specified

EPA Registration Number: 62719-519

40.60%

A) Supplied in 1 quart containers, 12 containers per lot

200

quarts

76.22

914.64

B) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons

90

gallon

299.73

1498.65

DOH-25H

Water Dispersible Granular Material Containing: Prodiamine

Product Trade Name: Endurance or equal ___ProClipse

EPA Registration Number: 228-434

65%

A) Supplied in 10 pound containers, 50 pounds per lot

100

pound

N/A

A) Supplied in 5 pound containers, 50 pounds per lot

100

pound

12.00

600.00
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Arborchem Products (Div. of Asplundh Tree Expert Co)

HERBICIDES

ltem #

Description

% Concentration/
Pounds per Gallon
of Active Ingredients

Estimated
Quantity

Unit of

Cost Per
Unit of
Measure | Measure

Extended
Cost

DOH-26H

Emulsifiable Concentrate Containing: Quizalofop P-Ethyl

Product Trade Name: Assure Il or equal __As Specified

EPA Registration Number: __352-541

.88 Ibs/gallon

A) Supplied in 1 gallon containers in lots of 4 gallons

16 gallon

160.00

640.00

DOH-27H

Emulsifiable Concentrate Containing: Fluazifop-P-butyl

Product Trade Name: Ornamec or equal

EPA Registration Number:

6.75%

A) Supplied in 1 gallon containers in lots of 4 gallons

16 gallon

No Bid

DOH-28H

A Dispersible Granule Containing:
Imazapyr
Diuron

7.78%
62.22%

Product Trade Name: Sahara DG or equal As Specified

EPA Registration Number: 241-372

A) Supplied in 10 pound bags in lots of 40 pounds

50 pound

11.00

440.00

DOH-29H

A Water Soluble Dry Granule Containing: Sulfosulfuron

Product Trade Name: Outrider or equal

EPA Registration Number:

75%

A) Supplied in 20 ounce bottles in lots of 200 ounce

400 | ounce

[No Bid

DOH-30H

A Liquid Containing: Diuron

40%

Product Trade Name: Diuron 4L or equal

EPA Registration Number:

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons

50 gallon

No Bid

DOH-31H

A Liquid Containing: Fluroxypyr

Product Trade Name: Vista XRT or equal ___As Specified

EPA Registration Number: 62719-596

45.52%

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons

100 gallon

165.00

825.00
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Arborchem Products (Div. of Asplundh Tree Expert Co)

HERBICIDES

ltem #

Description

% Concentration/
Pounds per Gallon
of Active lngredients

Estimated
Quantity

Unit of
Measure

Cost Per
Unit of
Measure

Extended
Cost

DOH-32H

Wettable Granule Formulation Containing:

Sodium Salt of Diflufenzopy: 2-[1-({3.5-Difluorophenylamino} Carbony}]

Hydrazono} Ethyl)-3-Pyridinecarboxylic Acid, Sodium
Sodium Salt of 3.6-Dicholoro-o-anisic Acid

21.40%
55.00%

Product Trade Name: Overdrive or equal _As Specified

EPA Registration Number: _____7969-150

A) Supplied in 7.5 pound jugs, 30 pounds per case

100

pound

34.00

1020.00

DOH-33H

Dispersible Granules Containing:
Sulfometuron Methyl
Chlorsulfuron

56.25%
18.75%

Product Trade Name: Landmark XP or equal __As Specified

EPA Registration Number: ___ 352-645

A) Supplied in 4 pound jugs in lots of 32 pounds

100

pound

119.00

3808.00

B) Supplied in 64 ounce jug, returnable/refillable

1600

ounce

7.43

475.52

DOH-34H

Dispersible Granules Containing:
Sulfometuron Methyl
Metsulfuron Methyl

56.25%
15.00%

Product Trade Name: Oust Extra or equal __As Specified

EPA Registration Number: ____352-622

A) Supplied in 4 pound jugs in lots of 32 pounds

400

pound

54.89

1756.48

B) Supplied in 64 ounce jug, returnable/refillable

6400

ounce

349

223.36

C) Supplied in 12 pound jugs

400

pound

54.89

658.68

DOH-35H

A Dry Flowable Granule Containing:
Bromacil
Diuron

40%
40%

Product Trade Name: Krovar | DF or equal ___As Specified

EPA Registration Number: ___352-505

A) Supplied in 6 pound containers in lots of 8 containers

50

pound

12.00

576.00




Exhibit A Pricing Page RFQ#6614C028  Arborchem Products (Div. of Asplundh Tree Expert Co)
HERBICIDES % Concentration/ Cost Per
Pounds per Gallon | Estimated | Unitof | Unit of |Extended
ltem # Description of Active Ingredients | Quantity | Measure| Measure | Cost
DOH-36H  |A Liquid Containing: ]
Imazapic 8.13%
Glyphosate 21.94%
Product Trade Name: Journey or equal ___No Longer Available
EPA Registration Number: _
A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 100 gallon N/A
DOH-37H  |A Liquid Containing:
Dimethylamine Salt of 2,4-Dichlovophenoxyacetic Acid 24.58%
Dimethylamine Salt of Dicamba (3,6-Dichloro-o-Anisic Acid) 12.82%
Product Trade Name: Veteran 720 or equal ___As Specified
EPA Registration Number: _228-295
A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 100 gallon 35.15 17875
B) Supplied in 30 gallon drums 100 gallon No Bid
DOH-38H  |Dispersible Granules Containing:
Chlorsulfuron 9%
Sulfometuron Methyl 18%
Sulfentrazone 48%
Product Trade Name: Throttle XP or equal _As Specified__
EPA Registration Number; ____352-725
A) Supplied in 3.9 pound containers, 8 containers per case 100 pound 111.75 435.83
DOH-39H  |Water Soluble Dispersible Extruded Paste Granule Containing:
Aminocyclopyrachlor 39.50%
Chiorsulfuron 15.80%
Product Trade Name: Perspective™ or equal _As Specified
EPA Registration Number: ____352-846
A) Supplied in 20 ounce containers in lots of 240 ounces 240 ounces 4.60 1104.00
B) Supplied in 20 ounce jug 40 ounces 4.60 92.00
C) Supplied in 5 pound containers in lots of 40 pounds 80 pounds 73.60 2944.00
D) Supplied in 5 pound jug 20 pounds 73.60 368.00




Exhibit A Pricing Page RFQi6614C028 Arborchem Products (Div. of Asplundh Tree Expert Co)
HERBICIDES % Concentration/ Cost Per
Pounds per Gallon | Estimated | Unit of | Unit of | Extended
Item # Description of Active Ingredients | Quantity | Measure| Measure | Cost
DOH-40H  |Water Soluble Dispersible Extruded Paste Granule Containing:
Aminocyclopyrachlor 39.50%
Metsulfuron methyl 12.60%
Product Trade Name: Streamline™ or equal __As Specified____
EPA Registration Number: ____ 352-848
A) Supplied in 3 pound containers in lots of 24 pounds 96 pounds 82.40 1977.60
B) Supplied in 3 pound jug 96 pounds 82.40 247.20
DOH-41H  |Water Soluble Dispersible Extruded Paste Granule Containing:
Imazapyr 31.60%
Aminocyclopyrachlor 22.80%
Metsulfuron methyl 7.30%
Product Trade Name: Viewpoint™ or equal _As Specified
EPA Registration Number: ___352-847
A) Supplied in 5 pound containers in lots of 40 pounds 100 pounds 58.71 2348.40
B) Supplied in 5 pound jug 100 pounds 58.71 293.55
DOH-42H  |A Liquid Containing:
Indaziflam (1.67 pounds per gallon) 19.05%
Product Trade Name: ESPLANADE 200SC or equal As Specified
EPA Registration Number: ___432-1516
A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 50 gallons 1031.42 516710
B) Supplied in 1 quart containers in lots of 1 gallon 50 gallons 270.27 1081.08
DOH-43H  |A Plant Growth Regulator Containing:
Mefluidide, diethanolamine salt 21.45%
Imazethapyr, ammonium salt 4.09%
Imazapyr, ammonium salt 0.15%
Product Trade Name: Stronghold or equal
EPA Registration Number: ____
A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 50 gallons No Bid
B) Supplied in 1 quart containers in lots of 1 gallon 50 gallons No Bid




Exhibit A Pricing Page RFQ#6614C028 Arborchem Products (Div. of Asplundh Tree Expert Co)
HERBICIDES % Concentration/ Cost Per
Pounds per Gallon | Estimated | Unitof | Unit of | Extended
ltem # Description of Active Ingredients | Quantity | Measure| Measure | Cost
DOH-44H  |A Turf and Ornamental Growth Regulator Containing:
Diethanolamine Salt of Mefluidide 3.20%

Product Trade Name: Embark or equal

EPA Registration Number; -

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 50 | gallons | NO Bid
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Arborchem Products (Div. of Asplundh Tree Expert Co)

ADJUVANTS

ltem #

Description

Estimated
Quantity

Unit of
Measure

Cost Per
Unit of
Measure

Extended
Cost

DOH-1A

A Water Soluble Blue Liquid Spray Pattern Indicator

Product Trade Name: Bullseye or equal _Hi-Light

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons.

100

gallon

48.20]

241.00

DOH-2A

A Diluent with Emulsifiers

Product Trade Name: Hygrade EC or Arborchem Basal Oil or Bark Oil EC

or Alenza Basal Oil or Penevator or equal Bid Arborchem Basal Oil

A) Supplied in 18 containersinlotsof 9

100

gallon

17.00]

1485.00

DOH-3A

Non-lonic Surfactant (90% Active Ingredient)

Product Trade Name: __Chemsurf 90

A) Supplied in _2 1/2 gal containers in lots of _5 gal

100

gallon

10.60]

53.00

DOH-4A

A Granular/Flake Drift Control Agent

Product Trade Name: __ 41-A

A) Supplied in ___32 0z cont. containers in lots of __ 12 .

100

pound

7.68]

184.32

DOH-5A

A Liquid Drift Control Agent

Product Trade Name: __CONTROL___( Rate 1-2 oz per 100 gal)

A) Suppliedin ___1qt. containers in lots of 12

400

quart

30.00

360.00

DOH-6A

Aquatic Surfactant

Product Trade Name: Chemsurf 90

A) Supplied in _2 1/2 gal containers in lots of _5 qgal

100

gallon

10.60

53.00

DOH-7A

A Water Soluble Liquid Spray Pattern Indicator

Product Trade Name: Blueprint Plus or equal ___Hi Light

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons.

100

gallon

48.20

241.00

DOH-8A

A Non-lonic Sticker Spreader

Product Trade Name: Nu-Film-IR or equal __As Specified

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of

100

gallon

NOBID

DOH-9A

A Ready-to-Use Formula Containing Paraffinic Oil Emulsifiers

Product Trade Name: Thinvert RTU or equal ___As Specified

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons per case.

100

gallon

15.00

75.00

B) Supplied in 15 gallon drum.

100

gallon

15.00

225.00




Exhibit A

Pricing Page RFQ#6614C028

SAFETY EQUIPMENT

ltem #

Description

Estimated
Quantity

Unit of
Measure

Cost Per

Unit of
Measure

Extended
Cost

DOH-1S

Emergency Spill Kit Containing:

15 Universal Plus Sorbent Pads

3 Cobra Coils

1 Pair Safety Goggles

1 Pair Latex Gloves

1 Large Refuse Bag

1 List of Environmental Compliance Telephone Numbers

Size: 18"x18"x4" Vacuum

Packed in Puncture Resistant Foil

Product Trade Name: __Attack Pac

A) Supplied by the kit.

each

60.00]

60.00

DOH-2S

A Granular/Flake Spill Absorbent

Product Trade Name: __Spill Guard

A) Suppliedin _2.51b___containers in lots of 4

pound

|

7.00|

70.00

DOH-3S

32 ounce Eye Wash Bottle

Product Trade Name: As Specified

A) Supplied per each.

each

20.00]

20.00




Exhibit A Pricing Page RFQ#6614C028
MISCELLANEOUS Cost Per
Estimated Unit of Unit of | Extended
ltem # Description Quantity Measure | Measure Cost
DOH-1M Pressure Rinser
Product Trade Name: Easy Rinse or equal ___ As Specified
A) Supplied per each. 1 each 70.00 70.00
DOH-2M  |Hand Soap with Citrus Oil
Product Trade Name: Zep or equal ____As Specified
A) Supplied in 32 ounce containers in lots of 20 containers per case 1 container 8.00 160.00
DOH-3M A Biostimulant Containing
Soluble Potash 1.00%
Iron 0.36%
Manure Extract 79.30%
Humic and Fulvic Acid Extract 9.00%
Kelp Extract 1.20%
Organo-Modified Silaxane Surfactant 0.36%
Product Trade Name: Launch or equal
A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 25 gallon | [No Bid
DOH-4M  |Nitri-Solve 100% - 15 mil 13" Nitrile Gloves - Compliance EPA 40 CFR 170
A) Supplied size Small. 1 pair 4.00 4.00
B) Supplied size Medium. 1 pair 4.00 4.00
C) Supplied size Large. 1 pair 4.00 4.00
D) Supplied size X-Large. 1 pair 4.00 4.00
E) Supplied size XX-Large. 1 pair 4.00 4.00
DOH-5M  |A 5-gallon Backpack Sprayer
Product Trade Name: Birchmeier or equal ____ 20 K Birchmeier
A) Supplied per sprayer 1 each 240.00 240.00
B) Gasket Set for Sprayer Pump 1 set 20.00 20.00
C) Hose Valve and Wand Repair Kit 1 kit 20.00 20.00
DOH-6M  |2-Quart Handheld Pressure Sprayer
Product Trade Name: Tolco or equal __As Specified
A) Supplied per sprayer 1 each | 17.00| 17.00




Exhibit A Pricing Page RFQ#6614C028 Arborchem Products (Div. of Asplundh Tree Expert Co)

MISCELLANEOUS Cost Per
Estimated | Unitof | Unit of |Extended
Item # Description Quantity | Measure| Measure | Cost

DOH-7M  |Closed System Backpack Sprayer

Product Trade Name: Birchmeier BCS or equal ___As Specified__
A) Supplied per sprayer 1 each 265.00 265.00
B) Gasket Set for Sprayer Pump 1 set 20.00 20.00
C) Hose Valve and Wand Repair Kit 1 kit 20.00 20.00




WV-1 [J New Update
REV. 08/03/12

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA - PURCHASING DIVISION

VENDOR REGISTRATION AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT
AND SMALL, WOMEN-, AND MINORITY-OWNED BUSINESS
CERTIFICATION APPLICATION

Before a vendor is eligible to sell goods and/or services to the State of West Virginia, the West Virginia Code §5A-3-12
requires all vendors to have on file with the West Virginia Purchasing Division a completed Vendor Registration and
Disclosure Statement. All vendors wishing to participate in the competitive bid process and receive purchase orders
from the State of West Virginia exceeding $1,000 are required to complete the Vendor Registration and Disclosure
Statement (WV-1 form) and pay a $125.00 annual fee. Payment of the annual fee includes access to the weekly West
Virginia Purchasing Bulletin that advertises purchases expected to exceed $25,000 which is available online at
http://www.state.wv.us/admin/purchase/newbul.htm. Please complete this form in its ENTIRETY and return it with a
check or money order made payable to the STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA in the amount of $125.00. Incomplete forms will
not be processed and will be returned to the vendor. Please send completed form and payment to:

Purchasing Division - Vendor Registration
2019 Washington Street East
P.O. Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

Whenever a change occurs in the information submitted, such change shall be reported immediately in the same
manner as required in the original disclosure statement (West Virginia Code §5A-3-12). Vendors doing business with the
State of West Virginia are expected to abide by the Vendor Code of Conduct available online at
http://www.state.wv.us/admin/purchase/vrc/vendorconduct.pdf.

Privacy Notice: The Purchasing Division is required to collect certain information as stated in West Virginia Code §5A-3-
12, other applicable sections of the West Virginia Code, the Vendor Registration and Disclosure Statement forms, and
other documents to facilitate the state bidding and contract administration processes. This information is stored in a
secure environment, but unless specifically protected under state law, any information provided may be inspected by or
disclosed to the public.

Vendors are also required to be licensed and in good standing in accordance with any and all state and local laws and
requirements by any state or local agency of West Virginia, including, but not limited to, the West Virginia Secretary of
State’s Office, the West Virginia Tax Department, West Virginia Insurance Commission, or other state agencies or
political subdivisions. Failure to do so may result in delay of or disqualification from a contract award pursuant to West
Virginia Code of State Rules §148-1-6.1.7. If you have any questions concerning this Vendor Registration and Disclosure
Statement, please contact the Purchasing Division at (304) 558-2311.

PLEASE TYPE OR CLEARLY PRINT ALL INFORMATION
To Be Completed by the Vendor and Returned to the Purchasing Division

1. Legal Name of Company/Individual Arborchem Products (Division of Asplundh Tree Expert Co)
Bidding Address 943 Nixon Dr

City/State/Zip Mechanicsburg, PA 17055
Contact Person Joe Lentz .
Telephone Number 717 766 6661 Fax Number /17 795 8234
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VENDOR REGISTRATION AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND SMALL, WOMEN-,
AND MINORITY-OWNED BUSINESS CERTIFICATION APPLICATION

PLEASE TYPE OR CLEARLY PRINT ALL INFORMATION
To Be Completed by the Vendor and Returned to the Purchasing Division

2. Vendor Classified As:

] Individual ] Estate/Trust

] Sole Proprietor ] Partnership

] Non-Profit Organization ] Limited Liability Company (LLC)

Corporation [Enter tax classification: D=Disregarded Entity; C=Corporation; P=Partnership] ___
[l Governmental Entity ] Other (Explain)

3. If you have a Federal Employer's Identification Number, enter it. All partnerships, corporations, or companies with
employees must have a FEIN.

[2]13f1]2]71715]15]0]| FEIN

If you do not have a FEIN, please enter Social Security Number below.

LI T T T PP T T ]SSN

4, (A) Small, Women-Owned, Minority-Owned Businesses

West Virginia Code §5A-3-59 establishes a procurement certification program in West Virginia for small, women-, and
minority-owned businesses. Requirements related to the certification program are provided in the West Virginia Code
of State Rules §148-2-1 et seq. Note that this certification provides nonresident vendors preference that is equivalent to
competing resident (West Virginia) vendors that have applied for resident vendor preference, in accordance with West
Virginia Code §5A-3-37. This certification may assist resident small, women-, and minority-owned businesses when
soliciting business in other states.

Certification of Status (Check all those which apply)

| Minority-owned Business [1] means a business concern that is at least fifty-one percent owned by one or more
minority individuals or in the case of a corporation, partnership, or limited liability company or other entity, at
least fifty-one percent of the equity ownership interest in the corporation, partnership, or limited liability
company or other entity is owned by one or more minority individuals and both the management and daily
business operations are controlled by one or more minority individuals.

e A “minority individual” means an individual who is a citizen of the United States or a noncitizen who is in full
compliance with United States immigration law and who satisfies one or more of the following definitions:

o African American means a person having origins in any of the original peoples of Africa and who is

regarded as such by the community of which this person claims to be a part.
o e e
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VENDOR REGISTRATION AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND SMALL, WOMEN-,
AND MINORITY-OWNED BUSINESS CERTIFICATION APPLICATION

PLEASE TYPE OR CLEARLY PRINT ALL INFORMATION
To Be Completed by the Vendor and Returned to the Purchasing Division

o Asian American means a person having origins in any of the original peoples of the Far East,
Southeast Asia, the Indian subcontinent or the Pacific Islands, including, but not limited to, Japan,
China, Vietnam, Samoa, Laos, Cambaodia, Taiwan, Northern Mariana, the Philippines, a U.S. territory
of the Pacific, India, Pakistan, Bangladesh, or Sri Lanka and who is regarded as such by the
community of which this person claims to be a part.

o Hispanic American means a person having origins in any of the Spanish-speaking peoples of Mexico,
South or Central America, or the Caribbean Islands or other Spanish or Portuguese cultures and who
is regarded as such by the community of which this person claims to be a part.

o Native American means a person having origins in any of the original peoples of North America and
who is regarded as such by the community of which this person claims to be a part or who is
recognized by a tribal organization.

[l Small Business [2] means a business, independently owned or operated by one or more persons who are
citizens of the United States or noncitizens who are in full compliance with United States immigration law,
which, together with affiliates, has two hundred fifty or fewer employees, or average annual gross receipts of
$10 million or less averaged over the previous three years.

(] Women-owned Business [3] means a business concern that is at least fifty-one percent owned by one or more
women who are citizens of the United States or noncitizens who are in full compliance with United States
immigration law, or in the case of a corporation, partnership or limited liability company or other entity, at least
fifty-one percent of the equity ownership interest is owned by one or more women who are citizens of the
United States or noncitizens who are in full compliance with United States immigration law, and both the
management and daily business operations are controlled by one or more women who are citizens of the United
States or noncitizens who are in full compliance with United States immigration law.

(B) Other Federal Designations

Additionally, by providing the following information, | represent that this enterprise is a small business as defined by the
Code of Federal Regulations, Title 13, Part 121, as appended - which contains detailed industry definitions and related
procedures - and/or the characteristics of the enterprise's control, operation and/or ownership are accurately reflected
in the information provided. Check all that apply.

O Disabled Small Business Ownership [4]
O Veteran Small Business Ownership [5]

5. Are you registering as a new vendor with the Purchasing Division? No [] Yes

6. Are you updating the information previously submitted? ] Ne Yes

T e e e e e e e e e e e e e e
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VENDOR REGISTRATION AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND SMALL, WOMEN-,
AND MINORITY-OWNED BUSINESS CERTIFICATION APPLICATION

PLEASE TYPE OR CLEARLY PRINT ALL INFORMATION
To Be Completed by the Vendor and Returned to the Purchasing Division

7. Are you completing this form to register a branch/division/subsidiary? No ] VYes
If yes, please list the parent company's name, address, and FEIN.

Company Name:

Address:

FEIN:

8. Has the vendor done business under another name? If so, list the name and address under which the business was
conducted.

Name Street Address, City, and State

9. List the name, title, city and state of residence for all owners/officers.

If the vendor is an individual, list his or her name and city and state of residence, and, if he or she has associates or
partners sharing in his or her business, list their names and city and state of residence. If the vendor is a firm, list the
name and city and state of residence of each member, partner or associate of the firm. If the vendor is a corporation
created under the laws of this state or authorized to do business in this state, list the names and city and state of
residence of the president, vice president, secretary, treasurer and general manager, if any, of the corporation; and the
names and city and state of residence of each stockholder of the corporation owning or holding at least ten percent of
the capital stock thereof. Attach an additional sheet if space is needed.

Name Position City and State of Residence
Scott Asplundh CEO Meadowbrook, PA
George Graham President Meadowbrook, PA
Joseph Dwyer CFO Landsdale, PA

If the vendor has only one owner/officer, list the name, position, and city and state of residence above and please initial
here:

10. List the name and telephone number of one or more banking institutions to serve as reference for the vendor.

Bank of America (267) 675-0290

PNC (215) 585-5622

WV-1 - Revised 08/03/12 Page 4




VENDOR REGISTRATION AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND SMALL, WOMEN-,
AND MINORITY-OWNED BUSINESS CERTIFICATION APPLICATION

PLEASE TYPE OR CLEARLY PRINT ALL INFORMATION
To Be Completed by the Vendor and Returned to the Purchasing Division

11. What is the latest Dun & Bradstreet number and rating on the vendor (if available)? 00-791-1753

12. Is the vendor acting as an agent for some other individual, firm or corporation? If yes, attach statement of the
principal authorizing such representation. No [1 Yes

By signing below and submitting this form, the vendor certifies and acknowledges that: 1) it has obtained all licenses,
certifications, and authorizations necessary to lawfully conduct business in the state of West Virginia; and 2) that the
assertions made by completing this form and delivering it to the Purchasing Division are accurate and true in accordance
with the applicable law and rules. As authorized agent of the vendor named herein, | do solemnly swear that the above
information is true and complete, in accordance with West Virginia Code §5A-3-12(e).

In the event that the vendor is applying for certification as a small, women-, or minority-owned business, the vendor’s
signature below further certifies that: 1) the state in which the vendor has its headquarters or principal place of business
does not deny a like certification to a West Virginia based small, women-owned, or minority-owned business; 2) the
state in which the vendor has its headquarters or principal place of business does not provide a preference to small,
women-owned, or minority-owned firms that is unavailable to West Virginia based businesses; and, 3) that it has read
and understands this form, along with the law and rules governing certification as a small, women-owned, or minority-
owned business.

Authaorized Agent of Vengor (Print Name) PURCHASING DIVISION
/ﬁ/ USE ONLY
2 —
thorized Agent (Sigratyre)
Vendor ID:

Joe Lentz

Vice President

Check No. :
Title
Memo No. :
Feb. 24 2014 Bk
Bate Entered by:

WV-1 - Revised 08/03/12 Page 5



Iy Y
ACORD
b

CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE

DATE (MM/DD/YY)
7/22/2013

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED

REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

IMPORTANT: If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must be endorsed. If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to
the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on this certificate does not confer rights to
the certificate holder in lieu of such endorsement(s).

PRODUCER

Aon Risk Services Central, Inc. {Primary Casualty Broker)
Philadelphia PA Office

One Liberty Place, Suite 1000
Philadelphia, PA 19103

Marsh, Inc. (Umbrella Excess Broker)

Two Logan Square, 22nd floor
Philadelphia PA, 19103

CONTACT
NAME

PHONE
(A/C No. Ext):

215-255-2000

FAX
(A/C, No):

215-255-1886

E-MAIL
ADDRESS:

PRODUCER

CUSTOMER ID #:

INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE

NAIC #

INSURED

Asplundh Tree Expert Co.

INSURER A: | IBERTY MUTUAL FIRE INSURANCE COMPANY

INSURER B: | IBERTY INSURANCE CORPORATION

708 Blair Mill Road INSURER C:
Willow Grove, PA 190901784 INSURER D:
INSURER E:
Region Code: 010 | ysuRERF:

COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER: 2144975148 REVISION NUMBER:

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,

EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.

LIMITS SHOWN ARI

2 AS REQUESTED.

INSR

ADDL

SUBR

POLICY EFFECTIVE

POLICY EXPIRATION

P TYPE OF INSURANCE s o POLICY NUMBER DATE ARRTDTYYY) | DATE (MAWDOYY LIMITS
A | GENERAL LIABILITY TB2-631-004328-953 8/1/2013 8/1/2014 EACH OCCURRENCE $ 1,000,000
|o/f] COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY DAMAGE TO RENTED $
D GLAIMS MADE @ OCCUR PREMISES (Ea occurrence)
[y Broad Form Contractual o MEL EXP Ay one person) $
] PERSONAL & ADV INJURY $ 1,000,000
GENERAL AGGREGATE $ 2,000,000
GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: e $ sy
[ ]pouicy || PRosECT[ | LOG $ —
A | AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY AS2-631-004328-053 8/1/2013 8/1/2014 COMBINED SINGLE LIMIT $ 1,000,000
[WZ)any auTo (Ea accident)
[ JauL ownep autos B'PD“-Y INJURY $
| JscHEpuLeD auTos il AS6-631-004328-183(V1) bocusbated
BODILY INJURY $
[ Jnrep autos (Per accident)
[__non ownep AuTos PROPERTY DAMAGE $
D (Per accident)
| |umereriaLiae [ | occum EACH OCCURRENCE $
| |ExcEssLAB || CLAIMS-MADE AGGREGATE $
Hi
DEDUCTIBLE $
|| RETENTION § $
WORKERS' COMPENSATION AND WC STATU- OTHER
B | e iy WA7-63D-004328-013 8/1/2013 8/1/2014 | wWCsSTAIL- [ |
ANY PROPRIETORPARTNERIEXECUTIVE | ] (AOS} E.L. EACH ACCIDENT $ 1,000,000
OFFICER/MEMBER EXCLUDED?
(Mendatoryin NH) | WC7-631-004328-023 (W1) EL DISEASE-EAEMPLOYEE | § 1,000,000
, descril r
DESGAIPTION OF OPERATIONS below WA7-63D-004328-573(MN) EL. DISEASE— POLICY LIMIT | $ 1,000,000
o

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VEHICLES (Attach ACORD 101, Additional Remarks Schedule, if more space is required)

CERTIFICATE HOLDER

CANCELLATION

Specimen SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE THE EXPIRATION DATE
= THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.
Specimen
Specimen AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE
Aon Risk Services Central, Inc.
ACORD 25 (2009/09) ©1988-2009 ACORD CORPORATION. All rights reserved.

The ACORD name and logo are registered marks of ACORD




Rev. 07/12 State of West Virginia
VENDOR PREFERENCE CERTIFICATE

Certification and application* is hereby made for Preference in accordance with West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37. (Does not apply to
construction contracts). West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37, provides an opportunity for qualifying vendors to request (at the time of bid)
preference for their residency status. Such preference is an evaluation method only and will be applied only to the cost bid in
accordance with the West Virginia Code. This certificate for application is to be used to request such preference. The Purchasing
Division will make the determination of the Resident Vendor Preference, if applicable.

1. Application is made for 2.5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is an individual resident vendor and has resided continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preced-

ing the date of this certification; or,

Bidder is a partnership, association or corporation resident vendor and has maintained its headquarters or principal place of

business continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or 80% of the

ownership interest of Bidder is held by another individual, partnership, association or corporation resident vendor who has

maintained its headquarters or principal place of business continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately
preceding the date of this certification; or,

/ Bidder is a nonresident vendor which has an affiliate or subsidiary which employs a minimum of one hundred state residents

and which has maintained its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia continuously for the four (4)

years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or,

2. Application is made for 2.5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is a resident vendor who certifies that, during the life of the contract, on average at least 75% of the employees
waorking on the project being bid are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two years
immediately preceding submission of this bid; or,

3. Application is made for 2.5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:

L Bidder is a nonresident vendor employing a minimum of one hundred state residents or is a nonresident vendor with an
affiliate or subsidiary which maintains its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia employing a
minimum of one hundred state residents who certifies that, during the life of the contract, on average at least 75% of the
employees or Bidder's affiliate’s or subsidiary’s employees are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state
continuously for the two years immediately preceding submission of this bid; or,

Bidder meets either the requirement of both subdivisions (1) and (2) or subdivision (1) and (3) as stated above; or,

Application is made for 3.5% resident vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked:

Bidder is an individual resident vendor who is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard
and has resided in West Virginia continuously for the four years immediately preceding the date on which the bid is
submitted; or,

47 Application is made for 5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:
5

6. Application is made for 3.5% resident vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked:
Bidder is a resident vendor who is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard, if, for
purposes of producing or distributing the commaodities or completing the project which is the subject of the vendor’s bid and
continuously over the entire term of the project, on average at least seventy-five percent of the vendor’'s employees are
residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two immediately preceding years.

7. Application is made for preference as a non-resident small, women- and minority-owned business, in accor-
dance with West Virginia Code §5A-3-59 and West Virginia Code of State Rules.

Bidder has been or expects to be approved prior to contract award by the Purchasing Division as a certified small, women-
and minority-owned business.

Bidder understands if the Secretary of Revenue determines that a Bidder receiving preference has failed to continue to meet the
requirements for such preference, the Secretary may order the Director of Purchasing to: (a) reject the bid; or (b) assess a penalty
against such Bidder in an amount not fo exceed 5% of the bid amount and that such penalty will be paid to the contracting agency
or deducted from any unpaid balance on the contract or purchase order.

By submission of this certificate, Bidder agrees to disclose any reasonably requested information to the Purchasing Division and
authorizes the Department of Revenue to disclose to the Director of Purchasing appropriate information verifying that Bidder has paid
the required business taxes, provided that such information does not contain the amounts of taxes paid nor any other information
deemed by the Tax Commissioner to be confidential.

Under penalty of law for false swearing (West Virginia Code, §61-5-3), Bidder hereby certifies that this certificate is true
and accurate in all respects; and that if a contract is issued to Bidder and if anything contained within this certificate

changes during the term of the contract, Bidder will notify the Purchasing Division in writing immediately.
Bidder: Arborchem (Div of Asplundh Tree EXf  signed: M%’

pate: March 6, 2014 Title: Vice Iggesident 6




RFQ No. 6614C028

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
Purchasing Division

PURCHASING AFFIDAVIT

MANDATE: Under W. Va. Code §5A-3-10a, no contract or renewal of any contract may be awarded by the state or any
of its political subdivisions to any vendor or prospective vendor when the vendor or prospective vendor or a related party
to the vendor or prospective vendor is a debtor and: (1) the debt owed is an amount greater than one thousand dollars in
the aggregate; or (2) the debtor is in employer default.

EXCEPTION: The prohibition listed above does not apply where a vendor has contested any tax administered pursuant to
chapter eleven of the W. Va. Code, workers’ compensation premium, permit fee or environmental fee or assessment and
the matter has not become final or where the vendor has entered into a payment plan or agreement and the vendor is not
in default of any of the provisions of such plan or agreement.

DEFINITIONS:

“Debt” means any assessment, premium, penalty, fine, tax or other amount of money owed to the state or any of its
political subdivisions because of a judgment, fine, permit violation, license assessment, defaulted workers’
compensation premium, penalty or other assessment presently delinquent or due and required to be paid to the state
or any of its political subdivisions, including any interest or additional penalties accrued thereon.

“Employer default” means having an outstanding balance or liability to the old fund or to the uninsured employers'
fund or being in policy default, as defined in W. Va. Code § 23-2c-2, failure to maintain mandatory workers'
compensation coverage, or failure to fully meet its obligations as a workers' compensation self-insured employer. An
employer is not in employer default if it has entered into a repayment agreement with the Insurance Commissioner
and remains in compliance with the obligations under the repayment agreement.

“Related party” means a party, whether an individual, corporation, partnership, association, limited liability company
or any other form or business association or other entity whatsoever, related to any vendor by blood, marriage,
ownership or contract through which the party has a relationship of ownership or other interest with the vendor so that
the party will actually or by effect receive or control a portion of the benefit, profit or other consideration from
performance of a vendor contract with the party receiving an amount that meets or exceed five percent of the total
contract amount.

AFFIRMATION: By signing this form, the vendor’s authorized signer affirms and acknowledges under penalty of
law for false swearing (W. Va. Code §61-5-3) that neither vendor nor any related party owe a debt as defined
above and that neither vendor nor any related party are in employer default as defined above, uniess the debt or
employer default is permitted under the exception above.

WITNESS THE FOLLOWING SIGNATURE:

Vendor's Name: /\rborchem Products (Division of Asplundh Tree Expert Co.)

Authorized Signature: %&7 //_z'?f’ s March 3, 2014

Pennsylvania

State of

County of Montgomery , to-wit:

Taken, subscribed, and sworn to before me this E__ day of March 5 2oﬁ
My Commission expires ";ll \=- o011

AFFIX SEAL HERE notary pusuic (UL d o W

COMMONWEALTH OF PENNSYLYANIA

NOTARIAL SEAL P«Q hasing Affidavit (Revised 07/01/2012,
CHERYLANN RIDOLF®, Notary Public Feng AR (RetRe )
Upper Moreland Twp., Montgomery County
My Commission Expires December 12, 2017




