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CERTIFICATION AND SIGNATURE PAGE,

By signing below, I certify that [ have reviewed this Sc}licitation in its entirety; understand the requirements,
terms and conditions, and other information contained herein; that I am submitting this bid or proposal for
review and consideration; that ] am authorized by the bidder to execute this bid or any documents related
thereto on bidder’s behalf; that I am authorized to bind the bidder in a contractual relationship; and that to the
best of my knowledge, the bidder has properly registered with any State agency that may require

registration.

/
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(Company‘)
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(Authorizéd Signan)(e)

Mﬁ- 7o/ 47 , Jdﬁzyﬂ,

(Representative Name, Title)

Q- 22-3728 ] 304-469-21b0

(Phone Number) (Fax Number)

T-20-20].).

(Date)

RECEIVED
2012SEP 20 AM10: 30

WV PURCH GG
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Revised 6/15/2012
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MV13

RFQ No.

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
Purchasing Division

PURCHASING AFFIDAVIT

Va. Code §5A-3-10a, no contract or renewal of any contract may be awarded by the state or any
tive vendor when the vendor or prospective vendor or a related parly

(1) the debt owed is an amount greater than one thousand dollars in

MANDATE: Under W.
of its political subdivisions to any vendor or prospec
to the vendor or prospective vendor is a debtor and:
the aggregate; or (2) the debtor is in employer default.

does not apply where a vendor has contested any tax administered pursuant to
mium, permit fee or environmental fee or assessment and
lan or agreement and the vendor is not

EXCEPTION: The prohibition listed above
chapter eleven of the W. Va. Code, workers' compensation pre
the matter has not become final or where the vendor has entered into a payment p

in default of any of the provisions of such plan or agreement.

DEFINITIONS:

ent, premium, penalty, fine, tax or other amount of money owed to ihe state or any of its
fine, permit violation, license assessment, defaulted workers'
t presently delinquent or due and required to be paid to the stale
| penalties accrued thereon.

“Debt” means any assessm
political subdivisions because of a judgment,
compensation premium, penalty or other assessmen
or any of its political subdivisions, including any interest or additiona

anding balance or liability to the old fund or to the uninsured employers'
fund or being in policy default, as defined in W. Va. Code § 23-2¢-2, failure to maintain mandatory workers'
compensation coverage, or failure to fully meet its obligations as a workers' compensation self-insured employer. An
employer is notin employer default if it has entered into a repayment agreement with the Insurance Commissioner
and remains in compliance with the obligations under the repayment agreement.

“Employer default” means having an outst

“Related party” means a party, whether an individual, corporation, partnership, association, limited liability company

or any other form or business association or other entity whatsoever, related to any vendor by blood, marriage,
ownership or contract through which the party has a relationship of ownership or other interest with the vendor so that
ion of the benefit, profit or other consideration from

the parly will actually or by effect receive or control a port

performance of a vendor contract with the party receiving an amount that meets or exceed five percent of the total
contract amount.

ms and acknowledges under penalty of

y related party owe a debt as defined
unless the debt or

AFFIRMATION: By signing this form, the vendor's authorized signer affir
law for false swearing (W. Va. Code §61-5-3) that neither vendor nor an
above and that neither vendor nor any related party are in employer default as defined above,

employer default is permitted under the exception above.

WITNESS THE FOLLOWING SIGNATURE:

Vendor's Name:

Authorized Signature:

State of ( ) \/

AT U

County of

, to-wit: )
4
jefore me this /%/ day of

Taken, subscribed, and sworn tc</
dul b ,20/3.

My Commission expires ——7’/-—’6—,/
{
E:MMMA%i%%@ﬁM-m%¢M%'5‘""" )
A%K){%E%k HERE  OFFICIAL SEAL T NOTARY PUBLIC
b f T, LY . NOTARY PUBLIC
e o X STATE GFF WEST VIRGINIA
f HOBIN J. MASSEY
109 CENTER STREET
. OAK HILL, WV 25901
: iy cominission explres July 6, 20
,aﬂmmﬁqywsmwy : ';-3

Purchasing Affidavit (Revised 07/01/2012)
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ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT FORM
SOLICITATION NO.: MV13

Instructions: Please acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued with this solicitation by completing this
addendum acknowledgment form. Check the box next to each addendum received and sign below.
Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification.

Acknowledgment: [ hereby acknowledge receipt of the following addenda and have made the
necessary revisions to my proposal, plans and/or specification, etc.

Addendum Numbers Received:
(Check the box next to each addendum received)

[ \/]/ Addendum No. 1 [ ] Addendum No. 6
[ A Addendum No. 2 [ ] Addendum No. 7
[ 1 Addendum No. 3 [ 1 Addendum No. &
[ 1 Addendum No. 4 [ ] Addendum No. 9
[ ] Addendum No. 5 [ ] Addendum No. 10

I understand that failure to confirm the receipt of addenda may be cause for rejection of this bid. 1
further understand that any verbal representation made or assumed to be made during any oral
discussion held between Vendor’s representatives and any state personnel is not binding. Only the
information issued in writing and added to the specifications by an official addendum is binding.

) C C LH?V}”C) Al Cp.
-- mpany

Authorized Signgture

Q~20~ 1A
Date

NOTE: This addendum acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite document processing.

Revised 6/15/2012
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Rev. 07/12 State of West Virginia
VENDOR PREFERENCE CERTIFICATE

Certification and application® is hereby made for Preference in accordance with West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37. (Does not apply to
construction contracts). West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37, providesan opportunity for qualifying vendors to request (atthetime of bid)
preference for their residency status. Such preference is an evaluation method only and will be applied only to the cost bid in
accordance with the West Virginia Code. This cerlificate for application is tobe used to request such preference. The Purchasing
Division will make the determination of the Resident Vendor Preference, if applicable.

1. Application is made for 2.5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:
____ Bidderisan individual resident vendor and has resided continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preced-
ing the date of this certification; or,

\/ Bidder is a partnership, association or corporation resident vendor and has maintained its headquarters or principal place of
business continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or 80% of the
ownership interest of Bidder s held by another individual, partnership, association or corporation resident vendor who has
maintained its headquarters or principal place of business continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately
preceding the date of this certification; or,

Bidder is a nonresident vendor which has an affiliate or subsidiary which employs a minimum of one hundred state residents
and which has maintained its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia continuously for the four (4)
years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or,

2. Application is made for 2.5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:
v Bidder is a resident vendor who certifies that, during the life of the contract, on average at least 75% of the employees
working on the project being bid are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two years
immediately preceding submission of this bid; or,

Application is made for 2.5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is a nonresident vendor employing a minimum of one hundred state residents or is a nonresident vendor with an
affiliate or subsidiary which maintains its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia employing a
minimum of one hundred state residents who certifies that, during the life of the contract, on average at least 75% of the
employees or Bidder's affiliate's or subsidiary's employees are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state
continuously for the two years immediately preceding submission of this bid; or,

‘ e

Application is made for 5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:
Bidder meets either the requirement of both subdivisions (1) and (2) or subdivision (1) and (3) as staled above; or,

Application is made for 3.5% resident vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked:

Bidder is an individual resident vendorwho is aveteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves orthe National Guard
and has resided in West Virginia continuously for the four years immediately preceding the date on which the bid is
submitted; or,

Application is made for 3.5% resident vendor preference whois a veteran for the reason checked:

Bidder is a resident vendor who is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard, if, for
purposes of producing or distributing the commodities or completing the project which is the subject of the vendor's bid and
continuously over the entire term of the project, on average at least seventy-five percent of the vendor's employees are
residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two immediately preceding years.

7. Application is made for preference as a non-resident small, women- and minority-owned business, in accor-
dance with West Virginia Code §5A-3-59 and West Virginia Code of State Rules.
Bidder has been or expects to be approved prior to contract award by the Purchasing Division as a certified small, women-
and minority-owned business.

Bidder understands if the Secretary of Revenue determines that a Bidder receiving preference has failed to continue to meet the
requirements for such preference, the Secretary may order the Director of Purchasing to: (a) reject the bid; or (b) assess a penally
against such Bidder in an amount not to exceed 5% of the bid amount and that such penalty will be paid to the contracting agency

or deducted from any unpaid balance on the contract or purchase order.

By submission of this certificate, Bidder agrees to disclose any reasonably requested information to the Purchasing Division and
authorizes the Depariment of Revenue to disclose to the Director of Purchasing appropriate information verifying that Bidder has paid
the required business taxes, provided that such information does not contain the amounts of taxes paid nor any other information
deemed by the Tax Commissioner to be confidential.

Under penalty of law for false swearing (West Virginia Code, §61-5-3), Bidder hereby certifies that this certificate is true

and accurate in all respects; and that if a contract is issued to Bidder and if anyt ntained within this certificate
A/

N

&

changes during the term of the contract, Bidder will notify the Purchasing Division
. 3 ) L
Bidder: H| h % ( o4 2 C LQM(Q lff‘ (.U_ Signed:

Date: Z '"(10 ~ 0] 2 Title:




CLASS 1 - AUTOMOBILE 070-06-01-000
Sub-Compact,
Front Wheel Drive, Wheelbase 95"
To include but not limited to: Chevrolet Sonic000000, Toyota Prius or equal.

KING COAL CHEVROLET COMPANY

b W=

Manufacturer / Brand CHEVROLET
Delivery 60-120 DAYS
Model Name & Number SPARK 5-DOOR HATCHBACK
HP TORQUE
Requirements:
Engine MIN: 75 HP 85 TORQUE 85 82
Transmission Automatic
Steering Power
Brakes Power/ABS
Radio AM/FM w/CD Player Installed
Glass All Tinted
Mirrors Left & Right Outside
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear
Tires All Season
Spare Tire Standard tire w/ Jack
Rear Window/Defogger Installed
Front Seat Bucket
Air Conditioning Installed
Floor Mats Installed
Front Air Bags Installed
Power Windows/Power Locks Installed
EPA EPA
4 - DOOR VEHICLE HGWY CITY
Price Each Gasoline 3 12,492.00 37 28
Price Each Flex-Fuel NO BID N/A N/A
Options:
Keyless Entry N/A
Side Air Bags STD
Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control _ TILT STD CRUISE N/A
FOB Dealership: (Deduct) T mana]  NA
FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile $ 1.49

Additional Information:
MODEL-1CV48, ENGINE ECOTEC 1.2 DOHC 4CYL MFI

WHEELBASE 93.5" AM-FM RADIO IS INSTALLED CD PLAYER NOT AVAIL. THIS MODEL

SPARE TIRE NOT AVAILABLE, COMES WITH INFLATION KIT
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CLASS 1 - AUTOMOBILE
Sub-Compact,
Front Wheel Drive, Wheelbase 95"

070-06-01-000

To include but not limited to: Chevrolet Sonic000000, Toyota Prius or equal.

KING COAL CHEVROLET
Manufacturer / Brand CHEVROLET
Delivery 60-120 DAYS

Model Name & Number

SONIC LS SEDAN-1JUB9

HP TORQUE
Requirements:
Engine MIN: 75 HP 85 TORQUE 138 125
Transmission Automatic
Steering Power
Brakes Power/ABS
Radio AM/FM w/CD Player Installed
Glass All Tinted
Mirrors Left & Right Outside
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear
Tires All Season
Spare Tire Standard tire w/ Jack
Rear Window/Defogger Installed
Front Seat Bucket
Air Conditioning Installed
Floor Mats Installed
Front Air Bags Installed
Power Windows/Power Locks Installed

EPA EPA

4 - DOOR VEHICLE HGWY CITY
Price Each Gasoline $ 14,373.00 35 26
Price Each Flex-Fuel NO BID NIA N/A
Options:
Keyless Entry STD
Side Air Bags STD
Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control TILT STD CRUISE N/A
FOB Dealership: (Deduct) ! > N/A
FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile $ 1.49

Additional Information:
WHEEL BASE 99.4"; ENGINE 1.8L 4CYL.
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Compact, 4 Door Sedan - Front Wheel Drive, Wheelbase 102.9"

CLASS 2 - AUTOMOBILE

070-06-02-000

Includes but not limited to: Toyota Corolla, VW Jetta, Honda Civic, Mitsubishi Lancer
Ford Focus, Chevy Cruze, Buick Verano or equal

KING COAL CHEVROLET

Manufacturer / Brand
Delivery
Model Name & Number

CHEVROLET

60-120 DAYS

CRUZE LS SEDAN-1PL69

|

HP TORQUE

Standard Equipment Requirements:
Engine MIN: 127 HP 128 TORQUE 138 125
Transmission Automatic
Steering Power
Brakes Power/ABS
Radio AM/FM w/CD Player Installed
Glass All Tinted
Mirrors Left & Right Outside
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear
Tires All Season
Spare Tire Standard tire w/ Jack
Rear Window/Defogger Installed
Front Seat Bucket
Air Conditioning Installed
Floor Mats Installed
Front Air Bags Installed
Power Windows/Power Locks Installed EPA EPA

HGWY CITY
Price Each Gasoline 16997 35 22
Price Each Flex-Fuel NO BID NIA N/A
Diesel NO BID

N/A N/A

Options:
Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control 356.4
Keyless Entry STD
Side Air Bags STD
FOB Dealership: (Deduct) > N/A
FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile 1.49

Additional Information:
WHEEL BASE 105.7"

OPT 1 TILT STD, CRUISE 356.40
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CLASS 2A - Automobile

5 Door Sedan w/Rear Hatch,000000
FRONTWHEEL DRIVE, 4 DOOR 2700 GVWR

Includes but is not limited to: Toyota Matrix, VW-Jetta Sportswagon, 000000Ford Focus000000 or equal.

Vendor Name:

Manufacturer / Brand
Delivery
Model Name & Number

KING COAL CHEVROLET
CHEVROLET

60-120 DAYS

CAPTIVA SPORT LS-1LD26

070-06-02-010

HP TORQUE
Standard Equipment Requirements:
Engine MIN: 127 HP 128 TORQUE 180 172
Transmission Automatic
Steering Power
Brakes Power/ABS
Radio - AM/FM w/CD Player Installed
Glass All Tinted
Mirrors Left & Right Outside
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear
Tires All Season
Spare Tire Standard tire w/ Jack
Rear Window/Defogger Installed
Front Seat Standard
Air Conditioning Installed
Floor Mats Installed
Front Air Bags Installed
Power Windows/Power Locks Installed
EPA EPA
HGWY CITY

Price Each - Gasoline 18643

32 22
Price Each - Flex-Fuel 18643

32 22
Options:
Tilt Wheel & Cruise control ~ STD
Keyless Entry | STD
Side Air Bags STD
FOB Dealership: (Deduct) > N/A
FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile 1.49
Manual Transmission - Credit N/A

Additional Information:

ENGINE 2.4L DOHC 4-CYL: 6SPD AUTOMATIC TRANS. WHEELBASE 106.6"

GVWR 4826
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CLASS 3 - AUTOMOBILE

Midsize, 4 Door, Front Wheel Drive, Wheelbase 107.4"

Includes but is not limited to: Toyota Camry, Chevrolet Malibu, Dodge Dart, Ford Fusion, Buick LaCrosse or equal.

KING COAL CHEVROLET

Manufacturer / Brand
Delivery
Mode!l Name & Number

CHEVROLET

60-120 DAYS

MALIBU LS SEDAN-1GB69

070-06-03-010

HP TOR
Standard Equipment Requirements:
Engine MIN: 160 HP 156 TORQUE 197 191
Transmission Automatic
Steering Power
Brakes Power/ABS
Radio -AM/FM w/CD Player Installed
Glass All Tinted
Mirrors Left & Right Outside
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear
Fuel Tank Factory Standard
Power Windows and Locks Installed
Tires All Season
Spare Tire Standard Tire w/ Jack
Rear Window/Defogger Installed
Front Seat Standard Seating
Air Conditioning Installed
Floor Mats Installed
Seating Capacily 5
Front Air Bags Installed
Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control Installed EPA EPA
Keyless Entry Installed HGWY CITY
Price Each Gasoline 18960 34 22
Price Each Flex Fuel NO BID
Price Each Hybrid 23392 37 25
Options:
Power Windows, Locks, Power Heated Mirrors STD
Power Driver Seat 308
Side Air Bags STD
FOB Dealership: (Deduct) > NIA
FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile 1.49

Additional Information:

WHEEL BASE-107.8", ENGINE 2.5L 4CYL.(GAS)

HYBRID CLASS 2.4L ECOTEC WITH e-ASSIST TECHNOLOGY 182 HP/171 TORQUE

OPT 1-POWER MIRRORS ARE NOT HEATED
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CLASS 4 - AUTOMOBILE
Large, 4 Door,Front Wheel Drive,
Wheelbase 110"

070-06-04-001

Includes but is not limited to: Chevrolet Impala, Ford Taurus, Ford Fusion000000 or equal.

KING COAL CHEVROLET

Manufacturer / Brand CHEVROLET
Delivery 60-120 DAYS
Model Name & Number IMPALA-1WF19
HP TOR
Standard Equipment Requirements:
Engine MIN: 210 HP 210 TORQUE 300 262
Transmission Automatic
Steering Power
Brakes Power/ABS
Radio - AM/FM w/CD Player Installed
Glass All Tinted
Mirrors Left & Right Outside
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear
Fuel Tank Factory Standard
Power Windows/Power Locks/Power Seat Installed
Tires All Season
Spare Tire Standard Tire w/ Jack
Rear Window/Defogger Installed
Front Seat Standard Seating
Air Conditioning Installed
Floor Mats Installed
Seating Capacity 5
Front Air Bags Installed
Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control Installed
Keyless Entry Installed
Side Air Bags Installed EPA EPA
HGWY CITY
Price Each Gasoline 18329 30 18
Price Each Flex Fuel 18329 22 13
Options:
Unmarked Police Option 1848
Police Package 1848
6-Passenger Option 171.6
FOB Dealership: {Deduct) >
FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile 1.49

Additional Information:
WHEEL BASE 110.5", ENGINE 3.6L V6
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CLASS 5 - AUTOMOBILE
Rear Wheel Drive, Full Size, 4 Door,
2,890 Curb Weight; Wheelbase 110"

070-06-05-001

Includes but is not limited to: Chrylser 300, Chevy Caprice, Dodge Charger000000 or equal.

Vendor Name

KING COAL CHEVROLET

Manufacturer / Brand
Delivery
Model Name & Number

CHEVROLET

60-120 DAYS

CAPRICE PPV-1EW19

HP TORQUE
Standard Equipment Requirements:
Engine MIN: 210 HP 210 TORQUE 301 265
Transmission Automatic
Steering Power
Brakes Power/ABS
Radio AM/FM w/CD Player Installed
Glass All Tinted
Mirrors Left & Right Outside
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear
Fuel Tank Factory Standard
Tires All Season
Spare Tire Standard tire wi Jack
Rear Window/Defogger Installed
Front Seat Bucket
Air Conditioning Installed
Floor Mats Installed
Seating Capacity 4
Front Air Bags Installed
Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control Installed
Keyless Entry Installed
EPA EPA
HGWY CITY
Price Each Gasoline 26158 26 18
Price Each Flex Fuel 26158 24 15
Options:
Full Size Spare Tire 149.6
Power Windows / Power Locks / Heated Mirrors 52.80 HEATED MIRRORS
Power Driver seat 171.6
Police Package | sTD
Side Air Bags STD
FOB Dealership: (Deduct) » NA
FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile 1.49
Optional Engine: NO CHARGE OPT. 6.0LV8 FLEX F.

Limited Slip Rear Axle

Additional Information:
CURB WEIGHT-4043;WHEELBASE 118.5"

BSE ENGINE -LFX 3.6L;ENGINE OPTION-6.0L FLEX FUEL-3565 HP/384 TORQUE

POWER WINDOWS & LOCKS STD

171.6
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CLASS 5A - AUTOMOBILE

HYBRID, COMPACT, 4 DOOR
Includes but is not limited to: Toyota Prius, Honda Civic or equal.

KING COAL CHEVROLET

Manufacturer / Brand
Delivery
Model Name & Number

CHEVROLET

60-120 DAYS

MALIBU ECO SEDAN - 1GC69

070-06-05-010

HP TORQUE
Requirements:
Engine MIN: 76 HP 82 TORQUE
Transmission Automatic 182 171
Steering Power
Brakes Power/ABS
Radio AM/FM
Glass All Tinted
Mirrors Left & Right Outside
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear
Tires All Season
Rear Window/Defogger Installed
Front Seat Bucket
Air Conditioning Installed
Floor Mats Installed
Front Air Bags Installed
EPA EPA
HGWY CITY
Hybrid 3 23,792.00 37 25
Options:
AM/FM with CD Player STD
Tilt Wheel & Cruise control STD
Keyless Entry STD
Power Windows - Power Doors STD
Side Air Bags STD
FOB Dealership: (Deduct) > | NA
FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile $ 1.49

Additional Information:

ENGINE 2.4L DOHC 4-CYL. WITH e-ASSIST TECHNOLOGY

NO CHARGE COLORS: WHITE,ICE SILVER MET., TAUPEGRAY MET. ATLANTIS BLUE

METALIC,CHAMPAIGNE SILVER MET.
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CLASS 6 - AUTOMOBILE
Utility Small, 4 Wheel Drive/AWD, 4 Door

3,800 GVWR

103" Wheelbase

KING COAL CHEW&eﬁbut is not limited to: Toyota Rav4, Ford Escape, Chevy Equinox; GMC Terrain or equal.

Manufacturer / Brand
Delivery
Model Name & Number

CHEVROLET

60-120 DAYS

EQUINOX AWD LS-1LG26

070-06-06-001

HP TORQUE
Standard Equipment Requirements:
Engine MIN: 165 HP 161 TORQUE 182 172
Transmission Automatic
Steering Power
Brakes Power/ABS
Radio AM/FM w/CD Player Installed
Glass All Tinted
Mirrors Left & Right Outside
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear
Tires All Season
Spare Tire Standard tire w/ Jack
Rear Window/Defogger Installed
Fuel Tank Standard
Front Seat Bucket
Rear Seat Bench
Air Conditioning Installed
Floor Mats Installed
Front Air Bags Installed
Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control Installed
Power Windows/Power Locks Installed
Keyless Entry Installed
Side Air Bags Installed
EPA EPA
HGWY CITY
Price Each Gasoline 21632 29 20
EPA EPA
HGWY CITY
Price Each Flex Fuel 21632 29 20
Options:
Full Size Spare Tire N/A
Off Road Package Including Limited Slip Rear Includes: $ N/A
Axle-Trac-Lok Differential 5
Engine Cooling - Heavy Duty $ T
Skid plate Group List items included in this group ~ §
Suspension - Heavy Duty W/gas Shocks $ Enter total off road
Front and Rear Tow hooks $
Hi & Lo Gear 4WD or equivalent %
Off Road Tires $
Tow Package 312.4
Exterior colors NO CHG
Roof-Top Luggage Rack | NA
Slush/All Weather Mats (Driver & Passenger) N/A
Slush/All Weather Mats (Second Row) N/A
Slush/All Weather Mats (Cargo) 66
FOB Dealership: (Deduct) | : » | NA
FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile 1.49
Optional Engine: N/A
Credit for Front Wheel Drive Only > -2335

Additional Information:
WHEEL BASE 112.5",GVWR 5070;2.4L 4 CYL. ENGINE

COLORS: WHITE,BLACK,SILVER, BLUE

1LS OPTION PKG




CLASS 6-A - AUTOMOBILE

Ulility Vehicle, Special Purpose, Off-Road, 4WD orFF0000 000000AWDO000000 5700 GVWR, 109" Wheelbase
Includes but is not limited to:Jeep Grand Cherokee, 000000Chevy Tahoe

070-06-06-002

W o NG W =
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KING COAL CHEVROLET
Manufacturer / Brand CHEVROLET
Delivery 60-120 DAYS
Model Name & Number TAHOE 4WD-CK10706
HP TORQUE
Standard Equipment Requirements:
Engine MIN: 200 HP 195 TORQUE 320 335
Transmission Automatic
Steering Power
Brakes Power/ABS
Radio AM/FM w/CD Player Installed
Glass All Tinted
Mirrors Left & Right Qutside
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear
Spare Tire Standard tire w/ Jack
Rear Window/Defogger Installed
Fuel Tank Standard
Front Seat Bucket
Rear Seat Bench
Air Conditioning Installed
Floor Mats Installed
Running Ground Clearance At least 8.3 inches
Cargo Volume at least 35 cubic ft.
Cargo Volume Rear Seat Down at least 67 cubic ft.
Front Air Bags Installed
Axle-trac-lok differential or equal Installed
Skid Plate Installed
Engine Cooling-heavy duty Installed
Suspension- Heavy Duty W/gas Shocks Installed
Front and Rear Tow Hooks Installed
Hi & Lo Gear 4WD or equivalent Installed
Off Road Tires Installed
Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control Inslalled
Keyless Entry Installed EPA EPA
Side Air Bags Installed HGWY CITY
Price Each Gasoline 32031 21 15
EPA EPA
HGWY CITY
Price Each Flex Fuel 32031 16 11
Options:
Power Windows / Power Locks STD
Tow Package List items included in this group 290.4
Exterior colors SOME EXTRA
Third Row Seating 352
40/20/40 Front Bench Seat -822
Fog Lamps 123.2
Aluminum Wheels § | 330
Off Road Package Including Limited Slip Rear End Includes: INCLUDED ABOVE
FOB Dealership: {Deduct) I | NA
FOB Other than Metro Charlesten - Per Mile 1.49

Additional Information:

WHEEL BASE 116", GVWR 7300

TOW PKG INCLUDES AUX. TRANS & ENG OIL COOLER; ENGINE 5.3L V8

NO CHG COLORS: WHITE, BLACK, SILVER,CHAMPAIGNE, MOCHA STEEL MET.




CLASS 7 - AUTOMOBILE
Utility Vehicle, Special Purpose, Midsize, 4WD or AWD, 000000 6270 GVWR -
Includes but is not limited to: Ford Explorer,FFO000 000000Chevy Tahoe000000 or equal.

070-06-07-001

Vendor Name:

Manufacturer / Brand
Delivery
Macdel Name & Number

KING COAL CHEVROLET CO.
CHEVROLET

60-120 DAYS

TRAVERSE AWD-CV14526

HP TORQUE
Standard Equipment Requirements:
Engine MIN: 235 HP 295 TORQUE 281 266
Transmission Automatic
Steering Power
Brakes Power/ABS
Radio - AM/IFM CD Player Installed
Glass All Tinted
Mirrors Left & Right Outside
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear
Tires All Seascn
Spare Tire Full Size w/ Jack
Rear Window/Defogger Installed
Fuel Tank Standard
Front Seat Bucket
Rear Seat Bench
Air Conditioning Installed
Floor Mats Installed
Auto Locking Hubs Installed
Front Air Bags Installed
Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control Installed
Power Windows / Power Locks Installed
Keyless Entry Installed
Spare Tire Carrier - External Installed EPA EPA
HGWY CITY
Price Each Gasoline 25739
EPA EPA
HCWY CITY
Price Each Flex Fuel N/A N/A NIA
Options:
1 Off Road Package Including Limited Slip Rear Includes: N/A
Axle-trac-lok differential $
Engine Cooling - heavy duty s T
Skid plate Group List items included in this group  $
Suspension - Heavy Duty W/gas Shocks $ : ¢ Enter total Off Road pkg above
All Terrain Tires $
Tow Hooks '$ |
2 Tow Package List items included in this group 462
3 Side Air Bags STD
4 Running Board 589.6
5 Third Row Seat STD
6 Low Range 4 Wheel Drive ) _ NIA
7 Roof-Top Luggage Rack ! 286
8 Slush/All Weather Mats (Driver & Passenger) 75
9 Slush/All Weather Mats (Second Row) 75
10 Slush/All Weather Mats (Cargo) N/A
11 Optional Engine N/A
12 40/20/40 Front Bench Seat NIA
13 Fog Lamps N/A
14 Aluminum Wheels NIA BASE MODEI
15 Rear Air STD
16 FOB Dealership: (Deduct) | — » | NA
17 FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile 1.49

Additional Information:

GVWR 6459: FULL SIZE SPARE/SPARE TIRE CARRIER EXTERNAL NOT AVAILABLE
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CLASS 8 - AUTOMOBILE
Utility Large, 4WD or AWD,000000 4 Doors, 7400 GVWR
Includes but is not limited to: Chevrolet Suburbans, Chevy Tahoe, Ford Expedition or equal.

070-06-08-001

KING COAL CHEVROLET
Manufacturer / Brand CHEVROLET
Delivery 60-120 DAYS
Model Name & Number TAHOE 4WD- CK10706
HP TORQUE
Standard Equipment Requirements:
Engine MIN: 300 HP 360 TORQUE 320 335
Transmission Automatic w/Overdrive
Steering Power
Brakes Power/ABS
Radio - AM/FM w/CD Player Installed
Glass All Tinted
Mirrors Left & Right Outside
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear
Tires All Season
Spare Tire Full Size w/ Jack
Rear Window/Defogger Installed
Fuel Tank Standard
Front Seat Standard
Rear Seat Bench
Air Conditioning Installed
Floor Mats Installed
Front Air Bags Installed
Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control Installed
Power Windows / Power Locks Installed
Keyless Entry Installed
Side Air Bags Installed
Low Range 4 Wheel Drive Installed
EPA EPA
HGWY CITY
Price Each Flex Fuel 31962 16 11
EPA EPA
HGWY CITY
Price Each Gasoline 31962 21 15
Options:
Off Road Package Including Limited Slip Rear Includes: 835.12
Axle-trac-lok differential 4 259.6
Engine Cooling - heavy duty N/A
Skid plate Group [Listitems included in thisgroup | OFF RD PKG
Suspension - Heavy Duty W/gas Shocks OFF RD PKG
All Terrain Tires I : | OFF RD PKG
Tow Hooks STD
Tow Package IListitems included in this group | 290.4
Exterior colors SOME EXTRA
Slush/All Weather Mats (Driver & Passenger) 123.2
Slush/All Weather Mats (Second Row) INCL Wi
Slush/All Weather Mats (Cargo) 61.6
40/20/40 Front Bench Seat STD
Fog Lamps : | 123.2
Aluminum Wheels - S 330
HD 8600 GVW Model = SlidEnbdaih Got i it NJA
3rd Row Seat STD
FOB Dealership: (Deduct) i » | NA
FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile 1.49

Additional Information:

OFF RD PKG:SKID PLATE HEAVY DUTY SUSPENSION,ALL TERRAIN TIRES,2 SPEED TRANSF CASE,HIGH CAPACITY AIR CLEA

NO CHARGE COLORS, WHITE, BLACK, SILVER, MOCHA, CHAMPAIGNE

BASE 15600 MODEL GVWR 7300
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SUV, Utility, 4 Door, Hybrid,

CLASS 8A - AUTOMOBILE
130" Wheelbase,

070-06-08-010

Includes but is not limited to: GMC Yukon, Toyota Highlander, Chevy Tahoe000000 or equal.

KING COAL CHEVROLET
Manufacturer / Brand CHEVROLET
Delivery 60-120 DAYS
Model Name & Number TAHOE 4WD/2WD-HYBRID
HP TORQUE
Standard Equipment Requirements:
Engine MIN: 209 HP HYBRID 332 367
Transmission Automatic w/Overdrive
Steering Power
Brakes Power/ABS
Radio AM/FM w/CD Player Installed
Glass All Tinted
Mirrors Left & Right Outside
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear
Tires All Season
Spare Tire Full Size wiJack
Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control Standard
Keyless Entry Standard
Power Windows/Power Locks Standard
Rear Window/Defogger Installed
Fuel Tank Standard
Front Seat Bucket
Rear Seat Bench
Air Conditioning Installed
Floor Mats Installed
Front Air Bags Installed
Side Air Bags Installed
EPA EPA
HGWY CITY
Price Each 4WD Hybrid 48502 23 20
EPA EPA
HGWY CITY
Price Each 2WD Hybrid $ 45,931.00 23 20
Options:
Tow Package List items included in this group STD
Exterior colors ' SOME EXTRA
Slush/All Weather Mats (Driver & Passenger) 3 123.20
Slush/All Weather Mats (Second Row) INCL W/ ABOVE
Slush/All Weather Mats (Cargo) $ 61.60
FOB Dealership: (Deduct) S N/A
FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile $ 1.49

Additional Information:

NO CHARGE COLORS: WHITE,BLACK,SILVER,MOCHA,CHAMPAIGNE

HYBRID ONLY AVAILABLE AS 116" WHEELBASE

4WD MODEL CK10706;2WD MODEL CC10706
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CLASS 12 - TRUCK

Large Pickup, 2 Wheel Drive

6000 GVWR, Short Bed, Approx. 5'7" bed.
Includes but is not limited to: Ford F150, Dodge 1500, Chevrolet 1500, GMC Sierra 1500000000 or equal.

KING COAL CHEVROLET

Manufacturer / Brand
Delivery
Model Name & Number

CHEVROLET
60-120 DAYS
SILVERADO 2WD-CC10703*

070-48-12-001

HP TORQUE

Standard Equipment Requirements:

Engine MIN 195 HP 235 TORQUE 195 260

Transmission Automatic

Steering Power

Brakes Power

Radio Installed

Glass All Tinted

Mirrors Left & Right Qutside

License Plate Mounts Front & Rear

Cargo Box Fleetside

Bumper Rear Siep Factory Installed

Tires All Season

Spare Tire Full Size w/ Jack

Air Conditioning Installed

Front Seat Bench

Rubber Floor Covering Installed EPA EPA

Front Air Bags Installed HGWY CITY

Price Each Gasoline 16635 20 15
EPA EPA

HGWY CITY

Price Each Hybrid 34583 available as crew cab only 23 20

EPA EPA
HGWY CITY

Price Each Flex Fuel 16942**** 19 14

Bed Size Quote 6.6

Options:

AM/FM w/ CD Player 149.6

Tilt Whee! & Cruise Control STD

Limited Slip Rear End 347.6

Keyless Entry | 356.40**

Power Windows / Power Locks 809.60"**

Tow Hooks STD

Long Bed 374.4

Slide Rear Window N/A

Side Air Bags STD

Engine Options Option 1 8316  120-4.8L V8

Engine Options Oplion 2: 1657.6 LMG-5.3 V8

Slush/All Weather Mats (Driver & Passenger) i 1 61.6

Slush/All Weather Mats (Second Row) 132 INCL FRONT

Bed Liner - Drop In ! g 334.4

Crew/Quad Cab 7397.79

Extended Cab 3711.79

Spray In Bed Liner NIA

Delete Truck Bed (Deduct) ; » § N/A

FOB Dealership: (Deduct) > NIA

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile i f 1.49

Additional Information:

*CC10703-REG CAB STANDARD BOX (6'6") ENGINE LU3-4.3 V6, GVWR 6400

**INCLUDES POWER LOCKS

***POWER WINDOW & LOCKS INCL POWER MIRRORS

**FLEX FUEL REQUIRES L20 4.8L V8 ENGINE;CREW CAB INCLUDES 4.8L ENGINE

4.8L V8 302 HP/305 TORQUE
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Class 12A - TRUCK

Large Pickup, Hybrid, 2WD, 6000 GVWR, Short Bed

Incl. but not limited to: Ford F150, Dodge 1500, Chevy 1500, GMC Sierra 1500 or equal

KING COAL CHEVROLET

Manufacturer / Brand CHEVROLET
Delivery 60-120 DAYS
Model Name & Number SILVERADO 1500 HYBRID 2WD
HP TORQUE
Standard Equipment Requirements:
Engine MIN 300 HP 300 TORQUE 332 367
Transmission Automatic
Steering Power
Brakes Power
Radio -AM/FM w/CD Player Installed
Glass All Tinted
Mirrors Left & Right Outside
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear
Cargo Box Fleelside
Bumper Rear Step Faclory Inslalled
Tires All Season
Spare Tire Full Size v/ Jack
Air Condilioning Installed
Front Seat Bench
Rubber Floor Covering Installed
Front Air Bags Installed
Tilt Wheel & Cruise Conlrol Installed
Power Windows / Power Locks Installed
Keyless Entry Installed
EPA EPA
HGWY CITY
Price Each Hybrid 34533 available as crew cab only 23 20
Options:
Limited Slip Rear End ) STD
Tow Hooks ! : D)
Exterior colors NO CHG
Slide Rear Window i 1 | NA
Side Air Bags STD
Engine Oplions Option 1: § . N/AHYBRID
Engine Oplions Option 2: N/A HYBRID
Slush/All Weather Mats (Driver & Passenger) ir i 132
Slush/All Weather Mats (Second Row) ) INCL ABOVE
Bed Liner r ’ 334
Crew Cab STD
Delete Truck Bed (Deduct) i » | NA
FOB Dealership: (Deduct) — N/A
FOB Other than Melro Charleston - Per Mile i i 1.49

Additional Information:

MODEL GLD2MH-CC10543 HYBRID ONLY AVAILABLE AS CREW CAB

7100 GVWR

070-48-12-010



CLASS 18 - TRUCK
Large Pickup, 4 Wheel Drive,
5400 GVWR, Short Bed

Includes but is not limited to: Toyota Tacoma, GMC 1500, Dodge Ram 1500, Ford F150 or equal.

KING COAL CHEVROLET

Manufacturer / Brand
Delivery
Medel Name & Number

CHEVROLET
60-120 DAYS

SILVERADO REG CAB 4WD-CK10703

070-48-18-000

HP TORQUE
Standard Equipment Requirements:
Engine MIN: 231 HP 270 TORQUE 302 305
Transmission Automatic
Steering Power
Brakes Power/ABS
Radio AM/FM
Glass All Tinted
Mirrors Left & Right Culside
License Plale Mounts Front & Rear
Cargo Box Fleetside
Bumper Rear Step Faclory Installed
Tires All Season
Spare Tire Full Size w/ Jack
Air Conditioning Installed
Front Seat Bench
Auto Locking Hubs Installed
Standard Floor Covering Installed
Front Air Bags Installed EPA EPA
HGWY CITY
Price Each Gascline 18925 18 13
EPA EPA
HGWY CITY
Price Each Flex Fuel 18925 18 13
EPA EPA
HGWY CITY
Price Each Hybrid available as crew cab only 37576 23 20
Options:
Off Road Package Including Limited Siip Rear, Includes: 831.6

Axle-trac-lok differential
Engine Coaling - heavy duty
Skid plate Group
Suspensicn - Heavy Duty W/gas Shocks
All Terrain Tires
Tow Hooks
AM/FM w! CD Player
Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control
Tow Package
Snow Plow Package
Slide Rear Window
Keyless Enlry
Power Windows, Locks, Power Heated Mirrors
Side Air Bags
Slush/All Weather Mals (Driver & Passenger)
Slush/All Wealher Mats (Second Row)
Bed Liner - Drop In
Spray In Bed Liner
Carpet Interior
Cloth Seals
Long Bed
Extended Cab w/ Third and Fourth Door
Crew Cab
ENGINE OPTION-5.3L V8(LMG)
FOB Dealership: (Deduct)
FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

Additional Information:

347.6
202.4
132
83.6
66

STD

List ilems included in this gorup
List items included in this gorup

GVWR 6400 W/STANDARD BOX; GVWR 6800 WILONG BOX

REG CAB LCNG BOX CK10903,EXT CAB STANDARD BOX-MODEL CK107563

CREW CAB SHORT BOX-MODEL CK10543

f

Enter total off road pkg above

149.6
STD
413.6
N/A
N/A
356.4
808.6
STD
61.6
132 INCL FRONT
3344
N/A
NIA
STD
288
3070.79
5968.29
726
N/A
1.48




Large Pickup, Hybrid, 4 Wheel Drive,
Includes but is not limited to: Toyota Tacoma, GMC 1500, Dodge Ram 1500, Ford F150 or equal.

KING COAL CHEVROLET

Manufacturer / Brand
Delivery
Model Name & Number

CLASS 18A - TRUCK

CHEVROLET

60-120 DAYS

SILVERADO 4WD HYBRID

5400 GVWR, Short Bed

HP TORQUE
Standard Equipment Requirements:
Engine MIN: 231 HP 293 TORQUE 332 367
Transmission Aulomalic
Steering Power
Brakes Power/ABS
Radio - AMIFM w/CD Player Inslalled
Glass All Tinted
Mirrors Left & Right Outside
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear
Cargo Box Fleetside
Bumper Rear Step Factory Inslalled
Tires All Season
Spare Tire Full Size v/ Jack
Air Conditioning Installed
Front Seal Bench
Auto Locking Hubs Installed
Slandard Floor Covering Installed
Fronl Air Bags Installed
Tt Wheel & Cruise Control Installed
Power Windows, Locks, Power Heated Mirrors Installed
Keyless Enlry Installed
EPA EPA
HGWY CITY

Hybrid 37576 23 20
Options:
Off Road Package Including Limited Slip Rear, Includes: N/A

Axle-trac-lok differential STD

Engine Cooling - heavy duly NIA T

Skid plate Group NIA

Suspension - Heavy Duly W/gas Shocks STD Enter total off road pkg above

All Terrain Tires N/A

Tow Hooks STD
Tow Package List items included in this gorup STD
Exterior colors NO CHG
Slide Rear Window NIA
Side Air Bags STD
Slush/All Wealher Mats (Driver & Passenger) ; i 132
Slush/All Weather Mats (Second Row) INCL W/FRONT
Slush/All Weather Mals (Cargo) i I NA
Bed Liner 334
Carpet Interior STD
Cloth Seals STD
Rear Jump Seat | | N/AFULL SEAT STD
Exlended Cab w/ Third and Fourlh Door EXT CAB N/A
Engine Oplion Size: [ NIA
FOB Dealership: (Deduct) b N/A
FOB Other than Melro Charleston - Per Mile 1.49

$

Additional Information:

MODEL CLD2MH-CK10543 HYBRID ONLY AVAILABLE AS CREW CAB; GVWR 7300

070-48-18-010
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CLASS 35 - ELECTRIC CAR
Front Wheel Drive, 1800 GVW
Includes but is not limited to: GEM e2, Chevy Volt, Ford Focus, or equal.

070-06-35-100

Vendor Name: KING COAL CHEVROLET CO.
Manufacturer / Brand CHEVROLET
Delivery 60-120 DAYS
Model Name & Number VOLT 1RC68

HP
Standard Equipment Requirements:
Engine Min: 56 HP 83
Speed Range
Automolive-style, three-point safely belts Installed
Laminated, tinted automotive safely glass with windshield wiper Installed
Rear and side reflectors Installed
Rearview and dual exterior mirrors (Drivers Side) Installed
Seating Capacity 4
Accessory Outlet Installed
Mounted Fan (Driver-Side) Installed
Dome Light Installed
Scuff Guards Installed
Hazard Lights Installed
Price Each: 38329
Options:
7.0 HP Performance Package | sTD
Audio System STD
Dash-Mounted Fan (Passenger Side) i % N/A
Grab Handles STD
Heated Seats | | 242
Heater/Defogger STD
Scorecard Holder I | NIA
Beacon Light N/A
Baltery 5 | sTD
FOB Dealership: (Deduct) e N/A
FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile | 1.49

Additional Information:




2013 Chevrolet Spark LS 1.2L 4-cyl. 4-speed Automatic Features and Specs
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Highlights

FUEL ECONOMY (CTY/HVWY) Not Available ENGINE TYPE Gas

CAR TYPE TOTAL SEATING 4

TRANSMISSION 4-speed Automatic CYLINDERS Inline 4

BASIC WARRANTY 3 Yr./ 36000 Mi. CONSUMER RATING Not Avallable
Colors Hide details

Exterior

Black Granite Metallic Demim Jalepeno Metallic Lemonade (Late

{Late Availability) Availability)
Salsa Silver Ice Metallic Summit White (Late Techno Pink
Availability)
Interior
Info N/A info N/A Info H/A Info /A
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Exterior

Measurements

Height: 61.0 in.

Length: 144.7 in.

Front track: 55.7 In.

Rear track: 55.5 in.

Wheel base: 93.5in.

Cargo capacity, all seats in place: 11.4 cu.ft.
Maximum cargo capacity: 31,2 cu.ft.

Roof and Glass

Variable intermittent wipers
Rear defogger

Rear window wiper

Body
Rear spoiler

Interior

Front Seats

Front head room: 39.4 in.
Front hip room: 48.0 in.
Front leg room: 42.0 in.
Front shoulder room: 50.7 in.
Helght adjustable driver seat
Cloth

Bucket front seats

Rear Seats

Rear hip Room: 47.5 in.
Rear head room: 37.3 in.
Rear leg room: 35.2 In.
Rear shoulder room: 49.7 in.
Split-folding rear seatback

Instrumentation
Clock

Tachometer

Trip computer

Low fuel level warning

Mechanical

Engine & Performance

Base engine size: 1.2 L

Cam type: Double overhead cam (DOHC)
Cylinders: inline 4

Valves: 16

Valve timing: Variable

Torque: 82 ft-Ibs. @ 4200 rpm
Horsepower: 85 hp @ 6400 rpm

Turning circle: 32.5 ft.

Base engine type: gas

DriveTrain
Drive type: front wheel drive
Transmission: 4-speed automatic

Safety

2013 Chevrolet Spark LS 1.2L 4-cyl. 4-speed Automatic Features and Specs

Hide details

Tires and Wheels

Painted alloy wheels

15 in. wheels

Null spare wheel

R15 tires

All season tires

Tire repair kit

EPA interior volume: 97.7 cu.ft.
Curb weight: 2337 Ibs,

Hide details

Convenience

Front console with storage
Front and rear cupholders
Front door pockets
Retained accessory power
Front seatback storage
Electric power steering
12V front power outlet(s)
Tilt-adjustable steering wheel
Hands-Free Calling*
Roadside Assistance*
Concierge Service*

Destination guidance (also Turn-by-Turn
Navigation)*

Destination Download*

Comfort

Interior air filtration

Air conditioning

Cargo area light

Front and rear floor mats
Driver vanity mirror

In Car Entertainment
Mast antenna

4 total speakers

AM/FM stereo

Auxiliary MP3 audio input

Telematics
OnStar telecommunications service

Hide details

Suspension

MacPherson strut front suspension
Torsion beam rear suspension
Front independent suspension
Stabilizer bar stabilizer bar

Fuel

Fuel type: gas

Fuel type: regular unleaded
Fuel tank capacity: 9.2 gal.
Range In miles (cty/hwy): N/A

Mechanical Options
Engine Block Heater

Hide detalls

http://www.edmunds.com/chevrolet/spark/2013/features-specs.html?style=200417976
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2013 Chevrolet Spark LS 1.2L 4-cyl. 4-speed Automatic Features and Specs

Safety & Security

4-wheel ABS

Front and rear head airbags

Dual frent and dual rear side-mounted airbags
Child seat anchors

Emergency braking assist

Ventilated front disc / rear drum brakes
Daytime running lights

Engine immobilizer

2 front headrests

2 rear headrests

Passenger airbag occupant sensing deactivation
Front seatbelt pretensioners

Stability control

Traction centrel

Electronic brakeforce distribution

Front height adjustable headrests

Rear height adjustable headrests
Post-collision safety system

Tire pressure monitoring

Emergency Service*

Airbag Deployment Hotification*

Stolen Vehicle Tracking/Assistance*

Warranty Hide details
Basic: 3 yr./ 36000 mi.
Drivetrain: 5 yr./ 100000 mi.
Roadside: 5 yr./ 100000 mi.
Rust: 6 yr./ 100000 mi.
* Feature available with a subscription to OnStar
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