CERTIFICATION AND SIGNATURE PAGE

By signing below, | certify that I have reviewed this Solicitation in its entirety; understand the requirements,
terms and conditions, and other information contained herein; that | am submitting this bid or proposal for
review and consideration; that Tam authorized by the bidder to execute this bid or any documents related
thereto on bidder’s behalf; that 1 am authorized to bind the bidder in a contractual relationship; and that to the
best of my knowledge, the bidder has properly registered with any State agency that may require

registration.

BQC ‘Q lgui "‘6 n LnC.

(Company)

(Representatiye Name, Title)

30Y-4.2-3; 2536791

(Phone Number) (Fax Number)

9-20-201A
(Date)

RECEIVED
2012 SEP 20 AH I0: 30

WV PURCHASING
E’i\ll(\,‘n, N

Revised 6/15/2012



ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT F ORM
SOLICITATION NO.: MV13

Instructions: Please acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued with this solicitation by completing this
addendum acknowledgment form. Check the box next to each addendum received and sign below.
Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification.

Acknowledgment: Ihereby acknowledge receipt of the following addenda and have made the
necessary revisions to my proposal, plans and/or specification, etc.

Addendum Numbers Received:
(Check the box next to each addendum received)

[ ‘4/ Addendum No. 1 [ ] Addendum No. 6
[ \/]/ Addendum No. 2 [ ] Addendum No. 7
[ 1 Addendum No. 3 [ ] Addendum No. 8
[ 1 Addendum No. 4 [ ] Addendum No. 9
[ 1 Addendum No. 3 [ 1 Addendum No. 10

[ understand that failure to confirm the receipt of addenda may be cause for rejection of this bid. 1
further understand that any verbal representation made or assumed to be made during any oral
discussion held between Vendor’s representatives and any state personnel is not binding. Only the
information issued in writing and added to the specifications by an official addendum is binding.

“ECM@}Z i;u;'CK ‘(2‘ /1(C A;(ffﬁmfiul—rhd—u
Company
Authorized Signature

9-20- A0 |2

Date

NOTE: This addendum acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite document processing.

Revised 6/15/2012
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RFQ No. MV13

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
Purchasing Division

PURCHASING AFFIDAVIT

MANDATE: Under W. Va. Code §5A-3-10a, no contract or renewal of any contract may be awarded by the state or any
of its political subdivisions to any vendor or prospective vendor when the vendor or prospective vendor or a related party
to the vendor or prospective vendor is a debtor and: (1) the debt owed is an amount greater than one thousand dollars in

the aggregate; or (2) the debtor is in employer default.

EXCEPTION: The prohibition listed above does not apply where a vendor has contested any tax administered pursuant to
chapter eleven of the W. Va. Code, workers' compensation premium, permit fee or environmental fee or assessment and
the matter has not become final or where the vendor has entered into a payment plan or agreement and the vendor is not
in default of any of the provisions of such plan or agreement.

DEFINITIONS:

“Debt” means any assessment, premium, penalty, fine, tax or other amount of money owed to the state or any of its
political subdivisions because of a judgment, fine, permit violation, license assessment, defaulted workers'
compensation premium, penalty or other assessment presently delinquent or due and required to be paid to the state
or any of its political subdivisions, including any interest or additional penalties accrued thereon.

“Employer default” means having an outstanding balance or liability to the old fund or to the uninsured employers'
fund or being in policy default, as defined inW. Va. Code § 23-2c-2, failure to maintain mandatory workers'
compensation coverage, or failure to fully meet its obligations as a workers' compensation self-insured employer. An
employer is not in employer default if it has entered into a repayment agreement with the Insurance Commissioner
and remains in compliance with the obligations under the repayment agreement.

“Related party'” means a party, whether an individual, corporation, partnership, association, limited liability company
or any other form or business association or other entity whatsoever, related to any vendor by blood, marriage,
ownership or contract through which the party has a relationship of ownership or other interest with the vendor so that
the party will actually or by effect receive or control a portion of the benefit, profit or other consideration from
performance of a vendor contract with the party receiving an amount that meets or exceed five percent of the total

contract amount.

AFEIRMATION: By signing this form, the vendor’s authorized signer affirms and acknowledges under penalty of
law for false swearing (W. Va. Code §61-5-3) that neither vendor nor any related party owe a debt as defined
above and that neither vendor nor any related party are in employer default as defined above, unless the debt or
employer default is permitted under the exception ahove.

WITNESS THE FOLLOWING SIGNATURE:
Vendor's Name: : - U f/-'b’ qu/

Authorized Signature: : : Date: z 7= 7~ 2 0l2—

State of

County of

Taken, subscribed, and sworn to before me this 5 day of m r , 2l’b\

My Commission expires %%A ﬁ% i ‘ 20 % '

ALH FICIAL SEAL i NOTARY PUBLIC

‘ARY PUBLIC ?'

A STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA i i

: & CHRISTINA R. BALDWIN 9 Purchasing Affidavit (Revised 07/01/2012)
PO BOX 1443 {

BEAVER, WV 25813 '

1Ay commission expires July 7, 2018 )

PR e S e
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Rev. 07/12 State of West Virginia
VENDOR PREFERENCE CERTIFICATE

Certification and application* is hereby made for Preference in accordance with West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37. (Does not apply to
construction contracts). West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37, provides an opportunity for qualifying vendors to request (al the time of bid)
preference for their residency status. Such preference is an evaluation method only and will be applied only to the cost bid in
accordance with the West Virginia Code. This certificate for application is to be used to request such preference. The Purchasing
Division will make the determination of the Resident Vendor Preference, if applicable.

1. Application is made for 2.5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:
___ Bidderisan individual resident vendor and has resided continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preced-
\/ ing the date of this certification; or,

Bidder is a partnership, association or corporation resident vendor and has maintained its headquarters or principal place of
business continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or 80% of the
ownership interest of Bidder is held by another individual, partnership, association or corporation resident vendor who has
maintained its headquarters or principal place of business continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately
preceding the date of this certification; or,

Bidderis a nonresident vendor which has an affiliate or subsidiary which employs a minimum of one hundred state residents
and which has maintained its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia continuously for the four (4)

years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or,

Application is made for 2.5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:
Bidder is a resident vendor who certifies that, during the life of the contract, on average at least 75% of the employees
working on the project being bid are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two years

immediately preceding submission of this bid; or,

Application is made for 2.5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is a nonresident vendor employing a minimum of one hundred state residents or is a nonresident vendor with an
affiliate or subsidiary which maintains its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia employing a
minimum of one hundred state residents who certifies that, during the life of the contract, on average at least 75% of the
employees or Bidder's affiliate’s or subsidiary's employees are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state
continuously for the two years immediately preceding submission of this bid; or,

4, Application is made for 5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:
V4 Bidder meets either the requirement of both subdivisions (1) and (2) or subdivision (1) and (3) as stated above; or,

5. Application is made for 3.5% resident vendor preference whois a veteran for the reason checked:

Bidder is an individual resident vendorwho s a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard
and has resided in West Virginia continuously for the four years immediately preceding the date on which the bid is
submitted; or,

Application is made for 3.5% resident vendor preference whois a veteran for the reason checked:

Bidder is a resident vendor who is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard, if, for
purposes of producing or distributing the commodities or completing the project which is the subject of the vendor's bid and
continuously over the entire term of the project, on average at least seventy-five percent of the vendor's employees are
residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two immediately preceding years.

7. Application is made for preference as a non-resident small, women- and minority-owned business, in accor-

dance with West Virginia Code §5A-3-59 and West Virginia Code of State Rules.
Bidder has been or expects to be approved prior to contract award by the Purchasing Division as a certified small, women-

and minority-owned business.

Bidder understands if the Secretary of Revenue determines that a Bidder receiving preference has failed to continue to meet the
requirements for such preference, the Secretary may order the Director of Purchasing to: (a) reject the bid; or (b) assess a penalty
against such Bidder in an amount not to exceed 5% of the bid amount and that such penalty will be paid to the confracting agency
or deducted from any unpaid balance on the contract or purchase order.

By submission of this certificate, Bidder agrees to disclose any reasonably requested information to the Purchasing Division and
authorizes the Department of Revenue to disclose to the Director of Purchasing appropriate information verifying that Bidder has paid
the required business taxes, provided that such information does not contain the amounts of taxes paid nor any other information
deemed by the Tax Commissioner to be confidential.

Under penalty of law for false swearing (West Virginia Code, §61-5-3), Bidder hereby certifies that this certificate is true
and accurate in all respects; and that if a contract is issued to Bidder and if anything contained within this certificate

changes during the term of the contract, Bidder will notify the Purchasing Division in WWWI
Bidder: Beck’Q?’ gm.Ck-(Z)MC ad‘fmnqﬂ}l yi¢ Signed: _3 )éUVVJ V ¢ p
Date: 4~ 20-20] 2, Title: ( pimm OF nl Trec k Mj/’f

l‘”\‘“‘
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Class 21 - Truck
Large Pickup, 4 Wheel Drive
10000 GVWR Long Bed

Includes but is not limited to: GMC Sierra 3500

BECKLEY BUICK-GMC AUTOMALL, INC.

Manufacturer / Brand
Delivery
Model Name & Number

Standard Equipment Requirements:
Engine

GMC

60-120 DAYS

SIERRA 3500 4WD REG CAB L. BED TK30903

HP

TORQUE

MIN: 300 HP 360 TORQUE 322

Transmission

Automatic

380

Steering

Power

Brakes

Power/ABS

Radio

AM/FM

Glass

All Tinted

Mirrors

Trailer Tow Mirrors

License Plate Mounts

Front & Rear

Tires

All Season Load Range E

Spare Tire

Full Size w/Jack

Cargo Box

Fleetside

Bumper

Rear Step/Factory Installed

Air Conditioning

Installed

Auto Locking Hubs

Installed

Standard Floor Covering

Installed

Front Air Bags

Installed

Price Each Gasoline
Price Each Flex Fuel
Price Each Diesel

Options:
Dual Rear Wheels

Off Road Package Including Limited Slip Rear, Includes:

Axle-trac-lok differential
Engine Cooling - heavy duty
Skid plate Group
Suspension - Heavy Duty w/Gas Shocks
All Terrain Tires
AM/FM w/ CD Player
Keyless Entry
Power Windows / Power Locks
Side Air Bags
Diesel Engine
Back -Up Alarm
Tow Package
Snow Plow Package
Exteriar colors
Carpet Interior
Slide Rear Window
Slush/All Weather Mats (Driver & Passenger)
Slush/All Weather Mats (Second Row)
Bed Liner - Drop In
Spray In Bed Liner
Crew Cab
Extended Cab w/ Third and Fourth Door
2 Wheel Drive (Deduct)
Delete Truck Bed (Deduct)
Short Bed (Deduct)
Alternate Engine
Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control
FOB Dealership: (Deduct)
FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

Additional Information:

22488

22488

20654

733.2

264

STD ‘l‘
STD

132 Enter Total Off Rd Pkg. Above

STD

132

149.6

356.4

809.60 INCL PWR MIRRORS

347.6

7387.6

121.44

List items included in this group STD

List items included in this group 250.8

NO CHG

88

N/A

1 61.6

N/A

334.4

N/A

4704.71

2984.51

-577.69

-809.6

vV w

| NA

7387.6

6.6L DIESEL

foigzics N 5

N/A

v

i jgss ,' 5 Tt J, FT
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CLASS 22 - VAN, CARGO

6500 GVWR, 109" Wheelbase

Includes but is not limited to: Chevy000000 Express, GMC Savanna or equal.

BECKLEY BUICK-GMC AUTOMALL, INC.

Manufacturer / Brand
Delivery

GMC

60-120 DAYS

070-92-22-001

Model Name & Number SAVANA CARGO VAN 1500 MODEL TG13405
HP TORQUE
Standard Equipment Requirements:
Engine MIN: 180 HP 210 TORQUE 195 260
Transmission Automatic 310 FLEX F 334 FLEX F
Steering Power
Brakes Power/ABS
Radio AM/IFM
Glass All Tinted
Mirrors Left & Right Outside
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear
Standard Bumper Installed
Tires All Season
Spare Tire Standard tire wiJack
Air Conditioning Installed
Seating Capacity 2 Passenger Seat
Front Air Bags Installed
EPA EPA
RWD HGWY CITY
Price Each Gasoline 16514 20 15
EPA EPA
RWD HGWY CITY
Price Each Flex-Fuel 17364 13 10
Options:
AM/FM w/ CD Player 180.4
Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control 347.6
Limited Slip Rear End 286
Tow Package: 233.2
Keyless Entry | | 369.6
Power Windows / Power Locks / Power Mirrors _ ) 519.2
Side Air Bags § | sTD
Glass All Around 277.2
Rear Door Window/Glass g ; 52.8
Side Door Window/Glass 114.4
Exterior Colors | | 132, METALIC COLORS
Rear Step Bumper STD
AWD | 1 5996.5
Optional Engine 875.6
Crew Van Package + NIA
Backup Camera 176
Backup Sensors ; ! 259.6
FOB Dealership: (Deduct) > N/A
FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile } i 1.49

Additional Information:

WHEELBASE 135",GVWR 7300,BASE ENGINE 4.3L V6 MFI

FLEX FUEL IS 5.3L V8,AWD MODEL-TH13405 HAS 56.3L V8

METALIC PAINT IS 132.00 OPTION, NO CHG COLORS: WHITE,BLACK,RED,YELLOW
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CLASS 23 - VAN, CARGO

Extended Body, 8500 GVWR 138" Wheelbase
Includes but is not limited to: GMC Savanna, Chevy Express000000 or equal.

BECKLEY BUICK-GMC AUTOMALL, INC.

Manufacturer / Brand
Delivery
Model Name & Number

Standard Equipment Requirements:
Engine

GMC

60-120 DAYS

SAVANA 2500 CARGO VAN-TG23405

HP

070-92-23-001

TORQUE

MIN: 226 HP 285 TORQUE 280

Transmission

Automatic

295

Steering

Power

Brakes

Power/ABS

Radio

AM/FM

Glass

All Tinted

Mirrors

Left & Right Outside

License Plate Mounts

Front & Rear

Tires

All Season

Spare Tire

Standard tire w/Jack

Rubber Floor Matting

Installed

Air Conditioning

Installed

Front Air Bags

Installed

Doors

Double Side & Rear

Loading Doors w/Glass

Seating Capacity 2

Passenger Seat

Price Each Gasoline
Price Each Flex-Fuel
Price Each Diesel

Options:

AMIFM w/ CD Player

Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control

Limited Slip Rear End

Engine Options:

Drivers Side Cargo Door

All Wheel Drive

Keyless Entry

Power Windows / Power Locks / Power Mirrors
Rear Door Window/Glass

Side Sliding Door w/Glass

Glass Sides - All around

Telescopic Trailer Tow Mirrors

Exterior colors

Back up Camera

Back up Sensors

Optional Gas Engine Size

4 Wheel Drive

Crew Van Package

Express Access / Savanna Pro Package
FOB Dealership: (Deduct)

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

Additional Information:
WHEEL BASE 135", GVWR 8600, 4.8L V8

17684
17684
28810

180.4

347.6

286

875.60 6.0L FLEX FUEL

At e 589.6

*4986.84

1 : - e 369.6

519.2

&5 e W INGL

132

1%, ial 162.8

N/A

132 METALIC COLORS

176

ki R LR 259.6

875.6 6.0L FLEXF.

! R NA

N/A

) , : | 1614.8

N/A

v

S sl 1.49

NO CHG COLORS WHITE,BLACK,RED,YELLOW

*OPTION 6 AWD -ONLY AVAIL.AS 1500 W/5.3L ENGINE GVWR 7300
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Vendor Name: ELK,(’V Boick: C?L»‘ﬁdﬁama ), Toc.

Manufaclurer / Brand
Daelivery
Model Name & Number

Standard Equlpment Roqulmmams'

CLASS 23 - VAN, CARGO CNG
Exlended Body, 8500 GVWR 13
includes bul is not limited to: GMG Savanna,

8" Wheelbase
Chevy Expressor equal.

5)0 /}0 nnv.s_

Eﬂl/dﬂg ASC0 h'&&'}

T

,,M\N‘. 225 HP 285 TORQUE

G050

070-92-23-001

Vn - T C2A3%405

TORQUE

Lam\tzaol

VB ENGINE":

Eng!ne FolN[c it ‘g

Transmisslon Automalic

Steering Power

Brakes PoweilABS

Radlo AMIFM

Glass Al Tinlad

Mirrors Left & Right Qulslde

License Plate Mounts Fronl & Rear

Tires All Season

Spare Tre Standard tiro wiJack

Rubber Floor Malling Installed

‘Alr Condilioning / Inslalled

Front Alr Bags , Insfalled

Doors g Double Slds & Rear
Loading Doors w/Glass

Seallng Capacily 2 Passenger Seal

Price Each GNG (Gasoline Gallon:qulvatont; GGE)

Optlons:

AMIFM v CD Player

Till Whee! & Gruise Conlral
Limlted Silp Rear End

Engine Opllons:

Drivers Side Cargo Door

Al Wheel Drive

Keyless Entry

pawer Windows / Power Locks / Pavet Mircors
Rear Door Window/Glass

Side Sliding Door wiGlass
Glass Sldes - All around
Telascople Traller Tovr Mirrors
Exlerlor colors

Back up Cameara

Back up Sensors

Optional Gas Engine Size

4 Whael Drive

Crew Van Package

Expross Access / Savanna Pro Package
FOB Dealership: (Deduct)

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

RWD
s 30750
ﬁﬁ%ﬁﬁﬁﬁﬁ%

i\ddlllo:l\jlln(orr%llon 8600 bhq,ng ,4, L_ \/—8

135 % [1theyl b

__ Mo CLij Co [n./"l lulnfi? J{lac 5 ,f{pd’ Fo o

$

5

$

3 _

$

$ 4

B 2(G. 60
$ 57920
$

$

$

$

$

$

$

$

5

e /l (ll’!}

: A'}'/# [
12000 Medali'C
176,60
59,6 0
M /A

EA
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BECKLEY BUICK-GMC AUTOMALL, INC.

CLASS 23A - VAN, CARGO
8500 GVWR, 135" Wheelbase

Manufacturer / Brand
Delivery
Model Name & Number

GMC

60-120 DAYS

SAVANA 2500 CARGO VAN-TG23405

070-92-23-002

HP TORQUE

Standard Equipment Requirements:
Engine Gasoline MIN: 225 HP 286 TORQUE 280 295
Engine Diesel MIN: 154 HP 286 TORQUE 260 525
Transmission Automalic
Steering Power
Brakes Power/ABS
Radio AMIFM
Glass All Tinted
Mirrors Left & Right Outside
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear
Tires All Season
Spare Tire Standard tire w/ Jack
Air Conditioning Installed
Seating Capacily 2 Passenger Seat
Front Air Bags Installed
Rear Rubber Floor Matling Installed

FWD RWD
Price Each Gasoline NO BID 17574
Price Each Flex Fuel NO BID 17574
Price Each Diesel NO BID 28699
Options:
AM/FM w/ CD Player N/A 180.4
Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control N/A 347.6
Limited Slip Rear End N/A 286
Tow Package: N/A 233.2
Keyless Entry ONIA 369.6
Power Windows / Power Locks / Power Mirrors N/A 519.2
Glass All Around ; | NA 277.2
Side Air Bags ~ NIA 308
Step Bumper E | NIA STD
Telescopic Trailer Tow Mirrors NIA N/A
Exterior Colors § N/A 132 METALIC
Backup Camera NIA 176
Backup Sensors | 1 NA 259.6
Optional Gas Engine Size NIA 875.60-6.0L
Crew Van Package | N/A NIA
Express Access/Savanna Pro Package ) ~ NA 1614.8
Four Wheel Drive | N/A NIA
FOB Dealership: (Deduct) p N/A N/A
FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile ? 1 NIA 1.49

Additional Information:
WHEEL BASE 135",GVWR 8600,4.8L V8

NO CHARGE COLORS-WHITE BLACK,RED,YELLOW




CLASS 25 - VAN
Small Rear Wheel Drive,
135" Wheel Base, Eight Passenger
Includes but is not limited to: GMC Savanna, Chevrolet Express, Ford Econoline 150 or equal.

070-93-25-000

BECKLEY BUICK-GMC AUTOMALL, INC.

Lo~ E WN =

Manufacturer / Brand
Delivery
Model Name & Number

Standard Equipment Requirements:
Engine

GMC
60-120 DAYS
SAVANA 1500 PASSENGER VAN-TG13406

MIN: 225 HP 286 TORQUE

Transmission

Automatic

HP

TORQUE

310

334

Steering

Power

Brakes

Power/ABS

Radio

AM/FM

Glass

All Tinted, Sides and Rear

Mirrors

Left & Right Qulside - 5" x 8" Minimum

License Plate Mounis

Front & Rear

Seating

8 Passenger

Tires

All Season

Spare Tire

Standard tire wiJack

Vinyl Flooring

Installed

Air Conditioning

Installed

Doors

Double Side & Rear

Front Air Bags

Installed

Interior

Full Length Head Liner wilnsulation Side &
Quarter Panel

Rear Bumper

Installed

Price Each Gasoline

Price Each Flex-Fuel

Price Each Diesel

Options:

AM/FM w/ CD Player

Tilt Whee! & Cruise Control

Limited Slip Rear End

Keyless Entry

Power Windows /Locks/Mirrors

All Wheel Drive

Alternate Engine

Carpet Interior

Slush/All Weather Mats (Driver & Passenger)
Slush/All Weather Mats (Second Row)
Sliding Side Door

Swing Side Door (One Side)

Side Air Bags

Interior upgrade (carpet & insulation pkg)
Exterior colors

Delete Center Row Seats (Deduct)
Delete Third Row Seats (Deduct)

Rear Step Bumper

Rear Heat/ A/C

Tow Package

Backup Sensors

Backup Camera

Sunscreen Glass

FOB Dealership: {Deduct)

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

Additional Information:

18889

18889

NO BID

yYv

v

135" WHEELBASE;GVWR 7300,8 PASSG. SEATING 2-3-3; 5.3L V8

NO CHARGE COLORS WHITE,BLACK,RED,YELLOW

HGWY

CITY

17 GAS

13 GAS

13 FLEX

10 FLEX

N/A

N/A

180.4

347.6

286

369.6

519.2

5606

NIA

162.8

N/A

N/A

132

STD

STD

162.80 CARPET ONLY AVAIL.

132 METALIC COLORS

NIA

N/A

STD

897.6

233.6

259.6

176

STD

N/A

1.49
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CLASS 26 - VAN

12 Passenger Van, 135" Wheel Base

Includes but is not limited to: GMC Savanna, Dodge Sprinter, Chevy Express or equal.

BECKLEY BUICK GMC AUTOMALL, INC

Manufacturer / Brand
Delivery
Model Name & Number

Standard Equipment Requirements:
Engine

GMC

60-120 DAYS

SAVANA 2500 12 PASSG. VAN-TG23406

MIN: 255 HP 350 TORQUE

HP

070-93-26-000

TORQUE

Transmission

Automatic

324

373

Steering

Power

Brakes

Power/ABS

Radio

AMIFM

Glass

All Tinted, Sides and Rear

Mirrors

Left & Right Outside - 5" x 8" Minimum

License Plate Mounts

Front & Rear

Seating

12 Passenger

Tires

Load Range E

Spare Tire

Standard tire widack

Rubber Floor Covering

Installed

Front and Rear Air Conditioning

Installed

Front Air Bags

Installed

Doors

Double Side & Rear

Interior

Full Length Head Liner w/Insulation Side &
Quarter Panel

Rear Bumper

Installed

Price Each Gasoline

Price Each Flex Fuel

Price Each Diesel

Options:

AM/FM w/ CD Player

Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control

Keyless Entry

Power Windows / Power Locks/Power Mirrors
Limited Slip Rear End

Extended Length

Sliding Side Door

Slush/All Weather Mats (Driver & Passenger)
Slush/All Weather Mats (Second Row)

Side Air Bags

Exterior colors

Delete Center Row Seats (Deduct)

Delete Third Row Seats (Deduct)

Rear Step Bumper

15 Passenger Seating

4 Wheel Drive

Optional Size V8 Gas Engine

Floor Carpet/Mats

Backup Camera

Backup Sensors

FOB Dealership: (Deduct)

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

Additional Information:

21891

21891

34761

\ R

SRy N

o

ENGINE 6.0L V8,GVWR 8600; SEATING 12 PASSG.2-3-3-4

NO CHARGE COLORS: WHITE,BLACK,RED,YELLOW: DIESEL IS 3500

EPA
HGWY

EPA
CIty

N/A > 8500

N/A > 8500

N/A > 8500

N/A > 8500

N/A > 8500

N/A > 8500

180.4

347.6

369.6

519.2

286

2975.84

132

N/A

N/A

STD

132 METALIC COLORS

N/A

N/A

STD

3393.84

N/A

-875

4.8L V8

162.8 CARPET ONLY

176

259.6

N/A

1.49




