



State of West Virginia
 Department of Administration
 Purchasing Division
 2019 Washington Street East
 Post Office Box 50130
 Charleston, WV 25305-0130

Solicitation

NUMBER
6613C001

PAGE
1

ADDRESS CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTENTION OF:
ALAN CUMMINGS 304-558-2402

*B09130030 304-614-4853
 MDM II TRUCKING INC
 65A CLARKSBURG RD
 BUCKHANNON WV 26201

V
E
N
D
O
R

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
 VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
 BY ORDER

S
H
I
P
T
O

DATE PRINTED
08/15/2012

BID OPENING DATE: 08/29/2012 BID OPENING TIME 1:30PM

LINE	QUANTITY	UOP	CAT NO.	ITEM NUMBER	UNIT PRICE	AMOUNT
0001	1	EA		770-06		
STONE AND AGGREGATE - FALL/WINTER						
OPEN-END CONTRACT						
THE WEST VIRGINIA STATE PURCHASING DIVISION FOR THE AGENCY, THE WEST VIRGINIA DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS, IS SOLICITING BIDS TO PROVIDE THE AGENCY WITH AN OPEN-END CONTRACT TO FURNISH ALL LABOR, MATERIALS AND EQUIPMENT NECESSARY TO SUPPLY STONE AND AGGREGATE TO DISTRICTS 1 THRU 10 AS WELL AS CINDERS TO DISTRICTS 1,3,4,6 AND 7 PER THE ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS.						
***** THIS IS THE END OF RFQ 6613C001 ***** TOTAL: _____						

RECEIVED

2012 AUG 28 AM 8:48

WV PURCHASING DIVISION

SIGNATURE <i>M. M. M.</i>	TELEPHONE 304-614-4853	DATE 8-27-12
TITLE Owner	FEIN 45-0564989 001	ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO SOLICITATION, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'

Exhibit A.1 Pricing Schedule

VENDOR NAME: MDM II Trucking Inc.

Bid F.O.B. Vendor's Storage Site (Items A-W)

- a) SOURCE OF MATERIAL (State all sources for which bid prices apply) (e.g., Quarry location if Sandstone or Limestone; dredging or pit location if Gravel; production plant name and location if Slag)

J.F Allen Quarry Elkins Crystal Springs
J.F Allen Quarry Mashy Gap Kelley Mountain
Southern Asphalt & Paving Quarry Kelley Mountain

- b) EXACT LOCATION OF VENDOR'S STORAGE SITE(S) A separate bid schedule must be submitted when bid price varies between Vendors' storage sites.

N/A

Contract Item	Description of Material	Bid Price per Ton Items A-W F.O.B. Vendor's Storage Site		
		LIMESTONE SANDSTONE, GRAVEL, SAND	BLAST FURNACE SLAG	STEEL SLAG
A	Class 1 Aggregate			
B	Class 2 Aggregate			
C	Class 10 Aggregate			
D	AASHTO #1 Aggregate			
E	AASHTO #3 Aggregate			
F	AASHTO #4 Aggregate			
G	AASHTO #467 Aggregate			
H	AASHTO #57 Aggregate			
I	AASHTO #67 Aggregate			
J	AASHTO #7 Aggregate			
K	AASHTO #8 Aggregate			
L	AASHTO #9 Aggregate			
M	Stone for Gabions			
N	Fine Aggregate			
OA	Limestone Standard Abrasives			
OB	Sandstone Standard Abrasives			
PA	Limestone Modified Abrasives			
PB	Sandstone Modified Abrasives			
Q	Riprap			
R	Shot Rock			

No Bid

F.O.B. Division's Storage Site - DISTRICT 4

6613C001

Contract Item	Description of Aggregate	Estimated Quantity (TONS)	Location of DOH Storage Site	Bid Price (\$/Ton) F.O.B. DOH Storage Site		
				LIMESTONE SANDSTONE GRAVEL, SAND	BLAST FURNACE SLAG	STEEL SLAG
<u>PRESTON COUNTY</u>						
				<i>14.00 Ton Haul 16.00 Shot Rock</i>		
A	Class 1	2000	Fellowsville	<i>NO BID</i>		
B	Class 2	5000	Fellowsville			
D	AASHTO #1	1000	Fellowsville			
G	AASHTO #467	3000	Fellowsville			
H	AASHTO #57	3000	Fellowsville			
K	AASHTO #8	2000	Fellowsville			
L	AASHTO #9	5000	Fellowsville			
M	Gabion Stone	500	Fellowsville			
N	Fine Aggregate	5000	Fellowsville			
OA	Limestone Std Abr.	5000	Fellowsville			
OB	Sandstone Std Abr.	5000	Fellowsville			
PA	Limestone Mod Abr.	5000	Fellowsville			
PB	Sandstone Mod Abr.	5000	Fellowsville			
R	Shot Rock	500	Fellowsville		<i>30.00</i>	
W	Quarry Waste	100	Fellowsville	<i>NO BID</i>		

PRESTON COUNTY

A	Class 1	500	Macomber	<i>NO BID</i>		
B	Class 2	500	Macomber			
K	AASHTO #8	500	Macomber			
L	AASHTO #9	500	Macomber			
N	Fine Aggregate	500	Macomber			
OA	Limestone Std Abr.	500	Macomber			
OB	Sandstone Std Abr.	500	Macomber			
PA	Limestone Mod Abr.	500	Macomber			
PB	Sandstone Mod Abr.	500	Macomber			
R	Shot Rock	500	Macomber			

F.O.B. Division's Storage Site - DISTRICT 4

6613C001

Contract Item	Description of Aggregate	Estimated Quantity (TONS)	Location of DOH Storage Site	Bid Price (\$/Ton) F.O.B. DOH Storage Site		
				LIMESTONE SANDSTONE GRAVEL, SAND	BLAST FURNACE SLAG	STEEL SLAG
<u>PRESTON COUNTY</u>						
A	Class 1	1000	Coopers Rock I-68	<i>NO BID</i>		
K	AASHTO #8	3000	Coopers Rock I-68			
L	AASHTO #9	3000	Coopers Rock I-68			
M	Gabion Stone	500	Coopers Rock I-68			
OA	Limestone Std Abr.	3000	Coopers Rock I-68			
OB	Sandstone Std Abr.	3000	Coopers Rock I-68			
PA	Limestone Mod Abr.	3000	Coopers Rock I-68			
PB	Sandstone Mod Abr.	3000	Coopers Rock I-68			
R	Shot Rock	500	Coopers Rock I-68			

TAYLOR COUNTY

16.00 Ton Shot Rock

A	Class 1	1000	Pruntytown	<i>NO Bid</i>		
B	Class 2	5000	Pruntytown			
D	AASHTO #1	1000	Pruntytown			
G	AASHTO #467	1000	Pruntytown			
H	AASHTO #57	3000	Pruntytown			
K	AASHTO #8	6000	Pruntytown			
L	AASHTO #9	6000	Pruntytown			
M	Gabion Stone	500	Pruntytown			
N	Fine Aggregate	6000	Pruntytown			
OA	Limestone Std Abr.	6000	Pruntytown			
OB	Sandstone Std Abr.	6000	Pruntytown			
PA	Limestone Mod Abr.	6000	Pruntytown			
PB	Sandstone Mod Abr.	6000	Pruntytown			
R	Shot Rock	500	Pruntytown		<i>28.50</i>	
W	Quarry Waste	100	Pruntytown	<i>NO Bid</i>		

F.O.B. Division's Storage Site - DISTRICT 7

6613C001

Contract Item	Description of Aggregate	Estimated Quantity (TONS)	Location of DOH Storage Site	Bid Price (\$/Ton) F.O.B. DOH Storage Site		
				LIMESTONE SANDSTONE GRAVEL, SAND	BLAST FURNACE SLAG	STEEL SLAG
<u>BARBOUR COUNTY</u>						
A	Class 1	2000	Belington	No Bid		
B	Class 2	1500	Belington	14.50		
D	AASHTO #1	500	Belington	No Bid		
E	AASHTO #3	500	Belington			
G	AASHTO #467	700	Belington			
K	AASHTO #8	1500	Belington			
L	AASHTO #9	1000	Belington			
M	Gabion Stone	200	Belington			
OA	Limestone Std Abr.	3000	Belington			
OB	Sandstone Std Abr.	3000	Belington			
PA	Limestone Mod Abr.	500	Belington			
PB	Sandstone Mod Abr.	500	Belington			
R	Shot Rock	500	Belington	24.25		

BARBOUR COUNTY

A	Class 1	6000	Philippi	No Bid		
B	Class 2	3000	Philippi	16.40		
D	AASHTO #1	500	Philippi	No Bid		
E	AASHTO #3	500	Philippi			
G	AASHTO #467	2000	Philippi			
H	AASHTO #57	1200	Philippi			
K	AASHTO #8	2500	Philippi			
L	AASHTO #9	1500	Philippi			
M	Gabion Stone	500	Philippi			
OA	Limestone Std Abr.	5000	Philippi			
OB	Sandstone Std Abr.	5000	Philippi			
PA	Limestone Mod Abr.	500	Philippi			
PB	Sandstone Mod Abr.	500	Philippi			
R	Shot Rock	500	Philippi	25.25		

F.O.B. Division's Storage Site - DISTRICT 7

6613C001

Contract Item	Description of Aggregate	Estimated Quantity (TONS)	Location of DOH Storage Site	Bid Price (\$/Ton) F.O.B. DOH Storage Site		
				LIMESTONE SANDSTONE GRAVEL, SAND	BLAST FURNACE SLAG	STEEL SLAG
<u>BRAXTON COUNTY</u>						
A	Class 1	10000	Laurel	<i>NO B.id</i>		
B	Class 2	7500	Laurel			
D	AASHTO #1	500	Laurel			
E	AASHTO #3	2000	Laurel			
G	AASHTO #467	500	Laurel			
H	AASHTO #57	500	Laurel			
K	AASHTO #8	2500	Laurel			
L	AASHTO #9	1000	Laurel			
M	Gabion Stone	500	Laurel			
OA	Limestone Std Abr.	500	Laurel			
OB	Sandstone Std Abr.	500	Laurel			
PA	Limestone Mod Abr.	500	Laurel			
PB	Sandstone Mod Abr.	500	Laurel			
R	Shot Rock	1000	Laurel			30.00

GILMER COUNTY

A	Class 1	6000	Glenville	<i>NO B.id</i>		
B	Class 2	2500	Glenville			
D	AASHTO #1	700	Glenville			
E	AASHTO #3	1500	Glenville			
G	AASHTO #467	2000	Glenville			
H	AASHTO #57	500	Glenville			
K	AASHTO #8	2000	Glenville			
L	AASHTO #9	700	Glenville			
M	Gabion Stone	200	Glenville			
OA	Limestone Std Abr.	3500	Glenville			
OB	Sandstone Std Abr.	3500	Glenville			
PA	Limestone Mod Abr.	500	Glenville			
PB	Sandstone Mod Abr.	500	Glenville			
R	Shot Rock	1000	Glenville			25.00

F.O.B. Division's Storage Site - DISTRICT 7

6613C001

Contract Item	Description of Aggregate	Estimated Quantity (TONS)	Location of DOH Storage Site	Bid Price (\$/Ton) F.O.B. DOH Storage Site		
				LIMESTONE SANDSTONE GRAVEL, SAND	BLAST FURNACE SLAG	STEEL SLAG
<u>UPSHUR COUNTY</u>						
A	Class 1	5000	Headquarters	<i>No Bid</i>		
B	Class 2	3500	Headquarters	<i>15.25</i>		
D	AASHTO #1	500	Headquarters	<i>No Bid</i>		
E	AASHTO #3	1500	Headquarters			
G	AASHTO #467	2000	Headquarters			
K	AASHTO #8	2500	Headquarters			
L	AASHTO #9	1500	Headquarters			
M	Gabion Stone	500	Headquarters			
OA	Limestone Std Abr.	7000	Headquarters			
OB	Sandstone Std Abr.	7000	Headquarters			
PA	Limestone Mod Abr.	500	Headquarters			
PB	Sandstone Mod Abr.	500	Headquarters			
R	Shot Rock	500	Headquarters	<i>24.25</i>		

UPSHUR COUNTY

A	Class 1	2000	Kanawha Head	<i>No Bid</i>		
B	Class 2	1500	Kanawha Head			
D	AASHTO #1	500	Kanawha Head			
E	AASHTO #3	500	Kanawha Head			
G	AASHTO #467	1500	Kanawha Head			
K	AASHTO #8	1000	Kanawha Head			
L	AASHTO #9	500	Kanawha Head			
M	Gabion Stone	200	Kanawha Head			
OA	Limestone Std Abr.	2000	Kanawha Head			
OB	Sandstone Std Abr.	2000	Kanawha Head			
PA	Limestone Mod Abr.	500	Kanawha Head			
PB	Sandstone Mod Abr.	500	Kanawha Head			
R	Shot Rock	200	Kanawha Head		<i>30.00</i>	

F.O.B. Division's Storage Site - DISTRICT 7

6613C001

Contract	Description	Estimated	Location of	Bid Price (\$/Ton) F.O.B.
Item	of Aggregate	Quantity	DOH	DOH Storage Site
		(TONS)	Storage Site	

LEWIS COUNTY

				LIMESTONE SANDSTONE GRAVEL, SAND	BLAST FURNACE SLAG	STEEL SLAG
A	Class 1	8000	Bendale, Weston	NO Bid		
B	Class 2	5000	Bendale, Weston	17.50		
D	AASHTO #1	500	Bendale, Weston	NO Bid		
E	AASHTO #3	1500	Bendale, Weston			
G	AASHTO #467	5000	Bendale, Weston			
I	AASHTO #67	500	Bendale, Weston			
K	AASHTO #8	2500	Bendale, Weston			
L	AASHTO #9	1000	Bendale, Weston			
M	Gabion Stone	1000	Bendale, Weston			
OA	Limestone Std Abr.	6000	Bendale, Weston			
OB	Sandstone Std Abr.	6000	Bendale, Weston			
PA	Limestone Mod Abr.	500	Bendale, Weston			
PB	Sandstone Mod Abr.	500	Bendale, Weston			
R	Shot Rock	1200	Bendale, Weston	24.25		

LEWIS COUNTY

OA	Limestone Std Abr.	1000	Mudlick Corridor H	NO Bid		
OB	Sandstone Std Abr.	1000	Mudlick Corridor H			
PA	Limestone Mod Abr.	500	Mudlick Corridor H			
PB	Sandstone Mod Abr.	500	Mudlick Corridor H			

LEWIS COUNTY

A	Class 1	500	New HDQ/US 19 S.	NO Bid		
B	Class 2	500	New HDQ/US 19 S.	18.25		
D	AASHTO #1	250	New HDQ/US 19 S.	NO Bid		
E	AASHTO #3	500	New HDQ/US 19 S.			
G	AASHTO #467	250	New HDQ/US 19 S.			
K	AASHTO #8	250	New HDQ/US 19 S.			