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GENERAL TERMS & CONDITIONS
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION (RFQ) AND REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL (RFP)

1. Awards will be made in lhe best inlerest of the Slale of West Virginia.

2, The Stale may accept or reject in pait, or in whole, any bid.

3. Prior to any award, the apparent successful vendor must be propetly registered wilh the Purchasing Division
and have paid the required $125 fee.

4, All services performed or goods delivered under State Purchase Order/Coniracts are lo be conlinued for the
term of the Purchase Order/Contracts, contingent upon funds being appropriated by the Legislalure or olherwise
being made available, M the event funds are not approprialed or olherwise available for lhese services or goods
this Purchase Order/Contract becomes void and of ho sffect after June 30,

5, Payment may only be made afler the delivery and acceplance of goods or services.

6. Interest may be pald for late paymenl in accordance wilh the West Virginia Code.

7. Vendor preference will be granted upon wrillen request in accordance with the West Virginia Code.

8. The Stale of West Virginia is exempt fram federal and slate taxes and will not pay or reiimburse such taxes.

9. The Direclor of Purchasing may cancel ahy Purchase Order/Conlract upon 30 days wrillen nolice lo the seller.

10, The laws of the Slate of West Virginla and \he Legislative Rules of the Purchasing Division shall govern the
purchasing process,

11. Any reference to automalic renewal is hereby deleted. The Contract may be renewed only upon mulual wrilten
agreement of the parlies.

12. BANKRUPTCY: In the event the vendorfconlractor files for bankruptey protection, the State may deem
this contract null and void, and terminale such contract withoul further order,

13, HIPAA BUSINESS ASSOCIATE ADDENDUM: The West Virginia Stale Government HIPAA Business Associate
Addendum (BAA), approved by the Attorney General, is available online at www.state.wv.usfadmin/purchase/vre/hipaa.html
and is hereby made panl of the agreement provided that the Agenn?; meets the definition of a Cover Enlity
(45 CFR §160.103) and will be disclosing Protacted IHealth Information (46 CFR §160.103) to the vendor.

14. CONFIDENTIALITY: The vendor agrees that he or she will not disclose lo anyone, directly or indirectly, any such
personally Identifiable information or olher confidential information gained from the agency, unless the individual who is
the subject of the Informalion consents to the disclosure in wriling or the disclosure is made pursuant to the agency's
policies, Xrocedures, and rules. Vendor further agrees to comply with the Confidentiality Policies and Informalion
Security Accountabilily Requirements, set forlh in hitp:/www.stale wv.usfadmin/purchase/privacy/moliceConfidentiality.pd.

15. LICENSING: Vendors must be licensed and Ih good standing in accordance wilh any and all state and local laws and
requirements by any state or local agency of West Virginia, including, but nol limited to, the West Virginia Secretary
of State's Office, the West Virginia Tax Department, and the West Virginia Insurance Commission. The vendor must
provide all necessary raleases lto obtain informalion o enable the director or spending unit to
vetlfy that the vendor Is licensed and in good standing with tho above enlities.

16, ANTITRUST: In submilling a bid lo any agency for the State of West Virginia, the bidder offers and agrees thal
if he bid is accepted the bidder will convey, sell, assign or transfer to the State of West Virginia all rights, lille and interest
in and to all causes of action it may now or herealter acquire under the antitrust laws of the United States and the State of
West Virginia for price fixing and/or unreasonable restraints of trade relating to the paricular commodities or services
purchased or acquired by the Stale of West Virginia. Such assignment shall be made and become effective at the time the
purchasing agency tenders the initial payment lo the bidder.

| certlfy that this bid is made without prior understanding, agreement, or conneclion with any corporation, firm, limited
lability company, parinership, or person or entity submilling a bid for the same material, supplias, equipment or
setvices and is in all respects falr and without collusion or Fraud, | further ceilify that | am authorized to sign
the certification on behalf of the bidder or this bid.

INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS

1, Use the quolation forms provided by the Purchasing Division. Compiele all seclions of he quotation form.

2, ltems offered must be in compliance with the specifications. Any deviation from the specificalions must be clearly
indicated by the bidder. Allernates offered by the bidder as EQUAL lo the specificalions must be clearly
defined. A bidder offeling an allernale should allach complete specliicalions and literature to the bid. The
Purchasing Division may walve minor devialions lo specilicalions,

3. Unit prices shall prevail in case of discrepancy. Al quolations are considered F.0.B, destinalion unless allemate
shipping terms are clearly Identified in the quolalion.

4. All quotations must be delivered by the hidder to the office listed below prior to the date and time of the bid
opening. Failure of he bidder to deliver the quotations on time will result in bid disqualifications: Department of
Administration, Purchasing Division, 2019 Washingtont Streel East, P.Q. Box 50130, Charleston, WV 26305-0130

5, Communication during the solicilation, bid, evaluation or award periods, except through he Purchasing Divislon,
is strictly prohibited (W.Va. C.S.R. §148-1-6.6).

Rear 11500714
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SPECIFICATIONS

The following sections of the West Virginia Department of Transportation, Division of Highways
Standard Specification Roads and Bridges, adopted 2010, as modified by the January 1, 2011
Supplemental Specifications and the January 1, 2012 Supplemental Specifications shall apply to the
administration of this Contract: 101, 102.4, 102.5, 105.1, 105.3, 105.4, 105.10, 105.11, 105.12,
105.13, 106.3, 106.4, 106.5, 106.6, 106.7, 106.9, 107.1, 107.2, 107.3, 107.14, 107.19, 107.20,
108.8,109.1, 109.2, and 109.20

The terms "Contractor" and "Vendor" used in the above specifications or this contract are
interchangeable. Contractor shall mean Vendor and Vendor shall mean Contractor.

West Virginia Department of Transportation, Division of Highways Standard Specification Roads
and Bridges, adopted 2010, as modified by the January 1, 2011 Supplemental Specifications and
the January 1, 2012 Supplemental Specifications may be obtained from:

West Virginia Division of Highways
Contract Administration

Building 5, Room 722

1900 Kanawha Boulevard, East
Charleston, West Virginia 25305
Phone: 304-558-2885

hitp://www.transportation.wv.gov/highways/contractadmin/specifications/2010StandSpec/Pages/default. aspx
Herbicide fumnished under this contract shall conform to the physical and chemical properties set out

in the EPA Registration of the product provided by the Vendor.

BIDDING INSTRUCTIONS

Vendors may bid on any or all of the products listed on the Bid Schedule. Vendors may quote
Product Name requested or provide “an equal to” product.

The vendor shall list the trade name and EPA Registration Number on the Bid Schedule for each
product bid. Failure to list this information on the Bid Schedule will result in the disqualification of the
vendor's bid on that product.

The vendor shall provide the label from the item being bid as “an equal to” the product requested to
eliminate any confusion in determining equivalency to product item requested with their bid. The final
determination of equivalency will be made by the Division of Highways.

Equivalency, chemical name or equivalent, shall mean equal and not necessarily identical. Prior to
award of low bid the Division of Highways may require product samples for evaluation to determine
equivalency. Product specifications and technical information should be submitted with bid and may
also be used to determine equivalency.



The successful vendor shall fumish two product labels, for each product awarded, to the Division of
Highways. The labels shall provide pertinent information regarding product storage and handling or
this information shall otherwise be provided with each shipment.

TRAINING AND TECHNICAL ASSISTANCE

In order to bid on and be awarded items on this contract, the vendor must have a
representative, holding a valid Category 7 certification in West Virginia, available
to provide training and technical assistance as required or upon request by Division of
Highways personnel. Each bidder shall provide the name and telephone number of
their representative in the space provided below with their bid. The company shall
have a valid Category 12 certification in West Virginia. A copy of the
representative’s current Category 7 certification and a copy of the company’s
current Category 12 certification in West Virginia shall be submitted with the bid.

The vendor’'s failure to submit the above certification information with their bid
shall result in the total disqualification of the vendor’s bid.

NAME OF REPRESENTATIVE PHONE NUMBER ADDRESS
Charles E, Srny‘Hn (ﬂo\D‘SJ.orOTZ‘I 1850 Touchstons Rd. (o!rbn;al Hﬂ:leS,VA 239
CONTRACT AWARD

It is the intent to award a contract for each product listed on the Bid Schedule. Qualified vendors who
submit a valid low bid will be awarded a contract for those products for which their bid is low, provided
that the vendor has listed the trade name and EPA Registration Number on the Bid Schedule for

each product bid, as indicated in Section 2. Failure to list this information will result in the
disqualification of the vendor's bid on that product.

The award for each product will be based on the bid price per unit of measure as requested on the
Bid Schedule. Vendors are cautioned that the quantities on the Bid Schedule are estimates and only
used for evaluation purposes.

The State of West Virginia reserves the right to make multiple awards on this contract when itis in the
best interest of the State to do so.
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APPLY PESTICIDES CORRECTLY

Pesticide Reguiatory Programs # LICENSES EXPIRE DECEMBER 31ST EACH YEAR
1900 Kanawha Blvd., East # [F YOU HAVE ANY QUESTIONS, CALL (304) 558-2209

Charleston, WV 25305-0190

——

D

Here is your new applicator/technician card. Keep this stub for your records.
Please remove the punch out license and retain this sheet for your category
information. .

The category(ies) you are certified or registered in and the year it expires are
listed below. * 20 credits are required each 3 year penod for applicators and 4 ;
credits every year for registered technicians. %

Check your applicator information at www. kellysolutions.com/wv
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ACCEPTANCE PLAN

With each delivery of herbicide products to the Division of Highways, the vendor shall certify that the
products delivered conform to the properties described in the EPA Registration.

Material failing to comply with the quality requirement will not be accepted.

TESTING PROCEDURES

Upon award of contract, the successful vendor(s) shall supply the Division of Highways, Materials
Control, Soil and Testing Division, 190 Dry Branch Road, Charleston, WV 25306, the proper testing
procedures to determine the presence and concentration of the Herbicide in flowing water.

BID QUANTITIES
Vendors are cautioned that the quantities listed on the Bid Schedule are estimates only. Actual

requests will be placed to the awarded vendor from the Division of Highways by an Agency Release
at the time of need.

DELIVERY

Materials under this contract are to be shipped prepaid F.O.B. delivery to Division of Highways
District Storerooms as follows:

District One Charleston
District Two Huntington
District Three Parkersburg
District Four Clarksburg
District Five Burlington
District Six Moundsville
District Seven Weston
District Eight Elkins
District Nine Lewisburg
District Ten Princeton

Materials should be shipped to the location and in the quantity specified in the Agency Release within
20 days after the Agency Release is issued by the Division of Highways.



10.

1.

VENDOR'S INVOICES

Vendor's invoices must be submitted in original and four copies and contain the following:
a. Division of Highways Agency Release Number and Contract Number.
b. Total quantity and unit price with the total cost of each type of item fumished.

Note: Under no circumstance will the Division of Highways accept, or pay for, quantities of material in
excess of the quantity stated on the Agency Release.

RESTRICTED AND NON-RESTRICTED HERBICIDES

Herbicide products which have been declared RESTRICTED in their use by the Environmental
Protection Agency (EPA) must be applied under the supervision of a licensed herbicide applicator.
The Department reserves the right to disallow the use of RESTRICTED herbicides when non-
restricted herbicides are available to achieve the same objective.

PURCHASING CARD ACCEPTANCE

The State of West Virginia currently utilizes a VISA Purchasing Card Program which is issued
through a bank. The successful vendor(s) must accept the State of West Virginia VISA Purchasing
Card for payment of all orders placed by any State agency as a condition of award.



12 Herbicide Bid Schedule 6612C024
HERBICIDES % Concentration/ Cost Per
Pounds per Gallon |Estimated| Unitof | Unitof | Extended
[tem # Description of Active Ingredients | Quantity | Measure | Measure Cost
DOH-1H |Water Soluble Emulsifiable Concentrats Containing:
Ammonium Salt of Fosamine with Suriactant 4 bs/gellon
Product Trade Name: Krenite S or equal Keeni +ﬂ X
EPA Registration Number: ___352- 345
A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 3000 galon |854.15  [¥117 45000
B) Supplied in 15 gallon returnable/refillable containers 3000 gallon | HYS5.43 | H13b,35. 00
DOH-2H |Water Soluble Emulsifizble Concentrate Containing:
Isopropylamine Salt of Clyphosate
Phosphate Ester Surfactant 50.20%
Product Trade Name: Roundup Pro Concentrate or equal _Bg_“hdgﬁ -pmfmcnjrrdi
EPA Registration Number: S34-529
A) Supplied in 30 gallon plastic refurnable drums. 6000 gallon | %120 18724900
B) Supplied in 2.5 gallon contziners in lots of 5 gallons 6000 gallon ¥12.05 45‘).‘2,300_00
C) Supplied in 15 gallon returnable/refillable containers 6000 gallon |¥L2.0% 472 440,00
D) Supplied in 288 gallon retumable/refillable shuttle. 205 sallon 6000 gellon 3 11.78 Ejo,m_oa
DOH-3H |Dispersible Granules Containing: Sulfometuron Methyl 75% )
Product Trade Name: Qust XP or equal Dust XP / Su |F°""I
EPA Registration Number: _3$2-6bl Sulfowet 352-401-558¢
A) Supplied in 3 pound containers in lots of 24 pounds  dust XP 2-&Y oz. 100 pound |84¢.3S lg'-l_i 35.00
B) Suppliedin 3pound jug  Sulfordd 100 pound |B2$.9p J;sqo.oo
DOH-4H |Water Soluble Aqueous Suspension Containing: Oryzalin 4 |bsfgallon
Product Trade Name: Oryzalin 4 Pro or equal SI-\rF lan As
EPA Registration Number: _76S06- 43 _ .
A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lofs of 5 gallons 250 gallon |B4€.16 #12 025 .00
DOH-5H |Agqueous Solution Containing: Imazapyr 2 |bs/gallon
Product Trade Name: Arsenal Powerline or equal Arsengl Pwu’l;aL/ Polaris fachitads
EPA Registration Number: 341-431_ Polaris Herbiue 228-534
£) Supplied in 2.5 gzllon containers in lots of 5 galions _ Polaris Huwbiade 150 gallon Bya.15 $731250
B) Supplied in 15 gallon drums  Arsene] Porreclinl 150 gallon |¥52.9, |B7424.60 '




12 Herbicide Bid Schedule 6612C024
HERBICIDES % Concentration/ Cost Per
Pounds per Gallon |Estimated| Unitof | Unitof | Extended
item # Description of Active Ingredients | Quantity | Measure| Measure Cost
DOH-8H |Aqueous Carrier Confzining: Pendimethalin 3.8 Ibs/galion
Product Trade Name: Pendulum AquaCap or equal ?t.mlulum Aap.g_ci;f
EPA Registration Number: _241-4lb S
A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 600 gallon | ¥45.20  [27126.00
DOH-7H |Water Soluble Concentrate Containing: Triclopyr 3 Ibs/galion
Product Trade Name: Garlon 3A or equal _ Garlon 3A /Element 3A
EPA Registration Number: 62719-37 __ Elemest 3A &2719-37
A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons  Element 34 500 gallon | #3343 Jtlb,‘l:.'s,on
B) Supplied in 30 gallon containers  Elewsdd 3R 500 gallon | 33345 P75
C) Supplied in 15 gallon confinuum retumable/refiiable containers 4
in pallets of 9 containers.  Garlon 3A 500 galon | “5k80 {2300 0
DOH-8H |Water Soluble Concentrate Containing: Triciopyr 4 |bs/gallon
Product Trade Name: Garlon 4 Ultra or equal _Grarlyn 4 Ultea /Elewent 4
EPA Registration Number: 2719-527 _ Elaend 4 63719-40
A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons  Elewent - 250 galon |Bd1.Ls #10 412 50
B) Supplied in 30 gallon containers  Elemtet 4 250 galon [BYLLS o, }12.50
C) Supplied in 15 gallon continuum retumable/refillzble containers
! in Fg?aliets of9 gontainers. Gacha ¥ Ulha 250 gallon 35245 By LIS
DOH-9H |A Water Soluble Dispersible Granule Containing: Diuron 80.00%
Product Trade Name: Karmex XP or equal Pacrol DF
EPA Registration Number: __b222-5] _
A) Supplied in 5 pound bags in lots of 10 bags 2000 pound $#4,25 £ % So0.00
B) Supplied in 25 pound bags 2000 pound [#Y.2s #€ 500,00
DOH-10H |Water Soluble Liquid Containing: Dimethylamine Salt of 2, 4-D acid 3.8 llbs/gallon
Product Trade Name: DM A4 or equal __ DMA y / Platoon
EPA Registration Number: _£2719-3 __ Plateon 228-14S
A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in fots of 5 gallons  Platosn 100 gallon [|#13.33 8) 33¢,00
B) Supplied in 30 gallon containers  Platoon 100 galon |3133% B 3% .00
C) Supplied in 15 gallon retumable/refillable containers
in pallets of 9 containers. pMA Y 100 gallon 21395 |51385.00

LL




12 Herbicide Bid Schedule 6612C024
HERBICIDES % Concentration/ Cost Per
Pounds per Gallon | Estimated | Unitof | Unit of | Extended
[tem # Description of Active Ingredients | Quantity | Measure| Measure Cost
DOH-11H |Water Soluble Liguid Containing:
Ammonium Salt of Imazapic 23.50%

Product Trade Name: Plateau or equal Plateau

EPA Registration Number: _241-3L5

A) Supplied in 1 gallon containers in lots of 2 gallons 50 galon |Fl2to  [B5L3e.00

B) Supplied in 1.44 ounce packets in lots of 14 packeis 4444 packet NA

C) Supplied in 1 quart containers in lofs of 4 quarts 200 quart NA

D) Supplied in 15 gallon containers 4 containers |4 16.25 i(,.qqs_ 8
DOH-12H |A Dispersible Liquid Containing: Hexezinone 2 Ibs/galion

Product Trade Name: Velpar L or equal ___Velpar L

EPA Registration Number, _352-392. _

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lofs of 5 gallons 50 gallon F$3.36  [¥4,190.00
DOH-13H |Dry Flowable Containing: Metsulfuron Methyl 60%

Product Trade Name: Escort XP or equal __Estort X/ M*‘*’QD’MF

EPA Registration Number: 332-439 Mckeal 353-439-4554%

A) Supplied in 16 ounce containers in lots of 8 pounds (8-16 oz cirs) "tf.‘:é 2400 ounce | ¥2.6S $L 300,00

B) Supplied in 16 ounce jugs  Mefeel VMF 2400 ounce |¥1eS 3L 3,0.00

C) Supplied in 64 ounce jug retumable/refillable  Escort XP  2~LHoz. 2400 ounce |%3.65 $4100.00
DOH-14H |Water Soluble Granule Herbicide Containing:

Ammonium Salt of Glyphosate 71.40%

Product Trade Name: Roundup Pro Dry or equal

EPA Registration Number: R _

A) Supplied in 23.25 pound box 25 box | NoBid |
DOH-15H |Dry Flowable Containing: Chlorsulfuron 75%

Product Trade Name: Telar XP or equal Tt-hf ﬂ’

EPA Registration Number: _351-654 _ _

A) Supplied in 8 x 16 ounce containter to & case 160 ounce | 3395 [E2232.00

A




12

Herbicide Bid Schedule

6612C024

HERBICIDES

ltem #

Description

% Concentration/
Pounds per Gallon
of Active Ingredients

Estimated
Quantity

Unit of
Measure

Cost Per
Unit of
Measure

Extended
Cost

DOH-16H

A Liquid Solution Containing:

Isooctyl ester of 2.4 Dichlorophenoxyacetic Acid

2-ethylhrxyl ester of +R-2-(2,4-Dichlorophenoxy Propionic Acid
Dicamba (3, 6-Dicholoro-c-anisic Acid)

32.48%
15.90%
5.38%

Product Trade Name: BK-800 or equal E2 Her h"f—;ﬂh

EPA Registration Number: _ 228-442.

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons

100

gallon

24995

F4499s5.00

B) Supplied in 30 gallon drums

100

gallon

84q qs

Y4 495.00

DOH-17H

Dry Flowable Contzining: Tebuthiuron

80%

Product Trade Name: Spike 80 DF or equal Spike 0 PF

EPA Registration Number: _ &2 719- (07

A) Supplied in 4 pound bags in [ois of 24 pounds

50

pound

119.95

99250 |

B) Supplied in 25 pound bags

50

pound

518.3s

£42.50

DOH-18H

A Water Soluble Emulsfiable Concenfrate Containing: Clopyralid

3 Ibs/gallen

Product Trade Name: Transline or equal Trdnshng

EPA Regisiration Number: _63714- 239

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons

25

gellon

3119.43

¥2940.25

B) Supplied in .5 gallon containers in lots of 2 gallons

25

gallon

mﬁm

3149313

DOH-18H

Aqueous Solution Confaining:
Isopropylamine Salt of Imazapyr

27.60%

Product Trade Name: Stalker or equal __ Stalker

EPA Registration Number: _241-39%

A) Supplied in 1 quart containers in lots of 4 quarts

200

quart

[#03.09

412,61%.00

DOH-20H

Aqueous Solution Containing:
Diglycolamine Salt of 3, 6-Dichloro-0-Anisic Acid

4 lbs/galion

Product Trade Name: Vangquish or equal Vdngy;f'k

EPA Registration Number: _323-317

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of § ga[[o?m-s

300

gallon

#5495

21644500

B) Supplied in 15 gallon retumable/refillable containers

in pellets of S containers.

300

gallon

5545

BIL 495,001
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HERBICIDES

ltem #

Description

% Concentration/
Pounds per Gallon
of Active Ingredients

Estimated
Quantity

Unit of
Measure

Cost Per
Unit of
Measure

Extended
Cost

DOH-21H

.75 Ibs/gallon

Aqueous Solution Containing: Triciopyr
Product Trade Name: Pathfinder Il or equal Paﬂ'-’r,mlr-r i

EPA Registration Number: _ (2119~ 176

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons

300

gallon

|£33.43

Ii 10,03k .06

DOH-22H

A Water Soluble Emulsfiable Concentrate Containing:
Isopropylamine Szlt of Glyphosate

53.80%

Product Trade Name: Rodeo or equal Aquom+

EPA Registration Number; _22g-365

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon contziners in lots of 5 galions

100

gallon

31218

§),21500

B) Supplied in 30 gallon plastic retumable drums

100

gallon

$149

$1199.20

DOH-23H

A Liquid Containing: Aminopyralid

Product Trade Name: Milestone VM or equal _ Miltstore VM ~rame to he' M lestont™

EPA Registration Number: __2719-531

40.60%

A) Supplied in 1 quart containers, 12 containers per lot

200

quarts

870,22

F153%.00

B) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons

50

gallon

¥,9913

5 1 4% So

DOH-24H

Water Dispersible Granular Material Conta;mng rodiamine
Product Trade Name: Endurance or equal Ea‘mﬂnﬂf/ Proclipse CS Wkt

EPA Regjstration Number: _ IB8UBH8 23§39 Proclipse 323-434

65%

A) Supplied in 10 pound containers, 50 pounds per lot Enduranat

100

pound

£9.15

#9300

A) Supplied in 5 pound containers, 50 pounds per lot

100

pound

¥q.s

§4915.60

DOH-25H

?rb&lt'pi{ Q_,S wdi
Emulsifiable Concentrate Containing: Quizalofop P-Ethyl

Product Trade Name: Assure Il or equal

EPA Registration Number:

.88 Ibs/gallon

A) Supplied in 1 gallon containers in lots of 4 gzllons

18

gellon

No Bid

DOH-26H

Emulsifiable Concentrate Containing: Fluazifop-P-butyl

Product Trade Name: Ornamec or equal

EPA Registration Number.

8.75%

A) Supplied in 1 gallon containers in lots of 4 gallons

16

gallon

No Bid

/Al
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Herbicide Bid Schedule

6612C024

HERBICIDES

ltem #

Description

% Concentration/
Pounds per Gallon
of Active Ingredients

Estimated
Quantity

Unit of
Measure

Cost Per
Unit of | Extended
Measure Cost

DOH-27H

A Dispersible Granule Containing:
Imazapyr
Diuron

7.78%
62.22%

Product Trade Name: Szahara DG cr equal Sahara D&

EPA Registration Number: _241-372

A) Supplied in 10 pound bags in lots of 40 pounds

50

pound

410,05 [$502.50

DOH-28H

A Water Soluble Dry Granule Containing: Sulfosulfuron

Product Trade Name: Qutrider or equal Dutcidly

EPA Registration Number; __534-50o

75%

A) Supplied in 20 ounce botiles in lots of 200 ounce

400

ounce

[81122 %4 729.00

DOH-29H

A Liquid Contzining: Diuron

40%

Product Trade Name: Direx 4L or equal Diuron YL

EPA Registration Number: _ 34704 -¥54

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons

gallon

82082  [#10yl.e0

DOH-30H

A Liguid Containing: Fluroxypyr

Product Trade Name: Fluroxypyr or equal

EPA Registration Number:

26.20%

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of § gallons

100

gallon

NoBid |

DOH-31H

A Liquid Containing: Fluroxypyr

Product Trade Name: Vista XRT or equal Vista YRT

EPA Registration Number: _6379-5%6

45.52%

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons

100

gallon

52 Fisa7qm

DOH-32H

Wettable Granule Formulation Containing:

Sodium Salt of Diflufenzopy: 2-[1-({3.5-Difluorophenylamino} Carbony}]

Hydrazono} Ethyl)-3-Pyridinecarboxylic Acid, Sodium
Sodium Salt of 3.8-Dicholoro-o-anisic Acid

21.40%
55.00%

Product Trade Name: Overdrive or equal ___ Over dnve

EPA Registration Number: _7464-150

A) Supplied in 7.5 pound jugs, 30 pounds per case

100

pound

(32748 [Z27ygo




12 Herbicide Bid Schedule 6612C024
HERBICIDES % Concentration/ Cost Per
Pounds per Gallon | Estimated | Unitof | Unitof | Extended
ltem £ Description of Active Ingredients | Quantity | Measure | Measure | Cost
DOH-33H |Dispersible Granules Containing:
Sulfometuren Methyl 56.25%
Chlorsulfuron 18.75%
Product Trade Name: Landmark XP cr egual Lﬂw:lnark )S“P
EPA Registration Number: _352-C4S
A) Supplied in 4 pound jugs in lots of 32 pounds 100 pound |¥1lbos | €1 LoS.o0
B) Supplied in 64 ounce jug, retumable/refilleble 264 ez. 1600 ounce |§7.24 81),594-00
DOH-34H |Dispersible Granules Containing:
Sulfometuron Methyl 56.25%
Metsulfuron Methyl 15.00%
Product Trade Name: OQust Extra or equal Dust E'ﬁh"-/ Sulford Exira
EPA Registration Number: _352-b32  Sulfomet Etfra 352-622-355%2
A) Supplied in 4 pound jugs in lots of 32 pounds _ Sulfed Exdra 400 pound 22590 Fio 3(,0.00
B) Supplied in 64 ounce jug, retumablefrefilable  Qust Bdra  2-LYez, 6400 ounce 1$29%  [Figs2.00
C) Supplied in 12 pound jugs 400 pound | Ne Bd
DOH-35H |A Dry Flowable Granule Containing:
Bromacil 40%
Diuron 40%
Product Trade Name: Krovar | DF or equal Krovar 1 DF
EPA Registration Number: __352-305
A) Supplied in 8 pound contziners in lots of 8 containers 50 pound | Biodd  [$544.00
DOH-36H |A Liquid Containing:
Imazapic 8.13%
Glyphosate 21.54%
Product Trade Name: Joumney or equal Taurnlg
EPA Registration Number; _241-H17 _
A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 100 | gallon ]-TI:H_ 4s |§|1ﬂ}5_°¢3

91




12 Herbicide Bid Schedule 6612C024
HERBICIDES % Concentration/ Cost Per
Pounds per Gallon | Estimated | Unitof | Unitof | Extended
ltem # Description of Active Ingredients | Quantity | Measure| Measure Cost
DOH-37H |A Liquid Containing:
Dimethylamine Salt of 2,4-Dichlovophenoxyacetic Acid 24.58%
Dimethylamine Salt of Dicamba (3,8-Dichloro-0-Anisic Acid) 12.82%
Product Trade Name: Veteran 720 or equal Veftran 720
EPA Regisiration Number: _22%-24S _
A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lofs of 5 gallons 100 gallon $32.28 53,03-5.05
B) Supplied in 30 gallon drums 100 galon [F29.97  F2d91.00
DOH-38H |Dispersible Granules Containing:
Chiorsulfuron 8%
Sulfometuron Methyl 18%
Sulfenfrazone 48%
Product Trade Name: Throttle XP or equal Theottle XP
EPA Regisiration Number: _352-725 _
A) Supplied in 3.9 pound containers, 8 containers per case 100 pound |¥€4.20 5€ 42000
DOH-39H |Water Soluble Dispersible Extruded Paste Granule Containing:
Aminocyclopyrachlor 38.50%
Chlorsulfuron 15.80%
Product Trade Name: Perspective™ or equal Plrﬁgldivﬂ
EPA Registration Number. __352-%4b
A) Supplied in 20 ounce containers in lots of 240 ounces NA 240 OUNGes NA
B) Supplied in Z0maresily 125 lb_wntminer 40 o2 [913.00 344 00
C) Supplied in 5 pound contziners in lots of 40 pounds 80 pounds [®73.(0 4s $3%.00
D) Supplied in 5 pound jug 20 pounds P13..0  [®)422.00
DOH<0H |Water Soluble Dispersible Extruded Paste Granule Containing:
Aminocyclopyrachlor 30.50%
Metsulfuron methyl 12.60%
Product Trade Name: Streamline™ or equal ___d{(tamling
EPA Regjstration Number: _352-%4% _
A) Supplied in 3 pound containers in lots 0f 24 pounds 9% pounds |B82.4p [¥7,d10.40
B) Supplied in 3 pound jug 98 pounds |B%24o F“}:q 10.4D
O Supidin 20 poued by A pewds FOW H7900S




12 Herbicide Bid Schedule 6612C024
HERBICIDES % Concentration/ Cost Per
Pounds per Galion | Estimated | Unitof | Unit of | Extended
item # Description of Active Ingredients | Quantity | Measure| Measure Cost
DOH-41H |Water Soluble Dispersible Extruded Paste Granule Containing:
Imazapry 31.60%
Aminocyclopyrachior 22.80%
Metsulfuron methy! 7.30%
Product Trade Name: Viewpoint™ or equal W‘U?"'n't
EPA Registration Number: __352.-94] }
A) Supplied in 5 pound containers in lofs of 40 pounds 100 pounds |¥5¢.91 ¥5 82100
B) Supplied in 5 pound jug Q) Supplied jn 20 th hag (35€71/1b) 100 pounds |[85¢ 71 35 47).%0
DOH-42H |A Liguid Containing: - ¢ I - /
Indaziflam 19.05%
) (1.87 pounds per gal)
Product Trade Name: ESPLANADE 200SC cr equal __Esplaghe 2003C
EPA Registration Number; _ 432-15lb _
A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 50 galons |£975.00 3%,’19.90
B) Supplied in 1 quart containers in lots of 1 gallon 50 gallons 41,;(,)50/{[- $3 Ss0.00
3
8 IpSo.ob/jAl

8T




12 Herbicide Bid Schedule 6612C024
ADJUVANTS Cost Per
Estimated Unit of Unitof | Extended
ltem # Description Quantity Measure | Measure Cost

DOH-1A  |A Water Soluble Blue Liquid Spray Pattemn Indicator

Product Trade Name: Bullseye or equal __ Balstye

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons. 100 galon [¥35.e5  [¥3505.00
DOH-2A  |A Miscible-Dispersible Liquid Defoamer (30% Active Ingredient)

Product Trade Name: ___Unfoam? _quact

A) Supplied in _1quat  containersin lofs of ___1* . 100 sl [ABBLS [B136S.00
DOH-3A  |A Diluent with Emulsifiers

Product Trade Name: Hygrade EC or Arborchem Basal Oil or Bark Oil EC or

Alenza Basal Qil or Penevator or equal Bark 01l EC

A) Supplied in containers in lots of 100 [ gallon [Hags [¥9%5.00
DOH-4A  |Non-lonic Surfactant (80% Active Ingredient)

Product Trade Name: ___ B¢ Sereader 9o

A) Supplied in _2S galba_ containersinlots of __ 2 . 100 [ galon [F109S  [31,095.00
DOH-5A A Granular/Flake Drift Control Agent

Product Trade Name:

A) Supplied in containers in lots of 100 | pound | NoBid |
DOH-6A  |A Liquid Drift Control Agent

Product Trade Name: ___ Reign LC "

A) Supplied in _Lqgact _ containers inlotsof X 100 | S [844s | 4445 .00
DOH-7TA  |Aquatic Surfactant

Product Trade Name: Spreadis 9o ___

A) Supplied in_2S4ailsn _ containersin lots of ___ 2~ 100 ] gallon | #1093 | 095 20
DOH-8A |A Water Soluble Liquid Spray Pattemn Indicator

Product Trade Name: Elueprint Plus or equal

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 3 gallons. 100 | gallon | WNo Bid |
DOH-9A |A Non-lonic Sticker Spreader

Product Trade Name: Nu-Film-IR or equal Attach

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of ___ 2 100 | gallon [B34so  [$3M¥Sp.co
DOH-10A |A Ready-to-Use Formula Containing Paraffinic Oil Emulsifiers

Product Trade Name: Thinvert RTU or equal

A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lois of 5 gallons per case. 100 gallon No Bid

B) Supplied in 15 gallon drum. 100 gallon N> Bid

6T




12 Herbicide Bid Schedule 6612C024
ADJUVANTS Cost Per
Estimated Unit of Unit of Extended
Item # Description Quantity Measure | Measure Cost
DOH-11A |A Concentrate Formula Containing Paraffinic Oil Emulsifiers and Surfactants
Product Trade Name: Thinvert RTU or equal
A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons per case. 100 gallon No Bid
B) Supplied in 15 gallon drum. 100 gallon No Bid
SAFETY EQUIPMENT Cost Per
Estimated Unit of Unit of | Extended
ltem # Description Quantity Measure | Measure Cost
DOH-1S  |Emergency Spill Kit Containing:
15 Universal Plus Sorbent Pads
3 Cobra Coils
1 Pair Safety Goggles
1 Pair Latex Gloves
1 Large Refuse Bag
1 List of Environmental Compliance Telephone Numbers
Size: 18"x18"x4" Vacuum
Packed in Puncture Resistant Foil
Product Trade Name:
A) Supplied by the Kit 1 [ each [ NeBid |
DOH-2S  |A Granular/Flake Spill Absorbent
Product Trade Name:
A) Supplied in containers in lots of 1 pound | No Bid
DOH-3S |32 ounce Eye Wash Bottle
Product Trade Name:
A) Supplied per each. 1 [ each | ¥pRi |

0¢



12 Herbicide Bid Schedule 6612C024
MISCELLANEOUS Cost Per
Estimated Unit of Unitof | Extended
ltem # Description Quantity Measure | Measure Cost
DOH-1M  |Pressure Rinser
Product Trade Name: Easy Rinse or equal
A) Supplied per each. 1 each No Bid
DOH-2M  |Hand Soap with Citrus Oil
Product Trade Name: Zep or equal
A) Supplied in 32 ounce containers in lots of 20 containers per case 1 container No Bid
DOH-3M |A Biostimulant Containing
Soluble Potash 1.00%
Iron 0.36%
Manure Extract 79.30%
Humic and Fulvic Acid Extract 9.00%
Kelp Extract 1.20%
Organo-Modified Silaxane Surfactant 0.36%
Product Trade Name: Launch or equal
A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons 25 [ gallon | NeBd |
DOH-4M  |Nitri-Solve 100% - 15 mil 13" Nitrile Gloves - Compliance EPA 40 CFR 170
A) Supplied size Small. 1 pair No Bid
B) Supplied size Medium. 1 pair
C) Supplied size Large. 1 pair
D) Supplied size X-Large. 1 pair
E) Supplied size XX-Large. 1 pair v
DOH-5M |A 5-gallon Backpack Sprayer
Product Trade Name: Birchmeier or equal
A) Supplied per sprayer 1 each No Bid
B) Gasket Set for Sprayer Pump 1 set |
C) Hose Valve and Wand Repair Kit 1 kit v
DOH-6M  [2-Quart Handheld Pressure Sprayer
- Product Trade Name: Tolco or equal
A) Supplied per sprayer 1 [ each [ NoBid |

1e



12 Herbicide Bid Schedule 6612C024
MISCELLANEOUS Cost Per
Estimated Unit of Unit of Extended
Item # Description Quantity Measure | Measure Cost

DOH-7M  |Closed System Backpack Sprayer

Product Trade Name: Birchmeier BCS or equal

A) Supplied per sprayer 1 each Nq 8:4

B) Gasket Set for Sprayer Pump 1 set |

C) Hose Valve and Wand Repair Kit 1 kit /

¢e



DOCUMENTS REQUIRED FROM AGENCY
FOR A REQUEST FOR QUOTATION (RFQ)

Request for Quotation (RFQ): Used for one-time/single purchases, open-end contracts.

The information below is a checklist of Agency responsibilities in processing a Request
for Quotation (RFQ). Please note, however, that while this information is accurate in
most cases, there may be occasions where additional information may be needed or
required.

Description

*WV-35 Requisition or RQH Screen Signed by Agency (with estimated value & maximum budget amts)

Specifications & suggested vendor list (name & address)

** WVFIMS Agency Cover Sheet (P-Document)

Pre-Approvals when applicable (AG; CTO/ISC; Design Build; Gen Ser; Prison Industries;
Surplus Property)

NA

Mandatory Pre-Bid Attendee List

Addendums (information prepared by agency for processing by Purchasing Division)

Signed Agency Recommendation for Award

Purchasing Affidavit Signed and Dated by Successful Vendor (may be provided through bid process)

Certification of Non-Conflict of Interest Signed by Agency Procurement Officer & Other Appropriate Staff

WV-96 Agreement Addendum signed by Vendor & Agency (if applicable)

* Maximum budget amounts must be reflected on the WV-35 to allow for price negotiations as
authorized and described in 5A-3-11a of the Code and 148-1-7, 7.11 of the Code of Rules.

** Projects that are funded by sources whereby invoices will not be processed by the State Auditor's
Office do not require a P-Document. However, in those cases the funding source must be named on
the WV-35 to be carried forward on the Purchase Order.

Jul-07
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" wne WV PURCHASING 0GB SECT Eex 3

. Department of Administration Quotation
E Purchasing Division
n 2019 Washington Street East
.. Post Office Box 50130
|| Charleston, WV 25205-0130

X913105630 02 B04-520-0789
CROP PRODUCTION SERVICES INC
1850 TOUCHSTONE RD

COLONIAL HEIGHTS VA 23834

6612C024

9]

ALAN CUMMINGS

304-Khg-2402

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED

BY ORDER

BID OPENING DATE: 05/09/20

_BID QPENING TIME

THE BID,

DISQUALIFICATION |0OF THE BID.

0001 = A 675-85
1

exxx%%  THIS IS THE END OF RFQ

01

ADEENDUH NO.
ISSUED TO CHANGE [BID OPENING DATE FROM
1:30 P.M. TO| 05/0/9/2012 AT 1:30 P.M. AND TO CLARIFY
SECTION 3 OF) THE [BID PACKET. A COPY OF| THE
REPRESENTATIVE'S [CURRENT CATEGORY 7 CE
COPY OF THE COMPANY'|S CURRENT CATEGDRY 12
CERTIFICATION IN MWEST VIRGINIA SHALL B

66

FAILURE TO SUBMIT| BOTH| THE REPRESENTAT|IVE'S AND THE
COMPANY'S CERTIFICATIONS WILL RESULT 1IN

05/02/2012 AT

RTIFICATION AND

SUBMITTED WITH

HERBICIDE, ADJUVANTS, [SAFETY & MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS

12CI024 xxxxxx TDTAL:

M </ Ajﬂ/ ELEPHONE

5/W /12

MTLe FEIN

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED AROVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED VENDOR'




WV PURCHASING DIVN. Fax 304-558-3970 May 4 2012 03:20pm PO0O1/001
State Of Wﬁst erginia ReqUESt for B s BEL S ER i T PAM~f-l»>,
Dapartment of Administration  Quotation 1

Purchasing Division —

2019 WaShing‘on Street East SRS RESS CORBEEPL O ALIER D A A

Post Office Box 50130 '

Charleston, WV 25305-0130 NGS
04-558-2402

_*9713105630 02 804-520-0789 S—
CROP PRODUCTION SERVICES TINC {DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

1850 TOUCHSTONE RD VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER

COLONIAL HEIGHTS VA 23834

057047301
D OFENNGDATE) 05/16/2012 BID OPENING TIME __01l:30PM

ADDHENDUM NO. 02

—

SSUED TO CHANGE BID OPENING DATE FROM 05/09/2012 AT
1:30 P.M. TO p5/16|/2012] AT 1:30 P.M.

DOl EA 6[715-85
1
HERBICIDE, ADPUVAN[IS, SAFETY & MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS

*fxxxx  THIS [S TH

T

END| OF RFQ 6612C0R4 *+**x*%% TOTAL:

SIGNATURE

TELEPHONE DATE
ol £ /ig/ 1
TITLE FEIN ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'
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copy o

West Virginia Dept. of Agrictllure APPLY PESTICIDES CORRECTLY |
Pesticide Regulatory Programs R # LICENSES EXPIRE DECEMBER 31ST FACH YEAR

1900 Kanawha Blvd., East i * JF YOU HAVE ANY QUESTIONS, CALL (304 =
Chartaston, WV 25305-0190 ‘ b i £ g el ‘ . ‘ Flgsas

Here is your new apphcator/techmcran card. Keep this stub for your records.
Please remove the punch out hcense and :etafn this sheet for your category
information. P gy et |

The category(ies) you a.ve cemﬁed or reg:ste:ed in and me year it expires are
listed below. * 20 credits are'requited each 3 year. peuod for applicators and 4
credits every year for registered techmc!ans il . , 3

\
SER

%3

Check your applicator mfo.rmatron at WWW keﬂysoluhons com/wv

YOUR PESTICIDE UCENSE’ 1S ATTACHED BELOW.

\&—- PUNCH OUT LICENSE CARD HERE 2 i L} 4 ” r]

6,7,12

[ TOR USE ONLY IN CATEGORIES ABOVE N 05032 i
WEST VIRGINIA CERTIFICATION

Expires: 12/31/2012 C05032 Charles Eugene Smyth
Commercial Pesticide Applicator

Charles Eugene Smyth Continuing Education Credits Credits  Credits !

3 Credit Information Acquired Required Needed
Crop Production Services, Inc.
1850 Touchstone Road 12-Pesliclde Storage & 12 - 8 Due 12/31/2013
Colonial Hgts. VA Dislribulion
@” 6-Aqualic Pesl Conlrol B 20 12 Due 12/31/2013
7-Right-of-Way/Industrial 2
foed 0 20 20  Due 12/31/2014

N
TRANSFERABLE AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE {

s sk
R
Lo - i B

MO ImmMezZ> I o




e 09100 State of West Virginia 24
VENDOR PREFERENCE CERTIFICATE

Cerlification and applicalion* is hereby made for Preference in accordance with West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37. (Does not apply to
construction conlracts). West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37, provides an apportunily for qualifying vendors lo request (allhetlime of bid)
preference for (heir residency status. Such preference is an evaluation method only and will be applied only to the cost bid in
accordance with the West Virginla Coda. This certificate for applicaion is to be used to request such preference. The Purchasing
Division will make the determination of the Resident Vendor Preference, if applicable.

1. Application is made for 2.5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is an individual resldent vendor and has resided conlinuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preced-
ing the date of this certification; or,

Bidderis a partnership, assoclalion or corporation resident vendor and has maintained its headquarters or principal place of
business continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or80% of the
ownership interest of Bidder is held by another individual, partnership, assogiation or corporation resident vendor who has
maintained its headquarters or principal place of business continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately
preceding the date of this cerlification; or,

Bldder is a nonresident venclor which has an affiliate or subsidiary which employs a minimum of one hundred state residents
and which has maintained its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virglnia continuously for the four (4)
years Immedialely preceding the date of this cerlification; or,

2, Application ts made for 2.5% resident vendot preference for the reason checked:

Bidder Is a resident vendor who certifies that, during the life of the conltract, on average at least 76% of the employees
working on the project being bid are residents of West Virginia who have restded in the slate conlinuously for the lwa years
immediately preceding submlission of this bid; or,

3. Application is made for 2.6% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder Is a nonresident vendor employing a minimum of one hundred stale residents or is a nonresidenl vendor with an
affiliate or subsidiary which maintains ils headquarters or principal place of business within Wast Virginia employing a
minimum of one hundred stale residents who certifies that, during the life of (he conlract, on average at least 75% of lhe
employess or Bidder's affiliate’s or subsidiaty's employees are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the slate
continuously for the two years immediately preceding submission of this bid; or,

Application s made for 6% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:
Bidder meets eilher the requirement of both subdivisions (1) and (2) or subdivision (1) and (3) as slaled above, or,

4

5, Application is made for 3.5% resident vendlor preference who Is a veteran for the reason checked:
Bidderis an Individual resldent vendarwho is a veleran of the United States armed forees, the reserves or the National Guard
and has resided in West Virginia continuously for the four years iImmedialely preceding (he date on which the bid is
submitted; or,

G, Application is made for 3.6% resident vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked:
Bidder is a resident vendor who is a veteran of the Unlied States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard, If, for
purposes of producing or distributing the commodities or compleling the projectwhich Is he subject of the vendor's bid and
continuously over the entire term of the project, on average at least sevenly-five percent of the vendor's employees are
residents of West Virginia who have resided in the stale continuously for the two immediately preceding years,

Bldder understands if the Secretary of Revenue determines (hat a Bidder recelving preference has failed to continue lo meet (he
requirements for such preference, the Secrelary may order the Director of Purchasing to: (a) reject the bid; or (b) assess a penally
agalns! such Bldder in an amount not to exceed 5% of the bid amount and that stich penally will be pald to lhe conlracling agency
ordeducted from any unpaid halance on the contractor purchase order.

By submission of this certificate, Bidder agrees to disclose any reasonably requested information lo the Purchasing Division and
authorizes the Depariment of Revenue lo disclose to the Director of Purchasing appropriate information verifying that Bidder has paid
the required business laxes, provided that such Information does not contaln the amounts of taxes paid nor any other informallon
deemed by the Tax Commissioner to be confidential.

Under penally of law for false swearing (West Virginla Code, §61-6-3), Bidder herehy certifies that this certiflcate is true
and accurate in all respects; and that if a contract Is issued to Bidder and If anything contained within this certificate

changes during the term of the contract, Bidder will notify the Pumhaéliwng immaodiately,
Bidder:__Crop Produdhon Secvius Signed;

pate: 55 W Tite:_ahianal MY May .

‘Check any combinalion of preforenco consideralion(s) indicated ahove, wliich you aie enlitied lo receive, L>
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REQ No. 612.¢02Y

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
Purchasing Division

PURCHASING AFFIDAVIT

West Virginia Code §5A-3-10a states: No contracl or renewal of any conlract may be awarded by the slale or any of ils
political subdivisions lo any vendor or prospeclive vendor when the vendor or prospeclive vendor or a related party lo the
vendor or prospective vendor is a deblor and lhe debt owed is an amount grealer than one thousand dollars in the
aggregale.

DEFINITIONS:

“Debt" means any assessment, premium, penally, fine, lax or olher amount of money owed to the slale or any of ils
political subdivislons because of a judgment, fine, parmit violation, license assessment, defaulled workers' compensalion
premium, penally or other assessment presently delinquent or due and required lo be paid lo (he stale or any of ils
political subdivisions, including any Interest or additional penallles accrued thereon.

“Deblor" means any individual, corporation, partnership, associalion, fimited liability company or any other form or
business associalion owing a debt to the state or any of its polilical subdivisions. "Political subdivision” means any counly
commission; municipalily; counly board of educalion; any instrumentalily established by a county or municlpalily; any
separate corporation or Instrumentalily eslablished by one or more countles or municipalilies, as permilled by law; or any
public body charged by law with lhe performance of a government funcfion or whose jurisdiction Is coexlenslve wilh one
or more counlies or municipalities. “Relaled party” means a party, whether an individual, corporalion, parinership,
association, limited liability company or any other form or business assoctation or olher enlily whatsoever, refaled lo any
vendor by blood, marriage, ownership or conlracl through which the parly has a relatlonship of ownership or other inleres!
wilh the vendor so thal the parly will aclually or by effecl recelve or control a portion of the benefil, profit or other
consideratlon from performance of a vendor contract with the parly recelving an amount thal meets or exceed (ive percent
of {he total conlract amount.

EXCEPTION: The prehibition of this section does nol apply where a vendor has contested any tax administered pursuant
lo chapler eleven of this code, workers' compensallon premium, permil {ee or environmental fee or assessment and the
malter has not become (inal or where the vendor has enlered inlo a payment plan or agreement and the vendor Is not in
defaull of any of the provisions of such plan or agreement.

Under penally of law for (alse swearing (West Virginla Code §61-6-3), it is hereby cerlified that the vendor affirms and
acknowledges the informalion in this affidavil and is in compliance with (he requiraments as stated.

WITNESS THE FOLLOWING SIGNATURE
< ) X
Vendor's Name: C *(‘Q‘Q:Pm‘x\@(‘&\‘\ &I &E"C\f\ s \Y\("’ ;

Aulhorized Signature: o Ay Dale: 5(‘ \-Arl P28 -
state of __ A\ ANEAS

Counly of \\(\O () , lo-wil:

Taken, subscribed, and sworn to before me thls‘{g%hday of Haub . 20\

My Commission expires 5“ \Q\ '

200
AFFIX SEAL HERE NOTARY PUBLIC. quﬂ.gm (;0 A L\x%)\Q.M\ k

H DERRYBERRY
Hcﬁgﬁ public-Atkansas
°u‘°“s°3¥‘.2‘="os.w.m 20
sslon Ex
Bk c%"t;fr?lmlulon ¥ 12376720

‘sa

10 Purchastng Allidavil (Revised 12/15/09)



