State of West Virginia Request_ for —  —moNnwERT
Department of Administraton  Quotation 6612C020 i
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Strest East
Post Office Box 50130
Chatleston, WV 25305-0130
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BID OPENING DATE: 0272972012 BID OPENING TIME 30PM
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(ONCRETE BOX [SECTIONS

OPEN-END CONTRACT

'HE WEST VIRGINIA |STATE PURCHASING DIVISION FOR THE
GENCY, THE WEST VIRGINIA DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS, IS
OLICITING BIDS TOQ PRCOVIDE THE AGENCY WITH AN OPEN-EN
(ONTRACT FOR |PRE-CAST REINFORCED CONCRETE BOX CULVERT
ECTIONS PER (THE ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS.
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LXHIBIT 3

| IFE OF CONTRACT: THIS CONTRACT BECOMES EFFECTIVE ON
\(WARD AND EXTENDS (FOR A PERIOD OF ONE (1)

EAR OR UNTIIL SUCH "REASCNABLE TIME" THEREAFTER AS IS
IECESSARY TO |OBTAIN A NEW CONTRACT OR RENEW THE
RIGINAL CONTRACT. THE "REASONABLE TIME" PERIOD SHALL
[OT EXCEED TWELVE (12) |MONTHS., DURING [THIS "REASONABLE
IME" THE VENDOR MAY THERMINATE THIS CONTRACT FOR ANY
EASON UPON (GIVING THE ([DIRECTOR OF PURGHASING 30 DAYS
RITTEN NOTICE.
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NLESS SPECIHIC PROVISIONS ARE STIPULATED ELSEWHERE

N THIS CONTHACT RQOCUMENT BY THE STATE [OF WEST
IRGINIA, ITY AGENCIES, OR POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS, THE
ERMS, CONDITIONS, AND [PRICING SET FORTH HEREIN ARE
IRM FOR THE |[LIFE |OF THE CONTRACT.

Ly M= I~ Y I

bru]

ENEWAL: THIS§ CONTRACT [MAY BE RENEWED UPON THE MUTUAL
~ YO0

Pt {

TR N | Ul prad B Swesas [T s0d dis-pass PF L 2-1L-zeiz
THLE GENERAQ M AW ALC; o FEIN - 55 05-2’0253- ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'




GENERAL TERMS & CONDITIONS o
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION (RFQ) AND REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL (RFP)

1. Awards will be mads in the best interest of the State of West Virginia.

2. The State may accept or reject in part, or in whole, any bid.

3, Prior to any award, the apparent successful vendor must be properly registered with the Purchasing Division
and have paid the required $125 fee.

4. All services performed or goods delivered under State Purchase Order/Contracts are to be continued for the
term of the Purchase Order/Contracts, contingent upon funds being appropriated by the Legislature or otherwise
being made available. In the event funds are not appropriated or otherwise available for these services or goods
this Purchase Order/Contract becomes void and of no effect after June 30.

5, Payment may only be made after the delivery and acceptance of goods or services.

6. Interest may be paid for [ate payment in accordance with the West Virginia Code.

7. Vendor preference will be granted upon written request in accordance with the West Virginia Code.

8. The State of West Virginia is exempt from federal and state taxes and will not pay or reimburse such taxes.

8. The Director of Purchasing may cancel any Purchase Ordsr/Contract upon 30 days written notice to the seller.

10. The laws of the State of West Virginia and the Legisialive Rules of the Purchasing Division shall govern the
purchasing process.

11. Any reference to automatic renewal is hereby deleted. The Contract may be renewed only upon mutual written
agreement of the parties. , :

12. BANKRUPTCY: In the event the vendotcontractor files for bankruptcy protection, the State may deem
this contract null and void, and terminate such contract without further order,

13. HIPAA BUSINESS ASSOCIATE ADDENDUM: The West Virginia State Government HIPAA Business Associate
Addendum {BAA), approved by the Attorhey General, is available online at www.state.wv.us/admin/purchase/vre/hipaa.htiml
and Is hersby made part of the agreement provided that the Agency meets the definiion of a Cover Entity
{45 CFR §160.103) and will be disclosing Protected Health Information (45 CFR §160.103) to the vendor.

14, CONFIDENTIALITY: The vendor agrees that he or she will not disclose to anyone, direclly or indirectly, any such
personally identifiable information or other confidential information gained from the agency, unless the individual who is
the subject of the information consents to the disclosure in writing or the disclosure is made pursuant to the agency's
policies, procedures, and rules. Vendor further agrees to comply with the Confidentiality Policies and Information
Security Accountability Requirements, set forth in hitp:/www.state wv.us/admin/purchase/privacy/hoticeConfidentiality . pdf.

15. LICENSING: Vendors must be licensed and in good standing in accordance with any and all state and local laws and
requirements by any state or local agency of West Virginia, including, but not limited to, the West Virginia Secretary
of State’s Office, the West Virginia Tax Department, and the West Virginia Insurance Commission. The vendor must
provide all necessary releases fto obtain Information to enable the director or spending unit tlo
verify that the vendor is licensed and in good standing with the above entities.

16, ANTITRUST: In submitting a bid to any agency for the State of West Virginia, the bidder offers and agrees that
if the bid is accepted the bidder will convey, sell, assign or transfer to the State of West Virginia all rights, title and interest
in and to all causes of action it may now or hereafter acquire under the antitrust laws of the United States and the State of
Waest Virginia for price fixing andfor unreasonable restraints of trade relating to the particular commodities or services
purchased ar acquired by the State of West Virginia. Such assignment shall be made and become effective at the time the
purchasing agency tenders the initial payment to the bidder.

| certify that this bid is made without prior understanding, agreement, or connection with any corporation, firm, limited
liability company, parthership, or person or entity submitting a bid for the same material, supplies, equipment or
services and is in all respects fair and without collusion or Fraud. | further certify that | am authorized to sign
the cetlification on behalf of the bidder or this bid.

INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS
1. Use the quotation forms provided by the Purchasing Division. Complete all sections of the quotation form.

2. ltems offered must be in compliance with the specifications. Any deviation from the specifications must be clearly
indicated by the hidder. Alternates offered by the bidder as EQUAL to the specifications must be clearly
defined. A bidder offering an alternate should attach complete specifications and literature to the bid. The
Purchasing Division may waive minor deviations to specifications.

3, Unit prices shall prevail in case of discrepancy. All quotations are considered F.O.B. destination unless alternate
shipping terms are cleatly identified in the quotation.

4. All quotations must be delivered by the bidder fo the office listed below prior to the date and time of the bid
opening. Failure of the bidder to deliver the quotations on time will result in bid disqualifications: Departiment of
Administration, Purchasing Division, 2019 Washington Street East, P.O. Box 50130, Charleston, WV 25305-0130

5. Communication during the solicitation, bid, evaluation or award periods, except through the Purchasing Division,
is strictly prohibited {(W.Va. C.S.R. §148-1-6.6).

Rev. 11/09/11
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Department of Administration  Quotation 6612C020 2
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East T ADRESS CORBESEONDENCE TO ATIENT)
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ALAN CUMMINGS
Charleston, WV 25305-0120  04-558-2402

*709042451 304-425-8955
EASTERN VAULT COMPANY INC DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
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SEE SPECIFICATIONS

ozm

02/13/2012
BID OPENING DATE. 0272972012 BID OPENING TIME _ 01:30PM

RITTEN CONSENT OF THE|SPENDING UNIT AJD VENDOR,
$UBMITTED TO|THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING THIRTY (30)
PAYS PRTOR TO® THE]EXPIRATION DATE. SUCH RENEWAL SHALL
BE IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF THE
PRIGINAL: CONTRACT{AND $HALL BE LIMITED|TC TWO (2) ONE
1) YEAR PERIODS,

CANCELLATION{ THE|DIRE¢TOR OF PURCHASING RESERVES THE
RIGHT TO CANGEL THIS CONTRACT IMMEDIATHELY UPON WRITTEN
OTICE TO THE VENDOR I¥ THE COMMODITIES AND/OR SERVICES
$UPPLIED ARE |OF INFERIOR QUALITY CR|DO NOT CONFORM
O THE SPECIFICATIONS @F THE BID AND CONTRACT HEREIN.

OPEN MARKET (LAUSHK: THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING MAY
AUTHORIZE A $PENDING UNIT TO PURCHASE ON THE OPEN
IARKET, WITHQUT THE FILING OF A REQUISITION OR COST
HSTIMATE, ITEMS SPECIFIED ON THIS CONTRACT FOR
MMEDIATE DELIVERY IN EMERGENCIES DUE 10 UNFORESEEN
TAUSES (INCLUYDING {BUT NOT LIMITED TO DHLAYS IN TRANS-
PFORTATION OR {AN UNANTI(IPATED INCREASEIIN THE VOLUME
QF WORK.)

QUANTITIES: QUANTITIES |LISTED IN THE REQUISITION ARE
APPROXIMATIONS ONIY, BASED ON ESTIMATES SUPPLIED BY
'HE STATE SPENDING UNIT. IT IS UNDERSTOOD AND AGREED
I'HAT THE CONTRACT [SHALIL COVER THE QUANTITIES ACTUALLY
GRDERED FOR DELIVERY DURING THE TERM O THE CONTRACT,
WHETHER MORE |OR LESS THAN THE QUANTITIRS SHOWN.

QRDERING PROGEDURE: SPHENDING UNIT(S) SHALL ISSUE A
RITTEN STATH CONTRACT [ORDER (FORM NUMHER WV-39) TO
I[HE VENDOR FQR COMMODIFIES COVERED BY THHIS CONTRACT.
IHE ORIGINAL |COPY |[OF THE WV-39 SHALL BE MAILED TQ THE
ENDOR AS AUTHORIZATION FOR SHIPMENT, A SECOND COPY
AILED TO THE PUR(QHASING DIVISION, AND [A THIRD COPY
HETAINED BY THE SHENDING UNIT.
B £l

/" M ' TELEPHONE 3p4- 425 BISS 2.16- 2011

FEIN
T eneand Mannet 55-oS20155 ADDRESS CHANGES TOI BE NOTEDIABOVE
WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR




State of West Virginia

Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

*709042451 304-425-8955
EASTERN VAULT COMPANY INC
PO BOX 1134

PRINCETON WV 24740

Request for
Department of Administraton  Quotation

iLAN CUMMINGS

04-558-2402

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
JOBSITE
SEE SPECIFICATIONS

BID OPENING DATE:

0272572012

BID OPENING TIME 01:30PM

| TTHOUT FURTHER ORDER.

v B I o

BURCHASING CARD AQCEPTANCE:

Is ISSUED THROUGH |A BANK.

EXHIBIT 10

ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT

Al -

PDDENDUMvip.'S:
NO. 1

NO. 2 V//

--------

BANKRUPTCY: |IN THE EVENT THE VENDOR/CQNTRACTOR FILES
FOR BANKRUPT(Y PRQTECTION, THE STATE MAY DEEM THE
CONTRACT NULIL AND {VOID; AND TERMINATE SUCH CONTRACT

[

THE TERMS AN CONDITIONS CONTAINED IN THIS CONTRACT
SHALL SUPERSHDE ANY ANID ALL SUBSEQUENT [TERMS AND
(CONDITIONS WHICH NAY APPEAR ON ANY ATTACHED PRINTED
WOCUMENTS SUCGH AS |PRICH LISTS, ORDER FQRMS, SALES
\GREEMENTS OR MAINTENANCE AGREEMENTS, JINCLUDING ANY
LECTRONIC MHEDIUM |SUCH |AS CD-ROM.

THE STATE |OF WEST VIRGINIA
CURRENTLY UTILIZE§ A VISA PURCHASING CARD PROGRAM WHICH
THE SUCCESSHUL VENDOR

MUST ACCEPT THE STATE QF WEST VIRGINIA IVISA PURCHASING
GARD FOR PAYMENT QF ALI ORDERS PLACED HY ANY STATE
AGENCY AS A (ONDITION (F AWARD.

REQUISITION NO.:

HEREBY ACKNOWLEQGE RECEIPT OF THE FOLLOWING CHECKED
\IDDENDUM (S) AND HAVE MADE THE NECESSARY REVISIONS TO
Y PROPOSAL, |PLANS AND/OR SPECIFICATION, ETC.

oooooooooooo

SIGNATURE

TELEPHONE DATE

TITLE

FEIN

ADDRESS CHANGES TC BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'




State of West Virginia
Depariment of Administration
Purchasing Divislon

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

*709042451 304-425-8955
FEASTERN VAULT COMPANY INC
PO BOX 1134

PRINCETON WV 24740

Request for
Quotation

CHFO NOMBER:

6612C020 4

[#]

\LAN CUMM
304-558-2402

INGS

SEE

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
JOBSITE

SPECIFICATIONS

02/13/2012
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THAT

] et
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IND ANY STATE PERSONNEI
NFORMATTON 1SSUEL
PECIFICATIONS BY
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WITH THE BID.

REV. 09/21/2002

NOTICE
SIGNED BID MUST

DEPARTMENT CH

FAILURE TO CONFIRM TH
CAUSE FOR REJECT

ENDOR MUST CLEARLY UNDERSTAND THAT ANY
ASSUMED TO BE MA
LD BHETWEEN VENDOR'S K

IS NOT BINDING.
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FEIN

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'




. ¥709042451
EASTERN VAULT COMPANY INC

State of West Virginia
Purchasing Divislon

Post Office Box 50130

PO BOX 1134

PRINCETON WV 24740

Department of Administration  Quotation 6612C020
2019 Washington Street East

Chatleston, WV 25305-0130
304-425-895%5

= REQNUMBER =

Request for

ALAN CUMMINGS
304-558-2402

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
JOBSITE
SEE SPECIFICATIONS

02/13/2012

3

B

|

I)

L)

{

[ ]

RFQ. NO.:

PURCHASING DEVISION

BUILDING 15

2019 WASHINGTON STREET, EAST
CHARLESTON, WV 25305-0130

THE BID SHOULD CONTAIN|THIS INFORMATION ON THE FACE OF
THE ENVELOPE|OR THE BID MAY NOT BE CON$IDERED:

EALED BID

UYER :

ID OPENING IDATE:

ID OPENING TIME:

LEASE PROVIDE A FAX NUMBER IN CASE IT|[IS NECESSARY
TO CONTACT YQU REGARDING YOUR BID:

H25-| (7

CONTACT PERSON (PLEASE |PRINT CLEARLY):

INY INDIVIDUAL SIQGNING |THIS BID IS CERTIFYING THAT:
1} HE OR SHE IS AUTHORIZED BY THE BIDJER TO EXECUTE

ALAN CUMMINGS - FILE 33
6612C020
02/29/2012

1:30 P.M,

SYRuBLE

'HE BID OR ANY DOGUMEN?

SIGNATURE

TE

TITLE

FEIN

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'




Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Sireet East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

*702042451 304-425-8955
EASTERN VAULT COMPANY INC
PO BOX 1134

;21 PRINCETON WV 24740

State of West Virginia Request for = L
Department of Administration Quotation 6612C020 6

-REQ.NUMBER

o = ADD o L) =l
ALAN CUMMINGS
304-558-2402

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
JOBSITE
SEE SPECIFICATIONS

02/13/2012

272972012

'HE BIDDER, [(2) THAT HE OR SHE IS AUTHPRIZED TO BIND
'HE BIDDER IN A CONTRALTUAL RELATIONSH[P, AND (3} THAT
'HE BIDDER HAS PRPPERL)Y REGISTERED WITH ANY STATE
PAGENCIES THAT MAY| REQUEIRE REGISTRATION|

k%%  THIS| IS THE END OF RFQ

SEE
66120020 ****x%% TOTAL: Anded ED

TELEPHONE

TITLE

FEEN

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'




1. SCOPE OF WORK

For labor, materials and equipment necessary to provide Pre-cast Reinforced Concrete Box Culvert Sections
to be used in District 1 through District 10 throughout the State of WV per the following specifications.

2. SPECIFICATIONS

The following sections of the West Virginia Department of Transportation, Division of Highways Standard
Specifications Roads and Bridges, adopted 2010, as modified by the January 1, 2011 Supplemental
Specifications shall apply to the administration of this Contract: Sections 101, 102.4, 105.1, 105.3, 105.4,
105.10, 105.11, 105.12, 106.3, 106.4, 106.5, 106.6, 106.7, 106.9, 107.1, 107.2, 107.3, 107.14, 107.18,
107.20, 108.8, 108.9, 109.1, 109.2, 109.9 and 109.20.

The terms "Coniractor” and "Vendor" used in the above specifications or this contract are interchangeable.
Contractor shall mean Vendor and Vendor shall mean Contractor.

West Virginia Department of Transportation, Division of Highways Standard Specifications Roads and
Bridges, adopted 2010 and the January 1, 2011 Supplemental Specifications may be obtained from:

West Virginia Division of Highways

Contract Administration

Building 5, Room 722

1800 Kanawha Bivd., East

Charleston, West Virginia 25305

Phone: 304-558-2885

hitp:/f'www.fransportation.wv.govthighways/contractadmin/specifications/2010Stand SpeciPages/default.aspx

3. REQUIREMENTS

All Pre-Cast Concrete Box Sections with a span or rise of 12 feet or less shall be manufactured in
accordance with the American Association of State Highway and Transportation Officials’ Standard
Specifications, AASHTO Designation M 273-11, meeting the design requirements of Table 2, except that
all welded wire reinforcement and reinforcing steel bars, where allowed, shall be coated in accordance with
AASHTO M 284M/M 284-09 (Epoxy Coating). See www.transportation.org.

The manufactured length of individual box secfions may be from four to eight feet in increments of one
foot. The maximum section length for delivery to a specific site shall be specified in the Agency Release.

The awarded vendor shall furnish joint sealanf material conforming to the requirements of AASHTO
Destination M 198-10, Type B for each box section delivered.

Itis intended that the box beam sections may be the final roadway wearing surface for the structure.




4. BIDDING INSTRUCTIONS

Bidders may bid on any or all of the sizes of Pre-cast Reinforced Concrete Box Culvert Sections listed on the
Bid Schedule. Bid price is per lineal foot.

Vendors are cautioned that the quantities listed on the Bid Schedule are approximations only. ff is
understood and agreed that the contract shall cover the quantities actually ordered for delivery during the term
of the contract, whether more or less than the quantities shown. As the need arises, an Agency Release will
be issued by the District to the awarded vendor.

5. CONTRACT AWARD

Qualified vendors who submit a valid low bid F.0.B Division of Highways' Delivery Site will be awarded a
contract for those items for which their bid is low per District. The State of West Virginia reserves the right to
make multiple awards on this contract when it is in the best interest of the State.

In the event a Contractor fails to conform to the requirements set out in this contract document, the Agency

Release or the goveming specifications, the Agency Release may be canceled and reissued to the next low
bidder.

6. ACCEPTANCE PLAN

Cracks developing in a box may be cause for rejection of the box. Cracks that are not detrimental fo the
structural integrity of the box section, as determined by the Division of Highways, may be accepted under the
following conditions:

1) Cracks of 0.004 inch or less shall be freated with a second coat of a
Division of Highways approved concrete sealer.

2) Cracks of greater than 0,004 inch shall be {reated by a Division of
Highways approved epoxy injection method.

All concrete sealer and epoxy injection required for acceptance shall be performed at no additional cost to the
Division of Highways.

1. DELIVERY

Upon receipt of an Agency Release, the awarded vendor shall submit shop drawings on Concrete Box
Sections with a span or rise of 12 feet or less to the Division of Highways' District Engineer/Manager issuing
the Agency Release within twenty (20) calendar days. Shop drawings must be approved by the Division of
Highways prior fo the manufacture of any box secfions.

All box sections shall be delivered to the.specified delivery site within ninety (30) calendar days after the
awarded vendor's receipt of the approved shop drawings.




The Division of Highways may require that a minimum of forty-eight (48) lineal feet of box secfions be
delivered fo a designated job site in a single calendar day. Upon receipt of an Agency Release specifying a
minimum daily delivery requirement, the awarded vendor must nofify the Division of Highways' District
Engineer/Manager within ten calendar days if the required delivery cannot be accomplished. To meet
minimum delivery requirements, the Agency Release may be cancelled and the box section obtained by
altenate means.

Should the awarded vendor fail to meet the above delivery schedule, liquidated damages will be assessed in
accordance with Section 108.7 of the cument Division of Highways Standard Specifications Roads and
Bridges.

Sites for delivery of box sections under this contract shall be accessible to equipment that is nomally and
customarily used for transportation of box sections. Upon receipt of an approved Agency Release, the
awarded vendor must notify the Division of Highways' District Engineer/Manager within ten calendar days if
delivery under the terms of this contract cannot be performed due to weight restriction or roadway geometric.

Prior to delivery, all Box Sections shall be tested and accepted in accordance with the requirement of
AASHTO Designation M 273-11 with a span or rise 12 feet or less.

8. VENDOR'S INVOICE

Vendor's invoices must be submitted in original and one copy and contain the foflowing:
a. The Agency Release Number and this Contract Number.
b. Total quantity and unit price with the total cost of box sections.
Note: Under no circumstance will the Division of Highways accept, or pay for,

quantities of material in excess of the quantity stated on the Agency Release,

Q. PARTIAL PAYMENT OF APPROVED BOXES

Upon completion of manufacture and approval by the Division of Highways of all Box Sections specified on an
Agency Release, the awarded vendor may invoice and the Division of Highways will pay for the cost of
manufacturing the Box Sections, not to exceed 65% of the total cost of the delivered Box Sections. Partial
payment for Box Sections shall be subject to the following conditions:

a The awarded vendor must request partial payment and fumish an
official invoice for the manufactured and approved Box Sections.
b. The partial payment invoice shall be accompanied by a surety bond

equal to the invoiced amount guaranteeing delivery of all atems
specified on the Agency Release.

C. The awarded vendor shall fumish a statement of approved Box
Sections condition and exact storage location.




10

d. The awarded vendor shall fumish a legal right-of-entry onto the
storage site to the Division of Highways’ employees andfor agents
for the purpose of inspection, sampling, testing and removing any
or all Box Sections.

e. The awarded vendor shall certify that the stored Box Sections are
stitably marked and identified as property of the Division of Highways
and will not be used for any purpose not designated by the Division
of Highways.

f. The awarded vendor shall furnish an official invoice and the Division
of Highways shall process that invoice for the remaining amount
{not to exceed 35%) of the total cost of the units upon acceptance
of delivery by the Division of Highways.

10.  PURCHASING CARD ACCEPTANCE

The State of West Virginia currently utilizes a VISA Purchasing Card Program which is issued through a bank.
The successful vendors must accept the State of West Virginia VISA Purchasing Card for payment of all
orders placed by Division of Highways Agency Releases for orders as a condition of award.




11. ~ Bid Schedule

Pre-cast Reinforced Concrete Box Culvert Sections

DELIVERY:

6612C020

F.0.B. destination to any designated delivery site within District 1 which includes:
Boone County, Clay County, Kanawha County, Mason County and Putnam County

UNIT OF MEASURE: LINEAL FOOT
BID PRICE: PERLINEAL FOOT

1!

*Estimated *Estimated
Quantity per] Costper | Extended Quantity per; Cost per | Extended
Span| Rise| Lineal Foot | Lineal Foot Cost Span| Rise| Lineal Foot | Lineal Foot Cost
31 2 80 NO Bid NO Bid 8 [ 2 80 NO Bid NO Bid
31 3 80 250.00 20000.00 8 | 3 80 419.00 33520.00
31 4 80 260.00 20800.00 8 | 4 80 419,00 33520.00
315 80 275.00 22000.00 8| 5 80 440.00 35200.00
316 80 320.00 25600.00 8| 6 80 460.00 36800.00
317 80 400.00 32000.00 8| 7 80 480.00 38400.00
318 80 500.00 40000,00 8 | 8 80 505.00 40400.00
4 | 2 80 NO Bid NO Bid 95 80 640.00 51200.00
4 | 3 80 264.00 21120.00 9| 6 80 645.00 516060.00
4 | 4 80 270.00 21600.00 9| 7 80 655.00 52400.00
4 | 5 80 294.00 23520.00 9| 8 80 705.00 56400.00
4 | 6 80 401.00 32080.00 91 9 80 715.00 57200.00
4 | 7 80 406.00 32480.00 9 | 10 80 725.00 58000.00
418 80 501.00 | 40080.00 0| 5 80 549.00 | 43920.00
5 | 2 80 No Bid NO Bid 10| 6 80 559.00 44720.00
51 3 80 278.00 22240.00 101 7 80 578.00 46240.00
51 4 80 299.00 23920.00 10| 8 80 609.00 48720.00
515 80 301.00 24080.00 10| 9 80 632.00 50560.00
516 80 385.00 30800.00 101 10 80 728.00 58320.00
51 7 80 402.00 32160.00 111 4 80 710.00 56800.00
51 8 80 485.00 38800.00 111 6 80 716.00 57280.00
6 | 2 80 No Bid NO Bid 111 8 80 840.00 67200.00
6 | 3 80 301.00 24080.00 11110 80 957.00 76560.00
6 | 4 80 311.00 24880.00 111 11 80 1080.00 | 84800.00
61 5 80 316.00 25280.00 1] 12 80 1190.00 | 95200.00
6 | 6 80 326.00 26080.00 121 4 80 684.00 54720.00
6 | 7 80 401.00 32080.00 2] 6 80 699.00 5592000
6] 8 80 501.00 40080.00 121 8 80 798.00 63840.00
7] 2 80 No Bid NO Bid 12 1 10 80 875.00 70000.00
71 3 80 322.00 25760.00 12 | 11 80 054.00 76320.00
71 4 80 332.00 26560.00 12 | 12 80 999.00 79920.00
7 5 80 362.00 28960.00 *Quantities listed in this RFQ are approximations only. itis understood
7 § 80 380.00 30400.00 and agreed that the contract shall cover the quantiiies actually ordered
7 7 80 405.00 32400.00 for delivery during the term of the contract, whether more or less than
7 8 80 505.00 40400.00 the quantities shown. Award will be based on lowest total cost.




11. * Bid Schedule

Pre-cast Reinforced Concrete Box Culvert Sections

DELIVERY:

6612C020

F.0.B. destination to any designated delivery site within District 2 which includes:
Cabell County, Lincoln County, Logan County, Mingo County and Wayne County

UNIT OF MEASURE: LINEAL FOOT
BID PRICE: PER LINEAL FOOT

I2.

*Esfimated *Estimated
Quantity per|] Cost per | Extended Quantity per| Costper | Extended
Span| Rise | Lineal Foot| Lineal Foot| Cost Span| Rise | Lineal Foot| Lineal Foot| Cost

3] 2 30 NOBID | NOBID 8 | 2 30 NOBID | NOBID _
3 3 30 255.00 7650.00 8 3 30 410.00 12300.00
3| 4 30 271.00 8130.00 8 | 4 30 418.00 12540.00
3 5 30 302.00 9060.00 8 5 30 428.00 12840.00
3 6 30 324.00 9720.00 8 6 30 457.00 13710.00
3| 7 30 370.00 11100.00 8 | 7 30 490.00 14700.00
3 8 30 501.00 15030.00 8 8 30 519.00 15570.00
4 2 30 NO BID NO BID 9 5 30 641.00 19230.00
4 3 30 271.00 8130.00 g 6 30 659.00 19770.00
4 4 30 289.00 8670.00 9 7 30 686.00 20580.00
4 5 30 302.00 9060.00 9 8 30 701.00 21030.00
4 6 30 402.00 12060.00 g 9 30 721.00 21630.00
4 | 7 30 408,00 12240.00 g |10 30 889.00 | 26670.00
418 30 505.00 | 15150.00 0] 5 30 550.00 | 16500.00
5 | 2 30 NOBID | NOBID 0] 6 30 566.00 | 16980.00
5 3 30 291.00 8730.00 101 7 30 601.00 18030.00
5 4 30 301.00 9030.00 101 8 30 646.00 19380.00
515 30 322.00 9660.00 10| 9 30 671,00 | 20130.00
5 6 30 405,00 12150.00 10| 10 30 789.00 23670.00
5 I 30 432.00 12960.00 1 4 30 679,00 20370.00
5 8 30 501.00 15030.00 11 6 30 702.00 21060.00
6 2 30 NO BID NO BID 111 8 30 888.00 26640.00
6 3 30 296.00 8880.00 11 | 10 30 988.00 29640.00
6 4 30 311.00 9330.,00 11| 11 30 1080.00 | 32700.00
6 5 30 333.00 9990.00 11 [ 12 30 1095.00 | 32850.00
6 6 30 353.00 10590.00 121 4 30 679.00 20370.00
6 7 30 486.00 14580.00 21 6 30 701.00 21030.00
6| 8 30 510.00 15300.00 21 8 30 799.00 [ 23970.00
7 | 2 30 NOBID | NOBID 12 1 10 30 892.00 | 26760.00
7 3 30 369.00 10770.00 12 1 1 30 1009.00 | 30270.00
7 4 30 369.00 11070.00 12 | 12 30 1025.00 | 30750.00
7 5 30 389.00 11670.00 *Quantities listed in this RFQ are approximations only. Itis understood
7 ) 30 419.00 12570.00 and agreed that the contract shall cover the quantities actually ordered
7 7 30 440.00 13200.00 for delivery during the ferm of the contract, whether more or less than
7 8 30 555.00 16650.00 the quantities shown. Award will be based on lowest total cost.




11. ' Bid Schedule 6612C020
Pre-cast Reinforced Concrete Box Culvert Sections

DELIVERY:

F.O.B. destination to any designated delivery site within District 3 which includes:

Calhoun County, Jackson County, Pleasants County, Ritchie
County, Roane County, Wirt County and Wood County

UNIT OF MEASURE: LINEAL FOOT
BID PRICE: PERLINEAL FOOT

DISTRICT 3 WILL NOT BE ORDERING PRE-CAST
CONCRETE BOX CULVERT SECTIONS.

I3
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11 " Bid Schedule 6612C020
Pre-cast Reinforced Concrete Box Culvert Sections

DELIVERY:
F.0.B. destination to any designated delivery site within District 4 which includes:
Doddridge County, Harrison County, Marion County, Monongalia County, Preston County and Taylor County

UNIT OF MEASURE: LINEAL FOOT
BID PRICE: PER LINEAL FOOT

and agreed that the contract shall cover the quantities actually ordered

for delivery during the lerm of the contract, whether more or less than

*Esfimated *Estimated
Quantity perj Cost per | Extended Quantity per; Costper | Extended
Span| Rise| Lineal Foot | Lineal Foot| Cost Span| Rise| Lineal Foot | Lineal Foot| Cost
3] 2 8 | 2
31 3 8| 3
31 4 8 | 4
31656 X 8] 5 X
31 6 8| 6
31 7 8 | 7
31 8 81 8
41 2 9 5
4 1 3 91 6
4 | 4 917
4 1 56 X 9 8 X
4 1 6 9 9
4 | 7 9110
418 0] 5
5 2 10] 6
51 3 10 7
51 4 10| 8 X
5 5 X 0] 9
51 6 10 | 10
5 7 11 4
51 8 M] 6
6 | 2 111 8
6 3 1| 10 X
6 | 4 11| 11
5|5 X T 12
6| 6 12| 4 120 764.00 | 91680.00
6 { 121 6
6 8 121 8 X
7 2 12 1 10
7 3 12 1 11
71 4 12 1 12
7 b X *Quantities listed in this RFQ are approximations only. i is understood
7 6
7 7
7 8

the quantities shown. Award will be hassd on lowest fotal cost.




11. " Bid Schedule

Pre-cast Reinforced Concrete Box Culvert Sections

DELIVERY:

6612C020

F.0.B. destination to any designated delivery site within District 5 which includes:
Berkeley County, Grant County, Hampshire County, Hardy
County, Jefferson County, Mineral County and Morgan County
UNIT OF MEASURE: LINEAL FOOT
BID PRICE: PER LINEAL FOOT

)

*Quantities listed in this RFQ are approximations only. Itis understood
and agreed that the contract shall cover the quantities actually ordered
for delivery during the term of the contract, whether more or less than

*Estimated *Estimated

Quantity per] Cost per | Extended Quantity per| Costper | Extended
Span| Rise | Lineal Foot | Lineal Foot| Cost Span| Rise| Lineal Foot | Lineal Foot| Cost
3] 2 8 | 2 X
313 8 [ 3 )
31 4 8| 4 48 404.00] 19392.00
315 X 8 | 5
316 8| 6
317 817 X
3| 8 8 | 8
4 | 2 g1 5
41 3 91 6
4 | 4 9| 7
i[5 X 58 X
4 1 6 9 9
4 | 7 9 | 10
418 (0] 5 i X
5 | 2 10( 6 48 621.00] 29808.00
5| 3 101 7
5 [ 4 101 8
51 5 X 1019 X
516 101 10
b | 7 11| 4
51 8 111 6
6 | 2 11| 8
6 { 3 11 | 10 X
6 | 4 1M1 1
6 | 5 X 1| 12
6 | 6 121 4 92 726,00 37752.00
6 [ 7 21 6
6 | 8 12| 8 96 902.00 86592.00
71 2 12 | 10
713 12 [ 11 X
71 4 121 12
715
716
717
7] 8

the quantities shown. Award wilt be based on lowest total cost.




11. " Bid Schedule

Pre-cast Reinforced Concrete Box Culvert Sections

DELIVERY:

6612C020

F.0.B. destination to any designated delivery site within District 6 which includes:
Brooke County, Hancock County, Marshall County, Ohio County, Tyler County and Wetzel County

UNIT OF MEASURE: LINEAL FOOT
BID PRICE: PER LINEAL FOOT

>

1

and agreed that the confract shall cover the quantities actually ordered
for delivery during the term of the confract, whelher more or less than
the quanities shown. Award will be based on lowest fotat cost.

*Estimated *Estimated
Quantity per; Cost per | Extended Quantity per} Costper | Extended
Span| Rise| Lineal Foot | Lineal Foot| Cost Span| Rise | Lineal Foot | Lineal Foot| Cost
3] 2 8 | 2
3 3 8 3
3] 4 8 | 4 X
35 X 8§ [ 5
316 8161 100 550.00] _55000.00
31 7 8 | 7
31 8 8 8 X
4 2 9 5
4 { 3 9| 6
4 14 917 X
s X T8
4 | 6 g1 9
77 L
| 418 0] 5 X
51 2 0] 6
513 X 0] 7
(514 100 356.00] 35500.00 10 8 | 100 746.00] _ 74600.00
51 5 0] 9 x
516 X 0] 10
5| 7 111 4
5| 8 1] 6
6 | 2 111 8
S X 11 [ 10 X
6 | 4 "M N
6|95 100 397.00{  39700.00 11 | 12
616 121 4
6 | 7 X 2] 6
6] 8 121 8 X
7| 2 12 1 10
713 X 12| 1
7| 4 121 12
715 100 429.00] 423900.00 *Quantities listed In this RFQ are approximations only. Itis understood
71 86
717
7 8




i

11. " Bid Schedule 6612C020
Pre-cast Reinforced Concrete Box Culvert Sections

DELIVERY:
F.0.B. destination to any designated delivery site within District 7 which includes:
Barbour County, Braxton County, Gilmer County, Lewis County, Upshur County and Webster County

UNIT OF MEASURE: LINEAL FOOT
BID PRICE: PERLINEAL FOOT

*Estimated *Estimated
Quantity per{ Cost per | Extended Quantity per] Costper | Extended
Span| Rise| Lineal Foot | Lineal Foot| Cost Span| Rise | Lineal Foot | Lineal Foot] Cost

3 2 8 2
3 3 8 3
31 4 8 | 4 X
315 X 8 | 5
316 86| « 439.00 | 10536.00
317 8 7 X
318 818 24 489.00 | 11736.00
4 2 9 5
4 3 9 6
4 1 4 9| 7 X
s X s
4 6 9 9
4 7 g 110
4 8 101 5 X
5| 2 10] 6 24 579.00 13896.00
5 3 101 7 X
5| 4 10] 8 24 636.00 15264.00
5 5 x 101 9 X
5| 6 10| 10 24 742,00 17808.00
5 7 111 4
5 8 114 6
6§ 2 11 8 X
6 | 3 111 10
6 | 4 11 ] 11
5|5 X T | 12
6|8 (714 X
6 | 7 121 6 24 690.00 16560.00
6| 8 121 8 24 811.00 19464.00
7|2 12110 24 908.00 21792.00
7 3 121 1 X
7| 4 12| 12 24 1020.00 | 24480.00
7 5 X *Quantities listed in this RFQ! are approximations only. 1fis undersioed
7 6 and agreed that the confract shall cover the quantities actually ordered
7 7 for delivery during the term of the contract, whether more or [ess than
7 8 the quantities shown. Award wilt be based on lowest total cost.




11. " Bid Schedule

Pre-cast Reinforced Concrete Box Culvert Sections

DELIVERY:

6612C020

F.O.B. destination to any designated delivery site within District 8 which includes:
Pendleton County, Pacahontas County, Randolph County and Tucker County

UNIT OF MEASURE: LINEAL FOOT
BID PRICE: PER LINEAL FOOT

18

*Quantities listed in this RFQ are approximations only. It is understood
and agreed that the conlract shall cover the quantities actually ordered
for delivery during the term of the contract, whether more or less than

the quantilies shown. Award will be based on lowest total cost.

*Estimated *Estimated

Quantity per] Cost per | Extended Quantity per] Costper | Extended
Span| Rise| Lineal Foot | Lineal Foot| Cost Span| Rise | Lineal Foot | Lineal Foot{ Cost
3 | 2 8 | 2
3] 3 8 | 3
31 4 8 | 4
1S X TS X
3] 6 8| 6
3|7 8 | 7
3| 8 g8 | 8
4| 2 9| 5
413 9| 6
414 9 [ 7
15 X 9 |8 X
416 9| 9
417 g 110
418 10 | 5
5 | 2 0] 6
51 3 10| 7
5 | 4 10| 8 X
515 X 079
5 6 10 [ 10
5 7 11| 4
5 8 1 6
6 | 2 11| 8
6 | 3 11 | 10 X
6 | 4 11 | 11
6 | 5 X 11 [ 12
6| 6 12] 4 40 691.00 | 27640.00
6 | 7 12| 6 48 716.00 | 34368.00
6| 8 121 8 48 847.00 | 40656.00
7 | 2 12 | 10
71 3 1271 11
7 | 4 121 12 X
715
716
717
7| 8




1.

" Bid Schedule
Pre-cast Reinforced Concrete Box Culvert Sections

DELIVERY:

6612C020

F.O.B. destination to any designated delivery site within District 9 which includes:
Fayette County, Greenbrier County, Monroe County, Nicholas County and Summers County

UNIT OF MEASURE: LINEAL FOOT
BID PRICE: PER LINEAL FOOT

Iq

*Estimated *Estimated
Quantity per; Cost per | Extended Quantity per| Costper | Extended
Span| Rise| Lineal Foot Lineal Foot|  Cost Span| Rise{ Lineal Foof | Lineal Foot Cost
3| 2 24 NO Bid NO Bid 8 | 2 24 NO Bid NO Bid
3] 3 24 256.00 6144.00 8 | 3 24 411.00 9864.00
3| 4 32 271.00 8672.00 8 | 4 32 411.00 13152.00
3] 5 32 321.00 10272.00 815 32 431.00 13792.00
3| 6 32 341.00 10912.00 816 32 462.00 14784.00
3] 7 32 382.00 12224.00 8 | 7 32 482.00 16424.00
318 32 505.00 16160.00 8 | 8 32 507.00 16224.00
41 2 24 NO Bid NO Bid 91 b 32 620.00 19840.00
4 | 3 24 276.00 6624.00 91 6 32 680.00 21760.00
4 | 4 32 288.00 9216.00 9| 7 32 740.00 23680.00
4 5 32 331.00 10592.00 9| 8 32 770.00 24640.00
4 | 6 32 352.00 11264.00 919 32 799.00 26568.00
4 7 32 443,00 14176.00 9| 10 32 825.00 26400.00
| 4 | 8 32 500.00 16000.00] 0| 5 32 547.00 17504.00
5| 2 24 NO Bid NO Bid 10| 6 32 586.00 18752.00
51 3 24 281.00 6744.00 10 7 32 602.00 19264.00
5] 4 32 302.00 9664.00 10| 8 32 627.00 20064.00
51 5 32 312.00 9984.00 10 ] 9 32 684.00 21888.00
51 6 32 370.00 11840.00] 10 ] 10 32 774.00 24768.00
51 7 32 425.00 13600.00} 111 4 32 803.00 25696.00
5] 8 32 505.00 16160.00 111 6 32 845.00 27040.00
6 | 2 24 NO Bid NO Bid 111 8 32 905.00 28960.00
6 | 3 24 301.00 7224.00 111 10 32 1050.00 33600.00
6 | 4 32 322.00 10304.00] 1] 11 32 1150.00 36800.00
615 32 345.00 11040.00 1] 12 32 1350.00 43200.00
6 | 6 32 355.00 11360.00 121 4 32 672.00 21504.00
6 | 7 32 457.00 14624.00 121 6 32 694.00 22208.00
6 | 8 32 520.00 16640.00 121 8 32 813.00 26016.00
7] 2 24 NO Bid NO Bid 12 | 10 32 905.00 28960.00
71 3 24 387.00 9288.00 121 1 32 977.00 31264.00{
714 32 387.00 12384.00 12 | 12 32 995.00 31840.00]
7 5 32 390.00 12480.00 *Quantities listed in this RFQ are approximations only. It is understood
7 6 32 4056.00 12960.00 and agreed that the confract shall cover the quantities actually ordered
717 32 415.00 13280.00 for delivery during the term of the contract, whether more or less than
7 8 32 475.00 15200.00 the quantities shown. Award will be based on lowest total cost.




11. " Bid Schedule

Pre-cast Reinforced Concrete Box Culvert Sections

DELIVERY:

6612C020

FF.O.B. destination to any designated delivery site within District 10 which includes:
McDowell County, Mercer County, Raleigh County and Wyoming County

UNIT OF MEASURE: LINEAL FOOT
BID PRICE: PERLINEAL FOOT

20

*Quantities listed in this RFQ are approximations only. [t is understood
and agreed that the contract shall cover the quantities actually ordered
for delivery during the term of the contract, whether more or less than

the quantities shown. Award will be based on lowest total cost.

*Estimated *Estimated
Quantity per| Cost per | Extended Quantity per| Costper | Extended
Span| Rise| Lineal Foot | Lineal Foot| Cost Span| Rise| Lineal Foot | Lineal Foot| Cost
3 [ 2 8 | 2 X
3 3 81 3
3| 4 81 4 36 422.001  15192.00
3|5 X 8 | 5
3] 6 G
31 7 8 | 7 x
31 8 81 8
i | 2 915
413 9] 6
A1 4 9 {7 X
715 X R
4186 91 9
17 9 [ 10
41 8 10] 5 48 566 27168.00
51 2 10] 6 44 579 25476.00
5| 3 1071 7
5 | 4 0] 8
5 5 X 101 9 x
586 0 | 10
5 [ 7 1] 4
51 8 ] 6
6 | 2 1] 8 X
6 | 3 1110
6 | 4 1M1 11
515 X T 12
6 | 6 121 4
6 | 7 121 6
6 | 8 121 8 X
7 | 2 12 [ 10
7 1 3 12 [ 11
7| 4 12| 12 32 973.00 31136.00
7| 5
716
717
7 | 8
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Rev. 09/08 State of West Virginia

VENDOR PREFERENCE CERTIFICATE

Certification and application* is hereby made for Preference in accordance with West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37. (Does notapply to
construction contracts). West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37, provides an opportunity for qualifying vendors to request (atthe time of bid)
preference for their residency status. Such preference is an evaluation method only and will be appiied only to the cost bid in
accordance with the West Virginia Code. This certificate for application is to be used to request such preference. The Purchasing
Division will make the determination of the Resident Vendor Preference, if applicable.

1. Application is made for 2.5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidderis an individual resident vendor and has resided continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preced-
ing the date of this certification; or,

Bidder is a partnership, association or corporation resident vendor and has maintained its headquarters or principal place of
business continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or 80% of the
ownership interest of Bidder is held by another individual, partnership, assoctation or comporation resident vendor who has
maintained its headquarters or principal place of business continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately
preceding the date of this certification; or,

Bidder is a nonresident vendorwhich has an affiliate or subsidiary which employs a minimurm of one hundred state residents
and which has maintained its headgquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia continuously for the four (4)
years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or,

< |

Application is made for 2.5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is a resident vendor who certifies that, during the life of the contract, on average at least 75% of the employees
working on the project being bid are residents of West Virginiawho have resided in the state continuously for the two years
immediately preceding submission of this bid; o,

Application Is made for 2.5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is a nonresident vendor employing a minimum of one hundred state residents or is a nonresident vendor with an
affiliate or subsidiary which maintains its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia employing a
minimum of one hundred state residents who certifies that, during the life of the confract, on average at feast 75% of the
employees or Bidder's affiliate's or subsidiary’s employees are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state

continuously for the two years immediately preceding submission of this hid; or,

i
e

|

| ®

Application is made for 5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:
Bidder meets either the requirement of both subdivisions (1) and (2) or suhdivision (1) and (3) as stated above; or,

Application is made for 3.5% resident vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked:

Bidder is an individual resident vendor who is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves orthe National Guard
and has resided in West Virginia continuously for the four years immediately preceding the date on which the bid is
submitted; or,

Application is made for 3.5% resident vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked:

Bidder is a resident vendor who is a veteran of the United States ammed forces, the reserves or the National Guard, if, for
purposes of producing or distributing the commodities or completing the project which s the subject of the vendor's bid and
continuously over the entire term of the project, on average at least seventy-five percent of the vendor's employees are
residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two immediately preceding years.

Bidder understands if the Secretary of Revenue determines that a Bidder receiving preference has faited to continue to meet the
requirements for such preference, the Secretary may order the Director of Purchasing to: {a) reject the bid; or (b) assess a penally
against such Bidder in anamount not to exceed 5% of the bid amount and that such penalty will be paid tothe contracting agency
or deducted from any unpaid balance on the contract or purchase order.

By submission of this certificate, Bidder agrees to disclose any reasonably requested information to the Purchasing Division and
authorizes the Department of Revenue to disclose to the Director of Purchasing appropriate information verifying that Bidder has paid
the required business taxes, provided that such information does not contain the amounts of taxes paid nor any other informatian
deemed by the Tax Commissioner to be confidential.

Under penalty of law for false swearing (West Virginia Code, §61-5-3), Bidder hereby certifies that this certificate is true
and accurate in all respects; and that if a contract is issued to Bidder and If anything contained within this certificate
changes during the term of the contract, Bidder wilf notify the Purchasing Div!'sign in writing immediately.

Bidder; EAS‘TERN‘ \/AULT Co_ ) -I:fq(“ Signed:

=3

l .m

Date: -2l 201k Title: \BENER"& /U{amam

*Check any combination of preference consideration(s) indicated above, which you are entitled lo receive,




‘ ' ) RFQ No. 66128920

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
Purchasing Division

PURCHASING AFFIDAVIT

West Virginia Code §5A-3-10a states: No contract or renewal of any contract may be awarded by the state or any ofits
political subdivisions to any vendor or prospective vendor when the vendor or prospective vendor or a related party to the
vendor or prospective vendor is a debtor and the debt owed is an amount greater than one thousand dollars in the
aggregate.

DEFINITIONS:

*Debt® means .any assessment, premium, penaity, fine, tax or other amount of money owed to the state or any of its
political subdivisions because of a judgment, fine, permit violation, license assessment, defauited workers' compensafion
premium, penalty or other assessment presently delinguent or due and required o be paid fo the state or any. of its
political subdivisions, including any interest or additional penalties accrued thereon,

“Debtor” means any individual, corporation, partnership, association, limited liability company or any other form or
business assoclation owing a debt to the state or any of its political subdivislons. “Political subdivision® means any county
comniission; municipality; county board of education; any instrumentality established by a county or municipality; any
separate corporation or instrumentality established by one or more counties or munlicipalities, as permitted by law; or any
public body charged by faw with the perfonnanoe of a government function or whose jurisdiction is coextensive with onhe
or more countles or municipalities, “Related party” means a party, whether an Individual, corporation, paithership,
association, limited liability company or any other form or business association or other entity whatsocever, related to any
vendor by blood, marriage, ownetship or contract through which the party has a relationship of ownership or other interest
with the vendor so that the party will actually or by effect recelve or control & portion of the benefit, profit or other
conslderation from performance of a vendor contract with the party recelving an amount that meets or exceed five percent
of the fotal contract amount.

EXCEPTION: The prohibition of this section does not apply where a vendor has contested any tax administered pursuant
to chapter eleven of this code, workers' compensation premium, permit fee or environmentat fee or assessment and the
matter has not become final or where the vendor has entered info a payment plan or agreement and the vendor is not.in
default of any of the provisions of such plan or agreement,

Under penalty of law for false swearing (West Virginia Cade §61-5-3), it is hereby certified that the vendor affirms and
acknowledges the information in this affidavit and is in compliance with the requirements as stated.

WITNESS THE FOLLOWING SIGNATURE

Vendor's Name: EAasrern \/Aut»'r CD. y Tren
o _
Authorized Signature: B"«— f)'/ ) RRIAN Sirusce Date:  2-1(-20Z
State of Me g4 m‘ﬁ inig
County of I\fh e s , to-wit:
Taken, subscribed, and sworn to before me this 2{;_day of /1; brua Ly L2042,
My Coramission expires /Oof . (g ,20)s5 .
. L {
AFFIX SEAL HERE NOTARY PUBLIC Mamee., &?. “Bret
OO SEAL
2 NOTARY PUBLIC 5
MR 48 h  STATE OF WESTVIRGINIA ¢
W Fd FRANCES J: MCKINNEY 0
2L RY.2 BOX 347 F
PRINCETON, WV 24740 g

68 Oclobor 18 20%5
AL Purchasing Affidavit (Revised 12/15/09)




Please use this document for technical questions, posing in a question

format

Please refer to the section your question is in reference to.

Technical questions for RFQi#

Vendor Name:

Questions:

23







