

Request for Quotation

T

RFQ NUMBER 6612C020 7

ADDRESS CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTENTION OF

ALAN CUMMINGS 304-558-2402

*709055926 304-464-4441 CARR CONCRETE CORPORATION PO BOX 265

26184-0265 WAVERLY WV

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS JOBSITE SEE SPECIFICATIONS

DATE PRINTED SHIP VIA F.O.B. FREIGHT TERMS TERMS OF SALE 02/13/2012 BID OPENING DATE: 02/29/2012 OPENING TIME 01:30PM CAT. LINE QUANTITY UOP ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE AMOUNT b001 **750-30** EΑ 1 CONCRETE BOX SECTIONS RECEIVED 2012 FEB 28 ANTI: 54 OPEN-END CONTRACT WV PURCHASING THE WEST VIRGINIA STATE PURCHASING DIVESION FOR THE DIVISION AGENCY, THE WEST VIRGINIA DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS, IS SOLICITING BIDS TO PROVIDE THE AGENCY WITH AN OPEN-END CONTRACT FOR PRE-CAST REINFORCED CONCRETE BOX CULVERT SECTIONS PER THE ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS. EXHIBIT 3 LIFE OF CONTRACT: THIS CONTRACT BECOMES EFFECTIVE ON AWARD AND EXTENDS FOR A PERIOD OF ONE (1) YEAR OR UNTIL SUCH "REASONABLE TIME" THEREAFTER AS IS NECESSARY TO OBTAIN A NEW CONTRACT OR RENEW THE DRIGINAL CONTRACT THE "REASONABLE TIME" PERIOD SHALL NOT EXCEED TWELVE (12) MONTHS. DURING THIS "REASONABLE TIME" THE VENDOR MAY TERMINATE THIS CONTRACT FOR ANY REASON UPON &IVIN& THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING 30 DAYS NRITTEN NOTICE. UNLESS SPECIFIC PROVISTONS ARE STIPULATED ELSEWHERE IN THIS CONTRACT DOCUMENT BY THE STATE OF WEST 'IRGINIA, IT\$ AGENCIES OR POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS, THE ERMS, CONDITIONS AND PRICING SET FORTH HEREIN ARE FIRM FOR THE LIFE OF THE CONTRACT. RENEWAL: THIS CONTRACT MAY BE RENEWED UPON THE MUTUAL SEE REVERSE SIDE FOR TERMS AND CONDITIONS TELEPHONE ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO REQ. INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'

GENERAL TERMS & CONDITIONS REQUEST FOR QUOTATION (RFQ) AND REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL (RFP)

- 1. Awards will be made in the best interest of the State of West Virginia.
- 2. The State may accept or reject in part, or in whole, any bid.

3. Prior to any award, the apparent successful vendor must be properly registered with the Purchasing Division

and have paid the required \$125 fee.

- 4. All services performed or goods delivered under State Purchase Order/Contracts are to be continued for the term of the Purchase Order/Contracts, contingent upon funds being appropriated by the Legislature or otherwise being made available. In the event funds are not appropriated or otherwise available for these services or goods this Purchase Order/Contract becomes void and of no effect after June 30.
- Payment may only be made after the delivery and acceptance of goods or services.
- 6. Interest may be paid for late payment in accordance with the West Virginia Code.
- 7. Vendor preference will be granted upon written request in accordance with the West Virginia Code.
- 8. The State of West Virginia is exempt from federal and state taxes and will not pay or reimburse such taxes.
- 9. The Director of Purchasing may cancel any Purchase Order/Contract upon 30 days written notice to the seller.
- 10. The laws of the State of West Virginia and the Legislative Rules of the Purchasing Division shall govern the purchasing process.
- 11. Any reference to automatic renewal is hereby deleted. The Contract may be renewed only upon mutual written agreement of the parties.
- 12. BANKRUPTCY: In the event the vendor/contractor files for bankruptcy protection, the State may deem this contract null and void, and terminate such contract without further order.
- 13. HIPAA BUSINESS ASSOCIATE ADDENDUM: The West Virginia State Government HIPAA Business Associate Addendum (BAA), approved by the Attorney General, is available online at www.state.wv.us/admin/purchase/vrc/hipaa.html and is hereby made part of the agreement provided that the Agency meets the definition of a Cover Entity (45 CFR §160.103) and will be disclosing Protected Health Information (45 CFR §160.103) to the vendor.
- 14. CONFIDENTIALITY: The vendor agrees that he or she will not disclose to anyone, directly or indirectly, any such personally identifiable information or other confidential information gained from the agency, unless the individual who is the subject of the information consents to the disclosure in writing or the disclosure is made pursuant to the agency's policies, procedures, and rules. Vendor further agrees to comply with the Confidentiality Policies and Information Security Accountability Requirements, set forth in http://www.state.wv.us/admin/purchase/privacy/noticeConfidentiality.pdf.
- 15. LICENSING: Vendors must be licensed and in good standing in accordance with any and all state and local laws and requirements by any state or local agency of West Virginia, including, but not limited to, the West Virginia Secretary of State's Office, the West Virginia Tax Department, and the West Virginia Insurance Commission. The vendor must provide all necessary releases to obtain information to enable the director or spending unit to verify that the vendor is licensed and in good standing with the above entities.
- 16. ANTITRUST: In submitting a bid to any agency for the State of West Virginia, the bidder offers and agrees that if the bid is accepted the bidder will convey, sell, assign or transfer to the State of West Virginia all rights, title and interest in and to all causes of action it may now or hereafter acquire under the antitrust laws of the United States and the State of West Virginia for price fixing and/or unreasonable restraints of trade relating to the particular commodities or services purchased or acquired by the State of West Virginia. Such assignment shall be made and become effective at the time the purchasing agency tenders the initial payment to the bidder.

I certify that this bid is made without prior understanding, agreement, or connection with any corporation, firm, limited liability company, partnership, or person or entity submitting a bid for the same material, supplies, equipment or services and is in all respects fair and without collusion or Fraud. I further certify that I am authorized to sign the certification on behalf of the bidder or this bid.

INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS

- 1. Use the quotation forms provided by the Purchasing Division. Complete all sections of the quotation form.
- 2. Items offered must be in compliance with the specifications. Any deviation from the specifications must be clearly indicated by the bidder. Alternates offered by the bidder as EQUAL to the specifications must be clearly defined. A bidder offering an alternate should attach complete specifications and literature to the bid. The Purchasing Division may waive minor deviations to specifications.
- 3. Unit prices shall prevail in case of discrepancy. All quotations are considered F.O.B. destination unless alternate shipping terms are clearly identified in the quotation.
- 4. All quotations must be delivered by the bidder to the office listed below prior to the date and time of the bid opening. Failure of the bidder to deliver the quotations on time will result in bid disqualifications: Department of Administration, Purchasing Division, 2019 Washington Street East, P.O. Box 50130, Charleston, WV 25305-0130
- 5. Communication during the solicitation, bid, evaluation or award periods, except through the Purchasing Division, is strictly prohibited (W.Va, C.S.R. §148-1-6.6).



Request for Quotation

RFQ NUMBER 6612C020

2

ADDRESS CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTENTION OF ALAN CUMMINGS 304-558-2402

Ť

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS JOBSITE SEE SPECIFICATIONS

*709055926 304-464-4441 CARR CONCRETE CORPORATION PO BOX 265 WAVERLY WV 26184-0265

DATE PRINTED TERMS OF SALE SHIP VIA F.O.B. FREIGHT TERMS 02/13/2012 BID OPENING DATE: 02/29/2012 BID OPENING TIME 01:30PM LINE QUANTITY UOP ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE AMOUNT. WRITTEN CONSENT OF THE SPENDING UNIT AND VENDOR, DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING THIRTY (30) SUBMITTED TO THE DAYS PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION DATE. SUCH RENEWAL SHALL BE IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF THE DRIGINAL CONTRACT AND SHALL BE LIMITED TO TWO (2) ONE (1) YEAR PERLODS. CANCELLATION: THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING RESERVES THE RIGHT TO CANCEL THIS CONTRACT IMMEDIATELY UPON WRITTEN NOTICE TO THE VENDOR IF THE COMMODITIES AND/OR SERVICES SUPPLIED ARE OF AN INFERIOR QUALITY OR DO NOT CONFORM TO THE SPECIFICATIONS OF THE BID AND CONTRACT HEREIN. DPEN MARKET CLAUSE: THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING MAY AUTHORIZE A SPENDING UNIT TO PURCHASE ON THE OPEN MARKET, WITHOUT THE FILING OF A REQUISITION OR COST ESTIMATE, ITEMS SPECIFIED ON THIS CONTRACT FOR IMMEDIATE DELIVERY IN EMERGENCIES DUE TO UNFORESEEN Causes (including but not limited to delays in trans-PORTATION OR AN UNANTICIPATED INCREASE IN THE VOLUME DF WORK.) QUANTITIES: QUANTITIES LISTED IN THE REQUISITION ARE APPROXIMATIONS ONLY, BASED ON ESTIMATES SUPPLIED BY THE STATE SPENDING UNIT. IT IS UNDERSTOOD AND AGREED THAT THE CONTRACT SHALL COVER THE QUANTITIES ACTUALLY $label{prop}$ prdered for $label{period}$ pring the term of the contract, WHETHER MORE OR LESS THAN THE QUANTITIES SHOWN. фrdering pro¢edur¢: sp¢nding unit(s) s#all issue a VRITTEN STATE CONTRACT ORDER (FORM NUMBER WV-39) TO HE VENDOR FOR COMMODITIES COVERED BY THIS CONTRACT. THE ORIGINAL COPY OF THE WV-39 SHALL BE MAILED TO THE VENDOR AS AUTHORIZATION FOR SHIPMENT, A SECOND COPY MAILED TO THE PURCHASING DIVISION, AND A THIRD COPY RETAINED BY THE SPENDING UNIT. SEE REVERSE SIDE FOR TERMS AND CONDITIONS SIGNATURE TELEPHONE DATE TITLE FEIN ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE



Request for Quotation

SHIP

6612C020

ALAN CUMMINGS 804-558-2402

ADDRESS CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTENTION OF:

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS JOBSITE SEE SPECIFICATIONS

*709055926 304-464-4441 CARR CONCRETE CORPORATION PO BOX 265 WAVERLY WV 26184-0265

DATE PRIN	Annual returns an extensive a six	TER	MS OF SAL	. E	SHIP V	iA	F.O.B.	FREIGHTTEF	RMS
02/13/ BID OPENING DATE:		 02/29/2	ንበ1 ኃ		<u></u>	ן תדם	OPENING TIME	01:30PM	
				CAT	I				
LINE	QUAI	NTITY	UOP	No.	ITEM NUM	//BER	UNIT PRICE	AMOUN	T
				1	<u> </u>				
	BANKRUI	PTCY:	IN T	HE EV	I ENT THE VI	ENDOR/C¢	NTRACTOR FILE	s	
	FOR BAN	NKRUPT	CY PRO	DTECT	ION, THE S	STATE MÅ	Y DEEM THE	Affician	
	CONTRAC					INATE S	SUCH CONTRACT		
						and the second s			
							HIS CONTRACT		
•	CONDIT:	JUPEKST TONS W	ITCH I	IX AVN	DEFINE ON 1	ANV ATTA	TERMS AND CHED PRINTED		
1	POCUMEN	DUR RTM	CH AS	PRIC	E LISTS, C	ORDER FØ	RMS, SALES		
i	AGREEME	ENTS OF	R MAIN	ITENAI	NCE AGREEN	MENTS, ‡	NCLUDING ANY		
•	ELECTRO	NTC ME	DTOM	SUCH	AS CD-ROM	¹ ·			
							OF WEST VIRGI		
							ARD PROGRAM WH	ICH	
!	MUST A	CCEPT 1	THE ST	rate (NK. IDE S DF WEST VI	RGINIA	TUL VENDOR VISA PURCHASI	NG	
(CARD FO	OR PAYN	ient ¢	DF ALI	ORDERS E	PLACED B	BY ANY STATE		
4	AGENCY	AS A u	,ONDT.	'ION q	F AWARD.				
,	фхнівіт	۲ 10						difference	
		1		,	220111		10.:6612.CO	17/3	
		l	i		KEÕOTS	u NOITI{	0.: 4415.45	F-4-1	
j	ADDENDU	JM ACKI	owrei	GEME	PT				
	t nebet	יע אריגא	וים. זיייסיי	איים DI	מטאטוויי עם	וויים מזוש	LOWING CHECKE	-	I
1	ADDENDU	JM(S) A	ND HA	VE MA	DE THE NE	CESSARY	REVISIONS TO		
					OR SPECIF				
j	ADDENDU	IM NO.	Q.						
-		11. 210.	, I						
1	NO. 1 .	• • • • • • •							
1	NO. 2 .							With the state of	
;								and the second	
				SEE RE	VERSE SIDE FOR TE			1	
IGNATURE						TELEPHONE		DATE	
ITLE		FEI	IN		<u> </u>		ADDRESS CHA	NGES TO BE NOTED AB	OVE



Request for Quotation

RFQ NUMBER 6612C020

ADDRESS CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTENTION OF

ALAN CUMMINGS 04-558-2402

*709055926 304-464-4441 CARR CONCRETE CORPORATION PO BOX 265

WAVERLY WV 26184-0265

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS JOBSITE SH SEE SPECIFICATIONS Ţ

DATE PRINTED	TERMS OF S	ALE S	HIP VIA	FOB:	FREIGHT TEAMS
02/13/2012 BID OPENING DATE:	02/29/2012		BTD C	PENING TIME	01 . 3 O DM
500000000000000000000000000000000000000	QUANTITY UOP	CAT. ITE	000000000000000000000000000000000000000		01:30PM
LINE	AGANTITY UOP	CAT ITEI	V NUMBER	UNIT PRICE	AMOUNT
No.	,				
NO.					
NO. 4	١				
NO.	5				•
I UNI	ERSTAND THAT	FAILURE TO	CONFIRM TH	E RECEIPT OF	
	ADDENDUM (S) M				
A LENTO	D MIXON OT DAD	TV TINIDED CHINN	D 1917 7 7 7 7 7 7 7 7 7 7 7 7 7 7 7 7 7		
I VENDO	OR MUST CLEAR ESENTATION MA	HY UNDERSTAN	D THAT ANY	VERBAL DE DURING ANY	
ORAL	DISCUSSION H	ELD BETWEEN	VENDOR'S R	EPRESENTATIVE	S
AND A	NY STATE PER	sonnet is no	T BINDING.	ONLY THE	
	MATION ISSUE FICATIONS BY				
7 1203	FICALION BI	1 {			
			Valuet	Bun Star NATURE 1 Crefe Ce	
		/	70001	July sour	Cap.
				NATURE	
). [arr Le	icrete le	M.C.
1			COM	PANY	1
		4	. 2-Z7	12_	}
			DAT		• •
				_	
NOTE:	MILLO ADDEND	The A CHATCHIA ED.	~~~~~		
NOIE:	THIS ADDEND	AM ACKNOMPED	JEMENT SHO	ULD BE SUBMIT	red
REV.	09/21/2009				
		NOTICE	l		
A SIG	NED BID MUST	BE SUBMITTER	о то:		
	DEPARTMENT O	· •	1		
SIGNATURE		SEE REVERSE SIDE F	OR TERMS AND CON TELEPHONE		DATE
TITLE	FEIN				
	FEIIV			ADDRESS CHA	NGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE



*709055926

PO BOX 265

WAVERLY WV

State of West Virginia Department of Administration Purchasing Division 2019 Washington Street East Post Office Box 50130 Charleston, WV 25305-0130

26184-0265

CARR CONCRETE CORPORATION

304-464-4441

Request for Quotation

RFQ NUMBER 6612C020

PAG	5 .0000
5	: {

ADDRESS CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTENTION OF

ALAN CUMMINGS 304-558-2402

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS S JOBSITE SEE SPECIFICATIONS

SHIP TO

	PRINTED 3/2012	TERMS OF SA	E	SHIP VIA	F	0.8;	FREIGHT TERMS
OPENING DA	<u>'</u>	29/2012		BID O	PENING '	CIME 0	1:30PM
LINE	YTITAAUD:		CAT. NO.	ITEM NUMBER		TPRICE	AMOUNT
			INO.				
	מזופרי	HASING DI	VITOTO	NT			
	5	DING 15	ATSTA	14			
	3		ON ST	REET, EAST			
	L .	LESTON, W	1 3	•			
	}						
	שני אור פינ	HOLLID CON	ייים איד אד היידו	THIS INFORMATION	י מות מות מי	מאטעה טה	
		4		MAY NOT BE CONS		FACE OF	
				MII NOI DE COMP	TDBRED.		
	SEALED BII	>	1				
	_[
	BUYER:		ALAN	CUMMINGS - FILE	33		
	RFQ. NO.:		6612	ი იაი			
	MrQ. NO		0012	C020	•		
	BID OPENII	NG DATE:	02/2	9/2012			
	BID OPENII	NG TIME:	1:30	P.M.			
	PLEASE PRO	OVIDE A F	AX NII	MBER IN CASE IT	TS NECES	SSARY	
	• • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • •		3 1	G YOUR BID:		,,,,,,,,	
				304.464-40	12		
				227 704 19K	!Q		
				PRINT CLEARLY):			
		owert		urr' Stanl	1-le		
				-	7	** **	
	ANY INDIVI	DUAL SIG	NING	THIS BID IS CERT	IFYING 7	TAT:	
	(1) HE OR	SHE IS A	UTHOR	IZED BY THE BIDD	ER TO EX	KECUTE	
	THE BID OF	ANY DOC	l l	S RELATED THERET		HALF OF	
ATUDE			SEE AE Ì	ERSE SIDE FOR TERMS AND CON	VOITIONS	<u>.</u>	-
ATURÉ				TELEPHONE		DAT	E
		FEIN			1		ES TO BE NOTED ABOVE



Request for **Quotation**

RFQ NUMBER 6612C020

PAGE 6

ADDRESS CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTENTION OF ALAN CUMMINGS

304-558-2402

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS JOBSITE SEE SPECIFICATIONS ď

*709055926 304-464-4441 CARR CONCRETE CORPORATION PO BOX 265 WAVERLY WV 26184-0265

02/13/2012 BID OPENING DATE: 02/29/2 LINE QUANTITY	· \$:		BID OPENIN		
\$4000000000000000000000000000000000000	· \$:			וכי יידאודי מיזי	30PM
CINE GOANTI	UOP CAT. NO.	ITEM NUMBER	ī	UNITPRICE	AMOUNT
THE BIDDER, THE BIDDER IN THE BIDDER HA AGENCIES THAS	A CONTRACT S PROPERLY	UAL RELATI REGISTERED	ONSHIP, AN WITH ANY	D (3) THAT	
***** THIS	is the end	OF RFQ 6	612C020 **	**** TOTAL:	Þ
	l see or ur	ASE SIDE FOR TERM	AND CONDITIONS		1
SIGNATURE	SECHEVE		EPHONE	DATE	
TITLE	EIN	<u> </u>		ADDRESS CHANGES	TO BE NOTED ABOVE

1. SCOPE OF WORK

For labor, materials and equipment necessary to provide Pre-cast Reinforced Concrete Box Culvert Sections to be used in District 1 through District 10 throughout the State of WV per the following specifications.

2. SPECIFICATIONS

The following sections of the West Virginia Department of Transportation, Division of Highways Standard Specifications Roads and Bridges, adopted 2010, as modified by the January 1, 2011 Supplemental Specifications shall apply to the administration of this Contract: Sections 101, 102.4, 105.1, 105.3, 105.4, 105.10, 105.11, 105.12, 106.3, 106.4, 106.5, 106.6, 106.7, 106.9, 107.1, 107.2, 107.3, 107.14, 107.19, 107.20, 108.8, 108.9, 109.1, 109.2, 109.9 and 109.20.

The terms "Contractor" and "Vendor" used in the above specifications or this contract are interchangeable. Contractor shall mean Vendor and Vendor shall mean Contractor.

West Virginia Department of Transportation, Division of Highways Standard Specifications Roads and Bridges, adopted 2010 and the January 1, 2011 Supplemental Specifications may be obtained from:

West Virginia Division of Highways Contract Administration Building 5, Room 722 1900 Kanawha Blvd., East Charleston, West Virginia 25305

Phone: 304-558-2885

http://www.transportation.wv.gov/highways/contractadmin/specifications/2010StandSpec/Pages/default.aspx

3. REQUIREMENTS

All Pre-Cast Concrete Box Sections with a span or rise of 12 feet or less shall be manufactured in accordance with the American Association of State Highway and Transportation Officials' Standard Specifications, AASHTO Designation M 273-11, meeting the design requirements of Table 2, except that all welded wire reinforcement and reinforcing steel bars, where allowed, shall be coated in accordance with AASHTO M 284M/M 284-09 (Epoxy Coating). See www.transportation.org.

The manufactured length of individual box sections may be from four to eight feet in increments of one foot. The maximum section length for delivery to a specific site shall be specified in the Agency Release.

The awarded vendor shall furnish joint sealant material conforming to the requirements of AASHTO Destination M 198-10, Type B for each box section delivered.

It is intended that the box beam sections may be the final roadway wearing surface for the structure.

4. BIDDING INSTRUCTIONS

Bidders may bid on any or all of the sizes of Pre-cast Reinforced Concrete Box Culvert Sections listed on the Bid Schedule. Bid price is per lineal foot.

Vendors are cautioned that the quantities listed on the Bid Schedule are approximations only. It is understood and agreed that the contract shall cover the quantities actually ordered for delivery during the term of the contract, whether more or less than the quantities shown. As the need arises, an Agency Release will be issued by the District to the awarded vendor.

CONTRACT AWARD

Qualified vendors who submit a valid low bid F.O.B Division of Highways' Delivery Site will be awarded a contract for those items for which their bid is low per District. The State of West Virginia reserves the right to make multiple awards on this contract when it is in the best interest of the State.

In the event a Contractor fails to conform to the requirements set out in this contract document, the Agency Release or the governing specifications, the Agency Release may be canceled and reissued to the next low bidder.

6. <u>ACCEPTANCE PLAN</u>

Cracks developing in a box may be cause for rejection of the box. Cracks that are not detrimental to the structural integrity of the box section, as determined by the Division of Highways, may be accepted under the following conditions:

- Cracks of 0.004 inch or less shall be treated with a second coat of a Division of Highways approved concrete sealer.
- 2) Cracks of greater than 0.004 inch shall be treated by a Division of Highways approved epoxy injection method.

All concrete sealer and epoxy injection required for acceptance shall be performed at no additional cost to the Division of Highways.

7. DELIVERY

Upon receipt of an Agency Release, the awarded vendor shall submit shop drawings on Concrete Box Sections with a span or rise of 12 feet or less to the Division of Highways' District Engineer/Manager issuing the Agency Release within twenty (20) calendar days. Shop drawings must be approved by the Division of Highways prior to the manufacture of any box sections.

All box sections shall be delivered to the specified delivery site within ninety (90) calendar days after the awarded vendor's receipt of the approved shop drawings.

The Division of Highways may require that a minimum of forty-eight (48) lineal feet of box sections be delivered to a designated job site in a single calendar day. Upon receipt of an Agency Release specifying a minimum daily delivery requirement, the awarded vendor must notify the Division of Highways' District Engineer/Manager within ten calendar days if the required delivery cannot be accomplished. To meet minimum delivery requirements, the Agency Release may be cancelled and the box section obtained by alternate means.

Should the awarded vendor fail to meet the above delivery schedule, liquidated damages will be assessed in accordance with Section 108.7 of the current Division of Highways Standard Specifications Roads and Bridges.

Sites for delivery of box sections under this contract shall be accessible to equipment that is normally and customarily used for transportation of box sections. Upon receipt of an approved Agency Release, the awarded vendor must notify the Division of Highways' District Engineer/Manager within ten calendar days if delivery under the terms of this contract cannot be performed due to weight restriction or roadway geometric.

Prior to delivery, all Box Sections shall be tested and accepted in accordance with the requirement of AASHTO Designation M 273-11 with a span or rise 12 feet or less.

8. <u>VENDOR'S INVOICE</u>

Vendor's invoices must be submitted in original and one copy and contain the following:

- a. The Agency Release Number and this Contract Number.
- b. Total quantity and unit price with the total cost of box sections.

Note: Under no circumstance will the Division of Highways accept, or pay for, quantities of material in excess of the quantity stated on the Agency Release.

9. PARTIAL PAYMENT OF APPROVED BOXES

Upon completion of manufacture and approval by the Division of Highways of all Box Sections specified on an Agency Release, the awarded vendor may invoice and the Division of Highways will pay for the cost of manufacturing the Box Sections, not to exceed 65% of the total cost of the delivered Box Sections. Partial payment for Box Sections shall be subject to the following conditions:

- a. The awarded vendor must request partial payment and furnish an official invoice for the manufactured and approved Box Sections.
- b. The partial payment invoice shall be accompanied by a surety bond equal to the invoiced amount guaranteeing delivery of all items specified on the Agency Release.
- c. The awarded vendor shall furnish a statement of approved Box Sections condition and exact storage location.

- d. The awarded vendor shall furnish a legal right-of-entry onto the storage site to the Division of Highways' employees and/or agents for the purpose of inspection, sampling, testing and removing any or all Box Sections.
- e. The awarded vendor shall certify that the stored Box Sections are suitably marked and identified as property of the Division of Highways and will not be used for any purpose not designated by the Division of Highways.
- f. The awarded vendor shall furnish an official invoice and the Division of Highways shall process that invoice for the remaining amount (not to exceed 35%) of the total cost of the units upon acceptance of delivery by the Division of Highways.

10. PURCHASING CARD ACCEPTANCE

The State of West Virginia currently utilizes a VISA Purchasing Card Program which is issued through a bank. The successful vendors must accept the State of West Virginia VISA Purchasing Card for payment of all orders placed by Division of Highways Agency Releases for orders as a condition of award.

6612C020

Pre-cast Reinforced Concrete Box Culvert Sections

DELIVERY:

F.O.B. destination to any designated delivery site within District 1 which includes: Boone County, Clay County, Kanawha County, Mason County and Putnam County

UNIT OF MEASURE: LINEAL FOOT BID PRICE: PER LINEAL FOOT

		*Estimated		
		Quantity per	Cost per	Extended
Span	Rise	Lineal Foot	Lineal Foot	Cost
3	2	80	NOBO	MBID
3	2 3 4	80		
3		80		
3 3 3 3 3	5	80		
3	6	80		
3	7	80		
	8	80		
4	3	80		
4		80		
4	4	80		
4	5	80		
4	6	80		
4	7	80		
4	8	80		
5	3	80		
5		80		
5 5 5	4	80		
5	5	80		
5	6	80		
5 5	7	80		
	8	80		
6	2	80		`
6	3 4	80		
6	4	80		
6	5	80		
6	6	80		
6	7	80		
6	8	80		
7	2	80		
7	3 4	80		
7	4	80		
7	5	80		
7	6	80		
7	7	80		
7	8	80		

-		*Catimated	-	
		*Estimated	Cootnor	Extended
O	D!	Quantity per	Cost per Lineal Foot	Cost
Span				
8	2	80	NO BID	NOBID
8	3	80	10 310	NO BID
8	4	80	(de0,00	52,800°°
8	5	80	680.00	54,400°
8	6	80	710,00	56,800°
8	7	80	730 %	58,400°
8	8	80	75500	60,000,00
9	5	80	750.60	10,000,00
9	6	80	760.00	60,800,00
9	7	80	720,00	62,400°
9	8	- 80	&CO.W	104,000xcs
9	9	80	820.00	65,600
9	10	80	100 B10	NORID
10	5	80	\$00,00	14,000,0
10	6	80	820.00	15600°
10	7	80	8-50.00	68,0000
10	8	80	900,00	72.000,19
10	9	80	100000	86 cc000
10	10	80	1100,0	88.000t
11	4	80	800,00	(A.CC) 50
11	6	80	2000	72 100
11	8	80	900,00	172 CYD, 60
11	10	80	120000	96 000
11	11	80	1500,00	120,000
11	12	80	NO BID	NO SO
12	4	80	100 BID	102 MM
12	$\frac{7}{6}$	80	0000	22/1/1
12	8	80	10E1000	74,000
12		80	10000	20 87700
	10	·	1700,	30,000
12	11	80	1500.00	100000
12	12	80	1800	Conty It is unders

6612C020

Pre-cast Reinforced Concrete Box Culvert Sections

DELIVERY:

F.O.B. destination to any designated delivery site within District 2 which includes: Cabell County, Lincoln County, Logan County, Mingo County and Wayne County

UNIT OF MEASURE: LINEAL FOOT BID PRICE: PER LINEAL FOOT

		*Estimated		
		Quantity per	Cost per	Extended
Span	Rise	Lineal Foot	Lineal Foot	Cost
3	2	30	No Bid	No Bid
3		30		
3	4	30		
3 3 3 3	5	30		
3	6	30		
3	7	30		
1	8	30		
4	2 3 4	30		
4	3	30		
4		30		
4	5	30		
4	6	30		
4	7	30		
4	8	30		
5	2	30		
5 5	3	30		
5	4	30		
5 5	5	30		
	6	30		
5	7	30		
5	8	30	<u> </u>	
6	3	30		
6		30		
6	4	30		
6	5	30		<u> </u>
6	6	30		
6	7	30		
6	8	30		
7	2	30		
7	3	30		
7	4	30		
7	5	30		
7	6	30		
7	7	30		
7	8	30		
	1			

		*Estimated			
		Quantity per	Cost per	Extended	
Span	Rise	Lineal Foot	Lineal Foot	Cost	
8	2	30	No Birl	NoBid	
8	3	30	101212	1000	
8	4	30			
8	5	30			
8	6	30			
8	7	30			
8	8	30	- Alb		
9	5	30	800	24,000	⇒
9	6	30	820	24,600,0	ン
9	7	30	840	25,200.	Ç)
9	8	30	860	25,800	c>
9	9	30	1000	30,000	
9	10	30	NOBA	NoBid	_
10	5	30	840	75, 400	XX
10	6	30	860	25,800,0	>
10	7	30	295	26,850	0
10	8	30	0F01	52,1001	0
10	9	30	1200	36,000,	2
10	10	30	1400	42,000	0_
11	4	30	260	25,800	DC.
11	6	30	280	26,4009)
11	8	30	940	20,00	SQ.
11	10	30	1250	37,500,	X)
11	11	30	1400	42,000,9	O
11	12	30	NO Bid	NaBid	
12	4	30	900	27,00	SO -
12	6	30	900	27600	0
12	8	30	1650	3,500	C
12	10	30	1250	37,500,5	p
12	11	30	1400	42,600.	(3
12	12	30	1500	45,600,9	۲

6612C020

Pre-cast Reinforced Concrete Box Culvert Sections

DELIVERY:

F.O.B. destination to any designated delivery site within District 3 which includes: Calhoun County, Jackson County, Pleasants County, Ritchie County, Roane County, Wirt County and Wood County

UNIT OF MEASURE: LINEAL FOOT BID PRICE: PER LINEAL FOOT

DISTRICT 3 WILL NOT BE ORDERING PRE-CAST CONCRETE BOX CULVERT SECTIONS.

·		
		`

6612C020

Pre-cast Reinforced Concrete Box Culvert Sections

DELIVERY:

F.O.B. destination to any designated delivery site within District 4 which includes: Doddridge County, Harrison County, Marion County, Monongalia County, Preston County and Taylor County

UNIT OF MEASURE: LINEAL FOOT BID PRICE: PER LINEAL FOOT

Г		· ·	*Estimated	T	
ı			1	04	Forter I I
l.	2nan	Diag	Quantity per	Cost per	Extended
F		Rise	Lineal Foot	Lineal Foot	Cost
ŀ	3	2			
ŀ	3	3			
-	3 3 3 3 3 3	2 3 4 5 6		V	
L	3	5		X	
L	3				
L	3	7			
L	3	8			
L	4	2			
L	4	2 3 4			
-	4	4		V	
L	4	5		X	
_	4	6 7			
L	4				•
L	4	8			
L	5	2 3 4			
L	5	3			
L	5 5 5 5 5			V	
L	5	5		X	
L					
_	5	7			!
	5	8			
L	6	2 3 4 5			
	6	3		•	
	6	4		*/	•
_	6			X	
	6	6			
	6	7			
	6	8			
	7	2			
	7	3 4			
	7	4		~ ~	
		5		X	
_	7	6		^	
	7 7 7	6			
	7	8			
		<u> </u>			

		*Estimated		
_	 .	Quantity per		Extended
	Rise	Lineal Foot	Lineal Foot	Cost
8	_2_			
8	3			
8	4		1/	
8	5		X	
8	6			
8	7			
8	8			
9	5			
9	6			
9	7		V	
9	8		X	
9	9			
9	10			
10	5			
10	6			
10	7		V	
10	8		X	
10	9			
10	10			:
11	4			
11	6			
11	8		V	
11	10		X	
11	11			
11	12			[
12	4	120	950	114,000.
12	6	·····	 	
12	8			ļ
12	10		Χ	1
12	11		/\	I
12	12			

	·	

6612C020

Pre-cast Reinforced Concrete Box Culvert Sections

DELIVERY:

F.O.B. destination to any designated delivery site within District 5 which includes:

Berkeley County, Grant County, Hampshire County, Hardy

County, Jefferson County, Mineral County and Morgan County

UNIT OF MEASURE: LINEAL FOOT BID PRICE: PER LINEAL FOOT

		*Estimated Quantity per	Cost per	Extended
Span	Rise	Lineal Foot	Lineal Foot	Cost
3	3			
3	3			
3 3 3 3 4	4		V	
3	5 6		X	
3	6			
3	7			
3	8			
	2			
4	2 3 4 5 6 7			
4	4		\ /	
4 4 4	5		X	
4	6		/ \	
4				
4	8			
5 5 5 5	2			
5	2 3 4 5 6	1		
5	4		\ /	
5	5	1	X	
]		
5 5	7			
	8			
6	2			
6 6	3			
6	2 3 4 5			
6	5		X	
6	6		/\	
6	7			
6	8			
7	2			
7 7 7	3			
7	4]	1/	
	2 3 4 5 6 7	1	X	
7	6	1		
7	7			
7	8			

		*Eatimated			
		*Estimated	Coatnau	Extended	
Cnas	Diac	Quantity per Lineal Foot	Cost per Lineal Foot	Cost	
Span		Lineal Foot	Lilleal FOOL	COST	
8	3		Χ		
8	4	48	063	41,220.	C O
8	5			111)	
8	6		v		
8	7		X		
8	8			İ	
9	5				
9	6	1		1	
9	7]	X	1	
9	8]	Λ	ŀ	
9	9				
9	10				
10	5		Χ		
10	6	48	900	43,200,	\circ
10	7				
10	8		Χ		
10	9		/ \		
10	10				
11	6	1			
	1	-	3.7		
11 11	8 10	-	X	1	
11	11	-	- 1	ļ	
11	12	-		1	•
	}	52		1/2 100	cC
12	4	52	<u> </u>	62,400	
12	6		,	1 A = 2 A	0
12	8	96	1600	153,60	•
12	10]	\ /		
12	11		Χ		
12	12			only It is under	

6612C020

Pre-cast Reinforced Concrete Box Culvert Sections

DELIVERY:

*Estimated

F.O.B. destination to any designated delivery site within District 6 which includes: Brooke County, Hancock County, Marshall County, Ohio County, Tyler County and Wetzel County

UNIT OF MEASURE: LINEAL FOOT BID PRICE: PER LINEAL FOOT

		^Estimated	i	
		Quantity per	Cost per	Extended
Span	Rise	Lineal Foot	Lineal Foot	Cost
3	3			
3 3 3				
3	4		1/	
	5		X	
3	6			
3	7			į
3	8			
4	2			
4	3			1
4	4		\	ł
4	5		X	
4	6		/ \	,
4	7			
4	8			
5	3		X	j
5				
5	4.	100	600	60,000.40
5 5	5			
	6		Χ	1
5 5	7		^	
	8			
6	3		1/	
6	3		X	
6	4			
6	5	100	700	76,600 ⁶
6	6			
6	7		X	
6	8			
7	2		**	
7	3 4		X	
7				
7	5	100	760	76,000,0
7	6			····
7	7		Χ	
7	8			
•		L		

		*Estimated		
		Quantity per		Extended
Span		Lineal Foot	Lineal Foot	Cost
8	3			
8	3		X	
8	4		^	
8	5			
8	6	100	900	90,000
8	7		V	
8	8			<u> </u>
9	5			
9	6			
9	7		X	
9	8		\wedge	ł
9	9			
9	10		r	
10	5		V	
10	6		X	
10	7			
10	8	100	1200	120,000
10	9		X	
10	10			
11_	4			
11	6			
11	8		X	
11	10]	^	
11	11	j		
11	12			
12	4			
12	6			
12	8		X	
12	10	1	^	
12	11	1		
12	12	1		

6612C020

Pre-cast Reinforced Concrete Box Culvert Sections

DELIVERY:

F.O.B. destination to any designated delivery site within District 7 which includes: Barbour County, Braxton County, Gilmer County, Lewis County, Upshur County and Webster County

UNIT OF MEASURE: LINEAL FOOT BID PRICE: PER LINEAL FOOT

		*Estimated	Coot nor	Evtondod
Span	Rise	Quantity per Lineal Foot	Cost per Lineal Foot	Extended Cost
3	2			
3 3 3 3	2 3 4 5			'
3	4		* -	
3			X	
3	6			
3	7			
3	8			
4	2			·
4	3			
	4		\	
4	2 3 4 5 6 7		X	
4	6			
4				÷
4	8			
5	2			
5 5	2			
5	4		1.7	
5	5		X	
5	6		/ \	
	7			
5 5	8			
6	2			
6	3			
6 6	2 3 4 5		.	
			X	
6	6		/	
6	7			
6	8			
7	2			<u> </u>
7	3			
7	4		V	
7	5		X	
7	6		<i>-</i> \	
7	7			
7	8			

		÷ □-4!41			
		*Estimated	04	Padanalad	
C	Di	Quantity per	Cost per	Extended	
Span	Rise	Lineal Foot	Lineal Foot	Cost	
8	3				
8	3		Χ		
8	4 5		/\		
8	6	24	010	20 CAGE	5
8	7	<u>۲</u> ۳	860 X	20,600 21,600	
8	8	24	960	21.00	
		<i>L</i> 4	100	21,000	
9	5 6				
9	7		\	ļ	
9	8		X		
9	9		/ \		
9	10				
10	5		Х		
10	6	24		24.000	5 ∕>
10	7		/000\ X	24,000	
10	8	24		28,800, 43,200	eO
10	9		1260 X		
10	10	24	1800	43.2cc	00
11	4				
11	6				
11	8		V		
11	10	1	X		
11	11	1	•		
11	12				
12	4		Χ		
12	6	24	1000	24000.0	٥
12	8	24	1200	28,800 43,200	(CC)
12	10	24	1800	43,200	හර #
12	11		Χ		
12	12	24	2400	57,kt0.	0

6612C020

Pre-cast Reinforced Concrete Box Culvert Sections

DELIVERY:

F.O.B. destination to any designated delivery site within District 8 which includes: Pendleton County, Pocahontas County, Randolph County and Tucker County

UNIT OF MEASURE: LINEAL FOOT BID PRICE: PER LINEAL FOOT

		*Estimated		
		Quantity per	Cost per	Extended
Span		Lineal Foot	Lineal Foot	Cost
3 3 3 3 3 3	2 3 4 5 6			
3	3			
3	4		V	
3	5		X	
3	6		7 \	
3	7			
	8			
4 4	3 4			
4	3			
4	4		V	
4	5 6 7		X	
4	6			
4	1			
4	8			
5	$\frac{2}{2}$			
5	3			
5	4		V	
5 5 5 5 5	2 3 4 5 6		X	
5	7			
. ,	8			-
6	$\frac{2}{2}$			
6	$\frac{3}{4}$			
6	2 3 4 5		* #	
			X	;
6	6			
6	7			
6	8			
7				
	3	-		
7	2 3 4 5 6			
7	5		X	
7 7 7	6		^	
7	7			
$\frac{1}{7}$	8			
	<u> </u>			

		*Estimated		
		Quantity per		Extended
Span	Rise	Lineal Foot	Lineal Foot	Cost
8	2			
8	3			
8	4		V	
8	5		X	
8	6			
8	7			
8	8			
9	5			
9	6			
9	7		X	
9	8		7	
9	9			•
9	10			
10	5			1
10	6			1
10	7		X	
10	8		^	
10	9			
10	10			
11	4			
11	6			
11	8		Χ	
11	10		^	
11	11			
11	12			
12	4	40	1200	48,000.90
12	6	48	1600	76,800 C
12	8	48	1850	48,000° 76,800° 88,860°
12	10			
12	11		X	
12	12		/	

6612C020

Pre-cast Reinforced Concrete Box Culvert Sections

DELIVERY:

F.O.B. destination to any designated delivery site within District 9 which includes: Fayette County, Greenbrier County, Monroe County, Nicholas County and Summers County

UNIT OF MEASURE: LINEAL FOOT BID PRICE: PER LINEAL FOOT

		*Estimated		
		Quantity per	Cost per	Extended
Span	Rise	Lineal Foot	Lineal Foot	Cost
3	2	24	NO BID	NABOO
3	3	24		Į į
3	4	32		
3	5	32		
3 3 3 3 3 3	6	32		
3	7	32		
	8	32		
4	2	24		
4	2 3 4	24		
4		32 32		
4	5	32		
4	6 7	32		
4		32		
4	8	32		
5	2	24		
5	3 4	24		
5 5 5 5		32		
5	5	32		
	1	32		
5	7	32		
	8	32		
6	2	24		
6	2 3 4	24		
6	4	32 32		
6	5	32		
6	6	32		
6	7	32		
6	8	32		
7	2 3 4	24		
7	3	24		
7	4	24 32		
7	5	32		
7		32		
7	7	32		\neg
7	8	32		
<u>.</u>				

		*Estimated		
		Quantity per	Cost per	Extended
Span	Rise	Lineal Foot	Lineal Foot	Cost
8	2	24	NoBid	Nobid
8	3	24		d
8	4	32		
8	5	32		
8	6	32		
8	7	32		
8	8	32		
9	5	32		
9	6	32		
9	7	32		
9	8	32		
9	9	32		
9	10	32		
10	5	32		
10	6	32		
10	7	32		
10	8	32		
10	9	32		
10	10	32		
11	4	32		
11	6	32		
11	8	32		
11	10	32		
11	11	32		
11	12	32		
12	4	32		
12	6	32		
12	8	32		
12	10	32		
12	11	32		
12	12	32		

6612C020

Pre-cast Reinforced Concrete Box Culvert Sections

DELIVERY:

F.O.B. destination to any designated delivery site within District 10 which includes: McDowell County, Mercer County, Raleigh County and Wyoming County

UNIT OF MEASURE: LINEAL FOOT BID PRICE: PER LINEAL FOOT

			*Estimated		-
			Quantity per	Cost per	Extended
	Span		Lineal Foot	Lineal Foot	Cost
	3	3			
I		3			
	3 3 3 3 4	4		**	
Ì	3	5		X	
	3	6		/ \	
İ	3	6 7			
	3	8			
I	4	2 3 4			
I	4	3			
l				•	
l	4	5 6		X	
l	4	6			
l	4	7			
L	4	8			
I	5	2			
ľ	5 5 5 5	2 3 4 5 6			
	5	4		\ /	
L	5	5		X	
Ĺ					
L	5	7 8			
L		1			
	6	2 3 4 5			
L	6	3			
L	6	4		\ /	
L	6			X	,
L	6	6			
L	6	7			
L		8			
	7	2 3			
	7				
	7	4		\ /	
	7			X	
	7 7 7	5		/ \	
_	7	7			
	7	8			
-	 -				

		T		
		*Estimated		
		Quantity per		Extended
Span	Rise	Lineal Foot	Lineal Foot	Cost
8	3		Χ	
8				-
8	4	36	NoBid	NoBid
8	5			
8	6		X	
8	7	·	^	
8	8			
9	5			
9	5 6 7			
9	7		V	
9	8		X	
9	9			
9	10			
10	5	48	No Bid	Nobid
10	6	44	4	1
10	7		7/11/2	
10	8		**	
10	9		X	
10	10		- -	
11	4			
11	6			
11	8		V	•
11	10		X	
11	11			
11	12			
12	4			
12	6		3 #	
12	8		X	
12	10			
12	11			
12	12	32	Norsa	NoBd

State of West Virginia

VENDOR PREFERENCE CERTIFICATE

Certification and application* is hereby made for Preference in accordance with West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37. (Does not apply to construction contracts). West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37, provides an opportunity for qualifying vendors to request (at the time of bid) preference for their residency status. Such preference is an evaluation method only and will be applied only to the cost bid in accordance with the West Virginia Code. This certificate for application is to be used to request such preference. The Purchasing Division will make the determination of the Resident Vendor Preference, if applicable.

1.	Application is made for 2.5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked: Bidder is an individual resident vendor and has resided continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or, Bidder is a partnership, association or corporation resident vendor and has maintained its headquarters or principal place of business continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or 80% of the ownership interest of Bidder is held by another individual, partnership, association or corporation resident vendor who has
	maintained its headquarters or principal place of business continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or, Bidder is a nonresident vendor which has an affiliate or subsidiary which employs a minimum of one hundred state residents and which has maintained its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia continuously for the four (4) years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or,
2.	Application is made for 2.5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked: Bidder is a resident vendor who certifies that, during the life of the contract, on average at least 75% of the employees working on the project being bid are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two years immediately preceding submission of this bid; or,
3.	Application is made for 2.5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked: Bidder is a nonresident vendor employing a minimum of one hundred state residents or is a nonresident vendor with an affiliate or subsidiary which maintains its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia employing a minimum of one hundred state residents who certifies that, during the life of the contract, on average at least 75% of the employees or Bidder's affiliate's or subsidiary's employees are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two years immediately preceding submission of this bid; or,
4.	Application is made for 5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked: Bidder meets either the requirement of both subdivisions (1) and (2) or subdivision (1) and (3) as stated above; or,
5.	Application is made for 3.5% resident vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked: Bidder is an individual resident vendor who is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard and has resided in West Virginia continuously for the four years immediately preceding the date on which the bid is submitted; or,
6.	Application is made for 3.5% resident vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked: Bidder is a resident vendor who is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard, if, for purposes of producing or distributing the commodities or completing the project which is the subject of the vendor's bid and continuously over the entire term of the project, on average at least seventy-five percent of the vendor's employees are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two immediately preceding years.
require against or dedu	understands if the Secretary of Revenue determines that a Bidder receiving preference has failed to continue to meet the ments for such preference, the Secretary may order the Director of Purchasing to: (a) reject the bid; or (b) assess a penalty t such Bidder in an amount not to exceed 5% of the bid amount and that such penalty will be paid to the contracting agency acted from any unpaid balance on the contract or purchase order.
authori the req deeme	mission of this certificate, Bidder agrees to disclose any reasonably requested information to the Purchasing Division and zes the Department of Revenue to disclose to the Director of Purchasing appropriate information verifying that Bidder has paid uired business taxes, provided that such information does not contain the amounts of taxes paid nor any other information d by the Tax Commissioner to be confidential.
	penalty of law for false swearing (West Virginia Code, §61-5-3), Bidder hereby certifies that this certificate is true curate in all respects; and that if a contract is issued to Bidder and if anything contained within this certificate es during the term of the contract, Bidder will notify the Purchasing Division in writing immediately.
	: Carr Concrete Corp Signed: Robert Burn Stanly
Date:_	2-27-2012 Title: Project Manager
*Check	any combination of preference consideration(s) indicated above, which you are entitled to receive.

RFQ No.	66120020

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA Purchasing Division

PURCHASING AFFIDAVIT

West Virginia Code §5A-3-10a states: No contract or renewal of any contract may be awarded by the state or any of its political subdivisions to any vendor or prospective vendor when the vendor or prospective vendor or a related party to the vendor or prospective vendor is a debtor and the debt owed is an amount greater than one thousand dollars in the aggregate.

DEFINITIONS:

"Debt" means any assessment, premium, penalty, fine, tax or other amount of money owed to the state or any of its political subdivisions because of a judgment, fine, permit violation, license assessment, defaulted workers' compensation premium, penalty or other assessment presently delinquent or due and required to be paid to the state or any of its political subdivisions, including any interest or additional penalties accrued thereon.

"Debtor" means any individual, corporation, partnership, association, limited liability company or any other form or business association owing a debt to the state or any of its political subdivisions. "Political subdivision" means any county commission; municipality; county board of education; any instrumentality established by a county or municipality; any separate corporation or instrumentality established by one or more counties or municipalities, as permitted by law; or any public body charged by law with the performance of a government function or whose jurisdiction is coextensive with one or more counties or municipalities. "Related party" means a party, whether an individual, corporation, partnership, association, limited liability company or any other form or business association or other entity whatsoever, related to any vendor by blood, marriage, ownership or contract through which the party has a relationship of ownership or other interest with the vendor so that the party will actually or by effect receive or control a portion of the benefit, profit or other consideration from performance of a vendor contract with the party receiving an amount that meets or exceed five percent of the total contract amount.

EXCEPTION: The prohibition of this section does not apply where a vendor has contested any tax administered pursuant to chapter eleven of this code, workers' compensation premium, permit fee or environmental fee or assessment and the matter has not become final or where the vendor has entered into a payment plan or agreement and the vendor is not in default of any of the provisions of such plan or agreement.

Under penalty of law for false swearing (West Virginia Code §61-5-3), it is hereby certified that the vendor affirms and acknowledges the information in this affidavit and is in compliance with the requirements as stated.

Vendor's Name: Carr Con Cre	ete Coro		
Authorized Signature: Robert 1Bu	n'Startey	Date: 2-27	-12
State of WV			
County of Wood , to-wit	:		
Taken, subscribed, and sworn to before me	his 27 day of Feb	, 20/2	
My Commission expires Feb	8,20,20	, 1	
AFFIX SEAL HERE	NOTARY PUBL	10 Whidi Kg	Yan



WITNESS THE FOLLOWING SIGNATURE

Please use this document for technical questions, posing in a question format

Please refer to the section your question	on is in reference to.	
Technical questions for RFQ#	·	
Vendor Name:		
Questions:		