State of Wast Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division .
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 26305-0130

RFQ COPY _
. PYPE NAME/ADDRESS HERE -

*709044732 304-768-9733
West Virginia Paving, Inc.

PO Box 544 '

Dunbar, WV 25064

Request for [
Quotation

BUYER 33
04 -K5R-2402

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

BY ORDER

DATEPRINT

VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED

Net 30

07/08/2011

Destination

Net 30

RAPID CURING

OPEN

THE WEST VIRGINIA

OLICITING BIDS FOR AN
I, LABOR, MATERI:
ODIFIED WINTER G

XHIBIT 1

IFE OF CONTRACT:
PON AWARD AND EXTENDS

§ NECESSARY |TO OBTAIN
RIGINAL CONTRACT
OT EXCEED TWELVE
'TME" THE VENDOR
EASON UPON GIVIN
[(RITTEN NOTICE.

(12)

L'

. THE

et

NILESS SPECIREIC PROVIS]
HIS CONTRACT DOCUMENT
TS AGENCIES, OR HOLITI
ONDITIONS AND PRICING
MHE LIFE OF THE CONTRAC

F o TR O L P B o)

) . 745-87
CUTBACK AEPHALT PATCHING

END CONTRACT

8 AND EQUIPMENT NEC

E BITUMINOUS PATCH
COLD MIX) T¢ VARJOUS XLOCATIONS THROUGHOUT
TSTRICT 1 THROUGH DISTRICT 10.

THIZ
FOR A PERIOD OF
EAR OR UNTIL SUCH "REASONABLE TIME® THEREAFTER AS
A NEW CONTRACT QR RENEW THE
THE
MONTHS .
Y THRMINATE THIS COD

IX

gTATE PURCHASING DIVISION FOR THE
AGENCY. THE WEST VIRGINIA DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS IS
OPEN END CONTRA§T TO  PROVIDE

SSARY TO SUPPLY
NG MIXTURE

CONTRACT BECOMES EFFECTIVE
ONE (1)

"REASONABLE TIR
DURING

E" PERIOD SHALL
THIS “REASONABLE
TRACT FOR ANY

DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING 30 DAYS

ONS ARE STIPULATED ELSEWHERE IN
BY THE STATE OF
CAL SUBDIVISIONS,
SET FORTH HEREIN
T.

WEST VIRGINIA,
THE TERMS,
ARE FIRM FOR

T
P

IR REIEEY

CLI AT
N _..' o ‘.‘F £ o i__,)

FEEY) FE TR

EREVERSE AIREEORIERYS 23

304-768-9733

July 27, 2011

FEIN

TITLE 7" ' '
l Vice President

55-057-0769-04

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS

IN SPAGE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'



GENERAL TERMS & CONDITIONS

REQUEST FOR QUOTATION (RFQ) AND REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL (RFP) - - ' |

1, Awards will be made In the best interest of the-State of West Virginia,

2. The State may accept ot rejectin pari, or in whole, any bid. o L

3, Prior to any award, the apparent successful vendor must be properly registered with the Purchasing Division
and have paid the reqiired $125 fee, _ , o C . :
4, Al services petformed ‘or goods. dellvered under State Purchase Order/Contracts are to bs continued for the

‘term of the Purchase Order/Contracts, contingent upon funds being appropriated by the Legislature. or offierwise
being made avaflable. In the event funds are not appropriated or otherwise available for these services .or goods

this Purchase Qrder/Contract becomes void and of no effect after June 30,

" 5. Payment may only be made after the delivery and acceptance of goods or services,
-6. Interest may be pald for late payment In accordance with the West Virginia. Code. -

7. Vendor proference will be granted upon wtitten request in accordance with the West Virginia Code.
8. The State of West Virginia is exempt from federal and state taxes and will not pay or relmburse such faxes. o
9. The Director of Purchasing may cancel any Purchase Order/Contract upon 30 days writtsn notice to the seller. s

" 10; The laws of the State' of West Virginla and the Leglslative Rules of the Purchasing Divislon shall govemn the

purchasing process. -

11. Any reforence to attomatic renewal Is hereby deleted. The Coniract may be renewed only upon mutual W?ltten E

agreement of the partles.

12, BANKRUPTCY: In the event the vendor/fcontractor files for bankruptey protection, the State may deem -

" this contract nuil and vold, and terimlnate such contract without further order. .

13. HIPAA BUSINESS ASSOCIATE ADDENDUM: The West Virginia State Goveriment HIPAA Business Assoclate
Addendum (BAA), approved by the Attomey General, is available onfine at wwiw.state.wv.us/adinin/purchaséfvro/hipaa.hitm
and Is. heraby made -part of the agreement. Provided that the Agency maels the definition of a Cover Entity.

.

(45 CFR §160.103) and will be disclosing Protected Heallh Information {45 CFR §160.103) to the vendor. -~ o
~ 14. CONFIDENTIALITY: The vendor agrees that he or she will nhot disclose to anyone, directly or, indirectly, any such

ersonally idantifiable information or other confidential information galned from the agency, unless the individua) who Is

he subject of the Information consents to the disclosure in writing or the disclosure Is made pursuant to the agency's ~ -
policiss, procedures, and rules. Vendor further agrees to comply with the Confidentiality ollcies and Information

Security Accountability. Requirements, set forth in hitp/fwww.state wv us/admin/purchase/privacy/motice Conficentlalily.pdf.

15. LICENSING: Vendors must be licensed and In good standing (n accordance with any and all state and local faws énc_[ -
requirements by any state or local agency of West Virglnia, Includihg, but not limited o, the -West Virginia Secretary .

of State's Offica, the West Virginia Tax Dopartment, and the West Virginla Insurance Commission. The vendor must

provide all necessary releases to obtain  Informaton to enable the director . or  spanding unit to_-_f

varify that the vendor is licensed and in good standing with the above entities.

16. ANTITRUST: In submitting a bid to any agency for the State of West Virginia, fhe bidder offers and agrees that -

If the bid is accepted the bidder will conveyhsell, assign or transfer to the State of West Virginia alf rights, title and interest

in and to all causes of action It may now or : -3 k: _
West Virginia for price fixing and/or unreasonable restraints of trade relaling to the particular commodities or seryices

purchasad or acquired by the State of West Virgirifa. Such assignment shall be made and becdime sffactive at the time the. K

purchasing agency tenders the Initial payment to the bidder.

| certify that this bid Is mads without prior understanding, agreement, or connection with any corporation, firm, lmied-. .
labllity company, partnership, or person or entlty submitling a bid for the. same material, supplies, equipment or -

services and Is in all respects fair and without collusion or Fraud. | further certify that | am authorized to sign
the certification on behalf of the bidder or this bid. : : D

INSTRUCTIONS TOBIDDERS - = .
1. Use the quotation forms provided by the Purchasing Division. Complete 4l sections of the quotation form.

2, ltems offered must be in compliance with the specifications. Any deviation from the speclfications must be clearly
indicated by the bidder. Alternates offered by the bidder as EQUAL to the specifications must be clearly
defined. bidder offering an alternate should attach complete specifications and lterature to the. bid. -The
Purchasihg Divislon may walve minor deviations to specifications, . o : o
3. Unit prices shall prevall In case of discrepancy. All quotations are considered F.O.B. destination unless afternate
shipping terms are clearly Identified in the quotation, o _ - -
4, All quotations must be delivered by the bidder to the office listed below prior to the date and time of the bid.

. opening. Fallure of the bidder to daliver the quotations on time will resultin bid disqualifications: Departmant of

Administration, Purchasing Division, 2019 Washington Street East, PO, Box 60130, Charleston, WV 25305-0130 -
5, Communication during the sollcltation, bid, evaluation or award periads, except through the Purchasing Division,
is striclly prohibited (W.Va. C.S.R. §148-1-6.6). : o

ereafter acquire under the antitrust laws of the United States and the State of

Rev. 12/(5/08 .~
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Rov. 00108 State of West Virginia

VENDOR PREFERENCE CERTIFICATE

Certification and application* is hereby made for Preference in accordance with West Virginla Code, §5A-3-37. (Does not apply fo
construction contracts). West Virginia Code, §56A-3-37, provides an opportunity for qualifying vendors to request (at the time of bid)
preference for their residency staius. Such preference is an evaluation method only and will be appiied only to the cost bid in
accordance with the West Virginla Code. This certlficate for application is to be used to request such preference. The Purchasing
Division will make {ha determination of the Resident Vendor Preference, if applicable, :

1. Application is made for 2,5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is an individual resident vendor and has resided confinuously in West Virginia for four (4} years immediataly preced-
ing the date of this cerification; or, )

Bidder is a partnership, association or corporation resident vendor and has maintained its headquarters or principal place of
business continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or 80% of the
ownership interest of Biddar is held by another individual, parinerfship, association or corporation resident vendor who has
maintained its headquatters or principal place of business continuously in West Virginla for four {4) years immediately
preceding the date of this certification, or,

Bidder is a nonresident vendor which has an affiliate or subsidiary which employs a minimum of one hundred stale residents
and which has maintained its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia continuously for the four (4)
years irnmediately preceding the date of this certification; or,

Application is made for 2.6% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is a resident vendor who.cettifies that, during the life of the contract, on average at least 76% of the employees
working on the project belng bid are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two years
immediately preceding submission of this bid; or,

—_—

|

Application is made for 2.5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is a nonresident vendor employing a minimum of one hundred state residents or isa nonresident vendor with an

affiliate or subsidiary which maintains its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia employing a

minimum of one hundred state residents who certifies that, during the life of the contract, on average at least 756% of the
" employees or Bidder's affiliate’s or subsidiary's employees are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the slate

continuously for the two years immediately preceding submission of this bid; or,

1 w

Application Is made for 5% resldent vendor preference for the reason checked:
Bidder meets sifher the requirement of both subdivisions (1) and (2)-or subdivision (1) and (3) as stated above; or,

Application Is made for 3.5% resldent vendor preference who is a veferan for the reason checked: .
Bidder is anindividual resident vendor who is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard
and has resided in West Virginta continuously for the four years immediately preceding the date on which the bid is
submitted; or, )

=
|7 ]

Application is made for 3,5% resident vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked:

Bidder Is a resident vendor who is a veteran of the Uniied States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard, If, for
purposes of producing or distributing the commodities or completing the project which s the subject of the vendor’s bid and
confinuously over the entire term of the project, on average at least seventy-five percent of the vendor's employees are
resldents of West Virginia who have resided in the state coniinuously for the fwo immaediately preceding years.

P

Bidder understands if the Secretary of Revenue determines lhat a Bidder recelving preference has fajled to contlnue to meet the
requirements for such preference, the Secretary may order the Director of Purchasing to: (a) reject the bid; or (b) assess a penaity
against such Bidder in an amount not to exceed 5% of the bid amount and that such penalty wiil be paid to the conlracling agency
of deducted from ahy unpaid balance on the contract or purchase order.

By subrission of this certificate, Bidder agrees to disclose any reasonably requested information to the Purchasing Division and
authorizes the Department of Revenue to disclose fo the Director of Purchasing appropriate information verifying that Bidder has paid
the required business taxes, provided that such information does not contain the amounts of {axes paid nor any other informalion
deemed by the Tax Commissioner to be confidential,

Under ponalty of law for false swearing {West Virginla Code, §61-5-3), Bidder herehy certifies that—ﬁﬁis certiﬂééteis true
and accurate In all respects; and that if a contract is issued to Bidder and if anything contained within this cetfiflcate
changes during the term of the contract, Bidder will notify the Purchasing Divislon in writing immediately.

Bidder: West Virginia Paving, inc. Signed: /ﬁj Storfia

Date: August 3, 2011 ' Title: Vice President

“Check any combinalion of preference censiderallon(s) indicated above, which you are entitted o recelve,



1. SPECIFICATIONS

The following sections of the West Virginia Department of Transportation, Division of Highways' Standard
Specifications Roads and Bridges, adopted 2010 as modified by the January 1, 2011 Supplemental
Specifications shall apply fo the administration of the Contract: Sections 101, 102.4, 102.5, 105.1, 105.3,
105.4, 105,10, 105.11, 105.12, 105.13, 106.3, 106.4, 106.5, 106.6, 106.7, 108.9, 107.1, 107.2, 107.3, 107.14,
10718, 107.20, 108.8, 109.1, 109.2 and 109.20.

The requirements of the West Virginia_Department of Transporation, Division of Highways', Standard
Specifications Section 109.20, PRICE_ADJUSTMENT FOR LOAD LIMIT VIOLATIONS shall apoly to af
material supplied under this coniract,This will include material loaded by the vendor into Division of Highways
owned andfor rented trucks. '

The terms “Confractor” and "Vendor” used in the above specifications and throughout this Confract are
interchangeable. Contractor shall mean Vendor and Vendor shall mean Contractor.

West Virginia Department of Transportation, Division of Highways' Standard Specifications Roads and
Bridges, Adopted 2010 as modified by the January 1, 2011 Supplemental Specifications may be obtained
from: - ) '

West Virginia Division of Highways

Contract Adminisiration Division

Building Five, Room 722

1900 Kanawha Boulevard, East

Chareston, West Virginia 253056

' http:ffwww.transportation wv.gov/highways/contractadmin/specifications/2010StandSpec/Pagesidefaull.aspx

2. SCOPE OF WORK

The purpose of this contract is to provide for alt fabor, materials and e'qL:ipment necessary fo supply Modified
Winter Grade Bituminous Patching Mixture (Cold Mix) fo the various locations listed in Section 13, Bid
Schedule. Actual quantities fo be delivered o each location will be specified in an Agency Release, which wil
be issued by the Division of Highways at the fime delivery is required,

3 DESCRIPTION

The patching material shall be composed of a suitable aggregate, plant mixed with & liquid asphalt material
and chemical anfi-stripping addifives. The material shall maintain adhesive qualittes for all moisture condifions
in the patched areas, except those having standing water.

4 MATERIALS

AGGREGATE

The coarse aggregate shall be a clean material consisting of crushed stone, crushed gravel or slag, meefing



the requirements of the Division of Highways' Standard Spegcifications subsections 703.1, 703.2 and 703.3
respactively,  Fine aggregate shall meef the reqwrements of the Division of Highways' Standard
Specifications Subsecion 702.3.

* Allowable standard aggregate sizes shall be #89, #9, or a- blend composed of #8 with a minimum of 50% #9.
The aggregate gradation shall be as recommended by the liquid asphalt supplier.

The gradation shall be determined in accordance with AASHTO T27 and AASHTO THA.
The aggregate fraction of the final mixture shell meet the crushed particle requirements of Division of

Highways' Standard Specifications Subsection 703.2.2. Questionable aggregates shall be tested as per MP
703.00.21, except the No. 8 51eve will be used.

ASPHALT MATERIAL

The. asphalt material shall be liquid asphall containing a minimum of 2.5% chemical anfi-stripping additives
meeting the requirements of the liquid asphalt suppher

Results from the following test methods and any additional tests conducted by the fiquid asphalt suppher shall
be presented to the respective Division of Highways District Materials Engineer/Supervisor for review prior to

production.

 Modified Asphalt Test
(1)  Flash Point °C {°F} - AASHTO T79
} Kinematic Viscosity in ¢St at 60°C {140°F)
Requirement - 350 fo 500 ¢St - AASHTO T201
(3)  Water (%)-Requirement-0.2% maximumm ~ AASHTO T55
)

{4 Distilfate Test - AASHTO T78
% To 225°C (4379F)
% To 2600C {5000F)
% To 315¢C {600F) .
Residue (%) at 360°C(680°F)
Residue Tests
(5} Ductifity at 25°C(77°F) - AASHTO T4
(6) Solubility Test - AASHTO T44
COMPOSITION OF MIXTURE

The aggregates and asphalt material shall be combined in such proportions that the composition by weight of
the finished mixture shall meet the requirements of the plant mix formula.

The aggregate fraction of the mixture shall be evaluated in accordance with AASHTO T27 and AASHTO Tﬁ ‘
and shall mest the requirements of the plant mix formula range. Any material failing to meet specification
requirements on any sieve shall not be approved.

The minimum amount of asphalt shall be as indicated in the table below, The amount of asphalt shall be
sufficient to thoroughly coat the aggregate partictes and provide enough adhesion fo hold the compacted
particles together under traffic conditions when propstly. placed and fo assure that the aggregate parficles



remain sufficiently coated after stockpiling.

Minimum Asphalt Content for Modified Patching Mixture
#89 or Blend of
Aggregate Type #8 with minimum of #9
50% #9
% Asphalf Note4 5.5% 6.0%

Note-1: Add a minimum additional 0.5% asphalt to the above
values for mixtures containing high-absomtive aggregates (>1.5%)

PLANT MIX FORMULA

The plant mix formula shall be in accordance with the recommendations of the liquid asphalt supplier. The
plant mix formuta composition report, which shall include fhe percentage of chemical anti-stripping additive,
shall be forwarded fo the District Materials Supervisor/Engineer before the mixture is produced. ;

~ CHANGES N PLANT MIX FORMULA

Should the contractor at any ime propose fo change the source of aggregate in the mikture, the definite
asphalt content or change the source of the bituminous material, the provisions of the Division of Highways'
Standard Specifications Subsection 401.4.2 shall apply.

QUALITY CONTROL TESTING

Quality contro! is the responsibility of the confractor. Quiality control testing shall inchide daily asphalt content
and gradation analysis of the design aggregate structure during production. Since the aggregate and asphalt
material are required fo be measured separately and accurately fo the proportions of the plant mix formula,
the asphalf content may be determined by calculating the percentage by total weight of mixture. However, all
standard methods of determining the asphalt content of the mixture that are allowed for hot mix asphalt under
Section 401 of the Division of Highways' Standard Specifications are acceptable. The ignition oven fest
method, AASHTO T308, would require an asphalt content correction factor, however, due fo the low flash
point of most asphalts used in cold mix, this test method is not recommended. If the AASHTO T164 soivent
extraction test method is used, a non-chiorinated solvent may be substituted for the standard specified solvent
and the test method may be modified as per the recommendafions of the soivent manufacturet/suppiler.

In addition, for each day of production, the completed mixture shalt be tested for aggregate coafing as follows:

Obtain a 100 — 150 gram sample and allow it to cure to normal taboratory temperature. Place the samplein a
glass jar of sufficient size that the loose sample will protrude to a level of no more than half of its capacity.
Cover the sample with water to approximately three-quarters of the capacily of the jar. Place a fight fitting
cover on the jar and allow it to stand for a period of 20 to 24 hours at normal laboratory temperature, The
sample jar shall then be vigorously agitated for a period of 30 seconds. Pour the water from the jar, remove
the sample, and spread it on a fiat light-colored surface (nonstick laboratory paper is recommended). Allow
the sample to air dry and visually examine it for stripping of the asphalt fiim from the aggregate. Esfimate the
amount of coated aggregate. Any thin brownish, transiucent areas are to be considered fully coated with an
asphalt film., Document the results of this fest.. The mixture shall be considered acceptable if af least 95% of




the aggregate is coated. Insufficient coating may fec{uire reworking of the mixture andfor an additional
amount of anti-stripping additive.

ACCEPTANCE OF THE MIXTURE

Acceptance shall be the resyonsibiliiy of the Division of Highways. This shalf be accomplished by moniforing
the contractor's quality control testing and reviewing all test data relevant to the mixture.

In addition, if the completed mixture shows signs of stripping, the Division of Highways shall choose to efther
monitor the contracior's quality confrol aggregate coafing test or conduct their own test and visually estimate
the amount of coated pariicles, Document the results of this test. Although this is a visual esfimation, the
confractor should be immediately nofified if the Division of Highway's fest results are below 95%. A low
coafing percentage should be an indicator for the Division of Highways to closely monitor the mixture after
stockpiling. All Division of H[ghways testmg shall be performed by the Division of Highways' D[stnct Materials
Section.

After the mixture is stockpiled on fhe Division of Highways' lot, it shall be visually evaluated for any
appearance of excessive non-fully coated aggregate paricles. If considered necessary, the Division of
Highways shall evaluate the mixture in accordance with ASTM D2483 {based on two-sample average) io

determine if at least 97% of the coarse aggregate particlns are fully.coated. This evaluation shall take place

within the first week after stockpiling. i the mixture Is less than 97% coated, the contractor will be required to
provide new material or remove the existing stockpite matetial from the Division of Highways' lot, rework it fo
an acceptable condition with addifional asphalt andfor chemical anti-stripping addifive as needed and retum. lt
to the Division of Highways' lot, at no additional cost to the Division of Highways.

PREPARATION OF MDXTURE

The aggregate shall be heated to insure that it is surface dry &t the time of mixing; however, the aggregate
temperature shall not exceed the safe temperature recommended by the liquid asphalt supplier. The liguid
asphalt shall not be heated beyond the safe temperature recommended by the liquid asphalt supplier. Care
shall be taken to prevent local overheating.

The aggregate and asphalt material shall be measured separately and accurately fo the proporfions in which
they are to be mixed. After the aggregate and binder have been combined, they shall be thorotighly mixed
unil the pariicles of aggregate are coated. The temperature of the finished mixture shall not be greater than
the maximum temperature recommended by the iiquid asphalt supplier.

WORKABILITY

The mixture shall be stockpiled on the vendor's site for 14 days or until the intemal mixture temperaiure is
within 10°F of ambient temperature without stripping and when taken from a stockpile, shall be capable of
being shoveled, raked spread and compacted.

At the end of the stockpiling penod on the contractor's yard, the mixture shall be tested in accordance with
ASTM D2489 (based on iwo-sample average). The tofal amount.of non-fully coated particles shall not
exceed 3%. The contractor shall provide the ASTM D2483 test results to the Division of Highways on Form
T410 Degree of Parficle Coating of Bitiminous-Aggregate Mixtures which - |s provided by the Division of
Highways District Materials Section. See Appendix A.



if the material fails to conform to the requirements of the Spectﬁcattons the contractor may rework the existing
material or provide new material.

STORAGE

The mixture shall be maintained on the contractor's property in stockpiles not exceeding a height of four fee!
(4" until the internal mixture temperature is within 10°F of the ambient temperature. In addition, the top of all
stockpiles shall be leveled fo eliminate any peaked areas.

The mixture shall contain sufficient asphalt that is capable of coaling the aggregate without stripping. After
stackpiling on the Division of Highways' lof, the mixture shall have a maximum of 5% non-fully coated parficies
after the first week and up to 90 days from delivery when evaluated in accordance with ASTM D2483 (hased
on two-sample average). This coating determination may be based on the Division of Highways' visual
inspection, if coating is not a problem or based on Division of Highways' testing when the amount of non-fully
coated paricles appears guestionable, If stripping occurs, the confractor will be required to provide new
material or remove the existing stockpile material from the Division of Highways' lot, rework it fo an acceptable
condition with additional asphalt andfor chemical anti-stripping additive as needed and retum it fo the Division
of Highways' lot.

5 B!DDING INSTRUCTIONS

* Vendors may bld to delwer the estimated quantities of material at any or alf of the de31gnated delivery sites.

Any qualification of bids or any modification of the specificafions or conditions governing the bids may be
cause for their rejection,

6. CONTRACT AWARD

The Division of Highways will consider Vendor's performance history in the award of this Purchase Order
Contract.

Qualified Vendors who submit a valid bid "F.O.B. Division Siorage Slte” wn! be awarded a contract for those
locat;ons for which their bid is low.

In the event a Vendor fails to conform fo the requirements set out in this contract document, the Agency , |

Release or the governing specifications, the Purchase Order Contract may be cancelled and awarded to the
next low bidder.

. SAMPLING AND TESTING

Upon award of contract, the Vendor shalt inform the Division of Highways of the location of Vendor's storage
sites so that materials may be sampled and tested prior fo shipment. Information shall be directed fo the
respective Division of Highways District Materials Engineers/Supervisors.
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8. WEIGHING MA'i;ERIALS DELIVERED BY TRUCK

Material delivered by truck shall be weighed In accordance with Section 401.8.3 of the West Virginia

~ Department of Transportation, Division of Highways' Standard Specifications Roads and Bridges, adopted

2010 as modified by the Januaty 1, 2011 Supplemental Specifications.

9. SUPPLYING OTHER ORGANIZATIONAL ENTITIES

‘County Courts, Municipalities, School Boards, other polifical subdivisions and govemmental entities, etc,, méy

have a need for these materials, and Vendors may wish to supply that need. Accordingly, bidders may wish
to extend their contract prices to these other entiies. 1If the bidder wishes to supply these other enfities, but
with prices different from those quoted for the Division of Highways, the bidder shall include a set of bid
schedules clearly and unambiguously marked for the express use of enfifies other than the Division of
Highways. Failure by the bidder fo include a set of bid schedules for other enfilies will be taken to mean that
fhe bid schedules extended fo the Division of Highways will also be extended fo thess other entities.

in the event any Vendor does nol wish to extend the prices, terms and conditions of this bid and subsequent
contract fo other entities of the State, he must so indicate in a clear and unambiguous manner in his bid. This
indication does net prejudice the award of the-contract. if a Vendor does not indicate his refusal to extend the
prices, terms and conditions of his bid to other entities of the State he is bound to extend them upon issuance
of a purchase order by these other enfifes.

Other organizational entmes using this provision of the contract shall do so without any 1nvolvement of the

Division of Highways; that is, the enfity shall make its own purchase amangements with the Vendor and shall
make ifs own arrangement for payment.

10.  PRODUCTION SCHEDULE

Vendor should produce material within two weeks of recelpt of the Agency Release from the Division of

Highways.

1. VENDOR'S mvmc’as

Vendor's invoices must be submitted in original and one copy containing the following:

a. ‘Division of Highway's Agency Release Number and this Coniract Number.
b. Total quantiy and unit price with the total cost of the material fumished.

Note: Under no circumstance will the Division of Highways accept, or pay for, quantifies of
material in excess of the quantily staled on the Agency Release.

12, PURCHASING CARD ACCEPTANCE

The State of West Virginia currently utifizes a VISA Purchasing Card Program which is issuéd through a bank.
The successful vendors must accept the State of West Virginia VISA Purchasmg Card for payment of all

. orders placed by DNISJOH of Highways as a condition of award.




APPENDIX A

T41Q
10-08

West Virginla Division of Highways
Degree of Particle Coating of Bituminous-Aggregate Mixtures

ASTM D2489
i_.ab Number: . Date Tested:
Technician: Cold-Mix Type:

Coid-Mix Source:

Cold-Mix Stockpile Location:

Test Sample Number 1

{A) Total Number of Particles: {B) Number of coaied pariicles:

(C) Percentage of Coated Particles = ( B FAY X100

- Test Sample Number 2

(D) Total Number of Particles: {E} Number of coated paricles.

(F) Percentage of Coated Pariicles = (E/D ) x 100

Average Percent Coated Particles = {C + F}/2:
Pass / Fail: )

97% Coating Requirement for First Week After Stockpiling
©5% Coafing Reguirement Up To 90 Days After Stockplling

Vendor should submit copy of Certificate of Liability Insurance and
Worker's Coupensation Certificate with bid.

The “Bid Schedule” is available for download on Purchasing’s Web site at
www.state,wv.us/admin/purchase

1
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13. BID SCHEDULE 66-11-C033
‘ VENDOR NAME: West Virginia Paving, Inc. -
~ Modified Winter Grade Bituminous Patching Mixture - Cold Mix
Delivery: F.0.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site
DISTRICT 1 :
Unit of Estimated | Unit Cost | Extended

County Delivery/Storage Site Measure | Number Tons | Per Ton Cost
Boone _|Clinton @ W85 N | 275 510700 [520.425.00
Boone Rock Creek ] TON 250 $105.50 |$26,375.00
Boone  |Seth | TON 75 $106.50 | $7,912.50
Clay ___ |Widen Road & CR 11 TON 200 $108.00 | §21, 600.00
Clay Ivaysel TON 0 NOBID | NOBID
Kanawha |Chelyan TON | 200 $103.00 |$20,600.00
Kanawha |Elkview | TON 200 $103.00 | $20,600.00
Kanawha |North Charleston TON 200 $100.50 | $20,100.00
Kanawha: |St. Albans TON | 100 $99.50 | $9,950.00
Kanawha |I-64 @ Rt. 119 and Penn. Avenue TON | 50 . $101.00 |$5,050.00
Kanawha |1-77 @ Sissonville TON | 100 510350 | $10.350.00
Kanawha [I-79 @ Amma TON 30 $105.50 | $3.165.00
Kanawhia |Cortidor G @ Alum Creek TON 30 $101.00 | $3,030.00
Mason Pt Pleasant TON 200 $105.00 | $21,000.00
Putnam  |Red House TON 75 $101.00 | $7,675.00
Putnam _{Hurricane @ Rt. 34 | TON 75 §101.00 | $7,575.00
Putnam  {Scary TON 30 $99.50 | $2,985.00




13. BID SCHEDULE 66-11-C033
VENDOR NAME: West Virginia Paving, Inc.
Modified Winter Grade Bituminous Patching Mixture - Cold Mix
Delivery: F.O.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site
DISTRICT 2
. Unit of Estimated Unit Cost | Extended
County Delivery/Storage Site Measure | Number Tons { PerTon Cost
Cabell Barboursville TON 200 $104.00] _$20,800.00
Cabell  |I-64 @ Huntington | _TON 40 $105.00]  $4,200.00
Lincoln  |West Hamlin TON 75 $104.50| $7,837.50
Lincoln  [Yawkey | TON 15 $104.50] $1,567.50
|Lincoln __ Harts | TON | 25 $109.50| $2,737.50
“|Logan _ |Coridor G @ Chapmanville TON | 80 $106.50[ $8,520.00
Logan  |Wilkinson Poron | 80 $108.00]  $6,480.00
Logan Man TON 40 $110.00} $4,400.00
Mingo Mingo County @Miller's Creek | TON | 50 $111.00| $5,550.00
iMingo  |Gilbert TON | 25 $113.50] $2,837.50
Wayne  |Crum TON | 75 $110.00 | $8,250.00
Wayne  |Pritchard TON 100 $108.00| $10,800.00
Wayne  (Wayne TON 100 $108.00{ $10,800.00
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13. BID SCHEDULE 66-11-C033
VENDOR NAME: West Virginia Paving, inc.
Modified Winter Grade Bituminous Patching Mixture - Cold Mix
Delivery: F.0.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site
DISTRICT 3
| Unitof | Estimated Unit Cost | Extended
County Delivery/Storage Site Mieasure | Number Tons | Per Ton Cost
Cathoun _|Millstone TON 200 | $113.00 |$22,600.00
Jackson _[Ripley TON | 300 $108.50 | $32,550.00
Jackson  {I-77 @ Medina TON 20 NOBID | NOBID
Pleasants |Belmont TON 0 NOBID | NOBID
Pleasants_[St. Mary's (Colin-Anderson Lot) TON [ 75 | NOBID | NOBID
|Ritchie _|JAPD Pennsboro TON | 0 NOBID | NOBID
Ritchie  |Eltenboro _ TON 75 NOBID | NOBID
Ritchie  |Corridor D @ Nutter Farm TON | 0 | wNosD| NoBID
Ritchie  [Smithville TON | 30 NOBID | NOBID
Roane |Lefthand @ WV 36 TON | 50 | $10825 [$5412.50
Roane  |Amber Hill @ US 119 TON | 0 I nNomD | NOBID
Roane _ |Spencer TON 225 $110.50 | $24,862.50
Wirt Elizabeth TON 75 NOBID | NOBID
Wood Parkersburg @ Rt 955 TON 50 | NomD| NOBID
Wood Corridor D @ Riverhil TON | 0 NOBID | NOBID
Wood 177 @ Mill Run Road TON % NOBID| NOBID




BID SCHEDULE

13. 66-11-C033
VENDOR NAME: West Virginia Paving, [nc.
Maodified Winter Grade Bituminous Patching Mixture - Cold Mix
Defivery. F.0.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site
DISTRICT 4
Unitof . | Estimated Unit Cost | Extended
County Delivery/Storage Site | Measure | Number Tons | Per Ton Cost
Doddridge _ |Smithburg | TON 60 |  $104.00 | $6240.00
Hamison  |Gore TON 300 | $99.00 | $29,700.00
Harrison  |1-79 @ Lost Creek ~ TON 75 $99.00 | $7,425.00
Harrison APD 50 @ Tunne! Hill TON 75 $101.00 | $7,575.00
[Marion Fairmont | TON 00 |  $101.00 | $10,100.00
Marion Mannington | TON 75 | 10200 | $7650.00
Monongalia |I-79 @ GoshenRoad | TON 15 | $104.00 | $1,560.00
Monongalia |Ridgedale TON 500 I $100.00 | $50,000.00
Monongalia _|{Pentress | TON 75 $102.00 | $7,650.00
Preston  |Albright | TON 300 | $101.00 | $30,300.00
Preston Bruceton | TON 100 [ st03.00 | $10,300.00
Preston  |TerraAlta TON 100 $102.00 | $10,200.00
Preston Fellowsville TON 100 $101.00 | $10,100.00
Preston Aurora | TON 100 $100.00 | $10,000.00
Preston 1-68 @ Copper's Rock TON 25 - $104.00 | $2,600.00
Taylor |Fetierman/Prunytown | TON 75 | s97.00 | $7.275.00
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13. BID SCHEDULE 66-11-C033
VENDOR NAME: West Virginia Paving, inc.
Modified Winter Grade Bituminous Patchiné Mixture - Cold Mix
Defivery: F.0.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site
DISTRICT 5
| Unitof | Estimated | UnitCost | Extended
County Delivery/Storage Site Measure | Number Tons | Per Ton Cost
Berkeley  |I-81 @ Martinsburg TON 300 $119.00 | $35,700.00
Berkeley [1-81 @ Exit 18 TON 0 NOBID{ NOBID
Grant |Petersburg TON 75 $106.00 | $7,850.00
Grant IMt. Storm | TON .50 $102.00 | $5,100.00
Grant [Corridor H @ Knobley Road | TON 0 NOBID | NOBID
Hampshire iRomney ' TON | 50 $107.50 | $5,375.00
Hampshire |Capon Bridge TON 30 $113.00 | $3,390.00
Hampshire |Slanesville TON 50 $110.00 | $5,500.00
Hardy  |Moorefield TON | 75 $105.00 | $7.875.00
Hardy Baker | TON | 75 $107.00 | $8,025.00
Jefferson __|Charles Town TON | - 100 §119.00 | $11,900.00
Mineral  |New Creek TON | 75 $105.00 | $7.875.00
Mineral Sky Line TON 50 $104.00 | $5,200.00
|Miineral Short Gap TON 50 $108.50 | $5425.00
Mineral District Headquarters TON 25 $106.00 | $2,650.00
Morgan Berkeley Springs TON 200 $117.50 | $23, 500.00
Morgan  |Largent TON 0 NOBID| NOBID

16



13. BID SCHEDULE 66-11-C033

VENDOR NAME: West Virginia Paving, Inc.

Modified Winter Grade Bituminous Patching Mixture - Cold Mix

Delivery: F.O.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site

DISTRICTE
Unit of Estimated Unit Cost | Extended
County Delivery/Storage Site Measure | Number Tons | Per Ton Cost

Brooke _|Welisburg TON 200 NO BID | NO BID
Brooke  |Weirton TON 0 NO BID | NO BID
Hancock _ |New Manchester TON 220 NO BID| NOBID
Marshall  |Glen Dale [ ton [ 1300 | NO BID] NOBID
Marshall _|Cameron | _TON 700 |  noBi| NoBID
Ohio | Triadelphia | TON | 150 | -nosID| NOBID
Ohio I1-70 @ Ttiadelphia | TON 100 J NO BID | NO BID
Tyler  |Centerville | TON | 100 | NO BID] NOBID
Tyler Sistersville | TON | 100 NO BID| NOBID
Tyler Sistersville Old Headquarters TON - 0 NO BID| NO BID
Wetzel ~ |Hundred TON | 100 NO BID| NO BID
Wetzel  [New Martinsville TON 150 NO BID] NO BID
Wetzel Pine Grove TON 100 NO BID| NOBID
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13. BID SCHEDULE 66-11-C033
VENDOR NAME: West Virginia Paving, Inc.
Modified Winter Grade Bituminous Patching Mixture - Cold Mix
Delivery: F.0.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site
DISTRICT 7
Unit of Estimated Unit Cost | Extended
County Delivery/Storage Site Measure | Number Tons Per Ton Cost
Barbour  {Phillipi TON 40 $94.00 | $3,760.00
Braxton {Laurel Court TON 150 $102.00 | $15,300.00
Braxton {179 @ Coon Knob TON 25  $99.00 | $2,475.00
Braxton 79 @ Burnsvilie TON 25 $99.50 | $2,487.50
- |Gilmer ~ |Glenville Headquarters TON 60 $103.00] $6,180.00
Lewis  [Weston (Ben Dale) TON - 100 $96.00 | $9,600.00
Upshur _ |Clow Lot @ Buckhannon | TON 40 $94.00 | $3,760.00
Webster  {Cherry Falls TON .. 30 $100.00] $3,000.00
Webster  [Cowen TON 30 _$102.00| $3,060.00
Webster _|Hacker Valley TON 30 599.00 | $2970.00
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13, BID SCHEDULE 66-11-C033
VENDOR NAME: West Virginia Paving, Inc.
~ Modified Winter Grade Bituminous Patching Mixture - Cold Mix
Delfivery: F.0.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site
DISTRICT 8
Unit of Estimated Unit Cost | Extended
County Delivery/Storage Site Measure | Number Tons | Per Ton Cost
Pendleton _|Franklin TON 100 $98.00 | $9,800.00
Pocahontas |Mariinton TON 25 $100.00 | $2,500.00
Randolph _ |Elkins TON | 125 $89.00 | $11,125.00
Tucker Parsons TON 60 $93.00 | $5,580.00

18




13. BID SCHEDULE 66-11-C033
VENDOR NAME: West V.irginia Paving, Inc.
Modified Winter Grade Bituminous Patching Mixture - Cold Mix
Delivery, F.O.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site
DISTRICT 9
Unit of Estimated Unit Cost | Extended
County Delivery/Storage Site | Measure Number Tons | PerTon .| Cost
Fayetie Oak Hill | TON 100 $105.50 | $10,550.00
Fayette  |Comidor L @ Oak Hil TON | 0 | nosip| NoBID
Fayette  |Lookout TON | 100 $104.00 | $10,400.00
Fayette  |Glen Ferris TON 300 | $100.00 | $20,000.00
Greenbrier |Lewishurg TON 125 $99.50  |$12,437.50
Greenbrigr |Crawley TON | 100 $102.00 |$10,200.00
Greenbrier |1-64 @ Hart's Run TON | i5 [ $100.50 | $1,507.50
Monroe  [Union TON | 275 $103.50 | $28,462.50
Monroe  |Peterstown TON | 0 NOBID | NOBID
Nicholas  [Summersville TON 175 $100.50 | $17,587.50
Nicholas__|Curtin TON | 25 | sor00 | 8242500
|Nicholas  |Corridor L @ Muddlety TON 150 - $99.50 [ $14,925.00
Surnmers  |Hinton TON 50 $105.50 | $5,275.00
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13 BID SCHEDULE 66-11-C033
VENDOR NAME: West Virginia Paving, In¢.
Modified Winter Grade Bituminous Patching Mixture - Cold Mix
Delivery: F.0.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site
DISTRICT 10
Unit.of Estimated Unit Cost | Exiended
County | Delivery/Storage Siie | Measure | Number Tons | Per Ton Cost
McDowsll |County Headquarters | TON | 100 $111.50 | $11.150.00
Mercer  |County Headquariers | TON 100 $109.00 | $10,900.00
Raleigh  jCounty Headquarters TON .‘i Q0 $104.00 | $10,400.00
Wyoming |County Headquarters TON 100 $109.00 | $10,800.00
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CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE

DATE {ME/DDIVYYY}
6/24/2011

CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY

REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFIGATE HOLDER,

THIS CERTIFICATE 1S ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY
OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES

BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER({S}, AUTHORIZED

AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER, THIS

carilficatoe holdor in iau of such endorsement(s).

IMPORTANT: If the cortificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the poltcy{ies) must be endorsed, If SUBROGATION 18 WAIVED, subject to
tihe torms and conditions of the policy, sertaln policies may require an endorsemont.

A statement on this cerdificate does not confer rights to the

PRODUCER
Mountain State Insurance Agency
1206 Kanawha Blvd. B,

gONE’«GT Annetia Dearth

%H!QON,E“ pay, (304) 720~2000 FERE gy, (304)7120-2002
ElllL, o adearthémountainstateinsurance . oon

INSURER(S] AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC #

Charleston Wy 25301 wsurer A BrickStreet Insurancs

INSURED INSURER B 1

Wast Virginia Paving, Inc. INSURER C ¢

2950 Charleg Avae. INSURER D ¢

P.C. Box 544 INBURER £

Dunbar WV 25064 {NSURERF :

COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER:CL1162407736 REVISION NUMBER:

INDICATED, NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT,

THIS IS TO GERTIFY THAT THE POLIGIES OF INSURANGE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED
TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY GONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS

GERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANGE AFFORDED BY THE POLIGIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES, LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS,

TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD

NSR DOE[BUBR POLICY EFE. | POLIGY EXP
LIk TYPE OF INSURANCE WYD POLICY NUMBER {HRDDAYYY) | (MRVDDAYYYS LINITS
GENERAL LIABILITY EAGH OCCURRENGE $
SAMAGE 10 RENTED
COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY PREMISES (Eaoccyrenca) | §
1 CEAIMS-MADE QGCUR MED EXP {Any one petson) | §
PERSONAL 5 ADV INJURY | §
GENERAL AGGRECATE $
GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: PRODUCTS - COMPIOP AGG | $
LOLET PL(?T_ 10 COMDINED SINGLE LIFIT ;
AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY {n ecidant) 3
ANY AUTO BODILY INJURY (Per person} | §
ﬁb‘?ggNED Sgi;(EDUlED ODILY INSURY {Per accklant) [ §
I NON-OWNED PROPERTY DAMACE $
HIRED AUTOS AUTOS (Per accidenl}
3
UMBRELLA LIAB OCCUR EAGH OCGURRENCE $
EXCESS LIAB CLAIMS-MADE AGGREGATE 3
DED | f RETENTIONS 3
7. | WORKERS GOMPENSATION x | NG STAIY, RS
AND EMPLOYERS® LIABILITY Yik
ANY PROPRIETORFARTNERIEXECUTIVE E.L, BAGH ACCIDENT $ 1,000,000
OFFICERIMEMBER EXCLUDED? [:] HIA . yen
{Mandatory In NH) C1020760408 7/1£2001  [1/1/2012 | £ pisEASE - EAEMPLOYER $ 1,000,000
{fyas, dascribe und
Dgs%RIPTG{IDﬁ OF%PERATMNS below El. DISEASE - POLICY LIMIT | § 1,000,000

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS f VEHICLES {Atlacl ACORD 104, Addlienal Remarks Schadule, i more space s required)

Project: Cold Mix Purchase Orders 2011-2012 Counties; Various

CERTJFICATE HOLDER

CANCELLATION

WVDOT- Division of Highways
1900 Kanawha Blvd. East
Building 5, Room A737
Charleston, WV 25305

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESGRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTIGE WILL BE DELIVERED IN
ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

mnnette Dearth/ANNE ff}ﬂus.i‘)”ié""’ 7., S et

ACORD 25 {2010/06}
INSHPE eantons i

The ACNRND namao and Inan ara rardetarard marke

© 1968-2010 ACORD CORPORATION. All rights reserved.
of ARNRN




THIS CERTIFICATE I§ ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO Ri
INSURANCE POLICY AND DOES NOT AMEND, EXTEND, OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED
LISTED, ALTHOUGH POLICIES MAY INCLUDE ADDITIONAL SUBLIMET/LIMITS NOT LISTED BELOW.

Certificate of Insurance

GHTS UPON YOU THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS CERTIFICATE IS NOT AN
BY THE POLICIES LISTED BELOW. POLICY LIMITS ARE NO LESS THAN THOSE

This is to Certify that

West Virginia Paving, Inc.
2950 Charles Ave.
Dunbar, WV 25064

is, at the issue date of this certificate, insured by the Company under the policy{ies) listed below, The insurance afforded by the listed peiicy(iesa ;
Conditions and is not altered by any requirement, ter or condition of any contract o7 other document with respect to which this certificate may be issued.

-

NAME AND
ADDRESS
OF INSURED

|

Liber
Mutugig

is subject to all their terms, exclusions and

. EXP DATE
CONTINUOUS
TYPE OF POLICY 0 . POLICY NUMBER LIMIT OF LIABILITY
EXTENDED
B POLICY TERM
: WA7-C8D-004005-020 COVERAGE AFFORDED UNDER WC . , A
WORKERS /12011 LAW OF THE FOLLOWING STATES: EMPLOYERS LIABILITY
COMPENSATION WV EMPLOYERS LIABILITY Bodily Injury by Accident
COVERAGE ONLY $7,000,000 gach Accizen
Bodily Injury By Disease
$1,000,000 pajice Lima
Bodily Injuey By Disease
$1 ,000.000 Each Person)
COMMERCIAL 0/1/2011 TB2-C81-004095-110 General Aggregate
GENERAL LIABILITY $2.000,000
@ OCCURRENCE Products / Completed Operations Apgregate
$2,000.000
D CLAIMS MADE FBach Occurrence
$1.000.000
1 & Advertising Injury
RETRO DAJE Personal & Advertsing fnjury $‘] ,000|000 Per Person / Organization
Other  Fir Damage $100,000  *'Ricd Pay - $5,000
Per Project Aggregate !
; b Each Accident—Single Limit
AUTOMOBILE 9/1/201t | AS2-C81-004005-120 $1,000,000 51 And .. Conbined
Each Person
m OWNED
|Zi NON-OWNED Fach Aceident or Occurrence
|ZI HIRED Fach Accident or Qecurrence
OFHER Auto: Comp Ded $10,000/Coll Ded: $10,000

ADDITIONAL COMMENTS

Project: Cold Mix Purchase Orders 2011-2012 Counties: Various

* Ifthe certificate expiration date is continuous or extended term, you will be notified if coverage is terminated or reduced before the certificate expiration date.

NOTICE OF CANCELLATION: (NOT APPLICABLE UNLESS A NUMBER OF DAYS IS ENTERED BELOW )
BEFORE THE STATED EXPIRATION DATE THE COMPANY WILL NOT CANCEL OR REDUCE THE

INSURANCE AFFORDED UNDER THE ABOVE POLICIES UNTIL AT LEAST  3()

OF SUCH CANCELLATION HAS BEEN MAILED TO:

I_ WVDOT- Division of Highways
1800 Kanawha Bivd. East
Building 5 Room A737
Charleston, WV 25305

Holder

H]
]
b
3
o

This certificate is executed by LIBERTY MUTUAL INSURANCE GROUP as respects such insurance as is afforded by those Companies

DAYS NOTICE

Liberty Mutual
Insurance Group

Mark A. Truelove

Liberty Square Shopping Center
Suite 113

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

Hurricane WV 25526 800-222-8890  07/25/2011
_—J OFFICE PHONE DATEISSLED
NM 772
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REQNo, | 6611C033

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
Purchasing Division

PURCHASING AFFIDAVIT

West Virginia Code §5A-3-10a states: No contract or renswal of any contracl may be awarded by the stale or any of its
politicat subdivisions to any vendor or prospective vendor when the vendor or prospective vendor or a refated party to the
vendor or prospective vendor is a debfor and the debt owned is an amount greater than one thousand doflars in the
aggregels

DEFINITIONS:

“Debt” means any assessment, premium, penalty, fine, tax or other amount of money owed to the state or any of ils
political subdivisions because of a judgment, fine, permit violafion, license assessment, defaulted workers' compensation
premlum, penalty or other assessment presently deiinquent or due and required to be pald to the state or any of its
political subdivisions, including any interest or additional penalties acerued thereon.

“Pebior® means any individual, corporation, partnership, assoclation, Limited Liability Company or any other form or
business association owing a debt to the state or any of its political subdivisions. “Political subdivislon™ means any county
commission; muticipality; county board of education; any instrumentality established by a county or municipatity; any
separate corporation or instrumentality eslablished by one or more counties or municipalifies, as permitted by law,; or any’
public body charged by law with the performance of a government function of whose Jurisdiction is cosxtensive with one
or more counties or municipalities. “Related party” means a party, whether an individual, corporation, partnership,
- association, limited Tiability company or any other form or business association or other enfity whatsoever, related to any
vendor by blood, marriage, ownership or contract through which the party has a relationship of ownership or other interest
with the vendor so fhat the party will actually or by effect recelve of control a portion of fhe benefit, profit or other
consideration from performance of a vendor contract with the parly receiving an amount that meats or exceed five parcent
of the fotal coniract amount.

EXCEPTION: The prohibition of this section does not apply where & vendor has contested any tax administered pursuant
to. chapter eleven of this code, workers’ compensation premium, permit fee or environmenial fee or assessment and the
matter has not becoms final or where the vendor has entered info a payment plan or agreement and the vendor is not in
default of any of the provisions of such plan or agreement.

Under penalty of law for false swearing (Wesf Virginfa Code §61-5-3), it is hereby certified that the vendor affirms and
acknowledges the information in this affidavit and is in compliance with the requirements as stated.

WITNESS THE FOLLOWING SIGNATURE
' Vendor's Name: West Virginia Paving, inc. - ) %

Authorized Signature: "W M“'b Date: July 27, 2011 - |

stateof  YVest Virginia

County of ___Kanawha , to-wit:

Taken, subscribed, and sworn 1o before me this ﬁay«af-@eeember, ol

My Commission expires 2-10 20 ﬁ _
{ it IS
AFFIX SEAL HERE NOTORY PUBLIC A Jo. ‘ ;

Purchasing Affidavit (Revised 12/15/08}




