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GENERAL TERMS & CONDITIONS

REQUEST FOR QUOTATION (RFQ) AND REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL (RFP) :

1. Awards will be made in the best interest of the-State of West Virginia.

2. The State may accept or rejectn part, or in whols, any bid. A S

3. Prior to any award, he apparent successful vendor must be properly registered with the Purchasing :Division
and have paid the required $125 fee, . C C - -
4, Al services performed or goods. delivered under State Purchase Order/Contracts are to be continued for the
tetin of the Purchase Qrder/Contracts, contingent upon funds being appropriated bf the Legislature.or otherwise
being made available. In the event funds are not appropriated or otherwise avallable for these services or goods
this Purchase Ordet/Gontract becomes void and of no effect after June 30. L

" §. Payment may only be made after the delivery and acceptance of geods or services.
-6, Interest may be pald for late payment In accordance with the West Virginia. Code. -
7. Véndor preference will be grantad upon written request in accordance with the West Virgirifa Code.
8. The Stale of West Virginia Is exempt from federal and state taxes and will not pay or relmburse such taxes. S
9. The Director of Purchasing may cancel any Purchase Qrder/Contract upon 30 days wiitien notice to the seller.
" 10: The laws of the State of West Virginla and the Legislative Bules of the Purchasing Division shall govem the
purchasing process, - ' -

11. Any refoerence fo automatic renéwal Is hereby deleted. The Contract may be renewed only upon mutual -ﬁy’iitten ;
agreement of the parties. R

12, BANKRUPTCY: In the event the vendor/contractor files for bankruptcy protection, the State may deem
this cantract null and vold, and terminate such contract without further order. . :

13, HIPAA BUSINESS ASSOCIATE ADDENDUM: The Wast Virginia State Govemment HIPAA Business Assoclate
Addendum (BAA), apptoved by the Attomey General, is available online at www.state wv.us/adinin/purchasé/vre/hipaa.hitm
and Is hereby made -part of the agreement. Provided that the Agency méets the definiion of a Cover Enlity.
(45 CFR §160.103) and will be disclosing Protected Health Information {45 CFR §1 60.103) to the vendor, oo -

14. CONFIDENTIALITY: The vendor agrees that he or she will not disclose to anyons, directly or. ind_iractl_r.‘ any such
* personally identlfiable information or other confidential information gained from' the agency, unless the individual who is
the subject of the information consents to the disclosure in writing or the disclosure is made ‘pursuant to the agency's *
policies, procedures, and rules. Vendor further agrees to comply with the Confidentiality Pollcles and Inforation-
Security Accountability- Requirements, set forth in http#fwmv.state.wv.ugfadmin!purchase[privacylnbtfoeConﬁd'enﬂahLy.pdf.

15. LICENSING: Vendors must be licensed and in goad standing in_accordance with any and all state and local laws and . -
requirements by any state or local agency of West Virginia, including, but not lirlted o, tho West Virginia Secrelary
of State's Office, the West Virginia Tax Department, and the West Virginia lnsurance Commisslon. The vendor must
provide all necessary releases to obtain information to enable the director . or  spending unit fto.-
varlly that the vendor is licensed and in good standing with the above entities. ) o

16. ANTITRUST: In submiting a bid to any agency for the State of West Virginia, the bidder offers and agrees that -
if the bid Is accepted the bidder will convey, sell, assfgn or transfer to the State of West Virginta all rights, title and interest
in and to all causes of action it may now or hereafter acquire under the antitrust laws of the United States and the State of -
West Virginia for price fixing and/or unreasonable restraints of trade refating to the particular commodities or seryices -
purchassd or acquired by the State of West Virgiria. Such assighment shall be made and bacome sffective at the time the,
purchasing agency tenders the Initial payment to the bidder. ‘ : S

I certify that this bid Is made without prior understanding, agreement, or connection with a corporation, firm, limied.. .
liability company, partnetship, or person or entity submiting a bid for the. sama materal, supplisg, equipment or
services and is in all respects falr and without collusion or Fraud. | further ceriify that | am aulhorized -to slgn

the certification on behalf of the bidder or this bid. : : o

INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS - - ‘ .

1, Use the quotation forms provided by the Purchasing Division. Complate all sections of the quotdtiqn form.

2, ltems offerad must be in compliance with the specifications. Any deviation from the speclfications must be clearly
indicated by the bidder. Alternates offered by the bidder as EQUAL to_ the specifications must be clearly
defihed, A bidder offerln[q an alternate should attach complete specifications and literature to the. bid. The
Purchaslhg Divislon may waive minor deviations to specifications, - . S : S
3. Unit prices shall rrevail In case of discrepancy. All quotations are consldeted F.O.B. destinalion unless altemate
shipping terms are clearly Identified in the quotation, L . A -
4, All quotations must be dellvered by the bidder to the office listed below prior to the date and tims of the bld .
. opening. Fallure of the bidder to deliver the, quotations on time will resuit in bid disqualifications: Department of
Administration, Purchasing Division, 2019 Washington Street East, P,O. Box 50130, Charleston, WV 25305-0130 -
5. Communication during the sollcitation, bid, evaluation or award periods, except throtigh the Purchasing Divislon,
s strictly prohibited (W.Va. C.S.R. §148-1-6.6). | Do

Rev. {211sis .-
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1. SPECIFICATIONS

The following sections of the West Virginia Department of Transportafion, Division of Highways' Standard
Speclfications Roads and Bridges, adopted 2010 as modified by the January 1, 2011 Supplemental
Specifications shall apply to the administration of the Contract: Sections 101, 102.4, 1025, 105.1, 105.3,
105.4, 105.10, 105.11, 105.12, 105.13, 106.3, 106.4, 106.5, 106.6, 106.7, 106.9, 107.1, 107.2, 107 .3, 107.14,
107.19, 107.20, 108.8, 109.1, 109.2 and 109.20.

The requirements of the West Virginia Department of Transportation, Division of Highways', Standard
Specifications Section 109.20, PRICE ADJUSTMENT FOR LOAD LIMIT VIOLATIONS shall apply to alf
material supplied under this contract. _This will include material loaded by the vendor info Division of Highways
owned andfor rented trucks. ‘

The ferms “Contractor” and "Vendor™ used in the above specifications and throughout this Confract are
interchangeable. Contractor shall mean Vendor and Vendor shall mean Contractor.

West Virginia Department of Transportation, Division of Highways' Standard Specifications Roads and
Bridges, Adopted 2010 as modified by the January 1, 2011 Supplemental Specificalions may be obtained
from: - . '

West Virginta Division of Highways

Contract Adminisiration Division

Buliding Five, Room 722

1900 Kanawha Boulevard, East

Charleston, West Virginia 25306

‘ hitp:fiwww. fransportation.wv.govihighways/contractadminfspacifications/2010StandSpec/Pages/default.aspx

2 SCOPE OF WORK

The purpose of this contract is to provide for afl fabor, materials and e'qéipment necessary to supply Modified
Winter Grade Bituminous Patching Mixture (Cold Mix) to the various locations listed in Section 13, Bid
Schedule. Actual quaniities to be delivered to each location will be specified in an Agency Release, which wil
be issued by the Division of Highways at the time delivery is required.

3, DESCRIPTION

The patching material shall be composed of a suitable aggregate, plant mixed with a liquid asphalt maferial
and chemical anti-stripping additives. The materiat shall maintain adhesive qualities for ali moisture conditions
in the patched areas, except those having standing water.

4 MATERIALS

AGGREGATE

The coarse aggregate shall be a clean material consisfing of crushed stone, crushed gravel or slag, meefing



the requirements of the Division of Highways' Standard Specifications subsections 703.1, 703.2 and 703.3
respectively.  Fine aggregate shall meet the requwements of the Division of Highways' Standard
Specifications Subsection 702.3.

~ Allowable standard aggregate sizes shall be #89, #9, or a blend composed of #8 with a minimum of 50% #9.
The aggregale gradation shall be as recommended by the liquid asphalt supplier.

The gradation shall be determined in accordance with AASHTO T27 and AASHTO T11.
The aggregate fraction of the final mixture shall mest the crushed particle requirements of Division of

Highways’ Standard Specifications Subsection 703.2.2. Questionable aggregates shall be tesled as per MP
703.00.21, except the No. 8 sreve will be used.

ASPHALT MATERIAL

The: asphalt material shall be liquid asphalt containing a minimum of 2.5% chemical anti-stripping additives
meefing the requirements of the liquid asphalt suppher

Resudts from the following test methods and any additional fests conducted by the liquid asphalt supplser shall
be presented to the respective Division of Highways District Matertals Engineer/Supervisor for. review prior to
production. :

~ Modified Asphalt Test
(1)  Flash Point °C (°F) - AASHTO T79
{2) Kinematic Viscosity in ¢St at 60°C (140°F)
Requirement - 350 to 500 ¢St - AASHTO T201
3)  Water {(%)-Requirement-0.2% maximum - AASHTO T55
]

Distillate Test - AASHTO T78
% To 225°C (437°F)
% To 260°C (5000F}
% To 315°C (600°F) .
Residue {%) at 360°C{680°F)
Residue Tests
{5} Ductility at 26°C(77°F) - AASHTO T51
(6) Solubility Test - AASHTO T44

COMPOSITION OF MIXTURE

The aggregates and asphalt material shall be combined in such proportions that the composition by weight of
the finished mixture shall mest the requirements of the plant mix formula.

The aggregate fraction of the mixture shall be evaluated in accordance with AASHTO T27 and AASHTO T11 |
and shall meet the requirements of the plant mix formula range. Any material failing to mest specification
requirements on any sieve shall not be approved.

The minimum amount of asphalt shall be as indicated in the table below. The amount of asphait shall be -
sufficient to thoroughly coat the aggregate parficles and provide enough adhesion to hold the compacted
particies together under traffic conditions when propetly. placed and fo assure that the aggregate parficles



remain sufficiently coated after stockpifing.

Minimum Asphalt Content for Modifted Patching Mixture
#88 or Blend of
Aggregate Type #8 with minimum of #
50% #9
% Asphalf Rotet 5.5% 6.0%

Note-1: Add a minimum additional 0.5% ésphait fo the above
values for mixtures containing high-absomtive aggregates (>1.5%)

PLANT MEX FORMULA

The plant mix formula shall be in accordance with the recommendations of the fiquid asphalt supplier. The
plant mix formula composition repart, which shall include the percentage- of chemical anti-stripping additive,
shall be forwarded to the District Matorials Supervisor/Engineer before the mixture is produced. -

- CHANGES IN PLANT MIX FORMULA

Should the contractor at any time propose fo change the source of aggregate in fhe miiure, the definite
asphalt content or change the source of the bitluminous material, the provisions of the Division of Highways'
Standard Specifications Subsection 401.4.2 shall apply.

QUALITY CONTROL TESTING

Quality control is the responsibility of the contractar. Quality control festing shall include daily asphalt content
and gradation analysis of the design aggregate structure during production. Since the aggregate and asphalt
material are required to be measured separately and accurately fo the proportions of the plant mix formula,
the asphalt content may be determined by calculating the percentage by total welght of mixture. However, all
standard methods of determiining the asphalt content of the mixiure that are allowed for hot mix asphalt under
Section 401 of the Division of Highways' Standard Specifications are acceptable. The ignition oven test
methed, AASHTO T308, would require an asphalt content correction factor, however, due to the low flash
point of most asphalts used in cold mix, this test method is nof recommended. If the AASHTO T164 solvent
extraction.test method is used, a non-chiorinated solvent may be subsfituted for the standard specified solvent
and the test method may be modified as per the recommendafions of the solvent manufacturer/supplier.

In addition, for each day of production, the completed mixture shall be tested for aggregate coating as follows:

Obtain a 100 — 150 gram sample and allow it to cure to normal {aboratory temperature. Place the sample ina
glass jar of sufficient size that the loose sample will protrude fo a level of no more than half of its capacity.
Cover the sample with water to approximately three-quarters of the capacity of the jar. Place a tight fitting
cover on the jar and allow it to stand for a period of 20 to 24 hours at normal laborafory femperature. The
sample jar shall then be vigorously agitated for a period of 30 seconds. Pour the water from the jar, remove
the sample, and spread it on a fiat light-colored surface (nonstick laboratory paper is recommended). Allow
the sample to air dry and visually examine it for stripping of the asphalt film from {he aggregate. Estimate the
amount of coated aggregate. Any thin brownish, transiucent areas are to be considered fully coated with an
asphalt film. Document the resulis of this test.. The mixture shalt be considered acceptable if at least 85% of



S A A S

[N LS

the aggregate is coated. Insufficient coating may keqhire reworking of the mixture andfor an additional
amount of anti-stripping additive,

ACCEPTANCE OF THE MIXTURE

Acceptance shall be the responsibiliiy of the Division of Highways. This shall be accomplished by moniforing
the contractor's quality control testing and reviewing all test data relevant to the mixture.

In addifion, if the completed mixture shows signs of stripping, the Division of Highways shall choose to elther
monitor the conlractor’s quality control aggregate coating test or conduct their own test and visually estimate
the amount of coated parficles. Document the results of this test. Although this is a visual estimation, the
contractor should be immediately nofified if the Division of Highway's fest results ars below 95%. A low
coating percentage should be an indicator for the Division of Highways to closely monitor the mixture after
stockpiling. All Division of nghways testing shall be performed by the Division of Highways' D{stnc Materials
Saction.

After the mixture is stockpi!ed on the Division of Highways' lot, it shall be visually evaluated for any
appearance of excessive nonfully coated aggregate parficles. If considered necessary, the Division of
Highways shall evaluate the mixture in accordance with ASTM D2489 (based onh two-sample averags) fo

determine if af least 97% of the coarse aggregate particles are fully.coated. This evaluation shall take place

within the first week after stockpiling. If the mixiure is less than 97% coated, the contracior will be required fo
provide new material or remove the existing stockpile material from the Division of Highways’ lof, rework it fo
an acceptable condition with addifional asphalt andfor chemical anti-stripping additive as needed and retum 1t
to the Division of Highways' lot, at no additional cost to the Division of Highways.

PREPARATION OF MIXTURE

The aggregate shall be healed to insure that it is surface dry af the time of mixing; however, the aggregate
temperature shall not exceed the safe temperature recommended by the liquid asphalt supplier. The liquid
asphalt shall not be heated beyond the safe temperature recommended by the liquid asphalt supplier. Care
shall be taken to prevent local overheafing.

The aggregate and asphalt material shall be measured separately and accurately fo the proportions in which
ihey are to be mixed. After the aggregate and binder have been combined, they shall be tharotighly mixed
until the particles of aggregale are coated. The temperature of the finished mixture shall not be greater ihan
the maximum temperature recommended by the liquid asphalt supplier.

WORKABILITY

The mixture shall be stockpiled on the vendor's site for 14 days or unil the internal mixture temperatuse is
within 10°F of ambient temperature without stripping and when taken from a stockpite, shall be capable of
being shoveled, raked spread and compacted.

At the end of the sfockpiling penod on the contractor's yard, the mixture shall be tested in accordance with
ASTM D2489 (based on iwo-sample average). The total amount.of non-fully coated particles shall not
excead 3%. The contractor shall provide the ASTM D2489 test results to the Division of Highways on Form
T410 Degree of Parlicle Coating of Bituminous-Aggragate Mixtures which - as provided by the Division of
Highways District Materials Section. See Appendix A.



If the material fails fo conform to the requirements of the speclﬁcatlons the contractor may rework the existing
material or provide new material.

STORAGE

The mixture shall be maintained on the confractor's property in stockpiles not exceeding a height of four feet
(4 until the intemal mixture temperature is within 10°F of the ambient femperature. In addition, ihe top of 4l
stockplles shall be leveled to eliminate any peaked areas.

The mixture shall contain sufficient asphalt that is capable of coaling the aggregate without stripping. After
stockpiling on the Division of Highways' foY, the mixture shall have a maximum of 5% non-fully coated particles
after the first week and up fo 90 days from delivery when evaluated in accordance with ASTM D2489 ({based
on two-sample average). This coafing determination may be based on the Division of Highways’ visual
inspection, if coating is not a problem or based on Division of Highways’ testing when the amount of non-fully
coated particles appears questionable. If stripping occurs, the contractor will be required to provide new
material or remove the existing stockpile material from the Division of Highways' lof, rework it to an acceptable
condition with additionial asphalt andfor chemical anti-stripping atditive as needed and retum it to the Division
of Highways' lot. '

5 B!DDING INSTRUCTIONS

* Vendors may bld to dehver the estimated quantities of material at any or all of the deStgnated delivery snﬁes o

Any qualification of bids or any modification of the specifications or conditions goveming the btds may be
cause for their rejection.

8. CONTRACT AWARD

The Division of Highways will consider Vendor's performance history in the award of this Purchase Order
Contract.

Qualified Vendors who submit a valid bid "F.0.B. Division Storage Site wﬂ[ be awarded a contract for those
locatlons for which their bid is low.

in the event a Vendor fails to conform to the requirements set out in this contract document, the Agency

Release or the govemning specifications, the Purchase Order Contract may be cancelied and awarded fo the
next low bidder.

7. SAMPLING AND TESTING

Upon award of contract, the Vendor shall inform the Division of Highways of the location of Vendar's storage
sites so that materials may be sampled and tested prior o shipment. Inforfiation shall be directed fo the
respeciive Division of Highways District Materials Engineers/Supervisors.




R £

8. WEIGHING MA‘!;ERiALS DELIVERED BY TRUCK

Material defivered by truck shall be weighed in accordance with Section 401.9.3 of the West Virginia
Department of Transportation, Division of Highways' Standard Specifications Roads and Bridges, adopted
2010 as modified by the January 1, 2011 Supplemental Specifications. . .

8. SUPPLYING OTHER ORGANIZATIONAL ENTITIES

County Courts, Municipalities, Schoot Boards, other polifical subdivisions and governmental entities, efc., may

have a need for these materials, and Vendors may wish to supply that need. Accordingly, bidders may wish
to extend their confract pricas to these other entifies. If the bidder wishes to supply these ofher entifies, buf
with prices different from those quoted for the Division of Highways, the bidder shall include a set of bid
schedules clearly and unambiguously marked for the express use of enfifies other than the Division of
Highways. Failure by the bidder to include a set of bid schedules for other entifies will be taken to mean that
fhe bid schedules extended to the Division of Highways will also be extended to these other entities.

in the event any Vendor does not wish to extend the prices, terms and condifions of this bid and subseguent
confract fo other entities of the State, he must so indicate in a clear and unambiguous manner in his bid. This
indication does not prejudice the award of the confract. if a Vendor does not indicate his refusal to extend the
prices, terms and conditions of his bid to other entifies of the State he is bound fo extend them upon issuance
of a purchase order by these other enfifies.

Other organizational enfities using this provision of the contraét shall do so without any involvement of the

Division of Highways; that is, the enfity shall make its own purchase arangements with the Vendor and shall
make its own arangement for payment.

10,  PRODUCTION SCHEDULE

Vendor should produce material within fwo weeks of receipt of the Agency Release from the Divigion of
Highways.

{1, VENDOR'S INVOICES
Vendor's invoices must be submitied in original and one copy containing the following:

a. ‘Division of Highway's Agency Release Number and this Contract Number.
b. Total quantity and unit price with the fotal cost of the material fumished.

Note: Under no circumstance will the Division of Highways accept, or pay for, quantities of
material in excess of the quantity stated on the Agency Release,

12, PURCHASING CARD ACCEPTANCE

The State of West Virginia currently utilizes a VISA Purchasing Card Program which is issuéd through a bank.
The successful vendors must accept the State of West Virginia VISA Purchasmg Card for payment of all

. orders placed by DN[S]OD of Highways as a condition of award.



APPENDIX A

T410
10-08

West Virginia Division of Highways
Degres of Particle Coating of Bituminous-Aggregate Mixtures

ASTM D2489
Lab Number: . Date Tested:
Technictan: Cold-Mix Type:

Cold-Mix Source:

Cold-Mix Stockpile Location:

Test Sample Number 1

(A) Total Numbaer of Panicles: (B) Number of coaied particles:

(C) Percentage of Coated Particles = (B /A ) x 100

- Test Sample Numbaer 2

(D) Total Number of Particles: (E) Number of coated particles:

(F) Percentage of Coated Parilcles = (E/D Jx 100

Average Percent Coated Particles = (C + F /2!
Pags / Fall. '

97% Coating Requirement for First Week After Stockpiling
95% Coating Requiremant Up To 90 Days After Stockpliing

Vendor should submit copy of Certificate of Iiability Tnsurance and
Worker's Compensation Certificate with bid.

The “Bid Schedule” is available for download on Purchasing’s Web site at
www.state,wv.us/admin/purchase
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13. BID SCHEDULE 66-11-C033
 \VENDOR NAME: Camden Materials, LLC.~
~ Modified Winter Grade Bituminous Patching Mixture - Gold Mix
Delivery: F.0.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site
DISTRICT 1 .
Unit of Estimated | Unit Cost | Extended

County Delivery/Storage Site Measure | NumberTons | Per Ton Cost
Boone  |Clinton @ WV85 TON 275 | nosip| NosiD
Boone Rock Creek TON 260 NOBID| NOBID
Boone  |Seth - TON 75 NOBID| NOBID
Clay Widen Road & CR 11 TON 200 NOBID| NOBID
Clay Maysel TON 0 NOBID | NOBID
Kanawha |Chelyan TON 200 NOBID | NOBID
Kanawha |Elkview TON 200 | nosp| NOBID
Kanawha |North Charleston TON 200 NOBID| NOBID
Kanawha: [St. Albans TON 100 NOBID! NOBID
Kanawha |1-64 @ Rt. 119 and Penn. Avenue TON 50 NOBID| NOBID
Kanawha {I-77 @ Sissonville TON 100 |  noBip | NOBID
Kanawha [I-79 @ Amma TON 30 NOBID | NOBID
Kanawha |Corridor G @ Alum Creek TON 30 NOBID | NOBID
Mason |Pt. Pleasant TON 200 NOBID | NOBID
Putnam  |Red House TON 75 NOBID| NOBID
Putnam  |Huricane @ Rt 34 TON 75 NOBID| NOBID
Putnam  |Scary TON 30 NOBID| NOBID




13. BID SCHEDULE 66-11-C033
VENDOR NAME: Camden Materials, LLC.
Modified Winter Grade Bituminous Patching Mixture - Cold Mix
Delivery: F.O.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site
DISTRICT 2
. Unit of Estimated Unit Cost | Extended
County Delivery/Storage Site Measure | Number Tons | Per Ton Cost
Cabell |Barboursville TON | 200 NOBID | NOBID
Cabell |64 @ Huntington TON | 40 " NOBID | NOBID
Lincoln  |West Hamfin TON. 75 NOBID | NOBID
Lincoln  [Yawkey TON 15 NOBID | NOBID
|Lincoln__|Harts TON 25 NOBID | NOBID
~|Logan " [Corridor G @ Chapmanville TON 80 NOBID | NOBID
Logan  |Wilkinson TON 80 NOBID | NOBID
Logan  (Man TON 40 NOBID | NOBID
Mingo  |Mingo County @Miller's Cresk TON | 50 NOBID | NOBID
- {Mingo Gilberl TON 25 NOBID| NOBID
Wayne  |Crum TON | 75 NOBID | NOBID
Wayne |Pritchard TON 100 NOBID | NOBID
Wayne  |Wayne TON 100 NOBID| NOBID
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13, BID SCHEDULE 66-11-C033
VENDOR NAME: Camden Materials, LLC.
Modified Winter Grade Bituminous Patching Mixture - Cold Mix
Delivery: F.O.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site
DISTRICT 3
| Unit of Estimated Unit Cost | Exiended
County Delivery/Storage Site Measure | Number Tons Per Ton Cost
Calhoun _[Milistone TON 200 |  $102.00 |$20,400.00
Jackson  {Ripley TON 300 $100.00 |$30.000.00
Jackson |I-77 @ Medina TON 20 $111.00 | $2,220.00
Pleasants |Belmont TON 0 $96.50
Pleasants |St. Mary's (Colin-Anderson Lof) TON 75 | NOBID | NOBID
|Ritchie _ |APD Pennsboro TON | 0 |  Nosp | NoBID
Ritchie_ [Ellenboro_ TON | 75| _ NOBID| NOBID
Ritchie  [Corridor D @ Nutter Farm TON | 0 [ nosiD| NOBID
Ritchie  |Smithviile TON 30 " NOBID| NOBID
Roane  |Lefthand @ WV 36 TON | 50 $120.00 | $6,000.00
Roane Amber Hill @ US 119 TON 0 NOBID| NOBID
Roane  |Spencer TON 225 $105.00 | $23,625.00
Wirt Eiizabeth TON 75 $98.00 [$7,350.00
Wood Parkersburg @ Rt 95S TON 150 $98.00 |$14,700.00
Wood Corridor D @ Riverhill TON 0 $101.00
Wood |77 @ Will Run Road TON | 3 $106.00 | $3,710.00




BID SCHEDULE

13. 66-11-C033
VENDOR NAME: Camden Materials, LLC.
Modified Winter Grade Bituminous Patching Mixture - Cold Mix
Delivery: F.0.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site
DISTRICT 4
Unitof. | Estimated Unit Cost | Extended
County Delivery/Storage Site | Measure | Number Tons | Per Ton Cost
Doddridge  |Smithburg | TON 60 | noBID| NOBID.
Harison  |Gore | TON 300 NOBID| NOBID
Harrison  |I-78 @ Lost Cresk ~ TON 75 | NOBID] NOBID
Harrison APD 50 @ Tunnel Hill TON 75 NOBID| NOBID
|Marion Fairmont [7ON | 100 |  NOBID| NOBID
Marion {Mannington TON 75 |  NOBID| NOBID
Monongalia |-79 @ Goshen Road TON | 15 | NoBID| NOBID
Monongalia |Ridgedale TON 500 | NOBID| NOBID
Monongalia |Peniress | TON 75 NOBID]  NO BID
Preston Albright | TON 300 NOBID| NOBID
Preston Bruceton | TON 100 NOBID | NOBID
Presfon  |Terra Alta TON 100 NOBID | NOBID
Preston Fellowsville TON 100 NOBID| NOBID
Preston Aurora | TON 100 NOBID | NOBID
Preston I-68 @ Copper's Rock TON 25 NOBID{ NOBID
Taylor JFetterman/Prunytown | TON | 75 | ~ NOBID| NOBID




13. BID SCHEDULE

66-11-C033

VENDOR NAME:

Camden Materials, LLC.

Modified Winter Grade Bituminous Patching Mixture - Cold Mix
Delivery: F.O.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site '

DISTRICT 5
| Unitof | Estimated | UnitCost | Extended

County Delivery/Storage Site WMeasure | Number Tons | Per Ton Cost

Berkeley  |1-81 @ Martinsburg TON 300 NOBID | NOBID
Borkeley  |I-81 @ Exit 18 TON 0 | Nosp | NoBID
Grant Petersburg | TON 75 | noBiD | NOBID
Grant |Mt. Storm 1 TON 50 | _ NOBID| NOBID
Grant [Corridor H @ Knobley Road | TON 0 NOBID | NOBID
Hampshire [Romney ' [ TON | 50 NOBID| NOBID
Hampshire |Capon Bridge I TON | 30 I NOBID| NOBID
Hampshire |Slanesville T'7oN [ 50 | No BID | NOBID
Hardy Moorefield TON | 76 | NOBID | NOBID
Hardy  |Baker [ TON | 75 | NoBID| NOBID
Jefferson__ [Charles Town [ TON | - 100 NOBID | NOBID
Mineral New Creek TON 75 NOBID| NOBID
Mineral Sky Line TON 50 NOBID| NOBID
{Mineral _|Short Gap TON 50 NOBID | NOBID
Mineral  |District Headquarters TON | 25 |  nNoBiD | NOBID
Morgan Berkeley Springs TON 200 NOBID | NOBID
Morgan Largent TON 0 NOBID | NOBID




13. BID SCHEDULE 66-11-C033

VENDOR NAME: Camden Materials, LL.C.

Modified Winter Grade Bituminous Patching Mixture - Cold Iviix

Delivery: F.Q.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site

DISTRICTE
Unit of Estimated Unit Cost | Extended
County Delivery/Storage Site Measure | Number Tons | Per Ton Cost

Brooke  |Wellsburg TON 200 NOBID | NOBID
Brooke  [Weirton TON 0 NO BID [ NO BID
Hancock _ |New Manchester [ TON [ 220 | NOBID| NOBID
Marshall _|Glen Dale | TON [ 1300 | nNOBID| NOBID
Marshall _|Cameron | TON 700 NOBID | NOBID
Ohio | Triadelphia | TON | 150 | noBiD| NOBID
Ohio |1-70 @ Ttiadelphia | TON 100 [ NOBID| NOBID
Tyler  |Centerville | TON ] 100 | nNosiD| NOBID
Tyler Sistersville | TON | 100 NnoBID | NOBID
Tyler Sistersville Old Headquarters TON - 0 T wNoBiD| NoBID
Wetzel  |Hundred TON | 100 NOBID| NOBID
Wetzel  |New Martinsville TON | 150 NOBID| NOBID
Wetzel Pine Grove TON 100 NOBID| NOBID
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13. BID SCHEDULE 66-11-C033
VENDOR f NAME: Carmden Materials, LLC.
Modified Winter Grade Bituminous Patching Mixture - Cold Mix
Delivery. F.0.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site
DISTRICT 7
Unit of Estimated Unit Cost | Extended
County Delivery/Storage Site Measure | Number Tons | PerTon Cost
Barbour  |Phillipi TON 40 NOBID | NOBID
Braxton  jLaurel Court TON 150 NOBID | NOBID
Braxton |79 @ Coon Knob TON 25 NOBID| NOBID
Braxton |79 @ Burnsville TON 25 NOBID| NOBID
- |Gilmer Glenville Headquarters TON 80 NOBID| NOBID
Lewis Waeston (Ben Dale) TON - 100 NOBID} NOBID
Upshur__|Ciow Lot @ Buckhannon | TON 40 NOEID| NOBID
Webster  |Cherry Falls TON .. 30 NOBID| NOBID
Webster |Cowen TON 30 NOBID| NOBID
Webster  |Hacker Valley TON 30 NOBID | NOBID
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13, BID SCHEDULE 66-11-C033

VENDOR N AME: Camden Materials, LLC.

© Modified Winter Grade Bituminous Patching Mixture - Cold Mix
Delivery: F.0.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site
DISTRICT 8
Unit of Estimated Unit Cost | Extended
County Delivery/Storage Site Measure | Number Tons | Per Ton Cost

Pendieton  |Franklin TON 100 NOBID | NOBID
Pocahontas _|Marlinton TON | 25 NOBID | NOBID
Randolph _|Elkins TON 125 NOBID | NOBID
Tucker \Parsons TON 60 NOBID | NOBID
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13. BID SCHEDULE 66-11-C033
VENDOR NAME: Camo?en Materials, LLC.
Modified Winter Grade Bituminous Paiching Mixture - Cold Mix
Delivery: .F.0.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site
DISTRICT 8
Unitof | Estimated | UnitCost | Extended
County Delivery/Storage Site | Measure | Number Tons PerTon .|  Cost
Fayetie  |Oak Hill ~ TON 100 NOBID | NOBID
Fayette  |Coridor L @ Oak Hill TON | 0 NOBID_| NOBID
Fayette _|Lookout TON 100 | NOBID | NOBID
Fayette  |Glen Ferris ToN T 200 | NOBID | NOBID
Greenbrier [Lewishurg TON 195 NOBID | NOBID
Greenbrier |Crawley TON | 100 | NOBID | NOBID
Greenbrier |1-64 @ Harl's Run TON | 15 | nosip | NOBID
Monrog __{Union TON | 275 | NOBID | NOBID
Monroe  |Peterstown TON | 0 | wnoBID | NOBID
Nicholas  |Summersvilie TON 175 NOBID | NOBID
Nicholas  |Curtin TON 25 NOBID | NOBID
INicholas  |Corridor L @ Muddlety TON 150 © NOBID | NOBID
Summers _ |Hinton TON 50 NOBID | NOBID
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13 BiD SCHEDULE 66-11-C033

VENDOR NAME: Camden Materials, LLC.

Modified Winter Grade Bituminous Paiching Mixture - Cold Mix

Delivery: F.0.B. WV Division of Highways Storage Site

DISTRICT 10
Unit.of Estimated Unit Cost | Extended
County | Delivery/Storage Site | Measure | Number Tons Per Ton Cost

McDowell |County Headquarters | TON 100 NOBID | NOBID
Mercer  |County Headquarters TON | 100 NOBID | NOBID
Raleigh  |County Headquarters TON | 100 NOBID | NOBID
Wyorning  |County Headquarters TON 100 NOBID | NOBID




' @&
ACORD
V

CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE

DATE (MM/DDIYYYY)
/2772011

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED

REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER,

IMPORTANT: [f the ceriificate holder Is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must be endorsed. [f SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to
the terms and conditions of the policy, ¢certain poiicles may require an endorsement. A statement on this certificate does not confer rights to the

certificate holder in lieu of such endorsement(s).

PRODUCER

Mountain State Insurance Agency
1206 Kanawha Blvd. E.

 NAhE."! Kathryn Arthur

(Ao o, Exy:_§3041720-2000

A o) (304)720-2002
Eg‘g};’gss: karthur@mountainstateinsurance.com

- PRODUCER
| cusToMER Ip 00012227

Charleston WV 25301 INSURER({S) AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC #

INSURED msurerA Westfield 24112
INSURER B :

Camden Materials, LLC INSURER € 1

2950 Charles Avenue HSURER D :
INSURERE :

Dunbar WV 25064 INSURER F :

COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER:10/11 Liab Auto REVISION NUMBER:

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUGCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.

INSR ADDL|SUBR

POLICY EFF

FOLICY EXP
LTR TYPE OF INSURANGE INSR | WD POLICY NUMBER (MMIDDIYYYY) | {MMWDD/YYYY) LIMITS
GENERAL LIABILITY EACH OGCURRENCE 5 2,000,000
TAMAGE 10 RENTED
X | COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILIFY PREMISES (Ea occurrence) | $ 100,000
A CLAIMS-MADE | X | CCCUR TRA32239498 9/1/2010 [9/1/2011 MED EXF {Any ons person) $ 5,000
— PERSONAL & ADVINJURY | § 2,000,000
| GENERAL AGGREGATE H 4,000,000
GENL AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: PRODUGTS - COMPIOP AGG | § 4,000,000
I POLICY l X ] RS I LoC ¥
AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY COMBINED SINGLE LIMIT
Ea pecitont s 2,000,000
ANY AUTO
— BODILY INJURY {Perperson} | $
Al | A cwnep autos ItRA3223998 0/1/2010  f9/1/2011 {Perperson)
— BODILY INJURY (Par accidens)| $
SCHEDULED AUTOS PROPERTY DAMAGE .
X | sirep AuTOS {Par accident)
X | non-ownED AUTOS $
$
UMBRELLA LIAB OCCUR EACH OCCURRENCE 3
EXCESS LIAB CLAIMS-MADE AGGREGATE $
DEDUCTIBLE $
RETENTION _$ $
WORKERS COMPENSATION WG STATU. OTE-
AND EMPLOYERS' LIABILITY TORY LIMITS ER
ANY PROPRIETOR/PARTNER/EXECUTIVE E.L EACH ACCIDENT 5
GFFICER/MEMBER EXCLUDED? NiA
{Mandatory Tn NH) EL. DISEASE - EA EMPLOYEE $ _
If yes, describe under
BESCRIPTICN OF OPERATIONS below E.L. DISEASE - POLIGY UMIT § §

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VEHICLES ({Attach ACORD 101, Additlonal Remarks Schedule, If more space Es required)

Evidence of Insurance.

CERTIFICATE HOLDER

CANCELLATION

WV Department of Transportation
1800 Kanawha Blvd, E

Building #5, Room A737
Charlaeston, WV 25305

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE ODELIVERED IN
ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

- Cl o o S
Kathryn Avthur/KATHY 79~ 25 €2

ACORD 25 {2009/09)
INS025 (200809)

© 1988-2000 ACORD CORPORATION. Ali rights reserved.

The ACORD name and logo are registered marks of ACORD



Rev. 09/08 State_of West Virginia

VENDOR PREFERENCE CERTIFICATE

Certification and application* is hereby made for Preference in accordance with West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37. (Does not apply fo
construction contracts). West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37, provides an cpportunity for qualifying vendors to request {(atthetime of bid)
preference for thair residency status. Such preference is an evaluation method only and will be applied only fo the cost bid in
accordance with the West Virginia Code. This certificate for application is to be used to request such preference. The Purchasing
Division will make the determination of the Resident Vendor Preferencs, if applicable. ‘

1. Application is made for 2.5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is an individual resident vendor and has resided continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preced-
ing the date of this cerlification; or,

Bidder is a partnership, assoclation or corporation resident vendor and has maintained its headquarters or principal place of
pusiness continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preceding the date of this cenification; or 80% of the
ownership interest of Bidder is held by another individual, partnefship, assoctation or corporation resident vendor who has
maintained its headquarters or principal place of business continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately
precetiing the date of this certification; or,

Bidder Is a honresident vendor which has an affiliate or subsidiary which employs a minimum of one hundred state residents
andwhich has maintalned its headquarters or princlpal place of business within West Virginia continuously for the four (4)
years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or,

—_—

2. Applcation is made for 2.6% restdent vendor preference for the reason checked:

___ Bldderls a resident vendor who.certifies that, during the life of the contract, on average at least 75% of the employees
working on the project being bid are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for ths two ysars
immediately preceding submission of this bid; or,

Application Is made for 2.5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is a nonresident vendor employing a minimum of one hundred state residents orisa nonresident vendor with an

afflliate or subsidiary which maintains iis headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia employing a

minimum of one hundred state residents who certifies that, during the life of the contract, on average at loast 75% of the
" employees or Bidder's affiliale’s or subsidiary's employees are residents of West Virglnia who have resided in the state

continuously for the two years immediately preceding submission of this bid; or,

l w

Application is made for 5% resident vendor preference for the reason.checked:
Bidder meets eiiher the requirement of both subdivisions (1) and (2) or subdivision (1) and (3) as stated above; or,

Application is made for 3.6% resident vendor preference who fs a veteran for the reason checked: ]
Bidder is ah individual resident vendor who is a veleran of the United States armed forces, the reserves orthe Nattonal Guard
and has resided In West Virginia continuously for the four years immediately preceding fhe date on which the bid is
submitted; or, )

| s
|7 I

Application is made for 3.6% resident vendor preference who Is a veteran for the reason checked:

Bidder is a resident vendor who is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard, If, for
purposes of producing or distributing the commodities or completing the project which is the subject of the vendor’s bid and
continuously over the entire term of the project, on avarage al least seventy-five percent of the vendor's employees are
residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two immediately preceding years.

r

Bidder understands if the Secretary of Revenue determines that a Bidder receiving preference has falled to continue o meet the
requirements for such preference, the Secretary may ordet the Director of Purchasing to; (a) reject the bid; or (b) assess a penalty
against such Bidder in an amount not to exceed 5% of the hid amount and that such penally will be pald to the contracting agency
or deducted from any unpaid batance on the contract or purchase order,

By submission of this certificate, Bidder agrees lo disclose any reasonably requested Information to the Purchasing Divislon and
authorizes the Depariment of Revanue to disclose fo the Director of Purchasing appropriate information verifying that Bidder has paid
the required business taxes, provided that such information does not contain the amounts of taxes paid nor any other information
deemed by the Tax Commissioner to be confidential.

Under penaity of taw for false swearing (West Virginla Code, §61-5-3), Bidder hereby certifies that this certificate is true.
and accurate in all respects; and that if a contract Is issued to Bldder and if an rﬁ%%%wntained within this certificate
changes during the tarm of the contract, Bidder will notify the K\rch sing Diygion in vy&iting immediately.

Camden Materials, LLC. )k @Giﬂ& | [—

~ Managing'Member

Bidden:

Signed:

Date: August 3, 2011 Title:

*Check any combinalion of preference consideration(s) indicated sbove, which you are enlitiad to recelve.




RFQ No. 6611C033

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA

Purchasing Division
PURCHASING AFFIDAVIT

West Virginia Code §5A-3-10a states: No conlract o renewal of any contract may be awarded by the state or any of its
poliical subdivisions to any vendor or prospective vendor when the vendor or prospective vendor or a refated party to the
vendor or prospective vendor is a deblor and the debt owned is ar amount greater than one thousand doflars In the
aggregate

DEEINITIONS:

“Debt* means any assessment, premium, penatty, fine, tax or other amount of money owed fo the stale or any of its
politicat subdivisions because of a judgment, fine, permit viclation, license assessment, defaulled workers' compensation
premium, penalty or other assessment presently definquent or due and required to be paid to {he state or any of ils
political subdivisions, including any interest or additional penelties accrued thergon.

“Debtor® means any individual, corporation, parinership, association, Limited Liabifity Company or any other form or
business association owing a debt to the state or any of its political subdivisions. “Political subdivislon” means any county
commission: municipality; county board of education; any instrumentality established by a courty or municipality;, any
separate corporation or insirumentality established by one or more caunties or municipalities, as permitied by law; or any
public body charged by taw with the performance of a government funciion or whose Jurisdiction is coextensive with one
or more counties or municipalities. “Related party” moans a party, whether an individual, corporation, parinership,
- association, fimifed liabllity company or any other form ot business associafion of other entity whatsoever, related to any
vendor by blood, marriage, ownership or contract through which the party has a relafionship of ownership or other interest
with the vendor so that the party will actually or by effect receive of control a portion of the benefil, profit or other
consideration from performance of a vendor contract with the party receiving an amount that meets of exceed five percent
of the fofal contract amount.

EXCEPTION: The prohibition of this section does not apply where & vendor has contested any tax administered pursuant
to chapter efeven of this code, workers' compensation premiutn, permit fee or environmental fee or assessment and the
matter has not become final or where the vendor has entered into a payment plan of agreament and the vendor is notin
default of any of the provisions of such plan or agreement.

Under penalty of law for false swearing (West Virginia Code §61-5-3), it is hereby ceriified that ihe vendor affims and
acknowiedges the information in this affidavit and is in compliance with fhe requirements as stated.

WITNESS THE FOLLOWING SIGNATURE
Vendor's Name: Camden Materials, LLC. — __—— P
L~
Authorized Signature: Date:

July 27, 2011

State of  YVest Virginia

County of ___Kanawha . to-wit

i
Taken, subseribed, and sworn io before me ihis 27, day of-Deeember, 20 i/

My Commission expires g Zé;mg &ﬁ 3¢ 2olE .20 .
AFFIX SEAL HERE NOTORY PUBLiCM'W%/ et

Purchasing Affidavit {Revised 12/15/09)
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