

TITLE

PRESIDENT

ひばし こくけん

State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

Request for Quotation

Ť

RFQ NU	MBER	
	מכיז	1

304-233-8000

10-07-2010

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED AB/

P	AGE
	7

**ADDRESS CORRESPONDENCE TO A TENTION OF S

TO ANN ADKINS

ALL STATE AGENCIES
AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER

96 ROBINSON DRIVE TRIADELPHIA, WV 26059

TERMS OF SALE SHIP VIA FREIGHTTERMS DATE PRINTED F.O.B. 09/08/2010 BID OPENING DATE: BID OPENING TIME 10/07/2010 01:30PM CAT, LINE QUANTITY UOP TEM NUMBER UNITPRICE AMOUNT REQUEST FOR QUOTATION THE PURCHASING DIVISION IS SOLICITING BIDS FOR BLANKET OPEN-END STATEWIDE CONTRACT TO SUPPLY 2011 (OR CURRENT YEAR MODELS) POLICE VEHICLES FOR THE WEST VIRGINIA STATE POLICE AND ALL POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS ATTACHMENTS TO THIS REQUEST FOR QUOTATION: SPECIFICATIONS/PRICING PAGES FOR FORD CROWN VICTORIA, 4 PAGES. SPECIFICATIONS PRICING PAGES FOR CHEVROLET IMPALA, SPECIFICATIONS PRICING PAGES FOR DOUGE CHARGER, 3 PAGES. SPECIFICATIONS PRICING PAGES FOR FORD EXPLORER, Annoch a Palls III JEEP GRAND CHEROKEE 3 PAGES. vendors are requested to complete pricing as THE REPORT OF THE REQUESTED ON THE \$PECIFICATION/PRICING PAGES, AND BIDDER'S NAME ON EACH PAGE. potice ***** ******* NOTICE ALL OPTION PRICING MUST BE AT DEALER COST. \$HOULD COMPLETE AND RETURN THE INFORMATION/ CERTIFICATION PAGE WITH BID. CONTRACTS SHALL NOT BE AWARDED WITHOUT RECEIPT OF THIS CERTIFICATION. ********************* WRITTEN QUESTIONS SHALL BE ACCEPTED THROUGH CLOSE OF BUSINESS ON TUESDAY, SEPTEMBER 21, 2010. QUESTIONS SEE REVERSE SIDE FOR TERMS AND CONDITIONS TELEPHONE SIGNATURE

55-076-5064



TITLE

WHEN RESPONDING

State of West Virginia Department of Administration Quotation **Purchasing Division** 2019 Washington Street East Post Office Box 50130 Charleston, WV 25305-0130

Request for

addressicorbescondencerio/abientionio

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

1		
φo	ANN	ADKINS
201	_ = = = 0	0000

ALL STATE AGENCIES AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED BY ORDER

JIM ROBINSON FORD 95 ROBINSON DRIVE TRIADELPHIA, WV 26059

TYPE NAME/ADDRESS HERE

RFQ COPY

DATE PRINTED TERMS OF SALE: SHIP VIA FO8 FREIGHT TERMS 09/08/2010 BID OPENING DATE: 10/07/2010 LINE QUANTITY JUOP ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE AMOUNT MAY BE SENT VIA USPS, FAX, COURIER OR EMIAL. tn order to assure no one vendor receives an unfair ADVANTAGE, NO SUBSTANTIVE QUESTIONS WILL BE Answered oraily. | IF POSSIBLE, EMAIL QUESTIONS ARE PREFERRED. ADDRESS INQUIRIES TO: JO ANN ADKINS DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION PURCHASING DİVISION 2019 Washington street; EAST CHARLESTON, WV 25305 FAX: 304-558-4115 EMAIL: JO A. ADKINS@WV. GOV *******REPORTS****** uccessful vendors shall be required to submit a REPORT (DUE SEPTEMBER 1, 2011) DETAILING THE NUMBER of vehicles and total amount of sales to date. T WOULD BE HELPFUL IF THIS REPORT INCLUDED THE OR POLITICAL SUBDIVISION MAKING THE PURCHASE(S) GENCY 001 070-06-99-001 FORD CROWN VICTORIA POLICE INTERCEPTOR 2011 FORD Crown Victoria Police Interceptor SEE REVERSE SIDE FOR TERMS AND CONDITIONS SIGNATURE 304 -233 - 8000 10-07-2010

-076-5064



DODZEK

State of West Virginia Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East Post Office Box 50130 Charleston, WV 25305-0130

Request for **E** Quotation

REQ NU	MBER	69.600 is	
	PC	17	

PA	GE****
	2

Address correspondence to a tiention of

JO ANN ADKINS <u> 104-558-8802</u>

RFQ COPY TYPE NAME/ADDRESS HERE

JIM ROBINSON FORD 95 ROBINSON DRIVE TRIADELPHIA, WV 26059 ALL STATE AGENCIES AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED BY ORDER

09/0	RINTED B/2010	TERMS OF SALE	SHIP VIA	F.O.B.	FREIGHTTERMS
BID OPENING DA	70.	/07/2010 Y UOP Ç	BII AI ITEMNUMBER ₽		AMOUNT
0002	CHEVROLET	EA 1 1 IMPALA POI	070-06-99-002 LICE PURSUIT VEHIO	NO NO	BID
					k
¢003		3 1	070-06-99-003 EXPLR XLT, OR JEE		27,647.00
	2011 F	Forn Expeni	tion 4×4 Specia	A SERVICE PKG.	•
0004	DODGE CHA	EA 1 ARGER POLICE	070-06-99-005 E PURSUIT VEHICLE	NO	BID
	EXHIBIT 3				
	YEAR OR UNECESSARY ORIGINAL NOT EXCEE	NTII SUCH " TO OBTAIN CONTRACT TO TWELVE (1) VENDOR MAY	DEXTENDS FOR A PE 'REASONABLE TIME" A NEW CONTRACT OR THE "REASONABLE T	THEREAFTER AS IS RENEW THE 'IME" PERIOD SHALL G THIS "REASONABLE ONTRACT FOR ANY	
	IN THIS C PRICING S CONTRACT.	CONTRACT DOC SET HEREIN A	ISIONS ARE STIPUL CUMENT, THE TERMS, ARE FIRM FOR THE L	CONDITIONS AND	
SIGNATURE	RENEWAL	THYS CONTR	EE TEVERSE SIDEFOR TEAURANDE TELEPHONE	O4-233-BOOO	10-07-2010
TITLE P	RESIDENT	Fein 5	5-076-5064		S TO BE NOTED ABOVE



PRESIDENT

State of West Virginia Department of Administration Purchasing Division 2019 Washington Street East Post Office Box 50130 Charleston, WV 25305-0130

Request for Quotation

en broadstoff (A) or en state

PC11

PAGE

WADDRESS CORRESS CONDENCE NO DATE OF THE NEW PROPERTY OF THE NEW P

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

JO ANN ADKINS 304-558-8802

ALL STATE AGENCIES
AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER

RFQ COPY TYPE NAME/ADDRESS HERE

> JIM ROBINSON FORD 95 ROBINSON DRIVE TRIADELPHIA, WV 26059

DATE	PRINTED	TERMS O	FSALE	SHIP	VIÁ	FOB		FREIGHTTERMS
	8/2010				***************************************		*************	
BID OPENING D	ATE:	10/07/201			BID	OPENING TIME	3 01	· 3.0 PM
LINE	QUAI	NTITY UC	p CAT	ITEM NU	MBER	UNIT PRICE		AMOUNT

	WRITTE	ONSENT	OF THE	SPENDING	ווא יידוחוו	D VENDOR,		
,	SUBMIT:	TED TO TH	E ÞIREC'	FOR OF PU	RCHASING	THIRTY (30))	
] -	PAYS P	RIOR TO T	HE EXPI)	RATION DA	TE. SUC	TH RENEWAL S	TTATT.	
İ	BE IN A	ACCORDANC:	E WITH ?	THE TERMS	AND COM	IDITIONS OF	THE	
	φκτGTN!	AL CONTRA	CT AND S	SHALL BE	LIMITED	TO TWO (2)	ONE	
	(T) AFY	R PERTOD	S.				÷ ,	
	CANCELI	ATTON T	TE DIE	יידר איי ריים איי	IID C'LIA C'TA	G RESERVES		,
	RIGHT 1	O CANCEL	THIS CO	DNTRACT T	UKCHASTI TUKUK	LY UPON WRI	THE	
	HOTICE	TO THE V	ENDOR II	THE COM	MODITIES	AND/OR SER	VTCES	
	ROLLETTE	D ARE OF	AN INFI	ERIOR QUA	LITY OR	DO NOT CONF	'ORM I	
	то тне	SPECIPICA	T‡ONS (F THE BI	D AND CO	NTRACT HERE	IN.	
·	,	[
	ALITED MA	KKET CLA	JSE: THE	DIRECTO	R OF PUR	CHASING MAY	•	
	MARKET	иттнонты Тачары	ירם מתה יוס מיוסני	ATT TO PU	RCHASE (N THE OPEN TION OR COS		·
	ESTIMAT	'E ITEMS	SPECIE	ED ON TH	KEČOTSI	LITON OR COS	T	
	IMMEDIA	TE DELIV	ERY IN E	EMERGENCTI	ES DUE T	O UNFORESEE	. זאי	
]	¢auses	(INCLUDII	IG BUT 1	OT LIMIT	ED TO DE	LAYS IN TRA	NS -	
	PORTATI	ON OR AN	UNANTIO	IPATED II	NCREASE	IN THE VOLU	ME	
	φF WORK	:.)						·
	OLIVNITA	TEC. CITA	mtmrac					•
}	APPROXI	TES: YUAT	NILA DA	TISTED II	N THE RE	QUISITION A SUPPLIED B	RE	
	THE STA	TE SPENDI	NG INT	אַד אַט טמּפּג זיי אָד דע	TIMATES	OOD AND AGR	Y	
	тнат тн	E CONTRAC	TSHALI	COVER TH	PUALIO 31	TITIES ACTUA	T.T.V	
İ	QKDEKED	FOR DEPT	VERY DU	RING THE	TERM OF	THE CONTRA	CT.	
	WHETHER	MORE OR	LESS TH	IAN THE QU	JANTITIE	S SHOWN.	,	
	ADDEDTA	G DDC					•	
]	MEANGEMENT	G PROGEDU	KE: SPH	NUING UNI	T(S) SH	ALL ISSUE A		
	COVERED	BY THIS	CUMADS	ACT ORDER	((WV-35) FOR SERVI	CES	
Ē	SENT TO	THE PURC	HASTNG	DTVTSTOM	YI'UNG M YYTGTNYT	WV-35 SHAL ITH REQUIRE	r be	
	APPROVA	L. THE P	URCHASE	ORDER WI	LL BE R	ETURNED TO	THE T	
	\$PENDIN	G UNIT AN	D ONE C	OPY FORWA	RDED TO	THE VENDOR	AS	
	AUTHORI	ZATION FO	R SHIPM	ENT.				
SIGNATURE			SEE REV	ÆRSE SIDE FOR T	TELEBUONE			
TITLE CO.C.	<u> </u>		·		TELEPHONE 3	<u> 104 - 233 - 8000</u>	DATE	10-07-2010

55-076-5064



VENDOR

TITLE

RFQ COPY

TYPE NAME/ADDRESS HERE

State of West Virginia Department of Administration Purchasing Division 2019 Washington Street East Post Office Box 50130 Charleston, WV 25305-0130

JIM ROBINSON FORD

95 ROSINSON DRIVE TRIADELPHIA, WV 26059

Request for Quotation

BFONUMBER PC11

PAC	E
	-

ADDRESS:CORRESPON	DENCE TO A RIGINITION OF

JO ANN ADKINS 304-558-8802

304-233-8000

10-07-2010

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

SH P TO

ALL STATE AGENCIES
AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER

DATE PRINTED TE	RMS OF SALE	SHIP.VIA	FOR	
09/08/2010 BID OPENING DATE: 10/07/		59.00 V/s	F O B	FREIGHTTERMS
		BID	OPENING TIME 01	;30PM
LINE QUANTITY	UOP CAT NO	ITEM NUMBER	UNIMPRICE	AMOUNT
NO ORDER IS BY THE PURCH	VALID UNLES	SS APPROVED AND I	ENCUMBERED	
FOR BANKRUPT	CY PROTECT: L AND VOID	ENT THE VENDOR/CO ON, THE STATE MA AND TERMINATE S	AY DEEM THE	
SHALL SUPERS CONDITIONS W DOCUMENTS SU	EDE ANY ANI HICH MAY AI CH AS PRICE R MAINTENAN	S CONTAINED IN TO ALL SUBSEQUENT PEAR ON ANY ATTAILSTS, ORDER FORCE AGREEMENTS, IN AS CD-ROM.	TERMS AND CHED PRINTED RMS, SALES	
REV. 05/26/2			·	- ·
	NOTI	CE		
A SIGNED BID	MUST BE ST	BMITTED TO:	·	
PURCHAS: BUILDING 2019 WAS	NT OF ADMING DIVISIONS 15 HINGTON STON, WV 25	N REET, EAST		
THE BID SHOUI THE ENVELOPE	OR THE BID	THIS INFORMATION MAY NOT BE CONS	IDERED:	
SIGNATURE	SEE REV	/ERSE SIDE FOR TERMS AND CON TELEPHONE	704 -227 - 8000 DATE	10 07-2010

55-076-5064



RFQ COPY

State of West Virginia Department of Administration Quotation Purchasing Division 2019 Washington Street East Post Office Box 50130 Charleston, WV 25305-0130

Request for

ADDRESS.CC	RRESPONDENC	ENTO/ATRIENTION OF

O ANN ADKINS 304-558-8802

ALL STATE AGENCIES AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED BY ORDER

JIM ROBINSON FORD 95 ROBINSON DRIVE TRIADELPHIA, WV 26059

TYPE NAME/ADDRESS HERE

DATE PRINTEDTERMS OF SALE SHIP VIA F.O.B. FREIGHTTERMS 09/08/2010 BID OPENING DATE: BID OPENING TIME CAT. LINE QUANTITY UOP ITEM NUMBER UNITPRICE AMOUNT SEALED BID BUYER: FILE 42 RFQ. NO.: PC11 **BID OPENING PATE:** 10/07/2010 BID OPENING TIME: 1:30 PM PLEASE PROVI⊅E A FAX NŲMBER IN CASE IT|IS NECESSARY TO CONTACT YOU REGARDING YOUR BID: 304-233-3127 CONTACT PERSON (PLEASE PRINT CLEARLY): S. LONG- Fleet Sales IS THE END OF REQ THIS PC11 ****** TOTAL: SEE REVERSE SIDE FOR TERMS AND CONDITIONS SIGNATURE

55-076-5064

304-233-8000

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

JIM ROBINSON FORD 95 ROBINSON DRIVE

JIM ROBINSON FORD 95 ROBINSON DRIVE TRIADELPHIA, WV 26059

2011 Ford Crown Victoria (FULL SIZE, FOUR DOOR, REAR WHEEL DRIVE, PASSENGER CAR)

The base price bid of the specified vehicle will include all items/features/equipment listed by Ford Motor Company as standard equipment on this vehicle as well as any other "optional" features to be included in BASE VEHICLE COST.

MODEL:

2011 Ford Crown Vic Police Interceptor

Body Code:

P71

Order Code:

730 A

POWERTRAIN:

3.55 AXLE

IN ADDITION TO STANDARD EQUIPMENT FOR THIS VEHICLE, EQUIPMENT TO BE INCLUDED IN BASE VEHICLE COST:

ITEM	ITEM ORDER CODE #
Lamp Pre-Wire Group:	476
Grille Lamp, Siren and Speaker Wiring	172
AUDIO, AM/FM Stereo Radio	58F
Hoses, Silicone w/Aircraft Clamps	177 ⁻
Lamp, Courtesy Disable	478
Floor Covering, Carpet & Mats	128
Power Heated Mirrors	61K
Spotlamp (Driver's Side Only)	51A
Limited Slip Differential	45C
Seats, Cloth Buckets/Cloth Rear	H
Horn/Siren Wiring Prep Package	175
State Police Paint Scheme (see note below	
Moldings, Color Keyed Body Side (Installed	l) 96A

WV State Police Custom Paint Scheme - (Vehicles will be purchased from available Ford stock colors for the above described model). All bumper coverings and/or body side moldings are to be of the same color. The vendor will customize the paint scheme by painting the traditional gold portion of the vehicle, which includes the roof of vehicle, front and rear pillars. The exact paint code and pattern may be obtained from the West Virginia State Police Procurement Section, Attention, 1st. Sgt Rick Pursley (Phone-746-2238) prior to bid submission:

IMPORTANT NOTE: Prospective Vendors must include all profit margins for the vehicle bid in the "Base Vehicle Cost" below. For bidding purposes, all options listed above must be included in the "Base Vehicle Cost."

Base Vehicle Cost:

2011 Ford Crown Victoria (FULL SIZE, FOUR DOOR, REAR WHEEL DRIVE, PASSENGER CAR)

VEHICLE OPTIONS:

Any and all options must be made available at actual Dealer Cost. Options other than those stated in this bid package may occasionally be requested. Those options may be considered by the State only if the dealer prices these tems at dealer cost and furnishes proof of dealer cost prior to the purchase order being submitted by the agency. Dealer must provide verification from the manufacturer. Pricing for all options listed belowmust be provided with the bid package. Failure to provide option-pricing information (at dealer cost) shall be grounds for disqualification of the bid.

OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT	FORD ITEM ORDER #	PRICE
		_
All Vehicles Keyed Alike	432	\$+ 44,00
Lamp, Dome Center 5" – (Delete)	54M	\$ - N/C
Spotlamp (Driver's Side Only)	51A	\$ - 166.00
License Bracket, Front	153	\$ + <u>N/C</u>
Locking Gas Cap	- 540 98G	\$+ 8.00
Air Bags, Side (Driver and Passenger) 59M	\$+_StandARD
Wheel Covers – Full	64N	\$+_39.00
Floor Covering, Carpet & Mats (Delete	e) 128	\$ - 109.00
Power Distribution Box	66F	\$ + Standard
Roof Wiring (No Hole in Roof)	189	\$+_74,00
Seats, Cloth Buckets/Vinyl Rear - (@M	suit) Stainideau	\$+ <u>57.00</u>
Speed Control	525	\$+_196.00
Base Police Prep Package	65A	\$+ <u>670.00</u>
Comfort and Convenience Group	41A	\$+_661.00
Complete Police Prep Package	68P	\$+ <u>1,805.00</u>
Radio Suppression Package	53M	\$ + <u>83.00</u>
Visibility Package	65W	\$ + 2,689.00
Comfort and Convenience Group	41A	\$+_661.00
Laminated Security Side Glass	68G	\$ + <u>N/A</u>
Street Appearance Package	60B	\$+ 151.00
Trunk Safety Pack	14T	\$+ 166,00

2011 Ford Crown Victoria (FULL SIZE, FOUR DOOR, REAR WHEEL DRIVE, PASSENGER CAR)

	Audio, AM/FM Radio			58Y	\$ <u>-87.00</u>
pelete	State Police Paint Sche	me Roof-Gol	d		\$ 175.00
	Service Manuals one se			er" shop mar	uuale
	Inclusive of any futur				\$ + CONTACT Vende \$ + 39.00
	Wheel covers, full	- apa,	•	MADE CLAS	29 00
".	1111001 001013, 1411			PANA 671V	\$ + _ <i>J i</i>
	which are provided at no the following listed colors 2009 Ford Crown Victoria the specified "standard fa trim and bumper covering Vibrant White Smokestone M Arizona Beige M Medium Brown M	which have be police vehicle ctory colors", A B C	een made sta es: The base and <u>must</u> incl Royal Blue Dark Blue Light Gray	endard by Ford price quoted a	I Motor Company for above is for any of ed // matching body J K L
	Dark Toreador Red M	D E	Silver Gray Silver Birch I	NA.	M N
	Light Blue M	F	Medium Tita		0
	Light Ice Blue M Norsea Blue M Ultra Blue M	G H I	Black		P
	The below listed paint sch	emes are opti	ional and shal	ll be priced as	indicated:
	Standard Factory Color in Two-Tone Police Paint	Scheme:	s770), Ø	
l	If minimum order quantity	required for S	pecial Ford P	olice Paint Scl	heme specify here:
			Minimum #	سر	<u>-</u>

2011 Ford Crown Victoria (FULL SIZE, FOUR DOOR, REAR WHEEL DRIVE, PASSENGER CAR)

Miscellaneous: Inspection of Sample Vehicle(s): Within one week after the issuance of a purchase order, the successful bidder shall make arrangements to deliver to the West Virginia State Police, 725 Jefferson Road, South Charleston, West Virginia, a sample vehicle having the same general body, chassis, engine and transmission as the vehicle on which the bid was submitted. This vehicle may not be a Crown Vic Police Interceptor and may be a Crown Victoria vehicle from the dealer's stock. It will be used as a prototype for determining the method of attaching various items of police equipment.

The standard factory warranty of the vehicle bid shall be clearly specified within the body of the Vendor's bid submission. In addition, any available extended factory warranties which are optional shall also be bid as separate items, listing all areas and items covered.

Note: Equipment installation to be at the factory and not "add on" dealer accessories. Any exception(s) will be clearly stated within the body of the respective Vendor's bid submission.

Inspection, Testing and Evaluation -- State Police Vehicle(s) Only

Pre-Delivery: Prior to delivery, each new vehicle must be completely serviced in accordance with standard new car dealer "make ready" preparation and in accordance with these specifications and the manufacturer's recommendations. Crankcase, differential, transmissions and fuel tank must be filled to capacity as recommended by the manufacturer. Each vehicle shall contain a pre-delivery check sheet showing what operations have been performed on the vehicle and signed by the mechanic(s) or individuals that worked on the same prior to the department inspection. Vehicle owner's manuals must be delivered with vehicle. When delivered to agency vehicle must be clean inside and outside. No dealer insignia or dealer name is to be attached to vehicle in any form.

Delivery, Testing and Evaluation: Vehicles will be inspected, tested and evaluated to determine if they meet the requirements of this specification.

The dealer will deliver vehicles. (Vehicles purchased by the West Virginia State Police will be delivered to 725 Jefferson Road, South Charleston, West Virginia during normal business hours.) Vehicles will not be accepted until inspected and approved by the Purchaser. All repairs and corrections will be the responsibility of the dealer. Dealer will provide dealer's license, insurance (as required for dealer license), and reasonable management assistance for predelivery acceptance inspections. If the successful bidder's car does not meet the requirements of this specification, it will be rejected by agency.

End of Bid Specifications

NO BID

2011 CHEVROLET IMPALA POLICE PURSUIT VEHICLE (MID-SIZE, FOUR DOOR, FRONT WHEEL DRIVE)

The base price bid of the specified vehicle will include all items/features/equipment listed by Chevrolet as standard equipment, as well as any other "optional" features listed below under Mandatory Equipment Base Package. These features include:

MODEL:

2011 Chevrolet Impala 4 - Door Sedan

Order Code:

9C1

Mandatory Equipment Base Package:

Air Conditioning:

Installed

Locks: Radio: Power with rear door child security AM/FM/compact disc with clock

Steering:

Power, with Tilt Wheel

Wipers: Brakes:

Intermittent with high speed Anti-lift Wipers System on Driverside 4 Wheel Anti-Lock disc brakes with Police Calibration and Heavy

duty front brake pads

Suspension:

Heavy Duty Police, Front & Rear Stabilizer Bars

Transmission:

Heavy Duty, 4T65E4-Speed Automatic, with Oil Cooler

Engine: Cooling:

Chevrolet 3900 Series II SFI V-6 Heavy/Severe Duty, High Capacity

Engine Cradle:

Reinforced Reinforced

Front Struts: Alternator:

150 AMP with Idle Boost

Battery:

Heavy Duty

Tires:

P225/60R 16 SBR Blackwall "V" rated .

Wheels/Covers:

16 " x 6.5" heavy duty steel wheels, with chrome bolt on

wheel center caps

Spare Tire: (N81)

Full Size

Seats -- Front:

Heavy duty cloth front bucket seats with ANO CONSOLE@

between the seats

Seats -- Rear:

Cloth Bench

Speedometer:

Certified calibrated speedometer

Key:

Single key for all locks, each vehicle different

Defogger:

Rear Window Installed

License Bracket

Front & Rear

Dome Lamp:

Door switch deactivated

Electric Mirrors:

LH & RH Remote Installed

Windows:

Power with Rear Window lockout switch, Factory Installed

Floor Covering:

Full carpeting to include a complete set of four, color coordinated

factory floor mats

Trunk Release

Electric

Dome Lamp (C67)

Front Aux.

State Police Paint Scheme

WV State Police Custom Paint Scheme – (Vehicles will be purchased from available Chevrolet stock colors for the above described model). All bumper coverings and/or body side moldings are to be of the same color. The vendor will customize the paint scheme by painting the traditional gold portion of the vehicle, which includes the roof of vehicle, front and rear pillars. The exact paint code and pattern may be obtained from the West Virginia State Police Procurement Section, Attention, ft Sgt. Rick Pursley(Phone 304-746-2238) prior to bid submission:

2011 CHEVROLET IMPALA POLICE PURSUIT VEHICLE (MID-SIZE, FOUR DOOR, FRONT WHEEL DRIVE)

IMPORTANT NOTE: Prospective Vendors <u>must</u> include all profit margins for the vehicle bid in the "Base Vehicle Cost" below. Any and all options must be made available at actual Dealer Cost (the below listing is not all-inclusive) Pricing for all options listed below <u>must</u> be provided with the bid package. Failure to provide option-pricing information (at dealer cost) shall be grounds for disqualification of the bid. For bidding purposes, all options listed above must be included in the "Base Vehicle Cost."

Base Vehicle Cost:	\$	NO	BID
	End of Base Vehic	le Cost	
OPTION PRICING INFORMATION	<u>l;</u>		
Cruise Control: (K34)		\$	
Seat Front substitute vinyl for c	loth:	\$	
Seat Rear substitute vinyl for c	oth:	\$	
Floor Covering - substitute heavy d	uty black vinyl for ca	arpet (6A3) \$	
Spotlight Left Hand Driver's Side	(7X8)	\$	
Service Manuals (one set) B (complete set of "dealer" shop man Inclusive of any future updates)	uals,	\$	
Mats, Front and Rear (B34)		\$	
All Vehicles Keyed Alike: (6E8)		\$	
Spare Tire – Full Size (Credit)	·	\$	
Traction Control:		\$	
Switchable Daytime running lamps:		\$	
Grounding stud located in the trunk		\$ <u> </u>	
Wiring for alternating lamps (Wig Wa	ag)	\$	

2011 CHEVROLET IMPALA POLICE PURSUIT VEHICLE (MID-SIZE, FOUR DOOR, FRONT WHEEL DRIVE)

Optional Packages pricing for options listed below must be provided at Dealer cost. Failure to provide option-pricing information (at Dealer cost) shall be grounds for disqualification of the bid.

Chevrolet Impala (Kerr Industries l	Installations)
Equipment Tray (K012-11)	\$
Partition (KPHEX)	\$
Siren Speaker (KSPEAK)	\$
Strobe Trunk Lid lamps	\$
Strobe Rear Parcel Lamps	\$
Front and Rear Corner Strobes	\$
NiteVision Dome Lamp	\$
Switch for Trunk Lid lamps	\$
Spare Tire Well Cover	\$
Relocated Spare Tire	\$
Underhood Lamp	\$
Power Distribution Center	\$
Trunk Tray Ground Stud	\$
Plastic Rear Seat	\$
Fold Down Equipment Tray	\$
Side Out Equipment Tray	s
Trunk Organizer	\$
Keyless Remote Entry	\$
Shotgun Mounts	\$
Skid Plates	\$ <u> </u>
Rear Deck Lamps (KDCK-RR)	\$

NO BID

2011 DODGE CHARGER POLICE PURSUIT VEHICLE (MID-SIZE, FOUR DOOR, REAR WHEEL DRIVE)

The base price bid of the specified vehicle will include all items/features/equipment listed by Dodge as standard equipment, as well as any other "optional" features listed below under Mandatory Equipment Base Package. These features include:

MODEL:

2011 Dodge Charger- 4 door Sedan

Order Code:

Mandatory Equipment Base Package:

Air Conditioning:

Installed

Locks:

Power with rear door faild security

Radio: Steering:

AM/FM/with Clock Power, with Tilt Wheel

Wipers:

Intermittent with high speed Anti-lift Wipers System on

Driver side

Brakes:

4 Wheel Anti-Lock disc brakes with Police Calibration and

Heavy duty front brake pads.

Suspension:

Transmission:

Five-Speed automatic transmission with overdrive plus

autostick (column shifter)

Engine:

3.5 Liter V-6 engine

Cooling:

Severe Duty Cooling System

Engine Cradle: Front Struts:

Reinforced Reinforced

Alternator:

160-Amp high-output alternator

Battery:

Heavy Duty

Tires:

P225/60R18 BSW V-Rated performance tires

Wheels/Covers:

18 x 7.5 inch steel wheels with standard Dodge Wheel

Covers.

Spare Tire:

Full

Seats-Front:

Heavy-duty cloth front bucket seats with manual lumbar.

Seats-Rear:

Cloth Bench.

Speedometer:

160-mph certified calibrated speedometer.

Key:

Separate key and key fob

Defogger:

Rear Window installed.

License Bracket:

Front and rear

Dome Light:

Door Switch Deactivated

Electric Mirrors:

LH & RH Remote installed

Windows:

Power with drivers' one touchdown feature

Floor Covering:

Full Carpeting to include a set of four, color-coordinated

factory floor mats

Trunk Release:

Electric

Dome Lamp ()

Front Aux.

Police Equipment Mounting Bracket:

Installed

State Police Paint Scheme:

WV State Police Custom Paint Scheme- (Vehicles will be purchased from available Dodge stock colors for the above described models). All bumper coverings and/or body side moldings are to be the same color. The vendor will customize the paint scheme by painting the traditional gold portion of the vehicle, which includes the roof of vehicle, front and rear pillars. The exact paint code and pattern may be obtained from the West Virginia State Police –Procurement Section, Attention 1st Sgt. Rick Pursley, (Phone 304-746-2238) prior to bid submission.

IMPORTANT NOTE: Prospective Vendors must include all profit margins for the vehicle bind in the "Base Vehicle Cost" below. Any and all options must be made available at actual Dealer Cost (the below listing is not-all inclusive). Pricing for all options listed below must be provided with the bid package. Failure to provide option-pricing information (at dealer cost) shall be grounds for disqualification of the bid. For bidding purposes, all options listed above must be included in the "Base Vehicle Cost"

RACE	VEHICLE	COST.
ルノどる(フエ ン		CUST

s NO BID

End of Base Vehicle Cost

OPTION PRICING INFORMATION:

5.7L Hemi V8 with Mult-Deplacement
System and 340 hp, 390 lb-ft torque@ 400
RPM.

Cruise Control () \$

Seat-Front-substitute vinyl for cloth

Seat-Rear-substitute vinyl for cloth

Floor Covering-substitute heavy duty black
Vinyl for carpet () \$

Spotlight-Left hand drivers side

JIM ROBINSON FORD 95 ROBINSON DRIVE TRIADELPHIA, WV 26059

Service Manuals (one set) (complete Set of "dealer" shop manuals, inclusive of any future updates)	\$
Mats, Front and Rear ()	\$
All Vehicles Keyed Alike:	\$
Spare Tire-Full Size (credit)	\$
Traction Control	\$
Switchable Daytime Running Lights	\$
Auxiliary wiring battery ignition feed to The front passenger floor/dash area	\$
Grounding Stud located in trunk	\$
Wiring for alternating lamps (Wig Wag)	\$
Power Drivers Seat	\$
Shift Lever ()	\$
West Virginia State Police custom paint Scheme (credit)	\$
Exterior Color Pricing:	•
Important Note: The above specified base factor colors" (no two tone).	vehicle cost for vehicles painted "standard
The base price quoted above is for any of the include color keyed // matching body trim ar	e specified "standard factor colors" and <u>must</u> nd bumper covering, if available.
The below listed paint schemes are optional	and shall be priced as indicated:
Standard Factory Color in Two-Tone Paint Scheme:	s NO BID
If minimum order quantity required for Spec	ial Police Paint Schemes, specify here:
Minim	um #
	•

2011 FORD EXPLORER XLT SSV, JEEP GRAND CHEROKEE, CHEVROLET TAHOE (FULL SIZE, FOUR DOOR, FOUR WHEEL DRIVE, UTILITY VEHICLE)

Vehicles bid in this classification shall be full-size, four door vehicles commonly referred to as sport utility vehicles. In addition to four passenger doors, they must also include a rear lift gate or cargo doors. Any vehicle bid must be able to withstand the rigors of police use and shall meet the following minimum specifications. In an effort to be more fuel efficient, EPA ratings may be a consideration in the purchase of a SUV vehicle. This range should be a minimum of 13 City and 20 highway.

The base price bid of the specified vehicle will include all items/features/equipment listed by the manufacturer as standard equipment, as well as any other "optional" features listed below. These features include, but are not limited to the following.

Mandatory Equipment Package:

Engine:

Minimum 4.0 L V6

Wheelbase:

Minimum 113"

Transmission:

Automatic, with Heavy Duty Oil Cooler, Maximum Available

Differential:

Limited Slip, Rear

Transfer Case:

4 wheel Drive

Suspension:

Heavy Duty with Front and Rear Stabilizer
Heavy Duty, Maximum Available for Vehicle

Engine Cooling:

Power Assisted

Steering: Brakes:

Power Assisted / 4 Wheel ABS

Radio:

AM/FM Stereo

Front Seats:

Cloth. Bucket Seats

Rear Seat:

Cloth Bench

Third Seat:

None

Windows:

Power Operated

Door Locks:

Power Operated with Rear Child Safety Feature

Floor Covering:

Fully Carpeted Passenger Compartment and Cargo Area with

Coordinating Carpeted Floor Mats (4) or Heavy Duty Vinyl Floor Covering (If Available with other Equipment

Specified)

Rear Window Defogger:

Installed

Air Conditioning:

Installed

Spare Tire:

Full Size

Skid Plates:

Transmission and Transfer Case

-- End of Base Equipment Listing B

IMPORTANT NOTE: Prospective Vendors <u>must</u> include all profit margins for the vehicle bid in the "Base Vehicle Cost" specified below. <u>Any and all</u> options must be made available at actual Dealer Cost (the below listing is not all-inclusive). Pricing for all options listed below <u>must</u> be provided with the bid package. Failure to provide option-pricing information (at dealer cost) shall be grounds for disqualification of the bid.

Model: 2011 FORD Expedition 4X4 Special Service PKG.

JIM RÓBINSON FORD 95 ROBINSON DRIVE TRIADELPHIA, WV 26059

2011 FORD EXPLORER XLT SSV, JEEP GRAND CHEROKEE, CHEVROLET TAHOE (FULL SIZE, FOUR DOOR, FOUR WHEEL DRIVE, UTILITY VEHICLE)

Base Vehicle Cost: \$ 27,647. ∞	
OPTION PRICING INFORMATION:	
Trailer Towing Package:	\$ 336.00 \$ ADVANCE TRAC- STD
Control Trac 4WD System	\$ ADVANCE TRAC- OTD
Rubber Floor Mats	\$ 64.00 \$ 30.00
√Engine Block Heater	
Skid Plates Package	\$ 85.00
Service Manuals (one set) (complete set of "dealer" shop manuals, Inclusive of any future updates)	\$ Contact Vendor
SPECIAL SERVICE PACKAGE OPTIONS	
Heavy Duty Battery	\$ Standard \$ N/A Option \$ N/A Option \$ Contact Vendor
Ground Straps	\$ N/A Option
Roof Wiring Prep Package	\$ N/A Option
Special Service/Fleet Manual	\$ Contact Vendor
OTHER:	
EPA RATING OF VEHICLE BID	
MPG HIGHWAY 17	MPG CITY 12
Miscellaneous: Inspection of Sample Vehicle(s): purchase order, the successful bidder shall make a State Police, 725 Jefferson Road, South Charlesto	arrangements to deliver to the West Virginia

purchase order, the successful bidder shall make arrangements to deliver to the West Virginia State Police, 725 Jefferson Road, South Charleston, West Virginia, a sample vehicle having the same general body, chassis, engine and transmission as the vehicle on which the bid was submitted. This vehicle is not a patrol vehide and may be a vehicle from the dealer's stock. It will be used as a prototype for determining the method of attaching various items of police equipment.

The standard factory warranty of the vehicle bid shall be clearly specified within the body of the Vendor's bid submission. In addition, any available extended factory warranties which are

2011 FORD EXPLORER XLT SSV, JEEP GRAND CHEROKEE, CHEVROLET TAHOE (FULL SIZE, FOUR DOOR, FOUR WHEEL DRIVE, UTILITY VEHICLE)

optional shall also be bid as separate items, listing all areas and items covered.

Note: Equipment installation to be at the factory and not "add on" dealer accessries. Any exception(s) will be clearly stated within the body of the respective Vendor's bid submission.

Inspection, Testing and Evaluation -- State Police Vehicle Only --

Pre-Delivery: Prior to delivery, each new vehicle must be completely serviced in accordance with standard new car dealer "make ready" preparation and in accordance with these specifications and the manufacturer's recommendations. Crankcase, differential, transmissions and fuel tank must be filled to capacity as recommended by the manufacturer. Each vehicle shall contain a pre-delivery check sheet showing what operations have been performed on the vehicle and signed by the mechanic(s) or individuals that worked on the same prior to the department inspection.

Delivery, Testing and Evaluation: Vehicles will be inspected, tested and evaluated to determine if they meet the requirements of this specification.

Vehicles will be delivered by the dealer. (Vehicles purchased by the West Virginia State Police will be delivered to 725 Jefferson Road, South Charleston, West Virginia.) Vehicles will not be accepted until inspected and approved by the Purchaser. All repairs and corrections will be the responsibility of the dealer. Dealer will provide dealer's license, insurance (as required for dealer license), and reasonable management assistance for pre-delivery acceptance inspections. If the successful bidder's car does not meet the requirements of this specification, it will be rejected.

Information/Option Certification

PC11

Vendor should comple		Robinson			
Dealer:			FOIL		
Vendor Contact:	BRIAN		LONG		
Address:	95 Robinson	DRIVE -	TRIADELPHIA	WV	2605
Telephone Number:	304	-233 -80	<u> 200 ' </u>		
Toll Free Number:					
Fax Number:	304	- 233 - 312	ンフ		
	ication is made that	options quo	ited on PC06 a	re quote	ed
at dealer cost.		options quo	oted on PC06 a	re quoto	∍d
	lone T	options quo	oted on PC06 a	re quoto	∍d
at dealer cost. BRIAN S. Print/Type Name	lone T	38 fon	oted on PC06 a	re quote	e d
Print/Type Name	on6 J	38 fon nature Fono	oted on PC06 a	re quot	e d

NOTE: No contracts shall be awarded unless this certification is signed and returned.

JIM ROBINSON FORD 95 ROBINSON DRIVE TRIADELPHIA, WV 26059

	PC-12
RFQ No.	1011

Purchasing Affidavit (Revised 12/15/09)

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA Purchasing Division

PURCHASING AFFIDAVIT

West Virginia Code §5A-3-10a states: No contract or renewal of any contract may be awarded by the state or any of its political subdivisions to any vendor or prospective vendor when the vendor or prospective vendor or a related party to the vendor or prospective vendor is a debtor and the debt owed is an amount greater than one thousand dollars in the aggregate.

DEFINITIONS:

WITNESS THE FOLLOWING SIGNATURE

NOTARY PUBLIC STATE OF VISST VIRGINIA BRIAN S. LONG

302-12th Street
Glon Date, Wort Virginia 26036
My Commission Expires Aug. 13, 2011

"Debt" means any assessment, premium, penalty, fine, tax or other amount of money owed to the state or any of its political subdivisions because of a judgment, fine, permit violation, license assessment, defaulted workers' compensation premium, penalty or other assessment presently delinquent or due and required to be paid to the state or any of its political subdivisions, including any interest or additional penalties accrued thereon.

"Debtor" means any individual, corporation, partnership, association, limited liability company or any other form or business association owing a debt to the state or any of its political subdivisions. "Political subdivision" means any county commission; municipality; county board of education; any instrumentality established by a county or municipality; any separate corporation or instrumentality established by one or more counties or municipalities, as permitted by law; or any public body charged by law with the performance of a government function or whose jurisdiction is coextensive with one or more counties or municipalities. "Related party" means a party, whether an individual, corporation, partnership, association, limited liability company or any other form or business association or other entity whatsoever, related to any vendor by blood, marriage, ownership or contract through which the party has a relationship of ownership or other interest with the vendor so that the party will actually or by effect receive or control a portion of the benefit, profit or other consideration from performance of a vendor contract with the party receiving an amount that meets or exceed five percent of the total contract amount.

EXCEPTION: The prohibition of this section does not apply where a vendor has contested any tax administered pursuant to chapter eleven of this code, workers' compensation premium, permit fee or environmental fee or assessment and the matter has not become final or where the vendor has entered into a payment plan or agreement and the vendor is not in default of any of the provisions of such plan or agreement.

Under penalty of law for false swearing (**West Virginia Code** §61-5-3), it is hereby certified that the vendor affirms and acknowledges the information in this affidavit and is in compliance with the requirements as stated.

WITHESS THE POLLOWING SIGNATURE	
Vendor's Name: Tim Nobinson	Forg
Authorized Signature:	Date: 10/07/2010
State of West VIRGNIA	
County of Marshall, to-wit:	9.
Taken, subscribed, and sworn to before me this 7th	lay of <u>October</u> , 20 <u>10.</u>
My Commission expires 8-18	, 20 //.
AFFIX SEAL HERE	NOTARY PUBLIC 58 LONG
moraawanaaawaaaaaaaaaaaaaaaaaaaaaaaaaaaaa	

State of West Virginia

VENDOR PREFERENCE CERTIFICATE

Certification and application* is hereby made for Preference in accordance with **West Virginia Code**, §5A-3-37. (Does not apply to construction contracts). **West Virginia Code**, §5A-3-37, provides an opportunity for qualifying vendors to request (at the time of bid) preference for their residency status. Such preference is an evaluation method only and will be applied only to the cost bid in accordance with the **West Virginia Code**. This certificate for application is to be used to request such preference. The Purchasing

Division will make the determination of the Resident Vendor Preference, if applicable.

*Check any combination of preference consideration(s) indicated above, which you are entitled to receive.

1.	Application is made for 2.5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked: Bidder is an individual resident vendor and has resided continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or,
<u>*</u>	Bidder is a partnership, association or corporation resident vendor and has maintained its headquarters or principal place of business continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or 80% of the ownership interest of Bidder is held by another individual, partnership, association or corporation resident vendor who has maintained its headquarters or principal place of business continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or, Bidder is a nonresident vendor which has an affiliate or subsidiary which employs a minimum of one hundred state residents and which has maintained its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia continuously for the four (4) years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or,
<u>2. X</u>	Application is made for 2.5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked: Bidder is a resident vendor who certifies that, during the life of the contract, on average at least 75% of the employees working on the project being bid are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two years immediately preceding submission of this bid; or,
3.	Application is made for 2.5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked: Bidder is a nonresident vendor employing a minimum of one hundred state residents or is a nonresident vendor with an affiliate or subsidiary which maintains its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia employing a minimum of one hundred state residents who certifies that, during the life of the contract, on average at least 75% of the employees or Bidder's affiliate's or subsidiary's employees are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two years immediately preceding submission of this bid; or,
4. 	Application is made for 5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked: Bidder meets either the requirement of both subdivisions (1) and (2) or subdivision (1) and (3) as stated above; or,
5.	Application is made for 3.5% resident vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked: Bidder is an individual resident vendor who is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard and has resided in West Virginia continuously for the four years immediately preceding the date on which the bid is submitted; or,
6.	Application is made for 3.5% resident vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked: Bidder is a resident vendor who is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard, if, for purposes of producing or distributing the commodities or completing the project which is the subject of the vendor's bid and continuously over the entire term of the project, on average at least seventy-five percent of the vendor's employees are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two immediately preceding years.
requiren against	understands if the Secretary of Revenue determines that a Bidder receiving preference has failed to continue to meet the ments for such preference, the Secretary may order the Director of Purchasing to: (a) reject the bid; or (b) assess a penalty such Bidder in an amount not to exceed 5% of the bid amount and that such penalty will be paid to the contracting agency cted from any unpaid balance on the contract or purchase order.
authorize the requ	hission of this certificate, Bidder agrees to disclose any reasonably requested information to the Purchasing Division and es the Department of Revenue to disclose to the Director of Purchasing appropriate information verifying that Bidder has paid lired business taxes, provided that such information does not contain the amounts of taxes paid nor any other information I by the Tax Commissioner to be confidential.
and acc	penalty of law for false swearing (West Virginia Code, §61-5-3), Bidder hereby certifies that this certificate is true curate in all respects; and that if a contract is issued to Bidder and if anything contained within this certificate is during the term of the contract, Bidder will notify the Purchasing Division in writing immediately.
Bidder:	Jim Kohinson Ford Signed:
Date:	10/07/2010 Title: // resident