

State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

Request for
Quotation

LGLOVES10

LGLOVES10

JO ANN ADKINS

304-558-8802

RFQ COPY TYPE NAME/ADDRESS HERE Bound Tree Medical LLC 5000 Tuttle Crossing Dublin OH 43016

ALL STATE AGENCIES AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED BY ORDER

DATEPRINI	*******************************		MS OF SAL	9.00000			Destinatio	n	Best Wa	V .
06/14/2 BID OPENING DATE:		Net 30			UPS, Federal Express		PENTING TIME		30PM	<u> </u>
P. C.	STANDARD COLOR	7/08/2	0.0000000000000000000000000000000000000	- A			100000000000000000000000000000000000000			
UNE	QUAN	VTITY.	UOP	No	ITEM NUM	BEH .	UNITPAIG		A	AOUNT
						,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,				
			-	OTTE CH	FOR QUOT	ለ ጥ ቸ/ጋእ፣	ļ			
			K.F	COED	FOR QUOL	WITON]			i
	Y.Y.T.	CITY CITY	(C T) TT	TOTAL	י דפ פחז.זמ	ተጥተክር\$ F	IDS FOR A		•	
, ,	ME PUR	CHASTI	מיים איכונים	TOTO	EXAM GLOV	ES FOR	ALL WEST		ļ	
1, 3	TATEMT	מאייים אי	INACI	NCTES	AND POLT	TTCAL S	UBDIVISIONS	3.	1	
Y	TKGTMT	A SIAI	E AGE	174 (-7.17)	1412 1022		1	- ,		
	****	*****	***							
	NOUIRI									
-	MOOTES	.60]			
r.	ያ ያ	OUEST	RIONE	SHALI	BE ACCEP	TED THE	OUGH CLOSE	OF		ļ
7	TIGENTES	ed on M	ONDAY	'. JUN	TE 28. 201	O. QUE	ISTIONS MAY	BE		
ا ا	TV TVA	A USPS	. FAX	cot	RIER OR E	MAIL.	IN ORDER TO)	1	
1 7	CCTIDE	NO VEN	א אטעו	ECETU	res an unf	AIR ADV	ANTAGE,	•		
l N	O SUBS	TTVANTI	E OUE	STION	IS WILL BE	ANSWEI	ED ORALLY.		}	
1	F POSS	TRLE.	E-MAI	L OUE	STIONS AR	E PREFI	RRED.			
7	DDRESS	INQUI	RIES	TO:			1			
•		, mr.1864-								
	O ANN	ADKINS			:			•]	
]	EPARTM	ient of	LMCA	NISTE	ATION		ļ			
]	URCHAS	ING DI	visid	N					CEN	/En
3	019 WA	SHING	ra no:	REET	east		ļ	- W 240	* on 6770 1 B	LU
		TON,					Į			
į į	AX:	304	558.4	115				20i0 II	II _7 /	\ ቁ կ ያ
1	-MIAL	JO.2	ADK	W®SN.	GOV,			Main C.F.	/L /	4 4 43
										î
			. 1						ASINO O	IVISION
			1		•			· 51,	ATE OF	HVISION.
	TTACH	MENTS:	•						1	1 1
			}							:
1	GLOVES	310 SPI	CIFIC	ATION	រន				1	
1	GLOVES	10 PR	CING	PAGE						
4	GLOVES	310 BII	SCHI	DULE	127.01		}	• •		
į į	RESIDEN	T VENI	OR PI	EFERI	ENCE					
1	PURCHAS	ING A	FIDAY	T.T.			1			•
	***************************************		200000000000000000000000000000000000000	**************************************	VERSE SIDE PORTE	ems and eo	I NOTIONS		1	
SIGNATURE /				20.00 B. 16.00		TELEPHONE (800) 53	0.0500	DATE		40
1 / March 1	WAIN	MC.				(800) 53			uly 6, 20	
NICE Preside	nt Mark	retina 📑	31	-1739	487				TO BE NOT	
WHI	EN RESP	ONDING	TO RFQ	INSER	T NAME AND A	DDRESS	IN SPACE ABOV	E LABELE	D 'VENDO	R'

GENERAL TERMS & CONDITIONS REQUEST FOR QUOTATION (RFQ) AND REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL (RFP)

1. Awards will be made in the best interest of the State of West Virginia.

2. The State may accept or reject in part, or in whole, any bid.

3. Prior to any award, the apparent successful vendor must be properly registered with the Purchasing Division and have paid the required \$125 fee.

- 4. All services performed or goods delivered under State Purchase Order/Contracts are to be continued for the term of the Purchase Order/Contracts, contingent upon funds being appropriated by the Legislature or otherwise being made available. In the event funds are not appropriated or otherwise available for these services or goods this Purchase Order/Contract becomes void and of no effect after June 30.
- 5. Payment may only be made after the delivery and acceptance of goods or services.
- 6. Interest may be paid for late payment in accordance with the West Virginia Code.
- 7. Vendor preference will be granted upon written request in accordance with the West Virginia Code.
- 8. The State of West Virginia is exempt from federal and state taxes and will not pay or relimburse such taxes.
- 9. The Director of Purchasing may cancel any Purchase Order/Contract upon 30 days written notice to the seller.
- 10. The laws of the State of West Virginia and the Legislative Rules of the Purchasing Division shall govern the purchasing process.
- 11. Any reference to automatic renewal is hereby deleted. The Contract may be renewed only upon mutual written agreement of the parties.
- 12. BANKRUPTCY: In the event the vendor/contractor files for bankruptcy protection, the State may deem this contract null and void, and terminate such contract without further order.
- 13. HIPAA BUSINESS ASSOCIATE ADDENDUM: The West Virginia State Government HIPAA Business Associate Addendum (BAA), approved by the Attorney General, is available online at www.state.wv.us/admin/purchase/vrc/hipaa.htm and is hereby made part of the agreement. Provided that the Agency meets the definition of a Cover Entity (45 CFR §160.103) and will be disclosing Protected Health Information (45 CFR §160.103) to the vendor.
- 14. CONFIDENTIALITY: The vendor agrees that he or she will not disclose to anyone, directly or indirectly, any such personally identifiable information or other confidential information gained from the agency, unless the individual who is the subject of the information consents to the disclosure in writing or the disclosure is made pursuant to the agency's policies, procedures, and rules. Vendor further agrees to comply with the Confidentiality Policies and information Security Accountability Requirements, set forth in http://www.state.wv.us/admin/purchase/privacy/noticeConfidentiality.pdf.
- 15. LICENSING: Vendors must be licensed and in good standing in accordance with any and all state and local laws and requirements by any state or local agency of West Virginia, including, but not limited to, the West Virginia Secretary of State's Office, the West Virginia Tax Department, and the West Virginia insurance Commission. The vendor must provide all necessary releases to obtain information to enable the director or spending unit to verify that the vendor is licensed and in good standing with the above entities.
- 16. ANTITRUST: In submitting a bid to any agency for the State of West Virginia, the bidder offers and agrees that if the bid is accepted the bidder will convey, sell, assign or transfer to the State of West Virginia all rights, title and interest in and to all causes of action it may now or hereafter acquire under the antitrust laws of the United States and the State of West Virginia for price fixing and/or unreasonable restraints of trade relating to the particular commodities or services purchased or acquired by the State of West Virginia. Such assignment shall be made and become effective at the time the purchasing agency tenders the initial payment to the bidder.

I certify that this bid is made without prior understanding, agreement, or connection with any corporation, firm, limited liability company, partnership, or person or entity submitting a bid for the same material, supplies, equipment or services and is in all respects fair and without collusion or Fraud. I further certify that I am authorized to sign the certification on behalf of the bidder or this bid.

INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS

- 1. Use the quotation forms provided by the Purchasing Division. Complete all sections of the quotation form.
- 2. Items offered must be in compliance with the specifications. Any deviation from the specifications must be clearly indicated by the bidder. Alternates offered by the bidder as EQUAL to the specifications must be clearly defined. A bidder offering an alternate should attach complete specifications and literature to the bid. The Purchasing Division may waive minor deviations to specifications.

3. Unit prices shall prevail in case of discrepancy. All quotations are considered F.O.B. destination unless alternate shipping terms are clearly identified in the quotation.

4. All quotations must be delivered by the bidder to the office listed below prior to the date and time of the bid opening. Fallure of the bidder to deliver the quotations on time will result in bid disqualifications: Department of Administration, Purchasing Division, 2019 Washington Street East, P.O. Box 50130, Charleston, WV 25305-0130 5. Communication during the solicitation, bid, evaluation or award periods, except through the Purchasing Division, is strictly prohibited (W.Va. C.S.R. §148-1-6.6).



Request for RECINIMBER

LGLOVES10

PAGE 2

ADDRESS CORRESPONDENCES TO A BEEN HONOR do ann adkins 304-558-8802

ALL STATE AGENCIES AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED BY ORDER

RFQ COPY	
TYPE NAME/ADDRESS	HERE
RFQ COPY TYPE NAME/ADDRESS Bound Tree Medical I	LLC
5000 Tuttle Crossing	
Dublin OH 43016	

DATEPRI	ITEO TER	MS OF SAUE	SHIP-V/A		FREIGHT TERMS
06/14/	2010 Net 30		UPS, Federal Express, Freight Camier RTD O	Destination PENTING TIME 01	:30PM
LINE	07/08/2 QUANTITY		пем нимее	UNITPRIGE	AMOUNT
		, ,			
1		K 9	98-67-01-021		
0001	1				\$51,713.13
	GLOVES, EXAM,	DISP. LAT	EX, NON-STERILE		•
	· .			,	
	EXHIBIT 3				
	1				
	LIFE OF CONT	ACT: TH	S CONTRACT BECOM	ES EFFECTIVE ON ERIOD OF ONE (1)	
۴	ודיוויותון כור כורכדער	a. Quitible "PREA	ASCRIADIR LINE IL	Intervant to to	
	AMARICANDS TO	ו ב וודגיים	TEW CONTRACT OR E	(ENEW THE	
1	あってつているで、ごつい で	የመልሮጥ ነው ነው	I TARASONABLE TIN	(E. BEKTON BUNDE	
	**************************************	ו כי דין וימוד דימוני	MONTHS. DURING RMINATE THIS CON	THIS KENDONADIE	
	TIME THE VE	NDOR MAY THE	DIRECTOR OF PURC	HASING 30 DAYS	
	WRITTEN NOTIO	te.			·
] 1	ONG AND GOTDIII A	PED DIGEMBER	
	UNLESS SPECIA	FIC PROVIS	ONS ARE STIPULATED THE TERMS, C	CONDITIONS AND	
	PRICING SET	EREIN ARE	FIRM FOR THE LI	E OF THE	
	CONTRACT.			5 	
1		CONTED A CIT	MAY BE RENEWED (PON THE MUTUAL	
	THE TREET CONC.	אורי אט יינאים	ISPENDING UNIT AT	AD. AEMDOK'	
1	Actor and a second seco	Indo MTPRC	TOR OF PURCHASING	3 THIRTI (30)	
	לדי מתדממ מצאלה	A THRIBXPT	PATTON DATE. SU	TH KENEMAP SHAPP	
}	BE IN ACCORD	ANCE WITH	THE TERMS AND COI SHALL BE LIMITED	TO TWO (2) ONE	'
	(1) YEAR PER	TODS.	BIIADD DD MIRE	, , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , ,	
1	[·	4 · 1		ha nyampina min	
	CANCELLATION	THE DIRE	CTOR OF PURCHASI	NG RESERVES THE LY UPON WRITTEN	
	사스까도스로 빠스 까다	A COMMENT A	M THE COMMODITIES	2 WATLANCE DEVATORS	3
	ACCOUNT TOO A DE	IOR ME TOR	ERTOR OHALLTY OR	IDO MOT COMPONG	,
	TO THE SPECI	ficattons	OF THE BID AND CO	ONTRACT HEREIN.	
***************************************		l eep of	Verse side for terms and co	NOTIONS .	
SIGNATURE	1. 17.		IYELEDIANE	IUA II	July 6, 2010
pu	draw Ton	EIN	(800) 53	ADDRESS CHANGE	S TO BE NOTED ABOVE
1	lent Marketing [31-173948 TO RFQ, INSER	7 RT NAME AND ADDRESS	IN SPACE ABOVE LABEL	



Request for MEGANUMBER Quotation

JO ANN ADKINS 304-558-8802

ALL STATE AGENCIES AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED BY ORDER

ADDRESS CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTENTION OF

RFQ COPY TYPE NAME/ADDRESS HERE Bound Tree Medical LLC 5000 Tuttle Crossing Dublin OH·43016

DATERRINTED	TERMS OF BALE	SHIPVIA	FOB,	FHEIGHTHEHMS
06/14/2010 Net 3	30	UPS, Federal Express, Freight Carrier		Best Way
BID OPENING DATE: 07/08		575 A	PENING TIME 01	:30PM
LINE QUANTITY	UOP CAT	TEMNUMBER	UNITPRICE	AMOUNT
				1
	1			
OPEN MARKET	dlause: Thi	DIRECTOR OF PUR	CHASING MAY	
AUTHORIZE A	SPENDING UI	IT TO PURCHASE C	N THE OPEN	
MARKET, WIT	HOUT THE FI	ING OF A REQUISI	TION OR COST	
estimate, i	TEMS SPECIF:	ED ON THIS CONTR	ACT FOR	
jmmediate d	eutvery in i	MERGENCIES DUE T	O UNFORESEEN	
dauses (inc	LUDING BUT 1	OT LIMITED TO DE	LAYS IN TRANS-	ļ
Hortation o	r an umantic	IPATED INCREASE	IN THE VOLUME	
df work.)				
quantities:	QUANTITIES	LISTED IN THE RE	QUISITION ARE	·
APPROXIMATI	ons only, b	SED ON ESTIMATES	SOPPLIED BY	
. The State S	BENDING ONI.	. IT IS UNDERST	OOD AND AGREED	
THAT THE CO	NTRACT SHALL	COVER THE QUANT	TITLES ACTUALLY	·
ORDERED FOR	DELIVERY D	RING THE TERM OF	THE CONTRACT,	
WHETHER MOR	E OR LESS T	AN THE QUANTITIE	S SHOWN.	
	odrevina an	NDING UNIT(S) SH	ATT. TOOTIE A	
ORDERING PR	OCEDUKE: SPI	ORDER (FORM NUME	ADD TOGOD W	
WRITTEN STA	TH CONTRACT	TIES COVERED BY T	UTC COMPDACT	
THE VENDOR	FOR COMMONT	HE WV-39 SHALL BE	MATIED TO THE	
THE ORIGINA	THUTOPINATION	FOR SHIPMENT, A	SECOND COPY	
VENDOR AS A	UIHOKIAMIIO	G DIVISION, AND	A THIRD COPY	i
MATTER TO I	THE SEENDI	NG IINTT		
RETAINED BI				
יייטין פאאפווסייטיי.	TN THE EV	INT THE VENDOR/CO	NTRACTOR FILES	
BOB BANKBIID	TOY PROTECT	ON, THE STATE MA	Y DEEM THE	
CONTRACT NU	LI AND VOID	, AND TERMINATE S	UCH CONTRACT	
WITHOUT FUR	THER ORDER.	·		
		!		
THE TERMS A	ND CONDITION	s contained in t	HIS CONTRACT	
SHALL SUPER	SEDE ANY ANI	ALL SUBSEQUENT	TERMS AND	· .
dONDTTIONS	WHICH MAY A	PPEAR ON ANY ATTA	CHED PRINTED	
HOCHMENTS S	udh as IPRICI	B LISTS, ORDER FO	RMS, SALES	·
AGREEMENTS	or maintenai	CE AGREEMENTS, I	NCLUDING ANY	
BLECTRONIC	MEDIUM SUCH	AS CD-ROM.	14.14.14.14.14.14.14.14.14.14.14.14.14.1	
	SEERE	VERSE SIDE FOR TERMS AND CON TELEPHONE	DATE	
SIGNATURE MICHAEL JON	Y	(800) 53		uly 6, 2010
Vice President Marketing	71 1730/8	7	ADDRESS CHANGE	S TO BE NOTED ABOVE
vice President Markeulio	1 3 <u>1-17 3340</u> 1	<u> </u>		

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'



BAYE SENTED: TERMS OF SAFE SHEWA FOR FOR FREIGHT TERMS

LGLOVES10

do ann adkins 304-558-8802

RFQ COPY TYPE NAME/ADDRESS HERE Bound Tree Medical LLC 5000 Tuttle Crossing Dublin OH 43016

ALL STATE AGENCIES AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED BY ORDER

COMMON ADDALESSECOLUSESSECONDENCESSECON BLEINHON LOS

06/14/2010	Net 30		ss, Freight Carrier De	
06/14/2010 BID OPENING DATE:	07/08/2010			30PM
UNE QU	ANTITY UOP NO	TEM NUMBER	UNITPACE	AMOUNT
		·		
· REV, 0	5/26/2009	·		
'				
EXHIBI	77 10			
hwiitp:	.1 10		LGLOVES10	
		REQUISITION N	o.:LGLOVES10	
	THE ACCIONITED COME			
ADDRND	OUM ACKNOWLEDGEME	1		
† HERE	BY ACKNOWLEDGE R	ECEIPT OF THE FOI	LOWING CHECKED	
ADDEND	UM(S) AND HAVE M	ADE THE NECESSARY	REVISIONS TO M	
PROPOS	AL, PLANS AND/OR	SPECIFICATION, F	src.	
ADDEND	E ON MU			
⅓ 0.1		,		
NO. 2				
10, 2				
10.3				
100 4				
NO. 4				-
ио. 5				
	TO GOT AND OWNER OF THE	TIDE TO CONFIDM TH	E RECEIPT OF THE	
T ONDE	OUM(S) MAY BE CAU	SE FOR REJECTION	OF BIDS.	
		1		
VENDOR	MUST CLEARLY UN	DERSTAND THAT AND	VERBAL	•
REPRES	ENTATION MADE OR DISCUSSION HELD B	ASSUMED TO BE MA	EDDEGENTATIVES	
ORAL D	IX STATE PERSONNE	TS NOT BINDING.	ONLY THE	
t treorm	NI DEUEN TARTON ISSUED IN	WRITING AND ADDEL) TO THE	
\$PECIF	CATIONS BY AN O	FICIAL ADDENDUM	IS BINDING.	
<u> </u>	1500	 EVERSE SIDE RONTERMS AND CO	 Nortions	1
SIGNATURE /	Tane	TELEPHONE	DATE	ulv 6, 2010
TITLE MANUELY	FEIN	(800) 53	ADDRESS CHANGES	uly 6, 2010 To be noted above
Vice President	31-173948	T MANGE AND ADDRESS	IN SPACE ABOVE LABELE	D 'VENDOR'



Request for Quotation LGLOVES10

*****PAGE

WADDRESS CORRESPONDENCE TO A TENT ON THE TENT OF THE T

JO ANN ADKINS 304-558-8802

RFQ COPY TYPE NAME/ADDRESS HERE **Bound Tree Medical LLC** 5000 Tuttle Crossing Dublin OH 43016

ALL STATE AGENCIES AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED BY ORDER

DATE PRIN	111.4.00	MS OF EALE	SHIP VIA UPS, Federal Express, Freight Carrier	Destination	Best Way
06/14/9 BID OPENING DATE	07/08/2	010		PENING TIME 01	:30PM
tine	QUANTITY	UGP AG	ITEM NUMBER	UNITABLOE	AMOUNT
		,			
	1		Cont	S.R'LLC	1
		.	STO	NATURE	wast rep.
•				Medical LLC	
			. ,,,,,,,,,,	PANY	•
			July 6,		
	•		DAT	• • • <i>• • • • • • • • • • • • • • • •</i>	
	NOTE: THIS AL	DENDUM ACI	INOWLEDGEMENT SHO	ULD BE SUBMITTED	
	·,			•	
'	EV. 09/21/20	09			,
					:
	PURCHASING C	RD ACCEPTA	NCE: THE STATE	OF WEST VIRGINIA	
(CURRENTLY UTI	LIZES A VI	SA PURCHASING CA	RD PROGRAM WHICH	
i	MUST ACCEPT T	HE STATE O	F WEST VIRGINIA	VISA PURCHASING	
	CARD FOR PAYN AGENCY AS A	ENT OF ALI	ORDERS PLACED F	Y ANY STATE	
,	AGENCY AS A	CNDITION	F ANARD.		
					· ·
-					
		пот	tce t		•
	A SIGNED BID	MUST BE ST	DBMITTED TO:		
	DEPARTMI	ent Of ADM.	NISTRATION VERSESIDE FORTEAMS AND CO		
SIGNATURE	w/ Las		тецерноле (800) 53	3-0523	July 6, 2010
Vice Preside	ont Marketing	31-1739487	7	ADDRESS CHANGES	S TO BE NOTED ABOVE
WH	EN RESPONDING	TO RFQ, INSER	T NAME AND ADDRESS	IN SPACE ABOVE LABELI	ED 'VENDOR'



Request for Quotation LGLOVES10

LGLOVES10

PAGE

ADDRÉSS CORRESPONDENCE TO A TIENTION OF JO ANN ADKINS

304-558-8802

RFQ COPY TYPE NAME/ADDRESS HERE Bound Tree Medical LLC 5000 Tuttle Crossing Dublin OH 43016

ALL STATE AGENCIES AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED BY ORDER

11.100	OF-SALC	UPS, Federal Express, Freight Carrier		Best Way
06/14/2010 INET 3U BID OPENING DATE: 07/08/20:	10			:30PM
	UOP CAT	ITEM NUMBER	UNIT.PHICE	AMOUNE
PURCHASING	a DIVISTO	N		
BUILDING		24		
2019 WASHI	ington st	REET, EAST		
CHARLESTO	N, WV 25	305-0130	•	
		MITTO TATEODAKA (STA)	ON MAN BACK OF	ľ
THE BID SHOOTD	CONTAIN THE BIO	THIS INFORMATION MAY NOT BE CONS	IDERED:	
		12.2 1,01 22 301		
SEALED BID				
BUYER:			FILE 42	
			T CT OTIBOT O	
RFQ. NO.:			LGLOVES10	
BID OPENING DAT	TE:		07/08/2010	
BID OPENING TIM	ME:		1:30 PM	
		,		
		mber in case it	IS NECESSARY .	
to contact you				
		(800) 25-5713 fax		
			<i>,</i>	
CONTACT PERSON	1 1	PRINT CLEARLY):	•	
		Cathy Taynor		
			•	
		·		
		<u> </u>		
SIGNATURE/	SEEREV	Ersesioe for terms and con Itelephone	OITIONS DATE	
TOTAL MANUAL MANUAL MEDIN		(800) 53	33-0523	July 6, 2010
Vice President Marketing 🖼 🖰 🤄	1-1739487		ADDRESS CHANGE	S TO BE NOTED ABOVE



RFQ COPY

TYPE NAME/ADDRESS HERE Bound Tree Medical LLC

5000 Tuttle Crossing

Dublin OH 43016

State of West Virginia Department of Administration Purchasing Division 2019 Washington Street East Post Office Box 50130 Charleston, WV 25305-0130

Request for Quotation

LGLOVES10

7

JO ANN ADKINS 304-558-8802

ALL STATE AGENCIES AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED BY ORDER

FREIGHTTERMS Freight Carrier | Destination Net 30 Net 30 01:30PM 07/08/2010 AMOUNE TEMNUMBER UNITARICE QUANTITY HNE. \$51,713.13 LGLOVES10 ***** TOTAL: THIS IS THE END OF REQ July 6, <u>2010</u> ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

Vice President Marketing 31-1739487 ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'

LGLOVES10 SPECIFICATIONS

STANDARDS

Gloves shipped under this contract (other than polyethylene gloves) must conform to the following:

- Most recent ASTM D3577 and D3578 standards.
- Most recent ASTM F1671 (test requirements for viral resistance) standard.
- BS EN 455-2000 (Parts 1 and 2 and clause 4.5 of Part 3).
- Polyethylene gloves shall be in conformance with FDA Rule 177.1520 for food contact.

No products covered by this specification shall be shipped to the user more than twelve (12) months from the date of manufacture.

MATERIALS:

LATEX gloves shall be compounded from virgin natural latex or any polymer compound that permits the glove to meet the specifications and is approved by the Food and Drug Administration.

VINYL gloves shall be compounded primarily from polyvinylchloride (PVC) paste.

NITRILE gloves shall be compounded primarily from a rubber cement or a synthetic polymer (e.g. "Nitrile").

POLYETHYLENE gloves shall be compounded from virgin polyethylene.

DESIGN:

Gloves (other than polyethylene gloves) shall be thin, soft, flexible, non-toxic; moisture resistant, and shall be of seamless construction and designed as ambidextrous.

The cuff shall be beaded, where indicated.

GENERAL INFORMATION:

All quantities are approximations only.

The award of this purchase order will be made to one bidder based on the low cost and best interest of the state. The award will not be split by item.

Gloves must be equal to the minimum specifications or better.

LGLOVES10 SPECIFICATIONS

SPECIAL CONDITIONS:

<u>Samples</u>: Samples of items bid shall be received in individually marked packages along with bid for examination and testing. The State of West Virginia reserves the right to perform inspections and test that are deemed necessary to assure that commodities conform to the prescribed requirements. Random samples may be selected from delivered commodities in order to assure compliance with these specifications. Failure to supply samples can result in bid disqualification.

Orders shall be delivered within ten (10) working days after orders are placed. Emergency orders shall be delivered within five (5) working days after orders are placed. Spending units must be advised in writing if orders will be delayed for any reason. Contractor shall carry an adequate stock to insure such delivery service for the duration of the contract.

All orders from this contract totaling \$100.00 or more shall be delivered FOB: Destination (vendor shall pay all shipping charges). This contract is mandatory for all orders of these products in excess of \$100.00. For all orders less than \$100.00 may be purchased through this contract (and agency paying shipping charges), or may be purchased from local source to save the shipping charges. All shipping cost will be invoiced as a separate charge with the original freight bill attached to the invoice.

NOTE: Stringing (issuing a series of requisitions to circumvent this limit) is a violation of Purchasing Policy.

The vendor shall not substitute any other brand of exam gloves from those awarded, nor sell any additional items under this contract not specifically covered herein, without prior written permission of the purchasing division.

Vendors must be manufacturers or regular, stocking dealers for the products they propose to offer and must carry a reasonable inventory of these products to meet the needs of state agencies. Vendors must agree to allow their stockrooms and warehousing facilities to be inspected by state purchasing at any time during the contract period.

Vendor is to provide a nine (9) month summary report of procurement volumes by item number and dollar amounts. This is a single report which is to be furnished at the beginning of the tenth month of the contract.

LGLOVES10 PRICING PAGE

I. VINYL EXAMINATION GLOVES (POWDERED): Medical Grade, non-sterile, .08 mm minimum thickness, seamless, beaded cuff, ambidextrous, 100/box.

BRAND: Digit	care Dermalux		
	ITEM NO. & SIZE	CATALOG NO.	PRICING / 100
Smail			\$No Bid
Mədium		265-DLX-2BX	\$3.88 box
Large		265-DLX-3BX	\$ 3.88 box
Xiarge		265-DLX-4BX	\$3.88 box

II. VINYL EXAMINATION GLOVES (POWDER FREE): Medical Grade, non-sterile, .08 mm minimum thickness, seamless, beaded cuff, ambidextrous. 100/box.

BRAND:	Digitcare Dermalux		•
	ITEM NO. & SIZE	CATALOG NO.	PRICING / 100
Small	•	265-DFLX-1BX	\$3.75 box
Medlum		265-DFLX-2BX	\$3.75 box
Large		265-DFLX-3BX	\$3.75 box
Xiarge		265-DFLX-4BX	\$3.75 box

III. LATEX EXAMINATION GLOVES (POWDER FREE, SMOOTH FINISH): Medical Grade, non-sterile, .15 mm minimum thickness, seamless, beaded cuff, ambidextrous, 100/box.

BRAND:	Digitcare DigitFree		·
	ITEM NO. & SIZE	CATALOG NO.	PRICING / 100
Small		265-DF-1BX	\$5.06 box
Medium		` 265-DF-2BX	\$5.06 box
Large		265-DF-3BX	\$5.06 box
Xlarge		265-DF-4BX	\$5.06 box

IV. LATEX EXAMINATION GLOVES (POWDER FREE, TEXTURE GRIP): Medical Grade, non-sterile, .15mm minimum thichness, seamless, beaded cuff, ambidextrous, 100/box.

BRAND: Digitcare OptiGrip		
ITEM NO. & SIZE	CATALOG NO.	PRICING / 100
Small	265-DFO-2XBX	\$5.13 box
Medium	265-DFO-3XBX	\$5.13 box
Large	265-DFO-4XBX	\$5.13 box
Xlarge	265-DFO-5XBX	\$5.13 box

LGLOVES10 PRICING PAGE

V. NITRILE EXAMINATION GLOVES (POWDER FREE): Non-sterile, .13 mm minimum thickness, seamless, beaded cuff, ambidextrous. 100/box.

BRAND: Digito	are Frontline		
	ITEM NO. & SIZE	CATALOG NO.	PRICING / 100
Small		29L91	\$6.25 box
Medium		29L92	\$6.25 box
Large		29L93	\$6.25 box
Xlarge		29L94	\$6.25 box

VI. NITRILE 12" EXAMINATION GLOVE (POWDER FREE): Non-sterile, .13mm minimum thickness, seamless, beaded cuff, ambidextrous. 100/box.

İ	ITEM NO. & SIZE	CATALOG NO.	PRICING / 100
Small		29L121	\$9.00 box
Medium		29L122	\$9.00 box
Large	• .	29L123	\$9.00 box
Xlarge ·		29L124	\$9.00 box

VII. POLYETHULENE DISPOSABLE GLOVES: 1.25 mils minimum, powderless/sulpher free, ambidextrous, for food service and precision parts handling. 100/box

BRAND:				
	ITEM NO. & SIZE	CATALOG NO.	PRICING / 100	
Medium			\$ No Bid	
Large			\$No Bid	

*** Note:

Samples shipped to address on bid directly from our Warehouse Which is at a different location in another State.

LGLOVES10 BID SCHEDULE

BID SCHEDULE	EDULE .	SIZE	EST. QUANTITY PER BOXES/100	UNIT	EXTENDED PRICE
	Vinyl Examination Gloves (Powdered)	MEDIUM	397	33.88 box \$1.540.36	\$1 540 36
≓	Vinyl Examination Gloves (Powder Free)	MEDIUM	4514	4514 \$3.75 box	\$16,927.50
Ë	Latex Examination Gloves (Powder Free, Smooth Finish)	MEDIUM	4055	4055 \$5.06 box	\$20.518.30
≥.	Latex Examination Gloves (Powder Free, Texture Grip	MEDIUM	69	69 \$5 13 box	\$353.97
٧.	Nitrile Examination Gloves (Powder Free)	MEDIUM	1948	1948 \$6 25 box	\$12 175 00
ΛΙ.	Nitrile 12" Examination Gloves (Powder Free)	MEDIUM	22	22 \$9.00 box	\$198.00
ΙΙΛ	Polyethylene Disposable Gloves	MEDIUM	200	200 No Bid	

All usages are approximate, for evaluation purposes only and have been anualized.

\$51,713.13

GRAND TOTAL

State of West Virginia

VENDOR PREFERENCE CERTIFICATE

Certification and application* is hereby made for Preference in accordance with West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37. (Does not apply to construction contracts). West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37, provides an opportunity for qualifying vendors to request (at the time of bid) preference for their residency status. Such preference is an evaluation method only and will be applied only to the cost bid in accordance with the West Virginia Code. This certificate for application is to be used to request such preference. The Purchasing Division will make the determination of the Resident Vendor Preference, if applicable.

Bidder is an inc ing the date of Bidder is a part business conti ownership inte maintained its preceding the Bidder is a non and which has years immedia	Ilvidual resident vendor and has resi this certification; or, nership, association or corporation in nuously in West Virginia for four (4) rest of Bidder is held by another indi headquarters or principal place of date of this certification; or, resident vendor which has an affiliate maintained its headquarters or print tely preceding the date of this certifi	
Bidder is a res working on the immediately pr	ldent vendor who certifies that, dur project being bid are residents of W eceding submission of this bid; or,	preference for the reason checked: ing the life of the contract, on average at least 75% of the employees est Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two years
Bidder is a nor affiliate or subs minimum of on employees or	resident vendor employing a minim sidiary which maintains its headqua a hundred state residents who cert	preference for the reason checked: num of one hundred state residents or is a nonresident vendor with an arters or principal place of business within West Virginia employing a ifies that, during the life of the contract, on average at least 75% of the nployees are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state ting submission of this bid; or,
4. Application is Bidder meets e	made for 5% resident vendor pr liher the requirement of both subdiv	eference for the reason checked: rislons (1) and (2) or subdivision (1) and (3) as stated above; or,
Bidder is an ind and has reside submitted; or,	viduai resident vendor who is a veter ad In West Virginia continuously fo	preference who is a veteran for the reason checked; ran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard or the four years immediately preceding the date on which the bid is
Bidder is a resi purposes of pro	dent vendor who is a veteran of the ducing or distributing the commoditi ver the entire term of the project, or	preference who is a veteran for the reason checked: United States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard, if, for les or completing the project which is the subject of the vendor's bid and a everage at least seventy-five percent of the vendor's employees are state continuously for the two immediately preceding years.
requirements for such p against such Bidder in a or deducted from any ur	reference, the Secretary may order n amount not to exceed 5% of the b paid balance on the contract or pun	
authorizes the Departme the required business to deemed by the Tax Com	nt of Revenue to disclose to the Dire xes, provided that such information missioner to be confidential.	any reasonably requested information to the Purchasing Division and clor of Purchasing appropriate information verifying that Bidder has paid a does not contain the amounts of taxes paid nor any other information
and accurate to all rea	necis: and that if a contract is is	Code, §61-5-3), Bidder hereby certifies that this certificate is true soued to Bidder and if anything contained within this certificate of the Purchasing Division in writing immediately.
Bidder: Bound Tre	e Medical LLC	Signed: Mark Tree
Date: July 6, 2010	1	Title: Vice President Marketing

^{*}Check any combination of preference consideration(s) indicated above, which you are entitled to receive.

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA Purchasing Division

PURCHASING AFFIDAVIT

West Virginia Code §5A-3-10a states: No contract or renewal of any contract may be awarded by the state or any of its political subdivisions to any vendor or prospective vendor when the vendor or prospective vendor or a related party to the vendor or prospective vendor is a debtor and the debt owed is an amount greater than one thousand dollars in the aggregate.

DEFINITIONS:

WITNESS THE FOLLOWING SIGNATURE

"Debt" means any assessment, premium, penalty, fine, tax or other amount of money owed to the state or any of its political subdivisions because of a judgment, fine, permit violation, license assessment, defaulted workers' compensation premium, penalty or other assessment presently delinquent or due and required to be paid to the state or any of its political subdivisions, including any interest or additional penalties accrued thereon.

"Debtor" means any individual, corporation, partnership, association, limited liability company or any other form or business association owing a debt to the state or any of its political subdivisions. "Political subdivision" means any county commission; municipality; county board of education; any instrumentality established by a county or municipality; any separate corporation or instrumentality established by one or more counties or municipalities, as permitted by law; or any public body charged by law with the performance of a government function or whose jurisdiction is coextensive with one or more counties or municipalities. "Related party" means a party, whether an individual, corporation, partnership, association, limited liability company or any other form or business association or other entity whatsoever, related to any vendor by blood, marriage, ownership or contract through which the party has a relationship of ownership or other interest with the vendor so that the party will actually or by effect receive or control a portion of the benefit, profit or other consideration from performance of a vendor contract with the party receiving an amount that meets or exceed five percent of the total contract amount.

EXCEPTION: The prohibition of this section does not apply where a vendor has contested any tax administered pursuant to chapter eleven of this code, workers' compensation premium, permit fee or environmental fee or assessment and the matter has not become final or where the vendor has entered into a payment plan or agreement and the vendor is not in default of any of the provisions of such plan or agreement.

Under penalty of law for false swearing (West Virginia Code §61-5-3), it is hereby certified that the vendor affirms and acknowledges the information in this affidevit and is in compliance with the requirements as stated.

##