

State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

Request for

GH-P TO

SEO NUMBER

address:corhespondence to attention

FRANK WHITTAKER 304-558-2316

DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED BY ORDER

RFQ COPY TYPE NAME/ADDRESS HERE

made, Iric.

DATEPHIN	************	TER	MS OF SAL	E	SHI	2 VIA	F	J.B.	FREIGHTTERMS
04/14/ BID OPENING DATE:		05/24/	2011			PID	DPENING	TIME O	 1:30PM
LINE	QUAN		- Vice	CAT.	JTGA#A	UMBER	100000000000000000000000000000000000000	PRICE	AMOUNT
-				NO					70.000
0001	BED SH	1	LS ND TO		954-05-1	1-500	\$141.	54	\$101,791.83
	THE WE SOLICI	ST VIR TING B ND CON	GINIA IDS F	DIVI OR FR	SION OF OM RESPO	IVISION, NATURAL INSIBLE V	RESOURCE ENDORS F	S, IS OR AN	
	FRANK AT FRA Deadli	WHITTA NK.M.W NE FOR M. ALL	KER I HITTA ALL TECH	N THE KERƏW TECHN NICAL	WV PURC V.GOV OF ICAL QUE	E SUBMIT CHASING D VIA FAX STIONS I	IVISION AT 304- S 04/27/	VIA EMA) 558-4115 2011 AT	(L
	NECESS ORIGIN NOT EX TIME"	F CONT R UNTI ARY TO AL CON CEED T THE VE UPON	L SUC OBTA TRACT WELVE NDOR GIVIN	AN H "RE IN A . TH (12) May T	D EXTENI ASONABLE NEW CONT E "REASO MONTHS. ERMINATE	RACT BECO OS FOR A E TIME" T TRACT OR DNABLE TI DURING E THIS CO OR OF PUR	PERIOD (HEREAFTE RENEW TH ME" PERIOR THIS "F NTRACT F	OF ONE () ER AS IS HE COD SHALL REASONABL FOR ANY	1)
:	UNLESS IN THI	SPECI S CONT	FIC P Ract	DOCUM N ARE	ENT, THE FIRM FO	STIPULA TERMS, OR THE LI	CONDITION FE OF THE	ONS AND	WY PURCHASING DIVISION
SIGNATURE	1///	11/1/2				TELEPHONE 714-389-		DATI	05/23/2011
TITLE SALES MANAC	HAH C	FI	33-10	13311		L		DRESS CHANG	ES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

GENERAL TERMS & CONDITIONS REQUEST FOR QUOTATION (RFQ) AND REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL (RFP)

- 1. Awards will be made in the best interest of the State of West Virginia.
- 2. The State may accept or reject in part, or in whole, any bid.
- 3. Prior to any award, the apparent successful vendor must be properly registered with the Purchasing Division and have paid the required \$125 fee.
- 4. All services performed or goods delivered under State Purchase Order/Contracts are to be continued for the term of the Purchase Order/Contracts, contingent upon funds being appropriated by the Legislature or otherwise being made available. In the event funds are not appropriated or otherwise available for these services or goods this Purchase Order/Contract becomes void and of no effect after June 30.
- 5. Payment may only be made after the delivery and acceptance of goods or services.
- 6. Interest may be paid for late payment in accordance with the West Virginia Code.
- 7. Vendor preference will be granted upon written request in accordance with the West Virginia Code.
- 8. The State of West Virginia is exempt from federal and state taxes and will not pay or reimburse such taxes.
- 9. The Director of Purchasing may cancel any Purchase Order/Contract upon 30 days written notice to the seller.
- 10. The laws of the State of West Virginia and the Legislative Rules of the Purchasing Division shall govern the purchasing process.
- 11. Any reference to automatic renewal is hereby deleted. The Contract may be renewed only upon mutual written agreement of the parties.
- 12. BANKRUPTCY: In the event the vendor/contractor files for bankruptcy protection, the State may deem this contract null and void, and terminate such contract without further order.
- 13. HIPAA BUSINESS ASSOCIATE ADDENDUM: The West Virginia State Government HIPAA Business Associate Addendum (BAA), approved by the Attorney General, is available online at www.state.wv.us/admin/purchase/vrc/hipaa.htm and is hereby made part of the agreement. Provided that the Agency meets the definition of a Cover Entity (45 CFR §160.103) and will be disclosing Protected Health Information (45 CFR §160.103) to the vendor.
- 14. CONFIDENTIALITY: The vendor agrees that he or she will not disclose to anyone, directly or indirectly, any such personally identifiable information or other confidential information gained from the agency, unless the individual who is the subject of the information consents to the disclosure in writing or the disclosure is made pursuant to the agency's policies, procedures, and rules. Vendor further agrees to comply with the Confidentiality Policies and Information Security Accountability Requirements, set forth in http://www.state.wv.us/admin/purchase/privacy/noticeConfidentiality.pdf.
- 15. LICENSING: Vendors must be licensed and in good standing in accordance with any and all state and local laws and requirements by any state or local agency of West Virginia, including, but not limited to, the West Virginia Secretary of State's Office, the West Virginia Tax Department, and the West Virginia Insurance Commission. The vendor must provide all necessary releases to obtain information to enable the director or spending unit to verify that the vendor is licensed and in good standing with the above entities.
- 16. ANTITRUST: In submitting a bid to any agency for the State of West Virginia, the bidder offers and agrees that if the bid is accepted the bidder will convey, sell, assign or transfer to the State of West Virginia all rights, title and interest in and to all causes of action it may now or hereafter acquire under the antitrust laws of the United States and the State of West Virginia for price fixing and/or unreasonable restraints of trade relating to the particular commodities or services purchased or acquired by the State of West Virginia. Such assignment shall be made and become effective at the time the purchasing agency tenders the initial payment to the bidder.
- I certify that this bid is made without prior understanding, agreement, or connection with any corporation, firm, limited liability company, partnership, or person or entity submitting a bid for the same material, supplies, equipment or services and is in all respects fair and without collusion or Fraud. I further certify that I am authorized to sign the certification on behalf of the bidder or this bid.

INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS

- 1. Use the quotation forms provided by the Purchasing Division. Complete all sections of the quotation form.
- 2. Items offered must be in compliance with the specifications. Any deviation from the specifications must be clearly indicated by the bidder. Alternates offered by the bidder as **EQUAL** to the specifications must be clearly defined. A bidder offering an alternate should attach complete specifications and literature to the bid. The Purchasing Division may waive minor deviations to specifications.
- 3. Unit prices shall prevail in case of discrepancy. All quotations are considered F.O.B. destination unless alternate shipping terms are clearly identified in the quotation.
- 4. All quotations must be delivered by the bidder to the office listed below prior to the date and time of the bid opening. Failure of the bidder to deliver the quotations on time will result in bid disqualifications: Department of Administration, Purchasing Division, 2019 Washington Street East, P.O. Box 50130, Charleston, WV 25305-0130
- 5. Communication during the solicitation, bid, evaluation or award periods, except through the Purchasing Division, is strictly prohibited (W.Va. C.S.R. §148-1-6.6).



State of West Virginia Department of Administration Purchasing Division 2019 Washington Street East Post Office Box 50130 Charleston, WV 25305-0130

Request for Quotation

FRANK WHITTAKER 304-558-2316

DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED BY ORDER

RFQ COPY TYPE NAME/ADDRESS HERE

DATE PRIN	***********	TER	us of sale		SHIPVIA		FOB		FREIGHTTERMS
04/14/2011		,		<u>_</u>					
BID OPENING DATE:		05/24/		**********		BID (<u>DPENING TIME</u>	0 1	:30PM
LINE	QUAN	(TITY	UOP '	CAT NO.	ITEM NUMBER		UNIT PRICE		AMOUNT
				2000200000000		000000000000000000000000000000000000000		***********	
	CONTRA	CT.							
					MAN DE DEN	-u-n	HDON THE MUT	11 A 1]
							UPON THE MUT	UAL	1
					SPENDING U		ND VENDOR, G THIRTY (30	,	1
							CH RENEWAL S		
							NDITIONS OF		
							TO TWO (2)		1
	(1) YE			מאוי	DUALL DE LI	141151	10 140 (2)	UNL	!
	(I) AE	AK FER	יפתחד	ŀ	•		i		
	CANCEL	LATION	. THE	TPE	TOP OF PUR	CHAST	NG RESERVES	THE	
	DIGUT	TO CAM	CEL TH	TS CO	NTRACT IMM	FNTAT	ELY UPON WRI	TTEN	·
							S AND/OR SER		<u>;</u>]
	CHEBIT	ED ARE	UE VN	TNEE	TIAUG SOTS	TYOR	DO NOT CONF	DRM	1
							ONTRACT HERE		
		0. 201			,		-,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,		
	OPEN M	ARKET	CLAUSE	: THE	DIRECTOR	OF PU	RCHASING MAY	•	
							ON THE OPEN		
							ITION OR COS	T	
					ED ON THIS				·
							TO UNFORESEE	N	
							ELAYS IN TRA		:
							IN THE VOLU		
	OF WOR								
				- 1					. 1
}	DUANTI	TIES:	QUANTI.	TIES	LISTED IN	THE R	EQUISITION A	RE	
							S SUPPLIED I		
	THE ST	ATE SP	ENDING	UNIT	r. IT IS U	NDERS	TOOD AND AGE	REED	
	THAT T	HE CON	TRACT	SHALL	COVER THE	QUAN	TITIES ACTU	LLY	
	ORDERE	D FOR	DELIVE	RY DI	JRING THE T	ERM O	F THE CONTRA	CT,	
	WHETHE	R MORE	OR LES	SS T	IAN THE QUA	NTITI	ES SHOWN.		i
				1					
							HALL ISSUE A		
							BER WV-39)		
	THE VE	NDOR F	OR COM	MODI	TIES COVERE	D BY	THIS CONTRAC	CT.	
1	THE OR	IGINAL	COPY	0F T 1	IE WV-39 SH	ALL B	E MAILED TO	THE	
	1				EASE SIDE FOR TERM	CANIS CA	 NORTONS	(4)(4)(4)(4)	1
SIGNATURE	///	7.5	7	yee:nev	TEL	EPHONE -	14-389-9600	DATE	05 /02 /0011
		1/4 (11)	1/				T-4 - 70 3 - 50 0 0		05/23/2011
TITLE SALES M	ANAGER	r i Fi	33-10)13311			ADDRESS	CHANGE	S TO BE NOTED ABOVE



State of West Virginia Department of Administration Purchasing Division 2019 Washington Street East Post Office Box 50130 Charleston, WV 25305-0130

Request for Quotation DNR211172

FRANK WHITTAKER 304-558-2316

RFQ COPY TYPE NAME/ADDRESS HERE

DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED BY ORDER

04/14/	2011		M9:OF:SAL	ia.	SHIP VIA		FOB.		FREIGHTTERMS
BID OPENING DATE:	100000000000000000000000000000000000000	05/24/	2011		BID	OPE	NING TIME	01	:30PM
LINE	QUAN	TITY	UOP	CAT. NO	ITEM NUMBER		UNITPRICE		AMOUNT
	MAILED	то тн	E PUR	CHASI	N FOR SHIPMENT, NG DIVISION, AND NG UNIT.				·
	FOR BA	NKRUPT CT NUL	CY PR L AND	OTECT VOID	ENT THE VENDOR/C ION, THE STATE M , AND TERMINATE	AY	DEEM THE	i	
	SHALL CONDIT DOCUME AGREEM	SUPERS IONS W NTS SU ENTS O	EDE A HICH CH AS R MAI	NY AN May a Pric Ntena	NS CONTAINED IN D ALL SUBSEQUENT PPEAR ON ANY ATT E LISTS, ORDER F NCE AGREEMENTS, AS CD-ROM.	TE ACH ORM	RMS AND ED PRINTE S, SALES	ΞD	
	REV. 0 EXHIBI		009						
	AND CO AND OT TO POL VIRGIN PRICES POLITI CLEARL	BID H NDITIO HER LO ITICAL IA. I , TERM CAL SU Y INDI NOT PR	IS RE NS OF CAL G SUBD F THE S, AN BDIVI CATE	FUSAL THE OVERN IVISI VEND CON SIONS SUCH	S: UNLESS THE TO EXTEND THE F BID TO COUNTY, S MENT BODIES, THE ONS OF THE STATE OR DOES NOT WISH DITIONS OF THE E OF THE STATE, T REFUSAL IN HIS E E AWARD OF THIS	RIC CHO BI OF TO ID HE ID.	ES, TERMS OL, MUNIC D SHALL I WEST EXTEND TO ALL VENDOR MI SUCH RI	S, CIPAL EXTEN THE UST EFUSAL	
	REV. 3	/88			ICE	Water State of the Control of the Co		************************	
SIGNATURE	1011=11.	/, -	_	SEEHE	VERSE SIDE FOR TERMS AND CO TELEPHONE		พ ร 89-9600	DATE	05/23/2011
TITLE SALES MAN	<i>lll4UU</i> iager	FI	∃N 33-1	013311					TO BE NOTED ABOVE



State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston WW 25305 0100 Charleston, WV 25305-0130

FRANK WHITTAKER 304-558-2316

ADDRESSICORRESPONDENCE TO ATTENTION OF

VENCOR

RFQ COPY TYPE NAME/ADDRESS HERE

DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED BY ORDER

	MS OF SALE SH	P.VIA FO.B.	FREIGHTTERMS
04/14/2011 BID OPENING DATE: 05/24/	2017	DID COUNTIE TI	
		BID OPENING TIM	
LINE QUANTITY	LIOP CAT. ITEM!	NUMBER UNIT PRIC	E. AWGON1
DEPARTM PURCHAS BUILDIN 2019 WA	MUST BE SUBMITTED ENT OF ADMINISTRATING DIVISION G 15 SHINGTON STREET, NOT STONE OF THE STORE OF	TION EAST	
	LD CONTAIN THIS IS OR THE BID MAY N	NFORMATION ON THE FA	ACE OF
BUYER:	4.	4	
RFQ. NO.:	ומ .	NR211172	
BID OPENING	DATE: 0	5/24/2011	
BID OPENING	TIME: 1	:30 PM	,
1	OU REGARDING YOUR	N CASE IT IS NECESS	ARY
CONTACT PERS	ON (PLEASE PRINT	CLEARLY): ERDINC	
1	SEE REVERSE SIDE FO	H TERMS AND CONDITIONS	
SIGNATURE MILITARIA		TELEPHONE 714-389-9600	DATE 05/23/2011
TITLE SALES MANAGER	EIN 33-1013311	ADDRES	SS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

DNR211172 West Virginia State Parks Guest Room Hospitality Items Open End Contract

The West Virginia Division of Natural Resources is requesting bids for the purchase of hospitality items for its lodge and cabin guest rooms throughout the park system. All items are to be F.O.B. Destination. Freight or delivery charges must be included in the line item price. Delivery must be made within thirty (30) days of purchase order award. The award may be split if it is in the best interest of West Virginia Division of Natural Resources.

General Specifications:

Guest room hospitality items must be manufactured for commercial contract hospitality use. All items must be new.

Information for Bidders:

Bidders must submit a unit price bid for each item to furnish as specified.

Vendor must coordinate shipping and receiving with the West Virginia Division of Natural Resources, park specific to each order. Vendor must notify the park not less than seventy-two (72) hours in advance as to the exact date and time of delivery.

Damaged Items:

All items will be inspected by the park superintendent, or their representative, subsequent to delivery to ensure that each item is not damaged or defective. Damaged or defective items must be replaced at no additional expense to the park.

General Specifications Sheets and Pillowcases:

Minimum 300 thread count 60/40% cotton/polyester linen sheets. Sheets must have a minimum 2" hem. Color of sheets must be white unless otherwise specified and if specified bidder must provide color options from manufacturer's standard color choices. Sheets must meet or exceed the following minimum specifications:

King fitted sheet: 78" X 80" X 15". 60/40% Cotton/Polyester. T300 Measurement and thread count must be equal or higher

King flat sheet: 108" X 115". 60/40% Cotton/Polyester. T300 Measurement and thread count must be equal or higher

Queen fitted sheet. 60" X 80" X 15". 60/40% Cotton/Polyester. T300.

Measurement and thread count must be equal or higher.

Queen flat sheet. 90" X 115". 60/40% Cotton/Polyester. T300. Measurement and thread count must be equal or higher

General Specifications Sheets and Pillowcases con't:

Full fitted sheet. 54" X 80" X 15". 60/40% Cotton/Polyester. T300. Measurement and thread count must be equal or higher.

Full flat sheet. 81" X 115". 60/40% Cotton/Polyester. T300. Measurement and thread count must be equal or higher

Twin fitted sheet. 39" X 80" X 15". 60/40% Cotton/Polyester. T300. Measurement and thread count must be equal or higher.

Twin flat sheet. 66" X 115". 60/40% Cotton/Polyester. T300. Measurement and thread count must be equal or higher.

Pillow case. Standard. 42" X 36". 60/40% Cotton/Polyester. T300. Measurement and thread count must be equal or higher

General Specifications Towels:

Micro cotton towel, jacquard check pattern or equal. Towels must be 100% long staple cotton. Color of towels must be white unless otherwise specified and if specified bidder must provide color options from manufacturer's standard color choices. Towels must to be provided in the following minimum specifications:

Micro cotton towel bath towel with minimum specifications 27"W X 54"D

Micro cotton towel hand towel with minimum specifications 16"W X 20"D

Micro cotton towel wash cloth with minimum specifications 13"W X 13"D

Micro cotton towel bath sheet with minimum specifications 30"W X 60"D

Windowpane two-tone plaid design kitchen towels with minimum specifications 15"W X 25"D

Windowpane two-tone plaid design dish cloth with minimum specifications 12"W X 12"D

Other Government Bodies:

Unless otherwise stated in the response, the vendor agrees to extend the same prices, terms and conditions to other government bodies. If the vendor does not wish to extend the same prices, terms and conditions to other government entities, it should be clearly stated in the response to such refusal. Such refusal shall not prejudice the award of this contract in any way.

Warranty:

All guest room hospitality items must be guaranteed to be free of defects in workmanship. Manufacturer warranties shall apply to all items.

West Virginia State Parks Guest Room Hospitality Items Open End Contract Pricing Sheet

	Estimated	Description	Unit Price	Amount
tem No.	Quantity	STANDARD TEXTILES #0124100 - 78X80X14 RING SPU		, www.
1 .	100	King fitted sheet: 78 X 80 X 15, 80/40 Cotton/Polyester, T300		å1 0FF 00
'	100	Measurement and thread count must be equal or higher COTTON / POLYEST	\$18.55	\$1,855.00
		STANDARD TEXTILES # 01213000 RING SPUN COTTON	111	
2	100	King flat sheet: 108 X 115. 60/40 Cotton/Polyester. T300 70/30	\$17.66	\$1,766.00
4	100	Measurement and thread count must be equal or higher COTTON/POLYES		\$1,700.00
		STANDARD TEXTILES 01243000 - 60X80X14 RING SPUT		
	351	Queen fitted sheet. 60 X 80 X 15. 60/40 Cotton/Polyester. T300. 70/30	\$16.41	\$5,759.91
3	351	Measurement and thread count must equal or higher, COTTON/POLYEST		35,759.91

. 1	ا مم	STANDARD TEXTILES 01215000 - RING SPUN COTTON	\$14.36	\$5,040.36
4	351	Queen flat sheet. <u>90 X 115.</u> 60/40 Cotton/Polyester. T300. 70/30		\$5,040.36
		Measurement and thread count must be equal or higher COTTON/POLYES STANDARD TEXTILES 01246000 - 54X80X14 - RING		COM
!			SPUN COTT \$12.23	\$ 550.35
5	45	I dil illed shoot. Str. oo x 301	•	p 550.55
		Measurement and thread count must be equal or higher. COTTON / POLYES	TER	
		STANDARD TEXTILES 01216000 - RING SPUN COTTON		
6	1161	Full flat sheet, 81 X 115. 60/40 Cotton/Polyester, T300. 70/30	\$11.76	\$13,653.36
		Measurement and thread count must be equal or higher COTTON/POLYES		
			PUN COTT	
7	495	Twin fitted sheet. 39 X 80 X 15. 60/40 Cotton/Polyester. T300. 70/30	\$13.50	\$6,682.50
		Measurement and thread count must be equal or higher. COTTON / POLYE	STER	
		STANDARD TEXTILES 01217000 - RING SPUN COTTON		
8	1845	Twin flat sheet, 66 X 115, 80/40 Cotton/Polyester, T300.	\$11.99	\$22,121.55
	1	Measurement and thread count must be equal or higher.		
	Ŀ	STANDARD TEXTILES 01270300, 70/30 COTTON/POLY		
9	2610	Pillow case. Standard. 42 X 36". 60/40 Cotton/Polyester. T300.	\$ 2.41	\$6,290.10
		Measurement and thread count must be equal or higher RING SPUN CO	TON	
	1	STANDARD TEXTILES 46311100 - 15 LB/DOZ100 %		
	1	COTTON-RING SPUN COTTON LOOP YARNS-ROOM READY DOBBY BORDERS	\$ 7.94	\$20,723.40
10	2610	Micro cotton towel bath towel with minimum specifications 27"W X 54"D		<u> </u>
		STANDARD TEXTILES 46319100-16X27-100 % COTTON RING SPUN COTTON LOOP YARNS-ROOM READY DORBY	6 1 02	\$5,037.30
11	2610	Micro cotton towel hand towel with minimum specifications 16"W X 20"DRORI	EB 1.33	33,037.30
		STANDARD TEXTILES 46316100, RING SPUN COTTON LOOP YARNS-100 % COTTON-ROOM READY, DOBBY BORDER Micro cotton towel wash cloth with minimum specifications 13 W X 13 D	1	40 010 00
12	2610		\$ T.08	\$2,818.80
		STANDARD TEXTILES 46308100-35X68-100 % COTTON	\$11 72	\$9,493.20
13	810	RING SPUN COTTON LOOP YARN-ROOM READY-DOBBY Micro cotton towel bath sheet with minimum specifications 30"W X 60" BORD	\$11.72 ER	Q37433.20
14	1134	Windowpane two-tone plaid design kitchen towels with minimum	NO BID	NO BID
•••	''-''	specifications 15"W X 25"D		<u> </u>
				Ì
15	1134	Windowpane two-tone plaid design dish cloth with minimum specifications	NO BID	NO BID
13	. 104	12"W X 12"D		
	 			
	l	TOTALS	\$141.54	\$101,791.8

The quantities listed above are for bid evaluation purposes only. Actual quantities may differ.



Comade, Inc.
Executed June 11, 2010

Corporate Resolution: 10:015
Title: Combined Corporate Binding

& Preference Reciprocity

HEREBY RESOLVED (Corporate Binding):

The undersigned Corporate Officer of Comade, Inc., by order of unanimous voting quorum of the elected Board of Directors acting on behalf of the Company appoint the following. The positions identified below have the authority to bind Comade, Inc. in the execution of documents of bids, contracts, and solicitations, and to receive and receipt therefore all purchase orders and notices issued pursuant to the provisions of any such bid or contract, this corporation hereby ratifying approving, confirming, and accepting each and every such act performed by said agent acting on behalf of the company.

Corporate Officer -

Chief Executive, President, Vice President, Secretary, Treasurer

Project Manager

Contract Administrator

HERBEY RESOLVED (Preference Reciprocity):

Comade, Inc. is considered a small business by US Federal business size standards – less than 100 employees.

Comade, Inc. being domiciled in the State of California (Corporation #2419853), County of Orange, City of Irvine (license #00049610), is NOT certified with the State of California, County of Orange, or the City of Irvine as a small business. We do not singularly qualify, participate, or benefit from any known State, County, or City sponsored entitlement program offered for small business. Moreover, we do not qualify for small business certification based average annual revenue requirements.

Comade, Inc. does not intend singular corporate participation in California certified small business preference. This resolution is specifically stated to avoid reciprocity with other states and agencies with whom we do or might offer services.

Chris Schaller

Chairman of the Board & Chief Executive Officer

Comade, Inc. 17915 Sky Park Circle, Suite B Irvine, CA 92614 949-474-0160 Fax: 949-474-0161 www.comade.com

State of West Virginia

VENDOR PREFERENCE CERTIFICATE

Certification and application* is hereby made for Preference in accordance with **West Virginia Code**, §5A-3-37. (Does not apply to construction contracts). **West Virginia Code**, §5A-3-37, provides an opportunity for qualifying vendors to request (at the time of bid) preference for their residency status. Such preference is an evaluation method only and will be applied only to the cost bid in accordance with the **West Virginia Code**. This certificate for application is to be used to request such preference. The Purchasing Division will make the determination of the Resident Vendor Preference, if applicable.

1.	Application is made for 2.5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked: Bidder is an individual resident vendor and has resided continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preced-
-	ing the date of this certification; or , Bidder is a partnership, association or corporation resident vendor and has maintained its headquarters or principal place of business continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or 80% of the ownership interest of Bidder is held by another individual, partnership, association or corporation resident vendor who has maintained its headquarters or principal place of business continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or , Bidder is a nonresident vendor which has an affiliate or subsidiary which employs a minimum of one hundred state residents
	and which has maintained its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia continuously for the four (4) years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or,
2.	Application is made for 2.5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked: Bidder is a resident vendor who certifies that, during the life of the contract, on average at least 75% of the employees working on the project being bid are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two years immediately preceding submission of this bid; or,
3.	Application is made for 2.5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked: Bidder is a nonresident vendor employing a minimum of one hundred state residents or is a nonresident vendor with an affiliate or subsidiary which maintains its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia employing a minimum of one hundred state residents who certifies that, during the life of the contract, on average at least 75% of the employees or Bidder's affiliate's or subsidiary's employees are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two years immediately preceding submission of this bid; or,
4.	Application is made for 5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked: Bidder meets either the requirement of both subdivisions (1) and (2) or subdivision (1) and (3) as stated above; or,
5.	Application is made for 3.5% resident vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked: Bidder is an individual resident vendor who is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard and has resided in West Virginia continuously for the four years immediately preceding the date on which the bid is submitted; or,
6.	Application is made for 3.5% resident vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked: Bidder is a resident vendor who is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard, if, for purposes of producing or distributing the commodities or completing the project which is the subject of the vendor's bid and continuously over the entire term of the project, on average at least seventy-five percent of the vendor's employees are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two immediately preceding years.
red ag or	dder understands if the Secretary of Revenue determines that a Bidder receiving preference has failed to continue to meet the quirements for such preference, the Secretary may order the Director of Purchasing to: (a) reject the bid; or (b) assess a penalty ainst such Bidder in an amount not to exceed 5% of the bid amount and that such penalty will be paid to the contracting agency deducted from any unpaid balance on the contract or purchase order.
au the de	submission of this certificate, Bidder agrees to disclose any reasonably requested information to the Purchasing Division and thorizes the Department of Revenue to disclose to the Director of Purchasing appropriate information verifying that Bidder has paid a required business taxes, provided that such information does not contain the amounts of taxes paid nor any other information semed by the Tax Commissioner to be confidential.
	nder penalty of law for false swearing (West Virginia Code, §61-5-3), Bidder hereby certifies that this certificate is true ad accurate in all respects; and that if a contract is issued to Bidder and if anything contained within this certificate nanges during the term of the contract, Bidder will notify the Purchasing Division in writing immediately.
Bi	dder:Signed:
Da	ate: Title:

*Check any combination of preference consideration(s) indicated above, which you are entitled to receive.

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA Purchasing Division

PURCHASING AFFIDAVIT

West Virginia Code §5A-3-10a states: No contract or renewal of any contract may be awarded by the state or any of its political subdivisions to any vendor or prospective vendor when the vendor or prospective vendor or a related party to the vendor or prospective vendor is a debtor and the debt owed is an amount greater than one thousand dollars in the aggregate.

DEFINITIONS:

"Debt" means any assessment, premium, penalty, fine, tax or other amount of money owed to the state or any of its political subdivisions because of a judgment, fine, permit violation, license assessment, defaulted workers' compensation premium, penalty or other assessment presently delinquent or due and required to be paid to the state or any of its political subdivisions, including any interest or additional penalties accrued thereon.

"Debtor" means any individual, corporation, partnership, association, limited liability company or any other form or business association owing a debt to the state or any of its political subdivisions. "Political subdivision" means any county commission; municipality; county board of education; any instrumentality established by a county or municipality; any separate corporation or instrumentality established by one or more counties or municipalities, as permitted by law; or any public body charged by law with the performance of a government function or whose jurisdiction is coextensive with one or more counties or municipalities. "Related party" means a party, whether an individual, corporation, partnership, association, limited liability company or any other form or business association or other entity whatsoever, related to any vendor by blood, marriage, ownership or contract through which the party has a relationship of ownership or other interest with the vendor so that the party will actually or by effect receive or control a portion of the benefit, profit or other consideration from performance of a vendor contract with the party receiving an amount that meets or exceed five percent of the total contract amount.

EXCEPTION: The prohibition of this section does not apply where a vendor has contested any tax administered pursuant to chapter eleven of this code, workers' compensation premium, permit fee or environmental fee or assessment and the matter has not become final or where the vendor has entered into a payment plan or agreement and the vendor is not in default of any of the provisions of such plan or agreement.

Under penalty of law for false swearing (West Virginia Code §61-5-3), it is hereby certified that the vendor affirms and acknowledges the information in this affidavit and is in compliance with the requirements as stated.

WITNESS THE FOLLOWING SIGNATURE

Vendor's Name: COMADE, INC.		
Authorized Signature: Muldu	Date: 05/23/2011	
State of CA		
County of ORANGE, to-wit:		
Taken, subscribed, and sworn to before me this $\underline{23RD}$ day	of MAY , 20 11.	
My Commission expires December 5.	; 20 <u>//</u> .	
AFFIX SEAL HERE	NOTARY PUBLIC Daniel a Vallan	

