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GENERAL TERMS & CONDITIONS - _
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION (RFQ) AND REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL (RFP)

1. Awards will be made in the best interast of the State of West Virginia.
2. The State may accept or reject in part, or in whole, any bid.

3. Prior to any award, the apparent successful vendor must be properly registered with the Purchasing Division
and have paid the required $125 fee. :

4. Al services performed or goods delivered under State Purchase Order/Contracts are to be continued for the
term of the Purchase Order/Contracts, contingent upon funds being appropriated by the Legislature or otherwise
being made available. In the event funds are not appropriated or otherwise available for these services or goods
this Purchase Order/Contract becomes void and of no effect after June 30.

5. Payment may only be made after the delfvery and acceptance of goods or services.

6. Interest may be paid for late payment in accordance with the West Virginia Code.

7. Vendor preference will be granted upon writtan request [h accordance with the West Virginia Code.

8. The State of West Virginia is exempt from foderal and state taxes and will not pay or reimburse such taxes.
-9, The Director of Purchasing may cancel any Purchase Order/Contract upon 30 days written notice to the seller.

10, The laws of the State of West Virginia and the Legislative Rules of the Purchasing Division shall govern the
purchasing process,

11, Any reference to automatic renewal is hereby delsted. The Contract may be renewed only upon mutual written
agreement of the partiss, :

12. BANKRUPTCY: In the evant the vendor/contractor files for bankruptcy protection, the State may deem
this contract null and void, and terminate such contract without further order.

13. HIPAA BUSINESS ASSOCIATE ADDENDUM: The West Virginla State Government HIPAA Business Associate
Addendum (BAA), approved by the Attorney General, is available online at www.state.wv.usfadmin/purchasefyre/hipaa.him
and is hereby made part of the agreement. Provided that the Agency meets the definition of a Cover Enfity
(45 CFR §160.103) and will be disclosing Protected Health Information (45 CFR §160,103) to the vendor.

14. CONFIDENTIALITY: The vendor agreas that he or she will not disclose to anyone, directly or indirectly, any such
personally identifiable Information or other confidential information gained from the agency, unless the individual who is
the subject of the information consents to the disclosure in writing or the disclosure is made gursuant to the agency's
policles, procedures, and rules. Vendor further agrees to comply with the Confidentiality olicles and Information
Security Accountability Requirements, set farth in hitp:/fwww state wv.us/admin/purchase/privacy/noticeConfidentiality pdf.

15. LICENSING: Vendors must be licensed and in good standing In accordance with any and alf stats and locat laws and
requirements by any state or local agency of West Virginia, fncludlr:,g, but not limited fo, the West Virginia Secreta
of State’s Office, the West Virginla Tax Department, and the West Virginia Insurance Commission. The vendor mus
provide all necessary releases to obtaih information to enabls the director or spending unit to
vetify that the vendor is licensed and in good standing with the above entities. o :

16, ANTITRUST: In submitting a bid to any agency for the State of West Virginia, the bidder offers and agrees that
if the bid is accepted the bidder will convey, sell, assign or transfer to the State of West Virginia all rights, title and Interest
in and to all causes of action it may now or hereafter acquire under the antitrust laws of the United States and the State of
West Virginia for price fixing and/or unreasonable restraints of trade relating to the pariicular commodities or setvices
purchased or acquired by the State of West Virginia. Such assignment shall be made and become effective at the time the
purchasing agency tenders the Initial payment to the bidder.

| certify that this bid is made without prior understanding, agreement, or connection with anY corporation, firm, limited
liability company, partnership, or person or enfity submitting a bid for the same material, supplies, equi ment or
services and is in all respects falr and without collusion or Fraud. | further ceriify that | am authorized to sign
the certification on behalf of tha bidder or this bld,

: INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS
1. Use the quotation forms provided by the Purchasing Division. Complete all sections of the quotation form.

2. ltems offered must be In compllance with the spacificaions. Any deviation from the specifications must be clearly

indicated by the bidder. Alternates offerad by the bidder as EQUAL to the specifications must be clearly

defined. A bidder offering an alternate should attach complete specifications and literature to the bid. The

Purchasing Division may waive minor deviations to specifications. ‘

3. Unit prices shall prevail in case of discrepancy. All quotations are considered F.0.B, destinatioh unless alternate

shipping terms are clearly identified in the quotation.

4. All quotations must be delivered by the bidder to the office listed below prior to the date and lime of the bid

~ opening. Failure of the bidder to deliver the quotations on time will result in bid disqualifications: Depariment of
Administration, Purchasing Divislon, 2019 Washington Street East, P.O. Box 50130, Chareston, WV 25305-0130

5, Communication during the solicitation, bid, evaluation or award periods, except through the Purchasing Division,

is strictly prohibited (W.Va. C.S.R. §148-1-6.8).

Rev. 12/16/02
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1. SPECIFICATIONS

The following sections of the West Virginia Department of Transportation, Division of Highways' Standard
Specifications Roads and Bridges, adopted 2010 as modified by the January 1, 2011 Supplemental Specifications
shall@pply to the administration of the Contract: Sections 101, 102.4,102.5, 1051 105.3, 105.4, 105.10, 105.11,
106.12, 105.13, 106.3, 106.4, 106.5, 106.6, 106.7, 106.9, 107.1, 107.2, 107.3, 107.12, 107.14, 107.25, 107.18,
107.19, 107.20, 107.23, 108.3, 108.5,108.5, 108.7, 108.8.

The terms “Contractor” and “Vendor’ used in the above specifications and throughout this Contract are
inferchangeable. Contractor shall mean Vendor and Vendor shall mean Contracior.

Waest Virginia Department of Transportation, Division of Highways’ Standard Specifications Roads and Bridges,
Adopted 2010 as modified by the January 1, 2011 Supplemental Specifications may be obtained from:

West Virginia Division of Highways

Contract Administration Division

Building Five, Room 722

1900 Kanawha Boulevard, East

Charleston, West Virginia 25305

hitp:/fwww.transportation.wv.govfhighways/contractadmin/specificationsf2010StandSpec/Pages/default.aspx

Al material, except tem P, shall be fumished in accordance with the reqwrements of the West Virginia
Department of Transportation, Division of Highways’ Standard Specifications Roads and Bridges, adopted 2010
as modified by the January 1, 2011 Supplemental Specifications.

ltem P Shall meet West Virginia Division of Highways' Specificationé, specifications of adjacent state highway
departments or specifications acceptable to the WV Division of Highways Engineer for similar material as bid in
ltems A through O.

The Division of Highways may purchase Hot-Mix Asphalt F.0.B. Vendor's plant. The bid price F.0.B. Vendor's
plant shall include the ioading of Division of Highways’, owned or rented, trucks and the furnishing of a coating
solution in accordance with Section 401.9.7 of the Specifications by Vendor.

2. BIDDING INSTRUCTIONS

Any quallf cation of bids or any modification of the specifications or condltlons governing the bids shall be cause to
reject bids.

If a Vendor will be supplying materials from more than one plant, the bid prices that apply to each plant shall be
clearly indicated in the bid, preferably on separate bid schedules.

3. DETERMINING LOW BID

The purpose of this contract is to establish unit prices for ltems A, B, C, D, E, F, G, H, L, J, K, LM, N, O, P, Q, R,
S, T, U, V,W, X Y,/Z AA AB, AC, AD, AE, AF, AG, AH, Al, AJ, AK, AL, AM, AN and AO which are to be used as
the basis for requisitioning Hot-Mix Asphalt and Warm-Mix Asphalt for use on various maintenance and repair
projects throughout the Division of Highways' Districts.



An Agency Release for individual paving projects will be based on the lowest overall total cost of the pick-up price
of material, ltems A through O, plus shoulder paving, Item S, T, and U plus the haul cost, Item V, plus the lay
down cost, lterm W, plus cleaning & sweeping, ltem X, tack material, fem Y, mobilization for paving, ltems Z or
AA, off-season plant opening, ltem AB, additional heelin joints, tem AC, skip paving surcharge, tem AD,
mobilization for profiling, ltem AE, pavement profiling, ltem AF, Traffic Control, ltems AG, AH, Al and"AJ and
pavernent repair, ltem AM, however items A through R may be furnished from any approved production location.
- ltems S, T, U, V, W, X, Y, Z, AA, AB, AC, AD, AE, AF, AG, AH, Al, Ad, AK, AL, AM, AN and AO shall be shown
on the Agency Release as a separate pay item when requested by the Engineer. '

Agency Releases for material to be picked up at the Vendor's plant by the Division of Highways will be based on
the lowest unit price of ltems A through R and the Division of Highway's most economical haul cost from the
Vendor's plant to individual job sites. Factors to be considered shall include but not be limited fo; bid price of
material, haul cost @ $0.25 for each additional ton-mile, loading and transportation delays and availability of
matetial. .

The distances allowed for haul costs wili be over suitable routes selected by the Division of Highways Engineer
that provides the lowest tofal cost to the Division of Highways and shall be measured from the Vendot’s plant
location to the mid-point of the project. Afl such chosen routes shall have acceptable load limits for both roads
and bridges.

The Division of Highways reserves the right fo request any one or combination of items for which bids are
received at the iowest overall total as set forth above.

Acceptance of a bid for any one item shall not be dependent upon the acceptance of a bid for any other item or
any combination of items. However, ltem P shall not be requested except when determined by the Division of
Mighways Engineer that all other equivalent items of material are not available, then only on a pick-up basis. Also,
ltem V will only be requested in combination with other quoted items.

Upon receipt of an Agency Release for lay down of Hot Mix Asphalt or pavement profiling, the Vendor shall advise

the Division of Highways, in writing, within five (5) calendar days of their acceptance of the Agency Release.
Failure to acknowledge shall resuit in canceflation of the Agency Release and re-award to the next lowest bidder.

4. CONTRACT CONDITIONS

Vendors may bid any or all items on the bid schedule, However, the amount bid on any one item may not be
conditioned on the acceptance of the bid on any other item or items.

Al qualified Vendors who submit a valid bid "F.0.B. Vendor's Plant’ will be awarded a Contract for those items
bid. See Section 13 for Bid Schedule,

In the event a Contracior fails to conform fo the requirements set out in this contract document, the Agency
Release or the governing specifications, and this Purchase Order may be canceled and awarded to the next
lowest hidder.

The State of West Virginia reserves the right to make multiple awards on this Contract when it is in the best
interest of the State to do so. :



Al 1abor rates paid by Vendor under llems S, T, U, W, X, Y, AC, AE, AF, AG, AH, Al, AJ, AK, and AM of this
contract must be in compliance with the West Virginia Department of Labor Prevailing Rates, Chapter 21-5A,
Series 15, 2006. .

The Vendor is not authorized to ship, nor is the Division of Highways authorized to receive materials prior to the
issuance of an Agency Release.

5. CONTRACT COMPLETION

All Agency Releases for lay down and profiling work shall specify a starting date and & completion date based on
the vendor's acceptance of the Agency Release. If work is not started by the vendor, by the specified starting
date in the Agency Releass, the Agency Release shall be cancelled and reissued to the next low bidder. If work
is not completed by the completion date as specified in the Agency Release, liquidated damages will be assessed
in accordance with Section 108.7 of the Standard Specifications Roads and Brldges Adopted 2010 as modified
by the January 1, 2011 Supplemental Specifications.

6. GENERAL PROVISIONS

6.1 Lay Down

Lay Down as noted in Item W-shall be provided by the Vendor as requested by the Division of Highways at
projects designated by the Division of Highways Engineer,

6.2 Skip Paving

The Vendor may be required to perform Skip Paving projects at a paving location, provided the distance between
the end of one skip and the beginning of the next does not exceed 2500 feet. When Skip Paving is requested the
Vendor shall be paid the Skip Paving Surcharge, ltem AD for each ton of final surface course maferial completed
in place on the project. Patching and leveling in preparation for resurfacing of & project shall not be considered
Skip Paving.

6.3 Heel - In

Heel-in of joints at the beginning and the end of each paving location, will be performed by the Vendor in
accordance with the Resurfacing Heei-In Detail.

Payment for beginning and ending heel-in joints shall be included in the unit price bid for llem W.

Additional Heel-In Joints, Item AC, constructed in accordance with the Resurfacing Heel-in Detail may be
required as directed by the Division of Highways Engineer at intersecting roadways, at the beginning and end of
each paving skip and other designated locations. Payment of additional Heel-In Joints shall be paid per lineal foot
as measured along the joint, which shall be full payment for complete construction of the joint.

6.4 Cleaning and Sweeping

Cleaning and Sweseping may be performed by the Division of Highways. However, Cleaning and Sweeping, if
provided by the Vendor, shall be performed in accordance with Subsection 401.10.1 of the Standard



Specifications, Payment shall be calculated as the paving length times the width swept in accordance with
subsection 401.10.1,

85  Off Season Plant Opening

If the Vendor is required to open his plant in the off season to service the needs of the Division of Highways, an
additional payment will be made under item AB, cff-season plant opening. Vendor will be paid additional day
charge for each additional consecutive day that the plant is open after the first day fo serve the needs of the
Division of Highways.

If the plent produces no material for any user on any calendar day, either during the week or on the weekend, the
Division of Highways will pay the first day rate for off-season plant opsning on the next day of the Division of
Highways usage. Payment for this item Is subject to the following conditions:

6.5.1 Payment for ltem AB can only be authotized and made during the winter months, i.e., between
December 15 and March 15, and then only if the plant would not have otherwise been open.

These dates may be revised by the Division of Highways Engineer, if necessary, to meet specific needs
in the field. Any such revision of dates will be in writing and shall be attached to the Vendor's invoice
at the time payment is requested. '

6.5.2 Payment will always be made in the full contract bid price amount for first day of plant opening.
However, the amount paid from each additional day of plant opening will be reduced as follows:
a. Payment for additional day charge will not be made if the plant has produced over 500 tons on that
particular day. If betwsen 300 and 500 tons have been produced, payment for additional day charge will
be made equal to one-half of the amount bid for additional day charge. The quantity produced to make
this-determination shall include all material produced that day, which includes tonnage bought by the
. State, the varlous local governments and all private work. .
b. The State will only pay its share of the amount determined to be due for additional day charge in
paragraph 6.5.2a above. For example, If the plant produces 375 tons and the Division of Highways takes
150 tons of the total, in this illustration 40% of the plant's daily production, payment for additional day
charge would be calculated as follows: Since the total daily production is between 300 and 500.tons, the
Vendor is due one-half (50%) of the additional day charge in accordance with paragraph 6.5.2a, Because
the Division of Highway's share of this daily production is 40%, the Division of Highways would pay 40%
of one-half of the additional day charge, or in this case, 20% of the additionai day charges.

6.5.3 In order to be paid for additional day charge, a ceriified statement shali accompany the invoice
stating the total quantity produced on that day. If payment for additional day of piant opening is not made
due to tonnage produced, the next consecutive day of piant operation, if any, will only qualify for payment
at the additional day rate, not the first day rate for plant opening. '

6.6 Pavement Profiling (Milling)-

6.6.1 Description of Work: This work shall consist of profiling the existing pavement to the specified

grade and cross siope by grinding, planning or milting. The profiling equipment shall be capable of

accurately establishing profile grades (1/4 inch plus or minus) along each edge of the machine by

reference from the existing pavement by use of ski or matching shoe or by reference to independent

grads control. The equipment shall have an automatic system for controlling grade and cross slope.
~ The Vendor shall provide adequate manpower and auxiliary equipment to control dust and remove
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cutting from the project site. Stockpiling of cuttings on the project site will not be permitted. Al

cuttings on the project site will not be permitted. Alf cutiings shall become the property of the Vendor.

The Vendor shall be responsible for damage to drainage facilities, manholes or other appurtenances
within the pavement area.

6.6.2 Method of Measurement:

6.6.2.1 Mobilization for Profiling: The work shall consist of preparatory operations including movement of
necessary personnel and equipment onto the project site to begin the profiling work. Only one
Mobilization for Profiling per Agency Release shall be paid when Pavement Profiling (Milling) is required.

'8.6.2.2 Pavement Profiling (Milling): Pavemént Profiling (Milling) shall be measured as the total number
of square yards planed or ground to a depth not exceeding two (2) inches. Should the required removal
depth exceed two (2) inches, additional quantities shall be measured for each additional two (2) inch
increment.

6.6.2.3 Haul of Profiled Cuttings: Hauling of cuttings from project site to the Vendor's nearest production
facility shall be paid under ltem V, Haul by Vendor, and weighted on truck scales in accordance with
Section 401.9.3 of the West Virginia Depattment of Transportation, Division of Highways' Standard
Specifications Roads and Bridges, adopted 2010 as modified by the January 1, 2011 Supplemental
Specifications.

6.7 Maintenance of Traffic

Maintenance of Traffic: Traffic Control and Temporary Pavement Marking-Paint may be furnished by the Division
of Highways. When Iltems AG, AH, Al, and AJ are requested, traffic shall be maintained by the Vendor in
accordance with Section 636 of the West Virginia Department of Transportation, Division of Highways' Standard
Specifications Roads and Bndges adopted 2010 as modified by the January 1, 2011 Supplemental
Specifications.

The project, while undergoing improvement, shall be kept open fo traffic in such condition that both local and
through traffic will be adequately and safely accommodated. All construction operations shall be scheduled by the
Contractor to keep traffic delay to a minimum.

6.8 HMA Base 1 Shoulder Paving

ltem Tis a surcharge for work performed to pave road shoulders. Work shall consist of installing and compacting
Base 1 HMA to the slevation of the existing pavement in the shoulder that is being paved.

HMA will be paid for with item A. Hauling of HMA will be paid for with item V. Lay Down will be paid for with item
W, Excavation will be paid for with item S.

HMA Base 2 Shoulder Paving

ltem U is a surcharge for work performed to pave shoulders. Work shall consist of installing and compacting Base
2 HMA to the efevation of the existing pavement in the shoulder that is being paved.

HMA will be paid for with item C. Hauling of HMA will be paid for with item V. Lay Down will be paid for with item
W. Excavation wili be paid for with item S.
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6.8.1 Excavation for shoulder paving: Work shall consist of removing existing shoulder material
for a length and width as directed by the Engineer in two inches (2"} vertical increments. Cost of
ioading, hauling and disposing of the excavated material shall be included in the unit bid price for
"Excavation for Shoulder Paving".

6.9 Pavement Repair

Work shall consist of squaring up the repair area, removing damaged material to a depth directed by the
Engineer, hauling and disposing of existing pavement, tacking of existing surfaces and placing and compacting
Base 2 HMA in lifts not exceeding fwo inches {2') to the level of the existing pavement. The cost of squaring,
removing, hauling and disposing of the existing pavement, supplying, tacking, placing and compacting the Base 2
HMA shall be included in the bid price for "Pavement Repair’. There will be no price adjustment to the asphait
used for item “AM" Pavement Repair.

6.10  Surcharge for Parking lot and Facilities Paving

A surcharge to be applied to items A-O when maierial is used o pave parking lofs.

6.11 Price Adjustment of Asphalt Cement

Due to the uncertainty in estimating the cost of petroleum products that will be used during the life of this contract,
adjustment in compensation for contract ltems A, B, C, D, E, F, G, H, |, J, K, L, M, N, O and P is provided for in
The Special Provision for Section 109 as Section 109.10 with the “C” factor being defined as the Average Asphalt
Content (AC) from the fable below multipiled by the Price index for bidding (Ib).

- AC (Average
ftem Description Asphalt Content
A | Section 401 Base | 3.9
B | Section 401 37.5mm Superpave 4.1
C | Section 401 Bass |l ‘ 5.0
"D | Section 401 Patch and Level 5.0
E | Section 401 Wearing [V 5.0
F | Section 402 Wearing 1V 4.9
‘G | Section 401 19mm Superpave 5.0
‘H | Section 401 Scratch Course . 5.7
| | Section 402 9.5mm Superpave 6.1
J_ | Section 401 Wearing | 5.7
K___1 Section 402 Wearing | 6.2
L | Section 401 4.75mm Superpave *
M | Section 402 4.75 mm Superpave ¥
N | Section 401 Wearing lil 7.6
O | Section 402 Wearing Il ' ¥
P | PlantRun 5.7

*values will be supplied when mix designs are approved,
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6.12  Price Adjustment of Fuel Oil No. 2 (Diesel Fusl}

Because of the uncertainty in estimating the cost of diesel fuel that will be used during the life of this contract,
adjustment in compansation for contract ltems A, B, C, D, EF, G, H, |, J, K, L, M, N and O is provided for in
The Special Provision for Section 109 as Section 109.9.

6.13  Surcharge for Warm-Mix Aéoha!t _

The cost difference for supplying Items A-O as Warm-Mix Asphall instead of Hot-Mix Asphalt(+) plus for increased
cost {-) minus for decreased cost.

6,14  Milled Rumble Strip

Milied Rumble Strips shall be constructed in accordance with "Rumble Strip Spemal Detail”. (See Figure 1 at the
end of the Specifications).

6.14.1 Mobilization for Milled Rumble Strips: Work shall consist of preparatory operations including
movement of necessary personnel and equipment onto project site to begin the work of milling rumble
strips. Only one mobilization for milling rumble strips per Agency Release shall be paid when milied
rumble strips are required.

7. MOBILIZATION FOR PAVING LIMITS

Mobilization for Paving, Items Z and AA will be paid when Vendor is required to place lay down quantities, ltem W,
under 500 tons. In addition, nighttime mobilization for paving, ItemZ, will oniy be paid when Vendor is directed by
_the Division of Highways Engineer to perform lay down at night.

Only one mobilization for paving per day of operation will be paid, unless moves of over five (5) miles between
individual paving locations are required. In cases where a Vendor is requnred to move from one roadway to the
adjacent roadway of a divided highway, additional mobilization for pavmg will only be paid if the nearest
interchange or crossing point that will accommodate the Vendor's equipment is over five (5) miles from the paving
locations. (This provision may require roundtrip moves of up fo ten (10) miles with no additional mobilization for
paving payment).

At an individual paving location where the Vendor is required to placé quantities of less than 500 tons on
successive days and/or nights, mobilization for paving will only be paid for the Initial day’s and/or night's operation.

An individual paving location shall be defined as a paving job where no skips exceeding 2500 feet are involved,
except between the approach slabs of a bridge or parallel pair of bridges.

8. WEIGHING MATERIALS DELIVERED BY TRUCK

Material delivered by truck shall be weighed in accordance with Section 401.9.3 of the West Virginia Department
of Transportation, Division of Highways' Standard Specifications Roads and Bridges, adopted 2010 as modified
by the January 1, 2011 Supplemental Specifications.



9. ACCEPTANCE PLAN

Quality control af the plant and in the field shall be the responsibility of the Vendor and shall meet the
requirements of MP 401.03,50.

Compaction quality control shall be in accordance with MP 401.05.20, Acceptance testing shall be the
responsibility of the Division of Highways.

~ Quality assurance of the material shall be as set forth in MP 401.02.27 for Marshall mix designs or MP 401.02.29
_for Superpave mix designs.

10.  WARM MIX ASPHALT

Warm-Mix_ Asphalt (WMA) produced using a water injection system may be substituted for Hot-Mix Asphalt
(HMA), at the discrefion of the Division of Highways Engineer; using Division of Highways approved HMA designs.
When WMA is used, the temperature of the completed mixture at the plant may be lowered to an estabiished
range that has previously been determined through trial production. The aliowable temperature range specified
on the approved T400 mix design form shall be adjusted accordingly when using WMA, In addition, typical
minimum HMA compaction temperatures shall be waived as long as additional density can be obtained at lower
temperatures without damaging the pavement.

1. SUPPLYING OTHER ORGANIZATION ENTITIES

Cohnty Courts, Municipalifies, School Boards and other political subdivision and governmental entities, efc, may
have a need for these materials, and Yendors may wish to supply that need.

Accordingly, bidders may wish to extend their contract prices to these other entities. If the bidder wishes to supply
these other entities, but with prices different from quoted for the Division of Highways, the bidder shall include a
set of bid schedules clearly and unambiguously marked for the express use of the entities other than the Division
of Highways. Failure by the bidder to include a set of bid schedules for other entities will be taken to mean that
the bid schedules extended to the Division of Highways will also be extended to these other entities.

in the event any Vendor does not wish to extend the prices, terms and conditions of his bid and subsequent
contract to other entities of the State, he must so indicate in a clear and unambiguous manner in his bid. This
indication does not prejudice the award of the contract. If a Vendor does not indicate his refusal to extend the
prices, ferms and conditions of his bid to other entities of the State, he is bound to extend them upon issuance of
a purchase order by these other entities.

Other organizational entities using this provision of the contract shall do so without any involvement of the Division

of Highways. That is, the enfity shall make its own purchase arrangements with the Vendor and shall make its
own arrangement for payment.

12.  VENDOR'S INVOICES

Separate invoices must be submitted for ltems “A” through R and for ltems "S" through ‘AQ". Vendor's invoices
must be submitted in original and one copy and contain the following:
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All weigh ticket numbers for material delivered and cuttings hauled during the invoicing period.
Division of Highways' Agency Release number and this contract number.

Total quantity and unit price with the total cost of each type of material furnished.

Vendors shall show all weigh ticket numbers on their individual invoices.

No payment will be made to a Contractor for ltem Z or AA unless he performs the lay down
operation and the quantity involved is less than 500 tons for ltem Z.

@0 oo

Under no circumstance will the Division of Highways accept, or pay for, quantities of material in excess of the
quantity stated on the Agency Relsase.
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.13 Bid Schedule - HOT MIX ASPHALT

Camden Materials, LI.C
Parkershurg, WV

District 3 - Calhoun County, Jackson County, Pleasants County, Ritchie

County, Roane County, Wirt County and Wood Count

lfem

item Description

Unit of
Measure

Cost Per
Unit

Hot-Mix Asphalt Section 401
Base |
FOB Vendor's Plant

TON

54.50

Hot-Mix Asphalt Section 401
37.5mm Superpave
FOB Vendor's Plant

TON

55.00

Hot-Mix Asphalt Section 401
Base {l
FOB Vendor's Plant

TON

57.50

Hot-Mix Asphalt Section 401
Patch and Level
FOB Vendor's Plant

TON

57.50

Hot-Mix Asphalt Section 401
Wearing IV
FOB Vendor's Plant

TON

57.50

Hot-Mix Asphait Section 402
Wearing IV
FOB Vendor's Plant

TON

72.00

Hot-Mix Asphalt Section 401
19mm Superpave
FOB Vendor's Plant

TON

59.00

Hot-Mix Asphalt Section 401
Seratch Course
FOB Vendor's Plant

TON

63.00

Hot-Mix Asphalt Section 402
9.5mm Superpave
FOB Vendor's Plant

"TON

70.00

Hot-Mix Asphalt Section 401
Wearing |
FOB Vendor's Plant

TON

63.00

Hot-Mix Asphalt Section 402
Wearing {
FOB Vendor's Plant

TON

69.00

Hot-Mix Asphalt Section 401
4,75mm Superpave
FOB Vendor's Plant

TON

72.00
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13 Bid Schedule -- HOT MIX ASPHALT

Camden Materials, LLC
Parkersburg, YW

District 3 - Calhoun County, Jackson County, Pleasants County, Ritchie

County, Roane County, Wirt County and Wood Count

, Unit of Cost Per
ftem item Dascription Measure Unit
Hot-Mix Asphalt Section 402
M |4.75mm Superpave TON - 72.00
FOB Vendor's Plant
Hot-Mix Asphalt Section 401
N |Wearing I! TON 87.00
FOB Vendor's Plant
Hot-Mix Asphalt Section 402
O |Wearing ill TON 67.00
FOB Vendor's Plant
Hot-Mix Asphait
P |PlantRun TON 68.00
FOB Vendor's Plant
Q  {Surcharge for PG70-22 Binder TON - 3.00
Surcharge for PG76-22 Binder
R NOTlgE: itam R will be ordered In 400 ton Increments TON 10.00
Excavation for Shouldser Paving
a) 0-1000 SQ YARD NO BID
S |[b) 1001-2000 SQ YARD NO BID
¢) 2001-3000 SQ YARD NO BID
d) 3001 and greater SQ YARD NO BID
HMA Base 1 Shoulder Paving Surcharge
- |la) 0-100 TON NO BID
T b} 101200 TON NO BID
¢c) 201-500 TON NQ BID
d) 501 and greater TON NO BID
HMA Base 2 Shoulder Paving Surcharge
a) 0-100- TON NO BID
U fb) 101-200 TON NO BID
: ¢) 201-500 TON NO BID
d) 501 and greater TON NO BID
Haul by Vendor
V' {a) First Ton Mile MILE NO BID
b) Each Additional Mile MILE NO BID
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Camden Materials, LLC 27
Parkersburg, WV

13 Bid Schedule -- HOT MIX ASPHALT
District 3 - Calhoun County, Jackson County, Pleasants County, Ritchie
County, Roane County, Wirt County and Wood County

Unit of Cost Per
ltem ltem Description Measure Unit

Lay Down of Materials
ltems A thru O, Each Site :
a) 0:100 TON NO BID

W b) 101-200 TON NO BID

¢) 201-500 TON NO BID

d) 501 and greater TON .| NOBID

X [Cleaning and Sweeping SQ YARD NO BID
{Bituminous Material for Tack Coat or Prime

Y Material furnished and applied under ltem Y to be GALLON NO BID

in accordance with Section 408 of the referenced
specifications as directed by the Engineer.

Daytlme Paving Mobilization

A Moblibation for Paving Charge may be made
Z  lwhen the purchase order quantily per paving See Descriptiol NOBID
location is less than 500 tons of Hot-Mix Asphalt
and night-time paving is not specified.

Nighttime Paving Mobilization
A Moblibation for Paving Charge may be made

AA when the Engineer directs that the paving is to See Descriptior)  NO BID
be done at night.
Off-Season Plant Opening
AB la) First Day : DAY 2,500.00
b) Each Additional Day : DAY 750.00 .
AC |Additional Heel-tn Joints | Lineal Foot NO BID
AD |Skip Paving Surcharge TON NO BID
AE  {Mobilization for Profiling PerAgency | \opip
_ Release
Payment Profiling {Milling)
a) Less than 250 SQ YARD NO BID
b). 251-500 SQ YARD NO BID
AF  |c) 501-1000 SQ YARD NO BID
d} 1001-2500 SQ YARD NO BID
e) 2501-5000 SQ YARD NO BID

f) 5001 and greater SQ YARD NO BID




13 Bid Schedule -~ HOT MIX ASPHALT
District 3 - Calhoun County, Jackson County, Pleasants County, Ritchie

County, Roane County, Wirt County and Wood Count

Camden Materials, LLC 28
Parkersburg, WV

Unit of Cost Per
item item Description Measure Unit
AG |Pilot Truck and Driver Per Day NO BID
AH {Traffic Control Devices UNIT NO BID
Al |Flagger HOUR NO BID
AJ |Arrow Board DAY NO BID
AK  Milled Rumble Strips Lineal Foot | NOBID
AL Mobiliza!ion for milled rumble strips Per Agency NO BID
_ Release
. Ton of
AM |Pavement Repair HMA Base 2 NO BID
Surcharge for Warm-Mix Asphalt
AN NOTIg Itam AN I3 for items A-O P TON NO BID
AO Surcharge for Parking Lot and Facility Paving TGN NO BID

NOTE: Hem AO s for lfems A-C

Vendor's Plant Location:
Parkersburg, WV




State of West‘Vlrglnla

Purchasing Divislon

Post Offlce Box 50130

RFQ COPY
TYPE NAME/ADDRESS HERE

*410155746
Camden Materials, LLC

2950 Charles Ave.
Dunbar, WV 25064

04/08/201.1

Department of Adininistration
2019 Washington Straet East
Charleston, WV 25308-0130

304-768-9733

Quotation

BU

304 -

33
558-2402

BY

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
ORDER

Destination

31D OPENING DATE!

001

ADDENDUM NO; 1
WIS ADDENDUM IS ISSUEL) TO EXTEND THE
_PROM:
04/13/2011 @ 1:30 PM
TO
04/20/2011 @ 1:30 BM
Hkkhk ks ndwre R xR xHEND ADDEUNDUM NO. 1#4
s Ta5-21
1 .
HOT MIX ASPHALT
Mpxwex  THIG [I8 THE END

TD OPENING DATE

kAW AR Rk TR A hhokR R

OF RFQ 6611C0

25 %w%%% %% TOTAL:

CENETHORS

LS8
3

ATE -
04-768-9733 - 04/20/2011

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABGVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS N SPACE ABQVE LABELED 'VENDOR'




GENERAL TERMS & CONDITIONS S
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION (RFQ) AND REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL (RFF)

1, Awards will be made In the best interest of the State of West Virginia.

2, The State may accept ot reject in part, o in whole, any bid. _ ' :

3. Prior to any award, the agparent successful vendor must be, properly tegisterad with the Purchasing Divislon
and have pald the required $125 fee. . : .
4, ANl services performed or goods delivered under State Purchase Order/Contraots are to be contihued for the
tarm of the Purchase Ordar/Conlracts, contingent upon funds heing appropriated b¥ the Leglslature or othetwlse -
belng made avallable. In the avent funds are not approprated or olherwlse avallable for thase setvices o gonds
this Purchase Order/Contract becomes vold and of no effect after June 30.

5, Paymant may only be made after the dallvery and acceptance of goods ar services.

6. Interest may be pald for late payment In accordance with the West Virginia Cods.

7. Vendor preference will he granted upon written request in accordance with the West Virginia Code.

8. The State of Wast Virginia is exempt from federal and state taxes and wlll not pay or reimburse such taxes.

9. The Direclor of Purchasihg may cancel any Purchase Order/Cenlract upon 30 days written nollcs to the sellor. .
. 40, The laws of the State of Wast Virginla and the Lagislative Rules of the Purchasing Division shall govern the
purchasing process. ‘ .

11, Any refarence to automatic renewal is heraby deleted. The Contract may be renewed only tpon muiual written
agreament of the parties. ‘

12. BANKRUPTCY: In the event the vendor/contractor flles for bankruptey protection, the State may deem
this contract null and vold, and terminate such contract without further order.

12. HIPAA BUSINESS ASSQCIATE ADDENDMM: The Wast Virginla State Goverhment HIPAA Business Associate -
Addendum (BAA), approvad by the Atlerney General, I8 avaliable online at www.statewv.us/admin/purchase/vrofhipag.him
and Is hersby made ert of the agresment. Provided that the Agency meets the definition of a Cover Entity
(46 CFR §160.103) and will be disclosing Protscted Health Information (48 GFR §180.103) to the vendor.

14, GONFIDENTIALITY: The vendor agrees that ha or she will not disclose to anyone, directly or indlrent!ly any such
ersonally identifieble Information or other cohfidential ihformation gained from the agency, unless the individual who is
he subjest of the information consents o the disclosure I wiling or the disclosure Is made pursuant to fhe agency's
policies, procedures, and rules, Vendor further- agrees to comply wilh the Confidentiality Policles and Information ..
Securlty Accountablifty Requirements, set forth i httpuf/www.state.wv.us/adminlpurchaselprl\raoyinotlceconffdemialily.pdf.

15. LICENSING: Vendors must be licensed and in gaod standing In accordance with any and all state and local faws and
requirements by any state of local agency of West Virginia, Including, but not limited to, the Wast Virginia Secrstary
of State's Office, the West Virginia Tax Depariment, and the West Vitginia Insurance Commission, The vendor . must
ptovide all necessaty releases to obtain  Information to  enable the director or spending  unlt “to
verify that the vendor is licensed and In good standing with the above entitles. '

16. ANTITRUST: In submitting a bid to any agenc?r for he State of West Virginia, the biddet offars and agrees lhét '
/1

it the bid is accepted the bidder will convey, sell, ass
i and to all causes of action it may now or hereafter acquire undar the antitrust laws of the United States and the State of
West Virginta for price lixing and/or ynreasonable resiraints of frade ralating to the partioular commodities or services
purchased or acquired by the State of Wast Virginia. Such asslgnment shail bs mads and become effective at the time the
purchasing agency tenders the Iniital payment to the bldder. : S

| cartify that this bid is made without prior understanding,. agreement, or connaolion with an{ cotporalion, firm, Iimied
lability company, parthership, or person of eniity submiting a hid for the same inaterlal, supplies, edquipment_of
setvices and Is In all respects falr and without collusion or Fraud. | furthet certify that | am authorized to slgn
the csriification on behalf of the bidder or this bid. - .

INSTRUGTIONS TOQ BIDDERS
1, Use the quotation forms provided by the Purchasing Diviston. Complete afl sections of the quotation form.

9. tems offerad must be in compliance with the spacifications. Any deviation from the specifications. must ba clearly
Indlcated by the bidder, Afternates offered by the bidder as-EQUAL to lhe speciiications must be cleary
defined. A bldder offering an alternate sheuld attach complete specifivations and literature to the bld. The
Purchasing Division may waive mihor deviations to spaocifioations.

3, Unit prices shall prevall In case of disctepancy. Al quotations are considered F.O.B. destination unless altarnate
shippling-terms are clearly identified In the guotation. .

4. All guotations must be delivered by thée bidder to the office lstad below prior to the date and time of the bld
apening. Failure of the bldder to daliver the quotations on tme will esult in bid disqualifications: Department of .
Adminisiration, Purchasing Division, 2019 Washington Street East, P.O. Box 50130, Chatleston, WV 263050130 - -

5. Communication during the sollcitaion, bid,. evaluatioh of award periods, except through the Purchasing Division,
is strictly prohibited (W.Va, C.8.R. §148-1-6.8). . .

. Rov, 12/15/08

1 or iransfer to the State of West Virginla all rights, ttle and interest -




State of West Vlrginla Hequest for B e
Depariment of Administration Quotatlon
Purchasing Division -
2019 Washington Street East
Post Offlos Box 60130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

RIFQ COPY
YPE NAME/ADDRESS HERE.

. 410155746 304-768-9733.

UYER 33
04-558-2402

LI - . B

U DTYISION OF HIGHWAYS
5| VARTOUS LOCALES A% INDICATED
BY ORDER

Camden Materials, LL.C
2950 Charles Ave.
Dunkar, WV 25064

REERE T O

...... SRR

04/11/2011 Net 30 Truck I Net 30
BID OPENING DATE: . . .

- | RDDENDUM -NO, 2

IS ADDENDUN IS IS88UED TO CORRECT gPEQIFICATION PER
'HRE ATTACHED BID OPENING REMAINS 04/ ﬁO/ 2011 AT
1:30 PM. : : )

£ W I B |

Akkkwkkk k¥ kAAFxAHTEND ADDENDUM NO. 2**»)*****wwww***wwww

door B P fas-21
S
HOT MIX ASPHALT ...

fhexsx THIG|TS THE END OF RFQ  6611C025 kAN ik TOTAL:,

L " o 304.768-673 ©04/20/2011
Manading Me N 20-4662043 ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE
WHEN F\‘EQF’ONDING TORFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'




GENERAL TERMS & CONDITIONS =
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION (RFG) AND REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL (RFF)

1. Awards will bo macde In the best Interest of the State of Wesi Virginia.

2. The State may accept or refect In part, or I whole, any bid,

3. Prior 1o anr award, the apparent successful vendor must be properly registerad with the Purchasing Division
and have paid the requlred $125 fee,

4, All services petformed or goods deliverad under Stats Puichase Order/Contracts are to be contihued for the
tarm of the Purchase Qrder/Contracts, contingent upon funds belng approptiated by the Legislalure or olhetwise
belng made avallable. Iy the event funds are not eppropriated or otharwise available for those services or goods
this Purchase Qrdet/Contract bacomes vold and of no effect after June 30.

5. Payment may only be made after the delivery and acceplance of goods or services,

5. Interest may be pald for lats payment in accordance with the Weat Vitginia Code.

7. Vondor preference will be granted upon written request fn accordance with the West Virginla Code.

8. The Stats of West Virginia is exempt from federal and state taxes and will not pay or relmburse such taxes.

8. The Director of Purchasing may cancel any Purchase Ordet/Coniragt upon 30 days wiltten noflce to the sellet.

10. The-laws of the State of West Virginla and the Leglslative Rules of the Purchaslng Divislon shall govern the
purchasing process.

1. Any refsrence to automatic renswal s hereby deleted. The Contract may be renewad only upon mutual written
agraament of the parties.

12. BANKHUPTCY: In the event the vendot/contractor files for banktuptoy protection, the State may deem
this contract null and vold, and tetminate such contract without further order.

13. HIPAA BUSINESS ASSOCIATE ADDENDUM: The West Virginia Stata Govarnmant HIPAA Businass Assoclate
-Addendum (BAA), approved by the Attorney General, Is avallable online at www.state.wv.us/adgmin/purchassfyre/ipaa.iitm
and |s harehy made dpart of the agreement. Provided that the Agency meets the definllion of a Cover Entity
(46 CFR §160.103) and will be disclusing Protested Health Information (45 CFR §160.103) te the vendor.

14. CONFIDENTIALITY: The vendor agress What he or she will hot disclesa to anyona, diracily or Indlreglly, any suol
parsonally identiiiable Inforination or other confidential information gained from the agency, unless the indiviciuat who is -
the subject of the Information consents to the disclosure in writing or the disclostire Is. made E’ursuant o the agency's
gollcies, ptocedures, and rules. Vendor further agrees o aomply with the Confidehtialily Policles and infonnation

soutily Accountabillly Requirements, set fortit in http:!Mww.state.wv.usfadmIn/purchasefprluacy/nolicaoonﬂdenliality.pdf.

"1, LICENSING: Vendors must be licensed and In good standing In accordance.with argr and all state and local laws and-
requitements by any state or local agency of West Virginia, Including, but not limited to, the Waest Virginia Sacretar
of State's Office, the Waest Virginia Tax Departinent, and the West irginia Insurance Gommission. The yendor mus
provide  all necessarr roleasas to  obtain  Informafion to enable " Whe director or spending unit to
verlly that the vancdor is Hoensed and in goud standing with the above enthies, '

16. ANTITRUST: It submittng a bld to any agency for the State of Wast Virglnia, this bidder offers and agraes that
If the bid Is accepted the bidder will convey sell, asslgh or transfer to the State of West Virginla all 1l hts, thie and Intarest
In and 1o all cauges of agtion it ma}' how or herqafter acculre yndet the antitrust laws of the Unlted States and the State of
West Virginta for pice fixing andfor unreasonable rastraints of trade relating to the partioular commodities or sarvices
purchased or acquired by the Siate of West Virginia, Stich assignment shall be made and bacome effective at the time the
purchasing agenoy teniders the fnltial payment to the biclder, :

| oartify that this bld Is mads without prior understanding, agresment, or connection with any corporation, firm, limitad
flabliity company, partnership, or person or eniity stbmiting a bid for the same matetal, supplies, equipmeant or
eorvices and Is I all respects fair and without collusion or Fraud. § further certify that 1 am aulhotizad to slgn
the certification on bahalf of the bidder or this bid. ,

INSTRUCTIONS TO BlDDEHS _
1, Use the guotation forms provided by the Purchasihg Divislon. Complets all sactions of the quotation forim,

2, ltams offered muyst be in compliance with the specifications. Any deviation from the specifications must be clearly
indicated by ihe biddar. Alternates offered by lhe bidder as EQUAL to the spaclficalions must be clearly
defined. bldder offerlnfu an alternate should atiach complete speoifications and Bterature to the bid, The
Purchasing Diviston may walve minor deviations to spacitioations,

3, Unit prioes shall prevall Ih case of discrepanocy, All quotations are considered F.O.B. destination Unless altarnate
shipping terms are olaarly identifled in the quotation.

4, All quotations must be delivered by the bldder to the offico listed balow ptior to the date and time of the bid
opening. Fallure of the bidder to deliver the quetations on time wil rasult in bid disqualifioations; Department of
Administration, Purchasipg Division, 2018 Washihgton Strest East, P.O, Box 50130, Charleston, WV 26305-0130

§. Communication during the solicltation, bid, evaluation or award perinds, except through the Purchasing Divislon,
Is strietly prohibited (W.Va. C.8.R. §148-1-6.6).

Rev. 12/16/08




ADDENDUM RO, 2

1. To correct the night-fime mobhiiization item number identified in the
first paragraph, the second sentence of section 7. Mobilization for
Paving Limits.

Currently reads:
7. MOBILIZATION FOR PAVING LIMITS

o vinen..In addition, nighttime mobilization for paving, item Z, will only be paild when Vendot
is directed by the Division of Highways Engineer to perform lay down at night.

Should read:

7. MOBILIZATION FOR PAVING LIMITS

........... In addition, nighttime mobilization for paving, ttem AA, will only be pald when
Vendor Is diracted by the Division of Highways Engineer to perform lay down at hight,
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Rev. 09/08

State of West Virginia
VENDOR PREFERENCE CERTlFICATE

Certification and application* is hereby made for Preference in accordance with West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37. (Does notapply to
construction contracts). West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37, provides an opportunity for qualifying vendors to request (at the time of bid)
preference for their residency staius. Such preference is an evaluation method only and will be applied only to the cost bid in
accordance with the West Virginia Code. This certificate for application is tobe used to request such preference, The Purchasing
Division will make the determination of the Resident Vendor Preferencs, if applicable.

1. Application is made for 2.5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:

_____ Bidderisan individual resident vendor and has resided continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preced-
ing the date of this certification; of,

_____ Bidderisa partnership, association or corporation resident vendor and has maintained its headquarters or principat place of

business continuousty in West Virginia for four (4} years immediately preceding the date of this certification;, or 80% of the

ownership interest of Bidder is held by another individual, partnership, association or corporafion resident vendor who has

maintained its headquarters or principal place of business continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately

preceding the date of this certification, or,

Bidder is a nonresident vendor which has an affiliate or subsidiary which employs a minimum of one hundred state residents

and which has maintained its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia continuously for the four 4)

years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or,

i

Application is made for 2 5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is a resident vendor who certifies that, during the life of the contract, on average at least 75% of the employees
working on the project being bid are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state confinuously for the two years
immediately preceding submission of this bid; or,

Application is made for 2 5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is a nonresident vendor employing a minimum of one hundred state residents orisa nonresident vendor with an
affiliate or subsidiary which maintains its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia employing a
minimum of one hundred state residents who certifies that, during the life of the contract, on average at least 75% of the
employees or Bidder's affiliate’s or subsidiary's employees are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state
continuously for the two years immediately preceding submission of this bid; or,

\ @

Applicatton s made for 5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:
Bidder meets either the requirement of both subdivisions (1) and (2) or subdivision (1) and (3) as stated above, oF,

Application is made for 3.5% resident vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked:

Bidderis an individual resident vendor whois a veteran of the United States armed forces, {he reserves or the National Guard
and has resided in West Virginia continuousty for the four years immediately preceding the date on which the bid is
submitted; or,

| b

6. Application is made for 3.5% resident vendor preference whois a veteran for the reason checked:

____ Bidderisa resident vendor who s a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard, if, for
purposes of producing or distributing the commodities or completing the project which s the subject of the vendor’s bid and
continuously over the entire term of the project, on everage at |oast seventy-five percent of the vendor's employees are

" residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two immediately preceding years,

Bidder understands if the Secretary of Revenue determines that a Bidder receiving preference has failed to continue to meet the
requirements for such preference, the Secretary may order the Director of Purchasing to: {a) reject the bid; or {b) assess a penalty
against such Bidder inan amount not to exceed 5% of the bid amount and that such penaity will be paid to the contracting agency
or deducted from any unpaid halance on the contract or purchase order.

By submission of this certificate, Bidder agrees to disclose any reasonably requested information to the Purchasing Division and
authorizes the Department of Revenue to disclose to the Director of Purchasing appropriate information verifying that Bidder has paid
the required business taxes, provided that such information does not contain the amounts of taxes paid nor any other information
deemed by the Tax Commissioner to be confidential.

Under penalty of law for false swearing (West Virginia Code, §61-5-3), Bidder heteby certifies that this certificate is true
and accurate in all respects; and that if a contract is issued to Bidder and if anything contained within this certificate
changes during the term of the contract, Bidder will notify the Purc : V pdiate

Bidder: Camden Materials, LLC

Date: _ April 13, 2011 Title: © Managing ember

*Chack any comblnation of preference considaration(s) indicated above, which you are entitled to receive.



L
State of West Virginia

DRUG FREE WORKPLACE CONFORMANCE AFFIDAVIT
West Virginia Code §21-1D-5

STATE OF Wast Virginia
COUNTY OF Kanawha , TO-WIT:
1, Methew Campbel , after being first duly sworn, depose and

state as follows:
Camden Materials, LLC

{Company Name)

2, I do hereby attest that : Camden Materials, LLC
(Company Name)

1. I am an employee of ; and,

maintains a valid written drug free workplace policy and that such
policy Is in compliance with West Virginia Code §21-1D-5,

The above statements are sworn to under the penalty of perjury.

Camden Materials, LLC
(Company Na

By:

Title: anaging Member

Date: April 20, 2011

Taken, subscribed and sworn to before me this M day of M L227.

By Commlssmn explr@y/\% e 2

COMPLY WITH WV CODE PRO NS. FAILURE TO INCLUDE TH

AFFID ITH THE BID SHALL RESULT I ALIFICATION
THE BID.

Rev March 2009
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RFQ No.  6611C025

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
Purchasing Division

PURCHASING AFFIDAVIT

West Virginia Code §5A-3-10a states: Mo contract or renewal of any contract may be awarded by the state or any of its
political subdivisions to any vendor or prospective vendor when the vendor or prospective vendor or a related parly to the
vendor or prospeciive vendor is a debtor and the debt owed is an amount greater than one thousand dollars in the
aggregate.

DEFINITIONS:

“Nebt” means any assessment, premium, penalty, fine, tax or other amount of money owad to the state or any of its
poiitical subdivisions because of a judgment, fine, permit violation, license assessment, defaulted workers' compensation
premium, penalty or other assessment presently delinguent or due and required to be paid to the state or any of its
political subdivisions, including any interest or additional penalties accrued thereon.

“Debtor” means any individual, corporation, partnership, assoclation, limited Yability company ot any other form or
business assoclation owing a debt to the state or any of its political subdivisions. “Political subdivision” means any county
commission; municipality; county board of education; any instrumentality established by a county or municipality; any
separate corporation or instrumentality established by one or more counties or municipalities, as permitted by law; or any
public body charged by law with the performance of a government function or whose jurisdiction is coextensive with one
or more counties or municipalities. “Related parfy’ means a party, whether an individual, corporation, partnership,
association, fimited liability company or any other form or business association or other entity whatsoever, related to any
vendor by blood, marriage, ownership or contract through which the parly has a refationship of ownership or other interest
with the vendor so that the party will actually or by effect receive or control a portion of the benefit, profit or other
consideration from performance of a vendor contract with the parly receiving an amount that meets or exceed five percent
of the total contract amount.

EXCEPTION: The prohibition of this section doas not apply where a vendor has contested any tax administered pursuant
to chapter eleven of this code, workers' compensation premium, permit fee or environmental fee or assessment and the
matter has not become final or where the vendor has entered into a payment plan or agreement and the vendor is not in
default of any of the provisions of such plan or agreement.

Under penalty of law for false swearlng (West Virginia Code §61-5-3), it is hereby certified that the vendor affirms and
acknowledges the informatio_n in this affidavit and is in compliance with the requirements as stated.

WtTNESS THE FOLLOWING SIGNATURE
Vendor's Name: Camden Materials, LLC = _——

Authorized Signature: ‘%/ i}_/ Date: APl 13,2011

State of West Virginia

Gounty of ____Kanawha , to-wit:
Taken, subscribed, and sworn to before me this [_3_” day of "-747»40/ , 20 ZL
My Commlssion expire&ﬁﬁua/l?/ ,20//7.

AFFIX SEAL HERE NOTARY PUBLIC @%w—

Purchasing Affldavit (Revised 12/15/09) '



