



**State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division**

NOTICE

Due to the size of this bid, it was impractical to scan every page for online viewing. We have made an attempt to scan and publish all pertinent bid information. However, it is important to note that some pages were necessarily omitted.

If you would like to review the bid in its entirety, please contact the buyer. Thank you.



State of West Virginia
 Department of Administration
 Purchasing Division
 2019 Washington Street East
 Post Office Box 50130
 Charleston, WV 25305-0130

Request for Quotation

RFQ NUMBER
6611C023

PAGE
1

ADDRESS CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTENTION OF
**BUYER 33
 304-558-2402**

VENDOR

*709034622 540-992-5500
 C3M INC SUMMIT HELICOPTERS INC
 PO BOX 39

 CLOVERDALE VA 24077

SHIP TO

**DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
 VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
 BY ORDER**

DATE PRINTED	TERMS OF SALE	SHIP VIA	F.O.B.	FREIGHT TERMS
02/08/2011				

BID OPENING DATE: **03/16/2011** BID OPENING TIME **01:30PM**

LINE	QUANTITY	UOP	CAT. NO.	ITEM NUMBER	UNIT PRICE	AMOUNT
0001	1	EA		675-85		
<p>CONTRACT TO FURNISH: HERBICIDES</p> <p style="text-align: center;">REQUEST FOR QUOTATION (RFQ) OPEN END CONTRACT</p> <p>THE WEST VIRGINIA STATE PURCHASING DIVISION FOR THE AGENCY, THE WEST VIRGINIA DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS, IS SOLICITING BIDS FOR AN OPEN END CONTRACT TO PROVIDE HERBICIDES AND ADJUVANTS FOR ALL TEN DISTRICTS PER THE ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS.</p> <p>TECHNICAL QUESTIONS CONCERNING THIS SOLICITATION MUST BE SUBMITTED IN WRITING TO SHERI SLONE IN THE WEST VIRGINIA STATE PURCHASING DIVISION VIA MAIL AT THE ADDRESS SHOWN IN THE BODY OF THIS RFQ, VIA FAX AT 304-558-4115, OR VIA EMAIL AT SHERI.D.SLONE@WV.GOV. DEADLINE FOR ALL TECHNICAL QUESTIONS IS 02/25/2011 AT THE CLOSE OF BUSINESS. ANY TECHNICAL QUESTIONS RECEIVED WILL BE ANSWERED BY FORMAL ADDENDUM TO BE ISSUED BY THE PURCHASING DIVISION AFTER THE DEADLINE HAS LAPSED.</p> <p style="text-align: center;">MANDATORY PRE-BID</p> <p>A MANDATORY PRE-BID WILL BE HELD ON FRIDAY 02/18/2011 AT 10 AM IN CHARLESTON, WV, 2019 WASHINGTON ST E. ALL INTERESTED PARTIES ARE REQUIRED TO ATTEND THIS MEETING. FAILURE TO ATTEND THE MANDATORY PRE-BID SHALL RESULT I</p>						

RECEIVED

2011 MAR 15 A 10:12

PURCHASING DIVISION
STATE OF WV

SEE REVERSE SIDE FOR TERMS AND CONDITIONS

SIGNATURE	TELEPHONE	DATE
TITLE	FEIN	ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'

GENERAL TERMS & CONDITIONS REQUEST FOR QUOTATION (RFQ) AND REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL (RFP)

1. Awards will be made in the best interest of the State of West Virginia.
2. The State may accept or reject in part, or in whole, any bid.
3. Prior to any award, the apparent successful vendor must be properly registered with the Purchasing Division and have paid the required \$125 fee.
4. All services performed or goods delivered under State Purchase Order/Contracts are to be continued for the term of the Purchase Order/Contracts, contingent upon funds being appropriated by the Legislature or otherwise being made available. In the event funds are not appropriated or otherwise available for these services or goods this Purchase Order/Contract becomes void and of no effect after June 30.
5. Payment may only be made after the delivery and acceptance of goods or services.
6. Interest may be paid for late payment in accordance with the *West Virginia Code*.
7. Vendor preference will be granted upon written request in accordance with the *West Virginia Code*.
8. The State of West Virginia is exempt from federal and state taxes and will not pay or reimburse such taxes.
9. The Director of Purchasing may cancel any Purchase Order/Contract upon 30 days written notice to the seller.
10. The laws of the State of West Virginia and the *Legislative Rules* of the Purchasing Division shall govern the purchasing process.
11. Any reference to automatic renewal is hereby deleted. The Contract may be renewed only upon mutual written agreement of the parties.
12. **BANKRUPTCY:** In the event the vendor/contractor files for bankruptcy protection, the State may deem this contract null and void, and terminate such contract without further order.
13. **HIPAA BUSINESS ASSOCIATE ADDENDUM:** The West Virginia State Government HIPAA Business Associate Addendum (BAA), approved by the Attorney General, is available online at www.state.wv.us/admin/purchase/vrc/hipaa.htm and is hereby made part of the agreement. Provided that the Agency meets the definition of a Cover Entity (45 CFR §160.103) and will be disclosing Protected Health Information (45 CFR §160.103) to the vendor.
14. **CONFIDENTIALITY:** The vendor agrees that he or she will not disclose to anyone, directly or indirectly, any such personally identifiable information or other confidential information gained from the agency, unless the individual who is the subject of the information consents to the disclosure in writing or the disclosure is made pursuant to the agency's policies, procedures, and rules. Vendor further agrees to comply with the Confidentiality Policies and Information Security Accountability Requirements, set forth in <http://www.state.wv.us/admin/purchase/privacy/noticeConfidentiality.pdf>.
15. **LICENSING:** Vendors must be licensed and in good standing in accordance with any and all state and local laws and requirements by any state or local agency of West Virginia, including, but not limited to, the West Virginia Secretary of State's Office, the West Virginia Tax Department, and the West Virginia Insurance Commission. The vendor must provide all necessary releases to obtain information to enable the director or spending unit to verify that the vendor is licensed and in good standing with the above entities.
16. **ANTITRUST:** In submitting a bid to any agency for the State of West Virginia, the bidder offers and agrees that if the bid is accepted the bidder will convey, sell, assign or transfer to the State of West Virginia all rights, title and interest in and to all causes of action it may now or hereafter acquire under the antitrust laws of the United States and the State of West Virginia for price fixing and/or unreasonable restraints of trade relating to the particular commodities or services purchased or acquired by the State of West Virginia. Such assignment shall be made and become effective at the time the purchasing agency tenders the initial payment to the bidder.

I certify that this bid is made without prior understanding, agreement, or connection with any corporation, firm, limited liability company, partnership, or person or entity submitting a bid for the same material, supplies, equipment or services and is in all respects fair and without collusion or Fraud. I further certify that I am authorized to sign the certification on behalf of the bidder or this bid.

INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS

1. Use the quotation forms provided by the Purchasing Division. Complete all sections of the quotation form.
2. Items offered must be in compliance with the specifications. Any deviation from the specifications must be clearly indicated by the bidder. Alternates offered by the bidder as **EQUAL** to the specifications must be clearly defined. A bidder offering an alternate should attach complete specifications and literature to the bid. The Purchasing Division may waive minor deviations to specifications.
3. Unit prices shall prevail in case of discrepancy. All quotations are considered F.O.B. destination unless alternate shipping terms are clearly identified in the quotation.
4. All quotations must be delivered by the bidder to the office listed below prior to the date and time of the bid opening. Failure of the bidder to deliver the quotations on time will result in bid disqualifications: Department of Administration, Purchasing Division, 2019 Washington Street East, P.O. Box 50130, Charleston, WV 25305-0130
5. Communication during the solicitation, bid, evaluation or award periods, except through the Purchasing Division, is strictly prohibited (W.Va. C.S.R. §148-1-6.6).



State of West Virginia
 Department of Administration
 Purchasing Division
 2019 Washington Street East
 Post Office Box 50130
 Charleston, WV 25305-0130

Request for Quotation

RFO NUMBER
6611C023

PAGE
2

ADDRESS CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTENTION OF
**BUYER 33
 304-558-2402**

VENDOR

*709034622 540-992-5500
 C3M INC SUMMIT HELICOPTERS INC
 PO BOX 39
 CLOVERDALE VA 24077

SHIP TO

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
 VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
 BY ORDER

DATE PRINTED	TERMS OF SALE	SHIP VIA	F.O.B.	FREIGHT TERMS
02/08/2011				

BID OPENING DATE: **03/16/2011** BID OPENING TIME **01:30PM**

LINE	QUANTITY	UOP	CAT NO	ITEM NUMBER	UNIT PRICE	AMOUNT
<p>DISQUALIFICATION OF THE BID. NO ONE PERSON MAY REPRESENT MORE THAN ONE BIDDER.</p> <p>AN ATTENDANCE SHEET WILL BE MADE AVAILABLE FOR ALL POTENTIAL BIDDERS TO COMPLETE. THIS WILL SERVE AS THE OFFICIAL DOCUMENT VERIFYING ATTENDANCE AT THE MANDATOR PRE-BID. FAILURE TO PROVIDE YOUR COMPANY AND</p> <p>EXHIBIT 10</p> <p>REQUISITION NO.:</p> <p>ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT</p> <p>I HEREBY ACKNOWLEDGE RECEIPT OF THE FOLLOWING CHECKED ADDENDUM(S) AND HAVE MADE THE NECESSARY REVISIONS TO MY PROPOSAL, PLANS AND/OR SPECIFICATION, ETC.</p> <p>ADDENDUM NO.'S:</p> <p>NO. 1 ✓</p> <p>NO. 2</p> <p>NO. 3</p> <p>NO. 4</p> <p>NO. 5</p> <p>I UNDERSTAND THAT FAILURE TO CONFIRM THE RECEIPT OF THE ADDENDUM(S) MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF BIDS.</p> <p>VENDOR MUST CLEARLY UNDERSTAND THAT ANY VERBAL REPRESENTATION MADE OR ASSUMED TO BE MADE DURING ANY</p>						

SEE REVERSE SIDE FOR TERMS AND CONDITIONS

SIGNATURE	TELEPHONE	DATE
-----------	-----------	------

TITLE	FEIN	ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE
-------	------	-----------------------------------



State of West Virginia
 Department of Administration
 Purchasing Division
 2019 Washington Street East
 Post Office Box 50130
 Charleston, WV 25305-0130

Request for Quotation

RFQ NUMBER
 6611C023

PAGE
 3

ADDRESS CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTENTION OF
 BUYER 33
 304-558-2402

PROPERTY


*709034622 540-992-5500
 C3M INC SUMMIT HELICOPTERS INC
 PO BOX 39
 CLOVERDALE VA 24077

SHIP TO

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
 VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
 BY ORDER

DATE PRINTED	TERMS OF SALE	SHIP VIA	F.O.B.	FREIGHT TERMS
02/08/2011				

BID OPENING DATE: 03/16/2011 BID OPENING TIME 01:30PM

LINE	QUANTITY	UOP	CAT NO	ITEM NUMBER	UNIT PRICE	AMOUNT
<p>ORAL DISCUSSION HELD BETWEEN VENDOR'S REPRESENTATIVES AND ANY STATE PERSONNEL IS NOT BINDING. ONLY THE INFORMATION ISSUED IN WRITING AND ADDED TO THE SPECIFICATIONS BY AN OFFICIAL ADDENDUM IS BINDING.</p> <p style="text-align: center;">  SIGNATURE SUMMIT HELICOPTERS INC COMPANY 3/11/11 DATE </p> <p>NOTE: THIS ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT SHOULD BE SUBMITTED WITH THE BID.</p> <p>REV. 09/21/2009 EXHIBIT 3</p> <p>LIFE OF CONTRACT: THIS CONTRACT BECOMES EFFECTIVE UPON AWARD AND EXTENDS FOR A PERIOD OF ONE (1) YEAR OR UNTIL SUCH "REASONABLE TIME" THEREAFTER AS IS NECESSARY TO OBTAIN A NEW CONTRACT OR RENEW THE ORIGINAL CONTRACT. THE "REASONABLE TIME" PERIOD SHALL NOT EXCEED TWELVE (12) MONTHS. DURING THIS "REASONABLE TIME" THE VENDOR MAY TERMINATE THIS CONTRACT FOR ANY REASON UPON GIVING THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING 30 DAYS WRITTEN NOTICE.</p> <p>UNLESS SPECIFIC PROVISIONS ARE STIPULATED ELSEWHERE IN THIS CONTRACT DOCUMENT, THE TERMS, CONDITIONS AND PRICING SET HEREIN ARE FIRM FOR THE LIFE OF THE CONTRACT.</p>						

SEE REVERSE SIDE FOR TERMS AND CONDITIONS

SIGNATURE	TELEPHONE	DATE
-----------	-----------	------

TITLE	FEIN	ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE
-------	------	-----------------------------------

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'

10. **TRAINING AND TECHNICAL ASSISTANCE**

In order to bid on and be awarded items on this contract, the vendor must have a representative, holding a valid Category 7 certification in WV, available to provide training and technical assistance as required or upon request by WV Division of Highways personnel, including but not limited to, an annual WV Division of Highways Vegetation Management Seminar and this person is encouraged to attend the mandatory pre-bid meeting. Each bidder should submit name and telephone number of representative with bid. The company shall have a valid Category 12 certification in West Virginia. Copies of these certifications should be submitted with the bid.

Failure to comply will result in awarding that vendor's Items to the next lowest compliant bidder.

<u>NAME OF REPRESENTATIVE</u>	<u>PHONE NUMBER</u>	<u>ADDRESS</u>
<u>PAUL B. THOMAS</u>	<u>540 314 4903</u>	<u>8617 Hazrell Mill RD Waverly, VA 23890</u>
_____	_____	_____

11. **MANDATORY PRE-BID**

There will be a mandatory pre-bid meeting on (requesting Friday, February 18, 2011 – this date coincides with the Vegetation Management Seminar being held on Thursday, February 17, 2011).

**Location: Purchasing Division Conference Room
2019 Washington Street, East, Building 15
Charleston, WV 25305**

The "Bid Schedule" is available for download on Purchasing's Web site at www.state.wv.us/admin/purchase

Item #	Description	% Concentration/ Pounds per Gallon of Active Ingredients	Estimated Quantity	Unit of Measure	Cost Per Unit of Measure	Extended Cost
20H-1H	Water Soluble Emulsifiable Concentrate Containing: Ammonium Salt of Fosamine with Surfactant Product Trade Name: Krenite S or equal EPA Registration Number: 352-395 A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons B) Supplied in 15 gallon returnable/refillable containers	4 lbs/gallon	3000	gallon	65.60	\$196800.00
20H-2H	Water Soluble Emulsifiable Concentrate Containing: Isopropylamine Salt of Glyphosate Phosphate Ester Surfactant Product Trade Name: Roundup Pro Concentrate or equal EXTRA CREDIT 5 EPA Registration Number: 71368 - 43 A) Supplied in 30 gallon plastic returnable drums. Extra Credit 5 B) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons Extra Credit 5 C) Supplied in 15 gallon returnable/refillable containers D) Supplied in 150 gallon returnable/refillable shuttle.	50.20%	6000	gallon	\$15.00	\$90000.00
20H-3H	Dispersible Granules Containing: Sulfometuron Methyl Product Trade Name: Oust XP or equal EPA Registration Number: 352-601 A) Supplied in 3 pound containers in lots of 24 pounds B) Supplied in 3 pound jug	75%	100	pound	\$39.65	\$3965.00
20H-4H	Water Soluble Aqueous Suspension Containing: Oryzalin Product Trade Name: Oryzalin 4 Pro or equal EPA Registration Number: A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons	4 lbs/gallon	250	gallon	-	NO BID

Item #	Description	% Concentration/ Pounds per Gallon of Active Ingredients		Estimated Quantity		Cost Per Unit of Measure		Extended Cost
				Unit of Measure	Unit of Measure			
DOH-5H	Aqueous Solution Containing: Imazapyr	2 lbs/gallon						
	Product Trade Name: Arsenal Powerline or equal Polaris Herbicide							
	EPA Registration Number: 241-431 / 288-534							
	A) Supplied in 1 quart containers in lots of 4 quarts			600	quart	-	No Bid	
DOH-6H	B) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons POLARIS HERB							
	C) Supplied in 15 gallon drums ARSENALPOWERLINE							
	Aqueous Carrier Containing: Pendimethalin	3.8 lbs/gallon						
DOH-7H	Product Trade Name: Pendulum AquaCap or equal PEN DEE 3.3 I&O							
	EPA Registration Number: 19713-590							
	A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons							
	Water Soluble Concentrate Containing: Triclopyr	3 lbs/gallon						
DOH-7H	Product Trade Name: Garlon 3A or equal Tahoe 3A							
	EPA Registration Number: 62719-37 / 228-520							
	A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons TAHOE 3A							
	B) Supplied in 30 gallon containers TAHOE 3A							
DOH-8H	C) Supplied in 15 gallon continuum returnable/refillable containers in pallets of 9 containers. GARLON 3A							
	Water Soluble Concentrate Containing: Triclopyr	4 lbs/gallon						
	Product Trade Name: Garlon 4 Ultra or equal TAHOE 4E							
DOH-8H	EPA Registration Number: 62719-527 / 228-517							
	A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons TAHOE 4E							
	B) Supplied in 30 gallon containers TAHOE 4E							
	C) Supplied in 15 gallon continuum returnable/refillable containers in pallets of 9 containers. GARLON 4 ULTRA							

Item #	Description	% Concentration/ Pounds per Gallon of Active Ingredients	Estimated Quantity		Unit of Measure	Cost Per Unit of Measure	Extended Cost
			Estimated Quantity	Unit of Measure			
HERBICIDES							
00H-9H	A Water Soluble Dispersible Granule Containing: Diuron Product Trade Name: Karmex XP or equal EPA Registration Number: 352-692 A) Supplied in 5 pound bags in lots of 10 bags B) Supplied in 25 pound bags	80.00%	2000	pound	\$8.55	\$17100.00	
00H-10H	Water Soluble Liquid Containing: Dimethylamine Salt of 2, 4-D acid Product Trade Name: DM A4 or equal WEDESTROY AM 40 EPA Registration Number: 62719-3 / 228-145 A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons B) Supplied in 30 gallon containers C) Supplied in 15 gallon returnable/refillable containers in pallets of 9 containers. DMA 4	3.8 lbs/gallon	100	gallon	\$16.25	\$1625.00	
00H-11H	Water Soluble Liquid Containing: Ammonium Salt of imazapic Product Trade Name: Plateau or equal PANORAMIC EPA Registration Number: 241-365 / 66222-141-81927 A) Supplied in 1 gallon containers in lots of 2 gallons B) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons C) Supplied in 1.44 ounce packets in lots of 14 packets D) Supplied in 1 quart containers in lots of 4 quarts PANORAMIC 2SL E) Supplied in 15 gallon containers	23.60%	50	gallon	\$138.80	\$6940.00	
00H-12H	A Dispersible Liquid Containing: Hexazinone Product Trade Name: Velpar L or equal EPA Registration Number: 352-392 A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons	2 lbs/gallon	50	gallon	\$67.80	\$3390.00	

HERBICIDES		Description	% Concentration/ Pounds per Gallon of Active Ingredients	Estimated Quantity	Unit of Measure	Cost Per Unit of Measure	Extended Cost
Item #							
OH-13H	Dry Flowable Containing: Metsulfuron Methyl	Product Trade Name: Escort XP or equal EPA Registration Number: 352-439 A) Supplied in 16 ounce containers in lots of 8 pounds (8-16 oz ctrs) B) Supplied in 16 ounce jugs C) Supplied in 64 ounce jug returnable/refillable	60%	2400	ounce	\$4.76	\$11424.00
				2400	ounce	\$7.95	\$19080.00
				2400	ounce	\$3.94	\$9480.00
OH-14H	Water Soluble Granule Herbicide Containing: Ammonium Salt of Glyphosate	Product Trade Name: Roundup Pro Dry or equal EPA Registration Number: 524-535 A) Supplied in 23.25 pound box	71.40%	25	box	\$53.75	\$1343.75
OH-15H	Dry Flowable Containing: Chlorsulfuron	Product Trade Name: Telar XP or equal EPA Registration Number: 352-654 A) Supplied in 8 x 16 ounce container to a case	75%	160	ounce	\$17.05	2728.00
OH-16H	A Liquid Solution Containing: Isooctyl ester of 2,4 Dichlorophenoxyacetic Acid 2-ethylhexyl ester of +R-2-(2,4-Dichlorophenoxy Propionic Acid) Dicamba (3, 6-Dichloro-o-anisic Acid)	Product Trade Name: BK-800 or equal EPA Registration Number: 228 - 442 A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons B) Supplied in 30 gallon drums	32.48% 15.90% 5.38%	100	gallon	\$48.40	\$4840.00
				100	gallon	\$47.90	\$4790.00

2 Herbicide Bidding Schedule

Item #	Description	% Concentration/ Pounds per Gallon of Active Ingredients		Estimated Quantity	Unit of Measure	Cost Per Unit of Measure	Extended Cost
OH-17H	Dry Flowable Containing: Tebuthiuron Product Trade Name: Spike 80 DF or equal EPA Registration Number: A) Supplied in 4 pound bags in lots of 24 pounds B) Supplied in 25 pound bags	80%		50	pound	-	NO BID
				50	pound	-	NO BID
OH-18H	A Water Soluble Emulsifiable Concentrate Containing: Clopyralid Product Trade Name: Transline or equal CLEAN SLATE EPA Registration Number: 228 - 491 A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons B) Supplied in .5 gallon containers in lots of 2 gallons	3 lbs/gallon		25	gallon	\$142.95	\$3573.75
				25	gallon	\$147.75	\$3693.75
OH-19H	Aqueous Solution Containing: Isopropylamine Salt of Imazapyr Product Trade Name: Stalker or equal EPA Registration Number: 241 - 398 A) Supplied in 1 quart containers in lots of 4 quarts	27.60%		200	quart	\$63.05	\$12610.00
OH-20H	Aqueous Solution Containing: Diglycolamine Salt of 3, 6-Dichloro-0-Anisic Acid Product Trade Name: Vanquish or equal EPA Registration Number: 228-397 A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons B) Supplied in 15 gallon returnable/refillable containers in pallets of 9 containers.	4 lbs/gallon		300	gallon	\$57.45	\$17230.50
				300	gallon	\$55.60	\$16680.00
OH-21H	Aqueous Solution Containing: Tricopyr Product Trade Name: Pathfinder II or equal RELEGATE RTU EPA Registration Number: 228 - 552 A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons	.75 lbs/gallon		300	gallon	\$31.60	\$9480.00

Item #	Description	% Concentration/ Pounds per Gallon of Active Ingredients	Cost Per		Extended Cost	
			Estimated Quantity	Unit of Measure		
HERBICIDES						
DOH-22H	A Water Soluble Emulsifiable Concentrate Containing: Isopropylamine Salt of Glyphosate Product Trade Name: Rodeo or equal <u>AQUA NEAT</u> EPA Registration Number: <u>62719 - 324</u> / <u>228-365</u> A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons B) Supplied in 30 gallon plastic returnable drums	53.80%	100	gallon	\$17.60	\$1760.00
			100	gallon	\$17.90	\$1790.00
DOH-23H	A Liquid Containing: Aminopyralid Product Trade Name: Milestone VM or equal EPA Registration Number: <u>62719-537</u> A) Supplied in 1 quart containers, 12 containers per lot B) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons	40.60%	200	quarts	\$76.80	\$15360.00
			50	gallon	\$276.00	\$13800.00
DOH-24H	Water Dispersible Granular Material Containing: Prodiamine Product Trade Name: Endurance or equal <u>PRO CLIPSE 65</u> EPA Registration Number: <u>228 - 434</u> A) Supplied in 10 pound containers, 50 pounds per lot	65%	100	pound	\$15.30	1530.00
DOH-25H	Emulsifiable Concentrate Containing Quizalofop P-Ethyl Product Trade Name: Assure II or equal EPA Registration Number: A) Supplied in 1 gallon containers in lots of 4 gallons	.88 lbs/gallon	16	gallon	-	No BID
DOH-26H	Emulsifiable Concentrate Containing Fluazifop-P-butyl Product Trade Name: Ornamec or equal EPA Registration Number: A) Supplied in 1 gallon containers in lots of 4 gallons	6.75%	16	gallon	-	NO BID

Item #	Description	% Concentration/ Pounds per Gallon of Active Ingredients	Estimated Quantity		Cost Per		Extended Cost
			Unit of Measure	Unit of Measure	Unit of Measure	Unit of Measure	
DOH-27H	A Dispersible Granule Containing: Imazapyr Diuron Product Trade Name: Sahara DG or equal EPA Registration Number: 241 - 374 A) Supplied in 10 pound bags in lots of 40 pounds	7.78% 62.22%	50	pound	\$13.95	\$697.50	
DOH-28H	A Water Soluble Dry Granule Containing: Sulfosulfuron Product Trade Name: Outrider or equal EPA Registration Number: 524--- 500 A) Supplied in 20 ounce bottles in lots of 200 ounce	75%	400	ounce	\$14.25	\$5700.00	
DOH-29H	A Liquid Containing Diuron Product Trade Name: Diuron 4L or equal EPA Registration Number: A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons	40%	50	gallon	-	NO BID	
DOH-30H	A Liquid Containing Fluroxypyr Product Trade Name: Vista or equal EPA Registration Number: A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons	26.20%	100	gallon	\$155.60	15560.00	
DOH-31H	Wettable Granule Formulation Containing: Sodium Salt of Diflufenzopy: 2-[1-(3,5-Difluorophenylamino) Carbonyl] Hydrazono} Ethyl)-3-Pyridinecarboxylic Acid, Sodium Sodium Salt of 3,6-Dichloro-o-anisic Acid Product Trade Name: Overdrive or equal EPA Registration Number: 7969 - 150 A) Supplied in 7.5 pound jugs, 30 pounds per case	21.40% 55.00%	100	pound	\$32.10	\$3210.00	

HERBICIDES		Estimated Quantity	Unit of Measure	Cost Per Unit of Measure	Extended Cost
Item #	Description				
DOH-32H	Dispersible Granules Containing Sulfometuron Methyl Chlorsulfuron Product Trade Name: Landmark XP or equal EPA Registration Number: 352 - 645 A) Supplied in 4 pound jugs in lots of 32 pounds B) Supplied in 64 ounce jug, returnable/refillable	100 1600	pound ounce	\$108.20 =	10820.00 NO BID
DOH-33H	Dispersible Granules Containing: Sulfometuron Methyl Metsulfuron Methyl Product Trade Name: Oust Extra or equal EPA Registration Number: 352 - 622 A) Supplied in 4 pound jugs in lots of 32 pounds B) Supplied in 64 ounce jug, returnable/refillable C) Supplied in 12 pound jugs	400 6400 400	pound ounce pound	\$39.65 \$2.35 \$39.65	\$15860.00 \$15040.00 \$15860.00
DOH-34H	A Dry Flowable Granule Containing: Bromacil Diuron Product Trade Name: Krovar I DF or equal EPA Registration Number: 352 - 505 A) Supplied in 6 pound containers in lots of 8 containers	50	pound	\$12.65	\$632.50
DOH-35H	A Liquid Containing: Imazapic Glyphosate Product Trade Name: Journey or equal EPA Registration Number: 241 - 417 A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons	100	gallon	\$84.25	\$8425.00

Item #	Description	% Concentration/ Pounds per Gallon of Active Ingredients	Estimated Quantity	Unit of Measure	Cost Per Unit of Measure	Extended Cost
HERBICIDES						
DOH-36H	A Liquid Containing: Dimethylamine Salt of 2,4-Dichlorophenoxyacetic Acid Dimethylamine Salt of Dicamba (3,6-Dichloro-o-Anisic Acid) Product Trade Name: Veteran 720 or equal EPA Registration Number: 228 - 295 A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons B) Supplied in 30 gallon drums	24.58% 12.82%	100 100	gallon gallon	29.50 \$28.45	\$2950.00 \$2845.00
DOH-37H	Dispersible Granules Containing: Chlorsulfuron Sulfometuron Methyl Sulfentrazone Product Trade Name: Throttle XP or equal EPA Registration Number: 352 - 725 A) Supplied in 3.9 pound containers, 8 containers per case	9% 18% 48%	100	pound	\$99.75	\$9975.00

Item #	Description	Estimated Quantity	Unit of Measure	Cost Per Unit of Measure	Extended Cost
ADJUVANTS					
DOH-1A	A Water Soluble Blue Liquid Spray Pattern Indicator Product Trade Name: Bullseye A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons.	100	gallon	\$41.25	\$4125.00
DOH-2A	A Miscible-Dispersible Liquid Defoamer (30% Active Ingredient) Product Trade Name: FOAM KIL A) Supplied in QUARTS containers in lots of 12	100	gallon	\$28.40	\$2840.00
DOH-3A	A Diluent with Emulsifiers Product Trade Name: Hygrade EC or Arborchem Basal Oil or Bark Oil EC or Alenza Basal Oil or Penevator or equal Hi GRADE EC A) Supplied in 5 containers in lots of 12	100	gallon	\$11.85	\$1185.00

HERBICIDES		Description	% Concentration/ Pounds per Gallon of Active Ingredients	Estimated Quantity	Unit of Measure	Cost Per Unit of Measure	Extended Cost
Item #							
DOH-38H	Water Soluble Dispersible Extruded Paste Granule Containing: Aminocyclopyrachlor Chlorsulfuron	39.50% 15.80%					
	Product Trade Name: Perspective™ or equal _____						
	EPA Registration Number: 352 - 846						
	A) Supplied in 20 ounce containers in lots of 240 ounces		240	ounces	\$4.3775	\$1050.60	
	B) Supplied in 20 ounce jug		40	ounces	\$4.3775	\$175.10	
	C) Supplied in 5 pound containers in lots of 40 pounds		80	pounds	\$70.04	\$5603.20	
	D) Supplied in 5 pound jug		20	pounds	\$70.04	\$1400.80	
DOH-39H	Water Soluble Dispersible Extruded Paste Granule Containing: Aminocyclopyrachlor Metsulfuron methyl	39.50% 12.60%					
	Product Trade Name: Streamline™ or equal _____						
	EPA Registration Number: 352 - 848						
	A) Supplied in 3 pound containers in lots of 24 pounds		96	pounds	\$82.40	\$7910.40	
	B) Supplied in 3 pound jug		96	pounds	\$82.40	\$7910.40	
DOH-40H	Water Soluble Dispersible Extruded Paste Granule Containing: Imazapy Aminocyclopyrachlor Metsulfuron methyl	31.60% 22.80% 7.30%					
	Product Trade Name: Viewpoint™ or equal _____						
	EPA Registration Number: 352 - 847						
	A) Supplied in 5 pound containers in lots of 40 pounds		100	pounds	\$58.71	\$5871.00	
	B) Supplied in 5 pound jug		100	pounds	\$58.71	\$5871.00	

ADJUVANTS

Item #	Description	Estimated Quantity	Unit of Measure	Cost Per	
				Unit of Measure	Extended Cost
DOH-4A	Non-Ionic Surfactant (90% Active Ingredient)	100	gallon	\$12.10	\$1210.00
	Product Trade Name: SUMMIT 9010				
	A) Supplied in 2.5 containers in lots of 2				
DOH-5A	A Granular/Flake Drift Control Agent	100	POUND GALON	\$10.75	1075.00
	Product Trade Name: POLY DRY				
	A) Supplied in 1 LB containers in lots of 24				
DOH-6A	A Liquid Drift Control Agent	100	gallon	\$31.00	\$3100.00
	Product Trade Name: POLY CONTROL II				
	A) Supplied in QUARTS containers in lots of 12				
DOH-7A	Aquatic Surfactant	100	gallon	\$12.95	\$1295.00
	Product Trade Name: SUMMIT 9010				
	A) Supplied in 1 gal containers in lots of 4				
DOH-8A	A Water Soluble Liquid Spray Pattern Indicator	100	gallon	-	NO BID
	Product Trade Name: Blueprint Plus or equal				
	A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons.				
DOH-9A	A Non-Ionic Sticker Spreader	100	gallon	\$35.25	\$3525.00
	Product Trade Name: Nu-Film-IR or equal				
	A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 2				
DOH-10A	A Ready-to-Use Formula Containing Paraffinic Oil Emulsifiers	100	gallon	-	NO BID
	Product Trade Name: Thinvert RTU or equal				
	A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons per case. B) Supplied in 15 gallon drum.				
DOH-11A	A Concentrate Formula Containing Paraffinic Oil Emulsifiers and Surfactants	100	gallon	-	NO BID
	Product Trade Name: Thinvert RTU or equal				
	A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons per case. B) Supplied in 15 gallon drum.				

SAFETY EQUIPMENT

Item #	Description	Estimated Quantity	Unit of Measure	Cost Per Unit of Measure	Extended Cost
DOH-1S	Emergency Spill Kit Containing: 15 Universal Plus Sorbent Pads 3 Cobra Coils 1 Pair Safety Goggles 1 Pair Latex Gloves 1 Large Refuse Bag 1 List of Environmental Compliance Telephone Numbers Size: 18"x18"x4" Vacuum Packed in Puncture Resistant Foil Product Trade Name: _____ A) Supplied by the kit.	1	each		N/B
DOH-2S	A Granular/Flake Spill Absorbent Product Trade Name: _____ A) Supplied in _____ containers in lots of _____.	1	pound		N/B
DOH-3S	3 Layer Fabric Coveralls (All Sizes) Product Trade Name: Kleen Guard or equal _____ A) Supplied in 12/each per case.	1	each		N/B
DOH-4S	Disposable Coveralls Product Trade Name: Tyvek or equal _____ A) Supplied in 25/each per case.	1	each		N/B
DOH-5S	32 ounce Eye Wash Bottle Product Trade Name: _____ A) Supplied per each.	1	each		N/B

MISCELLANEOUS				Cost Per	Extended
Item #	Description	Estimated Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit of Measure	Cost
DOH-1M	Pressure Rinser Product Trade Name: Easy Rinse or equal A) Supplied per each.	1	each		N/B
DOH-2M	Hand Soap with Citrus Oil Product Trade Name: Zep or equal A) Supplied in 32 ounce containers in lots of 20 containers per case	1	container		N/B
DOH-3M	A Biosstimulant Containing Soluble Potash 1.00% Iron 0.36% Manure Extract 79.30% Humic and Fulvic Acid Extract 9.00% Kelp Extract 1.20% Organo-Modified Silaxane Surfactant 0.36% Product Trade Name: Launch or equal A) Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons	2.5	gallon		N/B
DOH-4M	Rubber Boot/Shoe Covers Compliance EPA 40 CFR 170 A) Supplied in M, size 8 - 9 per pair. B) Supplied in L, size 10 - 11 per pair C) Supplied in size XL, size 12 - 13 per pair	1	pair		N/B
DOH-5M	Safety Goggles - indirect vent Meets ANS1 287.1-1989 A) Supplied per each.	1	each		N/B
DOH-6M	Face Shield - positive lock headgear Meets ANS1 287.1-1989 and CAN 1CSA-294 3-92 Specifications A) Supplied per each.	1	each		N/B

66-11-C023		MISCELLANEOUS			Cost Per	Extended
Item #	Description	Estimated Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit of Measure	Cost	Cost
DOH-8M	A 5-gallon Backpack Sprayer Product Trade Name: Birchmeier or equal					
	A) Supplied per sprayer	1	each			N/B
	B) Gasket Set for Sprayer Pump	1	set			N/B
	C) Hose Valve and Wand Repair Kit	1	kit			N/B
DOH-9M	Nitri-Solve 100% Nitrile Gloves 15 mil 13" Nitrile Gloves Compliance EPA 40 CFR 170					
	A) Supplied size Small.	1	pair			N/B
	B) Supplied size Medium.	1	pair			N/B
	C) Supplied size Large.	1	pair			N/B
	D) Supplied size X-Large.	1	pair			N/B
	E) Supplied size XX-Large.	1	pair			N/B
DOH-10M	2-Quart Handheld Pressure Sprayer Product Trade Name: Tolco or equal					
	A) Supplied per sprayer	1	each			N/B
DOH-11M	Closed System Backpack Sprayer Product Trade Name: Birchmeier BCS or equal					
	A) Supplied per sprayer	1	each			N/B
	B) Gasket Set for Sprayer Pump	1	set			N/B
	C) Hose Valve and Wand Repair Kit	1	kit			N/B