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GENERAL TERMS & CONDITIONS
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION (RFQ) AND REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL (RFP)

1, Awards will be made in the best interest of the Stafs of West Virginia.
2. The State may accept or rejectin part, or in whole, any bid.
3. All quotations are govemed by the West Virginia Code and the Legis/ative Rules of the Purchasing Division.

4. Prior to any award, the apparent successful vendor must be propetly registered with the Purchasing Division
and have paid the required $125 fee.

5. All services performed or goods delivered under State Purchase Order/Contracts are to be continued for the
term of the Purchase Order/Contracts, contingent upon funds being appropriated by the Legislature or otherwise
being made available. In the event funds are not appropriated or otherwise available for these services or
goods, this Purchase Order/Contract becomes void and of no effect after June 30.

6. Payment may only be made after the delivery and acceptance of goods or services.

7. Interest may be paid for late payment in accordance with the West Virginia Code.

8. Vendor praference will be granted upon written request in accordance with the West Virginia Code.

" 9. The State of West Virginia is exempt from federal and state taxes and will not pay or reimburse such taxes.

10, The Director of Purchasing may cancel any Purchase Order/Contract upon 30 days written nofice to the seller.

11. The laws of the State of West Virginia and the Legislative Rules of the Purchasing Division shall govem
all rights and duties under the Contract, including without limitation the wvalidity of this Purchase

Order/Confract,

12, Any reference to automatic renewal is hereby deleted. The Contract may be renewed only upon mutual written
agreament of the parties. .

13. BANKRUPTCY: In the event the vendor/contractor files for bankruptcy protection, the Siate may deem
this contract null and void, and terminate such contract without further order.

14. HIPAA BUSINESS ASSOCIATE ADDENDUM: The West Virginia State Government HIPAA Business Assoclate
Addendum (BAA), approved by the Altorney General, and available online at the Purchasing Division's web site
(hitp:/Avww.state.wv.us/admin/purchase/vrc/hipaa.htm) is hereby made part of the agreement Provided that,
the Agency meets the definition of a Cover Entity (45 CFR §160.103) and will be disclosing Protected Health
Information (45 GFR §160.103) to the vendor.

15. WEST VIRGINIA ALCOHOL & DRUG-FREE WORKPLACE ACT: If this Contract constitutes a public improvement
consiruciion contract as set forth in Article 1D, Chapter 21 of the West Virginia Code ("The West Virginia Alcohol
and Drug-Free Workplace Act”), then the following language shall hereby become part of this Contract: "The
contractor and its subcontractors shall implement and maintain a written drug-free workplace policy in compliance
with the West Virginia Alcohol and Drug-Free Workplace Act, as set forth in Article 1D, Chapter 21 of the West
Virginia Code, The contractor and its subcontractors shall provide a sworn statement in writing, under the
pehalties of perjury, that they maintain a valid drug-free work place policy in compliance with the West Virginia
and Drug-Free Workplace Act. [t is understood and agreed that this Contract shall be cancelled by the awarding
authority if the Contractor: 1) Fails to implement its drug-free workplace policy; 2) Fails to provide information
regarding implementation of the contractor's drug-free workplace policy at the request of the public authority; or
3) Provides to the public authority false information regarding the contractor's drug-free workplace policy.”

INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS

1. Use the quotation forms provided by the Purchasing Division.

2. SPECIFICATIONS: ltems offered must be in compliance with the specificalions. Any deviation from the
specifications must be clearly indicated by the bidder. AMernates offered by the bidder as EQUAL to the
specifications must be clearly defined. A bidder offering an alternate should attach complete specifications
and literature to the bid, The Purchasing Division may waive minor deviations to specifications.

3. Complete all sections of the quotation form.

& -Unitprices shalt-prevail-in-case ol-discrepancy:
5. All quotations are considered F.O.B. destination unless alternate shipping terms are clearly identified in the
quotalion.

6. BID SUBMISSION: All quotations must be delivered by the bidder to the office listed below prior to the date and time
of the bid opening. Failure of the bidder to deliver the quotations on time will result in bid disqualifications:
Department of Administration, Purchasing Division, 2019 Washington Street East, P.O. Box 50130,
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

Rev. 51809
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SBUS10

Specifications

Mandatory Pre-Bid Meeting

A mandatory pre-bid meeting shall be held on Monday, September 28, 2000 at
11:00 a.m. The meeting will be held in the Purchasing Division Conference
Room located at 2019 Washington Street, East (Capitol Complex - Building 15),
Charleston, WV 25305. Any vendor who wishes to bid on this contract must be
represented at this meeting. Failure to attend the pre-bid conference shall
disqualify a vendor from bidding on this contract. No person can represent more
than cne bidder.

o s e e e o ke o e e e e e ol e e ke ol e o e ke e e ke o ke sl e el o e etk de s o e e e e e e e e e e el e skl e e e e ek ek e e s e el de el e dede oo

Questions

Written questions shall be accepted through close of business (5:00 p.m. EDST)
on Friday, September 25, 2009. Questions may be sent via USPS, fax, courier
or email. In order to assure no vendor receives an unfair advantage, no
substantive questions will be answered orally. If possible, e-mail questions are
preferred. Address inquires to:

Jo Ann Adkins

Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street, East
Charleston, WV 25305

Fax: 304-558-4115

Phone: 304-558-8802 |
E-mail:  joadkins@wvadmin.gov
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The State of West Virginia and/or County Boards of Education reserve the right
for representatives to visit production facilities of successful bidders prior to
and/or during construction of the units for the purpose of observing production
and quality control.

School bus manufacturers will construct a pilot unit and provide expenses for

approval by the West Virginia Executive Director, Office of School Transportation
and/or his designee, prior to assembly line production of West Virginia school

buses.

September 15, 2009
Page 10f3



Specifications

Line setting fickets shall be furnished by the manufacturer for all vehicles.

Successful bidder will issue application for title at least 20 working days prior to
the anticipated delivery date of completed units. 5-day advance nofification to
the ordering agency must be given prior to the actual delivery date.

Payment by counties to the successful bidders will be made upon acceptance of
completed units by county boards of education. (Acceptance means when a
county has determined that ALL manufacturer responsibilities have been met.)
West Virginia Minimum Requirements for Design and Eguipment of School

uses, 2007 revision may be obtained from:

B ,

Ben Shew, Executive Director

Office of Schoo! Transportation

WY Department of Education

1800 Kanawha Bivd., Bidg. 8, Room 318
Charieston, WV 25305

Phone - {304) 558-2711

FAX - (304) 5586268

School buses must conform to WEST VIRGINIA MINIMUM REQUIREMENTS
FOR DESIGN AND EQUIPMENT OF SCHOOL BUSES, 2007 REVISION and
the attached 2009 ADDENDUM.

Any component supplied by a bidder as an equivalent (where equivalent is
permitted in the Minimum Reguirements) must have prior approval, in writing,
from the Executive Director, Office of School Transportation.

Delivery

Successful vendor shall be required to deliver buses within 120 days after receipt
of order.

Convenience Copy

Bidders are requested to send one convenience copy of their bid to the
FPurchasing Division.

Reports

Successful vendor(s) shall be required to submit annual reports on the actual
usage of the contract. Such report should incilude the quantity of each vehicle
purchased, the cost, and purchaser.

September 15, 2009
Page 2 of 3



>BUS10

Specifications

Quantity

Estimated guantity is 200 — 300 units, Estimate is provided for information only
and no guarantee of actual use of any future contract is implied by providing this
estimate.

September 15, 2002
Page 3 of 3



2010 SCHOOL BUS SPECIFICATION ADDENDUM
Al school buses shall be set for a maximum speed of 65mph and in the economy mode prior to
delivery. County Transportation Directors may apply for a waiver to the West Virginia

Department of Education’s Executive Director of School Transportation.

Gear ratios shall be determined for the most economical mode and verified with the West Virginia
Department of Education’s Executive Director of School Transportation.

A maximum idle fime shall be sef at 10 minutes.

BRAKES .
B. ABS automatic traction control system shall be standard on units with air brakes

B.1.d Be protected by a desiccant typed air dryer, with an ADIP or equal
spin-on replaceable filter.

B.2.g. A Schrader valve to charge the school bus air system in the event of a compressor
failure shall be provided

h. Park brake release shall not be affected by any electrical failure.

i.. Have at least 7" X 16 2 brake blocks.

j.. Beequipped with MGM long stroke welded clevis air chambers or equivalent.
k. Be equipped with ArvinMeritor slack adjusters or equivalent. |

1. Rear axle shall be equipped with oil deflector (that will direct oil from the brake surface).
EXCEPTION: Vehicles under 35 passenger.

DIFFERENTIAL

A. Purchaser shall specify differential ratios when order is submitted to chassis dealer.

B.. Speed will not exceed 70 miles per hour.

EXHAUST SYSTEM

A. Exhaust pipe, after Treatment Device and tailpipe shail be outside the bus body and attached to
the chassis, with hangers designed to accommodate expansion and contraction of the system

without damage to the system or hanger(s).
B. Tailpipe shall be constructed according to manufacturers’ standard.

FUEL, ALTERNATE
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C. Compressed Natural Gas (CNG) or Propane

HORN(S)
D. Covers shall be provided to keep moisture out of homs.

INSTRUMENTS AND INSTRUMENT PANEL

A3, Voitmeter with graduated scale to 16 voits, EXCEPTION: Ammeter may be substituted on
Type Al and B vehicles under 35 passengers.
10. Automatic transmission temperature gauge. EXCEPTION: Type Al, and B vehicles under
35 passengers.
11.  Tachometer. EXCEPTION: Type Al, and B vehicles under 35 passengers.

POWER AND GRADEABILITY

DIESEL POWER
Passenger Minimum Gross
Capacity Horsepower/Torque
84 - 90 240HP/620

5. Warranty for the engine shall be 5 vears/100,000 miles. All available warranty information must
be provided to the purchaser.

6. Noise acoustical abatement package is recommended. EXCEPTION: Rear engine vehicles.

CONSTRUCTION

G. Bus body shall meet the Colorado Rack Test

DOORS
A. Service Door

3. Service door shall have minimum horizontal opening of 24" and minimum vertical opening
of 68™.

EMERGENCY EXITS

E. Each emergency exit shall comply with FMVSS 217 and the present adopted version of the
National School Transportation Specifications.



1

HEATERS

K. There shall be a water flow controf method fo control temperature installed for convenient
operation by the operator.
STEPS

D.2.  The step tread shall have a 1.5” white, skid resistant, pebble type nosing that contrasts in
color by at least 70% measured in accordance with the contrasting color specification in
36CFR, Part 1192, ADA of the current National School Transportation Specification and

Procedure and is an integral piece without any joint extending to the leading edge of the
nosing turndown, The vertical surface of the nose shall be smooth.

TRANSMISSION

A. Warranty for the transmission shall be 5 yrs. unlimited mileage.

WINDSHIELD AND WINDOWS

F. Latch shall be designed to latch positively and securely.

FIRE BLANKET
A fire blanket shall be provided with a storage pouch mounted to the wall conveniently located

and identified as a fire blanket. The fire blanket shall meet CRR 16 part 1610 standard for
flammability of clothing. Blanket shall be approximately 62 inches X 80 inches.

GLAZING
Tinted glass may be installed in all doors, windows and windshield, Tinted plastic, which

complies with all applicable standards, may be installed in windows to the rear of the operator's
compariment.

SPECIAL EDUCATION SCHOOL BUS

A9, The floor anchorage track system shali consist of 4 tracks and shall be “L” type.
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SBUS10 Pricing Pages

TRANSIT UNITS

71 Passenger

210HP, FE, Automatic Transmission $_87,910.00
225HP, FE, Automatic Transmission $_89,450.00
225HP, RE, Automatic Transmission $_106,775.00
Defivery to Charleston, WV $_1,500.00
77 Passenger
210HP, FE, Automatic Transmission $ 93,110.00
225HP, FE, Automatic Transmission $_93,110.00
225HP, RE, Automatic Transmission $_107,875,00
Delivery to Charleston, WV $_1,500.00
84 Passenger
240HP, FE, Automatic Transmission $ 94,510.00
240HP, RE, Automatic Transmission $ 108,985.00
88 Passenger
240HP, FE, Auiomatic Transmission $ 94,510.00
240HP, RE, Automatic Transmission $ No Bid
Delivery to Charleston, WV $_1,500.00

Transit Unit Vendor: Blue Bird Bus Sales of Pittshurch, Inc. [BA Elue Bird Ris Sales of West Virginia

Jeff Pschirer e v

Print Name) " (Signature)

Date October 20, 2009

Phone 724-898-2472

Toll Free Phone Number _ 1-866~521-2472

Fax: 724-898-2660

Email Jpschirer@bluebirdpgh.com

Page 1 of 4



SBUS10 Pricing Pages

CONVENTIONAL UNITS

24 Passenger

Type A1 - 130HP — Automatic Transmission
Type B — 130HP ~ Automatic Transmission

30 Passenger

Type A1~ 130HP — Automatic Transmission
Type B — 130HP — Automatic Transmission

35 Passenger

Regular ~ 175HP - Automatic Transmission
Sp. Education - 175HP - Automatic Transmission
Delivery To Charleston, WV

47 Passenger

Regutar - 190HP - Automatic Transmission
Regular - 210HP - Automatic Transmission

Sp. Education - 190HP - Automatic Transmission
Delivery To Charleston, WV

53 Passenger
Regular - 190HP - Automatic Transmission
Regular - 210HP - Automatic Transmission
Regular - 210HP - Automatic Transmission
Delivery To Charleston, WV

59 Passenger

Regular - 190HP - Automatic Transmission
Regular - 210HP - Autornatic Transmission

Delivery To Charleston, WV
65 Passenger

Regular - 210HP - Automatic Transmission
Regular - 225HP Automatic Transmission

Delivery To Charleston, WV

g No Bid

$ No Rid

$ No Bid

$ No Bid

$ 74,710.00

$ _79,200,00

$.1,500.00

$ 76,545.00

3 77,460.00

$_80,165.00

$.1,500.00

$ 77,760.00

$_78,675.00

$_78,675.00

$.1,500.00

$ 77,540.00

$ 78,440.00

$.1,500.00

$ 78,155.00

$_79,345.00

$ 1,500.00

Page 2 of 4
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SBUS10 Pricing Pages
CONVENTIONAL UNITS - Continued

71 Passenger

Regular - 210HP - Automatic Transmission $_79,140.00

Delivery To Charleston, WV $_ 1,500.00
77 Passenger

Regular - 210HP - Automatic Transmission $ 85,385.00

Regular - 225HP - Automatic Transmission $_.85,385,00

Delivery To Charleston, WV $ 1,500.00

DELIVERY:

Bidders must state number of days after receipt of order (ARO) for bus delivery. Number of days
for delivery shall be no greater than 120 days. This does include “letters of intent”.

Ruses will be delivered within __ 120 days ARO.

Conventional Unit Vendor; Blue Bird Bus Sales of Pittdhurgh, Inc, DBA Blue Rird Rus Sales of West Virginia

Jeff Pschirer fdj/\

Print Name) (Signature)

Date October 20, 2009

Phone_ 724-898-2472

Toll Free Phone Number  1-866-521-2472

Fax 724-898-2660

Email dpschirer@bluebirdpgh.com

Page 3of 4



SBUS10 Pricing Pages

Special Needs — Conventional

210 HP ~ Automatic Transmission

210 HP — Automatic Transmission

225 HP — Automatic Transmission

225 HP — Automatic Transmission

225 HP -~ Automatic Transmission

53 Passenger

59 Passenger

65 Passenger

71 Passenger

77 Passenger

$ 81,310.00

$ 82,205.00

$ 83,645.00

$ 84,260.00

g 88,910.00

Page 4 of 4

15



Rev 0908 State of West Virginia 16
VENDOR PREFERERNCE CERTIFICATE

Certification and application” Is hereby made for Preference in accordance with West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37. (Does not apply fo
construction contracts). West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37, provides an opporiunity for qualifying vendors to reguest (at the time of bid)
preference for their residency status. Such preference is an evaluation methed only and will be applfed only to the cost bid in
accordance with the West Virginia Cod'e. This certificats for application is to be used to request such preference. The Purchasing
Division wilt make the determination of the Resident Vendor Preference, if applicable.

1. Application is made for 2.5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is an individual resident vendor and has resided continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preced-
ing the date of this ceriification; or,

Bidder is a partnership, association or corporation resident vendor and has maintained its headguaiters or principal place of
business continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preceding the date of this cerification; or 80% of the
ownership interest of Bidder is held by another individual, partnership, association or corporation resident vendorwho has
maintained its headquarters or principal place of business continuously in West Virginia for four (4} years immediately
preceding the date of this certification; or,

Bidder is & nonresident venhdor which has an affiliate or subsidiary which employs & minimum of one hundred state residents
and which has maintained its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia continuously for the four {4)
years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or,

2, Application is made for 2.5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:;
Bidder is a resident vendor who certifies that, during the life of the contract, on average at least 75% of the employees
working on the project being bid are residents of West Virginia whe have resided in the state continuously for the two years
immediately preceding submission of this bid; or,

3. Application is made for 2.5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:
Bidder is a nonresident vendor employing a minimum of one hundred state residents or is a nonresident vendor with an
affiliate or subsidiary which maintains its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia employing &
minimum of one hundred state residents who certifies that, during the Fe of the contract, on average at least 75% of the
employees or Bidder's affiliate’s or subsidiary’s employees are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state
continuously for the two years immediately preceding submission of this bid; or,

4, Application is made for 5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:
Bidder meets aither the reguirement of both subdivisions (1) and (2) or subdivision (1) and (3) as siated above; of,

5. Application is made for 3.5% resident vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked:
Bidder is an individual resident vendorwho is a veteran of the United States anmed forces, the reserves or the National Guard
and has resided in West Virginia continuously for the four years immediately preceding the date on which the bid is
submitted; or,

6. Application is made for 3.5% resident vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked:

Bidder s a resident vendor whe is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard, if, for
purposes of producing or distributing the commodities or completing the project which is the subject of the vendor's bid and
continuously over the entire term of the project, on average at least seventy-five percent of the vendor's employees are
residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two immediately preceding years.

Bidder understands if the Secretary of Revenue determines that a Bidder receiving preference has failed to continue to meet the
requirements for such preference, the Secretary may order the Director of Purchasing to: (@) reject the bid; or (b) assess a penalty
against such Bidder in an amount not io exceed 5% of the bid amount and that such penalty wilf be paid to the contracting agency
or deducted from any unpaid balance on the contract or purchase order.

By submission of this certificate, Bidder agrees to disclose any reasonably requested information to the Purchasing Division and
authorizes the Department of Revenue to disclose o the Director of Purchasing appropriate information verifying that Bidder has paid
the required business taxes, provided that such information does not contain the amounts of taxes paid nor any other information
deemed by the Tax Commissioner {o be confidential,

Under penalty of law for false swearing (West Virginia Code, §61-5-3), Bidder heraby certifies that this certificate is true
and accurate in all respects; and that if a contract is issued fo Bidder and if anything contained within this certificate
changes during the term of the contract, Bidder will notify the Purchasing Division in writing immaeadiately.

Elue Bird Bis Sales of Pittsburch, Tre. TEA .
Bidder: Blte Bird Rus Sales of Vst Vug]fna Signed%—\w_ Jeff Pschiver
Date:  Octcber 20, 2009 Title: Vice Pregident, Sdol R Sales

*Check any combination of preference considerafion(s) indicated above, which you are entitled fo receive.



RFQ No. SBus 10 17

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
Purchasing Division

PURCHASING AFFIDAVIT

VENDOR OWING A DEBT TO THE STATE:

West Virginia Code §5A-3-10a provides that: No contract or renewal of any coniract may be awarded by the
state or any of iis political subdivisions to any vendor or prospective vendor when the vendor or prospective
vendor or a related party o the vendor or prospeciive vendor is a debtor and the debt owed is an amount

greater than one thousand dollars in the aggregate.

PUBLIC IMPROVEMENT CONTRACTS & DRUG-FREE WORKPLACE ACT:

If this is a solicitation for a public improvement construction contract, the vendor, by its signature below, affirms
that it has a writien plan for a drug-free workplace policy in compliance with Article 1D, Chapter 21 of the Wesf
Virginia Code. The vendor must make said affirmation with its bid submission. Further, public improvement
construction contract may not be awarded to a vendor who does not have a written plan for a drug-free
workplace policy in compliance with Arficle 1D, Chapter 21 of the West Virginia Code and who has not
submitted that plan fo the appropriate contracting authority in fimely fashion. For a vendor who is a
subcontractor, compliance with Section 5, Article 1D, Chapter 21 of the West Virginia Code may take place
before their work on the public improvement is begun.

ANTITRUST:
in submitting a bid to any agency for the state of West Virginia, the bidder offers and agrees that if the bid is

accepied the bidder will convey, sell, assign or transfer o the state of West Virginia all rights, fitle and interest
in and to all causes of action it may now or hereafter acquire under the antitrust laws of the United States and
the state of West Virginia for price fixing and/or unreasonable restraints of trade relating to the particular
commodities or services purchased or acquired by the state of West Virginia. Such assignment shall be made
and become effective at the time the purchasing agency tenders the initial payment to the bidder.

| certify that this bid is made without prior understanding, agreement, or connection with any corporation, firm,
limited liability company, partnership or person or entity submitting a bid for the same materials, supplies,
equipment or services and is in all respects fair and without collusion or fraud. | further certify that | am
authorized to sign the certification on behalf of the bidder or this bid.

LICENSING:
Vendors must be licensed and in good standing in accordance with any and all state and local laws and

requirements by any state or local agency of West Virginia, including, but not limited to, the West Virginia
Secretary of State’s Office, the West Virginia Tax Department, West Virginia insurance Commission, or any
other state agencies or political subdivision. Furthermore, the vendor must provide all necessary releases to
obtain information to enable the Director or spending unit to verify that the vendor is licensed and in good
standing with the above entities.

CONFIDENTIALITY:

The vendor agrees that he or she will not disclose to anyone, directly or indirectly, any such personally
identifiable information or other confidential information gained from the agency, unless the individual who is
the subject of the information consents to the disclosure in writing or the disclosure is made pursuant to the
agency’s policies, procedures and rules. Vendor further agrees to comply with the Confidentiality Policies and
Information Security Accountability Requirements, set forth in hitp://iwww state. wv.us/admin/purchase/privacy/

noticeConfidentiality. pdf.

Under penalty of law for false swearing (West Virginia Code §61-5-3), it is hereby certified that the vendor
affirms and acknowledges the information in this affidavit and is in compliance with the requirements as stated.

Vendor's Name: _Blue Birnd Bus Sales of Pittsbach, Tne. IBA Bhee Bind Bus Sales of West Virginia

Authorized Signature: W - Date: October 20, 2009
Purchasing Affidavit (Revised 01/01/08}




State of West Virginia
Departmant of Administration
Purchasing Division

2019 Washingion Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130
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State Df West Virginia Request for o s BECLNEIMBER e
Depariment of Administration Quotation SBUS10 1
Purchasing Division

2019 Washingion Street East
Past Office Box 50130 J
Charleston, WV 25305-0130 404-558-8802

*507143237 : 724-898-2472
BLUE BIRD BUS SALES OF PITT IN
5374 WILLIAM FLYNN HWY
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VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED

GIBSONIA PA 15044 BY ORDER

“10/709/2009
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WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR!
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EXHIBIT 10

ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT

I HEREBY ACKNOWLEDGE RECEIPT OF THE FOLLOWING CHECKED
ADDENDUM(S) AND HAVE MADE THE NECESSARY REVISIONS TO MY
PROPOSAL, PLANS AND/OR SPECIFICATION, ETC.

ADDENDUM NO.'S:

TUNDERSTAND THAT FAILURE TO CONFIRM THE RECEIPT OF THE
ADDENDUM(S) MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF BIDS. VENDOR
MUST CLEARLY UNDERSTAND THAT ANY VERBAL

REPRESENTATION MADE OR ASSUMED TO BE MADE DURING ANY
ORAL DISCUSSION HELD BETWEEN VENDOR'S REPRESENTATIVES
AND ANY STATE PERSONNEL IS NOT BINDING. ONLY THE
INFORMATION ISSUED IN WRITING AND ADDED TO THE
SPECIFICATIONS BY AN OFFICIAL ADDENDUM IS BINDING.

REV. 11/96

............................

SIGNATURE ,
Blue Bird Bus Sales of Pittsburgh, Inc. DBA

............................



X4

SSBIPPY 1By

544 day
TIOL
INOHd ‘Auediion

NIC-Féy- AT Xvd

’

ey ﬁw\ TG g @ caé..“u&iﬁ“mwmhvg irews

F5A)- TS 0 -/ 3344
TI0L

AhHds] &y IRy

TV HZE ey

\W\\S\V\ \.S\)Pu\ S\..\.\\w.\d N.A-M.ih

i
n\”\f.u{x Mr?_\& uﬁt :N(H‘ s:.JM\ 4&..@ f;ﬂ%cmanO

} 0D - L gy —hQL X4

£

%w%ﬁo%oﬁ% metuci@.\_wm Q.,Omw | SS2IppY flews

3y
TI0L

Iz AT ST T
i

dey

STy

AAS)

+¥2 @IAA-S & A —H QS INOHd

o:x& BLQ.,\IJ)QE Qg

) %\ux&imiyﬁc;\ %Qw&l;dg “Aueduion

LLST-Ngh -1.0% xvd

) . " 1SS8IpPY Bl

-y
1101

RET-TOEE VR 9IS avdvd

dey

AR W

109X @Thh-S0h-hQ% 3NOHd

TR 0

WMy L A0 UK 9QME¢Z “Auedwon

5092 ~hOZ ~ oo Xvd

WSS T Lo NG e VBgD  1SSAIPPY [lewl

Br hSooss 008 33d4
TI0L

152 AM U5 S2\ mov D

LU g MOMYD e

(09 Z -hor~hQf INOHd

PY VWO AP 9\0 WhE

A VISV R 3%\ Aueduios

SHAGINNN
XY+ 8 ANOHdI 3L

6007 ‘gz Jequsideg sleq

— 0 abed

SSIHAAY ONIIVIA

SWVN SALLVINISTHdTY B Wi

QYVvO SSIANISNG ¥V IAVET ‘F19ISSO0d 1 - A181937 LNIdd Ol FuNS 38 3svald «

INRd A8v3Td

133HS NI NDIS

0LSNYS 'ON |esodouyd 10} 1sonbay




SBUS10 Pre-Bid Questions and Answers

1. Would it be possible to extend the bid opening date from October 15" to October 22™7

The Bid date has been changed to Oct. 10, 2009.

2 Maximum idle time shall be set for 10 minuies. Should exemption for special needs buses be
added fo this requirement?

All special needs buses are exempted from the idle time provision.

3. Maximum speed shall be set for 55MPH while differential section states that bus maximum
speed shall not exceed 70 MPH.

Maxirum speed shall be 65 MPH.

4 Gear ratios shall be determined for the most economical mode and verified with the West
Virginia Department of Education’s Executive Director of School Transportation while differential
section states that purchaser shali specify differential ratio.

Specification js correct as stated,

5. ABS automatic traction control system shall be standard on all units with air brakes, Our
request is that this requirement state that ABS with a differential traction controt device may bhe
used in lieu of ABS traction control.

A one year exemption for transit buses will be alfowed requiring an ABS automafic traction
controf system. The focking differential will be allowed as a substitute.

6 A Schrader valve to charge the school bus air system in the event of a compressor failure shall
be provided. Our request is that the words "Schrader Valve” be replaced with the words {external

charging port.)
An external charging port is an approved eguaf fo the Schrader Valve.

7. Park brake release shall not be affected by an electrical failure. The use of a park brake
interlocking valve which is a State requirement listed under brakes requires the use of an
electrical solenoid. For this reason the parking brake can not be released without electricity if the
bus is equipped with 2 parking brake interlock system.

The specification should read the park brake release shall be on an individual circuit.

8. Rear axle ofl deflectors. IC bus removed oil deflectors from alt product lines in 2001 and they
are not available on any IC products. Our request is that this reguirement be removed from the

specifications.
The rear axfe oil deflectors specification is waived for this year,

9. BWAB and IC Bus, LLC request the following action be considered in reference to West
Virginia specification Section Lamps And Signals G. School Bus Alternately Flashing Signal Lamps
5. Signal lamp system shall operate as follows: item f. This section to be changed to read as
follows “The signal lamp system shall have an emergency override switch or other method to
activate the red warning lamps with the vehicle ignition switch in either the on or off position.”
The rational is that if a unitis in a stationary position (ignition in off position) the enly warning
lights that should operate would be the red warning lights keeping with the same procedure as a
normal route stop; if a warning method is needed on a school yard for the purpose of slowing



traffic flow the use of the hazard lamps would be a more appropriate operationat mode to use.
Example of an emergency override {fail-safe) switch for the red warning famps can be found in
the Ohio specifications. It is listed as an emergency override system for the red warning lamps

and labeled accordingly and functions with ignition in any position. This is currently the system
that IC Bus is using on our product.

IC’s emergency override system is opproved as an equal to the specified Schoof Bus Alternately
Flushing Signal Lamps system for this year.



