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State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

NOTICE

Due to the size of this bid, it was impractical to scan
every page for online viewing. We have made an
attempt to scan and publish all pertinent bid
information. However, it is important to note that
some pages were necessarily omitted.

If you would like to review the bid in its entirety, please
contact the buyer. Thank you.
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State of West Virginia RequeSt for gz
Department of Administration  Quotation
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East : j _
Post Office Box 50130

Charleston, WV 25305-0130 JO ANN ADKINS
04-558-8802

TR I ESP LN

Ax

RFQ COPY
TYPE NAME/ADDRESS HERE

L colab
3106 Wabagh S
St ol v Bs1624290

ALL STATE AGENCIES

AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY CRDER

07/21/20009

QBR/05/2009 BID _OPRNTNG TIME 01:30PM

ek kxdkkkhkkprrhr! ADDENDUM NO., 1 2 whkfrkhkhhhhhhhdhddhhs
1. HOUSE0Y9 | QUES[TIONS| AND ANSWERS ATTACHED.

2. HOUSEO9 MANDA'ORY PRE-BID SIGN IN BHEETS ATTACHED.

B. HOUSE09 PRICING PA(ES REVISED, DATED 07/02/2009,
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BLANKET CONTRACT TC FURNISH HOUSEKEEPING SUPPLIES

SIGNATURE \_7 W é'_' JA/ FELEPHONESI-ZQ-A?JO DATE 000

s FEN
. D CHANGES TO TED ABOVE
Manaser, Bid Contracts [ 41-0231510 ADDRESS CHAN TO BE NOTED A

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'




GENERAL TERMS & CONDITIONS
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION (RFQ) AND REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL {RFP)

1. Awards will be made in the best inferest of the State of West Virginia.
2. The State may accept or reject in part, or in whole, any bid.
3. All quotations are governed by the West Virginia Code and the Legislative Rules of the Purchasing Division.

4. Prior to any award, the apparent successful vendor must be properly registered with the Purchasing Division
and have paid the required $125 fee.

5. All services performed or goods delivered under Stale Purchase Order/Contracts are to be continued for the
tarm of the Purchase Order/Contracts, confingent upon funds being appropriated by the Legislature or otherwise
being made available. In the event funds are not appropriated or otherwise available for these services or
goods, this Purchase Order/Contract bacomes void and of no effect after June 30.

6. Payment may only be made after the delivery and acceptance of goods or services.

7. Inferest may be paid for late payment In accordance with the Wes# Virginia Code.

8. Vendor preference will be granted upon written request in accordance with the West Virginia Code.

9. The State of West Virginia fs exempt from federal and state taxes and will not pay of reimburse such taxes.
10. The Director of Purchasing may cancel any Purchase Order/Contract upon 30 days writtan notice to the seller.

11, The laws of the State of West Virginia and the Legislative Rules of the Purchasing Division shall govern
g!!d rights a?d duties under the Contract, including without limitation the validity of this Purchase
rder/Contract.

12, Any reference to automatic renewal is hereby deleted. The Contract may be renewed only upon mutual written
agresment of the parties.

13. BANKRUPTCY: In the event the vendotr/contractor files for bankruptcy protection, this Contract may be
deemed null and void, and terminated without further order. ‘

14, HIPAA BUSINESS ASSOCIATE ADDENDUM: The West Virginia State Government HIPAA Business Associate
Addendum (BAA), approved by the Atiorney General, and available online at the Purchasing Division's web site
(hitp:/'www.state.wv.us/admin/purchase/vrc/hipaa.htm) is hereby made part of the agreement. Provided that,
the Agency meets the definition of a Cover Entlty (45 CFR §160.103) and will be disclosing Protected Health
Information (46 CFR §160.1083) to the vendor. :

15, WEST VIRGINIA ALCOHOL & DRUG-FREE WORKPLACE ACT: I this Confract constitutes a public improvement
construction contract as set forth In Article 1D, Chapter 21 of the West Virginla Code ("The West Virginia Alcohol
and Drug-Free Workplace Act’), then the following language shall hereby become part of this Contract: "The
contractor and its subconlractors shall implement and maintain a written drug-free workplace policy in compliance
with the West Virginia Alcohol and Drug-Free Workplace Act, as set forth in Ardicle 1D, Chapter 21 of the West
Virginia Code. The contractor and its subcontractors shall provide a swom statement in wrifing, under the
penalties of perjury, that they maintain a valid drug-free work place policy in comf:ﬁance with the West Virginia
and Drug-Free Workplace Act. |t is understood and agreed that this Contract shall be cancelled by the awarding
authority if the Contractor: 1) Fails to implement its drug-free workplace policy; 2) Fails to provide information
regarding implementation of the contractor's drug-free workplace policy at the request of the public authority; or
3) Provides to the public authority false information regarding the contractor's drug -free workplace policy "

INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS

1. Use the quotation forms provided by the Purchasing Division.

2, SPECIFICATIONS: Hlems offered must be in compliance with the specifications.  Any deviation from the
specifications must be clearly indicated bK the bidder. Alternates offered by the bidder as EQUAL to the
specifications. must be clearly defined. bidder offering an alternate should attach complete specifications
and literature to the bid. The Purchasing Division may waive minor deviations to specifications. .

3. Complete all sections of the quotation form.

4. Unit prices shall prevall in case of discrepancy.

5. All guotations are considered FOB. destination unless alternate shipping terms are clearly identified in the
gquetation.

6. BID SUBMISSION: All quotations must be delivered by the bidder o the office listed below prior to the date and time
of the bid opening. Failure of the bidder to deliver the guotations on time will result in bid disqualifications:
Depariment of Administration, Purchasing Division, 2019 Washington Street East, P.O. Box 50130,
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

Hev. 7/01/08




State of West Virginia Request for R

Department of Administration uoiation

Purchasing Division Quota HOUSEQ2 %
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Chatleston, WV 25305-0130 IO ANN ADKINS
RO4A-558-8802

RFQ COPY

TYPE NAME/ADDRESS HERE ALL STATE AGENCIES

AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER

07/21/20089
BID OPENING DATE:

QRN /2009

*EkEkk%  THIS| IS THE END OF RFQ HOUSEQS #*#%%%%x TOTAL:

SBEEREVERSERIDE FOR TERMSAND CONDITIONS -

SR TELEPHONE DATE
N 7W E. o0& 651-293-4310 7/30/09

TTLE Manaser. Bid Contracts [FEJN 410731510 ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE
WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'




HOUSED9 Questions and Answers

1Q. | Do you only want catalog products?

1A | Yes, HOUSEQS specifications state, ” All products bid, furnished must be listed in a current
catalog(s) that contains a product line broad enough to meet requirements of this request for
guotation,

2Q. | What was the annual usage for HOUSEQG in 20087

2A. | Approximately $170,000.00
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HOUSEQD9 Pricing Sheets
Vendors should complete all columns, i Note: ltems 7, 14, and 16 require additional information be added in the descnption coiumn.
Mimmum [Vendor Dituted
Est, Order Item List Unit] Discount Unit | Cost/
item # Description Qty Equal To Brand ! Size/Wt |Quantity {Number { Price % Category| Price | ounce ; Totai

1 Cleaner, General, Ammonia Liguid
Household-type product with a 6% NO BID
minimum concentration of NH3. 250 |[Malestic

2 |Liguid Bleach Household-type product !
with minimum concentration of 5.25% NO BID
sodium hypochlorite. 2,500 Maiestic

3 [Bleach-free liquid, commercial grade, Neutral 5 g 1 14975 | 177.03 $59.00 .00036 | $59.00/¢ase
Pro-quaternary, all-purpose disinfectant I
cleaner, no-nnse formula me%nmu.:mmnn Ecolab mbmmm #

4 [Cleaner, liquid, commercial grade, all- Neutral Ecolab 5 gal 14975 {177.03 359.00 [.00036 959.00/cage
purpose disinfectant cieaner, no-ringe Disinfect i 44 . G0 1
formula Clorox

5 Winans N 41,90 |.00063 |$41.90/cs
All &w@amwpmwwwmamwm_‘mm%mﬂ Warmior Ecalab »w_ wamm._ 1 12518 |170.63 H ?

6 Ioioaner, General All Purpose Dry A-125 Dry Bcolab | 2x 90 i 1 6118108 57.30 §37.891.0008 § $37.89/ps
non-phosphate formulated powder Multi Purp -5 oz
product designed to be added to water Cleaner ;
to perform various cleaning tasks. w
Preduct may be used to clean floors, Drackett Easy
walls, and equipment, 50 {Pack

7 ?Efu:ﬁomm Cleaner, liquid, odor
eliminator and disinfectant, 24 oz spray Orange Ecolab { 6-32 od 1 15639 | 34.22 $32.92 [R1U $32.92/ck
bottle. ofigagg Degr 15.30 # RTY

8 [|Cleaner, liquid, use where soft to $82.771 .00808 $82.77/cs
medium water herdness, alkaline. Oasss272  |Peolab |Z-2.g3ll 1 13560 | 194.00

9 iCleaner, wipes, disinfecting. Asept1-Wipe IT |Glorox Feolah 112-180 dt 1 63306725 142.40 S107.98 N/A™ 15107.98/es

10 2ZT07F
Stamnless Polish Towels, premorstened NO BID
for polishing metal surfaces. Supper

1 Ny i F 5 . ds
Floor Cleaner, damp mop, neutrat wum%mﬁ: Disint Ecolabj 5gal; 1 14975 1177.03 559.00 -00036} 559 00/
disinfectant, germ killing properties Chemical DMQ 44.90 # i

12 [Floor cleaner, neutral PH, concentrate, | 1 H be B
cleaning ability equal to 409 or A ﬁwnm:% eut Cim ) > gal 1 61125664 50.17 342.50} 00052 ubm.mo\or
Fantastic. 500 |valloshire Ecolab

13 |Floar finish, wax, water based, non- L i
vellowing, oo resistant surface, Gemstar  {Ecolab | 2.5 gal| 1 51189733 | 54.96 $35.72 535,72/ ¢
superior gloss. Buckeye 22.70 # RTU

14 |Baseboard Strippar, does not contam . 258" Lobo
ammens shift Off |Ecolab |[g=0 97" 1 161169504 91,97 $62.07 gry [562.07/c

15 |Pre-measured floor cleaner - neutrai Drackett Easy % O
PH. Sure Pak Neutral Cleaner | 250 |Pack Ecolab m.om ml 5 oz 11615014001 78.07 541.71 | .0007 B41.71/cd

Page 1 of 12 Rev. 07/20/2009 o



HOQUSEQDS Pricing Sheets

Vendors should complete all columns.

Note: ltems 7, 14, and 16 require additional information be added in the descnption column.

Minimum [Vendor _ Diluted
Est. Order Item List Unit} Discount Unit | Cost/
Item # Description Qty Equal To Brand ; Size/Wt |Quantity |Number | Price % Category| Price | ounce { Total
16 iGeneral dry granular phospate all A-125
purpose cleaner. Formulated for the Multi Purp Ecolab wwwm\ 1 m.wmw 57.30 §37.89) .0008 | §37.89
cleaning of all non-porous surfaces Clnr .
such as floors, bathroom fixtures and 6.60 #
other harg surfaces. No ninsing s
required after use of the cleaner. 7460  iSpic & Span
17
General liquid pine oil with hospital NO BID
grade disinfectant. Canverra
Provide EPA Registration Number: 2006 {Husky Pine :
18 Qasis 259 | Fcolab{ 2.5 gal| 1 24155 | 130.85 555.00 |.00805 B55.00/cs
- Glass Force 22.20 #
General ammoniated liquid concentrate
window :
cleaner, which is to be diluted with Cello Glass &
water to produce a cieaning solution Window
that will not streak or [eave a film Cleaner
residue on the surface of the glass. 150 [Amrnoniated
19 o Oasis 259 |Bcolab 2.5 ga1i 1 24155 {130.85 $55.00f 00805 | $55.00/4
General non-ammoniated liguid window Glass Force 29.90 #
cleane, which 15 fo be diluted with water : "
to produce a cleaning solution that will :
not streak or leave a film restdue on the
surfacs of the glass, 178 ({Brillo
20 |Non-phosphate laundry defergentfor |, eilo FEcolab
washing of clothing i wam water, WMHrﬁMH HMoscmzzmﬁa MMM@ # 1 10391 97.54 mmm. 54 |N/A 552.54
Detergent wili leave the fabric soft and | Brite |Launary
wit not irritate super sensitive skin, 500 [Detergent
21 lGeneral oil base soap furniture cleaner
in a spray pump bottle. Cleaner, for
wooden furniture. Formulated to clean
wooden paneling and furniture. Use of NO BID
th seap enhances the appearance of i
natural wood surfaces. (Equal fo Murphys Off :
Murphy Qit Soap) 200 iSoap Spray ;
22 |Spray furniture polish; formulated fo _ :
removea dust, fingerprints, and light soil Benold Ecolab ompmoow_m 1 mwwm 35.89 $28.69} pTUy $28.69/4
from finished surfaces with a light or -
gentle pressure beng appliedto a
wiping cloth. Polish shall notleave a Cello Lemion
residue when wiped from the surface. 100 |Kist

w

Page 2 of 12
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HOUSEQ9 Pricing Sheets
Vendors should complete alf columns. Note: Hems 7. 14, and 16 require additional information be added in the description column.
Minmmum |Vendor Diluted
Est. Order ftem List Unit] Discount Unit | Cost/
Item # Descrption Qty Equal To Brand | Size/Wt |Quantity [Number Price % Category| Price [ ounce | Totai
2 . -~ L
3 Lemon Scented Spray furniture polish; Benold Ecolap |6-16 oz 1 @WNN@ 35.89 $28.69 RIG 528.69/ps
formuiated to remove dust, fingerpnnts, 8.20 #
and light soil from finished surfaces with :
a light or gentle pressure being appiieg Chase Spray !
to a wipmg cloth. Polish shall not leave Pak Furniture !
a residue when wiped from the surface. ;| 650 {Polish
24 |Non-acid Bathroom cleaner, mild, b - Ecolab | 12-32 oA 6114 4
disinfects and deodenzes. Non A WMmW%% M>Wum~ 28.00 m 1 3665 53.31 428.31 RTU %28.31
25 Gemcidal disinfectant decgorant IB Disinfect Ecolab [12-32 of 1 6544  |163.35 $68.25 RIU $68.25
spray. Disinfectant spray must be non- Cleaner 28.20 # 3556
toxic, non-allergenic, and must he EPA
approved as being effective agamst
saphylecoccus aurex, pseudomonas
aerugin tuberculosis and micrococcus. i
Provide EPA Registration # 1500 |Winans STAT i
T
26 . ‘ Glass Forcg Beolab {,6-32 g4 1 25798 |28.09 $21.29 |RTU $21.29
22 ounce Windex {or equal} spray botfle| 250 [Windex 15.
27 |Window and floor squeegees with
handies, NO BID
28 |Non-caustic Aerosol Oven Cleanar,
formuiated to remove burnt-on grease
and other residues commoniy ccouring
in a kitchen. User must comply with all NO BID
instructions for the safe use of this
material.
Provide % Active Ingredient: 250  Mr. Muscle
29 |Liquid Kitchen Degreaser Cleaner, 1 _
gallon; NF Fajsov or equal. Product Grease Feolap 14-1 gal 1 1 19513 198.32 346,71 N?A [$46.71
must be formulated to remove grease Cutter Flus 27.80 #
from kitchen grills and equipment.
Degreaser must be approved by USDA Canberma
for use in food service areas. Must Iift Husky 903
and remove built-up grease from floor Kitchen
surface ang grouting. 100 |Degreaser 1
Liquid Enzyme Dramn Opener Pathwavs H
%0 Liguid Bacteria nmmmm»mw and spofter, Drain Trtmf Ecolab | 2.5 gal 1 29810 368.00 $164.22 .00801 {5164.22/¢s
must be environmentally acceptable, Canaberra 21.89 #
eliminate odor and form a digesting bio- Husky
film on drain lines and traps; must be BioEnzymatic
non-pathogenic. 400 {Drain Opener
Page 3 of 12 Rev. 07/20/2000
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HOUSE09 Pricing Sheets

Vendors should complete all columns.

Note: ltems 7, 14, and 16 reguire additional information be added in the descrption column.

w

Minimum {Vendor Difuted
Est. Crder ltem List Unit] Discount Unit | Cost/
Item # Desgription Qty Equal To Brand | SizeMWt iQuantity |Number | Price % Category! Price | ounce | Total
37 |Non-Acid Bowl Cleaner (Spartan NABC Non Acid Ecolab] 12-32 ok 1 6114 55,31 $28.31 $28.31
or equal); o Bowl Clnr 28.00 # 3665
must be safe and effective acid free Canperra
bathroom cleaner, disinfectant, Baseline Non
decdorant, mildew stat, virucide; Acid Bowi RIC
fungiciddal . 100 |Cleaner
32 Mr. Clean i
Cenerai ncaowmem%mﬂaw%% m caner. Magic Erasers Fcolab .WM\WON 1 wmmm 73.30 $4.52|N/A $54.52/
33 [Scounng pad, nyion with sponge; i
kitchen cleaning aid 200  [Microtron #74 ND _BID
34
Kitchen Scounng Pad Nylon §"%8" 125 {Microtron
35
Kitchen Scounng Pad Non-Detergent
Stainless Steel; (Disco D104A orequal) | 350 (Confineniai
36
Detergent Kitchen Scouring
Padidetergent (Brillo hotel or equal)
Must be constructed of durable matenat
and is to be used as an abrasive pad fo
the removal of difficuit soils or grease
from metai surfaces or other nonporous
surfaces. Pad may be mpregnated
with detergent or may have other
materials mcluded with the pad fo meet Brilio Hoel Size
2 special requirement of the purchaser. | 500 {Soap pad
37 i
Chlorinated Scouring Powder (Comet or
Equal} Formulated for the fast removal
of stain and solls from nen-porous
surfaces. This preduct is not infended
for use on glassware, fiberglass or i
plastic materiais. 1500 |Ajax
38 iKitchen Grill Block Scraper (DISCO GB-
12 or equal) 50 |Continental i

Page 4 of 12
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HOUSEO(S Pricing Sheets
Vendors should compiete ail columns. Note: ltems 7, 14, and 16 require additional information be added in the description column.
Minimum |Vendor Diluted
Est. Order ltem List Unit} Discount Unit ; Cost/
Itern # Description Qty Equat To Brand | Size/Wt {Quantity |Number | Price % Category| Price | ounce | Total
39 ABC Bowl |Ecolab | 12-32qz 1 !6l14 | $62.89 $28.81 | RTU  {$28.81/ck
Toilet Cleaner 9% Hypochlone Acid Cleaner 32.00 # 0257
Must be formuiated for the removai of
rust and unine stains from toilet howls.
Container shall have a directionat spout
to aid in the application of the cleaner o
the surface of the toilet bowl. Users are Canberra
to read and comply with all instructions Baseline Bowl
for the safe usage of ths product. 250 |{Cleaner
40 ABC olal 2~ . 528. .
e mMMMH Ecolab ww. oww *nu 1 mwww $62.89 928.81 | RIU 528.81/ oﬂ
Toilet Cleaner 20% Hypachlonic Acid
Must be formulated for the removal of
rust and unine stains from toflet bowls.
Container shail have a directional spout
to aid in the application of the cleaner {o
th surface of the toilet bowl. Users are
to read and comply with all instructions Winans Super
for the safe usage of this product. 125 {Bowi
Ay o opener Cleans! Pattways | Ecolab | 2.5 gal 1 29810 | 368.00 $164.20 00801 $164.22
packet. Must be non-toxic, formuiated Drain Trmnt 21.80 #
to open clogged sink and toilet dramns
without harm to the user, plastic pipes, Cello
and spetic tank systems. 100% Fumeless
biodegradable 50 {Drain Openar
42 |Prain Opener Caustic Cleaner : i =
Must be a finely ground alurunum chip Bingo Ecolab WW WN Mm 1 me 106.57 S74.64) RTU S$74.64
or flake formulation {minmum of 1% *
NACH; minimum $6% NA2C03),
designed to open sinks and toilet
drains. This preduct is highly cuastic
and must be used with caution. User s
to read and comply with all instructions
for use, 125 |Drano :
43 Winans Spray 1 _ H
409 Spray and %me%mwmm.% Mq equal) | 125 [N Wipe _ moowm,_um mmmmoﬁﬁ ! 15639 28.09 1525.70 RIU ~ $25.70/ds

Page 5§ of 12
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HOUSEQD9 Pricing Sheets

Vendors should complete ali columns. |} Note: ltems 7, 14, and 16 require additional information be added in the description column.
Minimum {Vendor Diluted
Est. Order Item List Unit{ Discount - Unit | Cost/
Item # Description Qty Equal To Brand | Size/Wt |Quantity (Number | Price % Category| Price | ounce | Totai
44 Disinfec Ecolab| 4~1 gal 1 14564 d
Tub and Tils Cleaner, 1 galion, non- owmmbmﬂ m wm.uom*_m 77.87 $41.07 | 00031 1$541.07/cg
abrasive
distnfectant; formulated o remove soap
scum and soil from ceramug file and Winans
plastic surfaces without scratching. Shower Room
Non-aerosol formulation 1s ready fo use,| 200 ICleaner
45 Mca and Tile Cleaner Foam Aerosoi Lemon Lift| Ecolabj 12-20 0f 1 11490 1§ 92.93 $63.91} RIU $p3.91/cs
pray
must be formulated to remove soap Champron 22 #
scum and soil from ceramic tile and SprayPak
plastic surfaces without scratching. Foammng
250 |Germicidal
46 |Disenfectant Heavy Duty Bathroom Oasis IPr HD Bth Ecolab! 2- 2 1 1 1 L o
Cleaner, Liguid Concentrate. 24 oz, asis nqmammo:mm a " 10158 § 130.82 $63.80| .0073  563.80/cs
Spray can. Lysol 10.30
47 |Spray Bottle - 22 ounce transparent
bottle intended for the convenient NO BID
handling and dispensing of vanous
cleaning fiquids 125 |Tolco
48 {Spray Botile - 32 ounce transparent
bottle intended for the conventent NO BID
handling and dispensing of various 4
cleanng liquids 125 |Tolco
49 : -
Brass and Chrome Polish; cieaner must E.Hmwmm o Ecolab 12=g 5 1 11480 90.51 $67.50| g1y +$67.50/cs
be suitable for the cleaning of brss and Mota woﬂ..m 8.50 #
chrome fixtures and leave the cleaned
surface with a high gioss finish. 200 {Ceilo Solanne
50 |Urinal Blocks with Para - must eliminate!  Aim Epnctr w/scredn Ecolab} 12-100 g 1 6114 47.09 $37.58|N/A 537.58/cs
odors at their source; 125  |Fresh 4,45 # 42000
51 Urinal Blocks, non Para - must Aimp Enetr wereen | Ecolab 1 12-1 b
eliminate odors at their source; 125 [Fresh L4511 mwm& 47.09 | $37.58|N/A $37.58/cp
52 |Toilet Bowl Blocks with Para - must Aim Hnctr w/scrednEcolab (1—100 g 6114
eliminate odors at their source 125 |Fresh 445 #F 1 4200 47.09 $37.58 N/A §37.58/ck
53 |Toilet Bowl Blocks, non Para - must Aim Boctr w/scredpfcolab [12-100 g - 6114
eliminate odors at their source 125 |[Fresh L.45 # 1 L2700 47.09 $37.58 N/A $37.58/c
54 |Urinal Screen-Para Urinai screen with KrystallKRY | Bcolab [12-100 6114 [ 37.58/ck
cleaner block Aim Fnctr w/screen| 100 IPBS 4.45 %m 1 4200 47.09 37,58 VA ¥ &
65 |Urinal Screen (non-parabow! block} KrystabFRS 124 Ecolab 12~ 100 ¢ 6114
Flexible Screen Aim Fnctr w/screenl 100 |SAN! G.45 # 1 ¢ 4200 47.09 1537.58 N/A $37.58/cp

[35Y
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HOUSEQ9 Pricing Sheets

Vendors shouid compiete all columns. Note: Items 7, 14, and 16 require additional information be added in the description coiumn.
Minwaum |Vendor Diluted
Est. Qrder item List Unit] Discount Unit | Cost/
Htem # Description Qty | EqualTo Brand | Size/Wt [Quantity INumber | Price | % Category| Price | ounce | Total
56 !
Simpie Orange Orange Ecolab 2.5 gal 1 14559 124.02 568.29 | 00667 1568.29
Product must be heavy duty, non-butyl, Force 22.70 #

orange citrus degreaser that removes H
grease, grime, and tough stams;

cencentrated product; environmetnally
friendly; biodegradable, nort toxic, non
flammable, non-corrosive, non-aprasive | 125 1Simple Orange
57 [Cleaner, liguid spray, efiminates gooey,
sticky, gummy, greasy problems, 16 oz

NO BID
Spray. Goo Gone
58 |Rinse Free, non ammoniated, . 76.13 $51.38 .00689 $51.38/cd
emuisifier floor stripper, equat to Cello Ow_:uquqmm_n% Ecolab | 35 gal 1 6121
mop and strip 125 IBasefine 47.50 # 5249
59 Qasis ,r.ﬁ Ecolab § 2.5 gal 1 14191 150.75 £63.05 1.00038 £63.05
Sanitizer, nonporous surfaces, Ammornium
quaternary ammomurn compound 10% Sanifizer
60 | Disinfectant Clesner 2.0 Sprcn Span Alll Feolab 15 gal 1 14538
pumose Spray & 92.87 mmb.wm. .00134{ $54.92/q
Spic and Span {or equai} Disinfecting & Glass
all-purpose spray and glass cleaner 125 |Cleaner
61
Fire resistant, heavy duty piastic
wastebaskets with rolled typ edge. i MO BID
Without cover, will not bum, non-
metallic type, UL Clasified Rectangular Rubbermaid
and round styles, (40 quart) 50 |#2544

652 |Refuse contaner, step-cn style, for use
in public laboratonies, kitchens and
hospitals. Ceonrtainers to have a
smooth easy to clean white finish
complete with lid on top, controlled by Rubbermaid
foot pedal. (18 gallon) 50 [#6145

63 [Refuse contamer, slep-on style, for use
lin public iaboratories kitchens and
hospitats. Conrtainers to have a
smaoth easy to clean white finish
complate with lid on top, controlled by Rubbemaid
foot pedal. (12 gallon) 50 [#6144 | i ~N7
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HOUSEQ09 Pricing Sheets

Vendors should complete ail columns. Note: ltems 7, 14, and 16 require additional information be added in the description column.

Minimum [Vendor ! Diluted
Est. Order Item List Unit}{ Discount Unit | CostY
Yem # Description Qty Equal To Brand | Size/Wt {Quantity |Number | Price % Category| Price | ounce | Totai
64 Wastebasket, fiare resistant, heavy duty :

plastic; rofled top edge, without cover, NO BID
will not burn, non-mertallic type, ul
clagsified. Rectangutar and round Rubbermaid
styles. (28 Quart) 50 |#2543

65 |Round garbage containers with covers:
Heavy Duty, mstitutional quality,
seamiess construction. Boil proof and
steam cleanable (235 degrees
F.Molded handles; heavy duly bae of
container shafl accept manufacturer's Rubbermaid
dolly. (32 gallon} 2632/2631

66 |Round Garbage containers with covers;
heavy duty; institutional quality;
seamless construction. Boil proof and
steam cieanable (235 degess F.}
Molded handles; heavy duty base of

container shatl accept manufacturer's Ruhbermaid
dolly. 25 {2855/2654
67 Rubbermaid

Conversion doily with casfers for above 25 #2640

68 )
Square big wheel container; general

refuse confainer with swing back top.
Unit desinged with large wheels for
movement of contamner over curbs and Rubbemnaid
sieps. #2558

60 [Water pails; hot dipged in molten zinc
after forming; raised bottom, plamn

galvanized wire gail, heavy stamp Rubbermaid
fiveted or wing ears. (10 quart) 2963

70 |Water Pail; heavy duty plastic with
rounded edges and a heavy wire bail. Rubbermaid
{10 quarf) #2983

71 |Water Pail; heavy duty plastic with
rounded edges and heavy wirs bail. {14 Rubbermaid
quart) #2614

72  {Waste receptacles, self-closing counter
balance door closure. Round ip style;
durable cnstruction for mdoor or outdoor

use, Factory mutual approved for fire Rubbermaid
safely. #2614

73 |Buffing pad for burnishing with 1500 H
RPM up 3000 RPM. i
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HOUSEO9 Pricing Sheets

Vendors should complete all coiumns. !

Note: ltems 7, 14, and 16 reguire additional information be added in the description column.

Minimum {Vendor Dituted
Est. Order Item List Unit| Discount Unit | Cost/
ftem # Description Gty Equal To Brand | Size/Wt |Quantity {Number Price % Category| Price | ounce Totail
Broom-brush specifications -
74 |Brush, floor, fine and medium, 14" Marnno NO BID
synthetic fiber #BF2195F14 :
75 |Brush, floor, fine and medium, 18" !
synthetic fiber Weiler #77013
76 [Brush, floor, fine and medium, 24"
synthetic fiber Weiler #77014
77 {Brush, ficor, ine and mediunt, 30° :
synthetic fiber Flatt #70126
78 |[Brush, floor, fine and medium, 36" Marine
synthetic fiber . [HBR219SF36
79 |Handle for fine & rmedium sweeping:
Handle 1s construcied of clsoe gran
species of hardwood with a smooth
lacquer finish. Handle ientth s 0" and
has a diameter of 1 1/8". Sturdy
tapered cuf threaded end with a 3/4" #5
acme thread to fit the fine and medium :
brushes. Wieier #75513
80 |Bi-level rofating joint Scrub Brush for
floor with Crimped Polypropylene that
rotates 360 degrees with threaded
handles.
Specifications for Medium & Rough Sweepmg (without handles)
Brush 1s designed for the sweeping of rough floor surfaces. Block is 1acquer finished hardwood, close grain
species, two handle hoies equal distance from each end at approximately 35 degree angle, tapered with 3/4" #8
acme thread. Bristles maternal is inserted into 1/4" hoie, Bristie frim iength shalt be specified length + ar - 1/4".
Polymer solvent resistant synthetic fiber has a diameter of .30" and length of 3 1/4", bassine fiber a shall be stiff
high quaiity fiber and have a length of 4",
81 |Brush, floor, medium and fugh, 14" i
bagsine Flatt #70200
82 |Brush, floor, medium and rough, 24"
bassine H Flatt #77033
]
I
Specifications for Rough Sweeping (without handles}
Brush 1s designed for the sweeping of rough floor surfaces. Block ts iacquer finished hardwood, close grain
species; fwo handle holes equal distance from each end at approximately 45 degree angle. Minimum dimension
of block shail be 1 1/8" thick, 3 1/2" wide x length gtven for each item. Fiber length shalt be +/ 1/4°, Copolymer
solvent resistant synthetic fiber shall be 5 1/8" in length. African sherbo bassine fiber shall be 8 1/4" in length ;
83 [Brush, floor, rough, 16* African Shero | [Flatt #70203 | ! m ! i
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HOUSEQQ Pricing Sheets

Vendors should complete ail columns. |

Note: ltems 7, 14, and 16 require additional information he added in the descrption column.

ltem #

1

Description

Equal To

Brand

Minimum
Order
Size/Wt {Quantity

Vendor
Kem
Number

I List Unit

Price

Discount
Y

Category

Unit
Price

Diluted
Cos¥
ounce

Total

84

Brush, floor, rough, 16" synthefic fiber

Flatt #70211

85

Handle for rough swesping must be
canstructed of ciose gram species of
hardwitd with a smooth lacquer finish.
Handle length 1s 54" and has a diameter
of 1 1/8". Sturdy tapered end to fit the
rugh sweeping floor brush.

flatt #76519

NO ﬁHU

Cut end wet mop heads; four-ply, cut
end natural yam; absorbent cotton for
general mopping; heavy duly vinyi
mesh headbands. Premum standard
head

g6

16 ounce

UNS 2316C

87

20 ounce

UNS 220C

88

24 ounce

UNS 224C

Cut end wet mop neads; four-ply, cut
end natural yarn; absorbent rayon
heavy duty vinyl mesh headbands,
Premium standard hgad

89

16 ounce

UNS 216R

0

20 ounce

UNS 220R

oA

24 ounce

UNS 224R

92

Super loop head; 5 inch vinyi mesh
12/CS - small

93

Super ioop head; 5 inch vinyl mesh
12/CS - medium

94

Dust mop heads; size 18 X 6 1/2; blue
color slot top clip on closer

95

Toilet bowl Map - made of plastic
handles and a non-absorbant acrylic
head.

96

Looped end maop heads with wide
bands at the top. 160z and 240z -
meadivm

97

Looped end mop heads with wide
bands at the top. 160z and 240z - large

98

Wet mop handles fiberglass small and
large. Side reiease gate for fast and
easy mop change.

99

Dust mop heads; 4-ply cotton blend with

looped ends. 24" x 5"

~

Page 10 of 12

Rev. 07/20/2009

T

sy



HOUSEQ9 Pricing Sheets

Vendors should compiete ail columns.

! Note: Items 7, 14, and 16 require additional information be added in the description column.

i

T

snap. 24" x 5"

: Minimum {Vendor | Diluted
Est. Otder ltem List Unit] Discount Unit | Cost/
ltem # Description Qty Equal To Brand | Size/Wt |{Quantily [Number ; Price % Category| Price | ounce | Total
100 |Dust mop frame and handle swivei and

NO BID

Mop Buckets

98

35 Q1. Yellow with a down press wnnger,

NOTE: items that are mtended for diluted use MUST inciude Manufacturer's snformation on dilution ratios,

: List Discount Perceniages:

l{Use additional sheets if needed for number of

discount percentages heing offered.)

H

Category

%

OGO~ G [ {4 [P |

Lo il

Vendors should complete the contract coordinator Information beiow:
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HOUSEG9 Pricing Sheets

Vendors should complete all columns, Note: ltemis 7, 14, and 16 require additional information be added in the description column.
Minimum {Vendor | Diluted
Est. Order ltem List Unit| Discount Unit ; Cost/
item Description Qty Equal To Brand | SizefWt |Quantity |Number | Price % Category| Price | ounce | Total

VENDOR Ecolab Inc.

NAME: pHONE: ©51-293-4310

CONTACT

PERSON;_omas E. Ohs cax.  651-293-2682
(Please print}

emal:  susie.diaz@ecolab.com

o omar £ Do wusos

(Signature) {Date)
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