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GENERAL TERMS & CONDITIONS ' -
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION (RFQ) AND REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL (RFP) .~

1. Awards will be made in the best inferest of the State of West Virginia.

2. The State may accept or reject in part, or in whole, any bid.

3. Prior to any award, the apparent successful vendor must be properly registered with the Purchasing Division
and have paid the required $125 fee.

4, Al services performed or goods delivered under State Purchase Order/Confracts are to be continued for the
term of the Purchase Crder/Contracis, contingent upon funds being appropriated by the Legislature or otherwise
being made available. in the event funds are not appropriated or otherwise available for these setvices or goods
this Purchase Order/Contract hecomes void and of no effect after June 30.

5. Payment may only be made after the delivery and acceptance of goods or services.

6. Interest may be paid for late payment in accordance with the West Virginia Code.

7. Vendor preference will be granted upon written request in accordance with the West Virginia Code.

8. The State of West Virginia is exempt from federal and state taxes and will not pay or reimburse such taxes.

9. The Director of Purchasing may cancel any Purchase Order/Contract upon 30 days written notice to the seller.

10. The laws of the State of West Virginia and the Legislalive Rules of the Purchasing Division shall govern the
purchasing process.

11. Any reference to automatic renewal is hareby deleted. The Contract may be renewed only upon mutual written
- agreement of the parties.

12. BANKRUPTCY: In the event the vendorfcontractor files for bankruptoy protection, the State may deem
this contract nuli and void, and terminate such contract without further order. '

13. HIPAA BUSINESS ASSOCIATE ADDENDUM: The West Virginia State Government HIPAA Business Associate
Addendum {BAA}, approved by the Attorney General, is available online at www.state.wv.us/admin/purchase/vrc/hipaa.htm
and is hereby made part of the agreement. Provided that the Agency meets the definition of a Cover Enfity
(45 CFR §160.103) and will be disclosing Protected Health Information (45 CFR §160.103) to the vendor.

14, CONFIDENTIALITY: The vender agrees that he or she will not disclose to anyone, directly -or indirectly, any such
personally identifiable information or other confidential information gained from the agency, unless the individual who is
the subject of the information consents to the disclosure in writing or the disclosure is made pursuant to the agency’s
policies, procedures, and rules, Vendor further agrees to comply with the Confidentiality Policies and Information
Security Accountability Requirements, set forth in hitp /Awww state wv.us/admin/purchase/privacy/notice Confidentiality. pdf.

15. LICENSING: Vendors must be licensed and in good standing in accordance with any and all state and local laws and
requirements by any state or local agency of Wast Virginia, including, but not fimited to, the West Virginia Secretary
of State's Office, the West Virginia Tax Depariment, and the West Virginia Insurance Commission. The vendor must
provide all necessary releases to obtain information fo enable the director or spending unit to
verify that the vendor is licensed and in good standing with the above entities.

16, ANTITRUST: In submitting a bid to any agency for the Slate of West Virginia, tha bidder offers and agrees that
if the bid is accepted the bidder will convey, sell, assign or fransfer fo the State of West Virginia all rights, title and interest
in and to all causes of action it may now or hereafter acquire under the antitrust laws of the United States and the State of
West Virginia for price fixing and/or unreasonable restraints of frade relating fo the particular commodities or services
purchased or acquired by the State of West Virginia. Such assignment shall be made and become effective at the time the
purchasing agency tenders the initial payment to the bidder. :

| certify that this bid is made without prior understanding, agreement, or connection with a1y corporation, firm, limited
liability company, partnership, or person or entity submitting a bid for the same material, supplies, equipment or
services and is in all respects fair and without collusion or Fraud. | further certify that | am authorized to sign
the 'certification on behalf of the bidder or this bid,

INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS

1. Use the quotation forms provided by the Purchasing Division. Complete all sections of the quotation form.

2. llems offered must be in compliance with the specifications. Any deviation from the specifications must be clearly
indicated by the bidder. Alternates offered by the bidder as EQUAL to the specifications must be clearly
defined. A bidder offering an alternate should attach complete specifications and literature to the bid. The
Purchasing Division may waive minor deviations to specifications.

3. Unit prices shall prevall in case of discrepancy. All quotations are considerad F.O.B. destinalion unless alte.ate
shipping terms are clearly identified in the quotation,

4. All quotations must be delivered by the bidder to the office listed below prior fo the date and fime of the bid
opening. Failure of the biddar to deliver the quotations on time will result in bid disqualifications: Department of
Administration, Purchasing Division, 2018 Washingion Street East, P.O. Box 50130, Charleston, WV 25305-0130

5. Communication during the solicitation, bid, evaluation or award periods, except through the Purchasing Division,
is strictly prohibited {(W.Va, C.5.R. §148-1-6.8). : ‘

Rev. 12/16/09
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SPECIFICATIONS

The following sections of the West Virginia Department of
Transportation, Division of Highways Standard Specifications Roads
and Bridges, adopted 2000, as modified by the current Supplemental
gpecifications shall apply to the administration of this Contract:
Sections 101, 102.4, 102.5, 1i06%.1, 105.3, 105.4, 105.10, 105.11,
105.%2, 105.13, 106.3, 106.4, 106.5, 106.6, 106.7, 106.9, L1C7.1,
107.2, 107.3, 107.14, 107.1%, 107.20, 108.8, 108.83, 109.1, 109%.2 and
109.20.

. Materials and equipment shall conform to the requirements of Bection

219 and 601.
Section 601.7 iz amended as follows:

DELETE THE SECOND AND THIRD PARAGRAPHE AND SUBSTITUTE
THE FOLLOWING: ‘

Concrete may be made by wvolumetric batching and continuous mixing

(concrete mobile) as designated in AASHTO M241, except as otherwise

gspecified herein.

When a truck mixer or agitator is used for transporting concrete, the
concrete shall be delivered to the site of the work and discharge
shall be completed within 1 1/2 hours after the addition of the
cement to the aggregates. Each batch of comcrete delivered at the -job
site shall be accompanied by a batch ticket (8T-17) bearing complete

' batching information. In adverse weather or uader other conditions

contributing to quick stiffening of the concrete, or when the
temperature of the concrete is 85° F. or above, the time between the
intreduction of the cement to the aggregates and discharge shall not
exceed one hour. When a truck mixer is used for the complete mixing
of the concrete, the mixing operation shall begin within one hour
after the cement has been added teo the aggregate. :

The addition of water after completion of initial mixing will not be
permitted, except that when concrete is delivered in truck mnmixers
additional water may be added to adjust to a specified consistency.
In this event, a minimum of 20 additiomal revelutions of the truck
mixer drum at mixing speed shall be regquired before discharge of any
concrete. The maximum allowable number of revolutions at mixing
gpeed shall not be exceeded in total mixing; and the maximum
allowable time between the addition of the cement to the aggregates
and the discharge of the batch shall not be exceeded. Concrete that
is not within the specified consistency limits at the time of
placement shall not be used.



10.

If the Vendor's plant certification expires during the life of this
contract, B8C0's will not be issued for concrete and controlled low-
strength material (CLSM) £rom that plant until such time as the
plant's certification is renewed.

In the event a Contractor faile to conform to the requirements set
out in this contract document, the State Contract Purchase Order or
the governing specifications, the SCO may be canceled and reissued to
the next low bidder.

MATERIAL TESTING

the Vendor will conduct all tésts reguired by the specifications to
be performed at the plant. Any job site testing reguired by the
specifications will be performed by the Divigion.

ACCEPTANCE PLAN

Material failing to comply with the guality requirements will not be
accepted, and will be returmed at the Vendor's expense.

DELIVERY
The unit Bid Price quoted‘for Conerete and Controllied Low-Streagth

Material (CLSM) Items A through I shall include delivery within five
{(5) miles of the Vendor's Plant.

TEMPERATURE CONTROL

The Vendor is reguired to meet the temperature regquirements as set
forth in the Standard Specifications. :

ADMIXTURES

All concrete shall be air-entrained. The cost of the air-entraining
agent shall be included in the Unit Bid Price of the concrete and no
additional charge Ffor air-emtraining agent will be allowed under Item
g, Admixture.

VENDOR'S INVOICE

Vendor's invoices must be submitted in original and one copy and
contain the following:

a. Division of Highways State Contract Order (8CO} Number
and this Comtract Number.
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Vendors should type Bid Schedules

The Bid Schedules ave ready for download on Purchasing’s Web site at
www.state.wv.us/admin/purchase . -

lz2.

Item
No.

J.

BIDDING SCHEDULE

Unit Bid Price for Ttems A through I, to include delivery within £ive
(5) miles of Vendor's Plant.

ORDER SIZE IN CUBIC YARDS

DISTRICT 1 PRICE PER CUBIC YARD

2-2.98CY 3-3,99CY 4-4,99CY 5 CY & Over

Class Concrete} 88.25/CY 150,25 /CY 13125 /CY /CY

Class Concrete 4 83.25/@5{. 145 gg/CY 126,25 /0y 107.25 /cy

Class Concrete] 79,25/CY 141.25/CY 122 25 /CY 103 25/{:‘:

2
B

Class C Concrete]g].,25/CY 143, 25/CY 124.25/CY 105 25 ./CY
D
X Concrete]89.25/cY 151,25/CY 132 25/CY 113.,.925/CY

Class

Modified Class K
Concrete, 8-1/2 Bag

Mix, Siliceous Sand 21g8_pp- /CY 189—:—@«Q~/CY 164 .EE{CY 142,00 /Y

CLEM Type & 170.50 /ey 132.50/CY  113.50/CY 94 _50/CY

cLsM Type B 168.50 /%Y 139-56-'F 4 i /cY /CY

CLSM Type C 178.59‘/&[ 140 SQ/CY 121.59/(3‘.( QEE.SE/CY

Will Class B Concrete supplied at prices
quoted above contain limestone sand? no

If so, state additional charge to provide
Class B Concrete using siliceous sand NA /oy

Charge per bag for increased cement
content above the target value. 12.00/¢Y

Additional Haul: Vendor may bid either or both options; however, the
Division of Highways will select the most cost effective option.

Option A § per cubic yard per mile
Option B $__4.00 per truck load per mile



12. BIDDING SCHEDULE (coptinued) DISTRICT 1

M. Admixture, per cubic yard
1) Water-reducing set retarder £1.50 ¢y
2) Water reducer - $ N/A CY
3) Calcium chloride based accelerator
(HE-122 or approved equal £3.50 ,107%
4) Hon-calcium chloride based accelerator
{(Darex Set Accelerator or approved equal $6.00 /107
5) Super plasticizer (Eucon 37 or approved
equal ‘ £ 6,00 CY
6) Fiber £ f.50 CY
7} Heated Concrete $ 4,25 C¥
8) Ice $ .50 per pound
. Due to time constraints, the cement may bave to be added

to the transit mixer at the project site using Division
personnel. Please state any additiomal c¢harges as

follows:
1} Cement provided and transported to
project site by vendor § /CY
2) Cement provided by vendor and transported
from Vendor's plant to project site by
Division $76.,.00/B /C
86.00/K
o. Penalty Charge for unloading time
in excess of ten (10) minutes per cubic .
vard. $ 1.85 per truck minute

Plant Location Chapel Rd. Gassaway, WV
304-364-8340




1z,

Item
Ho.

NO BID

BIDDING SCHEDULE (Continuted)

Unit Bid Price for ttems A through I, to include delivery within five

() miles of Vendor's Plant.

ORDER SIZE IN CUBIC YARDS

District __2 NO BID PRICE PER CUBIC YARD

2-2.99CY 3-3,99CY 4-4,90CY 5 C¥ & Over

Class A Conorete, _  /CY _jex ey /cy
Ciass B Conecrete,  /CY ey A" 4 /oY
Class C Comcrete, _ /CY _Joy oy /CY
Class D Comcrete, _  /CY _fcx Y 4 /CY
Class X Concrete, /Y /ey /CY /cY

Modified Class K
Concrete, 8-1/2 Bag

Mix, Siliceous Sand /Y /cY /oY

CLSM Type & _Jey - ey /cY
CLSM Type B ey ey A 1 /CY
CLESM Type C /CY /cY ____W/CY /cY

Will Class B Concrete sup?lied at prices
gquoted above contain limestone sand?

If go, state additional charge to provide
Class B Concrete uging siliceocus sand /CY

Charge . per bag f£or increased cement
content above the target wvalue. /ey

 additional Haul: Vendor may bid either or both options; however,

Division of Highways will select the most cost effective option.
Option A § per cubic yvard per mile

Cption B § per truck load per mile

/ey

the

13



NO BID
12. BIDDING SCHEDULE (continued) DISTRICT 2
M. admixture, per cubic yard
1) Water-reducing set retarder =
2) Water reducer g
3) Calcium chloride based accelerator
(HE-122 or approved egual) &
4) Non-caleium chloride based accelerator
(Darex Set Accelerator or approved equal’ ]
5) Super plasticizer (Eucon 37 or approved
egual) g
6) Fiber ]
7} Heated Concrete g
§) Ice s
N. Pue to time constraints, the cement may have to be added
to the transit mixer at the project site using Division
personnel. Please state any additional charges as
foliows: .
1) cement provided and transported to
project site by Vendor 8 /CY
2) Cement provided by vendor and transported
from Vendor's plant to project site by
Division § /c
o. Penalty Charge for unloading time

in excess of ten (10) minutes per cubic
yard.

Plant Location

v
cy

OZ
1044
<Y

cY
CY

per pound

=S per truck minute

14



12,

Item
No.

G}

BIDDING SCHEDULE (Continued)

Unit Bid Price for Items A through I, to include delivery within five

(5) miles of Vendor's Plant.

ORDER SIZE IN CUBIC YARDS

Digtrict 3 PRICE PER CUBIC YARD

2-2.88CY 3-3.98CY 4-4.99CY 5 CY & Over

Class A& Concrete] 74, 75/CY 136,775 /oY 11775 Fos's 08 75 /CY
Class B Concretel67.,75/CY¥ 129,75 /C¥110.75.../CY 91.75 /CY

Class € Concrete, 165.73¢cY 127,75 /oY 108,75/¢Y  89.75 . /CY

Classe D Concrete, 163.7%cy 125.75 /ov106.75 /cy 87.75 Jcy
Class K Comerete, 173.7%3cy135.76 /oy1t16,.75 /cy 97,75 __/CY

Modified Class K
Concrete, 8-1/2 Bag

Mix, Siliceous Sand 200.75/CY 162.75/CY 143.75./CY 124 735 /CY

CLEM Type A 152,75 /ey 114.75 /cy 95.75/CY 76.75 _/cY

CLSM Type B 151.75 joy 113.75 /¢y 94.75/cY 75,75 /oy
CLSM Type C 165.75 ey 127.75/cy  108,.75/cy 89.75 /CY

Will Class B Concrete supplied at prices
quoted above contain limestone sand? NO

Tf so, state additional charge to provide
Class B Concrete using siliceous sand N/A/CY

Charge per bag for increased cement
content above the target value. 12.00/CY

additional Haul: .Vendor may bid either or both options; however, the

Division of Highways will select the most cost effective optiom.
Option & 3 per cubic yvard per mile
option B 5_4.,00 per truck load per mile

15

NOT®: Gassaway & glenville Plants -~ For materials supplied to District
3 from either of these plants refer to District 1/9 price pages

for items A thru L,
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12. BIDDING SCHEDULE (Ceontipued) DISTRICT 3

M. Admixture, per cubic yard
1) Water-reducing set retarder g 1.50 C¥v
2} Water reducer g IJ[A (84
3) Caleium chloride based acceslerator
(HE-122 or approved egqual) $ 3.50/ o3
4) Non-calcium chloride based accelerator

{Darex Set Bhocelerator or approved egual $_6.00/102

5) Super plasticizer (Eucon 37 or approved
equal) $_g oo CY
6} Fiber $ .6 50 cY
7 Heated Contrate $.4.25 C¥
8) ice g 50 per pound
N. Due to time constraints, the cement may have to be added
to the transit mixer at the project site using Division
personnel. Please state any additional charges ag’
follows:
1) Cement provided and transported to
project site by Vendor 2 /CcY
2) Cement provided by Vendor and transported
from Vendor's plant to project site by
Divigion S76.00/R. /C
: , 86.00/K
0. Penalty Charge for unloading time

in excess of ten (10) minutes per cubic

yard.

Plant Location _Route 73N (Saltwell -Bx

NOTE: Gassaway &

$ _1._85 per truck minute

304-592~5577 Dispatch

Lynch Run Road, Glenville
304-452-8747 bDispatch

Chapel Rcoad, Gassaway
304-364-8340 Dispatch

Glenville Plants - For materials supplied to District 3

from either of these plants refer to District 1/9 price pages
for items A thru L.



1z2. BIDDING SCHEDULE (Continued)

‘Unit Bid Price for Items A through I, to include delivery within five

{(5) miles of Vendor's Plant.

Item
No.
A, Class
B Class

<. Class
D, Class

B, Ciasg

ORDER $IZE IN CUBIC YARDS

District

2-2.98CY
A Concrete,174.75CY
B Concrete,16/.75CY
C Concrete,165,75CY
D Concrete,163.75/CY

¥ Concrete,173.,75/CY

. Modified Class K
Concrete, B-1/2 Bag
‘Mix, Siliceous Sand 200.75 /¢y 162.75/CY 143,75 /oY 124.75 /cY

G. CLSM Type & 152 .75 /ey
H. cneM Type B 151,75 /cy

I, CLEM Type C 165.75 /cY

if so, state additional charge to provide

3-3.95CY
136.75 /CY
129.75 /cx

127,75 /CY
125,75 /¢y

135.75 /CY

114757 ¥
113.75/C¥

PRICE PER CUBIC YARD

4-4.99CY 5 CY & Over
117,75 /CY 98 .75 /CY
110.75 /cY 9_‘[____15___/0‘\_’
108.75./CY 89,75 . /€Y
106.75 /¢y 87,75 .../CY
116.75._/CY  97.75.. /CY

9535 Fios's
94,75 /cY

127,.75/CY 108.75../SY

J. Wiil Class B Concrete supplied at prices
quoted above contain limestone sand?

Class B Concrete using siliceous sand

. Charge per bag for increased cement
content above the target value.

L. additional Haul:

67 /oy

75,75 /CY
89 .75 /oY

—NO ...

N/A

/CY

12,00 /oy

Vendor may bid either or both options; however, the

Division of Highways will select the most cost effective option.

Option A §

per cubic yard per mile

optien B & 3.00 per truck load per mile

17



12. BTDDING SCHEDULE (continued) DISTRICY 4

M. admixture, per cubic yard
1) Water-reducing set retarder £1.50 oy
2) Water reducer $ N/A oY
3) Calciuvm chloride based accelerator
(HE-122 or approved equal) $3,.50/19%
4) Non-calciom chloride based accelerator
(Darex Set Accelerator or approved equal $6.00/19%
5) Super plasticizer (Eucon 37 or approved
equal) $6.00 cy
&) Fiber ‘ $6.50 cy
7} Heated Concrete £4,.25 (54'4
8) ice 5 .50 per pound
N. Due to time constraints, the cement may have to be added

to the transit mixer at the project site using Division
personnel. Please state any additional charges as

follows:
1) Cement provided and transported to
project site by Vendor k4 /oy
2) Cement provided by Vendeor and ¢ransported
from Vendor's plant to project site by :
Division $ 76.00/n /C
86.00/K
0. Penalty Charge for unloading time
in excess of ten (10) minutes per cubic
vard. £ 1.85 pexr truck minute

plant Location Route 73N (Saltwell Exit)
304-592-5577 Dispatch

3100 Morgahtown, Industrial Park, Westover
304-592~5577 Dispatch



1z. BIDDING SCHEDULE (Continued)

Unit Bid Price for Items A through I, to include delivery within £five
{8} miles of Vendor's Plant.

ORDER SIZE IN CUBIC YARDS

District 5 PRICE PER CUBIC YARD
Ttem
No. 2-2,98CY 3-3,80CY 4-4,98CY 5 CY & Over
a. Class concrete, 172.7%cy 134,75 /cy115,75 _/¢Y 96,75 /CY

B Class Conc-rete,764.75(CY 126.75 /c¥107.75 /CY  88.75 /CY

conerete,160.7Fcy 122.75 sey103,75 /oy 84,75 Vlex's

A
B
c. Clase C Concrete,162.7%cy 124.75 /cy105,75 /ey 86.75 /<Y
D. Clags b
K

E. class K Concrete,!71.7%ecy 133.75 /ev114.75 /cY 95,75 Fies's

¥. Modified Class K
Concrete, 8-1/2 Bag

Mix, Siliceous Samd 1907 .75 /CY 159.75CY 140,75 /oY 19475 /ey

@. CLSM Type A 152,75CY 114.75CY 95/75./CY 75,75 /cY
H. LEM B C

CLSM Type 151,75/ 113,25/ o435/ g5g5—T
I. CLSM Type C 165.75/cy 127.75/cy 108.75 /cY 89.75 /ey
J. Will Class B Concrete supplied at prices

quoted above contain limestone sand? NO

Tf so, state additional charge to provide

Class B Concrete using siliceous sand N/A /oy
K. Charge per bag for increased cement

content above the target value. 12.00 /cy
L. Additional Haul: Vendor may bid either or both options; however, the

Divipion of Highways will select the most cost effective option.
Option A § per cubic yard per mile

Option B $4,00 per truck load per mile



1z,

BIDDING SCHEDULE (continued) DISTRICT 5

M.

Admixture, per cubic yard

1) Water-reducing set retarder g 1.50 oy
2) Water reducer & N/A CY
3) Calcium chloride based accelerator
(HE-122 or approved equal) 8.50/1%0% 4}

Non-calcium chloride based accelerator

{Darex Set Accelerator or approved egual %.,.00/7%0%

5} Super plasticizer (Hucon 37 or approved
equal) %,00 cy
6} Fiber %.50 CY
7) Heated Concrete 4,25 oy
8) Ice $ .50 per pound

Due to time comstraints, the cement may have to be added
to the tramsit mixer at the project site using Division
personnel. Please state any additional charges as

follows:
1) Cement provided and transported to
project gite by Vendor $ /CY
2} Cement provided by Vendor and transported

from Vendor's plant to project site by

Division s 76, OOZB/C

86.00/K
Penalty Charge for unloading time
in excess of ten {10) m:l.nutes per cubic :
vard. $1.85 per truck minute

Plant Locatien 0OLd Route 219, North Elkins
304-630-5577 Dispatch

20



1z.

Item
No.

G.

BIDDING SCHEDULE (Continued)

Unit Bid Price for Items A through I, to include delivery within five
(5) miles of Vendor's Plant.

ORDER SIZE IN CUBIC YARDS

District 6 PRICE PER CUBIC YARD

2-2.,98CY 3-3.99CY 4-4,98CY 5 CY & Over

Class A Ccmcrete,"E;l?cﬂ%;j_@__/cﬂwggw/w 98.75 jcy
Class B Comcrete, 0/:7%cy129.15 /cy110.75 /ey 91.75 /CY
Class ¢ Concrete,!65:7%cy127.75 /cy108,75 /cYy 89.75 /cx
Class D Concrete,163-7%cy125.75 /cy106.75 /cY 89.75 /ey
Class K Concrete, | .J_,_B_'__l7__5/vC:Y‘l 35.75 yey116.75 /oy 97.75 /cY
Modified Class K

Cancrete, 8-1/2 Bag
Mix, Siliceous Samd 200.75 /CY 162,75./CY 143,75 /CY 124,75 /ey

cLew Type A 152,75 /CY 114.75/CY 95 75./CY g 55 /CY
cLeM Type B 151 .75 /CY 113,75 /CY g4 55 /O g5 e /CY
cLsM Type C  165.75_/CY 127,75 /Y 108.95-/Y  gg.55——/C¥
will Class B Concrete supplied at prices

guoted above contain limestone sand? _.NO

If so, state additional charge to provide
Class B foncrete using siliceous sand N/A /CY

Charge per bag for increased cement ‘
content above the target value. 12.00 /cY

Additional Haul: Vendor may bid either or both options; however, the
Division of Highways will select the most cost aeffective option.

Opticon A § per cubic yard per mile

option B ¢ _4.00 per truck load per mile

21



12.

BIDDING SCHEDULE (continued) DISTRICT 6

Admixture, per cubic yard

1) Water-reducing set retarder $1.50 cv
2} Water reducer $ N/A cY
3) Calecium chloride based accelerator

(HE-122 or approved egual) 8.50/1 8y
4) Non-calcium chloride based accelerator

{Darex Set Acocelerator or approved equal $.00/ 10%
5} Super plasticizer (Zucon 37 or approved

equal) 56,00 oy
&) Fibex $6.50 cCv
7) Heated Concrete $4.25 Y
8) Ice s RO per pound

Due to time constraints, the cement may have to be added
to the transit mixer at the projsct site using Division
personnel. Please state any additional charges as
follows:

1) Cement provided and transported to
project site by Vendor 3 JoY
2) Cement provided by Vendor and transported
from Vendor's plant to project site by
Division $76.00/8 /C
86.00/K

Penalty Charge for unloading time
in excess of ten (10) minutes per cubic

yard. $_1.858 per truck minute

Plant Location 3100 Morgantown i ; Westover

304-592~-5577 Dispatch

Route 73N Bridgeport (saltwell Exit)
304-592-5577 Dispatch
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12.

Item
No.

G.

23

BIDDING SCHEDULE (Continued)

Unit Bid Price for Items A through I, to include delivery within five
{3) miles of Vendor's Plant.

ORDER SIZE IN CUBIC YARDS

District 7 PRICEZ PER CUBIC YARD

' 2-2.98CY 3-3.98CY 4-4.90CY 5 CY & QOver

Ciass A Concrete, 174.7Bcy 136.75/cY 117,.75/CY g8 .75 /CY
Class B Concrete, 167.7BCY 129,.75/CY 110, 75/CY 91,75 . /CY
Class C Concrete, 165/7%cY 127.75/CY 108.75./CY gg 75 /CY
Ciass D Concrete, 163.73cy 125,75/¢Y 106,75./CY 87.75. /CY

Class K Concrete, 173, 7¥CY 135_75/CY 146.757CY GF5 /CY

Modified Class K
Concrete, 8-1/2 Bag

Mix, Siliceous Sand 200.,.76./CY 162_._'15/CY 143,75 /CY 12495 /CY

CLSM Type A  152.75 /¢y  114.79CY 9575 /CY 76 75 /C¥

cusM Type B 191.75  jev 113.7%cvy 94.75/cy 75,75 /CY
CLEM Type C 165.75 oy 127.7%cy 108.75 sev 89.75 Joy

Wiil Class B Concrete supplied at prices
quoted above contain limestone sangd? NO

If so, state additicnal charge to provide
Class B Concrete using siliceous sand N/fa __/CY

Charge per bag for increased cement '
content above the target value. 12,00 /ey

additional Haul: Vendor may bid either or both options; however, the
Division of Highways will select the most cost effective option.

Option A $§ ~ per cubic yard per mile
option B $ 3.00  per truck load per mile
NOTE: Gassgway‘& Glenville Plants - For materials Supplied
tg Digtrlct 7 from either of these plants refer to
District 1/9 price pages for items A thru L.
Elkins Plant - For materials Supplied to pistrict 7 from

the Elkins Plant refer to District 8 price page foritems
4 thru L. '



12. BIDDING SCHEDULE (comtinued) DISTRICT 7

M. Admixture, per cublc yard
1) Water-reducing set retarder 1.50 CY
2} Water reducer $ N [@ cYy
3} Calcium chloride based accelerator
(HE-122 or approved egual) $§3.50/P2g
4} Non-calcium chloride based accelerator
(Darex Set Accelerator or approved egual $6.00/ Ofsg
.5} Super plasticizer (Bucon 37 or approved
equal) $6,.00 CY
6) Fiber 5.0 CY
7) Heated Concrete $4,25 ¥
8} Ice ¢ .50 per pound
N. Due to time constraints, the cement may have to be added

to the trangit mizer at the project site using Divisgion
personnel. FPlease state any additional charges as

follows:
1) Cement provided and transported to
project site by Ven@lor § /CY
2) Cement provided by Vendor and transported
from Vendor's plant to project site by
Division 5_76.00/8 /c
86.00/K
o. Penalty Charge for unloading time
in excess of ten {(10) minutes pexr cubic
vard. § 185 per truck minute

Plant Location Route 73N Bridgeport, {(Saltwell Exit)
304-592-5577 Dispatch

01ld Route 219 North elkins
304-630-5577 Dispatch

Chapel Road, Gassaway
304-364-8340 pispatch

Lynch Run Reoad, Glenville
304-452-8747 Dispatch



12.

Ttem
No .

25

BIDDING SCHEDULE (Continued)

Unit Bid Price for Items 2 through I, to inciude delivery within five
{5) mileg of Vendor's Plant.

ORDER SIZE IN CUBIC YARDS

District 8 PRICE PER CUBIC YARD

2-2.%9CY 3-3.99CY 4-4,080Y 5 CY & Over

Class

2 Concrete,172,75CY 134,75 /CY 115.75 /CY 9675 /CY
Class B Concrete,164.75%CY 126.75 /¢Y¥ 107,75 /¢y 88.75 /oy
¢ Concrete, 162.7%y 124.75 /oy 105,75 /¢y 86.75 /jcy

Class
¢lass D Concrete,160.75%CY 122.75 /CY 103,75 /CY 84,75 /cY
Class K Comerete,]71.7%cy 133.75 /oy 114.75 /ey 95.75 /oy
Modified Clases K

Concrete, 8-1/2 Bag
Mix, Siliceous Sand 197.75 /cy 159,75 /cy 140.75/cy 1231.75 /ey

CLSM Type A 152,75 /€Y 114.75¢Y¥Y 95,75 /CY T6.75 Jjoy
CcLSM Type B 151.75 /oy 113.75cy 94,75 /ey 75.75 - /¥
CLSM Type ¢ 165,75 /CY 127.75CY 108.75 /Y 89.75 /C¥

Will Class B Comcrete supplied at prices
quoted above contain limestone sand? NO

if so, state additional charge to provide
Class B Concrete using siliceous sand N/A /CY

Charge per bag for increased cement
content above the target value. 12/88/cy

additional Haul: Vendor may bid either or both options; however, the
Division of Highways will seiect the most cost effective option.

Option & § per cubic yard per mile

Option B $3 00 per truck load per mile



12. BIDDING SCHEDULE (Continued) DISTRICT 8

M.

Admixture, per cubic yard

1)
2)
3)

4)
5)
&)

7)
8)

Due to time constraints,

Water-reducing set retarder

Water reducer

Caleiuwm chloride based accelerator
(HE-122 or approved egual)

Non-calcium chloride based accelerator
{Darex Set Accelerator or approved egual
Super plasticizer (Eucon 37 or approved
equal)

Fiber

Heated Concrete

ice

SR ey
$3.50/ OB %
£6.00/ ok %
$6.00 CY
$6.50 cv

$4.25 CY
$ 50 per pound

the cement may have to be added

to the transit mixer at the project site using Division

personnel. FPlease state any additional charges as
follows:
1} Cement provided and transported to
project site by Vendor § /oy
2) Cement provided by Vendor and transported
from Vendor's plank to project site by
Division $76.00/B /C

86.00/K

Penalty Charge for unloading time
in excess of tem (10) minutes per cubic

$1.85 per truck minute

yvard.

Plant Location 0ld Route 219 North Elkins

304-630-5577 Dispatch
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12,

Item
No.

27

BIDDING SCHEDULE (Continued)

Unit Bid Price for Items A through I, to include delivery within five
(5) miles of Vendor's Plant.

ORDER SIZE IN CUBIC YARDS

bistrict 9 PRICE PER CUBIC YARD

2-2.99CY 3-3.99CY 4-4.90CY 5 Y & Over

Class A Concrete, 188.2Bcy 150,25 /oy 131.25/¢Y  112.25 /CY

fe2]

Clase Concrete, 183.2%cY 145,25 /CY 126.25/CY 107.25 /CY

Class

C Concrete, 181 _28CY 14325 /CY 124.25/CY 495 5= /CY
Class D Concreste, 179,28CY 141,25 /CY¥ 122 25 /CY 403 25 . /CY
Class K Concrete, 189.25%cvy151.25 ey 132.25 /ey 113,25 /CY

Modified Class K
Concrete, 8-1/2 Bag

Mix, Siliceous Sand 218,00 /CY 180.00/C¥161.00 /CY 142 00  /CY
CLSM Type A 170.50 /cy132.50_ /cv113,50 /€Y 94 50 /€Y
cLsM Type B 168.50 ,cy130.50 /ey111.50 /ey 92.50 /cY
cLsM Type ¢ 178.50 ,cy140.50 /cy121.50 /cv 102.50 /cY

Will Clase B Concrete supplied at prices

quoted above contain limestone sand? NO
If so, state additiomal charge to provide
Class B Concrete using siliceous sand N/A jey

Charge per bag for increased cement
content above the target value. 12.00 /oy

Additional Haul: Vendor may bid either or both options; however, the
Division of Highways will select the most cost effective opticn.

Option A § per cubic yard per mile

Option B % 4.00 per truck load per mile



12. BIDDING SCHEDULE {centinued) DISTRICT )

Admixture, per cubic yard

iy
2)
3}

4)
5)
6)

73
8)

Water-reducing set retarder

Water reducer

Calcium chloride based accelerator
{HE-122 or approved egual)

Non-caleium chleride based accelerator
(Darex Set Accelerator or approved egual
Super plasticizer (Bucon 37 or approved
aqual)

Fiber

Heated Concrete

Ice

28

&1.50 oy
SN/A 544
$3.50/ 0t %
$6.00/0F 3
36,00 cC¥
56.50 CY
$4,25 CY

$ .50 per pound

PDue to time constraints, the cement may have to be added
to the transit mixer at the project site using Division

personnel. Please state any additional charges as
follows: :
1) Cement provided and transported to
project site by Vendor § /oy
2) Cement provided by Vendor and transported
from Vendor's plant to project site by
Division $76.00/B _/C

86.00/%

Penalty Charge for unloading time
in excess of ten (10) minutes per cublc

$_1_85 per truck minute

Plant Locatien Chapel Road, Gassaway

vard.

304-364-8340 Dispatch



1z.

Ttem
No.

NO BID

BIDDING SCHEDULE (Continued)

29

Unit Bid Price for Items A through I, to include delivery within five

{5) miles of Vendor's Plant.

ORDER SI2E IN CUBIC YARDS

bistrict 10 NO BID PRICE PER CUBIC YARD

2-2.98CY 3-3.,90CY 4-4.899CY 5 CY & Qver

Class A Concrete, _ _ /CY _Jey 4 4 /ey
Class B Concrete, ___ /CY ey % 4 /cY
Class ¢ Concrete, ____/CY A 4 o few /Y
Class D Concrete, __mMW)CY A 4 ey /C&
Class K Concrete, /CY /cY /cY /ey

Modified Class X
Concrete, 8-1/2 Bag

Mix, Siliceous Sand /CY Vis's Viss's
CLSM Type A . Jey _Jey ey

CLSM Ty'ée B L 4 ey ey

CLSM Type C /Y /ey oy

Will Class B Concrete supplied at prices
quoted above contain limestone sand?

Tf so, state additional charge to provide
Class B Concrete using siliceous sand

Charge per bag for increased cement
content above the target value.

/cY
/CcY

/cY

/CY

additional Haul: Vendor may bid either or both options; however, the
pivigion of Highways will select the most cost effective option.

Option A § per cubic yard per mile

Option B § per truck load per mile



NO BID

12. SBIDDING SCHEDULE (continued) DISTRICT 10
M. Admixture, per cubic yard
1) Water-reducing set retarder 3 cY
2) Water reducer s CY
3) Calcium chloride based accelerator
(HE-122 or approved egual) ] OZ
4) Non~caleium chloride based accelerator
{(barex Set Accelerator or approved egual § (831
5} Super plasticizer (Eucon 37 or approved
equal) S cY
&) Fiber 8 oY
7) Heated Concrete $ cY
8) Ice [ per pound
N. . Due to time constraints, the cement may have to be added

to the transit mixer at the project site using Division
perscnnel. Please state any additional charges as

foliows:
1) Cement provided and transported to
project site by Vendor § /ey
2} Cement provided by Vendor and transported
from Vendor's plant to project site by
Divigion s /cC
o. Penalty Charge for unloading time
in excess of ten (10) minutes per cubic
yvard. $ per truck minute

Plant Location




REQ No. 00100020 82

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
Purchasing Division

PURCHASING AFFIDAVIT

west Virginia Code §5A-3-10a states: No contract or renewal of any contract may be awarded by the state or any of its
political subdivisions to any vendor of prospective vendor when the vendor of prospeciive vendor or a related party 10 the
vendor or prospective vendor is a debtor and the debt owed is an amount greater than one thousand doiiars in the
aggregate.

DEFINITIONS: ‘
“Debi" means any assessment; premium, penalty, fine, tax of other amount of monay owed to the state or any of its
political subdivisions hecause of a judgment, fine, permit violation, ficense assessment, defaulted workers' compensation
prermium, penalty of other assesstment presently delinguent or due and required fo be pald to the stale or any of its

political subdivisions, including any interest or additional penalties accrued therson.

"Debtor” means any individual, corporation, partnership, association, limited liability cornpany of any other form or
business association owing a debt to the state oF any of its political subdivisions. "oolitical subdivision” means any county
commission; municipality; county board-of sducation: any instrurnentality established by a county Of municipality, any
separate corporation of instrumentaiity established by one or more counties or municipalities, as permitted by iaw, or any
public body charged by law with the performance of a government function o7 whose jurisdiction 18 coextensive with one
or more counties of municipalities. “Related party” means 2 party, whether an individual, corporation, partnership,
_zssociation, limited liability company or any other form of business association or other entity whalsoever, related io any
vendor by blood, marriage, ownership of contract through which the party has a relationship of ownership of other interest
with the vendor so that the party will actually or by effect receive of control a portion of the benefit, profit or other
consideration from perfermantce of a vendor contract with the party receiving an amount that meets of exceed five percent
of the total contract amount. ‘

EXCEPTION: The prohibition of this section does not apply where a vendor has contested any tax administered pursuant
to chapter eleven of this code, workers’ compensation premium, permit fee or environmenital fee or assessment and ihe
matter has not become final or whers the vendor has entered into a2 payment plan or agreement and the vendor is not in
default of any of the provisions of such plan or agreement.

Under penalty of law for false swearing {West Virginia Code §61-5-3), it is hereby certified that the vendor affirms and
acknowledges the information in this affidavit and is in compliance with the requirements as stated.

WITNESS THE FOLL'OWING SIGNATURE

(iﬁdrﬂﬂtaCJ;”ﬂhf é% WV
Authorized Signature: J .
State of M %{/’;’,W
County of Mg , to-wils

Vendor's Name:

Daie: 3 - & 67"'" >of ¢

G
Taken, subscribed, and sworn o before me thisﬂi@{f’day of '/77&&%/ 2040
My Commission expires 22@4& /3 Aol 20 .

Za

AFFIX SEAL HERE "~ NOTARY PUBLIC
NWW:ﬁiu”«m-Mww P s
% M‘m{‘%ﬂ‘f FUBLID OFFISIAL SEAL
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{ BRIVE
WY 28330
HES MAR. 15,2818

Purchasing Affidavit (Revised 12/15/09)



Rev. 08/08

Siate of West Virginia
VENDOR PREFERENCE CERTIFICATE 81

Certification and apptication* is hereby made for Preference in accordance with West Virginia Code, §0A-3-37. (Does not apply to
canstruction contracts). West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37, provides an opportunity for quafifying vendors 1o request (at the time of bid)
preference for their residency status. Such preference is an evaluation method only and will be applied only o the cost bid in
accordance with the West Virginia Code. This certificate for application s to be used to request such preference. The Purchasing
Division will make the determination of the Resident Vendor Preference, if applicable.

1. Application is made for 2.5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is an individual resident vendor and has resided continuousty in West Virginia for four (4} years immediately preced-
ing the date of this ceriification; of,

Bidderis a parinership, association or corporation resident vendor and has maintained its headquarters or principal place of
husiness continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or 80% of the
ownership interest of Bidder is held by another individual, partnership, association or corporation resident vendor who has
maintained its headquarters or principal place of business continuously in West Virginia for four (4} years immediately
preceding the date of this certification; of,

Bigder is a nonresident vendor which has an affiliate or subsidiary which employs & minimum of one hundred state residents
and which has maintained its headguarters of principal place of business within West Virginia continuously for the four 4
years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or, '

U

—%

Application is made for 2.5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked: "

Bidder is a resident vendor who certifies that, during the tife of the contract, on average at least 75% of the empioyees
working on the project being bid are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two years
immediately praceding submission of this bid; or,

*LP

Application is made for 2 5o resident vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is a nohresident vendor empioying a minimum of one hundred state residents oris a nonresident vendor with an
affiiate or subsidiary which maintains its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia employing a
minimum of one hundred state residents who certifies thal, guring the life of the contract, on average at least 75% of the
employees or Bidder's affiliaie’s or subsidiary’s employees are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the slale
continuousty for the two years immediately preceding submission of this bid; or,

L%
.

4. Application is made for 59, resident vendor preference for the reason checked:
Bidder meats either the requirement of both subdivisions (1) and (2) or subdivision (1) and {3) as stated above; of,

5. Application is made for 3.5% resident vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked:
Bidder is an individual resident vendor who i a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard
and has resided in West Virginia continuously for the four years immediately preceding the date on which the bid is
submitted; or,

6. Application is made for 3 5%, resident vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked:
Bidder is a resident vendoer who is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves of the National Guard, if, for
purposes of producing of distributing the commodities or completing the project which is the subject of the vendor's bid and
confinuously over the entire term of the project, on average at east seventy-five percent of the vendor's employees are
residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two immediately preceding years.

Bidder understands if the Secretary of Revenue determines that a Bidder receiving preference has failed to continue to meet the
requirements for such preference, the Secretary may order the Director of Purchasing to: (a) reject the bid; or (b) assess a penalty
against such Bidder in an amount not to exceed 5% of the bid amount and that such penalty will be paid to the confracting agency
ordeducted from any unpaid balance on the contractor purchase order.

By submission of this certificate, Bidder agrees to disclose any reasonably requested information to the Purchasing Division and
authorizes the Department of Revenue to disclose o the Director of Purchasing appropriate information verifying that Bidder has paid
the required business taxes, provided that such information does not contain the amounts of taxes paid nor any othef information
deemed by the Tax Commissioner to be confidential.

~ Under penalty of law for false swearing (West Virginita Code, §61-5-3), Bidder hereby certifies that this certificate is true
and accurate in all respects; and thatifa contract is issued to Bidder and if anything contained within this certificate

changes during the term of the contract, Bidder will notify the Purchasin Division i 1 m& lgm jately.
Bidder: /th 5’7'7’)??’-' éw;/ﬂ)fm/g__, Sighed: Q" t' /\p < V

_ : 4 ~
Date: 3~ 29~ v iU Title: W Wﬁé/\,

&
“Check any combination of preference consideration{s} indicated above, which you are entitled fo receive.



