



**State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division**

NOTICE

Due to the size of this bid, it was impractical to scan every page for online viewing. We have made an attempt to scan and publish all pertinent bid information. However, it is important to note that some pages were necessarily omitted.

If you would like to review the bid in its entirety, please contact the buyer. Thank you.



State of West Virginia
 Department of Administration
 Purchasing Division
 2019 Washington Street East
 Post Office Box 50130
 Charleston, WV 25305-0130

Request for Quotation

RFQ NUMBER
6610C017

PAGE
1

ADDRESS CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTENTION OF
MICHAEL AUSTIN
304-558-2402

VENDOR
 *709034622 540-992-5500
 C3M INC SUMMIT HELICOPTERS INC
 PO BOX 39
 CLOVERDALE VA 24077

SHIP TO
 DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
 VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
 BY ORDER
RECEIVED
 FEB 27 2010
 By

DATE PRINTED 02/23/2010	TERMS OF SALE	SHIP VIA	F&B	FREIGHT TERMS
-----------------------------------	---------------	----------	-----	---------------

BID OPENING DATE: **03/31/2010** BID OPENING TIME **01:30PM**

LINE	QUANTITY	UOP	CAT. NO.	ITEM NUMBER	UNIT PRICE	AMOUNT
0001	1	EA		675-85		
CONTRACT: TO FURNISH HERBICIDES OPEN END CONTRACT TO PROVIDE THE MATERIALS NECESSARY FOR HERBICIDES FOR THE WEST VIRGINIA DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS TO BE USED IN ALL TEN (10) DISTRICTS PER THE ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS. THE MODEL/BRAND/SPECIFICATIONS NAMED HEREIN ESTABLISH THE ACCEPTABLE LEVEL OF QUALITY ONLY AND ARE NOT INTENDED TO REFLECT A PREFERENCE OR FAVOR ANY PARTICULAR BRAND OR VENDOR. VENDORS WHO ARE BIDDING ALTERNATES SHOULD SO STATE AND INCLUDE PERTINENT LITERATURE AND SPECIFICATIONS. FAILURE TO PROVIDE INFORMATION FOR ANY ALTERNATES MAY BE GROUNDS FOR REJECTION OF THE BID. THE STATE RESERVES THE RIGHT TO WAIVE MINOR IRREGULARITIES IN BIDS OR SPECIFICATION IN ACCORDANCE WITH SECTION 148-1-4(F) OF THE WEST VIRGINIA LEGISLATIVE RULES AND REGULATIONS. MANDATORY PRE-BID A MANDATORY PRE-BID WILL BE HELD ON FRIDAY, 03/12/10 A 10:00 AM IN PURCHASING CONFERENCE ROOM, BLDG 15. ALL INTERESTED PARTIES ARE REQUIRED TO ATTEND THIS MEETING. FAILURE TO ATTEND THE MANDATORY PRE-BID SHALL RESULT IN DISQUALIFICATION OF THE BID. NO ONE PERSON MAY REPRESENT MORE THAN ONE BIDDER.						

RECEIVED
 000 MAR 31 A 10:46
 PURCHASING DIVISION
 STATE OF WV

SEE REVERSE SIDE FOR TERMS AND CONDITIONS

SIGNATURE 	TELEPHONE	DATE
TITLE	FEIN	ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'

HERBICIDESCHEMICAL FORMULATIONPercent Concentration/
Pounds per Gallon
of Active Ingredients

DOH-1H WATER SOLUBLE EMULSIFIABLE CONCENTRATE CONTAINING:
Ammonium Salt of Fosamine with Surfactant 4 lbs/gallon

Product Trade Name Krenite SEPA Registration Number 352-395

Supplied in 2 1/2 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons.

A) @ \$ 61.45 per gallon (i.e. \$ 307.25 per lot)

Supplied in 15 gallon returnable/refillable containers.

B) @ \$ 47.78 per gallon (i.e. \$ 716.70 per lot)

DOH-2H WATER SOLUBLE EMULSIFIABLE CONCENTRATE CONTAINING:
Isopropylamine Salt of Glyphosate 50.2%
Phosphate Ester Surfactant

Product Trade Name Roundup Pro ConcentrateEPA Registration Number 524-529

Supplied in 30 gallon plastic returnable drums.

A) @ \$ 22.00 per gallon (i.e. \$ 660.00 per drum)

Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons.

B) @ \$ 18.75 per gallon (i.e. \$ 93.75 per lot)

Supplied in 15 gallon returnable/refillable containers.

C) @ \$ 24.00 per gallon (i.e. \$ 360.00 per lot)

Supplied in 150 gallon returnable/refillable shuttle.

D) @ \$ 20.00 per gallon (i.e. \$ 3000.00 per shuttle)

The Bid Schedules are ready for download on Purchasing's Web site at
www.state.wv.us/admin/purchase

Vendors should type Bid Schedules

DOH-3H

DISPERSIBLE GRANULES CONTAINING:

Sulfometuron Methyl

75%

Product Trade Name Oust XP

EPA Registration Number 352-601

Supplied in 3 pound containers in lots of 24 pounds.

A) @ \$ 48⁴⁰ per pound (i.e. \$ 1161⁶⁰ per lot)

B) Supplied in 3 pound jug

@ \$ 52⁰⁰ per pound (i.e. \$ 156⁰⁰ per jug)

DOH-4H

WATER SOLUBLE AQUEOUS SUSPENSION CONTAINING:

Oryzalin

4 lbs/gallon

Product Trade Name Oryzalin 4 Pro

EPA Registration Number NO BID

Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons.

A) @ \$ — per gallon (i.e. \$ — per lot)

DOH-5H

AQUEOUS SOLUTION CONTAINING:

Imazapyr

2 lbs/gallon

Product Trade Name Arsenal Powerline

EPA Registration Number 241-431

Supplied in 1 quart containers in lots of 4 quarts

A) @ \$ 298⁵ per quart (i.e. \$ 1194⁰ per lot)

Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons

B) @ \$ 71⁹⁵ per gallon (i.e. \$ 3597⁵ per lot)

Supplied in 15 gallon drums

C) @ \$ 69⁹⁵ per gallon (i.e. \$ 1049²⁵ per drum)

DOH-6H

AQUEOUS CARRIER CONTAINING:

Pendimethalin

3.8 lbs/gallon

Product Trade Name Pendulum AquaCap

EPA Registration Number 241-416

Supplied in 2.5 gallon container in lots of 5 gallons

A) @ \$ 49.95 per gallon (i.e. \$ 249.75 per lot)

DOH-7H

WATER SOLUBLE CONCENTRATE CONTAINING:

Triclopyr

3 lbs/gallon

Product Trade Name ~~Garlon 3A~~ TAHOE 3A

mfg: NUFARM

EPA Registration Number 228-520

Full Aquatic Labeling

Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons

A) @ \$ 48.30 per gallon (i.e. \$ 241.50 per lot)

Supplied in 30 gallon containers

B) @ \$ 45.25 per gallon (i.e. \$ 1357.50 per container)

Supplied in 15 gallon continuum returnable/refillable containers in pallets of 9 containers

GARLON 3A
62719-37 C)

@ \$ 61.90 per gallon (i.e. \$ 8356.50 per pallet)

DOH-8H

WATER SOLUBLE CONCENTRATE CONTAINING:

Triclopyr

4 lbs/gallon

Product Trade Name ~~Garlon 4 Ultra~~ TAHOE 4E

mfg: NUFARM

EPA Registration Number 228-517

Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons

A) @ \$ 53.88 per gallon (i.e. \$ 269.40 per lot)

Supplied in 30 gallon containers

B) @ \$ 51.45 per gallon (i.e. \$ 1543.50 per container)

Supplied in 15 gallon continuum returnable/refillable containers in pallets of 9 containers

GARLON 4
ULTRA C)
2719-527

@ \$ 79.50 per gallon (i.e. \$ 10732.50 per pallet)

DOH-9H

A WATER SOLUBLE DISPERSIBLE GRANULE CONTAINING:

Diuron

80.0%

Product Trade Name Karmex XPEPA Registration Number 352-692

Supplied in 5 pound bags in lots of 10 bags

A) @ \$ 6.05 per pound (i.e. \$ 60.50 per lot)

Supplied in 25 pound bags

B) @ \$ 6.05 per pound (i.e. \$ 151.25 per bag)

DOH-10H

WATER SOLUBLE LIQUID CONTAINING:

Dimethylamine Salt of 2, 4-D acid

3.8 lbs/gallonProduct Trade Name DM A4EPA Registration Number 62719-3

Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons

A) @ \$ 14.75 per gallon (i.e. \$ 73.75 per lot)

Supplied in 30 gallon drums

B) @ \$ 14.50 per gallon (i.e. \$ 435.00 per drum)

C) Supplied in 15 gallon returnable/refillable containers in pallets of 9 containers

@ \$ 14.25 per gallon (i.e. \$ 1923.75 per lot)

DOH-11H

WATER SOLUBLE LIQUID CONTAINING:

Diethanolamine Salt of Mefluidide

Ammonium Salt of Imazethapyr

Ammonium Salt of Imazapyr

21.45%

4.09%

0.15%

Product Trade Name StrongholdEPA Registration Number NO BID

Supplied in 1 gallon containers in lots of 4 gallons

A) @ \$ N/B per gallon (i.e. \$ ———— per lot)

DOH-12H

WATER SOLUBLE LIQUID CONTAINING:

Ammonium Salt of Imazapic

23.6%

Product Trade Name PlateauEPA Registration Number 241-365

Supplied in 1 gallon containers in lots of 2 gallons

A) @ \$ 132⁴⁵ per gallon (i.e. \$ 264⁹⁰ per lot)

Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons

B) @ \$ 127²⁵ per gallon (i.e. \$ 636²⁵ per lot)

Supplied in 1.44 oz packets 14 packets per lot

C) @ \$ NO BID per packet (i.e. \$ per lot)

Supplied in 1 qt containers 4 qts per lot

D) @ \$ NO BID per qt (i.e. \$ per lot)

E) Supplied in 15 gallon containers

@ \$ 124⁴⁵ per gallon (i.e. \$ 1866⁷⁵ per lot)

DOH-13H

A DISPERSIBLE LIQUID CONTAINING:

Hexazinone

2 lbs/gallon

Product Trade Name Velpar LEPA Registration Number 352-392

Supplied in 2 ½ gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons

A) @ \$ 64⁰⁰ per gallon (i.e. \$ 320⁰⁰ per container)

DOH-14H

DRY FLOWABLE CONTAINING:

Metsulfuron Methyl

60%

Product Trade Name Escort XPEPA Registration Number 352 - 439

Supplied in 16 oz. containers in lots of 8 lbs. (8-16 oz. ctrs.)

A) @ \$ 5.98 per oz. (i.e. \$ 765.44 per lot)

Supplied in 16 oz. jug

B) @ \$ 6.47 per oz (i.e. \$ 103.52 per jug)

C) Supplied in 64 oz Jug returnable/refillable

@ \$ 5.98 per oz (i.e. \$ 382.72 per jug)

DOH-15H

WATER SOLUBLE GRANULE HERBICIDE CONTAINING:

Ammonium Salt of Glyphosate

71.4%

Product Trade Name QUIKPro MONSANTO
~~Roundup Pro~~EPA Registration Name 524-535A) Supplied in ^{27.2# box}~~22.25~~ lb. box
@ \$ 59.84 ^{27.2#}~~22.25~~ lb. box (i.e. \$ 2.20 per lb.)

DOH-16H

DRY FLOWABLE CONTAINING:

Chlorsulfuron

75%

Product Trade Name Telar XPEPA Registration Number 352-654

Supplied in 8 x 16 ounce containers to a case

A) @ \$ 16.00 per ounce (i.e. \$ 256.00 per container)

DOH-17H

A LIQUID SOLUTION CONTAINING:

Isooctyl ester of 2,4-Dichlorophenoxyacetic Acid 32.48%
 2-ethylhexyl ester of +R-2-(2,4-Dichlorophenoxy) Propionic Acid 15.90%
 Dicamba (3, 6-Dichloro-o-anisic Acid) 5.38%

Product Trade Name BK-800

EPA Registration Number NO BID

Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons

A) @ \$ _____ per gallon (i.e. \$ _____ per lot)

Supplied in 30 gallon drums

B) @ \$ _____ per gallon (i.e. \$ _____ per drum)

DOH-18H

DRY FLOWABLE CONTAINING:

Tebuthiuron 80%

Product Trade Name Spike 80 DF

EPA Registration Number NO BID

Supplied in 4 pound bags in lots of 24 pounds

A) @ \$ _____ per pound (i.e. \$ _____ per lot)

Supplied in 25 pound bags

B) @ \$ _____ per pound (i.e. \$ _____ per lot)

DOH-19H

A WATER SOLUBLE EMULSIFIABLE CONCENTRATE CONTAINING:

Clopyralid 3 lbs/gallon

Product Trade Name Transline CLEANSLATE mfg: NUFARM

EPA Registration Number 228-491

Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons

A) @ \$ 158²⁵ per gallon (i.e. \$ 791²⁵ per lot)

B) Supplied in .5 gallon containers in lots of 2 gallons

@ \$ 164⁶⁵ per gallon (i.e. \$ 329³⁰ per lot)

DOH-20H

AQUEOUS SOLUTION CONTAINING:

Isopropylamine Salt of Imazapyr

27.6%

Product Trade Name Stalker

EPA Registration Number 241-398

Supplied in 1 quart containers in lots of 4 quarts

A) @\$ 65⁸⁵ per quart (i.e. \$ 263⁴⁰ per lot)

DOH-21H

AQUEOUS SOLUTION CONTAINING:

Diglycolamine Salt of 3, 6-Dichloro-0-Anisic Acid

4 lbs/gallon

Product Trade Name Vanguish

EPA Registration Number 228-397

Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons

A) @\$ 60⁹⁰ per gallon (i.e. \$ 304⁵⁰ per lot)

Supplied in 15 gallon returnable/refillable containers in pallets of 9 containers

B) @\$ 58⁰⁰ per gallon (i.e. \$ 7830⁰⁰ per pallet)

DOH-22H

AQUEOUS SOLUTION CONTAINING:

Triclopyr

.75 lbs/gallon

Product Trade Name ~~Pathfinder~~ RELEGATE RTU mfg: NJFARM

EPA Registration Number 228-552

Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons

A) @\$ 32⁵⁰ per gallon (i.e. \$ 162⁵⁰ per lot)

DOH-23H

WATER SOLUBLE EMULSIFIABLE CONCENTRATE CONTAINING:

Isopropylamine Salt of Glyphosate

53.8%

Product Trade Name ~~Rodeo~~ AQUANEAT mfg: NUFARM

EPA Registration Number 228-365

Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons

A) @\$ 17¹⁵ per gallon (i.e. \$ 85⁷⁵ per lot)

Supplied in 30 gallon plastic returnable drums

B) @\$ 17⁹⁵ per gallon (i.e. \$ 538⁵⁰ per drum)

DOH-24H A LIQUID CONTAINING:
Aminopyralid 40.6%

Product Trade Name Milestone VM

EPA Registration Number 62719-537

Supplied in 1 quart containers 12 containers per lot

A) @ \$ 73.75 per quart (i.e. \$ 885.00 per lot)

Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers 5 gallons per lot

B) @ \$ 278.00 per gallon (i.e. \$ 1390.00 per lot)

DOH-25H WATER DISPERSIBLE GRANULAR MATERIAL CONTAINING:
Prodiamine 65%

Product Trade Name ~~Endurance~~ PRO CLIPSE

EPA Registration Number 228-434

Supplied in 10 pound containers 50 pounds per lot

A) @ \$ 17.10 per pound (i.e. \$ 855.00 per lot)

DOH-26H EMULSIFIABLE CONCENTRATE CONTAINING:
Quizalofop P-Ethyl 0.88 lbs/gallon

Product Trade Name Assure II

EPA Registration Number NO BID

Supplied in 1 gallon containers in lots of 4 gallons

A) @ \$ per gallon (i.e. \$ per lot)

DOH-27H EMULSIFIABLE CONCENTRATE CONTAINING:
Fluazifop-P-butyl 6.75%

Product Trade Name Ornamec

EPA Registration Number NO BID

Supplied in 1 gallon containers in lots of 4 gallons

A) @ \$ per gallon (i.e. \$ per lot)

DOH-28H

A DISPERSIBLE GRANULE CONTAINING:Imazapyr
Diuron7.78%
62.22%Product Trade Name Sahara DGEPA Registration Number 241-372

Supplied in 10 pound bags in lots of 40 pounds.

A) @ \$ 9.50 per pound (i.e. \$ 380.00 per lot)

DOH-29H

A WATER SOLUBLE DRY GRANULE CONTAINING:

Sulfosulfuron

75%

Product Trade Name OutriderEPA Registration Number 524-500

Supplied in 20 oz bottles in lots of 200 oz

A) @ \$ 11.95 per oz (i.e. \$ 2390.00 per lot)

DOH-30H

A LIQUID CONTAINING:

Diuron

40%

Product Trade Name Diuron 4LEPA Registration Number 19713-36

Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons

A) @ \$ 18.75 ^{op} per gallon (i.e. \$ 93.75 ^{op} per lot)

DOH-31H

A LIQUID CONTAINING

Fluroxypyr

26.2%

Product Trade Name ~~Vista~~ FLUROXYPYR PRO MFG NUFARMEPA Registration Number 71368-87

Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons

A) @ \$ 79.85 per gallon (i.e. \$ 399.25 per lot)

DOH-32H

WETTABLE GRANULE FORMULATION CONTAINING

Sodium salt of diflufenzopy: 2-[1-({3,5-difluorophenylamino} carbonyl) hydrazono] ethyl)-3-pyridinecarboxylic acid, sodium
Sodium salt of 3,6-dichloro-p-anisic acid

21.4%
55.0%

Product Trade Name OverdriveEPA Registration Number 7969-150

Supplied in 7 1/2 lb. jugs. 30 lbs. per case

A) @ \$ 3285 per lb. (i.e. \$ 985⁵⁰ per case)

DOH-33H

DISPERSIBLE GRANULES CONTAINING

Sulfometuron Methyl
Chlorsulfuron

56.25%
18.75%

Product Trade Name Landmark XPEPA Registration Number 352-645

Supplied in 4 lb. jugs in lots of 32 lbs.

A) @ \$ 111⁹⁶ per lb. (i.e. \$ 3582⁷² per case)

Supplied in 64 oz jug returnable/refillable

B) @ \$ N/B per oz. (i.e. \$ N/B per jug)

DOH-34H

DISPERSIBLE GRANULES CONTAINING

Sulfometuron Methyl
Metsulfuron Methyl

56.25%
15.00%

Product Trade Name Oust ExtraEPA Registration Number 352-622

Supplied in 4 lb. jugs in lots of 32 lbs.

A) @ \$ 4840 per lb. (i.e. \$ 1548⁸⁰ per lot)

Supplied in 64 oz. returnable/refillable

B) @ \$ 3²⁵ per oz. (i.e. \$ 208⁰⁰ per jug)

Supplied in 12 lb. jugs

C) @ \$ 52⁰⁰ per lb. (i.e. \$ 624⁰⁰ per jug)

DOH-35H

A DRY FLOWABLE GRANULE CONTAINING:

Bromacil
Diuron

40%
40%

Product Trade Name Krovar I DF

EPA Registration Number 352 - 505

Supplied in 6 lb containers in lots of 8 containers

A) @ \$ 10.²⁰ per lb (i.e. \$ 489.⁶⁰ per lot)

DOH-36H

A LIQUID CONTAINING:

Imazapic
Glyphosate

8.13%
21.94%

Product Trade Name Journey

EPA Registration Number 241 - 417

Supplied in 7 1/2 lb jugs, 30 lbs. per case

EPA Registration Number ~~XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX~~

Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons

A) @ \$ 84.⁹⁵ per gallon (i.e. \$ 424.⁷⁵ per lot)

X

DOH-37H

A LIQUID CONTAINING:

Dimethylamine Salt of 2,4-Dichlorophenoxyacetic Acid
Dimethylamine Salt of Dicamba (3,6-Dichloro-o-Anisic Acid)

24.58%
12.82%

Product Trade Name Veteran 720

EPA Registration Number 228 - 295

Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons

A) @ \$ 29.⁹⁵ per gallon (i.e. \$ 149.⁷⁵ per lot)

Supplied in 30 gallon drums

B) @ \$ 27.⁶⁵ per gallon (i.e. \$ 829.⁵⁰ per drum)

X

DOH-38H

DISPERSIBLE GRANULES CONTAINING

Chlorsulfuron
Sulfometuron Methyl
Sulfentrazone

9%
18%
48%

Product Trade Name Throttle XP

EPA Registration Number 352 - 725

Supplied in 3.9 lb. containers, 8 containers per case

A) @ \$ 99.⁹⁵ per lb (i.e. \$ 3118.⁴⁴ per case)

ADJUVANTS

DOH-1A

A WATER SOLUBLE BLUE LIQUID SPRAY PATTERN INDICATOR

Product Trade Name Bullseye

Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons

A) @ \$ 37⁸⁰ per gallon (i.e. \$ 189⁰⁰ per lot)

DOH-2A A MISCIBLE-DISPERSIBLE LIQUID DEFOAMER (30% Active Ingredient)

Product Trade Name Fome-Kill mfg: DREYEL

Supplied in QUARTS containers in lots of 12

A) @ \$ 6.85 per qt. (i.e. \$ 82²⁰ per lot)

DOH-3A A DILUENT WITH EMULSIFIERS

Product Trade Name Hygrade EC or Arborchem Basal Oil or Bark Oil EC Or Alenza Basal Oil or Penevator

Supplied in containers in lots of gallons

A) @ \$ NO BID per gallon (i.e. \$ per lot)

X DOH-4A NON-IONIC SURFACTANT (90% Active Ingredient)

Product Trade Name SURF-AC 910

Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons

A) @ \$ 12.75 per gallon (i.e. \$ 63.75 per lot)

DOH-5A A GRANULAR/FLAKE DRIFT CONTROL AGENT

Product Trade Name Poly Dry

Supplied in 1 pound containers in lots of 24 containers

A) @ \$ 6⁵⁰ per Pound (i.e. \$ 156⁰⁰ per lot)

DOH-6A A LIQUID DRIFT CONTROL AGENT

Product Trade Name Poly Control 2

Supplied in QUARTS containers in lots of 12

A) @ \$ 7⁶⁰ per QUART (i.e. \$ 91²⁰ per lot)

DOH-7A AQUATIC SURFACTANT

Product Trade Name Summit 910

Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons

A) @ \$ 12⁷⁵ per gallon (i.e. \$ 63⁷⁵ per lot)

DOH-8A A WATER SOLUBLE LIQUID SPRAY PATTERN INDICATORProduct Trade Name Blueprint PlusSupplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallonsA) @ \$ NO BID per gallon (i.e. \$ per lot)DOH-10A A NON-IONIC STICKER SPREADERProduct Trade Name Nu-Film-IRSupplied in 2 ½ gallon containers in lots of 5 gallonsA) @ \$ 32.45 per gallon (i.e. \$ 162.25 per lot)DOH-11A A READY TO USE FORMULA CONTAINING PARFFINIC OIL EMULSIFIERSProduct Trade Name Thinvert RTU

Supplied in 2 ½ gallon jugs. 5 gallon per case

A) @ \$ NO BID per gallon (i.e. \$ per case)

Supplied in 15 gallon drum

B) @ \$ per gallonDOH-12A A CONCENTRATE FORMULA CONTAINING PARFINNK OIL EMULSIFIERS AND SURFACTANTSProduct Trade Name Thinvert Concentrate

Supplied in 2 ½ gallon jugs. 5 gallon per case

A) @ \$ 20.85 per gallon (i.e. \$ 104.25 per case)

Supplied in 15 gallon drum

B) @ \$ 20.55 per gallon \$ 308.25 per drum

SAFETY EQUIPMENT

DOH-1S EMERGENCY SPILL KIT CONTAINING:

- 15 Universal Plus Sorbent Pads
- 3 Cobra Coils
- 1 Pair Safety Goggles
- 1 Pair Latex Gloves
- 1 Large Refuse Bag
- 1 List of Environmental Compliance Telephone Numbers
18" x 18" x 4"
- Vacuum Packed in Puncture Resistant Foil

Product Trade Name NO BID

A) @ \$ per each

DOH-2S A GRANULAR/FLAKE SPILL ABSORBENT

Product Trade Name NO BID

Supplied in containers in lots of containers

A) @ \$ per pound (i.e. \$ per lot)

DOH-3S 3 LAYER FABRIC COVERALLS (ALL SIZES)

Product Trade Name Kleen Guard

Supplied in 12 ea/case

A) @ \$ NO BID per each (i.e. \$ per case)

DOH-4S DISPOSABLE COVERALLS

Product Trade Name Tyvek

Supplied in 25 ea/case

A) @ \$ NO BID per each (i.e. \$ per case)

DOH-5S 32 OZ. EYE WASH BOTTLE

Product Trade Name NO - BID

Supplied per each

A) @ \$ per each

DOH-1M PRESSURE RINSER

Product Trade Name Easy Rinse

Supplied per each

A) @ \$ NO BID per each

DOH-2M HAND SOAP WITH CITRUS OIL

Product Trade Name Zep

Supplied in 32 oz. containers in lots of 20 containers per case

A) @ \$ NO BID per container (i.e. \$ per case)

DOH-3M A BIOSTIMULANT CONTAINING:

Soluble Potash	1.00%
Iron	0.36%
Manure Extract	79.30%
Humic and Fulvic Acid Extract	9.00%
Kelp Extract	1.20%
Organo-Modified Silaxane Surfactant	0.36%

Product Trade Name Launch

Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons

A) @ \$ NO BID per gallon (i.e. \$ per lot)

DOH-4M A WORK BOOT

Product Trade Name Iron Duke

Compliance EPA 40 CFR 170

Supplied per pair

A) @ Size (6-11) \$ per pair

B) @ Size (12 +) \$ per pair

DOH-5M

RUBBER BOOT/SHOE COVERS

Compliance EPA 40 CFR 170

Supplied per pair

- A) @ Size M (8-9) \$ _____ per pair
- B) @ Size L (10-11) \$ _____ per pair
- C) @ Size XL (12-13) \$ _____ per pair

DOH-6M

SAFETY GOGGLES – indirect vent

Meets ANS1 287.1-1989

- A) @ \$ _____ per each

DOH-7M

FACE SHIELD – positive lock headgear

Meets ANS1 287.1-1989 and
CAN1CSA-294 3-92 Specifications

- @ \$ _____ per each

DOH-8M

A 5-GALLON BACKPACK SPRAYER

Product Trade Name Birchmeier

- A) @ \$ _____ per sprayer

Gasket Set For Sprayer Pump

- B) @ \$ _____ per set

Hose Valve & Wand Repair Kit

- C) @ \$ _____ per kit

DOH-9M NITRI-SOLVE 100% NITRILE GLOVES
15 mil 13" Nitrile Gloves

Compliance EPA 40 CFR 170

Sizes S, M, L, XL, or 2XL

A) @ \$ _____ per pair

DOH-10M 2-QUART HANDHELD PRESSURE SPRAYER

Product Trade Name Tolco

A) @ \$ _____ per sprayer

DOH-11M CLOSED SYSTEM BACKPACK SPRAYER

Product Trade Name Birchmier BCS

A) @ \$ _____ per sprayer

Gasket set for sprayer pump

B) @ \$ _____ per set

Hose Valve & Wand repair kit

A) @ \$ _____ per kit