State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

%904114349
MEDELA INC
1101 CORPORATE DR

800-435-8316

MCHENRY IL 60050-7005 Q%

Request for
Quotation

N
S
3

306-558-0047

HEALTH AND HUMAN RESOURCES
BPH - NUTRITION SERVICES (WIC)
C/0 DHHR MATERIALS MANAGEMENT
908 BULLITT STREET
CHARLESTON, WV

25301 306-558-3417

07/03/2008
BID OPENING DATE: 08/07/2008 BID OPENINE TIME 01:30PM
DPEN~END [BLANKET CONTRACT)
0001 EA 465-78 ,
100 No Bid

DELUXE NURTURE III DOUBLE ELECTRIC BREAST PUMP
IITEM #320 OR| EQUAL.

ooz EA 465-78 $19.00 $19,000.00

1,600

BASIC DOUBLE| COLLECTION KIT, ITEM #420 OR EQUAL

0eos 1.000 EA 465-78 $15.50 $15,500.00

r
HARMONY MANUAL BREAST PUMP ITEM #67161W OR EQUAL ’
LT N Sl
HKECEIVED
EXHIBIT 3
LIFE OF CONTRACT: THIS CONTRACT BECOMES EFFECTIVE
Cesasesesasaleenvslss AND EXTENDS FOR A [PERIOD OF ONE: "
YEAR OR UNTIL SUCH "“REASONABLE TIME™ THEREAFTER AS
EE BEVERSESIDE FOR TERWS AND-GONDITIO
ADPVAAL \A@{éyf" 815-578~2459 8~12-08
TITLgm.rli'TCo;xtract ‘Coorc% / UI—%%—L%OQB??BZ ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED VENDOR'



GENERAL TERMS & CONDITIONS
REGUEST FOR QUOTATION (RFQ)} AND REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL (RFP)

1. Awards will be made in the best interest of the State of West Virginia.

2. The State may accept or reject in part, or in whole, any bid.

3. All quotations are governed by the West Virginia Coede and the Legisfative Rules of the Purchasing Division.

4. Prior io any award, the apparent successiul vendor must be propetly registered with the Purchasing Division and have
paid the required $125.00 registration fee.

5, All services performed or goods delivered under State Purchase Orders/Contracts are to be continued for the term
of the Purchase Order/Confract, contingent upon funds being appropriated by the Legislature or otherwize being
made available. In the event funds are not approptiated or otherwise available for these services or goods, this
Purchase Order/Contract becomes void and of no effect after June 30,

6. Payment may only be made after the delivery and acceplance of goods or services.

7. interest may be paid for late payment in accordance with the West Virginia Code.

8. Vendor preference will be granted upon written request in accordance with the West Virginia Code.

9. The State of West Virginia Is exempt from federal and state taxes and will not pay or reimburse such taxes.

10.  The Director of Purchasing may cancel any Purchase Order/Contract upon 30 days written notice to the seller.

1.  The laws of the State of West Virginla and the Legis/ative Rules of the Purchasing Division shal govern all rights
and duties under the Conlracl, including without limitation the validity of this Purchase Order/Contract.

12.  Any reference lo automatic renewal is hereby deleted. The Contract may be renewed only upon mutual written
agreement of the parties.

13. BANKRUPTCY: Inthe event the vendor/contraclor fifes for bankruptcy protection, this Contract may be deemed
nult and void, and terminated without further order.

14.  HIPAA Business Associate Addendum: The Wesl Virginia State Government HIPAA Business Associate
Addendum (BAA), approved by the Attorney General, and available online at the Purchasing Division's web site
(http/iwww. state. wv.us/admin/purchasefvre/hipaa.htm) is hereby made part of the agreement. Provided that, the
Agency meets the definition of a Covered Entity (45 CFR §160.103) and will be disclosing Protected Health
information (45 CFR §160.103) te the vendor,

15.  West Virginia Alcohol & Drug-Free Workplace Act:  [If this Contract constitutes a public improvement construciion
contract as set forth in Article 10, Chapter 21 of the Wesl Virginia Code {"The West Virginia Alcohol and Drug-Free Workplace
Act"), then the following language shall hereby become part of this Contract: "The contraclor and its subcontractors shall
implement and mainain a written drug-free workplace pelicy in compliance with the West Virginia Alcohol and Brug-Free
Workplace Adt, as set forth in Article 1D, Chapter 21 of the West Virginia Code. The cortractor and its subcontractors shall
provide a sworn statement in writing, under the penalties of perjury, that they maintain a valid drug-free work place policy in
compliance with the West Virginia Aleohol and Drug-Free Workplace Act. itis understood and agreed that this Contract shall b
cancelled by the awarding authority if the Contractor: 1) Fails to implement its drug-free workplace policy; 2) Fails to provide
information regarding implementation of the contractor’s drug-free workplace policy at the request of the public authority;
or 3) Provides to the public authority false information regarding the contractor's drug-free workplace policy.”

iINSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS

1. Lise the quotation forms provided by the Purchasing Division.

2. SPECIFICATIONS: ltems offered must be in compliance with the specifications. Any deviation from the specifications
must be clearly indicated by the bidder. Alternates offered by the bidder as EQUAL to the specifications must be
clearly defined. A bidder offering an alternate should attach complete specifications and literature to the bid. The
Purchasing Division may waive minor deviations to specifications.

3. Complete all sections of the quotation form.

4. Unit prices shall prevail in cases of discrepancy.

5, All quotations are considered F.O.B. destination unless alternate shipping terms are clearly identified in the quotation.

6. BID SUBMISSION: All quotations must be delivered by the bidder fo the office listed below prior to the date and time

of the bid opening. Failure of the bidder to deliver the quotations on time will result in bid disqualifications:
Department of Administration, Purchasing Division, 2019 Washington Street East, P.O, Box 50130,
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

Rev. 770108



State of West Virginia Reques§ for R NONBERTT

Department of Administration Quotation WICS0040 5
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Sfreet East g NHIH; ESTT
Post Office Box 50130

Charleston, WV 25305-0130 ROBERTA WAGNER
30a-5R8-0067

*¥904114349 800-4635-8316
MEDELA INC '
1101 CORPORATE DR

HEALTH AND HUMAN RESOURCES
BPH -~ NUTRITION SERVICES (WIC)
C/0 DHHR MATERIALS MANAGEMENT
900 BULLITT STREET
CHARLESTON, WV

25301 506-558-3417

MCHENRY IL 60050-7005

=
0770372608
BID OPENING DATE! 08/07/2008 BID OPENING TiIME 01:30PM

NECESSARY TO| DBTAJIN A NEW CONTRACT OR RENEW THE
ORIGINAL CONTRACT,. THE "REASONABLE TIME™ PERIOD SHALL
NOT EXCEED TWELVE, (12)] MONTHS. DURING| THIS "REASONABLE
TIME™ THE VENDOR MAY TERMINATE THIS CONTRACT FOR ANY
REASON UPON IGIVING THE| DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING 30 DAYS
WRITTEN NOTICE.

UNLESS SPECIFIC PROVIS[IONS ARE STIPULATED ELSEWHERE
IN THIS CONTRACT DOCUMENT, THE TERMS, CONDITIONS AND
PRICING SET HEREIN ARE| FIRM FOR THE LIFE OF THE
CONTRACT.

RENEWAL: THIS CONTRACT| MAY BE RENEWED UPON THE MUTUAL
WRITTEN CONSENT OF THE| SPENDING UNIT AND VENDOR,
SUBMITTED TO! THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING THIRTY (30)
PDAYS PRIDR TO THEH EXPIRATION DATE. SUCH RENEWAL SHALL
BE IN ACCORDANCE WITH |[THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF THE
DRIGINAL CONTRACT| AND SHALL BE LIMITED TO TWO (23 ONE
(1> YEAR PERIOCDS.

CANCELLATION: THE| DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING RESERVES THE
RIGHT TO CANCEL THIS CONTRACT IMMEDIATELY UPON WRITTEN
NOTICE TD THE VENDOR IF THE COMMODITIES AND/OR SERVICES
SUPPLIED ARE! OF AN INFERIOR QUALITY OR DO NOT CONFORM
TO THE SPECLFICAT|IIONS [OF THE BID AND CONTRACT HEREIN.

-

DPEN MARKET CLAUSE: THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING MAY
AUTHORIZE A SPENDING UNIT TO PURCHASE ON THE OPEN
MARKET, WITHOUT THE FILING OF A REQUISITICN OR COST
ESTIMATE, ITEMS SPECIF|IED ON THIS CONTRACT FOR
IMMEDIATE DE|LIVERY IN EMERGENCIES DUE [TO UNFORESEEN
CAUSES (INCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED TO DELAYS IN TRANS-
PORTATION OR| AN UNANTICIPATED INCREASEl IN THE VOLUME
OF WORK.)

QUANTITIES: QUANTITIES LISTED IN THE REQUISITION ARE

TELEPHCNE

815-578-2459 8-12-08
T ol Contract Coord TFEN e 3008932 ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE
WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'




gtate of West Virginia quutestt for TREGNONEER i
epartment of Administration uotation

Purchasing Division WiC90040 3
2019 Washington Street East - ‘  CORRESPONDENG
Post Office Box 50130

Charleston, WV 25305-0130 ROBERTA WAGNER
306~-558-0047

*¥904114369 80C-4635-8316
MEDELA INC
1101 CORPORATE DR

HEALTH AND HUMAN RESOURCES
BPH - NUTRITION SERVICES (WIC)
C/0 DHHR MATERIALS MANAGEMENT
900 BULLITT STREET
CHARLESTON, WV

25301 304-558-3417

MCHENRY IL 60050-7C05

07/03/2008
BID OPENING DATE: 0gs/07,2008 BID DPENING TIME 01:30PHM

APPROXIMATIONS ONLY, BASED ON ESTIMATES SUPPLIED BY
THE STATE SPENDING UNIT. IT IS UNDERSTOOD AND AGREED
THAT THE CONTRACT SHALL COVER THE QUANTITIES ACTUALLY
ORDERED FOR DELIVERY DURING THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT,
WHETHER MORE| OR LESS THAN THE QUANTITIES SHOWN.

ORDERING PROCEDURE: SPENDING UNIT(S) SHALL ISSUE A
WRITTEN STATE CONTRACT, ORDER (FORM NUMBER WV-39) TO
THE VENDOR FOR COMMODITIES COVERED BY [THIS CONTRACT.
THE ORIGINAL| COPY OF THE WV-39 SHALL BE MAILED TO THE
VENDOR AS AUTHORIZATION FOR SHIPMENT, A SECOND COPY
MATLED TO THE PURCHASING DIVISION, AND A THIRD COPY
RETAINED BY [THE SPENDING UNIT,

BANKRUPTCY: | IN THE EVENT THE VENDOR/CONTRACTOR FILES
FOR BANKRUPTCY PROTECTIION, THIS CONTRACT IS AUTOMATI-
CALLY NULL AND VO|IID, AND IS TERMINATED WITHOUT FURTHER
ODRDER.

SHALL SUPERSEDE ANY AND ALL SUBSEQUENT TERMS AND
CONDITIONS WHICH MAY APPEAR ON ANY ATTIACHED PRINTED
DOCUMENTS SUCH AS| PRICE LISTS, ORDER FORMS, SALES
AGREEMENTS OR MAINTENANCE AGREEMENTS, (INCLUDING ANY
ELECTRONIC MEDIUM SUCH AS CD-ROM. o~

THE TERMS AN CONmITIDFS CONTAINED IN [THIS CONTRACT
P

REV. 04/11/2001

INQUIRIES:
WRITTEN QUESTIONS| SHALl. BE ACCEPTED THROUGH CLOSE OF
BUSINESS ON JUL)Y 22, 2008, QUESTIICNS MAY BE

SENT VIA USP|S, FAX, COURIER OR E~MAIL.| IN ORDER TO
ASSURE NO VENDOR RECEIVES AN UNFAIR ADVANTAGE, NO
SUBSTANTIVE QUESTIONS WILL BE ANSWERED ORALLY. IF
POSSIBLE, E-MAIL QUEST|IONS ARE PREFERRED. ADDRESS
INQUIRIES TO:

V4

SN D aces VIAdA [ELEFHONE 5 )5-578-2459 8-12-08
ME v Chntract Coord /TN 36-3098932 ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'



*¥904116349 -
MEDELA INC
1101 CORPORATE DR

MCHENRY IL

State of West Virginia

Department of Administration

Purchasing Division

Request for =

Quotation

2019 Washington Street East

Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

60050-7005

800-435-83146

3N6-Hhh8-0067

ROBERTA WAGNER

HEALTH AND HUMAN RESOURCES

BPH

- NUTRITION SERVICES (WIC)

C/0 DHHR MATERIALS MANAGEMENT

900 BULLITY STREET
A

CHARLESTON,
25301

306-558-~-3417

0770372008

BID OPENING DATE:

08/07/2008

BID

OPENING TIME

01:30PM

FAX:

AND
AND

REV.
THE
THE

ROBERTA WAGNER
DEPARTMENT OF ADMINIST
PURCHASING DIVISION

2019 WASHINGTON S[TREET
CHARLESTON,

E-MAIL:

EXHIBIT 4

LOCAL GOVERNMENT
IN THE BID HIIS RE

TO POLITICAL
VIRGINIA. IF THE
PRICES,
POLITICAL SU
CLEARLY
SHALL NOT PR
MANNER .

INTENDED TO

PARTICULAR B
ALTERNATES S
ILITERATURE A

WV 25311

504-558-41156

CONDITIONS OF THE

RCBERTA.A. WAGN

BODIE
FUSAL

RATION

» EAST

ERDWV.GOV

S:  UNLESS

TO EXTEND THE PRICES,

BID TO COUNTY, S[CHOOL,

OTHER LOCAL GOVERNMENT BODIES,

TERMSE,

INDILCATE [SUCH

3/88

MODEL/BRAND/SPECIF
ACCEPTABLE LEVEL O

REFLECT A

£

EJUDICE THE AWARD

RAND OR VE
HOULD| SO S
ND SPECIFI

SUBDIIVISIIONS OF THE STATE
VENDOR DOES
AND CONDITIONS
BDIVISIONS OF THE

NOT

REFUSAL IN H

ICATIONS NAMED H
F QUALITY ONLY A

OF THIS

THE

THE
OF WEST
WISH

IS BID.

PREFERENCE OR FAVOR ANY

NDOR .

CATIONS.

VENDORS W
TATE AND INCLUDE

VENDOR INDICATES
TERMS,

MUNICIPAL
BID SHALL EXTEND

TG EXTEND THE
OF THE BID TO ALL
STATE, THE VENDOR MUST
SUCH REFUSAL
CONTRACT IN ANY

EREIN ESTABLISH
ND ARE NOT

HO ARE BIDDING
PERTINENT
FAILURE TO PROVIDE

SIGNATURE

Date s \/ﬂ/

F

TELEPHONE

815-578-2459

8§~12~08

TITLE

Gov Céniract Coord

FEIN

36--3098932

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'



*¥906114349
MEDELA INC
1101 CORPORATE DR

MCHENRY 1IL

State of West Virginia

Department of Administration

Purchasing Division

Request for

Quotation

2019 Washington Street East

Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

800-435-8

60050-7005

316

ROBERTA WAGNER

306-558~-0067

HEALTH AND HUMAN RESOURCES

BPH -~

NUTRITION SERVICES (WIC)

C/0 DHHR MATERIALS MANAGEMENT

200 BULLITT STREET
CHARLESTON, WV

2

5301 304-558-3417

07/063/72008

BiD OPENING DATE:

08/07/2008

BID

OPENING TIiME

01:

30PM

INFORMATION FOR A
REJECTION OF; THE

TO WAIVE MINOR IR
IN ACCORDANCE WIT
VIRGINIA LEGISLAT

PURCHASING CARD A
CURRENTLY UTJILIZE
IS ISSUED THROUGH
MUST ACCEPT {THE S
CARD FOR PAYMENT
AGENCY AS A |[CONDI

VEND
CERTIFICATID

PREFERENCE I
5A~3-37 (DOE

N AND
N ACC
S NOT|

ION
ED:

A. APPLICAT
REASON CHECK

I

{ ) BIDDER
HAS RESIDED
(%) YEARS IM
CERTIFICATION;

IS A
CONTI
MEDIA
OR

¢ ) BIDDER IS A
QUARTERS OR [PRINC
WEST VIRGINIA FOR
THE DATE OF [THIS
INTEREST OF [BIDDE
PARTNERSHIP,{ ASSO

HO HAS MAINTAINE
i

NY AL
BID.

REGUL
H SEC
IVE R

CCEPT|
S AV
A BA
TATE
OF AL
TIGN

OR PR
APPL

ORDAN
APPL

THE

TION

ULES

IANCE @

NK .

S MAD

TERNATES MAY BE

STATE RESER

ARITIES IN BIDS

148-1-4(F)
AND REGULAT)

THE STATE

ISA PURCHASING C

THE SUCCESS

OF WEST VIRGINIA
L ORDERS PLACED
CF AWARD.

EFERENCE CERTIFI
ICATION* IS HERE

CE WITH WEST VIRGINIA CODE,
Y TO CONSTRUCTION CONTRACTS).

GROUNDS FOR

VES THE RIGHT

OR SPECIFICATIONS
OF THE WEST

IONS.

OF WEST VIRGINIA
ARD PRODGRAM WHICH
FUL VENDOR

VISA PURCHASING
BY ANY STATE

CATE

BY MADE FOR

E FOR 2.5% PREFERENCE FOR THE

PARTINERSHIP,
TION RESIDENT VENDOR AND HAS MAINTAINED ITS HEAD-

IPAL PLACE OF BUSINESS CONTINUOUSLY IN
FOUR| (4) YEARS IMMEDIATELY PRECEDING
CERTIFICATION;

R IS HELD BY ANOTHER |INDIVIDUAL,
CIATION OR CORPORATION RESIDENT VENDOR
D I7TSs; HEADQUARTERS DR| PRINCIPAL PLACE

ASSOCIA

OR 80

N INDIVIDUAL RESIDENT, VENDOR AND
NUOUSILY IN WEST VIRGINIA FOR FOUR
TELY PRECEDING THE DATE OF THIS

TIOCN OR CORPORA-

OF THE OWNERSHIP

s

MU,

0L

[TELEPHONE
81

5-578~2459

§-12-08

il
%Bv Co&tract Coord

FEIN

36-3098932

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'



State of West Virginia Request for

Department of Administration  Quotation b ;3
Purchasing Division WIC90040 ;

2019 Washingion Street East ‘ DRSS CORRESH
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130 ROBERTA WAGNER
ANG-558-0067
%¥9061146369 800-435-831¢6
MEDELA INC HEALTH AND HUMAN RESOURCES

1101 CORPORATE DR BPH - NUTRITION SERVICES (WIC)
C/70 DHHR MATERIALS MANAGEMENT
900 BULLITT STREET

CHARLESTON, WV

25301 306-558-3417

MCHENRY IL 60050-7005

07/05/2008
BID OPENING DATE! 08/07/2008 BID DPENING TIME 01:30PM

OF BUSINESS [CONTINUOUSLY IN WEST VIRGINIA FOR FOUR (&)
YEARS IMMEDIATELY PRECEDING THE DATE OF THIS
CERTIFICATION; OR :

{ ) BIDDER| I$ A CORPORATION NONRESIDENT VENDOR
WHICH HAS AN AFFILIATE| OR SUBSIDIARY WHICH EMPLOYS

A MINIMUM OF ONE HUNDRED STATE RESIDENTS AND WHICH
HAS MAINTAINED IT|S HEAQUARTERS OR PRINCIPAL PLACE OF
BUSINESS WITHIN WEST VIIRGINIA CONTINUOUSLY FOR THE
FOUR (4} YEARS IMMEDIATELY PRECEDING THE DATE OF THIS
CERTIFICATION.

B. APPLICATIION IS MADE FOR 2.5% PREFERENCE FOR THE

REASON CHECKED:

=l

{ ) BIDDER IS A RESIDENT VENDOR WHOD [CERTIFIES THAT,
DURING THE L{IFE OF THE| CONTRACT, ON AVERAGE AT LEAST
75% OF THE EMPLOYEES WORKING DN THE PR[OJECT BEINE BID
ARE RESIDENT|S OF WEST VIRGINIA WHO HAVE RESIDED IN
THE STATE CONTINUOUSLY, FOR THE TWO YEARS IMMEDIATELY
PRECEDING SUBMISSION OF THIS BID; S

OR
{ ) BIDDER| TS A NONRESIDENT VENDOR EMPLOYING A
MINIMUM OF ONE HUNDRED! STATE RESIDENTS! OR IS A
NONRESIDENT VENDOR WITH AN AFFILIATE OR SUBSIDIARY
WHICH MAINTAINS ITS HEADQUARTERS OR PRINCIPAL PLACE

OF BUSINESS WITHIN WEST VIRGINIA EMPLOYING A MINIMUM
OF ONE HUNDRED STATE RESIDENTS WHO CERTIFIES THAT,
DURING THE L|IIFE OF THE] CONTRACT, ON AVERAGE AT LEAST
75% OF THE EMPLOYEES OR BIDDERS' AFFILJIATE'S OR
SUBSIDIARY'S| EMPLOYEES) ARE RESIDENTS OF WEST VIRGINIA
WHO HAVE RES|IDED {IN THE STATE CONTINUOUSLY FOR THE TWO
YEARS IMMEDIATELY| PRECEDING SUBMISSION OF THIS BID.

BIDDER UNDERSTANDS IF THE SECRETARY OF TAX & REVENUE
DETERMINES THAT A BIDDER RECEIVING PREFERENCE HAS
4

. /h DMAU S \/{7/{ 7/ TELEPHONE 51 5.578-2459

"M ov Cohtract Coord Vi 16-3098932 ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'

8-~12-08




ES)tate of Wgstf\lgginia quutestt fOI’ B ARG NOVEERET T EEEE 7 T
epartment of Administration uotation

Purchasing Division WICI004C {
2019 Washington Street East ; eSS BOBHEST
Post Office Box 50130

Charleston, WV 25305-0130 ROBERTA WAGNER
3046-588~-0067

%904114349 800-435-8314
MEDELA INC
1101 CORPORATE DR

HEALTH AND HUMAN RESOURCES
BPH - NUTRITION SERVICES (WIC)
C/70 DHHR MATERIALS MANAGEMENT
9200 BULLITT STREET
CHARLESTON, WV

258301 306-558-3417

MCHENRY IL 60050-7C05

07/05/2008
BID OPENING DATE

08/07/2008 BID OPENING TIME D1:30PHM

FAILED TO CONTINUE TO MEET THE REQUIREMENTS FOR SUCH
PREFERENCE, |THE SECRETARY MAY ORDER THE DIRECTOR OF
PURCHASING TO: (A) RESCIND THE CONTRACT OR PURCHASE
DRDER ISSUED; OR |[(B) ASSESS A PENALTY AGAINST SUCH
BIDDER IN AN AMOUNT NOT TO EXCEED 5% OF THE BID AMOUNT
AND THAT SUCH PENALTY rILL BE PAID TO |[THE CONTRACTING

M

R

AGENCY OR DEDUCTED FROM ANY UNPAID BALANCE ON THE
CONTRACT OR PURCHASE ORDER.

BY SUBMISSION OF [THIS CERTIFICATE, BIDDER AGREES TO
DISCLOSE ANY| REASONABLY REQUESTED INFORMATION TO THE
PURCHASING DIVISION AND AUTHORIZES THE| DEPARTMENT OF
TAX AND REVENUE TO DISCLOSE TO THE DIRECTOR OF
PURCHASING APPROPRIATE; INFORMATION VERIFYING THAT
BIDDER HAS PAID THE REQUIRED BUSINESS [TAXES, PROVIDED
THAT SUCH INFORMATION DDES NOT CONTAIN| THE AMOUNTS OF
TAXES PAID NOR ANY OTHER INFORMATION DEEMED BY THE TAX
COMMISSIONER TO BE CONFIDENTIAL.

UNDER PENALTY OF LAW FOR FALSE SWEARING (WEST VIRGINIA
CODE 61-5-3)|, BIDDER HEREBY CERTIFIES {THAT THIS
CERTIFICATE |[IS TRUE AND ACCURATE IN ALYt RESPECTS; AND
THAT IF A CONTRACT IS |[ISSUED TO BIDDER] AND IF ANYTHING
CONTAINED WITHIN [THIS [CERTIFICATE CHANGES DURING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT, BIDDER WILL NOTIFY THE
PURCHASING D|IIVISIDN IN WRITING IMMEDIATELY.

BIDDER : Medela, InC. | e

DATE :

SIGNE

\/‘)Mu Voo 815-578-2459 8-12-08
FEIN

Govl Contract Coord // 36-3098932 ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE
WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'

TITLE




State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

*904114349 800-435-8
MEBDELA INC
1101 CORPORATE DR

MCHENRY Il 60050-7005

2019 Washington Strest East

Request for

Quotation

ROBERTA WAGNER
53046-558-0067

316

960

CHARLESTON,
25301

BULLITT STREET
Wv

HEALTH AND HUMAN RESOURCES
BPH - NUTRITION SERVICES (WIC)
C/70 DHHR MATERIALS MANAGEMENT

304~-558-3417

067/03/2008

BID OPENING DATE: 08/07/2008

BID

OPENING TIME

01:30PM

TITLE

% CHECK ANY
IN EITHER "A" OR "B"™,
ARE ENTITLED] TO RECEIV
MAXIMUM 5% PREFERENCE
{REV. 12/00)

COMBINATIO

NOT]

A SIGNED BID MUST| BE $§
DEPARTMENT OF ADM
PURCHASING DIVISI
BUILDING 15
2019 WASHINGTON S
CHARLES[TON, WV 2

PLEASE NOTE:l A CONVENI

THE BID SHOU
THE ENVELOPE

LD CONTAIN
OR THE BI

SEALED BID

e [ e e e o ———

RFQ. NO.:---

BID OPENING

BID OPENING [TIME:

Government Contl

N OF PREFERENCE
OR BOTH ™A™ AND
E.
FOR BOTH "A™

AND
ICE
UBMITTED TO:

INISTRATION
ON

TREET, EAST
5305-0130

ENCE COPY WOULD

THIS INFORMATIO
D MAY NOT BE CON

~-RW/FILE 22-----

-WiIC90040

ract Coordinator

CONSIDERATION(S)
"B"™ WHICH YOU

YOU MAY REQUEST UP TO THE

“Bﬂ .

BE APPRECIATED.

N ON THE FACE OF
SIDERED:

S

N

8-12~08

TYLE,

Gov CJntract Coord

36-3098932

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'



Purchasing Division

¥90611463459

MEDELA INC

1101 CORPORATE DR
MCHENRY IL 60050-70

State of West Virginia
Department of Administration

2019 Washington Street East

Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

800-435-8316

05

Request for =

R NUVBER

Quotation

WIic90es0

iROB
304

ERTA WAGNER
-558-0067

BPH

200
CHA
2

BULLITT STREET
RLESTON, WV
5301

HEALTH AND HUMAN RESOURCES
NUTRITION SERVICES (WIC)
C/0 DHHR MATERIALS MANAGEMENT

304-568-3417

07/03/2008

BiD OPENING DATE: 08/07/2008

BI1D

OPENING TIME

0l1:30PM

PLEASE PROVI
TO CONTACT Y

exxxxx THIS IS

FAX N
GARDI

HE EN

UMBER IN CASE IT
NG YOUR BID:

815-578-2459

PRINT CLEARLY):

Bonnie Voigt

D OF RFQ WIC20

IS NECESSARY

0G0 %%%%%% TOTAL:

$34,.500,00

YAy

8-12-08

TITLE

FEIN
Gov kontract CoordJ?V

36-3098932

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE L ABELED 'VENDOR'



WV-36 (Rev, 01/04/07}

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA

10

Page of Pages

Regquisition/ P.C. No.:
WIC90040

PURCHASE CONTINUATION SHEET RW22

Vendor

Accl. No,:

MUL MUL MUL

P.O. Date: Spending Unit:

Bureau for Public Health - Office of Nutrition Services

{tem No.

Quantity

Description

Unit Price

Amount

100 EA.

1000
EACH

1000
EACH

REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
TO PROVIDE THE FOLLOWING ITEMS:

DELUXE NURTURE [l DOUBLE ELECTRIC BREAST PUMP
ITEM #320 OR EQUAL.

A. Pump will be used for double and/or single pumping.

8. Pump must have fully adjustable suction and manual cycling
to imitate baby's variable nursing patterns.

C. Kits must include: Nuriure Hl or equal, pump motor, a double
collection kit, insulated fote with ice pack, four extra boftles with
2-piece lids, and instructional DVD.

SHIPPING & HANDLING INCLUDED IN PRICE OF PUMPS.

BASIC DOUBLE COLLECTION KIT ITEM #4203 OR EQUAIL.

A. Kits must include items needed for double or single pumping
with Nurture 1l or equal |, motor, 2 bottles with 2-plece lids, 2
bottle stand, 2 bottles stand, 2 flanges, 2 flange bases, 2 double
caps, single cap, long {ube, short fube, 2 filters (1 spare), 3
O-rings (1 spare), and instruction manuatl in English and Spanish,

WARRANTY: 5 Years against defects in materiafs and
workmanship.

SHIPPING & HANDLING INCLUBED IN PRICE OF PUMPS,

HARMONY MANUAL BREAST PUMP ITEM #67161W OR
EQUAL.

Must have a pumping action that mimics the baby's natural
nursing rhythm in two modes:

1. Let down mode.
2. Expression mode.

Must have an ergonomic swivel handie.

Must have a massaging soft breast shield,

SHIPPING & HANDLING INCLUDED IN PRICE OF PUMPS.
THIS WILL BE AN OPEN END CONTRACT. THE TERM SHALL
BE FOR A PERIOD OF ONE YEAR WITH THE OPTIONS OF (2)
TWO, (1) ONE YEAR RENEWALS.

INVOICES: THE VENDOR SHALL SUBMIT INVOICES, IN
ARREARS, TO THE AGENCY AT THE ADDRESS ON THE

FACE OF THE PURCHASE ORDER LABELED "INVOICE TO"
PURSUANT TO THE TERMS OF THE CONTACT.

No Bid

+$19.00

$15,50

No Bid

$19.000.00

$15,500.,00




RFQ Cost Sheet # WIC90040

BIDDERS SHALL PROVIDE A COST FOR THE FOLLOWING:

Estimated UNIT TOTAL
Annusat COST COSsT

ttem# Quantity Description:

1 100 Deluxe Nurture 11l Double Electric Breastpump g o bid g no bid
item #320 or equal as specified in the RFQ.

2 1,000 Basic Double Collection Kit item #420 or equal 3 19.00 $ 19,000.00
as specified in the RFQ.
3 1,000 Harmony Manual Breastpump ltem #67161W or g 15.50 $ 15.500.00
equal as specified in the RFQ.
34 .500.00
Grand Total; $

NOTE:  Award will be made o vendor bidding the lowest price for all items.
Agency will place arders as the need arises for these items.
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REQ No, WICB0040 12

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
Purchasing Division

PURCHASING AFFIDAVIT

VENDOR OWING A DEBT TO THE STATE:

West Virginia Code §5A-3-10a provides that: No contract or renewal of any contract may be awarded by the
state or any of its political subdivisions to any vendor or prospective vendor when the vendor or prospective
vendor or a related party {o the vendor or prospective vendor is a debtor and the debt owed is an amount

greater than one thousand doliars in the aggregate.

PUBLIC IMPROVEMENT CONTRACTS & DRUG-FREE WORKPLACE ACT:

West Virginia Code §21-1D-5 provides that: Any solicitation for a public improvement construction contract
shall require each vendor that submits a bid for the work to submit at the same time an affidavit that the vendor
has a written plan for a drug-free workplace policy in compliance with Article 1D, Chapter 21 of the West
Virginia Code. A public improvement construction contract may not be awarded to a vendor who does not
have a written plan for a drug-free workplace policy in compliance with Article 1D, Chapter 21 of the West
Virginia Code and who has not submitted that plan to the appropriate contracting authority in timely fashion.
For a vendor who is a subcontractor, compliance with Section 5, Article 1D, Chapter 21 of the West Virginia
Code may take place before their work on the public improvement is begun.

ANTITRUST:

in submitting a bid to any agency for the state of West Virginia, the bidder offers and agrees that if the bid is
accepted the bidder will convey, sell, assign or transfer to the state of West Virginia all rights, title and interest
in and to all causes of action it may now or hereafter acquire under the antitrust laws of the United States and
the state of West Virginia for price fixing and/or unreasonable restraints of trade relating to the particular
commodities or services purchased or acquired by the state of West Virginia. Such assignment shall be made
and become effective at the time the purchasing agency tenders the initial payment to the bidder.

| certify that this bid is made without prior understanding, agreement, or connection with any corporation, firm,
limited liability company, partnership or person or entity submitting a bid for the same materials, supplies,
equipment or services and is in all respects fair and without collusion or fraud. | further certify that | am
authorized to sign the certification on behalf of the bidder or this bid.

LICENSING:

Vendors must be licensed and in good standing in accordance with any and all state and local laws and
requirements by any state or local agency of West Virginia, including, but not limited to, the West Virginia
Secretary of State’s Office, the West Virginia Tax Department, West Virginia Insurance Commission, or any
other state agencies or political subdivision. Furthermore, the vendor must provide all necessary releases to
obtain information to enable the Director or spending unit to verify that the vendor is licensed and in good

standing with the above entities.

CONFIDENTIALITY:

The vendor agrees that he or she will not disclose to anyone, directly or indirectly, any such personaily
identifiable information or other confidential information gained from the agency, unless the individual who is
the subject of the information consents to the disclosure in writing or the disclosure is made pursuant to the
agency's policies, procedures and rules. Vendors should visit www.state.wv.us/admin/purchase/privacy for

the Notice of Agency Confidentiality Policies.

Under penalty of law for false swearing (West Virginia Code §61-5-3), it is hereby certified that the vendor
acknowledges the information in this said affidavit and is in compliance with the requirements as stated.

Vendor's Name:  Medela, Inc.

i a // "
) ¢
Authorized Signatures-... i}\ DM v \/ ﬂ/(g//(// Date; __ 8-12-08
/

FPurchasing Affidavit (Revised 07/0 1/38)




*9041143492
MEDELA INC
1101 CORPORATE DR

MCHENRY 1L

12008 9:23AM

60080

Wy BIV OF

State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

800~-435-8316

~-7008

{

PURCH

REQUES't for o riER
Quotation WICHO

T st 0
040

B, N
ROBERTA WAGNER
04-558-0067

10. 4576

P.

-

900 BULLITT STREET
CHARLESTON, WV
25301

PPH - NUTRITION SERVICES (WIC)
¢/O DHHR MATERTALS MANAGEMENT

304-558-3417

DRTERRNTES

FREIGHTTERUS!

07/31/2008

D OPENING DATE:

08/14/2008

BID OPENING TIME g

30BM

1. TO MOVE BID
2. TGO CHANGE

FROM: AWARD

THE ITEMS WITH
TEE LOWEST HRT

REASON: NO ONE

THEREFORE, &

3, ADDENDUM

BID.
EXHIBIT 10O

ADDENDUM (8)
PROPOSAL, PLAN

ADDENDTUM NO.
Wo. 1 ...

THE

WL
PRICE FOR AL ITQMS.

TO: THIS WILL BE

MULLIPLE
ATL THE ITEMS LISTED.

A CKNOWLEDY

SHOULD RE SIGNED
STGN AND RETURN MAY RE

ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMH

T HEREBY ACKNOWLHDGE R
AND HAVE M

IS:

OBENING
AWARD

BE

A MUL
THE AWA
CE (PER T

VENDOR

AND R

S AND/OR

ADDENDUM NO. 1

DATE FROM 8/7/2/008 TO 8/14/2008.
LANGUAGE TO READ:

DE TO VENDOR BIDPING THE LOWEST

TIPLE AWARD CONTRACT, SPLITTING

RD GOING TC THE VENDOR (S) BIDDIN
TEM .

CAN PROVIDE ALL THESE ITEMS.
EMENT IS ATTACHED. THIS DOCUMENT
SULT IN DISQUALIFICATION OF YOUR
REQUISITION NO.: WIC20040
NT
ECEIPT QF THE FOLLOWING CHECKED

ADE THE NECESSARY REVISIONS TO M
SPECIFICATION, [ETC.

QON%RMEQ%% ,
GON?%W@%ﬁiO% DATE .

N Mg \OAL

R TR O s AN OO TONSHE

AWARD WILL BE NECESSARY TO OBTAIN

ETURNED WITH YOUR BID. FAILURE TQ

JONHﬂﬁﬁﬂON%uMWW(

AVAILABILITY. et

TELEPHONE

e A 835-578.459 Q..12-08
o Cprntract Coord : 36-309893%2 ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE
TWHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACWQVE_LABELED VENDCR'

1)

T




12008 9:23AM

Stato of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305.0130

*904124349 800-435-8
MEDELA INC
1101 CORPORATE DR

MCHENRY IL 60050-7005

wy DIV OF PURCH
Request for BT

Quotation

316

NO. 4576 P 22

ROBERTA WAGNER

304-558-0067

"] UEALTH AND HUMAN RESOURCES

EPH - NUTRITION SERVICES (WIC)
¢/0 DHHR MATERTALS MANAGEMENT
900 PULLITT STREET
CHARLESTON, WV

25301 304-558-3417

oifﬁi/zoos

BID OPENING DATE! 08714 /2008

BlD OPENING”?}ME

NO, 3 ....
NO, 4 ... 0>
NO. 5 L] »

I UNDERSTAND
ADDENDUM (S)

YENDOR MUST| CLEARLY
ORAL DISCUSSION
Al ANY STATE P
INFORMATION ISSUED IN
SPECIFICATIONS BY AN

REV. 11/96

OF AD

THAT FAILURE TO CONFIRM
MAY EE CAUSE FOR REJECTION

DERSTAND THAT ANY VEREAL
REPRESENTATION MADE OR ASSUMED TO BE
BEID BETWEEN VENDOR'S
RSONNEL I8 NOT BINDING.

DENDUM NO. 1

WRITING AND ADDED TO THE
QOFFICTIAL AD?PXDUM IS BINDING/L

THE RECEIPT OF TH|
OF BID&.

WADE DURING ANY
REPRESENTATIVES
ONLY THE

SEEREVERSESIDERY O 2 EHMSANQGQNQﬂQNS

M AYITAY e

TELERHONE

5.578.2459 8-12-08

36309

{_Gov Crtxact, Coord fm/

8932

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING 10 RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'



-medela

e e
atural solutions for beautiful beginnings

Technical Data Sheet

Product Number: 6107170W

Product Name: Lactina® Double Pump Kit Date: 01-01-08

Product Description: An apparatus for the expression of breast milk. The system may be used manually or by
attachment to Medela® Lactina® Electric Breastpump for single or double pumping.

Specifications:

Personal accessory kit for use with Lactina® Electric Breastpump.
Suction automatically released at end of each stroke via vent hole

Pump kit has vacuum regulator with a range of continuous adjustment between minimum and
maximum, safe and effective settings.

Piston, cylinder and gasket are separate from collection of milk to prevent breast milk from coming in
contact with the gasket.

Contains components for manual pumping.

Pump kit provides single patient suction source for hygiene.

Maximum pressures will not exceed 240 mm Hg +/- 10 mm Hg,

Kit operates as a single or double pump system with the change of a setting,
Universally threaded to it any standard bottle or collection bag.

Kit includes two 150 ml collection container, with lids and stand.

Includes 2 sets of PersonalFit Breastshields (2 - 24mm and 2- 27 mm shields).

New 2-piece breastshield design which allows for the option of 3 additional size PersonalFit
Breastshields (2 lmm, 30mm, and 36mm).

Includes a spare membrane
Kit is made of medical grade polypropylene

All Medela products and components that come into contact with breastmilk are made with
polypropylene plastic and have always been BPA and DEHP free.

Kit has written low literacy instructions in English and Spanish
Kit is autoclavable, boilable and dishwasher safe.

Packed 20 per case




“medela

Natural soh:ttionsfor beautiful heginnings”

Technical Data Sheet

Product Number: 67161W

Product Name: Harmony™ Breastpump Date: 01-01-08

Product Description:
A portable, personal use breastpump for stimulation and extraction of breastmilk. To be used for manual, single pumping.
Designed for occasional use by moms who nurse their babies for most feedings.

Harmony Manual Breastpump with Natural Expression. Two mode pumping for maximum milk flow. Ergonomic
swivel handle, massaging SoftFit Breastshield and fewer pieces 1o assemble and clean.

Specifications:

® Two (2) distinct pumping modes: 1) Stimulation mode: to simulate a baby’s initial fast suckling to initiate the
milk ejection reflex (MER); and 2) Expression mode: expression mode to simulate a baby’s slower deeper
suckling.

» Each of these pumping modes must be identifiable to the mother as a separate and distinct option on the breast
pump handle,

. Manual speed control

. Variable vacuum: Vacuum target of 150mmHG for letdown mode; 230 mmHG for expression mode

. One - handed pumping

) Compatible with Medela two-piece breastshields (24mm, 27mm, 30mm, SoftFit™) and Medela CSF™ bags

L) All materials that touch breastmilk are made of medical grade polypropylene.

) All materials designed to withstand boiling and dishwasher cleaning (212°F/100°C)

. Warranty: Limited 90 Day

L) All Medela products and components that come into contact with breastmilk are made with polypropylene

plastic and have always been BPA and DEHP free.

Contents:

. Includes one Harmony breastpump, partially assembled and non-sterile

. Includes one {1) - 150 ml collection containers with one (1) solid lid and one (1) bottle stand.

. Includes one (1) SoftFit™ breastshield (24mm) and 1 (27mm) PersonalFit breastshield

. Includes (2) spare membranes

. Inciudis written low literacy instructions on assembly, use, collection & storage and cleaning in English and
Spanish.

] Packaged twenty (20) pumps per case




