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GENERAL TERMS & CONDITIONS
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION (RFQ) AND REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL (RFP) -

1. Awards will be made in the best interest of the State of West Virginia.
2. The State may accept or reject in part, or in whole, any bid.
3. All quotations are governed by the West Virginia Code and the Legislative Rules of the Purchasing Division.

4. Prior to any award, the apparent successful vendor must be propetly registered with the Purchasing Division
and have paid the required $125 fee.

5. All services performed or goods delivered under State Purchase Order/Contracts are to be continued for the
term of the Purchase Order/Contracts, contingent upon funds being appropriated by the Legislature or otherwise
being made available. In the event funds are not appropriated or otherwise available for these services or
goods, this Purchase Order/Contract becomes void and of no effect after June 30.

6. Payment may only be made after the delivery and acceptance of goods or setvices.

7. Interest may be paid for late paymentin accordance with the West Virginia Code.

8. Vendor preference will be granted upon written request in accordance with the West Virginia Code.

9. The State of West Virginia is exempt from federal and state taxes and will not pay or reimburse such taxes.

10. The Director of Purchasing may cancel any Purchase Order/Contract upon 30 days written notice fo the selier.

11. The laws of the State of West Virginia and the Legislative Rules of the Purchasing Division shall govern
g!d rifghts and duties under the Contract, including without limitation the validity of this Purchase
rder/Contract.

12. Any reference to automatic renewal is hereby deleted. The Contract may be renewed only upon mutual written
agreement of the parties.

13. BANKRUPTCY: In the event the vendor/contractor files for bankruptcy protection, this Contract may be
deemed null and void, and terminated without further order.

14. HIPAA BUSINESS ASSOCIATE ADDENDUM: The West Virginia State Government HIPAA Business Associate
Addendum (BAA), approved by the Attorney General, and available online at the Purchasing Division's web site
(hitp://www.state.wv.us/admin/purchase/vre/hipaa.htm) is hereby made part of the agreement. Provided that,
the Agency meets the definition of a Cover Entity (45 CFR §160.103) and will be disclosing Protected Health
Information (45 CFR §160.103) to the vendor.

15. WEST VIRGINIA ALCOHOL & DRUG-FREE WORKPLACE ACT: If this Contract constitutes a public improvementi
construction contract as set forth in Article 1D, Chapter 21 of the West Virginia Code ("The West Virginia Alcohol
and Drug-Free Workplace Act’), then the following language shail hereby become part of this Contract: "The
contractor and its subcontractors shall implement and maintain a written drug-free workplace policy in compliance
with the West Virginia Alcohol and Drug-Free Workplace Act, as set forth in Article 1D, Chapter 21 of the West
Virginia Code. The contractor and its subcontractors shall provide a sworn statement in writing, under the
penalties of perjury, that they maintain a valid drug-free work place policy in compliance with the West Virginia
and Drug-Free Workplace Act. It is understood and agreed that this Contract shall be cancelled by the awarding
authority if the Contractor: 1) Fails to implement its drug-free workplace policy, 2) Fails to provide information
regarding implementation of the contractor's drug-free workplace policy at the request of the public authority; or
3) Provides to the public authority false information regarding the contractor's drug-free workplace policy.”

INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS

1. Use the quotation forms provided by the Purchasing Division.

2. SPECIFICATIONS: [tems offered must be in compliance with the specifications. Any deviation from the
specifications must be clearly indicated by the bidder. Alternates offered by the bidder as EQUAL to the
specifications must be clearly defined. A bidder offering an alternate should attach complete specifications
and fiterature to the bid. The Purchasing Division may waive minor deviations to specifications.

3. Complete all sections of the quotation form.
4. Unit prices shall prevail in case of discrepancy.

5. Al quotations are considered F.0.B. destination uniess alternate shipping terms are clearly identified in the
quotation.

6. BID SUBMISSION: All quotations must be delivered by the bidder to the office listed below prior to the date and time
of the bid opening. Failure of the bidder to deliver the quotations on time will result in bid disqualifications:
Department of Administration, Purchasing Division, 2019 Washington Street Fast, P.O. Box 50130,
Charieston, WV 25305-0130

Rev, 7/01/08
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SBUS09

Specifications'

Mandatory Pre-Bid Meeting

A mandatory pre-bid meeting shall be held on Tuesday, October 7, 2008 at 11:00
a.m. The meeting will be held in the Purchasing Division Conference Room '
located at 2019 Washington Street, East (Capitol Complex - Building 15),
Charleston, WV 25305. Any vendor who wishes to bid an this contract must be
represented at this meeting. Failure to attend the pre-bid conference shall '
disqualify a vendor from bidding on this contract. No person can represent more

than one bidder.
Fedokihokicdokdokdodo keodok dodokokedekoRededo Rl Kok R de Tk R Rk e e e e Fe e dide e Fe e e e ok o e ke e e e e e e koo e e e e e e e e e e e e e e o ol e e e el

Questions

- Wiritten questions shall be accepted through close of business (5:00 p.m. EDST)
on Friday, October 3, 2008. Questions may be sent via USPS, fax, courier or
email. In order to assure no vendor receives an unfair advantage, no substantive
questions will be answered orally. If possible, e-mail questions are preferred.

Address inquires to:

Jo Ann Adkins

Department of Admmsstration
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street, East
Charleston, WV 25305

Fax: 304-558-4115

Phone: 304-558-8802

E-mail: joadkins@wvadmin.gov

The State of West Virginia and/or County Boards of Education reserve the right
for representatives to visit production facilities of successful bidders prior to
and/or during construction of the units for the purpose of observmg production

and quality control.

School bus manufacturers will construct a pilot unit and provide expenses for
approval by the West Virginia Executive Director, Office of School Transportation
and/or his designee, prior to assembly line production of West Virginia school

buses.

September 12, 2008
Page 10of 3



SBUSO09

Specifications

Line setting tickets shall be furnished by the manufacturer for all vehicles.

Successful bidder will issue application for title at least 20 working days prior to
the anticipated delivery date of completed units. 5-day advance notification to
the ordering agency must be given prior to the actual delivery date.

Payment by counties to the successful bidders will be made upon acceptance of
completed units by county boards of education. (Acceptance means when a
county has determined that ALL manufacturer responsibilities have been met.)
West Virginia Minimum Requirements for Design and Equipment of School
Buses, 2007 revision may be obtained from:

Ben Shew, Executive Director

Office of School Transportation

WV Department of Education

1900 Kanawha Blvd., Bldg. 6, Room 318
Charleston, WV 25305

Phone - (304) 558-2711

FAX - (304) 558-6268

School buses must conform to WEST VIRGINIA MINIMUM REQUIREMENTS
FOR DESIGN AND EQUIPMENT OF SCHOOL BUSES, 2007 REVISION and
the attached 2009 ADDENDUM.

Any component supplied by a bidder as an equivalent (where equivalent is
permitted in the Minimum Requirements) must have prior approval, in writing,
from the Executive Director, Office of School Transportation.

Delivery

Successful vendor shall be required to deliver buses within 120 days after receipt
of order. :

Convenience Copy

Bidders are requested to send one convenience copy of their bid to the
Purchasing Division.

Reports

Successful vendor(s) shall be required to submit annual reports on the actual
usage of the contract. Such report should include the quantity of each vehicle
purchased, the cost, and purchaser.

September 12, 2008
Page20f3

P8




SBUS09

Specifications

Quantity
Estimated quantity is 200 ~ 300 units. Estimate is provided for information only

and no guarantee of actual use of any future contract is implied by providing this
estimate.

September 12, 2008
Page 3 of 3
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2009 SCHOOL BUS SPECIFICATION ADDENDUM

AH school buses shall be set for a maximum speed of 65mph and in the economy mode prior to
delivery. County Transportation Directors may apply for a waiver to the West Virginia
Department of Education’s Executive Director of School Transportation.

Gear ratios shall be determined for the most economical mode and verified with the West Virginia
Department of Education’s Executive Director of School Transportation.

A maximum idle time shall be set at 10 minutes.

BRAKES

B.2.g. A Schrader valve to charge the school bus air system in the event of a compressor
failure shall be provided

EXHAUST SYSTEM

A. Exhaust pipe, muffler After Treatment Device and tailpipe shall be outside the bus body and
attached to the chassis, with hangers designed to accommodate expansion and contraction of the
system without damage to the system or hanger(s).

FUEL, ALTERNATE

B. Compressed Natural Gas (CNG) or Propane

INSTRUMENTS AND INSTRUMENT PANEL

A3.  Voltmeter with graduated scale to 16 volts. EXCEPTION: Ammeter may be substituted on
Type Al, P and B vehicles under 35 passengers.
10.  Automatic transmission temperature gauge. EXCEPTION: Type Al, B and B vehicles
under 35 passengers.
11, Tachometer. EXCEPTION: Type Al B and B vehicles under 35 passengers.

POWER AND GRADEABILITY

DIESEL POWER
Passenger Minimum Gross
Capacity _ Horsepower/Torque
84 -90 2450HP/620

CONSTRUCTION

P10



G. Bus body shall meet NSTS-for the Colorado Rack Test

DOORS
A. Service Door

3. Service door shall have minimum horizontal opening of 24" and minimum vertical opening
0f68". e Linla I laxza BRI - DeR IR a0 ATAWN PR LT TP

EMERGENCY EXITS

C. Each emergency exit shall comply with FMVSS 217 and NSTS the present adopted version of the
National School Transportation Specifications.

HEATERS

K. There shall be a water-flow-regulating valve water flow control method to control temperature
installed for convenient operation by the operator. EXCEPTION:—Type-Al-and Il-and D-vehicles

STEPS

D.2.  The step tread shall have a 1.5” white, skid resistant, pebble type nosing that contrasts in
color by at least 70% measured in accordance with the contrasting color specification in
36CFR, Part 1192, ADA of the current National School Transportation Specification and
Procedure and is an integral piece without any joint extending to the leading edge of the
nosing turndown. The vertical surface of the nose shall be smooth.

WINDSHIELD AND WINDOWS

F. Latch shall be designed to latch positively and securely, with-ease-efrelease-that-would-enable
" . .

GLAZING
Eire Blanket FIRE BLANKET

A fire blanket shall be provided with a storage pouch mounted to the wall conveniently located
and identified as a fire blanket. The fire blanket shall meet CRR 16 part 1610 standard for
flammability of clothing. Blanket shall be approximately 62 inches X 80 inches.

P11
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GLAZING

Tinted glass may be installed in all doors, windows and windshield. Tinted plastic, which
complies with all applicable standards, may be installed in windows to the rear of the operator's
compariment.



P17
Rev. 09/08 State of West Virginia

VENDOR PREFERENCE CERTIFICATE

Certification and application® is hereby made for Preference in accordance with West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37. (Does not apply to
construction contracts). West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37, provides an opportunity for qualifying vendors fo request (at the time of bid)
preference for their residency status, Such preference is an evaluation method only and will be applied only to the cost bid in
accordance with the West Virginia Code. This certificate for application is to be used to request such preference. The Purchasing
Division will make the determination of the Resident Vendor Preference, if applicable.

1. Application is made for 2,5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidderis an individual resident vendor and has resided continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preced-
ing the date of this certification; or,

Bidder Is a parinership, association or corporation resident vendor and has maintained its headquarters or principal place of
business continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or 80% of the
ownership interest of Bidder is held by another individual, partnership, association or corporation resident vendor who has
maintained its headquarters or principal place of business continucusly in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately
preceding the date of this certification; or,

Bidderis a nonresident vendorwhich has an affiliate or subsidiary which employs a minimum of one hundred state residents
and which has maintained its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia continuously for the four {4)
years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or,

Application is made for 2.5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:
Bidder is a resident vendor who cettifies that, during the life of the contract, on average at least 75% of the employees
working on the project being bid are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two years

immediately preceding stibmission of this bid; or,

Application is made for 2.5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is a nonresident vendor employing a minimum of one hundred state residents or is a nonresident vendor with an
affiliate or subsidiary which maintains its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia employing a
minimum of one hundred state residents who certifies that, during the life of the contract, on average at least 75% of the
employees or Bidder’s affiliate’s or subsidiary’s employees are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state
continuously for the two years immediately preceding submission of this bid; or, :

Application is made for 5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:
Bidder meets either the requirement of both subdivisions (1) and (2) or subdivision (1) and (3) as stated above; or,

Application is made for 3.5% resident vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked:

Ridder is an individual resident vendor who is a veteran of the United States ammed forces, the reserves or the National Guard
and has resided in West Virginia continuously for the four years immediately preceding the date on which the bid is
submitted; or, -

Application is made for 3.5% resident vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked:

Bidder is a resident vendor who is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the resetves or the National Guard, §, for
purposes of producing or distributing the commodities or completing the project which is the subject of the vendor's bid and
continuously over the entire term of the project, on average at least seventy-five percent of the vendor's employees are
residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two immediately preceding years.

Bidder understands if the Secretary of Revenue determines that a Bidder receiving preference has failed to continue to meet the
requirements for such preference, the Secretary may order the Director of Purchasing to: (a) reject the bid; or (b) assess a penaity
against such Bidder in an amount not to exceed 5% of the bid amount and that such penalty will be paid to the contracting agency
or deducted from any unpaid balance on the contract or purchase order.

By submission of this certificate, Bidder agrees to disclose any reasonably requested information to the Purchasing Division and
authorizes the Department of Revenue to disclose to the Director of Purchasing appropriate information verifying that Bidder has paid
the required business taxes, provided that such information does not contain the amounts of taxes paid nor any other information
deemed by the Tax Commissioner to be confidential.

Under penalty of law for false swearing (West Virginia Code, §61-5-3), Bidder hereby certifies that this certificate is true

and accurate in all respects; and that if a contract is issued to Bidder and if anything contained within this certificate
changes during the term of the contract, Bidder will notify the Purchasing Division in writing immediately.

|

s

lsnisa

|

Blue Bird Bus Sales of Pittsburgh, Inc.
Bidder: DBA Blue Bird Bus Sales of West Signed: 2:3:_.—/—\
Virginia ’ \
Date:  October 22, 2008 Title: _Vice President, School BRus Sales

*Check any combination of preference consideration(s) indicated above, which you are entitied fo receive.
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RFQ No. _SBUSO9

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
Purchasing Division

PURCHASING AFFIDAVIT

VENDOR OWING A DEBT TO THE STATE:
West Virginia Code §5A-3-10a provides that: No contract or renewal of any contract may be awarded by the

state or any of its political subdivisions to any vendor or prospective vendor when the vendor or prospective
vendor or a related party to the vendor or prospective vendor is a debtor and the debt owed is an amount

greater than one thousand dollars in the aggregate,

PUBLIC IMPROVEMENT CONTRACTS & DRUG-FREE WORKPLACE ACT:

West Virginia Code §21-1D-5 provides that: Any solicitation for a public improvement construction contract
shall require each vendor that submits a bid for the work to submit at the same time an affidavit that the vendor
has a written plan for a drug-free workplace policy in compliance with Article 1D, Chapter 21 of the West
Virginia Code. A public improvement construction contract may not be awarded to a vendor who does not
have a written plan for a drug-free workplace policy in compliance with Article 1D, Chapter 21 of the West
Virginia Code and who has not submitted that plan to the appropriate contracting authority in timely fashion.
For a vendor who is a subcontractor, compliance with Section 5, Article 1D, Chapter 21 of the West Virginia
Code may take place before their work on the public improvement is begur.

ANTITRUST:
in submitting a bid to any agency for the state of West Virginia, the bidder offers and agrees that if the bid is

accepted the bidder will convey, sell, assign or transfer to the state of West Virginia all rights, title and interest
in and to all causes of action it may now or hereafter acquire under the antitrust laws of the United States and
the state of West Virginia for price fixing and/or unreasonable restraints of trade relating to the particular
commeodities or services purchased or acquired by the state of West Virginia. Such assignment shall be made
and become effective at the time the purchasing agency tenders the initial payment to the bidder.

I certify that this bid is made without prior understanding, agreement, or connection with any corporation, firm,
limited liability company, partnership or person or entity submitting a bid for the same materials, supplies,
equipment or services and is in all respects fair and without collusion or fraud. 1 further certify that | am
authorized to sign the certification on behalf of the bidder or this bid.

LICENSING:
Vendors must be licensed and in good standing in accordance with any and all state and local laws and

requirements by any state or local agency of West Virginia, including, but not limited to, the West Virginia
Secretary of State's Office, the West Virginia Tax Department, West Virginia Insurance Commission, or any
other state agencies or political subdivision. Furthermore, the vendor must provide all necessary releases to
obtain information to enable the Director or spending unit to verify that the vendor is licensed and in good

standing with the above entities.

CONFIDENTIALITY:
The vendor agrees that he or she will not disclose to anyone, directly or indirectly, any such pefsonalty

identifiable information or other confidential information gained from the agency, unless the individual who is
the subject of the information consents to the disclosure in writing or the disclosure is made pursuant to the
~ agency’s policies, procedures and rules, Vendors should visit www.state.wv. us!admmlpurchaselpnvacy for

the Notice of Agency Confidentiality Policies.

Under penally of law for false swearing (West Virginia Code §61-5-3), it is hereby cerlified that the vendor
acknowledges the information in this said affidavit and is in compliance with the requirements as stated.

Vendors Name: Blue Bird Bus Sales of Pittsburgh, Inc, DBA Blue Bird Bus Sales of West Virginia

Authorized Signature: w Date: October 22, 2008

Purchasing Affidavit (Revised 07/01/08}




SBUSO09 Pricing Pages

210HP, FE, Automatic Transmission
225HP, FE, Automatic Transmission
225HP, RE, Automatic Transmission
Delivery to Charleston, WV

210HP, FE, Automatic Transmission
225HP, FE, Automatic Transmission
225HP, RE, Automatic Transmission
Delivery to Charleston, WV

240HP, FE, Automatic Transmission
240HP, RE, Automatic Transmission

240HP, FE, Automatic Transmission
240HP, RE, Automatic Transmission
Delivery to Charleston, WV

TRANSIT UNITS

71 Passenger

77 Passenger

84 Passenger

89 Passenger

< L5

82,974.00

84,594.00

90,382.00

S 7 A P

7,500.00

88,649.00

88,649,.00

25.034.,00

O R

1,500.00

89,940.00

94,474.00

No Bid

No Bid

$
$
$

Transit Unit Vendor: Blue Bird Bus Sales of Pittsburgh, Inc.

Jeff Pschirer

N

Print Name) (Signature) N

Date QOctober 22, 2008

Phone__724-898-24772

Toll Free Phone Number  866-521-2472

Fax: 724-898-2660

Em ail Jpschirer@bluebirdpgh.com

P13

DBA Blue Bird Bus Sales of
West Virginia



SBUSO09 Pricing Pages

CONVENTIONAL UNITS

24 Passenger

Type A1 — 130HP — Automatic Transmission
Type B — 130HP — Automatic Transmission:

30 Passenger

Type A1 - 130HP — Automatic Transmission
Type B~ 130HP — Automatic Transmission

35 Passenger
Reguiar'- 175HP - Automatic Transmission
Sp. Education - 175HP - Automatic Transmission
Delivery Ta Charfeston, WV

47 Passenger
Regular - 190HP - Automatic Transmission
Regular - 210HP - Automatic Transmission
Sp. Education - 180HP - Automatic Transmission
Delivery To Charleston, WV

53 Passenger
Regular -~ 190HP - Automatic Transmission
Regular - 210HP - Automatic Transmission
Regular - 210HP - Automatic Transmission
Delivery To Charleston, WV

59 Passenger

Regular - 190HP - Automatic Transmission
Regular - 210HP - Automatic Transmission

Delivery To Charleston, WV
65 Passenger

Regular - 210HP - Automatic Transmission
Regular - 225HP Automatic Transmission

Delivery To Charleston, WV

* Heonomy mode selection is not available

$__53,523.00 %
$ No Bid
$_53,850.00 *
$__no mig

$ No Bid

$_ No mid

$
$__67,643.00
$_ 68,539.00
$__1,772.00
$___1.500.00
$ 68,881.00
$ 69,778.00
$ 69,778.00
$  1,500.00
$__69,260,00
$_70,148.00
$ _ 1,500.00
$ 69,896.00
$ 71,066.00
$ 1,500.00

Page 2 of 4

P14
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SBUS09 Pricing Pages
CONVENTIONAL UNITS - Continued

71 Passgnger

Regular - 210HP - Automatic Transmission $ 70,857.00

Delivery To Charleston, WV $ 1,500.00

77 Passenger

Regular - 210HP - Automatic Transmission : $ 75,747.00
Regular - 225HP - Automatic Transmission $_75,747.00
Delivery To Charleston, WV $_1,500.00
DELIVERY:

Bidders must state number of days after receipt of order (ARO) for bus delivery. Number of days
for delivery shall be no greater than 120 days. This does include “letters of intent”.

Buses will be delivered within ___ 120 days ARO.

Conventional Unit Vendor: Blue Bird Bus Sales of Pittsburgh, Inc. DBA Blue Bird Bus Sales of
West Virginia

Jeff pschirer "“/-?—'D ——
Print Name) - (Signature) TN

Date October 22, 2008

Phone 724-898-2472

Toll Free Phone Number_ 866-521-2472

Fax:_724-898-2660

Email Jpschirer@bluebirdpgh,com

Page 30f4



SBUSO09 Pricing Pages

Special Needs — Conventional

210 HP — Automatic Transmission

210 HP — Automatic Transmission

2285 HP — Automatic Transmission

225 HP — Automatic Transmission

225 HP — Automatic Transmission

53 Passenger

59 Passenger

65 Passenger

71 Passenger

77 Passenger

$_73,111.00

$_74,344.00

$ 75,812.00

$_76,413.00

$_81,176.00

Page 4 of 4

P18



State of West Virginia Request for
Department of Administration  Qluotation
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Sireet East

Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130 TO ANN ADKINS
R4 -_ERERA 2200
Lathhhihobddahdlnd ALL STATE AGENCIES
JEFF PSCHIRER AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS

VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER

BLUE BIRD BUS SALES OF PITTSBURGH INC
5374 WILLIAM FLYNN HIGHWAY
GIBSONIA PA 15044

09/23 /2008
BID OPENING DATE: YT

ok k kkERERFAE AR AR F X F A ADDENDUM NQO. 1r**xfhkkrdkhx kA b ok adhk

1. MANDATORY| PRE-BID MEETING HAS BEEN MOVED TO
10/09/200B @ 1D:00AM. SAME LOCATION.

P . ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT IS ATTACHED. THIS
DOCUMENT BHOULD BE BIGNED AND RETURNED WITH YOUR
BID. FAILURE O SIGN AND RETURN MAY RESULT IN
DISQUALIFICATIPN OF| YOUR BID.
BXEIBIT 1p

bk x kA kAR R KRR R AR EFERFEND OF ADDENDUM NO| L1**x*xkkkkk k& k¥

BEVERSE: CONDBIo T
ﬁf:}/'—\ 724-898-2472 October 22, 2008

TITLE FEIN
Vice President SBS 251228073 ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'




EXHIBIT 10

ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT

I HEREBY ACKNOWLEDGE RECEIPT OF THE FOLLOWING CHECKED
ADDENDUM(S) AND HAVE MADE THE NECESSARY REVISIONS TO MY
PROPOSAL, PLANS AND/OR SPECIFICATION, ETC.

ADDENDUM NO.'S:

] UNDERSTAND THAT FAILURE TO CONFIRM THE RECEIPT OF THE
ADDENDUM(S) MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF BIDS. VENDOR
MUST CLEARLY UNDERSTAND THAT ANY VERBAL

REPRESENTATION MADE OR ASSUMED TO BE MADE DURING ANY
ORAL DISCUSSION HELD BETWEEN VENDOR'S REPRESENTATIVES
AND ANY STATE PERSONNEL IS NOT BINDING. ONLY THE
INFORMATION ISSUED IN WRITING AND ADDED TO THE
SPECIFICATIONS BY AN OFFICIAL ADDENDUM IS BINDING.

SIGNATURE
Blue Bird Bus Sales of West Virginia/

Blue Bird Bus Sales of Pittsburgh, Inc.

............................

REV.11/96



State of West Virginia Request for R

Department of Administration  Quotation SBUS09 1
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East

Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130 JO ANN ADKINS
RO4-558-8802
*507143237 T724-898-2472

ALIL STATE AGENCIES

AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER

BLUE BIRD BUS SALES OF PITT IN
5374 WILLIAM FLYNN HWY

GIBSONIA PA 15044

10/10/2008
BID OPENING DATE: 11 /99 /9008

rkkkkkk kR A ARKR AR R K| ADDENDUM NO. 2 *khkkprdhkdktdkkhkhkhx

.. SBUS0Y9 SPECIFICATION CLARIFICATION ATTACHED, 1 PAGE.

> . SBUSY MANDATORY PRERBID SIGN IN SHEETS, ATTACHED.

bk kkkkwE Ik Ex*kFFAEND OF ADDENDUM NO. 2 *kxkkdkdkdkkfhhkdk

bo01 EA p70-30
1
SCHOCL BUS CHASST

Ud

SIGNATURE DA

S — 724-898-2472 October 22, 2008

TITLE AN FEIN
Vice President SBS 251228073 ADDRESS CHANGES TC BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'




2009 SCHOOL BUS SPECIFICATION ADDENDUM II

BRAKES

B. ABS automatic traction control system sheuld shall be standard on units with air
brakes

B.1.d. Be protected by a desiccant typed air dryer, with an ADIP or equal spin-on
replaceable filter.

TRANSMISSION

A. Warranty for the transmission sheuld shall be 5 yrs. unlimited mileage.

SPECIAL EDUCATION SCHOOL BUS

FASTENING DEVICES

A.9.  The floor anchorage track system shall consist of 4 tracks and shall be “L” type.

B.2.g. An external quick connect charging port on the air tank to charge the school bus air
system in the event of a compressor failure shall be provided.
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Capacity

Exterior Width
Interior Width
AisleWidth

Skirt Length
interior Headroom
Overall Height
Wheelbase

Fuel Tank

Entrance Door

Rear Door

Muittiple floor plans available with
passenger seating upto 77
06"

903/4"

Varies by floor plan

16 1/4”

74" standard; 77" optional
1247-127"
1897/217"/238"/252"/ 273"

60-gallon between frame raifs in

rear overhang

27" wide x 78" high/ double “full view”
outward opening

37.7"widex 52.5" high

Transmission

Engine
Tire Size
Alternator

Brakes

Suspension

Steering
Front Axle
Rear Axle
Wheel Cut
GVWR

- % .
.
i

S

Allison®PTS 2500
Curmemins®ISB-07 200- 240 hp:
11R22.5(6) |
200amp

Hydrautic disc brakes with 4-wheel anti-lock

brakes.

Front 8,000 b, parabolic springs
Rear-17.000-21,0001b. 2-stage leaf springs
(rating varies by wheelbase)

TAS 55

120001

21,000b.

50°

Upto31,000ib.

BLUE BIRD



.

-

suspensmn

21,000 b, rear axte with a two-stage rear suspensmn system
(rating varies by wheelbase)

Biue Stripe rubber coolant hoses with constant torque
clamps

Hydraulic brake system

Anti-tock brakes

15"steel front bumper

“E-Z Adjust" tilt/telescoping steering column

“Group 31" batteries

“Huck spin” fasteners on all permanent frame fixtures

All parts are pre-primed or thoroughly Tust-proofed

after fabrication and before assembly

Entire underbody (body skirt and floor is

undercoated before mounting on chassis

Exterior surfaces are painted with heat-cured polyurethane
Interior surfaces are painted with high-quality, hotsprayed,
balted-on enamal

1/8"Smoath black rubber flocring, 3/16" ribbed rubber
aisle

Goodyear Hi-Miler heater hose with constant torque clamps
Blue Stripe rubber cooling hoses with constant torguie
clamps

Synthetic transmission fiuid

11R22.5{G) tres

Spicer”lubed for life" driveline

Rubber melded wheelhouse

12,000 i front axie with 8,060 Ib. parabolic spring
suspension

21,000 ib. rear axie with a two-stage rear suspension
system (rating varies by wheelbase}

Side exhaust befare rear wheels

“Huck spin”frame fasteners

T4-gauge steel, hat shaped posts and roof bowS

ngnd %&gauge steel: roof Iangnudmal mternal
structural members v :
Ggauge, channeied mterlor steel wznduw headers

m'ass' e16—ga ge ontmuous belt of ln'erzor steel

square -inch tempered safety. glass

"Safety View" vision panel with a wrde ar gle Fresnal lens”:
for view of loading/unioading zone :
Best driver’s line of sight ins the school bus industry
50-degree wheel cut reduces need for backing
Flat ard convex rearview migrors

Oval shape crossover mirsors

Electric hora with high and low note

Blue Bird's unitized construction of the passenger
compartment

15" steel front bumper, 12" steel rear bumper

Side exhaust before rear wheels

8.25 % 22.5 Disc, hub-piloted steei wheels
T1R22.5(G) tires

Chassis muitiplex wiring

Large work space under hood

Easy hood assist requires less than 15 ib. opening effort
Bacly wiring terminal is easily accessible through
exterior electrical compartment

Wiring is color coded and continucusly numbered

for easy identification

Automatic resetting <ircuit breakers for body wiring
Tempered glass, split-sash windows

Grease fittings on emergency door hinges
Easy-opening, outward opening entrance door; features
long-lasting, oil-impregnated, bronze pivatal bearings
Body wiring Is encased in"sasy to access” ABS

molding above passenger windows

Sicde exit exhaust

74" headroom at aisle, front o rear
Split-sash, tempered windows
Tinted windshield

90,000 btu front heater and defroster

Power accessory socket for cellular phones, {8 radios, etc.

Fult"panoramic” cockpit view
Full body insulation

. Acoustic headlining (Driver’s and 15t Sections}

ntmuai pmdu
Wi may be oy

3-point seat belt with 7 1/2"vertical adjustment
Fully adiustable driver's seat

Cruise control

Improved vision in Ioading zone with “Safety View”
window and farge glass paneled door

New wraparcund dash

Cummins® 158-07 diesel engine 200-24C hp

Allison® PTS 2200 & PTS 3000 Transmission
Hendrickson® front and rear air ride suspension
Electri¢, remote conirol and heated mirrors

Laminated gtass

77" headroom/12" split sash windows

Dedicated deor and wheelchair fifts, along with recessed
wheelchair securements for special-needs passengers
Underfloor luggage compartments with locking doors
Tinted glass

Mud flaps

Vandal locks

AM/FM/CD Radio with deluxe speakers

100 gaiion fuel tank

Air brake system

Bode® electric door

16,000 b, front springs

Phywood subfloor

Headroom | 74"

Width Exterior | 96"

Width Interior | 90 3/4”

Skirt Length | 16 1/4"

Qverall Length § 289"-471"

Qverall Height | 124"-127"

Telephone:
724-898-2472

Wheelbase/Passenger Capacity | 189"=48

2177 =54

238" = 60

257" = 66

273" = 7277

Direct Parts:
1-800-323-1455

5374 Wiltiam Ftynn Hwy., Gibsonia, PA 15(}44-9650

Pl 131 W dm



Capacity

Exterior Width
Interior Width
Aisle Width

Skirt Length
Interior Headroom
Overall Height
Wheelbase

Step Height (f/r)

Overhang

Fuel Tank

Entrance Door

Muttiple floor plans available vith

passenger seating up to 90

96"

903/4"

Varies by floor plan
193/4"

74" standard; 77" optional

124"-127"

14177169/ 190772117/ 232"

Varies
Front: 88%

Rear: varies on model sizes

60-gallon between the frame rails in

rearoverhang
30" wide x 78" high / double “fulf view”

outward opening

CHILERD

Rear Dooy

Transmission
Engine

Tire Size
Alternator

Brakes

Suspension

Steering
Front Axle
Rear Axle
Wheel Cut
GVWR

0L

Allison®PT52500
Cummins 1S8-07, 200-280hp ©
11R22.5(H) -
20CGamp

Hydraulic disc brakes with 4-wheel anti-lock
brakes

Front- 13,2001, 2-leaf parabolic springs
Rear-17,000- 21,0001b. 2-stage leaf springs
(rating varies by wheelbase)

TAS65

13,2001/b.

21,0001b. (23,000 1b. optional)

45°

Upto36,2001b.

BLUE BIRD



sprmg suspensmn s

21,000 b, rear axle with a two-stage, rear suspenswn #W.heéi ant loék ﬁrékes :

system {rating varies by wheelbase) - Dusat halogen hea diight s

«  Driver's three-point seat belt with adjustable 7 1/2”
piflar loop

» “Full view" outward-opening entrance door with 1,350
square-inch tempered safety glass

+ Flat and convex rearview mirrors

+  Oval shape crossover mirrers

«  Electric horn with high and low note

+  Blue Bird's unitized construction of the passenger
compartmeant

«12"steed front bumper, 12" steel rear bumper

- Side exhaust before rear wheels

+ Al parts are pre-primed or thoroughly rust-proofed + 8.25x22.5 Disc, hub-piloted steel wheels
after fabrication and before assembly « 11R22.5(H) tires

+  Entire underbody (body skirtand floor} is
undercoated before mounting on chassis

«  FExterior surfaces are painted with heat-cured pelyurethane

+  Intetior surfaces are painted with high-quality, hotsprayed,
baked-on enamel

+  1/8"Smooth black rubber flooring, 3/16" ribbed rubber + Bady wiring terminal is easity accessible through

Black rubber coolant hoses with constant torque clamps
Hydraulic brake system

Anti-lock brakes

- 12"steel front bumper

Tift/telescoping steering wheel

"Group 31" batteries

"Huck spin”fasteners on all permanent frame fixtures

.

aisle exterior electricat compartment
- Black rubber cooling hoses with constant torque clamps Wiring is color coded and continuousty numbered
+  Synthetic transemission fluid for easy identification

+ 1TR22.5(H) tires - Automatic resetting circuit breakers for body wiring

+  Spicer“iubed for life” driveline « Tempered glass, splitsash windows

+  Rubber molded wheelhouse + Grease fittings on emergency door hinges

. 13,200 Ib. front axte with 13,200 Ib. 2 leaf parabofic - Easy-opening, outward opening entrance door; features

spring suspension

» 21,000 |b. rear axle with a two-stage, rear suspension
system (rating varies hy whaelbase)

« Side exhaust before rear wheels

+ "Huck Spin”frame fasteners

long-asting, oil-impregnated, bronze pivotat bearings
Body wiring is encased in "easy to access” ABS
molding above passenger windows

Side exit exhaust

E Powersteermgw hn[t/te!escopmg ot

Large, easy to read gauges

Bacikdit, easy to reach switch panel with rocker switches
Electric, intermittent, singte switch windshield wipers
Manual “‘glide-type” outward opening door

Driver's 3-point seat belt with 7 1/2"vertical adjustment
Fully adjustable driver’s seat

Cruise control

SR

FHONAEFEE

Cumiming® 1S8-07 diesel engine 200-28C hp

Allison® PTS 2200 & PTS 3000 Transmission
Hendrickson® front and rear air ricde suspension
Electric, remote control and heated mirrors

Laminated glass

77" headroom/ 12" split sash windows

Dedicated door and wheelchair lifts, along with recessed
wheelchair securemnents for special-needs passengers
Underfloor luggage compartments with locking doeors
Tinted glass

Mud flaps

Vandal locks

AM/FMACD Radio with deluxe speakers

100 gallon fuel tank

Alr brake system

Plywood subfloor

Headroom | 74"
Width Exterior | 96"
Width Interior | 50 3/4”
+ 74"headroom at aisle, front to rear Skirt Length | 19 3/4”
-+ l4-gauge steel, hat shaped po§ts alnd rf)of bows . Split-sash, tempered windows vl Lot | 2697477
Rigid 16-gauge steel roof longitudinal internal . Tinted wirdshield — 9 - >
gtructus rall Height | 124"- 127"
i structual members + 90,000 btu front heater and defroster T - ac esg' T
. 16-gauge channeled interior steet window headers + Power accessory socket for cellular phones, CB radios, etc. eelbase/Passenger Capacity =
- A massive 16-gatge continuious belt of interior stee§ - Full“panoramic” cockpit view 169" = 60
armor above! and below floor line . Full body insulation 190" = 66/72
“Riveted and welded construction - Acoustic headfining (Driver’s and 15t sections) 2117 72/78
Four fulHength 16 gauge éxterior side rubralls . 239" = B4/90

0-gauge ﬂuted exterior s[de panels

22-gauge interior galvalume side panéls Telephone:

724-898-2472

ing obligations. Some eqmpment and features show

BDirect Parts:

1-800-323-1455

approved for prmtsng in keeplng with its policy of con 5374 William Flynn Hwy., Gibsonia, PA 15044-8650

Printed in US.A,



Capacity Muttiple floor plans available with Rear' \ﬂﬁndow 557 widexZZ”high o

passenger seating up to 90 Transmission .-~ Afllison®PTS 2500
Exterior Width 96" Engine Cummins ISC-07 260- 300 hp
Interior Width 90 3/4" Cummins ISB-07 200-280 hp
Aisle Width Varies by floor plan Tire Size 11R22.5(H)
Skirt Length 193/4” Alternator 200amp
Interior Headroom 74" standard: 77" optional Brakes Alr brakes with 4-wheel anti-lock brakes
Overall Height 1247-127" Suspension Front - 13,200 b. 2-leaf parabolic springs
Wheelbase 189°/217"/245" /273" Rear- 19,000~ 23,000 lb. 2-stage leaf springs
Step Height (f/r) Varies (rating varies by wheelbase}
Overhang Front: 85" Steering TAS65
Rear: 120" Front Axle 13.2001b.
Fuel Tank 60-gallon betweern the frame raifs Rear Axle 21,0006,
Entrance Door 30" widex 78" high/ double “full view” Wheel Cut 45°
outward opening GVWR Upto 36,200/,

BLUE BIRD




Latge, easy to read galges _
© 13,200 ib. front axle with 13,200 1b. 2 leaf,

parabulic spring suspension R
21,008 |b. rear axle with a two-stage, rear suspension
system {rating varies by wheelbase}

+  Biack rubber coolant hoses with constant torgue clamps

- Airbrake system

«  Anti-lock brakes

« 12”steel front burnper

- Tilvtelescoping steering wheel

« "Group 31" batteries

+ "Huck spin” fasteners on alt permanent frame fixtures

« Al parts are pre-primed or thoroughly rust-proofed
after fabrication and before assembly

- Entire underbody {body skirt and floor} is
underceated before mounting on chassis

+ Exterior surfaces are painted with heat-cured polyurethane

- interior surfaces are painted with high-gquality, hotsprayed,
baked-on enamel

. /8" Smooth black rubber flooring, 3/16" ribbed rubber
aiste

«  Black rubber cooling hoses with constant torque clamps

- Synthetic transmission fluid

»  11RZ2.5{H} tires

. Spicer“lubed for life" driveline

+  Rubber molded wheethouse

+ 13,2001, front axle with 13,200 |b, 2 leaf parabolic
spring suspension

+ 21,000 Ib. rear axle with a two-stage, rear suspension
system (rating varies by wheelbase}

+ Rearexit exhaust

» “Huck spin”frame fasteners

'+ ¥ 14-gauge steed, hat shaped posts and roof bows
+ figid 16-gauge steel roof langitudina internal
.- structural members
S 16-gauge, channeled interfor steel wirdow headers
- A massive 16-gauge continuous belt of interlor steel
. armorabove and below floor fine . - o
. Riveted and welded construction e
Four ffl-length;, 16 gauge exteriar side rub raits -
20-gatige fluted exterior side panels - . .
gauge interior galvalume side panels 1
alige steef floor panels .
50,000 pal steel ¢
ttached with

Hassis frame with pel
ick Spib fasteners

- piflar loop

tmanent fixtures and ©

(R ge
Driver's three-point seat belt with adjlstabl

“Full view” outward-opening ehtrance door with 1,350
square-inch tempered safety glass
Unencumbered stepwell area

Flat and corvex rearview mirrors

Oval shape crossaver mirrors

Electric horn with high and fow note

Blue Bird’s unitized construction of the passenger
compartment

12"steel front bumper, 12"steel rear bumper
Rear exit exhaust

8,25 x 22.5 Disc, hub-piloted steet wheeis
11R22.5{H) tires

Erigine Compartment; top hinged, alurninum door with gas
assist cyfinders; 80" wide x 34" high for easy access; remote
engine start switch, starter button, and compartment light
switch

Body wiring terminal is easily accessible through

exterlor efectrical compartment

Wiring is color coded and continucusty numbered

for easy klentification

Autornatic resetting circuit breakers for body wiring
Tempered glass, split-sash windows

Grease fittings on emergency door hinges

Easy-opening, outward opening entrance door; features
Jong-lasting, ofl-impregnated, branze pivotal bearings
Body witing is encased in “easy to access* ABS

molding above passenger windows

Rear exit exhaust

74" headroom at aisle, front to rear

Split-sash, ternpered windows

Tinted windshield

90,000 btu front heater and defroster

Power accessory socket for ceflular phones, CB radios, ete.
Unencumbered stepwell area

Full“panoramic” cockpit view

Full body insulation

Acoustic headlining (Driver's and 1st Sections)

B e PU PN =T K [y P

Wrap around dash with power door control and oth
convenient switches N
Manual “glide-type” outward opening deor

3-point seat belt with 7 1/2"vertical adjustment
Fully adjustable driver's seat

Cruise control

Cummins® 15C-07 diese! engine 285-300 hp
Cummins® 158-07 diesel engine 215-280hp

Allison® PTS 3000 Transmission

Hendrickson® front and rear alr ride suspansion
Flectric, remote control and heated mirrors

Larninated giass

77" headroom/12" split sash windows

Dedicated door and wheelchair lifts, along with recessed
wheelchair securements for special-needs passengers
Underfioor luggage compartments with locking doors
Tinted glass

Mud flaps

Vandat locks

AM/FM/CD Radio with deluxe speakers

100 gailon fuel tank

Plywood subfloor

Headroom | 74"

Width Exterior | 96"

Width Interior | 90 3/4”

Skirt Length | 19 3/4”

Cverali Length § 395"- 480"

Overall Height { 124"-127"

Telephcné:
724-898-2472

Wheelbase/Passenger Capacity | 189"= 66
2317"=72
245"=78
273" = 84790

Direct Parts:
,1-800-323-1455

o

RGHINC.

5374 Wiltiam Flynn Hwy., Gibsonia, PA 15044-0650

T proved for printing. I keepihg with its policy of continual product improvement, Blue Bird resesves the right to
crring obligations. Some equipment and-features shown may be optional-—your Blue Bird Dealer will explain.

2rinted in U.S.A.



Capadity

Floor

Exterior Width
Interior Width
Aisle Width

Skirt Length
Interior Headroom
Overall Height
Wheelbase

Fuel Tank

Entrance Door

Muttiple floor plans available with
standard seating and wheelchair
accessible models;

passenger seating up to 30

Flat floor, front to rear

96"

90 3/4"

Varies by floor plan

12"

74" standard

120"

158"

55-galfon between frame raifs
26.5" wide x 76.6" high / double "fulf

view" outward opening

Rear Door 37.7"widex52.5" high

Transmission Abfomqtlc with overdrive
Engine 6.0liter, V-8 Turbo diesel
Tire Size LT225/75R/ 16E steef befted, radial tires
Wheels Dual rear, single front ‘
Brakes Heavy-duty disc, front and rear power
brakes with ABS
Suspension Independent coil springs front,
leaf springs rear
Front Axle 4,6001b.
Rear Axle 94501,
GVWR 14,0506,

BLUE BIRD



“front, leaf-type spr;ngs onrear) -
Rear bumper is chassis frame motunted: 10” high, one -
piece 3/16" steel 90 degree fange, top and bottom;
14" wrap around each side
+  Bodyis meunted to chassis using heavy-duty energy-
absorbing rubber isolator system to reduce vibration,
extend vehicle life, and provide a quiet, smooth ride

- Durable, corrosion-resistant aluminum used for stepwedi,
under floor body pane), interior and exterior side body
panels and roof panels

+ Back of bus is corrosion-resistant electro-deposited coated
steel

172" exterior-grade plywood sub-floor over aluminum with
14-gauge steei frame

+ Al body parts are thoroughly rust-proofed after fabrication
ard before assembly

- Entire underbody (body skirt and floct) is undercoated
before mounting

. Exterior surfaces are painted with OEM heat-cured
polyurethane

« 1/8"Smooth black rubber flocring, 3/16" ribbed rubber
aisle with atuminurm aisle trim and gatvanized steel cove
molding

+  interior wheel housings covered with rubber

- Goodyear Hi-Miler heater hose with constant torque clamps
when rear heater ordered

The Micro Bird meets or exceeds alf requirements of Federal Motor Vehicle
Safety Standards (FMVSS) and Canadian Motor Vehicie Safety Stanidlards

(CRAVSS) for joint strength and rolf over safety.
+  4-whee! anti-lock brakes
_+. Halogen daytime runnirg lights
o+ Driver's retractable lap and shoulder belt
Driver's door seinforced for impact protection
[+ '26.5" % 76.6" double “full view” outward-opening
i+': entrance door with 1,335 square-inch clear-tempered,
tintedglass |
Low two-step nonskid corrosion-resistant aluminurm

! r;zed tape around aII emergency exits
lght hght warnmg system with hoocis

Wiring is calor coded ard contxnuously numbered for:
easy identification:
Automatic resetting circuit breakers for body wiring
Clear and tempered glass, split-sash windows with

easy to service latches

Grease fittings on rear emergency door hingas
Easy-opening, outward opening entrance door; features
fong-lasting, oil-impregnated, bronze pivotal bearings
Body wiring is encased in“easy to access” aluminum
molding above passenger windows

Unitized construction

16-gauge steel, hat-shaped side posts and roof bows
Rigid 16-gauge internal channel steel headers above
windows

Amassive 16-gauge internal continuous side plate of steel
armor above and below floor line

Riveted and welded construction

Three full-length exterior side rub rails {black)

12" alurinum side body skirt

Smooth, hardened aluminum exterior side panels
interior atuminum panels

14-gauge steel floor frame

Power steering

Large, easy to Tead illuminated gauges

Adjustable semi-bucket driver’s seat

Auto-retracting driver's seat belt

Adjustable sun visor

Large 344 square-inch, right-front "driver assist” window
for improved field of vision {located on guarter panel in
front of entrance dooy)

Intermittent electric windshield wipers

Electric windshield washer

Backiit, easy to reach, switch panel with racker switches
motnted on door control

Left-side overhead latching and lockable driver's storage
compartmert

Manual “glide-type” ottward opening door

Tilt steering wheel

ar appfoved for pnntmg In keepmg W|th 1ts po}tcy of conti
mentand features showr ‘

e
T

Static rcof«mounted vent {noncfosing typa) in ﬁrst body

section

«  Fresh airintake (below windshield level}

+ 1/2"exterior-grade plyweod subfloor under entire
passenger area provides thermal and acoustic insulation

»  Stepwell entrance light

«  Spht-sash, clear and terpered windows

« Driver's window and door glass tinted

+ Single row, interior dome lights

«  Full acoustic headlining

- Fuli bedy insulation including roof and side bows

+ Body mounted on an energy absorbing isolator system

- Electric heated and remote mirsors

+  Electronic speed control

- Battery comnpartment, skirt mounted in roflout tray

« Aliweather air condigioning system front & reas

- Laminated safety glass

+  Exterior rub rails at bottorn skirting

- Dedicated door and wheelchair ift for special-needs
passengers

- Recessed wheelchair securements

«  Electric power entrance door

+ LEDlights

+ UCRA (latch) attachments and child restraints seats

. Three point seat beit seats with lap and shoulder harness

- Track seating

« Tinted Glass

Headroom | 74°
Width Exterior | 96"
Width Interior | 90 3/4"
SkirtLength | 127
Overall Length | 266"
Overall Height | 120"
Wheelbase | 158"
GVWR | 14,050 1b.
Telephone: Direct Parts:
724-888-2472 1-800-323-1455

5374 William Fiynn Hwy., Gibsonia, PA 15044-8650
Printed in U.S.A.



Capacity

Floor

Exterior Width
Interior Width
Aisle Width

Skirt Length
Interior Headroom
Overall Height
Wheelbase
FuelTank
Entrance Door

Muitiple floor plans available with
standard seating and wheelchair
accessible models;
passenger seating up to 30
Optional Fiat Floor

96"

90 3/4”

Varies by floor plan

127

747 standard

1o

139"and 159"

33-gallon between frame rails
26.5"wide x 76.6" high / double “fulf

view" outward opening

Rear Door
Transmission
Engine
Tire Size

Wheels

Brakes
Suspension
Front Axie
Rear Axle

GVWR

*Optional items Available

1571
i%

-

L
T ¥
e

Automatic withoverdrive -

60liter, gasoline V-8
6.6 liter, Durarmax V-8 Turbo diesel*
(T225/75R/16D steel befted, raclial tires
Dualrear, single front

Heavy-duty disc, front and rear power
brakes with ABS

Indlependent coil springs front,

leaf springs rear

46001b.

86001b.

1230016

BLUE BIRD



Heavy duty shock absorbers, front and rear

Easy riding suspension {independent coll springs on

front, leaf-type springs on rear)

«+  Rear bumper is chassis frame mounted: 16" high, one
piece 3/16" steel die formed 9 degree flange, top and
bottorm; 14" wrap around each side

«+  Body is mounted to chassis using heavy-duty energy-
absorbing rubber isolator systern to reduce vibration,
axtend vehicle life, and provide a quiet, smooth ride

+  Durable, corrosior-resistant aluminum used for stepwelf,
under floor body panel, interior and exterior side body
panels and roof panels

«  Back of bus is corosion-resistant electro-deposited coated
steel

«  1/2"exterior-grade plywood sub-floor over aluminum with
14-gauge steel frame

- Al bady parts are thoroughly rust-proofed after fabrication
and before assembly

+  Entire underbody (hody skirt and floor) is undercoated
before mounting

- Exterior surfaces are painted with OEM heat-cured
polyurethane

+ 1/8"Smooth black rubber flooring, 3/16” ribbed rubber
aiste with aluminuzn aisle trim and galvanized steel cove
moiding

- Interior wheel housings covered with rubber

+ Goodyear Hi-Miler heater hose with constant torque clamps
when rear heater ordered

- The Micro Bird meets or exceeds all requirements of Federal Motor Vehicle
i afety Standards (FIYSS) and Canadian Motor Vehicle Safety Standards
'{CMVSS) for joint strength and rolf over safety,

4-wheel anti-ock brakes

Halogen daytime running Irghts

Driver’s retractable lap and shoulder be[t

Driver's door réinforced for impact protection

265" 76.6” double“full view” outward-opening
entrance door vith 1,335 squaré-inch clgar«temgqered,

Automatlc resettmg cgrcust breakers for body wiring :

+ Clear and tempered glass, split-sash wmdows with
easy 1o service latches

+ Grease fittings on rear emergency door hinges

-+ Easy-opening, outward opening entrance door; features
long-lasting, oil-mpregnated, bronze pivotal bearings

+ Bodywiring is encased in "easy to access” aluminum

meolding above passenger windows

-+ Unitized construction

- 16-gauge steek, hat-shaped side posts and roof bows
+ Rigid 16-gauge internal channel stee! headers above
wincows

Amassive 16-gauge internai continuous side plate of steel
arrnor above and below flcor line

- Riveted and welded construction

Three full-length exterior side rub rails {black)

127 alurminurn side body skirt (167 for fiat floar)

-+ Smooth, hardened aluminum exterior side panels

+  Interior aluminum parels

-+ 14-gauge steel floor frame

+ Power steering

"« Large, easy to read ifluminated gauges

- Adjustabie semi-bucket driver’s seat

+  Auto-retracting driver’s seat belt

»  Adjustable sun visor ‘

+  Large 423 square-inch, right-front “driver assist” window
for improved field of vision: {focated on quarter panetin
front of entrance door)

+ Intermittent electric windshield wipers

«  Electric windshieid washer

»  Bacilit, easy to reach, switch panel with rocker switches

" mounted on door control

v Leftside overhead latching and lockable driver’s storage

compartment
- Manual “glide-type“outward opening doos

approved for’ r;n&mg “- Inn keepmg wnth lts pohcy of conti
i d fi

. 1/ exterior- ~grade plywood subfloor under entire 0
passenger area provides thermal and acoustic insutation

»  Stepweli entrance light

« Splitsash, clear and tempered windows

+  Single row, interior dome lights

« Full acoustic headlining

«  Fuli body insulation inciuding roof and side bows

«  Body mounted on an energy absorbing isclator system

» 6.6 liter Duramax V-8 Turbo diesel engine

+  Electric heated and remote mirtors

+ Electronic speed control

« Tilt steering wheei

«  Battery compartment, skirt mounted in rollout tray

« Al weather air conditioning systern front & rear

+ Laminated safety glass

- Exterior rub rails at bottom skirting

+  Dedicated door and wheelchair lift for special-needs
passengers

+  Recessed wheelchair securements

«  Eectric power entrance door

+ LEDlights

«  UCRA {latch) attachments and child restraints seats

+  Three point seat belt seats with lap and shoulder harness

« Track seating

« Tinted Glass

« Hatfloor, front torear

74"

26"

20 3/4"
127

2317~ 266"
110"

139 159"
12,300 b,

Direct Parts:
1-800-323-1455

Headroom
Width Exterior
Width interior

Skirt Length
QOverall Length
Qverall Height

Wheelbase

GVWR

Telephone:
724-898-2472

5374 Wllham Flyrm Hwy., Gibsonia, PA 15044-9650
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