State of West Virginia Request for === =]

Department of Administration  Quotation FUELHDO9 1
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Chatleston, WV 25305-0130

— *709014845 304-636-2600
GUTTMAN OIL CCOMPANY
PO BOX 1728

SR ADDRESS.CORAESPONDENCE TG ATTENTION-OF
TO ANN ADKINS
B04-558-8802

ALL STATE AGENCIES
{ AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS
| VARTCUS LOCALES AS INDICATED

ELKINS WV 26241 BY ORDER

AN, AL
08/28/2008 NET 30 DAYS DESTINATION PREPATID
BiD OPENING DATE: 09/23/2008 BID OPENING TIME 01:30PM

REQUERT FOR QUOTATION

BLANKET OPENFEND STATEWIDE CONTRACT TO{ SUPPLY
DIESEL AND HEATINGG FUEL FOR ALL WEST VIRGINIA STATE
AGENCIES AND| POLITICAL| SUBDIVISIONS.

VENDORS SHALL USE| THE ATTACHED "FUELHDOY9 PRICING PAGE"
O ENTER THE[ER QUOTATION. AN ELECTRON[IC VERSTION

DF FUELHD0OS2 PRICING PAGE CAN BE FOUND AT:

NWW.STATE ., WV| US/ADMIN/PURCHASE /NEWBUL. HTM

BIDDERS ARE REQUESTED THAT IN ADDITION|TO THE
REQUIRED PAPER BID THAT AN ELECTRONIC VERSION BE
SUBMITTED WITH THEIR BID. VENDORS SHALL NOT E-MAIL
THE ELECTRONIC COPY. [N THE EVENT THE| PAPER BID AND
THE ELECTRON[C BIP COPY DO NOT MATCH, THE PAPER

BID SHALIL PREVAIL|

BRAEREEREREREREREERE R IR AFEIA XA IR AR AT A AR AN F XAk bbb edk®

A PRE-BID MEETING| WILL| BE HELD ON SEPTEMBER 9, 2008 AT
10:30 AM IN THE PURCHABING DIVISION CONFERENCE ROOM
LOCATED AT 2019 WASHIN{GGTON STREET E., (HARLESTON,WV

5305,
*p*x*THILS MEETING IS NOT MANDATORY***%*

FhAhkhkdhkhkhkhkhkhkdrhrdhprithhbhkhhhhkhkhkhhdh b kb hprrrhdhdrhdddrdrdrasx

—QUESTIONS-SHALL-BE-ACCEPTED -THROUGH -CLESE- OF-BUSINESS e i
D9/08/2008. | QUESTIONS|MAY BE SENT VIA|USPS, FAX,
COURIER OR EMAIL.| IN QRDER TO ASSURE NO VENDOR
RECEIVES AN UNFAIR ADVANTAGE, NOC SUBSTANTIVE QUESTIONS
WILL BE ANSWERED QRALLY., IF POSSIBLE, |E-MAIL
DUESTIONS ARE PREFERRED.
ADDRESS INQUEIRES TO:

T

T 860-296-5823 e 9.92-08

SIGNATURE - —
\t*-/%éé&%ﬁﬁi?gﬂuééﬁgfr—
ﬂn%ﬂﬂﬁﬂiiﬁﬁﬂﬁAGER N 50956510 ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR’




GENERAL TERMS & CONDITIONS
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION (RFQ) AND REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL (RFP)

1. Awards will be made in the best interest of the State of West Virginta.
2, The State may accept or reject in part, or in whole, any bid.
3. All quotations are governed by the West Virginia Code and the Legislative Rules of the Purchasing Division.

4. Prior to any award, the apparent successful vendor must be propetly registered with the Purchasing Division
and have paid the required $125 fee.

5. Al services performed or goods delivered under State Purchase Order/Contracts are to be continued for the
term of the Purchase Order/Contracts, contingent upon funds being appropriated by the Legislature or otherwise
being made available. In the event funds are not appropriated or otherwise available for these services or

goods, this Purchase Order/Contract becomes void and of no effect afier June 30.

6. Payment may only be made after the delivery and acceptance of goods or services.

7. Interest may be paid for late payment in accordance with the West Virginia Code.

8. Vendor preference will be granted upon written request in accordance with the West Virginia Code.

9. The State of West Virginia is exempt from federal and state taxes and will not pay or reimburse such taxes.

10. The Director of Purchasing may cancel any Purchase Order/Contract upon 30 days written notice to the seller.

11. The laws of the State of West Virginia and the Legislative Rules of the Purchasing Division shall govern
ali rights and duties under the Confract, including without limitation the validity of this Purchase

Order/Contract.

12. Any reference to automatic renewal is hareby deleted. The Contract may be renewed only upon mutual written
agreement of the parties.

13. BANKRUPTCY: In the event the vendor/contractor files for bankrupicy protection, this Contract may be
deemed null and void, and terminated without further order.

14. HIPAA BUSINESS ASSOCIATE ADDENDUM: The West Virginia State Government HIPAA Business Associate
Addendum (BAA), approved by the Attorney General, and available online at the Purchasing Division's web site
(hitp://www.state.wv.us/admin/purchase/vrc/hipaa.htm) is hereby made part of the agreement. Provided that,
the Agency meets the definition of a Cover Entity (45 CFR §160.103) and will be disclosing Protected Health

information {45 CFR §160.103) to the vendor.

15. WEST VIRGINIA ALCOHOL & DRUG-FREE WORKPLAGE ACT: If this Coniract constitutes a public improvement
construction contract as set forth in Article 1D, Chapter 21 of the West Virginia Code ("The West Virginia Alcohol
and Drug-Free Workplace Act’), then the following language shall hereby become part of this Contract: "The
contractor and its subcontractors shall implement and maintain a written drug-free workplace policy in compliance
with the West Virginia Alcohol and Drug-Free Workplace Act, as set forth in Article 1D, Chapter 21 of the West
Virginia Code. The contractor and ifs subconfractors shall provide a sworn statement in writing, under the
penalties of perjury, that they mainfain a valid drug-free work place policy in compliance with the West Virginia
and Drug-Free Workplace Act. It is understood and agreed that this Confract shall be cancelled by the awarding
authority. if the Contractor: 1) Fails to implement its drug-free workplace policy; 2) Fails to provide information
regarding implementation of the contractor's drug-free workplace policy at the request of the public authority; or
3} Provides to the public authority false information regarding the contractor's drug-free workplace policy." .

INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS

1. Use the quotation forms provided by the Purchasing Division.

2. SPECIFICATIONS: ltems offered must be in compliance with the specifications. Any deviation from the
specifications must be clearly indicated by the bidder. Allernates offered by the bidder as EQUAL to the
specificaions must be clearly defined. A bidder offering an alternate should attach complete specifications
and literature to the bid. The Purchasing Division may waive minor deviations to specifications.

3. Complete all sections of the quotation form.

4. Unit prices shall prevail in case of discrepancy. _

5. Al quotations are considered F.O.B. destination unless alternate shipping terms are clearly identified in the
quotation.

6. BID SUBMISSION: All quotations must be delivered by the bidder to the office listed below prior to the date and time
of the bid opening. Failure of the bidder to deliver the quotations on time will result in bid disqualifications:
Department of Administration, Purchasing Division, 2019 Washington Street East, P.O. Box 50130,

Charleston, WV 25305-0130

Rev. 7/01/08
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BY ORDER
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State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

*705014845 304-636-2600
GUTTMAN OIL COMPANY
PC BOX 1728

ELKINS WV 26241

Request for &
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g0 ADKINS
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AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS
VARTIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
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08/28/2008
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LISTED IN THE REQUISITION ARE
APPROXTIMATIONS ONLY, BASED ON ESTIMATERS
IT IS UNDERS{OOD AND AGREED
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State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

Request for
Quotation

I RAFQ NUNMBER:
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2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130
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JO ANN ADKINS
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VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
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GUTTMAN OIL COMPANY

PO BOX 1728

ELKINS WV

26241

State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
2019 Washingion Street East
Post Office Box 50130
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BiD OPENING DATE: 09/23/2008 BID OPENING TIME 01:30PM

BASED UPCN 2]
ALL, PRICE AD
A MANNER ACC
GOVERNMENTAL
PUBLISHED PR
SHOULD BE RE
PURCHASING A
DATE OF THE
PRICE ADJUSTI
ACCEPT THE P
ACCORDINGLY

AND CANCEL TI

PREFERRED TE]
THE PRICES O]
FTRM FOR LIF
DF CONTRACT
(6) MONTHS.

EXHIBIT 4

LOCAL GOVERNI
I[N THE BID H
AND CONDITIO]
AND OTHER LO

TO POLITICAL
VIRGINIA. I
PRICES, TERM
POLITICAL SUj
CLEARTLY INDI
SHALL NOT PRI
MANNER.

REV. 3/88

N ACT
TUSTM
EDPTAB
BENC
ICE L
CEIVE
T LEA
INCRE]
MENT,
RICE |
DR RE
HE CO}

RMS :

N THT
. OF
CLAUS

*

MENT

[S RE
NS OF
AL G
FSUBE:
THE
5, AN]
BOTVI
CATE

EJUDT

—
B

JAI: D
ENT R
LE TO
H MAR
LSTS.
D IN ]
ST 30
ASE .

THE

ADJUS
JECT

NTRAC

by

5 CON]
'HE C
;. CON

EODIE

FUSAL
THE

DVERN]
EV TS
VEND
D CONI
BIONS
SUCH

"E TH

BID TO COUNTY, S

REFUSATL

EQUESTS MUST BE

SUCH REQUESTS
WRITING BY THE D
DAYS IN ADVANCE

PURCHASING DIVIS

r.

FRACT ARE
DNTRACT, AS INDI

-

S UNLESS THE
TO EXTEND THE P}

MENT BODIES, THE
DNS-OF - THE-STATE
PR DOES NOT WISH
DITIONS

i)
]

AWARD OF THIS

DLLAR FIGURE, NOT A PERCENTAGE.
SUBSTANTIATED IN
THE DIRECTOR PURCHASING, E.G.
KS, GENERAL MARKET INCREASE,

FOR AND INCREASE
TRECTOR QF

OF THE EFFECTIVE

ITS ENTIRETY

TERMS,

BID SHALL EXT

O_F___WEST__ SR -

TC EXTEND THE

OF THE BID TC ALL

OF THE STATE, THE VENDOR MUST
IN HIS BID.
CONTRACT IN ANY

SUCH REFU

ANY TIME THE VENDOR REQUESTS A
TON MAY EITHER
IMENT AND AMEND THE CONTRACT

THE ADUSTMENT IN

CATED IN THE LIFE
FAINED HEREIN, NQT TO EXCEED SIX

VENDOR INDICATES
RICES,
"HOOL, MUNICIPAL

END

SAL

EE REVERSE SIOE FOR TERNS AND CONDITIONS

TELEPHONE

800-296-5823

DATE

9-22-08

TITLE -

B

MANAGER

Q}GI\TTURE | )\W M / M

FEIN
25-0956510

ADDRESS CHANGES TC BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE A3BOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'




State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East
Past Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

*709014845
GUTTMAN OIL COMPANY
PO BOX 1728

304-636-2600

Request for ¢
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State of West Virginia Request for & “RFQNUMBER =0
Department of Administration Quotation FUELUDO9 7
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130

Charleston, WV 25305-0130 JO ANN ADKINS
B04-558-8802

*708014845 304-636~2600
GUTTMAN OIL COMPANY
PO BOX 1728

ALL STATE AGENCIES

AND POLITICAI: SUBDIVISIONS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER

ELKINS WV 26241

08/28/2008 - NET 30 DAYS BEST WAY DESTINATION PREPAID
BID OPENING DATE: 09/23/2008 BID OPENING TIME 01-:30PM
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State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

*709014845
GUTTMAN O1L COMPANY
PO BOX 1728

ELKINS WV 26241
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DR FALSE SWEARING (WEST VIRGINIA
EREBY CERTIFIES THAT THIS

D ACCURATE IN ALIL RESPECTS; 2AND
[SSUED TC BIDDER{AND IF ANYTHING
CERTIFICATE CHANGES DURING THE
BIDDER WILL NOTIFY THE

WRITING IMMEDIATELY.

DATE:

pIGNED:
\

TITLE

N OF PREFERENCE

¥ CHECK ANY FOMBINATIO]

FONS IDERATION ( s)

EE REVERSE SIDEFOR TERMSAND CONDITIONS 5

DATE

T 0-296-5823

9-22-08

S iip T Jellt
R / FEIN

L
MANAGER

25-0956510

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'




*70

PO

ELKINS WV

Purchasing Division

Post Office Box 5013

5014845
BOX 1728

26241

State of West Virginia
Department of Administration

2019 Washington Sireet East

0

Charleston, WV 25305-0130

304-636-2600
GUTTMAN OIL COMPANY

Request for 1
Quotation

- REQNUMBER: =2

FUELHDO®

304-558-8802

JO ANN ADKINS

BY ORDER

ALL STATE AGENCIES
AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED

AT _ 7% -
08/28/2008 NET 30 DAYS BEST WAY DESTINATION PREPATD
BID OPENING DATE! 09/23/2008 BID QPENING TIME L:30PM

ARE ENTITLED

OR
TO R]
MAXIMUM 5% PREFER]
REV. 12/00)

[N EITHER "A[

A SIGNED BID|MUST
DEPARTMENT O
PURCHASING D
BUILDING 15

2012 WABHING]
CHARLESTON, |

THE BID SHOULL CCj
THE ENVELOPE| OR TI

SEATLED BID

L VISION

WV 2p305-0130

NTAIN

rON STREET, EAST

TH1S INFORMATICI
HE BID MAY NOT BE CON$IDERED:

'B", OR BOTH "A" AND [B" WHICH YOU
CCEIVE.  YOU MAY REQUEST UP TO THE
ENCE FOR BOTH "A" AND|"B".

NOTICE

BE SUBMITTED TO:
" ADMINISTRATION o~

PLEASE PROVT]

AX NUMBER IN CASE IT

BUYER:
RFQ. NO.: FUELO9
BID OPENING DATE: 09/23/2008
BID OPENING TIME: 1:30PM

N ON THE FACE OF

IS NECESSARY

FILE 42

T i [l

TELEPHONE

800-296-5823

9-22-08

[FITLE~, i

MANAGER

FEIN
25-0956510

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED AROVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'




*709014845

ELKINS WV

State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

304-636-2600

GUTTMAN OIL CCOMPANY
PO BOX 1728

26241

Request for
Quotation

FUELHD 0 9 10

TACDRESS CORRESPONBENCE TOATIEN ON O T

JO ANN ADKINS
B04-558-8802

ALL STATE AGENCIES

AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS
VARTIQOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER

08/28/2008

NET 30 DAYS

AE
PREPATD

DESTINATION

BID OPENING DATE:

09/23/2008

BID OPENING TIME 01:30PM

Fxxkkk

'O CONTACT YDU REGARDING YOUR BID:

(304) 636-$133

CONTACT PERSQON (PLEASE| PRINT CLEARLY) :

THIS| IS THE END OF RFQ

FUELHIPOS *#**%*x*% TOTAL:

SIGNATURE

it 2 /Jﬂﬁf?{—

DATE

TELE””§?)0-296-5823 9-22-08

e \CH‘HJANAGER

25-0956510

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'




State of West Virginia
Depariment of Administration
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

*709014845 304-636-2600
GUTTMAN OIL COMPANY
PO BOX 1728

Request for
Quotation

FUELHDO®

Sl ADDRESS CORRESFONDENGE TO ATTENTON-OF -
JO ANN ADKINS
304-558-8802

ALL STATE AGENCIES
AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED

ELKINS WV 262241

BY ORDER

09/08/2008

NET 30 DAYS

BEST WAY

DESTINATION

PREPATD

BID OPENING DATE: 09/23/2008

BID

QOPENING TIME

01:30PM

khkkRRRERRkRATA )T hhh*®

L. QUESTION PERIO]
BUSINESS SEPTEI]
QUESTIONS|WILL

2. ADDENDUM ACKNOI]
DOCUMENT ESHOUL)]
BID. FAILURE ]
DISQUALIFICATI

EXHIBIT 19

FR*XERF K *** Kk **EN]

k%% x * ADDENDUM NO. L1¥%f¥#%
D HAS|BEEN EXTENDED T¢ CL
MBER 11, 2008. NO ADDITI
BE ACCEPTED AFTER THAT T

NLEDGEMENT IS ATTACHED.

D BE SIGNED AND RETURNED
ro SIEN AND RETURN MAY RE
DN OF| YOUR BID.

"

Lkxkdkxk

D OF ADDENDUM NO.

kXRARIAAIkkRREE

OSE OF
ONAL
IME.

THIS

WITH YOUR
SULT IN

khkkkkXxkhkkhhdk

EE ;R'ﬁVEF(SE SIDECORTERMSAND CONDITIGN

SIGNATURE

NMW /M&L'#‘L

= 00-296-5823

DATE

9-22-08

FEIN

TITL
O R RANCH MARAGER

25-0956510

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOCR'




State of West Virginia Request for
Department of Administration  Quotation
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street E£ast

Post Office Box 50130

Charleston, WV 25305-0130

*709014845 304-636-2600
GUTTMAN OIL. COMPANY
PO BOX 1728

JO ANN ADKINS
304-558-8802

ALL STATE AGENCIES
AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED

ELKINS WV 26241 BY ORDER

; : Fi i
09/10/2008 NET 30 DAYS BEST WAY DESTINATION PREPAID .
BID OPENING DATE: 09/23/2008 - BID OPENING TIME 01:30PM

ok Ak *Ek*kkF XXX ADDENDIM NO. 2 *ckkkhhkhhhdhhdahkhrhhdts
L. TO REPLACE THE| TEAM] RVP WITH THE ATTACHED FORM.

kA X AKK KX KKK K F AR *END OF| ADDENDUM NO. 2%k *xxx ks skhhdkdkkk

&GMHWE N ;Z P /ikﬂzzuxf;;;f THEN§86-296;5823 DATE 9-22-08
TITLE %RANGH—#{ANAGER FEN 950956510 ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE
WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'




 Rev. 107 State of West Virginia
VENDOR PREFERENCE CERTIFICATE

Certification and application* is hereby made for Preference in accordance with West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37. (Does not apply o
construction contracts). West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37, provides an opportunity for qualifying vendors to request (at the time of bid)
preference for their residency status. Such preference is an evaluation method only and will be applied only to the cost bid in
accordance with the West Virginia Code. This certificate for application is to be used to request such preference. The Purchasing
Division will make the determination of the Resident Vendor Preference, if applicable.

1. Application is made for 2.5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is an individual resident vendor and has resided continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preced-
ing the date of this certification; or,

Bidder is a partnership, association or corporation resident vendor and has maintained its headquarters or principai place of
business continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or 80% of the
ownership interest of Bidder is held by another individual, partnership, association or corporation resident vendor who has
maintained its headquarters or principal place of business continuously in West Virginia for four {4) years immediately
preceding the date of this certification; or,

Bidder is a nonresident vendor which has an affiliate or subsidiary which employs a minimum of one hundred state residents
and which has maintained its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia continuously for the four (4)
years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or,

2. Application is made for 2.5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:

XXX  Bidderis a resident vendor who certifies that, during the fife of the contract, on average at least 75% of the employees
working on the project being bid are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two years
immediately precading submission of this bid; or,

3. Application is made for 2.5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is a nonresident vendor employing a minimum of one hundred state residents or is a nonresident vendor with an
affiliate or subsidiary which maintains its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia employing a
minimum of one hundred state residents who certifies that, during the life of the contract, on average at least 75% of the
employees or Bidder's affiliate’s or subsidiary's employees are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state
continuously for the two years immediately preceding submission of this bid; or,

Application is made for 5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:
Bidder meets either the requirement of both subdivisions (1) and (2) or subdivision {1} and (3) as stated above; or,

4

5. Application is made for 3.5% resident vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked:
Bidder is an individual resident vendorwho is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves orthe National Guard
and has resided in West Virginia continucusly for the four years immediately preceding the date on which the bid is
submitted; or,

6. Application is made for 3.5% resident vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked:

Bidder is a resident vendor who is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard, if, for
purposes of producing or distributing the commodities or compieting the project which is the subject of the vendor's bid and
continuously over the entire term of the project, on average at least seventy-five percent of the vendor's employees are
residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two immediately preceding years.

Bidder understands if the Secretary of Revenue determines that a Bidder receiving preference has failed to continue to meet the
requirements for such preference, the Secretary may order the Director of Purchasing to: (a) reject the bid; or (b) assess a penalty
against such Bidder in an amount not to exceed 5% of the bid amount and that such penaity will be paid to the contracting agency
or deducted from any unpaid balance on the contract or purchase order.

By subimission of this certifi cate Bidder agrees | to disclose any reasonably requested information 10 the Purchasing Division and

the required business taxes, provided that such information does not contain the amounts of taxes paid nor any cther information
deeimed by the Tax Commissioner to be confidential.

Under penalty of law for false swearing (West Virginia Code, §61-8-3), Bidder hereby certifies that this certificate is true
and accurate in all respects; and that if a contract is issued to Bidder and if anything contained within this certificate
changes during the term of the contract, Bidder will notify the Purtﬁslng Division inriting imme

/N

/mﬁwf—

Bidder: GUTTMAN OII COMPANY Signed:

Date: 9-22-08 itles MANAGER

*Check any combination of preference consideration(s) in either "A” or “B', or both "A” and "8” which you are entitled fo receive. You may request up fo the
maximum of 5% preference for both "A” and "B”.




State of West Virginia Request for
Depariment of Administration  Quotation
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East
Past Office Box 50130

. Charleston, WV 25305-0130

Jo ANN ADKINS
B04£-558-8802

*¥709014845 304-636-2600
GUTTMAN OIL COMPANY
PO BOX 1728

ATL STATE AGENCIES
AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED

ELKINS WV 26241 BY ORDER

09/ 17/ 2008 NET 30 DAYS BEST WAY DESTTINATTON PREPATD
BID OPENING DATE: - 09/23/2008 BID OPENING TIME 01:30PM

HAKERRRKRERRR AR A AR *FAADDENDUM NO. 3% *dk*phkhhxddFdhhbhhtddk

FUELHDOS BPECIFICATIONS, REVISED, DATED 0%/15/2008.
FUELHD09 PRICING/INFORMATION PAGES,| REVISED.
FUELO9/FUELHDOP QUESTIONS AND ANSWERS.

MANDATORY| PRE-BID SIGN-IN SHEETS ATTACHED.

REMOVING EXHIBIT 6 |- PRICE ADJUSTMENT PROVISION.
LOCATED ON PAGE 4 OF THE ORIGINAL REQUEST FOR
QUOTATION].

U W H

kEkkkE R kXX XX FFXFEND OF LRDDENDUM NO. I**prdddkhxdhkkhhkkkk*x

000Gl LS 1 05-09
- T
DIESEL AND HEATING FUELS

o ‘SEEBEVERSE SIDE. TERMS ANDCONDITIC

Xas ety /Aﬂﬁ?‘" - 2965823 " 99008
MANAGFR FEIN 25-0956510 ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE
WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'

SIGNATURE




State of Wesi Virginia Request fOI‘ 25 ~REG-NUMBERE: = o PAG
Department of Administration Quotation FUELHDO9 1
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East
Past Office Box 50130

Charleston, WV 25305-0130 70 ANN ADKINS
304-558-8802

*709014845 304-636-2600
GUTTMAN OIIL. COMPANY
PO BOX 1728

ALL STATE AGENCIES
AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED

ELKINS WV 26241 BY ORDER

09/18/2008 NET 30 DAYS BEST WAY DESTINATION -
BID OPENING DATE: 09/23/2008 BTD OPENING TIME

REkkkFX*kkhkhhkhkxkxxpx*ADDENDUM NO. 4d*%kkfhkhdkhhhrhhhkdhkrdh®

1. FUELEDOS REVISED SPECIFICATIONS ATTA[CHED.

HxXkRF AR AKX A AE A A4 4*END OF ADDENDUM NO. 4k **kxddxddxhxrdx

SIGNATURE W g :// / QW 'TELEPH°§60;296-5823 i 9-22-08

TiLe m MANAGER N e 0956510 ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE
WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'




EXHIBIT 10

ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT

I HEREBY ACKNOWLEDGE RECEIPT OF THE FOLLOWING CHECKED
ADDENDUM(S) AND HAVE MADE THE NECESSARY REVISIONS TO MY
PROPOSAL, PLANS AND/OR SPECIFICATION, ETC.

ADDENDUM NO.'S:

NO. 5 ........

I UNDERSTAND THAT FAILURE TO CONFIRM THE RECEIPT OF THE
ADDENDUM(S) MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF BIDS. VENDOR
MUST CLEARLY UNDERSTAND THAT ANY VERBAL
REPRESENTATION MADE OR ASSUMED TO BE MADE DURING ANY
ORAL DISCUSSION HELD BETWEEN VENDOR'S REPRESENTATIVES
AND ANY STATE PERSONNEL IS NOT BINDING. ONLY THE
INFORMATION ISSUED IN WRITING AND ADDED TO THE
SPECIFICATIONS BY AN OFFICIAL ADDENDUM IS BINDING.

SIGNATURE

COMPANY

e 9-22-08

DATE

REV. 11/96




FUELHDO0@ Pricing/information Pages

Vendor: Guitman Oil Company, Elkins WV

DISTRICT

TYPE OF FUEL:

ESTIMATED Needs: -

FIRM MARKUP PRICE PER

FIRM MARKUP PRICE PER

Galions 6 mo. GALLON: T/W GALLON: T/
ONE #1 Diesel/Kerosene 20,000 NO BID NC BID
ONE #2 Digsel 225,000 0.2523 0.1871
ONE #2 Diese/Winter Additive 1,000 0.3023 0.2371
ONE #1Heating/Kerosene 5,000 NO BID NO BID
ONE #2 Heating 1,000 0.3023 0.2371
TWO #1 Digsel/Kerosene 20,000 NO BID 0.2669
TWO #2 Diesel 150,000 NO BID 0.2169
T™WO #2 Diesel/Winter Additive 1,000 NO BID 0.2669
TWO #1Heating/Kerosene 10,000 NO BID 0.2669
TWO #2 Heating 1,600 NO BID 0.2669
THREE #1 Diesel/Kerosene 20,000 NO BID 0.2505
THREE #2 Diesel 240,000 NO BID 0.2005
THREE #2 Diesel/Winter Additive 1,000 NO BID 0.2505
THREE #1Heating/Keroseng 1,000 NO BID {.2505
THREE #2 Heating 1,000 NO BiD {.2505
FOUR #1 Diesel/Kerosene 45,000 0.3601 {.2885
FOUR #2 Diesel 275,000 0.3101 0.2385
FOUR #2 Diesel/Winter Additive 1,000 0.3601 0.2885
FOUR #1Heating/Kerosene 10,000 0.3801 0.2885
FOUR #2 Heating 1,000 0.3601 0.2885
FIVE #1 Diesel/Kerosene 30,000 0.3704 0.2700
FIVE #2 Diesel 185,000 0.3204 0.2200
FIVE #2 Diesel/Winter Additive 1,000 0.2704 0.2700
FIVE #1Heating/Kerosene 5,000 0.3704 0.2700
FIVE #2 Heating 16,600 0.3704 0.2700
SIX #1 Diesel/Kerosene 40,000 NO BID 0.2434
SIX #2 Digsel 140,000 NO BID 0.1984
SIX #2 Diesel/Winter Additive 1,000 NO BID 0.2484
SIX #1Heating/Kerosene 1,000 NO BID 0.2484
SIX #2 Heating 1,000 NO BID 0.2484
SEVEN #1 Diesel/Kerosene 35,000 0.3632 0.2741
SEVEN #2 Diesel 245,000 0.3132 0.2241
SEVEN #2 Dissel/Winter Additive 1,000 0.3632 0.2741
SEVEN #1Heating/Kerosene 1,000 0.3632 0.2741
SEVEN #2 Heating 1,000 0.3632 0.2741
EIGHT #1 Diesel/Kerosene 30,000 (.3848 0.2806
EIGHT #2 Diesel 185,000 0.3348 0.2406
EIGHT #2 Diesel/Winier Additive 1,000 0.3848 0.2906
EIGHT #1Heating/Kerosene 15,000 0.3848 0.2906
EIGHT #2 Heating 1,000 0.3848 {.2406

Page 1 of 2




FUELHDO9 Pricing/Infermation Pages

Vendor: Guttman Qil Company, Elking WV

ESTIMATED Needs: -

FIRM MARKUP PRICE PER

FIRM MARKUP PRICE PER

DISTRICT TYPE OF FUEL: Gallons 8 mo. GALLON: T/ GALLON: TfT
NINE #1 Diesel/Keroseng 30,000 0.3642 0.2731
NINE #2 Diesel 225,000 0.3142 0.2231
NINE #2 Diesel/Winter Additive 1,000 0.3642 0.2731
NINE #1Heating/Kerosene 1,000 0.3642 0.2731
NINE #2 Heating 5,000 0.3642 0.2731
TEN #1 Diasel/Karosene 2,000 NC BID 0.2937
TEN #2 Diesel 175,000 NO BID 0.2437
TEN #2 Diesel/Winter Additive 1,000 NO BID 0.2937
TEN #1Heating/Kerosene 1,000 NO BID 0.2937
TEN #2 Heating 1,000 NO BID 0.2937
Minimum Gallonage for T/T Diesel & Heating Qil: 7500
Deliver gasoline and distillates on the same T/T Load? Yes XOXXXX
2 locations max within 20
Able to split deliveries between multiple locations? Yes mile promimity
Emergency Fee (Upcharge): $ 750.00
Fax Number: 304-636-8133

Contract Coordinator: Darroll Talbott, Virginia Dumire

Phone Number:

800-296-5823

Email Address:|vdumire@gutimanoil.com

Signature:

Naorke

F

o,

7/23/68

Date:

~—

9/22/2008

fuel:

Submit (below) potential Terminals where vendor will be obtainin

District One

Charleston, WV; Bandy's Inc.

District Two

Ashland, KY; Bandy's Inc.

District Three

Marietta, OH; BTS Terminai

District Four

ny

District Five

Altoona PA; Petersburg Oif; Roach Energy

District Six

Pittsburgh PA; BTS Terminal

t

District Seven

Pittsburgh PA; Altoona PA; BTS Terminal; Guttman Qil Company

District Eight

Pittsburgh PA; Altoona PA; BTS Terminal; Gutiman Oit Company

District Nine

Charleston, WV; Roancke VA; Bandy's Inc.

District Ten

Page 2 of 2




