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GENERAL TERMS & CONDITIONS . :
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION (RFQ) AND REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL (RFP) g

1. Awards will be made in the best interest of the State of West Virginia.
2. The State may accept or reject in part, or in whole, any bid.
3. All quotations are governed by the West Virginia Code and the Legislative Rules of the Purchasing Division.

4. Prior to any award, the apparent successful vendor must be properly registered with the Purchasing Division
and have pald the required $125 fee.

5. All services performed or goods delivered under State Purchase Order/Contracts are to be continued for the
term of the Purchase Order/Contracts, contingent upon funds being appropriated by the Legislature or otherwise
being made available. In the svent funds are not appropriated or otherwise available for these services or
goods, this Purchase Ordar/Centract becomes void and of no effect after June 30.

6. Payment may only be made after the delivery and acceptance of goods or services.

7. Interest may be paid for late payment in accordance with the West Virginia Code.

- 8. Vendor preference will be granted upon written request in accordance with the West Virginia Code.

9. The State of West Virginia is exempt from federal and state taxes and will not pay or reimburse such taxes.

10. The Director of Purchasing may cancel any Purchase Order/Contract upon 30 days written notice to the seller.

11. The laws of the State of West Virginia and the Legislative Rules of the Purchasing Division shall govemn
all rights and duties under the Contract, including without Jimitation the validity of this Purchase

Order/Contract.

12. Any reference to automatic renewal is hereby deleted. The Contract may be renewed only upon mutual written
agreement of the parties.

13. BANKRUPTCY: . In the event the vendor/contracior files for bankruptcy protection, this Contract may be
deemed null and void, and terminated without further order.

14. HIPAA BUSINESS ASSOCIATE ADDENDUM: The West Virginia State Government HIPAA Business Associate
Addendum (BAA), approved by the Attorney General, and available online at the Purchasing Division's web site
(http:Ifwww.state.wv.us/admin/purchase/vrclhipaa.htm) is hereby made part of the agreement. Provided that,
the Agency meets the definition of a Cover Entity (45 CFR §160.1 03) and will be disclosing Protected Health

Information (45 CFR §160.103) to the vendor.

15. WEST VIRGINIA ALCOHOL & DRUG-FREE WORKPLACGE ACT: If this Contract constitutes a public improvemeant
construction confract as set forth in Article 1D, Chapter 21 of the West Virginia Code ("The West Virginia Alcohol
and Drug-Free Workplace Act"), then the following language shall hereby become part of this Conkact: "The
- contractor and its subcontractors shall implement and maintain a written drug-free workplace policy in compliance
with the West Virginia Alcohol and Drug-Free Workplace Act, as set forth in Article 1D, Chapter 21 of the West
Virginia Code. The contractor and its subcontractors shall provide a swomn statement in writing, under the
penalties of perjury, that they maintain a valid drug-free work place policy in compliance with the West Virginia
and Drug-Free Workplace Act. It is understood and agreed that this Contract shall be cancelled by the awarding
authority if the Contractor: 1) Fails to implement its drug-free workplace policy; 2) Fails to provide information
regarding implementation of the confractor's drug-free workplace policy at the request of the public authority; or
3) Provides to the public autharity false information regarding the contractor's drug-free workplace policy.”

INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS

1. Use the quotation forms provided by the Purchasing Division.

2. SPECIFICATIONS: ltems offered must be in compliance with the specifications. Any deviation from the
specifications must be clearly indicated by the bidder. Alemates offered by the bidder as EQUAL to the
specifications must be clearly defined. A bidder offering an alternate should attach complete specifications
and literature to the bid. The Purchasing Division may waive minor deviations to specifications.

3. Complete all sections of the quotation form.

4. Unit prices shall prevail in case of discrepancy. _

5. All quotations are considered F.O.B. destination unless alternate shipping terms are clearly identified in the
quotation.

6. BID SUBMISSION: All quotations must be delivered by the bidder to the office listed below prior to the date and time
of the bid opening. Failure of the bidder to deliver the quotations on time will result in bid disqualifications:
Depariment of Administration, Purchasing Division, 2019 Washington Sireet East, P.O. Box 50130,

Charleston, WV 25305-0130

Rev. 7/01/08




FUELLQ — Gasoline
Specifications —

This is a request for quotation to supply unleaded gasoline to all West
Virginia State Agencies and Political Subdivisions.

Unleaded Gasoline shall comply with the most recent ASTM D 4814:07a or
the most current edition Standard Specifications for Automotive Gasoline.

The minimum anti-knock octane for: Unleaded Gasoline: 87

The State has been divided geographically into ten regions (which are the
same as the ten DOH Districts) as follows:

Region I: Mason, Putnam, Kanawha, Clay and Boone counties.
Region II: Cabell, Wayne, Lincoln, Logan and Mingo counties.
Region III: Pleasants, Wood, Ritchie, Wirt, Calhoun, Roane, and Jackson

counties.
Region IV: Doddridge, Harrison, Marion, Taylor, Monongzalia, and Preston

counties.

Region V: Grant, Hardy, Mineral, Hampshire, Morgan, Berkeley and
Jefferson counties. :

Region VI: Tyler, Wetzel, Marshall, Ohio, Brooke and Hancock counties.
Region VII: Gilmer, Barbour, Lewis, Braxton, Upshur and Webster
counties.

Region VIII: Tucker, Randolph, Pendleton and Pocahontas counties.

Region IX: Nichoelas, Fayette, Greenbrier, Summers and Monroe counties.
Region X: Raleigh, Wyoming, McDowell and Mercer counties.

VENDOR ELIGIBILITY: Vendors must be an established refiner,
distributor or dealer for a minimum of three (3) years and must provide to
the Purchasing Division the locations of all facilities that will be delivering
to any of the ten regions within West Virginia along with a list of equipment
available to perform all the requirements of the contract. It is preferred the
required information be submitted with the bid. Failure to provide the
required information at the request of the Purchasing Division shall result in

disqualification of the bid.

(3/13/2009




FUELL0D — Gasoline
Specifications —

SAMPLING, INSPECTION, AND TESTS: Sampling, inspection and
testing shall be in accordance with Federal Specifications to obtain a fuel
which meets the detailed requirements as specified and determined by the
Division of Highways Laboratory. No allowances shall be made for any
reproducibility factors in the prescribed test methods. The supplier will
allow samples to be taken prior to discharging of product into localities
tanks. Samples will be taken without prior notices.

PRICING: The State of West Virginia will accept bids only by Region
locations. Vendors must bid a firm fixed mark-up price per gallon on fuel
delivery with product price tied to the OIL PRICE INFORMATION
SERVICE (OPIS) publication. All prices quoted shall be the delivered price
to any location within the ten regions '

Pricing will be based on the Weekly OPIS on the DA_Y OF ORDER.
The OPIS Weekly Average is posted every Friday morning.

FIRM FIXED MARK-UP PER GALLON: Vendors shall bid only a
firm fixed mark-up (percentages not acceptable) for business profit and
expenses in supplying the product to the State Agencies and Political
Subdivisions. Product cost shall be the average rack price of the products as
published (for the preceding week) for the vendor supply terminal location
in the OIL PRICE INFORMATION SERVICE as published by United
Communications Group 11300 Rockville Pike, Suite 1100, Rockville, MD.
20852.. Telephone number (800)929-4824.

Bids are requested for two pricing categories:

Tank-wagon (T/W) and Truck Transport (T/T). Vendor must indicate the

* minimum _delivery quantity for two (2) locations within 20 miles proximity
for truck transport (T/T) delivery pricing. Additionally, vendors bidding
truck transport (T/T) shall bid a fixed up-charge fee on the pricing page for
truck transport (T/T) delivery to a maximum of four (4) locations within 30

miles proximity.

03/13/2009




FUEIL10 — Gasoline
Specifications —

Irrespective of method of transport, the minimum delivery quantity shall be
800 gallons. The bid prices for one Region shall not be conditioned on the

award of any other Region.

PAYMENT: Shall be made based on the terminal fuel is puiled from.
If vendors bid multiple terminal sources, the invoice will be based on the
lowest price, or vendor shall provide proof of terminal product is pulled

from on the invoice.

TAXES: The State of West Virginia agencies are exempt from the
Federal Excise Tax, and the State Consumers Sales Tax. State of West
Virginia agencies are not exempt from State Excise Tax. West Virginia
State agencies currently pay a variable rate component of the motor fuel
excise tax on motor fuel sold or used of 11.7/cents per gallon. State
agencies also currently pay 20.50/cents per gallon for the flat rate
component of the West Virginia Excise Tax.

Any Superfund Tax must be included in the bidder’s mark-up price. The
State will not accept bids from bidders who cannot meet the above

conditions regarding taxes

AGENCY ORDERING PROCEDURE: All State Agencies and DOH
districts shall be responsible for placing orders with awarded vendors.

The Division of Highways, district locations — one (1) point of contact, per
district, shall place their orders with vendor via e-mail or telephone, when

computers are unavailable.

West Virginia State Agencies utilizing this contract must purchase an
OPIS license allowing the agency access to OPIS weekly pricing.
Contact OPIS at 888-301-2654.

Orders shall be placed Monday through Friday and utilize the published
preceding week OPIS average rack price. Pricing will be based on the
Weekly OPIS on the DAY OF ORDER.

03/13/2009




FUEL10 - Gasoline
Specifications —

Refer to the attached map of West Virginia Division of Highway’s District
areas. The listing for Division of Highways District Office locations is as

follows:

WVDOH/DISTRICT 1
1334 Smith St.
Charleston, WV 25301

WVDOH/DISTRICT 2
801 Madison Ave.
Huntington, WV 25712

WVDOH/DISTRICT 3
624 Depot St.
Parkersburg, WV 26102

WVDOH/DISTRICT 4
PO Box 4220
Clarksburg, WV 26301

WVDOH/DISTRICT 5
PO Box 99
Burlington, WV 26710

WVDOH/DISTRICT 6
1 DOT Drive
Moundsville, WV 26041

WVDOH/DISTRICT 7
PO Box 1728
Weston, WV 26452

WVDOH/DISTRICT 8
PO Box 1516
Elkins, WV 26241

WVDOH/DISTRICT 9
HC 82, Box 3-A
Lewisburg, WV 24601

03/13/2009
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FUEL10 — Gasoline
Specifications —

WVDOH/DISTRICT 10
270 Hardwood Lane
Princeton, WV 24740

VENDOR ACKNOWLEDGEMENT PROCEDURE: The vendor must
e-mail ordering agency upon receipt of order showing order received, and
giving tentative delivery information.

Since the product pricing is subject to weekly changes, the state agency is to
verify pricing information provided by OPIS. The actual price is computed

as follows:

NORMAL: Average rack price from OPIS report + State Excise Tax for
Motor Fuel (if applicable).
+ Vendors mark-up as quoted in contract
= Price per gallon delivered

DELIVERIES:  The State has sole discretion to determine Method of
Delivery, by tanker truck or tank wagon. Such Method of Delivery shall
be specified at the time of order based on the order volume. Normal use
requirements will be ordered three (3) working days in advance of the
required delivery date. Vendors SHALL complete fuel deliveries_within the
three (3) working day period of order placement. ***The three (3) working
day period shall start the next business day after placement of order, ***
Unless prior arrangements have been made, deliveries shall be made during
normal work hours (7:30 am to 3:30 pm), Monday through Friday.

A penality fee of $250 (reduction of invoice) , can be imposed for failure to
provide delivery of fuel within the three (3) working day period of order
placement, unless such delay is attributable to terminal allocations. Vendors
can submit documentation related to allocation issues to avoid the penality.

Emergency requirements or situations which cannot be scheduled in advance
will necessitate 24 hour delivery. Cost for 24 hour emergency delivery shall
be at a fixed up-charge. Vendors should enter the fixed up-charge fee on the
pricing page and submit with bid. . Deliveries shall include a legible

03/13/2009




FUEL10 - Gasoline
Specifications —

metered delivery ticket which has been processed through a meter certified
and sealed by the State of West Virginia, Division of Weights and Measures,
and stamped with quantities, location, time (a.m./p.m.) date, driver and
product. When bulk deliveries are made the driver shall stick the tank
before and after product is delivered and enter the readings onto the delivery

ticket.

A copy of the delivery ticket, signed by both the driver and a person from
the receiving facility, shall be left,(on delivery date) at the location receiving
the fuel.

Delivery tickets must include the location where delivery was made, the
product(s) delivered, the blended percentages, the number of gallons
delivered, and the rack price or prices for blended fuels.

Vendors must have the capability to deliver to above ground storage tanks
utilizing a remote fill system on the tank.

NOTE: All fuel deliveries shall be metered at the point of delivery and
shall issue a printed ticket, to meet the Division of Labor requirements:
Tanker trucks may make a delivery of a complete compartment and are
permitted to use the allocation metered ticket from the loading point for this
printed ticket. West Virginia Code 47-1-11 adopts NCWM Hand Book 130
part “Uniform Engine Fuels...Regulation”. Section 3 of that Regulation,
subparagraph 3.1.1 concerns documentation. A Bill of Lading from the
terminal source locations is acceptable and shall contain quantities, location,
time (a.m./p.m.) date, driver and product.

DELAY OR FAILURE TO DELIVER: The vendor shall not be liable
in damages for the delay of shipment or failure to deliver caused by fire,
flood, Acts of God, Acts of Government, Act of an alien enemy, or by any
other circumstances which in the opinion of the state agency is beyond the
control of the contractor. The state agency may, in its discretion purchase
the product on the market until such time product becomes available by the

supplier.

In the event the vendor is unable to drop fuel due to an error by the ordering
agency, a flat fee of $250.00 may be charged.

03/13/2009




FUEL18 - Gasoline
Specifications —

INVOICING: Vendors of DOH fuel deliveries are encouraged to utilize a
paperless invoice process, submitting the following information via e-mail to

the DOH ordering locations:

A.  Delivery ticket number(s) for fuel delivery, date and time of
delivery and DOH location of the delivery.

B.  Fuel types, total quantities, unit prices, applicable taxes, total
prices, and the terminal source of supply for all deliveries.

C.  TItisthe intent of the Division of Highways
to utilize the State Purchasing Card for all vendor
reimbursement of fuels purchased.

NOTES: Under no circumstances will the West Virginia Division of
Highways accept, or pay for, quantities of fuel in excess of the quantity
requested via the telephone or electronic order.

Government entities other than the WVDOH, utilizing this contract, must
have the option of formulating their invoicing procedures with the successful

vendors.

REPORTING REQUIREMENTS: Winning bidders shall be required to
submit quarterly reports to the Equipment Division in a format which shall
be supplied. This report shall show the quantity and cost of each product
/delivery method and the location (district) or agency to which it was
delivered; and a total of each product for each quarter. This report SHALL
also be sent to the Purchasing Division, attention: jo.a.adkins@wv.gov.

AWARD:

The award will be a single award per Region (1 through 10)/ per delivery
method. Each Region will be split into tank transport and tank wagon
pricing. Pricing will be from the source fuel was pulled from (terminal

location).

03/13/2009




FUEL10 Pricingf/information Pages

Vendor: Petroleum Products, Inc.

BISTRICT TYPE OF EUEL: ESTIMJ&L’ﬁEﬂI:eedS: - |FIRM MARKUP P_?’:EE PER GALLON: FIRM 21:55;15 PR-:-?-:_ PER
ONE __ |Unieaded Gagoline 200,000 $0.4128 $0.1975
TWO  |Unieaded Gasoline 206,000 $0.4486 $0.2044 ]
THREE_ |Unleaded Gasoline 150,000 No Bid No Bid ]
FOUR  |Unleaded Gasoline 238,000 No Bid No Bid
FIVE _ |Unieaded Gasoline 160,000 No Bid No Bid o
SIX Unleaded Gasoline 112,000 No Bid No Bid -
SEVEN |Unleaded Gasaline 206,000 No Bid No Bid B
EIGHT _|Unleaded Gasoline 138,000 No Bid No Bid ) .
NINE  |Unleaded Gasoling 168,000 No Bid No Bid
TEN _|Unleaded Gasoline 220,000 No Bid No Bid o
Minimurn Gallonage for T/T: | T 3,700
Able to split deliveries between multiple locations? Yesg X No
Mintmum Qty: T/T delivery for 2 [oclations within 20 mile proxi;'nity: 8,500 - - ]

TIT delivery for 4 locations within 30 mile proximity: {upcharge} $500.00

Emergency Fee (Upcharge)

:$95.00/hr- min. 4hr. Charge

Contract Coordinator:

David Martin

Phone Number:

304-720-7261

|304-755-3792 —

Fax Number:

Submit (below) potential Terminals where vendor will be obtaining fuel:

District 1 & 2- Charleston, WV

Fage 1 of 1



FUEL10 AND FUELHDIO
(QUESTIONS & ANSWERS

1Q

1. In the statement "Vendors SHALL complete fuel deliveries within
the three (3) working day period”, does this mean the order day is
counted as the first day or does this mean that there are 3 delivery
days following the order day?

1A

s 2 3/10/09 Pre-bid Meeting, the three
ay. count &ﬁl% hegin the next woerk day after
lacement
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2Q

2. How should the pricing be handled when an order is placed for
less than 868 gallons?

2A

If the vendor processes such an order as a FUEL1S Contract Order, the
order should not be priced any differently than Tuel orders greater
than 888 gallons. If the vendor does not wish to process the small
order 3% 3 FUEL1® Contract Order, he should so advise the individual
requesting the order, as well as advise that individual what the
pricing will be. Agency staff needs to be reminded that the less than
868 gallon orders can be purchased locally/oft contract, following
Purchasing guldelines,

3Q

3. Since gasoline and diesel are separate bids and separate awards
why is there a question about whether the vendor will be able te
deliver both on the same T/T load?

w
o>

This is possible where the same vendor is awarded both T/T gas and
T/T diesel contracts for a specitic District

4Q

4. Have the WVDOH personnel been provided adequate education and
training to be able to order multiple types of fuel for several tanks
at up to 4 locations that also fit the terminal limitations and truck

capacity limitations?

4 A

It is understandable such an order will reguire coordination between
both the agency staff and the vendor staff. The Division of Highways
staff will be educated on this coordination requirement.

5Q

5. Why was the bid from Tri-State Petroleum increased by $.86 per
gallon with change orders after the bid was awarded for FUEL8S and
FUELHD®B9?

5A

Tri-State submitted two (2) separate bids; one bid was for payment by
Credit Card, the other bid was for payment by ACH Treasury Payment
only. The difference in the unit price of these two (2) bids was the
$2.06 per unit. The RFQ stated that payment would be by the state
YISA credit card.

10




FUEL10 AND FUELID10
QUESTIONS & ANSWERS

6 Q

6. With the extreme volatility in fuel prices, has consideration
been given to product prices being based on a dally OPI5S average for
the delivery date rather than a daily average being used for an
entire week based on the order date?

6 A

yes, but it is our preference to use the weskly OPIS pricing vor the
date of order.

7Q

7. Would you please provide detailed information concerning the
requirements from VISA that allows the "WV VISA purchasing card
program” to gualify for the lowest processing and/or interchange fees
that are available?

7 A

Interchange rates are detsrmined by a number of things: (1) the type
of transaction (whether face to face, card not present, etc..}; (2)
whether the merchant passes data with that transaction (the higher
level the data passed the lower the interchange rate will be); (3) if
the merchant is signed up for Visa’s large ticket interchange rate,
it will receive a more economical rate on higher ticket transaction.
Obviously, WV can try to control how to use the card (whether face to
face, etc.), but most of the control lies with the accepting

merchant.

8 Q

8. There is a provision for allocation issues with respect to the
$250.0@ "failure to deliver within 3 days" provision of the
contract. I have trouble with there not being a provision for
weather related events or for mechanical failures. Can this be

addressed?

8 A

See answer to question 1

9 Q

9, In the event of allocation issues with cenventional

gasoline..... is an E10 Ethanol blend (87 Octane) a suitable
substitute. In the event that this would materialize....will the E16
OPIS pricing prevail as the benchmark price?

9 A

If there is no conventional gasoline available and E1@ Ethanol blend
(87 Octane) is being substituted the vendor must obtain a letter from

the terminal indicating such.

10Q

19. Where do the quarterly reports go with respect to the Division of
Highways? Previous contract only specified copies to you at
Purchasing bDivision

10A

Please send to Jim Hash at Jim.B.Hashfiwv.gov

11Q

11. Why are fuel order confirmations necessary?

order confirmations confirm the vendor received an order, and more

1A

1




FUEL10 AND FUELHDIO
(JUESTIONS & ANSWERS

importantly, the confirmations should include the vendor’s scheduled
delivery date/time, allowing the agency to insure staff are available

for the delivery.

120

Can vendors make a delivery without an agency order?

12A

No, all deliveries must be based on an agency request/order; making
an un-reguested delivery could result in an agency refusing to pay

the vendor’s invoice.

12
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DISTRICT 2

GASOLINE

HUNTINGTON HEADQUARTERS A-93 10,000 GL

304-528-5625

BARBOURSVILLE (CABELL CO.} U-92 10,000 GL

304-736-3111

WEST HAMLIN (LINCOLN CO.} A-07 5,000 GL

304-824-3434

YAWKEY (LINCOLN CG.) U-54

304-524-2511

WILKINSON (LOGAN CO.} A-01

304-792-7035

1,000 GL

5,000 GL

CHAPMANVILLE (LOGAN CC.} A-07 5,000 GL

304-792-7031

MAN (LOGAN CO.) A-07

304-583-2188

WILLIAMSON (MINGO CO.) U-92

304-235-6003

5,000 GL

10,000 GL

GILBERT STATION (MINGO CO.) A-05 5,000 GL

304-664-3191

WAYNE (WAYNE CO.)

304-272-5127

HUNTINGTON 1-64 A-05

304-528-5669

5,000 GL

5,000 GL

DIESEL

10,000 GL
5,000 GL
4,000 GL
5,000 GL
5,000 GL
5,000 GL
10,000 GL
5,000 GL
5,000 GL

5,000 GL

i5

KERQSENE

___ PRUT

[—e——

1,000 GL




State of West Virginia Request for
Department of Administration  Quotation
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East - ADDRESS COPRES
Post Office Box 50130

Charleston, WV 25305-0130 JO ANN ADKINS
304-558-8802

ADDHESS.CORRE:

*¥77090351198 304-926-3000
PETROLEUM PRODUCTS INC
SET TC PURGE

ALL STATE AGENCIES
AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED

BELLE WV 25015 BY -ORDER

02/20/2009 ¢ 30 [ngs Psiivensd
BID OPENING DATE 03/19/2009 RID _QPENTING TTME 01-30PM

REQUEST KFOR QUOTATION

BLANKET OPEN-END [STATEWIDE CONTRACT TO| SUPPLY
AUTOMOTIVE GASOLINE FOR ALL WEST VIRGINIA STATE
AGENCIES AND| PCLITICAI] SUBDIVISIONS.

VENDORS SHALI, USE THE ATTACHED "FUEL10| PRICING PAGE"
TO ENTER THEIR QUOTATION. AN ELECTRONIC VERISON

OF FUEL10 PRICING PAGE CAN BE FOUND AT
WWW . STATE . WV|. US/ADMIN/[PURCHASE /NEWBUL . HTM

BIDDERS ARE REQUESTED [THAT IN ADDITION| TO THE
REQUIRED PAPER BID THAT AN ELECTRONIC VERSION BE
SUBMITTED WITH THEIR BID. BIDDERS SHALL NOT E-MAIL
THE ELECTRONIC COPY. |[(IN THE EVENT THE| PAPER BID AND
THE ELECTRONIC BID COPY DO NOT MATCH, [THE PAPER

BID SHALL PREVATIY.

AR h R R R R R TR AR XA A XA I AT AR AXT AR AP AR AR AR AR R TRERR

A PRE-BID MEETING WILL; BE HELD ON MARCH 10, 2009 AT
10:30AM IN THE PURCHASING DIVISION CONFERENCE ROOM
LOCATED AT 2019 WASHINGTON STREET E., CHARLESTON, WV

25305.
*¥*xE*THLS IS NOT A MANDATORY MEETING **#*%

LIk e S i L b o R i e e e R R R R R R R R R R R

PUESTIONS SHALL BE ACCEPTED THROUGH CLOSE OF BUSINESS
03/09/2009. | QUES[TIONS! MAY BE SENT VIA| USPS, FAX,
COURIER OR EMATL.{ IN DRDER TO ASSURE NO VENDOR
RECEIVES AN UNFAIR ADVANTAGE, NO SUBSTANTIVE QUESTIONS
WILL BE ANSWERED PRALLY. IF POSSIBLE,| E-MAIL
DUESTIONS ARE PREFERRED.

ADDRESS INQUERES ['O:
JO ANN ADKINE

SIGNATURM%)% ﬂq]é: T gg-lorjc_ 7207 & 2 DATE 3 //_? /a?

TITLE. FEN
...t:n‘h?#nai SAjfj }?’7&»} 73 STp25357 3 ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'




State of West Virginia Request for

Department of Administration - Quotation FUEL10 2
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Sireet East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130 JO ANN ADKINS
304 -558-8802

2 ARRRESS CORRESPONDENCE TOATTENTION:OF

*709035119 304-926-3000
PETROLEUM PRODUCTS INC
SET TO PURGE

ALL STATE AGENCIES
AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED

BELLE WV 25015 BY ORDER

02/20/2009
BID GPENING DATE

03/19/2009 BID QPENTNG TIME 01-30PM

DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION
PURCHASING DIVISION
2015 WASHINGTON. STREET], EAST
CHARLESTON, WV 25305
FAX: 304-558-4115
E-MAIL: JO.A.ADKTINS@WV.GOV

ATTACHMENTS [FTO THIS REQUEST FOR QUOTATIION:

1. FUEL1Q0 SPECIFICATIONS, 7 PAGES
2. FUEL1i0 PRICING PAGE, 1 PAGE
3. WV MAP DIVIDED BY REGIONS/DISTRICTS
4. EXHIBIT 10 - RESIDENT VENDOR PREFERENCE CERTIFICATE
5. PURCHASING AFFIDAVIT
0001 LS “405-15
1
GASOLINE
EXHTBIT 3
LIFE OF CONTRACT: THIS CONTRACT BECOMES EFFECTIVE ON

................. .. AND EXTENDS FOR A PERIOD OF SIX (6)
MONTHS OR UN[IIL SUCH "REASONABLE TIME"| THEREAFTER AS IS
NECESSARY TO| OBTA[IN A NEW CONTRACT OR RENEW THE
ORIGINAIL, CONIRACTI. THE "REASONABLE TIME" PERIOD SHALL
NOT EXCEED TWELVE} (12)| MONTHS. DURING| THIS "REASONABRLE
TIME" THE VENDOR MAY TERMINATE THIS CONTRACT FOR ANY
REASON UPON GIVING THE DIRECTOR OF PUR{HASING 30 DAYS
WRITTEN NOTICE. :

E'REVERSE'SIDE FOR TERMS AND CONDITION

SIGNATURE M 27)7/7 Mj[’: TEL(EF)QSE}E) 7282 i 3 /-f 7 / 29
Totornsd_Sules Miawaoin | SY02735 7 ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE
WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'




State of West Virginia Request for == mowwsr—"7— ST PAGET L
Department of Administration Quotation ' FUELLOQ 3
Purchasing Division _

2019 Washington Sireet East
Post Office Box 50130

Charleston, WV 25305-0130 JO ANN ADKINS
304-558-8802

*70803511° 304-526-3000
PETROLEUM PRODUCTS INC
SET TO PURGE

ALL STATE AGENCIES
AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED

BELLE WV 25015 BY ORDER

02/20/2009
BID OPENING DATE

03/19/2009 BID OPENING TIME Q01:30PM

UNLESS SPECIFIC PROVISIONS ARE STIPULATED ELSEWHERE
IN THIS CONTRACT DOCUMENT, THE TERMS, [CONDITIONS AND
PRICING SET HEREIN ARE FIRM FOR THE LIFE OF THE
CONTRACT . '

RENEWAL: THIS CONTRACT MAY BE RENEWED UPON THE MUTUAL
WRITTEN CONSENT OF THE SPENDING UNIT AND VENDOR,
SUBMITTED TC! THE PIRECITOR OF PURCHASTNG THIRTY (30)
DAYS PRIOR T THE EXPIRATION DATE. SUCH RENEWAL SHALL
BE IN ACCORDRNCE WITH [THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF THE
ORIGINAL CONTRACT| AND [SHALIL BE LIMITED| TO TWO {(2) SIX
(6) MONTH PERIOCDS.

CANCELLATION|: THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING RESERVES THE
RIGHT TO CANCEL THIS CONTRACT IMMEDIATELY UPON WRITTEN
NOTICE TO THE VENPOR IF THE COMMODITIES AND/OR SERVICES
SUPPLIED ARE| OF AN INFERIOR QUALITY OR| DO NOT CONFORM
TC THE SPECIFICATIIONS OF THE BID AND CPNTRACT HEREIN.

OPEN MARKET CLAUSE: THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING MAY
AUTHORIZE A SPENDING IT TO PURCHASE DN THE OPEN
MARKET, WITHDUT THE FILING OF A REQUISITION OR COST
ESTIMATE, ITEMS SPECIFIED ON THIS CONTRACT FOR
ITMMEDIATE DELIVERY IN EMERGENCIES DUE [0 UNFORESEEN
CAUSES (INCLUDING| BUT NOT LIMITED TO DELAYS IN TRANS-
PORTATION OR| AN UNANTICIPATED INCREASE| IN THE VOLUME
OF WORK.)

QUANTITIES: QUANTITIES
APPROXTIMATICNS ONLY, B
[HE STATE SPENDING UNI
I'HAT THE CONTRACT| SHAL
DRDERED FOR DELIVERY D
WHETHER MORE| OR LESS T

LISTED IN THE REQUISITION ARE
SED ON ESTIMATES SUPPLIED BY

IT IS UNDERSI'OOD AND AGREED
COVER THE QUAN[IITIES ACTUALLY
RING THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT,
THE QUANTITIES SHOWN.

DRDERING PRO

SIGNATURE i f QW é: R TELEP%%) 7 20 ~7/4 2 i 3 //‘ 7 /}D'}?

T Yemad Suled Prmwost | &0y 3579 ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE
WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'

iALL ISSUE A




Department of Admin
Purchasing Division

*709035119 304-
SET TO PURGE

BELLE WV 25015

State of West Virginia

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

PETRCLEUM PRODUCTS INC

Request for = PRGE
T ADDRESS CORRESPONDENGE IO AT TENONOF. =
JC ANN ADKINS
304-558-8802
926-3000
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BY
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ORDER

AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS
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ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'




State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

*709035119 304-9226-3
PETROLEUM PRODUCTS INC

2019 Washington Street East

Request for TRIGNOVMBER =] 00 = PAGE T
Quotation FUEL10 5
T ADDRESS CORRESPONDENCE TOATTENTION OF
JO ANN ADKINS
304-558-8802
000

{ ALL STATE AGENCIES
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BELLE WV 25015
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ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'




State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

*709035119
PETROLEUM PRODUCTS INC

304-526-3000

Request for
Quotation

JO ANN ADKINS
304-558-8802

ATI. STATE AGENCIES

AND POLITICAIL, SUBDIVISIONS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER

SET TO PURGE

BELLE WV 25015

02/20/2009
BID OPENING DATE

RID OPENING TTMHE 01:-30PM

03/19/2009

PURCHASING CARD ACCEPTANCE: THE STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
CURRENTLY UTILIZES A V|ISA PURCHASING CARD PROGRAM WHICH
IS ISSUED THROUGH A BANK. THE SUCCESSFUL VENDOR

MUST ACCEPT {THE STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA| VISA PURCHASING
CARD FOR PAYMENT OF ALL ORDERS PLACED BY ANY STATE
AGENCY AS A CONDITION OF AWARD.

NOTIICE

A SIGNED BID| MUST| BE SUBMITTED TO:
DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION
PURCHASING DIVISION

BUILDING 15
2019 WASHINGTON S[ITREET, EAST

CHARLESTON, WV 25305-0130

THE BID SHOULD CONTAIN| THIS INFORMATION ON THE FACE OF
THE ENVELOPE| OR THE BIp MAY NOT BE CONSIDERED:

SEALED BID

BUYER : FILE 42
REQ. NO.: FUEL10

BID OPENING DATE: 03/19/2009
BID OPENING 1:30 PM

TELEPHCNE

SiGNATURE M mﬂ(}ﬁ

500) 720202 | 3)1r7)09
TITLE

Torteraid Sils Jommasia | CSOLEITTI ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE
WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR’




Siate of West Virginia ReqUeSt for ==
Department of Administraton  Quotation
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Sireet East

Post Cffice Box 50130

Charleston, WV 25305-0130

304-558-8802

*709035119 304-926-3000
PETROLEUM PRODUCTS INC
SET TO PURGE

ALL+ STATE AGENCIES
AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED

BELLE WV 25015 BY ORDER

02/20/2009
BID OPENING DATE

n2/1a/2009

PLEASE PROVIDE A [FAX .NUMBER IN CASE IT] IS NECESSARY
TO CONTACT Y[OU REGARDING YOUR BID:

T
kkxx*x* THIS| IS THE END OF RFQ FUEL10 ****%% TOTAL: _#§/, 40440

EE REVERSE SIDE FOR TERMS AND CONRITIONS::

;;GNATURE TELEPHONE DATE i
/Ua,\mﬁmm/z: (3o4) 7202/ L “3/:7/9 7

TITLE FEN .

bl Sabes havmacer §YBLYIS 7Y ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'




FUEL10 — Gasoline
Specifications

This is a request for quotation to supply unleaded gasoline to all West
Virginia State Agencies and Political Subdivisions.

Unleaded Gasoline shall comply with the most recent ASTM D 4814-07a or
the most current edition Standard Specifications for Automotive Gasoline.

The minimum anti-knock octane for: Unleaded Gasoline: 87

The State has been divided geographically into ten regions {which are the
same as the ten DOH Districts) as follows:

Region I: Mason, Putnam, Kanawha, Clay and Boone counties.

Region II: Cabell, Wayne, Lincoln, Logan and Mingo counties.

Region III: Pleasants, Wood, Ritchie, Wirt, Calhoun, Roane, and Jackson
counties.

Region IV: Doddridge, Harrison, Marion, Taylor, Monongalia, and Preston
counties. .

Region V: Grant, Hardy, Mineral, Hampshire, Morgan, Berkeley and
Jefferson counties.

Region VI: Tyler, Wetzel, Marshall, Ohio, Brooke and Hancock counties.
Region VII: Gilmer, Barbour, Lewis, Braxton, Upshur and Webster
counties.

Region VIII: Tucker, Randolph, Pendleton and Pocahontas counties.

Region IX: Nicholas, Fayette, Greenbrier, Summers and Monroe counties.
Region X: Raleigh, Wyoming, McDowell and Mercer counties.

VYENDOR ELIGIBILITY: Vendors must be an established refiner,
distributor or dealer for a minimum of three (3) years and must provide to
the Purchasing Division the locations of all facilities that will be delivering
to any of the ten regions within West Virginia along with a list of equipment
available to perform all the requirements of the contract. It is preferred the
required information be submitted with the bid. Failure to provide the
required information at the request of the Purchasing Division shall result in
disqualification of the bid.

-1- 02/26/2009




FUEL10 — Gasoline
Specifications

SAMPLING, INSPECTION, AND TESTS: Sampling, inspection and
testing shall be in accordance with Federal Specifications to obtain a fuel
which meets the detailed requirements as specified and determined by the
Division of Highways Laboratory. No allowances shall be made for any
reproducibility factors in the prescribed test methods. The supplier will
allow samples to be taken prior to discharging of product into localities
tanks. Samples will be taken without prior notices.

PRICING: The State of West Virginia will accept bids only by Region
locations. Vendors must bid a firm fixed mark-up price per gallon on fuel
delivery with product price tied to the OIL PRICE INFORMATION
‘SERVICE (OPIS) publication. All prices quoted shall be the delivered price
to any location within the ten regions

Pricing will be based on the Weekly OPIS on the DAY OF ORDER.
The OPIS Weekly Average is posted every Friday morning.

FIRM FIXED MARK-UP PER GALLON: Vendors shall bid only a
firm fixed mark-up (percentages not acceptable) for business profit and
expenses in supplying the product to the State Agencies and Political
Subdivisions. Product cost shall be the average rack price of the products as
published (for the preceding week) for the vendor supply terminal location
in the OIL PRICE INFORMATION SERVICE as published by United
Communications Group 11300 Rockville Pike, Suite 1100, Rockville, MD.
20852. Telephone number (800)929-4824.

Bids are requested for two pricing categories:

Tank-wagon (T/W) and Truck Transport (T/T). Vendor must indicate the
minimum delivery quantity for two (2) locations within 20 miles proximity
for truck transport (T/T) delivery pricing. Additionally, vendors bidding
truck transport (T/T) shall bid a fixed up-charge fee on the pricing page for
truck transport (T/T) delivery to a maximum of four (4) locations within 30
miles proximity.

-2 02/20/2009




FUEL10 — Gasoline
Specifications —

Irrespective of method of transport, the minimum delivery quantity shall be
800 gallons. The bid prices for one Region shall not be conditioned on the

award of any other Region.

PAYMENT: Shall be made based on the terminal fuel is pulled from.
If vendors bid multiple terminal sources, the invoice will be based on the
lowest price, or vendor shall provide proof of terminal product is pulled
from _on the invoice.

TAXES: The State of West Virginia agencies are exempt from the
Federal Excise Tax, and the State Consumers Sales Tax. State of West
Virginia agencies are not exempt from State Excise Tax. West Virginia
State agencies currently pay a variable rate component of the motor fuel
excise tax on motor fuel sold or used of 11.7/cents per gallon. State
agencies also currently pay 20.50/cents per gallon for the flat rate
component of the West Virginia Excise Tax.

Any Superfund Tax must be included in the bidder’s mark-up price. The
State will not accept bids from bidders who cannot meet the above
conditions regarding taxes

AGENCY ORDERING PROCEDURE: All State Agencies and DOH
districts shall be responsible for placing orders with awarded vendors.

The Division of Highways, district locations — one (1) point of contact, per
district, shall place their orders with vendor via e-mail or telephone, when
computers are unavailable.

West Virginia State Agencies utilizing this contract must purchase an
OPIS license allowing the agency access to OPIS weekly pricing.
Contact OPIS at 888-301-2654.

- Orders shall be placed Monday through Friday and utilize the published
preceding week OPIS average rack price. Pricing will be based on the
Weekly OPIS on the DAY OF ORDER.

-3- A 02/20/2009




FUEL18 — Gasoline
Specifications —

Refer to the attached map of West Virginia Division of Highway’s District
areas. The listing for Division of Highways District Office locations is as
follows:

WVDOH/DISTRICT 1
1334 Smith St.
Charleston, WV 25301

WVDOH/DISTRICT 2
801 Madison Ave.
Huntington, WV 25712

WVDOH/DISTRICT 3
624 Depot St.
Parkersburg, WV 26102

WVDOH/DISTRICT 4
PO Box 4220
Clarksburg, WV 26301

WVDOH/DISTRICT 5
PO Box 99
Burlington, WV 26710

WVDOH/DISTRICT 6
1 DOT Drive
Moundsville, WV 26041

WVDOH/DISTRICT 7
PO Box 1728
Weston, WV 26452

WVDOH/DISTRICT 8
PO Box 1516
Elkins, WV 26241

WVDOH/DISTRICT 9
HC 82, Box 3-A
Lewisburg, WV 24901

-4 - 02/20/2009




FUEL10 - Gasoline
Specifications —

WVDOH/DISTRICT 10
270 Hardwood Lane
Princeton, WV 24740

VENDOR ACKNOWLEDGEMENT PROCEDURE: The vendor must
e-mail ordering agency upon receipt of order showing order received, and
- giving tentative delivery information.

Since the product pricing is subject to weekly changes, the state agency is to
verify pricing information provided by OPIS. The actual price is computed
as follows:

NORMAL: Average rack price from OPIS report + State Excise Tax for
Motor Fuel (if applicable).
+ Vendors mark-up as quoted in contract
= Price per gallon delivered

DELIVERIES:  The State has sole discretion to determine Method of
Delivery, by tanker truck or tank wagon. Such Method of Delivery shall
be specified at the time of order based on the order volume. Normal use
requirements will be ordered three (3) working days in advance of the
required delivery date. Vendors SHALL complete fuel deliveries within the
three (3) working day period of order placement. Unless prior arrangements
have been made, deliveries shall be made during normal work hours (7:30
am to 3:30 pm), Monday through Friday.

A penality fee of $250 (reduction of invoice) , will be imposed for failure to
provide delivery of fuel within the three (3) working dav period of order
placement, unless such delay is attributable to terminal allocations. Vendors
can submit documentation related to allocation issues to avoid the penality.

Emergency requirements or situations which cannot be scheduled in advance
will necessitate 24 hour delivery. Cost for 24 hour emergency delivery shall
be at a fixed up-charge. Vendors should enter the fixed up-charge fee on the
pricing page and submit with bid. .

-5- 02/20/2009




FUEL18 — Gasoline
Specifications —

Deliveries shall include a legible metered delivery ticket which has been
processed through a meter certified and sealed by the State of West Virginia,
Division of Weights and Measures, and stamped with quantities, location,
time (a.m./p.m.) date, driver and product. When bulk deliveries are made
the driver shall stick the tank before and after product is delivered and enter
the readings onto the delivery ticket.

A copy.of the delivery ticket, signed by both the driver and a person from
the receiving facility, shall be left,(on delivery date) at the location receiving
the fuel.

Delivery tickets must include the location where delivery was made, the
product(s) delivered, the blended percentages, the number of gallons
delivered, and the rack price or prices for blended fuels.

Vendors must have the capability to deliver to above ground storage tanks
utilizing a remote fill system on the tank.

NOTE: All fuel deliveries shall be metered at the point of delivery and
shall issue a printed ticket, to meet the Division of Labor requirements:
Tanker trucks may make a delivery of a complete compartment and are
permitted to use the allocation metered ticket from the loading point for this
printed ticket. West Virginia Code 47-1-11 adopts NCWM Hand Book 130
part “Uniform Engine Fuels...Regulation”. Section 3 of that Regulation,
subparagraph 3.1.1 concerns documentation. A Bill of Lading from the
terminal source locations is acceptable and shall contain quantities, location,
time (a.m./p.m.) date, driver and product.

DELAY OR FAILURE TO DELIVER: The vendor shall not be liable
in damages for the delay of shipment or failure to deliver caused by fire, -
flood, Acts of God, Acts of Government, Act of an alien enemy, or by any
other circumstances which in the opinion of the state agency is beyond the
control of the contractor. The state agency may, in its discretion purchase
the product on the market until such time product becomes available by the
supplier.

In the event the vendor is unable to drop fuel due to an error by the ordering
agency, a flat fee of $250.00 may be charged.

-6- 02/20/2009




- FUEL10 - Gasoline
Specifications —

INVOICING: Vendors of DOH fuel deliveries are encouraged to utilize a
paperless invoice process, submitting the following information via e-mail to
the DOH ordering locations:

A.  Delivery ticket number(s) for fuel delivery, date and time of
‘delivery and DOH location of the delivery.

B.  Fuel types, total quantities, unit prices, applicable taxes, total
prices, and the terminal source of supply for all deliveries.

C.  Itis the intent of the Division of Highways
to utilize the State Purchasing Card for all vendor
reimbursement of fuels purchased.

NOTES: Under no circumstances will the West Virginia Division of
Highways accept, or pay for, quantities of fuel in excess of the quantity
requested via the telephone or electronic order.

Government entities other than the WVDOH, utilizing this contract, must
have the option of formulating their invoicing procedures with the successful
vendors.

REPORTING REQUIREMENTS: Winning bidders shall be required to
submit quarterly reports to the Equipment Division in a format which shall
be supplied. This report shall show the quantity and cost of each product
/delivery method and the location (district) or agency to which it was
delivered, and a total of each product for each quarter. This report SHALL
also be sent to the Purchasing Division, attention: jo.a.adkins@wv.gov.

AWARD:

The award will be a single award per Region (1 through 10)/ per delivery
method. Bach Region will be split into tank transport and tank wagon
pricing. Pricing will be from the source fuel was pulled from (terminal
location).
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FUEL10 Pricing/information Pages

vendor: Petroleum Products, Inc.

DISTRICT TYFE OF FUEL: EST!M.:;ﬁEnI:eeds. - {FIRM MARKUP P'?,:,sE PER GALLON:{ FIRM gl:ztg.l: PR';.?TE PER
ONE___ {Unieaded Gasoline 200,000 $0.4128 $0499ys L
TWO _|Unieaded Gasoline 206,000 $0.4486 $0.2044 -
THREE |Unleaded Gasoline 150,000 No Bid Ng Bid '
FOUR__|Unleaded Gasoline 238,000 No Bid No Bid R
FIVE Unleaded Gasoline 160,000 No Bid No Bid
81X |Unleaded Gasoline 412,000 No Bid No Bid -
SEVEN _[Unleaded Gaseline 206,000 No Bid No Big :
EIGHT _|Unleaded Gasciing 136,000 No Bid Mo Bid
NINE __ [Unleaded Gaseline 188,000 No Bid No Bid —
TEN Unleaded Gasciine 220,000 No Bid No Bid
Minimum Gallonage for TIT: 8,7'{')()': ) -
Able to split deliveries between multiple locations? - B Yes X T Ne
Minimum Qty: T/T delivery for 2 locations within 20 mile proxirnity: 8,500 :
TIT delivery for 4 locations within 30 mile proximity‘:K (upcharlge) $500.00 _
Emergency Fee {Upcharge) $95.00/hr- min. 4hr, Charge )
Contract Coordinator: David Martin )
Phone Numll;er: 304-720-7261
Fax Numbel: _304-?55-3792

'Submit {below) potential Terminals where vendor will be obtaining fuel:

Disfrict 1 & 2- Charleston, WV
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f“*"' oans State of West Virginia
VENDOR PREFERENCE CERTIFICATE

Ceriification and application® is hereby made for Preference in accordance with West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37. {(Does notapply to
consfruction contracts). West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37, provides an opporfunity for qualifying vendors to request (at the time of bid)
preference for their residency status. Such preference is an evaluation methad only and will be applied only to the cost bid in
accordance with the West Virginia Code. This certificate for application is to be used to request such preference. The Purchasing
Division will make the determination of the Resident Vendor Preference, if applicable.

1. Application is made for 2.5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is an individual resident vendor and has resided continuously in YWest Virginia for four {4) years immediately preced-
ing the date ofthis certification; or,

Bidder is a partnership, association or corporation resident vendor and has maintained its headquarters or principal place of
business continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or 80% ofthe
ownership interest of Bidder is held by another individual, partnership, association or corporation resident vendor who has
maintained its headquarters or principal place of business continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately
preceding the date ofthis certification; or,

Bidder is a nonresident vendor which has an afffiiate or subsidiary which employs a minimum of one hundred state residents
and which has maintained its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia continuously for the four (4)
years immediately preceding the date of this cetlification; or,

2, Application is made for 2.5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:
Bidder is a resident vendor who certifies that, during the life of the contract, on average at least 75% of the employees
working on the project being bid are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two years
immediately preceding submission of this bid; or,

3. Application is made for 2.5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is a nonresident vendor employing a minimum of one hundred state residents or is a nonresident vendor with an
affiliate or subsidiary which maintains its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia employing a
minimuim of one hundred state residents who certifies that, during the life of the contract, on average at least 75% of the
employees or Bidder’s affiliate’s or subsidiary’s employees are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state
continuously for the two years immediately preceding submission of this bid; or,

Application is imade for 5% resident vendor preference forthe reason checked:
Bidder meets either the requirement of both subdivisions (1) and (2) or subdivision (1) and (3) as stated above; or,

Application is made for 3.5% resident vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked:

Bidder is an individual resident vendor who is & veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard
and has resided in West Virginia continuously for the four years immediately preceding the date on which the bid is
submitted; or,

I""P‘P

@

Application is made for 3.5% resident vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked:

Bidder is a resident vendor who is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard, if, for
purposes of producing or distributing the commodities or completing the project which is the subject of the vendor’s bid and
continuously over the entire term of the project, on average at least seventy-five percent of the vendor's employees are
residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state confinuously for the two immediately preceding years.

Bidder understands if the Secretary of Revenue determines that a Bidder receiving preference has falled to continue to meet the

" requirements for such preference, the Secretary may order the Director of Purchasing to: (a} reject the bid; or (b) assess a penalty
against such Bidder in an amount not to exceed 5% of the bid amount and that such penalty will be paid to the contracting agency
or deducted from any unpaid balance on the contract or purchase order,

By submission of this certificate, Bidder agrees to disclose any reasonably requested information to the Purchasing Division and
authorizes the Department of Revenue to disclose to the Director of Purchasing appropriate information verifying that Bidder has paid
the required business taxes, provided that such information does not contain the amounts of taxes paid nor any other information
deemed by the Tax Commissioner to be confidential.

Under penalty of law for false swearing (West Virginia Code, §61-5-3), Bidder hereby certifies that this certificate is true
and accurate in all respects; and that if a contract is issued to Bidder and if anything contained within this certificate
changes during the terim of the contract, Bidder will notify the Purchasing Division in writing immediately.

Bidder: thf}w Livim ﬂw;}ﬁ 13 J,»c Signed: __ m/u,ﬂ m)éf
Date:_3/17)09 | tite: Lirteonsd Saleo Vrrumasisn

*Check any combination of preference consideration(s) indicated above, whith you are entitied to recsive.




RFQ No. }fu 2800

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
Purchasing Division

PURCHASING AFFIDAVIT

VENDOR OWING A DEBT TO THE STATE:

West Virginia Code §5A-3-10a provides that: No contract or renewal of any coniract may be awarded by the
state or any of its political subdivisions to any vendor or prospective vendor when the vendor or prospective
vendor or a related party to the vendor or prospective vendor is a debtor and the debt owed is an amount
greater than one thousand dollars in the aggregate.

PUBLIC IMPROVEMENT CONTRACTS & DRUG-FREE WORKPLACE ACT:

If this is a solicitation for a public improvement construction contract, the vendor, by its signature below, affirms
that it has a written plan for a drug-free workplace policy in compliance with Article 1D, Chapter 21 of the West
Virginia Code. The vendor must make said affirmation with its bid submission. Further, public improvement
construction contract may not be awarded to a vendor who does not have a written plan for a drug-free
workplace policy in compliance with Aricle 1D, Chapter 21 of the West Virginia Code and who has not
submitted that plan to the appropriate contracting authority in timely fashion. For a vendor who is a
subcontractor, compliance with Section 5, Article 1D, Chapter 21 of the West Virginia Code may take place
before their work on the public improvement is begun.

ANTITRUST:

in submitting a bid to any agency for the state of West Virginia, the bidder offers and agrees that if the bid is
accepted the bidder will convey, sell, assign or transfer to the state of West Virginia all rights, title and interest
in and to all causes of action it may now or hereafter acquire under the antitrust laws of the United States and
the state of West Virginia for price fixing andfor unreasonable restraints of trade relating to the particular
commodities or services purchased or acquired by the state of West Virginia. Such assignment shall be made
and become effective at the time the purchasing agency tenders the initial payment to the bidder.

I certify that this bid is made without prior understanding, agreement, or connection with any corporation, firm,
limited liability company, partnership or person or entity submitting a bid for the same materials, supplies,
equipment or services and is in all respects fair and without collusion or fraud. | further certify that | am
authorized to sign the certification on behalf of the bidder or this bid.

LICENSING:

Vendors must be licensed and in good standing in accordance with any and ail state and local laws and
requirements by any state or local agency of West Virginia, including, but not limited to, the West Virginia
Secretary of State’s Office, the West Virginia Tax Department, West Virginia Insurance Commission, or any
other state agencies or political subdivision. Furthermore, the vendor must provide all necessary releases to
obtain information to enable the Director or spending unit to verify that the vendor is licensed and in good
standing with the above entities.

CONFIDENTIALITY:

The vendor agrees that he or she will not disclose to anyone, direcily or indirectly, any such personally
identifiable information or other confidential information gained from the agency, unless the individual who is
the subject of the information consents to the disclosure in writing or the disclosure is made pursuant to the
agency’s policies, procedures and rules. Vendor further agrees to comply with the Confidentiality Policies and
Information Security Accountability Requirements, set forth in hitp:/Awww.state.wv.us/admin/purchase/privacy/
noticeConfidentiality. pdf. -

Under penalty of law for false swearing (West Virginia Code §61-5-3), it is hereby certified that the vendor
affims and acknowiedges the information in this affidavit and is in compliance with the requirements as stated.

% 2 T
Vendor's Name: __[($ o limm faomuci3 , Loe
Authorized Signature: M% 74”/%0& Date: 3/ ?/ g

Purchasing Affidavif (Revised 01/01/09)




