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GENERAL TERMS & CONDITIONS
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION (RFQ) AND REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL (RFP)

1. Awards will be made in the best interest of the State of West Virginia.
2. The State may accept or reject in part, or in whole, any bid.
3. All quotations are governad by the West Virginia Code and the Legislative Rufes of the Purchasing Division.

4. Prior to any award, the apparent successful vendor must be properly registered with the Purchasing Division
and have paid the required $125 fze.

5. All services performed or goods delivered under State Purchase Order/Contracts are to be continued for the
term of the Purchase Order/Contracts, contingent upon funds being appropriated by the Legislature or otherwise
being made available. In the event funds are not appropriated or otherwise available for these services or
goods, this Purchase Order/Contract becomes void and of no effect after June 30.

6. Payment may only be made after the delivery and acceptance of goods or services.

7. Interest may be paid for late payment in accordance with the West Virginia Code.

8. Vendor preference will be granted upon written request in accordance with the West Virginia Code.

9. The State of West Virginia is exempt from federal and state taxes and wifl not pay or reimburse such taxes.

10. The Director of Purchasing may cancel any Purchase Order/Contract upon 30 days written notice to the seller.

11, The laws of the State of West Virginia and the Legislative Rules of the Purchasing Division shall govern
all rights and duties under the Contract, including without limitation the validity of this Purchase
OrderfContract.

12. Any reference to automatic renewal is hereby deleted. The Contract may be renewed only upon mutual written
agreement of the parties.

13. BANKRUPTCY: in the event the vender/contractor files for bankruptey protection, this Contract may be
deemed null and void, and terminated without further order.

14. HIPAA BUSINESS ASSOCIATE ADDENDUM: The West Virginia State Government HIPAA Business Associate
Addendum (BAA), approved by the Attorney General, and available online at the Purchasing Division's web site
(http://www.state.wv.us/admin/purchase/vrc/hipaa.htm) is hereby made part of the agreement.  Provided that,
the Agency meets the definition of a Cover Entity (45 CFR §160.103) and will be disclosing Protected Health
Information (45 CFR §160.103) to the vendor.

15. WEST VIRGINIA ALCOHOL & DRUG-FREE WORKPLACE ACT: If this Contract constitutes a public improvement
construction contract as set forth in Article 1D, Chapter 21 of the West Virginia Code {"The West Virginia Alcohol
and Drug-Free Workplace Act’), then the following language shall hereby become part of this Contract: "The
contractor and its subcontractors shall implement and maintain a written drug-free workplace policy in compliance
with the West Virginia Alcohol and Drug-Free Workplace Act, as set forth in Article 1D, Chapter 21 of the West
Virginia Code. The contractor and its subcontractors shall provide a sworn statement in writing, under the
penalties of perjury, that they maintain a valid drug-free work place policy in compliance with the West Virginia
and Drug-Free Workplace Act. It is understood and agreed that this Contract shall be cancelled by the awarding
authority if the Contractor: 1) Fails to implement its drug-free workplace policy; 2) Fails to provide information
ragarding implementation of the contracior's drug-free workplace policy at the request of the public authority; or
3} Provides to the public authority false information regarding the contractor's drug-free workplace policy.”

INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS

1. Use the quotation forms provided by the Purchasing Division.

2. SPECIFICATIONS: ltems offered must be in compliance with the specifications. Any deviation from the
specifications must be clearly indicated by the bidder. ~ Altlernates offered by the bidder as EQUAL to the
specifications must be clearly defined. A bidder offering an alternate should attach complete specifications
and literature to the bid. The Purchasing Division may waive minor deviations to specifications,

3. Compilete all sections of the quotation form.
4. Unit prices shall prevait in case of discrepancy.

5. All quotations are considered F.O.B. destination unless alternate shipping terms are clearly identified in the
quotation.

6. BID SUBMISSION: All quotations must be delivered by the bidder to the office listed below prior to the date and time
of the bid opening. Failure of the bidder to deliver the quotations on time will result in bid disqualifications:
Department of Administration, Purchasing Division, 2019 Washington Street East, P.O. Box 50130,
Charfeston, WV 25305-0130

Rev. 7/01/08
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SPECIFICATIONS

The following sections of the West Virginia Department of Transporiation, Division of Highways Standard
Specification Roads and Bridges, adopted 2000, as modified by the current Supplemental Specifications shall
apply o the administration of this Contract: 101, 102.4, 102.5, 105.1, 105.3, 1054, 105.10, 105.11, 105.12,
108.13, 106.3, 106.4, 108.5, 106.6, 106.7, 106.8, 1071, 167.2, 107.3, 107.14, 107.19, 107.20, 108.8, 108.1,
108.2, and 108.20

The terms "Contractor" and "Vendor® used in the above specifications or this contract are interchangaable.
Contractor shall mean Vendor and Vendor shall mean Coniractor.

West Virginia Depariment of Transportation, Division of Highways Siandard Specifications Roads and
Bridges, adopted 2000 and the current Supplemental Specifications may be obtained from:

Office of the Director of Contract Administration Division
Room A-728

West Virginia Division of Highways

State Capitol Compiex, Building 5

Charleston, West Virginia 25305

Herbicide furnished under this confract shall conform fo the physical and chemical properties set out in the
" EPA Registration of the product provided by the Vendor.

BIDDING INSTRUCTIONS

Vendors may quote on any or all of the chemical products listed herein.

it is the intent to award a Statewide Contract for each chemical product listed herein. The contract will be
awarded to the lowest compliant bidder for each item. The award for each item wilt be based on the bid price
per gallon, pound or ounce and not the lot or container amount. ‘

The vendor shall list the trade name and EPA Regisiration Number, where appiicable, on the Bidding Schedule
for each chemical product bid. Failure fo list this information may result in the disqualification of the vendor's

bid on that product.

Vendors shall not qualify bids. Any qualification of bids or any modification of the specifications or conditions
governing the bids may be cause fo reject bids.

The successful vendor shall furnish two product iabels, for each product awarded, to the West Virginia Division
of Highways. The iabels shall provide pertinent information regarding product storage and handling or this
information shall otherwise be provided with each shipment.

Equivalency where requested as, chemical name or equivalent, shall mean equal and not necessarily identical.
Prior to award of low bid the Division of Highways may require samples for evaluation to determine
squivalency when applicable. Product specifications and technical information should be submitted with bid
and may also be used to determine equivalency. The final defermination of equivalency will be made by the
Division of Highways and award will be based upon the item providing the intended service or result and unit
price.

CONTRACT AWARD

Qualified vendors who submit a valid low bid will be awarded a confract for those items for which their bid is
low,

The State of West Virginia reserves the right o make multiple awards on this contract when it is in the best
interest of the State fo do so.



ACCEPTANCE PLAN

With each delivery of herbicide products to the Division, the vendor shall certify that the products so delivered
do conform to the properties described in the EPA Registration.

Material failing to comply with the quality requirement will not be accepted.

TESTING PROCEDURES

Upon award of contract, the successful vendor shall supply the Division of Highways, Materials Control, Soil
and Testing Division, 312 Michigan Avenue, Charleston, West Virginia 25311, the proper testing procedures to
determine the presence and concentration of the Herbicide in flowing water.

BID QUANTITIES

Vendor should base guotation on estimated herbicide use as follows:

DOH-1H 3,000 gallons
DOH-2H : 6,000 gallons
POH-3H 100 pounds
DOMH-4H 250 gallons
DOH-5H 150 galions
DOH-6H 600 galions
DOH-7H 500 gallons
DOH-8H 250 gallons
DOH-9H 2000 pounds
DOH-10H 100 galions
POH-11H 25 gallons
DOH-12H 50 gallons
DOH-~13H 50 gallons
DOH-14H ' 150 pounds
DOH-15H 25 cases

DOH-16H 10 pounds
DOH-17H 100 galions
DOH-18H 50 pounds
POH-19H 25 gallons
DOH-20H 50 gallons
DOH-21H 300 gallons
DOH-22H 300 gallons
DOH-23H 100 gallons
DOH-24H : 50 pounds
DOH-25H ' 100 pounds
DOH-26H 16 gallons
DOH-27H 18 gallons
DOH-28H : 50 pounds
DOH-29H 400 ounces
POH-30H ' 50 gallons
DOH-31H ‘ 100 gallons,
DOH-32H 100 pounds
DOH-33H 100 pounds
DOH-34H 400 pounds
DOH-35H 50 pounds
DOH-36H 100 gallons
DOH-37H ' 100 gallons
DOH-38H 100 pounds

Vendors are cautioned that the above quantities are estimates only. Actual orders will be for the required
needs of the Division of Highways.



DELIVERY - 11

Materials under this contract are to be shipped prepaid F.0.B. delivery to West Virginia Division of Highways
District Storerooms as follows:

District One Charlesion
District Two Huniingion
District Three Parkersburg
District Four Clarksburg
District Five : Buriington
District Six Moundsville
District Seven Weston
District Eight Elkins
District Nine Lewisburg

District Ten Princeton

Materials should be shipped to the location and in the guantity spécified in State Contract Purchase Orders
(SCOs) within 20 days affer the SCO is issued by the Division of Highways.

VENDOR'S INVOICES

Vendor's invoices must be submitted in criginal and four copies and contain the following:

a. Division of Highways State Contract Order (SCO) Numbers, and
this Contract Number.

b. Total guantity and unit price with the total cost of each type
of material furnished.

Note: Under no circumstance will the West Virginia Division of Highways accept, or pay for, guantities of
material in excess of the guantity stated on the State Contract Purchase Order.

RESTRICTED AND NON-RESTRICTED HERBICIDES

Herbicide products which have been declared RESTRICTED in their use by the Environmental Protection
Agency (EPA) must be applied under the supervision of a licensed herbicide applicator. The Department
reserves the right fo disaliow the use of RESTRICTED herbicides when non-restricted herbicides are available
to achieve the same objective,

TRAINING AND TECHNICAL ASSISTANCE

In order {o bid on and be awarded items on this contract the vendor must have a competent representative
available to provide training and technical assistance as required or upon request by WVDOH personne,
including but net iimited fo, an annual West Virginia Division of Highways Vegetation Management Seminar
and attend the mandatory prebid meeting. Each bidder should submit name and telephone number of
representative with bid. The representative shall have a vaiid Category 7 certification in West Virginia and the
company shall have a valid Category 12 certification in West Virginia. Copies of these certifications should be
submitted with the bid.

Failure to comply will result in awarding that vendor's ltems to the next lowest compliant bidder.

NAME OF REPRESENTATIVE PHONE NUMBER ADDRESS )
Todd Hageatuek  570-459-508 100 N. Conahen Dive
Hazleton, PA 1820]
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11.

12.

13.

LIST OF APPROVED HERBICIDES

| 2L R M L AR

The Product Trade Name shown is the approved herbicide to be bid. No substitutes will be accepted.

AD :

JUVANTS, SAFETY EQUIPMENT AND MISCELLANEOUS
Unless a Product Trade Name is requested these ltems will be awarded based on the lowest unit price bid for
acceptable performance.  Lowest unit price bid will be determined by comparing minimum iabel
recommendations per 100 gallons of spray solution and unit price. Acceptable performance will be determined
by District personnel assessment of desired results and may include, but is not limited to, field test evaluations.
MANDATORY PRE-BID
Therewillbe a rhandatory pre-bid meeting on April 13, 2009, at 10:00 AM.
Location:
Purchasing Division Conference Room

2019 Washington Street, East, Building 15
Charleston, WV 25305



14, BIDDING SCHEDULE

NOTE: Vendor should type bid price

CHEMICAL FORMULATION

HERBICIDES

Percent Concentration/
Pounds per Gallon
of Active Ingredients

DOH-1H

B)

DOM-2H

B)

D)

WATER SOLUBLE EMULSIFIABLE CONCENTRATE CONTAINING:

Ammonium Salt of Fosamine with Surfactant 4 Ibsfgallon

Product Trade Name Krenite S

EPA Registration Number 352-395

Supplied in 2 1/2 gallon containers in jots of 5 gallons.
59.45 297.25

@3 per gallon (i.e. § per lot)
Supplied in 15 gallon returnable/refillable containers,
@% 60.25 per gailon (ie. $ 303.75 per lot)

WATER SOLUBLE EMULSIFIABLE CONCENTRATE CONTAINING:
Isopropylamine Salt of Glyphosate 50.2%
Phosphate Ester Surfactant

Product Trade Name Roundup Pro Concentrate
524-529

EPA Registration Number

Supplied in 30 galion plastic returnable drums.

@% 47.95 per gallon (i.e. § 1438.50 per drum)

Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in jots of 5 gallons.

@% 48.65 per gallon (i.e. $ 243.25 per lof)
Supplied in 15 gallon refurnablefrefillable containers.
49,15 . 737.25
per gallon {i.e. $ per lot)
Supplied in 150 galien returnablefrefittable shutile.
@$ 49.00 per galion (i.e. § 7350.00 per shutile)

The “Bid Schedule” is available for download on

Purchasing’s Web site at
www.state.wv.us/admin/purchase s

13



14, BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOH-3H

POH-4H

A)

DOH-5H

A)

B)

C)

DISPERSIBLE GRANULES CONTAINING:
Suiforneturon Methyl

Product Trade Name Dust XP
352-601

=R A Registration Number

Supplied in 3 pound coniainers in lofs of 24 pounds.

@% 72.45 per pound {(i.e. § 1738.80 per lof)

Supplied in 3 pound jug

@3 74.95 per pound {i.e. § 224.85 per jug)

WATER SOLUBLE AQUEQUS SUSPENSION CONTAINING:

Oryzalin

Product Trade Name Oryzalin 4 Pro

EPA Registration Number 72167-15-73220

Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons.

60 .45 302.25

@% _per gallon (i.e. $ per lot)

AQUEQUS SOLUTION CONTAINING:
Imazapyr

Product Trade Name Arsenal Powerline

EPA Registration Number

Suppiied in 1 guart containers in iots of 4 quarts
@5 No bid

Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons

per quart (i.e. % per lof)

@ No bid per galion (ie. $ _ per lof)
Supplied in 15 gallon drums

@¢ No bid per gallon (i.e. $ per drum)

78%

4 Ibs/galion

2 Ibsfgallon

14



14, BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOM-8H

A)

DOH-TH

A)

B)

DOH-8H

A)

C)

AQUEOUS CARRIER CONTAINING:

Pandimethalin 3.8 ibs/galion

Product Trade Name __ Pendulum AguaCap

EPA Registration Number __ 241-416

Supplied in 2.5 galion container in lots of & gallons

@35 _ 22:95 pergalion(ie.$_264-75  periot)

WATER SOLUBLE CONCENTRATE CONTAINING:
Triciopyr 3 Ibs/galion

Product Trade Name Garlon 3A

EPA Regisiration Number __ ©62719-37

Supplied in 2.5 galton containers in lots of 5 gallons

@$% 4.95 per galion {i.e. $ 374.75 per lot)

Suppled in 30 galion containers

@% 73.25 per gallon (i.e. 2197.50 per container)

Supplied in 15 gallon continuum retumnable/refillable containers in paliets of 9 containers

@% 712,45 per gallon (i.e. $ 9780.75 per pallet)

WATER SOLUBLE CONCENTRATE CONTAINING:
Triclopyr 4 Ibsfgalion

Product Trade Name _ Garlon 4 Ultra
62719-527

EPA Registration Number

Supplied in 2.5 galion containers in lots of 5 gallons

@% 92.95 per gallon (i.e. $ 464.75 per iot)

Suppiied in 30 gallon containers

91.45 2743.50

per container)

@9

Supplied in 15 gatlon continuum returnable/refillable containers in pallets of 9 containers

per galion (i.e. §

@% 90.90  pergalion(ie. $ 12271.50 per paliet)

15
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14, BIDDING SCHEBULE CON'T

DOH-8H

B)

DOH-10H

A)

C)

DOH-11H

AWATER SOLUBLE DISPERSIBLE GRANULE CONTAINING:
Diuron 80.0%

Product Trade Name Karmex XP

EPA Registration Number 352692

Supplied in 5 pound bags in lots of 10 bags

@% 4.45 per pound (e § 222.50 per lot)
Supplied in 25 pound bags
@3 4.40 per pound (i.e. § 110.00 per bag)

WATER SOLUBLE LIQUID CONTAINING:
Dimethylamine Salt of 2, 4-D acid 3.8 ibsfgallon

Product Trade Name DM A4

EPA Registration Number 62719-3

Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons
@$_13.95 per galion (ie.$_ 069.75  periof)
Supplied in 30 galicn drums

@3 13.85

Supplied in 15 gallon returnablefrefilable containers in paliets of 9 containers

§ 415.50

per gallon {j.e. per drum)

@%_14.10  pergalion (te. $1203.50  serion

WATER SOLUBLE LIQUID CONTAINING;

Diethanolamine Sali of Mefluidide 21.45%
Ammonium Salt of Imazethapyr 4.08%
Ammonium Salt of Imazapyr 0.15%
Product Trade Name Stronghold

EPA Registration Number
Supplied in 1 galion containers in lots of 4 gallons

@$ No bid per gallon (ie. $ per lot)



4. BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOR-12H

B)

E)

DOH-13H

A}

WATER SOLUBLE LIQUID CONTAINING:
Ammonium Salf of Imazapic

Product Trade Name Plateau

EPA Registration Number

Supplied in 1 gallon containers in lots of 2 galions
@% No bid per galion (i.e. § per iot)
Supplied in 2.5 gatlon containers in lots of 5 galons

@ % No bid per galion (i.e. $ per ot}
Supplied in 1.44 oz packets 14 packets per lot

@$ No bid  perpacket(ie. $ per lot)
Supphied in 1 gf containers 4 gts per ot

@$_No bid perqtfie.$ per lot)

Supplied in 15 galion containers

@$_No bid pergallon(ie $ per lot)

A DISPERSIBLE LIQUID CONTAINING:
Hexazinone

Product Trade Name Velpar L

EPA Registration Number __ 352=392

Supplied in 2 % gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons

@$__ 62.95 pergalion(ie.$_ 314.75 percontainer)

23.6%

2 ibs/galion

17



14, BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOH-14H

B)

©)

DOH-15H

DOH-16H

A)

DRY FLOWABLE CONTAINING;
Metsulfuron Methyl 60%

Product Trade Name Escort XP

EPA Registration Number 352-439

Supplied in 16 oz. containers in lots of 8 Ibs. (8-16 oz. ¢irs.)

@9 9.65 peroz (i.e. $_1235.20 per lof)

Supplied in 16 oz. jug

10.25 164.00

peroz (i.e. $ per jug)

@3$

Supplied in 64 oz Jug returnable/refillable

@$_11.50  peroz(le$ 736.00  perjug)

WATER SOLUBLE GRANULE HERBICIDE CONTAINING:
Ammonium Salt of Glyphosate 71.4%

Product Trade Name Roundup Pro dry

EPA Registration Name
Supplied in 23.25 b. box
@$ No bid 23.251b. box {ie. $ perib.)

DRY FLOWABLE CONTAINING:
Chlorsulfuron 75%

Product Trade Name __ Telar XP

EPA Registration Number 352-654

Supplied in 8 x 16 ounce containers fo a case

@% 17.85 per ounce (i.e. $ 2284.80 per container)

18



14, BIODING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOH-1TH

B)

DOH-18H

B)

DOH-19H

A}

B)

A LIQUID SOLUTION CONTAINING,
tscoctyl ester of 2.4 Dichlorophenoxyacetic Acid

Z-ethylhrxyl ester of +R-2-(2,4-Dichiorophenoxy)
Propionic Acid

Dicamba (3, 6-Dicholoro-o-anisic Acid

Product Trade Name BK-800

EPA Registration Number

Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons
@3 No bid per gallon {i.e. § per lot)

Suppiied in 30 gallon drums

@s_No bid sorgaion (e $ per drum)

DRY FLOWABLE CONTAINING:
Tebuthiuron

Product Trade Name Spike 80 DF

EPA Registration Number

Suppiied in 4 pound bags in lots of 24 pounds
@%_No bid perpound(ie.$ per lot)
Supplied in 25 pound bags

@ No bid o 0ing (e $ per lot)

AWATER SOLUBLE EMULSFIABLE CONCERTRATE CONTAINING:

Ciopyralid

Product Trade Name Transline

EPA Registration Number  62719-259

Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 galions

@%_315.95 pergation(ie.$_1579.75 perio)

Supplied in .5 gallon containers in lots of 2 galions

@%$_321.95 pergallon{le.$_ 643.90 perlot)

32.48%

15.90%

5.38%

80%

3 ibs/gallon

19



14. BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOH-20H

A)

DOH-21H

B)

DOH-22H

A)

DOH-23H

A)

B)

AQUECUS SOLUTION CONTAINING:
isopropylamine Salt of imazapyr

Product Trade Name Stalker

EPA Registration Number

Supplied in 1 quart containers in tots of 4 quarts
@$ No bid pserquart(ie. $ per lot)
AQUEOUS SOLUTION CONTAINING:

Digiycolamine Satlt of 3, 6-Dichioro-0-
Anisic Acid

Product Trade Name Vanguish

EPA Registration Number 228-397

Supplied in 2.5 galion containers in lots of 5 galions

63.95 319.75

per gallon (i.e. § per iof)

@s

Supplied in 15 gallon refurnabiefrefiliable containers in
paliets of 9 containers

@5 64.95 per gailon (i.e. § 8768.25 per palies)

AQUEOUS SOLUTION CONTAINING:
Triclopyr

Product Trade Name __ Pathfinder i

EPA Registration Number 62719-176

Supplied in 2.5 galion containers in lots of 5 gallons

@%__ 38.45 vpergalon(ie $ 192.25  periob)

WATER SOLUBLE EMULSIFIABLE CONCENTRATE CONTAINING:

Isopropylamine Salt of Glyphosate

Product Trade Name  Rodeo

EPA Regisiration Number

Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons
@ No bid o calon (e $ per lot)

Supplied in 30 gallon plastic returnable drums

@$ No bid

per gafion (i.e. $ per drum)

27.6%

4 ths/gallon

.75 thefgalion

53.8%
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14 BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOH-24H

B)

DOH-25H

A)

DOH-26H

A)

DOH-27H

A LIQUID CONTAINING:
Aminopyralid

Product Trade Name Milestone VM

EPA Registration Number 62719-537

Supplied in 1 quart confainers 12 containers per lot

@3 71.25 per quart (i.e. § 855.00

Suppiied in 2.5 gallon containers 5 gaklions per iot

per lof)

@5 275.95 per galion {i.e. § 1379.75 per lof)

WATER DISPERSIBELE GRANULAR MATERIAL CONTAINING:

Prodiamine

Product Trade Name _ Endurance
228-398

EPA Regisiration Number

Supplied in 10 pound containers 50 pounds per lot

@3 25.63 per pound (i.e. § 1282.50

EMULSIFIABLE CONCENTRATE CONTAINING:
Quizalofop P-Ethyl

Product Trade Name Assure i

EPA Registration Number

per iof)

Supplied in 1 gallon containers in iots of 4 gallons

@$% No bid per gallon {(i.e. §

EMULSIFIABLE CONCENTRATE CONTAINING:
Fluazifop-P-butyl

Product Trade Name Ornamec

per lot)

EPA Registration Number

Supplied in 1 gallon containers in lots of 4 gailons

@$_No bid  pergaton(ie.

per lot)

40.6%

65%

6.88 ihs/galion

6.75%
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14. BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOH-28H A DISPERSIBLE GRANULE CONTAINING:

tmazapyr T.78%
Diuron . 62.22%

Product Trade Name Sahara DG

EPA Regisiration Number

Supplied in 10 pound bags in lots of 40 pounds.

A) @% No bid per pound (i.e. § per lot)
DOH-20H A WATER SOLUBLE DRY GRANULE CONTAINING:
Suifosuffuron 75%
Product Trade Name Qutrider

EPA Registration Number  524-500

Supplied in 20 oz botiles in lofs of 200 oz

A) @$ 13.85 peroz(ie. $ 2770.00 per lof)

POH-30H A LIQUID CONTAINING:
Diuron A40%

Product Trade Name Diuron 4L

EPA Registration Number

Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 galions

A) @%$__No bid pergallon{ie $ per lot)
DOH-31H A LIQUID CONTAINING
Fluroxypyr 26.2%

Product Trade Name Vista

EPA Registration Number ©2719~-308

Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 galions

A) @% 88.88 per galion (i.e. $ 444.40 per lot)



T4 BIDPDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOH-32H WETTABLE GRANULE FORMULATION CONTAINING
Sodium salt of difiufenzopy: 2-[1-{{3.5<ifuorophenylamino} carbony}]

hydrazono} ethyl)-3-pyridinecarboxylic acid, sodium 21.4%
Sodium sali of 3.6-dichioro-g-anisic acid 55.0%
Product Trade Name Overdrive

EPA Registration Number _ 7/969-150

Supplied in 7 ¥2 1b. jugs. 30 Ibs. per case
1095.00

A) @$ 36.50 perib. (i.e $ per case)
DOH-33H DISPERSIBLE GRANULES CONTAINING
Sufformeturon Methyl 56.25%
Chiorsuffuron 18.75%

Product Trade Name Landmark XP

EPA Registration Number 352-645

Supplied in 4 Ib. jugs in lots of 32 Ibs,

A) @3% 158.25 perib. (ie § 4424 .00 per case)

Supplied in 64 oz jug returnable/refillable

B3 @ $_______&_§2;m%§per vz. {ie § 8912.00 per jug.)
DOH-34H DISPERSIBLE GRANULES CONTAINING
Sulfometuron Methyt 56.25%
Metsuifuron Methvi 15.00%

Product Trade Name Qust Extra

EPA Regiétration Number _352-62 2

Supplied in 4 b, jugs in lots of 32 Ibs.

A) @s$_77-50 perlb.{ie. $ 2480.00 per lot)

Supplied in 64 oz. returnable/refillable

By  @s$ /6.50 peroz. (i.e. § 4896.00 per jug)
Supplied in 12 Ib. jugs

C) @$_85.95 perib.(ie.$_1031.40  perjug)




14, BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOH-35H

A)

DOH-36H

A)

DOH-37H

B)

DOH-38H

ADRY FLOWABLE GRANULE CONTAINING:
Bromacil
Divron

Product Trade Namea Krovar | DF
352-505

EPA Registration Number

Supplied in 6 b containers in lots of 8 containers

@$_10.95  perib(ie §525.60

A LIQUID CONTAINING:
imazapic
Glyphosate

Product Trade Name Journey

EPA Registration Number

Supplied in 7 ¥z Ib. jugs. 30 Ibs. per case

40%
40%

per lot)

8.13%
21.94%

EPA Registration Number.
Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons
@$_No bid pergalion(ie. $

A LIQUID CONTAINING:

per lot)

Dimethylamine Salt of 2,4-Dichlovophenoxyagetic Acid 24.58%
Dimethylamine Salt of Dicamba (3,6-Dichioro-o-Anisic Acid) 12.82%

Product Trade Name Veieran 720

EPA Registration Number 228-295

Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gafions

@% 27.65 per gallon (i.e. $ 138.25

per lof)

Supplied in 30 galion drums

@$_27.45 per gallon (e.$__ 823.50

per drum)

DISPERSIELE GRANULES CONTAINING
Chiorsulfuron

Sulforneturon Methyl

Sulfentrazone

Product Trade Name Throttle XP

EPA Registration Number 352-725

9%
18%
48%

Suppled in 3.2 Ib. containers, 8 containers per case

per case)

24
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14. BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

POH-1A

DOH-2A

A)

DOH-3A

DOH-4A

A)

DOH-5A

DOH-6A

ADJUVANTS

AWATER SOLUBLE BLUE LIQUID SPRAY PATTERN INDICATOR

Product Trade Name Bullseye
Supplied in 2.5 galon __ contziners in lots of 5 galions
@ _No bid per galion (i.e. $ per lot)

A MISCIBLE-DISPERSIBLE LIQUID DEFOAMER (30% Active ingredient)

Product Trade Name

Supplied in containers in jots of

@% No bid per (ie. $ per o)

A DILUENT WITH EMULSIFIERS

Product Trade Name _ Hygrade EC or Arborchem Basal Oil or Bark Oil EC
: Or Alenza Basal Oil or Penevaior

S{Jppiied in containers in iots of gallons

@% No bid per gallon (i.e, $ per lot)

NON-IONIC SURFACTANT (90% Active Ingredient)

Product Trade Name

Supplied in containers in lots of gallens

@3 No bid pergallon (l.e. $ per lot)

A GRANULAR/FLAKE DRIFT CONTROL AGENT

Product Trade Name

Supplied in containers in lots of containers

@3 _No bid per (ie. $ per iot)

A LIQUID DRIFT CONTROL AGENT

Product Trade Name

Supplied in containers in lots of

@?3s No bid per {ie $ per lot)
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14. BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOH-TA

A)

DOH-BA

DOH-10A

A)

DOH-11A

B)

AQUATIC SURFACTANT

Product Trade Name

Supplied in containers in lots of ga[lons>

@s__ No bid per galion (i.e. § oer lof)

AWATER SOLUBLE LIQUID SPRAY PATTERN INDICATOR

Product Trade Narﬁe Blueprint Plus
Supplied in 2.5 galion containers in lots of 5 galions
@% No bid per gallon {ie. $ per lot)

A NON-IONIC STICKER SPREADER

Product Trade Name Nu-Film-IR

Supplied in 2 ¥ galion containers in lofs of > gallons

@53 28.15 140.75

pergalion {ie. § per fot)

A READY TO USE FORMULA CONTAINING PARFFINIC OIL EMULSIFIERS

Product Trade Name _ Thinvert RTU

Supplied in 2 ¥ galion jugs. 5 galion per case

@$_No bid per gallon (i.e. $ per case)

Supplied in 15 gaiton drum

@s$_No bid per galion




14. BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOH-12A

B)

ACONCENTRATE FORMULA CONTAINING PARFINNK OIL EMULSIFIERS
AND SURFACTANTS

Product Trade Name Thinvert Concentrate

Supplied in 2 % gallon jugs. 5 gallon per case

@s No bid per galion (i.e. $ per case)

Supplied in 15 gallon drum

@¢_No bid per galion
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14, BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOH-18

DOH-25

A)

DOH-3S

DOH-45

A)

DOH-58

SAFETY EQUIPMENT

EMERGENCY SPILL KIT CONTAINING:

15 Universal Plus Sorbent Pads
3 Cobra Coils

1 Pair Safety Goggles

1 Pair Latex Gloves

1 Large Refuse Bag

1 List of Environmental Compliance Telephone Numbers

18" x 18" x 4"
Vacuum Packed in Puncture Resistant Foil

Product Trade Name

$ No bid per each

@

A GRANULAR/FLAKE SPILL ABSORBENT

Product Trade Name

Supplied in containers in lots of

@%__No bid per pound (i.e. §

containers

per lot)

3 LAYER FAERIC COVERALLS (ALL SIZES)

Product Trade Name Kleen Guard

Supplied in 12 ea/case

@$__ No bid pereach {ie. $

DISPOSABLE COVERALLS

Product Trade Name Tyvek

Supplied in 25 ea/case

@$___No bid per each (l.e. $

per case)

per case)

32 OZ. EYE WASH BOTTLE

Product Trade Name

Supplied per each

@s No bid per each
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14. BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOH-1M

DOH-2ZM

A)

DOH-3M

A)

DOH-4M

A)

B)

MISCELLANEOUS

PRESSURE RINSER

Product Trade Name Easy Rinse

Supplied per each

@53 No bid per each

HAND SOAP WITH CITRUS OIL

Product Trade Name Zep

Supplied in 32 oz. containers in lots of 20 containers per case

@$ No bid per container (i.e. $

A BIOSTIMULANT CONTAINING:

Soluble Potash
fron

Manure Extract

Humic and Fulvic Acid Extract

Kelp Extract

Organo-Modified Silaxane Surfactant

Product Trade Name Launch

Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons

@%_No bid pergallon(ie. $

AWORK BOOT

Product Trade Name lron Duke

Compliance EPA 40 CFR 170

Supplied per pair

@ Size (6-11) % No bid per pair

@ Size (12 +) § No bid per pair

per Jof)

per case)

1.00%
0.36%

79.30%
9.00%
1.20%
0.36%
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14, BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOH-5M

DOH-6M

A}

DOH-TM

DOH-8M

A)

<)

RUBBER BOOT/SHOE COVERS

Compliance EFA 46 CFR 170

Supplied per pair

No bid

@ SizeM (8-9)§ per pair

@Size L (10-11)§_ No bid o papr

@ Size XL (12435 No bid

SAFETY GOGGLES ~ indirect vent

Meeis ANS1 287.1-18808

@$% No bid per each

FACE SHIELD — positive lock headgear

Meets ANS1 287.1-1889 and
CAN1CSA-294 3-92 Specifications

@$_No bid  pereach

A 5-GALLON BACKPACK SPRAYER

Product Trade Name Birchmeier

@3 No bid per sprayer

Gasket Set For Sprayer Pump

No bid
@$%__  perset

Hose Valve & Wand Repair Kit

@$_No bid  perkit
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14. BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOH-SM

A)

DOH-10M

DOH-11M

NITRI-SOLVE 100% NITRILE GLOVES
15 mil 13" Nitriie Gloves

Compliance EPA 40 CFR 170
Sizes S, M, L, XL, or 2XL

@$_ No bid per pair

2-QUART HANDHELD PRESSURE SPRAYER

Product Trade Name Toico

@%__No bid per sprayet

CLOSED SYSTEM BACKPACK SPRAYER

Product Trade Name Birchmier BCS

@%__No bid per sprayer

Gasket sef for sprayer pump

Hose Valve & Warid repair kit

@3 No bid per kit
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FOR USE ONLY IN CATEGORIES ABOVE

WEST VIRGINIA CERTIFICATION
Expires: 12/31/09 C04443

Commercial Applicator
Todd Hagenbuch
DeAngelo Brothers Inc.
- 100 N. Conahan Drive
Hazleton, PA 182081

oy

S




Rev DaIE State of West Virginia RFQ FO. 66900032 37
VENDOR PREFERENCE CERTIFICATE

Cariification and appiication” is hereby made for Preference in accordancs with West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37. (Does not apply to
construction contracts). West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37, provides an opporiunity for qualifying vendors to request (af the time of bid)
oreference for their residency status. Such preference is an evaluation method only and will be applied only to the cost bid in
accordance with the West Virginia Code. This ceriificate for application is to be used to reguest such preference. The Purchasing
Division will mzke the determination of the Resident Vendor Praference, if applicable. '

1, Application is made for 2.5% resident vendor praference for the reason checked:

Bidder is an individual resident verdor and has resided continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately praced-
ing the date of this certification; ot,

Bidder is & partnership, association or corporation resident vendor and has maintained its headguarters or principal place of
business continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preceding the date of this ceriffication; or 80% of the
ownarship interest of Bidder is held by another individual, partnership, association or corporation resident vender who has
maintained its headguarters or principal place of business continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately
preceding the date of this certification; or, _

Bidder is a nonresident vendor which has an affiliate or subsidiaty which employs & minimum of one hurdred siate residents
and which has maintained its headguarters or principal place of business within West Virginia continuously for the four (4)
years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or,

2. Application is made for 2.5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is a residert vendor who cettifies that, during the life of the coniract, on average at least 75% of the employees
working on the project being bid are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two years
immediately preceding submission of this bid; or,

3. Application is made for 2.5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:
Bidder is a nonresident vendor employing a minimum of one hundred state residents or is & nonresident vendor with an
affiliste or subsidiary which maintains its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia employing &
minkmum of one hundred state residents who certifies that, during the life of the contract, on average at least 75% of the
employees or Bidder's affiliate's or subsidiary’s employees are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state
continuousty for the two years immediately preceding submission of this bid; or, '

4. Application is made for 5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked: . .
Bidder meets either the requirement of both subdivisions (1) and (2) or subdivision (1) and (3) as stated above; or,

5. Application is made for 3.5% resident vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked:
Bidder is an individual resident vendor who is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard
and has resided in West Virginia continuously for the four years immediately preceding the date on which the bid is
submitted; or,

6. Application is made for 3.5% resident vendor preference who Is a veteran for the reason checked:

Bidder is a resident vendor who is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard, §, for
purposes of producing or distributing the commodities or completing the project which is the subject of the vendor's bid and
continuously over the entire term of the project, on average at least seventy-five percent of the vendor's employees are
residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two immediately preceding years.

Bidder understands if the Secretary of Revenue determines that a Bidder receiving preference has failed to continue fo meet the
requirements for such preference, the Secretary may order the Director of Purchasing o (a) reject ihe bid; or {b) assess a penalty
against such Bidder in an amount not to exceed 5% of the bid amount and that such penalty will be paid to the contracting agency
or deducted from any unpaid balance on the contract or purchase order.

By submission of this certificate, Bidder agrees to disclose any reasonably requested information fo the Purchasing Division and
authorizes the Department of Revenue fo disclose fo the Director of Purchasing appropriate information verifying that Bidder has paid
the required business taxes, provided that such information does not contain the amounts of taxes paid nor any other information
deemned by the Tax Commissiorer to be confidential.

Under penalty of Jaw for false swearing (West Virginia Code, §61-5-3), Bidder hereby certifies that this certificate is true
and accurate in all respects; and that if a contract is issued fo Bidder and if anything confained within this certificate
changes during the term of the contract, Bidder will notify the Purchasing Division in writing immediately.

Bidder: Signed:

Date: Title:

*Check any combinaticn of preference consideration(s) indicated above, which you are entitled to receive.




RFQ No. 669(:0032 8 3

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
Purchasing Division

PURCHASING AFFID

VENDOR OWING A DEBT TO THE STATE:
West Virginia Code §5A-3-10a provides that: No contract or renewal of any contract may be awarded by the
state or any of its political subdivisions to any vendor or prospective vendor when the vendor or prospective
vendor or a related parly to the vendor or prospective vendor is a debtor and the debt owed is an amount
greater than one thousand dollars in the aggregate.

PUBLIC IMPROVEMENT CONTRACTS & DRUG-FREE WORKPLACE ACT:

If this is a soficitation for a public improvement construction contract, the vendor, by its signature below, affirms
that it has a written plan for a drug-free workplace policy in compliance with Article 1D, Chapter 21 of the West
Virginia Code, The vendor must make said affirmation with its bid submission. Further, public improvement
construction contract may not be awarded fo a vendor who does not have a written plan for a drug-free
workplace policy in compliance with Articie 1D, Chapter 21 of the West Virginia Code and who has not
submitted that plan to the appropriate contracting authority in timely fashion. For a vendor who is a
subconiractor, compliance with Section 5, Article 1D, Chapter 21 of the West Virginia Code may take place
before their work on the public improvement is begun.

AVIT

ANTITRUST:

in submitting a bid to any agency for the state of West Virginia, the bidder offers and agrees that if the bid is
accepted the bidder will convey, sell, assign or transfer to the state of West Virginia all rights, title and interest
in and fo all causes of action i may now or hereafter acquire under the antitrust laws of the United States and
the state of West Virginia for price fixing and/or unreasonable restraints of trade relating to the particular
commeodities or services purchased or acquired by the state of West Virginia. Such assignment shall be made
and become effective at the time the purchasing agency tenders the initial payment fo the bidder.

| certify that this bid is made without prior understanding, agreement, or connection with any corporation, firm,
limited liability company, parinership or person or entity submitting a bid for the same materials, supplies,
equipment or services and is in all respects fair and without collusion or fraud. | further certify thatt am
authorized to sign the certification on behalf of the bidder or this bid.

LICENSING:

Vendors must be licensed and in good standing in accordance with any and all state and local laws and
requirements by any state or local agency of West Virginia, including, but not limited to, the West Virginia
Secretary of State’s Office, the West Virginia Tax Department, West Virginia Insurance Commission, or any
other state agencies or political subdivision. Furthermore, the vendor must provide all necessary releases to
obtain information to enable the Director or spending unit to verify that the vendor is licensed and in good
standing with the above entities.

CONFIDENTIALITY:

The vendor agrees that he-or she will not disclose to anyone, directly or indirectly, any such personally
identifiable information or other confidential information gained from the agency, unless the individual who is
the subject of the information consents to the disclosure in writing or the disclosure is made pursuant to the
agency's policies, procedures and rules. Vendor further agrees {0 comply with the Confidentiality Policies and
information Security Accountability Requirements, set forth in http://www state. wv.us/admin/purchase/privacy/

noticeConfidentiality.pdf.

Under penalty of law for false swearing {(West Virginia Code §61-5-3), it is hereby certified that the vendor
affirms and acknowledges the information in this affidavit and is in compliance with the requirements as staled.

Vendor's Name: /Q /Q,VP pad s}

Authorized Signature: Wy

o
Burchasing Affidavit (Revised 01/01/09) /

Date: He)S- O?






