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State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

NOTICE

Due to the size of this bid, it was impractical to scan
every page for online viewing. We have made an
attempt to scan and publish all pertinent bid
information. However, it is important to note that
some pages were necessarily omitted.

If you would like to review the bid in its entirety, please
contact the buyer. Thank you.
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State of West Virginia

“ stV )

Request for pm=—mowmss:
Department of Administration
Pug:hasing Division Quomtlon 66900352 1
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130 MICHAEL AUSTIN
306-H558-2602
%7090349622 540~-992~5500
C3M INC SUMMIT HELICOPTERS INC DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS _
PO BOX 39 VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER
CLOVERDALE VA 24077

04/02/2009

81D OPENING DATE;

06/28/2009

B1D OPENING TIME g1

:30PHM

00G1

HERBICIDES

/ QUESTIONS:
P FRIDAY 04/10//2009
- WILL BE ACCEPTED

1

Q

TO PROVIDE THE MATERIA
THE WEST VIRGINIA
ALL (103 TEN

DIVI
DISTRICTS

THE MODEL/BRAND/SPECIF
THE ACCEPTABLE LEVEL O
INTENDED TO
PARTICULAR BRAND
ALTERNATES SHOULD
LITERATURE AND SPECIFI
INFORMATION
REJECTION OF
TO WAIVE MINCR IRREGUL
IN ACCORDANGE WITH SEC
VIRGINIA LEGISLAT|IVE R

REFLECT A
OR VE
S0 8

FOR ANY AL
THE BID.

THERE WILL BE A MANDAT
STATE CAPITAL COMPLEX,
CONFERENCE R[DOM,
ATTEND THE PRE-BID WIL

AT 10

MUST BE REC
(b:0
AFTER

675-90

PEN END CONTRACT

.S NECESSARY FOR] HERBICIDES FOR
SION OF HIGHWAYS| TO BE USED IN
PER THE ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS

ICATIONS NAMED HEREIN ESTABLISH
F QUALITY ONLY AND ARE NOT
PREFERENCE DR FAVOR ANY

MDOR .
TATE AND INCLUDE] PERTINENT
CATIONS. FAILURE TO PROVIDE
TERNATES MAY BE GRODUNDS FOR
THE STATE RESERVES THE RIGHT
ARITIES IN BIDS {OR SPECIFICATIONS
ITION 148-1-4(F) OF THE WEST

ULES AND REGULATIIONS.

ORY PRE-BID CONFERENCE AT THE
BUILDING 15, PURCHASING DIVISION
:00 AM ON 04/13/09. FAILURE TO
L RESULT IN BID DISQUALIFICATION.

EIVED BY CLOSE OF BUSINESS ON
0 PM, EST) NO FURTHER QUESTIONS
THE DATE STATED.

VENDORS WHO ARE BIDDING M0 APR 28 A I 11

STGNATURE

avi

O

f;eé’?

AT

FITLE v

-

FPEIN

ADDRESS CHANGES

TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHENRESPONDWKBWDRFQINSERTNAMEANDADDRESSINSPACEABOVELABEUﬂVVENDOR



14, BIDDING SCHEDULE

NOTE: Vendor should type bid price

HERRBICIDES
Percent Concentration/
‘ Pounds per Gallon
CHEMICAL FORMULATION of Active Inaredients
DOH-TH WATER SOLUBLE EMULSIFIABLE CONCENTRATE CONTAINING: ‘
Ammonium Salt of Fosamine with Surfactant 4 [bs/galion
Product Trade Name Krenite S

EPA Registration Number 352-395

Supplied in 2 1/2 galion containers in lots of 5 gallons.
A) @%_59.55 per gallon (ie. §_297.75 per lot)

Supplied in 15 gallon returnablefrefillable containers.

B) @%_47.15 per gallon (ie.$ _711.75 per iof)
DOH-2H WATER SOLUBLE EMULSIFIABLE CONCENTRATE CONTAINING:
isopropytamine Salt of Glyphosate 50.2%

Phosphate kzster Surfactant

Product Trade Name | Roundup Pre Concenirate

EPA Registration Number _ 524-526

Suppiied in 30 gallon piastic returnable drums.

A) @$%_35.00 | per galion (i.e. $_1,050.00  per drum)
Supplied in 2.5 gaflon céntainers in l-ots of & galions.

B) @9%_36.20 per gallon (i.e. $ 181.00 periot)

Supplied in 15 gallon returnablefrefillabie containers.

C) @%_nla pergallon(ie.$ _ n/a per lof)
Supplied in 150 gallon returnablefrefillable shuttle.
D) @%_n/a per gallon (ie. $ n/a per shuttle)

The “Bid Schedule” is available for download on Pur

chasing’s Web sife at
wwyw.state. wv.us/admin/purchase ¢




14, BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOH-3H

DOH-4H

A)

DOH-5H

B)

©)

DISPERSIBLE GRANULES CONTAINING:

Sulformeturon Methyl

Product Trade Name Oust XP
352-601

EPA Regisiration Number

Supplied in 3 pound containers in lofs of 24 pounds.
@% 41.00 per pound (i.e. $ 984,00 per lof)
Supplied in 3 pound jug

@% 42.50_ . . perpound(ie §_127.50 _ _ perjug)

WATER SOLUBLE AQUEOUS SUSPENSION CONTAINING:

Oryzalin
Product Trade Name Oryzalin 4 Pro
72167-15-73220

EPA Registration Number

Suppiied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of § gallons.

@S 44,50 227.50

_pergalion (ie. § per lot)

AQUEOUS SOLUTION CONTAINING:
tmazapyr

Product Trade Name Arsenal Powerline

EPA Registration Number 261-431

Supplied in 1 quart containers in lots of 4 quaris

@ $_ 46.00 | per quart (i.e. % 184'00 per ot}
Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in Iﬁts‘ of & gaillons

@ $158.40 per gallon (i.e. $ 792.00 per lot)
Supplied in 15 gallon drums

@ $150,00 pergallon (i.e. $ 2,250.00  perdrum)

14

5%

4 ibsfgalion

2 ths/gallon



14, BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

POH-6H

DOH-TH

A)

B)

OH-8H

B)

AQUEQOUS CARRIER CONTAINING:
Pendimethalin 3.8 ths/galion

Product Trade Name _ Pendulum AguaCap
241416

EPA Registration Number

Supplied in 2.5 gallon container in lots of 5 galions

@% 47.95 pergallon{ie §_ 239.75 periot)

WATER SOLUBLE CONCENTRATE CONTAINING:
Triclopyr 3 Ibslgailon

Product Trade Name Garlon 3A

EPA Registration Number __ 62719-37

Suppiied in 2.5 galton containers in lots of 5 gallons

@$__ 64.75 pergalion (ie.$_ 323.75  periof)

Supplied in 30 galion containérs

@$__ 64.45 per gallon {i.e. $ 1,933.50  per container)

Supplied in 15 galion continuum returmnable/refillable containers in paliets of 8 containers
@$__ 63.50 per galion (ie.$ 85372.50  per pallet)

WATER SOLUBLE CONCENTRATE CONTAINING:
Triclopyr 4 ibs/galion

Product Trade Name _ Garlon 4 Ulira

EPA Registration Number 62719~527

Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of & gallons

@%_ 82,00  pergalion(ie.$__ 410.00 periot)

Supplied in 30 gallon containers

@$__79.30 per galion (ie. $ _2,379.00 ' per container)

Supplied in 15 gallon continuum r@tumable/reﬁliablé containers i pallets of 9 containers

@%$__ 79.30 per gallon (i.e. $ 10,705.50  per pallet)

15



14, BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOH-9H

B)

DOH-10H

B)

C)

DOH-11H

A WATER SOLUBLE DISPERSIBLE GRANULE CONTAINING:

Diuron - B0.0%
Product Trade Name __ Karmex XP

EPA Registration Number 332-692

Supplied in 5 pound bags in lots of 10 bags

@%_6.40 perpound (le. 5 320,00 per iot)

Supplied in 25 pound bags

@ _6.40 per pound (ie.$ _ 160,00 per bag)

WATER SOLUBLE LIQUID CONTAINING:

Dimefhylamine Salt of 2, 4-D acid 3.8 bs/gallon
Product Trade Name DIV Ad

EFPA Registration Number 627i9~3

Supplied in 2.5 galion containers in lots of 5 galions

@%_ 13.35 pergalion {ie. 3 _ 66,75 per lot)

Supplied in 30 gallon drums

@%_n/a pergalion{ie.$_n/a per drum)

Supplied in 15 gallon returnablefrefillable containers in pallets of 9 containers

@%_nla pergallon{le. $ _ n/a per lot)

WATER SOLUBLE LIQUID CONTAINING:
Diethanolamine Salf of Mefluidide
Ammonium Salt of imazethapyr
Ammonium Salt of imazapyr

Product Trade Name Stronghold

EPA Registration Number

21.45%
4,08%
0.15%

Supplied in 1 galion containers in lots of 4 gallons

@$s no bid nobbid

per galion (i.e. §

per lot)

16



14. BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOH-12H

B)

POH-13H

A}

WATER SOLUBLE LIQUID CONTAINING:
Ammonium Salt of Imazapic

Product Trade Name Plateau

EPA Registration Number __ 241-365

Supplied in 1 galion containers in fots of 2 galions
@$_140-75  pergation(ie.$_ 28150 perio)
Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 galions

@% 133.75 per gallon {i.e. § 678.75 ner ot}
Supplied in 1.44 oz packets 14 packets per lot

@% n/a per packef (i.e. $ n/a per lot)
Supplied in 1 gt containers 4 gfs per lot

@% n/a pergt(ie $ n/a per iot)

Supplied in 15 gallon containers
@% 186.95 per galion (i.e. $ 2,804.25 per lot)

A PISPERSIBLE LIQUID CONTAINING:
Hexazinone

Product Trade Name Velpar L

EPA Registration Number 352-392

Supplied in 2 % gallon containers in lots of & galions

@ 64.60 per gaﬂon.(i-_e:$ 323.00 " per container)

23.6%

2 lbs/gallon

17



14, BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOH-144

DOH-15H

DOH-18H

A)

DRY FLOWABLE CONTAINING:
Metsulfuron Methyl - 60%

Product Trade Name Escort XP
352439

EPA Registration Number

Supplied in 16 oz. containers in lots of 8 Ibs. (8-16 oz. cirs.)

@%$___5.75 peroz. {ie.$_736.00 per lot)

Supplied in 16 oz. jug

@%_ 6,00 peroz(ie.$__ 96,00 per jug)

Supplied in 84 oz Jug returnable/refillable

@%__5.50 peroz(le. §_ 352,00 per jug}

WATER SOLUBLE GRANULE HERBICIDE CONTAINING:
Ammonium Salt of Glyphosate 71.4%

Product Trade Name Roundup Pro dry

EPA Registration Name

Supplied in 23.25 Ib. box

@%___n/a 23.251. box {(ie. § nla perlb.)

DRY FLOWABLE CONTAINING: :
Chiorsuifuron T5%

Product Trade Name __ Telar XP

EPA Registration Number 352654

Supplied in 8 x 16 ounce containers to a case

@$% - 260.45 _perounce(ie $33,337.60 per coniainer)

18



14. BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOH-17TH

A)

DOH-18H

B)

DOH-19H

A)

B)

A LIQUID SOLUTION CONTAINING:

Isooctyl ester of 2.4 Dichlorophenoxyacetic Acid ‘ 32.48%
2-athylhrxyl ester of +R-2-(2,4-Dichlorophenoxy)

Propionic Acid | 15.80%
Dicamba (3, 8-Dicholoro-o-anisic Acid 5.38%
Product Trade Name BK-800

EPA Registration Number

Supplied in 2.5 galion containers in lots of 5 galicns

@ % __no bid per gallon (i.e. $ no bid periot)

‘Supplied in 30 gailon drums

@$% _no bid per galton (i.e. $ no bid perdrum)

DRY FLOWARBI E CONTAINING;

Tebuthiuron 80%
Product Trade Name Spike B0 DF

EPA Registration Number

Supplied in 4 pound bags in iots of 24 pounds

@$ no bid perpound(ie $ no bid perlof)

Supplied in 25 pound bags

@% no bid perpound(ie. $ no bid periof)

AWATER SOLUBLE EMULSFIABLE CONCERTRATE CONTAINING:

Clopyralid 3 Ibslgalion

Product Trade Name Franshne Clean Slate

EPA Registration Number __ NuFarm 228-491

Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons
@%__157.60 per galion (ie.$__ 788,00 _ periof)
Supplied in .5 gailon containers in lots of 2 gallons

@%__160.50 pergallon(le.$ __ 321.00  perlot)

19



14, BIDDING SCHEDULE CONT

DOH-20H

A)

DOH-21H

B)

DOH-Z22H

A)

DOH-23H

B)

AQUEQDUS SOLUTION CONTAINING:
isopropylamine Salt of imazapyr 27.6%

Product Trade Name Stalker

EPA Registration Number 241398

Supplied in 1 quart containers in lots of 4 quarts

@3% 62.50 perguart (ie. § 250.00 per lot)

AQUEOCUS SOLUTION CONTAINING:.

Diglycolamine Salt of 3, 6-Dichloro-0- :
Anisic Acid 4 ths/gabion

Product Trade Name Vanguish

228397

EPA Registrafion Number

Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons
@% 57.50 per galion (ie. § 287.50 per lot)

Suppited in 15 gallon refurnable/refilable containers in
pallets of 8 containers

@%_ 2740 pergallon (e $_72749.00  perpaliet)

AQUEOUS SOLUTION CONTAINING:

Triclopyr .75 Ibs/gallon

Product Trade Name Pathfinder i

EPA Registration Number 62719-176

Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gakions

@%_ 137,75 pergallon{ie.$__ 188.75 per lot)

WATER SOLUBLE EMULSIFIABLE CONCENTRATE CONTAINING:
Isopropylamine Salt of Glyphosate 53.8%

Product Trade Name Rodeo  Aqua Neat

EPA Registration Number NuFarm 228-365

Supplied in 2.5 galton containers in lots of 5 gallons
@$_38.45 pergallon(ie.§_ 192.25  perlot)
Supplied in 30 galion piastic returnabte drums

@$ 38.45 per gafion (ie.$ 1,153.50  perdrum)

20



14, BIDDING SCHEDULE COR'T

DOk-24H

B)

BOH-25H

A)

DOH-26H

A)

DOH-27H

A LIQUID CONTAINING:
Aminopyralid

Product Trade Name Milestone VM

EPA Registration Number 62719-537

Supplied in 1 quari containers 12 containers per lot

@%_81.50  perquari{ie.$__978.00

Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers 5 gallons per iof

@$ 279,45 p@rganon (i,e_$1,397.25

WATER DISPERSIBLE GRANULAR MATERIAL CONTAINING:

per lot)

per lot)

Prodiamine

Product Trade Name __ Enduramee  Proclipes 65 WDG

EPA Registration Number _ 228-434

Supplied in 10 pound coniainers 50 pounds per lot

@s 18.75 per pound (ie. $ 937.50

EMULSIFIABLE CONCENTRATE CONTAINING:
Quizalofop P-Ethyl

Product Trade Name Assure H

EPA Registration Number

per jot)

Supplied in 1 gallon containers in lois of 4 gallons

@%__no bid pergalion{ie. $ no bid

EMULSIFIABLE CONCENTRATE CONTAINING:
Fluazifop-P-butyl

Product Trade Name Ornamec

per lot}

EPA Registration Number

Supplied in 1 gallon containers in lots of 4 gallons

@%__no bid pergallon(e. $ _no bid perlof)

40.6%

65%

0.88 Ibs/galion

6.75%

21



14. BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOH-2ZBH A DISPERSIBLE GRANULE CONTAINING:

Imazapyr ' 7.78%
Diuron 82.22%

Product Trade Name Sahara DG
241372

EPA Registration Number

Supplied in 10 pound bags in lots of 40 pounds.

A) @%_9.15 per pound {i.e. $ __ 366,00 perliot)

DOH-29H A WATER SOLUBLE DRY GRANULE CONTAINING:
Sulfosuffuron 75%
Product Trade Name Qutrider

EPA Registration Number »24-500

Supplied in 20 oz botlles in lots of 200 oz

A) @s% 12,75 per oz (Le. § 2,550.00 per iof)
DOH-30H A LIQUID CONTAINING:
Diuron 48%
Product Trade Name Diuron 4L
EPA Registration Number 66222-34
Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lofs of 5 galions
A) @% 21.50 pergallon {i.e. $ 107.50 per lot)
DOH-31H A LIQUID CONTAINING
Fluroxypyr _ 26.2%
Product Trade Name Vista
62719-308

EPA Registration Number

Suppliéd in 2.5 galflon containers in fots of 5 gallons

A) @$ 78.95 per gailon (i.e. $ 394,75 per lot)



14, BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOH-32H

A)

DOH-33H

A)

. B) @%__no bid

DOH-34H

WETTABLE GRANULE FORMULATION CONTAINING

Sodium salt of diflufenzopy: 2-[1-({3.5-difluorophenylaminc} carbony}]

hydrazono} ethyl)-3-pyridinecarboxylic acid, sodium
Sodium salf of 3.6-dichloro-p-anisic acid

Product Trade Name Overdrive

EPA Registration Number

7969-150

Supplied in 7 % 1b. jugs. 30 lbs. per case

@$_30.40 '

perlb. (ie. $_912.00

per case)

RISPERSIBLE GRANULES CONTAINING

Suliometuron Methyl

Chlorsulfuron

Product Trade Name Landmark XP

EPA Registration Number _ 352-645

Suppiled in 4 Ib. jugs in lots of 32 Ibs.

@$% 113.55

perib.{le.$__ 3,633.60

per case)

Supplied in 64 oz jug returnable/refiliable

peroz. (ie. $ no bid

DISPERSIBLE GRANULES CONTAINING

Sutfometuron Methvi

Metsulfuron Methyl

Product Trade Name Qust Extra

EPA Registration Number _ 352-622

per jug)

Supplied in 4 Ib. jugs in lots of 32 Ibs.

@$.43.35

perib.{ie.$_1,387.20

per lot)

Supplied in 64 oz. returnable/refillable

@35_2.85

per jud)

peroz. (ie.$ 182,40

Supplied in 12 ib. jugs

@%__50.00

perfb.(ile. 5_600.00

per jug)

21.4%
55.0%

56.258%
18.75%

56.25%
15.00%

23



14, BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOM-35H

A)

POH-36H

A)

DOH-37H

B)

DOH-38H

A)

A DRY FLOWABLE GRANULE CONTAIRING:
Bromacil : 40%
Diuron . . 40%

Product Trade Name Krovar | DF
352~505

EPA Registrafion Number

Supplied in 6 Ib containers in lots of 8 containers

@$ 12.20 perlb (ie. §_585.60 per iof)

A LIQUID CONTAINING:

Imazapic 8.13%
Glyphosate 21.94%

Product Trade Name Journey

EPA Registration Number __ 241-417

Supplied 17 Yrbrogs—-30-ibspercase

EPfA Registratior Moradwer

Supplied in 2.5 galion containers in lots of 5 gallons
@$ _109.75  pergallon(ie. $__548.75 per lot)
A LIQUID CONTAINING:

Dinethyiamine Salt of 2,4-Dichiovophenoxyacetic Acid 24.58%
Dimethylamine Salt of Dicamba (3,6-Dichloro-o-Anisic Acid}) 12.82%

Product Trade Name Veteran 720

EPA Registration Number 228-~295

Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons

@%_28.15 pergafion (ie. $_ 140,75 per iof)
Supplied in 30 gallon drums

28.15 844,50
@% per gallon (i.e. $ per drum)

DISPERSIBLE GRANULES CONTAINING

Chiorsulfuron ‘ 9%
Sulfometuron Methyl 18%

Sulfentrazone 48_%

Product Trade Name Throttie XP

EPA Registration Number __ 392-725

Supplied in 3.9 Ib. containers, & cantainers per case

@s 96.75 perib (ie.§ _3s018.60 per case)

24



14.  BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

25

DOH-1A

DOH.2A

DOH-3A

A)

DOH-4A

A).

DOH-5A

DOH-8A

A)

ADJUVANTS

A WATER SOLUBLE BLUE LIQUID SPRAY PATTERN INDICATOR

Product Trade Name ___Buliseye
Supplied in __ 2.5 gallon _ containers in lots of 5 gallons

@$%_38.00 per galion (i.e.$ _190.00 per ot}

- AMISCIBLE-DISPERSIBLE LIQUID DEFOAMER (30% Active ingredient)

Product Trade Name Brewer Defoamer
Suppliedin _1 qt containers in tois of __ 12 '
@%_7.25 per (ie.$ 87,00  perlot)

A DILUENT WITH EMULSIFIERS

Product Trade Name _Hyvgrade EC or Arborchem Rasal Qil or Bark Ol EC
Or Alenza Basal Oil or Penevator

Sijppiied in containers in lots of ' gallons

@9%_no hid per gallor (i,e, $ ___no bid per lot)

NON-IONIC SURFACTANT (90% Active ingredient)

Product Trade Name ~ Sumnit 910

Supplied in_2+5 831100 niiners in lots of ) gallons

@$ 12.90 per gallon (i:e. $ 60.00 per lof) -

A GRANULAR/FLAKE DRIFT CONTROL AGENT

Product Trade Name __AOBi D

Supplied in containers in lofs of containers_
@$ _no bid per (le.$__ perlot)

A LIQUID DRIFT CONTROL AGENT

Product Trade Name _FPoly Comtrol T1I

Suppliedin _ 1 gt containers in fots of 12




14, BIDDING SCHEDULE CONT

DOH-TA AQUATIC SURFACTANT

Product Trade Name Summit 910

. Supplied in 2.5 GALLON containers in fofs of > gallons
A) @% 12.00 per gallon (i.e. $ __ 60,00 per of)
DOH-BA AWATER SOLUBLE LIQUID SPRAY PATTERN INDICATOR

Product Trade Name BigeorhriPlus Alligare Marker Dye

Supplied in __ 2.5 galion ___ containers in lofs of 5 gallons

A) @%_28.75 pergallon (ie.$ 143,75 per lot)

DOH-10A A NON-IONIC STICKER SPREADER

Product Trade Name Nu-Film-IR

Supplied in 2 12 galion containers in lots of 3 gallons

A) @ 9% 32.45 per gaflon (i.e. % 162.25 per lot)

DOH-11A A READY TO USE FORMULA CONTAINING PARFFINIC OIt. EMULSIFIERS

Product Trade Name _ Thinvert RTU

Supplied in 2 ¥ gallon jugs. 5 gallon per case

A} @% no bid per gallon (e § no bid per case) |

Supplied in 15 gallon drum

B} @s¢ no bid per gafion




14.

BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOH-124 A CONCENTRATE FORMULA CONTAINING PARFINNK OIL EMULSIFIERS

AND SURFACTANTS

Product Trade Name Thinvert Concentrate

Supplted in 2 ¥ gallon jugs. 5 gallon per case

A) @ o bid - per galon (le.§ 0 bid per case)

Supplied in 15 gallon drum

B) @s¢ Do bid - . per galion

27 .



14, BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOH-1S

A)

DOH-28

DOH-3&

A)

DOH-45

DOH-58

A)

SAFETY EQUIPMENT

EMERGENCY SPILL KIT CONTAINING:

15 Universal Plus Sorbent Pads

3 Cobra Coils

1 Pair Safety Goggles

1 Pair Latex Gloves

1 Large Refuse Bag

1 List of Environmental Compliance Telephone Numbers
18" x 18" x 4"
Vacuum Packed in Puncture Resistant Foil

Product Trade Name Ao 2D

@9 per each

A GRANULAR/FLAKE SPILL ABSORBENT

Product Trade Name MO TBOD

Suﬁplied i containers in lots of confainers
@3 per pound (i.e. $ per iof)

3 LAYER FABRIC COVERALLS (ALL SIZES)

Product Trade Name Kieen Guard

Supplied in 12 ealcase

@9 pereach (ie. §_mMo 0> per case)
MSPOSABLE COVERALLS

Product Trade Name Tyvek

Supplied in 25 ealcase

@3 per each (le. § MOBID per case)

32 OZ, EYE WASH BOTTLE

Produet Trade Name MO RBD

Supplied per each

@$ per each

28



14, BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

MISCELLANEOUS

DOH-1M PRESSURE RINSER

Product Trade Name Easy Rinse

Supplied per sach

A) @% per each
DOH-2M HAND SOAP WITH CITRUS OIL
Product Trade Name Zep

Suppiied in 32 oz. containers in lofs of 20 coniainers per case

A) @3 per container {i.e.$ Mo Bid  percase)

DOH-3M A BIOSTIMULANT CONTAINING:
Soluble Potash _ 1.00%
fron 0.36%
Manure Extract . | 79.30%
Humic and Fulvic Acid Extract 9.00%
Keip Extract 1.20%
Organo-Modified Silaxane Surfactant 0.36%
Product Trade Name Launch

Supplied in 2.5 galion containers in lots of 5 gallons

A) @% per galion (i.e. $_pio Bid per fot)
DOH-4M AWORK BOOT
Product Trade Name lron Duke

Compliance EPA 40 CFR 170
Supplied per pair

A) @ Size (6-11) % e per pair

B3 @ Size (12+) $ < per pair



14, BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOH-5M

DOH-GM

DCH-7M

DOR-8M

A)

B)

RUBBER BOOT/SHOE COVERS

Compliance EPA 40 CFR 170

Supplied per pair

@ Size M (8-9)% P per pair
@ Size L (10-11) § - per pair

@ Size XL (1213)$ .~ per pair

SAFETY GOGGLES ~ indirect vent

Meets ANS1 287.1-1989

@%_jo B per each

FACE SHIELD —~ positive lock headgear

Meels ANS1 287.1-188% and
CAN1CSA-294 3-92 Specifications

@%_NOTBN  pereach

A 5-GALLON BACKPACK SPRAYER

Product Trade Name Birchmeier

@%_ MO per sprayer

Gasket Set For Sprayer Pump

@%_ o od per set

Hose Valve & Wand Repair Kit

@% _ wnd¥>  perkit
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14. BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOH-&i

A)

DOH-10M

DOH-T1TM

NITRI-BOLVE 100% NITRILE GLOVES
15 mil 13" Nitrile Gloves

Compitance EPA 40 CFR 170

Sizes 5, M, L, XL, or 2XL

@3 / per palr

2-QUART HANDHELD PRESSURE SPRAYER

Product Trade Name Tolco

@s$ / per sprayer -

CLOSED SYSTEM BACKPACK SPRAYER

Product Trade Name Birchmier BCS

@% / per sprayer
Gasket set for sprayer pump

@ 3% / per set

Hose Valve & Wand repair kit

@¥%_ / per kit
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VENDOR PREFERENCE CERTIFICATE

Ceriification and application® is hersby made for Preference in accordance with West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37. (Does not apply to
construction contracts). West Virginfa Code, §5A-3-37, providas an opporiunity for qualifying vendors o request {at the time of bid)
praference for thekr residency siatus. Such preference is an evaluation method only and will be applied only fo the cost bid in
accordance with the West Virginia Code, This certificate for application is to be used to reguest such preference. The Purchasing
Division will make the determination of the Resident Vendor Praference, if applicable. ‘

1. Application is made for 2.5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidderis an individuat resideni vendor and has resided continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preced-
ing ihe date of this ceriification; or,

Bidder is a parinership, association or corporation resident vendor and has maintained its headguariers of principal place of
business continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preceding the date of this cerfification; or 80% of the
ownership interest of Bidder is held by another individual, partnership, association or corporation resident vendor who has
maintained its headquarters or principal place of business continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately
preceding the date of this certification; or, )

Bidder is 2 nonresident vendor which has an affiiate or subsidiary which empioys a minimum of one hundred state residents
and which has maintained its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia continuously for the four (4)
years immediately preceding the date of this ceriification; or, ‘

2. Application is made for 2.5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:
Bidder is a resident vendor who certifies that, during the fife of the contract, on average at least 75% of the employees
working on the project being bid are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two years
immediately preceding submission of this bid; o,

3, Application is made for 2.5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:
Ridder is & nonresident vendor emnploying a minimum of one hundred state residents or is a nonresident vendor with an
affiliate or subsidiary which maintains its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia employing a
minimum of one hundred state residents who certifies that, during the life of the contract, on average at least 75% of the
employees or Bidder's affiliate’s or subsidiary's employees are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state
continuously for the two years immediately preceding subrnission of this bid; or,

4, Application is made for 5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked: S
Bidder meets either the requirement of both subdivisions (1) and (2) or subdivision (1) and (3) as stated above; o,

5. Application Is made for 3.5% resident vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked:
Bidder is an individual resident vendor who is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves orthe National Guard
and has resided in West Virginia continuously for the four years immediately preceding the date on which the bid is
submitted; or,

8, Applicafion is made for 3.5% resident vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked:

Ridder is a resident vendor who is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard, if, for
purposes of producing or distributing the commodities of completing the project which is the subject of the vendor’s bid and
continuolsly over the entire term of the project, on average at least seventy-five percent of the vendor's employees are
residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two immeadiately preceding years.

Ridder uriderstands if the Secretary of Revenue determines that a Bidder receiving preference has failed to continue fo meet the
requirements for such preference, the Secretary may orderthe Director of Purchasing to: {a) refect the bid; or (b) assess a penalty
against such Bidder in an amount not to excesd 5% of the bid amount and that such penalty will be paid to the confracting agency
or deducted from any unpaid balance on the contract or purchase order. ‘

By subrnission of this certificate, Bidder agrees to disclose any reasonably requested information to the Purchasing Division and
authorizes the Department of Revenue to disclose to the Director of Purchasing appropriate information verifying that Bidder has paid
the required business taxes, provided that such infermation does not contain the amounts of taxes paid nor any other information
deerned by the Tax Commissioner to be confidential. :

Under penalty of law for false swearing (West Virginia Code, §61-5-3}, Bidder hereby certifies that this certificate is true
and accurate in all respects; and that if a confract is issued to Bidder and if anything contained within this certificate
changes during the term of the confract, Bidder will notify the Purchasing Division in writing immediately.

Bidder: Signed:

Date: Title:

*Check any combination of preference consideration{s) indicated above, which you are entitled fo receive,
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STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
Purchasing Division

PURCHASING AFFIDAVIT

VENDOR OWING A DEBT TO THE STATE:

West Virginia Code §5A-3-102 provides that: No contract or renewal of any coniract may be awarded by the
state or any of its political subdivisions o any vendor or prospective vendor when the vendor or prospective
vendor of a related party fo the vendor or prospective vendor is a debtor and the debt owed is an amount
greater than one thousand dollars in the aggregate.

PUBLIC IMPROVEMENT CONTRACTS & DRUG-FREE WORKPLACE ACT:

If this is a solicitation for a public improvement construction confract, the vendor, by ifs signature below, affirms
that it has a written plan for a drug-free workplace policy in compliance with Article 1D, Chapter 21 of the West
Virginia Code. The vendor must make said affirmation with its bid submission. Further, public improvement
construction contract may not be awarded fo a vendor who does not have a written plan for a drug-free
workplace policy in compliance with Article 1D, Chapter 21 of the West Virginia Code and who has not
submitted that plan fo the appropriate confracting authority in timely fashion. For a vendor who is a
subconiracior, compliance with Section 5, Article 1D, Chapter 21 of the West Virginia Code may take place
before their work on the public improvement is begun.

ANTITRUST: :

In submitting a bid to any agency for the state of West Virginia, the bidder offers and agrees that if the bid is
accepted the bidder will convey, sell, assign or fransfer to the state of West. Virginia all rights, title and interest
in and fo all causes of action it may now or hereafter acquire under the antitrust laws of the United Stafes and
the state of West Virginia for price fixing and/or unreasonable restraints of trade relating to the particular
commodities or services purchased or acquired by the state of West Virginia. Such assignment shall be made
and become effective at the time the purchasing agency tenders the initial payment {o the bidder.

| certify that this bid is made without prior understanding, agreement, or connection with any corporation, firm,
iimited fiability company, partnership or person or entity subrmitling a bid for the same materials, supplies,
equipment or services and is in all respects fair and without collusion or fraud. | further ceriify that | am
authorized to sign the certification on behalf of the bidder or this bid.

LICENSING:

Vendors must be licensed and in good standing in accordance with any and all state and local laws and
requirements by any state or local agency of West Virginia, including, but not limited fo, the West Virginia
Secretary of State’s Office, the West Virginia Tax Department, West Virginia Insurance Commission, ofr any
other state agencies or political subdivision. Furthermore, the vendor must provide all necessary releases to
obtain information to enable the Director or spending unit to verify that the vendor is licensed and in good
standing with the above entities.

CONFIDENTIALITY:

The vendor agrees that he or she will not disclose to anyone, directly or indirectly, any such personally
identifiable information or other confidential information gained from the agency, unless the individual who is
the subject of the information consents to the disclosure in writing or the disclosure is made pursuant to the
~agency's policies, procedures and rules. Vendor further agrees to comply with the Confidentiality Policies and
information Security Accountability Requirements, set forth in hitp:/hwww state wv.usfadmin/purchase/privacy/
noticeConfidentiality.pdf. :

Under penalty of law for false swearing (West Virginia Code §61-5-3), it is hereby certified that the vendor
affirms and acknowledges the information in this affidavit and is in compliance with the requirements as stated.

Vendor's Name: _Summit Helicopferd Inc, -
Authorized Sighature: A %) Date:  4/27/09
G el o ———

\q._.......;—-“" ¥
Purchasing Affidavit {Revised 01/01/09) /




