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State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

NOTICE

Due to the size of this bid, it was impractical to scan
every page for online viewing. We have made an
attempt to scan and publish all pertinent bid
information. However, it is important to note that
some pages were necessarily omitted.

If you would like to review the bid in its entirety, please
contact the buyer. Thank you.
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*¥913105630

State of West Virginia
Purchasing Division

Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

Department of Administration

Request for
Quotation

2019 Washington Street East

724-865-9180 _
UAP DISTRIBUTION INC Ctpp Produchon Serny
121 PFLUGH ROAD 1950 Touchsford Rood

BUTLER PA 16001 Golonial Heights, A

23834

304-hh8-2602

M)IVISION OF HIGHWAYS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER

04/02/2009

BID OPENING DATE:

04/28/2009

0001

1
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14. BIDDING SCHEDULE
Vendors please type prices

HERBICIDES
Percent Concentration/
Pounds per Gallon
CHEMICAL FORMULATION of Active Ingredients

DOH-1H WATER SOLUBLE EMULSIFIABLE CONCENTRATE CONTAINING:

Ammonium Salt of Fosamine with Surfactant 4 Ibs/galion

Product Trade Name Krenite §

EPA Registration Number 352-395

Supplied in 2 1/2 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons.
A) @%__54.73 per gallon (i.e. $ __ 273.65 per lot)
Supplled in 15 gallon returnable/refilable containers.

B) @ $__5047 per gallon (i.e. $ __757.05 per lot)

DOH-2H WATER SOLUBLE EMULSIFIABLE CONCENTRATE CONTAINING:
Isopropylamine Salt of Glyphosate 50.2%

Phosphate Ester Surfactant

Product Trade Name Roundup Pro Concentrate

EPA Registration Number 524-529

Supplied in 30 gallon plastic returnable drums.

A) @$__3428 per gallon (i.e. $ _ 1,028.40 per drumy)
Supplied In 2.5 gallon containers In lots of 5 gallons.

B) @$__3482 per galion (i.e. $ __174.10 per lot)
Supplied in 15 gallon returnable/refillable containers.

C) @$__34.28 per gallon (i.e. $ __514.20 per lot)
Supplied in 150 gallon returnable/refillable shuttie.

D) @3$__34.28 per gallon (i.e. $ __5,142.00 per shuttle)



14. BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOH-3H DISPERSIBLE GRANULES CONTAINING:
Sulfometuron Methyl 75%

Product Trade Name Qust XP

EPA Registration Number ___ 352-601

Supplied in 3 pound containers in lots of 24 pounds.
A) @$_ 5210 perpound (i.e.$__1,25040_______ perlot)
B) Supplied in 3 pound jug
@$__54.20 per pound (i.e. $ __162.60 per jug)
DOH-4H WATER SOLUBLE AQUEOUS SUSPENSION CONTAINING:
Oryzalin 4 Ibs/gallon

Product Trade Name Oryzalin 4 Pro

EPA Registration Number No Bid

Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 galions.
A) @s per gallon (L.e. $ per lot)
DOH-5H AQUEOUS SOLUTION CONTAINING:

Imazapyr 2 ibs/gallon

Product Trade Name .Arsenal Powerline
EPA Registration Number 241-431

Supplied in 1 quart containers in lots of 4 quarts

A) @$__177.99 per quart (i.e. $__711.96 per lof)
Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons

B) @$__162.07 per gallon (i.e. $ _ 810.35 per lot)
Supplied in 15 galion drums

C) @$__158.25 per gallon (i.e. § _2,373.75 per drum)



14, BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOH-6H AQUEOUS CARRIER CONTAINING:
Pendimethalin 3.8 ibs/gallon

Product Trade Name _ Pendulum AgquaCap
EPA Registration Number ___241-416

Supplied in 2.5 gallon container in lots of 5 gallons

A) @ 9%, _46.84 per galion {i.e. $ __234.20 per lot)

DOH-7H WATER SOLUBLE CONCENTRATE CONTAINING:
Triclopyr 3 Ibs/gallon

Product Trade Name Garlon 3A

EPA Registration Number 62719-37

Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons

A) @ $__58.17 per gallon (i.e. $ __290.85 per lot)

Supplied in 30 gallon containers
B) @ $__5817 per gallon (i.e. $ __1,745.10 per container)
Supplied in 15 gallon continuum returnable/refillable containers in paliets of 9 containers
C) @$__ 58.27 per gallon (i.e. $ __7,866.45 per paliat)
DOH-8H WATER SOLUBLE CONCENTRATE CONTAINING:
Triclopyr 4 Ibs/galion

Product Trade Name __Garlon 4 Ultra

EPA Registration Nurmber 62719-527

Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of & galons
A) @$__7488 per gallon (i.e. $ __374.30 per lot)
Supplied in 30 gallon containers

B) @$__74.88 per galion (i.e. $ __2,245.80 per container)

Supplied in 15 galion continuum returnable/refillable containers in pallets of © containers

C) @%__74.86 per gallon (i.e. $ __10,106.10 per pallef)



14. BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOH-9H

A)

B)

DOH-10H

A)

B)

C)

DOH-11H

A)

A WATER SOLUBLE DISPERSIBLE GRANULE CONTAINING:

Diuron

Product Trade Name Karmex XP

EPA Registration Number 352-692

Supplied in 5 pound bags in lots of 10 bags
@$__368 per pound {i.e. $__184.00
Supplied in 25 pound bags
@%$_368___ . perpound(ie. $__ 92.00

WATER SOLUBLE LIQUID CONTAINING:
Dimsthylamine Salt of 2, 4-D acid

Product Trade Name M A4

EPA Registration Number ___ 82719-3

Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons
@%__14.05 per gallon (i.e. $ ___70.25
Supplied in 30 gallon drums

@ $__14.05 pergallon (i.e. $__ 421.50

Supplied in 15 gallon returnable/refillable containers in pallets of 9 containers

@$%__15.05 per gallon (l.e. $ ___2,031.75

WATER SOLUBLE LIQUID CONTAINING:

Diethanolamine Salt of Mefluidide
Ammonium Salt of Imazethapyr
Ammonium Salt of Imazapyr

Product Trade Name Stronghold
EPA Registration Number 2217-802

Supplied in 1 gallon containers in lots of 4 gallons

@ $__310.00 pergallon (i.e. $ __1,240.00

80.0%
per lot)
per bag)
3.8 lbs/gallon
per lot)
per drum)
per lot)
21.45%
4.09%
0.15%
per lot)



14. BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T
DOH-12H WATER SOLUBLE LIQUID CONTAINING:

Ammonium Salt of Imazapic 23.6%

Product Trade Name Plateau

EPA Registration Number 241-365

Supplied in 1 gallon containers in lots of 2 gallons

A) @3 ___142.00 per galion (i.e. $ __284.00 per lot)
Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons

B) @5$ ___142.00 pergallon (i.e. $___710.00 per lot)
Supplied in 1.44 oz packets 14 packets per lot

G @ $___NoBid per packet (i.e. $ per lot)

Supplied in 1 qt containers 4 qts per ot

D) @%___NoBid perqt{ie. § per tot)
E) Supplied in 15 gallon containers
@ $__142.00 per gallon (l.e. $ ___ 2,130.00 per lot)

DOH~13H A DISPERSIBLE LIQUID CONTAINING:

Hexazinone 2 Ibs/gallon
Product Trade Name Velpar L,

EPA Registration Number __ 352-392

Supplied in 2 ¥ gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons

A) @$._. 6240 per gallon (i.e. $__312.00 per container)



14. BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOH-14H DRY FLOWABILE CONTAINING:
Maetsulfuron Methyl 60%

Product Trade Name Escort XP

EPA Registration Number ___352-439

Supplied in 18 oz. containers in lots of 8 Ibs. (8-16 oz, ctrs.)

A) @%__6.92 peroz. (i.e. 5 _ 885.76 per lot)

Supplied in 16 oz. jug
B) @$__692 peroz (ie.$___110.72 per jug)
C) Supplied in 64 oz Jug returnable/refillable

@$_8642 peroz(l.e. $___ 41088 per jug)

DOH-16H WATER SOLUBLE GRANULE HERBICIDE CONTAINING:
Ammonium Salt of Glyphosate 71.4%

Product Trade Name QuikPRO
EPA Registration Name 524-535

A) Supplied in 27.2 ib. box (4 x 6.8 Ib jugs)
@ $__375.36 27.2Ib. box (i.e. $ __13.80 per Ib.)

DOH-16H DRY FLOWABLE CONTAINING:
Chlorsulfuron 75%

Product Trade Namme ___Telar XP
EPA Registration Number 352-654

Supplied in 8 x 18 ounce containers to a case

A) @$___16.80 per ounce {i.e. $ ___ 268.80 per container)



14. BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOH-17TH

A)

B)

DOH-18H

A)

B)

DOH-19H

A)

B)

A LIQUID SOLUTION CONTAINING:
Isooctyl ester of 2.4 Dichlorophenoxyacetic Acid

2-ethylhrxy! ester of +R-2-(2,4-Dichlorophenoxy)
Propionic Acid

Dicamba (3, 6-Dicholoro-o-anisic Acid

Product Trade Name BK-800

EPA Registration Number 2217-758
Suppilied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of & gallons
@%___6580 per gallon (i.e. $ ___ 329.00 per lot)

Supplied in 30 gallon drums

@%$__ 65860 per gallon (i.e. $ __ 1,968.00 per drum)

DRY FLOWABLE CONTAINING:

Tebuthiuron

Product Trade Name Spike 80 DF
EPA Registration Number __62719-107

Supplied in 4 pound bags in lots of 24 pounds

@$___24.10 per pound {i.e. $ __578.40 per lot)
Supplied in 25 pound bags

@$___23.80 per pound (i.e. $ __595.00 per lot)

AWATER SOLUBLE EMULSFIABLE CONCERTRATE CONTAINING;
Clopyralid

Product Trade Name ___Transline

EPA Registration Number 62719-259

Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons
@$___148.14 per gallon (i.e. $ _ 740.70 per lot)
Supplied in .5 gallon containers in lots of 2 gallons

@ $___ No Bid per gallon (l.e. $ per lof)

32.48%

16.90%

5.38%

80%

3 Ibs/galion



14. BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOH-20H

A)

DOH-21H

A)

B)

DOH-22H

A)

DOH-23H

A)

B)

AQUEOUS SOLUTION CONTAINING:

Isopropylamine Sait of Imazapyr

Product Trade Name Stalker

EPA Registration Number ____241-398

Supplied in 1 quart containers in lots of 4 quarts
@$___242.50 per quart (i.e. $ __970.00
AQUEOUS SOLUTION CONTAINING:

Diglycolamine Salt of 3, 8-Dichloro-0-
Anisic Acid

Product Trade Name Vanquish

EPA Registration Number ____228-397

Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons
@$%__5380 per gallon (i.e. $ __269.00

Supplied in 15 galion returnable/refillable containers in
pallets of 9 containers

@ $__53.80 per gallen (i.e. $ _ 7,263.00
AQUEOUS SOLUTION CONTAINING:
Triclopyr

Product Trade Name Pathfinder i
EPA Registration Number 62719-176

Supplied in 2.5 galion containers in lots of 5 gallons

@$__3245 per gallon (i.e. $ __182.25

27.6%
per lot)
4 ibs/gallon
per lot)
per pallet)
.75 lbs/galion
per lot)

WATER SOLUBLE EMULSIFIABLE CONCENTRATE CONTAINING:

Isopropylamine Salt of Glyphosate

Product Trade Name Rodeo

EPA Registration Number ___82719-324

53.8%

Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons
@$__4360 per gallon (i.e. $ __218.00
Supplied in 30 gallon plastic returnable drums

@%$_4360____ pergallon (i.e. $__1,308.00

per lot)

per drumy)



14. BIDDING SCHEDULE CON']

DOH-24H A LIQUID CONTAINING:
Aminopyralid 40.6%

Product Trade Name Milestone VM

EPA Registration Number 62719-537

Supplied in 1 quart containers 12 containers per lot

A) @ $__70.05 per quart (i.e. $ __840.60 per lot)
Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers 5 gallons per ot

B) @$__ 27262 per gallon (i.e. $ __1,363.10 per lot)

DOH-25H WATER DISPERSIBLE GRANULAR MATERIAL CONTAINING:
Prodiamine 65%

Product Trade Name _ Proclipse 656 WDG
EPA Registration Number ___228-434

Supplied in 5 pound containers 20 pounds per lot
A) @s$__17.15 per pound (i.e. $ ___343.00 per lot)
DOH-26H EMULSIFIABLE CONCENTRATE CONTAINING:
Quizalofop P-Ethyi 0.88 Ihs/gallon
Product Trade Name Assure ll

EPA Registration Number ___352-541

Supplied in 1 gallon containers in lots of 4 gallons
A) @ $__145.00 per gatlon (i.e. $ __580.00 per lof)
DOH-27H EMULSIFIABLE CONCENTRATE CONTAINING:
Fluazifop-P-butyl 6.76%

Product Trade Name __Omame¢

EPA Registration Number 2217-728

Supplied in 1 gallon containers in lots of 4 gallons

A) @$%$.. 5200 per gallon (i.e. $ ___208.00 per lot)




14. BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOH-28H

A)

DOH-29H

A)

DOH-30H

A)

DOH-31H

A)

A DISPERSIBLE GRANULE CONTAINING:

imazapyr
Diuron

Product Trade Name Sahara DG

EPA Registration Number ___ 241-372

Supplied in 10 pound bhags in lots of 40 pounds.
@%$__10.90 per pound (i.e. $ __436.00
AWATER SOLUBLE DRY GRANULE CONTAINING:
Sulfosulfuron

Product Trade Name __ Outrider

EPA Registration Number 524-500

Supplied in 20 oz bottles in lots of 200 oz

@%__11.20 per oz (i.e. $ __2,240.00

A LIQUID CONTAINING:

Diuron

Product Trade Name Direx 4L

EPA Registration Number __ 352-678

Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons
@%$__2240 per galion (i.e. $___112.00
A LIQUID CONTAINING

Fluroxypyr

Product Trade Name Vista

EPA Registration Number ____62719-308

Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons

@$__786.20 per gallon (i.e. $ __381.00

7.78%
62.22%
per lof)
75%
per lot)
40%
per lot)
26.2%
per lot)



14. BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOH-32H

A)

DOH-33H

A)

B) @$%__6.77

DOH-34H

A)

B)

C)

WETTABLE GRANULE FORMULATION CONTAINING

Sodium salt of diffufenzopy: 2-[1-({3.5-difluorophenylamino} carbony}]

hydrazono} ethyl)-3-pyridinecarboxylic acid, sodium
Sodium salt of 3.6-dichloro-g-anisic acid
Product Trade Name Overdrive

EPA Registration Number ___ 7869-150

21.4%
§5.0%

Supplied in 7 %2 Ib. jugs. 30 Ibs. per case

@ $__31.90 per ib. (i.e. $__957.00

DISPERSIBLE GRANULES CONTAINING
Suifometuron Methyl

Chlorsulfuron

Product Trade Name Landmark XP

EPA Registration Number 352-645

per case)

§6.26%
18.756%

Supplied in 4 Ib. jugs in lots of 32 Ibs.
@ $__118.27 perib. (i.e. $___3,784.64
Supplied in 64 oz jug returnable/refillable

peroz. (ie. §__ 433.28

DISPERSIBLE GRANULES CONTAINING
Sulfometuron Methyl

Metsulfuron Methyl
Product Trade Name Qust Extra

EPA Registration Number 352-622

per case)

per jug)

§6.25%
15.00%

Supplied in 4 tb. jugs in lots of 32 lbs.

@%__ 5218 perlb. (i.e. $__1,669.76

per lot)

Supplied in 64 oz. returnable/refillable
@$__3.08 peroz. {i.e. $§_ 197.12
Supplied in 12 Ib. jugs

@ $___NoBid per Ib. (i.e. $

per jug)

per jug)



14. BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOH-356H

A)
DOH-36H

A)

DOH-37H

A)

B)

DOH-38H

A)

A DRY FLOWABLE GRANULE CONTAINING:

Bromacit
Diuron

Product Trade Name Krovar | DF

EPA Registration Number 352-505

Supplied in 6 ib containers in lots of 8 containers

@%$___12.05 perib (i.e. $___578.40

A LIQUID CONTAINING:
Imazapic
Glyphosate

Product Trade Name Journey

EPA Registration Number 241-417

Supplied in 7 ¥ ib. jugs. 30 Ibs. per case

EPA Registration Numher 241.417

Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of & galions
@$%___105.12

A LIQUID CONTAINING:

Dimethylamine Salt of 2,4-Dichlovophenoxyacetic Acid

per gallon (i.e. $ __525.60

Dimethylamine Salt of Dicamba (3,8-Dichloro-o-Anisic Acid)

Product Trade Name Veteran 720

EPA Registration Number ___228-295

Supplied in 2.5 galion containers in lots of 5 gallons

@$__ 2763 pergallon (i.e. $ __138.15

Supplied in 30 gallon drums

@%$__.27.40 per gallon (i.e. $ __ 822.00
DISPERSIBLE G LES CONTAINING
Chlorsulfuron

Sulfometuron Methyl

Sulfentrazone

Product Trade Name Throttis XP

EPA Registration Number 352-725

Supplied in 3.9 Ib. containers, 8 containers per case

@$__ 109.24 perib (le.$ __ 3.408.29

40%
40%
per lot)
8.13%
21.94%
per lot)
24.58%
12.82%
per lot)
per drum)
9%
18%
48%
per case)




14. IDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOH-1A

A)

DOH-2A

A)

DOH-3A

A)

DOH-4A

A)

DOH-5A

A)

DOH-6A

A)

ADJUVANTS

A WATER SOLUBLE BLUE LIQUID SPRAY PATTERN INDICATOR

Product Trade Name Bullseye
Supplied in 2.5 gallon  containers in lots of 5 gallons

@ %$__36.10 per gallon (ji.e. $ ____180.50 per lot)

A MISCIBLE-DISPERSIBLE LIQUID DEFOAMER (30% Active Ingredient)
Product Trade Name _Unfoamer '

Supplied in _1 quart containers in lots of ___12

@%___15.83 per quart {i.e. $___ 189.96 per lot)

A DILUENT WITH EMULSIFIERS
Product Trade Name _ Hyarade EC or Arborchem Basal Oil or Bark Oil EC

Or Alenza Basal Qil or Penevator
Supplied in __15 gallon containers in lots of __151to0 135 galions

@3%$__9.60 per gallon (i,e, $ _144 to $1,296.00 per lot)

NON-IONIC SURFACTANT (90% Active Ingredient)

Product Trade Name _Spreader 90

Supplied in ____2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons

@%___11.80 per gallon (i.e. $ ___59.00 per lot)

A GRANULAR/FLAKE DRIFT CONTROL AGENT
Product Trade Name No Bid

Supplied in containers in lots of containers

@ per (ie. $ per lot)

A LIQUID DRIFT CONTROL AGENT
Product Trade Name _Reign LC

Supplied in __1 quart containers in lots of 12

@% 825 per ___quart (i.e. $__90.00 per lot)



14. BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOH-7A AQUATIC SURFACTANT
Product Trade Name _Spreader 90

Supplied in __2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons

A) @53 11.80 per galion (i.e. $ ____59.00 per lot)

DOH-8A A WATER SOLUBLE LIQUID SPRAY PATTERN INDICATOR

Product Trade Name Blueprint Plus
Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons

A) @ $___No Bid per gallon (i.e. $ per lot)

DOH-10A A NON-IONIC STICKER SPREADER

Product Trade Name Nu-Film-IR

Supplied in 2 ¥ gallon containers in lots of ___3 gallons

A) @$%__3280 per galion (i.e. $ ___164.00 per lot)

DOH-11A A READY TO USE FORMULA CONTAINING PARFFINIC OIL. EMULSIFIERS

Product Trade Name _ Thinvert RTU

Supplied in 2 2 gallon jugs. 5 gallon per case

A) @% No Bid per gallon (i.e. $ per case)

Supplied in 15 gailon drum

B) @S No Bid per gallon




y

14. BIDDING SCHEDULE CON’

DOH-12A A CONCENTRATE FORMULA CONTAINING PARFINNK Oll. EMUL SIFIERS
AND 8 ACTANTS

Product Trade Name Thinvert Concentrate

Supplied in 2 % gallon jugs. 5 gallon per case

A) @93 No Bid per gallon (i.e. $ per case)

Supplied in 15 gallon drum

B) @$ No Bid per galion




14, BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOH-1S

A)

POH-28

A)

POH-38

A)

DOH-4S

A)

DOH-5S

A)

SAFETY EQUIPMENT

EMERGENCY SPILL KIT CONTAINING:

15 Universal Plus Sorbent Pads

3 Cobra Coils

1 Pair Safety Goggles

1 Pair Latex Gloves

1 Large Refuse Bag

1 List of Environmental Compliance Telephone Numbers
18" x 18" x 4"
Vacuum Packed in Puncture Resistant Foil

Product Trade Name

@3 per each

A GRANULAR/FLAKE SPILL ABSORBENT

Product Trade Name

Supplied in containers in lots of

@$ per pound (i.e. $

containers

per lot)

3 LAYER FABRIC COVERALLS (ALL SIZES)
Product Trade Name Kleen Guard

Supplied in 12 ealcase

@$ per each (i.e. $

DISPOSABLE COVERALLS

Product Trade Name Tyvek

Supplied in 25 ea/case

@s pereach (i.e. $

per case)

per case)

32 OZ. EYE WASH BOTTLE

Product Trade Name

Supplied per each

@s$ per each




14. BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T
MISCELLANEOUS

DOH-1M PRESSURE RINSER
Product Trade Name Easy Rinse

Supplied per each

A) @$ per each
DOH-2M HAND SOAP WITH CITRUS OIL
Product Trade Name Zep

Supplied in 32 oz. containers in lots of 20 containers per case

A) @s$ per container (i.e. $ per case)

DOH-3M A BIOSTIMULANT CONTAINING:
Soluble Potash 1.00%
Iron 0.36%
Manure Extract 79.30%
Humic and Fulvic Acid Extract 9.00%
Kelp Extract 1.20%
Organo-Modified Silaxane Surfactant 0.36%
Product Trade Name Launch

Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons

A) @3 per galion (i.e. $ per lot)

DOH-4M A WORK BOOT
Product Trade Name iron Duke

Compliance EPA 40 CFR 170
Supplied per pair

A) @ Size 8-11)$ per pair

B) @Size(12+) $ per pair




¥

DOH-5M

A)

B)

C)

DOH-6M

A)

DOH-7TM

DOH-8M

A)

B)

C)

-14. BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

RUBBER BEOOT/SHOE COVERS
Compliance EPA 40 CFR 170

Supplied per pair

@ Size M (8-9) § per pair
@ SizeL (10-11) $ per pair
@ Size XL (12-13) $ per pair

AFETY GOGGLES — indirect vent
Meets ANS1 287.1-1989

@3 per each

FACE SHIELD - positive lock headgear

Meets ANS1 287.1-1988 and
CAN1CSA-294 3-82 Specifications

@3$ per each

A 5-GALLON BACKPACK SPRAYER
Product Trade Name Birchmeier

@3 per sprayer

Gasket Set For Sprayer Pump

@3 per set

Hose Valve & Wand Repair Kit

@3 per kit
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14. BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T

DOH-9M

A)

DOH-10M
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DOH-11M

A)

B)

A)

NITRI-SOLVE 100% NITRILE GLOVES
15 mil 13" Nitrile Gloves

Compliance EPA 40 CFR 170

Sizes 8, M, L, XL, or 2XL

@$

per pair

2-QUART HANDHELD PRESSURE SPRAYER

Product Trade Name

@$

Tolco

per sprayer

CLOSED SYSTEM BACKPACK SPRAYER

Product Trade Name

@$

Birchmier BCS

per sprayer

Gasket set for sprayer pump

@$

per set

Hose Vaive & Wand repair Kit

@s

per Kit
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TIMBERLAND DIVISIOMN

April 24, 2009

State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

Michael Austin — Senior Buyer
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

Michael:

Enclosed, please find the price submission of Crop Production Services, Inc. for the
WYV Division of Highways Herbicide bid: RFQ 669C0032. Also included, you will

find label and MSDS information for alternate products not specified in the Bidding
Schedule. These products were included because the specified product is either no

longer available or the original manufacturer has provided an alternative.

On behalf of Crop Production Service, Inc. I have submitted the following herbicides
for substitution:

DOH-15H  QuikPro for Roundup Pro Dry (manufacturer substitute)
DOH-25H  Proclipse 65 WDG for Endurance (manufacturer substitute)
DOH-30H  Direx 4L for Diuron 4L (product no longer available)

Also enclosed, please find label and MSDS information for the surfactants and
adjuvants not currently specified in the Bidding Schedule.

I have previously submitted information to the State of West Virginia regarding my
company’s name change. I have included a copy of that letter in this mailing for
verification. I greatly appreciated your verbal affirmation at the pre-bid meeting on
April 13, 2009. However, the reason for my concern is that this RFQ was originally
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mailed to our Butler, PA location and included our previous company name.
Similarly, our VA location received an RFQ that should have been sent to our Butler
location. Due to the difficulties UAP Distribution, Inc. experienced with last year’s
WYVDOH bid, I simply want to ensure Crop Production Services, Inc. does not
encounter a similar situation this year.

I also wish to avoid any confusion that may exist regarding the title of my operating
Division. Crop Production Services, Inc. operates in numerous markets across the
nation. To create an identity and allow for market separation, my group is referred to
as the “CPS Timberland Division”. Although you will see the CPS Timberland
Division title on my business card and correspondences, please do not confuse it with
that of the parent company, Crop Production Services, Inc.

If you have any further questions on my company’s name change or should you have
additional inquiries, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Yours truly,

Urandia £ &

Charles E. Smyth

CPS Timberland Division
VM Territory Manager

1850 Touchstone Road
Colonial Heights, VA 23834
Office (804) 520-0789
Mobile (804) 513-7185

West Virginia Commercial Applicator CO5032 Categories: 3,6, 7, 12



Jafuaty 16, 2009

Dear Valued Customer,.

We would liketo thunk you foryour bisingss thiy past season and ro take th
to mfmm. you of some Tmportant:changes. With the:recent acquisition .ol

Distributicn The, Crop Production Services is exéited about the future:and wh
fo-offer you:- ourcustomer,

oppoftunity

atwe:have.

Thale have been and w‘ll] Iw sevelal changes ay wei mdke'ﬂlfS"Bﬂt’l‘ilinll, some af‘ wluch

' ;.Predgnctxon Services, liie. and Westeri Farfii Servics, Ine.
Weie wisiged into UAP Diswibution, filL. U A'P D: stfzbuu on, T, was: chosen as the
sur vivmg entlty because: 1t is: cmrent o-Business’ S

- ely, on J ammrw '09;;:thefnew empaﬁy i
and ig fully fegisteied t6.do. biisiness i all S0:states. OuFFe
same:

04:3769161

If you have ahy question or if we can be of aily _
sales representative on our Division Offiee:at:870-367-8561

tli«it ymr&&nust@m@t‘ wm.-beneﬁt ﬁ‘bm aur outsmndmg'serv]ce and eXpE‘J fise.

Sicerely,

PO, Box B57 Monticello; AR 716570657 « Phone; 870/367 - 8567 ‘Fax: d70/367-1804
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VENDOR PREFERENCE CERTIFICATE

Cerification and application® is hereby made for Preference in accordance with West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37. {Does not apply to
construction contracts). West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37, provides an opporiunity for qualifying vendors to reduest (at the fime of bid)
preference for their residency status. Such preference is an evaluation method only and will be applied only to the cost bid in
accordance with the West Virginia Code. This certificate for application is to be used to request such preference. The Purchasing
Division will make the determination of the Resident Vendor Preference, if applicable.

1. Application Is made for 2.5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is an individual resident vendor and has resided continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preced-
ing the date of this certification; o, '
Bidder is a parinership, association or corporation resident vendor and has maintained its headquarters or principal place of
business continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or 80% of the
ownership interest of Bidder is held by another individual, parthership, association or corporation resident vendor who has
maintained its headquarters or principal place of business continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately
preceding the date of this certification; or, .

Bidder is a nonresident vendor which has an affiliate or subsidiary which employs a minimum of one hundred state residents
and which has maintained its headguarters or principal place of business within West Virginia continuously for the four (4)
years immediately preceding the date of this certification; o,

2. Application is made for 2.5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is a resident vendor who certifies that, during the life of the contract, on average at least 75% of the employees
working on the project being bid are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state conlinuously for the two years
immediately preceding submission of this bid; or,

3. Application is made for 2.5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked:
Bidder is a nonresident vendor employing a minimum of one hundred state residents or is a nonresident vendor with an
affiliate or subsidiary which maintains its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia employing a
minimurm of one hundred state residents who certifies that, during the life of the contract, on average at least 75% of the
employees or Bidder's affiliate’s or subsidiary's employees are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state
continuously for the two years immediately preceding submission of this bid; or,

4. Application is made for 5% resident vendor preference for the reason checked: _
Bidder meets either the requirement of both subdivisions (1) and (2) or subdivision (1) and (3) as stated above; or,

5, Application is made for 3.5% resident vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked:
Bidder is an individual resident vendor who is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard
and has resided in West Virginia continuously for the four years immediately preceding the date on which the bid is
submitted; or,

6. Application is made for 3.5% resident vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked:

Bidder is a resident vendor who is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard, if, for
purposes of producing or distributing the commodities or completing the project which is the subject of the vendor’s bid and
continucusly over the entire term of the project, on average at least seventy-five percent of the vendor's employees are
residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two immediately preceding years.

Bidder understands if the Secretary of Revenue determines that a Bidder recelving preference has failed to continue to meet the
requirements for such preference, the Secretary may order the Director of Purchasing to: (a) reject the bid; or (b) assess a penalty
against such Bidder in an amount not o exceed 5% of the bid amount and that such penalty will be paid to the contracting agency
or deducted from any unpaid balance on the contract or purchase order.

By submission of this certificate, Bidder agrees to disclose any reasonably requested information to the Purchasing Division and
authorizes the Depariment of Revenue to disclose to the Director of Purchasing appropriate information verifying that Bidder has paid
the required business taxes, provided that such information does not contain the amounts of taxes paid nor any cther information

deemed by the Tax Commissioner to be confidential.

Under penalty of law for false swearing (West Virginia Code, §61-5-3), Bidder hereby certifies that this certificate is true
and accurate in all respects; and that if a contract Is issued to Bidder and if anything confained within this certificate
changes during the term of the contract, Bidder will notify the Purchasing Division in writing immediately.

Bidder: Cfb? .bet’“dibh SLTV{(QS,TNC- Signed: L&M&A g. %
pate: /24 /b‘l Tite: VM Tarri{'on'; Manajtr

“Check any combinalion of preference consideration(s} indicated abovs, which you are entified fo recelve.
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STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
Purchasing Division

PURCHASING AFFIDAVIT

VENDOR OWING A DEBT TO THE STATE:

West Virginia Code §5A-3-10a provides that: No contract or renewal of any contract may be awarded by the
state or any of its political subdivisions to any vendor or prospective vendor when the vendor or prospective
vendor or a related party to the vendor or prospective vendor is a debfor and the debt owed is an amount
greater than one thousand dollars in the aggregate. -

PUBLIC IMPROVEMENT CONTRACTS & DRUG-FREE WORKPLACE ACT:

If this is a solicitation for a public improvement construction contract, the vendor, by its signature below, affirms
that it has-a written plan for a drug-free workplace policy in compliance with Article 1D, Chapter 21 of the West
Virginia Code. The vendor must make said affirmation with its bid submission. Further, public improvement
construction contract may not be awarded to a vendor who does not have a wriiten ptan for a drug-free
workplace policy in compliance with Article 1D, Chapter 21 of the West Virginia Code and who has not
submitied that plan to the appropriate contracting authority in timely fashion. For a vendor who is a
subcontractor, compliance with Section 5, Article 1D, Chapter 21 of the West Virginia Code may take place
before their work on the public improvement is begun.

ANTITRUST:

In submitting a bid to any agency for the state of West Virginia, the bidder offers and agrees that if the bid is
accepted the bidder will convey, sell, assign or fransfer to the state of West Virginia all rights, title and interest
in and to ali causes of action it may now or hereafter acquire under the antitrust laws of the United States and
the state of West Virginia for price fixing and/or unreasonable restraints of trade relating to the particular
commodities or services purchased or acquired by the state of West Virginia. Such assignment shall be made
and become effective at the time the purchasing agency tenders the initial payment to the bidder.

| certify that this bid is made without prior understanding, agreement, or connection with any corporation, firm,
limited liability company, partnership or person or entity submitting a bid for the same materials, supplies,
equipment or services and is in all respects fair and without collusion or fraud. | further certify that | am
authorized to sign the certification on behalf of the bidder or this bid. '

LICENSING: _

Vendors must be licensed and in good standing in accordance with any and all state and locai laws and
requirements by any state or local agency of West Virginia, including, but not limited te, the West Virginia
Secretary of State’s Office, the West Virginia Tax Department, West Virginia Insurance Commission, of any
other state agencies or political subdivision. Furthermore, the vendor must provide all necessary releases to
obtain information to enable the Director or spending unit to verify that the vendor is licensed and in good
standing with the above entities. :

CONFIDENTIALITY:

The vendor agrees that he or she will not disclose to anyone, directly or indirectly, any such personally
identifiable information or other confidential information gained from the agency, unless the individual who is
the subject of the information consents to the disclosure in writing or the disclosure is made pursuant to the
agency's policies, procedures and rules. Vendor further agrees to comply with the Confidentiality Policies and
Information Security Accountability Requirements, set forth in http:/flwww.state.wv.us/admin/purchase/privacy/

noticeConfidentiality. pdf.

Under penalty of law for false swearing (West Virginia Code §61-5-3), it is hereby certified that the vendor
affirms and acknowledges the information in this affidavit and is in compliance with the requirements as stated.

Vendor's Name: Cro? "Produd'fon SP-W;CeS: Tne.
Authorized Signature: _ Chadsa £ ﬁ\j Date: Y /3‘{/ o9

Purchasing Affidavit (Revised 01/01/08) AN




