*709062036

PO BOX 429

State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

800-334-9880

BOB BARKER COMPANY INC
134 N MAIN ST

FUQUAY VARINA NC 27526

Request for
Quotation

ROBERTA WAGNER
304-558-0067

304-

HEALTH AND HUMAN RESOURCES

HOPEMONT HOSPITAL

CENTRAL RECEIVING

ROUTE 7

TERRA ALTA, WV
26764

789-2411

i e A R N ———————
02/26/2008
BID OPENING DATE U037/2772008 BID OPENING TIME 0L:30PM
RECE ﬁ\fF@
| 000 MAR 2L P 12 22
Seehitached Spec OPEN-END BLANKET CONTRACT
PURCHAZING DIVISION
‘MJEO%WV
0001 BX 260-82 '
36 * . U5 Q5. 063
TOOTHETTES W/DENTIFRICE, SINGLE WRAPPED, 250/BOX
¥ sold S5ofby - 8 52.:
0002 BX 260-82
60 ¥ 5.9 23U .50
POLIDENT DENTURE [CLEANSING TABLETS OR [EQUAL -66- TABS/
q0
BOX _ : * Sod by Case
Scls Attaghed Sppec obxlcs #24.R5
0003 EA 260-82
275 * 3 935
POLIGRIP DENTURE [ADHESIVE OR EQUAL <+ OZ. TUBE
a.50% M
S¢eAttdched Spec * pold oy Aegr o
& R
0004 BT 095-56 gk‘g@ I
180 |
LOTION, HAND/BODY| EQUAL TO SECURA, 8 OZ. BOTTLE By

TELEPHONE

300-

DATE

ADU-GRBO

3\glo%

FEIN

Hlp- 1558002

ADDRESS CHANGES

TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'




GENERAL TERMS & CONDITIONS
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION (RFQ) AND REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL (RFP)

1. Awards will be made in the best interest of the State of West Virginia.

2. The State may accept or reject in part, or in whole, any bid.

3. All quotations are governed by the West Virginia Code and the Legislative Rules of the Purchasing Division.

4. Prior to any award, the apparent successiul vendor must be properly registered with the Purchasing Division and have
paid the required $125.00 registration fee.

5. All services performed or goods delivered under State Purchase Orders/Contracts are to be continued for the term
of the Purchase Order/Contract, contingent upon funds being appropriated by the Legislature or otherwise being
made available. In the event funds are not appropriated or otherwise availabie for these services or goods, this
Purchase Order/Contract becomes void and of no effect after June 30.

6. Payment may only be made after the delivery and acceptance of goods or services.

7. interest may be paid for late payment in accordance with the West Virginia Code.

8. Vendor preference will be granted upon written request in accordance with the West Virginia Code.

9. The State of West Virginia is exempt from federal and state taxes and will not pay or reimburse such taxes.

10.  The Director of Purchasing may cancel any Purchase Order/Contract upon 30 days written notice to the seller.

11.  The laws of the State of West Virginia and the Legislative Rules of the Purchasing Division shall govern all rights
and duties under the Contract, including without limitation the validity of this Purchase Order/Contract.

12.  Any reference to automatic renewal is hereby deleted. The Contract may be renewed ohly upon mutual written
agreement of the parties.

13. BANKRUPTCY: Inthe event the vendor/contractor files for bankruptcy protection, this Contract may be deemed
null and void, and terminated without further order.

14. HIPAA Business Associate Addendum - The West Viginia State Government HIPAA Business Associale
Addendum (BAA), approved by the Attorney General, and available online at the Purchasing Division's web site
(http://www.state.wv.us/admin/purchase/vre/hipaa.htm) is hereby made part of the agreement. Provided that, the
Agency meets the definition of a Covered Entity (45 CFR §160.103) and will be disclosing Protected Health
Information (45 CFR §160.103) to the vendor.

INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS

1. Use the quotation forms provided by the Purchasing Division.

2. SPECIFICATIONS: Items offered must be in compliance with the specifications. Any deviation from the specifications
must be clearly indicated by the bidder. Alternates offered by the bidder as EQUAL to the specifications must be
clearly defined. A bidder offering an alternate should attach complete specifications and literature to the bid. The
Purchasing Division may waive minor deviations to specifications.

3. Complete all sections of the quotation form.

4. Unit prices shall prevail in cases of discrepancy.

5. All quotations are considered F.O.B. destination unless alternate shipping terms are clearly identified in the quotation.

6. BID SUBMISSION: All quotations must be delivered by the bidder to the office listed below prior to the date and time

of the bid opening. Failure of the bidder to deliver the quotations on time will result in bid disqualifications.

SIGNED BID TO:

Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

Rev. 9/25/07
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134
PO

9062036

N MAIN ST
BOX 429

FUQUAY VARINA NC

State of West Virginia
Department.of Administration
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Strest East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

800-334-9880

BOBR BARKER COMPANY INC

27526

Request for
Quotation

HOP80127

A S8 LH

SEONDENCETOATIENTION:OF:

ROB
304

ERTA WAGNER
-558-0067

CEN
ROU

2

TRAL RECEIVING
TE 7

TERRA ALTA, WV

6764 .

HEATL'TH AND HUMAN- RESOURCES
HOPEMONT HOSPITAL

304-789-2411

RBid Administratoy

Slo- 1555002,

02/26/2008
BID OPENING DATE Ud/ld //I.dUUB Bl OFPRNLING "LI'LIME Ul:t50FM
BT 095-56
940
SHAMPOO, JOHNSON [BABY NON-TEAR, OR EQUAL, 3.5 OZ BTL
VENDORS MUST| PROV[IDE SAMPLE OF SHAMPOO| THEY'RE BIDDING
TO ALLOW THE NURS[ING STAFF TO TEST IT [TO VERIFY THAT IT
IS NON-TEARING, IF BIDDING OTHER THAN BRAND SPECIFIED.
0006 BT 095-56
142
SHAMPOO, SELSEN BLUE OR EQUAL, 7 - 8 Of. BOTTLE
0007 EA 095-86 %
145 1.03% |ua. 35
SHAVE CREAM,| REGULAR, [EQUAL TO GOLGATE|, 2.25 O%Z. EA.
Dorbasol i gold oy case of Dgea. > 30A5/cs
She/ g Nl g?ﬁ '
Attached Sppc NO BiIp |NO BID
0008 BT 095-86 '
46
PRE-SHAVE EQUAL TO LECTRIC SHAVE, 7 0Z. /BOTTLE
| LU LD
0009 BX 095-74 o
B 4s. 55 9 65 Fof\s
RAZORS, DISPOSABLE, TWIN BLADE OR EQUAL, Z66/Bo%
Soe Attached Spec
élGNATUH TELEPHONE . DATE
e Lo 00~ 2521 -9880 AR S,
TITLE FEIN

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'



State of West Virginia Request for p=srms

Department of Administration  Quotation .. HOP8012 3
Purchasing Division — V

2019 Washington Street East

SRR

Post Ofﬁce BDX 50130 1% AL A8A%iclo PONDENGETOATTENHONOE::
ROBERTA WAGNER
Charleston, WV 25305-0130 304-558-0067
*709062036 800-334-9880

BOB BARKER COMPANY INC
134 N MAIN ST

PO BOX 429

FUQUAY VARINA NC 27526

HEALTH AND HUMAN RESOURCES
HOPEMONT HOSPITAL
CENTRAL RECEIVING
ROUTE 7
TERRA ALTA, WV
26764 + 304-789-2411

02/26/2008
BID OPENING DATE:

0372772008 BID OPENING TIME 0I:30PM

0010 BX 270-00
61
THERMOMETER [PROBH COVERS, DIATEK 600 OR EQUAL 100/BX

(WELCH ALLYN)

NO BID | NO BID

0011 cLL 485-37
103
BATH TUB DISINFEQTANT [EQUAL TO CAVICIDE, PER GALLON

0012 CS 475-70
65
BED PAD, CONVOLUTED, 2" X 76", 18 PER [CASE

0013 CS 475-70
96

+[BED PAD SLEEVE TOQ FIT [76" PAD, 12/CASE

i!GNATURE Oﬂ g Lo ( ) ' = :Té@é;'ggugﬁqquso DATE 3\\C\\08

TITLE B A@[mﬁnﬁg@g@ﬁ@imh’ 5l 155500 ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE
WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'




State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

- 709062036 800-334-9
BOB BARKER COMPANY INC
134 N MAIN ST

PO BOX 429

FUQUAY VARINA NC 27526

2019 Washington Street East

Request for
Quotation

'ﬁdpsoiév

304 -

558-0067

ROBERTA WAGNER

880

2

6764

HEALTH AND HUMAN RESOURCES
HOPEMONT HOSPITAL
CENTRAL RECEIVING
ROUTE .7

TERRA ALTA, WV
304-789-2411

uz/zb/zuua

BID OPENING DATE

0372772008

BLD

PENING "LULNMB

UL 3UPM

0014

0015

0016

0017

1 .
STOCKINGS, ANTIEMBOLIS

PR
1 12
STOCKINGS, ANTIEMRBOLIS

0998-67

cs 640-50 %é%mér
27 - &
CUPS, PORTION, 1 pZ., GOLO OR EQUAL, 2p- PK/CASE
250 CUPS/BAG. CUPS MUST BE COMPATIBLE| WITH OCELCO PILIJ
CRUSHER PAT [#233583 VENDORS MUST PROVIDE SAMPLE OF CUP
BEING BID TO VERIFY THEY WORK WITH EXISTING EQUIPMENT.
cs 47570
14 373,744 528.D
CUPS, MEDICINE, PLASTIC, 1 O%. 50 TUBES/CASE
100 CUPS/TUBE. Sob Atiached Spee
NO BiD |NO BID
PR 998-67

M, THIGH, SMALL

PER PAIR

1\"‘ "

NO BID

M, THIGH, MEDIUM

PER PAIR

TITLE

DATE

2\h\a\o8

Bid Adrministratol

Sle- 159F02

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'




BELQ

State of West Vlrg"‘"a Request fOl‘ B UMBE:

Department of Administration Quotation HOPS80127 . 5
Purchasing Division :

2019 Washington Street East

ADDRESS CORRESH

Post Office Box 50130 e R
ROBERTA WAGNER
Charleston, WV 25305-0130  Bo4-558-0067
%709062036 800-334-9880

BOB BARKER COMPANY INC
134 N MAIN ST

PO BOX 429

FUQUAY VARINA NC 27526

HEALTH. AND HUMAN RESOURCES
HOPEMONT HOSPITAL
CENTRAL RECEIVING
ROUTE 7
TERRA ALTA, WV
26764 304-789-2411

02/26/2008
BID OPENING DATE

03/27/72008 BID OPENING TIME. 01:30PM

0018 : PR
4
STOCKINGS, ANTIEMBOLISM, THIGH, LARGE

998-67

0019 PR 998-67
20
STOCKINGS, ANTIBQLISM,l KNEE, SMALL PER PAIR

0020 PR 998-67
26
STOCKINGS, ANTIBQLISM,| KNEE,

0021 PR 998-~67
54
STOCKINGS, ANTIBOLISM,| KNEE, LARGE PER PAIR

0022 o PR 998-67
49 ‘
STOCKINGS, ANTIBOLISM,| KNEE, X-LARGE PER PAIR

sxemwnsm 1o sy Q 2 e 22 -8B DATE 3\\Q‘D€>

e Big Adminisralto™ o \cssagT ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE
WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'




*709062

PO BOX
FUQUAY

State of West Virginia

Department of Administration

Purchasing Division

Request for

Quotation

2019 Washington Street East

Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

036

429
VARINA NC 27526

800-334-9880
BOB BARKER COMPANY INC
134 N MAIN ST

T HOP80127

304-558-0067

ROBERTA WAGNERA""'””"““““

HOPEMONT HOSPITAL

CENTRAL RECEIVING

ROUTE 7

TERRA ALTA, WV
26764

HEALTH AND HUMAN RESOURCES

304-789-2411

02/26/2008

BID OPENING DATE

0372772008

BTDOPENTING—TIME

ULl i sUPM

0023 BX
5
MULTISTIX, 10 SG,| EQUA
0024 BX
8
HEMA CHEK SI{IDE TEST E
0025 EA
18
SHARPS COLLECTOR,| 6.9
0026 BX
19
CALMOSEPTINE OINTMENT
3.5 GR/PK.
0027 EA
184 :
CALMOSEPTINE OINTMENT

270-00

L TO BAYER 2

270-00

465-28

270-00

OR EQUAL,

270-00

OR EQUAL,

QUAIL: TO BAYER 25

QUART, EQUAL TO

144PK/

AR K R
e &%Eiﬁ

161, 100/BOX

B&D 305489,

EA

.- [TUBE

SIGNATURE() 9 0 \Lo ( )

TELEPHONE

o 3R -850

DATE

31308

TITLE

Blid Adirn

FEIN

inlstratan

So- 159800072

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'




*70

134
PO

State of West Virginia

Purchasing Division

Department of Administration

Request for
Quotation

HOP80127

Post Office B

9062036

N MAIN ST
BOX 429

FUQUAY VARINA NC

ox 50130

Charleston, WV 25305-0130

800-334-9

BOB BARKER COMPANY INC

27526

2019 Washington Street East

880

ROBERTA WAGNER
304-558-0067

26764

304~

HEALTH AND HUMAN. RESOURCES
HOPEMONT HOSPITAL
CENTRAL RECEIVING
ROUTE 7

TERRA ALTA, WV

789-2411

BID OPENING DATE:

03727/

zU0U0¢8

B1iD

Ol:

30PM

PENING T1Mhb

0028

0029

0030

0031

0032

(7:3)

52
BATH OIL, EQ

TO FIT THE D

192
TOOTHPASTE,

150
FINGERNAIL C

506 Attached S

\3 &

| 150
TOENAIL CLIP

1Sce Attached &

\
36

COMB, -84 P
‘_? 1}
ce Attached Sy

o Attached Sp

GL

UAL TO TLC

ISPENISER I

A

.85

o
@©
(x]

1,IPPERS
DG

EA

PERS,

nec

2c

270-00

260-82

095-68

lo95-68

REGULAR

095-47

545-9, GALLONS

N THE WHIRLPOOL

TUBS.

. 4ot ea

=3.03
O

shale¥

Oz. TUBE, COLGATE OR ERUAL
‘ M Sold by s of HBeo > 81q.52

. 254 ea. 53,10
¥ sold oy cose 1 24les >
oe M & .9
. L4leou Q.15

*

oD

so\d by case af |Z ¥ Wafs

Lo. Le©

X sela by Case

oF yudeas

SIGNATURE

~

‘TELEPHONE

SOO- 5?*\- QAg30

™ 3lalo®

TITLE

L
Bid Aﬁfmﬂmgﬁm

FEIN

Slp- 1558C0 2

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'




- State of West Virginia
Purchasing Division

Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

*709062036 :
BOB BARKER COMPANY INC
134 N MAIN ST

PO BOX 429

FUQUAY VARINA NC 27526

Department of Administration

2019 Washington Street East

800-334-9880

AEQNUMBER:

Request for

Quotation

. HOP80127

ADDRESS:CO

ONDENCE-TOATIENTIONQE!

ROBERTA WAGNER

304-558-0067

HEALTH AND HUMAN RESOURCES

HOPEMONT HOSPITAL

CENTRAL RECEIVING

ROUTE 7

TERRA ALTA, WV
26764

304-789-2411

ITE

02/26/2008

BID OPENING DATE

0372772008

B

LD OFPENLING "I'IME

UL:30PM

0034

0035

0036

0037

0033

36~ ,
CoMB, 5" BLASTIIC
Sce Attached Spjpe
Py
10 |BK

HAIRBRUSH, HLASTIC REQ

Sae Attached Spec

EA
200
DEODORANT, LADY SPEED

Sce Attpehed

LA

Sipec

200
DEODORANT, MEN SHEED S

See Attached Spe

PK
120
CORN CUSHIONS, MHEDIUM,

095-47

095-47

ULAR STYLE, 2

095-56

STICK, #A=t—aF
\doz

095-56

2 0%
G

475-09

DR. SCHOLLS OR

.42 2.42.
X sad by H4lds + 342l .

& .14 1.0
DAOZEN PER BOX

.32 FpU.OO.
. OR EQUAL

. | % Sold by dozen > 2).8u\ld=z

.9 <

TICK, 22567 OR EQUAL
¥ sold by doten+ 21.80\de

F“&-ﬁ&’ 4.,

?:Loq.ob

EQUAL, 6/PKG.

SIG

300~

M- 9880

DATE

2lalog

TITL

tmmeol 0 \ cz X

™ 5L- 15580

Bid Administrator

L

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'



State of West Virginia RequeSt fOI‘ B s BRONUMBERG:: TR

Department of Administration  Quotation HOP80127 . 9
Purchasing Division -
2019 Washington Street East

Post Oﬁice BOX 50130 :::‘ i " o O . 8 »~ N ING BT ,:.Z.:ZI
ROBERTA WAGNER
Charleston, WV 25305-0130 304-558-0067
*709062036 800-334-9880

BOB BARKER COMPANY INC
134 N MAIN ST

PO BOX 429

FUQUAY VARINA NC 27526

HEALTH AND HUMAN RESOURCES
HOPEMONT HOSPITAL
CENTRAL RECEIVING
ROUTE 7
TERRA ALTA, WV
26764 " 304-789-2411

U02/726/2000
BID OPENING DATE:

0372772008 BID OPENING TIME UIT30PM

0038 10 BX 475-09 ~
06~ 21.4%9 oM. O

AT,COHOL PREP PADS|, -266¢/BOX
Si>e Attached Splec 2000

RIES Eprs
0039 cs 475-09 ‘%@ @p.j’

3 .
GAUZE SPONGEH, 2X2| NON-ISTERILE, 40 BAGS/CASE

0040 cs 185-13 _ -
100 y4g.a9 4,9435.00
L,IQUID DIAL [W/MOISTURIZERS & VITAMIN E. OR EQUAL i

4 GALLONS/CASE

N L} @ " [T s
0041 cs 175-09 S e
3
GAUZE SPONGE|, 4X4| NON-STERILE, 10 BAGS|/CASE

0042 ofS 475-09 M@ E@

10

WOUND WASH, BLAIREX, 7[.1 OZ. OR EQUAL | 12 CANS/CASE

;IGNATUR . : TELEF.':;-ii:)NEv: : = DATE
Ahoe Lol oo 224-850 | 3\qles
s Bid Adrinistralorn = = Lo 1SSEWL ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'



PO

*709062036
BOB BARKER COMPANY INC
134 N MAIN ST

FUQUAY VARINA NC

Purchasing Division

Post Office Box 5013

BOX 429
27

State of West Virginia
Department of Administration

0

Charleston, WV 25305-0130
800-334-9880

526

Request for

Quotation

2019 Washington Street East

SREQD EH
HOP80127

5S:COBH

PN

NCGE TOATTENTIONGE::

ROBERTA WAGNE
304-558-0067

HEALTH AND HUMAN

ROUTE 7
TERRA ALTA, WV
26764

RESOURCES

HOPEMONT HOSPITAL
CENTRAL RECEIVING

304-789-2411

BID OPENING DATE:

0372772008

0043

0044

BX
24

COLOSTOMY PQUCH,

5 PER BOX

BX
24
2-3/|a"

FLANGE, SK

EXHIBIT 3

LIFE OF CONTRACT:
YEAR OR UNTI
NECESSARY TO

L, SUC

NOT EXCEED TWELVE
TIME" THE VENDOR
REASON UPON [GIVIN
WRITTEN NOTICE.

UNLESS SPECIFIC P
IN THIS CONTRACT

PRICING SET HERETI
CONTRACT.
RENEWAL : THIIS CON

ORIGINAL CONTRACT.

.......

N ARE

TRACT

DOCUMENT, THE TERMS,

FIRM FOR TH

MAY BE RENEWED

E LIFE OF THE

CONDITIONS AND

UPON THE MUTUAL

bl PERINING LLME Ul :Ts3UFM
475-63 NO E} ' BID
2-3/4" HOLLISTER #3804 OR EQUAL
75-63
IN BARRIER, 5/BOX
THIS CONTRACT BECOMES EFFECTIVE ON
EXTENDS FOR A [PERIOD OF ONE (1)
H "REASONABLE TIME" THEREAFTER AS IS
OBTATN A NEW CONTRACT OR RENEW THE
THE "REASONABLE TIME" PERIOD SHALL
(12)| MONTHS. DURING| THIS "REASONABLE
MAY TERMINATE THIS CONTRACT FOR ANY
G THE| DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING 30 DAYS
ROVIS[IONS ARE STIPULATED ELSEWHERE

SIG

2\alos

TITLE

Bich Adhwinistra T

"S- 198800

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'




Purchasing Division

State of West Virginia
Department of Administration

2019 Washington Street East

S BEL

Request for

H

P80127

Quotation

A

S5 PONDENCETOATTENTION.OF

*709062036

134 N MAIN ST
PO BOX 429
FUQUAY VARINA NC

Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

800-334-9880

BOB BARKER COMPANY INC

27526

ROBERTA WAGNER

304-558-0067

HEALTH AND HUMAN RESOURCES

HOPEMONT HOSPITAL
CENTRAL RECEIVING
ROUTE 7

TERRA ALTA, WV
26764

304-789-2411

02/26/

2008

BID OPENING DATE:

0372772008

WHETHER MORH

lORDERING PRO

WRITTEN CONSENT QO
SUBMITTED TOQ THE
DAYS PRIOR TO THE
BE IN ACCORDANCE
ORIGINAL CONTRACT
(1) YEAR PERIODS.

CANCELLATION: THE

NOTICE TO THE VEN

TO THE SPECIIFICAT
OPEN MARKET |CLAUS
IAUTHORIZE A [SPEND
MARKET , WITHOUT T
ESTIMATE, ITEMS S
IMMEDIATE DHLIVER
CAUSES (INCLUDING

OF WORK.)

QUANTITIES:
APPROXIMATIO
THE STATE SH
THAT THE CON
ORDERED FOR

QUANT
NS ON
ENDIN
TRACT]
DELIV
OR L

CEDUR,
E CON
OR CQ

COoPrY]
THORT
E PUR
THE S

WRITTEN STAT
THE VENDOR F
THE ORIGINAIL
VENDOR AS AU
MAILED TO TH
RETAINED BY

PORTATION OR AN UNANTI

F THE

EXPI
WITH
AND

DIREC

DOR I
IONS

E: T
ING
HE FIL
PECIHI
Y IN [E
BUT

ITIES

G UNI
SHAT{L

E: SP
TRACT]
MMOD IfT
OF TH

E

CHASI
PENDI

N

LY, BASED ON ESTIMATH
1.

ERY DURING THE TERM O
ESS THAN THE QUANTITI

ZATION FOR SHIPMENT,

NG UNIT.

SPENDING UNIT AND VENDOR,
DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING THIRTY
RATION DATE.

TOR OF PURCHASIT

IT TO PURCHASE
ING OF A REQUIS

MERGENCIES DUE

LISTED IN THE R

IT IS UNDERS
COVER THE QUAN

NDING UNIT(S) S
ORDER (FORM NUM
IES COVERED BY
E WV-39 SHALL B

G DIVISION, AND

SUCH RENEWAL SHALL
THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF THE

SHALL BE LIMITED TOC TWO

NG RESERVES THE

RIGHT TO CANCEL THIS CONTRACT IMMEDIATELY UPON WRITTEN
F THE COMMODITIES AND/OR SERVICES
SUPPLIED ARE OF AN INKFERIOR QUALITY OR DO NOT CONFORM
OF THE BID AND CONTRACT HEREIN.

E DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING MAY
ON THE OPEN
ITION OR COST
ED ON THIS CONTRACT FOR

'TO UNFORESEEN
NOT LIMITED TO DELAYS IN TRANS-
CIPATED INCREASE IN THE VOLUME

EQUISITION ARE
S SUPPLIED BY
TOOD AND AGREED
TITIES ACTUALLY
F THE CONTRACT,
ES SHOWN.

HALL ISSUE A
BER WV-39)
THIS CONTRACT.
E MAILED TO THE
A SECOND COPY
A THIRD COPY

(30)

(2) ONE

TO

3halke

TITLE

= =
@ﬁﬁ@dwmmgmawm

&
A,

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'



State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

*709062036 800-334-9
BOB BARKER COMPANY INC
134 N MAIN ST

PO BOX 429

FUQUAY VARINA NC 27526

Request for

Quotation |

880

HOP80127

R =ADDRESS COBBESFONDENCE TOATTENTION OF -
ROBERTA WAGNER
304-558-0067

HEALTH AND HUMAN -RESOURCES
HOPEMONT HOSPITAL

CENTRAL RECEIVING

ROUTE 7

TERRA ALTA, WV

26764 304-789-2411

02/26/2008

BID OPENING DATE

0372772008

BLD OPENING TIME 01l:30PM

BANKRUPTCY :
FOR BANKRUPTICY PROTECT]

ORDER .

THE TERMS
CONDITIONS

AGREEMENTS O
ELECTRONIC
REV. 04/11/2
INQUIRIES
WRITTEN QUES
BUSINESS ON
VIA USPS, FA
NO VENDOR RE
QUESTIONS WI
QUESTIONS AR

ROBERTA WAG
DEPARTMENT O
PURCHASING D
2019 WASHING
CHARLESTON,

FAX: 304-558
E~-MAIL: ROBE

PLEASE NOTE:
95% OF LISTE
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WV-36 {Rev. 01/01/07)

Requisition/P.0. No.:

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA Page___of ____Pages |HOP80127
PURCHASE CONTINUATION SHEET MEW22 ML MUL MUL
. i Spending Unit:
Vendor: P.O. Date: HOPEMONT HOSPITAL
item No. | Quantity Description Unit Price Amount

10.

11.
12.
13.

14.

15.

16.
17.
18.

19.
20.
21.

22, ml49 PR.pl

36 BX.

60 BX.

275 EA.
180 BTL

940 BTL

142 BTL
145 EA.
46 BTL.
45 BX.

61 BX.

103 GL.
65 CS.
96 CS.

27 C8.

14 CS.

1PR.
12 PR.
4 PR.

20 PR.
26 PR.
54 PR.

REQUEST FOR QUOTATION TO PROVIDE AN OPEN END
CONTRACT FOR THE FOLLOWING:

TOOTHETTES WITH DENTIFRICE OR EQUAL, SINGLE
WRAPPED, 250/BOX.

POLIDENT DENTURE CLEANSING TABLETS OR EQUAL, 60
TABLETS/BOX.

POLYGRIP DENTURE ADHESIVE OR EQUAL, 1.4 OZ. TUBE.
LOTION, HAND/BODY, SECURA OR EQUAL, 8 OZ. EA.

JOHNSON BABY SHAMPOO, NON TEAR, OR EQUAL 3.5 OZ.
BOTTLE. VENDORS MUST PROVIDE SAMPLE OF SHAMPOO
THEY'RE BIDDING TO ALLOW THE NURSING STAFF TO
TEST IT TO VERIFY THAT IT IS NON-TEARING, IF BIDDING
OTHER THAN BRAND SPECIFIED.

SELSEN BLUE SHAMPOO, OR EQUAL 7-8 OZ. BOTTLE.
SHAVE CREAM, REG., COLGATE OR EQUAL, 2.25 OZ. EA.
PRE-SHAVE, LECTRIC SHAVE OR EQUAL, 7 OZ. PER BTL.
RAZORS, DISPOSABLE, TWIN BLADE, 100/BOX.

THERMOMETER-PROBE COVERS, TO FIT DIATEK 600
WELCH ALLYN UNITS OR EQUAL, 100/BOX.

BATH TUB DISINFECTANT, CAVICIDE OR EQUAL, GALLON.
BED PAD, CONVOLUTED, 2" x 76", 18/CASE.
BED PAD, SLEEVE TO FIT 76" PAD, 12/CASE.

CUPS, PORTION, 1 OZ., SOLO OR EQUAL, 20-PK/CASE, 250
CUPS/PKG. CUPS MUST BE COMPATIBLE WITH OCELCO
PILL CRUSHER PAT #233533. VENDORS MUST PROVIDE
SAMPLE OF CUP BEING BID TO VERIFY THEY WORK WITH
EXISTING EQUIPMENT.

CUPS, MEDICINE, PLASTIC, 1 OZ., 50 TUBES/CASE, 100
CUPS/TUBE.

STOCKINGS, ANTIBOLISM, THIGH, PAIR:
SMALL
MEDIUM
LARGE

STOCKINGS, ANTIBOLISM, KNEE, PAIR:
SMALL
MEDIUM
LARGE
X-LARGE

19



WV-36 (Rev. 01/01/07)

Requisition / P.O. No.:

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA ‘ Page__of __Pages | HOP80127
PURCHASE CONTINUATION SHEET MEw22 I MuliMuL MuL
Vendor: P.O. Date: *HOPEMONT HOSPITAL
Item No. | Quantity Description Unit Price Amount
23, 6 BX. |MULTISTIX, 10SG, BAYER 2161 OR EQUAL, 100/BOX.
24, 8 BX. |HEMA CHECK SLIDE TEST, BAYER 2592 OR EQUAL.
25. 18 EA. | SHARPS COLLECTOR, 6.9 QUART, B&D 305489 OR EQUAL.
26. 19 BX. | CALMOSEPTINE OINTMENT OR EQUAL, 144 PK./BOX,
3.5 GR./PK.
27. 184 EA | CALMOSEPTINE OINTMENT OR EQUAL, 8 OZ. TUBE.
28. 52 GAL | BATH OIL, TLC 545-9 OR EQUAL, GALLONS TO FIT THE
DISPENSER IN THE WHIRLPOOL TUBS.
29. 192 EA | TOOTHPASTE, .85 OZ. COLGATE OR EQUAL.
30. 150 EA | FINGERNAIL CLIPPERS.
31. 150 EA | TOENAIL CLIPPERS, REGULAR.
32. 36 EA |COMB, 8", PLASTIC.
33, 36 EA |COMB, 5", PLASTIC.
34, | 10 BX. |HAIRBRUSH, PLASTIC REGULAR STYLE, 2 DOZEN/BOX.
35. 200 EA | DEODORANT, LADY SPEED STICK, 1.5 OZ. OR EQUAL.
36. 200 EA | DEODORANT, MEN SPEED STICK, 2.25 OZ. OR EQUAL.
37. 120 PK | CORN CUSHIONS, MEDIUM, DR. SCHOLLS OR EQUAL, 6/PK.
38. 100 BX | ALCOHOL PREP PADS, 200/BOX.
39. 3 CS. | GAUZE SPONGE, 2" X 2" NON-STERILE, 40 BAGS/CASE.
40. 100 CS | LIQUID DIAL W/MOISTURIZES & VIT. E OR EQUAL, 4
GAL./CS.
41. 3 CS. | GAUZE SPONGE, 4" X 4" NON-STERILE, 10 BAGS/CASE.
42, 10 CS. | WOUND WASH, BLAIREX, 7.1 OZ. OR EQUAL, 12 CANS/CS.
43, 24 BX. | COLOSTOMY POUCH WITH 2-3/4" FLANGE - HOLLISTER
#3804 OR EQUAL, 5 POUCHES/BOX.
44, 24 BX. | FLANGE, 2-3/4" SKIN BARRIER, 5 PER BOX.

QUANTITES LISTED ARE ESTIMATES ONLY. ACTUAL
NEEDS OF THE FACILITY WILL BE PROVIDED, WHETHER
THEY BE GREATER OR LESS THAN ESTIMATED.

Grand Total

20



WV-36 (Rev. 01/01/07)

Requisition / P.O. No.:

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA Page____of ____Pages | HOP80127
PURCHASE CONTINUATION SHEET Bw2e (MUl WuL MuL
Vendor: PO, Date: Spending Unit:
endor. - . e HOPEMONT HOSPITAL
Description Unit Price Amount

ltem No. | Quantity

ITEM.

OF ALL ITEMS BID.

BIDDERS WILL INCLUDE SHIPPING IN THE PRICE OF THE

SUCCESSFULL BIDDER WILL ACCEPT THE STATE OF WEST
VIRGINIA PURCHASING CARD THROUGH VISA, AS
PAYMENT, IN ARREARS.

FACILITY WILL PLACE ORDERS TO THE SUCCESSFUL VIA
TELEPHONE, ON AN AS NEEDED BASIS.

AWARD WILL BE MADE TO THE LOWEST GRAND TOTAL BID

21



RFQ No. HOP80127

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
Purchasing Division

PURCHASING AFFIDAVIT

West Virginia Code §5A-3-10a states: No contract or renewal of any contract may be awarded by the state or
any of its political subdivisions to any vendor or prospective vendor when the vendor or prospective vendor or
a related party to the vendor or prospective vendor is a debtor and the debt owed is an amount greater than
one thousand dollars in the aggregate

DEFINITIONS:

“Debt” means any assessment, premium, penalty, fine, tax or other amount of money owed to the state or any
of its political subdivisions because of a judgment, fine, permit violation, license assessment, defaulted
workers’ compensation premium, penalty or other assessment presently delinquent or due and required to be
paid to the state or any of its political subdivisions, including any interest-or additional penal’ues accrued
thereon.

22

“Debtor” means any individual, corporation, partnership, association, limited 'Iiability company or any other form

or business association owing a debt to the state or any of its political subdivisions. “Political subdivision”
means any county commission; municipality; county board of education; any instrumentality established by a
county or municipality; any separate corporation or instrumentality established by one or more counties or
municipalities, as permitted by law; or any public body charged by law with the performance of a government
function or whose jurisdiction is coextensive with one or more counties or municipalities. “Related party” means
a party, whether an individual, corporation, partnership, association, limited liability company or any other form
or business association or other entity whatsoever, related to any vendor by blood, marriage, ownership or
contract through which the party has a relationship of ownership or other interest with the vendor so that the
party will actually or by effect receive or control a portion of the benefit, profit or other consideration from
performance of a vendor contract with the party receiving an amount that meets or exceed five percent of the
total contract amount.

EXCEPTION: The prohibition of this section does not apply where a vendor has contested any tax
administered pursuant to chapter eleven of this code, workers’ compensation premium, permit fee or
environmental fee or assessment and the matter has not become final or where the vendor has entered into a
payment plan or agreement and the vendor is not in default of any of the provisions of such plan or agreement.

LICENSING: Vendors must be licensed and in good standing in accordance with any and all state and local
laws and requirements by any state or local agency of West Virginia, including, but not limited to, the West
Virginia Secretary of State’s Office, the West Virginia Tax Department, West Virginia Insurance Commission,
or any other state agencies or political subdivision. Furthermore, the vendor must provide all necessary
releases to obtain information to enable the Director or spending unit to verify that the vendor is licensed and in
good standing with the above entities.

CONFIDENTIALITY: The vendor agrees that he or she will not disclose to anyone, directly or indirectly, any
such personally identifiable information or other confidential information gained from the agency, unless the
individual who is the subject of the information consents to the disclosure in writing or the disclosure is made
pursuant to the agency's policies, procedures and rules. Vendors should visit www.state.wv.us/admin/
purchase/privacy for the Notice of Agency Confidentiality Policies.

Under penalty of law for false swearing (West Virginia Code, §61-5-3), it is hereby certified that the vendor
acknowledges the information in this said affidavit and are in compliance with the requirements as stated.

Vendor's Name: Bob BDaiker Qommnu\ nC -

Authorized Signature: Q\ e W —-Q\_\ Date: 3\1 9 log

Purchasing Affidavit (Revised 06/15/07)
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Bid Department: 1-800-235-8586
or FAX 1-888-866-3331

DentaSwab Toothsponges

All-in-one Disposable DentaSwab
Toothsponge needs no water!

e ATIDAF R N by

» These unique DentaSwab Toothsponges are
: o5 perfect for overnight detainees or in situations
where oral care is needed quickly and
conveniently. Toothsponges require no water to
activate the tough-acting mint-flavored dentrifrice
found soaked into the small sponge applicator.
Just throw away the individually wrapped
toothsponge when finished.

Wiy b

DentaSwab

o 500 per case.
e Measures 4" in length

Item Number Description

DP DentaSwab Toothsponges

http://thehub/productPRO/productspecs/specsheet.asp?productcode=DP&pg=check 3/19/2008
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Bid Department: 1-800-235-8586

Efferdent Denture Cleanser Tablets

Antibacterial.
Fights odor.

or FAX 1-888-866-3331

Removes stains.
90 tablets per box.
6 boxes per case.

item Number

Descriptibn

WL63901

Efferdent Denture Cleanser Tablets

http://thehub/productPRO/productspecs/specsheet.asp?productcode=WL63901 &pg=check

3/19/2008
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Bid Department: 1-800-235-8586
or FAX 1-888-866-3331

Efferdent Denture Cleanser Tablets
Antibacterial.
Fights odor.
Removes stains.

90 tablets per box.
6 boxes per case.

Item Number Description
WL63901 Efferdent Denture Cleanser Tablets

http://thehub/productPR O/productspecs/specsheet.asp?productcode=WL63901&pg=check  3/19/2008
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Bid Department: 1-800-235-8586
or FAX 1-888-866-3331

Effergrip Extra Strength Denture Adhesive

e 12 per case.

Item Number Description
WL63965 Effergrip Extra Strength Denture Adhesive

http://thehub/productPRO/productspecs/specsheet.asp?productcode=WL63965&pg=check  3/19/2008
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Bid Department: 1-800-235-8586

Barbasol Aerosol Original Shave Cream, 2.25 oz

e Original Formula

e 36 per case

or FAX 1-888-866-3331

Item Number

Description

BAR225

. Barbasol Aerosol Original Shave Cream, 2.25 oz

http://thehub/productPRO/productspecs/specsheet.asp?productcode=BAR225&pg=check

3/19/2008



Bid Department: 1-800-235-8586
or FAX 1-888-866-3331

Bob Barker Twin Blade Razor, Royal Blue

Clear, removable safety cap.

Stainless steel twin-blade.

Royal blue handle with royal blue head.
One piece construction.

6 boxes of 100 razors.

l  ltem Number: | . .. Description
‘ RTB600 | Bob Barker Twin Blade Razor, Royal Blue
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Bid Department: 1-800-235-8586
or FAX 1-888-866-3331

Dispenser Cups, Plastic 1 oz.

Easily dispense lice control shampoo with
affordable Dispenser Cups

o Graduated.
e 5000 per case.

item Number Description

60183 Dispenser Cups, Plastic 1 oz.

http://thehub/productPRO/productspecs/specsheet.asp?productcode=60183 &pg=check 3/19/2008



Page 1 of 1

Bid Department: 1-800-235-8586
or FAX 1-888-866-3331

Colgate Toothpaste, Regular, 0.85 oz.

Clinically proven fluoride protection

e 0.850z
o Colgate White Paste

48 Each Per Case

item Number Description

CG50200 Colgate Toothpaste, Regular, 0.85 oz.

http://thehub/productPRO/productspecs/specsheet.asp?productcode=CG50200&pg=check  3/19/2008
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Bid Department: 1-800-235-8586
or FAX 1-888-866-3331

Clippers, Fingernail

Essential Nail Care Products at affordable
prices

Our metal nail clippers do not contain files making
it harder to use clippers as a weapon.

o All metal.
o Nofile.
e 2" in length.
o 24 per case.
ltem Number Description l
PT1 Clippers, Fingernail ]

http://thehub/productPRO/productspecs/specsheet.asp?productcode=PT1&pg=check 3/19/2008



Clippers, Fingernail

prices
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Bid Department: 1-800-235-8586

or FAX 1-888-866-3331

Essential Nail Care Products at affordable

Our metal nail clippers do not contain files making

it harder to use clippers as a weapon.

o All metal.
e No file.
e 2"in length.
e 24 per case.
Item Number Description
PT1 Clippers, Fingernail

http://thehub/productPRO/productspecs/specsheet.asp?productcode=PT1&pg=check 3/19/2008
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Bid Department: 1-800-235-8586
or FAX 1-888-866-3331

Clippers, Toenail

Essential Nail Care Products at affordable
. prices

Our metal nail clippers do not contain files making
it harder to use clippers as a weapon.

e All metal.
o Nofile.
e 3-1/4" length.
e 12 per case.
Item Number Description
PT3 Clippers, Toenail

http://thehub/productPRO/productspecs/ specsheét.asp?productcode=PT3 &pg=check 3/19/2008
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Bid Department: 1-800-235-8586
or FAX 1-888-866-3331

Black Plastic Pocket Comb, 7"

e Black
o Plastic
e 144 per case

Item Number Description
C-7 Black Plastic Pocket Comb, 7"

http://thehub/productPRO/productspecs/specsheet.asp?productcode=C-7&pg=check 3/19/2008
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Bid Department: 1-800-235-8586
or FAX 1-888-866-3331

Black Plastic Pocket Comb, 5"

e Black
e Plastic
o 144 per case

ltem Number Description
C-5 " Black Plastic Pocket Comb, 5"

http://thehub/productPRO/productspecs/specsheet.asp?productcode=C-5&pg=check 3/19/2008



Page 1 of 1

Bid Department: 1-800-235-8586

Standard Hairbrush, Nylon Bristles, 8"

e 24 per case.

or FAX 1-888-866-3331

Item Number

HB

Description
Standard Hairbrush, Nylon Bristles, 8"

http://thehub/productPRO/productspecs/specsheet.asp?productcode=HB&pg=check 3/19/2008
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Bid Department: 1-800-235-8586
or FAX 1-888-866-3331

Lady Speed Stick Antiperspirant, 1.4 oz.
e Shower fresh scent.

e Invisible dry.

e Contains stearyl alcohol, a solid which
does not cause intoxication.

e 12 per case.

item Number | Description ’
CG96579 Lady Speed Stick Antiperspirant, 1.4 oz.

http://thehub/productPRO/productspecs/specsheet.asp?productcode=CG96579&pg=check  3/19/2008
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Bid Department: 1-800-235-8586
or FAX 1-888-866-3331

Mennen Speed Stick Antiperspirant, 2 oz.

e Fresh scent.

e Contains stearyl alcohol, a solid which
does not cause intoxication.
o 12 per case.
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Item Number Description

CG95008 Mennen Speed Stick Antiperspirant, 2 oz.

http://thehub/productPRO/productspecs/ épecsheet.asp?productcode=CG95 008&pg=check  3/19/2008
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Bid Department: 1-800-235-8586
or FAX 1-888-866-3331

Alcohol Prep Pads

TRIND- NOD g
SoF gy

Hospital Strength Alcohol Prep Pads
Each 1-1/8" x 2-3/8" prep pad contains 70%
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item Number Description
HC3001 Alcohol Prep Pads

http://thehub/productPRO/productspecs/specsheet.asp?productcode=HC3001 &pg=check

3/19/2008
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Bid Department: 1-800-235-8586

] or FAX 1-888-866-3331

Dial Golden Liquid Antibacterial Soap, 1 Gal

#1 doctor recommended

¢ 4 1-Gailon plastic bottles per case

ltem Number Description

8047 Dial Golden Liquid Antibacterial Soap, 1 Gal |

http://thehub/productPRO/productspecs/specsheet.asp?productcode=8047&pg=check 3/19/2008



America’s Leatding Detention Supplier

Minutes ol Special Meeting of the Board of Directors for Bob Barker Company. Inc.

A SPECIAL MEETING of the board of directors of Bob Barker Company, inc was held on July
24, 2007 in the Varina Room at Bob Barker Co, Inc headquarters, Fuquay Varina, North Carolina,
The Following directors were present and participated in the mesting:

Robert § Barker, Sy, Patricia M. Barker
Robert J Barker, Jr. Nancy B. Johns
George Sneuacd Sonny Williams
Gabe Cipaw

RobertJ Barkcr Sr., Chairman of the Board, chaired the meeting and Patricia M, Barkcr
Executive Vice President of thz, Corporation, acted as Seeretary of the meeting,

The chairman announced that a quorurm of directors was present and ﬂmt the meeting, having been
duly convened, was ready 1o proceed with its business. The Secretary presented a waiver of notice of the
meeting, signed by all of the directors and was direcied to file the waiver of notice with the minutes of the
mieeting.

After full discussion of the affairs of the coimpany, the following resclution was intr odrlc«:d for
consideration and adoption by the directors:

RESOLVED, ihat the Board of Directors hercby grants sipnatory authority to enter bids obligating
the company in agreements fo formish products and services at agreed prices and conditions.

P Whitimifl

Shannon Pilkington

Connie Kincade

Marie Fatterson

Mary Shes

Tom Parker

Tine Morgan

Robert J Barker, Sr.

Robert ] Barker, I,

Dale Griffith - Lt LA
Adlison Wilmesmeler MQ “n A } fgﬁ ‘ )

The resolution was unanimously approved. There being no further business before the meeting,
on motion duly made, seconded and carried, it was adjourned.

2 c;/@ae/u/& Aopplos S

Robstt J Barker, 8¢
Chairman of the B{mrd of Dlrecmrs

Patricia M. Barker
Secretary to the Board of Directors

Bol Batker Company, ine. PO Box 429, 134 N. Main St, Fuguay-Varina, NC 27526 ph: (919) 552-3431 fax: (919) 5b2-5007



