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Classroom Furniture Specifications
CLRMO08

(1) Fixed-Height Student Chairs
(a) Legs and Frame
Minimum 1> Diameter 18-Gauge Nickel Chrome Plated Steel
(b)Back Support
Minimum 3/4” Diameter 16-Gauge Nickel Chrome Plated Steel
(c) Seat & Back '
Minimum 5/8” Thick Thermal Settmg Solid Plastic
OR
One-Piece Heavy-Duty High-Density Injection Molded Poly
Polyethylene Shell to have Heavy-Duty Reinforcing Ribs Molded to
Accommodate Back Support Tubing
Polypropylene Shell to have Molded Heavy-Duty Reinforcing Ribs

(2) Fixed-Height Tablet Arm Chair Desks

(a) Legs and Frame
Minimum 1” Diameter 16-Gauge Nickel Chrome Plated Steel

(b) Tablet Arm Support Tube
Minimum 7/8” Diameter 16-Gauge Nickel Chrome Plated Steel

(¢) Wraparound Brace Welded to Back and Support Tube
Minimum 3/4” Diameter 16-Gauge Nickel Chrome Plated Steel

(d) Back Support
Minimum 3/4” Diameter 16-Gauge Nickel Chrome Plated Steel

(e) Seat & Back
Minimum 5/8” Thick Thermal Setting Solid Plastic

OR

One-Piece Heavy-Duty High-Density Injection Molded Poly Shell Polyethylene
Shell to have Heavy-Duty Reinforcing Ribs Molded to Accommodate Back
Support Tubing. Polypropylene Shell to have Molded Heavy-Duty Reinforcing
Ribs Only

(f) Top Writing Surface
Minimum 5/8” Thick Thermal Setting Solid Plastic

OR

Minimum 5/8” Thick — 47 1b. Core Fiberboard with High-Density Plastic
Laminate and Phenolic Backer Sheet

(3)Fixed-Height Combination Study Unit Desks
(a) Legs, Frame, Tablet Arm Support Tube and Side Brace
Minimum 1” Diameter 16-Gauge Nickel Chrome Plated Steel
(b) Back Support
Minimum 3/4” Diameter 16-Gauge Nickel Chrome Plated Steel
(c) Seat & Back
Minimum 5/8” Thick Thermal Setting Solid Plastic
OR
One-Piece Heavy-Duty High-Density Injection Molded Poly Shell Polyethylene
Shell to have Heavy-Duty Reinforcing Ribs Molded to Accommodate Back
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Classroom Furniture Specifications
CLRMOS

Support Tubing Polypropylene Shell to have Molded Heavy-Duty Reinforcing
Ribs Only
(d) Top Writing Surface
Minimum 5/8” Thick Thermal Setting Solid Plastic
OR
Minimum 5/8” Thick — 47 1b. Core Fiberboard with High-Density Plastic
Laminate and Phenolic Backer Sheet

(4) Fixed-Height Open-Front Combination Study Unit Desks
(a) Legs, Frame, Book Box Support Tube and Side Brace
Minimum 1” Diameter 16-Gauge Nickel Chrome Plated Steel
(b) Back Support
Minimum 3/4” Diameter 16-Gauge Nickel Chrome Plated Steel
(c) Book Box
Minimum 4-1/2” Deep 20-Gauge. Steel with Powder Coat Paint
(d) Seat & Back '
Minimum 5/8” Thick Thermal Setting Solid Plastic
OR
One-Piece Heavy-Duty High-Density Injection Molded Poly Polyethylene Shell
to have Heavy-Duty Reinforcing Ribs Molded to Accommodate Back Support
Tubing Polypropylene Shell to have Molded Heavy-Duty Reinforcing Ribs
Only
(e) Top Writing Surface
Minimum 5/8” Thick Thermal Setting Solid Plastic
OR
Minimum 5/8” Thick — 47 Ib. Core Fiberboard with ngh-Densrcy Plastic
Laminate and Phenolic Backer Sheet

(5) Adjustable-Height Open-Front Book Box Desks
(a) Legs and Frame
Minimum 1-1/8” Diameter 16-Gauge Steel Upper Leg and Frame Supplied
Powder Coat Painted or Fully Nickel Chrome Plated — Minimum 1” Diameter
16-Gauge Nickel Chrome Plated Lower Leg Insert Height-Adjustable in 17
Increments from 22” to 29”
OR
Minimum %” x 2” 16-Gauge Rectangular Steel Upper Leg and Frame Supplied
Powder Coat Painted — Minimum %" x 1-7/8” 16-Gauge Nickel Chrome Plated
rectangular Steel Lower “T” Pedestal Leg Insert Height-Adjustable in
(b) Book Box
Minimum 4-1/2” Deep 20-Gauge Steel with Powder Coat Paint
OR
Minimum 4-1/2” Deep Molded Polyethylene
(¢) Top Writing Surface
Minimum 5/8” Thick Thermal Setting Solid Plastic
OR
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Classroom Furniture Specifications
CLRMO8

Minimum 5/8” Thick — 47 1b. Core Fiberboard with High-Density Plastic
Laminate and Phenolic Backer Sheet
(6) Adjustable-Height Lift Lid Book Box Desks

(a) Legs and Frame
Minimum 1-1/8” Diameter 16-Gauge Steel Upper Leg and Frame Supplied
Powder Coat Painted or Fully Nickel Chrome Plated— Minimum 1” Diameter
16-Gauge Nickel Chrome Plated Lower Leg Insert Height-Adjustable in 17
Increments from 22” to 29~

(b)Book Box
Minimum 4-1/2” Deep 20-Gauge Steel with Powder Coat Paint

(c) Lift Lid
One Full-Length Piano Hinge, Two Friction Hinges and Two Rubber Bumper
Cushions

(d) Top Writing Surface
Minimum 5/8” Thick Thermal Setting Solid Plastic

OR

Minimum 5/8” Thick — 47 1b. Core Fiberboard with High-Density Plastic
Laminate and Phenolic Backer Sheet

(7) Adjustable-Height Student Study Desks

(a)Legs and Frame
Minimum 1-1/8” Diameter 16-Gauge Steel Upper Leg and Frame Supplied
Powder Coat Painted or Fully Nickel Chrome Plated— Minimum 1” Diameter
16-Gauge Nickel Chrome Plated Lower Leg Insert Height-Adjustable in 17
Increments from 22” to 29”

(b) Top Writing Surface
Minimum 5/8” Thick Thermal Setting Solid Plastic

OR

Minimum 5/8” Thick — 47 Ib. Core Fiberboard with High-Density Plastic
Laminate and Phenolic Backer Sheet

(8) Fixed-Height Student Study Desks

(a) Legs and Frame
Minimum 1” Diameter 16-Gauge Nickel Chrome Plated Steel

(b) Top Writing Surface
Minimum 5/8” Thick Thermal Setting Solid Plastic

OR

Minimum 5/8” Thick — 47 1b. Core Fiberboard with High-Density Plastic
Laminate and Phenolic Backer Sheet

(9) Pneumatic Height-Adjustable Star Base Swivel Computer Lab Chair

(a) Frame
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Classroom Furniture Specifications
CLRMO8

Minimum 3/4” Diameter 16-Gauge Powder Coat Painted Steel Back Support
Tubing Welded to Two (2) 3” x 8-1/2” 12-Gauge Steel Plates Welded to Single
Seat Support Plate

(b) Seat & Back
Minimum 5/8” Thick Thermal Setting Solid Plastic

OR e

One-Piece Heavy-Duty High-Density Injection Molded Polyethylene Shell with
No Exposed Hardware and Heavy-Duty Reinforcing Ribs Molded to
Accommodate Back Support Tubing

(c) Swivel Pneumatic Lift Mechanism Adjusts Seat Height from 15 to 20”

(d) Base
Five-Spoke Star Base of High Strength Polymer with Five 2” Dual Hooded
Casters
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CLRMOS - Pricing Pages

It Min Non-Skid
em Description Est. Quantity| Unit Price| Order Glides | Other Extra
Category | - Fixed-Height Chairs
y 12" Two-Piece "X-Frame" Hard Plastic Stacking
Chair (Artco-Bell #X103) 50 39.12 4 $40.62
14" Two-Piece "X-Frame" Hard Plastic Stacking
2 Chair (Artco-Bell #X103) 300 39.12 4 $40.62
3 16" Two-Piece "X-Frame" Hard Plastic Stacking
Chair (Artco-Bell #X105) 500 39.96 4 $41.46
4 18" Two-Piece "X-Frame" Hard Plastic Stacking
Chair (Artco-Bell #X107) 1000 38.88 4 $40.38
"A+" 18-1/2" "OverSize" Two-Piece "X-Frame"
4A |Hard Plastic Stacking Chair With 30% Larger
Seating Area (Artco-Bell #X108) 125 50.8 4 $52.30
5 12" Two-Piece "H-Frame" Hard Plastic Stacking ,
Chair w/o Book Rack (Arico-Bell #H1X3) 75 41.04 4 '$42.54
14" Two-Piece "H-Frame" Hard Plastic Stacking
6 Chair w/o BookRack (Artco-Bell #41X3) 50 41.04 4 $42.54
16" Two-Piece "H-Frame" Hard Plastic Stacking
7 Chair Without BookRack (Artco-Bell #H1X5) 50 42.71 4 $44.21
18" Two-Piece "H-Frame" Hard Plastic Stacking
8 Chair Without BookRack (Artco-Bell #H1X7)
125 50.25 4 $51.75
gA | BookRack Option - Items 5 Thru 8 1000 5
9 X-Brace Option for ltems 7 & 8 » 200 no bid
10" One-Piece Soft Plastic Seat & Back Stacking
10 |Chair Artco Bell 7101 100 1796 5 $18.76
12" One-Piece Soft Plastic Seat & Back Stacking
1 |Chair (Artco-Bell #7101) 200 17.96 5 $18.76
14" One-Piece Soft Plastic Seat & Back Stacking
12 |Chair (Artco-Bell #7103) 1000 17.96 5 $18.76
16" One-Piece Soft Plastic Seat & Back Stacking
13 |Chair (Artco-Bell #7105) 1000 10.82 5 $21.32
18" One-Piece Soft Plastic Seat & Back Stacking
14 |Chair (Artco-Bell #7107) 500 21.88 5 $23.38
"A+" 18-1/2" "OverSize" One-Piece Soft Plastic
14A | Seat & Back Stacking Chair With 30% Larger
Seating Area (Artco-Bell #7108) 500 25.11 5 $26.61
15 Optional Bookrack for Item #14 (Artco-Bell #7157)
500 411 4 $42.60
16 |Optional Ganging Device for ltem #14 100 439 no min.
18" One-Piece Soft Plastic Seat & Back Chair
17  |With Upholstered Seat & Back Pads and Casters
(Artco-Bell #7167) 250 49.71 5
18" One-Piece Soft Plastic Seat & Back Chair
18 |With Upholstered Seat and Back Pads (Artco-
Bell #7107) 350 36.25 5 $37.75
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CLRMOS8 - Pricing Pages
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Item

Description

Est. Quantity

Unit Price

Min
Order

Non-Skid
Glides

Other Extra

19

18" One-Piece Soft Plastic Seat & Back Chair
With Casters (Artco-Bell #7167)

50

35.35

20

Pneumatic Adjustable-Height One-Piece Soft
Plastic eat & Back Swivel Teacher's Chair, With
Upholstered Seat & Back Pads and Molded 5-
Pronged Pedestal Base (Artco-Bell #7P90)

25

74.22

21

12" One-Piece Soft Plastic Seat & Back Stacking
Chair With Sled Base (Artco-Bell #7003)

50

23.09

22

14" One-Piece Soft Plastic Seat & Back Stacking
Chair With Sled Base (Artco-Bell #7003)

50

23.09

23

16" One-Piece Soft Plastic Seat & Back Stacking
Chair With Sled Base (Artco-Bell #7005)

50

25.66

24

18" One-Piece Soft Plastic Seat & Back Stacking
Chair With Sled Base (ABC #7007)

50

27.57

Category Il - Fixed-Height Chair Desks

25

Chair Desk With Bookrack - Hard Plastic Seat,
Back and Tablet-Arm WorkTop (Artco-Bell #
H257)

100

93.47

$94.97

26

Chair Desk Without Bookrack - Hard Plastic Seat,
Back and Tablet-Arm WorkTop (Scholar Craft
507)

100

113.5

$115.00

27

Chair Desk With Bookrack - Hard Plastic Seat,
Back , Laminate work surface ABC H207 .

75

83.58

$85.08

28

Chair Desk With Bookrack - One-Piece Soft
Plastic Seat & Back With Laminate Tablet-Arm
WorkTop (Artco-Bell #7257)

50

69.2

$70.70

28A

"A+" "OverSize" Chair Desk With Bookrack - One-
Piece Soft Plastic Seat & Back With Laminate
Tablet-Arm WorkTop and 30% Larger Seating
Area (Artco-Bell #7258)

150

82.09

$83.59

29

Chair Desk Without Bookrack - One-Piece Soft
Plastic Seat & Back With Laminate Tablet-Arm
WorkTop (Artco-Bell #7207)

50

67.26

$68.76

29A

"A+" "OverSize" Chair Desk Without Bookrack -
One-Piece Soft Plastic Seat & Back With
Laminate Tablet-Arm WorkTop and 30% Larger
Seating Area (Artco-Bell #7208)

175

80.15

$81.65

30

Chair Desk With Bookrack - One-Piece Soft
Plastic Seat & Back With Laminate Tablet-Arm
WorkTop (Artco-Bell #7257)

50

69.2

$70.70
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CLRMO08 - Pricing Pages

Item

Description

Est. Quantity

Unit Price

Min
Order

Non-Skid
Glides

Other Extra

30A

"A+" "OverSize" Chair Desk With Bookrack - One-|
Piece Soft Plastic Seat & Back With Laminate
Tablet-Arm WorkTop and 30% Larger Seating
Area (Arico-Bell #7258)

50

82.09

$83.59

31

Chair Desk Without Bookrack - One-Piece Soft
Plastic Seat & Back With Laminate Tablet-Arm
WorkTop (Artco-Bell #7207)

50

67.26

$68.76

31A

"A+" "OverSize" Chair Desk Without Bookrack -
One-Piece Soft Plastic Seat & Back With
L.aminate Tablet-Arm WorkTop and 30% Larger
Seating Area (Artco-Bell #7208)

50

80.15

$81.65

Categor

v Ill Fixed-Height Combination Study Unit Desks

$1.50

32

Combination Desk With Bookrack - Hard Plastic
Seat, Back and WorkTop (Artco-Bell #H457)

50

100.6

$102.10

32A

"A+" "OverSize" Combination Desk With Bookrack
Hard Plastic Seat, Back and WorkTop With 30%
Larger Seating Area (Artco-Bell #H458)

75

124.91

$126.41

33

Combination Desk Without Bookrack - Hard
Plastic Seat, Back and WorkTop (Artco-Bell
#H407)

50

98.88

$100.38

33A

"A+" "OverSize" Combination Desk Without
Bookrack - Hard Plastic Seat, Back and WorkTop
With 30% Larger Seating Area (Artco-Bell #H408)

75

121.19

$122.69

34

Combination Desk With Bookrack - One-Piece
Soft Plastic Seat & Back With Laminate WorkTop
(Artco-Bell #7457)

25

67.26

$68.76

34A

"A+" "QOverSize" Combination Desk With Bookrack
One-Piece Soft Plastic Seat & Back With
Laminate WorkTop and 30% Larger Seating Area
(Artco-Bell #7458)

50

78.74

$80.24

35

Combination Desk Without Bookrack - One-Piece
Soft Plastic Seat & Back With Laminate WorkTop
(Artco-Bell #7407)

25

64.77

$66.27

35A

"A+" "OverSize" Combination Desk Without
Bookrack - One-Piece Soft Plastic Seat & Back
With Laminate WorkTop and 30% Larger Seating
Area (Artco-Bell #7408)

50

74.22

$75.72

36

Combination Desk Without Bookrack - One-Piece
Soft Plastic Seat & Back With Laminate WorkTop
(Artco-Bell #7407)

25

64.91

$66.41
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Item

Description

Est. Quantity

Unit Price

Min
Order

Non-Skid
Glides

Other Extra

36A

"A+" "OverSize" Combination Desk Without
Bookrack - One-Piece Soft Plastic Seat & Back
With Laminate WorkTop and 30% Larger Seating
Area (Artco-Bell #7408)

150

74.53

$76.03

36B

"A+" "OverSize" Combination Desk With Bookrack
One-Piece Soft Plastic Seat & Back With Hard
Plastic WorkTop and 30% Larger Seating Area
(Artco-Bell #7458)

100

96.96

$98.46

36C

"A+" "OverSize" Combination Desk Without
Bookrack - One-Piece Soft Piastic Seat & Back
With Hard Plastic WorkTop and 30% Larger
Seating Area (Artco-Bell #7408)

- 150

91.6

$93.10

37

Combination Desk With Double Entry Sled Base
and Bookrack - Hard Plastic Seat, Back and
WorkTop (Artco-Bell #H057)

75

127.7

38

Combination Desk With Double Entry Sled Base
and Bookrack - One-Piece Soft Plastic Seat &
Back With Laminate WorkTop (Artco-Bell #7857)

75

95.19

$96.69

Category IV - Fixed-Height Open-Front Combination Study Unit Desks

39

Bookbox Combination Desk - Hard Plastic Seat,
Back and WorkTop With Steel Bookbox (Scholar
Craft #780)

100

135.63

40

Bookbox Combination Desk - One-Piece Soft
Plastic Seat & Back With Hard Plastic WorkTop

and Steel Bookbox (Scholar Craft #720)

50

118.1

Category V - Fixed-Height Lift-Lid Combination Study Unit Desks

41

Lift-Lid Bookbox Combination Desk - Hard Plastic
Seat, Back and WorkTop With Steel Bookbox
(Scholar Craft #980)

75

165.29

42

Lift-Lid Bookbox Combination Desk - One-Piece
Soft Plastic Seat & Back With Hard Plastic
WorkTop and Steel Bookbox (Scholar Craft #920)

75

138.29

Category VI - Adjustable-Height Open-Front Book Box Desks

43

Pedestal "T-Leg" Bookbox Desk With 18" x 24"
Hard Plastic WorkTop and Steel Bookbox (Artco-
Bell #9300)

50

82.65

44

Pedestal "T-Leg" Bookbox Desk With 20" x 26"
Laminate WorkTop and Steel Bookbox
(Artco-Bell #9306)

50

62.8
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Item

Description

Est. Quantity

Unit Price

Min
Order

Non-Skid
Glides

Other Extra

45

Four-Leg Bookbox Desk With 18" x 24" Hard
Plastic WorkTop and Steel Bookbox (Artco-Bell
#9500) '

25

62.98

46

Four-Leg Bookbox Desk With 18" x 24" Laminate
WorkTop and Steel Bookbox (Artco-Bell #9500)

50

43.13

47

Two-Student Pedestal "T-Leg" Bookbox Desk
With Laminate WorkTop and Steel Bookboxes
(Artco-Bell #1911)

75

128.37

48

Four-Leg Student Desk With Steel Side Book
Compartment, Modesty Panel, and 18" x 34"
Laminate WorkTop (Artco-Bell #2111 Left-Hand
or #2121 Right-Hand)

75

69.97

Category VIl - Adjustable-Height Lift-Lid Book Box Desks

49

Four-Leg Lift-Lid Bookbox Desk With 18" x 24"
Hard Plastic WorkTop and Steel Bookbox (Artco-
Bell #9780)

50

96.05

50

Four-Leg Lift-Lid Bookbox Desk With 18" x 24"
Laminate WorkTop and Steel Bookbox
(Artco-Bell #9780)

50

79.16

51

Pedestal "T-Leg" Lift-Lid Bookbox Desk With 18"
x 24" Hard Plastic WorkTop and Steel Bookbox
(Artco-Bell #9680)

50

113.96

52

Pedestal "T-Leg" Lift-Lid Bookbox Desk With 18"
x 24" Laminate WorkTop and Steel Bookbox
{Artco-Bell #9680)

50

97.06

Category VIl - Adjustable-Height Student Study Desks

53

Four-Leg Student Study Desk With Open-View
Book Compartment and 18" x 24" Hard Plastic
WorkTop (Artco-Bell #9800)

75

64.81

54

Four-Leg Student Study Desk With Open-View
Book Compartment and 18" x 24" Laminate
WorkTop (Artco-Bell #9800)

50

47.92

55

Four-Leg Student Study Desk Without Book
Compartment With 20" x 34" Hard Plastic
WorkTop (Artco-Bell #2900)

75

99.11

56

Four-Leg "Flat Top" Student Study Desk With 18"
x 24" Hard Plastic WorkTop and Chrome
Frame (Artco-Bell #9100)

25

58.87

Category IX - Pneumatic Height-Adjustable Star Base Swivel Computer Lab Chairs

57

Hard Plastic Seat and Back (Artco-Bell #4P90)

100

80.3

1
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CLRM0O8 - Pricing Pages
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em Description Est. Quantity| Unit Price; Order Glides | Other Extra
58 “StandardSize" One-Piece Soft Plastic Seat &

Back (Artco-Bell #7P90) 100 75.93 1
59 "OverSize" One-Piece Soft Plastic Seat & Back

(Artco-Bell #7P98) 100 83.88 1

Category X - Adjustable-Height Multi-Purpose Activity Tables

60 Four-Leg With 24" x 36" Laminate Top

(Artco-Bell #12086) 25 58.23 2
61 Four-Leg With 24" x 48" Laminate Top

(Artco-Bell #1210) 25 60.65 2
62 Four-L.eg With 24" x 60" Laminate Top

(Artco-Bell #1235) 25 76.39 2
63 Four-Leg With 30" x 48" Laminate Top

(Artco-Bell #1220) 25 65.73 2
64 Four-Leg With 30" x 60" Laminate Top

(Artco-Bell #1230) 25 82.55 1
65 Four-Leg With 30" x 72" Laminate Top

(Artco-Bell #1250) 25 92.34 1
66 Four-Leg With 36" x 36" Laminate Top

(Artco-Bell #1205) 25 72.81 2
67 Four-Leg With 36" x 60" Laminate Top

(Artco-Bell #1240) 25 91.98 1
68 Four-Leg With 36" x 72" Laminate Top

(Artco-Bell #1260) 25 99.89 1
69 Four-Leg With 36" Dia. Round Laminate Top

(Artco-Bell #1282) 25 69.2 2
70 Four-Leg With 42" Dia. Round Laminate Top

(Artco-Bell #1281) 25 76.49 2
71 Four-Leg With 48" Dia. Round Laminate Top

(Artco-Bell #1280) 25 82.64 1
79 Four-Leg With 60" Dia. Round Laminate Top

(Artco-Bell #1286) 25 125.67 1
73 Four-Leg With 48" x 72" Kidney-Shape Laminate

Top (Artco-Bell #1275) 25 140.27 1
74 Four-Leg With 60" x 66" Horseshoe-Shape :

Laminate Top (Artco-Bell #1277) 25 168.46 1
75 Four-Leg With 24" x 24" x 24" x 48" Trapezoid-

Shape Laminate Top (Artco-Bell #1291) 25 68.3 9
76 Four-Leg With 30" x 30" x 30" x 60" Trapezoid-

Shape Laminate Top (Artco-Bell #1290) 25 80.39 2

Pedestal "T-Leg" With 24" x 48" Laminate Top
77 |(Artco-Bell #1910)

: 25 108.02 1

78 Pedestal "T-Leg" With 24" x 48" Laminate Top

(Artco-Bell #1910) o5 108.02 1
79 Pedestal "T-Leg" With 30" x 60" Laminate Top

(Artco-Bell #1930) o5 195.45 1
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It Min | Non-Skid
em Description Est. Quantity| Unit Price| Order Glides | Other Extra
go |Pedestal "T-Leg" With 30" x 72" Laminate Top

(Artco-Bell #1950) 25 131.45 1
81 Pedestal "T-Leg" With 36" x 72" Laminate Top
(Artco-Bell #1960) 25 139.41 1
82 |Pedestal "T-Leg" - UnKnown Size 25 no bid
83 |Tote Tray 12" x 16" x 4" High 25 no bid
84 Steel Bookbox 14-1/2" x 13-5/8" x 4 5" High
(Artco-Bell #0021) 100 16.49 no min.
9" x 21" Wire Management Panel (Artco-Bell
85 lswmpa) 50 25.81 2
86 9" x 33" Wire Management Panel (Artco-Bell
#WMP4) 50 30.55 2
87 9" x 45" Wire Management Panel (Artco-Bell ‘
#WMPS5) 50 32.91 2
88 9" x 57" Wire Management Panel (Artco-Bell
#WMPB) 50 36.22 2
89 |Optional Casters 100 no bid
9% Folding Table With 30" x 60" Laminate Top
(Midwest Folding Products #3060EF) 25 154.8 2
91 Folding Table With 30" x 72" Laminate Top
(Midwest Folding Products #3072EF) 25 130.8 2
9 Folding Table With 30" x 96" Laminate Top
(Midwest Folding Products #3096EF) 25 154.8 1
93 Folding Table With 60" Dia. Round Laminate Top
(Midwest Folding Products #R60EF) 25 190.8 1
Category Xl - Heavy Duty Folding Tables
94 Heavy-Duty Adjustable-Height Folding Table With
20" x 26" Plywood Laminate Top 25 no bid
Heavy-Duty Adjustable-Height "T-Leg" Folding
95 |Table With 24" x 48" Plywood Laminate Top
(Midwest Folding Products #TLA245EF) 25 203.68 1
Heavy-Duty Adjustable-Height "T-Leg" Folding
96 |Table With 30" x 60" Plywood Laminate Top :
(Midwest Folding Products #TLA305EF) 25 205.33 1
Heavy-Duty Adjustable-Height "T-Leg" Folding
97 |Table With 30" x 72" Plywood Laminate Top ,
(Midwest Folding Products #TLA306EF 25 218.3 1
Heavy-Duty Adjustable-Height "T-Leg" Folding
98 | Table With 36" x 72" Plywood Laminate Top
| (Midwest Folding Products #TLA 366EF) 25 240.45 1
Category XII - Lightweight Folding Tables
99 18" x 72" Folding Table With ABS Plastic Top
(Midwest Folding Products #618NLW) o5 186.29 2
18" x 96" Folding Table With ABS Plastic Top
100 | (Midwest Folding Products #818NLW) 05 199.35 5
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It Min | Non-Skid
em Description Est. Quantity| Unit Price| Order Glides | Other Extra
101 24" x 72" Folding Table With ABS Plastic Top
(Midwest Folding Products #624NLW) 25 193.86 2
102 24" x 96" Folding Table With ABS Plastic Top
(Midwest Folding Products #824NLW) 25 211.18 2
103 30" x 60" Folding Table With ABS Plastic Top
(Midwest Folding Products #530NLW) 25 186.9 2
104 30" x 72" Folding Table With ABS Plastic Top
(Midwest Folding Products #630NLW) 25 206.24 2
105 30" x 96" Folding Table With ABS Plastic Top
(Midwest Folding Products #830NLW) 25 242.78 2
106 36" x 72" Folding Table With ABS Plastic Top
(Midwest Folding Products #836NLW) 25 249.19 2
107 36" x 96" Folding Table With ABS Plastic Top
(Midwest Folding Products #836NLW) 25 270.6 2
108 60" Dia. Round Folding Table With ABS Plastic
Top (Midwest Folding Products #R60NLW) 25 267.18 1
Category Xlll - Banquet Folding Tables
109 30" x 72" Folding Table With Plywood Laminate
Top (Midwest Folding Products #630EF) 25 155.37 2
110 30" x 96" Folding Table With Plywood Laminate
Top (Midwest Folding Products #830EF) 25 176.84 1
60" Dia. Round Folding Table With Plywood
111 Laminate Top (Midwest Folding Products
#R60EF) 25 219.91 1
Category XIV - Mobile Folding Cafeteria Tables
48" Dia. Round Table With Particleboard
112 |Laminate Top, "T-Mold" Vinyl Edge and Chrome
Frame (Midwest Folding Products #SRT48C) 25 418.89 1
60" Dia.Round Table With Particleboard Laminate
113 Top, "T-Mold" Vinyl Edge and Chrome Frame
(Midwest Folding Products #SRT60C)
25 439.48 1
30" x 145" Table With Particleboard Laminate
Top, "T-Mold" Vinyl Edge and Chrome Frame
114 | \Midwest Folding Products #STU12C)
25 555.44 1
30" x 145" Table With Particleboard Laminate
Top, "T-Mold" Vinyl Edge, Chrome Frame and
115 147" High Attached Stool Seating (12 Seats)
(Midwest Folding Products #5SU1212C) 25 1047.38 1
30" x 145" Table With Particleboard Laminate
Top, "T-Mold" Vinyl Edge, Chrome Frame and
118 115" High Attached Stool Seating (12 Seats)
(Midwest Folding Products #SSU1212C) 25 1047.38 1
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117

30" x 145" Table With Particleboard Laminate
Top, "T-Mold" Vinyl Edge, Chrome Frame and 15"
High Attached Bench Seating (Midwest Folding
Products #SBU12C)

25

908.15

118

30" x 145" Table With Particleboard Laminate
Top, "T-Mold" Vinyl Edge, Chrome Frame and
17" High Attached Bench Seating

(Midwest Folding Products #SBU12C)

25

908.15

118B

60" Dia. Round Table With Particleboard
Laminate Top, "T-Mold" Vinyl Edge, Chrome
Frame, and Attached Stool Seating (8 Seats)
(Midwest Folding Products #SSURB08C)

25

895.2

118C

96" Long "Convertible Bench" Table With
Particleboard Laminate Top, Plywood Laminate
Bench, Vinyl "T-Mold" Edge, Powdercoat Painted
Frame With Chrome Plated Pedestal

(Midwest Folding Products #TB8)

25

462.69

Category XV - Desks (Teacher's and Study Carrel)

119

30" x 48" Single-Pedestal Steel Teacher's Desk
(Artco-Bell #D4L0 Left Pedestal or #D4R0 Right
Pedestal)

25

314.46

120

30” x 60" Double-Pedestal Steel Teacher's Desk
(Artco-Bell #D500)

25

418.69

121

24" x 36" Study Carrel Desk With Pedestal "T-
Legs",
Laminate Top, and Laminate Privacy Panel With

25

216.53

122

24" x 36" Study Carrel Desk With Pedestal "T-
Legs",
Laminate Top, and Laminate Privacy Panel With

25

216.53

123

Optional Privacy Panel (Included in ltems #121 &
#122)

25

no bid

Category XVI - Miscellaneous Chairs

124

Upholstered Stack Chair With Chrome Frame
(HON #1081)

100

59.06

125

Stackable Upholstered Chair With Painted Frame
and

100

59.06

126

Steel Folding Chair (National Public Seating #200)

100

18.39

127

Steel Folding Chair With Vinyl Seat & Back
Padding

100

23.57

128

High-Density Poly Stacking Chair (Artco-Bell
#CS17)

200

57.21

Category XVI| - Storage Equipment
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Table Caddy for 48" to 72" Round Folding Tables

129 (Midwest Folding Products #HRTC)

.12 403.92 1

Table Caddy for 72" Long Rectangular Folding

130 Tables (Midwest Folding Products #TC72)

12 173.03 1

Table Caddy for 96" Long Rectangular Folding

131 | Taples (Midwest Folding Products #TC96)

12 180.34 1

Horizontal Chair Caddy for Folding Chairs

132 (Midwest Folding Products #CC84)

12 161.28 1

Two-Tier Vertical Chair Caddy for Folding Chairs

133 (Midwest Folding Products #VCT72)

12 310.14 1

Category XVIIl - Adjustable-Height Stools

134 With Poly Seat and Chrome Frame
Artco-Bell #0801 (Adjusts 19" to 27-1/2")

25 45.22 4

With Poly Seat and Chrome Frame

135 Artco-Bell #0802 (Adjusts 23" to 32")

25 46.84 4

With Hard Plastic Seat and Chrome Frame

137 | Artco-Bell #0803 (Adjusts 19-1/2" to 28")

25 48.91 4

With Hard Plastic Seat and Chrome Frame

138 | Artco-Bell #0804 (Adjusts 23-1/2" to 32-1/2")

25 50.14 4

Category XIX - Inside Delivery Fee

Cost / per order to place items in correct room in building.

100

Additional 10% per item

Vendor Representative:

Name: Brian Hanes Tom Sexton & Associates
Address: 10 Clingman Street

- South Webster, Ohio 45682

Main Office : 1-800-404-5032

—|Reps Office : (740) 778-1433

Mobile : (740) 352-4246

| FAX . (740) 778-1434

E-mail . hanes.b@tomsextonfurniture.com

— Brian Hanes & Gary Smith
Name of Sales Representatives

2/5/08
Date
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