

NOCH

State of West Virginia Department of Administration Purchasing Division 2019 Washington Street East Post Office Box 50130 Charleston, WV 25305-0130

Request for Quotation

SH-p

Ö

RFO NUMBER
668C0028

PA	GE
	1

ADDRESS CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTENTION OF

MICHAEL AUSTIN 304-558-2402

*201151617 304-485-4585 ATLAS TOWING COMPANY PO BOX 688

PARKERSBURG WV 26102

DATE PRIN	DATE PRINTED TERMS OF SALE		£	SHIP VIA	F	O.B.	FREIGHT TERMS	
05/21/	2008							
BID OPENING DATE:		06/11/	2008		BID	OPENING	TIME 0	:30PM
LINE	QUA	NTITY	UOP	CAT.	ITEM NUMBER	UNI	TPRICE	AMOUNT
				100				
0001					770 07			
0001		1	EA		770-06			
	STONE	& AGGR	FCATE					
1	JIOHL	a Hook	LOAIL					

				OPEN	END CONTRACT			
1								
					MATERIALS, AND E			
					ONE AND AGGREGAT IGHWAYS, DISTRIC			
					NDER THE CONDITI			
	I .	AFTER.	TONO	1100	NOER THE CONDITE	0113 31 20	oli ili	
	NOTE:	(1) VE	NDORS	CAN	COMPLETE BIDDING	SCHEDUL	ES AT OUR	
]				TE.WV.US/ADMIN/P			
					OT NEED TO SEND	IN BLANK	PAGES,	
					RE BIDDING ON)			
					LD STAMP EACH PA E AND NUMBER PAG		200	
- The second sec	3				THAT YOU ARE SUB	(ECEIVED
Walantee Wal					DDING SCHEDULE V	1	W250-040908	
THE PROPERTY OF THE PROPERTY O					OF THESE PAGES I	ì		JUNII AII: 19
APPRIL 64-11-11-11-11-11-11-11-11-11-11-11-11-11					E SITES.	_	2694	voii 1 /m 11' 1 1
							e comp	ALASINIC SIMINION
		- -						Zint in a single in the single
	EXHIBI	1 5						
	I TEE D	F CONT	RACT.	тн	IS CONTRACT BECO	MES EEEE	CTIVE ON	
					D EXTENDS FOR A	1		
	YEAR O	R UNTI	L SUC		ASONABLE TIME" T	1		
	NECESS	ARY TO	OBTA	IN A	NEW CONTRACT OR	RENEW TH	łE	
					E "REASONABLE TI	1		
							REASONABLE	
	TIME"	THE VE	NDOR	MAY T	ERMINATE THIS CO	NTRACT F	OR ANY	
								A. (1) (1) (1) (1) (1) (1) (1) (1) (1) (1)
	<u> </u>			SEE RE	VERSE SIDE FOR TERMS AND CO	I NDITIONS		
SIGNATURE					TELEPHONE		DATE	en terinistat in terinistat kalada kalada kalada kalada da
TITLE		[FE	in	***************************************		Ant	DESC CHANCES	TO DE NOTED ABOVE
						ADI	JRESS CHANGES	TO BE NOTED ABOVE

GENERAL TERMS & CONDITIONS REQUEST FOR QUOTATION (RFQ) AND REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL (RFP)

- 1. Awards will be made in the best interest of the State of West Virginia.
- 2. The State may accept or reject in part, or in whole, any bid.
- 3. All quotations are governed by the West Virginia Code and the Legislative Rules of the Purchasing Division.
- 4. Prior to any award, the apparent successful vendor must be properly registered with the Purchasing Division and have paid the required \$125.00 registration fee.
- 5. All services performed or goods delivered under State Purchase Orders/Contracts are to be continued for the term of the Purchase Order/Contract, contingent upon funds being appropriated by the Legislature or otherwise being made available. In the event funds are not appropriated or otherwise available for these services or goods, this Purchase Order/Contract becomes void and of no effect after June 30.
- 6. Payment may only be made after the delivery and acceptance of goods or services.
- 7. Interest may be paid for late payment in accordance with the West Virginia Code.
- 8. Vendor preference will be granted upon written request in accordance with the West Virginia Code.
- 9. The State of West Virginia is exempt from federal and state taxes and will not pay or reimburse such taxes.
- 10. The Director of Purchasing may cancel any Purchase Order/Contract upon 30 days written notice to the seller.
- 11. The laws of the State of West Virginia and the *Legislative Rules* of the Purchasing Division shall govern all rights and duties under the Contract, including without limitation the validity of this Purchase Order/Contract.
- 12. Any reference to automatic renewal is hereby deleted. The Contract may be renewed only upon mutual written agreement of the parties.
- 13. BANKRUPTCY: In the event the vendor/contractor files for bankruptcy protection, this Contract may be deemed null and void, and terminated without further order.
- 14. HIPAA Business Associate Addendum The West Viginia State Government HIPAA Business Associate Addendum (BAA), approved by the Attorney General, and available online at the Purchasing Division's web site (http://www.state.wv.us/admin/purchase/vrc/hipaa.htm) is hereby made part of the agreement. Provided that, the Agency meets the definition of a Covered Entity (45 CFR §160.103) and will be disclosing Protected Health Information (45 CFR §160.103) to the vendor.

INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS

- 1. Use the quotation forms provided by the Purchasing Division.
- 2. SPECIFICATIONS: Items offered must be in compliance with the specifications. Any deviation from the specifications must be clearly indicated by the bidder. Alternates offered by the bidder as EQUAL to the specifications must be clearly defined. A bidder offering an alternate should attach complete specifications and literature to the bid. The Purchasing Division may waive minor deviations to specifications.
- 3. Complete all sections of the quotation form.
- 4. Unit prices shall prevail in cases of discrepancy.
- 5. All quotations are considered F.O.B. destination unless alternate shipping terms are clearly identified in the quotation.
- 6. BID SUBMISSION: All quotations must be delivered by the bidder to the office listed below prior to the date and time of the bid opening. Failure of the bidder to deliver the quotations on time will result in bid disqualifications.

SIGNED BID TO:

Department of Administration Purchasing Division 2019 Washington Street East Post Office Box 50130 Charleston, WV 25305-0130

Rev. 9/25/07



VEZDOR

State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

Request for Quotation

þ

ō

RFONUMBER
668C0028

PAGE

ADDRESS CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTIENTION OF

MICHAEL AUSTIN 304-558-2402

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER

*201151617 304-485-4585 ATLAS TOWING COMPANY PO BOX 688

PARKERSBURG WV 26102

DATE PRIN	TE PRINTED TERMS OF SALE SHIP VIA		VIA		F.C			FREIGHINIER	IMS			
05/21/	2008											
BID OPENING DATE:		06/11/	2008			BID	OPE	NING	TIME	01:30)PM	***************************************
LINE	QUAN	YTITY	UOP	CAT. NO	ITEM NU	MBER		UNIT	PRICE		AMOUNT	
					•		<i>)</i>					
	REASON	UPON	GIVIN	G THE	DIRECTOR	R OF PUR	CHA	SING	30 DAYS	l		
	WRITTE	N NOTI	CE.				1					
					IONS ARE							
	t ·		1 5		ENT, THE	•	ı					
	1		HEREI	N ARE	FIRM FOR	R THE LI	I/FE	OF TH	E			
	CONTRA	CT.										
	1		1 8		MAY BE							
					SPENDING		1					
					TOR OF PL					.		
					RATION DA							
	1				THE TERMS		1			1		
	1			AND	SHALL BE	LIMIIED	טו ע	IWU	(2) UNE			
	(1) YE	AK PEK	יפתחדי									
	CANCEL	LATTON	. TUE	DIDE	CTOR OF I	HOCHACT	TNC	DECED	VEC THE	1		
	1		1	:	ONTRACT :		E					
	1		I 1		F THE CO							
	*		ŧ 1		ERIOR QUA							
			: 1		OF THE B					F		
	10 1112	01 201	107.	100		LD FIND G						
	DPEN M	ARKET	CLAUS	E: TH	E DIRECTO	OR OF PU	JRCH	ASING	MAY			
	4		t 1	:	NIT TO PU		E					
					LING OF A							
	1		:		IED ON T							
	IMMEDI	ATÉ DE	LIVER	Y IN	EMERGENC:	IES DUE	TO	UNFOR	ESEEN			
	CAUSES	CINCL	UDING	BUT	NOT LIMI.	TED TO D	DELA	YS IN	TRANS-	1		
	PORTAT	ION OR	AN U	NANTI	CIPATED :	INCREASE	ΞIN	THE	VOLUME			
	OF WOR	K.)				•						
	1											
					LISTED :							and a second
	4				ASED ON I							
			: 1		T. IT IS		\$					
	t · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·				L COVER	_	1			š		
	DRDERE	D FOR	DELIV	ERY D	URING THE	: TERM O	UF T	HE CO	NIRACT,			
			I	SEERE	I VERSE SIDE FOR:	TERMS AND CO	OITIONC	NS				
SIGNATURE	<u>y ny say ta </u>		<u>ang ang pangkan kananah di Panghabah di Sib</u>			TELEPHONE	بدئيا تكنشن استستست		DA	ΓE	ntentrativativativativativativativativativativ	
TITLE		[FI	EIN			_L	1	ADD	DESC UNIVE	ES TO	BE NOTED AB	OVE
				***************************************			<u></u>	AUU	TILOG CHANG	ALG IVE	· HOIED AD	VYL



VENDOR

State of West Virginia Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East Post Office Box 50130 Charleston, WV 25305-0130

Request for

SHIP

ō

668C0028

ADDRESS CORRESPONDENCE (OTATIVENITION OF A MICHAEL AUSTIN 304-558-2402

304-485-4585 ***201151617** ATLAS TOWING COMPANY PO BOX 688

PARKERSBURG WV 26102

DATE PRINTED TE	RMS OF SALE	SHIP VIA	F.O.B.	FREIGHT TERMS
05/21/2008				
BID OPENING DATE: 06/11	/2008	BID O	PENING TIME 01	:30PM
LINE QUANTITY	UOP CAT. NO.	ITEM NUMBER	UNIT PRICE	AMOUNT
WHETHER MOR	E OR LESS T	HAN THE QUANTITIE	s shown.	
WRITTEN STA THE VENDOR THE ORIGINA	TE CONTRACT FOR COMMODI L COPY OF T	ENDING UNIT(S) SH ORDER (FORM NUMB TIES COVERED BY T HE WV-39 SHALL BE N FOR SHIPMENT, A	ER WV-39) TO HIS CONTRACT. MAILED TO THE	
MAILED TO T		NG DIVISION, AND		
FOR BANKRUP	TCY PROTECT	ENT THE VENDOR/CO ION, THIS CONTRAC ND IS TERMINATED	T IS AUTOMATI-	
SHALL SUPER CONDITIONS DOCUMENTS S AGREEMENTS	SEDE ANY AN WHICH MAY A UCH AS PRIC	NS CONTAINED IN T D ALL SUBSEQUENT PPEAR ON ANY ATTA E LISTS, ORDER FO NCE AGREEMENTS, I AS CD-ROM.	TERMS AND CHED PRINTED RMS, SALES	
REV. 04/11/	2001			
EXHIBIT 10		25047077701	In . 66800028	
		KEUUISIIIUN N	la.: 668G0D28	
ADDENDUM AC	KNOWLEDGEME	NT		
		ECEIPT OF THE FOL ADE THE NECESSARY		
1 ' 1		SPECIFICATION, E		
ADDENDUM NO	.'s:			
SIGNATURE	SEE RE	VERSE SIDE FOR TERMS AND COND TELEPHONE	DITIONS DATE	
	Trai			
TITLE	FEIN		ADDRESS CHANGES	TO BE NOTED ABOVE



VENDOR

State of West Virginia Department of Administration Quotation Purchasing Division 2019 Washington Street East Post Office Box 50130 Charleston, WV 25305-0130

Request for

P

Ö

668C0028

PA	GE
	4

ADDRESS CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTENTION OF

MICHAEL AUSTIN 304-558-2402

*201151617 304-485-4585 ATLAS TOWING COMPANY PO BOX 688

PARKERSBURG WV 26102

05/21/2008	IEHMS OF SALE	SHIPVIA	F.U.B	FHEIGHLIEHMS	
	06/11/2008	BID OP	PENING TIME 01	:30PM	
	NITITY LIGH CAT	ITEM NUMBER	UNITPRICE	AMOUNT	
BID OPENING DATE: LINE QUAY NO. 1 NO. 2 NO. 3 NO. 4 NO. 5 I UNDE ADDEND VENDOR REPRES ORAL D AND AN INFORM	RSTAND THAT FAIL UM(S) MAY BE CAU MUST CLEARLY UN ENTATION MADE OR USCUSSION HELD B Y STATE PERSONNE LATION ISSUED IN	URE TO CONFIRM THE SE FOR REJECTION OF THAT ANY ASSUMED TO BE MADE BY THE SET OF THE SET	E RECEIPT OF THOF BIDS. VERBAL DE DURING ANY EPRESENTATIVES ONLY THE TO THE IS BINDING. NATURE Company		
REV. 1		June 11, 2008 DATE	• • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • •		
	000000000000000000000000000000000000000		**************************************		
SIGNATURE	SEE:RE\	/ERSE SIDE FOR TERMS AND CONDIT TELEPHONE	TIONS IDATE		
ONITAL) OUE		1 accentioned	- Invite		
TITLE	FEIN		ADDRESS CHANGES	TO BE NOTED ABOVE	



MODZMA

State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

Request for Quotation

SHIP

T O AFO NUMBER

PAGE

ADDRESSICORRESPONDENCE TO ATTENTION OF

MICHAEL AUSTIN

*201151617 304-485-4585 ATLAS TOWING COMPANY PO BOX 688

PARKERSBURG WV 26102

DATE PRIN	TED	TER	MS OF SAL	£	SHIP VI	A	F.O.B	FREIGHTTEAMS
05/21/	2008							
BID OPENING DATE:		06/11/	2008			BID	OPENING TIME	01:30PM
LINE	QUAN	JTITY	UOP	CAT. NO.	ITEM NUM	BEA	UNITPRICE	AMOUNT
				NO.				
1							£CZZZĘ-855	<i>3</i> 7:
	CERTIF	ICATIO	N AND	APPL	ICATION* :	IS HERE	BY MADE FOR	X.
1	1		1 :				GINIA CODE,	
	5A-3-3	7 (DOE	S NOT	APPL	Y TO CONS	TRUCTIO	N CONTRACTS).	
	A. AP	PLICAT	ION I	S MAD	E FOR 2.5%	& PREFE	RENCE FOR THE	
	REASON	CHECK	ED:					
							1	Li Porto de la Carta de la Car
	()	BIDDER	IS A	N IND	IVIDUAL RI	ESIDENT	VENDOR AND	
	HAS RE	SIDED	CONTI	NUOUS	LY IN WES	r virgi	NIA FOR FOUR	
	1				PRECEDING	THE DA	TE OF THIS	
	CERTIF	ICATIO	N; OR				a. Department	
	and the second second							
· ·	a state of the second second second second	1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1			118/111 / 1111		TION OR CORPORA	\-
	i .						D ITS HEAD-	
	1 -		F	i i			S CONTINUOUSLY	
	1						IATELY PRECEDIA	
				i	-		OF THE OWNERSH	II
	INTERE	ST OF	BIDDE	R IS	HELD BY A	NOTHER	INDIVIDUAL,	
1	1	- 1	I :	1			N RESIDENT VENI	t e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e
	i		1	1			PRINCIPAL PLAC	La contraction of the contractio
							NIA FOR FOUR (4	i)
	1		l .	i i	EDING THE	DATE O	F THIS	
	CERTIF	ICATIO	N; OR		•			
	1			1			ENT VENDOR	
			1	l I			HICH EMPLOYS	
	1			1			TS AND WHICH	7
							CIPAL PLACE OF	
	1			i			USLY FOR THE	
	FOUR (4) YEA	RS IM	MEDIA	TELY PRECI	EDING T	HE DATE OF THIS	S
	CERTIF	ICATIO	N.					
			ŧ	S MAD	E FOR 2.5	& PREFE	RENCE FOR THE	
	REASON	CHECK	ED:					
500000000000000000000000000000000000000	<u> </u>			SEFRE	VERSEISIDE FOR TE	RMS AND CO	I NDITIONS	1
SIGNATURE	<u> </u>	<u> </u>	<u> </u>			TELEPHONE		NTE
With L		ler	=iNI					
TITLE		l-t	EIN				ADDRESS CHAN	GES TO BE NOTED ABOVE



State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East Post Office Box 50130 Charleston, WV 25305-0130

Request for

OH-P

Ť

668C0028

ADDRESS CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTENTION OF

MICHAEL AUSTIN 304-558-2402

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED BY ORDER

*201151617 304-485-4585 ATLAS TOWING COMPANY PO BOX 688

PARKERSBURG WV 26102

DATE PRINT	ED	TE	RMS OF SAL	E	SHIP V	A		FO.B	FREIGHT TERMS
05/21/2	2008								
BID OPENING DATE:		06/11/	2008			BID	OPI	ENING TIME O	1:30PM
LINE	QUAN	TITY	UOP	CAT. NO	ITEM NUN	IBER .		UNITPRICE	AMOUNT
			100000000000000000000000000000000000000				1000000		
	1. 1. 1. 1. 1. 1. 1. 1. 1. 1. 1. 1. 1. 1	ntnner				00 1110			**************************************
	TWO STOCKING COOKING COOKING CO.	SECTION CONTRACTOR CONTRACTOR AND CONTRACTOR AND	tale policina program pro-procure consequent	NO CONTRACTOR DESCRIPTION OF THE PROPERTY OF T	ACLAST CONTRACTOR STATE OF THE PARTY OF THE		!	RTIFIES THAT,	All more and the second
E E			1	,			4	AGE AT LEAST ECT BEING BID	***************************************
				1			i	RESIDED IN	*********
			F :	l .			1	IMMEDIATELY	
					F THIS BI	1	-		
	DR								
	()	BIDDEF	IS A	NONR	ESIDENT V	ENDOR E	MPI	LOYING A	
			1		STATE RE		ı		
			1 1				j.	SUBSIDIARY	
			1				E	CIPAL PLACE	
3			1				ı	NG A MINIMUM	
			1					FIES THAT,	
					R BIDDERS			AGE AT LEAST	
i i			1			1	1	WEST VIRGINIA	
3			i	1		1	ı	LY FOR THE TWO	
1				_		1	1	F THIS BID.	
				:					
								AX & REVENUE	
								RENCE HAS	
3							•	NTS FOR SUCH	The state of the s
1		-	ŧ 1			F	F	DIRECTOR OF	niver
f	PURCHA		1 1			1	1	OR PURCHASE AINST SUCH	
1			1 1			I	ı	THE BID AMOUNT	
								E CONTRACTING	
					M ANY UNP				
	CONTRA		1 1						
								R AGREES TO	
								ATION TO THE	
			1 1		D AUTHURI CLOSE TO		1	EPARTMENT OF	
1					INFORMAT		:		
1			1				:	XES, PROVIDED	
MONATURE				SEE RE	ERSE SIDE FOR TE	RMS AND CONTELEPHONE	VDITK	ONS DATE	
BIGNATURE						ICLEUNIE		DAIE	
ITLE		F	EIN					ADDRESS CHANGE	S TO BE NOTED ABOVE



State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

Request for

OI-p

T

668C0028

ADDRESS CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTENTION OF

MICHAEL AUSTIN 304-558-2402

MODEMA

304-485-4585 *201151617 ATLAS TOWING COMPANY PO BOX 688

PARKERSBURG WV 26102

DATE PRINTED	TER	MS OF SALE	SHIP VIA	FO.B.	FREIGHTTERMS
05/21/20	80(
BID OPENING DATE:	06/11/	2008	BID	OPENING TIME 01	:30PM
LINE	QUANTITY	UOP CAT NO	ITEM NUMBER	UNIT PRICE	AMOUNT
TA		OR ANY OTH		THE AMOUNTS OF EEMED BY THE TAX	Agrama ya i
CC CE TH CC	DDE 61-5-3) ERTIFICATE HAT IF A CO DNTAINED WI ERM OF THE	, BIDDER H IS TRUE AN NTRACT IS THIN THIS CONTRACT,	OR FALSE SWEARIN EREBY CERTIFIES D ACCURATE IN AL ISSUED TO BIDDER CERTIFICATE CHAN BIDDER WILL NOTI WRITING IMMEDIA	THAT THIS L RESPECTS; AND AND IF ANYTHING GES DURING THE FY THE	
	•	BIDDE	R: -Atlas Towing C	ompany	
		DATE:	June 11, 2008		
		SIGNE	D: 6. 1. Cair	s, Pres.	
		TITLE	President		
I AF	N EITHER "A RE ENTITLED	" OR "B", TO RECEIV REFERENCE	N OF PREFERENCE OR BOTH "A" AND E. YOU MAY REQU FOR BOTH "A" AND	"B" WHICH YOU EST UP TO THE	
A	SIGNED BID		ICE UBMITTED TO:		
		ING DIVISI			
DICHATUDE		SEE RE	VERSE SIDE FOR TERMS AND COI TELEPHONE	NDITIONS DATE	
SIGNATURE			ELECTIONS	DATE	
TITLE	FE	IN .		ADDRESS CHANGES	TO BE NOTED ABOVE



NOCKE

State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

Request for Quotation

SH-p

ō

REQNUMBER
668C0028

PA	GE	
	8	

ADDRESS:CORRESPONDENCESTO/ATTENTION OF

MICHAEL AUSTIN

*201151617 304-485-4585 ATLAS TOWING COMPANY PO BOX 688

PARKERSBURG WV 26102

05/21/2008	TERMS OF SA	_ 	SHIP VIA	F.O.B.	FREIGHTTERMS		
1	06/11/2008		BID	OPENING TIME	01:30PM		
LINE QUAN	TITY UOP	CAT NO	ITEM NUMBER	UNIT PRICE	AMOUNT		
21 CI	UILDING 15 019 WASHING HARLESTON,	WV 25305	-0130	N ON THE FACE O	F		
THE EN		HE BID MA	Y NOT BE CON	SIDERED:			
BUYER:			33				
RFQ. NO	D.:		668C0028		·		
BID OPI	ENING DATE:		06/11/2008				
PLEASE	PROVIDE A	FAX NUMBE		IS NECESSARY			
see M	VII. NATE AND SOME SOME SOME SOME SOME SOME SOME	304	4-485-4585				
CONTACT	T PERSON (P		NT CLEARLY):	,			
SIGNATURE		SEE REVERSE SI	DE FOR TERMS AND CON TELEPHONE	ADITIONS DAT	E		
TITLE	FEIN				ES TO BE NOTED ABOVE		



State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

S H P

Ţ

REQ NUMBER 668C0028 9

ADDRESS CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTENTION OF:::

MICHAEL AUSTIN 304-558-2402

NEW DOR

304-485-4585 *201151617 ATLAS TOWING COMPANY PO BOX 688

PARKERSBURG WV 26102

DATE PRINT	ED	TER	MS OF SA	(L)E			SHIP	VIA		FO.B.		FREIGHTTERMS
05/21/	2008											
BID OPENING DATE:		06/11/	2008					BID	OPENING TIME 0			L:30PM
LINE	QUAN	ппү	UOP	CA NO			ITEM NU	MBER		UNITPAK	SE	AMOUNT
									2000000			
											TOT41	
	*****	THIS	IS	IHE	ENU) OF	RFQ	668C0	028	****	IUIAL	
					1							es communication of the commun
:					-							THE STATE OF THE S
												AND
					l							
												,
					l							

	ļ											77
												- L
												TO THE PARTY OF TH

					l							
]			
	:											į į
					ļ					,		
	-											***************************************
		-			-							
							***************************************]			
CICHATURE				SEE	REV	ERSE SI	DEFOR	TERMS AND CC	NDITIO	NS	DATE	
SIGNATURE								LECENTONE			DATE	
TITLE		FE	IN					 		ADDRES	S CHANGE	S TO BE NOTED ABOVE
1118	EN DEOD	ONDINO	FO DE	- INIO	COT	- 31454	E ANID	ADDDECO	INI OF			ED 'VENDOR'

1. SPECIFICATIONS

The following sections of the West Virginia Department of Transportation, Division of Highways Standard Specifications, Roads and Bridges, adopted 2000, as modified by the current Supplemental Specifications, shall apply to the administration of this contract: Sections 101, 102.4, 102.5, 105.1, 105.3, 105.4, 105.10, 105.11, 105.12, 105.13, 106.3, 106.4, 106.5, 106.6, 106.7, 106.9, 107.1, 107.2, 107.3, 107.14, 107.19, 107.20, 108.8, 109.1, 109.2, and 401.9.3.

The requirements of the West Virginia Department of Transportation, Division of Highways, Standard Specifications, Roads and Bridges, Section 109.20, PRICE ADJUSTMENT FOR LOAD LIMIT VIOLATIONS shall apply to all material supplied under this contract. This will include material loaded by the vendor into Division of Highways owned and/or rented trucks.

The terms "Contractor" and "Vendor" used in the above specifications of this Contract are interchangeable. Contractor shall mean Vendor and Vendor shall mean Contractor.

West Virginia Department of Transportation, Division of Highways' Standard Specifications Roads and Bridges, adopted 2000, and the current Supplemental Specifications may be obtained from:

West Virginia Division of Highways Engineering Division, Technical Section State Capitol Complex, Building 5, Room A-650 1900 Kanawha Boulevard, East, Building 5 Charleston, West Virginia 25305

MATERIAL SPECIFICATIONS ARE AS FOLLOWS:

	WVDOH STANDARD
	SPECIFICATION
MATERIAL (NOTE 1)	SECTION
Fine Aggregate	702 (Note 5)
Coarse Aggregate	703 (Note 5)
Riprap	704.2
Stone for Gabions	704.3
Shot Rock	704.8
Abrasives (Note 2)	Note 3
Aggregate for Base & Subbase	704.6 (Note 5)
#8 Modified and #9 Modified	Note 4

NOTE 1: Fine aggregate on the bid schedule shall be considered to be fine aggregate for portland cement concrete or mortar sand, the particular type to be specified in State Contract Purchase Orders (SCO'S). Coarse aggregate on the bid schedule is identified by an AASHTO standard size; e.g., AASHTO Size No. 1, AASHTO Size No. 467, etc. Aggregate for base and sub-base on the bid schedule is identified by class; e.g., Class 1, Class 2, and Class 9, etc.

- NOTE 2: CINDERS WILL NOT BE CONSIDERED in this Purchase Requisition.
- NOTE 3: Abrasives shall conform to the following specifications:

A. Quality

- 1. Crushed sandstone shall not be used as an abrasive.
- 2. The liquid limit shall not exceed 25 and the plasticity index shall not exceed 6.
- 3. Total deleterious substances including but not limited to metal, glass, clay, shale, and thin or elongated pieces shall not exceed 3% of the dry weight of the total sample. Deleterious content shall be determined on that fraction of material retained on the U.S. Standard #4 (4. 75 mm) sieve.
- 4. When gravel is used as an abrasive, the material retained on the #8, sieve shall have a majority of crushed particles.

B. Gradation

1. The material shall conform to the following gradation requirements determined in accordance with AASHTO T-27.

SIEVE SIZE	% PASSING BY WEIGHT			
	Standard	Modified		
1/2 inch	100	100		
3/8 inch	85 — 100	85 – 100		
#100	0 – 10	0 – 4		

NOTE 4: In addition to meeting the gradation requirements of AASHTO #8 and #9 aggregate in table 703.4, Modified AASHTO #8 and Modified AASHTO #9 aggregate shall have a maximum of 2.5% passing the #200 sieve as determined by AASHTO T-11 and T-27. Modified AASHTO #8 and Modified AASHTO #9 aggregate shall meet all other requirements for AASHTO #8 and AASHTO #9 aggregate.

NOTE 5: With exception of the following contract items, grading on all specified sieve sized for material furnished shall be determined by AASHTO T-27 (Dry Test Only) or by AASHTO T-27 with AASHTO T-11:

Item I, AASHTO #7
Item J, AASHTO #8
Item K, AASHTO #9
Item R, AASHTO #8 Modified
Item S. AASHTO #9 Modified

The grading for the above items shall be determined by AASHTO T-27 and AASHTO T-11.

2. BIDDING INSTRUCTIONS

Vendors may bid any or all items on the bid schedule. Vendors <u>shall</u> provide the information requested in Subsection 12.1 & 12.2, paragraphs (a) and (b) on the bid schedule. Failure to provide required information will be sufficient grounds to invalidate the bid.

Any qualification of bids or any modification of the specifications or conditions governing the bids may be cause to reject bids.

The Division of Highways may purchase aggregate and stone F.O.B. Vendor's Storage Site. The bid price F.O.B. Vendor's Storage Site shall include the loading of Division of Highways' trucks by Vendor.

Vendor shall have the capacity to deliver a minimum quantity of 300 tons per day to any designated site when directed by the District Engineer/Manager.

3. DETERMINING LOW BID

Bids will be evaluated by the Division on the basis of cost per cubic yard F.O.B. at the designated site. Cost per cubic yard will be determined by multiplying the Vendor's bid price in dollars per ton by a "Tons per cubic yard factor" which is listed in the following table.

TONS PER CUBIC YARD FACTORS*

	TY	BLAST FURNACE			
ITEM	LIMESTONE	SANDSTONE	GRAVEL	SLAG	STEEL SLAG
Class 1, 2, 9	1.46	1.46 (2920)	1.46 (2920)	1.36 (2720)	1.81 (3620)
AASHTO Sizes #1 thru #7	1.30 (2600)	1.30 (2600)	1.30 (2600)	1.04 (2080)	1.61 (3220)
AASHTO Sizes #8 thru #10	1.32 (2640)	1.32 (2640)	1.32 (2640)	1.20 (2400)	1.61 (3220)
Gabions	1.31 (2620)	1.31 (2620)	1.31 (2620)		李 年 河 河 河 河 河 河
Shot Rock, Riprap	1.31 (2620)	1.31 (2620)	W 20 TH W 20 TH		
Fine Aggregate	1.40 (2800)	1.40 (2800)	1.40 (2800)	1.36 (2720)	1.77 (3540)
Abrasives	1.36 (2720)	1.36 (2720)	1.36 (2720)	1.28 (2560)	1.75 (3500)

^{*}Numbers in parenthesis are pounds per cubic yard

4. CONTRACT AWARD

All qualified Vendors who submit a valid bid "F.O.B. Vendor' Storage Site" will be awarded a contract to establish a unit price for those items bid (See Subsection 12.1):

- a. A State Contract Purchase Order (SCO) specifying Division of Highways pick up or Vendor delivery to project site will be issued to the low bidder when a specific type and quantity of material is to be purchased for use on a designated project.
- b. A Blanket State Contract Purchase Order (SCO) specifying Division of Highways pick F.O.B. Vendors Storage Site, may only be issued when material for routine highway maintenance operations at various locations is to be purchased. When material is secured on an SCO of this nature, the District Engineer/Manager shall take those steps necessary to assure that material is secured from the Vendor which results in the lowest cost to the Division. Factors to be considered shall include, but are not limited to; bid price of material, haul cost at \$1.50 for the first ton-mile and \$0.25 for each additional mile.

Qualified Vendors who submit a valid bid "F.O.B. Division Storage Site" will be awarded a contract to establish a unit price for those locations and items for which their bid is low based on cost per cubic yard (see Subsection 12.2). A State Contract Purchase Order (SCO), with the required delivery schedule, will be issued for the actual quantity of material to be delivered to the location specified. If the Vendor is unable to furnish material in accordance with the specified delivery schedule the District Engineer/Manager shall be advised in writing within five (5) working days of the reason for failure to conform to delivery requirements.

a. All qualified Vendors who are awarded F.O.B. Division Storage Sites must have the awarded items available for delivery 30 days after the contract award date.

In the event a Vendor fails to conform to the requirements stated in this contract document, the State Contract Purchase Order (SCO) or the governing specifications, the State Contract Purchase Order (SCO) may be cancelled and reissued to the next lowest bidder.

The Vendor is not authorized to ship, nor is the Division authorized to receive materials prior to issuance of an (SCO).

5. SUPPLYING OTHER ORGANIZATIONAL ENTITIES

In accordance with Chapter 5A, Article 3, Section 9 of the Code of West Virginia the commodities or services contracted for herein shall be available to all local governmental bodies in accordance with the same prices, terms and conditions afforded to the State of West Virginia.

In the event any Vendor does not wish to extend the prices, terms and conditions of his bid and subsequent contract to all political sub-divisions of the State, he must so indicate in a clear and unambiguous manner in his bid. This indication does not prejudice the award of the contract. If a Vendor does not indicate his refusal to extend the prices, terms and conditions of his bid to political sub-divisions of the State he is bound to extend them upon issuance of a purchase order by these other entities.

Other organizational entities using this provision of the contract shall do so without any involvement of the Division of Highways. That is, the entity shall make its own purchase arrangements with the Vendor and shall make its own arrangement for payment.

6. HAULING AGGREGATE TO STATE PROJECTS BY CONTRACTOR

The most direct suitable route from the Vendor's aggregate storage site to the midpoint of the project will be determined by the Division and used to compute haul distance for the purpose of determining low bid, and also for the purpose of determining payment. The Contractor shall deposit aggregates at the project site at the locations and in the manner directed by the Division of Highways. This may include tailgating the aggregate into an aggregate spreader or onto a roadway, or dumping the aggregate into a stockpile.

7. WEIGHING MATERIALS DELIVERED BY TRUCK

Material delivered by truck shall be weighed in accordance with Section 401.9.3 of the West Virginia Department of Transportation, Division of Highways Standard Specifications Roads and Bridges, adopted 2000, as modified by the current Supplemental Specifications.

8. WEIGHING MATERIALS DELIVERED BY MODES OF TRANSPORTATION OTHER THAN TRUCKS

Materials delivered to the designated site by barge, or other non-truck modes shall have their weight determined by a means acceptable to the Division, and the weights of materials so shipped shall be certified, by the Vendor or his authorized agent, to be correct.

The minimum barge delivery requested will be approximately 6,500 tons per SCO. When barge delivery is required contract item will be ordered in 1500 ton increments.

9. SAMPLING AND TESTING

Sampling and testing for quality of all items furnished in this contract will be the responsibility of the Division. Minimum frequency of sampling and testing for quality on all materials (other than those sources already covered by the Division's "commercial source" approval) will be at least one sample every six days of shipment (or if tested during production, at least one sample every six days of production).

Other minimum frequencies shall be in accordance with the following:

Property

<u>Frequency</u>

Gradation-Delivered Material

One sample per each day of shipment (or if tested during production, one sample per each day of production). See Note 1 below.

Gradation-Division Pick-up

(Division pick up; A-1 Source) One sample per each week of shipment per MP 700.00.52; or if tested during production, one sample per each day of production. See Note 1 below.

(Division pick up; A-2 Source)
One sample per 250 tons shipped and a minimum of one per week of shipment.

Moisture Content (See Note 2)

All samples taken by the Vendor shall be by a Certified Aggregate Sampler or Certified Aggregate Inspector. Tests shall be performed by a Certified Aggregate Inspector.

NOTE 1: The Vendor will be responsible for providing test results

attesting to the gradation of materials delivered. Gradation

results from the production source will be acceptable.

NOTE 2: In the event visual inspection of the aggregate indicates excess or unusual moisture beyond that normally expected in the aggregate, the Division reserves the right to determine the moisture content by standard methods. If this becomes necessary, the net weight of the portion represented will be adjusted utilizing the test results obtained by the Division in accordance with MP 700.00.22. Items "N" & "O" (Abrasives) will

be considered fine aggregate outlined in MP 700.00.22.

10. ACCEPTANCE PLAN

Material failing to comply with the quality requirements will not be accepted. Acceptance for gradation shall be on the basis of test results, provided and certified by the Vendor to be true test results and representative of the material supplied to the Division, on consecutive random samples from a lot. A lot shall consist of a quantity of material represented by an average value (not to exceed 5 sublots). A sublot shall consist of the quantity of material represented by a single gradation test. In the case where only one sample is taken to represent the total quantity, the sublot and lot will be considered the same. Frequency of sampling and testing shall be in accordance with the Vendor's quality control plan outlined in MP 700.00.51. The Vendor shall provide the gradation test results to the Division within 72 hours.

Gradation test results shall be averaged in accordance with MP 300.00.51. When the average falls outside the applicable limits, the lot of material represented thereby will be considered nonconforming to the extent that the last of its sublots is nonconforming. When a lot of material is nonconforming, then the last sublot contained therein shall have its degree of nonconformance determined as set forth below.

When a sublot of material is to have its price adjusted, the percentage point difference between the nonconforming test value and the specification limit shall be determined for each sieve size determined to be nonconforming, and this value shall be multiplied by its appropriate multiplication factor as set forth in Table I.

TABLE

NONCONFORMING SIEVE SIZE	MULTIPLICATION FACTOR		
Plus #40	1		
#40	1.5		
#50	1.5		
#100	2.0 (1.3 for abrasives)		
#200	2.5		

The total measure of nonconformance of an individual sublot is the sum of all nonconformances on the various sieve sizes of that sublot. In no case, however, shall a sublot of material have its price adjusted more than once, and the first adjustment which is determined shall apply.

When the total degree of nonconformance has been established and it is 12 or less, the material will be paid for at an adjusted contract price as specified in Table 2.

DEGREE OF NONCONFORMANCE	PERCENT OF CONTRACT PRICE TO BE REDUCED
1.0 TO 3.0	2
3.1 TO 5.0	4
5.1 TO 8.0	7
8.1 TO 12.0	11
Greater than 12	*

^{*}The Division will make a special evaluation of the material and determine the appropriate action.

In the event a Vendor delivers a specific quantity of material from a stockpile, and said quantity is less than the total quantity contained in the stockpile, and it has been determined from his certified test data that a nonconforming sublot(s) is contained in said stockpile, the price reduction shall be calculated for the specific quantity as follows:

The percent price reduction shall be determined as set forth above for the nonconforming sublot. The quantity represented by the nonconforming sublot shall then be calculated as a percent of the total (total material contained in the stockpile). To determine the price reduction on the specific quantity delivered, multiply the percent of nonconforming material contained in the stockpile by the quantity delivered, and reduce this quantity by the percent price reduction as determined.

Example:

If it has been determined that a stockpile of 100 tons contains 10 percent failing material, and said material is to have its price reduced by 4 percent, then the actual quantity delivered, say 15 tons, will be multiplied by 0.10 (10 percent failing

material) which equals 1.5 tons. This 1.5 tons will thus have its price reduced by 4 percent. The remaining 13.5 tons will be paid for at full contract price.

WHERE T: = tonnage delivered

P = percent price reduction

D = cost per ton

Qn = quantity of nonconforming sublot(s)

Qt = quantity of total stockpile

If two (2) sublots are nonconforming within the stockpile, calculate each separately for the adjusted payment on the quantity delivered (as above). Add these two adjusted payments together and subtract from the total the price to be paid before adjustment for tonnage delivered (TD). If three (3) sublots are nonconforming, calculate each separately and subtract twice the price to be paid before adjustment for tonnage delivered, and so on. Example:

(AP1 + AP2) - TD = Final price to be paid after adjustments

OR

(AP1 + AP2 + AP3) - 2 TD = Final price to be paid after adjustments

Where: AP = price to be paid after initial adjustment for one nonconforming sublot determined by the above equation.

T = tonnage delivered

D = cost per ton

In the event material is delivered from a continuous stockpile, that is, a stockpile which is continuously being replenished while also having material removed for these applications, certification shall be based on the shipment samples.

11. PURCHASING CARD ACCEPTANCE

The State of West Virginia currently utilizes a VISA Purchasing Card Program which is issued through a bank. The successful vendors must accept the State of West Virginia VISA Purchasing Card for payment of all orders places by State DOT agency for orders as a condition of award.

Vendors are encouraged to utilize a paperless invoice process submitting the following information via e-mail to the DOH ordering locations:

- a. All weigh ticket numbers for material delivered during the invoicing period.
- b. Division of Highways' State Contract Purchase Order (SCO) number and this contract number.
- c. Total quantity and unit price with the total cost of each type of material furnished. (Total quantity invoiced shall be scale weights (supported by weigh tickets) adjusted in accordance with Section 9, Note 2.)

NOTE: Under no circumstances will the West Virginia Division of Highways accept, or pay for, quantities of material in excess of the quantity stated on the State Contract Purchase Order.

NOTE: Vendors should type Bid Schedule

12. BIDDING SCHEDULE

12.1 Bidding F.O.B. Vendor's Storage Site

a) SOURCE OF MATERIAL (State all sources for which bid prices apply) (e.g., Quarry location if Sandstone or Limestone; dredging or pit location if Gravel; production plant name and location if Slag)

Mulzer- Charlestown, IN; New Amsterdam, IN; Cape Sandy, IN.
Hilltop- Big Bend Quarry, Battletown, KY.

Yager Materials- Riverside Stone, Wolf Creek, KY.

Shelly Materials- Marietta, Ohio

b) EXACT LOCATION OF VENDOR'S STORAGE SITE(S) A separate bid schedule must be submitted when bid price varies between Vendors storage sites.

1334 Staunton Turnpike, Parkersburg, WV 26104

Con- Tract Item	Description of Aggregate	Bid Price Per Ton F.O.B. Vendor's Storage Site				
		LIMESTONE SANDSTONE, GRAVEL, SAND	BLAST FURNACE SLAG	STEEL SLAG		
Α	Class 1 Aggregate	18.05				
A B	Class 2 Aggregate	18.05				
C	AASHTO #1 Aggregate	18.75				
Ď	AASHTO #3 Aggregate	18.75				
E	AASHTO #4 Aggregate	18.75				
F	AASHTO #467 Aggregate	18.75				
Ğ	AASHTO #57 Aggregate	18.75				
Н	AASHTO #67 Aggregate	18.99				
ì	AASHTO #7 Aggregate	NO BID		-		
J	AASHTO #8 Aggregate	19.10				
K	AASHTO #9 Aggregate	27.00		+		

NOTE: Vendors can complete the Bid Schedule at Purchasing's Web Site www.state.wv.us/admin/purchase

BIDDING SCHEDULE (Continued)

12.1 Bidding F.O.B. Vendor's Storage Site (Continued)

L M	Stone for Gabions Fine Aggregate	19.25 13.75	
N	Standard Abrasives	National Control of the Control of t	
O P	Modified Abrasives Riprap		 <u>,</u>
Q	Shot Rock		
R	AASHTO #8 Modified	19.75	
S	AASHTO #9 Modified		 <u></u>
T	Pea Gravel		
U		ms Q and P): irst Ton-Mile ach Additional Ton Mile	
V		nd/or P): irst Ton-Mile ach Additional Ton-Mile	

DISTRICT ONE

		Estimated	Location of	Bid Price (\$/Ton) F.O.B.		
Contract	•	Quantity	DOH	DOH Storage Site		
Item	of Aggregate	(TONS	Storage Site			
				LIMESTONE BLAST		
	KANAWHA COU	NTY (BARGE D	ELIVERY)	SANDSTONE FURNACE STEEL		
				GRAVEL, SAND SLAG SLAG		
Α	Class 1	7500	St. Albans	16.99		
D	No. 3	3000	St. Albans	17.50		
F	No. 467	1500	St. Albans	17.50		
R	No. 8 Modified	7500	St. Albans	20.00		
	MASON COUN	ITY (BARGE DE	LIVERY)			
۸	Class 1	10000	Glenwood	20.00		
A _. C	No. 1	1500	Glenwood	22.00		
D	No. 3	3000	Glenwood	22.00		
F	No. 467	1500	Glenwood	22.00		
R	No. 8 Modified	3000	Glenwood	25.00		
	MASON COUN	ITY (BARGE DE	ELIVERY)			
А	Class 1	10000	Lakin	15.50		
Ċ	No. 1	1500	Lakin	16.25		
Ď	No. 3	1500	Lakin	17.25		
F	No. 467	1500	Lakin	17.25		
L	Gabion Stone	1500	Lakin	18.00		
R	No. 8 Modified	10000	Lakin	18.30		
	PUTNAM COUNTY (BARGE DELIVERY)					
Α	Class 1	15000 F	Hometown MP 34.77	16.99		
С	No. 1		Hometown MP 34.77	17.25		
D	No. 3		Hometown MP 34.77	17.50		
F	No. 467	1500 H	Hometown MP 34.77	17.50		
R	No. 8 Modified	10000 H	Hometown MP 34.77	20.00		

DISTRICT THREE

12.2 Bidding F.O.B. Division's Storage Site

Contract Item	Description of Aggregate	Estimated Quantity (TONS)	Location of DOH Storage Site	DOH :	(\$/Ton) F.O.B Storage Site	
	CALHO	UN COUNTY		LIMESTONE SANDSTONE	BLAST FURNACE	STEEL
		2222	B #131 f	GRAVEL, SAND	SLAG	SLAG
A	Class 1	3600	Millstone	28.80		
D	No. 3	800	Millstone	29.50		
Н	No. 67	1700	Millstone	29.75		
L	Gabion Stone	600	Millstone	30.00		
R	No. 8 Modified	1150	Millstone	30.50 37.75		
S	No. 9 Modified	500	Millstone			
	JACKS	ON COUNTY				
Α	Class 1	10000	Ripley			
C	No. 1	500	Ripley			
D	No. 3	800	Ripley			
F	No. 467	9000	Ripley		·	
Ġ	No. 57	3500	Ripley			
H	No. 67	3000	Ripley			
Ĺ	Gabion Stone	750	Ripley			
N	Standard Abr.	1000	Ripley			
R	No. 8 Modified	1500	Ripley	****		
S	No. 9 Modified	1500	Ripley			
	JACKS	ON COUNTY				
Α	Class 1	2000	Ravenswood Lot			
Ď	No. 3	200	Ravenswood Lot			
L	Gabion Stone	500	Ravenswood Lot			
R	No. 8 Modified	500	Ravenswood Lot			
			•	L		*
	<u>JACKSON</u>	I COUNTY (1-77			•	
Α	Class 1	300	Medina (177)			
D	No. 3	100	Medina (177)			
Ν	Standard Abr.	750	Medina (177)			
	PLEASA	NTS COUNTY				
	011	5000	Calim Andorson Lat	17.50		
A	Class 1		Colin Anderson Lot	18.00		
С	No. 1		Colin Anderson Lot	18.50		
D	No. 3		Colin Anderson Lot	18.50		
F	No. 467		Colin Anderson Lot Colin Anderson Lot	18.75		
Н	No. 67			19.25		
L	Gabion Stone		Colin Anderson Lot Colin Anderson Lot	19.75		
R	No. 8 Modified		Colin Anderson Lot	27.00		
S	No. 9 Modified	1000	COMI ANGEISON LOL	L		

DISTRICT THREE

Contract Item	Description of Aggregate	Estimated Quantity (TONS)	Location of DOH Storage Site	Bid Price (\$/Ton) F.O.B. DOH Storage Site
	PLEASA	NTS COUNTY		LIMESTONE BLAST SANDSTONE FURNACE STEEL GRAVEL, SAND SLAG SLAG
N	Standard Abr.	1000	Belmont	GRAVEL, SAND SLAG SLAG
	RITCH	HE COUNTY		
Α	Class 1	8500	Ellenboro	26,69
Ċ	No. 1	1000	Ellenboro	27.39
Ď	No. 3	4000	Ellenboro	27.39
G	No. 57	5000	Ellenboro	27.39
H	No. 67	4000	Ellenboro	27.63
J	No. 8	1500	Ellenboro	27.74
ĸ	No. 9	1000	Ellenboro	35.64
Ĺ	Gabion Stone	1000	Ellenboro	27.89
N	Standard Abr.	3000	Ellenboro	NO BID
	WARRACTO .	HIE COUNTY	والذيطة مح	
N	Standard Abr.	500	Smithville	
,	RITCHIE COL	INTY (CORRIE	OOR D)	
N	Standard Abr.	800	Nutter Farm	
	ROAL	NE COUNTY		
Α	Class 1	8650	Spencer	
Ĉ	No. 1	450	Spencer	
Ď	No. 3	4000	Spencer	
F	No. 467	6400	Spencer	
H	No. 67	1050	Spencer	
ĸ	No. 9	200	Spencer	
N	Standard Abr.	2200	Spencer	
R	No. 8 Modified	2100	Spencer	
		NE COUNTY		
Α	Class 1	3550	Left Hand (Walton)	
D	No. 3		Left Hand (Walton)	
F	No. 467		Left Hand (Walton)	
Н	No. 67		Left Hand (Walton)	
K	No. 9		Left Hand (Walton)	
N	Standard Abr.		Left Hand (Walton)	
14	white the court of a state of		\\	

DISTRICT THREE

Contract	t Description of Aggregate	Estimated Quantity (TONS)	Location of DOH Storage Site	Bid Price (\$/Ton) F.O.B. DOH Storage Site
				LIMESTONE BLAST
	RO	ANE COUN	TY	SANDSTONE FURNACE STEEL
				GRAVEL, SAND SLAG SLAG
Α	Class 1	1000	Southern Roane WV 36	
D	No. 3	400	Southern Roane WV 36	
F	No. 467	1200	Southern Roane WV 36	
Ν	Standard Abr.	450	Southern Roane WV 36	
	<u>W</u>	IRT COUNT	<u>.</u>	
N	Standard Abr.	1500	Elizabeth Headquarters	
	<u>w</u>	IRT COUNT	<u> Y</u>	
Α	Class 1	4200	Elizabeth WV CR 14/7	23.55
C	No. 1	250	Elizabeth WV CR 14/7	24.25
D	No. 3	1500	Elizabeth WV CR 14/7	24.25
E	No. 4	1500	Elizabeth WV CR 14/7	24,25
F	No. 467	1500	Elizabeth WV CR 14/7	24.25
H	No. 67	1800	Elizabeth WV CR 14/7	24.49
S	No. 9 Modified	2000	Elizabeth WV CR 14/7	32.50
	W	OOD COUN	<u>TY</u>	
				1 20 70
Α	Class 1	10000	Parkersburg Co. Hqtrs.	20.40
C	No. 1	1000	Parkersburg Co. Hqtrs.	21.10
D	No. 3	3000	Parkersburg Co. Hqtrs.	21.10
E	No. 4	2500 1000	Parkersburg Co. Hqtrs. Parkersburg Co. Hqtrs.	21.10
G	No. 57 No. 7	2000	Parkersburg Co. Hqtrs.	NO BID
J	No. 8	4000	Parkersburg Co. Hqtrs.	21.45
L	Gabion Stone	400	Parkersburg Co. Hqtrs.	21.60
N	Standard Abr.	4000	Parkersburg Co. Hqtrs.	NO BID
R	No. 8 Modified	6000	Parkersburg Co. Hqtrs.	22.10
S	No. 9 Modified	2000	Parkersburg Co. Hqtrs.	29.35
_	110. 0 1110000		, amorozang eur man-	1
	W	OOD COUN	<u>TY</u>	
Α	Class 1	6000	WV 95 Parkersburg	21.25
G	No. 57	4000	WV 95 Parkersburg	21.95
Н	No. 67	6000	WV 95 Parkersburg	22.19

DISTRICT THREE

Contract Item	Description of Aggregate	Estimated Quantity (TONS)	Location of DOH Storage Site	Bid Price (\$/Ton) F.O.B. DOH Storage Site
	woo	D COUNTY		LIMESTONE BLAST SANDSTONE FURNACE STEEL GRAVEL, SAND SLAG SLAG
N	Standard Abr.	1500	Mill Run Road	
COR	RIDOR D DODD	RIDGE CO.	GREENWOOD	
N	Standard Abr.	1500	Greenwood	
<u>PL</u>	EASANTS COU	NTY (BARGE	DELIVERY)	
Α	Class 1	6500	Colin Anderson Lot	17.50
С	No. 1	1500	Colin Anderson Lot	18.00
D	No. 3	1500	Colin Anderson Lot	18.50
F	No. 467	3000	Colin Anderson Lot	18.50
H	NO. 67	3000	Colin Anderson Lot	18.75
L	Gabion Stone	1500	Colin Anderson Lot	19.25
R	No. 8 Modified	4500	Colin Anderson Lot	19.75
S	No. 9 Modified	4500	Colin Anderson Lot	27.00