

### Request for Quotation

S H P

Ţ

RFQ NUMBER 668C0022

PAGE	

ADDRESS CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTENTION OF

MICHAEL AUSTIN

304-558-2402

>HZOOR

**\*709005844** 717-666-6661 ARBORCHEM PRODUCTS CO DIV ASPL 943 NIXON DRIVE

MECHANICSBURG PA 17055 DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED BY ORDER

DATE PRIN	TED	TEF	MS OF SAI	₽	SHIP VIA	F.O.B.	FREIGHT TERMS
02/26/	2008						
BID OPENING DATE	,	04/02/	2008		BID	OPENING TIME 0	1:30PM
LINE	QUAI	VTITY	UOP	CAT.	ITEM NUMBER	UNIT PRICE	AMOUNT
				NC			
0001		_	EA		675-85		
	HERBIC	IDEC					
	HERBIC	IDES					
				OPEN	END CONTRACT		
					LS NECESSARY FOR		
					HIGHWAYS TO BE		
	DIZIKI	CIS PE	RIHE	AIIA	CHED SPECIFICATI	ONS.	
	THERE	WILL B	EAM	ANDAT	ORY PRE-BID CONF	FRENCE AT THE	
ł						VISION CONFERENCE	E
					OAD, CHARLESTON,		
	1:00 P	M ON D	3/11/	2008.	FAILURE TO ATTE	ND THE PRE-BID	
	CONFER	ENCE W	ILL R	ESULT	IN BID DISQUALI	FICATION.	
	L						
					STIONS WILL BE A		·
					00 PM EST ) ON F : PURCHASING DIV		
	SCHD 1	OOK QU	23110	143 10	ATTENTION: MIC	!	
					2019 WASHINGTO		
					CHARLESTON, WV		
			,		VIA FAX, E-MAIL	OR REGULAR MAIL	
					.AUSTINOWV.GOV		
		AX: 30			DUIDILITY TO MED	75W 7047 70570	RECEIVED
					ONIBILITY TO VER CEIVED BY CALLIN		
	MACSIT	AN CNU	VC DE	EN KE	CEIVED BY CALLIN		nn inn _ i _ 12- 02-
						4	108 APR - 1 P 12: 02
	EXHIBI	Т 3				es.	more our ownerned
			-			\$ <sub>1</sub> ,2' ;	JRCHASING DIVISION   STATE OF WV
							JIMIE UI WY
				SEEREN	ERSE SIDE FOR TERMS AND CON	IDITIONS	
SIGNATURE	_//_	<del>Z)</del> -			TELEPHONE TELEPHONE	DATE DATE	2 22 2 2
TITLE, 18	Ser L		N —		1 7/7	1666661	5-21 -1008
		-	"a/3)	<i> Q-7 </i>	ひらむ	ADDRESS CHANGES	S TO BE NOTED ABOVE



# Request for Quotation

P

T

668C0022

PAGE

ADDRESS CORRESPONDENCE TO A TIENTION OF

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

MICHAEL AUSTIN

BY ORDER

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED

\*709005844 717-666-6661 ARBORCHEM PRODUCTS CO DIV ASPL 943 NIXON DRIVE

MECHANICSBURG PA 17055

DATE PRINT	ιED	TER	MS OF SAL	<b>E</b>	SHIP VIA		F.O.B.		FREIGHT TERMS
02/26/	2008								
BID OPENING DATE:		04/02/	2008			BID	OPENING TIME	0.7	:30PM
LINE		VTITY	UOP	CAT.	ITEM NUMBER				
			3	NO	HEWNUMBER		UNIT PRICE		AMOUNT
	I TEE O	F CONT	RACT.	TH	TS CONTRACT	BECU	MES EFFECTIVE	ON	
						1	PERIOD OF ONE	1	
	VEAR O						HEREAFTER AS		
					NEW CONTRACT			13	
							ME" PERIOD SH		
							THIS "REASON		
							NTRACT FOR AN'		
							CHASING 30 DAY		
		N NOTI		G INC	DIKECIUK UP	PUK	CHASING ON DA	rs	
	MKTIIE	M MOIT	CC.					1	
	IINI ECC	CDECT		DOUTO	TONO ADE OTT		TED 51.05.11155-	- 1	<i>*</i> **
							TED ELSEWHERE	_	
							CONDITIONS AND	י נ	
1		1	HFKFT	N AKE	FIRM FOR TH	ELI	FE OF THE		
	CONTRA	Ci.				ì		- 1	
						[			• •
							UPON THE MUTUA	\L	
					SPENDING UN			1	
							G THIRTY (30)		
							CH RENEWAL SHA		
							NDITIONS OF TH		
				AND	SHALL BE LIM	ITED	TO TWO (2) ON	IE	
	(1) YE	AR PER	IODS.						
								}	
ľ		T .					NG RESERVES TH	1	
Į	RIGHT	TO CAN	CEL T	IS C	DNTRACT IMME	DIATE	ELY UPON WRITT	EN	
H	NOTICE	TO TH	E VEN	OOR I	F THE COMMOD	ITIES	S AND/OR SERVI	CES	
	SUPPLI	ED ARE	OF A	\ INF	ERIOR QUALIT	Y OR	DO NOT CONFOR	M	
ļ	TO THE	SPECI	FICAT	IONS	OF THE BID A	ND C	ONTRACT HEREIN	ı.	
						İ		- 1	
ļ	DPEN MA	ARKET (	CLAUSE	E: TH	E DIRECTOR O	F PUF	RCHASING MAY		
Į.	AUTHOR	IZE A	SPEND	ING U	NIT TO PURCH.	ASE C	ON THE OPEN		
1	MARKET.	, WITH	JUT T⊬	E FI	ING OF A RE	QUIS	ITION OR COST		
Į	ESTIMA	TE, ITE	EMS SF	PECIF	ED ON THIS	CONT	RACT FOR		
[:	IMMEDIA	ATE DE	IVER	/ IN E	EMERGENCIES :	DUE h	TO UNFORESEEN		
k	CAUSES	CINCL	DING	BUT	NOT LIMITED	TO DE	ELAYS IN TRANS	-	}
							IN THE VOLUME		
					<u> </u>				
IGNATURE /		4		SEE REV	ERSE SIDE FOR TERMS				
Joe	Zen				IELEPH	T/	7 766 6661	3-	27-2008

232-27550



TITLE

State of West Virginia Department of Administration Purchasing Division 2019 Washington Street East Post Office Box 50130 Charleston, WV 25305-0130

# Request for Quotation

T

668C0022

PAGE 3

Maddress correspondences to Assention to E

MICHAEL AUSTIN 304-558-2402

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

\*709005844 717-666-6661 ARBORCHEM PRODUCTS CO DIV ASPL 943 NIXON DRIVE

MECHANICSBURG PA 17055

DATE PRINT	TED	TEI	RMS OF SA	LE	SHIF	VIA	F.O.B.	FREIGHTTERMS
02/26/	2008					31434		
BID OPENING DATE:		04/02/	2008			BID	OPENING TIME O	1:30PM
LINE	QUAN	VIIIY	UOP	CAT NO.	ITEM:N	UMBER	UNIT PRICE	AMOUNT
	OF WOR	к.)						
	APPROX THE ST THAT T ORDERE	IMATIO ATE SP HE CON D FOR	NS ON ENDIN TRACT DELIV	LY, E G UNI Shal Ery D	ASED ON T. IT I L COVER URING TH	ESTIMATE S UNDERS THE QUAN E TERM O	REQUISITION ARE S SUPPLIED BY TOOD AND AGREED ITITIES ACTUALLY OF THE CONTRACT, ES SHOWN.	
	WRITTE THE VE THE OR VENDOR MAILED	N STAT NDOR F IGINAL AS AU TO TH	E CON OR CO COPY THORI E PUR	TRACT MMODI OF T ZATIO CHASI	ORDER ( TIES COV HE WV-39 N FOR SH	FORM NUM ERED BY SHALL B IPMENT,	HALL ISSUE A IBER WV-39) TO THIS CONTRACT. E MAILED TO THE A SECOND COPY A THIRD COPY	
	FOR BAI	NKRUPT NULL A	CY PR	OTECT	ION, THIS	S CONTRA	ONTRACTOR FILES CT IS AUTOMATI- WITHOUT FURTHER	
	SHALL : CONDIT: DOCUME! AGREEM!	SUPERS IONS W NTS SU ENTS O	EDE A HICH CH AS R MAI	NY AN May a Pric Ntena	D ALL SU PPEAR ON E LISTS,	BSEQUENT ANY ATT ORDER F EMENTS,	THIS CONTRACT TERMS AND ACHED PRINTED ORMS, SALES INCLUDING ANY	
	REV. 0	4/11/2	001					
	CURRENT IS ISSU	TLY UT JED TH	ILIZE ROUGH	S A V A BA Tate	ISA PURCH NK. THE OF WEST N	HASING C SUCCESS /IRGINIA	OF WEST VIRGINI ARD PROGRAM WHIC FUL VENDOR VISA PURCHASING	н
IGNATURE //	1, 49			SEE RE	/ERSE SIDE FOR:	TELEPHONE		3-77-2008

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'



### Request for Quotation

ρ

668C0022

ADDRESS CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTENTION OF

MICHAEL AUSTIN 304-558-2402

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED BY ORDER

\*709005844 717-666-6661 ARBORCHEM PRODUCTS CO DIV ASPL 943 NIXON DRIVE

MECHANICSBURG PA 17055

DATE PRIN	TED	essessi (Elf	IMS OF SA		- 5	HIP VIA		FO.B.	FREIGHT TERMS
02/26/	2008								
BID OPENING DATE:		04/02/	2008		·	RID	OF	PENING TIME 0	1:30PM
LINE	QUAN		UOP	CAT	1751	NUMBER			
				NO.	1,15,	AINUMBER		UNITPRICE	AMOUNT
							Т	<u> </u>	
	CARD E	OR PAV	MENT	OF AL	NODE:	S PLACED	ь,	Y ANY STATE	
					OF AWAR			ANT STATE	
	AGENCI	AS A	COMDI	ITOM	OF AWAR	ъ.			
	1								
	CVIIINT	T 10							
	EXHIBI	i IO							
					REC	UISITION	NC	).:	•
	ADDENDI	UM ACK	NOWLE	DGEME	NT				
	I HERE	BY ACK	NOWLE	DGE R	ECEIPT	OF THE FO	LL	OWING CHECKED	
	ADDEND	UM(S)	AND H	AVE M	ADE THE	NECESSAR	ĮΥ	REVISIONS TO MY	,
	PROPOSA	AL, PL	ANS A	ND/OR	SPECIF	ICATION,	ET	C.	
						•			
į	ADDENDI	UM NO.	'S:						
			·						
	NO. 1	<b>V</b>							
			•						
Ì	NO. 2								
			•						
	NO. 3 .								1
			••						
	NO. 4			-					
		• • • • •	* *						
	NO E						}		
	NO. 5	• • • • • •	••						
	T 1211						l		
								RECEIPT OF THE	
	ADDEND	JM(S)	MAY B	E CAU	SE FOR	REJECTION	0	F BIDS.	
	VENDOR	MUST	CLEAR	עאט צו	DERSTAN	D THAT AN	Υ	VERBAL	
į	REPRESE	ENTATI	AM NC	DE OR	ASSUME	D TO BE M	ΑD	E DURING ANY	
								PRESENTATIVES	
						T BINDING		ONLY THE	
						AND ADDE			
ķ	SPECIFI	CATIO	NS BY	AN O	FICIAL	ADDENDUM	I	S BINDING.	
7									
CNATURE -		-		SEE REV	ERSE SIDE FO	R TERMS AND CO	VDIT		
GNATURE	Serte					TELEPHONE	,	766 6661 DATE	3-27-08
TLE , /		FEI	N - 7 - 7	1 m	7550				
UP			_ d 3 ,	12-1	1350			ADDRESS CHANGES	TO BE NOTED ABOVE



# Request for Quotation

668C0022

PAGE

ADDRESS CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTENTION OF

MICHAEL AUSTIN 304-558-2402

BY ORDER

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED

\*709005844 717-666-6661 ARBORCHEM PRODUCTS CO DIV ASPL 943 NIXON DRIVE

MECHANICSBURG PA 17055

DATE PRINT	ED	TEF	IMS OF SAL		SHIP	VIA		O.B.	FREIC	HTTERMS
02/26/										
OPENING DATE:		04/02/	2008			BID	OPENING	TIME	01:30PM	
LINE			UOP	CAT NO:	ITEM N	JMBER	UN	IT PRICE		THUOMA
- 1					ł		l .		1	

SIGNATURE . Solve of Agolundly COMPANY DATE REV. 11/96 VENDOR PREFERENCE CERTIFICATE CERTIFICATION AND APPLICATION\* IS HEREBY MADE FOR PREFERENCE IN ACCORDANCE WITH WEST VIRGINIA CODE, 5A-3-37 (DOES NOT APPLY TO CONSTRUCTION CONTRACTS). APPLICATION IS MADE FOR 2.5% PREFERENCE FOR THE REASON CHECKED: BIDDER IS AN INDIVIDUAL RESIDENT VENDOR AND HAS RESIDED CONTINUOUSLY IN WEST VIRGINIA FOR FOUR (4) YEARS IMMEDIATELY PRECEDING THE DATE OF THIS CERTIFICATION; OR BIDDER IS A PARTNERSHIP, ASSOCIATION OR CORPORA-TION RESIDENT VENDOR AND HAS MAINTAINED ITS HEAD-QUARTERS OR PRINCIPAL PLACE OF BUSINESS CONTINUOUSLY IN WEST VIRGINIA FOR FOUR (4) YEARS IMMEDIATELY PRECEDING THE DATE OF THIS CERTIFICATION; OR 80% OF THE OWNERSHIP INTEREST OF BIDDER IS HELD BY ANOTHER INDIVIDUAL, PARTNERSHIP, ASSOCIATION OR CORPORATION RESIDENT VENDO

SEE REVERSE SIDE FOR TERMS AND CONDITIONS

SIGNATURE

TITLE

FEIN

2312-77550

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO DEC INSERT MANE AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE HARE FOR WEIGHT ADDRESS.

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'



# Request for Quotation

SHIP

T

668C0022

address correspondence to attention of MICHAEL AUSTIN 304-558-2402

**\*709005844** 717-666-6661 ARBORCHEM PRODUCTS CO DIV ASPL 943 NIXON DRIVE

MECHANICSBURG PA 17055

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED BY ORDER

DATE PRINTED		TER	MS OF SAL	E	SHIP VIA	SHIP VIA F.O.B.		
02/26/20	808							
BID OPENING DATE:		04/02/	2008	·	BID	OPENING TIME 01	:30PM	
LINE	QUAN	ППҮ	UOP	CAT. NO	ITEM NUMBER	UNITPRICE	AMOUNT	
OF YE	BUS:	INESS	CONTI ATELY	NUOUS PREC	HEADQUARTERS OR LY IN WEST VIRGI EDING THE DATE O	NIA FOR FOUR (4)		
WH A HA BU FO	IICH I MINII AS MAI USINES UR (4	HAS AN MUM OF INTAIN SS WIT	AFFI ONE ED IT HIN W RS IM	LIATE HUNDR S HEA EST V	ORATION NONRESID OR SUBSIDIARY W ED STATE RESIDEN QUARTERS OR PRIN IRGINIA CONTINUO TELY PRECEDING T	HICH EMPLOYS TS AND WHICH CIPAL PLACE OF USLY FOR THE		
B. RE		PLICAT CHECK		S MAD	E FOR 2.5% PREFE	RENCE FOR THE	e son	
75 AR TH PR	RING % OF E RES E STA	THE L THE E SIDENT ATE CO	IFE O MPLOY S OF NTINU	F THE EES W WEST Dusly	DENT VENDOR WHO CONTRACT, ON AVORKING ON THE PROVINGINIA WHO HAVOR FOR THE TWO YEARS THIS BID;	ERAGE AT LEAST OJECT BEING BID E RESIDED IN		
NO WH OF OF DU 75 SU WH YE	NIMUM NRESI ICH M BUSI ONE RING % OF BSIDI O HAV	1 OF O IDENT IAINTA INESS HUNDR THE L THE E IARY'S IMMEDI	NE HUIVENDOINS INS INS INS INS INS INS INS INS INS	NDRED R WIT TS HE N WES ATE R THE EES OF DYEES IN THE PRECE	ESIDENT VENDOR EN STATE RESIDENTS HE AN AFFILIATE OF ADQUARTERS OR PROPERTY OF A STATE CONTRACT, ON AVER BIDDERS' AFFILMARE RESIDENTS OF A STATE CONTINUOUS THE SECRETARY OF	OR IS A R SUBSIDIARY INCIPAL PLACE YING A MINIMUM TIFIES THAT, ERAGE AT LEAST IATE'S OR WEST VIRGINIA JSLY FOR THE TWO OF THIS BID.		
	0000000000000				ERSE SIDE FOR TERMS AND CON			
SIGNATURE /	7	<i>0</i>		- SEE HEV	TELEPHONE	DATE	3 2	
TITLE 61	An f	,  FEI	N つ 2 1		7//		3-27-08	
··	<u></u>	ノ 『 <sup>*</sup>	"クカ1	7 0-	پيدستر مسر ۳	ADDRESS CHANGES	TO BE NOTED ABOVE	



# Request for Quotation

Ţ

668C0022

PAGE

ADDRESS CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTENTION OF

MICHAEL AUSTIN 304-558-2402

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER

\*709005844 717-666-6661 ARBORCHEM PRODUCTS CO DIV ASPL 943 NIXON DRIVE

MECHANICSBURG PA 17055

DATE PRIN	TED	TER	MS OF SAL	E	SHIP	VIA	FO.B.		FREIGHT TERMS
02/26/	2008								
BID OPENING DATE:		04/02/	2008			BID	OPENING TIME	01:	30PM
LINE	QUA	TITY	UOP	CAT. NO.	ITEM NU	MBER	LINIT PRICE		AMOUNT
	FAILED PREFER PURCHA ORDER BIDDER AND TH	TO CO ENCE, SING T ISSUED IN AN AT SUC OR DE	NTINU THE S O: (/ ; OR AMOU H PEN/ DUCTEI	E TO ECRET A) RE (B) A NT NO ALTY D FRO	MEET THE ARY MAY O SCIND THE SSESS A F T TO EXCE WILL BE F M ANY UNP	REQUIRE RDER TH CONTRA ENALTY ED 5% O AID TO	FERENCE HAS MENTS FOR SU E DIRECTOR O CT OR PURCHA AGAINST SUCH F THE BID AM THE CONTRACT ANCE ON THE	F SE OUNT	
	DISCLO: PURCHA: TAX AN: PURCHA: BIDDER THAT SI TAXES I	SE ANY SING D D REVE SING A HAS P UCH IN	REASON TO SERVING TO S	DNABL DN AN D DIS RIATE HE RE FION TOTH	Y REQUEST D AUTHORI CLOSE TO INFORMAT QUIRED BU DOES NOT	ED INFO ZES THE THE DIR ION VER SINESS CONTAIN ATION D	DER AGREES TO RMATION TO TO DEPARTMENT ECTOR OF IFYING THAT TAXES, PROVING THE AMOUNTS EEMED BY THE	HE OF DED OF	
	CODE 6 CERTIF THAT II CONTAII TERM OI	1-5-3) ICATE F A CO NED WI F THE	, BIDI IS TRU NTRACT THIN T CONTR	DER H JE AN T IS THIS ACT,	EREBY CER D ACCURAT ISSUED TO	TIFIES E IN AL BIDDER TE CHAN LL NOTI		AND HING HE	
			E	IDDE	_	raberr	<i>Grodusts</i>	Dr.	of Azplundh
				ATE:	o:	77 2 1 e Sa	) PMJ		
GNATURE //	- Bac	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·		SEE REV	ERSE SIGE FOR T		iditi lekis	la ser	
L/ce	- Ten					TELEPHONE	7 766 6661	PAIE 3	27-08
TLE //D	0	O FEI	v つつ,	12	7756-				BE NOTED ABOVE



### Request for Quotation

SH-P

668C0022

PAGE 8

ADDRESS CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTENTION OF:

MICHAEL AUSTIN 304-558-2402

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER

766.6661 3-27-08

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

\*709005844 717-666-6661 ARBORCHEM PRODUCTS CO DIV ASPL 943 NIXON DRIVE

MECHANICSBURG PA 17055

DOPENNO DATE: 04/02/2008  BID OPENING TIME 01:30PM  UNIT PRICE AMOUNT  * CHECK ANY COMBINATION OF PREFERENCE CONSIDERATION(S) IN EITHER "A" OR "B", OR BOTH "A" AND "B" WHICH YOU ARE ENTITLED TO RECEIVE. YOU MAY REQUEST UP TO THE MAXIMUM 5% PREFERENCE FOR BOTH "A" AND "B".  NOTICE  A SIGNED BID MUST BE SUBMITTED TO:  DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION PURCHASING DIVISION BUILDING 15 2019 WASHINGTON STREET, EAST CHARLESTON, WV 25305-0130  THE BID SHOULD CONTAIN THIS INFORMATION ON THE FACE OF THE BID MAY NOT BE CONSIDERED:  SEALED BID  BUYER:  33  RFQ. NO.:  668C0022  BID OPENING DATE: 04/02/2008  BID OPENING TIME: 1: 30 PM	DATE PRIN	TED	TER	MS OF SAL	E	SHIP VIA	FOB	FREIGHT TERMS
* CHECK ANY COMBINATION OF PREFERENCE CONSIDERATION(S) IN EITHER "A" OR "B", OR BOTH "A" AND "B" WHICH YOU ARE ENTITLED TO RECEIVE. YOU MAY REQUEST UP TO THE MAXIMUM 5% PREFERENCE FOR BOTH "A" AND "B".  NOTICE  A SIGNED BID MUST BE SUBMITTED TO:  DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION PURCHASING DIVISION BUILDING 15 2019 WASHINGTON STREET, EAST CHARLESTON, WV 25305-0130  THE BID SHOULD CONTAIN THIS INFORMATION ON THE FACE OF THE ENVELOPE OR THE BID MAY NOT BE CONSIDERED:  SEALED BID  BUYER:  33 RFQ. NO.: 668C0022 BID OPENING DATE: 04/02/2008								
* CHECK ANY COMBINATION OF PREFERENCE CONSIDERATION(S) IN EITHER "A" OR "B", OR BOTH "A" AND "B" WHICH YOU ARE ENTITLED TO RECEIVE. YOU MAY REQUEST UP TO THE MAXIMUM 5% PREFERENCE FOR BOTH "A" AND "B".  NOTICE  A SIGNED BID MUST BE SUBMITTED TO:  DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION PURCHASING DIVISION BUILDING 15 2019 WASHINGTON STREET, EAST CHARLESTON, WV 25305-0130  THE BID SHOULD CONTAIN THIS INFORMATION ON THE FACE OF THE ENVELOPE OR THE BID MAY NOT BE CONSIDERED:  SEALED BID  BUYER:  33  RFQ. NO.:  668C0022  BID OPENING DATE:  04/02/2008					- mar	BID	OPENING TIME O	1:30PM
* CHECK ANY COMBINATION OF PREFERENCE CONSIDERATION(S) IN EITHER "A" OR "B", OR BOTH "A" AND "B" WHICH YOU ARE ENTITLED TO RECEIVE. YOU MAY REQUEST UP TO THE MAXIMUM 5% PREFERENCE FOR BOTH "A" AND "B".  NOTICE  A SIGNED BID MUST BE SUBMITTED TO:  DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION PURCHASING DIVISION BUILDING 15 2019 WASHINGTON STREET, EAST CHARLESTON, WV 25305-0130  THE BID SHOULD CONTAIN THIS INFORMATION ON THE FACE OF THE ENVELOPE OR THE BID MAY NOT BE CONSIDERED:  SEALED BID  BUYER:  33 RFQ. NO.: 668C0022 BID OPENING DATE: 04/02/2008	LINE	QUAN	TITY	UOP		ITEM NUMBER	UNIT PRICE	AMOUNT
A SIGNED BID MUST BE SUBMITTED TO:  DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION PURCHASING DIVISION BUILDING 15 2019 WASHINGTON STREET, EAST CHARLESTON, WV 25305-0130  THE BID SHOULD CONTAIN THIS INFORMATION ON THE FACE OF THE ENVELOPE OR THE BID MAY NOT BE CONSIDERED:  SEALED BID  BUYER:  33  RFQ. NO.: 668C0022  BID OPENING DATE: 04/02/2008		IN EITH ARE ENT MAXIMUN	IER "A ITLED 1 5% P	COMBI " OR TO R	NATIO "B", ECEIV	N OF PREFERENCE OR BOTH "A" AND E. YOU MAY REQU	CONSIDERATION(S) "B" WHICH YOU EST UP TO THE	-
PURCHASING DIVISION BUILDING 15 2019 WASHINGTON STREET, EAST CHARLESTON, WV 25305-0130  THE BID SHOULD CONTAIN THIS INFORMATION ON THE FACE OF THE ENVELOPE OR THE BID MAY NOT BE CONSIDERED:  SEALED BID  BUYER:  33  RFQ. NO.: 668C0022  BID OPENING DATE: 04/02/2008		A SIGNE	D BID	MUST				7), M 1
THE ENVELOPE OR THE BID MAY NOT BE CONSIDERED:  SEALED BID  BUYER:  RFQ. NO.:  668C0022  BID OPENING DATE:  04/02/2008		PU BU 20	RCHAS ILDIN 19 WAS	ING D G 15 SHING	IVISI	ON TREET, EAST		****
BUYER: 33  RFQ. NO.: 668C0022  BID OPENING DATE: 04/02/2008								
RFQ. NO.: 668C0022 BID OPENING DATE: 04/02/2008		SEALED	BID	mining manasas and and an				
BID OPENING DATE: 04/02/2008	1	BUYER:		Ì		33		
	F	RFQ. NO	• •			668C0022		÷
BID OPENING TIME: 1: 30 PM		BID OPE	NING I	DATE:		04/02/2008		
SEE REVERSE SIDE FOR TERMS AND CONDITIONS	I	BID OPE	NING 1	IME:	*SEE!REV		DITIONS	

312-77550



MODIAMA

State of West Virginia Department of Administration Purchasing Division 2019 Washington Street East Post Office Box 50130 Charleston, WV 25305-0130

### Request for Quotation

T

668C0022

PAGE 9

ADDRESS CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTENTION OF

MICHAEL AUSTIN 304-558-2402

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER

\*709005844 717-666-6661 ARBORCHEM PRODUCTS CO DIV ASPL 943 NIXON DRIVE

MECHANICSBURG PA 17055

DATE PRINT	FED	E.	ims of sa	LE	SI	AIP VIA		F.O.B.	FREIGHTTERMS		
02/26/	2008										
BID OPENING DATE:		04/02/	2008		•	BID	BID OPENING TIME 01:30PM				
LINE				CAT.							
LINE	QUAN	(	UOP	NO.	ILEM	NUMBER		UNIT PRICE	AMOUNT		
	DIFACE	DDAUT	<b></b>								
							1 73	S NECESSARY			
	ID CON	TACT Y	OU RE	GARDI	NG YOUR						
					フノフ	795-	15	234			
						Z- K-2	مندل.	5 <i>-2-1</i>			
į	CONTAC	T PERS	ON (P	LEASE	PRINT	CLEARLY):	:				
		Jos		42K	1/2		L				
									Y		
									'		
1											
	****	THIS	IS T	HE EN	D OF RF	Q 668C0	022	2 ***** TOTAL	·		
									146		
1									]		
1											
ļ		ļ									
1											
İ		1							,		
]			,						<u> </u>		
<u> </u>				1							
				1							
							1				
ļ		ļ	1						ļ .		
-		-		ļ							
		1		į					1		
		1									
				į							
				İ			1				
			į	[					1		
				SEFREV	ERSE SIDE FO	R TERMS AND CO	I NDITIO	INS	1		
GNATURE	000000000000000000000000000000000000000		santigereinisterigi	open med 1955.		TELEPHONE	- W-17.00	DATE			
TLE	<u> </u>	N					ADDRES CHANGES	TO BE NOTED ABOVE			

#### SPECIFICATIONS

The following sections of the West Virginia Department of Transportation, Division of Highways Standard Specification Roads and Bridges, adopted 2000, as modified by the current Supplemental Specifications shall apply to the administration of this Contract: 101, 102.4, 102.5, 105.1, 105.3, 105.4, 105.10, 105.11, 105.12, 105.13, 106.3, 106.4, 106.5, 106.6, 106.7, 106.9, 107.1, 107.2, 107.3, 107.14, 107.19, 107.20, 108.8, 109.1, 109.2, and 109.20

The terms "Contractor" and "Vendor" used in the above specifications or this contract are interchangeable. Contractor shall mean Vendor and Vendor shall mean Contractor.

West Virginia Department of Transportation, Division of Highways Standard Specifications Roads and Bridges, adopted 2000 and the current Supplemental Specifications may be obtained from:

West Virginia Division of Highways State Capitol Complex Engineering Division, Technical Section Room A-650, Building 5 Charleston, West Virginia 25305

Herbicide furnished under this contract shall conform to the physical and chemical properties set out in the EPA Registration of the product provided by the Vendor.

#### 2. BIDDING INSTRUCTIONS

Vendors may quote on any or all of the chemical products listed herein.

It is the intent to award a Statewide Contract for each chemical product listed herein. The contract will be awarded to the lowest compliant bidder for each item. The award for each item will be based on the bid price per gallon, pound or ounce and not the lot or container amount.

The vendor shall list the trade name and EPA Registration Number, where applicable, on the Bidding Schedule for each chemical product bid. Failure to list this information may result in the disqualification of the vendor's bid on that product.

Vendors shall not qualify bids. Any qualification of bids or any modification of the specifications or conditions governing the bids may be cause to reject bids.

The successful vendor shall furnish two product labels, for each product awarded, to the West Virginia Division of Highways. The labels shall provide pertinent information regarding product storage and handling or this information shall otherwise be provided with each shipment.

Equivalency where requested as, chemical name or equivalent, shall mean equal and not necessarily identical. Prior to award of low bid the Division of Highways may require samples for evaluation to determine equivalency when applicable. Product specifications and technical information should be submitted with bid and may also be used to determine equivalency. The final determination of equivalency will be made by the Division of Highways and award will be based upon the item providing the intended service or result and unit price.

#### CONTRACT AWARD

Qualified vendors who submit a valid low bid will be awarded a contract for those items for which their bid is low.

The State of West Virginia reserves the right to make multiple awards on this contract when it is in the best interest of the State to do so.

. ACCEPTANCE PLAN 11

With each delivery of herbicide products to the Division, the vendor shall certify that the products so delivered do conform to the properties described in the EPA Registration.

Material failing to comply with the quality requirement will not be accepted.

#### TESTING PROCEDURES

Upon award of contract, the successful vendor shall supply the Division of Highways, Materials Control, Soil and Testing Division, 312 Michigan Avenue, Charleston, West Virginia 25311, the proper testing procedures to determine the presence and concentration of the Herbicide in flowing water.

#### 6. BID QUANTITIES

Vendor should base quotation on estimated herbicide use as follows:

DOH-1H	3,000	gallons
DOH-2H	6,000	gallons
DOH-3H	100	pounds
DOH-4H	250	gallons
DOH-5H	150	gallons
DOH-6H	600	gallons
DOH-7H	500	galions
DOH-8H	250	gallons
DOH-9H	2000	pounds
DOH-10H	100	gallons
DOH-11H	25	gallons
DOH-12H	50	gallons
DOH-13H	50	gallons
DOH-14H	150	pounds
DOH-15H	25	cases
DOH-16H	10	pounds
DOH-17H	100	gallons
DOH-18H	50	pounds
DOH-19H	25	gallons
DOH-20H	50	gallons
DOH-21H	300	gallons
DOH-22H	300	gallons
DOH-23H	100	gallons
DOH-24H	50	pounds
DOH-25H	100	pounds
DOH-26H	16	gallons
DOH-27H	16	gallons
DOH-28H	50	pounds
DOH-29H	400	ounces
DOH-30H	50	gallons
DOH-31H	100	gallons
DOH-32H	100	pounds
DOH-33H	100	pounds
DOH-34H	400	pounds
DOH-35H	50	pounds
DOH-36H	100	gallons
DOH-37H	100	gallons
DOH-38H	100	pounds

Vendors are cautioned that the above quantities are estimates only. Actual orders will be for the required needs of the Division of Highways.

Materials under this contract are to be shipped prepaid F.O.B. delivery to West Virginia Division of Highways District Storerooms as follows:

Charleston
Huntington
Parkersburg
Clarksburg
Burlington
Moundsville
Weston
Elkins
Lewisburg
Princeton

Materials should be shipped to the location and in the quantity specified in State Contract Purchase Orders (SCOs) within 20 days after the SCO is issued by the Division of Highways.



#### **VENDOR'S INVOICES**

Vendor's invoices must be submitted in original and four copies and contain the following:

- Division of Highways State Contract Order (SCO) Numbers, and a. this Contract Number.
- b. Total quantity and unit price with the total cost of each type of material furnished.

Note: Under no circumstance will the West Virginia Division of Highways accept, or pay for, quantities of material in excess of the quantity stated on the State Contract Purchase Order.

#### 9. RESTRICTED AND NON-RESTRICTED HERBICIDES

Herbicide products which have been declared RESTRICTED in their use by the Environmental Protection Agency (EPA) must be applied under the supervision of a licensed herbicide applicator. The Department reserves the right to disallow the use of RESTRICTED herbicides when non-restricted herbicides are available to achieve the same objective.

#### 10. TRAINING AND TECHNICAL ASSISTANCE

In order to bid on and be awarded items on this contract the vendor must have a competent representative available to provide training and technical assistance as required or upon request by WVDOH personnel, including but not limited to, an annual West Virginia Division of Highways Vegetation Management Seminar and attend the mandatory prebid meeting at the end of the seminar. Each bidder should submit name and telephone number of representative with bid. The representative shall have a valid Category 7 certification in West Virginia and the company shall have a valid Category 12 certification in West Virginia. Copies of these certifications should be submitted with the bid.

Failure to comply will result in awarding that vendor's Items to the next lowest compliant bidder.

DAVE hrause Joelente

PHONE NUMBER

610 377 4366 610 308-2007

215 7609420

943 NIXON Dr Mechanisburg PA 17055

The Product Trade Name shown is the approved herbicide to be bid. No substitutes will be accepted.

### 12. ADJUVANTS, SAFETY EQUIPMENT AND MISCELLANEOUS

Unless a Product Trade Name is requested these Items will be awarded based on the lowest unit price bid for acceptable performance. Lowest unit price bid will be determined by comparing minimum label recommendations per 100 gallons of spray solution and unit price. Acceptable performance will be determined by District personnel assessment of desired results and may include, but is not limited to, field test evaluations.

14. BIDDING SCHEDULE

NOTE:

Vendor should type

Bid Schedule

**HERBICIDES** 

Percent Concentration/ Pounds per Gallon of Active Ingredients

# CHEMICAL FORMULATION

DOH-1H	WATER SOLUBLE EMULSIFIABLE CONCENTRATE CONTAINING: Ammonium Salt of Fosamine with Surfactant	4 lbs/gallon
	Product Trade Name Krenite S	
	EPA Registration Number 352 - 395	
	Supplied in 2 1/2 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons.	
A)		
	Supplied in 15 gallon returnable/refillable containers.	
В)	@\$58.30 per gallon (i.e. \$291.50 per lot)	
DOH-2H	WATER SOLUBLE EMULSIFIABLE CONCENTRATE CONTAINING: Isopropylamine Salt of Glyphosate Phosphate Ester Surfactant	50.2%
	Product Trade Name Roundup Pro Concentrate	
	EPA Registration Number	
	Supplied in 30 gallon plastic returnable drums.	
A)	@ \$ No Bid per gallon (i.e. \$ per drum)	
	Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons.	
В)	@\$ No Bid per gallon (i.e. \$ per lot)	
	Supplied in 15 gallon returnable/refillable containers.	
C)	@\$ No Bid per gallon (i.e. \$per lot)	
	Supplied in 150 gallon returnable/refillable shuttle.	
D)	@ \$ No bid per gallon (i.e. \$ per shuttle)	

DOH-3H	DISPERSIBLE GRANULES CONTAINING: Sulfometuron Methyl	75%
	Product Trade Name Oust XP	
	EPA Registration Number 352601	
	Supplied in 3 pound containers in lots of 24 pounds.	
A)	@ \$ 106.00 per pound (i.e. \$ 2544.00 per lot)	
B)	Supplied in 3 pound jug	
	@\$	
DOH-4H	WATER SOLUBLE AQUEOUS SUSPENSION CONTAINING: Oryzalin	4 lbs/gailon
	Product Trade Name Oryzalin 4 Pro	
	EPA Registration Number 72 167-15-74477	
	Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons.	
A)	@\$	
DOH-5H	AQUEOUS SOLUTION CONTAINING: Imazapyr	2 lbs/gallon
	Product Trade NameArsenal Powerline_	
	EPA Registration Number 241- 431	
	Supplied in 1 quart containers in lots of 4 quarts	
A)	@\$69.43 per quart (i.e. \$277. <b>7</b> 2 per lot)	
	Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons	
B)	@\$ 259.70 per gallon (i.e. \$ 1298.50 per lot)	
	Supplied in 15 gallon drums	
C)	@\$ 259.70 per gallon (i.e. \$ 3895. <b>5</b> 0 per drum)	

DOH-6H	AQUEOUS CARRIER CONTAINING: Pendimethalin	3.8 ibs/gallon
	Product Trade Name Pendulum AquaCap	
	EPA Registration Number 24/6	
	Supplied in 2.5 gallon container in lots of 5 gallons	
A)	@\$ 46.50 per gallon (i.e. \$ 232.50 per lot)	
DOH-7H	WATER SOLUBLE CONCENTRATE CONTAINING: Triclopyr	3 lbs/gallon
	Product Trade NameGarlon 3A	
	EPA Registration Number 627/9-37	
	Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons	
A)	@\$ 71.20 per gallon (i.e. \$ 356.00 per lot)	
	Supplied in 30 gallon containers	
B)	@\$71.20per gallon (i.e. \$ _2136.00per container)	
	Supplied in 15 gallon continuum returnable/refillable containers in pallets of 9	containers
C)	@\$ 66.70 per gallon (i.e. \$ 9004.50 per pallet)	
DOH-8H	WATER SOLUBLE CONCENTRATE CONTAINING: Triclopyr	4 lbs/gallon
	Product Trade Name Garlon 4 Ultra	
	EPA Registration Number 62719-527	
	Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons	
A)	@\$96.46 per gallon (i.e. \$482.30 per lot)	,
	Supplied in 30 gallon containers	
B)	@\$ 96.46 per gallon (i.e. \$ 2893.80 per container)	
	Supplied in 15 gallon continuum returnable/refillable containers in pallets of 9	containers
C)	@\$ 91.69 per gallon (i.e. \$ 12378.15per pallet)	

DOH-9H	A WATER SOLUBLE DISPERSIBLE GRANULE CONTAINING: Diuron	80.0%
	Product Trade Name Karmex XP	
	EPA Registration Number 362-692	
	Supplied in 5 pound bags in lots of 10 bags	
A)	@\$4.55per pound (i.e. \$227.50per lot)	
	Supplied in 25 pound bags	
В)	@\$	
DOH-10H	WATER SOLUBLE LIQUID CONTAINING: Dimethylamine Salt of 2, 4-D acid	3.8 lbs/gallon
	Product Trade Name DM A4	
	EPA Registration Number 7/368-1	
	Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons	
A)	@\$ 12.81 per gallon (i.e. \$ 64.05 per lot)	
	Supplied in 30 gallon drums	
B)	@\$ 12.81 per gallon (i.e. \$ 384.30 per drum)	
C)	Supplied in 15 gallon returnable/refillable containers in pallets of 9 containers	
	@\$14.81_per gallon (l.e. \$1999.35_per lot)	
DOH-11H	WATER SOLUBLE LIQUID CONTAINING: Diethanolamine Salt of Mefluidide Ammonium Salt of Imazethapyr Ammonium Salt of Imazapyr	21.45% 4.09% 0.15%
	Product Trade Name <u>Stronghold</u> EPA Registration Number <u>2217 - 802</u>	
	Supplied in 1 gallon containers in lots of 4 gallons	
A)	@\$298.00_ per gallon (i.e. \$1192.00_ per lot)	

		<b>SCHEDULE</b>	A 4 117
14.	- HI II IINII →	SCHED   -	1711
12,			CONT

DOH-12H	WATER SOLUBLE LIQUID CONTAINING: Ammonium Salt of Imazapic	23.6%
	Product Trade Name Plateau	
	EPA Registration Number 241-365	
	Supplied in 1 gallon containers in lots of 2 gallons	
A)	@\$	
	Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons	
В)	@\$ 286.20 per gallon (i.e. \$ 1431.00 per lot)	
	Supplied in 1.44 oz packets 14 packets per lot	
C)	@ \$N/A per packet (i.e. \$ per lot)	
	Supplied in 1 qt containers 4 qts per lot	
D)	@ \$N/A per qt (i.e. \$ per lot)	
E)	Supplied in 15 gallon containers	
	@\$ 275.60 per gallon (i.e. \$ 4134.00per lot)	
DOH-13H	A DISPERSIBLE LIQUID CONTAINING: Hexazinone	2 lbs/gallon
	Product Trade Name Velpar L	
	EPA Registration Number 352 - 392	
	Supplied in 2 ½ gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons	
A)	@\$ 62.22 per gallon (i.e. \$ 311.11 per container)	

0%
5%

DOH-17H	A LIQUID SOLUTION CONTAINING: Isooctyl ester of 2.4 Dichlorophenoxyacetic Acid	32.48%
	2-ethylhrxyl ester of +R-2-(2,4-Dichlorophenoxy) Propionic Acid	15.90%
	Dicamba (3, 6-Dicholoro-o-anisic Acid	5.38%
	Product Trade Name BK-800	
	EPA Registration Number	
	Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons	
A)	@ \$ <u>No Bil</u> per gallon (i.e. \$ per lot)	
	Supplied in 30 gallon drums	
В)	@\$ No bil_ per gallon (i.e. \$ per drum)	
DOH-18H	DRY FLOWABLE CONTAINING: Tebuthiuron	80%
	Product Trade NameSpike 80 DF	
	EPA Registration Number <u>627/9-107</u>	
	Supplied in 4 pound bags in lots of 24 pounds	-
A)	@ \$	
	Supplied in 25 pound bags	
B) <sup>1</sup>	@\$	
DOH-19H	A WATER SOLUBLE EMULSFIABLE CONCERTRATE CONTAINING: Clopyralid	3 lbs/gallon
	Product Trade NameTransline	
	EPA Registration Number <u>62719-259</u>	
	Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons	
A)	@\$ 337.61 per gallon (i.e. \$ 1688.05 per lot)	•.
B)	Supplied in .5 gallon containers in lots of 2 gallons	
	@\$ 341.11 per gallon (I.e. \$ 682.22 per lot)	

: 14. : <u>BIDD</u>	ING SCHEDULE CON'T	
DOH-20H	AQUEOUS SOLUTION CONTAINING: Isopropylamine Salt of Imazapyr	27.6%
	Product Trade Name Stalker	
	EPA Registration Number 24/-398	
	Supplied in 1 quart containers in lots of 4 quarts	
A)	@\$ 78.75 per quart (i.e. \$ 315.00 per lot)	
DOH-21H	AQUEOUS SOLUTION CONTAINING: Diglycolamine Salt of 3, 6-Dichloro-0- Anisic Acid	4 lbs/gallon
	Product Trade Name Vanquish	
	EPA Registration Number 100 - 88 4	
	Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons	
A)	@\$ 59.81 per gallon (i.e. \$ 299.06 per lot)	
	Supplied in 15 gallon returnable/refillable containers in pallets of 9 containers	
B)	@\$ 64.31 per gallon (i.e. \$ 8681.85 per pallet)	
DOH-22H	AQUEOUS SOLUTION CONTAINING: Triclopyr	.75 lbs/gallon
	Product Trade NamePathfinder II	
	EPA Registration Number <u>627/9-176</u>	
	Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons	
A)	@\$	
DOH-23H	WATER SOLUBLE EMULSIFIABLE CONCENTRATE CONTAINING: Isopropylamine Salt of Glyphosate	53.8%
	Product Trade Name Rodeo	
	EPA Registration Number 62719-324	
	Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons	
A)	@\$	
	Supplied in 30 gallon plastic returnable drums	

**@** \$ 39.49 per gallon (i.e. \$ 1184.70 per drum)

B)

DOH-24H	A LIQUID CONTAINING: Aminopyralid	40.6%
	Product Trade Name <u>Milestone VM</u>	
	EPA Registration Number 627/9-537	
	Supplied in 1 quart containers 12 containers per lot	
A)	@ \$ 76.17 per quart (i.e. \$ 914.10 per lot)	
	Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers 5 gallons per lot	
. В)	@\$ 299.40 per gallon (i.e. \$ 1497.00 per lot)	
DOH-25H	WATER DISPERSIBLE GRANULAR MATERIAL CONTAINING: Prodiamine	65%
	Product Trade Name Endurance	
	EPA Registration Number 228 - 398	
	Supplied in 10 pound containers 50 pounds per lot	
A)	@\$ 24.86 per pound (i.e. \$ 1243.00 per lot)	
DOH-26H	EMULSIFIABLE CONCENTRATE CONTAINING: Quizalofop P-Ethyl	0.88 lbs/gallon
	Product Trade NameAssure II	
	EPA Registration Number 332 - 54/	
	Supplied in 1 gallon containers in lots of 4 gallons	
A)	@\$ 145.00 per gallon (i.e. \$ 580.00 per lot)	
DOH-27H	EMULSIFIABLE CONCENTRATE CONTAINING: Fluazifop-P-butyl	6.75%
	Product Trade Name Ornamec	
	EPA Registration Number	
	Supplied in 1 gallon containers in lots of 4 gallons	
A)	@ \$ <u>Nn Did_</u> per gallon (i.e. \$ per lot)	

DOH-28H	A DISPERSIBLE GRANULE CONTAINING:	
	lmazapyr Diuron	7.789 62.229
	Product Trade NameSahara DG	
	EPA Registration Number 24/-372	
	Supplied in 10 pound bags in lots of 40 pounds.	
A)	@ \$ $\frac{9.12}{}$ per pound (i.e. \$ $\frac{364.80}{}$ per lot)	
DOH-29H	A WATER SOLUBLE DRY GRANULE CONTAINING: Sulfosulfuron	75%
	Product Trade Name Outrider	
	EPA Registration Number 524-500	
	Supplied in 20 oz bottles in lots of 200 oz	
A)	@ \$N/Aper oz (i.e. \$ per lot)	
DOH-30H	A LIQUID CONTAINING: Diuron	40%
	Product Trade Name Diuron 4L	
	EPA Registration Number	
	Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons	
A)	@\$per gallon (i.e. \$per lot)	
DOH-31H	A LIQUID CONTAINING Fluroxypyr	26.2%
	Product Trade Name Vista	
	EPA Registration Number <u>62719-3</u> 08	
	Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons	
A)	<b>@</b> \$ $\frac{91.79}{}$ per gallon (i.e. \$ $\frac{458.95}{}$ per lot)	

DOH-32H	WETTABLE GRANULE FORMULATION CONTAINING Sodium salt of diffufenzopy: 2-(1-({3.5-diffuorophenylamino} carbony}) hydrazono} ethyl)-3-pyridinecarboxylic acid, sodium Sodium salt of 3.6-dichloro-o-anisic acid	21.4% 55.0%
	Product Trade Name Overdrive	
	EPA Registration Number 7969-150	
	Supplied in 7 ½ lb. jugs. 30 lbs. per case	
A)	@ \$ 38.90 per lb. (i.e. \$ 1167.00 per case)	
DOH-33H	DISPERSIBLE GRANULES CONTAINING Sulfometuron Methyl Chlorsulfuron	56.25% 18.75%
•	Product Trade NameLandmark XP	
	EPA Registration Number 352 - 645	
	Supplied in 4 lb. jugs in lots of 32 lbs.	
A)	@\$	
	Supplied in 64 oz jug returnable/refillable	
В) (	D\$8.87 per oz. (i.e. \$567.68 per jug)	
DOH-34H	DISPERSIBLE GRANULES CONTAINING Sulfometuron Methyl Metsulfuron Methyl	56.25% 15.00%
	Product Trade Name Oust Extra	
	EPA Registration Number 352 - 622	
	Supplied in 4 lb. jugs in lots of 32 lbs.	
A)	@\$ 106.00 per lb. (i.e. \$ 3392.00 per lot)	
	Supplied in 64 oz. returnable/refillable	
B)	@\$6.62 per oz. (i.e. \$423.68 per jug)	
	Supplied in 12 lb. jugs	
C)	@ \$per lb. (i.e. \$per jug)	

DOH-35H	A DRY FLOWABLE GRANULE CONTAINING:  Bromacil  Diuron	40% 40%
	Product Trade Name Krovar I DF	
	EPA Registration Number 352-505	
	Supplied in 6 lb containers in lots of 8 containers	
A)	@\$ 11.60 per lb (i.e. \$ 556.80 per lot)	
DOH-36H	A LIQUID CONTAINING: Imazapic Glyphosate	8.13% 21.94%
	Product Trade NameJourney	
	EPA Registration Number 24/- 4/7	
	Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons	
A)	@\$ 118.72 per gallon (i.e. \$ 593.60 per lot)	
DOH-37H	A LIQUID CONTAINING: Dimethylamine Salt of 2,4-Dichlovophenoxyacetic Acid Dimethylamine Salt of Dicamba (3,6-Dichloro-o-Anisic Acid)	24.58% 12.82%
	Product Trade Name Veteran 720	
	EPA Registration Number	
	Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons	
A)	@\$ No Bd per gallon (i.e. \$per lot)	
	Supplied in 30 gailon drums	
В)	@ \$ <u>\( \lambda \( \lambda \) \( \lambda \) \( \lambda \) per drum)</u>	
DOH-38H	DISPERSIBLE GRANULES CONTAINING Chlorsulfuron Sulfometuron Methyl Sulfentrazone	9% 18% 48%
	Product Trade Name Throttle XP	
	EPA Registration Number 352 - 725	
	Supplied in 3.9 lb. containers, 8 containers per case	
A)	@\$ 116.60 per lb (i.e. \$ 3637,92 per case)	

# **ADJUVANTS**

DOH-TA	A WATER SOLUBLE BLUE LIQUID SPRAT PATTERN INDICATOR	
	Product Trade Name Bullseye	
	Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons	
A)	@\$per gallon (i.e. \$ per lot)	
DOH-2A	A MISCIBLE-DISPERSIBLE LIQUID DEFOAMER (30% Active Ingredier	nt)
	Product Trade Name Arborchem Defoamer	-
	Supplied in $\frac{qts}{}$ containers in lots of $\frac{12qt/cs}{}$	
A)	@ \$ $\frac{8.24}{}$ per $^{qt}$ (i.e. \$ $\frac{98.88}{}$ per lot)	
DOH-3A	A DILUENT WITH EMULSIFIERS	
	Product Trade Name Hygrade EC or Arborchem Basal Oil or Bark Oil E Or Alenza Basal Oil or Penevator	<u>:C</u>
	Supplied in $\frac{2^{\frac{1}{2}}}{2}$ containers in lots of $\frac{5}{2}$ gallons	
A)	@\$ 7.10 per gallon (i,e, \$ 35.50 per lot)	
DOH-4A	NON-IONIC SURFACTANT (90% Active Ingredient)	
	Product Trade Name Chemsurf 90	
	Supplied in 1 gal containers in lots of 4 gallons	
A)	@\$	
DOH-5A	A GRANULAR/FLAKE DRIFT CONTROL AGENT	
	Product Trade Name 41-A	
	Supplied in 32 oz containers in lots of 12 containers	
A)	@\$	ıt)
DOH-6A	A LIQUID DRIFT CONTROL AGENT	
	Product Trade Name NO BID	
	Supplied in containers in lots of	
A)	@ \$ per (i.e. \$ per lot)	

DOH-7A	AQUATIC SURFACTANT			
	Product Trade Name Chemsurf 90			
	Supplied in 1 galcontainers in lots of4gallons			
A)	@\$			
DOH-8A	A WATER SOLUBLE LIQUID SPRAY PATTERN INDICATOR			
	Product Trade Name Blueprint Plus			
	Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons			
A)	@\$NO_BIDper gallon (i.e. \$per lot)			
DOH-10A	A NON-IONIC STICKER SPREADER			
	Product Trade Name Nu-Film-IR			
	Supplied in 2 ½ gallon containers in lots of gallons			
A)	@ \$ NO BID per gallon (i.e. \$ per lot)			
DOH-11A	A READY TO USE FORMULA CONTAINING PARFFINIC OIL EMULSIFIER			
	Product Trade NameThinvert RTU			
	Supplied in 2 ½ gallon jugs. 5 gallon per case			
A)	@\$			
	Supplied in 15 gallon drum			
В)	11.00 per gallon			

DOH-12A	A CONCENTRATE FORMULA CONTAINING PARFINNK OIL EMULSIFIERS AND SURFACTANTS			
	Product Trade Name Thinvert Concentrate			
	Supplied in 2 ½ gallon jugs. 5 gallon per case			
A)	@\$ 24.00 per gallon (i.e. \$ 120.00 per case)			
	Supplied in 15 gallon drum			
В)	@\$ 24.00 per gallon			

### SAFETY EQUIPMENT

DOH-1S	EMERGENCY SPILL KIT CONTAINING:			
	<ul> <li>15 Universal Plus Sorbent Pads</li> <li>3 Cobra Coils</li> <li>1 Pair Safety Goggles</li> <li>1 Pair Latex Gloves</li> <li>1 Large Refuse Bag</li> <li>1 List of Environmental Compliance Telephone Numbers</li> <li>18" x 18" x 4"</li> <li>Vacuum Packed in Puncture Resistant Foil</li> </ul>			
	Product Trade Name Attack Pac ATK-153			
A)	@\$_50.00 per each			
DOH-2S	A GRANULAR/FLAKE SPILL ABSORBENT			
	Product Trade Name Spill Guard			
	Supplied in 2.5 1b containers in lots of 4 container			
A)	@\$ 5.95 per pound (i.e. \$ 59.50 per lot)			
DOH-3S	3 LAYER FABRIC COVERALLS (ALL SIZES)			
	Product Trade Name Kleen Guard			
	Supplied in 12 ea/case			
A)	@\$			
DOH-4S	DISPOSABLE COVERALLS			
	Product Trade Name Tyvek			
	Supplied in 25 ea/case			
A)	@\$per each (i.e. \$ per case)			
DOH-5S	32 OZ. EYE WASH BOTTLE			
	Product Trade Name Eye Wash			
	Supplied per each			
A)	@\$17.00per each			

# 14. <u>BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T</u>

DOH-1M	PRESSURE RINSER			
	Product Trade Name Easy Rinse			
	Supplied per each			
A)	@ \$ 80.00 per each			
DOH-2M	HAND SOAP WITH CITRUS OIL			
	Product Trade Name Zep			
	Supplied in 32 oz. containers in lots of 20 containers per case			
A)	@ \$			
DOH-3M	A BIOSTIMULANT CONTAINING: Soluble Potash Iron	1.00% 0.36%		
	Manure Extract Humic and Fulvic Acid Extract Kelp Extract Organo-Modified Silaxane Surfactant	79.30% 9.00% 1.20% 0.36%		
	Product Trade Name Launch			
	Supplied in 2.5 gallon containers in lots of 5 gallons			
A)	@\$_NoBid_per gallon (i.e. \$per lot)			
DOH-4M	A WORK BOOT			
	Product Trade Name <u>Iron Duke</u>			
	Compliance EPA 40 CFR 170			
	Supplied per pair			
A)	@ Size (6–11) \$ <u>No Bil</u> per pair	·		
В)	@ Size (12 +) \$ No Bil per pair			

DOH-5M	RUBBER BOOT/SHOE COVERS			
	Compliance EPA 40 CFR 170			
	Supplied per pair			
A)	@ Size M (8-9) \$			
В)	@ Size L (10-11) \$ <b>Nobil</b> per pair			
C)	@ Size XL (12-13) \$ 1061 per pair			
DOH-6M	SAFETY GOGGLES - indirect vent			
	Meets ANS1 287.1-1989			
A)	@\$NO_BIDper each			
DOH-7M	FACE SHIELD – positive lock headgear			
	Meets ANS1 287.1-1989 and CAN1CSA-294 3-92 Specifications			
	@\$NO_BID_per each			
DOH-8M	A 5-GALLON BACKPACK SPRAYER			
	Product Trade Name Birchmeier			
A)	@ \$ per sprayer			
	Gasket Set For Sprayer Pump			
B)	@ \$ 17.00 per set			
	Hose Valve & Wand Repair Kit			
C)	@\$ 18.00 per kit			

14. BIDDING SCHEDULE CON'T					
DOH-9M	NITRI-SOLVE 100% NITRILE GLOVES 15 mil 13" Nitrile Gloves				
	Compliance EPA 40 CFR 170				
	Sizes S, M, L, XL, or 2XL				
A)	@ \$ per pair				
DOH-10M	2-QUART HANDHELD PRESSURE SPRAYER				
	Product Trade NameTolco				
A)	@ \$				
DOH-11M	CLOSED SYSTEM BACKPACK SPRAYER				
	Product Trade Name Birchmier BCS				
A)	@ \$				
	Gasket set for sprayer pump				
В)	@\$per set				

Hose Valve & Wand repair kit

\_ per kit

**@\$**\_\_\_\_\_18,00

C)

### **DISTRICT DELIVERY ADDRESSES**

District One Office
1334 Smith Street
Charleston West Virgini

Charleston, West Virginia 25301-1492

District Six Office 1 DOT Drive

Moundsville, West Virginia 26041-1605

District Two Office 801 Madison Avenue Huntington, West Virginia 25712-0880

District Seven Office 255 Depot Street Weston, West Virginia 26452-1228

District Three Office 624 Depot Street Parkersburg, West Virginia 26102-0308

District Eight Office US 219 North Elkins, West Virginia 26241-1516

District Four Office 179 & Meadowbrook Road Clarksburg, West Virginia 26302-2570 District Nine Office 103 1/2 Church Street Lewisburg, West Virginia 24901

District Five Office Route 50 Burlington, West Virginia 26710-0099

District Ten Office 270 Hardwood Lane Princeton, West Virginia 24740-2737

66800022

### STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA Purchasing Division

# PURCHASING AFFIDAVIT

West Virginia Code §5A-3-10a states: No contract or renewal of any contract may be awarded by the state or any of its political subdivisions to any vendor or prospective vendor when the vendor or prospective vendor or a related party to the vendor or prospective vendor is a debtor and the debt owed is an amount greater than one thousand dollars in the aggregate

#### **DEFINITIONS:**

D: = = i

"Debt" means any assessment, premium, penalty, fine, tax or other amount of money owed to the state or any of its political subdivisions because of a judgment, fine, permit violation, license assessment, defaulted workers' compensation premium, penalty or other assessment presently delinquent or due and required to be paid to the state or any of its political subdivisions, including any interest or additional penalties accrued thereon.

"Debtor" means any individual, corporation, partnership, association, limited liability company or any other form or business association owing a debt to the state or any of its political subdivisions. "Political subdivision" means any county commission; municipality; county board of education; any instrumentality established by a county or municipality; any separate corporation or instrumentality established by one or more counties or municipalities, as permitted by law; or any public body charged by law with the performance of a government function or whose jurisdiction is coextensive with one or more counties or municipalities. "Related party" means a party, whether an individual, corporation, partnership, association, limited liability company or any other form or business association or other entity whatsoever, related to any vendor by blood, marriage, ownership or contract through which the party has a relationship of ownership or other interest with the vendor so that the party will actually or by effect receive or control a portion of the benefit, profit or other consideration from performance of a vendor contract with the party receiving an amount that meets or exceed five percent of the total contract amount.

EXCEPTION: The prohibition of this section does not apply where a vendor has contested any tax administered pursuant to chapter eleven of this code, workers' compensation premium, permit fee or environmental fee or assessment and the matter has not become final or where the vendor has entered into a payment plan or agreement and the vendor is not in default of any of the provisions of such plan or agreement.

LICENSING: Vendors must be licensed and in good standing in accordance with any and all state and local laws and requirements by any state or local agency of West Virginia, including, but not limited to, the West Virginia Secretary of State's Office, the West Virginia Tax Department, West Virginia Insurance Commission. or any other state agencies or political subdivision. Furthermore, the vendor must provide all necessary releases to obtain information to enable the Director or spending unit to verify that the vendor is licensed and in good standing with the above entities.

CONFIDENTIALITY: The vendor agrees that he or she will not disclose to anyone, directly or indirectly, any such personally identifiable information or other confidential information gained from the agency, unless the individual who is the subject of the information consents to the disclosure in writing or the disclosure is made pursuant to the agency's policies, procedures and rules. Vendors should visit www.state.wv.us/admin/ purchase/privacy for the Notice of Agency Confidentiality Policies.

Under penalty of law for false swearing (West Virginia Code, §61-5-3), it is hereby certified that the vendor acknowledges the information in this said affidavit and are in compliance with the requirements as stated.

Vendor's Name:	Arbovehem	Graduets	Oiv. of Aso	(undh)
Authorized Signatu	ıre:	Sento	/ Date:	3-27-2008
Purchasing Affidavit (Re	evised 06/15/07)			



\*709005844

943 NIXON DRIVE

State of West Virginia Department of Administration Purchasing Division 2019 Washington Street East Post Office Box 50130 Charleston, WV 25305-0130

717-666-6661

# Request for Quotation

RFQ NUMBER 668C0022 No. 1

ADDRESS CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTENTION OF MICHAEL AUSTIN 304-558-2402

ARBORCHEM PRODUCTS CO DIV ASPL

MECHANICSBURG PA 17055 DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED BY ORDER

DATE PRINTED TERMS OF SALE SHIP VIA FOB FREIGHT TERMS 03/20/2008 BID OPENING DATE: 04/02/2008 BID OPENING TIME 01:30PM CAT NO LINE QUANTITY UOP ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE AMOUNT ADDENDUM NO. 1 CHANGES TO THE SPECIFICATIONS ATTACHED. ADD: EXHIBIT 6, PRICE ADJUSTMENT PROVISION. BID OPENING DATE AND TIME REMAINS THE SAME. NO OTHER CHANGES 0001 EA 675-85 HERBICIDES IS THE END OF RFQ \*\*\*\* THIS 668C0022 \*\*\*\*\* TOTAL: SEE REVERSE SIDE FOR TERMS AND CONDITIONS TELEPHONE

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'

# FOR USE ONLY IN CATEGORIES ABOVE WEST VIRGINIA CERTIFICATION

Expires: 12/31/08 C04461

Commercial Applicator

David L. Krause Asplundh

943 Nixon Drive

Mechanicsburg, PA

NOT TRANSFERABLE