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SPECIFICATIONS

The following sections of the West Virginia Department of
Transpertation, Division of Highways Standard Specifications Roads
and Bridges, adopted 20006, as modified by the current Supplemental
Specifications shall apply to the adminigtration of this Contract:
Sections 101, 102.4, 102.5, 105.1, 105.3, 105.4, 105.10, 105.11,
105.12, 105.13, 106.3, 106.4, 106.5, 106.6, 106.7, 106.9, 107.1,
107.2, 107.3, 107.14, 107.19, 107.20, 108.8, 108.9, 109.1, 109.2 and
105.20.

Materials and equipment shall conform to the requirements of Section
219 and 601.

Section 601.7 is amended azs follows:

DELETE THE SECOND AND THIRD PARAGRAPHS AND SUBSTITUTE
THE FOLLOWING:

Concrete may be made by volumetrie batching and continuous mixing
(concrete mobile) as desxgnated in AASHTO M241, except as otherwise
specified herein.

When a truck mixer or agitator is used for transporting concrete, the
concrete shall be delivered teo the site of the work and discharge
shall be completed within 1 1/2 hours after the addition of the
cement to the aggregates. Each batch of concrete delivered at the job
site shall be accompanied by a batch ticket (ST-17) bearing complete
batching information. In adverse weather or under other conditions
contributing to quick stiffening of the concrete, or when the
temperature of the concrete iz 85° F. or above, the time between the
introduction of the cement to the aggregates and discharge shall not
exceed one hour. When a truck mixer is used for the complete mixing
of the concrete, the mixing operation shall begin within one hour
after the cement has been added to the aggregate.

The addition of water after completion of initial mixing will not be

permitted, except that when concrete is delivered in truck mixers

additional water may be added to adjust to a specified consistency.
In this event, a minimum of 20 additional revolutions of the truck
mizxer drum at mixing speed shall be required before discharge of any
concrete. The mazimum allowable number of revolutions at mixing
speed shall not be exceeded in total mixing; and the maximum
allowable time between the addition of the cement to the aggregates
and the discharge of the batch shall not be exceeded. Concrete that
is not within the specified consistency limits at the time of
placement shall not be used.

Section 601.9.2 is amended as follows:

IN THE FIRST SENTENCE OF THE THIRD PARAGRAPH, CHANGE "45 minutes" to
*one hour.m®

R Aud B L}

i C 1 A




The terms "Contractor"™ and "Vendor” used in the above specifications
or this contract are interchangeable. Contractor shall mean Vendor
and Vendor shall mean Contractor.

West Virginia Department of Transportation, Division of Highways
Standard Specifications Roads and Bridges, adopted 2000 and the
current Supplemental Specifications may be obtained from:

West Virginia Division of Highways
Engineering Division, Technical Section
State Capitol Complex -

Building 5, Room A-650

Charleston, West Virginia 25305

BIDDING INSTRUCTIONS

Any qualification of bids or any modification of the specifications
or conditions governing the bids may be cause to reject bids.

If a Vendor is bidding materials from more than one plant, a set of

bid schedules with all required information shall be provided for
each source.

DETERMINING LOW BID

State Contract Purchase Orders (5C0) for individual projects will be
based on the lowest overall total cost of the material {Items A
through I) plus the haul cost (Item L) pluz any additional charges
{(Items 3, K, M, N and 0).

The haul distances allowed for Item L will be over =suitable routes
selected by the District Engineer and shall be measured from the
Vendor's plant to the job site. All such chosen routes shall have
acceptable load limite for both roads and bridges. If a Vendor

ingerts prices for both options of Item I, Additional Haul, the

Division will calculate payment under this item using the option that
will result in the least expense to the bivision.

CONTRACT AWARD

All qualified Vendors who submit a wvalid bid will be awarded a
contract for those items bid.

The Division will only buy concrete and controlled low-strength
material (CLSM) produced in a certified plant. Therefore, State
Contract Orders (SCO'S) will only be issued to Vendors with a
certified plant. Bids gubmitted from Vendors whose plant iz not
certified will be considered wvalid, but SCO'"g will not be issued to a
Vendor until such time as his plant becomes certified.
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10.

If the Vendor's plant certification expires during the life of this
contract, SCO's will not be issued for concrete and controlled low-
strength material (CLSM) from that plant until such time as the
plant's certification is renewed.

In the event a Contractor fails to conform to the requirements set
cut in this contract document, the State Contract Purchase Order or
the governing specifications, the 8CO may be canceled and reissued to
the next low bidder.

MATERIAL TESTING

The Vendor will conduct all teets regquired by the specifications to
be performed at the plant. Any job site testing required by the
specifications will be performed by the Division.

ACCEPTANCE PLAN

Material failing to comply with the quality requirements will not be
accepted, and will be returned at the Vendor's expense.

DELIVERY

The unit Bid Price quoted for Concrete and Controlled Low-Strength

Material (CLSM) Items A through I shall include delivery within five
{(5) miles of the Vendor's Plant.

TEMPERATURE CONTROL

The Vendor is required to meet the temperature requirements as set
forth in the Standard Specificatioms.

ADMIXTURES
All concrete shall be air-entrained. The cost of the air-entraining
agent shall be included in the Unit Bid Price of the concrete and no

additional charge for air-entraining agent will be allowed under Item
J, Admixture.

VENDOR'S INVOICE

Vendeor's invoices must be submitted in original and one copy and
contain the following:

a. Division of Highways State Contract Order (SCO) Number
and thiz Contract Number.
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11.

12

b. Total gquantity and unit price with all additional charges
itemized, and the total cost for the material furnisghed.

Note: Under no circumstance will the West Virginia Division of

Highways accept, or pay for, quantities of material in excess of the
quantity stated on the $CO.

PURCHASING CARD ACCEPTANCE

The BState of West Virginia currently utilizes a VISA Purchasing Card
Program which is issued through a bank. The successful vendors must accept
the State of West Virginia VISA Purchasing Card for payment of all oxrders
placed by State DOT agency for orders as a condition of award.
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NOTE: Vendors can complete Bidding Schedule at Purchasing's Web Site
www .state.wv.us/admin/purchase

Vendor should type Bidding Schedule

12.

Itenm
No.

a.

H.

J.

BIDDING SCHEDULE

Unit Bid Price for Items A through I, to include delivery within five

(5) miles of Vendor's Plant.

ORDER SIZE IN CUBIC YARDS

CY & Over

/cy
/CcY
/cY
/CcY

/cy

DISTRICT ___1 PRICE PER CUBIC YARD
2-2.99CY 3-3.99¢CY 4-4.99CY 5
Class A Concrete, _  /CY __ lecy _ Jecx
Clags B Concrete, _  /CY Y £ 4 _Jcx
Class C Concrete, ___ /CY DY 4. 4 Y A% 4
Class D Concrete, __  /CY _Jcx _ Jcx
Class K Concrete, /cY /CY /oy

Modified Class K
Concrete, 8-1/2 Bag

Mix, Siliceous Sand /cY /CY /CY
CLSM Type A Y= 2 - S - 1

CLSM Type B __Jex ey [fey

CLSM Type C /cY /CcY _____/CY

Will Class B Concrete supplied at prices
quoted above contain limestone sand?

If so, state additional charge to provide
Class B Concrete using giliceous sand

Charge per bag for increased cement
content above the target value.

Additional Haul: Vendor may bid either or both options;
Division of Highways will select the most cost effective

/CY
/CY
/cY

/cY

/cY

/Y

however, the
option.

Option A § per cubic yard per mile

Option B § per truck load per mile

np -




12. BIDDING SCHEDULE (continued) DISTRICT 1

M. Admixture, per cubic yard

14

1) Water-reducing set retarder $ cY
2) Water reducer $ cY
3} Calcium chloride based accelerator

(HE-122 or approved equal s 0Z
4) Non-calcium chloride based accelerator

{(Darex Set Accelerator or approved equal 8 0z
5) Super plasticizer (Eucon 37 or approved

equal & (0)'4
6) Fiber $ CcY
7) Heated Concrete $ cY
8} Ice -3 per pound

N. Due to time constraints, the cement may have to be added

to the transit mixer at the project site using Division

personnel. Please state any additional charges as

follows:
1) Cement provided and transported to
project sgite by vendor § /CY
2) Cement provided by vendor and transported
from Vendor's plant to project site by
Division 8 /c
c. Penalty Charge for unloading time
in excess of ten (10) minutes per cubie
yard. -] per truck minute

Plant Location

iR

T
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Item
No.

c.

D.

F.

c.

BIDDING SCHEDULE {Continuted)

Unit Bid Price for Items A through I, to include delivery within five

{(5) miles of Vendor's Plant.

ORDER SIZE IN CUBIC YARDS

Digtrict 2

PRICE PER CUBIC YARD

2-2.99CY 3-3.95CY 4-4.99CY 5 CY & Over

Class A Concrete, ___ /CY _fey _Jex
Class B Concrete, ____ /CY __Jey _ Jfey
Class C Concrete, _ /CY¥ Y 4%+ 4 Y4+t 4
Class D Concrete, _ /CY e _fcy
Class K Concrete, /cY /CY /cY

Modified Class K
Concrete, 8-1/2 Bag

Mix, Siliceocus Sand Jcy VLo ¢ /CY

CLSM Type A /cY /ey /cY

/CY /cY /CY

CLSM Type B

CLSM Type C /cy /cy /cY

Will Class B Concrete supplied at prices
gquoted above contain limestone sand?

If so, state additional charge to provide
Class B Concrete using siliceous sand

Charge per bag for increased cement
content above the target value.

/CY

/cY

/cY
/cY
/cY
/ey

/cY

/cY
/CcY

/oY

/ey

Additional Haul: Vendor may bid either or both opticmns; however, the
Division of Highways will select the most cost effective option.

Option A § per cubic yard per mile

Option B & per truck load per mile

15
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12. BIDDING SCHEDULE (continued) DISTRICT 2
M. Admixture, per cubie yard
1) Water-reducing set retarder $
2} Water reducer -]
3) Calcium chloride based accelerator
{HE-122 or approved equal) $
4} Non-calcium chloride based accelerator
(Darex Set Accelerator or approved equal s
5) Super plasticizer (Eucon 37 or approved
equal) 3
6) Fiber -]
7) Heated Concrete ]
8) Ice 8
N. Due to time constraints, the cement may have to be added

to the transit mixer at the project site using Division
personnel. Please state any additional charges as

follows:
1) Cement provided and transported to
project site by Vendor 8 /ey
2) Cement provided by vendor and transported
from Vendor's plant to project site by
Division $ __ /C
0. Penalty Charge for unloading time

in excess of ten (10) minutes per cubice

yard.

Plant Location

16

CY
cY

0Z

0Z

per pound

$ per truck minute

el |
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Item
No.

F.

G.
H.
I.

J.

17

BIDDING SCHEDULE {Continued)

Unit Bid Price for Itemg A through I, to include delivery within five
(5) miles of Vendor's Plant.

ORDER SIZE IN CUBIC YARDS

Digtrict 3 PRICE PER CUBIC YARD

2-2.99CY 3-3.99CY 4-4.99CY 5 CY & Over

Class A Concrete, ______/CY /cY L+ 4 NO BID /ey
Class B Comcrete, 205.0fcy  165.00/cy  130.00/cY 105.00 fey
Class C Concrete, _ /CY o Jex Y 4% 4 NO BiD /ey
Class D Concrete, /cY /oY /CY NO BID fov

Class K Concrete, 215,00/CY 175;00/CY 140.00/CY 1'15.00._/CY

Modified Class K
Concrete, 8-1/2 Bag

Mix, Siliceous Sand _ /ey __ fecx /cY NO BID /ey
CLSM Type A _Jey _Jey /ey NG BID /cY

CLSM Type B _ Jjoy __ Jexy _ Joy NO BID /¢y

CLSM Type C /ey /cY _Jey NO BID /ey

Will Class B Concrete supplied at prices
quoted above contain limestone sand? NO

If so, state additiomal charge to provide
Class B Concrete using siliceous sand NA /CY

Charge per bag for increased cement
content above the target value. 16.00 /ey

Additional Haul: Vendor may bid either or both options; however, the
Division of Highways will select the most cost effective option.

Option A § per cubic yard per mile
Option B § 4.00 per truck load per mile

bR NE - ]

N




12. BIDDING SCHEDULE (Continued) DISTRICT 3

M. Admixture, per cubic yard
1) Water-reducing set retarder § 2.00 cC¥Y
2) Water reducer $_NC cY
3) Calcium chloride based accelerator -
(HE-122 or approved equal) $ 3.00/1%z
4) Non-calcium chloride based accelerator
{Darex Set Accelerator or approved equal $6.00/1702
5) Super plasticizer (Eucon 37 or approved
equal) ' £6.00 cY
§) Fiber $6.50 CcY
7) Heated Concrete $4.95 cY
8) Ice $ .45 per pound
N. Due to time constraints, the cement may have to be added

to the trangit mixer at the project site using Division

personnel.

Please state any additional charges as

follows:
1) Cement provided and transported to
project site by Vendor § NA /Y
2) Cement provided by Vendor and transported
from Vendor's plant to project site by
Divieion $.NA /c
o. Penalty Charge for unloading time

in excess of ten (10) minutes per cubic
yard. :

Plant Location McAlpin, WV (Harrison Co.)

$2.00 per truck minute

18
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12.

Item
No.

D.

G.

19

BIDDING SCHEEDULE (Continued)

Unit Bid Price for Items A through I, to include delivery within five
(5) miles of Vendor's Flant.

ORDER SIZE IN CUBIC YARDS

District __& PRICE PER CUBIC YARD

2-2.59CY 3-3.089CY 4-4.99CY 5 CY & Over

Class A Concrete, 179.00cY 1£4.00cy 119.00@cy 99.00 /cY
Class B Concrete, 172.00CY 137.0¢cCY 112.00cCY 92.00 /CY
Class C Concrete, /cY /cY /CY NO BID sey

Class D Comcrete, /CY /Y /oy NO BID /ey

Class K Concrete, 182.00cy 147.0Qcy 122.0Qcy 102.00 /ey

Modified Class K
Concrete, 8-1/2 Bag

Mix, Silicecus Sand 155.0@cy 165.0Qcy 140.0¢cy 120.00 scy
CLSM Type A 156.00cy 121.0@cy 96.00/cY 76.00 /cy

CLSM Type B 154.00cy 119.0@cy 94.00/cY 74.00 /cY

CLSM Type C 170.00¢y 135.0@¢cx 109.0902 89.00 /oY

Will Class B Concreté supplied at prices

quoted above contain limestone sand? NO

If so, state additional charge to provide

Class B Concrete using siliceous sand NA /cY

Charge per bag for increased cement

content above the target value. _ 16.00 /CcY

Additional Haul: Vendor may bid either or both options; however, the
Division of Highways will select the most cost effective option.

Option A § per cubic yard per mile

Option B § 3.50  per truck load per mile




12, BIDDING SCHEDULE (continued) DISTRICT 4

M.

Admixture, per cubic yard

1)
2)
3)

4)
5)
6)

7)
8)

Due to time constraints,

Water-reducing set retarder

Water reducer

Calcium chloride based accelerator
(HE-122 or approved eqgual)

Non-calcium chloride based accelerator
(Darex Set Accelerator or approved equal
Super plasticizer (Eucon 37 or approved
equal)

Fiber

Heated Concrete

Ice

$2.00 c¥
$Ng; CcY
§3.00/17 oz

$6.00/l% 0%

$6.00 cy
$6.50 oY
84,25 cY

$_.45 per pound

the cement may have to be added

to the transit mixer at the project site using Division

personnel.

Please state any additional charges as

follows:
- 1) Cement provided and transported to
project site by Vendor § NA /ey
2) Cement provided by Vendor and transported
from Vendor's plant to project site by
Division $ NA /c

Penalty Charge f£or unloading time

in excess of ten (10) minutes per cubic
yard.

Plant LocationMcAlpin, WV (Harrison Co.)

$ 2.00 per truck minute

Bakers Ridge Road (quongalia Co.)

20
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12.

Item
No.

c.
D.
E.

F.

a.

BIDDING SCHEDULE (Continued)

Unit Bid Price for Items A through I, to include delivery within five
(5) miles of Vendor's Plant.

ORDER SIZE IN CUBIC YARDS

District 5

2-2.98CY

PRICE PER CUBIC YARD

3-3.95CY 4-4.99CY 5 CY & Over

Class A Concrete, /CcY

Class B Concrete, 205.0pCY
Class C Concrete, /CY

Class D Concrete, /cY

Class K Concrete, 215.00QcyY

Modified Class K
Concrete, 8-1/2 Bag
Mix, Siliceocus Sand

CLSM Type A /cY
CLEM Type B /oy
CLSM Type C /cY

Will Class B Concrete supplied at prices
quoted above contain limestone sand? _ NG

If so, state additiomal charge to provide
Class B Concrete using siliceous sand NA /CY

Charge per bag for increased cement
content above the target wvalue. 16.00 /oy

Additional Haul: Vendor may bid either or both options; however, the

/ey /cx NO BID /ey
165.0fcY  130.00cY  105.00 /CY
L 4 __lecy NG BID /CY

/ey /cy NO BIP /ey
175.0¢cy 140.00cCY 115.00 /ey

__Jex /cY /cY NC BID /ey
_ Jex _ ey NO BID /CY
_ Jexy ey NC BID /ey
/ey /oY NG BID sey

Division of Highways will select the most cost effective option.

Option A § per cubic yard per mile

Option B § 4.00 per truck load per mile

21
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BIDDING SCHEDULE {continued) DISTRICT 5

Admixture, per cubic yard

i) Water-reducing set retarder $ 2.00 cv
2) Water reducer g NC CcY
3) Calcium chloride based accelerator
(HE-122 or approved equal) $3~00/1Z 0Z 4)

Non-calcium chloride based accelerator

(Darex Set Accelerator or approved equal $6.00/17 oz

5) Super plasticizer (Eucon 37 or approved
equal) $6v00 CY
6) Fiber $6.50 CY
7) Heated Concrete $4.75 cY
8) Ice §$§.45 per pound

Due to time constraints, the cement may have to be added
to the transit mixer at the project site using Division
personnel. Please state any additional charges as

follows:
1) Cement provided and transported to
project site by Vendor g Na /CY
2) Cement provided by Vendor and tranaported
from Vendor's plant to project site by
Division $ NA /c

Penalty Charge for unloading time
in excess of ten (10) minutes per cubic
yard. $ 2.00 per truck minute

plant Location US Route 33 West Elkins, WV

i
:
;
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12, BIDDING SCHEDULE (Continued)

Unit Bid Price for Items A through I, to include delivery within five
{5) miles of Vendor's FPlant. :

ORDER SIZE IN CUBIC YARDS

District 6 PRICE PER CUBIC YARD
ITtem
No. 2-2.99CY 3-3.99CY 4-4,.99CY 5 CY & Over
A. Class A Concrete, /cY /cY /CcY NG /CY

B Class B Concrete, 205.00CY 165.06cy 130.0¢cyY 105.00 /cy

c. Class C Concrete, /CY Joy /CcY NO BID /C¥

D. Class D Concrete, /CY /ey /CcY NO BID /c¥
BE. Class K Concrete, 215.0fcy 175.00CY 140.0(CY 1i5.00 /cx

F. Modified Class K
Concrete, 8-1/2 Bag

Mix, Biliceous Sand [~ 1 V{4 /cY NO BID /cx
G. CLSM Type 2 . [cx _Jey _ Jex NG BID scy
H. CLSM Type B __Jex __fex  __ jex  NO BID ey ;
I. CLSM Type C /cY /cY /ey NO BID /c¥

J. Will Class B Concrete supplied at prices

quoted above contain limestone sand? NC

If so, state additiomal charge to provide

Class B Concrete using siliceous sand NA /CY
K. Charge per bag for increased cement 16.00

content above the target value. /cY

L. Additional Haul: Vendor may bid either or both options; however, the
Division of Highways will select the most cost effective option.

Option A § per cubic yard per nile
option B § 4.00 per truck load per nile

15 Ik




12. BIDDING SCHEDULE (continued) DISTRICT 6

M,

Admixture, per cubic yard

1)
2)
3)

4)
5)
§)

7)
8)

Water-reducing set retarder

Water reducer

Caleium chloride based accelerator
{(EE-122 or approved equal)

Non-caleium chloride based accelerator
{Darex Set Accelerator or approved equal
Super plasticizer (Eucon 37 or approved
equal)

Fiber

Heated Concrete

Ice

24

$2.00 cY
$ NC cY

$3.00/17 oz
§6.00/17 oz

$6.00 (534
$6.50 (54 4
$4.25 CcY
$.45  per pound

Due to time constraints, the cement may have to be added
to the transit mixer at the project gite using Division

personnel.

Please state any additional charges as

follows:
1) Cement provided and transported to
project site by Vendor § /CcY
2) Cement provided by Vendor and transported

from Vendor's plant to project site by

Division § NA

- Penalty Charge for unloading time

in excess of ten (10) minutes per cubig

yvard.

g 2-00

Plant Location McAlpin, WV (Harrisonm Co.)

/c

per truck minute

AR
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12.

Item
No.

a.

H.

BIDDING SCHEDULE (Continued)

25

Unit Bid Price for Items A through I, to include delivery within five

{(5) miles of Vendor's Plant.

ORDER SIZE IN CUBIC YARDS

bistrict 7 PRICE PER CUBIC YARD

2-2,98CY 3-3.99CY 4-4,89CY 5 CY & Over

Class A Concrete, 1/9.0Pcy 144.0pcy 119.0¢cy 99.00 /cY
Class B Concrete, 172.0fcy 127.00CY 112.08cCY 92.00 /cx
Class ¢ Concrete, /ci /CY /oy NG BID oy
Class D Concrete, /cY jcx ey NU BID  sey
Class K Concrete, 182.00cy 147.0%cyY 122.04CY 102.00 /CY
Modified Class K

Concrete, 8-1/2 Bag

Mix, Siliceous Sand 195.09¢cy 165.0¢cy 140.0@cy 120.00 /c¥
CLSM Type A 156.0Q0cy 121.00cy 96.00/cyY 76.00 /ey
CLSM Type B 154.00cy 119.0dcy 94.00/CY 74.00 /cY
CLSM Type C 170.0@cy 135.00¢y 109.0¢cy 89,00 /cY
Will class B Concrete supplied at prices

quoted above contain limestone sand? NG

If so, state additional charge to provide

Class B Concrete using siliceous sand NA /CY
Charge per bag for increased cement

content above the target value. 16.00 /oy

Additional Haul: Vendor may bid either or both options; however, the
Divigion of Highways will select the most cost effective optiom.

option A § per cubic yard per mile

Option B § 3.50 per truck load per mile

1 B e L EL
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12. BIDDING SCHEDULE (continued) DISTRICT 7

M.

0.

Admixture, per cubic yard

1) Water-reducing set retarder $2.00 ey
2) Water reducer 3NC cY
3) Calcium chloride based accelerator

(HE-122 or approved equal) $3-00/1% 0z
4} Non-calcium chloride based accelerator

(Darex Set Accelerator or approved equal $6.00/170z
5) Super plasticizer (Eucon 37 or approved

equal) $6.00 cvy
6) Fiber $6.50 cCY
7) Heated Concrete $ 4,25 CY
8) Ice $ .45 per pound

Due to time constraints, the cement may have to be added
to the transit mixer at the project site using Division
personnel. Please state any additional charges as

follows:
1) Cement provided and transported to
project site by Vendor § NA /cY
2} Cement provided by Vendor and transported
' from Vendor's plant to project site by
Division § NA /C

Penalty Charge for unlcading time
in excess of ten (10) minutes per cubic
yard. g 2.00 per truck minute

Plant Location US Route 33 lorentz, WV

e Bl
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BIDDING SCHEDULE (Continued)

Unit Bid Price for Items A through I, to include delivery within five
{5) miles of Vendor's Plant.

ORDER SIZE IN CUBIC YARDS

District 8 PRICE PER CUBIC YARD

2-2.99CY 3-3.98CY 4-4,99CY 5 CY & Over

Class A Concrete, 1/7.00CY 142.0Q¢y 117.00¢cy 97.00 /CcY
Class B Concrete, 170.0{¢y 135.0Q¢cy 110.0(0cy 90.00 /cY
Class C Concrete, /oY /cY /CY NO BID /cY
Class D Concrete, /ey /cY /cy NO BID /ey
Class K Concrete, 181.00Qcy 146.0Q¢cy 121.0¢¢cy 101.00 /ey
Modified Class K

Concrete, 8-1/2 Bag

Mix, Siliceocus Sand 105.0(0/CY 165.0(/CY 140. 00y 120.00 /cx
CLSM Type A 156.00Q¢cy 121.00cy 96.00 /cY 76.00 /cy
CLSM Type B 154.0Qcy 119.0Q¢cy 94.00 /cY 74.00 /cY
CLSM Type C 170.0¢0cy 135.00¢cy 109.00/cxy 89.00 /cy
Will Class B Concrete Supplied at prices

quoted above contain limestone sand? NO

If so, state additicnal charge to provide

Class B Concrete using siliceous sand NA /cY
Charge per bag for increased cement

content above the target value. 16.00 /ey

Additional Haul: Vendor may bid either or both options; however, the
Division of Highways will select the most cost effective option.

Option & § per cubic yard pet mile
Option B § 3.50 per truck load per mile

4R
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12, BIDDING SCEEDULE (Continued) DISTRICT 8

M.

Admixture, per cubic yard

1)
2)
3)

4)
5)
6)

7}
8)

Water-reducing set retarder

Water reducer

Calecium chloride based accelerator
(HE-122 or approved equal)

Non-caleium chloride based accelerator
(Darex Set Accelerator or approved egqual
Super plasticizer {Eucen 37 or approved
equal)

Fiber

Heated Concrete

Ice

28

$2.00 ey
sNC ey

$3.00/1%z%
§6.00/1%z

$§6.00 cv
$6.50 c¥Y
$4.25 cC¥
$.45 per pound

Due to time constraints, the cemernt may have to be added
to the transit mixer at the project site using Division

personnel. Please state any additional charges as
follows:
1) Cement provided and transported to
project site by Vemdor § N /oy
2} Cement provided by Vendor and transported

from Vendor's plant to project site by

Division § NA

Penalty Charge for unloading time
in excess of ten (10) minutes per cubig

$ 2-00 per truck minute
Plant Location US Route 33 West Flkins, WV '

yaxrd.
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12.

Item
No.

BIDDING SCHEDULE (Continued)

Unit Bid Price for Items A through I, to include delivery within five
{5) miles of Vendor's Plant.

ORDER SIZE IN CUBIC YARDS

District 9 PRICE PER CUBIC YARD

2-2.99CY 3-3.85CY 4-4.99CY 5 CY & Qver

Class A Concrete,  /CY _Jecx _fey /CY
Class B Concrete, ___ /CY _Jeoy Y { /cY
Class C Concrete, _ /C¥ ___fcx _ Jey /cY
Class D Concrete, __ /CY [ty ey /CcY
Class K Concrete, /CY /CY /oY /ey

Modified Class K
Concrete, 8-1/2 Bag

Mix, Silicecus Sand Y 4 %+ 4 /cY /cx /cY
CLSM Type A /oy _ Jex ___Jey ' /cy

CLSM Type B /oy _ Jey __Jex /ey

CLSM Type C /ey /cY Y+ 1 /cy

Will Class B Concrete supplied at prices
quoted above contain limestone sand?

If s0, state additional charge to provide
Class B Concrete using siliceous sand /cY

Charge per bag for increased cement
content above the target value. /CcY

Additional Haul: Vendor may bid either or both options; however, the
Division of Highways will select the most cost.effective option.

Option A § per cubic yard per mile

Option B § per truck load per nile

29
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12. BIDDING SCHEDULE (continued) DISTRICT 9

M.

Admixture, per cubic yard

1) Water-reducing set retarder $ cY
2) Water reducer § cY
3) Calcium chloride based accelerator

(HE-122 or approved equal) $ 0Z
4) Non-calcium chloride based accelerator

{Darex Set Accelerator or approved equal $ 0Z
5) Super plasticizer (Bucon 37 or approved

equal) 4 cY
6} Fiber -4 cY
7) Heated Concrete - CcY
8) Ice ' 8 per pound

Due to time constraints, the cement may have to be added
to the transit mixer at the project site using Division
personnel. Please state any additional charges as

follows:
1) Cement provided and transported to
project site by Vendor § /CcY
2) Cement provided by Vendor and transported
from Vendor's plant to project site by
Divigion 5 /c

Penalty Charge for unloading time
in excess of ten (10) minutes per cubic
yard., $ per truck minute

Plant Location

IR

HII
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12.

Item
No.

C.

D.

F.

BIDDING SCHEDULE {(Continued)

Unit Bid Price for Items A through I, to include delivery within five

{5} miles of Vendor'zs Plant.

ORDER SIZE IN CUBIC YARDS

District 10

PRICE PER CUBIC YARD

2-2.99CY 3-3,99CY 4-4,99CY 5 CY & Over
Class A Concrete, /cY /cy /cY /CY
Class B Concrete, /CcY J/CY /CY /CY
Class C Concrete, /CY /CY /CY /cY
Class D Concrete, F o4 /CY /cY /CY
Class K Concrete, /cY /CY /CY /cYy
Modified Class K
Concrete, 8-~1/2 Bag
Mix, Siliceous Sand /CY /Y /cY
CLSM Type A /cY /cy /ey /CY
CLSM Type B /cY /cY /ey /CcY
CLSM Type C /cY /cY /cY /cy
Will Class B Concrete supplied at prices
quoted above contain limestone sand?
If so, state additional charge to provide
Class B Concrete using siliceous sand /ey
Charge per bag for increased cement
content above the target value. /cY

/cY

Additional Haul: Vendor may bid either or both opticns; however, the
Division of Highways will select the most cost effective option.

Option A § per cubic yard per mile

Option B § ___per truck load per mile

31
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12. BIDDING SCHEDULE (continued) DISTRICT 10

Admixture, per cubic yard

1)
2)
3)

4)
5)
&)

7)
8)

Water-reducing set retarder

Water reducer

Calcium chloride based accelerator
{EE-122 or approved equal)

Non-calcium chloride based accelerator
{Darex Set Accelerator or approved equal
Super plasticizer {Eucon 37 or approved
equal)

Fiber

Heated Concrete

Ice

WAL B A A

Due to time constraints, the cement may have to be added
to the tramnsit mixer at the project site usging Division
personnel. Please state any additional charges as

follows:
1) Cement provided and transported to
project site by Vendor § /cY
2) Cement provided by Vendor and transported
from Vendor's plant to project site by
Division $ /c

Penalty Charge for unloading time
in excess of ten {10} minutes per cubic

yard.

Plant Location

g per truck’

32
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DISTRICT ADDRESSES
District One District Six
1334 Smith Street 1 DOT Drive

Charleston, West Virginia 25301-1492

District Two
801 Madison Avenue
Huntington, West Virginia 25712-0880

District Three
624 Depot Street
Parkersburg, West Virginia 26102-0308

District Four
I-79 & Meadowbrook Road
Clarksburg, West Virginia 26302-2570

District Five

US Route 50

Post Office Box 99

Burlington, West Virginia 26710-0099

Moundsville, West Virginia 26041-1605

District Seven
255 Depot Street
Weston, West Virginia 26452-1228

District Eight
US 219 North
Elkins, West Virginia 26241-1516

District Nine
103 1/2 Church Street
Lewisburg, West Virginia 24901

District Ten
270 Hardwood Lane
Princeton, West Virginia 24740-2737

bkl
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RFQ No. 66800017

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
Purchasing Division

PURCHASING AFFIDAVIT

West Virginia Code §5A-3-10a states: No contract or renewal of any contract may be awarded by the state or
any of its political subdivisions to any vendor or prospective vendor when the vendor or prospective vendor or
a related party to the vendor or prospective vendor is a debtor and the debt owned is an amount greater than
one thousand dollars in the aggregate

DEFINITIONS: 7

“Debt” means any assessment, premium, penalty, fine, tax or other amount of money owed to the state or any
of its poiitical subdivisions because of a judgment, fine, permit violation, license assessment, defaulied
workers' compensation premium, penalty or other assessment presently delinquent or due and required to be
paid to the state or any of its political subdivisions, including any interest or additional penafties accrued
thereon. '

“Debtor” means any individual, corporation, partnership, association, limited liability company or any other form
or business association owing a debt to the state or any of its political subdivisions. “Political subdivision”
means any county commission; municipality; county board of education; any instrumentaiity established by a
county or municipality; any separate corporation or instrumentality established by one or more counties or
municipalities, as permitted by law; or any public body charged by law with the performance of a government
function or whose jurisdiction is coextensive with one or more counties or municipalities. “Related parly” means
a party, whether an individual, corporation, partnership, association, limited liability company or any other form
or business association or other entity whatsoever, related to any vendor by blood, marriage, ownership or
contract through which the party has a relationship of ownership or other interest with the vendor so that the
party will actually or by effect receive or control a portion of the benefit, profit or other consideration from
performance of a vendor contract with the party receiving an amount that meets or exceed five percent of the
total contract amount.

EXCEPTION: The prohibition of this section does not apply where a vendor has contested any tax
administered pursuant to chapter eleven of this code, workers' compensation premium, permit fee or
environmental fee or assessment and the matter has not become final or where the vendor has entered into a
payment plan or agreement and the vendor is not in default of any of the provisions of such plan or agreement.

LICENSING: Vendors must be ficensed and in good standing in accordance with any and all state and local
laws and requirements by any state or local agency of West Virginia, including, but not limited to, the West
Virginia Secretary of State’s Office, the West Virginia Tax Department, West Virginia Insurance Commission,
or any other state agencies or political subdivision. Furthermore, the vendor must provide all necessary
releases to obtain information to enable the Director or spending unit to verify that the vendor is licensed and in
good standing with the above entities.

CONFIDENTIALITY: The vendor agrees that he or she will not disclose o anyone, directly or indirectly, any
such personally identifiable information or other confidential information gained from the agency, unless the
individual who is the subject of the information consents 1o the disclosure in writing or the disclosure is made
pursuant to the agency's policies, procedures and rules. Vendors should visit www.state.wv.us/
admin/purchase/privacy for the Notice of Agency Confidentiality Policies.

Under penalty of law for false swearing (West Virginia Code, §61-5-3), it is hereby certified that the vendor
acknowledges the information in this said affidavit and are in compliance with the requirements as stated.

Vendor's Name: 7L CoN Z— LC

Authorized Signature: 4{ { Q/,ZZE‘ Date: /- 7 - 2008

Purchasing Affidavit (Revised 04/15/07)
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