State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

Post Office Box 50130
Charieston, WV 25305-0130

¥709043622 35046-842-8
STANLEY INDUSTRIES INC
7 MAPLE LAKE

BRIDGEPCRT WV 26338

Request for &

Quotation

2019 Washington Street East

560

- PFONUMBER.
668C0008 1

JOHN JOHNSTON
306-5583-26402

| DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER

10/24/2007

BiD OPENING DATE: 11/13/72007

BID DPENING TIME 01:30PM
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Purchasing Division

9043622

DGEPORT WV 26330

State of West Virginia
Depariment of Administration

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

3046-842-8560
STANLEY INDUSTRIES INC
7 MAPLE LAKE

Request for =
Quotation

JOHN JOHNSTON
A46-558-2402

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

BY ORDER

VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED

NTE

10/24/2007

21D OPENING DATE:
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State of West Virginia Request for ———rowmwem-= CERAGEE
Department of Administration Quotation =
Purchasing Division 668C0008 3 r
2019 Washington Street East o p@b ESS.CORRESPONDENGE TOATIENTIOROF - =
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130 JOHN JDHNSTON
306-558-2402
¥709043622 304-842-85610

STANLEY INDUSTRIES INC

_ DIVISION DF HIGHWAYS
7 MAPLE LAKE |

VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
. BY ORDER
| BRIDGEPORT WV 26330

1072672007
EID OPENING DATE: 11/13/2007 S BID OPENING TIME

01:30PM

CRDERED FOR PELIVERY DURING THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT,
WHETHER MORE} OR L[ESS THAN THE QUANTITIES SHOWN.

ORDERING PROCEDURE: SPENDING UNIT(S) SHALL ISSUE A
WRITTEN STATE CONTRACT| ORDER (FORM NUMBER WV-39) TO N
THE VENDOR FOR COMMODITIES COVERED BY [THIS CONTRACT. -
THE ORIGINAL| COPY| OF THE WV-39 SHALL BE MAILED TD THE -
VENDOR AS AUTHORIZATION FOR SHIPMENT, A SECOND COPY ]
MAILED TO THE PURCHASING DIVISION, AND A THIRD COPY
RETAINED BY [THE SPENDING UNIT.

BANKRUPTCY: { IN THE EVENT THE VENDOR/CONTRACTOR FILES
FOR BANKRUPTCY PROTECT|ION, THIS CONTRACT IS AUTOMATI-
CALLY NULL AND VOID, AND IS TERMINATED WITHGUT FURTHER
ORDER.

SHALL SUPERSEDE ANY AND ALl SUBSEQUENT| TERMS AND
CONDITIDNS WHICH MAY APPEAR ON ANY ATTACHED PRINTED =
DOCUMENTS SUCH AS| PRICE LISTS, ORDER FIORMS, SALES
AGREEMENTS OR MAINTENANCE AGREEMENTS, (INCLUDING ANY -
ELECTRONIC MEDIUM SUCH} AS CD-ROM.

THE TERMS ANF CONDITIONS CONTAINED IN [THIS CONTRACT
E
H

REV. 04/11/2001

VENDOR PREFERENCE CERTIFICATE
CERTIFICATION AND APPLIICATIONx IS HEREBY MADE FOR
PREFERENCE IN ACCORDANCE WITH WEST VIRGINIA CODE,
SA-3-37 (DDES NOT| APPLYY TO CONSTRUCTION CONTRACTS).

A. APPLICAT|IION IS MADE FOR 2.5% PREFERENCE FOR THE
REASON CHECKED: =

( > BIDDER{ IS AN INDIVIDUAL RESIDENT| VENDOR AND

SFGNATURQ/V' %gm TELEPHONE (304)842 8560 DATE 11_09_2007
TME progident FEN  55_(0544546 ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE
WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOCR'




State of West Virginia

Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street Eas
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

*¥7090463622
STANLEY INDUSTRIES INC
7 MAPLE LAKE

BRIDGEPCRT WY 26330

Department of Administration

306-862-8560

Request for =
Quotation

R NUNMEER -
668C0008

t

JOHN JOHNSTON

304-558-2402

BY ORDER

DIVISION GF HIGHWAYS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED

10/24/2007

BID OPENING DATE: 11/13/2007

BIiD OPENING TIME

01:30PM
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REASON CHECKED:
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ON OR CORPORATION RESIDENT VENDOR
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546 ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'



State of West Virginia qu uest for = FONREEE ST
Depariment of Administration uotation

Purchasing Division 668C0008 2
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130

Charleston, WV 25305-0130 JOHN JOHNSTON
306-588-2402

110

709043622 3046-8452-8560
STANLEY INDUSTRIES INC
7 MAPLE LAKE

DIVISICN OF HIGHWAYS

VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER
BRIDGEPORT WV 26330

1072472007
BID OPENING DATE: 11/13/2007 BID OPENING TIME 01:30PM

NONRESIDENT- VENDOR WITH AN AFFILIATE OR SUBSIDIARY
WHICH MAINTAINS LTS HEADQUARTERS OR PR|INCIPAL PLACE
OF BUSINESS WITHIN WEST VIRGINIA EMPLOYING A MINIMUM
OF ONE HUNDRED STATE RESIDENTS WHO CERFTIFIES THAT, g
DURING THE L|IFE OF THE| CONTRACT, ON AVERAGE AT LEAST ”
75% OF THE EMPLOYEES OR BIDDERS'" AFFIL|IATE'S OR
SUBSIDIARY'S EMPLOYEES ARE RESIDENTS OF WEST VIRGINIA =
WHO HAVE RESIDED |IN THE STATE CONTINUGUSLY FOR THE TWOD
YEARS IMMEDIATELY PRECEDING SUBMISSION OF THIS BID.

BIDDER UNDERSTANDS IF {THE SECRETARY OF] TAX & REVENUE
DETERMINES THAT A BIDDER RECEIVING PREFERENCE HAS
FATLED TD CONTINUE TO MEET THE REQUIREMENTS FOR SUCH
PREFERENCE, (THE SECRETARY MAY ORDER THE DIRECTOR OF
PURCHASING Ti0: (JA) RESCIND THE CONTRAICT OR PURCHASE
ORDER ISSUED; OR |(B) ASSESS A PENALTY [AGAINST SUCH
BIDDER IN AN AMOUNT NOT TO EXCEED 5X OF THE BID AMOUNT
AND THAT SUCH PENALTY WILL BE PAID TO {THE CONTRACTING
AGENCY OR DEDUCTED FROM ANY UNPAID BALANCE ON THE
CONTRACT CGR PURCHASE ORDER.

i

BY SUBMISSION CF |THIS CERTIFICATE, BIDDER AGREES TO
DISCLOSE ANY] REASONABL)YY REQUESTED INFORMATION TO THE
PURCHASING DIIVISION AND AUTHORIZES THE| DEPARTMENT OF
TAX AND REVENUE T|0 DISICLOSE TO THE DIRECTOR QOF
PURCHASING APPROPRIATE| INFORMATION VER|JIFYING THAT
BIDDER HAS PAID THE REQUIRED BUSINESS [TAXES, FROVIDED
THAT SUCH INFORMATION PDOCES NOT CONTAIN THE AMOUNTS OF
TAXES PAID NOR ANY OTHER INFORMATION DEEMED BY THE TAX
COMMISSIONER; TO BE CONFIDENTIAL.

UNDER PENALTYY OF {LAW FOR FALSE SWEARING (WEST VIRGINIA

CODE 61-5-3)|, BIDDER HEREBY CERTIFIES [THAT THIS -
CERTIFICATE |IS TRUE AND ACCURATE IN AL|L RESPECTS; AND =
THAT IF A CONTRACT IS ISSUED TO BIDDER| AND IF ANYTHING T
CONTAINED WITHIN |[THIS CERTIFICATE CHANGES DURING THE

(304)842-8560 11-08-2007
ME pregident v FEN  55_0544546 ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE
WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABCOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'




State of West Virginia
Purchasing Division

Post Office Box 50130
Charlesten, WV 25305-0130

x709043622
STANLEY INDUSTRIES INC
7 MAPLE LAKE

BERIDGEPORT WV 26330

Depatiment of Administration

2019 Washington Street East

304-842-8560

Request for =

L RFO NUMBER

Quotation

668C0008

JOH

306

N JOHNSTON
—558-2402

;| DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER

18/26/2007

BiD OPENING DATE: 11/13/2087

BID

OPENING TIME

01:30PM

TERM OF THE CONTRACT,

IN EITHER "A™ OR ['B"“,

MAXIMUM 5% PREFERENCE
(REV. 12/00)

PURCHAS|ING DIIVISI
BUILDING 15

THE ENVELOPE] OR THE BI

SEALED BID

PURCHASING DIVISION IN WRITING IMMEDIA
BIDDER: -->tanley Ind
DATE:| ---1709-2007 _

‘ ¥
SIGNED:Cjk\ Lol Pyl

TITLE:
* CHECK ANY COMBINATION OF PREFERENCE

ARE ENTITLED) TO RECEIVE.

NOTICE
A SIGNED BID| MUST| BE SUBMITTED TO:

DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION

2019 WASHINGTON S[TREET,
CHARLES|TON, WV 2B305-0130

THE BID SHOULD CONTAIN THIS INFORMATIO

BIDDER WILL NOTI

OR BOTH "A™ AND
YOU MAY REQU
FOR BDTH "A"™ AND

ON

EAST

D MAY NOT BE CON

FY THE
TELY.

CONSIDERATION(S)
"B" WHICH YOU
EST UP TO THE
llBlI .
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SIDERED:

VERSE 51DE FOR TERMS AND CONDITIONS

ﬂmmw?%;w%ffal "zg%;:
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(3

04)842-8560

TME Predident

FEN  55-0544546

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'

et 1




State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Strest East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

x709043622
STANLEY INDUSTRIES INC
7 MAPLE LAKE

Request

Quotation

304-842-8560

for =

CorREErNUMBER:

668C0008

JOHN JOHNSTON
304-5658-2402

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED

BY ORDER

BRIDGEPORT WV 26330

10/2472007
BID OPENING DATE:

11/13/2007 BID OPENING TIME

BUYER: 33

RFQ. ND.: 668C0008 -
BID OPENING [DATE: 11/13/200/7 | =
BID OPENING [TIME: 1:30 PM

PLEASE PROVIDE A [FAX NUMBER IN CASE IT
TGO CONTACT YOU REGARDING YOUR BID:

(304)842-8609

IS NECESSARY

PRINT CLEARLY):
Wayne Stanley

i

xxxx%x THIS| IS THE END OF RFQ 668BCO008 xxxxxx TOTAL:

TFHEPHONE (304)842-8560 11-09-2007
Pres”ident 55-0544546 ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE
WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'

THLE




Stanley Industries,

NOTE: Vendors should type Bidding Schedule

12. BIDDING SCHEDULE

12.1 Bidding F.O.B. Vendor’s Storage Site

a)

b)

Con-
Tract
item

SOURCE OF MATERIAL (State all sources for which bid prices
apply) (e.g., Quarry location if Sandstone or Limestone;
dredging or pit location if Gravel; production plant name and
location if Slag)

Limestone Quarry - US 219, 6 miles south of Thomas, WV,

1.2 miles off of US 219 on_the Sugarland: Road.

EXACT LOCATION OF VENDOR'S STORAGE SITE(S) A
separate bid schedule must be submitted when bid price varies
between Vendors storage sites.

SAME AS ABOVE

Description of
Aggregate

Re—"IOMmOOwWr»

-Class 1 Aggregate
Class 2 Aggregate
AASHTO #1 Aggregate
AASHTO #3 Aggregate
AASHTO #4 Aggregate
AASHTO #467 Aggregate
AASHTO #57 Aggregate
AASHTO #67 Aggregate
AASHTO #7 Aggregate
AASHTO #8 Aggregate
AASHTO #9 Aggregate

Bid Price Per Ton
F.0.B. Vendor's Storage Site

LIMESTONE BLAST
SANDSTONE, FURNACE STEEL
GRAVEL, SAND SLAG SLAG

$ 8.05
$ 8.30
No Eid
No Bid
$10.50

$10,.85
$10.85
No Bid
§71.30
$71.85

17

Inc.
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Stanley Industries, Inc.

BIDDING SCHEDULE (Continued)

121

c «-vapuvo=Zz=2r

Bidding F.0.B. Vendor's Storage Site (Continued)

Stone for Gabions $10.80
Fine Aggregate No Bid
Standard Abrasives $11.30
Modified Abrasives $11.30
Riprap $13.40
Shot Rock $10.80
AASHTO #8 Modified $11.30
AASHTO #9 Modified $11.45
Pea Gravel No Bid
Haul by Vendor (Except tems Q and P):
@_$% 1.60 $ for First Ton-Mile
@_3% 0.21 $ for Each Additional Ton Mile

Haul by Vendor (Items Q and/or P):
$ 3.70 $ for First Ton-Mile
@_% 0.42 $ for Each Additional Ton-Mile

e




12. BIDDING SCHEDULE

12.2 Bidding F.O.B. Division's Storage Site (Continued)

DISTRICT EIGHT

Stanley Industries, Inc.

_ Estimated Location of Bid Price ($/Ton) F.O.B.
Contract  Description Quantity DOH DOH Storage Site
ltem of Aggregate {TONS) Storage Site
LIMESTONE BLAST
RANDOLPH COUNTY SANDSTONE FURNACE | STEEL
: GRAVEL, SAND SLAG SLAG
A Class 1 1500 Pickens
B Class 2 1500 Pickens
H No. 67 1000 Pickens
J No. 8 1800 Pickens
RANDOLPH COUNTY
A Class 1 1000 Elkins
B Class 2 1000 Elkins
H No. 67 500 Elkins
J No. 8 3500 Elkins
K No. 9 5000 Elkins
RANDOLPH COLINTY
A Class 1 100 Harman
B Class 2 1000 Harman
H No. 67 500 Harman
J No. 8 4000 Harman
RANDOLPH COUNTY
A Class 1 1000 Valley Head
B Class 2 1000 Valley Head
H No. 67 1000 Valley Head
J No. 8 3500 Valley Head
TUCKER COUNTY
A Class 1 2000 . Parsons $11.35
B Class 2 4000 Parsons $11.60 .
J No. 8 6000 Parsons $15.00
K No. 9 1200 Parsons $15.50

6@
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Stanley Industries, Inc.

12. BIDDING SCHEDULE DISTRICT EIGHT

12.2 Bidding F.Q.B. Division's Storage Site (Continued)

Estimated Location of Bid Price ($/Ton) F.O.B.

Contract  Description Quantity DOH DOH Storage Site
ltem = of Aggregate (TONS) Storage Site
LIMESTONE BLAST
TUCKER COUNTY SANDSTONE FURNACE | STEEL
GRAVEL, SAND SLAG SLAG
A Class 1 1300 Thomas $10.95
B Class2 1500 Thomas $T1.20
J No. 8 6000 Thomas $14.50
TUCKER COUNTY

J No.8 2500 Canaan Valley Pk. | $16.70 | ]
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RFQ No. ___66800008

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
Purchasing Division

PURCHASING AFFIDAVIT

West Virginia Code §6A-3-10a states: No contract or renewal of any contract may be awarded by the state or
any of its political subdivisions to any vendor or prospective vendor when the vendor or prospective vendor or
a related party to the vendor or prospective vendor is a debtor and the debt owed is an amount greater than
one thousand dollars in the aggregate

DEFINITIONS:

“Debt” means any assessment, premium, penally, fine, tax or other amount of money owed to the state or any
of its political subdivisions because of a judgment, fine, permit violation, license assessment, defaulted
workers’ compensation premium, penalty or other assessment presently delinquent or due and required to be
paid to the state or any of its political subdivisions, including any interest or additional penalties accrued
thereon.

“Debtor” means any individual, corporation, partnership, association, {imited liability company or any other form
or business association owing a debt to the state or any of its political subdivisions. “Political subdivision”
means any county commission; municipality; county board of education; any instrumentality established by a
county or municipality; any separate corporation or instrumentality established by one or more counties or
municipalities, as permitted by law; or any public body charged by law with the performance of a government
function or whose jurisdiction is coextensive with ane or more counties or municipalities. “Related party” means
a party, whether an individual, corporation, parinership, association, limited liability company or any other form
or business association or other entity whatsoever, related to any vendor by blood, marriage, ownership or
contract through which the party has a relationship of ownership or other interest with the vendor so that the
party will actually or by effect receive or control a portion of the benefit, profit or other consideration from
performance of a vendor contract with the pariy receiving an amount that meets or exceed five percent of the
fotal contract amount.

EXCEPTION: The prohibition of this section does not apply where a vendor has contested any tax
administered pursuant to chapter eleven of this code, workers’ compensation premium, permit fee or
environmental fee or assessment and the matter has not become final or where the vendor has entered into a
payment plan or agreement and the vendor is not in default of any of the provisions of such plan or agreement.

LICENSING: Vendors must be licensed and in good standing in accordance with any and all state and local
laws and requirements by any state or local agency of West Virginia, including, but not limited to, the West
Virginia Secretary of State’'s Office, the West Virginia Tax Department, West Virginia Insurance Commission,
or any other state agencies or political subdivision. Furthermore, the vendor must provide all necessary
releases to obtain information to enable the Director or spending unit to verify that the vendor is licensed and in
good standing with the above entities.

CONFIDENTIALITY: The vendor agrees that he or she will not disclose to anyone, directly or indirectly, any
such personally identifiable information or other confidential information gained from the agency, unless the
individual who is the subject of the information consents to the disclosure in writing or the disclosure is made
pursuant to the agency’s policies, procedures and rules. Vendors should visit www.state.wv.us/admin/
purchase/privacy for the Notice of Agency Confidentiality Policies.

Under penalty of law for false swearing (West Virginia Code, §61-5-3), it is hereby certified that the vendor
acknowiedges the information in this said affidavit and are in compliance with the requirements as stated.

Vendor's Name: _Stanley Industries . Ing.

Authorized Signature:%f;,mﬂ %% Date: 11/09/07

"

Purchasing Affidavit (Revised 06/15/07)




