

State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

## Request for Quotation

Ţ

667C0033

P	AGE	
		1

ADDRESS CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTENTION OF:

JOHN JOHNSTON 304-558-2402

>ENDOR

\*424153422 303-431-7333 APPLEWOOD SEED COMPANY 5380 VIVIAN STREET

ARVADA CO. 80002

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED BY ORDER

07/09 BID OPENING DATE		08/01/	2007		חזמ		PENING TIME O	1:30PM
LINE	en <b>f</b> usióskiápsolábolálások:	UO/UI/ NTITY	UOP	CAT. NO.	ITEM NUMBER	UF	UNITPRICE	AMOUNT
0001	WILDFL	1 OWER S	LS EEDS		790-20			
		S AND		OWER	END CONTRACT SEEDS PACKAGED A D MIX PACKAGED 1			Section (Section)
	EXHIBI	Т 3		SE	E ATTACHED	RIPOCAL APPLICATION OF THE PROPERTY OF THE PRO		Section and the section and th
·	YEAR ONECESSORIGIN	R UNTI ARY TO AL CON CEED T THE VE UPON	L SUC OBTA TRACT WELVE NDOR GIVIN	AN H "RE IN A . TH (12) MAY T	IS CONTRACT BECO D EXTENDS FOR A ASONABLE TIME" T NEW CONTRACT OR E "REASONABLE TI MONTHS. DURING ERMINATE THIS CO DIRECTOR OF PUR	PE HE RE ME T	RIOD OF ONE (1 REAFTER AS IS NEW THE " PERIOD SHALL HIS "REASONABLI RACT FOR ANY	W.Y.
	IN THI	S CONT G SET	RACT	DOCUM	IONS ARE STIPULA ENT, THE TERMS, FIRM FOR THE LI	CO	NDITIONS AND	
	WRITTE SUBMIT DAYS P	N CONS TED TO RIOR T	ENT O THE O THE	F THE DIREC EXPI WITH	THE TERMS AND CO	ND IG ICH IND	VENDOR, THIRTY (30) RENEWAL SHALL ITIONS OF THE	PURCHASING DIVISION STATE OF WV
SIGNATURE () (i)	No 111:0	) A <del>o</del> n		SEE REV	/ERSE SIDE FOR TERMS AND CO			7/27/2007
IIILE Bid Manager FEIN 84-067190							TOWN THE TOW	TO BE NOTED ABOVE

### GENERAL TERMS & CONDITIONS REQUEST FOR QUOTATION (RFQ) AND REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL (RFP)

- 1. Awards will be made in the best interest of the State of West Virginia.
- 2. The State may accept or reject in part, or in whole, any bid.
- 3. All quotations are governed by the West Virginia Code and the Legislative Rules of the Purchasing Division.
- 4. Prior to any award, the apparent successful vendor must be properly registered with the Purchasing Division and have paid the required \$125.00 registration fee.
- 5. All services performed or goods delivered under State Purchase Orders/Contracts are to be continued for the term of the Purchase Order/Contract, contingent upon funds being appropriated by the Legislature or otherwise being made available. In the event funds are not appropriated or otherwise available for these services or goods, this Purchase Order/Contract becomes void and of no effect after June 30.
- 6. Payment may only be made after the delivery and acceptance of goods or services.
- Interest may be paid for late payment in accordance with the West Virginia Code.
- 8. Vendor preference will be granted upon written request in accordance with the West Virginia Code.
- The State of West Virginia is exempt from federal and state taxes and will not pay or reimburse such taxes.
- 10. The Director of Purchasing may cancel any Purchase Order/Contract upon 30 days written notice to the seller.
- 11. The laws of the State of West Virginia and the *Legislative Rules* of the Purchasing Division shall govern all rights and duties under the Contract, including without limitation the validity of this Purchase Order/Contract.
- 12. Any reference to automatic renewal is hereby deleted. The Contract may be renewed only upon mutual written agreement of the parties.
- 13. BANKRUPTCY: In the event the vendor/contractor files for bankruptcy protection, this contract is automatically null and void, and is terminated without further order.
- 14. HIPAA Business Associate Addendum The West Viginia State Government HIPAA Business Associate Addendum (BAA), approved by the Attorney General, and available online at the Purchasing Division's web site (http://www.state.wv.us/admin/purchase/vrc/hipaa.htm) is hereby made part of the agreement. Provided that, the Agency meets the definition of a Covered Entity (45 CFR §160.103) and will be disclosing Protected Health Information (45 CFR §160.103) to the vendor.

#### **INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS**

- 1. Use the quotation forms provided by the Purchasing Division.
- 2. SPECIFICATIONS: Items offered must be in compliance with the specifications. Any deviation from the specifications must be clearly indicated by the bidder. Alternates offered by the bidder as EQUAL to the specifications must be clearly defined. A bidder offering an alternate should attach complete specifications and literature to the bid. The Purchasing Division may waive minor deviations to specifications.
- 3. Complete all sections of the quotation form.
- 4. Unit prices shall prevail in cases of discrepancy.
- All quotations are considered F.O.B. destination unless alternate shipping terms are clearly identified in the quotation.
- 6. BID SUBMISSION: All quotations must be delivered by the bidder to the office listed below prior to the date and time of the bid opening. Failure of the bidder to deliver the quotations on time will result in bid disqualifications.

#### SIGNED BID TO:

Department of Administration Purchasing Division 2019 Washington Street East Post Office Box 50130 Charleston, WV 25305-0130



HODONE

State of West Virginia Department of Administration Purchasing Division 2019 Washington Street East Post Office Box 50130 Charleston, WV 25305-0130

#### Request for Quotation

SHIP

T

RFQ NUMBER 667C0033 PAGE

ADDRESS CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTENTION OF:

JOHN JOHNSTON 304-558-2402

\*424153422 303-431-7333 APPLEWOOD SEED COMPANY 5380 VIVIAN STREET

ARVADA CO 80002 DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED BY ORDER

DATE PRINTED TERMS OF SALE SHIP VIA **FREIGHT TERMS** FOB. 07/09/2007 BID OPENING DATE: 08/01/2007 **BID OPENING TIME** 01:30PM CAT LINE QUANTITY LIOP ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE AMOUNT ORIGINAL CONTRACT AND SHALL BE LIMITED TO TWO (2) ONE (1) YEAR PERIODS. CANCELLATION: THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING RESERVES THE RIGHT TO CANCEL THIS CONTRACT IMMEDIATELY UPON WRITTEN NOTICE TO THE VENDOR IF THE COMMODITIES AND/OR SERVICE SUPPLIED ARE OF AN INFERIOR QUALITY OR DO NOT CONFORM TO THE SPECIFICATIONS OF THE BID AND CONTRACT HEREIN. OPEN MARKET CLAUSE: THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING MAY AUTHORIZE A SPENDING UNIT TO PURCHASE ON THE OPEN MARKET, WITHOUT THE FILING OF A REQUISITION OR COST ESTIMATE, ITEMS SPECIFIED ON THIS CONTRACT FOR IMMEDIATE DELIVERY IN EMERGENCIES DUE TO UNFORESEEN CAUSES (INCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED TO DELAYS IN TRANS-PORTATION OR AN UNANTICIPATED INCREASE IN THE VOLUME OF WORK.) QUANTITIES: QUANTITIES LISTED IN THE REQUISITION ARE APPROXIMATIONS ONLY, BASED ON ESTIMATES SUPPLIED BY THE STATE SPENDING UNIT. IT IS UNDERSTOOD AND AGREED THAT THE CONTRACT SHALL COVER THE QUANTITIES ACTUALLY ORDERED FOR DELIVERY DURING THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT. WHETHER MORE OR LESS THAN THE QUANTITIES SHOWN. ORDERING PROCEDURE: SPENDING UNIT(S) SHALL ISSUE A WRITTEN STATE CONTRACT ORDER (FORM NUMBER WV-39) TO THE VENDOR FOR COMMODITIES COVERED BY THIS CONTRACT. THE ORIGINAL COPY OF THE WV-39 SHALL BE MAILED TO THE VENDOR AS AUTHORIZATION FOR SHIPMENT, A SECOND COPY MAILED TO THE PURCHASING DIVISION, AND A THIRD COPY RETAINED BY THE SPENDING UNIT. BANKRUPTCY: IN THE EVENT THE VENDOR/CONTRACTOR FILES FOR BANKRUPTCY PROTECTION, THIS CONTRACT IS AUTOMATI-CALLY NULL AND VOID, AND IS TERMINATED WITHOUT FURTHER ORDER. SEE REVERSE SIDE FOR TERMS AND CONDITIONS TELEPHONE (303) 431-7333 SIGNATURE 7/27/07 Bid Manager 84-0671900 ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE



\*424153422

APPLEWOOD SEED COMPANY

5380 VIVIAN STREET

State of West Virginia Department of Administration Purchasing Division 2019 Washington Street East Post Office Box 50130 Charleston, WV 25305-0130

303-431-7333

#### Request for Quotation

667C0033

RFQ NUMBER

JOHN JOHNSTON 304-558-2402

T

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED BY ORDER

ADDRESS CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTENTION OF

EXDOR ARVADA CO 80002 FREIGHT TERMS DATE PRINTED TERMS OF SALE SHIP VIA F.O.B. 07/09/2007 BID OPENING DATE: 08/01/2007 BID OPENING TIME 01:30PM CAT. QUANTITY UOP ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE AMOUNT LINE THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS CONTAINED IN THIS CONTRACT SHALL SUPERSEDE ANY AND ALL SUBSEQUENT TERMS AND CONDITIONS WHICH MAY APPEAR ON ANY ATTACHED PRINTED DOCUMENTS SUCH AS PRICE LISTS, ORDER FORMS, SALES AGREEMENTS OR MAINTENANCE AGREEMENTS, INCLUDING ANY ELECTRONIC MEDIUM SUCH AS CD-ROM. REV. 04/11/2001 PURCHASING CARD ACCEPTANCE: THE STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA CURRENTLY UTILIZES A VISA PURCHASING CARD PROGRAM WHIC IS ISSUED THROUGH A BANK. THE SUCCESSFUL VENDOR MUST ACCEPT THE STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA VISA PURCHASING CARD FOR PAYMENT OF ALL ORDERS PLACED BY ANY STATE AGENCY FOR ORDERS THAT ARE LESS THAN \$2,500 AS A CONDI-TION OF AWARD. VENDOR PREFERENCE CERTIFICATE CERTIFICATION AND APPLICATION\* IS HEREBY MADE FOR PREFERENCE IN ACCORDANCE WITH WEST VIRGINIA CODE, 5A-3-37 (DOES NOT APPLY TO CONSTRUCTION CONTRACTS).

APPLICATION IS MADE FOR 2.5% PREFERENCE FOR THE REASON CHECKED: BIDDER IS AN INDIVIDUAL RESIDENT VENDOR AND HAS RESIDED CONTINUOUSLY IN WEST VIRGINIA FOR FOUR (4) YEARS IMMEDIATELY PRECEDING THE DATE OF THIS CERTIFICATION; OR BIDDER IS A PARTNERSHIP, ASSOCIATION OR CORPORA-TION RESIDENT VENDOR AND HAS MAINTAINED ITS HEAD-QUARTERS OR PRINCIPAL PLACE OF BUSINESS CONTINUOUSLY I SEE REVERSE SIDE FOR TERMS AND CONDITIONS DATE

TELEPHONE

SIGNATURE TITLE

FEIN

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE



State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

#### Request for Quotation

RFQ NUMBER

667C0033

ADDRESS CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTENTION OF:

JOHN JOHNSTON 304-558-2402

**\***424153422 303-431-7333 APPLEWOOD SEED COMPANY 5380 VIVIAN STREET ARVADA CO 80002

Ţ

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED BY ORDER

07/09/		1-1	IMS OF SAL	.C	SHIP VIA			F.O.B.	FREIGHT TERMS
BID OPENING DATE:		08/01/	2007		<u> </u>	BID	0P	ENING TIME O	1:30PM
LINE	QUAN	¥ΤΙΤΥ	UOP	CAT.	ITEM NUME	ER.		UNIT PRICE	AMOUNT
				,,,,					
	WEST V	TRCTNT	V EUB	EUNB	(6) VEADS	TMMED	TΛ	TELY PRECEDING	
								F THE OWNERSHI	
					HELD BY AN				<b>'</b>
	PARTNE	RSHIP,	ASSO	CIATI	ON OR CORP	ORATIO	N	RESIDENT VENDO	
								RINCIPAL PLACE	
								A FOR FOUR (4)	·
	1				EDING THE	DATE O	F	THIS	
	CERTIF	ICALIU	N; UK						
	( )	BIDDER	TS A	CORP	ORATION NO	NRESTO	FN.	T VENDOR	
								CH EMPLOYS	
								AND WHICH	
								PAL PLACE OF	
	Į.							LY FOR THE	
	•			MEDIA	TELY PRECE	DING T	HE	DATE OF THIS	
	CERTIF	ICAIIU	N.						
	B. API	PLICAT	TON T	C MAD	F FOR 2.5%	PREE	RFI	NCE FOR THE	
	REASON			·	- 10K E.5%	, ,,,,		NOL TOK THE	
								·	
								RTIFIES THAT,	,
								AGE AT LEAST	
								ECT BEING BID	·
				- 1		1		RESIDED IN	
					FUR THE T		K 5	IMMEDIATELY	
	OR	1110 30	BI1133	TOK U	. 11113 DID	,			
		BIDDER	IS A	NONR	ESIDENT VE	NDOR E	MPI	LOYING A	
	MINIMU	M OF O	NE HU	NDRED	STATE RES	IDENTS	OF	RISA	
								SUBSIDIARY	
	WHICH N	ATNIAM	INS I	TS HE	ADQUARTERS	OR PR	INC	CIPAL PLACE	
	OF BUS:	INESS	WITHI	N WES	T VIRGINIA	EMPLO	IY TT	NG A MINIMUM	
					ESIDENTS W			-IES THAT, AGE AT LEAST	
					R BIDDERS'				
								WEST VIRGINIA	
IGNATURE (7)	-	·7)		SEE REV	ERSE SIDE FOR TER				
- ().la	ne Wh	loon				(303)43	31-	7333 DATE	7/27/07
Bid Mana	ger	FE	IN 84-	-067190	00			ADDRESS CHANGES	S TO BE NOTED ABOVE



VEZDOR

State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130 Charleston, WV 25305-0130

## Request for Quotation

667C0033

JOHN JOHNSTON 304-558-2402

þ

Ţ

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED BY ORDER

\*424153422 303-431-7333 APPLEWOOD SEED COMPANY 5380 VIVIAN STREET

ARVADA CO 80002

DATEPRIN	Eυ		MS OF SAL		SHIPV	A	F,O,B	FREIGHT LERMS
07/09/	2007	,			, and the second			
BID OPENING DATE:		08/01/	2007			P T D	OPENING TIME (	1:30PM
	na series e construir	00/01/	<u> </u>			. BIU	OLENTAG ITHE A	PICE SUPPLEMENTAL CONTROL OF THE PROPERTY OF T
LINE	QUAN	ITITY	UOP	CAT. NO.	ITEM NUN	BER	UNIT PRICE	AMOUNT
		ue beo	***	T. 11 2711	- 01475 0		NOLY EDD THE TH	<u>,                                     </u>
							USLY FOR THE TWO	<b>」</b>
	YEARS	IMMEDI	ATELY	PREC	EDING SUB	MISSION	OF THIS BID.	ļ .
			0 T A V D		THE ASADS	TABY 65	T43/ 0 001/03/11/0	
				1		I	TAX & REVENUE	
•	DETERM	INES T	HAT A	BIDD	ER RECEIV	ING PRE	FERENCE HAS	
	FATIFD	TO CO	NTTNII	F TO	MEET THE	REQUIRE	MENTS FOR SUCH	
							E DIRECTOR OF	
į	PURCHA	SING T	0: (	A) RE	SCIND THE	CONTRA	CT OR PURCHASE	
	ORDER	ISSUED	: OR	(B) A	SSESS A PI	ENALTY	AGAINST SUCH	
			- 1			,	F THE BID AMOUN	r
								·
							THE CONTRACTING	
	AGENCY	OR DE	DUCTE	D FRO	M ANY UNP	AID BAL	ANCE ON THE	
	CONTRA	CT OR	PURCH	ASE D	RDFR.			
		J. J.						
						[		
							DER AGREES TO	
!	DISCLO	SE ANY	REAS	ONABL	Y REQUEST	ED INFO	RMATION TO THE	
	PHRCHA	STNE D	TVISI	ΠΝ ΔΝ	D AUTHORT	ZES THE	DEPARTMENT OF	
					CLOSE TO	1		
						L L		į į
	PURCHA	SING A	PPROP	RIATE	INFORMAT	ION VER	IFYING THAT	
	BIDDER	HAS P	AID T	HE RE	QUIRED BU	SINESS	TAXES, PROVIDED	'
							THE AMOUNTS OF	
		1	- 1			L		
							EEMED BY THE TAX	
	COMMIS	SIONER	TO B	E CON	FIDENTIAL	•		
		i				-		
	KNDED	BENALT	V NE	I AW E	OD EALCE	SHEADTH	G (WEST VIRGINIA	
								<b>1</b>
		1		,	EREBY CER			
	CERTIF	ICATE	IS TR	UE AN	D ACCURATI	E IN AL	L RESPECTS; AND	
•	THAT T	F A CO	NTRAC	T IS	ISSUED TO	BIDDER	AND IF ANYTHING	.
	l.						GES DURING THE	
		- 1	1				•	
		1			BIDDER WI			
	PURCHA	SING D	IVISI	ON IN	WRITING	IMMEDIA	TELY.	
						1	A	[
•					/ i	_	1 < - 2 1 0-	1
				,	- ADDIT	(Waal	N Deed W.	
				RIDDE	K: 4-44,		d Seed Co.	· <b>-</b>
					· v	1		
						İ		
				SEE RE	ERSE SIDE FOR TE	RMS AND CON	IDITIONS	
IGNATURE			<u> </u>			relephone	DATE	<u> </u>
TLE		FE	IN		,		ADDRESS CHANG	ES TO BE NOTED ABOVE



VENDOR

State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division 2019 Washington Street East Post Office Box 50130 Charleston, WV 25305-0130

# Request for Quotation

RFQ NUMBER 667C0033 PAGE

ADDRESS CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTENTION OF: ЈОНИ ЈОНИЅТОИ 304-558-2402

F.O.B.

SHIP Ţ

SHIP VIA

**\*424153422** 303-431-7333 APPLEWOOD SEED COMPANY 5380 VIVIAN STREET

ARVADA CO 80002 DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED BY ORDER

07/09/2007					-						
BID OPENING DATE:		08/01/	2007			BID	OPENING	TIME 0	1:30PM		
LINE	QUAI	YTITY	UOP	CAT NO.	ITEM NUM	/BER	UNIT	PRICE	AMOUNT		
				DATE:	July 27	, 2007 - ue	Wils	<u></u>			
				SIGHE	Diane N Bid Man						
				TITLE	:						
	IN EIT ARE EN	HER "A TITLED M 5% P	" OR TO R	"B", ECEIV	N OF PREF OR BOTH " E. YOU M FOR BOTH	A" AND AY REQU	"B" WHIC	H YOU			
	:			NOT	ICE		•				
	A SIGN	ED BID	MUST	BE S	UBMITTED	TO:					
	P B 2	URCHAS UILDIN 019 WA	ING D G 15 SHING	IVISI TON S	INISTRATI ON TREET, EA 5305-0130						
	1	VELOPE	1 1		THIS INF D MAY NOT			FACE OF			
	BUYER:				33						
	RFQ. N	0.:			667C0						
CIONATION O		/)		SEE RE	VERSE SIDE FOR T		NDITIONS	in a second			
SIGNATURE VIOL	o While	00-				TELEPHONE (30	<b>3)</b> 431 <b>-</b> 7333	DATE	7/27/07		
TITLE Bid Mana	ger	FE	<sup>≅N</sup> 84−	-067190	00		ADD	RESS CHANGE	S TO BE NOTED ABOVE		
		ONDING:	TO DEO	INICED	T NIANAT AND	A DODECC :	IN COACE A	OVE LADEI	ED WENDOR		



VEZDOR

DATE PRINTED

State of West Virginia Department of Administration Purchasing Division 2019 Washington Street East Post Office Box 50130 Charleston, WV 25305-0130

# Request for Quotation

SHIP

Ğ

SHIP VIA

RFQ NUMBER 667C0033

F.O.B

:		•			:	ļ		•	į	١	ţ		ì	ŀ	
				•											

FREIGHT TERMS

JOHN JOHNSTON 304-558-2402

ADDRESS CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTENTION OF

\*424153422 303-431-7333 APPLEWOOD SEED COMPANY 5380 VIVIAN STREET

ARVADA CO 80002

TERMS OF SALE

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED BY ORDER

07/09/2007									
BID OPENING DATE:	0.1	3/01/	2007		BID C		OPENING TIME	1:30PM	
LINE	QUANTI	TY	UOP	CAT. NO.	ITEM NU	MBER	UNIT PRICE	AMOUNT	
	BID OPE	NING	DATE	•	IME				
				GARDI	umber in ng your e 467-78	ID:	IS NECESSARY		
	CONTACT	PERS			PRINT CL				
	****	THIS	IS T	HE EN	D OF RFQ	667C0	033 ***** TOTA	L:	
SIGNATURE				SEE RE	VERSE SIDE FOR T	ERMS AND COI	NDITIONS DAT	E	
<u> </u>		. 1,				L		·	
TITLE .		FE		WOED	TALANCE AND	1000000	ADDRESS CHANG	ES TO BE NOTED ABOVE	

#### **SPECIFICATIONS**

Seed must be United States origin

Successful vendor must provide proof of origin.

Quantities are for pure live seed.

No substitutions of species will be accepted.

Minimum 85% germination

Minimum 99% purity

Proof of germination and purity must be attached to each bag of seed.

All seed shipped must meet West Virginia Chapter 19, Article 16, Section 2, labeling requirements. All seed shall be tested by a certified seed laboratory with certified results submitted to the purchaser in writing at the time of delivery.

The state of West Virginia will randomly test seed for purity and germination.

Shipping must be FOB Destination.

#### **CONTRACT AWARD**

Qualified Vendors who submit a valid low bid may be awarded a contract for those items for which their bid is low.

Low bid will be determined for each individual item.

The State of West Virginia reserves the right to make awards on this contract that are in the best interest of the State.

#### ACCEPTANCE PLAN

With each delivery of wildflowers to the Division, the vendor will certify that the products so delivered do conform to the materials specifications.

Material failing to comply with the quality requirement will not be accepted.

### **BID QUANTITIES**

Vendor should base quotation on estimated pure live seed (PLS) quantities as follows:

Item-1	300 pounds (PLS)
Item-2	400 pounds (PLS)
Item-3	400 pounds (PLS)
Item-4	200 pounds (PLS)
Item-5	700 pounds (PLS)
Item-6	100 pounds (PLS)
Item-7	50 pounds (PLS)

Vendors are cautioned that the above quantities are estimates only. Actual orders will be for the required needs of the Division of Highways.

## WILDFLOWER CONTRACT INDIVIDUAL SPECIES

Item-1	Drummond Phlox Phlox Drummondii Our suggested minimum puri for all items is 98.00%.	tу
	Provided in 8lb. bags  Phlox and Lupine should ha	
	Purity% Germination% a minimum germination of 8	:0%.
	Bid Price \$ No bid per pound (PLS)	
Item-2	Scarlet Flax Linum Vubrum	
	Provided in 8lb. bags	
·	Purity % Germination %	
	Bid Price \$ No bid per pound (PLS)	
Item-3	Zinnia/luminosa pink Zinnia elegans	
	Provided in 10lb. bags	
	Purity % Germination %	
	Bid Price \$ No Bid per pound (PLS)	
Item-4	Golden Lupine Lupinus densiflorus	
	Provided in 10lb. bags	
	Purity % Germination %	
	Bid Price \$No_Bid per pound (PLS)	
Item-5	Rocket Lockspur Delphiniums Ajacis	
	Provided in 10lb. bags	
	Purity 99.99 % Germination 96 %	
	Bid Price \$ 13.95 per pound (PLS)	

#### WILDFLOWER CONTRACT CUSTOM MIX #1

PACKAGED IN 5 POUND BAGS										
Item-6	% by Weight	% by Seed	Genus & Species							
	35.00	17.0%	Calendula officinalis/Calendula							
	Purity%	Germination_	%							
	30.00	22.7%	Centaurea cyanus/Dwarf Cornflower							
	Purity%	Germination_	%							
	30.00	13.6%	Cosmos bipinnatus/Cosmos							
	Purity%	Germination_	%							
	5.00	46.7%	Tinctoria Coreopsis, Plains Coreopsis							
	Purity%	Germination_	%							
	Bid Price \$ No Bid		Your purity and germination requirements are too high. A more appropriate purity for a mix is 98.00% and an appropriate germ. would be 75%.							
		CUSTOM MIX	#2							
	P	ACKAGED IN 6.5 POU	IND BAGS							
Item-7	% by Weight	% by Seed	Genus & Species							

Item-7	% by Weight	% by Seed	Genus & Species
	30.00	3.4%	Centaurea cyanus/Dwarf Cornflower
	Purity%	Germination_	%
	20.00	27.7%	Tinctoria Coreopsis/Plains Coreopsis
	Purity%	Germination_	%

### CUSTOM MIX #2 (CONT'D)

### PACKAGED IN 6.5 POUND BAGS

35.00	2.3	3%	Sulphureaus Cosmos/Sulphu	ır Cosmos
Purity	%	Germination_		
15.00	66.	.6%	Silene armeria/Catchfly	
Purity	%	Germination_	<u></u> %	
Bid Price \$ N	o bid1	per pound (PLS)		
and the second s		- 1	requirements are too	ination.

#### **DISTRICT ADDRESSES**

District One 1334 Smith Street

Charleston, West Virginia 25301-1492

District Six 1 DOT Drive

Moundsville, West Virginia 26041-1605

District Two 801 Madison Avenue Huntington, West Virginia 25712-0880 District Seven
255 Depot Street

Weston, West Virginia 26452-1228

District Three 624 Depot Street Parkersburg, West Virginia 26102-0308 District Eight US 219 North

Elkins, West Virginia 26241-1516

District Four I-79 & Meadowbrook Road Clarksburg, West Virginia 26302-2570 District Nine 103 1/2 Church Street Lewisburg, West Virginia 24901

District Five US Route 50 Post Office Box 99 Burlington, West Virginia 26710-0099 District Ten 270 Hardwood Lane Princeton, West Virginia 24740-2737

## STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA Purchasing Division

### **PURCHASING AFFIDAVIT**

West Virginia Code §5A-3-10a states: No contract or renewal of any contract may be awarded by the state or any of its political subdivisions to any vendor or prospective vendor when the vendor or prospective vendor or a related party to the vendor or prospective vendor is a debtor and the debt owned is an amount greater than one thousand dollars in the aggregate

#### **DEFINITIONS:**

"Debt" means any assessment, premium, penalty, fine, tax or other amount of money owed to the state or any of its political subdivisions because of a judgment, fine, permit violation, license assessment, defaulted workers' compensation premium, penalty or other assessment presently delinquent or due and required to be paid to the state or any of its political subdivisions, including any interest or additional penalties accrued thereon.

"Debtor" means any individual, corporation, partnership, association, limited liability company or any other form or business association owing a debt to the state or any of its political subdivisions. "Political subdivision" means any county commission; municipality; county board of education; any instrumentality established by a county or municipality; any separate corporation or instrumentality established by one or more counties or municipalities, as permitted by law; or any public body charged by law with the performance of a government function or whose jurisdiction is coextensive with one or more counties or municipalities. "Related party" means a party, whether an individual, corporation, partnership, association, limited liability company or any other form or business association or other entity whatsoever, related to any vendor by blood, marriage, ownership or contract through which the party has a relationship of ownership or other interest with the vendor so that the party will actually or by effect receive or control a portion of the benefit, profit or other consideration from performance of a vendor contract with the party receiving an amount that meets or exceed five percent of the total contract amount.

**EXCEPTION:** The prohibition of this section does not apply where a vendor has contested any tax administered pursuant to chapter eleven of this code, workers' compensation premium, permit fee or environmental fee or assessment and the matter has not become final or where the vendor has entered into a payment plan or agreement and the vendor is not in default of any of the provisions of such plan or agreement.

**LICENSING:** Vendors must be licensed and in good standing in accordance with any and all state and local laws and requirements by any state or local agency of West Virginia, including, but not limited to, the West Virginia Secretary of State's Office, the West Virginia Tax Department, West Virginia Insurance Commission, or any other state agencies or political subdivision. Furthermore, the vendor must provide all necessary releases to obtain information to enable the Director or spending unit to verify that the vendor is licensed and in good standing with the above entities.

**CONFIDENTIALITY:** The vendor agrees that he or she will not disclose to anyone, directly or indirectly, any such personally identifiable information or other confidential information gained from the agency, unless the individual who is the subject of the information consents to the disclosure in writing or the disclosure is made pursuant to the agency's policies, procedures and rules. Vendors should visit **www.state.wv.us/admin/purchase/privacy** for the Notice of Agency Confidentiality Policies.

Under penalty of law for false swearing (West Virginia Code, §61-5-3), it is hereby certified that the vendor acknowledges the information in this said affidavit and are in compliance with the requirements as stated.

Vendor's Name:	STAPPICUODO	Deld (0)-			
Authorized Signatur	e: Nañe	Wilson	Date:	7/27/07	

Purchasing Affidavit (Revised 04/15/07)