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State of West Virginia Request for o T RFONUMBER L PABE ]

Fl?epartm_ent of Administration  Quotation PRI&024 3
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2019 Washington Street East
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CALLY NULL AND VOIID, AND IS TERMINATED| WITHOUT FURTHER
ORDER.
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P8

WYV Correctional Industries
PRI4024

WYV Correctional Industries (WVCI) hereby solicits bids for upholstery fabric for the upholstery
of seating products manufactured in our seating shop.

1.

2.

o o L

WVCI will award multiple vendor contracts in order to have a wide range of selection
and pricing.
In addition to the fabric patterns listed in this bid, Vendor shall include and bid additional
popular fabrics for the government industry. Vendor shall submit fabric samples and
specifications to WVCL.
Vendor shall provide digital images of the fabrics to WVCI for incorporation into the
WVCI web site. For marketing purposes, Vendor shall supply 500 fabric sample cards to
WVCL
All components are specified as brand name or equal. These specifications are meant to
establish a minimum quality acceptable within our anticipated price range. If a vendor is
bidding-an equal or alternate, they must submit fabric samples and specifications.
Vendor shall state any minimum order requirements.
All fabrics must pass the California 117 flammability tests.
All fabrics shall be shipped FOB Destination to:

WYV Correctional Industries
Pruntytown Correctional Center
WV Highway 250 South
Grafton, WV 26354
All deliveries must be made in a 28 or smaller trailer.

OR

WYV Correctional Industries
Denmar Correctional Center
HC 64, Box 125
Hillsboro, WV 24946

10. Price Adjustments: The vendor may request a price increase 30 days prior to the

expiration of the contract, in writing, to the Director of Purchasing. The contract price
may be adjusted in accordance with the change in the Producer Price Index (PPI) for
Product Code WPU122203, Furniture and Household Durables, Furniture). Price
adjustments will be made in accordance with the percentage change in the PPI. Tt is the
vendor’s responsibility to request this adjustment to price. Requests shall include a copy
of the relevant index and must be within the allowed time period for adjustment. Any
adjustments authorized as a result of the adjustment request will not be retroactive.

T Y Y
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SPECIFICATIONS

PATTERN SENECA

CONTENT:

WEIGHT:

STANDARD WIDTH:

REPEAT:

BACKING:

FLAME RESISTANCE:

PERFORMANCE
CHARACTERISTICS:

COLORFASTNESS TO CROCKING:

COLORFASTNESS TO LIGHT:
AATCC 16A-1974 OR AATCC
16E-1976

BRUSH PILL ASTM:

BREAKING STRENGTH
ASTM D3597-D1682-64(1975)

TEAR RESISTANCE:

SEAM SLIPPAGE:
ASTM D3597-D434-75

ABRASION:
ASTM3597 WYZENBEEK
METHOD

CLEANING CODE:

58% Cotton, 42% Polyester

12.4 ounces per linear yard

54"

H:63/4" V:21/4"

Acrylic

California Technical Bulletin 117, S:ction E

NFPA 260-1989
UFAC CLASS 1

Dry: Class 4, minimum
Wet: Class 3, minimum

Class 4, minimum at 40 hours
3 TO 4 MINIMUM

Exceeds 50 pounds Warp & Weit

Exceeds 6 pounds

30+ pounds Warp & Fill

Passes 30,000 double rubs (Heavy duty)
Cotton Duck (#10)

S- Clean with Solvent Only.

L b A

b e O R (1
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SPECIFICATIONS

PATTERN PRIVET

CONTENT:
WEIGHT:
STANDARD WIDTH:
REPEAT:

BACKING:

FLAME RESISTANCE:

PERFORMANCE
CHARACTERISTICS:

COLORFASTNESS TO CROCKING:

COLORFASTNESS TO LIGHT:
AATCC 16A-1974 OR AATCC
16E-1976

BREAKING STRENGTH
ASTM D3597-D1682-64(1975)

TEAR RESISTANCE:

SEAM SLIPPAGE:
ASTM D3597-D434-75

ABRASION:
ASTM3597 WYZENBEEK
METHOD

CLEANING CODE:

61%Acrylic, 39% Polyester

13.7 OUNCES

54"

H:2 1/4"-V:2 12"

Acrylic

California Technical Bulletin 117, Section E

NEFPA 260 1989
UFAC, Class 1

Dry: Class 5, minimum
Wet: Class 4, minimum

Class 4, minimum at 40 hours

Exceeds 50 pounds in Warp & Weft

Exceeds 6 pounds

30+ pounds - Warp & Fill

Passes 30,000 double rubs (Heavy duty)
Coftton Duck (#10)

S - Clean with Solvent only.

e b N e
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SPECIFICATIONS

PATTERN LAREDO

CONTENT:
WEIGHT:
STANDARD WIDTH:
REPEAT:

BACKING:

FLAME RESISTANCE:

PERFORMANCE
CHARACTERISTICS:

COLORFASTNESS TO CROCKING:

COLORFASTNESS TO LIGHT:
AATCC 16A-1974 OR AATCC
16E-1976

BRUSH PILL ASTM:

BREAKING STRENGTH
ASTM D3597-D1682-64(1975)

TEAR RESISTANCE:

SEAM SLIPPAGE:
ASTM D3597-D434-75

ABRASION:
ASTM3597 WYZENBEEK
METHOD

CLEANING CODE:

58% Cotton, 42% Polyester

12.4 OUNCES

54"

H:63/4"-V: 13 1/2"

Acrylic

California Technical Bﬁllet'm 117, Sectioh E

NFPA 260-1989
UFAC CLASS 1

Dry: Class 4, minimum
Wet: Class 3, minimum

Class 4, minimum at 40 hours
3 TO 4 MINIMUM
Exceeds 50 pounds Warp & Weft

Exceeds 6 pounds

30+ pounds Warp & Fill

Passes 30,000 double rubs (Heavy duty)
Cotton Duck (#10)

S- Clean with Solvent Only.

Fe I e AL
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SPECIFICATIONS

PATTERN FANTASY
- CONTENT: 58%Cotton/42% Polyester
STANDARD WIDTH: 54"
BACKING: Laytex
WEIGHT: 12.4 oz. per linear yard
REPEAT: 6-3/4"H-13.5"V
FLAME RESISTANCE:  Meets requirements of the following fire codes:

California Technical Bulletin 117, Section E
NFPA 260-1989

UFAC, Class 1
SURFACE ABRASION: 30,000 Double Rubs (#10 Cotton Duck)
ASTM-D-35%97 (Wyzenbeek) Heavy Duty
Modified :
COLORFASTNESS: - Wet: Class 3 - Minimum
AATCC-Test Method 8-1974 Dry: Class 4 - Minimum
LIGHTFASTNESS: 40 hours, Class 4
AATCC Test Method 16E
1974
BREAK STRENGTH: ' Exceeds 50 Ibs. In both Warp & Fill
ASTM D3597/D-1682-64 1975
TEAR STRENGTH: Exceeds 6 Ibs. In both Warp & Fill
SEAM SLIPPAGE: Warp -30.0+
ASTM D4034 Fill -30.0+
BRUSH PILL: 3-4 Minimum
ASTM D-3511

CLEANING CODE: S- Clean with solvent only.
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SPECIFICATIONS
PATTERNS ATHENA
CONTENT: 100% Polyolefin
STANDARD WIDTH: 54"
BACKING: Acrylic
WEIGHT: 11.0 oz.per linear yard, backed
- REPEAT: N/A
FLAME RESISTANCE: Meets requirements of the following fire codes:

California Technical Bulletin 117, Section E
CS-191-53, Class 1

BIFMA FF1-78

UFAC, Class 1

NFPA 260-1989

ASTM E84, Class A

B.S. 5852 Part 1; 1979 Ignition Source O;
Smouldering cigarette

SURFACE ABRASION: 30,000 Double Rubs
ASTM D-4157-Wyzenbeek

COLORFASTNESS: Dry - Class.5- Wet - Class 5
AATCC-Test Method 8

LIGHTFASTNESS: 60 Hours, Class 5
AATCC Test Method 16E

CLEANING CODE: "~ WS- For water based stains, use water based
cleaning agents. For oil based stains, use a
solvent cleaner.




CONTENT:
STANDARD WIDTH:
BACKING:
WEIGHT:

REPEAT:

FLAME RESISTANCE:

SURFACE ABRASION:
ASTM-D-3597 (Wyzenbeek)
Modified

COLORFASTNESS:
AATCC-Test Method 8-1974

LIGHTFASTNESS:
AATCC Test Method 16E
1976

BREAK STRENGTH:
ASTM D3597/D-1682-64 1975
TEAR STRENGTH:

SEAM SLIPPAGE:
ASTM D434-75

BRUSH PIL1L.:
ASTM 3511

CLEANING CODE:

P14

SPECIFICATIONS

PATTERN EMPIRE
57% Acrylic/43% Polyester
54"
Acrylic
11.3 oz.
3/4"Hx 1-1/4"V
Meets requirements of the following fire codes:
California Technical Bulletin 117, Section E

NFPA 260-1989
UFAC, Class 1

30,000 Double Rubs (#10 Cotton Duck)
Heavy Duty

Wet: Clas s4- Dry: Class 5
40 hours, Class 4
Exceeds 50 1bs. In both Warp & Fill

Exceed 6 lbs.

Warp - 30+ Ibs.
Fill - 30+ lbs.

3-4 Minimum

S- Clean with solvent only.
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SPECIFICATIONS

PATTERN GLAMOUR

CONTENT:

WEIGHT:
STANDARD WIDTH:
REPEAT:

BACKING:

FLAME RESISTANCE:

PERFORMANCE
CHARACTERISTICS:

COLORFASTNESS TO CROCKING:

COLORFASTNESS TO LIGHT:
AATCC 16A-1974 OR AATCC
16E-1976

BREAKING STRENGTH
ASTM D3597-D1682-64(1975)

TEAR RESISTANCE:

SEAM SLIPPAGE:
ASTM D3597-D434-75

ABRASION:
ASTM3597 WYZENBEEK
METHOD

CLEANING CODE:

58% Cotton/42% Polyester

12.40 Ounces per linear yard

54"

H:2 1/4" -V:2 172"

Acrylic

California Technical Bulletin 117, Section E

NFPA 260 1989
UFAC, Class 1

Dry: Class 4, minimum
Wet: Class 3, minimum

Class 4, minimum at 40 hours
Exceeds 50 pounds in Warp & Weft

Exceeds 6 pounds

30+ pounds - Warp & Fill

Passes 30,000 double rubs (Heavy duty)
Cotton Duck (#10)

S - Clean with Solvent only.
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- SPECIFICATIONS
PATTERN JAMBOREE

CONTENT:
STANDARD WIDTH:
BACKING:

WEIGHT:

REPEAT:

FLAME RESISTANCE:

SURFACE ABRASION:
ASTM-D-3597 (Wyzenbeek)
Modified

COLORFASTNESS:
AATCC-Test Method 8-1974

LIGHTFASTNESS:
AATCC Test Method 16E
1976

BREAK STRENGTH:

ASTM D3597/D-1682-64 1975

TEAR STRENGTH:

SEAM SLIPPAGE:
ASTM D434-75

BRUSH PILL:
ASTM 3511

CLEANING CODE:

58%Cotton/42% Polyester

54"

Acrylic

12.0 ounces per linear yard, backed

H: 7/8" V: 1-7/8"

Meets requirements of the following fire codes:
California Technical Bulletin 117, Section E

NFPA 260-1989
UFAC, Class 1

30,000 Double Rubs (#10 Cotton Duck)

Heavy Duty

Wet: Class 3- Dry: Class 4

40 hours, Class 4

Exceeds 50 Ibs. In both Warp & Fill

Exceed 6 1bs.

Warp - 30+ Ibs.
Fill - 30+ Ibs.

3-4 MINIMUM

S- Clean with solvent only.

TR T
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SPECIFICATIONS

PATTERN HEWITT
CONTENT: 86% Polyolefin/10% Acrylic/4% Polyester
STANDARD WIDTH: 54"
WEIGHT: 17 ounces per linear yard
BACKING: Acrylic
REPEAT: N/A
FLAME RESISTANCE: Meets requirements of the following fire codes:

California 117, Sec. E
CS 191-53, Class 1
BIFMA X5.7-1991
NFPA-260-1989

UFAC Class 1
B.S. 5852 Part 1: Ignition Source O; Smouldering
cigarette

SURFACE ABRASION: 80,000 double rubs

ASTM D-4157

Wyzenbeek

COLORFASTNESS TO LIGHT: Class 5- 60 hours

AATCC 16 E

COLORFASTNESS TO

CROCKING: Dry - Class 5 Minimum

AATCC Test Method 8 Wet - Class 5 Minimum

SEAM SLIPPAGE: Warp: 74 lbs. Fill: 70 lbs.

ASTM-D-4034

CLEANING CODE: WS-For water based stains us water based cleaning

agents. For oil based stains use solvent cleaner.




P18

SPECIFICATIONS

PATTERN SHERPA/SHIRE

CONTENT:
STANDARD WIDTH:
WEIGHT:

BACKING:

FLAME RESISTANCE:

CLEANING CODE:

ULTRAVIOLET STABILITY

BREAK STRENGTH:
ASTM-D-1682 (Grab Method)

TEAR RESISTANCE:
ASTM-D-2262 (Tongne Method)
SURFACE ABRASION:

ASTM D-4157 -Wyzenbeek

RESISTANCE TO SEAM SLIPPAGE
ASTM-D-4034

COLORFASTNESS TO LIGHT
AATCC Test Method 16-1981

COLORFASTNESS TO CROCKING
AATCC-Test Method 8-1981

100% Marquesa L.ana (Polyolefin)

54"

16.0 oz.per linear yard, backed

Acrylic

Meets requirements of the following fire codes:
California Technical Bulletin 117, Section E
(S-191-53, Class 1

BIFMA FF1-78

ASTM E84, Class A

B.S. 5852 Part 1: 1979 Ignition Source 0;
Smouldering Cigarette

NFPA 260-1989

UFAC, Class 1

“WS” for water based stains use water based
cleaning agents. For oil based stains use solvent cleaner.

Minimai degradation at 350 hours
AATCC 16 - Xenon Fade-Ometer
Warp - 300 1bs., Fill - 300 ibs.

Warp - 60 1bs., Fill - 63 lbs.

Can exceed 250,000 double rubs
Warp - 50 1bs. , Fill - 54 Ibs.
400 Hours, Class 5

Exceeds 200 hours
Dry - Class 4.5 - Wet - Class 5

El




P18

SPECIFICATIONS
PATTERN HYDE
CONTENT: 100% Vinyl
STANDARD WIDTH: 54"
ROLL SIZE: 40 Yards
WEIGHT: 29.25 (+ 1.5) ounces per linear yard
GAUGE: 45 Nominal
BACKING: High Loft Knit (100% Polyester)
FLAME RESISTANCE: Meets requirements of the following fire code:
California Technical Bulletin 117, Section E
FMVSS-302
UFAC, Class 1
BIFMA, Class A
SURFACE ABRASION: No significant wear after 100,000 double rubs
Wyzenbeek #8 cotton duck
MILDEW RESISTANT
CARE AND CLEANING: Regular cleaning (dirt and grime): Use

a mild soap and water, then fresh water
rinse. Cleaning frequently depends on use.
As a minimum, please clean weekly.
Stubborn stains {crayon, eye shadow,
chocolate, blood): Wipe using a soft cloth
or soft brush. Use detergent cleaners such
as Formula 409 or Fantastik. Rinse with
clean water and wipe dry.

1711 I
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SPECIFICATIONS
PATTERN TRIO

CONTENT: 100% Polyolefin
STANDARD WIDTH: 54"
WEIGHT: 8.5 ounces per linear yard (+ 1 ounce)
BACKING: Acrylic
REPEAT: N/A
FLAME RESISTANCE: Meets requirements of the following fire codes:

California 117, Sec. E
CS 191-53, Class 1
BIFMA X5.7-1991
NFPA-260-1989, Class 1

UFAC Class 1
SURFACE ABRASION: 60,000 double rubs
ASTM D-4157
Wyzenbeek
COLORFASTNESS TO LIGHT: Class 5- 60 hours
AATCCI6E
COLORFASTNESS TO
CROCKING: Dry - Class 4.5 Minimum
AATCC Test Method 8 Wet - Class 5 Minimum
PILLING: Class 5
ASTM-D-3511
SEAM SLIPPAGE: Warp: 86 Ibs. Fill: 102 1bs.
ASTM-D-4034
CLEANING CODE: WS-For water based stains us water based cleaning

agents. For oil based stains use solvent cleaner.

11
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SPECIFICATIONS

PATTERN NEOCHROME 111
ROLL WIDTH: 54 inches
ROLL SIZE: 30 yards
WEIGHT: 37.7 ounces per linear yard
TOP COAT FINISH: BeautyGard
ABRASION RESISTANCE: 250,000 Double Rubs (Wyzenbeek)
Standard 191A, Method 3504
FLAMMABILITY CODES: California Bulletin 117-Sec. E

BIFMA (Screen Test, Sec. 4.6.1.1)

Port Authority of New York/New Jersey

MVSS-302 _

Boston Fire Code (BFD IX-1)

CID A-A-2905-A (Federal Standard 191A, test
method 5903 (replaces CCC-A-680a)

Upholstery Requirements of FAR 25.853

Superior Tear Strength

-20 degrees F cold crack

Static dissipative slip finish

Resistant to scuffs and scrapes

Produced from environmentally friendly
materials and processes

Non-migratory plasticizers to retain a
soft and supple feel

Made in the U.S.A.

This product contains an agent to protect
against bacterial and fungal microorganisms.

CLEANING INSTRUCTIONS: Light Soiling - 10% household liquid dish soap in
warm water, apply with a soft, damp cloth.
Heavy Seiling - Dampen a soft white cloth with
Lighter fluid (naptha) and rub gently. Rinse with
a water-dampened cloth.
Difficualt stains - Dampen a white cloth with a
solution of household bleach (sodium hypochlorite)
10% bleach, 90% water. Rub gently. Rinse with
A water-dampened cloth to remove bleach
concentration.

71T T 11
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SPECIFICATIONS
PATTERN WHISPER
ROLL WIDTH: 54 inches
ROLL SIZE: 30 yards
WEIGHT: 27 ozs.
BACKING: Soft Hi-Loft 2
ABRASION RESISTANCE: 100,000 Cycles (Wyzenbeek)/CFFA-1
Federal Standard 191-A(5304) : _
WEAR RESISTANCE: Superior - 100,000 cycles
LIGHT FASTNESS: Passes 1,000 Hours
FLAMMABILITY CODES: California Bulletin 117-Sec. E
BIFMA Class A
UFAC Class 1
Motor Vehicle Safety Standard 302
* UV STABILIZED PIGMENTS
* MILDEW RESISTANT

* 4 COMPONENT URETHANE TOPCOATING SYSTEM

CLEANING INSTRUCTIONS: Light Seiling - 10% household liquid dishsoap in

warm water, apply with a soft, damp cloth.
Heavy Soiling - One to one (1:1) Fantastik/water or
409/water. Clean with a soft white damp cloth.

Rub gently; rinse with a water-dampened cloth.
Difficult stains - Household bleach (10% bleach/
90% water). Apply with a dampened soft white

cloth. Rub gently. Rinse with a dampened cloth to
remove bleach concentration.

USES: Contract Interiors . Office . Restaurant .
Hotel/Motel . Nursing Home/Hospital . Marine/
RV/Auto . Residential

Attt b b B o 3mb
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SPECIFICATIONS
PATTERN BANDEAU

CONTENT:
STANDARD WIDTH:
WEIGHT:

FINISH:

REPEAT:

FLAME RESISTANCE:

SURFACE ABRASION:
ASTM-D-4157 (Wyzenbeek)

COLORFASTNESS:
AATCCS

LIGHTFASTNESS:
AATCC 16E

SEAM SLIPPAGE
ASTM-D-4034

CLEANING CODE:

70% Polyester/30% Cotton

54"

i1 oz.

Crypton

1.375"Hx 0"V

California Technical Bulletin 117, Section E;
UFAC Class 1

CS-191-53, Class 1

BIFMA X5.7-1991

NFPA 260-1989, Class 1

B.S. 5852 Parr 1: 1979 Ignition Source 0,

smouldering cigarette

50,000 Double Rubs
Wet -Class 5 Dry -Class 5
5 Hours, Class 40

Warp: 54.6 1bs  Fill: 66.7 lbs.

WS-For water based stains use water based cleaning

agent. For oil based stains use solvent cleaner.

414
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SPECIFICATIONS
PATTERN DAKTARI
CONTENT: 100% Polyester
STANDARD WIDTH: 54"
WEIGHT: 10 ounces per linear yard
FINISH: Crypton
REPEAT: H:23/8" V:47/8"
FLAME RESISTANCE: California 117, Sec. E, Class 1
NFPA 260-1989, Class1
UFAC Class 1
CS-191-53, Classl
BIFMA X5.7-1991
B.S. 5852 Part 1:1979
SURFACE ABRASION: 50,000 double rubs
ASTM D-4157 Wyzenbeek
COLORFASTNESS TO LIGHT: Class 5, 40 hours
AATCC-TM 16

COLORFASTNESS TO CROCKING:
AATCC-8

SEAM SLIPPAGE:
ASTM-03

CLEANING CODE:

Wet: Class5 Dry: Class 5

Warp: 46 Ibs.  Fill: 106 Ibs.

Studies show that nothing works better on Crypton

than a powdered enzyme detergent, such as Cheer, or Tide, mixed with water, Be sure to rinse
with a clean cloth and clear water. The fabric must be rinsed thoroughly, leaving no soap
residue. Because Crypton fabrics were designed for easy maintenance, the use of solvent-based
cleaners is unnecessary. In fact, some heavy-duty solvents can damage the textile’s fibers. To
be safe, we recommend that you do not use solvents in the general maintenance of Crypton
fabrics. Diluted bleach (4 parts water to 1 part bleach) can be used to disinfect Crypton, but
should be removed quickly and completely to avoid fading. Bleach that is not completely

removed will eventually fade the fabric.
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SPECIFICATIONS
PATTERN DOMAINE
CONTENT: 100% Polyester
STANDARD WIDTH: 54"
WEIGHT: 12.4 ounces per linear yard
FINISH: Crypton
REPEAT: H:7" V:73/8"
FLAME RESISTANCE: California 117, Sec. E, Class 1
NFPA 260-1989, Class1
UFAC Class 1
(S-191-53, Classl
BIFMA X5.7-1991
B.S. 5852 Part 1:1979
SURFACE ABRASION: 50,000 double rubs
ASTM D-4157 Wyzenbeek
COLORFASTNESS TO LIGHT: Class 5, 40 hours
AATCC-TM 16

COLORFASTNESS TO CROCKING:
AATCC-8

SEAM SLIPPAGE:
ASTM-4034

CLEANING CODE:

Wet: Class5 Dry: Class 5

Warp: 75 Ibs.  Fill: 86 Ibs.

Studies show that nothing works better on Crypton

than a powdered enzyme detergent, such as Cheer, or Tide, mixed with water, Be sure to rinse
with a clean cloth and clear water. The fabric must be rinsed thoroughly, leaving no soap
residue. Because Crypton fabrics were designed for easy maintenance, the use of solvent-based
cleaners is unnecessary. In fact, some heavy-duty solvents can damage the textile’s fibers. To
be safe, we recommend that you do not use solvents in the general maintenance of Crypton
fabrics. Diluted bleach (4 parts water to 1 part bleach) can be used to disinfect Crypton, but
should be removed quickly and completely to avoid fading. Bleach that is not completely

removed will eventually fade the fabric.
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SPECIFICATIONS
PATTERN STRYKER
CONTENT: 38% Cotton/62% Polyester
WEIGHT: 11.6 (+ 1) ounces per linear yard
STANDARD WIDTH: 54"
FINISH: Crypton
REPEAT: H:1/4"  V:3/16"
FLAME RESISTANCE: California Technical Bulletin 117, Section E
NFPA 260-1989, Class 1
UFAC, CLASS 1
BIFMA X5.7-1991
CS-191-53, Class 1
B.S. 5852 Part 1. 1979 Ignition Source;
Smouldering cigarette
PERFORMANCE
CHARACTERISTICS:
COLORFASTNESS TO CROCKING: Dry: Class 5
AATCC-8 Wet: Class 5
COLORFASTNESS TO LIGHT: Class 5, minimum at 40 hours

AATCC 16A-1974 OR AATCC
16E '

BREAK STRENGTH:
ASTM-D-5034

TEAR STRENGTH:
ASTM-D-2262

SEAM SLIPPAGE:
ASTM -D-4034

ABRASION:
ASTM-D-4157 Wyzenbeck

PILLING:
ASTM-D-3511
SHRINKAGE:

PICKS AND ENDS PER INCH:

CLEANING CODE:

Warp: 320.31bs. Fill: 478.2 Ibs.

Warp: 23.51bs.  Fill: 19.5 lbs.

Warp: 44 1bs. Fill: 66 lbs.

50,000 double rubs

Wire Screen

Class 5

This test is not performed by the manufacturer.

Warp (ends) 173 Fill (picks) 47

WS-For water-based stains, use water-based clean-

ing agent. For oil-based stains, use solvent cleaner.

P26
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SPECIFICATIONS

PATTERN SUEDEGARD P27

CONTENT:
STANDARD WIDTH:
WEIGHT:
BACKING:

REPEAT:

FLAME RESISTANCE:

SURFACE ABRASION:
ASTM D-4157

COLORFASTNESS TO CROCKING:

AATCC 8

TENSILE STRENGTH:
ASTM-D-5034

TEAR STRENGTH:
ASTM-D-2262 (Tongue Test)

SEAM SLIPPAGE:
ASTM-D-4034

CLEANING CODE:

100% Polyester with backing

54" |

15 ounces per linear yard

Crypton

N/A

Meets requirements of the following fire codes:

California 117, Sec. E, Class 1
NFPA 260
UFAC Class 1

150,000 double rubs
#10 Cotton duck

Wet: Class 4

Warp: 120.01bs. Fill: 229.3 lbs.
Warp: 8.5 lbs. Fill 6.8 Ibs.

Warp: 112 Ibs.  Fill: 165.3 1bs.

Studies show that nothing works better on Crypton
than a powdered enzyme detergent, such as
Cheer, or Tide, mixed with water. Be sure

to rinse with a clean cloth and clear water. The
fabric must be rinsed thoroughly, leaving no soap
residue. Because Crypton fabrics were designed
for easy maintenance, the use of solvent-based
cleaners is unnecessary. In fact, some heavy-duty
solvents can damage the textile’s fibers. To be
safe, we recommend that you do not use solvents
in the general maintenance of Crypton fabrics.
Diluted bleach (or 4 parts water to 1 part bleach)
can be used to disinfect Crypton, but should be
removed quickly and completely to avoid fading.
Bleach that is not completely removed will event-
ually fade the fabric.
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SPECIFICATIONS * * 0# Wy
PATTERN | - FIBER WEIGHT/ | PATTERN SURFACE ABRASION 7 TENSILE LIGHT- CLEANING
54> | conTENT | L. vD. | REPEAT | WEAVE | ™ \yrenheek - | STRENGTH |FasTnEss| FLAMMABILITY | ™ oo
* Armour 100% 14.6 oz. Nong N/A Exceeds 2,000,000 Warp 419 [bf, Exceeds Cal. 117-E WS
& BASF Nylen Double Ribs Fill 367 1bi. 40 Hrs. UFAC .
Armour B BIFMA
. NFPA 260
Caressa Vinyl 28 oz. None N/A - Exceeds 100,000 Warp 83.7 Ibf. Exceeds See Notes WwS§
Double Rubs Fill 55.1 Ibf. 500 Hrs.
Cosmos 100% Trace | 10.40 oz, H .875" 85 ends Exceeds 60,000 Warp 100 Ibf. Excesds Cal. 117-E WS
* Polyolefin vV .875" 52 picks Double Rubs Filt 160 Ibf. 80 Hrs. UFAC
BIFMA
NFPA 260
Duraweave 100% 17.5 0z None 13 ends Exceeds 140,000 4 Warp 270 Ibi. Exceeds See Notes Ws
FR Marquesa 13 picks Double Rubs Fill 270 1bd. 200 Hrs.
Lana
Feundation 100% 13.75 oz. Nong 44 ends Exceeds 600,000 Warp 368 Ibf. Exceeds Gal, 117-E WS
* Polyester 48 picks Double Rubs Fifl 239 Iht. 40 Hrs. UFAC
: BIFMA
NFPA 260
ASTM E84
Ruhieon |} 54% Okefin | 15.4 oz. H.E 36 ends Exceeds 50,000 Warp 93 ibf. Exceeds Cal 117-£ w
* 26% Nylon Viy 32 picks Double Rubs Fill 346 Ibf. 60 Hrs. LIFAC
20% Polyester, BiIFMA
NFPA 260
Taj 50% Polyester| 9.6 0z H.5 60 ends Exceeds 55,000 Warp 225 Ibf. Exceeds Cal. 117-E W
* 50% Oiefin vV .625 64 picks Double Rubs Fill 200 Jbf. 60 Hrs. UFAC
BIFMA
NFPA 260

* = Treated with Teflon® fabric protector by Dupont,

California Technical Bulietin #117, Section E (191-53)
UFAC Class Class |
BIFMA Class 1 Class |
NFPA 260 Ciass |
NFPA 701 Life Safety Code (small scale} Class |
MVSS 302 Class |
New York & New Jersey Port Authovity Code Class |

Boston Fire Dept. BFD [X-1

CARESSA - FLAMMABILITY

Meets Reguirements
Meets Requirements
Meets Requirements
Meets Requirements
Meets Requirements
Meets Requirements
Meets Reguirements
Mests Requirements

Siate of California 181-53 Technical Bulletin 117, Section E

UFAC Class |
BIFMA Class |
NFPA 260 Class |
Tunnel Test - ASTM E 84 Class A

NFPA 701 - Large Scale
FPort Auihority of NY/NJ - FTM 5903
Smoke Density - ASTM E 6562

RURAWEAVE - FLAMMABILITY

Meets Requirements
Meets Requirements
Meeis Requirements
Meets Requirernents
Meets Regquirements
Meets Requirements
Meets Reguirements
Passes NFPA Requirements

Plecise kesp this card infact. individual samples available.
Color ma%chir;?: Mayer will always attempt to ship « sofisfactory commercial maich.
Becouse of industry stendard dye lot variation, colors may not metch exactly.

WEST VIRGINIA PRISON INDUSTRIES

©1998 Mayer-Paefz, Inc.

BASF

(800) 428-4415
Fox (317) 2672629
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"Valtie Coordinates Collection g % g

PATTERN 'FIBER WEIGHT/ PATTERN FINISH SURFACE ABRASION  TENSILE LIGHT- FLAMMABILTE CLEANING

B4 CONTENT LIN. YD. REPEAT « WYZENBEEK STRENGTH FASTNESS CODE
CAPE 54% Nylon S oz Nane Teflon Exceeds 174,000 Warp 170 Lbs. Excesds Cal. 117-E e
- 48% Polyester Doubls Rubs Fillt 200 Lbs. 40 Hrs. UFAC, -
BIFMA . :
NFPA 260
CARAT 52% Nylon 9oz 75" H Teflon Exceeds 159,000 Warp 187 Lbs, Exceeds Cal. 117-E - WS
48% Polyestear 85"V Double Rebs Fiif 98 Lbs, 40 Hrs. URAC
' * BIFMA
NFPA 260
CELEERATION  52% Nvlon 9 oz 8" H Teflon Exceeds 108,000 Warp 170 Lbs. Exceeds Cal. 117-E . WS
48% Polyaster 5y Double Rubs Fill 20C Lbs. 40 Hrs. UFAC
BIFMA
NFPA 280
CHARLESTON 52% Polyester 10.14 oz 675" H Teflon Exceeds 50,000 Warp 124 Lbs. Excesds Gal. 117-E WS
+ 48% Acrylic 11.75"V Double Rubs Fill 144 Lbs. 4() Hrs. UFAC
BIFMA
. NFPA 260
CLARITY 52% Olefin 7.8 oz 5625"H Teilon " Excseds 80,000 Warp 120 Lbs. Exceeds Cal. 117-E W
48% Polyester 6878V -Dothle Rubs Filt 180 Lbs. 60 Hrs. UFAC
BIFMA
NEPA 260 - _
GLEMATIS - 60% Polyester  10.3 oz 759"H Teficn Exceeds 100,000 Warp 222 Lbs. Fxceeds Gal. 137-E Ws
40% Olefin 5"V Double Rubs Fill 225 Lbs. 40 Hrs. UFAC
Non - BIFMA
Matching NFPA-260 .
COMPANION  52% Nylon S0z 2" H Teflon Exceeds 159,000 Warp 187 Lbs. Exceeds Cal. 117-E. Ws
48% Polysster 2y . Double Rubs Fiil 98 Lbs. 40 Hrs. UFAC
BIFMA
. NFPA 260
GOURTYARD  54% Nylon 8 oz 5"H Teflon Exceeds 95,000 Warp 120 Lbs. Exceeds Cal. 117-E WS
46% Polyester STV Double Rubs Fill 140 Lbs, 60 Hrs, UFAC -
BIFMA
NFPA 260
CROSSTOWN  52% Nylon 8oz 0"H Teflen Exceeds 162,000 Warp 170 Lbs. Exceeds Cal. i17-E .. WS
48% Poiysstar 5TV Double Rubs Fill 200 Lbs, 40 Hrs. UrAC -
Shown : BIFMA
Railroaded NFPA 2680
FOUNDATION 100% 1350z Nong Teflon Exceeds 1,000,000 Warp 368 Lbs. Exceeds Cal. 117-E w3
Polyaster Douple Rubs Fili 338 Lhs, 60 Hrs. LIFAC
BIFMA :
NFPA 280

¢ W: Water-Based Cleaner - Spot clean, using the foam only from a water based cleaning agent such as 2 mild detergent or non-solvent
upholstery shampoo product. Apply foam with a soft brush'in a circular motion, Vacuum when dry. Pretest a small area before proceeding.

= WS8: Walar/Solvent Cleaner - Spot ciean, with a mild scfvent, an upholstery shampoo, or the foam from a mild detergent. When using a
solvent or dry cleaning product, follow instructions carefully and clean only in a well ventilated room. Avoid any product that contains carbon
tefrachioride cr other toxic materials. With sither method, pretest a small area before proceeding. . . -

* Railroaded: This feature allows reduction of seams and-enables smoother furniture tailoring.
= All patterns should be upholstered as shown on the card.

Fabric *UP THE ACLL” or Fabric "RAILROADED” or
"REGULAR" Pasition “TOP TO SELVAGE" Ppsftion

Phones (800) 428-4415
(317) 2672626
Order Fax (317) 2672629
Fax (877) 7SAMPLE
www.mayerfabrics.com

sl ke i ek

30801



"Ambiance Collection
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PATTERN FIBER WEIGHT/ PATTERN TENSILE LIGHT- . ., GLEANING
547 CONTENT LIN.YD. REPEAT FMSH ™ yv7enmeek STRENGTH FASTNESS |-AMMABILITY ™Te,ne
FOLIG B2% Cotion 1343 0z. 6.814"H Teflon Exceeds 51,000 Warp 2785 Lbs.  Exceeds Cal. 117-E WS
38% Polyester 6.76"V Double Rubs Fili 112.57 Lbs. 40 Hrs. JFAC
Shown BIFMA
Railroadsd NFPA 260
N MOTION  58% Cotion 12150z,  1239"H Teflon Exceeds 51,000 Warp 245.5 Lbs.  Exceeds Cal. 117-E WS
42% Polyester 6.76" V Double Rubs Fill 51.6 Lbs, 40 Hrs. UFAC
Shown BIFMA
Railroaded MNFPA 260
KEYNOTE 62% Cetion  13.59 0z, B25" H Teflon Exceads 51,000 Warp 282 Lbs. Exceeds Cal. 117-E WS
38% Puolyester 112"y Doutrz Rubs Fifl 128 Lbs. 40 Hrs. UFAG
Shown ) BIFMA
Railrcaded NFPA 260
LADDER 58% Cotten 12.15 oz 317 H Tefion Exceeds 57,000 Warp 275 Lbs.  Exceads Cal. $17-E WS
. 42% Polyester 56"V Double Rubs Filt 105 Lbs. 40 Hrs. UFAC
Shown . BIFMA
Railroaded NFPA 260
MAYA ~ 84% Polyester 10.74 0z. Non-Matching  Teflon Exceeds 50,000 Warp 210 Lbs. Excesds Cal. 117-E WS
16% Clefin Texture ' Double Rubs Fill 214 Lbs. 40 Hrs. UFAC
BIFMA
NFPA 260
NEBULA 100% Terratex  17.50z.  Non-Mafching NA Exceeds 45,000 Warp 450 Lbs. Fxceeds Cal 117-E WS
Polyester Texture Double Rubs Filt 200 Lbs. 49 Hrs. UFAC
- 100% BIFMA
Recycled NFPA 260
- ASTMD EB4
PARK AVENUE  58% Cotton 12150z 1.3"H Teflon Exceeds 39,000 Warp 278 Lbs. Exceeds Cal. 117-E WS
42% Polyester 28"V Double Rubs Filt 101 Lbs. 40 Hrs. UFAC
Shown BiFMA
Railroadad NFPA 260
PISCES 100% Terratex 12.8 0z. 14.5" H NA Exceeds 160,000 Warp 280 Lbs. Exceeds Cal. 117-E WS
Polyester B.757V Double Rubs Fitl 230 Lbs. 40 Hrs. UFAC
100% Nen-Matching BIFMA
Recycled Texture NFPA 260
ASTM D £84
PLAZA 89% Trace 1716 0z. Non-Maiching  Teflon Exceeds 30,000 Warp 100 Lbs. Exceeds Cal. 117-E WS
Oiefin Chenille Double Rubs Fil 60 Lbs. 40 Hrs. UFAG
11% Polyester BiFMA
NFPA 280
RAGTIME 58% Cotton 1215 ¢z 152" H Teflon Exceeds 51,000 Warp 276 Lbs. Exceeds Cal. 117-E WS :
42% Polyester 25"V Dauble Rubs Fill 105 Lbs. 40 Hrs. UFAC
Shown BIFMA £
Raitroaded NFPA 260 :
° WS: Water/Solvent Cleaner - Spot clean, with a mild solvent, an upholstery shampoo, or the foam from a mild detergent. When using a
solvent or dry cleaning product, follow instructions carefully and clean only it a well ventilated room. Avoid any product that contains carbon
tetrachloride or other toxic materiafs. With either method, pretest a srmall area before proceeding.

° Railroaded: This feature allows reduction of seams and enables smoother furniture tailoring.
= All patterns sheuld be upholstered as shown on the card.

= JE==]
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Fabric “RALRGADED" or
“FOP TO SELVAGE" Position

Fabric "UP THE ROLL" or
“REGULAR" Position

Phones {800) 428-4415

(317) 2672626
Order Fax [317) 267-2629
Fax (877) 7SAMPLE
www.mayerfabrics.com
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PATTERN FIBER WEIGHT/ PATTERN FINISH SURFACE ABRASION TENSILE LIGHT- FLAMMABILITY CLEANING
54" - GDNTENT. LIN.YD. REPEAT . WYZENBEEK STRENGTH FASTNESS CODE
COMPASS  52% Polyester 11 oz. 115" H Tefion Exceeds 39,000 Warp 108.5 Lbs.  Exceeds Cal. 117-E g
48% Polyester 1157V Double Rubs Fil 108 Lbs. 40 Hrs. - UFAC
_ : BIFMA
] NEFPA 260 _
CONCENSUS . 58% Polyester  11.5 0z, Nong Teflon Exceeds 75,000 Warp 157 Lbs.,  Excesds Cal. 117-E WS
' 42% Polypraleng Double Rubs Fill 161 Lbs. 60 Hrs. UFAC
BIFMA
NFPA 260
GIOVANNI  75% Polyester 13 oz 5°H Teflon Exceeds 50,000 Warp 285 Lbs. Exceads Cal. 117-E WS
o 25% Rayon 57y Double Rubs Fiti 196 Lbs. 40 Hrs. UFAG
Shown ; BIFMA
Railrpaded ) NFPA 260
LATITUDE  44% Polyester 11.67 oz 6.75" H NA Exceeds 50,000 Warp 235 Lbs. Exceeds Cal. 117-E WS
36% Rayon 127V Double Rubs Fill 162 Lbs. 40 Hrs. LIFAC
18% Wooi BIFMA
2% Nylon NFPA 260
MASTERTEY 86% Polyester 12.4 oz None Teflan Exceeds 40,000 Warp 126 Lbs. Exceeds Cal 117-E WS
9% Wool Double Rubs Fill 127 Lbs. 40 Hrs, UFAC
5% Nylon BIFMA
7 NFPA 260
PAGEANT  52% Polyester 1t oz. 875"H Teflon Excegds 45,000 Warp 102 Lbs.  Excesds Cal. 117-E S
48% Rayon 782V : “zDolible Rubs Fifl 112 Lbs. 40 Hrs, UFAC
BIFMA
- ] . NFPA 260
PINPOINT FR 57% Polfyester  11.68 oz Nane Nona Exceeds 60,000 Warp 1563 Lbs.  Exceeds Cal. 117-E S
43% Trevira Doubie Rubs Fill 112 Lbs. 40 Hrs. UFAC
Polyester BIFMA
NFPA 260
PINSTRIPE  50% Polyester 11.210z.  .3125"H Teflon Excesds 50,000 Warp 114 Lbs.  Exceeds Cal. 117-E 3
50% Cotton o'V Bouble Rubg Fill 66 Lbs. 40 Hrs. - UFAC
BIFMA
NFPA 260
RENMNIE 40% Polyester g oz 135"H Tefion Exceeds $00,000 Warp 162 Lbs.  Exceeds Cal. 117E .~ WS
33% Olefin 145"V Double Rubs Fill 151 Lhs, 40 Hrs. UFAG
16% Woo! BiFMA
11% Nylen NFPA 260
TRAVERSE 52% Polysster 10.76 oz 1.12"H Teflon Exceeds 57,000 Warp 108.5 Lbs.  Exceeds Cal. 117-E S
48% Rayon RAra Couble Rubs Fill 108 Lbs. 40 Hrs. UFAC
BIFMA
NFPA 260

¢ 8: Solverit:Cleaner - Spot c]eém, using a mild water free solvent or dry cleaning product. Clean orly in a well ventilated room and avoid any
product containing carbon tetrachloride or other toxic materials. Pretest 4 small area before proceeding.

* WS5: Water/Solvent Cleaner - Spot clean, with a mifd solvent, an upholstery shampoo, or the foam from a miild detergent. When using a
solvent or dry cleaning product, follow instructions carefully and clean only in a weil ventilated room. Avold any product that contams carbon
tetrachloride or other toxic materials. With either method, pretast a small area before proceeding.

* Raillroaded: This feature allows reduction of seams and enables smoother furniture tailoring.

+ All patterns shouid be upholstered as shown on the card.

Phones [800) 428-4415
(317} 267-2626
Order Fax (317) 267-2629
Fax (877) 7SAMPLE
www.mayerfabrics.com

Fabric "UP THE ROLL" or
“REGULAR" Position

Fabric “RAILROADED" or
“TOP TO SELVAGE" Position
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Mainstream Collection e % &
PATTERN FIBER WEIGHT/ PATTERN FINISH SURFACE ABRASION TENSILE LIGHT- FLAMMABi' ITY CLEANING
54" - GONTENT LIN. YD. REPEAT WYZENBEEK STRENGTH FASTNESS . s GODE
CHELSEA  54% Polyester 110z 8.75" H Tefion Exceeds 50,000 Warp 178 Lbs.  Exceeds Cal. 117-E WS
27% Acrylic 575"V . Double Rubs Fill 88 Lbs. 40 Hrs. UFAC
19% Olafin BIFMA
. NFPA 260
DECADE 100% infinity  11.2 6z None NA Exceeds 765,000 Warp 210 Lbs. Exceeds Cal 117-E WS
CREPE Nylon Double Rubs Fill 160 Lbs. 200 Hrs. UFAC
: BIFMA
NFPA 250
DECADE"  100% Infinity  12.3 oz A"H NA Exceeds 765,000 Warp 200 Lbs.  Exceads Cal. 117-E WS
ORIDN ylon Sy Double Rubs’ Fil! 200 Lbs. 200 Hrs, UFAG
BIFMA
) NFPA 260
DIAMONIQUE  65% Aylon 10 oz. 57H Tefion Exceeds 100,000 Warp 331 Lbs.  Exceeds Cal. 117-E WS
35% Olefin 75"V Double Rubs Filt 166 Lbs. 40 Hrs, ~ UFAC
BIFMA
NFPA 260
ASTM D E84
INTEREOCGHEN 60% Poiysster 10.5 oz. 2"H Teflon Exceeds 106,000 Warp 91 Lbs. Exceeds Cal. 117-E - WS
40% Trace 75"y Double Rubs Fill 10C Lbs. 40 Hrs. UFAC
Shown OClefin . BIFMA .
Railroaded : NFPA 260
JIGSAW 53% Acrylic  12.41 ¢z 6.75"H Teflon Exceeds 60,000 Warp 180 Lbs. Exceads Cal. 117-E WS
47% Polyester 135"V Doubie Rubs Fill 118 Lbs. 40 Hrs. UFAC
: S BIFMA
NFPA 260
MOMSOONFR  100% FR 110z 13.5"H Fire Exceeds 63,000 Warp 112 Lbs. Exceeds Cal. 117-E W -
Polypropylena 5V Retardant Deuble Rubs Filt 161 Lbs. 40 Hrs. UFAG s
BIFMA :
NFPA 260 -
PERSPECTIVE  100% FR 11.45 oz 169"H . Fire Exceeds 50,000 Warp 157 Lbs. Excesds Cal 117-E w
FR Palypropylene 310"V Retardant Double Rubs Fitl 161 Lbs. 40 Hrs. LIFAC
. BIFMA
NFPA 260
WOOLTEX ~ 40% Polyester 9.3 oz. Nong Teflon Exceads 100,000 Warp 147 Lbs.  Excseds Cal. 117-E WS
) 33% Olefin Double Rubs Fill 153 Lbs. 40 Hrs. UFAC
16% Woo! BIFMA
11% Nyton NFPA 260

s W: Water-Based Cleaner - Spot clean, using the foam only from a water based cleaning agent such as a mild detergent or non-solvent
uphelstery shampoo product. Apply foam with a soft brush in a circular motion. Vacuum when dry. Pretest a small area before proceeding.

* WS: Water/Solvent Cleaner - Spot clean, with a mild sclvent, an upholstery shampoo, or the foam from a mild detergent. When using a
solvent or dry cleaning product, follow instructions carefully and clean only in & well ventilated room. Avoid any product that contains carbon
tetrachleride or other toxic materials. With either method, pretest a small area before proceeding. -

* Railroaded: This feature allows reduction of seams and enables smoother furniture tailoring.
* All patierns should be upholstered as shown on the card.

FaBri_c “UP THE ROLL" or Fabric “RAILROADED" or
“REGULAR" Position “TOP TQ SELVAGE” Position

Phones {800} 4284415

(317) 2672626
Order Fax (317) 267-2629
Fax (877) 7SAMPLE

www.mayerfabrics.com

E T
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FOU NDATION10 ' Seating Fabric

TECENICAL INFORMATION

Contents: 100% Recycled Polyester Backing: None Repeat: None

Width: 547 Finish: Teflon Directional No

Weight: 13.8 oz./linear yard Cleanability: WS Raiiroaded: No

PERFORMANCE Test Method Results

Surface Abrasion: Heavy Duty X ASTM-D-4157 Wyzenbeek Test Exceeds 1,00,000 Double Rubs

Breaking Strengih: % ASTM-D-5034 Exceeds Warp 337 Ibf/Fifi 324 Ibf
Colorfastness to Crocking: & AATCC-8 Dry: Passes Class 4/Wet: Passes Class 4

Colorfasiness to Light: % AATCC-18A Exceeds 60 Hours

*Class in the colorfasiness requirements is based on a numerical scale of 5 for negligible or no color transfer 1o 1 for very severe color change or color transfer.

FLAMMABILITY &

California Technical Bulletin #117, Section E Passes
NFFA 250 Passes
ASTM E84 . Passges
BIFMA Passes

May comply with California Technical Bulletin 138 when combined with appropriate componenis.

CLEANING INFORMATION

WSE: Water/Solvent Cleansr — Spot clean, with 2 mild solvent, an upholstery shampoo, or the foam from a mild detergent. When using a solvent or dry cleaning
product, foilow instructions carefully and clear only in a well-ventilated room. Avoid any product that contains carbon fetrachloride or other toxic maiterials.

With either method, pretest a small area before proceeding.

TEN YEAR WARRARNTY

FOUNDATION1C is covered by a 10-year limited performance warranty from the date of installation, when used for seating applications. FOUNDATION1D is

warranted against wear through (i.e. the compiete deterioration of the fabric's structure in a particular ares) ¥ praperly installed and maintained. This warranty

does not cover damage due to abuse, misuse, vandalism, inadsquate padding or abrasion from cther seating componenis or furniture, use of improper cieaning
agents or methods and use subseguent to ownership by the original purchaser. Mayer Fabrics can provide a copy of the manufacturer's warranty.

If FOUNDATION10 fails fo perform during to 10-year warranty period, the affected area of f;;_[)ﬁc will be repaired or replaced including labor and materials upon
written request of the customer. i

Except as expressly provided herein, Mayer Fabrics makes no representations or warranties, express or implied, inciuding, without lirmitation, ény warranty of
merchantability or fitness of its products for any particular purpose, and hereby disclaim the same.

CUSTOM CAPABILITIES
PaHerns in the Mayer fine can be custom colored. Please contact Mayer Fabrics for more information.

Please keep this card intact. Individual samples available.
Color maiching: Mayer will always attempt to ship a satisfactory commercial match, Because of industry standard dye lot variation, colors may not match exactly.

T,
i TERRATEX® is a registered trademark of Interface Fabrics Group and designates fabrics that are made from 100% racycled or compostable

:?'a,,, 27 materals using increasingly sustainable manufacturing practices to produce a high quality product that is recyclable at the end of its useful Iife.

MAYERFABRICS

T317.267.2828 or 800.428.4415 £317.257.2629 or 877.7SAMPLE  www.mayerfzbrics.com ssoco  [IHHIHERREIWINNE - so2or
©2003 Mayer-Paetz, Inc,
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TECHNICAL INFORMATION | P34

* Cleaning

WEIthI Pattern " Light- % .., -
Fiber Content “Linear Yd. Repeat Finish Fastness Flammability Code o
100% Infinity Nylon 9 None ' 500 re, n AT E Q

Acrylic Backing Boubie Rubs

B H 260 hrs.

BTy

Exceeds 765,000
Double Rubs

F00% Infiniy Nylon
£er,lic Backing

B W3 Water/Solvent Gleanar - Spot clean, with a mild solvent, an upholstery shampoo, or the foam from a mild detergent. When using a soivent or dry cleaning
product, follow instructions carefully and clean only in a well ventilated room. Avoid any product that containeg carbon tetrachloride or other toxic materials,
With-either method, pretest a small area before procesding.

As a compatible component this fabric may meet the requirements of California Technical Bulletin 133.

INFINITY NYLON™ is covered by a 10 year imited performance warranty from the date of installation, when used for seating applications. Infinity Nylon seating
upholstery fabric is'warranted against wear through (i.e. the complete deterioration of the fabric’s structure in a particutar area) and the loss of colorfastness (ie.
the excessive loss of color due to exposure to light) if properly installed and maintained. This warranty does not cover damage due to abuse, misuse or use of
improper cleaning agents or methods.

If irfinity Nylon seating upholstery fabrics fail to perform as warranted, the affected area of fabiic will be repaired or replaced upon the written reguest of the customer.

Except as expressly provided hersin, Mayer Fabrics makes no representations or warranties, express or implied, including, without limitation, any waranty of merchantability
or fitness of its products for any particular purpose, and hereby disclaims the same.

Patierns in the Mayer upholstery line can be custom colored. Please consult your Mayer representative for more information,

Please keep the card intact. Individua! samples available,
Color matching: Mayer will always attempt to ship a satisfactory commercial match. Because of indusiry standard dye lct variation, colors may not maich exactiy.

MAYERFABRICS

T317.267.2626 or 800.428.4415 F317.267.2629 or B77.7SAMPLE www.mayerfabrics.com  DECGCD |HIMEENEIENHNIAN 60206
©2001 Mayer-Paetz, Inc.
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“Woven Crypton Il Collection b % RN (R

PATTERN FIBER WEIGHT/ PATTERN FINISH SURFACE ABRASION ~ TEMNSILE LIGHT- FLAMMARILTy CLEANING

54~ CONTENT i__KI_N. YO. ) REPEAT o W__YZENBE_E_K _ STRENGTH FASTNESS CODE
BOARDWALK 52% 15.71 oz. 175" H Waven Exceeds 60,000 Warp 213 Lbs. Exceeds Cal. 117-E W
Polyester 126"V Grypton Double Rubs Fill 126 Lbs. 40 Hrs. UFAC
Shown 48% Acrylic BIFMA
Railroaded . NFPA 260
CHECKERS 100% 15.5 oz. 375" H Woven Excesds 60,000 Warp 259 Lbs. Exceeds Cal. 117-F W
Polyester 375" Y Crypton Double Rubs Fill 90 Lbs. 40 Hrs. UFAC
BIFMA
NFPA 260
GEM 100% 15.5 0z, 1"H Woven Exceeds 60,000 Warp 259 Lbs.  Exceeds Cal. 117-E W
Polyester 7y Crypton Double Rubs Fili 190 Lbs. 4] Hrs, UFAC
BiFMA
NFPA 260
LEGEND 100% 15.5 0z. 75" H Wovern Exceeds 60,000 Warp 2569 Lbs.  Exceeds Cal. H17-E W
Polyester g5V Crypton _Double Rubs Filt 190 Lbs. 40 Hrs. UFAG
BIFMAA
. NFPA 260
METRO 100% 12 0z, None Woven Exceeds 150,000 Warp 284.8 Lbs.  Exceeds Cat, 117-E W
Polyester Crypten Doubie Rubs Fifl 196.4 Lbs. 40 Hrs, UFAC
BIFMA
NFPA 260
PARK PLACE 52% 16.24 ¢z, 6.75" H Waven Exceeds 60,000 Warp 223 Lbs. Exceeds Cal. 117-E W
Polyaster 13.5"V Crypton Double Rubs Fill 139 Lbs. 4G Hrs. UFAC
48% Acrylic Random . BIFMA
Match NFPA 260
SUEDE 100% 15 oz. None Woven Exceeds 150,000 Warp 128 Lbs. Excaeds Gal. 117-E W
Polyester Crypton Bouble Rubs Fill 229 Lbs. 40 Hrs. UFAC
BIFMA
NFPA 260
TRACERY 43% 15.5 oz. 45"H Woven Exceeds 50,000 Warp 233 Lbs,  Excesds Cal. 117-E W
Polyester 4687"V  Crypton Double Rubs Fifl 68 Lbs. 40 Hrs. UFAC

56% Cotten BIFMA
NFPA 280

» Cleaning - Generally, stains are removed with plain water and powdered enzyme detergent. Upholstery foam shampoo, water based cleaning
products and germicidal detargents can be used. Be sure to remove all residue from cleaning products with clean water. Do not use solvant

based cleaners or dry cleaning products.

¢ W: Water-Based Cleaner - Spot clean, using the foam only from a water based cleaning agent such as a mild de.tergentvor non-solvernt
upholstery shampoo product. Apply foam with a soft brush in a circular motion. Vacuum when dry.

Pretest a small area before proceeding. )
¢ Railrozded: This feature alfows reduction of seams and enables smoother furniture tailoring.

o All patterns should be upholstered as shown on the card.

Fabric “UP THE ROLL" or Fabric “RAILRDADED” or
"REGULAR" Position “TOP TO SELVAGE” Position

CRYPTON'

SUPER FAZRICS

Phones (800} 428-4415

(317) 2672626
Order Fax (317) 2672629
Fax [877) 7SAMPLE

www.mayerfabrids.com

Jill] A ,mlﬂiﬂfﬂﬂ”ﬂﬂﬁﬂummmﬂ
A Division of Mayer-Paetz Inc.
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“Woven Crypton Collection R L

PATTERN FIBER WEIGHT/ PATTERN FiNigy SURFACE ABRASION  TENSILE LIGHT- FLAMMABILITY CLEANING 7

54" CONTENT LIN. YD. REPEAT WYZEMBEEK STRENGTH FASTNESS CODE
CADENGE 100% 13.58 ¢z 7 H Cryptan Exceeds 70,000 Warp 100 Lbs.  Evceeds Cal. 117-E W
Polyaster 25"V Double Rubs Fill 100 Lbs. 40 Hrs. UFAC

Shown Coated BIFMA
Railroaded NFPA 266
COBBLESTONE 100% 16.16 oz Nong Crypton Exceeds 60,000 Warp 233 Lbs. Exceeds Cal. 117-E W
Polyester Gouble Rubs Fill 257 Lbs. 40 Hrs. UFAG
Coated : BIFMA
N NFPA 260
ECHO 100% 16.05 o0z. 875"H  Crypton Excesds 200,000 Warp 128 Lbs.  Exceeds Cal. 117-E W
Polyester 875V Boubie Rubs Fitt 255 Lbs. A0 Hrs. UFAC
Coated BIFMA
NFPA 260
GINGER 100% 16.05 oz. 875" H Crypion Exceeds 200,000 Warp 129 Lbs. Exceeds Cal. 117-E W
Polyester B757V . Double Rubs Fill 256 Lbs, 40 Hrs. UFAC
Coated . . BIFMA
NFPA 260
GROVE 100% 13.34 0z. 18" H Crypton Exceeds 80,000 Warp 100 Lbs.  Exceeds Cal. 117-E w
Polyester 8.5"V Double Rubs Fill 100 Lbs. 40 Hrs. UFAC
Shown Coated BIFMA
Railroaded NFPA 260
METRIC 100% 17.17 ¢z 5"H Crypton-  Exceeds 100,000 Warp 100 Lbs.  Exceeds Cal. 117-E W
Polyester 25"y Double Rubs Fili 10C Lbs. 40 Hrs. UFAG
Coated BIFRZA
_ NFPA 260
MONET 100% 20220z, 7.0875"H  Crypton Exceeds 60,000 Warp 251 Lbs,  Exceeds Cal. 117-E w
Polyester 675"V Double Rubs Fill 251 Lbs..  40:Hrs. UFAC
Coated . E BIFMA
. NFPA 260
TIDE WATER 100% 17.07 oz 13.5"H Crypion Exteeds 100,000 Warp 100 Lbs. Exceeds - Cal. 117-E ‘W
Polyester 13.625" V Double Rubs Fill 100 Lbs. 4G Hrs. UFAC
Goated BIFMA
) NFPA 260
TUSCANY 106% 16 oz, 7125°H  Crypton - Exceeds 54,000 Warp 143 Lbs. Exceeds Cal. 117-E W
Polyester 13.75" ¥V N Double Rubs Filt 147 Lbs. 40 Hrs. UFAC
Coated ) BIFMMA
NFPA 260

° Cleaning ~ Generally, stains are removed with plain water and powdered enzyme detergent, Upholstery foam shampoo, water based cleaning
products and germicidal detergents can be used. Be sure to remove all residue from cleaning products with clean water. Do not use solvent

based cleaners or dry cleaning products.

° W: Walet-Based Cleaner - Spot clean, using the foam only from & water based cleaning agent such as a mild detergent or non- soivent
upholstery shampoo product. Apply foam with a soft brush in a eircular motion. Vacuum when dry. :

Pretest a small area before proceeding.
¢ Railroaded: This faature allows reduction of seams and enables smoother furniture tailoring.

e A}l patterns should be upholstered as shown on the card.

Fabric “UP THE ROLL” or Fabric “RAILRQADED" or
“REGULAR" Position "TOP T0 SELVAGE" Pestition

CRYPTON

SUFZR FASRICS

Phones (800) 428-4415
(317) 2672626
Order Fax {317} 267-2629
Fax (877} 7SAMPLE
www.mayerfabrics.com

A D:v1ston of Mayer—Paetz Inc
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Pattern

Specifications EMPIRE FANTASY GLAMOUR LAREDO PRIVET SENECA
WIDTH 5 4}} 5 41! 5 4() 5 4}} 54” 5 4”
REPEAT H-%, V1%~ H-63%", V131" no repeat H-63%", V13" H-213", -2~ H-6%", V-2%~
WEIGHT 11.3 ozévd lin 12.4 oz/yd lin 12.4 oz/yd lin 12.4 oz/yd lin 13.7 oz/yd lin 12.4 ozfyd lin
WEAR TESTS
BREAK STRENGTH: Exceeds 50 |bs Exeeeds 50 ibs Exceeds 5C lbs Exceeds 50 Ibs Exceeds 50 Ibs Exceeds 50 Ibs
TEAR RESISTANCE: Exceeds 8 |bs Exceeds 6 Ibs Exceeds 6 lbs Exceeds 6 Ibs Exceeds 6 [bs Exceeds 6 Ibs
SEAM SLIPPAGE: Warp - 30+ Ibs Warp - 30+ Ibs Warp - 30+ Ibs Wa}p 30+ Ibs Warp - 30+ Ibs - Warp - 30+ Ibs
Fill - 30+ Ibs Fiil - 30+ lbs Fill - 30+ lbs Fili - 30+ Ibs Fill - 30+ Ibs  ~ Fill - 30+ Ibs
yem SURFACE 30,000 30,000 30,000 30,000 30,000 30,000
ABRASION: double rubs double rubs double rubs double rubs double rubs double rubs
COLORFASTNESS 40 hours . 40 hours 40 hours 40 hours 40 hours 40 hours
TO LIGHT: Class 4 min. - Class 4 min. Class 4 min, Ciass 4 min. Class 4 min. Class 4 min.
COLORFASTMNESS Wet; Class 4 min. Wet: Class 3 min. Wet: Class 3 min. Wet: Class 3 min. Wet: Ciass 4 min. - Wet: Ctass 3 min.
@ TO CROCKING: Dry: Class 5 rmin. Dry: Class 4 min. Dry: Class 4 min. Dry: Class 4 min. Dry: Cless 5 min. Dry: Class 4 min.
CLEANING CODE: S ~ Clean with Scivent Only
# FLAME RETARDANCY: i, o
+ California 117, Secticn E 0
+ NFPA 260-1989 ,///, 3 SCOTCHGARD.
. Tl =
UFAC Class 1 {\“\ 2
Mush

EXPLANATION OF ACT ICCNS FOR UPHOLSTERY

{FIRE RETARDANGY

Fammabifity {esting defermined as fabric's resistance to burming.
# PASSES
GCalifornia 117

I COLORFASTNESS TO WET.& DRY. GROCKING

Colorfastness fo wet & dry crocking refers o the rubbing off of color fTom the fabric onto clothing, hands or
other materials and can oecur under wet or dry conditicns.

&

PASSES
AATCE 8-1974 Dry Crocking, Class 4 minimum; Wet Crocking, Class 3 minimum

FCOLORFASTNESS TO LIGHT: 3 1170 s ;
Colorfastness fo light is the degree to which fabric will retain its color when exposed to ight.

PASSES
AATCC 16A-1974 or AATCC 16E-1976; Class 4 minimum at 40 hours
NOTE: Class 4 minimurn at 60 hours is recommended for direct sunlight exposure sifvations.

. PHYSICAL PROPERTIES

3 physical properly tests include; brush pill test to determine a fabric's pilling. Breaking/tensile strength
s the ability of & fabric 1o withstand tension without breaking or tearing. Seam siippage is the pulling
apart of fabrics at the seams.

PASSES

Erush Pill ASTM D3511, 34 minimum

Breaking Strength ASTM D3597-D1882-64 (1875} 50 tbs, minimum in warp & weft
Seam Shppage ASTM D3597-D434-75 25 Ibs. misimum in warp & weft

,,;?\s?

ABRAS ON

Abrasion is the ability of a fabric to withstand damage from wear and rubbing. Thers is 2 general contract
specification as well as a heavy duly specification.

PASSES
E General Contract  ASTM 3597 modifiad (310 cotton dusky; 15,000 dovble ubs Wyzenbeek Mathod
Heswy Duty  ASTM 3597 modified (#10 cotton duzky; 30,000 doublz nths Wyzenbeek Method
or ASTM D4366 (with 21 oz weght); 40,000 rubs Martindale Method

P37
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MAYERFABRICS

BIG KISS ALL SEASONS
¢G122

Notes:

G35-28F-0022P

CATEGORY
Seating

CONTENT
100% Vinyl Surface

WIDTH
54“

PROPERTIES

FINISH
PreFixx

DIRECTIONAL
No

REPEAT
None

BACKING
Poly/Cotton Knit

ABRASION RESISTANCE
Exceeds 1,000,000 Double Rubs

CLEANING

P38

WS: Spot clean with water-based cleaning agent, mild solvent or
foam. Follow cleaner instructions carefully. Avoid products with

carbon tetra- chioride or other toxic agents. Professional

cleaning is recommended.

FLAME RESISTANCE

Passes California Technical Bulletin #117, Section E; BIFMA,

NFPA 260; Federal Spec. CID A-A-2950; City of Boston Code; NFPA
701; FAAZ25,853(a); NY & NJ Port Authority Code; FMVSS 302; May
comply with California Technical Bulletin 133 when combined with

appropriate components.

Copyright Mayer Fabrics 2005
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WY Correctional industries
PRi4024

Douglass Fabrics or equal:

Estimated
Annual
Quantity Price Extended
Pattern Name (Yards) Per Yard Price
Athena 35| $14.66 $513.10
Bandeau 20] $20.32 $406.40
Daktari 20f $20.32 $406.40
Empire 50 $10.63 $212.60
Fantasy ogl $11.01 $220.20
Glamour 4o $11.01 $440.40
Hewitt 35 $10.16 $355.60
Hyde 300] $9.50 $2,850,00
Jamboree a5 $11.01 $385.35
Laredo a0 $11.07 $220.20
Neochrome Il 35]  $11.25 $393.75
Privet 50 $13.39 $669.50
Seneca * 20| $11.01 $220.20
Sherpa 5000 $7.95 $3,975.00
{Shire 226 $7.95 $1,788.75
Stryker 20] $20.32 $406.40
Suedegard 20{ $18.66 $373.20
Trio 35| $7.23 $253.05
Whisper 351 $10.25 $358.75
Total Bid $14,448.85
Mayer Fabries or equal:
Estimated
Annual
Quantity Price Extended
Pattern Name (Yards) - PerYard Price
All Seasons ¥ 100} $11.25 $1,125.00
Cape 20 N0 BID
Chelsea 25 NO BID
Clematis - 15 NO BID

*EXACT PRODUCT - DOUGTASS USES THE MANUFACTURERS WAME, COLORGUARD TO MARKET THIS PATTERN,

P38
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Contrex - 75 NC BID
Cosmos 20 NO BID
Courtyard 10 NO BID
Crosstown 10 NC BID
Decade Orion 10 NO BID
Echo 75 NO BID
Foundation 10 25 NG BID
Gem 10 KO BID
Giovanni 10 NO Bib
Grove 10 NO BID
In Motion 15 NO BID
interlochen 45 MO BID
Legend 20 1) BT
Mastertex 5 N0 BID
Monet 30 NO RID
Monsoon 15 NO BEID
Nebula 10 NO BID
Pageant 5 NO BID
Pinstripe NO BID
Pisces NO BID
Taj 125 N0 BID
Tidewater 5 MO BID
Tuscany 10 o BID
Wooltex 10 O EBID
Total Bid $1,125.00
Grand Total Bid $15,573.85

P48
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P41
RFQ No, FR14024

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
Purchasing Division

PURCHASING AFFIDAVIT

West Virginia Code §5A-3-10a states: No contract or renewal of any contract may be awarded by the state or
any of its political subdivisions to any vendor or prospective vendor when the vendor or prospective vendor or
a related party to the vendor or prospective vendor is a debtor and the debt owned is an amount greater than
one thousand dollars in the aggregate

DEFINITIONS:

“Debt” means any assessment, premium, penalty, fine, tax or other amount of money owed to the state or any
of its political subdivisions because of a judgment, fine, permit violation, license assessment, defaulted
workers’ compensation premium, penalty or other assessment presently delinquent or due and required to be
paid to the state or any of its political subdivisions, including any interest or additional penalties accrued
thereon.

“‘Debtor” means any individual, corporation, partnership, association, limited liability company or any other form
or business association owing a debt to the state or any of its poliitical subdivisions. “Political subdivision”
means any county commission; municipality; county board of education; any instrumentality established by a
county or municipality; any separate corporation or instrumentality established by one or more counties or
municipalities, as permitted by law; or any public body charged by law with the performance of a government
function or whose jurisdiction is coextensive with one or more counties or municipalities. “Related parly” means
a party, whether an individual, corporation, partnership, association, limited liability company or any other form
or business association or other entity whatsoever, related to any vendor by blood, marriage, ownership or
contract through which the party has a relationship of ownership or other interest with the vendor so that the
party will actually or by effect receive or control a portion of the benefit, profit or other consideration from
performance of a vendor contract with the party receiving an amount that meets or exceed five percent of the
total contract amount.

EXCEPTION: The prohibition of this section does not apply where a vendor has contested any tax
administered pursuant to chapter eleven of this code, workers' compensation premium, permit fee or
environmental fee or assessment and the matter has not become final or where the vendor has entered into a
payment plan or agreement and the vendor is not in default of any of the provisions of such plan or agreement.

LICENSING: Vendors must be licensed and in good standing in accordance with any and all state and local
laws and requirements by any state or local agency of West Virginia, including, but not fimited o, the West
Virginia Secretary of State’s Office, the West Virginia Tax Department, West Virginia Insurance Commission,
or any other state agencies or political subdivision. Furthermore, the vendor must provide all necessary
releases to obtain information to enable the Director or spending unit to verify that the vendor is licensed and in
good standing with the above entities.

CONFIDENTIALITY: The vendor agrees that he or she will not disclose to anyone, directly or indirectly, any
such personally identifiable information or other confidential information gained from the agency, unless the
individual who is the subject of the information consents to the disclosure in writing or the disclosure is made
pursuant to the agency's policies, procedures and rules. Vendors should visit www.state.wv.us/
admin/purchase/privacy for the Notice of Agency Confidentiality Policies.

Under penalty of law for false swearing (West Virginia Coffe, §61-5-3), it is hereby certified that the vendor
acknowledges the information in this said affidavit and areg/fh compliance with the requirements as stated.

Vendor's Name:’ Douglas,{]industries, Inc. s

A
Authorized Signature://éé{MM W\-”_g/ #te: June 1, 2007
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