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State of West Virginia RequeSt for e wommEER T T PAGE T
Department of Administration  Quotation PRI3Z793% >
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charlesfon, WV 25305-0130 JOHN ABROTT
204-558-2h464

¥612140807 01 920-468-2173
OEI DIVISION KRUEGER INTERNATI
PO BDX 8400

WV PRISON INDUSTRIES

617 LEON SULLIVAN WAY
CHARLESTON, WV
25301 304-558-2945

GREEN BAY WI 54308-8400

06/22/2007
BIiD OPENING DATE:

05/09/2007 BID

UNLESS SPECIFIC PROVIS|IONS ARE STIPULATED ELSEWHERE
IN THIS CONTRACT [DOCUMENT, THE TERMS, [CONDITIONS AND
PRICING SET HEREIN ARE| FIRM FOR THE LIFE OF THE
CONTRACT.

RENEWAL: THIS CONTRACT; MAY BE RENEWED UPON THE MUTUAL
WRITTEN CONSENT OF THE| SPENDING UNIT AND VENDOR,
SUBMITTED 7O THE DIRECTOR OF FPURCHASING THIRTY (30)
DAYS PRIOR T0 THE| EXPIRATION DATE. SUCH RENEWAL SHALL
BE IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF THE
ORIGINAL CONTRACT| AND [SHALL BE LIMITED| TO TWO (2) ONE
(1) YEAR PERIODS.

CANCELLATION: THE; DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING RESERVES THE
RIGHT TO CANECEL TFIS CIONTRACT IMMEDIATELY UPON WRITTEN

NOTICE TO THE VENDOR IF THE COMMODITIES AND/OR SERVICES
SUPPLIED ARE| OF AN INFERIOR QUALITY OR| DO NOT CONFORM
TO0 THE SPECIFICATIIONS [DF THE BID AND CONTRACT HEREIN.

OPEN MARKET CLAUSE: THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING MAY
AUTHORIZE A [SPENDING UNIT TO PURCHASE |ON THE OPEN
MARKET, WITHOUT THE FILING OF A REQUISITION OR COST
ESTIMATE, ITEMS SPECIFIED ON THIS CONTRACT FOR
IMMEDIATE DELIVERY IN EMERGENCIES DUE [TO UNFORESEEN
CAUSES (INCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED TO DELAYS IN TRANS-
PORTATION OR| AN UNANTICIPATED INCREASE, IN THE VOLUME
0F WORK.) '

QUANTITIES: QUANTIITIES! LISTED IN THE REQUISITION ARE
APPROXIMATIONS ONLY, BASED ON ESTIMATES SUPPLIED BY
THE STATE SPENDING UNIT. IT IS UNDERS[TOOD AND AGREED
THAT THE CONTRACT| SHALL COVER THE QUANTITIES ACTUALLY
ORDERED FOR DELIVERY DURING THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT,
WHETHER MORE| OR LESS THAN THE QUANTITIES SHOWN.

ORDERING PROCEDURE: SPENDING UNIT(S) SHALL ISSUE A

B ‘SEE BEVERSE SIDE FORTERMS AND CONDITIONS
. o - TELEPHON‘E T ] DATE
Kelly J. Andersen - see page 6 signature 920-468-2173 05/07/07
TIT] .
Controller/Asst Secretary — 39-1375589 ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE
WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'
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Kellv J, Andersen — see page 6 signature
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05/07/07
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Controller/Asst Secretary|

FEIN

39-~1375589

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'
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State of West Virginia Request for m———mowmwer= ST PAGE T
Department of Administration  Quotation PRI3Z793 4
Purchasing Division .
2019 Washington Street East T ADDRESS CORRESPONDENCE TO ALIENTON OF ]
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130 JOHN ABBODTT

3046-558-2h4664

¥612140807 01 920-468-2173
OEI DIVISION KRUEGER INTERNATI
PO BOX 8400

WV PRISON INDUSTRIES

617 LEON SULLIVAN WAY
CHARLESTON, WV
25301 304-558-2945

GREEN BAY WI 54308-8400

ATEPRINTED

04/22/2007
BID OPENING DATE: 05/09/2007 BID OPENING TI(ME

ERMS OF SALE

G1:30PM

WEST VIRGINIA FOR| FOUR| (4) YEARS IMMEDIIATELY PRECEDING
THE DATE OF {THIS CERTIFICATION; GOR 80% OF THE OWNERSHIP|:
INTEREST OF BIDDER IS HELD BY ANOTHER [INDIVIDUAL, '
PARTNERSHIP, ASSOCTATION OR CORPORATION RESIDENT VENDOR
WHO HAS MAINTAINED ITS HEADQUARTERS OR; PRINCIPAL PLACE
OF BUSINESS CONTINUOUSLY IN WEST VIRGINIA FOR FOUR (4)
YEARS IMMEDIATELY| PRECEDING THE DATE OF THIS
CERTIFICATION; DR

( ) BIDDER| IS A CORPORATION NONRESIDENT VENDOR
WHICH HAS AN AFFILIATEl OR SUBSIDIARY WHICH EMPLOYS

A MINIMUM OF ONE HUNDRED STATE RESIDENTS AND WHICH
HAS MAINTAINED ITS HEAQUARTERS OR PRINCIPAL PLACE OF
BUSINESS WITHIN WEST VIRGINIA CONTINUQUSLY FOR THE
FOUR (4} YEARS IMMEDIATELY PRECEDING THE DATE OF THIS
CERTIFICATION.

B. APPLICATIION IS MADE FOR 2.5% PREFERENCE FOR THE
REASON CHECKED:

( > BIDDER IS Al RESIDENT VENDDR WHO |[CERTIFIES THAT,
DURING THE LIFE OF THE| CONTRACT, ON AVERAGE AT LEAST
75% OF THE EMPLOYEES WORKING ON THE PROJECT BEING BID
ARE RESIDENTIS OF WEST VIRGINIA WHO HAVE RESIDED IN
THE STATE CONTINUQUSLY| FOR THE TWO YEARS IMMEDIATELY
PRECEDING SUBMISSION OF THIS BID;
OR '
( > BIDDER IS A NONRESIDENT VENDOR EMPLOYING A
MINIMUM OF ONE HUNDRED| STATE RESIDENTS| OR IS A
NONRESIDENT VENDOR WITH AN AFFILIATE OR SUBSIDIARY
WHICH MAINTAINS ITS HEADQUARTERS OR PR[INCIPAL PLACE
OF BUSINESS WITHIN WES[T VIRGINIA EMPLOYING A MINIMUM
OF ONE HUNDRED STATE RESIDENTS WHD CERTIFIES THAT,
DURING THE L|IFE OF THE| CONTRACT, ON AVERAGE AT LEAST -
75% OF THE EMPLOYEES OR BIDDERS'™ AFFIL|TATE'S OR
SUBSIDIARY'S| EMPLOYEES| ARE RESIDENTS OF WEST VIRGINIA

STENATURE s - _ TELEPHONE D
Kellv J. Andersepn - see page 6 signature 920-468-2173 05/07/07

TITLE FEIN .
Controller/Asst Secretar 39-137558¢% ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED VENDOR'
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State of West Virginia ReCIuest for o mmovwEE T CPAGE L
Department of Administration  Quotation PRIZ793 5
Purchasing Division

2019 Washinglon Street East
Post Office Box 50130

Charleston, WV 25305-0130 JOHN ABBOTT
3NG-558-25466

x612140807 01 220-468-2173
OETI DIVISION KRUEGER INTERNATI
PO BOX 8400

WV PRISON IMDUSTRIES

617 LEON SULLIVAN WAY
CHARLESTON, WV
25301 306-558-2945

GREEN BAY WI 54308-8400

\TEPRINTED.
04/22/2007
BID CPENING DATE: 05/09/2007 BID OPENING TIME  01:30PM

. WHO HAVE RESIDED IN THE STATE CONTINUOUSLY FOR THE TWO
YEARS IMMEDIATELY; PRECEDING SUBMISSION OF THIS BID.

BIDDER UNDERISTANDS IF [THE SECRETARY OF| TAX & REVENUE
DETERMINES THAT Al BIDDER RECEIVING PREFERENCE HAS
FAILED TO CONTINUE TO MEET THE REQUIREMENTS FOR SUCH
PREFERENCE, THE SECRETARY MAY ORDER THE DIRECTOR OF
PURCHASING T0: (A) RESCIND THE CONTRACT OR PURCHASE
ORDER ISSUED;; OR {(B) ASSESS. A PENALTY AGAINST SUCH
BIDDER IN AN AMOUNT NOT TO EXCEED 5% OF THE BID AMOUNT
AND THAT SUCH PENALTY WILL BE PAID TOQ |[THE CONTRACTING
AGENCY OR DEDPUCTED FROM ANY UNPAID BALANCE ON THE
CONTRACT OR PURCHASE CRDER. B

BY SUBMISSION OF {THIS CERTIFICATE, BIDDER AGREES TO
DISCLOSE ANY| REASONABLY REQUESTED INFORMATION TO THE
PURCHASING DIVISION AND AUTHORIZES THE| DEPARTMENT ODF
TAX AND REVENUE TP DISCLOSE TOD THE DIRECTOR OF
PURCHASING APPROPRIATE| INFORMATION VER[IFYING THAT
BIDDER HAS PAID THE REQUIRED BUSINESS TAXES, PROVIDED
THAT SUCH INFORMATION DDES NOT CONTAIN THE AMOUNTS OF
TAXES PAID NOR ANY OTHER INFORMATION DEEMED BY THE TAX
COMMISSIONER; TO BE CONFIDENTIAL.

UNDER PENALTY OF {LAW FOR FALSE SWEARINIE (WEST VIRGINIA
CODE 61-5-33|, BIDDER HEREBY CERTIFIES THAT THIS
CERTIFICATE |IS TRUE AND ACCURATE IN AL[L RESPECTS; AND
THAT IF A CONTRACT IS |[ISSUED TO BIDDER| AND IF ANYTHING
CONTAINED WITHIN [THIS CERTIFICATE CHANGES DURING THE
TERM OF THE CCONTRACT, BIDDER WILL NOTIFY THE PURCHASIN
DIVISION IN WRITING IMMEDIATELY. '

OEI Division,
BIDDER: -frueger Interngriomal, Ine. ______

EE REVERSE SIDE FOR 1 ERMS AND CONDITIONS - -
TELEPHONE DATE

RKell¥ J. Andersen — see page 6 signature 920-468-2173 05/05/07
¥ .
E%%troller/Asst Secretaryﬁm39~1375589 ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABCOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'
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State of West Virginia Request for —rovwmwEER— T PAGE T
Department of Administration  Quotation PRI3793 6
Purchasing Division '
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130

Charleston, WV 25305-0130 JOHN ABBOTT
3046-5Kh8-2K46G

¥612140807 01 920-468-2173
OEI DIVISION KRUEGER INTERNATI
PC BOX 840D

WV PRISON INDUSTRIES

617 LEON SULLIVAN WAY
CHARLESTON, WV
25301 504-558-2945

GREEN BAY WI 54308-8400

DATE + _.__95/_0_7.,/92 ________________ e

‘ ")
STENED : _/ @’4«:—:—_’: ___________

TITLE[: -——-== i s o oL e

- ¢ CHECK ANY [COMBEINATION OF PREFERENCE [CONSIDERATIGN(S)

IN EITHER "AM™ OR ["BY™, [OR BOTH ™A™ AND |"B"™ WHICH YOU ARE
ENTITLED TO RECEIVE. |[YOU MAY REQUEST UP TO THE MAXIMUM
5% PREFERENCE FOR| BOTH| ™A™ AND “B"™.
(REV. 12/00)
NOTICE

A SIGNED BID MUST| BE SUBMITTED TO:

DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATICN
PURCHAS|ING DIVISION

BUILDINgE 15
2019 WASHINGTON S[TREET, EAST
CHARLESTON, WV 25305-0130

THE BID SHOULD CONTAIN THIS INFORMATION ON THE FACE OF
THE ENVELOPE| OR THE BID MAY NOT BE CONSIDERED:

SEALED BID

BUYER: JOHN ABBOTT~—wfemme e o —
RFQ. NO.: PRIZ793~---—~-|mrmmmmommmo oo m e

- SEE BEVERSE SIDEFORTERMS AND CONDITION

SN TELEPHONE DATE
Kelly J. Andersen - see signature above 920-468-2173 05/07/07
TITLE FEIN
Controller/Asst Secretary 39-1375589 ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'
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State of West Virginia Request for e L AP NUMBER T TTTPAGE T
Department of Administration  Quotation PRI3793 7
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East L ADDRESE CORRESIONDENCE TUATIENTIONGR, 7
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130 JOHN ABBOTT

306-558-2544

¥612140807 01 928-468-2173
OEI DIVISION KRUEGER INTERNATI
PO BOX 8400

WV PRISON INDUSTRIES

GREEN BAY WI 54308-8400 617 LEDON SULLIVAN WAY
CHARLESTON, WV

25301 304-558-2945

SPRINTE
06/22/2007
BID OPENING DATE:

BID OPENING [DATE: 05/09/2007---——-—=---—-————-——-

BID OPENING TIME: 1230 PMommmmm oo oo

PILLEASE PROVIDE A FAX NUMBER IN CASE IT IS NECESSARY
TO CONTACT YOU REGARDING YOUR BID:

Fax Numbdr: 920-468-2633

CONTACT PERSIDN (PLEASE; PRINT CLEARLY):
Jeff Tebon -+ Phong:920-468-2173

xxxxxx THIS IS THE END OF RFQ PRI3793 *xxxxx TOTAL:

T T SEE REVERSE SIDE FOR TERIS AND CONDITIONS
SIGNATURE ITELEPHONE DATE

Kelly J. Andersen — see page 6. signature 920-468-2173 05/07/07
TITLE
Controller/Asst Secretary — 39-1375589 ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'
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P8

WV Correctional Industries
PRI3793

WYV Correctional Industries (WVCI) hereby solicits bids for seating components and kits, to be

manufactured by WVCL

1. All items bid must be in “kit form”.

2. WVCI reserves the right to award in whole, in part or as 2 multiple vendor contracts.

3. Vendor shall indicate by chair all interchangeable parts among the various series of
seating being bid.

4. Vendor shall provide digital brochures to WVCI for marketing purposes. If digital
images are not available, vendor shall provide 1,000 brochures of each series at no
additional charge to WVCL

5. All components are specified as brand name or equal. These spemﬁcations are meant to
establish a minimum quality acceptable within our anticipated price range. If a vendor is
bidding an equal or alternate, they must submit specifications and a color brochure
depicting the style of seating. WVCI further reserves the right to request a sample of
each chair to be used for evaluation purposes. Sample chairs will be returned to the
submitting vendor.

6. Vendor shall indicate and price any optional features, parts, etc. for any of the seating

products being bid.

. Vendor shall state any minimum order requzrements

. All chair kits and components must meet or exceed AN SI/BIFMA and California 117

flammability test.

9. All chair kits and components shall be shipped FOB Destination to:

WYV Correctional Industries
Pruntytown Correctional Center
- WV Highway 250 South
Grafton, WV 26354
All deliveries must be made in a 28 or smaller trailer.
10, Alternate Delivery Site:

o0 =~

WYV Correctional Industries
Lakin Correctional Center
11264 Ohio River Road

West Columbia, WV 25287

11. Price Adjustments: The vendor may request a price increase 30 days prior to the
expiration of the contract, in writing, to the Director of Purchasing. The contract price
may be adjusted in accordance with the change in the Producer Price Index (PPI) for
Product Code WPU122203, Furniture and Household Durables, Furniture). Price
adjustments will be made in accordance with the percentage change in the PPI. It is the
vendor’s responsibility to request this adjustment to price. Requests shall include a copy.
of the relevant index and must be within the allowed time period for adjustment. Any
adjustments authorized as a result of the adjustment request will not be retroactive.

12. WVl reserves the right to award multiple vendor contracts. Multiple awards will be
made by seating series, not individual seating kits. - |

(i g
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Original Line Series or Equai

EXECUTIVE CHAIRS:

Heavy duty swivel tilt control, formed and pinned construction with tension adjustment.

Base - Anti-tip 5 leg chrome (25” leg span)

Caster - 50mm nylon hooder, black, FB mounting-soft caster optional

Wood Seat - 5 ply poplar, %” with 36” radius bend, 20” wide, Executive Low Back — 16
Yy deep, Executive High Back — 23” deep

Seat Foam - High resiliency shall meet California fire standards technical bulletin #117,
specs 37 thick, 18 1 x 22 34 &
Back Foam - High resiliency shall meet California fire standards technical bulletin #117,
specs 37 thick, 22 3" x 18 34" -

Arms - 14 gauge 10/20 high strength steel, 17 diameter plating quality (chrome plated or
electrostatically powder coated). Arm wood — solid oak or walnut finished and routed
with inserts or solid maple with foam cushion for upholstery.

SIDE CHAIRS — ARM/ARMLESS:

Frame — 14 gange 10/20 high strength steel, 1 diameter plating quality (chrome plated or
electrostatically powder coated)

Wood Seats — 5 ply poplar 14" with 36" radius bend 21 2 wide 17 74" deep

Wood Backs — 5 ply poplar ¥2” with 36” radius bend 20” wide 16 4" deep

Seat Foam - High resiliency shall meet California fire standards 22 %" technical bulletin
#117,2” thick 18 127 x 22 34"

Back Foam — High resiliency shall meet California fire standards technical bulletin #117,
specs 2” thick 18 14”7 x 22 %47,

il




Comfort Line Series or Equal

HIGH BACK CHAIRS:
= 50mm dual wheel caster with brass grip ring for ease of insertion and for maximum
holding power
= 5leg 25” die cast aluminum polished of black ESTHEILD — will also accept optional oak
wood caps

Gas cylinder with lever has a height adjustment of 3 and range of 17-20 inches

3 pc telecover for black option

Swivel tilt control with infinite position tilt lock and forward lockout

One piece inner frame made of 14 gauge cr steel tubing

Seat and back long life comfort band treated to exceed flammability requirements — the
comfort band is made up of rubber thread spiral wrapped with cotton yarn — the cords are
weaved together with polypropylene then coated and dried

Seat foam — dimension 24 % w x 22 d x 2tk density 2.6-2.8

Inside Back Foam ~ dimension 23 %2 w x 24 2 h x 2tk density 1.8-1.9

QOutside Back Foam — dimension 20 % w x 24 h x 1/2tk density 1.8-1.9

Tilt tension adjustable for 125 ibs to 350 lbs. occupant

Arms — Pair of 14 gauge 1” plating quality tubular arm in chrome or black — arm attaches
to seat mounting bracket. Arm caps of solid oak, walnut or upholstered. Optional soft
urethane looped arm, optional horizontal and vertical adjustable T-arm, and optional
horizontal and vertical adjustable T-arm with swivel tilt arm pad.

LOW BACK CHAIRS:

*  50mm dual wheel caster with brass grip ring for ease of insertion and for maximum
holding power

» 5 leg 257 aluminum base available polished or black — will also accept optional oak wood
caps

Gas cylinder with lever has a beight adjustment of 3” and range or 17-20 inches

3 pe telecover for black option

Swivel tilt control with infinite position tilt lock and forward tilt lockout

One piece inner frame made of 14 gauge cr steel tubing

Seat and back long life comfort band treated to exceed flammability requirements — the
comfort band is made up of rubber thread spiral wrapped with cotton yarn — the cords are
weaved together with polypropylene then coated and dried

Seat foam — dimension 24 ¥» w x 22 d x 2tk density 2.6-2.8

Inside Back Foam — dimension 23 % w x 20 ¥ h x 2tk density 1.8-1.9

Outside Back Foam — dimension 20 % w x 18 1/2 h x 1/2tk density 1.8-1.9

Tilt tension adjustable for 125 Ibs to 350 lbs. occupant

Arms — pair of 14 gauge 17 plating quality tubular armm in chrome or black — arm attaches
to seat mounting bracket, Arm caps of solid oak, walnut or upholstered. Optional soft
urethane looped arm, optional adjustable looped arm, optional adjustable T-arm, or
optional adjustable T-arm with swivel tilt arm pad.

P10
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P11

GUEST CHAIRS:

Arm frame of 14 gauge 17 plating quality tubing standard in chrome of powder coated
black

Arm wood of solid oak, walnut or upholstered

One piece inner frame of 14 gauge cr steel tubing

Seat and back long life comfort band treated to exceed flammability requirement — the
comfort band is made up of rubber thread spiral wrapped with cotton yarn — the cords are
weaved together with polypropylene then coated and dried

Seat foam — dimension 24 ¥ w x 22 d x 2tk density 2.6-2.8

Inside back foam — dimension 23 2 w x 20 %2 h x 2tk density 1.8-1.9

Outside back foam - dimension 20 % w x 18 % h x %tk density 1.8-1.9

Without arms — armless frame of 14 gauge 17 plating quality tubing standard in chrome
or powder coated black — no wood arm

OPERATOR TASK CHAIRS:

50mm dual wheel caster with brass grip ring for ease of insertion and for maximum
holding power

5 leg steel base with 22” overlay ~ standard is black

Gas cylinder with lever has a height adjustment of 4” and range of 16-21 mches

Back and seat angles adjustable independently with infinite position locks

Seat wood — size 17 % w x 16 d x 1/2tk — curved 7-ply poplar with waterfall front

Seat foam — dimension 19 w x 17 % d x 2tk density 3.0-3.25

Black adjustable height back upright with back hinge set

Back wood —size 15 % w x 14 5/8 h x 1/2tk — curved 5-ply poplar wood for easy staphng
Back foam — dimension 17 w x 15 5/8 hx 1 1/2tk density 1.8-1.9

Optional back treatment of black plastic

Hardware

Arms — pair of black flat ¥4” x 2 14" bar steel arms which attach directly to the seat — the
arms to be adjustable horizontally. Optional vertically and horizontally adjustable arms

gl il
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TUF Line Series or Equal

TUF LINE CHAIRS:

50mm dual wheel caster with brass grip ring for ease of insertion and for maximum
holding power
Base - #1 and #2 - 5 leg 227 steel with plastlc overlay; #3 — 257 steel with plastic overlay
Gas cylinder — 17-4 taper 45mm has a range of 5, seat height adjustment — 16 to 21 ¥
Control — Northfield T3001, front cushion stop, with infinite position tilt lock may be
locked in any position. Front tilt to 6 3% - rear tilt to 9 4%, with infinite position back
angle adjustment lock tilt tension adjustable for 125 Ibs to 350 Ibs occupant
Seat wood — non formaldehyde glue - %" thick 7-layer poplar plywood with waterfall
front: #1 17 %7 x 167, #2-19 /8" x 17", #3-21"x 18"
Back wood — non—formaldehyde glue ¥4 5 layer poplar plywood #1 - 15%"x145/8"x
Wi H2 and #3 - 17 Y x 17 5/8” x %"
Foam passes CA 117
Seat foam — minimum density of 3.0. #1 - 18 %’ x 18 4" x 2, #2 - 20 %7 x 19 17 x 2™,
#3--22%"x20%"x2”
Back foam — minimum density of 1.7 and lumbar pad
Back upright — ¥4 x 2 14" steel with hinge set
Standard arms — black 14" x 2 14" steel — attach divectly to seat wood. Adjustable both
vertically and horizontally - soft urethane arm pads, standard black.
Optional:

o Armless ,

o Soft casters-dual wheel caster with brass grip for ease of insertion and for
maximum holding power
Mechanical adjustable lumbar
Swivel tilt arm pads
Heavy duty control
Seat Slider
Highback 22.5”

O 0000

TUF GRANDE CHAIRS:

50mm dual wheel caster with brass grip ring for ease of insertion and for maximum
holding power

Meets or exceeds all ANSI/BIFMA requirements

99528 Intensive Use Aluminum Base. Meets or exceeds all “Intensive Use” test
requirements, in addition to all ANSI/BIFMA test requlrements

Base overall diameter of 28.88”

50mm gas cylinder or 45mm gas cylinder in textured powder coat

Gas lift 17-4 taper, black with exposed length of 2.6” and travel of 2.95”

Seat wood is 23 w by 20” d, %" overall thickness with 9 layer hardwood plywood

N
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Seat foam is 23 ¥4” x 23 5/8” x 4 ¥4 dual density foam, passes applicable CAL 117
flammability test -
Back wood is 23 ¥4 h x 18 5/8” w, matenal is 5/8" thick w1th 7 layer hardwood plywood
Back foam is 29 1" x 24 5/8 x 4 ¥ triple density foam, passes applicable CAL 117 for
flammability test.

Mechanism meets or exceeds all ANSI/BIFMA test requirements and must provide a full
21 degree range of motion with infinite position tilt lock and provide a forward tilt stop
feature, which when activated, limits the forward travel of the mechanism to 0 degrees

and when not activated, permits the mechanism to tilt forward to an additional 6 degrees.
Provides spring tension adjustment. Provides 2.25” of back depth adjustment and utilize

a 17-4 gas taper. Tilt tension adjustable for 125 lbs to 350 1bs occupant.

Back Upright J shaped utilizes 1035 carbon content steel with 37 width _
Ergomatic arm height adjusts 2 ¥ vertically and utilizes a heavy duty urethane loop arm
cap with 2 ¥ arm width adjustment.

(IR
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Sofline Series or Equal

SOFLINE ADVANCED TASK CHAIRS:

= Pneumatic height adjustment from 16 210 20 %

= Control to contain the following features:

o Gas lift adjustment to activate pneumatic lift

Control swivels and tilts

Tilt tension adjustment handwheel

Seat to back angle is adjustable and can be locked at any pomt in the range

Seat tilt angle is adjustable and can be located at any point in the range

6 degrees forward seat tilt when activated by lockout lever

Seat tilt lock

Black matte finish including telescoping black cover over pneumatic lift

Seat depth adjustment 2 %" travel in %” increments with activation lever under

the front of the seat

» Seatsize 18°dx 20” wor 19”7 d x 21 2" w (upholstered). Ergonomically contoured }2”
thick, 7 ply hardwood laminate inner seat with waterfall front and threaded steel fasteners
for arms and mechanism. 3 %” thick, multi-density, multiple IFD, fabricated
polyurethane foam.

» Backsize 16”hx 17" w, 20" hx 18" w, 24" h x 19” w or 28" h x 20” w (upholstered).
157 thick, 7 ply hardwood laminate inner seat, ergonomically contoured horizontally and
vertically with threaded steel fasteners. 2 %” thick, multi-density, multi-IFD, fabricated
polyurethane foam. 7

» Ratchet-type back height adjustment mechanism with 2 %" travel in 7 increments and 3”
x .25” steel back upright. Back height above seat: 16 to 18 %2 inches

*  55mm dual wheel hooded carpet casters with 45mm barrel and 7/16”x7/8” stem with

- locking ring

= S-leg integrally colored high performance polymer base. 25” caster center diameter.
Black matte finish

* Optional headrest for 24” and 28" backs, with height and angle adjustment and molded
polyurethane foam cushion.

00 0O00O0O0C

SOFLINE OFFICE DELUXE CHAIRS:

= Pneumatic height adjustment ~ Seat height from 16 % to 21 inches
» Control to contain the following features:
o Gas lift adjustment to activate pneumatic lift
Control swivels and tilts with a knee-tilt action
Tilt tension adjustment handwheel
Seat-to-back angle is adjustable and can be locked at any point in the range
Tilt lock moves to any desired position and then lock in place _
Black matte finish including telescoping black cover over pneumatic lift
Seat depth adjustment 2 ¥4 travel in 1/2” increments with activation lever under
the front of the seat

00000
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Seat size 187 d x 20” wor 19” d x 21 %" w (upholstered). Ergonomically contoured }2”

thick, 7 ply hardwood laminate inner seat with waterfall front and threaded steel fasteners ———— ..

for arms and mechanism. 3 %” thick, multi-density, multiple IFD, fabricated
polyurethane foam.

Back size 20” hx 18” w, 24" h x 19” w, or 28” h x 20" w (upholstered). }2” thick, 7 ply
hardwood laminate inner seat, ergonomically contoured horizontally and vertically with
threaded steel fasteners. 2 ¥%” thick, multi-density, multi-IFD, fabricated polyurethane
foam.

Ratchet type back height adjustment mechanism with 2 %" travels in 7 increments and 3”
x .25” steel back upright. Back height above seat: 16 to 18 V2 inches.

55mm dual wheel hooded carpet casters with 45mm barrel and 7/16” x 7/8” stem with
locking ring.

5-leg integrally colored high performance polymer base 25” caster center diameter.
Black matte finish.

Optional headrest for 24" and 28” backs, with height and angle adjustment and molded
polyurethane foam cushion.

SOFLINE ECONO TASK CHAIR:

Pneumatic height adjustment — Seat height from 14 %7 10 18 %~
Control to contain the following features:

o Gas lift adjustment to activate pneumatic lift
Control swivels S
Forward and rearward seat tilt adjustment
Forward and rearward back angle adjustment
Seat and back angle lock — moves 1o any desired position and then lock in place
with a single lever. Remains locked except when being adjusted

o Black matte finish including telescoping black cover over pneumatic lift
Seat size 18.5” d x 19.5” w (upholstered). Ergonomically contoured high strength
polymer inner seat with waterfall front and threaded metal fasteners for arms and
mechanism. 2.5” thick, 48 Ib. IFD polyurethane foam.
Back size 16” h x 17.5” w (upholstered). Impact resistant polymer inner back,
ergonomically contoured horizontally and vertically w1th threaded metal fasteners. 1.75”
thick, 35 Ib. IFD, polyurethane foam.
Ratchet type back height adjustment mechanism with 2 2" travels in 7 increments and 3”
x .25 steel back upright. Back height above seat: 16 to 18 % inches
55mm dual wheel hooded carpet casters with 45mm barrel and 7/16”x7/8” stem with
locking ring.
5-ieg integrally colored high perfonna:nce polymer base. 25” caster center diameter.
Black matte finish.
Seat depth adjustment option: 2 15" travels in 14" mcrements with activation lever under
the front of the seat. _
Stool version must be available with drafting height option and adjustable foot ring.

O 00O

SOFLINE VISITOR CHAIR:

Seat size 18”7 d x. 22” w (upholstered). Ergonomically contoured % thick, 7 ply
hardwood laminate inner seat with waterfall front and threaded steel fasteners for
attaching arms and base. 2” thick, 48 Ib. IFD, polyurethane foam.

8
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Back size 177 h x 217 w (upholstered). %2> thick, 7 ply hardwood laminate innerback,

- ergonomically contoured-horizontally and-vertically-with threaded steel fasteners.-27- -~ -~ ———--

thick, 35 1b IFD, fabricated polyurethane foam.
Sled base made of 1” diameter x 16 gauge steel tube with chrome or black epoxy finish.
Breathe Series or Equal

Breathe Chairs — Task and Guest:

Backrest Outer Frame PP fiber

Backrest Inner Frame PP

Backrest First Layer Mesh 100% Polyester

Backrest Second Layer Mesh 100% Nylon

Seat Shell PP

Plywood Thickness: 9/16”

Seat Foam PU Thickness: 3” :

Lumbar Support Foam PU Thickness: 1 n”

Knee Synchron tilt mechanism, Metal, Thickness: 5Sm/m, Finish-Coating, Function —
Seat: 16°Back: 26° with 5-position locking function

Gas Lift, Metal, Thickness: 2.5m/m, Function — travel 3”

Gas Lift Outer Tube, Metal, Diameter 2” x 1.6m/m x L 6 7/8”, Powder Coating
Base, Aluminum, Depth 27 27, Powder Coating

Caster, Nylon #6, Dimension 45/60

Armrest, Metal + Nylon, Height Adjustable 2 ¥%4”

Armrest PU Pad, PVC 30%; PU 30%; ABS 40%

Sled Base, if applicable, Steel, Diameter 1 ¥4 x 2.3m/m (3/32”), Powder Coating
Breathable Mesh Back

Back Flex

Variable Position Back Lock

Lumbar Adjustment

Adjustable Arm Option

Heavy Duty Die Cast Base

M {8
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_ Instyle Series or Equal'

INSTYLE CHAIRS:

Stackable

Chrome or Black frames
Plastic backs
Dimensions with arms:

o

0O 000

O

Overall width 24”

Overall height 32 %"

Seat Depth 17 12

Seat Width 17 %%~

Weight 15 lbs

Textured polypropylene black arms

Dimensions without arms:

O

O 0 00

Overall width 19 4"
Overall height 32 14"
Seat Depth 17 157
Seat Width 17 %"
Weight 12 Tbs

10
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Item #

Description

WV Correctional Industries

PRI3793
Estimated : : Volume/Skid
Annual Unit * Extended Unit
Quantities Pricing Price Pricing ¥

** Extended
Price

ICF-103 Jr. Executive Chair $ xoBrD |$ $ $
ICF-104 Executive Chair 30 $ No BID I§ $ $
ICF-105 High Back Executive Chair 75 $ %o BID |$ [ $
ICF-106 Side Chair 120 {$ No BID _|§ $ $

Opera’tor Task Chalr'

BiD

ICF-107 15 $ NO $ $ $

ICF-107DR  |Task Draft Stool 35 $ NO BID |§ $ $

ICF-107DRHD [High Back Draft Stoo! 50 $ No BID |§ 5 $

CFT-108 Comfort Managerial 25 $ NO BID |$ $ $

CFT-109 Cornfort High Back 45 $ N0 BID |§ $ $

CFT-110 Comfort Guest 100 |$ NO BID [$ [3 $
A

*FEQEL IS5 OFFERING OUR COLOSSAL/COLOSSAL PLUS LINE

TUFE-0015 #1 TUF Chairs 5 $ $ $ $

TUF-002M  |#2 TUF Chairs 135 $ $ $ $

TUF-003L #3 TUF Chairs 130 3 $ $ $

TUF-004MHB |TUF HB Medium 35 $ $ $ $

TUF-005LHB |TUF HB Large COLOSSAL 110 |$192.74 $21,201.40]$192.74 $21,201:40

TUF-006DLX |TUF Deluxe HB 75 $ $ 5 $

TUF-007 HD |TUF Deluxe HD 10 $ $ $ $
©IF-008G TUF Cop Chair COLOSSAL PLUS 40 $285.10 $11, 704,00 $285.10 $11,404.00

11 UF-009-811 |TUF 911 Chair 5 $ $ $ $

_XR*OET IS

OFFERING OUR__ ITHACA LINE AS

AN

EQUAT._TO SOFLINEF%%

INS-woa

w***OEIVIS

instyle, no arms

aE

$7 656. 60

SOF-OO‘I Solene "Advanced Task 50 $ $ 3

SOF-002 SofLine Office DeluxeTTHACK 50 $132.00 $6.600.00 1% 132.00 $6,600.00

SOF-003 Softine Econo Task 50 $ $ : $

SOF-004 SofLine Visitor Chair ITTHACA 50 $82.00 $4,100.00 [$82.00 $4,100.00
OFFERING OUR ALTA POLY LINE AS AN EQUAL TO INSTYLE***

INS-wa

Instyle, with arms

$3,845.00

iy

o

1) if b;ddlng volume or ers,k state minimum order reqmrement

2) Include spare/optional parts and pricing for each series

3) Llstanywarrantles that apply

e e

e BTt
s e

* Multiply the Estimated Annual Quantities by the Unit Price

SE BR o IBere T o . 316 90000516900 $16,900.00
OEI-BR-side |Breathe Guest Chair $129.00 |5 6,450.00(5129.00 |5 6,450.00
MESH Mesh Fabric, yards $N0 BID $ o BIp |$ NO RID

o sz e

‘Multiply the Volume/Skid Unit Pricing by the Estimated Annual Quantities

l *=* WVCI will purchase an entire skid when ordering volume kits; however, Volume Unit Price shall be bid for

single chalir kit, not total skid price

Eaen

$~No BID

thers]
R

P18

'||FTE1

‘Bl




P19
RFQ No. PRI3793

"AFFIDAVIT

West Virginia Code §5A-3-10a states:

No coniract or renewal of any contract may be awarded by the state or any of its political subdivisions to any
vendor or prospective vendor when the vendor or prospective vendor or a related party to the vendor or
prospective vendor is a debtor and the debt owned is an amount greater than one thousand dollars in the

aggregate

DEFINITIONS:
“Debt” means any assessment, premium, penalty, fine, tax or other amount of money owed to the state orany

of its political subdivisions because of a judgment, fine, permit violation, license assessment, defaulted
workers' compensation premium, penaity or other assessment presently delinquent or due and required to be
paid to the state or any of its political subdivisions, including any interest or additional penalties accrued

thereon. :

“Debtor” means any individual, corperation, partnership, association, limited liability company or any other form
or business association owing a debt to the state or any of its political subdivisions, "Political subdivision”
means any county commission; municipality; county board of education; any instrumentality established by a
county or municipality, any separate corporation or instrumentality established by one or more counties or
municipalities, as permitted by law; or any public body charged by law with the performance of a government
function or whose jurisdiction is coextensive with one or more counties or municipalities. “Related party” means
a party, whether an individual, corporation, parinership, association, limited liability company or any other form
or business association or other entity whatsoever, related to any vendor by blood, marriage, ownership or
contract through which the party has a relationship of ownership or other interest with the vendor so that the
party will actually or by effect receive or control a portion of the benefit, profit or other consideration from
performance of a vendor contract with the party receiving an amount that meets or exceed five percent of the

total contract amount.

EXCEPTION: _
The prohibition of this section does not apply where a vendor has contested any tax administered pursuant to
chapter eleven of this code, workers’' compensation premium, permit fee or environmental fee or assessment
and the matter has not becorne final or where the vendor has entered into a payment plan or agreement and
the vendor is not in defautt of any of the provisions of such plan or agreement.

LICENSING: : '
Vendors must be licensed and in good standing in accordance with any and all state and local laws and

requirements by any state or local agency of West Virginia, including, but not limited to, the West Virginia
Secretary of State’s Office, the West Virginia Tax Department, West Virginia Insurance Commission, or any
other state agencies or political subdivision. Furthermore, the vendor must provide all necessary releases o
obtain information to enable the Director or spending unit to verify that the vendor is licensed and in good
standing with the above entiies.

CONFIDENTIALITY:

The vendor agrees that he or she will not disclose o anyone, directly or indirectly, any such personally
identifiable information or other confidential information gained from the agency, unless the individual who is
the subject of the information consents to the disclosure ih writing or the disclosure is made pursuant to the
agency’s policies, procedures and rules. Vendors should visit www.state.wv.us/admin/purchase/privacy for

the Notice of Agency Confidentiality Policies.

Under penalty of law for false swearing (West Virginia Code, §61-5-3), it is hereby certified that the vendor
acknowledges the information in this said affidavit and are in compliance with the requirements as stated.

Vendors Name; OEI Division, Krueger International, Inc.

Date: __ 05/07/07
dersen -~ Controller/Asst. Secretary

Authorized Signature:

. 1
No Debt Affidavit (Revised 10/%%

o1 |
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WVCI COLOSSAL&COLOSSAL PLUS MODEL PRICE LIST
COLOSSAL & COLOSSAL PLUS

COLOSSAL
. CLCOLS

Modei Number
CIL.COLS.LA.BL
CIL.COLS.NA.BL
CIl.COLS.TA.BL

COLOSSAL PLUS

CI.COLSP

Model Number
CLCOLSP.LABL
CLCOLSP.NA.BL
CLCOLSP.TA.BL

Colossal Seating

Loop Arm

No Arms

Task Arm

Black Frame Color . . P
Correctional Industry Program Supplies Fabric and Completes Upholstery

Description

Colossal Loop Armm Chair
Colossat Armless Chair
Coiossat Task Am Chair

Colossal Plus Seating

Loop Arm

No Arms

Task Arm

Black Frame Color

Correctional Industry Program Supplies Fabric and Completes Uphalstery

Description

Colossal Plus Loop Arm Chair
Colossal Plus Amless Chair
Colossal Plus Task Arm Chair

COLOSSAL&COLOSSAL PLUS ARMS

CLCOLA
CLCOLPA
LA

TA

B, LR

Model Number
CL.COLALABBL

" CLCOLA.LAL.BL
SLCOLALAR.BL

" CI.COLA.TAB.BL
ClL.COLA.TAL.BL
CIL.COLA.TAR.BL
Cl.COLPA.LAB.BL
CLCOLPA.LAL.BL
CIL.COLPALAR.BL
Ci.COLPA.TAB.BL
CIL.COLPATAL.BL
CL.COLPA.TAR.BL

Colossal Arm

Colossal Plus Arm

Loop Arm

Task Arm

B=Right Hand & Left Hand, L=Left Hand, R=Right Hand

Description

Colossat Arms Loop Right Hand & Left Hand Black
Colossat Amm Loop Left Hand Biack

Colossal Arm Loop Right Hand Black

Cotossal Arms Task Right Hand & Left Hand Black
Colossal Arm Task Left Hand Black

Colossal Arm Task Right Hand Black

Colossal Plus Amms Loop Right Hand & Left Hand Black
Colossal Plus Amm Loop Left Hand Black

Colessal Pius Am Loop Right Hand Black

Colossal Plus Amms Task Right Hand & Left Hand Black
Colossal Plus Am Task Left Hand Black

Colossal Plus Arm Task Right Hand Black

Date: 05/07/2007

Price

$271.00
$192.74
$253.40

Price

$362.20
$285.10
$344.60

Price
$78.36
$39.18
$39.18
$59.88
$29.94
$29.94
$77.20
$38.60
$38.60
$58.72
$29.36
$29.36

FPage 1
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WVCI ITHACA MODEL PRICE LIST

ITHACA

STANDARD CHAIR

OEI62, OEIG4
NOTE:

Model Number
OEI62/JR30/STD/AOLY/C
OES2/JR37ISTD/POLYIC
OEIB2/KMETER/STD/POLY/C
QEIS2/KRT2/STD/POLY/C
OEI62/STB/POLY/C
OEI64/JR3G/SLDIPOLYIC
QOEIG4/JRIT/SLDIPOLYIC
OEIB4/KMETER/SLD/POLY/C
OEIB4/KR72/SLD/POLY/C
QOEIB4/SLD/POLY/C

SLED CHAIR

OEI60S
NOTE:

Model Number
QEISOS/KMETER/POLY
OEIB0S/POLY

STOOL CHAIR

OEI63, OEI6S
NOTE:

Model Number
OEIB3/JR30/STD/POLYIC
OEIS3/IR37/ISTD/POLYIC
OEIBIKMETER/STD/POLY/C
QEI63/KR72/STDIPOLYIC
QEI63/STD/POLY/C

~ OEIB5/JR30/SLD/POLYIC
OEI65/JR37/SLD/POLY/C
QEIBS/KMETER/SLD/POLY/C

* QES/KRT72/SLDIPOLYIC
OEIS5/SLD/POLY/C

Standard Chair :
Correctional Industry Program Supplies Fabric and Completes Upholistery

Description

Free Floai Task Chair w/ 380 Deg Pivot Arm
Free Float Task Chair w/ Adjustable 7-Arm
Free Float Task Chair w/ Fixed Loop Arm
Free Fioat Task Chair w/ Adjustable Loop Arm

" Free Fioat Task Chair wio Arms

Free Float Task Chalr wf 360 Deg Pivot Arm wi Seat Slider
Free Float Task Chair w/ Adjustable T-Arm w/ Seat Slider
Free Float Task Chair wf Fixed Loop Arm w/ Seat Slider

Free Float Task Chair wf Adjustable Loop Arm w/ Seat Slider:
Free Float Task Chair wio Arms w/ Seat Slider

Correctional Industry Program Supplies Fabric and Completes Upholstery

Description
Sled Base Guest Chair w/ Fixed Loop Arm
Sled Base Guest Chair w/o Arms

Standard Chair
Correctional Industry Program Supplies Fabric and Compietes Upholstery

Description

Stool w/ 360 Deg Pivol Arm

Stool w/ Adjustable T-Arm

Stool w. Fixed Loop Arm

Stool w/ Adjustable Loop Amn

Stool wio Arms

Stool wf 360 Deg Pivot Arm w/ Seat Slider
Stool w/ Adjustabie T-Arm w/ Seat Slider
Stool w/ Fixed Loop Arm w/ Seat Slider
Stool w/ Adjustable Loop Arm w/ Seat Slider
Stoal wio Arms w/f Seat Slider

Date: 05/07/2007

Price

$196:00 .1«

$178.00
$146.00
$178.00
$132.00
$215.00
$187.00
$165.00
$197.00
$151.00

Price
$96.00
$62.00

Price

$232.00
$214.00
$182.00
$214.00
$168.00
$251.00
$233.00
$201.00
$233.00
$187.00

Page 1
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Briefing Paper m

Ithaca™ Task Chair

Summary
fthaca task seating has a mid-market price, beiween Pride and Snap.

Tthaca has high comfort due to thick, et supportive, cushioning and a great free-floating back action.
Key Gustomer Phrases
Mid-market price

Thick, yet supporiive, seat cushioning.

High-end comfort. lthaca
Very pleasing design.

Why is OEl infroducing #thaca?

Customers are demanding more product for less monay.

More features, more comfort, better design . . . and {ower price.

CE!'s answer is lthaca.

More Features

thaca uses a true synchrotilt mechanism, as found on the majority of high-end ergenomic chairs (think Pride).

The seat and back are "synchronized” - moving in a 2 to 1 relationship. This is recognized as the most
comfortable means of chair articulation.

Ithaca has back height adjustment (iike Pride). The range is 3"
lthaca has a 3-position back lock (like Pride).

fthaca has a tilt tension adjustment (like Pride).

lthaca has height and width adjustable arms {like Pride BA arm).
More Comfart

What's the first thing customers do when they sit in [thaca?
They smile.

They smile because of the thick, yet supportive, seat cushion. (No boitoming-out, as with many
competitive, thick cushionsd task chairs.)

Ithaca’s seat cushion is unitke anything your customers have ever axperiencad. it is a unique foam
formulation that is used extensively in Europe, but rarely in the U.S.

When customers relax info Ithaca they experience the smaoth, responsive back flex.

Thick, suppartive seat and smacth, responsive back flex. The fermula for “Comfort”.
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Task/Desk Seating Specifications

Mechanism (OElL 62/64/63/65)

A stamped steel dual housing forms a sturdy cradle for the seat. There are two control levers. One lever actuates the pneumatic
cylinder, which adjusts the seat height from 17-1/4” to 22-1/4” with infinite selection' within the range. One lever locks the chair at 3-
positions or actuates the free-floating mode. The synchronized 2:1 free-floating mode has adjustments 8° on seat and 16° on back.

Backrest All Models

The injection molded plastic board has embedded inserts for mounting the board is converted with contoured molded high resilient
foam and upholstered with fabric. A textured black shroud covers the rear side. An easy to operate mechanism is installed on the
back board for adjusting the back height (37).

Seat All Models
Constructed of 14 thick, saddle shape plywood with 2-1/2” molded high-resilient foam and upholstered with fabrlc The entire seat
assembly is mounted to the mechanism by four screws.

Pedestal Base (OEI 62/64)
The 25" diameter, five-blade base is made of reinforced nylon. Black only.

 Pedestal Base Stool (OEI 63/65)
The 27" diameter, five-blade base is made of reinforced nylon. Black only.

Carpet Casters (OEI 62/64/63/65)
The double 55mm diameter black wheels are molded of high-impact thermoplastic and are housed in a high impact frame. Hard floor

casters are available.

Adjustable Loop Arm Option (JRI72)
Height adjustment of 2-1/2” and width adjustment of 1 per side.

Adjustable T-Arm Option(JR37)
Height adjustment of 3” and width adjustment of 1-1/2” per side.

Adjustable 360-Degree  T-Arm Option(JR30) :
Height adjustment of 3 and width adjustment of 1-1/2” per side. Arm cap pivot and lock in various positions.

Backrest (OEI60S)
The injection molded plastic board has embedded inserts of mounting. The board is covered with contour molded foam and
upholstered with fabric. A textured back shroud covers the rear side.

Seat (OEI60S)
Constructed a 1/2” thick, saddle shape plywood with 2-1/2” contour molded thh resilient foam and coved with upholstered fabric.

Sled Base (OEI60S)
The sled base is formed 1-1/8” diameter, 13-gauge thickness steel tubing. Black only
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@ E D Task/Desk Seating
{thaca™ Task Chair General Information
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Features

gt E:

Width - 25" 24" o 257

JR30 JR37 JR72 (ETR1) KMETER

360 Degree Adjustable Task Adjustable Loop Fixed Loop
Adjustabi Pivot




WVCI ALTA MODEL PRICE LIST Dafe: 05/07/2007
ALTA POLYPROPYLENE CHAIRS
ALTA POLYPROPYLENE ARM CHAIR
ALT1 Alta Seating - Level 1
WA With Arms
G LS SG L or S = Non Ganging, G or SG = Ganging
P Polypropylene _
XX Frame Color ‘ : . :
SXX Shell Color : '
s Steel Glides (To order plasiic glides please replace the S with a P)
Model Number Description : Price
ALTTWAGPAOUSXX/S Alia Poly Chair With Arms and Ganging $69.91
ALTTWALPIROUSXX/S Alta Poly Chair With Arms and Non-Ganging $64.09
ALTIWASGP/XXISXX/SLD Alta Poly Chair With Arms, Sled Base and Ganging $74.76
ALTTWASP/XOUSXX/SLD Alta Poly Chair With Arms, Sled Base and Non-Ganging $68.94
&
ALTA POLYPROPYLENE ARMLESS CHAIR '
ALT1 Alta Seating - Level 1
NA No Arms
G, L, S 8G L or § = Non Ganging, G or SG = Ganging
P Polypropylene
XX Frame Color :
SXX Shell Color
S Steel Glides (To order plastic glides please replace the S with a P)
Model Number Description : Price
ALTINAGPOOUSXX/S Alta Poly Chair w/o Arms and Ganging $61.14
ALTINALP/XX/SXX/S Alta Poly Chair w/o Arms and Non-Ganging : $54.69
ALTINASGP/IOUSXX/SLD Alta Poly Chair w/o Arms, Sled Base, and Ganging ) $62.09
ALTINASPAROUSXX/SLD Alta Poly Chair w/o Arms, Sled Base, and Non-Ganging $55.59
ALTA POLYPROPYLENE TABLET ARM CHAIR
ALTH Alta Seating - Level 1 =
TAL, TAR Tablet Arm Left, Tablet Arm Right '
P Polypropylene
XX "~ Frame Color
SXX Shelf Color
XXX Tablet Arm Laminate Color
s Steel Glides (To order plastic glides please replace the S with a P)
Model Number Description Price
ALTATALPOCUSXKIXKXKIS Alta Poly Chair With Left-Hand Tablet and Non-Ganging $84.48
ALT1TARPIOKSXXKXXXKIS Alta Poly Chair With Right-Hand Tablet and Non-Ganging - $84.48
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WVCI ALTA MODEL PRICE LIST
ALTA CHAIRS (WITH FOAM)

ALTA UPHOLSTERABLE ARM CHAIR (WITH FOAM)

ALT?

WA

G, L § 8G
P S

xXx

PXX

F

Model Number
ALTIWAGIPROUPXXF
ALTIWAG/SHOUPXXIF
ALTIWALIPIXX/PXX/F -
ALTIWALSIXXIPXXIF
ALTTWAS/NSGIXXIPXXIF
ALTIWASIXXIPXXIF
ALTIWASG/NSGIXXIPXX/F
ALTIWASGIPXXF

Alta Seating - Level 1

With Arms

L or 8 = Non Ganging, G or SG = Ganging
P=Piastic Glides, S=Steel Glides

Frame Color

Back Panel Color

Foam

Description

Alta Chair w/Arms and Ganging, Plastic Glides

Alta Chair w/Arms and Ganging, Steel Glides

Alta Chair w/Arms and Non Ganging, Plastic Glides

Alta Chair w/Arms and Non Ganging, Steel Glides

Alta Chair w/Arms, Sled Base & NenGanging, NonSkid Glides
Alta Chair w/Armns, Sled Base & NonGanging, No Glides

Alta Chair w/Arms, Sled Base & Ganging, NonSkid Glides
Alta Chair w/Arms, Sled Base & Ganging, Ne Glides

ALTA UPHOLSTERABLE ARMLESS CHAIR (WITH FOAM)

ALT1

NA

G, L S S8G
P S

XX

PXX

F

Mode] Number
ALTINAG/PIXX/IPXXIF
ALTINAGISIXXPXXIF
ALTINALIPXOUPXXIF
ALTINALS/XX/PXX/F
ALTINAS/INSGIXX/PXXF
ALTINAS/XX/PXXF
ALTINASGINSG/XXIPXXIF
ALTINASGXXPXX/F

Alta Seating - Level 1

No Arms

L or S = Non Ganging, G or SG = Ganging
P=Plastic Glides, S=Steel Glides

Frame Color

Back Panef Color

Foam

Description

Alta Chair, No Arms and Ganging, Plastic Glides

Alta Chair, No Arms and Ganging, Steel Glides

Alta Chair, No Arms and Non-Ganging, Plastic Glides

Alta Chair, No Arms and Non-Ganging, Stee! Glides

Alta Chair, No Arms, Sked Base, NenGanging, NonSkid Glides
Alta Chair, No Arms, Sled Base, NonGanging, No Glides

Alta Chair, No Arms, Sled Base, Ganging, NonSkid Glides
Alta Chair, No Arms, Sled Base, Ganging, No Glides

ALTA UPHOLSTERABLE TABLET CHAIR (WITH FOAM)

ALTY
TAL, TAR
XX

P 5

PXX
XXX

M

Modef Number

ALTITALPIXXIPXXIXXXKIF
ALTITALSIUPXXIXXKIF
ALTATARIPDOUP X XIXXXIF
ALTTTARISIXXIP XX XXXIF

Alta Seating - Level 1

Tablet Arm Left, Tablet Arm Right
Frame Color

P=Piastic Glides, S=Steel Glides
Back Panel Color

Tablet Arm Laminate Cofor

Foam

Description

Alta Chair w/Left Tablet and Non-Ganging, Plastic Glides
Alta Chair w/ieft Tablet and Non-Ganging, Steel Glides
Alta Chair w/Right Tablet and Non-Ganging, Plastic Glides
Alta Chair w/Right Tablet and Non-Ganging, Steel Glides

Date: 05/07/2007

RN

Price
$74.14
$74.14
$68.32
$68.32
$79.09
$73.17
$84.91
$78.99

‘Price
$65.37
$65.37
$58.92
$58.92
$65.74
$59.82
$72.24
$66.32

Price
£83.76
$88.71
$83.76
$88.71
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ALTA SEATING SPECIFICATION

Component Speciﬁcétions:

Product Styles Available:

Frame;

The following is a listing of required options:

4 leg arm chair

4 leg armiess chair

4 leg tablet amm chair

Sled base arm chair {(non-stacking)
Sled base armless chair (non-stacking)

oo o

The legs and the side members shall be constructed by a 7/8” outside diameter, with a
13-gauge wall thickness, 1010 cold rolled steel, The kickback leg-design witha 7.5
degrees is to increase structural integrity and maximize frame stability. The side tube
characteristics shall be constructed of a 7/8" cutside diameter, with a 13-gauge wall
thickness, and will have a high strength low alloy material (no arm four leg frame, with arm
sled base frame). The cross tube characteristics shail be constructed of a 7/8” outside
diameter, with a 14-gauge wall thickness (all frames). The joint characteristics (side tube

- fo leg) will be sitver brazed with 505 alloy (50% silver and 5% other, including a 2% nickel

added for a sfrong joint).

* Armyrests:

Seat:

The armrest shall be constructed of a nylon alloy, exhibiting exceptionally high impact
strength (will flex when exposed to heavy loads or impact). The armrests should be
contoured to provide ergonomic assistance and pleasing aesthetics.

The seat board shall be constructed of a 5-ply maple/poplar hardwood or equivalent. The
seat boards should have a minimum of 293 square inches of surface area and have (4)
.25 diameter pre-drilled holes to facilitate a 10-24 x 9/32 T-nut. The seat foam utilized
shall be an HR46 urethane foam x 1-1/8" thick. The foam should be pre-cut to
approximately 18-1/2" x 18-1/2" with radius corners. The seat should include an injection-
molded polypropylene stacking bumper as part of the frame/seat assembly.




Backrests:

The backboard shall be made of a compound curve molded 9-ply hardwood and should
have {4) .290 diameter pre-drilled holes to facilitate T-nuts. The back foam shoutd consist
of an HR46 urethane foam X 34" thick. Back foam dimensions should be approximately
19 X 14 with radius comers. The upholstered back should be attached to the chair frame
by a {4) ¥4 - 20 buttonhead cap screws. The back should be covered with a .093" thick,
high-impact styrene shroud should also have six attachments points located around the
perimeter to facilitate a wood screw for attachment purposes.

Carpet Glide:

The chair frame should accommodate a 7/8” x 14-gauge non-swivel g.]ide. The glide
should have a Chrome Plated steel or monochromatic plastic for durability and aesthetics.

Ganger:

The ganger should consist of a 3/16 diameter, steel wire and should have two methods of
attachment. Method one should be a permanent part of the welded frame on armless
chairs. Method two should be an optional fixture that can be instalied with screws to the
armrest.

Am Cap:r

The chair frame should facilitate a polypropylene cap on all no armchairs. The cap will
match the frame color and be able to close off alf exposed open ends of fubes in the chair
frame. Chrome frames will have black end caps. The arm caps should provide an
aesthetically pleasing appearance to both user and observer.

Tablet Arm:

The tablet arm should consist of 11-ply hardwood with the following makeup. The makeup
should include a resin core with metamine laminate writing surface and backing sheet.
The tablet edge should be round and painted to match the laminate surface. The tablet
arm should also be available in left or right hand models. ,

Transport Dolly:
The transpert dolly should consist of a tubular steel frame with a black powder coat finish

and four 5" casters; 2 fixed and 2 swivel. The transport dolly should accommodate 10
chairs with a stacking height of 52"




WVCI BREATHE MODEL PRICE LIST

BREATHE
BREATHE PEDESTAL BASE NO ARM MESH CHAIR
CLBRTH.P Breathe Pedestal Base Mesh Chair
NA No Arms
L Black Only
KD Knocked Down - Upholsterable
Model Number '~ Desecripion :
CI.BRTH.P.NA BL.KD : Breathe Pedestal Base No Arm Mash Chair - Unupholstered
BREATHE HEADREST/ADJUSTABLE ARM SET
CLBRTH.AARMSET Breathe Adjustable Arm Set
CLBRTH.HEADREST Breathe Headrest
BL Black Only
Mode! Number Description
CL.BRTH.AARMSET.BL Breathe Adjustable Arm Set
CI.BRTH.HEADREST.BL Breathe Headrest
BREATHE SLED BASE NO ARM MESH CHAIR
CIL.BRTH.SL Breathe Sled Base Mesh Chair
NA No Arms
BL Bilack Only
KD Knocked Down - Upholsterable
Model Number Description
CIL.LBRTH.SL.NABL.KD Breathe Sled Base No Arm Mesh Chair - Unupholstered

Date: 05/07/2007

$169.00

Price
$16.00
$22.00

Price
$129.00

Page 1
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Features

Breathable Mesh Back
Back Flex

Variable Position Back Lock
Lumbar Adjustment
Adjustable Arm Option
Heavy Duty Die Cast Base
Optional Head Rest

General Dimensions

Seat Width

Seat Depth

Back Width (At Top)

Back Width (At Lumbar)
Back Height (Above Seat)
Lumar Height (Above Seat)
Head Rest Width

Head Rest Height

Head Rest Adj. Range

Overall Dimensions

NO ARM

Width

Depth

Seat Height Range
Back Height Range
'B/H/R W/Head Rest

ARM

Width

Depth

Width Between Arms
Width Cutside Arms

Arm Height Range From Seat

Chair weight 48 Ibs

General Information

HKXHKX XXX

215/8"
191/2"
22 5/8"
18 1/2"
247
4" - 8"
14.1/2"
712"
o

22 3/4"

25"
18" -21"
41 1/4"- 44 1/4"
47 1/2"- 83 /2"

27 1/2"
25"
20 1/2"
27 172"
7"-93/4"

(1
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