¥709005959
FUJIFILM GRAPHIC SYSTEMS USA

State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WY 25305-0130

h02-485-1234

Request for
Quotation

T ADDRESS CORRESPONDENGE TO ATTENTIONOFE, = =

JOHN ABBOTT

3046-558-2h44

| WV PRISON INDUSTRIES

V| 4340 ROBARDS LANE
N |
0 LOUISVILLE KY 40218 | 617 LEON SULLIVAN WAY
" CHARLESTON, WV
e 25301 304-558-2945
CDATEPRINTED ot TERMSORSALE & i LS FOB FREGHT TERNS
06/04/2007 net 38 days best way destination prepaid
BID OPENING DATE: 064/19/2007 BID OPENING TIME _ 01:30PM

QUESTIONS /

RON WINZENREID
WV CORRECTIONAL INDUSTRIES
ROAD 2,
MOUNDSVILLE,
PHONE # (304> 843-4079
FAX #:

SHOULD THE VIENDOR

PACKAGING: ALL ORDERS
MENT IN A MANNER
AGAINST DAMAGE.

ANY AND ALL
SHALL BE PAID BY

BE IN ACCORDANCE
SHAlLLL BE FREE FRO
HARM TO THE-

REQUEST

FOR

BOX (1
WV 26041

(304 843-4081

ALL
EQUIPMENT

DAMAGED GOODS.
HE VENDG®OR.

FOR GUOTATION

THE PURCHASING DINVISION IS SOLICITING
WEST VIRGINIA CORRECTIPONAL INDUSTRIES
OPEN-END CONTRACT

COMMENTS SHOULD BE DIRECTED

- PREFERRED MET

ANY RETURN

BIDS FOR THE
TO PROVIDE AN

PRINTING INKS AND SUPPLIES.

ATTACHMENTS:| 1. SPECIFICATIONS / BID FORM
2. AFFIDAVIT

TO:

DELIVERY: ALL ORDERS WILL BE SHIPPED FOB DESTINATION

REQUIRE MINIMUM ORDER QUANTITIES,
PLEASE PROVIDE THOSE QUANTITIES FOR EACH ITEM WITH
THE BID.

ARE TO BE PACKAGED FOR SHIP-
IN WHICH THE ITEMS ARE PROTECTED
WVCI RESERVES THE RIGHT TO REFUSE-
FREIGHT CHARGES

QUALITY OF PRODUCTS: ITEMS DELIVERED HEREUNDER SHALL
0 THE SPECIFICATIONS].
DEFECTS AND SHALL NOT CAUSE
IN WHICH THE PRODUCTS ARE USED.
NO USED OR RECONDITIONED PARTS OR MATERIALS WILL BE
ACCPETED.

THE PRODUCTS

HOD OF QUESTIONS

e ]‘ R i

SIGNATURE

TITLE

TELEPHOME

888-898-5239 ext2283

CATE

4/17/07

Account” Manager FEN 231430030

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'




State of West Virginia Request for [~ —mrommmen——— T PAGE
Department of Administration  Quotation PRIZ500 >
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East T ADDRESS CORRESPONDENGE TOATTENION G- r o
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130 JOHN ABBOTT

306-hh8-2544

] *709005959 502-485-1234 —
2| FUJIFILM GRAPHIC SYSTEMS USA .| WV PRISON INDUSTRIES
4340 ROBARDS LANE H

+| 617 LEON SULLIVAN WAY
| CHARLESTON, WV
25301 304-558-2945

LOUISVILLE KY 40218

- FREIGHT TERMS -

T DAIEPRINTED ..

064/06/2007_
BID OPENING DATE:

T SARA

B

0001 LS 700-38

PRINTING INKIS AND SUPPLIES

EXHIBIT 6

PRICE ADJUSTMENT PROVISION:
THE STATE OF| WEST| VIRGINIA WILL CONSIDER BIDS THAT
CONTAIN PROV|ISIONS FOR| PRICE ADJUSTMENTS PRIOR TO THE
ORIGINAL EXPIRATION OFf THE CONTRACT, PROVIDED THAT SUCH
PRICE ADJUSTMENT COVERS BOTH UPWARD AND DOWNWARD
MOVEMENT OF [THE COMMQDITY PRICE, AND THAT ADJUSTMENT IS
BASED ON THE| "PASS THROUGH" INCREASE OR DECREASE OF RAW
MATERIALS AND/OR [LABOR, WHICH MAKE UP ALL OR A
SUBSTANTIAL PART |OF A PRODUCT. ADJUSTMENTS ARE TO BE
BASED UPON AN ACTUAL DOLLAR FIGURE, NOT A PERCENTAGE.
LL PRICE ADJUSTMENT REQUESTS MUST BE SUBSTANTIATED IN
A MANNER ACCEPTABLE TO| THE DIRECTOR PURCHASING, E.G.
GOVERNMENTAL! BENCH MARKS, GENERAL MARKET INCREASE.
PUBLISHED PRICE LISTS.| SUCH REQUESTS FOR AND INCREASE
SHOULD BE RECEIVED IN WRITING BY THE DIRECTOR OF
PURCHASING AT LEAST 300 DAYS IN ADVANCE| OF THE EFFECTIVE
DATE OF THE [INCREASE. | ANY TIME THE VENDOR REQUESTS A
PRICE ADJUSTMENT,| THE PURCHASING DIVIS[ION MAY EITHER
ACCEPT THE PRICE ADJUSTMENT AND AMEND [THE CONTRACT
ACCORDINGLY [OR REJECT [THE ADUSTMENT IN ITS ENTIRETY AND
CANCEL THE CONTRACT.

PREFERRED TERMS:
IT IS PREFERRED THAT THE PRICES ON THIS CONTRACT ARE

FIRM FOR LIFE OF [THE CONTRACT, AS INDICATED IN THE LIFE
OF CONTRACT [CLAUSE CONTAINED HEREIN, NOT TO EXCEED ONE

T T oI GEE R VERSE SIDE FOR TERNS AND CONDITIONS
SIGNATURE TELEPHONE DATE

e FEIN ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE
WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'
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State of West Virginia Req uest for ———rroNmEERT— PAGE . ...
Department of Administration  Quotation PRI3500 3
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East T ADDH BRESPONDENCE TOATTENNONOR: -
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130 JOHN ABBOTT
304-hh8-2h44
2005959 502-485-1234 ]

ISVILLE KY 40218

FUJIFILM GRAPHIC SYSTEMS USA
4340 ROBARDS LANE

WV

617
CHA
2

PRISON INDUSTRIES

LEON SULLIVAN WAY
RLESTON, WV
5301 304-558-2945

. DATEPANTED. . | TERMSOFSAE

G S

064/04/2007

BID OPENING DATE:

04719/

07

_OPENING TIME

(1) YEAR.

EXHIBIT 3

..............

YEAR OR UNTIL

CONTRACT.

RENEWAL : THIS

DAYS PRIOR TP

CANCELLATION:

NOTICE TO THE

LIFE OF CONTRACT:

-----

NECESSARY TO| OBTA
ODRIGINAL CONTRACT].
NOT EXCEED TWELVE
TIME™ THE VENDOR
REASON UPON GIVIN
WRITTEN NOTICE.

UNLESS SPECIFIC P
IN THIS CONTRACT
PRICING SET HEREI

WRITTEN CONSENT O
SUBMITTED TO] THE

BE IN ACCORDANCE
- ORIGINAL CONTRACT
(1) YEAR PERIODS.

RIGHT TO CANCEL T

SUPPLIED ARE| OF A
TO THE SPECIFICAT

OPEN MARKET CLAUS
AUTHORIZE A SPEND
MARKET, WITHOUT T

CON

THE

THE

VEN

TH
AN
H "RE
IN A

TH
(12>
MAY T
G THE

ROVIS
DOCUM
N ARE

TRACT
F THE
DIREC
EXPI
WITH
AND

DIRE
HIS C
DOR I
N INF
IONS

E: TH
ING U
HE FI

IS CONTRACT BECO
D EXTENDS FOR A

ASONABLE TIME"™ T
NEW CONTRACT OR

E "REASONABLE TI
MONTHS. DURING
ERMINATE THIS CO
DIRECTOR OF PUR

IONS ARE STIPULA
ENT, THE TERMS.,
FIRM FOR THE LI

MAY BE RENEWED
SPENDING UNIT A

RATION DATE. SU
THE TERMS AND CO
SHALL BE LIMITED

CTOR OF PURCHASI
ONTRACT IMMEDIAT
F THE COMMODITIE
ERIOR QUALITY OR
OF THE BID AND C

E DIREETOR OF PU
NIT TO PURCHASE
EING OF A REQUIS

FTOR OF PURCHASINr THIRTY (303
C
N

MES EFFECTIVE ON
PERIOD OF ONE (1
HEREAFTER AS IS
RENEW THE

ME™ PERIOD SHALL
THIS "REASONABLE
NTRACT FOR ANY
CHASING 30 DAYS

TED ELSEWHERE
CONDITIONS AND
FE OF THE

UPON THE MUTUAL
ND VENDOR,

H RENEWAL SHALL
DITIONS OF THE
TO TWO (2) ONE

NG RESERVES THE
ELY UPON WRITTEN
S AND/OR SERVICE
DO .NOT CONFORM
ONTRACT HEREIN.

RCHASING MAY
ON THE OPEN
ITION OR COST

-~ SEE-REVERSE SIDE FOR TERMSAND CONDITIONS |

DATE

SIGNATURE

TELEPHONE

TITLE

FEIN

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'




State of West Virginia Request for —FmNNER o PRGE T
Department of Administration  Quotation PRI3500 4
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130

Charleston, WV 25305-0130 JOHN ABBOTT
304-Kh58-2K44

T ADDRESS CORRESPONDENCE TOATTENTION O - =7

e *709005959 502-485-1234 ]
FUJIFILM GRAFPHIC SYSTEMS USA =1 WV PRISON INDUSTRIES
4340 ROBARDS LANE

617 LEON SULLIVAN WAY
CHARLESTON, WV
25301 304-558-2945

LOUISVILLE KY 40218

[[oimze

Co o DATEPRINTED T [ TERMSOFSALE. . [ SHIPVIA - FREGHTTERMS
04/04/2007
BID OPENING DATE: — 04/19/2007 —_BID OPENING TIME _ 01:30PM

oF

ESTIMATE, ITEMS SPECIFIED ON THIS CONTRACT FOR
IMMEDIATE DELIVERY IN EMERGENCIES DUE TO UNFORESEEN
CAUSES (INCLUDING| BUT NOT LIMITED TG DELAYS IN TRANS-
PORTATION OR| AN UNANTICIPATED INCREASE| IN THE VOLUME
OF WORK.>

QUANTITIES: QUANT|ITIES| LISTED IN THE REQUISITION ARE
APPROXIMATIONS ONEY, BASED ON ESTIMATES SUPPLIED BY
THE STATE SPENDING UNIT. IT IS UNDERS[TOOD AND AGREED
THAT THE CONTRACT| SHALL COVER THE QUANTITIES ACTUALLY
ORDERED FOR DELIVERY DURING THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT,
WHETHER MORE| OR LESS THAN THE QUANTITIES SHOWN.

ORDERING PROCEDURE: SPENDING UNIT(S) SHALL ISSUE A
WRITTEN STATE CONTRACT, ORDER (FORM NUMBER WV-39) TO
THE VENDOR F|OR COMMODITIES COVERED BY [THIS CONTRACT.
THE ORIGINAL| COPY| OF THE WV-39 SHALL BE MAILED TO THE
VENDOR AS AUTHORIZATION FOR SHIPMENT, A SECOND COPY
MAILED TO THE PURCHASING DIVISION, ANDI A THIRD COPY
RETAINED BY THE SPENDING UNIT.

BANKRUPTCY: | IN THE EVENT THE VENDOR/CONTRACTOR FILES
FOR BANKRUPTCY PROTECT|ICN, THIS CONTRACT IS AUTOMATI-
CALLY NULL AND VOID, AND IS TERMINATED WITHOUT FURTHER
ORDER.

THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS CONTAINED IN [THIS CONTRACT
SHALL SUPERSEDE ANY AND ALL SUBSEQUENT| TERMS AND
CONDITIONS WHICH MAY APPEAR ON ANY ATTACHED PRINTED
DOCUMENTS SUCH AS| PRICE LISTS, ORDER FORMS, SALES
AGREEMENTS OR MAINTENANCE AGREEMENTS, INCLUDING ANY
ELECTRONIC MEDIUM SUCH AS CD-ROM.

REV. 04/11/2001
VENDOR PREFERENCE CERTIFICATE

e SEE BEVERSE SIDEFORTERMS AND CONDITIONS: - e
SIGNATURE TELEPHONE DATE

TITLE FEIN ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE
WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELLED 'VENDOR'




*709005959
] FUJIFILM GRAFHIC SYSTEMS USA
“¥1 4340 ROBARDS LANE

Department of Admin
Purchasing Division

Post Office Box 5013

LOUISVILLE KY 40218

State of West Virginia

istration

2019 Washingion Street East

0

Charleston, WV 25305-0130

502-485-1234

Request for ——rromummer

Quotation

PRI3500

. ADDRESS tORRESPONDERCE TOATENION OF. = o

JOH
304

N ABBOTT
-h58-20h44

] wy

CHA
2

PRISON INDUSTRIES

617 LEON SULLIVAN WAY

RLESTON, WV

5301

304-558-2945

S T e

TERMSOFSALE o SHPVAL

. FREIGHTTERMS

06/04/2007

BID OPENING DATE:

— 04/19/2007

BIiD

OPENING TIME

01:30PM

CERTIFICATION AND
PREFERENCE IN ACC
5A-3-37 (DOES NOT

A, APPLICATION I
REASON CHECKED:

( ) BIDDER
HAS RESIDED

(43 YEARS IM
CERTIFICATION;

IS A
CONTI

OR

( )Y BIDDER] IS A
QUARTERS OR PRINC
WEST VIRGINIA FOR
THE DATE OF [THIS
INTEREST OF BIDDE

PARTNERSHIF,} ASSO

OF BUSINESS CONTI
YEARS IMMEDIATELY
CERTIFICATION; OR

( ) BIDDER
WHICH HAS AN
A MINIMUM OF

IS A
AFFI
ONE

BUSINESS WITHIN W
CERTIFICATION.

B. APPLICATIION I
REASON CHECKED:

APPL
ORDAN
APPL

S MAD

N IND
NUOQUS

EDIATELY

PART

TION RESIDENT VENDOR A

IPAL
FOUR
CERTI
R IS
CIATI

WHO HAS MAINTAINED ITS

NUQUS
PREC

CORP
LIATE
HUNDR

HAS MAINTAINED ITS HEA

EST V

FOUR (4) YEARS IMMEDIA

S MAD

ICATIONx IS HERE
CE WITH WEST VIR
Y TO CONSTRUCTIO

E FOR 2.5% PREFE

IVIDUAL RESIDENT
LY IN WEST VIRGI
PRECEDING THE DA

NERSHIP, ASSOCIA
ND HAS MAINTAINE
PLACE OF BUSINES
(4) YEARS IMMED
FICATION; OR 80
HELD BY ANOTHER
ON OR CORPORATIO
HEADQUARTERS OR
LY IN WEST VIRGI
EDING THE DATE O

ORATION NONRESID
OR SUBSIDIARY W
ED STATE RESIDEN
QUARTERS OR PRIN
IRGINIA CONTINUO
TELY PRECEDING T

E FOR 2.5% PREFE

BY MADE FOR
GINIA CODE,
N CONTRACTS).

RENCE FOR THE

VENDOR AND
NIA FOR FOUR
TE OF THIS

TIOGN OR CORPORA-

D ITS HEAD-

S CONTINUOUSLY IN
IATELY PRECEDING

OF THE OWNERSHI

INDIVIDUAL .

PRINCIPAL PLACE
NIA FOR FOUR (4)
F THIS

ENT VENDOR

HICH EMPLOYS

TS AND WHICH
CIPAL PLACE OF
USLY FOR THE

HE DATE OF THIS

RENCE FDOR THE

N RESIDENT VENDOR|

.. . SEEREVEHSE SIDEFORTERMS AND CONDHIONS - =0 o

TELEPHONE

“[DATE

TITLE

FEIN

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPAGE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'




C L B NUMBER
PRI3500 6
T ADDRESS COHRESPONDENGE TO ATTENT BN OF

JOHN ABBOTT
304-K58-25844

Request for

State of West Virginia ]
Quotation

Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Sireet East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

x709005959
FUJIFILM GRAPHIC SYSTEMS USA
4340 ROBARDS LANE

502-485-1234 —
1 WV PRISON INDUSTRIES

617 LEON SULLIVAN WAY
] CHARLESTON, WV
25301

LOUISVILLE KY 40218

304-558-2945

o BATERRINIED o n e TERMSORGALE

04/06/2007
BID OPENING DATE:

04

RESIDENT VENDOR WHO CERTIFIES THAT,
CONTRACT, ON AVERAGE AT LEAST

{ ) BIDDER IS A
DURING THE L{IFE QF THE

75% OF THE E
ARE RESIDENT
THE STATE CO
PRECEDING SU

MPLOYEES W
S OF WEST

NTINUOUSLY
BMISSION O

VIRGINIA WHO HAYV|
FOR THE TWO YEA
F THIS BID;

ORKING ON THE PRDJECT BEING BID

E RESIDED IN
RS IMMEDIATEL

Y

OR
{ ) BIDDER
NONRESIDENT

OF BUSINESS

SUBSIDIARY'S
HO HAVE RESIDED
EARS IMMEDIATELY)

BIDDER UNDERSTANDS IF
BIDDER RECEIVING PRE

DETERMINES THAT A

MINIMUM OF ONE HUNDRED
VENDOR WITH AN AFFILIATE O
WHICH MAINTAINS I[fS HEADQUARTERS OR PR
WETHIN WEST VIRGINIA EMPLO
OF ONE HUNDRED STATE RESIDENTS WHO CER
DURING THE L|IIFE OF THE
75% OF THE EMPLOYEES OR BIDDERS®
EMPLOYEES
IN THE STATE CONTINUO
PRECEDING SUBMISSION

IS A NONRESIDENT VENDOR E

STATE RESIDENTS

ON AV
AFFIL
ARE RESIDENTS O

CONTRACT,

THE SECRETARY OF

FAILED TO CONTINUE TO MEET THE REQUIRE

PREFERENCE ,
PURCHASING TO:
DRDER ISSUED;

THE SECRETARY MAY ORDER TH
(A> RESCIND THE CONTRA
OR [(B> ASSESS A PENALTY

BIDDER IN AN AMOUNT NOT TO EXCEED 5% O
ND THAT SUCH PENALTY WILL BE PAID TO
GENCY OR DEDUCTED FROM ANY UNPAID BAL

CONTRACT OR PURCHASE ORDER.

BY SUBMISSION OF [THIS CERTIFICATE,

BID

DISCLOSE ANY REASONABLY REQUESTED INFO
PURCHASING DIIVISION AND AUTHORIZES THE
AX AND REVENUE TO DISCLOSE TO THE DIR
URCHASING APPROPRIATE| INFORMATION VER
BIDBDER HAS PAID THE REQUIRED BUSINESS

MPLOYING A

OR IS A

R SUBSIDIARY
INCIPAL PLACE
YING A MINIMUM
TIFIES THAT,
ERAGE AT LEAST
TATE'S OR

F WEST VIRGINIA
USLY FOR THE TWO
OF THIS BID.

TAX & REVENUE
FERENCE HAS
MENTS FOR SUCH
E DIRECTOR OF
CT OR PURCHASE
AGAINST SUCH
F THE BID AMOUNT
THE CONTRACTING
ANCE ON THE

DER AGREES TO
RMATION TO THE
DEPARTMENT OF
ECTOR OF

IFYING THAT
TAXES, PROVIDED

SIGNATURE

TELEPHONE

DATE

TITLE

FEIN

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'




State of West Virginia
Depariment of Administration
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

*709005959 502-485-1234
FUJIFILM GRAPHIC SYSTEMS USA
4340 ROBARDS LANE

LOUISVILLE KY 40218

Request for
Quotation

o REQNUMBER o

PRI3500

T ADDRESS CORRESPONDERCE TG ATTENTION.OF - s

JOHN ABBOTT
306-Kh8-2564

S Wy

PRISON INDUSTRIES

617 LEON SULLIVAN WAY
CHARLESTON,
253901

wv
304-5658-2945

DATEPAINTED. ] TERMSOFSALE

LTSRN

04/04/2007

BID O

PENING DATE:

OPENING TIME

TION
Y OTH
E CON

THAT SUCH IN
TAXES PAID N
COMMISSIONER

FORMA
OR AN
TO B

UNDER PENALT
CODE 61-5-3)
CERTIFICATE
THAT IF A CO
CONTAINED WI
TERM OF THE
DIVISION IN

Y OF

» BID
IS TR
NTRAC
THIN

CONTR
WRITI

LAW F
DER H
UE AN
T IS
THIS
ACT ;

NG IMMED

BIDDE

DATE :

SIGNE

TITLE[: -
COMBI
" R
RECEI
E FOR

NATIO
I!BI! s
VE.
BOTH

* CHECK ANY
IN EITHER "A
ENTITLED TO
5% PREFERENC
(REV. 12/00)>

YOU

NOTICE

A SIGNED BID MUST| BE S

DEPARTMENT O
PURCHAS|ING D
BUILDING 15

F ADM

ITVISION

!IAII

DOES NOT CONTAIN
ER INFORMATION D
FIDENTIAL.

OR FALSE SWEARIN
EREBY EERTIFIES

D ACCURATE IN AL
ISSUED TO BIDDER
CERTIFICATE CHAN
BIDDER WILL NOTI

IATELY.

N OF PREFERENCE
OR BOTH ™A™

AND
MAY REQUEST
AND "B".

UBMITTED TO:

INISTRATION

THE AMOUNTS OF
EEMED BY THE TAX

G (WEST VIRGINIA
THAT THIS

L RESPECTS; AND
AND IF ANYTHING
GES DURING THE

FY THE PURCHASING

CONSIDERATION(S)
"B"™ WHICH YOU ARE
UP TO THE MAXIMUM

S

IGNATURE

TELEPHONE

DATE

TITLE

FEIN

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'




2! LOUISVILLE KY

¥*709005959

State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

1 FUJIFILM GRAPHIC SYSTEMS USA
| 4340 ROBARDS LANE

40218

| WV PRISON INDUSTRIES

Request for TTPAGE
Quotation 8
o - ADDRESS GORRESPUNDENCE TO ATTENTION.GF =+
JOHN ABBOTT
304-5h8-2K44
502-485-1234 5

617 LEON SULLIVAN WAY
CHARLESTON, WV
g | 25301 306-558-2945
DATEPRINTED. ~ © | TERMSOFSALE =7 [~
06/06/2007
BID OPENING DATE: _ 04/19/2007 BID OPENING TIME 01:30PM

2019 WASHINGTON S
CHARLESTON,

THE BID SHOULD CONTAIN

THE ENVELOPE} OR THE BI
SEALED BID

BUYER:

RFQ. NO.:

BID OPENING DATE:

BID OPENING [TIME:

PLEASE PROVIPDE A
TO EONTACT YOU REGARDI

FAX N

TREET, EAST
h305-0130

THIS INFORMATIO
P MAY NOT BE CON

JOHN ABBOTT----

UMBER IN CASE IT
NG YOUR BID:

458-6567

M ON THE FACE OF
SIDERED:

T SEEREVERRE SIDE FOR TERME AND CONDITIONS

SIGNATURE

TELEPHONE

"~ [DATE

TIILE

FEIN

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'




P10

PRI3500 - FILM, INKS, PLATES, ETC. - BID FORM - BID OPENING 4/19/07; 1:30 PM

ITEM SPECIFICATIONS ARE SHOWN AS
. BRAND SPECIFIC - AN ACCEPTABLE EQUAL
MAY BE BID

UNIT PRIC

PER

APPROXIMATE
ANNUAL

QUANTITY

EXTENDED
TOTAL

FILM ST s e
IMAGE 5000 NEG PAPER FILM 20 ROLLS $2721.00
TTEK MEGA PLATES (MEGA PLUS FILM) ROLL 15 ROLLS $2589. 45
AB DICK NEG DIGITAL FILM (13"X200") ROLL 30 ROLLS ¢ 11940.60
AB DICK NEG DIGITAL FILM (14"X200' ROLL $ 42864

.....R(SLL.

" 35 ROLLS

$9121.00

BLANKETS

AB DICK MEGA PRO PLATES (13"X200%

ITEK PLATES (24 1/4 X 28 1/2 X .008) $207.84 BOX OF 30 8 BOXES $1662.72
KODAK PLATES (23 5/8 X 28 3/4 X .003) $204,27 BOX OF 30 50 BOXES $10213.50
KODAK PLATES (13 8/16 X 19 3/32 X .006) $223.88 BOX OF 100 15 BOXES $3358.20
KODAK PLATES (12 3/4 X 18 1/16 X .005) $204.77 BOX OF 100 10 BOXES $2047.70
KODAK PLATES (21 5/8 X 25 5/8) $325.80 BOX OF 60 25 BOXES $8145.00
KODAK PLATES (24 1/4 X 28 1/2) 2-SIDED $207.84 BOX OF 30 25 BOXES $5196.00

TTEK BLANKET (330 X 496 X 2.5) $98 0 EACH 55 BLANKETS  |$ 1502.25
1450 1650 BLANKET (18 7/16 X 12 5/8 X .067) $21.67 EACH 55 BLANKETS  |$1191.85
1250 BLANKET (18 1/2 X 10 5/8 X .067) $18.82 EACH 15 BLANKETS  |$ 282.30
SAKURAI BLANKET (24 5/8 X 28 3/4) 4 PLY $48.79 EACH 40 BLANKETS  |$1951.60
SAK UNDER BLANKET (22 3/4 X 28 5/8) $36.45 FACH 40 BLANKETS |5 1458.00
AB DICK BLANKET (19 1/4 X 22 3/4 X .0675) $37.70 EACH 3 BLANKETS |$7113.37
FUJI BLANKET (22 5/8 X 26 1/8 X .076) $56.74 EACH $170.22

3 BLANKETS

CHEMICALS : Lo
AB DICK ACTIVATOR (MEGA PLATE) $12.75 GAL 83 - 1 GAL CONTAINERS |5 1058. 25
ANCHOR BLANKET WASH $400.00 55 GAL DRUM 4-55GALDRUMS  |$ 1600.00
KODAK DEVELOPER (PLATE SP200) $113.09 5 GAL 15 - 5 GAL CONTAINERS }$ 1696.35
AB DICK RAPID ACCESS DEVELOPER $12 19 5QT 124 - 5 QT CONTAINERS [$1511.56
HAR UNIVERSAL FAN-A-PART $21.24 GAL 21 - 1 GAL CONTAINERS [$ 446,04
AB DICK CAMERA PROCESSOR FIXER $15.52 5QT 92 - 5 T CONTAINERS |$ 1427.84
ANCHOR FOUNTAIN CONCENTRATE $no bid 5 GAL 7- 5 GAL CONTAINERS |$ o bid
AB DICK MEGA PLATE FOUNTAIN CONCENTRATE  {$11.24 GAL 20 - 1 GAL CONTAINERS |$ 224.80
AB DICK STABLIZER £11.99 L 27-1 ONTAINERS |$ 323.73

$45.00

5 LB CAN

119 -

— CAN.S. e

VANSON BLACK (RB) $ carc pn
VANSON BLACK PROCESS SWOP (OB) $46.13 5 LB CAN 54-51BCANS [$ 2491.02
VANSON BRILLIANT BLUE (RB) $19.84 1 LB CAN 1-11BCAN [$ 19.84

VANSON CYAN PROCESS SWOP (OB) $58.63 5 B CAN 55-5 LB CANS |$ 3224.65
VANSON DELFT BLUE (RB) §113.78 5 LB CAN 16 -5 LB CANS | 1802.48




P11

ITEM SPECIFICATIONS ARE SHOWN AS , APPROXIMATE
BRAND SPECIFIC - AN ACCEPTABLE EQUAL ANNUAL EXTENDED
MAY BE BID UNIT PRICE PER QUANTITY TOTAL
VANSON GOLD CHIPS (RB) $No bid 5 LB CAN 7-5LBCANS  {$no bid
VANSON GOLD METALLIC (OB) $ 53.49 2.2LBCAN [ 22-2.2LBCANS [$1176.78
VANSON GREEN IVY MINT (OB) $ 113.78 5 LB CAN 2-5LBCANS 1$227.56
VANSON GREEN IVY MINT (RB) $ 113.78 5 LB CAN 1-5LBCAN  $113.78
VANSON MAGENTA PROCESS SWOP (OB) $ 58.02 5 LB CAN 59-5LB CANS [$3423.18
VANSON RED PEPPER (RB) $17.14 1 LB CAN 1-11BCAN  [$17.14
VANSON RED PEPPER (RB) $ 113.78 5 LB CAN 16 -5 LB CANS |$1820.48
VANSON REFLEX BLUE (OB) $ 92.20 5 LB CAN 4-5IBCANS [$368.80
VANSON REFLEX BLUE (RB) $ 92.20 5 LB CAN 12-5LBCANS [$1106.40
VANSON RUBINE RED (OB) $ 94.30 5 LB CAN 1-5LBCAN  [$94.30
VANSON RUBINE RED (RB) § 74.30 5 LB CAN 1-5LBCAN |$24.30
VANSON YELLOW (RB) $81.18 5 LB CAN 6-5LBCANS [$487 08
VANSON YELLOW SWOP (OB) $ 54,74 5 LB CAN 52 -5 LB CANS |$2846.48
VANSON GOLD CHIPS (OB) $113.78 5 LB CAN 7-5LBCANS  [$568.90
VANSON MIXED INK (OB) $ 113.78 5LB CAN 10-5LBCANS [$1137.80
SUPPLIES FOR P e T S
1250 CLEAN UP SHEETS (11 1/8 X 18 1/8) PINBAR |$ 21.55 BOX OF 100 4 BOXES $re 24
3200 CLEANUP SHEETS (13 5/8 X 19 3/8) PINBAR |$ 21.56 BOX OF 100 18 BOXES $388.08 =
M-1360-PB CLEANUP SHEETS (12 7/8 X 18 1/16) 1§ 26.63 BOX OF 100 3 BOXES $79.89
FACE MASKS $ no bid BOX OF 50 2 BOXES $nobid
GLOVES (VINYL DISPOSABLE) (X-LARGE) $6.47 BOX OF 50 110 BOXES $711.70
HANDI-PADS $ 73.80 CASE OF 12 26 CASES $1918.80 !
LAMINATING FILM (18X500X1 1.5MIL) ¢ 20.80 ROLL 79ROLLS  [$1643.20
1250 MASKING SHEETS $ 33.86 BOX OF 100 10 BOXES $338.60
ITEK MASKING SHEETS ¢ 33.86 BOX OF 100 12 BOXES 5406.32
1450/1650 MASKING SHEETS $ 37.71 BOX OF 100 5 BOXES $188.55
KORS BASELING HEIDELBERG MASKING SHEETS | 99.32 BOX OF 100 $80X4 bx [$397.28
ORANGE OVERLAY (RULED) BASELINE $ 129,32 BOX OF 100 5 BOXES $646.60
ACETATE CLEAR FILM $ 54.35 BOX OF 50 8 BOXES $434.72
STRETCH FILM (1500" X 18" 0.8 MIL) AEP $ 16.03 ROLL -7 BOXES (28)}$ 448.84
SHRINK FILM (16" X 2098’ X 75 GAUGE) RENOLON |$ 165.36 ROLL | (11X9BOXES $1818.96

TOTAL $112213.48
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SIGNATURE — - TELEPHONE DATE
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RFQ NoFRI3500

AFFIDAVIT

West Virginia Code §5A-3-10a states:

No contract or renewal of any contract may be awarded by the state or any of its political subdivisions to any
vendor or prospective vendor when the vendor or prospective vendor or a related party to the vendor or
prospective vendor is a debtor and the debt owned is an amount greater than one thousand doflars in the

aggregate

DEFINITIONS: :
“Debt” means any assessment, premium, penalty, fine, tax or other amount of money owed to the state or any

of its political subdivisions because of a judgment, fine, permit violation, ficense assessment, defauited
workers' compensation premium, penalty or other assessment presently delinquent or due and required to be
paid to the state or any of its political subdivisions, including any interest or additional penalties accrued

thereon.

“Debtor* means any individual, corporation, partnership, association, limited liability company or any other form
or business association owing a debt to the state or any of its political subdivisions. “Political subdivision”
means any county commission; municipality; county board of education; any instrumentality established by a
county or municipality; any separate corporation or instrumentality established by one or more counties or
municipalities, as permitted by law; or any public body charged by law with the performance of a government
function or whose jurisdiction is coextensive with one or more counties or municipalities. “Related party” means
a party, whether an individual, corporation, partnership, association, limited liability company or any other form
or business association or other entity whatsoever, related to any vendor by blood, marriage, ownership or
contract through which the party has a relationship of ownership or other interest with the vendor so that the
party will actually or by effect receive or control a portion of the benefit, profit or other consideration from
performance of a vendor contract with the party receiving an amount that meets or exceed five percent of the

total contract amount.

EXCEPTION:

The prohibition of this section does not apply where a vendor has contested any tax administered pursuant to
chapter eleven of this code, workers’ compensation premium, permit fee or environmental fee or assessment
and the matter has not become final or where the vendor has entered into a payment plan or agreement and
the vendor is not in default of any of the provisions of such plan or agreement.

LICENSING:
Vendors must be licensed and in good standing in accordance with any and alt state and local laws and

requirements by any state or local agency of West Virginia, including, but not limited to, the West Virginia
Secretary of State’s Office, the West Virginia Tax Department, West Virginia Insurance Commission, or any
other state agencies or political subdivision. Furthermore, the vendor must provide all necessary releases to
obtain information to enable the Director or spending unit to verify that the vendor is licensed and in good

standing with the above entiies.

CONFIDENTIALITY:

The vendor agrees that he or she will not disclose to anyone, directly or indirectly, any such personally
identifiable information or other confidential information gained from the agency, unless the individual who is
the subject of the information consents to the disclosure in writing or the disclosure is made pursuant to the
agency’s policies, procedures and rules. Vendors should visit www.state.wv.usfadmin/purchase/privacy for

the Notice of Agency Confidentiality Policies.

Under penalty of law for false swearing (West Virginia Code, §61-5-3), it is hereby certified that the vendor
acknowledges the information in this said affidavit and are in compliance with the requirements as stated.

Vendors Name: Fujimc Systems USA Inc
! s "
Authorized Signature: ;aa(/“’*—\ Date: _4/17/07
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