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GENERAL TERMS & CONDITIONS
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION {RFQ) AND REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL (RFP)

1. Awards will be made in the best interest of the State of West Virginia.

2. The Siate may accept or reject in part, or in whole, any bid.

3 All quotations are governed by the West Virginia Code and the Legislative Rules of the Purchasing Division.

4, Prior to any award, the apparent successiul vendor must be properly registered with the Purchasing Division and have
paid the required $125.00 registralion fee.

5. All services periormed or goods delivered under State Purchase Orders/Contracts are to be continued for the term
of the Purchase Order/Contract, contingent upon funds being appropriated by the Legislaiure or otherwise being
made available. In the event funds are not appropriated or otherwise available for these services or goods, th!s
Purchase Order/Contract becomes veid and of no effect after June 30.

8. Payment may only be made after the delivety and acceptance of goods oy setvices.-

7. interest may be paid for late payment in accordance with the West Virginia Code.

8. Vendor preference will be granted upon written request in accordance with the West Virginia Code.

8, The Stale of West Virginia is exempt from federal and state taxes and will not pay or reimburse such taxés.

10.  The Director of Purchasing may cancel any Purchase Order/Contract upon 30 days wtitien notice fo the seller.

11.  The laws of the State of West Virginia and the Legisfative Rules of the Purchasing Division shall govern all rights

and duties under the Contract, including without imitation the validity of this Purchase Order/Contract.

12, Any reference to automatic renewal is hereby deleted. The Contract may be renewed only upen mutual written
agreemeant of the parties.

13.  BANKRUPTCY: Inthe event the vendor/contractor files for bankruptcy protection, this contract is automatically
null and void, and is terminated without further order.

14, HIPAA Business Associate Addendum - The West Viginia Stafe Government HIPAA Business Associate
Addendum (BAA), approved by the Attorney General, and available online at the Purchasing Division's web site
(hitp:/www.state.wv.us/admin/purchase/vre/hipaa.htm) i$ hereby made pan! of the agreement. Provided that, the
Agency meets the definition of a Covered Entity (45 CFR §1560.103) and will be disclosing Protected Health
Information {45 CFR §160.103) to the vendor.

INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS

1. Use the gquotation forms provided by the Purchasing Division.

2. SPECIFICATIONS: ltems offered must be in compliance with the specifications. Any deviation from the specifications
must be clearly indicaled by the bidder. Alternates offered by the bidder as EQUAL to the specifications must be
clearly defined. A bidder offering an alternate should attach complele specifications and literature to the bid. The
Purchasing Divisiocn may waive minor deviations o speciilcations.

3. ' GCompilete all sections of the quotation form.

4, Unit prices shall prevail in cases of discrepancy.

5. All quotations are considered F.O.B. destination unless alternale shipping terms are ciearly identified in the quotation.

6. BID SUBMISSION: All quotations musl be delivered by the bidder to the office listed below prior to the date and time

of the bid opening. Failure of the bidder 1o deliver the quotations on time will result in bid disqualifications.
SIGNED BID TO:

Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

Rev. 06/21/2006
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StaTE OF WEST VIRGINIA

VENDOR PREFERENCE CERTIFICATE

Certification and application™ is hereby made for Preference in accordance with West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37. (Does not
apply to construction contracts).

Application is made for 2.5% preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is an individuai resident vendor and‘ has resided continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately
preceding the date of this certification;

A

x or

¥ ™ Bidderis a partnership, association or corporation resident vendor and has maintained its headquarters or principat
place of business continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preceding the date of this certification;
of B0% of the ownership interest of Bidder is held by another individual, parinership, association or corporation
resident vendor who has maintained its headquarters or principal place of business continuously in West Virginia for

four {4} years immediately preceding the date of this certification;

or . ‘

Bidder is a nonresident vendor which has an affiliate or subsidiary which employs a minirmum of one hundred state

residents and which has maintained its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia continuously

for the four {4) years immediately preceding the date of this certification.

8. Application is made for 2.5% preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is a resident vendor who certifies that, during the life of the contract, on average at feast 75% of the employ-
ees working on the project being bid are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the
two years immediately preceding submission of this bid;

or

Bidder is a nonresident vendor employing a minimum of one hundred state residents or is a nonresident vendor with
an affiliate or subsidiary which maintains its headguarters or principal place of business within West Virginia employ-
ing a minimum of one hundred state residents who certifies that, during the life of the contract, on average at least
75% of the empioyees or Bidder's affiliate’s or subsidiary’s employees are residents of West Virginia who have
resided in the state continuously for the two years immediately preceding submission of this bid.

Bidder understands if the Secretary of Tax & Revenue determines that a Bidder receiving preference has failed to continue to
meet the requirements for such preference, the Secretary may order the Director of Purchasing to: (a) rescind the contract or
purchase order issued; or (b) assess a penalty against such Bidder in an amount not to exceed 5% of the bid amount and that
such penalty will be paid to the contracting agency or deducted from any unpaid balance on the contract or purchase order.

By submission of this certificate, Bidder agrees to disclose any reasonably requested information to the Purchasing Division
and authorizes the Department of Tax & Revenue to disclose to the Director of Purchasing appropriate information verifying
that Bidder has paid the required business taxes, provided that such information does not contain the amounts of taxes paid
nor any other information deemed by the Tax Commissioner to be confidential.

Under penalty of law for false swearing (West Virginia Code, §61-5-3), Bidder hereby certifies that this certificate is
true and accurate in all respects; and that if a contract is issued to Bidder and if anything contained within this
certificate changes during the term of the contract, Bidder will notify the Purchasing Division in writing immedi-

ately.
Bidder: Signe(% W—\w__w o

06 FLEET MANAGER
SEPT 18, 200 Tiie:

Date:

*Check any combination of preference consideration(s) in either "A” or "B", or both "A” and "B” which you are eniitled to receive. You may
request up to the maximum of 5% preference for both “A” and “B".

{Rev. 12/00)



| ~ RFQNo. /’7f/07
AFFIDAVIT

West Virginia Code §5A-3-10a states: .

No contract or renewal of any contract may be awarded by the state or any of its political subdivisions to any
vendor or prospective vendor when the vendor or prospective \endor or a related party fo the vendor or
prospective vendor is a debtor and the debt owned is an amount greater than one thousand doflars in the

aggregate.

DEFINITIONS:
“Debt” means any assessment, premium, penalty, fine, tax or other amount of money owed to the state or any

of its political subdivisions because of a judgment, fine, permit violation, license assessment, defaulted
workers' compensation premium, penalty or other assessment presently delinquent or due and required fo be
paid to the state or any of its political subdivisions, including any interest or additional penalties accrued

thereon.

“Debtor’ means any individual, corporation, partnership, aséoqiation, limited liability compahy or any other form
or business association owing a debt to the state or any of its political subdivisions.

“Political subdivision” means any county commission; municipality; county board of education; any
instrumentality established by a county or municipality; any separate corporation or instrumentality established
.by one or more counties or municipalities, as permitted by law; or any public body charged by law with the
performance of a government function or whose jurisdiction is coextensive with one or more counties or

municipalities. :

“Related party" means a party, whether an individual, corporation, partnership, association, limited liability
company or any other form or business association or other entity whatsoever, related to any vendor by blood,
marriage, ownership or contract through which the party has a relationship of ownership or other interest with
the vendor so that the party will actually or by effect receive or control a portion of the benefit, profit or other
consideration from performance of a vendor contract with the party receiving an amount that meets or exceed

five percent of the total contract amount,

EXCEPTION:
The prohibition of this section does not apply where a vendor has contested any tax administered pursuant to

chapter eleven of this code, workers’ compensation premium, permit fee or environmental fee or assessment
and the matter has not become final or where the vendor has entered into a payment plan or agreement and
the vendor is not in default of any of the provisions of such plan or agreement.

LICENSING: :
The vendor must be licensed in accordance with any and all state requirements to do business with the state of

West Virginia.

CONFIDENTIALITY: : ]
The vendor agrees that he or she will not disclose to anyone, directly or indirectly, any such personally

identifiable information or other confidential information gained from the agency, unless the individual who is
the subject of the information consents to the disclosure in writing or the disclosure is made pursuant to the
agency’s policies, procedures and rnules. Vendors should visit www.state. wv.us/admin/purchase/privacy for

the Notice of Agency Confidentiality Policies. -

Under penalty of law for false swearing (West Virginia Code, §61-5-3), it is hereby certified that the vendor

acknowledges the information in this said affidavit and are in compliance with the requirements as stated.
COUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER DODGE iNC

Vendors Name: . /N 4 ﬂ 14/ ,

( d ﬁ‘%/ //(%/ N W _ September 17, 2006
Authorized Signature: \ W Date:
No Debt Affidavit

Revised 02/06/06



MVO07 Information and Certification

VENDOR NAME: COUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER DODGE INC.
Contract coordinator: DON McNEMAR

Toll Free Telephone Number: 800-424-7611

Telephone Number: 304-624-7611

Fax Number: 304-624-5428

Email Address: businesslink@countryclubchrysier.com

Note: This request for quotation requires that all option pricing be at dealer cost.

It is hereby certified, under penaity of perjury, that | have met this requirement on
ajl MVO7 documents.

N : Donald R. McNema
ame N Y ke chemar
Signature: ( M M(A&z_/—————* T
v
Title FLEET MANAGER

Date SEPTEMBER 18 2006
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wvssa STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
PURCHASING CONTINUATION SHEET

Buyer;

FPage

Req. or P. O, No.:

Don McNemar
Vendor: COUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER DODGE

Spending Lhnit:

PO Box 2321 -USRt19 8.
Clarksburg, WV 26302-2321

800-424-7611 FAX 304-624-5428 ﬂf ]/0 7
Requisition No.:

ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT

i hereby acknowledge receipt of the following checked addendum(s) and have made
the necessary revisions to my proposal, plans and/or specifications, ete.

Addendum No.’s:
No. 1 /
No. 2
No. 3
No. 4

No. &

| understand that failure to confirm the receipt of the addendum(s) is cause for

rejection of bids.

AL

Signature
(soore g God Cueychn Dhpss
' Company )
7- /506
Date

Exhibit 10
Rev. 11/96




CLASS 1 AUTOMOBILE
Compact, 4 Door Sedan,

Front Wheel Drive, Wheelbase 95"

Vendor Name: COUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER

Manufacturer / Brand
Delivery
Model Name & Number

Requirements:

CHRYSLER
90-120 DAYS
PT CRUISER / PTCH44

Engine MIN: 135 HP 107 TORQUE
Transmission Automatic
Steering Power
Brakes Power/ABS
Radio AMIFM
Glass All Tinted
Mirrors Left & Right Qutside
License Plate Mounis Front & Rear
Tires All Season
Spare Tire Included - whlack
Rear Window/Defogger . Instalied
Front Seat Bucket
Air Conditioning Instalied
Floor Mats Instalied
Price Each Gasoline $12,364.00
Price Each Bi-Fuel NO BID
Price Each Dedicated CNG (1.6 Liter) NQ BID
EPA
HGWY

470-06-01-000

EPA
cITy

27

21

FOB Dealership: (Deduct)
FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

{$20.00)

Yy

$1.45

Don McNemar
COUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER DODGE
PO Box 2321 - USRt 19 S,
Clarksbhurg, WV 26302-2321
800-424-7611 FAX 304-824-5428

1 of 46

8/10/2006




CLASS 2 AUTOMOBILE ‘ 070-06-02-000
Midsize, 4 Door Sedan
Front Wheel Drive, Wheelbase 104"

Vendor Name;COUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER

Manufacturer / Brand
Delivery
Model Name & Number

Standard Equipment Requirements:

CHRYSLER
80-120 DAYS
SEBRING 4 DOOR / JSCH41

MIN: 153 HP 186 TORQUE

Engine
Transmission Automatic
Steering Power
Brakes Power/ABS
Radio AMIFM
Glass All Tinted
Mirrors Left & Right Outside
License Plaie Mounts Front & Rear
Tires All Season
Spare Tire Included - w/Jack
Rear Window/Defogger Instalied
Front Seat Bucket
Air Condltioning Instalied
Floor Mats Installed
Price Each $16,897.00
Price Each Bi-Fuel NOBID
Price Each Dedicated CNG (1.6 Liter} NOBID
FFV | E-85 $16,897.00

FOB Dealership: (Deduct)

FOB Cther than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

EPA EPA
HGWY ‘ . CITY

29 22

($20.00)

Yy v

$1.45

Don McNemar

COUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER DODGE
PO Box 2321 - USRt 19 S.

. Clarksburg, WV 26302-2321

800-424-7611 FAX 304-624-5428

2 of 46 8/10/2006



CLASS 4 AUTOMOBILE
Full Size, 4 Door, Rear Wheel Drive,
Wheetbase 109"

Vendor Name: COUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER DODGE

Manufacturer / Brand
Belivery
Model Name & Number

Standard Equipment Requirements:

DODGE

90-120 DAYS

CHARGER SE [ LHDH48

FOB Dealership: {Deduct)

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

Engine MIN: 210 HP 240 TORQUE

Transmission Automatic

Steering Power

Brakes Power/ABS

Radio AM/FM

Glass Al Tinted

Mirrors Left & Right Outside

License Piate Mounis Front & Rear

Fuel Tank Factory Standard

Power Windows and Locks Installed

Tires All Season

Spare Tire Full Size widack

Rear Window/Defogger Installed -

Frant Seat Bucket or Split Bench

Air Conditioning Installed

Floor Mats Installed

‘Seating Capacity 5

Price Each Gasoline $16,278.00

Price Each Dedicated CNG NOBID

Price Each FFV NO BID

EPA

HGEWY

070-06-04-001

EPA
CITY

"

19

A 2 4

($20.00)

Pon McNemar
COUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER DODGE
PO Box 2321 -USRt 19 8.
Clarksburg, WV 26302-2321
800-424-7611 FAX 304-624-5428

3of46

$1.45

8/10/2006




Vendor Name:

Manufacturer / Brand
Delivery
Model Name & Number

Standard Equipment Requirements:

CLASS 5 HYDBRID AUTOMOBILE 070-06-05-010
Full Size, 4 Door, Rear Wheel Drive
2,890 Curb Weight

MIN: 160 HP FULL HYBRID

Engine

Transmission Automatic
Steering Power

Brakes Power/ABS
Radio AM /! FM /CD
Glass All Tinted

Mirrors Left & Right Cutside
iicense Plate Mounis Front & Rear
Fuel Tank Factory Standard
Tires Al Season
Spare Tire Full Size wiJack
Rear Window/Defogger Installed

Front Seat Bucket

Air Conditioning instalted

Floor Mats instalied

Seating Capacity 4

Price Each Gasoline $

EPA EPA
HEWY CITY

Deiete Floor Mats {Deduct)
FOB Dealership: {Deduct)
FOB Cther than Metro Charieston - Per Mile
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CLASS 6 AUTOMOBILE 070-06-08-001
Utility, All Wheel/4 Wheel Drive, 4 Door
5,700 GYWR

Vendor Nmae:

Manufacturer / Brand
Delivery
Model Name & Number

Standard Equipment Requirements:

Engine MIN: 210 HP 254 TORQUE
Transmission Autornatic

Steering Power

Brakes Power/ABS

Radio AM/FM

Glass Al Tinted

Mirrors Left & Right Outside
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear

Tires All Season

Spare Tire Fuil Size widack
Rear Window/Defogger Installed

Fuel Tank Standard

Front Seat Bucket

Rear Seat Bench

Air Conditioning installed

Floor Mats installed

Price Each Gasoline $

Delete Floor Mats (Deduct)

Manual Transmission wiOverdrive {(Deduct)
Remove Console {Delete) (Console between seats)
FOB Dealershig; (Deduct)

FOR Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

5 of 46
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Vendor Name:

CLASS 8A AUTOMOBILE
Special Purpose, Off-Road, Alf Wheel Drive,
5700 GVWR, 109" Wheelbase

Manufacturer / Brand
Detivery
Modei Name & Number

Standard Equipment Requirements:

Engine MIN: 200 HP 195 TORQUE
Transmission Automatic

Steering Power

Brakes Power/ABS

Radio _AMIFM

Glass All Tinted

Mirrors {.eft & Right Qutside
License Plate Mounis Front & Rear

Tires All Terrain

Spare Tire Fuii Size widack
Rear Window/Defogger Installed

Fuel Tank Standard

Front Seat Bucket

Rear Seat Banch

Air Conditioning installed

Fioor Mats installed .

Running Ground Ciearance

At least 8.5 inches

Cargo Volume

Rear Seat | at least 35 cubic fi.

Cargo Velume

Rear Seat [ at least 67 cubic f.

Price Each Gasoline

070-06-06-002

L)
Lﬂlo_g/ﬂ
EPA EPA
HGWY CITY

Delete Running Boards and Luggage Racks (Deduct)

Delete Floor Mats (Deduct}
Manual Transmission wiQverdrive {Deduct)

Remove Console (Delete) {Console between seats)

FOB Dealership: (Deduct)
FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

YvyyYyvwvy

Deon McNemar
COUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER DODGE
PO Box 2321 -USRt19 6.
Clarkshburg, WV 26302-2321
800-424-7611 FAX 304-624-5428

6 of 46
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CLASS 7 AUTOMOBILE
Special Purpose, 4 Wheel Drive,
6400 GYWR

Vendor Name: COUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER

Manufacturer / Brand
Delivery
Modet Name & Number

Standard Equipment Requirements:

DODGE

00-120 DAYS

DURANGO / HB5M74

Engine MIN: 235 HP 205 TORQUE
Transmission Automatic
Steering Power
Brakes Power/ABS
Radio AM/FM
Glass All Tinted
Mirrors Left & Right Outside
lLicense Plate Mounts Front & Rear
Tires Ali Season
Spare Tire Full Size wiJack
Rear Window/Defogger Instalied
Fuel Tank Standard
Front Seat Bucket
Rear Seat Bench
Air Conditioning installed
Floor Mals Installed
Auto Locking Hubs Instailed
Price Each Gasoline $20,096.00

Delete Floor Mats {Deduct)
Manual Transmission w/Qverdrive {Deduct)

Remove Console (Delete) (Console between seats)

FOB Dealership: (Deduct)
FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

EPA
HGWY

070-06-07-001

EPA

COITY

19

14

Yy vYyvyy

{24.00)

N/A

N/A

Don McNemar
COQUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER DODGE
PO Box 2321 - US Rt 19 S.
Clarksburg, WV 26302-2321
800-424-7611 FAX 304-624-5428

7 of 48
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CLASS 8 VEHICLE : 070-06-08-002
4 Wheet Drive, 4 Doors,
8600 GVWR

Vendor Name: COUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER DODGE

Manufacturer / Brand
Delivery
Model Name & Number

Standard Equipment Requirements:

Engine MIN: 300 HP 360 TORQUE
Transmission Automatic w/Overdrive
Steering Power

Brakes Power/ABS

Radio AM/FM

Glass Al Tinted

Mirrors L.eft & Right Outside
License Plaie Mounts Front & Rear

Tires Al Season

Spare Tire Full Size widack

Rear Window/Defogger Installed

Fuel Tank Standard

Front Seat Bench

Rear Seat Bench

Air Conditioning Instalied

Floor Mats Installed

Price Each Gasoline

EPA EPA
HGWY CITY
Deiete Floor Mats (Deduct) > § -
Manual Transmission w/Overdrive (Deduct) > $ -
Remove Console {Delete) (Console between seats) > § -
FOB Dealership: {Deduct) > $ -
FOR Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile §
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Vendor Name:

CLASS 8A MYBRID VEHICLE
4 Wheel Drive, 4 Door,
5,675 Curb Weight

Manufacturer / Brand
Delivery
Model Name & Number

Standard Equipment Requirements:

Engine MIN: 268 HP HYBRID
Transmission Autornatic w/Overdrive
Steering Power

Brakes Power/ABS

Radio AM/FM/CD

Glass Adl Tinted

Mirrors i.eft & Right Ouiside
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear

Tires : All Season

Spare Tire Full Size wijack

Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control Standard

Keyless Entry Standard

Power Windows/Power Locks Standard

Rear Window/Defogger Instailed

Fue! Tank Standard

Front Seat Bucket

Rear Seat Bench

Air Conditioning Installed

Floor Mais Installed

Price Each Gasoiine

Delete Fioor Mats (Deduct)
FOB Dealership: (Deduct)

070-06-08-010

EPA
CITY

Yy

FOB Other than Metro Chariesion - Per Mile

Don McNemar

COUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER DODGE
PO Box 2321 - USRt 18 8.
Clarksburg, WV 26302-2321
FAX 304-624-5428

800-424-7811

9of 46
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Vendor Name:

CLASS 9 TRUCK
Small Pickup, 2 Wheel Drive,
3500 GVWR, Short Bed

Manufacturer / Brand
Delivery
Modet Name & Number

Standard Equipment Requirements:

Engine MIN: 143 HP 154 TORQUE
Transmission Automatic

Steering Power

Brakes Power

Radio AM/EM

Glass Ali Tinted

Mirrors Left & Right Quiside
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear

Cargo Box Fleetside

Bumper Rear Step Factory nstalled
Tires All Season

Spare Tire Included - widack -

Air Conditioning Installed

Front Seat Bench

Rubber Floor Covering Instalied

Price Each Gasoline

Delete Floor Mats (Deduct)
Manual Transmission wfOverdrive (Deduct)
FOR BDealership: {Deduct)
FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

070-48-08-001

EPA EPA
HEWY CITY
> 3
» 3
> $
$
Don McNemar
COUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER DODGE
PO Box 2321 - USSRt 18 S,
Clarksburg, WV 26302-2321
800-424-7611 FAX 304-624-5428
8/10/2006

10 of 46




CLASS 10 TRUCK 670-48-10---001
Small Pickup, 2 Wheel Drive, Extended Cab,
4200 GVWR, Short Bed

Vendor Name: COUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER DODGE

Manufacturer / Brand DODGE
Delivery 90-120 DAYS
Madel Name & Number DAKOTA CLUB CAB/ NDIL33

Standard Equipment Requirements:

Engine MIN: 200 HP 225 TORQUE
Transmission Automatic
Steering Power
Brakes Powser
Radio ) AM/FM
Glass All Tirded
Mirrors Left & Right Ouiside
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear
Cargo Box Fleetside
Bumper Rear Step Faclory Installed
Tires All Season
Spare Tire included - widack
Air Conditioning installed
Front Seat Bench BUCKETS
Rubber Floor Covering Installed CARPET
Price Each Gasoline $13,184.00
ERA EPA
HGWY CITY.

22 16

Manual Transmission wiOverdrive (Deduct) > ($965.00)
FOB Dealership: (Deduct) > {$20.00)
FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile > $1.45

Don McNemar
COUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER DODGE
PO Box 2321 -USRt19S.
Clarksburg, WV 26302-2321
800-424-7611 FAX 304-624-5428
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CLASS 10A TRUCK 070-048-10-010
Mid Size Pickup
FFull Size Doors, 4 Door Crew Cab

Vendor Name: COUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER DIDOGE

Manufacturer / Brand DODGE
Delivery 90-120DAYS
Model Name & Number DAKOTA QUAD CAB / ND1L34

Standard Equipment Requirements:

Engine MIN: 200 HP 225 TORQUE
Transmission See pricing options below
Steering Power

Brakes Power

Radio ‘ ' AMIFM

Class All Tinted
 Mirrors : Left & Right Oulside

License Plate Mounts Front & Rear

Cargo Box ‘ Fieetside

Bumper Rear Step Faciory Installed

Tires All Season

Spare Tire Included - widack

Air Conditioning instalied '

Front Seat Bench - BUCKETS
Rubber Floor Covering installed CARPET INC MATS

Price Each Gasoline $14,466.00

2 Wheel Drive - Automatic Transmission STANDARD

2 Wheel Drive - Manual Transmission DEDUCT ($965.00}

4 Wheel Drive - 6 sped Manual Transmyjeey ]
4 Wheel Drive - Automalic Transmissmuss 1 7A

EPA EPA
HGWY CITY

22 16

($20.00)
$1.45

FOB Dealership: (Deduct)
FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile
Powertrain Warranty  _ 36000__miles ___ 3 years

Yy

Don McNemar
COUNTRY CL.UB CHRYSLER DODGE
PO Box 2321 - USRE 19 8,
Clarksburg, WV 26302-2321
800-424-7611 FAX 304-624-5428
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CLASS 11 TRUCK
Smal Pickup, 2 Wheel Drive,
4200 GVWR, Short Bed

070-48-11-001

Vendor Name:CQUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER DODGE

Manufacturer / Brand
Delivery
Model Name & Number

Standard Equipment Requirements:

Engine MIN: 148 HP 180 TORQUE
Transmissicn Automatic

Sieering Power

Brakes Fower

Radio AMFM -

Glass Alf Tinted

Mirrors Left & Right Outside
lLicense Plate Mounts Front & Rear

Cargo Box Fleeiside

Bumper Rear Step Factory Installed
Tires All Season

Spare Tire Included - w/dack

Alr Conditioning Insiailed

Front Seat Bench

Rubber Fioor Covering Installed

Price Each Gasoline

EPA EPA
HEWY CITY
Manual Transmission w/Overdrive {Deduct) > $ -
Remove Console (Delete) (Console between seats) > $ -
FOB Dealership: (Deduct) » §$ -
FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile %
12 of 46 8/10/2006




CLASS 12 TRUCK
Large Pickup, 2 Wheel Drive
6000 GVWR, Short Bed

Vendor Name:COUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER DODGE

Manufacturer / Brand
Delivery
Model Name & Number

Standard Equipment Requirements:

DODGE

00-120BAYS

RAM 1500/ DR1LB1

Engine CMIN 185 HP 260 TORQUE
Transmission Automatic ‘
Steering Power
Brakes Power
Radio AMFM
Glass All Tinted
Mirrors Left & Right Ouiside
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear
Cargo Box Fleetside
Bumper Rear Step Factory Instalied
Tires All Season
Spare Tire Fuli Size wilack
Air Conditioning Installed
Front Seat Bench
Rubber Floor Covering Instalied
Price Each Gasoline $13,713.00
Hybrid NO BID
EPA
HGWY

Manual Transmission w/Overdrive (Deduct)
Delete Truck Bed (Deduct)
FOB Dealership: {Deduct)
FOR Other than Metro Charteston - Per Mite

070-48-12-001

EPA
CITY

21

16

YY ¢V

.($932'00)

N/A

{$20.00)

$1.45

Don McNemar

COUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER DODGE

PO Box 2321 -US R 19 8.
Clarksburg, WV 26302-2321
800-424-7611 FAX 304-624-5428

13 of 46
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CLASS 13 TRUCK | 070-48-13-001
Large Pickup, 2 Wheel Drive

00 GVWR, Long Bed
Vendor Name:COUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER DOBGE /¢ Ho6 B¢

Manufacturer / Brand
Delivery
Modet Name & Number

Standard Equipment Reguiremerts:

DODGE

90-120 DAYS

RAM 1500 LB/ DR1L62Z

Engine MIN: 231 HP 293 TORQUE
Transmission Automatic
Steering Power
Brakes Power
Radic AM/IFM
Glass All Tinted
Mirrors Left & Right Oulside
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear
Cargo Box Fleetside
Bumper Rear Step Factory Instailed
Tires All Season
Spare Tire Full Size w/Jack
Air Conditioning installed
Front Seat Bench
Rubber Floor Covering installed
Price Each Gasoline $14,639.00
Price Each Dedicated Alternative Fuel NO BID
Price Each Bi-Fuel Alternative Fue! FFV /EBS $14,639.00
EPA EPA
HEWY CITY

19 14

Delete Floor Mats {Deduct) > N/A RUBBER FLOOR
FOB Dealership: (Deduct} b ($20.00)
FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile - $1.45

Don McNemar
COUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER DODGE
PO Box 2321 - US Rt 19 S.
Clarksburg, WV 26302-2321
800-424-7811 FAX 304-624-5428
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CLASS 14 TRUCK 070-48-14-000
Large Pickup, 2 Whee! Drive
9000 GYWR, Long Bed, Crew Cab
8800 GVWR ‘

Vendor Name:COUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER DODGE

Manufacturer [ Brand
Delivery
Model Name & Number

‘Standard Equipment Requirements:

DODGE
90-120 DAYS
RAM 2500 QUAD f DH2L42

Engine MIN: 300 HP 360 TORQUE
Transmission Automatic

Steering Power

Brakes Power

Radio AM/FM

Glass All Tinted

Mirrors Left & Right Cutside

License Plate Mounts Front & Rear

Cargo Box Fleetside

Bumper Rear Step Factory Installed .
Tires All Season

Spare Tire Full Size w/dack

Air Conditioning Installed .

Rubber Floor Covering Installed

Price Each Gasoline
Price Each Dedicated Alternative Fuel
Price Each Bi-Fuel Alternative Fuel

$17,873.00
NO BID
NO BID
EPA EPA
HGWY cITY

HEAVY DUTY - NO EPA RATING

Manual Transmission w/Overdrive (Deduct) > {$994.00)
FOB Dealership: (Deduct) » {$20.00)
FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile $1.45

Bon McNemar
COUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER DODGE
PC Box 232 - US Rt 19 S.
Clarksburg, W\ 26302-2321
800-424-761" FAX 304-624-5428
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CLASS 15 TRUCK
Large Pickup, 2 Wheel Drive,
8500 GVWR, Long Bed

Vendor Name:COUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER DODGE

Manufacturer / Brand
Delivery
Model Name & Number

Standard Equipment Reguirements:

DODGE

90-120 DAYS

RAM 2500 4X2 / DR2L62

Engine MIN: 300 HP 360 TORQUE
Transmission Automatic
Steering Power
Brakes Power
Radio AMIFM
Glass All Tinted
Mirrors {eft & Right Outside
License Piate Mounis Front & Rear
Carge Box Fleetside
Bumper Rear Step Factory Installed
Tires All Season
Spare Tire Fult Size whlack
Alr Conditioning instailed
Rubber Floor Covering Instailed
Price Each Gasoline $15,642.00
Price Each Bi-Fuel Alternative Fuel NO BID
EPA
HGWY

Delete Truck Bed (Deduct)
Manual Transmission w/Overdrive (Deduct)
FOB Deatership: (Deduct)
FOB Other than Matro Charleston - Per Mile

070-48-15-000

EPA
CITY

HEAVY DUTY —

NO EPA RATING

yvyvyYyvwy

Don McNemar

COUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER DODGE

PO Box 2321 - US Rt 19 S.
Clarksburg, WV 26302-2321
800-424-7611 FAX 304-624-5428
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CLASS 16 TRUCK
Small Pickup, 4 Wheel Drive,
4500 GVWR, Short Bed

Vendor Name: COUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER DODGE

Manufacturer / Brand
Delivery
Model Name & Number

Standard Equipment Requirements:

Engine MIN: 207 HP 238 TORQUE
Transmission Automatic

Steering Power

Brakes Power

Radio AM/FM

Glass All Tinted

Mirrors Left & Right Qutside
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear

Cargo Box Fleetside’

Bumper Rear Step Factory Instalied
Tires All Season

Spare Tire Full Size w/Jack

Air Conditioning installed

Front Seat Bench

Auta Locking Hubs installed

Rubher Floor Covering

Installed

Price Fach Gasoline

070-48-16-000

EPA EPA

HGWY CITY

Manual Transmission w/Overdrive (Deduct) > $ -
FOB Dealership: (Deduct) » s -

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

17 of 46
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CLASS 17 TRUCK
Small Pickup, 4 Wheel Drive,
Extended Cab, 4700 GVWR

070-48-17-000

vendor Name:COUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER DODGE

Manufacturer / Brand BODGE
Delivery 90-120 DAYS
Model Name & Number DAKOTA CLUB CAB / ND5L33

Standard Equipment Requirements:

Engine MiN: 207 HP 225 TORQUE
Transmission Automatic
Steering Power
Brakes Power/ABS
Radio AMIFM
Glass All Tintad
Mirrors Left & Right Quiside
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear
Cargo Box Fleetside
Bumper Rear Step Factory Installed
Tires All Season
Spare Tire Full Size wiJack
Air Conditioning Instalied
Front Seat Bench BUCKET
Auto Locking Hubs installed”
Rubber Floor Mats Installed CARPET W/MATS
Price Each Gasoline $15,783.00
EPA EPA
HGWY CITY

19 15

Manual Transmission w/Overdrive {Deduct) > ($965.00)
Delete Floor Mats (Deduct) > ($17.00)
Remove Console {Delete) (Console hetween seals) > N/A
FOB Dealership; (Deduct) » ($20.00)
FOB Other than Metro Charteston - Per Mile $1.45

Don McNemar
COUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER DODGE
PO Box 2321 -US R 18 8.
Clarksburg, WV 26302-2321
800-424-7611 FAX 304-824-5428
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CLASS 17A TRUCK

Midsize Pickup, Front-Hinged, Fuil Size Doors,
4 Wheel Drive, 4 Door Crew Cab, 4850 GVWR

Vendor Name: COUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER DODGE

Manufacturer / Brand
Delivery
Model Name & Number

Standard Equipment Requirements:

DODGE

50-120 DAYS

DAKOT QUAD CAB /ND5L84

Engine MIN: 240 HP 225 TORQUE
Transmission | Automatic )
Steering Power

Brakes Powet/ABS

Radio AM/FM

Glass All Tinted

Mirrors l.eft & Right Outside

License Plate Mounfs Front & Rear

Cargo Box Fleetside

Bumper Rear Step Factory instalied
Tires Ali Season

Spare Tire Fuli Size wi/Jack

Air Conditioning installed

Front Seat Bench . BUCKETS
Auto Locking Hubs installed

Rubber Floor Mats Instafled CARPET / MATS

Price Each Gasoline

Manual Transmission w/Overdrive (Deduct}
FOB Dealership: (Deduct)
FOB Cther than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

$16,949.00

EPA
HEWY

070-48-17-010

EPA
CITY

19

15

965.00

Y¥vYyy

{20.00)

Don McNemar

COUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER DODGE

PO Box 2321 -USRt 198,
Clarksburg, WV 26302-2321
800-424-7611 FAX 304-624-5428

19 of 46
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CLASS 18 TRUCK

Large Pickup, 4 Wheel Drive,

5400 GVWR, Short Bed

Vendor Name:COUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER DODGE

Manufacturer / Brand
Delivery
Model Name & Number

Standard Equipment Requirements:

Engine MIN: 231 HP 203 TORQUE
Transmission Automatic
Steering Power
Brakes Power/ABS
Radio AMEM
Glass All Tinted
Mirrars Left & Right Cutside
License Plate Mounis Front & Rear
Cargo Box Fleetside
Bumper Rear Step Factory Installed
Tires All Season
Spare Tire Full Size widack
Air Conditioning installed
Front Seat Bench
Auto Locking Hubs Installed
Rubber Floor Covering Instalied
Price Each Gasoline $15,153.00
Price Each CNG NQ BID
Hybrid NOBID
Flex Fuel $15,153.00
EPA
HGWY

6 Cylinder (Deduct}

Manual Transmission w/Overdrive (Deduct)
Delete Floor Mats (Deduct)

FOB Dealership: {Deduct)

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

070-48-18-000

EPA
CITY

18

14

Yy

yvyvy

Don McNemar
COUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER DODGE
PO Box 2321 - US Rt 13382.1
Clarksburg, WV 26302~
800-424-7611 FAX 304-624-5428
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NOT AVAILABLE

($994.00)

NOT IN BASE REQ.

($20.00)

$1.45
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CLASS 19 TRUCK

Large Pickup, 4 Wheel Drive,

8500 GVWR, Long Bed

Vendor Name:COUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER DODGE

Manufacturer / Brand
Delivery
Model Name & Number

Standard Equipment Requirements:

Engine MIN: 295 HP 335 TORQUE
Transmission Automatic
Steering Power
Brakes Power/ABS
Radio AMFEM
Glass Ali Tinted
Mirrors Left & Right Outside
License Plate Mounis Front & Rear
Cargo Box Fieetside
Bumper Rear Step Factory installed
Tires All Season
Spare Tire Fuil Size wilack
Alr Conditioning Installed
Front Seat Bench
Auto Locking Hubs Instalied
Rubber Floor Covering Installed
Price Each Gasoline $17,968.00
Price Each Dedicated Alternative Fuel NO BID
Price Fach Bi-Fuet Alternafive Fuel NOQ BID

Delete Truck Bed {Deduct)

Short Bed (Deduct)

8 Cylinder (Deduct)

Manual Transmission w/Overdrive {Deduct)
Delete Floor Mats {Deduct)

FOB Dealership: (Deduct)

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

EPA
HGWY

070-48-19-000

EPA
CITY

HEAVY DUTY - NO EPA RATING

YYYvyyY

Con McNemar
COUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER DODGE
PO Box 2321 -USRt 19 8.
Clarksburg, WV 26302-2321
800-424-7611 FAX 304-624-5428

21 of 46

{$184.00)

N/A

N/A
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CLASS 20 TRUCK 070-48-20-001
Chassis Cab, 4 Wheei Drive,

9200 GVWR, Single Rear Wheels

vendor Name:COUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER DODGE

Manufaciurer f Brand
Delivery
Model Name & Number

Standard Equipment Requirements:

Engine MIN: 300 HP 360 TORQUE
Transmission Automatic

Steering Power

Brakes Power/ABS

Radio AMIFM

Glass All Tinted

Mirrors Left & Right Outside
License Plate Mounis Front & Rear

Singte Rear Wheels Installed

Tires All Season Load Range D
Fuel Tank 20 Gallons Minimum

Air Conditioning Instailed

Front Seat Bench

Rubber Flogr Covering Installed

Required Options:

Price Each Flatbed 137" Each
Price Each Flatbed 161" Each

Price Each Dump Bed 137" Each

Price Each Pump Bed 161" Each

Price Each Utility Bed 137" Each

Price Each Utility Bed 161 Each

Gasoline Engine: 8 Cyl, 7.0 {Deducy)

2 Wheei Drive (Deduct)

Delete Truck Bed (Deduct)

8 Cylinder {Deduct)

Manual Transmission w/Overdrive (Deduct)
FOB Dealership: (Deduct)

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

GASOLINE

EPA
CITY

h 4 \ A/ Yy YyYy \} Y ¥
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CLASS 20A TRUCK
Chassis Cab, 4 Wheel Drive,
12,000 GVWR, Dual Rear Wheels

Vendor Name:

Manufacturer / Brand

Delivery

Model Name & Number

Standard Equipment Requirements:

070-48-20-002

Engine MIN: 300 HP 360 TORQUE
Transmission Automatic
Steering Power
Brakes Power/ABS
Radio AMIFM
Glass All Tinted
Migrors left & Right Outside
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear
Dual Rear Wheels Installed
Tires All Season LLoad Range D
Fuel Tank 20 Gallons Minimum
Air Conditioning Instalied
Front Seat Sanch
Rubber Floor Covering Instatled
Required Options: ) DIESEL GASOLINE
Price Each Flatbed 137" Each $25,687.00 $20,009.00
Price Each Fiatbed 161" Each $26,097.60 $20,413.00
EPA EPA
HEWY CITY

HEAVY DUTY NO EPA RATING

Price Each Bump Bed 137" Each $23,248.00
Price Fach Dump Bed 161" Each $25,653.00 AS ENG
Price Each Utility Bed 137" Each $23,314.00 USED
Price Each Utility Bed 161" Each $24,736.00
Gasoline Engine: 8 Cyl, 7.0 (Deduct) > L
2 Wheel Drive {Deduct} > ($2,410.00)
Delete Truck Bed (Deduct) > NIA
& Cylinder (Deduct) > N/A
Manual Transmission w/Overdrive (Deduct) > _-$994.00 GAS / -$1952.00 DIESEL
FOB Dealership: (Deduct) » ($20.00)
EOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile —> $1.45
. NOTE :TRUCK CAN BE ORDERED WITH NQ BED REQUIRED
PLEASE CALL FOR PRICING ADJUSTMENTS & AVALIABLE BED OPTIONS
Don McNemar
COUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER DODGE
PO Box 2321 - US Rt 21 g ;1
Clarksburg, WV 26302
800-424-7611 FAX 304-624-5428
23 0f 46 811072006



CLASS 21 TRUCK
Large Pickup, 4 Wheel Drive,
9000 GVWR, Long Bed, Dual Rear Wheels

070-48-21-001

Vendor Name: COUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER DODGE

Manufacturer / Brand
Delivery
Model Name & Number

Standard Equipment Requirements:

DODRGE
90-120 DAYS
RAM 3500 REG CAB/DIBLEZ

Engine MIN: 300 HP 360 TORQUE
Transmission Automatic

Steering Power

Brakes Power/ABS

Radio AM/FM

Glass All Tinted

Mirrors {.eft & Right Trailer Tow Type
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear

bual Rear Wheels Instalied

Tires Alf Season Load Range E

Spare Tire Fult Size wfJack

Cargo Box Fieetside

Bumper Rear Step / Factory Installed

Air Conditioning Installed

Auto Locking Hubs Instalied

Rubber Floor Covering Installed

Price Each Gasoline $21,719.00
Price Each CNG NO BID
EPA

HEWY

EAVY DUTY - NO EPA RA

2 Wheel Drive (Deduct) > ($2,660.00)
Delete Truck Bed (Deduct) > ($184.00)
Short Bed (Deduct) » N/A
& Cylinder (Deduct) > NIA
Manual Transmission w/Overdrive (Deduct) > ($994.00)
Delete Floor Mats {Deduct) > N/A
Remove Console (Delete) (Console between seals) > N/A
FOB Dealership: (Deduct) e ($20.00)
FOB Other than Metro Chatleston - Per Mile > $1.45
Deon McNemar

COUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER DODGE

PO Box 2321 - USSRt 18 8.

Clarksburg, WV 26302-2321

800-424-7611 FAX 304-624-5428
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CLASS 22 VAN, CARGO
6500 GVWR, 109" Wheelbase

Vendor Name:COUNTYR CLUB CHRYSLER DODGE

‘Manufacturar / Brand
Delivery
Model Name & Number

Standard Equipment Requirements:

Engine MIN; 180 HP 210 TORQUE
Transmigsion Automatic

Steering Power

Brakes Power/ABS

Radio AMIFM

Glass All Tinted

Mirrors Left & Right Ouiside
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear

Step Bumper installed

Tires All Season

Spare Tire Full Size w/Jack

Air Conditioning Installed

Seating Capacity 2

Passenger Seat

Price Each Gasoline

FOB Dealership: {Deduct)
FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mite

EPA
HGWY

070-92-21-001

v

8/10/2006




CLASS 23 VAN, CARGO 070-92-23-002
8500 GVWR, Rear Wheel Drive 135" Wheelbase

vendor Name:COUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER DODGE

Manufacturer / Brand
Delivery
Model Name & Number

Standard Equipment Requirements:

Engine Gasoline MIN: 225 HP 286 TORQUE
Engine Diesel MIN: 154 HP 286 TORQUE
Transmission Automatic
Steering Power
Brakes Power/ABS
Radio AMFM
Glass All Tinted
Mirrors Left & Right Quiside
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear
Tires All Season
Spare Tire Full Size wilack
Air Conditioning Instailed
Seating Capacity 2 Passenger Seat
EXTENDED STANDARD
BODY BODY -

Price Each Gasoline
Price Each Diesel

Y
&
1

FOB Dealership: (Deduct)
FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile $
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CLASS 24 VAN
Mini Passenger, Front Wheel Drive,
110" Wheelbase

Vendor Name: COUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER DODGE

Manufacturer / Brand
Delivery
Madel Name & Number

Standard Equipment Requirements:

DODGE

60-120 DAYS

CARAVAN /RSKL5Z

Engine MIN: 180 HP 165 TORQUE
Transmission Automatic

Steering Power

Brakes Power/ABS

Radio AMIFM

Glass All Tinted

Mirrors Left & Right Quiside
Licenge Plate Mounts Front & Rear
Seating 7 Passenger

Tires All Season

Spare Tire Included - wiJack
Rear Window Wiper/Defogger Installed

Fioor Mats instalied

Air Conditioning Installed

Doors Double Side & Rear

Loading Doors w/Glass

Price Each Gasoline
Price Each CNG

Delete Center Row Seats (Deduct)
Delete Third Row Seats (Deduct)

$14,277.00

NO BiD

EFA
HGWY

070-93-24-00

EPA
CITY

26

19

NO CREDIT QOPTION

Yy

NO CREDIT OPTION

FOB Dealershin: (Deduct)
FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

{$20.00)

Y.y

$1.45

Don McNemar
COUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER DODGE
PO Box 2321 -USRt 19 8.
Clarksburg, WV 26302-2321
800-424-7611 FAX 304-624-5428
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CLASS 25 VAN
8mall Rear Wheel Drive,
125" Wheel Base, Eight Passenger

Vendor Name: COUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER PODGE

Manufacturer / Brand
Detivery
Model Name & Number

Standard Equipment Requirements:

Engine MIN: 225 HP 286 TORQUE

Transmission Automatic

Steering Power

Brakes Power/ABS

Radio AM/FM

Glass All Tinted, Sides and Rear

Mirrars Left & Right Outside

License Plate Mounts Front & Rear

Seating 8 Passenger

Tires - All Season

Spare Tire Full Size w/lack

Rear Window Wiper/Defogger Instailed

Fipor Mats Installed

Air Conditioning tnstalied

2oors bouble Side & Rear
Full Length Head Liner w/insulation

Interior Side & Quarter Panel
Installed

Rear Step Burnper

Price Each Gasoline
Price Each Bi-Fuel
Price Each CNG

Delete Center Row Seats (Deduct)

Delete Third Row Seats (Deduct)

FOB Dealership: (Deduct)

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

070-93-25-001

EPA EPA
HGWY CITY
»> $ -
> $ -
> s -
$
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CLASS 26 VAN 070-93-26-000
12 Passenger Van, 125" Wheei Base

Vendor Name:COUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER DODGE

Manufacturer { Brand
Delivery
Mode! Name & Number

Standard Equipment Requirements:

Engine MIN: 255 HP 350 TORQUE
Transmission Automatic
Steering Power
Brakes Power/ABS
Radio AMIFM
Glass Al Tinted, Sides and Rear
Mirrors Left & Right Oulside
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear .
Seating 12 Passenger
Tires t.oad Range E
Spare Tire . Full Size wiJack
Rubber Floor Covering Instalied
Front and Rear Alr Conditioning Installed
Doors Double Side & Rear
Fuli Length Head Liner w/lnsulation
Interior ‘ Side & Quarter Panel
Rear Step Bumper Instalied

Price Each Gasgline
Price Each Bi-Fuel
Price Each CNG
Price Each Diesel

EPA ERPA
HGWY ‘ CITY

1

Detete Center Row Seats {Deduct}

Delete Third Row Seats (Deduct)

H

FOB Deatership: {Deduct)

fyrvyvy
3 |eR LA 16
%

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile
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CLASS 31 AUTOMOBHE
Passenger Car, 104" Whee! Base

103" WHEEL BASE

Vendor Name: COUNTRY CL;UB CHRYSLER DODGE

Manufaciurer / Brand
Delivery
Modet Name & Number

Standard Equipment Requirements:

CHRYSLER

90-120 DAYS

PT CRUISER / PTCH44

Engine MIN: 145.HP 155 TORQUE

Transmission Automatic

Steering Power

Brakes Power/ABS

Radio AMFM

Glass All Tinted

Mirrors Left & Right Quiside

License Plate Mounts Front & Rear

Tires All Season

Spare Tire Included - widack

Rear Window/Defogger Instailed

Floor Mats installed

Air Conditioning Installed

Price Each Gasoline $12,386.00
Price Each Dedicated CNG (1.6 Liter) NO BID
EPA

HEWY

FOB Dealership: (Deduct)

EOB Other than Metro Charlestor: - Per Mile

070-83-31-000

EPA
CITY

29

22

h

Don McNemar

COUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER DODGE

PO Box 2321 - USRL 19 8.

Clarksburg, WV 26302-2321
800-424-7611 FAX 304-624-5428
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CLASS 32 AUTOMOBILE 070-93-32-000
Full Size, Front Wheel Drive,
110" Wheel Base

Vendor Name: COUNTRY CLUB CHRYGLER

Manufacturer / Brand
Detivery
Model Name & Number

Standard Equipment Requirements:

Engine MIN: 175 HP 195 TORQUE
Transmission Automatic

Steering Power

Brakes Power/ABS

Radio AM/FM

Glass All Tinted

Mirrors Left & Right Quiside
License Plate Mounis Front & Rear

Tires Ali Season

Spare Tire Fult Size wilack
Rear Window/Defogger Installed

Fioor Mats Instailed

Air Conditioning Instalted

Front Seats Bucket

Price Fach Gasoline b

Price Fach Dedicated CNG (1.6 Liter) $

EPA EPA
HGWY CITY
Delete Floor Mats {Deduct} > $ -
Manusl Transmission w/Overdrive (Deduct) > g .
FOB Dealership: {Deduct) » $ -
FOB Other than Metro Charlesion - Per Mite $
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CLASS 33 TRUCK 070-93-33-000
Chassis Cab, 4 Wheel Drive,
Diesel Engine, 17,500 GVWR, Dual Rear Wheels
Vendor Name:COUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER DODGE

Manufacturer / Brand
Delivery
Model Name & Number

Standard Equipment Requirements:

Engine MIN: 300 HP 520 TORQUE
Transmission Automatic

Steering Power

Brakes Power/ABS

Radio AM/FM

Glass All Tinted

Mirrors Left & Right Qutside
License Plate Mounts Front & Rear

Step Bumper Instalied

Tires ' All Season

Air Conditioning Instalied

Seating Capacity 2 Passenger Seat

2WD 4WD

Price Each 141" WB 60" C/A
Price Each 165" WB 84" C/A

EPA EPA
HGWY CITY

Flat Bed 141" Each

Flat Bed 165" Each

Dump Bed 141" Each

Dump Bed 165" Each

Gas Engine 6.8 Liter V-10 {Deduct)

Manuai Transmission w/Overdrive {Deduct)
FOB Dealership: {Deduct}

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

Yvvy

1R | 1R (e R8s e

€2 e | e [ e
3
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*NOTE: This vehicle
rmust be equipped with the
attached 5 page specifications.

Vendor Name:

CLASS 33A TRUCK

CHASSIS CAB, 4 WHEEL DRIVE, DIESEL ENGINE

17,500 GVWR, DUAL REAR WHEELS

Manufacturer / Brand
Delivery
Model Name & Number

Standard Equipment Reqguirements:

070-93-33-001

MIN: 300 HP 520 TORQUE

Engine
Transmission -~ Automatic
Steering Power
Brakes Power/ABS
Radio AM/FM
Glass All Tinted
Mirrors Left & Right Outside
License Plate Mounis Front & Rear
Dual Rear Wheels installed
Tires Ali Sgason
Spare Tire Fult Size wiJack
Air Conditioning Installed
4WD
Price Each 141" WB 60" C/A wiDOH Pkg D
Price £ach 165" WB 84" C/A wiDOH Pkg N
EPA EPA
HEWY CITY
Gas Engine 6.8 Liter V-10 (Deduct) > $ -
Manual Transmission w/Overdrive (Deduct) > $ -
FOB Deaiership: (Deduct) > $ -
FOB Other than Buckhannon, WV - Per Mile $
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CLASS 34 AUTOMOBILE 070-06-34-001
UTELITY, 4 WHEEL/ALL WHEEL DRIVE,
4 DOOR, 4100 GVWR

Vendor Name: COUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER DODGE

Manufacturer / Brand
Delivery
Modei Name & Number

Standard Equipment Requirements:

DODGE

90-120 DAYS

NITRO / KABL74

Engine MIN: 150 HP 165 TORQUE

Transmission Automatic

Steering Power

Brakes Power/ABS

Radio AMIFM

Glass All Tinted

Mirrors L.eft & Right Outside
" License Plate Mounts Front & Rear

Fuel Tank Standard

Tires All Season

Spare Tire Included - w/dack

Air Conditioning Installed

Front Seat Bucket

‘Floor Mats Installed

Rear Window Defogger Installed

Price Each Gasoline $19,815.00
EPA EPA
HGWY CiTY

23 18

Manual Transmission w/Overdrive (Deduct) > {3870.00)

Delete Floor Mats {Deduct) > ($26.00)

FOB Dealership: (Deduct) > ($20.00)
> $1.45

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mite

Don McNemar
COUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER DODGE
PO Box 2321 -USRE19 S,
Clarksburg, WV 26302-2321
800-424-7611 FAX 304-624-5428
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CLASS 34A AUTOMOBILE . 070-06-34-010
Utility, 4 Door, 4100 GVWR

Vendor Name: COUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER DODGE

Manufacturer / Brand
Delivery
Model Name & Number

Standard Equipment Requirements:

Engine Full Hybrid
TFransmission Automatic
Steering ' ‘ ~ Power
Brakes Power/ABS
Radic ‘ AMIFM
Glass All Tinted
Mirrors : Left & Right Quiside
License Plate Mounis Front & Rear
Fuel Tank Standard
Tires All Season
Spare Tire included - widack
Air Conditioning Installed
Front Seat Bucket
Floor Mats Instailed
Rear Window Defogger Instailed
Hybrid Front Wheel Drive D
Hybrid All Wheel Drive ]
EPA EPA
HGWY : CITY.
Manual Transmission wiOverdrive {Deduct} > $ -
Delete Floor Mats (Deduct} » $ -
FOB Dealership: (Deduct) > $ -
FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile 5 -
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CLASS 34B HYBRID AUTOMOBILE
Mig-Size, 4 Door, 3680 Curb Weight

Vendor Name: COUNTRY CLUB CHRYSLER DODGE

Manufacturer { Brand
Delivery
Mode! Name & Number

Standard Equipment Requirements:

Engine Full Hybrid 187 HP

Transmission Aulomatic

Sieering : Power

Brakes Power/ABS

Radio AM/IFMICD

Glass All Tinted

Mirrors Left & Right Outside

License Plate Mounts Front & Rear

Fuel Tank Standard

Tires Al Season

Spare Tire Included - widack

Air Conditioning Standard

Tilt Wheel & Cruise Control . Standard

4 Passenger Seating Standard

Front Seat . Bucket

Floor Mats Installed

Rear Window Defogger Standard

Hybrid Front Wheel Drive NO BI

EPA

HGWY

070-93-33-010

EPA
CITY

Delete Floor Mats (Deduct)

Yy
€
]

FOB Dealership: (Deduct)

FOS Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile -
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