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GENERAL TERMS & CONDITIONS
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION (RFQ) AND REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL (RFP)

Awards will be made in the best interest of the State of West Virginia.
The State may acecept or reject in par, or in whole, any bid.

All quotations are governed by the West Virginia Code and the Legislative Rules of the Purchasing Division.

Prior 1o any award, the apparent successful vendor must be propetly registered with the Purchasing Division and have
paid the required $125.00 registration fee.

All services performed or goods delivered under State Purchase Orders/Contracts are 1o be continued for the term
of the Purchase Order/Contract, contingent upon funds being appropriated by the Legislature or otherwise being
made available. In the event funds are not appropriated or otherwise available for these services or goods, this
Purchase Order/Contract becomes void and of no effect after June 30,

Payment may only be made after the delivery and acceptance of goods or services.

Interest may be paid for late payment in accordance with the West Virginia Code.

Vendor preference will be granted upon wrilten request in accordance with the West Virginia Code.

The State of West Virginia is exempt from federal and state taxes and will not pay or relmburse such {axes.
The Director of Purchasing may cancel any Purchase Ordet/Contract upon 30 days written notice to the seller.

The laws of the State of West Virginia and the Legisfative Rules of the Purchasing Division shall govern all rights
and duties under the Contract, including without limitation the validity of this Purchase Order/Confract.

Any reference 1o automatic renewal is hereby deleted. The Contract may be renewed only upon mutual written
agreement of the parties.

BANKRUPTGY: In the event the vendor/contractor files for bankruptcy protection, this contract is automatically
null and void, and is terminated without further order.

HIPAA Business Associate Addendum - The West Viginia State Government HIPAA Business Associate
Addendum (BAA), approved by the Attorney General, and available onfine at the Purchasing Division's web site
(http:/iwww.state.wv.usfadmin/purchase/vre/hipaa.him) Is hereby made part of the agreement. Provided that, the
Agency meets the definition of a Covered Entity (45 CFR §160.1 03) and wili be disclosing Protected Health
Information (45 CFR §160.103} to the vendor.

INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS
Use the qguotation forms provided by the Purchasing Division.
SPECIFICATIONS: Hems offered must be in compliance with the specifications. Any devialion from the specifications
must be clearly indicated by the bidder. Alternates offered by the bidder as EQUAL to the specifications must be

clearly defined. A bidder offering an alternate should altach complete specifications and literature to the bid. The
Purchasing Division may waive minor deviations lo specifications.

Complele all sections of the quotation form.
Unit prices shall prevail in cases of discrepancy.
All guotations are considered F.O.B. destination unless allernate shipping terms are clearly identified in the quotation.

BID SUBMISSION: All quotations must be delivered by the bidder to the office listed below prior to the date and time
of the bid opening. Failure of the bidder to deliver the quotations on time will result in bid disqualifications.

SIGNED BID TO:

Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charlestan, WV 25305-0130

Rev. 06/21/2006
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e Nt Department of Administration
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RFQ. NO.:=-fommn === INKCRTO 7= === ===l o oo e
BID OPENING [DATE:l---TUESDAY, OCTOBER 24, 2006---------
BID OPENING [TIME:|-=-1:{30 P.M.-=------— oo

PLEASE PROVIPE A FAX NUMBER IN CASE IT
TO CONTACT YOU REGARDING YOUR BID:

CONTACT PERSON (PLEASE| PRINT CLEARLY):
Michelle Kimble

KXKXKXXX

THIS IS THE END OF RFQ INKCRTO7 *x*x%x%x% TOTAL:

< BEE'REVERSE SIDE FOR TERMS AND: CONDITIONS

S|GNATUPW/4M W T%%S‘jf“%M 5 ; OO L QA{EO_51_O6

gaEleS Repjpesentatlve FEIN55 064 7703 ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'



wvsea STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA

PURCHASING CONTINUATION SHEET

Buyer: Page Reqg.or P. 0. No.:

Vendor: T/&W ZMW %@ Spending Unit:

Requisition No.:

ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT

| hereby acknowledge receipt of the following checked addendum(s) and have made
the necessary revisions to my proposal, plans and/or specifications, etc.

Addendum No.’s:
No. 1 _/_K
No. 2 X _
No. 3
No. 4

No. 5

I understand that failure to confirm the receipt of the addendum(s) is cause for

rejection of bids.

WW%W
ﬁmdfwmd V27

Company

W -5/-06

Date

Exhibit 10
Rev. 11/86




Revised 10/16/06

Pricing Schedule INKCRT07 - BID OPENING 10/31/2006, 1:30 PM

Estimated
Cartridge # ant UnitCost | Total

b S

Hewlett Packard

1 51626A 50 $31.09 $ 15%4.50
2 51629A 90 $32.50 $§ 2925.00
3 51641A 50 $3%5.42 $ 1671.00
4 51645A 600 $ 20.05 $ 18030.00
5 51649A 90 $5%2.99 § 2969.10
6 02274A 70 $96.01 $ 6785.70
7 92291A 85 $126.5% $ 10755.05
8 92298A 45 $98.17 $ 4417.65
9 €1823D 99 $32,72 $ 3239.28
10 C3900A 35 $141.36 $ 4947.60
11 C3903A 50 $84.55 $ 4227.50
12 C3906A 50 $66.47 $ 3323.50
13 C3909A 70 $177.73 $ 12441.10
14 C4092A 60 $H8.41 $ 3504.60
15 C4096A 55 $95.6% $ 5259.6%
16 C4127X 100 $118.64 $ 11864.00
17 C4129X 70 $151.59 $ 10611.30
18 C4151A 40 $ 164,09 $§ 6563.60
19 C4152A 40 $164.09 $ 6563%.60
20 C4153A 40 $ 147,11 $ 5884.40
21 C4154A 15 $362.43 $  5436.45
22 C4155A 15 $293.72 $ 4405.80
23 C4182X 45 $174.%2 $ 7844.40
.24 C4191A 60 $ 82.58 $ 2954.80
25 C4192A 60 $117.59 $ 7055,40
26 C4193A 60 $ 117.59 $ 7055.40
27 C4194A 60 $117.59 $ 7055.40
28 C4195A 80 $78.86 $ 6308.80
29 C4196A 30 $ 195,68 $ 5870.40
30 C4197A 20 $228.%% $ 4566.60
31 C4800A 80 $ 35.00 $ 2800.00
32 C4801A 80 $ 35.00 $ 2800.00
33 C4802A 80 $ 35.00 $ 2800,00
34 C4803A 85 $ 35.00 $ 2975,00

Page 1 of 6




Pricing Schedule INKCRTO7 -

Revised 10/16/06

BID OPENING 10/31/2008, 1:30 PM

Estimated
Item # Cartridge # Quantity Unit Cost Total

5 S Sl R
35 C4804A 85 $ 62,02 $ 5271.70
36 C4805A 80 $ 62.02 $ 5271.70
37 C4806A 80 $ 62.02 $ 5271.70
38 C4810A 85 $ 3%.98 $ 2888, 30
39 C4811A 40 $ 33,98 $ 1%59.20
40 C4812A 40 $ 3%.98 $ 1%59.20
41 C4813A 40 (8 3%.98 $ 1559.20
A2 C4841A 40 $ 3%.25 $ 1%%0.00
43 C4842A 40 $ 3%.25 $ 13%0.00
44 C4843A 40 $ 33.25 % 13%0.00
45 C4844A 45 $ 3%.25 3 1496.25
46 C4921A 40 $35.98 $ 1359.20
47 C4922A 40 $ %3%.98 $ 1%359.20
48 C4923A 40 $ 5%.98 3 1%59.20
49 C5010AN 80 $ 29.78 $ 2382 .40
50 C5011AN 85 $23.70 $ 2014.50
51 CH023A 60 $ 66.47 $ %988.,20
52 C5024A 60 $ 66.47 $ %988,20
53 C5025A 60 $ 66,47 $ 3988.20
54 C5026A 6b $ 66.47 $ 43%20.55
55 C6578AN 300 [$56:0% $ 16809.00
56 C6578DN 310 $ 3%.98 $ 1053%3.80
57 C6614DN 200 $ 32.10 $ 6420.00
58 C6615DN 140 $ 29:3%9 $ 4114.,60
59 C6625AN 90 $ 51.83 $ 2864.70
60 C6628AN 80 $ 34.07 $ 2725.60
61 C6656AN 420 $ 22,26 $ 9349.20
62 CB657AN 215 $ 35,98 $ 7305.70
63 C6658AN 105 $ 26.26 $ 2757.30
64 C7115A 120 $59.38 $ 7125.60
65 C8061X 145 $ 120.%4 $ 17449.30
66 C8543X 75 $ 255.00 $ 19125.00
67 C8727AN 125 $ 20.85 $ 2606.25
68 C8728AN 110 $25.73 3 2610.30
69 C9700A 50 $ 80.00 $ 4000.00
70 C9701A 50 $ 95.14 $ 4'157.00

Page 2 of 6



Pricing Schedule INKCRTO07 -

Estimated

Revised 10/16/08

BID OPENING 10/31/2006, 1:30 PM

Item # Cartridge # Quantity Unit Cost Total
71 C9702A 55 $ 95.14 $  523%2.70
72 C9703A 50 $ 95.14 $ 4757.00
73 C9704A 50 $ 161.5% $ 8096.50
74 C9720A 60 $ 145.06 $ 8703%.60
75 C9721A 60 $ 189.44 $ 11366.40
76 C9722A 60 $ 189.44 $ 11366.,40
77 C9723A 60 $ 189.44 $ 11366.40
78 C9730A 50 $ 202.78 $ 1013%9.00
79 C9731A 40 $ 282.92 $ 11%16.80
80 CO732A 40 $ 282.92 $ 11%16.80
81 C9733A 40 $ 282.92 $ 11316.80
82 Q1138A 100 $ 1%8.33 $ 1383%,00
83 Q1339A 90 $ 186,80 $ 18680.00
84 C4836A 45 $ 33.25 $ 1496.25
85 C4837A 50 $ 33,25 $ 1496.25
86 C4838A 30 $ 33.25 $ 1496.2%
87 C9362WN 65 $ 18,32 $ 1190.80
88 C9361WN 70 $ 22.50 $ 1575.00
89 C8766WN 70 § 26.20 $ 18%4.00
90 C8767WN 95 $ 31,21 $ 2964.95
91 C9351AN 55 $ 18.80 $ 10%4.,00
92 C9352AN 60 $ 21.30 $ 1278.00
93 C4190A 45 $ 120,00 $ 5400,00
94 Q2670A 20 § 122.67 $  2453.40
95 Q2671A 20 $ 121.13 $ 2422 .60
96 Q2672A 20 $ 121.13 3 2422 .60
97 Q2673A 20 $ 121.13 $ 2422 .60
o8 Q3960A 30 $ 78.17 $ 2%45.10
99 Q3961A 30 $ 93.13 $ 279%.90
100 |Q3962A 30 $ 93.13 $ 279%.90
101 Q3963A 30 $ 93.13 $ 279%.90
102 [Q3946A 30 $ No Bid $
103 [Q2612A 40 $ 66.76 $ 2670.40
104 |QB511A 30 $ 114.42 $ %432 .60
105 |Q5949A 100 $ 68.%% 3 6833.00

Page 3 of B



Pricing Schedule INKCRT07 -

i

e

Q2613A

Cartridge #

Estimated
Quantity

.

Revised 10/16/06

BID OPENING 10/31/2006, 1:30 PM

$

Q2610A

$111.07

$ 4442.80

Q2624A

$ 68.10

$ 6810,00

$577,022.33

109 |7Y743 30 $ No Bid $
110 7Y743 30 $ No Bid $
* c _{Subtotal $

Lexmark
111 [12A1450 30 $ 126.59 $ 3797.70
112 12A1451 30 $ 175.45 $ 5263.50
113 12A1452 30 $ 175.45 $ 5263.50
114 12A1453 30 $ 175.45 $ 5263.50
115 12A1454 30 $131.14 $ 3934.20
116 12A1455 30 $ %41.%36 $ 10240.80
117 1361750 15 $ 149.41 $ 2241.15
118 1361751 15 $ 86,83 $ 1%02.45
119 1361752 15 $ 80.23 $ 1203.45
120 [1361753 10 $ 80.23 $ 802.30
121 1361754 15 $ 80.23% $ 1203.45
122 1380950 20 $ 311.69 $ 623%.80
123 1382050 40 $ 37.27 $ 1490.80
124 1382060 45 $ 50.45 $ 2270.25
125 1382150 100 $ 315.14 $ 31514.00
126 1382925 110 $ 209.19 $ 23010.90
127 08A0477 50 $ 149.35 $ 7467.50
128 10B042C 20 $ 390.51 $ 7810.20
129 10B042K 20 $ 18%.92 $ 3678.40
130 10B042M 20 $ 390.51 $ 7810.20
131 10B042Y 20 $ 590.51 $ 7810.20
132 10N0217 60 $ 21.13 $ 1267.80
133 10N0227 60 $ 22.55 $ 135%.00
134 12A0725 40 $ 315.14 $ 12605.60
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Pricing Schedule INKCRT07 -

Revised 10/16/06

BID OPENING 10/31/2006, 1:30 PM

Estimated

ltem # Cartridge # Quantity Unit Cost Total
135 12A1970 90 $ 32,17 $ 2895.30
136 12A5845 100 $ 293.83 $ 29383.00
137 12A6835 105 $ 293.83 $ 30852.15
138 12A6865 105 $ 328.16 $ 24456.80
139 12A7462 20 $ 348.05 $ 63%61.00
140 12A7465 120 $ 332.3%0 $ 39876.00
141 1370101 50 $ 154,15 $ 7707.60
142 15G041C 30 $ 216.3%6 $ 6490.80
143 15G041K 30 $ 136.82 $ 4104.60
144 15G041M 30 $ 216.%6 $ 6490.80
145 15G041Y 30 $ 216.736 $ 6490.80
146 15M0120 85 $ 41.%6 $ 3515.60
147 15M2871 45 $ 21.99 $ 989.55
148 15W0900 10 $ 190.84 § 1908.40
149 15W0901 10 $ 190.84 $ 1908.40
150 15W0802 10 $ 190.84 $ 1808.40
151 15W0903 10 $ 129.30 $ 1293.00
152 15W090K 10 $ No Bid $

153 16G0055 45 $ 44.07 ¢ 1983.15
154 17G0050 90 $ 50.48 $ 2743.20
155 17G0060 80 $ 34.73 $ 2778.40
156 17G0152 40 $ 123,08 $ 4923,20
157 1810000 45 $ 43.22 $ 1944.90
158 20K0500 15 $ 110.03 $ 1650.45
159 20K0501 10 $ 110,03 $ 1100.30
160 20K0502 15 $ 110.03 $ 1650.45
161 20K0503 10 $ 97.01 $ 970,10
162 24015HY 100 $ No Bid $

163  |4K00199 20 $ 240.83% $ 4816.60
164 64015HY 20 $ No Bid $

Subtotal $366,0%1
Epson Inkjet

165 T0O03011 40 $ 29.89 $ 1195.60
166 T0O05011 45 $ 35.09 $ 1579.05
167 T007201 45 $ 23,52 $ 10%8.40

Page 5 of 6




Revised 10/16/06

Pricing Schedule INKCRT07 - BID OPENING 10/31/20086, 1:30 PM

Estimated
Item# | Cartridge # Quantity Unit Cost Total
168 T008201 40 $19.67 $ 786.80
169 T009201 40 $27:58 $ 110%,.20
170 1019201 30 $27.58 $ 827.40
171 7020201 20 $2%.80 $ 476.00
172 1032120 40 $31.39 $ 1255.60
173 T032220 40 $15.11 $ 604.40
174 T032320 40 $15.11 $ 604,40
175 1032420 40 $15.11 $ 604,40

_ (Subtotal __|$10,095.55

SR
L)

. | (CRANDTOTAL §955,149.18

i

- : S - dee e

Rebate for returned cartridges 1000 NA $
. e e

2:00pm

All toner cartidge orders received prior to shall be delivered the

next business day. NOTE: This cannot be prior fo 2:00 p.m.

S o3 S

1, /g/g%{%qé/e , representing Jones Business Machines
{print name) {company name)

hereby certify, under penalty of law for fraud, that items priced above are new toner/inkjet
cartridges; these products are not "remanufctured, "compatible", or remade and are the
brands as specified.

Signature/Date: MMM [0 ‘3/"0é
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Pagell
RFQ No. INKCRTOY

AFFIDAVITY

West Virginia Code §5A-3-10a states: .
No confract or renewal of any contract may be awarded by the state or any of s political subdivisions to any
vendor or prospeciive vendor when the vendor or prospective \endor or a related party fo the vendor or
prospective vendor is a debtor and the debt owned s an amount greater than one thousand dollars irt the
aggragate.

DEFINITIONS:

“Debt” means any assessment, premium, penalty, fine, tax or other amount of money owed o the state or any
of its political subdivisions because of a judgment, fine, permit violation, ficense assessment, defautted
workers' compensation premium, penalty or other assessment presently delinquent or due and required to be
paid to the state or any of its pofitical subdivisions, including any intarest or addtiona! penalies accrued

thereomn.

“Debtor” means any individual, corporation, partnership, association, fimited Tabilty company or any other form
or business association owing a debt o the state or any of its polificat subdivisions.

“Political subdivision® means any county commission; municlpality; county board of education; any
instrumentality established by a county or municipalty; any separate corporation or instrumentality established
by ane or more counties or municipalifies, as permitted by law; or any public body charged by faw with the
performance of a govemment funclion or whose jurisdiction is coextensive with one or more counties or

mumnicipalties.

‘Related party” means a parly, whether an individual, corporation, parnership, assodiation, limited liability
company or any other form or business assotiation or other entity whatsoever, related 1o any vendor by blood,
maniage, ownership or contract through which the party has a relationship of ewnership or other interest with
the vendor so that the party will actually or by effect receive or control a portion of the benefit, profil or other
consideration from performance of a vendor contract with the parly receiving an amount that meels or exceed

five paroent of the fotal contract amount.

EXCEFTION:
The prohibition of this section does not apply where a vendor has contested any tax administered pursuant to

chapter elaven of this code, workers’ compensation premium, permit fee or envinmental fee or assessment
and the matter has not become final or where the vendor has entered into 8 payment plan or agreement and
the vendor is not in default of any of the provisions of such plan or agreement.

LICENSING:
The vendor must be icensed in accordance with any and alf state requirements to do business with the state of

West Virginia, ‘
CONFIDENTIALITY:

The vendor agrees that he or she will not disclose to anyone, directly or indirectly, any such personally
identifiable information or other confidential information gained from the agency, unless the individual who is

the subject of the information consents fo the disclosure in wiiting or the disclosure is mede pursuant to the
ggency's policles, procedures and rules. Vendors should visit www.stata.wv.usfadmin/purchase/privacy for

the Notice of Agency Confidentiality Policies.

Under penaity of law for false swearing (West Virginia Code, §61-5-3), it is hereby certified that the vendor
acknowledges the information in this said affidavit and are in compliance with the reguiremenis as stated.

Vendor's Name: S ones Business Machines
Authorized Signature: Date: "M@ﬁé‘/é&& é
No Debt Afidavie

Ravitad QX005

TNTAI P.1A



