State of West Virginia RéqueSt_ for &= BEQNUMBER 2 SR
Department of Administration Quotation DNR80113 1
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130

Charleston, WV 25305-0130 BUYER 32
306-558-0492

7 ¥710153438 859-594-4948
TURFGRASS INC

PO BOX 637

8045 D DIXIE HIGHWAY
FLORENCE KY 41022

DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES
JOBSITE
SEE SPECIFICATIONS

12/28/2006
BID OPENING DATE:

01/24/2007

REQUEST FOR QUOTATION

THE PURCHASING DIVISION IS SOLICITING BIDS FOR THE
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL [RESOURCES TO PROVIDE AN OPEN-
END CONTRACT| FOR MISCE[LLANEOUS GOLF COURSE TURF
CARE CHEMICALS, FERTIL|IZERS, AND SEED [PRODUCTS.

ATTACHMENTS: 1. [SPECIFICATIONS
2. BID FORM
3. AFFIDAVIT

0001 . LS 335-78
1
MISC. GOLF CDURSE| FERT|ILIZER, SEED & CHEMS.

EXHIBIT 1

LIFE OF CONTRACT: THIS CONTRACT BECOMES EFFECTIVE ON
Weeeseesnessss. AND EXTENDS FOR A PERIDD OF ONE (1)
YEAR OR UNTIL SUCH "REASONABLE TIME"™ THEREAFTER AS .

IS NECESSARY| TO OBTAIN A NEW CONTRACT [OR RENEW THE
DRIGINAL CONTRACT|. THE "REASONABLE TIME™ PERIOD SHALL
NOT EXCEED TWELVE| (12)| MONTHS. DURING THIS "REASONABLE

TIME™ THE VENDOR MAY TERMINATE THIS CONTRACT FOR ANY Rl ad vl
REASON UPON [SIVING THE| DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING 30 DAYS % G Bud e R
WRITTEN NOTICE.
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C‘;'ener‘ﬁ]! Manager 38-1907448 ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

KWHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'




Department of Administration Quotation
Purchasing Division

2019 Washingion Street East

Post Office Box 50130

Charleston, WV 25305-0130

%¥710153438 859-594-6948
TURFGRASS INC

PD BOX 637

8045 D DIXIE HIGHWAY
FLORENCE KY 41022

State of West Virginia ~ Request for =

BUYER 32

3064-558-0492

DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES

JOBSITE
SEE SPECIFICATIONS

12/28/2006

BID OPENING DATE: 0D1/24/2007

BID OPENING TIME

01:30PM

THIS CONTRACT DOCUMENT|, THE TERMS,

CONTRACT.

DAYS PRIOR TO THE| EXPIRATION DATE.

SUCCESSIVE ONE (1p YEAR PERIODS.

CANCELLATION

VOLUME OF WORK).

ORDER.

N\

UNLESS SPECIFIC PROVIS[IONS ARE STIPULATED ELSEWHERE I

CONDITIONS, AND

PRICING SET HEREIN ARE| FIRM FOR THE LIFE OF THE

RENEWAL: THI|S CONTRACT| MAY BE RENEWED UPON THE MUTUAL
WRITTEN CONSENT OF THE| SPENDING UNIT AND VENDOR,
SUBMITTED TO| THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING THIRTY (30)

SUCH RENEWAL SHAL

BE IN ACCORDIANCE WITH [THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF THE
ORIGINAL CONTRACT| AND [SHALL BE LIMITED| TO TWO (2)

THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHAS]ING RESERVES TH
RIGHT TO CANCEL THIS CONTRACT IMMEDIATELY UPON WRITTE
NOTICE TO THE VENDOR IF THE COMMODITIES AND/OR SERVIC
SUPPLIED ARE| OF AN INFERIOR QUALITY OR| DO NOT CONFORM
WITH THE SPECIFICATIONS OF THE BID AND CONTRACT HEREI

OPEN MARKET |CLAUSE: THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING MAY
AUTHORIZE A |[SPENDIING UNIT TO PURCHASE [ON THE OPEN
MARKET, WITHOUT THE FILING OF A REQUIS|ITION OR COST
ESTIMATE, ITEMS SPECIFJIED ON THIS CONTRACT FOR
IMMEDIATE DELIVER)Y IN EMERGENCIES DUE |TO UNFORESEEN
CAUSES (INCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED TO DELAYS IN
TRANSPORTATION OR| AN UNANTICIPATED INCREASE IN THE

BANKRUPTCY: | IN THE EVENT THE VENDOR/CONTRACTOR FILES
FOR BANKRUPTICY PROTECTIION, THIS CONTRACT IS AUTOMATI-
CALLY NULL AND VO|ID, AND IS TERMINATED| WITHOUT FURTHE

VENDDOR PREFERENCE CERTIFICATE

N

L

E
N
ES
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R

SIGNATURE \Y\ \\ \ \\W‘

00t 471-9710

1/19/2007

TITLE

genex‘{aj\ Manager FEN  38-1907448

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

N@EN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'
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State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

Request for =

Quotation

Post Office

%710153438
TURFGRASS INC
PO BOX 637
8045 D DIXIE H
FLORENCE KY 4

Charleston,

2019 Washington Street East

Box 50130
WYV 25305-0130

859-594-4948

IGHWAY
1022

306-558-0692

DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES
JOBSITE
SEE SPECIFICATIONS

OPENING TIME

PREFERENCE

A. APPLICA

« )
HAS RESIDED
(4) YEARS 1

t

QUARTERS OR
WEST VIRGIN
THE DATE OF
INTEREST OF
PARTNERSHIP

OF BUSINESS
YEARS IMMED
CERTIFICATI

«

( )
AN NN

BIDDER

CERTIFICATION AND) APPLICATION* IS HEREBY MADE FOR

BIDDER| IS AN INDIVIDUAL RESIDENT| VENDOR AND
CONTINUOUSLLY IN WEST VIRGINIA FOR FOUR
MMEDIATELY PRECEDING THE DATE OF THIS

CERTIFICATION; OR

BIDDER| IS Al PARTNERSHIP,
TION RESIDENT VENDOR AND HAS MAINTAINED ITS HEAD-
PRINC|IPAL PLACE OF BUSINES]S CONTINUOUSLY IN
(4) YEARS IMMEDIATELY PRECEDING
THIS CERTIFICATION;
BIDDER IS HELD BY ANOTHER
,] ASSOCIATION OR CORPORATION RESIDENT VENDOR
WHO HAS MAINTAINED ITS| HEADQUARTERS OR| PRINCIPAL PLACE
CONTINUOUSLY IN WEST VIRGINIA FOR FOUR (4)
IATELY} PRECEDING THE DATE OF THIS '

IA FOR| FOUR

ON; OR

B. APPLICAT|ION IS MADE FOR 2.5% PREFERENCE FOR THE
REASON CHECKED:

BIDDER| IS Al RESIDENT VENDOR WHO [CERTIFIES THAT,

IN ACCORDANCE WITH WEST VIRGINIA CODE,
5A-3-37 (DOE|S NOT| APPLYY TO CONSTRUCTION CONTRACTS).

TIION IS MADE FOR 2.5% PREFERENCE FOR THE
REASON CHECKED:

ASSOCIATION OR CORPORA-

IS Al CORPORATION NONRESIDENT VENDOR
WHICH HAS AN| AFFIILIATE| OR SUBSIDIARY WHICH EMPLOYS

A MINIMUM OF| ONE HUNDRED STATE RESIDENTS AND WHICH
HAS MAINTAINED IT|S HEAQUARTERS OR PRINCIPAL PLACE OF
BUSINESS WITHIN WEST V{IRGINIA CONTINUOUSLY FOR THE
FOUR (4) YEARS IMMEDIATELY PRECEDING THE DATE OF THIS
CERTIFICATION.

OR 80% OF THE OWNERSHIP
INDIVIDUAL,

SIGNATURE

e

TELEPHONE

DATE
800-471-9710 1/19/2007

AN )
TITLE Gene%a\{.‘ Manager

FEN  38-1907448

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WQFN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'
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Purchasing Division

Post Office Box 5013

FLORENCE KY 41022

State of West Virginia
Department of Administration

2019 Washington Street East
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DNR80113
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TURFGRASS INC
PO BOX 637
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State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

859-594-4

8045 D DIXIE HIGHWAY
61022
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State of West Virginia

Purchasing Division

Department of Administration

2019 Washington Street East

Request for =

-BREQNUMBER:

Quotation

DNR80113

“ADDRESS CORBESPONDENCE TOATIENTION-OE:

%¥710153438
TURFGRASS INC
PO BOX 637

FLORENCE KY

Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

859-5964-4948

8045 D DIXIE HIGHWAY
41022

BUYER 32

306-558-0692

DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES
JOBSITE
SEE SPECIFICATIONS

SEALED BID

THE BID SHOULD CONTAIN
THE ENVELOPE| OR THE BID MAY NOT BE CON

CHARLES|TON, WV 25305-0130

THIS INFORMATIO

N ON THE FACE OF
SIDERED:

BUYER:
RFQ. NO.:
BID OPENING DATE:

BID OPENING {TIME:

Tom Brehob

PLEASE PROVIDE A [FAX N
TO CONTACT YU REGARDI

CONTACT PERSION (PLEASE

RON PRICE----

DNR80113----~

JANUARY 24, 2007---~-—-—==w=w-

1:30 PM------

UMBER IN CASE IT| IS NECESSARY

NG YOUR BID:
-859-594-4048__._

PRINT CLEARLY):

SIGNATURE \\\ \\L' \“\.;)“

TELEPHONE

800-47

1-9710

¥F19/2007

TITLE

Gener‘g\l‘ Manager

FEIN
38-1907448

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

V\MEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'
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State of West Virginia Request for =
Depariment of Administration  Quotation
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East T ADDRESSTO
Post Office Box 50130 ~
Charleston, WV 25305-0130 BUYER 32
304-558-04692

%7101536438 859-594-4948
TURFGRASS INC

PO BOX 637

80465 D DIXIE HIGHWAY
FLORENCE KY 41022

DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES
JOBSITE
SEE SPECIFICATIONS

12/728/2
BID OPENING :

xxxx%xx THIS IS THE END OF RFQ DNR80/113 *%xxxx TOTAL:

TELEPHONE DATE

\\/ \\' 800-471-9710 1/19/2007
General( Manager [ 38-1907448 ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN\RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'

SIGNATURE

TITLE
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DNR80113 — GOLF COURSE CHEMICALS RFQ SPECIFICATIONS
BID OPENING: JANUARY 24, 2007; 1:30 PM

To provide golf certified chemicals, soil amendments, turf type seed and general
turf care products for West Virginia State Parks operated golf courses: Cacapon,
Hawks Nest, Pipestem and Twin Falls State Park Facilities. West Virginia State
Park non-golf course facilities may also purchase non-regulated chemicals, seed,
and turf products within this contract; also all county and municipalities may
purchase from this contract. The State of West Virginia always has preference
over all other agencies regardless of the time of order. Should inventory of any
chemical be low, the state-owned golf courses listed on this RFQ will have first
preference over any and all other agencies.

This contract provides for product(s) to be ordered by case, unless noted within
description as described within this request for quotations. Due to high cost of

some chemicals, a few products are listed both in case items as well as single

units items.

Vendor Bids:

If a product lists a company, and/or manufacturer agency product then “No
Substitutions” or generic will be approved. Product line items that do not note
Manufacturer/Company, vendor must provide product label, which includes
chemical/product data, and proof that product meets or exceeds specifications.

Product selection:

Selection of those product substitutions (if Manufacturer is not specified) will be
made on the basis of cost per unit, label ingredients, and product application rate
comparisons as evaluated by golf course facility operators and their specific
application use. There shall only be one vendor award per line item.

We expect multiple vendor awards to manufacturer agency chemicals: In the
best interest of the State of West Virginia individual item numbers will be
awarded to prospective low bidder. In the case of “agency” chemicals, there will
be multiple awards if same low bids are quoted.

Life of contract

The life of this contract will be effective on date of award and extends until the
end of Calendar year 2007, or until such “reasonable time” thereafter as is
necessary to obtain a new contract or renew the original contract. The
“reasonable time” period shall not exceed four (4) months. During this
“reasonable time” the vendor may terminate this contract for any reason upon
giving the Director of Purchasing 30 days written notice.



Eligible park facilities:

All West Virginia State Park Facilities may order within this contract: (Specific

chemicals may be excluded depending chemical applicator permits requirement).

Vendor is responsible for verification of permits as guided by West Virginia State
law.

Facilities include:
Golf Course Facilities within this contract

Cacapon Resort State Park

Tom Ambrose, Superintendent

818 Cacapon Lodge Drive

Berkeley Springs, WV 25411, (304) 258-6691; FAX (304) 258-8867

Hawks Nest State Park

Thomas Shriver, Superintendent

P.O. Box 857

177 West Main Street '
Ansted, WV 25812, (304) 658-5196; FAX (304) 658-4549

Pipestem Resort State Park

Steve Bolar, Superintendent

Rt.20 Box 150

Pipestemn, WV 25979, (304) 466-1800; FAX (304) 466-2803

Twin Falls Resort State Park
Nathan Hanshaw, Assistant Superintendent

Rt. 97 P.O. Box 667
Mullens, WV 25882, (304)294-6000; FAX (304) 294-5000

Also Facilities that may order items within the contract include:

* Lodge parks, without golf course facilities
* Vacation parks

* Day use parks

* Historical parks

Individual address and contact names for park locations and bidding evaluation
purposes may be evaluated on the web: www.wvstateparks.com .

Specific order(s) through the year will be determined by seasonal needs of
individual State Park Superintendents.

Delivery of product:

Product purchase orders will be made from the respective facilities as needed
throughout the 2007 calendar year. Orders from this contract shall be delivered

P9
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FOB destination prepéid and alloweéi. Agency may make purchases of less than
$500 from a local source if price includes delivery and a savings results from
local purchase.

Vendor Order form: - The vendor shall work jointly with the Parks and Recreation
section in developing an order form and catalogue. Information and instructions
on the ordering process shall be pro{/ided to employees with the order forms.

~ Vendor(s) award to this purchasé orc%ier shall make delivery of product to specific
golf courses as listed within a maximum of 10 days of order. See below for
address location of the State Park oéerated' golf courses.

ltems that are shipped to Iocation-an;d do not meet contract product specifications
shall be returned at no cost to the State park course. . o

Products shall be received in sealed EOrigihél containers. ltems delivered
damaged will be returned to vendor for replacement at no cost to buyer.

1

Payment: g

Orders under the value of $2500.00 fshall be paid using State of West Virginia
issued VISA purchasing credit card gs condition of award.
Purchase orders over the $2500.00 dollar amount shall.be invoiced to the park.
Original invoice is required with delivery slip.

- . |
Training and technical service:

Vendor supplying product within their award shall provide facility technical

service and professional training a minimum of twice a year to the respective
park golf course staff relating to the product award at no charge. This training
shall be scheduled with golf manager for appropriate timeframes of course
needs. Training and chemical service shall include at minimum but not be limited
to product safety, proper handling, storage, application rates and approved uses
within golf turf care. ' :

t

Product Estimates: |

Quantities listed below are approximr%xtions only, based on estimated usage from
respective golf course managers. Actual products ordered will be determined by
seasonal changes depending on weather and site specific turf care needs
whether that be more or less that theiquantities shown.
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DNR80113 - GOLF COURSE CHEMICALS

BID FORM - BID OPENING: JANUARY 24, 2007: 1:30 PM

* Multiply the Est. Purchase Quantity by the Unit Price fo equal the Exténded Amount

Est.
Purchase o * Extended
Item No: Quantity Descnption Unit Price Amount
1 1 Acclaim Extra, Bayer, 4 x 1 gal No substttutlons $1,865 |$1,865.
2 1 Acclaim Exira, Bayer, 2 X 2, 5 gal 'No substitutions: No Bid |No Bid
3 10 All clear-tank cleaner, Loveland 4 x 1 gal, No substitutions {NO Bid No Bid
Goosegrass / Crabgrass Control Andersons, Bensulide $72.00 |$72 0.00
4 10 5.2% :
Arena 0.5G , Arysta Llfesmence 25 Ibs bag , Insec’ucxde $70.00 {$1,750
5 25 No subststutes
6 15 |Arena 50 WDG , Insecticide, 2x4;0 oz. , no substitutions _|$1,125 |$16,875
| L o $3,000 |$6,000
7 2 Banner Maxx, Syngenta, 10 gal. hnk pak, no substitutions
8 8 Banner Maxx, Syngenta, 2 x 1 ga;l, no substitutions . $605.00|$4,840
9 5 Banner Maxx, Syngenta, 1 gallon only , no substitutions $302.50)$1,51 2.50
¥ ’ .
10 20 Banol, Bayer, 2 x1 gal, no substi;fuﬁons $673.00|$1,346
11 2 Banol, Bayer, 1.gallon only , No SUbstitutidns $ 33 6 50| $673.00
12 1 Bayleton 1 G, Bayer,. 30lb ,noi subs’ututlons $85. 0 0 |$85.00
13 110 Bayleton Granular, Bayer, 15 Ib. bag, no subs’ntutuons $ 3 3 . 00 $3,630
Bayleton mini bulk, Bayer , 11 ounce % 50 mini.drum , No $ 2', 559 |'$7,677
14 3 substitutions : B
15 10~ Bayleton 50 WSP Bayer, 4 x4 x55 50z ,no substitutions $.4 08.00| % 4 1080
16 6 Bensumec 4 LF, PBI Gordon 4 x1 gal, No substitutions _ No Bid | No BIA
17 16 Bensumec 4 LF, PBI Gordon, 2 x2 5 gal , no.substitutions | $355 - 00| $5,680
18 12 Blazon, Miliken Turf Chemicals, 4 x 1 gal , no substitutions $1 55 .00} $1, 860
19 Cascade, 2x2.5gal, no substifutions . $ 275 .00} $550.00
a : . L $625.00] $4,375
20 7 Cleary's- 36/26, Cleary, 2 X 2,5 gal, no substitutions
21 30 Chipco 26 GT, Bayer, 2 x 2.5 gal, no substitutions $5 5<4 .95] $16,648.5(
22 34 Chipco Signature; Bayer, 4 x 5.5% no substitutions $419.85| $14,274.9(
K -'i .
" $94,44 1.90

Subtotal
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DNR80113 - GOLF COURSE CHEMICALS BID FOR

Ml - BID OPENING: JANUARY 24, 2007: 1:30 PM

P12

Est. % i .
Purchase | ' * Extended
ltem No: | Quantity Description - : Unit Price Amount
Cleary Spectro Fungicide, Cleary Chemlcal 4 x5
23 3 ib, no substitutions 1 $291.00 $873.00.
Cleary 3336 F, Cleary Chemlcal 2x2. 5 gal no  1$723.00 $28,920
24 40 substitutions T '
Cleary 3336 Plus, Cleary Chemlcal 2x25 gal , . - ,
25 40 no substitutions 2.5 Gal lon $425.00 $1 7',' 000
|Cleary 3336 WSP Mini-drum, Cleary Chemical, 48|¢ g , :
26 5 x 1 Ib, no substitutions - . - .l $635.00 $4,775
'Cleary3336WSP ClearyChemlcal 6x2|b no |$234.00 ]$702.00
27 3 substitutions » _ :
Cleary Gran 3336, GC Cleary Chemlcal 50 b
28 10 greens grade, no subs 30# Bag . $56'00 $560.00
No Bid No Bid
29 1 Compass Bayer, 10-1b min drum, no subs‘ututxons : :
30 1 Compass, Bayer, 4 x 1 1b. . nojsubsfitutions $1,294.95[$1,294.95
Confront, Dow Agri Chemical, 4 x gal, no $ 445.00 $445.00
31 1 substitutions . . .
32 1 Curalan EG, BASF, 11# case, fio substitutions $268.00 $268.00
|Cultrine Plus,granular, Aquatlc weed control 30 lb $49. 00 $49.00
33 1 bag, No subs . :
Daconil Zn, Flowable, Syngenté 2x25gal,no 1$230.00 -{$2,760. 00
34 12 substitutions . '
Daconil Ultrex, Syngenta, 4 X 5;Ib no . $205.00  |$1,640
35 8 substitutions !
- |Daconil Weather Stik, Syngenta 2x25 gal no 36¢ o :
36 70 substitutions ; $360. O,O $25,200
37 15 Dylox, 6.2 G, Bayer, 30 Ib. bag, ! xno substltutlons $30.00 , $4506000
- |Dimension Ultra 1E ; Dow Agro Scxences 2x25 |No Bid: INo Bid
38 10 gal, no substitutions o '
Dimension Ultra WSP, Dow Agyo Sciences, 8 X _
39 1 2.5 #, no substitutions $990.00 $990.00
Dithane 75 DG, Rainshield , 4x12 ib bag, WSP, [No Bid No Bid
40 10 _|Dow, no substitutions :
* Multiply the Est, Purchase Quantity by the Unit Price to equal the Ex’tended Amount . . Subtotal $85,326.95

I



DNR80113 - GOLF COURSE CHEMICALS B

D FORM - BID OPENING JANUARY 24 2007: 1:30 PM

P13

. Est. Purchase - * Extended
ltem No: Quantity De:zscnptlon Unit Price Amount
41 20 Drive 75 DF . BASF, 6 x 1 Ib , no substitutions $430.00 $8,600
Dursban 50 WSP, Dow Agro, 8x175 no $190.00 |($3,800
42 20 substitutions
Dursban Pro, Dow Agro Sciences, 2x 2 gal,no  .|$180.00 |{$360.00
43 2 substitutions :
44 2 Dylox 80 SP, Bayer,"l 0x 5 Ib.,.no substitutions __ |$505.00 |$1,010
Embark 28, PBIl Gordon, 4 x 1 gal , no £925.00 |[$18,500
45 20 substitutions . : -t _
46 . 10 _|Eagle 20EW, Dow, 2 X 2.5455?., Jaldohons  [$955.00 |$9,550
Ferromec AC, liquid iron, PBI Gordon, 2 x 2.5 gal, $35.50 ' $3,550
47 100 no substitutions ' o !
48 100 Flghter F Loveland, 24 X 1pt., no substitutions NO; Bid No Bid
49 15 Foém Spra? trar::lker ITuff-trax, 4 x 1.gal, orequal | $75.00 $1,125
Fore, Rain shield, Dow Agro, 8 x 6#, no
50 50 {substitutions . $282.00 |$14,100
Fungicide X, And_erso hs, snow mo.ld, 44.T#bag,no | $71 .55 $3,219.75
51 45 substitutions : !
3 ,l N
52 3 Headway, Syngenta,v 10 gél link pack , ho substitutions $4 7 650 $13, 950
53 5 Hesdway, Syngenta , 2x 1 . no substitutions $931.50 |34, 6 57.50
© 54 5‘ ' l-ieritage TL , Syngenta , 4x61b, no substi.tutions $1,256.00 $6,280
55 6 Heritage, Syngenta, 20 x 410z, , no substitutions $379.50 . $2,2717
* |HerbiMaxx, Loveland Products, 2 x 2:5 gal, no No Bid No Bid
56 5 substitutions -
57 6 Instrata , Sylnger'ita 2x 25' gal, no substitutions $725.00 |$4,350 ‘
12x32 oz :
58 20 Incide out, Precision, 4 x 1 gal., no substitutions. . | $85. 00 $‘_1 , 700
* Mulﬂply the Est. Purchase Quantity by the Unit Price to. equai the Extended Amount . Subtotal |$97,062. 2[5 i
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Est. Order b * Extended
ltem No: Quantity Descrlptlon Unit Pnce Amount
Kleenup Pro, UHS, 2 x 2.5 gal no - . .
59 21 substitutions -~ §o Bid No Bid
Mach 2 liquid, Dow Agro Sciences, 2 x 495.00
60 2 2.5 gal, no substitutions- - $ T $990.00
Mach 2 G,1.5 % granular, 33lb-bag. Dow [$73.00 '$12,775
61 175 Agro, No substitutions: e ' o
Malathion, Clean crop; 2 x 2.5 gal., no No Bid No Bid
62 2 substitutions ‘
Manage, Monsanto, 30 X .9 gram, no . .
63 3 |substitutions No Bid No Bid
Manage, Monsanto, 10 x 1.33 oz, ho )
64 -4 substitutions ' $740.00 $2,960
’ Maxi-cal — greens grade, Kelly’s, 50#, no . .
65 50 substitutions - |No Bid No Bid
. ' Maxi-cal — standard grade Kelly's, 50# . ‘.
66 5 no substitutions ! No Bid No Bid
MCPP 4 Amine, Rlverdale 2x25gal,nolg155.0
67 10 substitutions $155.00 $1,550..
. Mec-Amine D, 2 x 2. 5; igal. , ) ]
68 10 substitutions No Bid No Bid
69 10 Merit .5G, Bayer, 304, hio substitutions $69.00 $690.00
Merit 75 WSP mlnl-drum, Bayer, 8.8 Ib; . P
70 1 no substitutions : $2,252.00 $2'252'0.O
Millennium ultra 2, Rlverdale 2x2.5 gal :
71 4 no substitutions $225. O,O. $900.00 .
MSMA 6 Plus, Helena Group ,2x2.5 . : :
72 50 gal , No substitutions . . ‘ $89.00 $4,450
* Multiply the Est. Order Quanfity by the Unit Price to equal the Extendéd Amount Subtotal $2 6,567.00
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' Est. Order ! , * Extended
" Item No: Quantity Déscnption Unit Price Amount
73 40 Naiad , 2 X 2.5 gal liquid , No substitutions No' Bid No Bid
Naiad, tablets,30 pellets/case,!1 pellet treats1 acre, No | No Bid No Bid
74 20 substitutions : v ‘
Naiad concentrate, ‘40z tubes, 20 per case, No No Bid No Bid
75 10 substitutions
76 10 Néiad, 30 gallon pall No Substitutions ' ‘No Bid No Bid
. Naiad, dispenser, hand wand to be used w;th No Bid No Bid
77 4 lrngatlon hose ! S
4 No Bid No Bid
78 10 Nalad tablets for dlshenser { Item 77)
79 1 Pendulum, BASF, 2 $< 10 #, No substltutlons $155.00 $155.00
80 1 Primer 604, Aquatrols. 2x2.5, No. substltutlons No Bid No Bid
Primo Maxx, Syngenta, 10 gal lmk pak , No $3,860 $11,580
81 3 substitutions -
{Primo Maxx, Syngenlta, 1 gallon only ‘No $391.00 $5,865
82 15 substitutions 1
_10x1 : : 424, .
83 1 Pro star, Baﬁar 4 x i_.S gal, No substitutions $424.00 $424.00
525.00 25.
84 1 Prograss Bayer, 2 x;2 ga al, No subst:tutlons $ %3 00
: 171.00 171.0
‘85 1 Proxy, , Bayer, 2 X 2. 5 gal No subs‘ututxons 3 ¥ 0
86 X Reward, , 4x'1 gal, Syngenta, no Substitutions $485.00 $485.00
Respond 3, granular, UHS 501b, No No Bid No Bid
87 20 substitutions @ : .
: No Bid No Bid
88 . 20 Roots 123, Roofs, Inc 2x2 5 gal, no subst1tut10ns - .
* Multiply the Est. Order Quantity by the Unit Pnce to equal the Extended rAmount . Subtotal . [$:19,205.00
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Est. Order .
ltem No: Quantity Description . Unit Price '| * Extended Amount
| Roundup — QuickPro, Dry Pak, Monsanto 1.50n . Sl o
89 10 x 30 case, no subs $55.00  |$550.00
RoundUp, Monsanto, 2 X 2.5 gal, ,NO . R i :
90 10 substitutions ! 52 2.5 - 00 $225.00
- ; .o . No Bid JNo Bid
91 5 Rubigan, Gowan, 1x 1 gal , no substitutions _
92 1 Sevin SL, Bayer, 2 x 2.5 gal, noi_sﬁbstitutibns 1$159.00 , $159.00
93 1 Snapshot ‘Dow Agro, 50 #, no'iisubéfituﬁons - [$92..00 $92.00
94 10 Subdue GR, Syngenta, 251b, no substitutions i 8,9 -00 '|$890.00
Subdue Maxx,’ Syngenta, 10 gallhnk pak, no les 4
95 4 substitutions i 2,400 $21,600
Subdue Maxx, Syngenta, 2X 1 a! no P .
96 18 substitutions yne g $1’?"08'00 $19,944.00
, Subdue, Maxx, yngenta, 1 gallon only , no $554.00 |$5,540.00
97 10 substitutions A I T .
08 15 Suspend SC, Bayer, 2x2.5 gal no substitutions No Bid |No Bid
No Bid No Bid
99 15 Suspend SC, Bayer, pinf, no substltutlons :
100 6 Talstar F, “GC" ,FMC.4 x 1 gal, rio substitutions $ 389.75 |¥ 2,338.50.
Talstar, GC Granular,FMC, 50 Ib‘ no No Bid No Bid
101 2 substitutions A
102 1 Tartan, Bayer, 2 x 2.5 gal , nosubstltuttons $2,080.001$2,080.00
103 1 Team 2 G, Knox, 401b. , ho su‘bstttuttons $v22 .50 $22.50
Tempo SC Ulira, Bayer, 12 240 mi. '
104 8 substitutions $354.00 $2,832.00
Tempo, 20 GC, Bayer, 4x4155 gm, no
105 8 substitutions $122.85 1$982.80
Terra Cyte, Bio Safe System 70 Ib. no . .
106 1 substifutions No Bid No Bid
Terrazole 35 WP, Uniroyal, 6 x2:lb no ' . .
107 1 substitution No Bid No Bid
TransFilm 2.5, PBI Gordon, 2 X 2 5 gal, no . .
108 6 substitutions No .Bid No Bid A
$57,255.80

* Multiply the Est. Order Quantity by the Unit Price to equal the Extended Amount

Subtotal
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- Est. Order * Extended
Item No: Quantity Description Unit Price Amount
Trimec Bent, PBI Gordon, 2 x 2.5 gal, no
109 10 |substitution $125.00 | $1,250.00
Trimec Classic, PBI Gordon, 2x2 5 gal no '
110 10 substitution $134.00 | $1,340.00
Trimec Plus, PBI Gordon, 2 X 2 5 gal, no
111 10 substitution $155.00 $1,550.00
' Trimec, Super, PBI Gordon, 2x2.5 gal, no . .
112 5 substitutions No Bid No Bid
' Trimec, 992, PBI Gordon, 2 x 2. 5 gal, no . .
113 5 substitutions | No Bid No Bid
Trimmit 2SC, Syngenta 2% 1 gal, no = ,
114 15 substitutions 'gallon [$370.00 $5,550.00
Tupersan 50 WP, PBI Gordon 12 x 4 Ib, no :
115 2 substitutions $765.00 $1,530.00
Tupersan, Granular 4.7, PBI Gordon , 20 Ib., o ' ) )
116 - 2 substitutions |No Bid No Bid
Turfcide 400, Flowable , Crompton 2%x2.5 gal .
117 2 no substitutions - $Hv4'00 $228.00
118 1 Zerotol, Bio Safe System, 30.gal, no. substitutidns No Bid No Bid
" |Zerotol , Bio Safe System, 2.5 gal, no o ' _
119 10 |substitutions %98.00 $980.00
* Multiply the Est. Order Quantity by the Unit Price to equal the Extended Amount Subtotal |$ 12,428. 00
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ltem Est. Order *Extended
No: Quantity Description Unit Price Amount
’ Spotrete F, Thiram , profects treated plants from rabbit and deer, and rodent ' .
120 1 damage, Cleary, 2X2.5 gal./case, or equal; Must provide label $160.00 $160.0 0
' Spray pattern indicator — BLUE, no-marking on'shoes after drying, 2%2.5 -

121 10 gal./case, or equal. Must provide label .. $125.00($1,250.0 0
Spray pattern indicator - GREEN, no-marking on shoes after drying; 2X2.5 '

122 10 gal/case or equal. Must provide label , $125.00 |$1,250.00
Spray indicator BLUE color , water soluble packets, 4 x 12x 2 oz - Must supply !

123 20 label 0x2.68 oz C $129.00|%$2,580.00
Spray indicator, GREEN color,water soluble packets, 4 x 12x 2 oz., - Must :

124 10 supply label 0x2.68 oz B ‘ ' $145.00 |$1,450.00

|SR-2000 Rotary Spreader, APT-8091-3, High quality stainless steel frame, - -

pneumatic fires, cone- adjust spread pattern, Hopper cover included, .$ 3 55.00$710.00

125 2 Anderson/Scott , no substitutions . ' )
Scent, wintergreen, 12X1 gt., Concentrate..Spra}‘y Ald, odor masking apent or :

128 3 equal; supply label SRR No Bid |No Bid
Scent, bubblegum, 12x1-qt , Concentrate, Spray Aide, odormaskirig agentor no Bid |No Bid

127 3 equal. Must supply label : : : T

128 20 Backlapping compound, 120 grit, Gel-Tec or equal , 25 # bucket $44.95 [$899.00

129 20 Backlapping compound, 80 grit, Gel-Tec or equial , 25 Ib bucket, 1$44,95 |$899.00

130 20 Backlapping compound, 180 grit, Gel-Tec or equal, 10 # bucket, ¢44.95 ¢899 . 00
D-Tox, Flowable, liquid product, to neutralize pesticides, and petroleum spills; :

131 2X2.5 gal./case, Cleary or equal ' . : $86 0 0 |$516.00

132 Spray adjuvant, Rewet, Exhault, or equal. 2 x 2.5 gal, Must supply labels No Bid |No Bid
Hole-In-white, white paint aerosol canused fo improve visual $8 0 .00 |$320.00

133 4 effect of putting green cup,12x 12 oz case, Hole-in whité Co. or egual.

134 4 Hole white, appli_cator tool,Deslgned.fpr paint i:an as spgciﬁed above. | 445 r:, 0 $182.0 0

135 Dye/_Green turf dye, -restores natural green color {o turf during dormant ‘ : .
periods, or seasonal browning, no hazardous chemicals, heavy metals $4$55.00|$620.0 0
o other inert ingredients harmfuf to turf, may be:applied to divot mix, :
Becker Underwood, 2x 2.5 gall case, or equal . .

136 4 DYE/ Green-Zit, dyes grass a natural green color, and maybe used for top
dressing, 2 x 2.5 gal/case Cleary , of equal L $175.00 $700. 0‘0

« Multiply the Est. Order Quaniity by the Unit Price o equal the Extended Ariount subtotal 312,435, ‘0 0
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Est. Order
Quantity

De écription

Fairway and Tees ( Turf Type Seed)
vendor must supply tag/ label with bid

3-way Perennial Ryegrass Blend, Mixture shall comprised of 3 Rye's in equal parts
all Ryes' being gray leaf spot resistant, NTEP rated varlety for Mid Atlantic Region.
within blend, Oregon Certified Seed, >84%! germination current year ,

* Extended

138

25

50 b bag package , vendor must supply tadlllabel . must be_golf quality seed

4-way blend of Bluegrass, Fescue, and ﬁye shall comprised of 2 Blue grass Cultivars
, 1 tall turf type fescue, 1 perennial rye- which is gray leaf spot resistant,

Seed,> 84% germination current year, Ored_on Cerfified Seed, 50 Ib.

vendor must supply tag / label ,must be NTEP rated varieties for mid Atlantic region,
must be golf quality seed product '; ‘

No
Bid

139

25

i

4-way Bluegrass/ Rye Blend, with approx 575% Kentucky bluegrass and 25% Ryegrass
which is gray leaf spot resistant, must be NTEP rated variety for mid Atlantic region

> 84% Germination current year, No noxious weeds, 50 Lb bag. Must provide label
vendor must supply tag/ label , must be golf‘lquality seed product

No
Bid

No
Bid

140

12

i

Bentgrass Seed { Turf Type) !
vendor must supply tag/ fabel with bid ‘1
Two Seed Cultivar Blend, Seed Research :Varieties of Bentgrass, in equal parts,
Oregon Certified Seed, >84% germination current year, no noxious weed, No subs,25 b,
Dominant- SR 119 and McKenzie cultivar Blend, vendor must supply tag/ label

No
Bid

No
Bid

1441

12

Penncross Bent, Oregoh Certified Seed, >‘84% germination In current

$6.50

$78.00

142

year, no noxious seed, 25 Ib bag vendor must supply label

i
1.-93 Creeping Bent seed, Germination >84% germination current year,
No noxious seed, 25 bhag, Oregon Certified Seed

i

vendor must supply tag/ label

$8.55

$51.30

t
* Muitiply the Est. Order Quantity by the Unit Price to equal the Extended Amount |

Subtotal

$ 160.55
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. Est.-Order . * Extended
item No: Quantity Description Amount
AR o ] Specialized Fertilizers : T

Rt A e T {Landscaping, bedding plants and omamental plantings )

T e A :
143 1 15-0-15Pius, Hi Cal, 10.5 % Ca, water soluble, 25Lbbag, T, Grass
Plant Marvel, or equal, supply label if substitute 19-0-1% Sol, 418.15(4$18.15
Sub -~ -2 | -
144 4 . |28-18-BPlus, Egh(]igf' i—so'?aci} %vin% plgnéngss.t%és,smubs,landscapes 17.65(%$17.65
Water soluble, 25 Ib bag, Plant Marvel or equal, supply label if substitute
445 1 40-30-20Plus , Blossom booster for landscaping annual plant beds, No No
Water soluble, 25 Ib bag, Plant Marvel or equal, Supply label if substitute Rid Rid
Sub - T.Grass 20-5-30_Sol. ' 17
146 1 15-3-20Plus, 3% Ca, 1% Mag, For winter Bedding planfs , water soluble 17.98|$77.98
25 | b package, Plant Marvel or equal, supply label if substitute
147 1 19-26-14Plus , Rose food , landscaping, water soluble, 25 Ib bag, N(? N(?
Plant Marve! or equal, supply label if substifute Bid Bid

Subtotal |$53.78

* Multiply the Est. Order Quantity by the Unit Price to equal the Extended Amount
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Est. Order * Extended
Item No:| Quantity Description Umt Price Amount
R Andersons - Polyon e e e
148 20 ' ’
‘ Polyon 0-0-50, SGN 100, Sulfate of Potash, No substitutions No Bid |N& Bid
149 10 . |Polyon 16-3-26SGN 140, 50% Polymef coated N, 82% No Bid |No Bid
Polymer coated K, Polyon 41, no substitutions
150 10  |Polyon 22-2-19SGN 140, 86% Polymetl' coated N, 80% Polymer coated K, No Bid |No Bid
Polyon 41, Polyon SOP with milcros, Sulphate of Potash, no substitutions
Dimension Products - Pre-emer ent Herblclde
) erd - $19.85 |$2,977.50
151 150 18-3-12,Andersons w/.103% Dimension &i25% NS-52, '
Stock # APT184DMS.1, SGN 150, no substitutions
i
152 150 |18-3-12, Andersons wi0.164% Dimension & 25% NS-52, $28.35 |$4,252.50
Stock # APT18DM5.2, SGN 150, no substntuhons
153 200 19-3-6, Andersons w/.072% Dimension & zo% NS-52, No Bid |No Bid
Stock # APT193DM5, SGN 215, no substitu}lons
;
* Multiply the Est. Order Quantity by the Unit Price to equal the Extended Amount Subtotal |37 ,230.00

P21
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Est. Order * EXTENDED
Q Description ~Unit Price AMOUNT
Andersons ’ o P 1 o
. . £ SR Y Ry R iR
Tee Time e
‘, (Homogenous 80-120 Contec ) . e
30 9.18-18 w/ 25% methylene Urea, SGN 110, MAP, 7%5,4%,Ca,2% Mg
Andersons, 50 Ib bag, no subs , AGC8429 35.00 [$1,050
155 30 17-3-17 wi50% Methylene, Urea, +Micros, MAP, #.3% Amm N, 10%S, 1%Fe, .5Mn | .-, . ° $1 ,230
Andersons, 50 Ib bag, no subs, AGC84825 41.00
156 30 47-3-17 Andersons, SGN 80, 50% Methylene, Urea, Potassium Sulfate, 4 1 O'O $ 1.230
10% S, 1% Fe, 0.5% Mn, 50 Ib bag, AGC 84825, no substitutions * !
157 30 18-9-18, Andersons, SGN 80, Potassium Sulfate , . 34.00 [$1,020.00
8.7% S, 0.28% Fe, 0.14% Mn, 50 Lb bag, AGC8348-1, no subs
158 30 19-3-19,w/100% Methylene Urea, 6.5% S, SSP/TSP, 6.5% S,
: AGCB381, Andersons, no substitufions _ ' 43.00 |$1,290.09
159 30 19-2-15 w/100% methylene urea +micros,SSP/TSP, 7.6%S,
A% Fe, 2% Mg, .02%B,.05%Cu,.05%Mn,.0005% Mo, .05%Zn,
- 150 Ib bag, No Substitutions , AGCB346 .
g o "&“ggg B P e T D e SN R L e R
. .aﬁ;@%’j ;g,"?%; e 100 SGN- Methylene Urea, Tee Time
e _ Blended
160 30 10-5-25w/50%, Methylene Urea, DAP, 8.5%S, 1%Fe, .1 %Cu, 1% Mn, .1% Zn
Micros, Andersons, No Substituions, Hem # AGC101M5.1, SGN 100 : 25 00 7680 00
161 30 *113-2-13w/Am sulfate,2% lron, micros, Andersons, AGC13M5.1, no subs 22.00 $660.00
162 30 43-2-13 SGN 100, Andersons, Amm Sulfate, Potasslum Sulfate, 22 :
wimicros (18.3% S, 2.0% Fe, 0.1% Cu, .01% Mn, 0.1% Zn), 50 Ib bag, no subs -00 | $660 '0 0 ]
* Multiply the Est. Order-Quantity by the Unit Price to equal the Extended Amount $ ﬂ: -9 r 3 6 0 . q 0
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“Item No:

Est. Order |
Quantity

ic:

AR SR E R e 3
e

Description

Unit Price

i

7 Fertilizers - Andersons

=
]

v140% PCSU/MOP/Nicro

RIRTTG

LTS &

* Extended

i A o
lﬁ};’g" g A -.‘)\f"l
&%f’, B

e o o e e =
T
.

Andersons, No substitutions, SGN 100, 50 Ib bag _

5.0-20,
ALA52MS5, Andersons, no substitutions, 50 Ib bag, No Bid No

164 30 5.10-31, w/20% PCSCU, + 10% FE, ALAS1FES, No Bid |No Bid
Andersons, no substitutions,:50 Ib bag.

165 20 |10-22-22 Starter, w /DAPIMOP , No Bid |No Bid
ALA105, Andersons, No substitutions , 50 Ib bag.

166 30 |18-0-18, wi50% PCSCU, 50% AS+ 1% Fe No Bid |No Bia
Andersons, ALA189FES, no $ubsﬁtutions, 50 Ib bag.

167 0 |244-11, w/ 25% AS, 35% PGSCU, +3% Fe o s y
Andersons, ALA248FE5, no substitutions, 50 Ib bag iNo Bid|No Bid

168 50  |32-3-10 w/ 20% PCSCU Andersons No Bid |No Bid

- ALA3265, No substitutions, 50 Ib bag
160 2 |5-5:30 w/ .48% prodiamine - No Bid |No Bid
| Andersons, No substitutions {ALASPR5 50 Ib bag
Greens Grade Fertilizers} Andersons - New for 2007

170 20 18-9-18 w/ 63% Methylene Urea, + Micros $.40.00
Aridersons, No substitutions, SGN 80, 50 Ib bag mee

174 20 |13-2-13, W/ Am. Sulfate, DG Pro, 2% Ifon, Micros $22.00 ($440.00
Andersons, No substitutions, SGN 100 , 50 Ib bag

172 20 21-3-16, w/97% Nutralene, DG PRO, 1% iron, Micros $35.001$700.00
Andersons, No substitutions , SGN 100, 50 Ib bag

173 20 10-5-25, w 50% Nutralene, DG PRO, Micros $28.00($560.0 0

* Multiply the Est. Order Quantity by the Unit Price to equal the Extended Amount

Subtotal

$2,500.00

P23
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Est. Order * Extended
Quantxty Descnptlon Umt Price Amount
NES Lebanon country club -NX- pro

174 30 43-25-12, Lebanon Country Ciub, SGN 185, Potassium Chloride,
2% S, 0.5% Fe, 50 Ib bag, no subs

175 30 46-16~16, Lebanon Country Club, 40% IBDU SGN 230, Sulfate of Potash, $25.00 [$750.00
5.4% S, 1.0% Fe, 0.8% Mg, 0.4% Mn. 50 Ib bag, no subs

176 30 18-5-9, Lebanon Country. Club, 51% MU, SGN 185, Suifate of Potash,
5.4% S. 1.0% FE, 1% M, 0.25% Mn, 50 Ib bag, no subs $18.00 |$540.00

177 30 10-18-22, Lebanon Par Ex , SGN 90, Sulfate of Potash, $28.00 |$840.00
1% Mg, 7.2% S, 0. 8% Fe, 50 Ib bag, no subs

178 30 13.20-20 , NX Pro, 7% Meth-EX40 Micros Greens N o Bid |No Bid
SGN 100, 50 Ib bag, Lebanon Turf, NO Subs ‘ o

179 30 16-0-30,Lebanon NX-Pro, SGN 100, Sulfste of Potash, 9.8% S, $24.00 |$720.00
1% Fe, 0.7% Mn, 50 Ib bag, no subs -

180 30 47-3-17, Lebanon NX-Pro, SGN 145, Sulfate of Potash, 8% S, 0.5% Fe $1 9.95($598.50
50 Ib bag, no subs . )
184 30 20-4-10, Lebanon Greenskeeper ,43% CRN, SGN 180 ' $16.00 |$480.00

Muriate of Potash, 0.5% Fe, no subs

$4,401.00

* Multiply the Est, Order Quantity by the Unit Price {o equal the Extended Amount Subtotal
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Est. Order ' ! * Extended
Quantity Déscription Unit Price Amount

Item No

: Andersons - TEE TIME

18-6-15, w/65% methylene Urea, 2°oiron. Micros,65% N from Urea,
182 20 5.1% S, 2% Fe, .1% Cu, .1% Mn, 1% Zn Andersons, AGC184M5.1
50 Ib bag, no substltuﬁons SGN 100

21.3-16 w/97% methylene Urea, 1 % iron, micros, 97% of N from Meth Urea's £35.001$700.00
183 20 5.4% 8, 1% Fe, .1% Cu, .1% Mn, . %Zn Andersons, # AGC217m50.1
] 50.1b bag, , no substitutions SGN 100
AT i T 3’ ATE .-
e ’4‘%&
7 % »‘% Jl‘;:élb E""&L‘r
533.00($660.00

529.00 {$435.00

R Greens - low cut turf, Tees SGN 120-140
184 20 19-25-5 w/35% methylene urea, starfer fertilizer, SGN 120,greens grade
MAP, AGC8383-1, 50 Ib bag, Anderfsons, no substitufions

185 15 31-3-10 w/45% methylene Urea, micios, MAP, 3.8% S, .2% Fe, .1% Mn
AGC8331-1, 50 Ib bag, Andersons, no substitutions

|
186 15 22-3-14 w/33% methylene Urea, MAP, 10% 8, 5.7%Amm N,
50 Ib bag, Andersons, AGC8414-2, no substitutions

Blended - SGN 125- Methylene Urea, Tee Time

187 10 0-0-45, Andersons, 100% Poly Coated, SGN 125, Sulfate of Potash £45.001($450.00
AGCB30456, no substitutions ) B

188 ' 20 25-5-15 w/50% methylene urea, 1% lron, Micros, DAP, 5.1% S, 1% Fe .
SGN 125 , AGC254M5, Andersons , :50 Ib bag, no substitutions $26.0015520.00

189 2 |22-4-18 w/ 93% Methylene Urea, 1% lron, DAP, 6% S, 1%Fe No No
Andersons, AGC22715, 50 Ib bag , no substitutions . Bid Bid

190 20 19-26-5 w/ 18% Methylene Urea, 1% jron, Micros, 1.7% S,1% Fe, .1% Cu $22.001$440.00

.1% Mn, .1% Zn, Andersons _, 50 Ib bag, no substitutions
* Muitiply the Est, Order Quantity by the Unit Price fo equal the Extended Amount Subtotal % 3 7 805.00




P26

DNRB80113 - GOLF COURSE CHEMICALS BID FORM - BID OPENING: JANUARY 24, 2007; 1:30 PM

ltem | Est. Order : * Extended
No: Quantlty Description Unit Price Amount
: Blended- NS-52 SGN 215 Eananre SR
10-15-30 w /1%iron, NS-52,AGC105, Andersons, 50 Ib bag, No substitutions ,
191 o |10 biro 9 ° $16.50 |$495.00

SGN 215, 50 Ib bag, no substitutions , Andersons ,

102 30 17-3-17,Andersons,SGN 150.NS-52, Potassium Sulfate,19.6% S, 2% FE, $20.00 $600.00
0.1% Cu, 1.0% Mn, 0.1% Zn, 50 b bag, AGC1715M5, no substxtuhons :

183 20 8-24-12, 25% NS-52, MOP, Andersons, APT1845, SGN 215 . No.Bid |No Bid
No substitutions,50 Ib bag,

194 100 21.28-7 starter fertilizer, 10.95% ammonium nitrate, 10.95% urea, SGN 215 . No Bid |No Bid
Andersons, no substitutions

185 100 25.5-12 w/50%, NS-52, 2% iron, Micros, AGC251m50, Andersons,

50 [b bag , no substitutions " INo Bid |No Bid

186 200 |5-10-31 w/ 20% NS-52, 10% iron, 4%Ammon N, 1% Urea, , .41%8S, No Bid |No Bid
Andersons, no subs, 50 Ib bag SGN 215 - .
197 100 25-5-15 wi32% NS-52, AGC255, Andersons. 50 Lb bag, no substitutions

28-3-10 w/21% NS-52, AGCZBSS, Andersons, 50lb bag, no substitutions

28-3-10w/96% NS-52, AGC28265, Andersons, 50 lb bag, no substitutions .
EEE R e

Blended- Poly-s SGN 240
200 100 49-3-19 w/94% poly-S, micros, Andersons AGCS361, 50 Ib bag, no substitutions
00 |25-3-10 w/96%, Poly-S, 2% Iron, MAP, Andersons, . $29.00 |$2,900
201 50 Ib bag, AGCB8385, no substitutions . . ;

* Multiply the Est. Order Quantity by the Unit Price to equal the Exiended Amount . Subtotal . |$ 8 I} 195.(Q0
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Item No:

Est. Order
Quantity

Description

Anderson -Sprayable Nutrient packages

Unit Price

* Extended
Amount

2- 2.5 gal case, AGC83009, No Subs:

202 30 Fluids minors package, 2 x 2.5 gal case, 2.45% FE, 1%Mg, _ - 1
05% Zn, .02%B, .235% MN, Andersons, AGC83025 ,0-4-4, no subs 222:15(%6,664.50
17-3-5 fluid fertilizer, w/25% CRN,prdactin, +micros, Provides, L-Amino No Bid|No BRid

203 100 acids, vitamins, and secondary binutrients, ’
Sprayable Nutrlents, AGC174AVS , Andersons, 5 gal, no substitutions

204 100 29.2.3 Anderson's Fluid Fertilizer, 29% Total N, 2% Ph, 3%soluble Potash, $66.35|%$6,635.00

Andersons Fertilizers, w/post emergent weed control

13-3-26 W/ .860% millennium Ultra, 50% NS, SOP, Andersons,

50 Ib bag, no substitutions -

206

300

18-5-9 w/ millennium Ultra, /30% NS-52 , AGC185ML4.2
SGN 150, Andersons, no substitutions

Lebannon Country Club

* Multiply the Est. Order Quantity by the Unit Price to equal the Extended Amount

. 50-4-10 with 1.15% Team, Lebanon Couniry Club, NO Substitutions
300 50 Ib bag Fairway grade, , 39% Controlled release N.
* |18-5-9 Lebanon Country Club, fairway grade, <150 SGN , No substitutions 18.00 | $2,700.00

208 150 3.6% slow rel N, homogenous blend , 50 ib bag

46-16-16, Country Club, 40% IBDU, SGN 230, Sulfate of Potash, 25.00 $3,750.00
209 150 5.4% S, 1.0% Fe, 0.8% Mg, 0.4% Mn, No substitutions

48-5-9, Country Club, 51% MU, SGN 185, Suifate of éotash. .
210 140 5.4% S. 1.0% FE, 1% Mg, 0.25% Mn, No substitutions $8.00 | $2,520.00
211 100 18-3-18, Country Club, Meth-EX40, 65% Controlled Release N, No Bid| No Bid

SGN 100, greens grade , PIN > 245, 4.5% WIN, 7.2 OWSN, NO Substitutions

R q A *’%‘WW&W&WWQMSm%wm&&%ﬁﬂ%&ﬁ%ﬁ&&?&ﬁfm R R R

Subtotal

s.31,419.50




. DNR80113 - GOLF COURSE CHEMICALS BID FORM - BID OPENING: JANUARY 24, 2007; 1:30 PM

P28

Est. Order
ltem No: Quantity Description Unit Pnce * Extended Amount
’ UAP - Greens Grade ; a =
212 20 0-0-28, 7.5%Fe,5.5% Mn, SOP, UAP/Loveland 1‘3 . .
50 Ib bag, greens grade, SGN-80-100,no substifutions No.Bid No Bid
213 20 0-0-26, 3% Fe Polymer Coated potassium, SOP, UAP/Loveland No Bid No Bid
501b bag, greens grade, SGN-90-100,no substitutions
214 30 5.2.8 80% Milorganite, 4.8% FE, SOP UAP , SGNQO 100 No Bid No Bid
50 Ib bag, greens grade, no substitutions
215 30 5-4-5 , natural organic, with minimum 8% CA,micros, SGN 85 \ ]
|50 Ib bag, UAP/Loveland , No substitutions No Bid | No Bid
' 6-2-0 4% Fe,100% Milorganite,50Ib bag, no substitutions, SGNS0-100, No Bid No Bid
216 30 greens grade
7-1-14, 60% Milorganite, 50% Nutralene, SOP, 50 Ib bag, No Bid No Bid
217 30 UAP, No substitutions SGN90-100 , greens grade
10-18-22-UAP, 62% BCMU, SOP, 1%FE, ,micros, No B‘i d No Bid
218 50 SGN 90-100, greens grade , 50 Ib bag, no subs '
12-1-12, 40% Org, 40% BCMU, 40% AS, 2.4% F,SOP, UAP/Loveland No Bid | No Bid
219 50 50 Ib bag, no subs , Greens grade SGN 90-100
~ 12-2-24,77%BCMU, 1.2% Fe, + Micros, SOP, UAP/Loveland No Bid No Bid
220 50 50 Ib bag, greens grade, SGN 90-100, No substitutions :
. 14-3-14,70% BCMU, 2% Fe,+micros, SOP, UAP\Loveland, 50 Ib bag . .
221 50 SGN- 90-100 greens grade , No substitutions' No Bid No Bid
15-0-30, 100% BCMU, 1%Fe, SOP, UAP/Loveland , 50 Ib bag o .
222 20 SGN 90-100, greens grade, No substitutions No Bid No Bid
16-4-8, 1% Fe, 100% Ammonium sulfate, SOP, UAP/Loveland . No Bid No Bid
223 30 50Ib bag, greens grade, SGN 80-100,no substituﬁons '
18-0-18, 75% BCMU, 25% AS, 1.3% Fe,+Micros, SOP, 50 Ib bag No Bid | No BId
224 30 SGN 90-100, 50 Ib bag, UAP/Loveland , no substitutions ‘
18-3-18 92% BCMU, .9% FE+Micros, SOP, UAP/Loveland No Bid No Bid
225 20 50 Ib bag, greens grade, < No substitutions, SGN- 90-100
21-3-12, 63%BCMU, 0.9% Fe +Micros, UAP/Loveland ; .
226 20 50 Ib bag, greens grade, SGN- 90-100, no substitutions No Bid | No Bid
. ' 00000
* Multiply the Est. Order Quantity by the Unilt Price to equal the Extended Amount Subtotal $
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.Est. Order
lfem NO Quantity Description Unit Price * Extended Amount
e UAP- tee cut and fairways e
20 12-1-12, 50% Org,54%BCMU,21% Pot Nitrate, UAP/Loveland L g Bid

50 Ib bag, tee and low cut fairways, 'SGN 125-150, no substitutions No Bi No Bi

228 20 12-24-12, 30% STU, SOP, UAP/ Loﬁleland , starter fert No Bid No Bid
50 Ib bag, tee and low cut fairways, :SGN- 125-150 , no substitutions

229 20  [16-2-22, 61% BCMU, + Micros, SOP, UAP/Loveland No Bid |No Bid
50 Ib bag, tee and low cut fairways, SGN 125-150, no substitutions ‘ ’

230 20 19-0-19, 100% SRN,1% FE, SOP, L}APLoveland No Bid No Bid
50 Ib bag, tee and low cut fairways, SGN- 125-150,n0 substitutions

231 20 15-0-30, 100%STU, 1%Fe, SOP, UAP/LoveIand . .
50 |b bag, tee and low cut fairways, SGN125-1 50, no substitutions No Bld No Bid

232 20 22-0-22, 60% BCMU, 1.5% FE, SOP, UAP/Loveland
50 Ib bag, tee and low cut fairways, SGN 125-150 , no substitutions  |NO Bid No Bid

233 20 22-4-20,70% STU, 1% Fe, Prospect; SOP, UAP/Loveland No Bid No Bid
50.1b bag, tee and low cut fairways, SGN 125-150 , no substitutions SR i

234 20  |28-3-10,72% BCMU, 1% Fe, SOP, UAP/Loveland No Bid |No Bid
50 Ib bag, tee and low cut fairways, SGN 125-150, no substitutions

235 20 21 -0-21. 100 % BCMU, SOP, UAP/LjoveIand No Bid No Bid

) 50 |b bag, low cut, fairways, SGN 125—1 50, no substitutions

236 20 24-2-12, 50% BCMU, 1% Fe, SOP, UAP/Loveland No Bid No Bid.
50 Ib bag, low cut, fairways, SGN 125-150 , no substitutions

237 20 25-5-11, 70% STU, 1% FE, Proépec?, SOP, UAP/Loveland No Bid No Bid
50 Ibbag, low cut fairways, fees, SGN 125-150,no substitutions

238 20 28-3-10, 72% BCMU, 1% Fe, SOP, @AP/Loveland No Bid No Bid

o 50 |b bag, tees and low cut fairways, no substitutions
: : 00000
* Multiply the Est, Order Quantity by the Unit Price to equal the Extended Amount . Subtotal $
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Est. Order '
Item No:| Quantity Description Unit Price | * Extended Amount
UAP- -Golf Turf -Lawn Care :

239 20 |1441-11, wi lime SGN- standard grade, UAP, no substitutions 50 lbbag _[NO_Bid |NO Bid

12-1-12, 50 % org, 54% BCMU,21% Pot Nitrate, UAP/Loveland No Bid |No BId
240 30 50 Lb bag, standard grade, golf and lawn care; SGN 200-220 ,no subs .

12-24-14, 30% STU, 2% Fe, Prospect, UAPIvaeland - starter fert ‘ No Bid |No Bid
241 100 50 |b bag, standard grade, golf and lawn care, SGN 200-220, no subs O 1 O 1

19-19-19 30% STU, SOP, UAP /Loveland ,50 Ib bag No Bid |No Bid
242 100 standard grade, goif and lawn care SGN 200-220, no subs

20-3-20,70% STU, 2% Fe, SOP, UAP/Loveland No Bid |No Bid
243 100 standard grade, golf and lawn care, SGN 200-220, no substitutions

20-8-8 30% STU,UAP /Loveland , 50 Ib bag, Standard grade No Bid |No Bid
244 100 golf and lawn care, SGN 200-220, no substitutions

28-3-10 50% STU, 1% Fe, UAP/Loveland No Bid |No Bid
245 100 50 Ib bag, golf and lawn care, SGN 200-220 , no substitutions

30-0-10, 50% STU, Prospect, SOP, UAP/Loveland No Bid [No Bid
246 100 501b bag, golf and lawn care, SGN 200-220, no substitutions :

23-3-6, 25% SCU,.82 % Trimec., UAP/Loveland N ] )
247 100 50 Ib bag, golf and lawn care ,standard grade\ ho substitutions NO Bid |No Bid

18-24-12, 25% SRN, UAP/Loveland No Bid [No Bid
248 100 50Ib bag,standard grade, golf and lawn care, SGN -200-220, No , subs

20-3-20, 70% STU, 2% Fe, OP, UAP . A :
249 100 50 Ib bag, standard grade, golf and lawn care, SGN 200-220, no subs No Bid |No Bid

20-4-10, 75% SRN, 1% Fe, UAP/Loveland, 50 Ib bag No Bi No Bi
250 100 standard grade, golf and lawn care, SGN 200-220,no subs d id

20-5-20, 50% STU, Prospect, SOP, UAP/Loveland No Bid |No Bid
251 . 100 50 ib bag, golf and lawn care, SGN 200-220, No subs

' No Bid |No Bid

21-3-16, 60% BCMU, 30% SCU, 3% Fe, SOP, UAP/Loveland
252 100 50 Ib bag, no substitutions, SGN 200-220

22-3-11, 40% SCU', ,2% Fe, UAP/Loveland, No Bid |No Bid
253 100 50 Ib bag, no substitutions, SGN 200-220

34-0-15, ALL Mineral, Prospect, UAP/Loveland’ . .
254 100 |50 Ib bag, no substitutions, SGN- 200-220 No Bid |No Bid

00000
* Multiply the Est. Order Quantity by the Unit Price 1o equal the Extended Amount Subtotal $
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Est. Order * Extended
Quantity Description Unit Price Amount
] T Femhzer + Insect Control- Lawn Care RS TR R
UAP

255 5 0-0-7, .225% Allectus, UAPILoveland No Bid | No Bid
50 Ib bag, lawn care, insect control no subshtuﬁons

256 5 18-2-5 40% SCU,.225% Allectus, UAP/Loveland No Bid | No Bid
50 }b bag, lawn care, insect contro'l. no substitutions

- 257 5 15-3-5, 20% SCU, .20 % Merit, UAPlLoveland ) . .
50 Ib bag, lawn care, insect control, no substitutions No Bid | No B].‘d
* Multiply the Est. Order Quantity by the Unit Price to equal the Extended Amount Subtotal s YU UUU

P31
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Est. Order
Item No: | Quantity Description * Extended Amount
e Pre-emergent crabgrass Control -UAP e

258 700 115-0-05, 25% STU, .17% Dimension, ( .38 Ib Al) UAP/Loveland - T i
50 Ib bag, no substitutions No Bid No Bid

259 100 15-3-5 .86% Team Pro mn, 20% STU, 50 b bag - UAP ( 1.5 Al) . .
standard medium grade, Fairway, crab grass conirol preemergent ,no subs No Bid No Bid

260 100 19.3-5, .10% dimension, Mini, 25% STU, (.17Ib Al)

fairway, 50 Ib bag., UAP, No subs
Fertilizer, with Broad leaf control

261 100 15.2-5 25% SCU, .87 Millennium ultra, UAP ~ ) . . .
‘ 50 Ib bag, no substitutions ‘ No Bid No Bid. »
AR Soluble / Liquid Fertilizers e
262 125 18-3-6 , The Classlc, Slow available liquid nitrogeri, w / micros ’ No Bid No Bid

2 x 2.5 gal containers, Growth Products, No Subs

263 25  |28-8-18 + Micros, bent special, FeRION, UAP/Loveland No Bid No Bid
25 ib bag, soluble , no substitutions , 1-3 bags.per acre

264 25 13-0-44 + Micros, , Pot Nitrate, FeRION, UAP/Loveland No Bid No Bid
25 |b bag, soluble, no substitutions, 2-4 Ibs/ gal/ 1,000 sq, ft.

‘ , ' No Bid |[No Bid
265 25 13-28-20, UAP, BCMU, SOP,Micros, minimum
6% sulphur, , 50 Ib bag , or equal :

s 00000

- }* Multiply the Est. Order Quaniity by the Unit Price to equal the Extended Amount Subtotal
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—Tiemn | ESL Oraer

No: | Quantity Description | UnitPrice | * Extended Amount
Ben Griggs Brothers /Green S ec Fertlhzers g;g e % S
et e e e TR e o %&» .

266 15 Griggs Brothers 7-7-7 iron, 50. Ib bag, No substitutions $ 29 $437.25

267 15 Griggs Brothers , granular, Turf Rally, 16-4-8, 50 Ib.bag, no Substitutions $30 $459.75

268 15 Griggs brothers, 10-2-4, All natural organic, 50 Ib bag, No substitutions $32 $494.25

269 25 Griggs Brothers, Endurance, 8-4-16, 50 Ib_bag, No subsfitutions $32.35 1$808.75

270 25 Griggs Brothers, Aerator, 38% Calcium, 50 Ib bag, No substitutions $21.50 1$537.50

165.

271 125 Griggs Brothers, Gary's green ulira 13-'2-3+|ron. , 2% 2.5 gal , no substitufions $165.00 $20 ! 625

272 100 Griggs brothers, P—K-p!vus , 3-21-18 + micros, 2x 2.5 gal , no substitutions $230.00 $23,0 0 0

273 125 Gary's Green,18-3-4, iron-micros, 2 X 2.5 gal., No subsﬁtutions $158.00 $ 19, »7 50

Griggs Brothers A-O-K, 1 0-24 2 x2.5gal, No subshtut:ons , »$ 1. 75. w 00

Milorganite, organic fertilizer,_6-2-0, Fairway, SGN <150, 50 Ib, No subs $7.49 1$1,797.60

276 700 ' Milorganite, organic fertilizer, 6-2-0, Greens grade, SGN <100, 50 Ib, no subs $8.37 |$5,859.00
277 120 Milorganite, organic fertilizer, 6-2-0 Classic, Pro Only, 4% iron, 50 # bag, No subs No Bid No Bid

* Multiply the EsL. Order Quaniity by the Unit Price fo equal the Exiended A;rlount subtotal |82 79 19.10
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Est. Order
Item No: | Quantity Description Unit Price * Extended Amount
ST Nature Safe Fertilizers R
278 50 5.6-6 starter fertilizer, Fine grade, nature safe, 50 Ib b'ég , No substitutions No Bl d No Bid
279 50 8-3.5 stress guard fert,Fine grade, nature safe, 50 Ib bag, no substitutions No Bid |No Bid
280 25 :12-2-6- Ammonium sulfate fortified, fine, nature safe, 50 Ib bag, no subs ANO Bid No Bid
281 250 10-2-8, all season fertllizer, coarse, nature safe. 50 Ib bag, no subsfitutions No Bid No Bid
282 65 15-2-8- with Meth-ex 40, fine, nature safe , 50 ib bag no substitutions No Bid . No Bid
283 250 15-2-8 with Meth-EX 40,coarse, SGN225, nature safer 50 b pag, no substitutions No Bid No Bid
284 10 3-5-5, pelieted, landscape ferlilizer, nature safe, 50 Ib, no substitutions No Bid No Bid
21-3-7, blended with Uflexx, coarse,slow release N, 8 ;weeks of feed , Na'iure Safe - No Bid |No Bid
285 100 50 Ib bag, Coatse prade, no substitutions _ .
286 100 13-0-0 Blending Base, super fine , 50 Ib bag, Nature Safe, No substitutions No Bid |No Bid
13'0'0, l?}ianging Base,.pelleted_ 50 Ib bag. Nature Safe, no substitutions No Bid |[No Bid
" 5 RERE ! 5 R ey
288 20 Penn- Mulch -Seed establishment mulch,50# bag, gteen color granules
with a starter fertilizer , Lebannon, or equal, Must suppty label \. $ 18.00 $ 360.00
« Multiply the Est. Order Quanilty by the Unit Price 1o equal the Exiended Amount subtotat |5 360.00
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Est. Order

Item No: Quantity Description Unit Price * Extended Amount
Granular Nutrients : ﬁ%’ﬁa&

. (vendor supply label ) : 5 5

R

ety
StRee

: T
st
: 3}?}%*@%@«%&‘;{%

. 2898 15 Muriate of Potash, 0-0-62, 50 |b bag, , or equal
290 15 Sulfate of Potash, 0-0-50, 50 Ib bag, Greens grade, SGN <100,0r equal $240.00
291 15 0-0-~52, sulfate potash, 50 Ib bag, < 150 SGN, or equal $ 255.00
292 10 Urea, 46-0-0, Prilled, 50 Ib bag, or equal .

MonoPotassium Phosphate, MKP, 00-52-34 , or equal,

Lime, Gypsum, Sulphur ey
e B R e

Gypsum Pellets, - Greens grade, 50# bag $425.00
295 50 Gypsum pellets — Standard grade, 50# bag $300.00
Dolomitic Limestone - Micro Peflet greens applications $4.50 $4,500.00

296 1000 50 Ib bag, :

297 1000 Hi-Cal lime, Micro Pellet., High Calcium content, low Mg. $5.50 $5 »500.00

for greens applications, 50 Ib bag

298 1000 Hi-Cal lime, standard pellet, Fairway grade, 50 Ib bag ' $5.50 $5,500.00
299 500 Granular Sulfur, AGC8870, Andersons, 90% S dispersible granular No Bid No Bid
50 Ib bag, n o subs , SGN 100

A T R
. %ﬁ%ﬁ%é’%& Turf Foliar Nutrient u,%%?@:ﬁz%
300 50 Cal-Vantage, Earth Works, ,2 x 2.5 gal, no substitutions No Bid
301 5 Cal-Vantage, Earth Works, 30 gal, no substitutions No Bid No Bid
302 5 Cal-Vantage, Earth Works, 55 gal , no substitutions No Bid No Bid
303 25 C-Alpha Foliar, 2 x 2.5 gal container 10% Ca, No substitutions No Bid No Bid
304 10 C-Alpha Foliar, 30 gallon, 10% Ca, No substitutions No Bid No Bid
* Multiply the Est. Order Quantity by the Unit Price to equal the Extended Amount Subtotal 31 6 ’ 7 2 0 . O O

GRAND TOTAL{$ 571,445.83




