PO

State of West Virginia

Purchasing Division

Department of Administration

2019 Washington Street East

conRERYINKUMBER S

ﬁ-equest for

667C0019 1

Quotation

Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

¥ i ARDRESS CORRESPONDENC E TOATTEN FON OF - =0

JOHN JOHNSTON

3046-558-2402

x709062626

306-647-6296

GREENBRIER

RONCEVERTE

BOX 277

WV 24970

EXCAVATING & PAVING

D1V
VA
BY

ISTON OF HIGHWAYS
RIDUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
ORDER

Riy

REIGHT TERM

03/11/2007

NET 30

BEST WAY

DESTINATION PREPAID

BID OPENING DATE

04/06/2007

BID

OPENING TIME 01:30PM

0001

TN
1
HOT-MIX ASPHALT

THE VENDOR'S
VIRGINIA DIVIISION

LAY DOWN HOT-MIX
OF HIGHWAYS

NOTE :
LICENSE,
COMPENSATION
DOWN OF MATERIALS.

EXHIBIT 3

OPEN

TO FURNISH MATERIALS,
PLANT,

TO FURNISH MATERIALS,
ASPHALT FOR THE WEST
AT VARIOUS
CONDITIONS SPECIFIED HEREINAFTER.

LIFE OF CONTRACT:

TH

765-21

END CONTRACT

EQUIPMENT AND LA

HOT-MIX ASPHALT 7O
OF HIGHWAYS FOR USE
CONDITIONS SPECIFIED HEREINAFTER.

AND/OR

EQUIPMENT AND LA

LOCATIONS IN TH

VENDORS SHOULD SUBMIT A COPY OF
INSURANCEE CERTIFICATE,
CERT|IFICA[TE IF BIDDING IT

AND WO

IS CONTRACT BECO

BOR TO SUPPLY AT
THE WEST
UNDER THE

BOR NECESSARY TO
VIRGINIA DIVISION
E STATE UNDER TH

CONTRACTORS
RKERS

EM "H™ LAY

oooooooooooo

YEAR OR UNTI
NECESSARY TO
ORIGINAL CON
MOT EXCEED T

L SUCH

TRACT).
WELVE

OBTAIN A
THE

(12)] MONTHS.

AND EXTENDS FOR A PERIOD OF ONE (1)
"REASONABLE TIME™ T
NEW CONTRACT OR RENEW THE
"REASONABLE TIME™

DURING

TIME®™ THE VENDOR
REASON UPON
WRITTEN NOTICE.

GIVIN

MAY T
G THE

ERMINATE THIS CO
DIRECTOR OF PUR

MES EFFECTIVE ON

HEREAFTER AS IS

PERIDD SHALL
THIS "™REASONABLE(
NTRACT FOR ANY
CHASING 30 DAYS

SIGNATUR

"SRR N~

" 504-647-4296

DATE
4/2/07

TITLE V.P.

o
FEIN

5

-0635695

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'




Request for

State of West Virginia g
Quotation

Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Sireet East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

JOHN JOHNSTON
3046-558-2602

709052626 304-6467-4296

GREENBRIER EXCAVATING & PAVING DIVISIOGN OF HIGHWAYS

PO BOX 277 VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
i BY ORDER

RONCEVERTE WV 24970

ATE PRINTED

SHI

REIGHETER

03/11/

2007

BEST WAY

DESTINATION

PREPAID

BID OPENING DATE:

04/06/2007

BID

DPENING TIME

01:30PH

FIC PROVIS
DOCUM
N ARE

UNLESS SPECI
IN THIS CONTRACT
PRICING SET HEREI
CONTRACT.

RENEWAL: THIS CONTRACT
WRITTEN CONSENT OF THE
SUBMITTED TO] THE DIREC
DAYS PRIOR TO THE] EXPI
BE IN ACCORDANCE WITH

ORIGINAL CONTRACT; AND

(1) YEAR PERJIODS.

CANCELLATION|: THE| DIRE
RIGHT TOD CANCEL THIS C
NOTICE TO THE VENPUR I
SUPPLIED ARE| OF AN INF
TO THE SPECIFICATIIONS

DPEN MARKET |[CLAUSE: TH
AUTHORIZE A [SPENDING U
MARKET, WITHOUT THE FI
ESTIMATE, ITEMS SPECIF
IMMEDIATE DELIVER)Y IN
CAUSES (INCLUDING BUT
FORTATION OR| AN UNANTI
OF WORK.)

QUANTITIES: QUANT|ITIES
APPROXIMATIONS ONLY, B
THE STATE SPENDING UNI
THAT THE CONTRACT| SHAL
ORDERED FOR [DELIVIERY D
WHETHER MORE| DR LESS T

IONS ARE STIPULA
ENT, THE TERMS,
FIRM FOR THE LI

MAY BE RENEWED
SPENDING UNIT A

TED ELSEWHERE
CONDITIONS AND
FE OF THE

UPCN THE MUTUAL
ND VENDOR,

TOR OF PURCHASIN
RATION DATE. SU
THE TERMS AND CO
SHALL BE LIMITED

CTOR OF PURCHASI
ONTRACT IMMEDIAT
F THE COMMODITIE
ERIOR QUALITY OR
OF THE BID AND C

E DIRECTOR OF PU
NIT TO PURCHASE

LING OF A REQUIS
IED ON THIS CONT
EMERGENCIES DUE

NOT LIMITED TO D
CIPATED INCREASE

LISTED IN THE R
ASED ON ESTIMATE
T. IT IS UNDERS
L COVER THE QUAN
URING THE TERM O
HAN THE QUANTITI

G THIRTY (30D

CH RENEWAL SHALL
NDITIONS OF THE
TO TWO (2) OCGNE

NG RESERVES THE
ELY UPON WRITTEN

S AND/OR SERVICES

DO NOT CONFORM
ONTRACT HEREIN.

RCHASING MAY

OM THE OPEN
ITION DR COST

RACT FOR

TO UNFORESEEN

ELAYS IN TRANS-
IN THE VOLUME

EQUISITION ARE
S SUPPLIED BY
TODD AND AGREED
TITIES ACTUALLY
F THE CONTRACT,
ES SHOWN.

TELEPHONE

DAT

304-647-4296

4/2/07

= IR
V.P

- [FITLE

FENTT55-0635695

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'




State of West Virginia RequeSt for
Department of Administration  Quotation
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East

Past Office Box 50130

Charleston, WV 25305-0130 JOHN JOHNSTON
3046-558-2402

*709052626 304-647-4296
GREENBRIER EXCAVATING & PAVING
PO BOX 277

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER

RONCEVERTE WV 24970

03/11/2007 NET 30 BEST WAY - DESTINATION PREPAID
BID OFENING DATE: 04/06/2007 . BID OPENING TIME 01:30PM

ORDERING PROCEDURE: SPENDING UNIT(S) SHALL ISSUE A
WRITTEN STATE CONTRACT| ORDER (FORM NUMBER WV-39) TO
THE VENDOR FOR COMMODITIES COVERED BY |[THIS CONTRACT.
THE ORIGINAL|( COPY| OF THE WV-39 SHALL BE MAILED TO THE
VENDOR AS AUTHORIZATION FOR SHIPMENT, |A SECOND COPY
MAILED TO THE PURCHASING DIVISION, AND A THIRD COPY
RETAINED BY [THE SPENDING UNIT.

BANKRUPTCY: { IN THE EVENT THE VENDOR/CONTRACTOR FILES
FOR BANKRUPTCY PROTECT|ION, THIS CONTRACT IS AUTOMATI-
CALLY NULL AND VOID, AND IS TERMINATED| WITHOUT FURTHER
ORDER.

SHALL SUPERSEDE ANY AND ALL SUBSEQUENT, TERMS AND
CONDITIONS WHICH MAY APPEAR ON ANY ATTACHED PRINTED
DOCUMENTS SUCH AS| PRICE LISTS, ORDER FIORMS, SALES
AGREEMENTS OR MAINTENANCE AGREEMENTS, |INCLUDING ANY
ELECTRONIC MEDIUM SUCH AS CD-ROM.

THE TERMS ANr CONDITIONS CONTAINED IN [THIS CONTRACT
E
H

REV. 04/11/2001

PURCHASING CARD ACCEPTANCE: THE STATE| OF WEST VIRGINIA
CURRENTLY UTIILIZE[S A VIISA PURCHASING CARD PROGRAM WHIC
IS ISSUED THROUGH A BANK. THE SUCCESSFUL VENDOR

MUST ACCEPT [THE S|[TATE [OF WEST VIRGINIA} VISA PURCHASING
CARD FOR PAYMENT [OF AL[L ORDERS PLACED BY ANY STATE
AGENCY FOR ORDERS| THAT| ARE LESS THAN $2,500 AS A CONDI-
TIOM OF AWARD.

INSURANCE: SUCCESSFUL |[VENDOR SHALL FURNISH PROGF OF
COVERAGE OF COMMERCIAL| GENERAL LIABILITY INSURANCE
PRIOR TO ISSUANCE| OF THE CONTRACT. UNLESS OTHERWISE
SPECIFIED IN THE [BID DOQCUMENTS, THE MINIMUM AMOUNT OF
INSURANCE COVERAGE REQUIRED IS $250,000.

SE REVERSE SIDE FOR TERMS AND CONDITIONS.

: TELEPHONE 301 _647-4296 |PME4/2/07

T V.P. FEN 5 5-0635695 ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE
WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR

SIGNATU,




| Po

¥709052626

| RONCEVERTE WV

Purchasing Division

BOX 277

24970

State of Wast Virginia
Depariment of Administration

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

304-647-429%6
GREENBRIER EXCAVATING & PAVING

Request for

THREQNUMBER:

Quotation

667C0019

T AUDNE S CORRESPONDENGE TOATTENTION OF -1

JOH

304~

N JOHNSTON
558-2402

BY

DIVISION DOF HIGHWAYS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED

ORDER

HEIGHT TERMS

03/11/2007

NET 30

BEST WAY

DESTINATION

PREPAID

BID OPENING DATE:

04/04/2007

BID

OPENING TIME

01:30PM

CERTIFICATE FROM

PERSONS DESIRING

L ICENSE.
CAPITOL COMPLEX,
25305.

PROSPECTIVE

CONTRACTORS NAME

CONTRACTORS

A .
REASON CHECKED:

WORKERS COMPENSAT

WEST VIRGINIA STA
STATE MUST BJE LIC
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OF THEIR CONTRACT
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CON
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T30 PE
ENSED
S EMP
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G THE
BUILD
(30

TE CO
R TO
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E s

SE NO
DDER
ORS L
NTRAC
OR PR
APPL
DRDAN
APPL

S MAD

VENDCOR IS REQUIR
RS COMPENSATION

TRACTORS LICENSE

DE 21-11-2 REQUI
RFORM CONTRACTIN
. THE WEST VIRG
OWERED TO ISSUE

FOCR A CONTRACTOD
WEST VIRGINIA D
ING 3, ROOM 319,
4) 558-7890.

DE 21-11-11 REQU
INCLUDE THE CONT

Greenbrler Excavatin

oooooooooooooooo

L L R R R T R

WILL REQUIRED TO
ICENSE PRIOR TO
T.

EFERENCE CERTIFI
ICATION>* IS HERE
CE WITH WEST VIR
Y TO CONSTRUCTIO

E FOR 2.5% PREFE

ED TO PROVIDE A
IF SUCCESSFUL.

RES THAT ALL
G WORK IN THIS

THE CONTRACTORS

CHARLESTON, WV

IRES ANY
RACTORS LICENSE

FURNISH A c€OPY
ISSUANCE OF A
CATE
BY MADE FOR
GINIA CODE.,

N CONTRACTS).

RENCE FOR THE

INIA CONTRACTORS

RS LICENSE MAY BE
IVISION OF LABOR

g, & Paving, Inc.

SEE-HEVEASE SIDE FORTERMS AND.CONDITIONS

=SNG

TELEPHONE

304-647-4296

ATE
4/2/07

TITLE

FEIN

55-0635695

ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'




Request for
Quotation

State of West Virginia
Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Sireet East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

JOHN JOHNSTON

204-6558-2402

*¥709052626 304-667-4296

GREENBRIER EXCAVATING & P
PO BOX 277

RONCEVERTE WV 24970

AVING DIV

BY

ISION OF HIGHWAYS

DRDER

VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED

EPRINTED ERM:

03/11/2007 NET 30

BEST WAY

DESTINATION

BID OPENING DATE:

064/04/2007

BID

OPENING TIME 01

30PM

( ) BIDDER IS AN IND
HAS RESIDED |[CONTINUOUS
(4) YEARS IMMEDIATTELY
CERTIFICATION; OR

(X)) BIDDER IS Al PART
TION RESIDENT VENDOR A
QUARTERS OR |PRINC|IPAL

WEST VIRGINIA FOR| FOUR
THE DATE OF [THIS [CERTI
INTEREST OF BIDDER IS

PARTNERSHIP,| ASSOCIATI
WHO HAS MAINTAINED ITS
OF BUSINESS CONTINUOUS
YEARS IMMEDIATELY] PREC
CERTIFICATION; OR
(¢ > BIDDER CORP
WHICH HAS AN| AFFILIATE
A MINIMUM OF| ONE HUNDR
HAS MAINTAINED ITS HEA
BUSINESS WITHIN WEST V
FOUR (4) YEARS IMMEDIA
CERTIFICATION.

IS A

B. APPLICAT|ION IS MAD

REASON CHECKED:

IS A RESI
IFE OF THE

(X)) BIDDER
DURING THE L
75% OF THE EMPLOYEES W
ARE RESIDENTIS OF WEST

THE STATE CONTINUOUSLY,

IVIDUAL RESIDENT,
LY IN WEST VIRGI
PRECEDING THE DA

NERSHIP, ASSOCIA
PLACE OF BUSINES
(4) YEARS IMMED
FICATION; OR 80X
HELD BY ANOTHER
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HEADQUARTERS OR
LY IN WEST VIRGI
EDING THE DATE 0O

ORATION NONRESID
OR SUBSIDIARY W
ED STATE RESIDEN
QUARTERS OR PRIN
IRGINIA CONTINUO
TELY PRECEDING T

E FOR 2.5% PREFE

DENT VENDOR WHD

CONTRACT, ON AV
ORKING ON THE PR
VIRGINIA WHO HAV
FOR THE TWO YEA

VENDOR AND
NIA FOR FOUR
TE OF THIS

TION OR CORPORA-

ND HAS MAINTAINED ITS HEAD-

S CONTINUOUSLY IN

IATELY PRECEDING
OF THE OWNERSHIFP

INDIVIDUAL,

N RESIDENT VENDOR
PRINCIPAL PLACE

NIA FOR FOUR (4)

F THIS

ENT VENDOR

HICH EMPLOYS

TS AND WHICH
CIPAL PLACE OF
USLY FOR THE

HE DATE OF THIS

RENCE FOR THE
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OJECT BEING BID
E RESIDED IN

RS IMMEDIATELY

PRECEDING SUBMISSIION OF THIS BID;
OR
SIGNATURI \ = TELEFPHONE DATE
M&NML\L 304-647-4296 4/2/07
TrLE V.P. FEN  55-0635695 ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR’



State of West Vfrgn‘"a Request. for o BEQING R Reen
Department of Administration Quotation 667C0019 6
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130 JOHN JOHNSTON
30G6-Bh3-2602

] ¥709052626 304-647-46296
GREENBRIER EXCAVATING & PAVING
PO BOX 277

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER

‘0 RONCEVERTE WV 24970

ATE RRINTED: TERMEOF B IGHT
03/11/2007 NET 30 BEST WAY DESTINATION PREPAID
BID OPENING DATE" 06/04/2007 BID OPENING TIME _0l:30PM

( ) BIDDER| IS Al NONRESIDENT VENDOR EMPLOYING A
MINIMUM OF ONE HUNDRED| STATE RESIDENTS| OR IS A
NONRESIDENT [VENDOR WITH AN AFFILIATE QR SUBSIDIARY
WHICH MAINTAINS IITS HEADQUARTERS OR PR[INCIPAL PLACE
OF BUSINESS WITHIN WEST VIRGINIA EMPLOYING A MINIMUM
OF ONE HUNDRED STATE RESIDENTS WHO CERTIFIES THAT,
DURING THE L|IIFE OF THE; CONTRACT, ON AVERAGE AT LEAST
75% OF THE EMPLOYEES OR BIDDERS' AFFILIATE'S OR
SUBSIDIARY'S EMPLOYEES| ARE RESIDENTS OF WEST VIRGINIA
WHO HAVE RESIDED |IN THE STATE CONTINUQUSLY FOR THE TWO
YEARS IMMEDIATELY| PRECEDING SUBMISSION DF THIS BID.

BIDDER UNDERSTANDS IF [THE SECRETARY OF) TAX & REVENUE
DETERMINES THAT A BIDDER RECEIVING PREFERENCE HAS
FAILED TO CONTINUE TO MEET THE REQUIREMENTS FOR SUCH
PREFERENCE, [THE SECRETARY MAY ORDER THE DIRECTOR OF
PURCHASING TO: (JAY RESCIND THE CONTRACT OR PURCHASE
DRDER ISSUED;; DR [(B) ASSESS A PENALTY AGAINST SUCH
BIDDER IN AN| AMOUNT NOT TO EXCEED 5% OF THE BID AMOUNT
AND THAT SUCH PENALTY MWILL BE PAID TO [THE CONTRACTING
AGENCY OR DEDUCTED FROM ANY UNPAID BALANCE ON THE
-CONTRACT OR PURCHASE ORDER.

BY SUBMISSION OF :THIS CERTIFICATE, BIDDER AGREES TO
DISCLOSE ANY| REASONABL)YY REQUESTED INFORMATION TO THE
PURCHASING DIVISION AND AUTHORIZES THE| DEPARTMENT OF
TAX AND REVENUE Tj0 DISCLOSE TO THE DIRECTOR OF
PURCHASING APPROPRIATE, INFORMATION VERIFYING THAT
BIDDER HAS PAID THE REQUIRED BUSINESS |[TAXES, PROVIDED
THAT SUCH INFORMATION DOES NOT CONTAIN THE AMODUNTS OF
TAXES PAID NDR ANY OTHER INFORMATION DEEMED BY THE TAX
COMMISSIONER| TO BE CONFIDENTIAL.

UNDER PENALT)Y OF |LAW FOR FALSE SWEARING (WEST VIRGINIA
CODE 61-5-3)|, BIDDER HEREBY CERTIFIES [THAT THIS
CERTIFICATE |IS TRUE AND ACCURATE 1IN AL|L RESPECTS; AND

TELEPHONE  304-647-4296 [P 4/2/07

élGNATUHE k j ! ; g M
v.p N e 0635695 ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

TITLE
WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'

EE BEVERSE SIDE FOR TEAMS AND CONDITIONS




State of West Virginia Request for
Department of Administration  Quotation
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East

Post Office Box 50130

Charleston, WV 25305-0130 JOHN JOHNSTON
304-558-2402

*¥709052626 306-6467-6G296
GREENBRIER EXCAVATING & PAVING
PO BOX 277

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER

RONCEVERTE WV 24970

REIGHTTE

NET 30 BEST WAY DESTINATION PREPATID
BID OPENING DATE: 046/04/2007 BID DPENING TIME 01:30PM

THAT IF A CONTRACT IS |[ISSUED TG BIDDER) AND IF ANYTHING
CONTAINED WITHIN [THIS CERTIFICATE CHANGES DURING THE
TERM OF THE [CONTRACT, BIDDER WILL NOTIFY THE PURCHASING
DIVISION IN WRITING IMMEDIATELY.

BIDDER: @xeenbrier Excavating & PavingjInc.

4/02/07
DATE:| --- A
fi \ '
-
SIGNED: =—----=--==mofmmmmm e eSS oo
V.P.
LR = R

x CHECK ANY COMBINATION OF PREFERENCE [CONSIDERATIONC(S)
IN EITHER "A"™ OR |"B", [GR BOTH "A™ AND "B™ WHICH YOU ARE
ENTITLED TO RECEIVE. [YOU MAY REQUEST UP TO THE MAXIMUM
5% PREFERENCE FOR| BOTH ™A™ AND "B".
(REV. 12/00)

NOT|ICE
A SIGNED BID MUST) BE SUBMITTED TO:

DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION
PURCHASING DIVISION

BUILDING 15
2019 WASHINGTON S[FREET, EAST
CHARLES[TON, WV 25305-0130

DATE

304-647-4296 4/2/07
TLE V.P. FEN £ _0635695 ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE
WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'

TELEPHONE




State of West Virginia Request for —mowweET— PAGE. -
Department of Administration Quotation 667C0019 a
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East T TAUDRESS CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTENTION OF -7
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130 JOHN JOHNSTON
304-558-2602
¥x709052626 304-647-4296

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS "
VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
BY ORDER

GREENBRIER EXCAVATING & PAVING
PO BOX 277

RONCEVERTE WV 24970

= FRINTED FIEVIA REIG
03/11/2007 BEST WAY DESTINATION PREPAID
BID GPENING DATE: 04/04/2007 BID OPENING TIME 01:30PM

THE BID SHOULD CONTAIN THIS INFORMATION ON THE FACE OF
THE ENVELOPE} OR THE BID MAY NOT BE CONSIDERED:

SEALED BID
BUYER: 33
RFQ. NO.: 667C0019

BID OPENING DATE AND TIME

PLEASE PROVIDE A FAX NUMBER IN CASE IT; IS NECESSARY
TO CONTACT YDU REGARDING YOUR BID:

xxxxxx THIS| IS THE END OF RFQ 66T7C0I019 x=xxxxx%xx TOTAL:

SEE REVERGE SIDE FOR TERVS AND CONDITIONS
TELEPHONE DATE

_ _ 304-647-4296 4/2/07
TiTE V.P. PN 55_.0635695 ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'

SIGNATURE




1z2.

DISTRICT EIGHT

BID SCHEDULE (Continued)

t

Hot-Mix Asphalt

Base 1

F.0.B. Vendor Plant @
per ton

Item &
37.50

Hot-Mix Asphalt

Base II (Patch & Level),

or Wearing Iv 36.90
F.0.B. Vendor Plant @ -

per ton

Item B

Hot-Mix aAsphalt
Wearing I (S8cratch) 37.97
F.0.B. Vendor Plant @
per ton

Item C

Hot-Mix Asphalt

Wearing III No Bid
F.0.B. Vendor Plant @

per ton

Item D

All of the above items sghall be in accordance with The West
Virginia Department of Transportation, Division of Highways,
Standard Specifications Roads and Bridges, Adopted 2000 as
modified by the current Supplemental Specifications, Section
401 as gpecified in the 5C0.

Item E - Hot-Mix Asphalt
Skid Resistant Pavement
F.0.B. Vendor Plant @
per ton

46.00

The above item shall be in accordance with The West Virginia
Department of Transportation, Division of Highways, Standard
Specifications Roads and Bridges, Adopted 2000 as modified by
the current Supplemental Specifications, Section 402.

Iftem F - Hot-Mix Asphalt
Plant Run
F.0.B. Vendor Plant @ 37.97
per ton
Jtem G - Haul by Vendor
@ 1.40 for first ton mile and
@ . L7 for each additional mile
Ttem B - Lay down of Materials
Items A thru E, Each Site
0 to 100 tons @ 59.00 per ton
101 to 200 tons @ 20.00 . per ton
201 to 500 tons @ 10.00 per ton
501 and up @ 8.00 per ton

43




1z2.

DISTRICT EIGHT

BID SCHEDULE {Continued)

Material placed under Item H shall be constructed in accordance with
the Requirements of The West Virginia Department of Transportation,
Division of Highways, Standard Specifications Roads and Bridges,
Adopted 2000 as modified by the current Supplemental Specifications,
Section 401 or 402 as specified in the SCO.

Item I - Cleaning & Sweeping

@ 001 per sq. yd.
Item J - Bituminous Material for Tack Coat
or Prime 1.00
All Types @ * per gallon

Material furnished and applied under Item J to be in accordance with
Section 408 of the referenced specifications, as directed by the
District Engineer/Manager.

Item X - Daytime Paving Mobilization - A Mobilization for Paving
Charge of $700.00 may be made when the purchase order
quantity per paving location is less than 500 tons of
Hot-Mix Asphalt and nighttime paving is not specified.

Item L - Nighttime Paving Mobilization - A Mobilization for
Paving Charge of §2.000.00 may be made when the
purchase order quantity per paving location is less than
500 tons of Hot-Mix Asphalt and nighttime paving is

gpecified.
Item M - Off Season Plant Opening
@ 3.000.00 for first day
@ 550.00 for each additional day
Item N - Additional Heel-In Joints
@ 10.50 per lineal foot
Item O - Skip Paving Surcharge
@ .50 per ton
Item P - Mobilization for Profiling
@ 2,500.00 per SCO
Item ©Q - Pavement Profiling (Milling}, sguare
yards per SCO
Less than 250 @ 25.00 per Sg. Yad.
250 less than 500 @ 15.00 per Sqg. ¥d.
500 less than 1000 @ 10.00 per Sg. Y4.
1000 less than 2500 @ 6.00 per Sg. Yd.
2500 less than 5000 @ 3.00 per Sg. ¥Yd.
5000 and greater @ 2.25 per Sqg. Yd.
Item R - Pilot Truck and Driver

@ 700.00 per day

44




12.

DISTRICT EIGHT

BID SCHEDULE (Continued)

ITtem S -

Item T

Item U

Item V

Vendor's Plant Location

Traffic Control Devices

@ 0.75 per Unit
Flagger
@ 5000 per Hour

Arrow Board
@ 50.00 per Day

Rumble Strips
No Bid

Lewisburg, WV

45




1z2.

DISTRICT NINE

BID SCHEDULE {Continued)

Hot-Mix Asphalt
Base I
F.0.B. Vendor Plant @ 37.50

per ton

Item A

Hot-Mix Asphalt

Base II (Patch & Level},

or Wearing IV 36.90
F.0.B. Vendor Plant @

per ton

Item B

¥

Hot-Mix Asphalt

Wearing I (Scratch) 37.97
F.0.B. Vendor Plant @ N
per ton

Item C

Hot-Mix Asphalt
Wearing IIX )
F.0.B. Vendor Plant @ No Bid

per ton

Item D

All of the above items shall be in accordance with The West
Virginia Department of Transportation, Division of Highways,
Standard Specifications Roads and Bridges, Adopted 2000 as
modified by the current Supplemental Specifications, Section
401 as specified in the SCO.

Ttem E - Hot-Mix Asphalt
Skid Resistant Pavement
F.0.B. Vendor Plant @
per ton

46.00

The above item shall be in accordance with The West Virginia
Department of Transportation, Division of Highways, Standard
Specifications Roads and Bridges, Adopted 2000 as medified by
the current Supplemental Specifications, Section 402.

Item F - Hot-Mix Asphalt
Plant Run
F.0.B. Vendor Plant @ 37.97
per ton
JTtem G - Haul by Vendor
@ 1.40 for first ton mile and
@ 17 for each additional mile
Ttem H - Lay down of Materials
Items A thru E, Each Site
0 to 100 tons @ 59.00 per ton
101 to 200 tons @ 20,00 per ton
201 to 500 tons @ 10.00 per ton
501 and up @ 8.00 per tomn

45




12.

DISTRICT NINE

BID SCHEDULE (Continued)

Material placed under Item H shall be constructed in accordance with
the Requirements of The West Virginia Department of Transportation,
Division of Highways, Standard Specifications Roads and Bridges,
Adopted 2000 as modified by the current Supplemental Specifications,
Section 401 or 402 as specified in the SCO.

ITtem I - Cleaning & Sweeping

@ .001 __per sg. yd.
Ttem J - Bituminous Material for Tack Coat
or Prime
All Types @ 1.00 per gallcon

Material furnished and applied under Item J to be in accordance with
Section 408 of the referenced specifications, as directed by the
District Engineer/Manager. : )

Item X - Daytime Paving Mobilization - A Mobilization for Paving
Charge of § 700.00 may be made when the purchase order
quantity per paving location is less than 500 tons of
Hot-Mix Asphalt and nighttime paving is not specified.

Item L - Nighttime Paving Mobilization - A Mobilization for
Paving Charge of $2,000.00 may be made when the
purchase order gquantity per paving location is less than
500 tons of Hot-Mix Asphalt and nighttime paving is

gpecified.
Item M - Off Season Plant Opening
- @ 3.000.00 for first day
@ 550.00  for each additiocnal day
Ttem N - Additional Heel-In Joints
@ 10.50 per lineal foot
Item O -~ Skip Paving Surcharge
@ 4.5 per ton
Item P - Mobilization for Profiling
@ 2,500.00 per SCO
Item Q - Pavement Profiling (Milling), square
yvards per SCO
Less than 250 @ 25.00 per Sg. Yd.
250 less than 500 @ 15.00 per Sq. ¥Yd.
500 less than 1000 @ 10.00 . per 3q. ¥Y4.
1000 less than 2500 @ 6.00 per Sq. Yd.
2500 less than 5000 @ 3.00 per Sq. Yd.
5000 and greater @ 2.2 per Sq. Yd.
Item R - Pilot Truck and Driver

@ 700.00 per day
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12.

DISTRICT NINE

BID SCHEDULE (Continued)

Item 8 - Traffic Control Devices

@ 0.75 per Unit
Item T ~ Flagger

e 50.00 per Hour
Ttem U - Arrow Board

@ 50.00 per Day
Item V - Rumble Strips

@ No Bid per LF

Vendor's Plant Location Lewisburg, WV
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12.

DISTRICT TEN

BID SCHEDULE (Continued)

Hot-Mix Asphalt

Base T

F.0.B. Vendor Plant @
per ton

Item A
37.50

Item B - Hot-Mix Asphalt
Base II (Patch & Level},
or Wearing IV 36.90
F.0.B. Vendor Plant @
per ton

Hot-Mix Asphalt
Wearing I (Scratch)
F.0.B. Vendor Plant
per ton

Item C
@ 37.97

Hot-Mix Asphalt

Wearing IIX No Bid
F.0.B. Vendor Plant @

per ton

ITtem D

All of the above items shall be in accordance with The West
Virginia Department of Transportation, Divigion of Highways,
Standard Specifications Roads and Bridges, Adopted 2000 as
modified by the current Supplemental Specifications, Section
401 as specified in the SCO.

Item E - Hot-Mix Asphalt
Skid Resistant Pavement 46.00
F.0.B. Vendor Plant
per ton

The above item shall be in accordance with The West Virginia
Department of Transportation, Division of Highways, Standard
Specifications Roads and Bridges, Adopted 2000 as modified by
the current Supplemental Specifications, Section 402.

Item F - Hot-Mix Asphalt
Plant Run
F.0.B. Vendor Plant @ 37.97
per ton
Item G - Haui by Vendor
@ 1.40 for first ton mile and
@ .17 for each additicnal mile
Item H - Lay down of Materials
Items A thru E, Each Site
0 to 100 toms @ 59.00 per ton
101 to 200 toms @ 20.00 per ton
201 to 500 tons @ 10.00 per ton
501 and up @ 8.00 per ton
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DISTRICT TEN

RID SCHEDULE (Continued)

Material placed under Item H shall be constructed in accordance with
the Requirements of The West Virginia Department of Transportaticn,
Division of Highways, Standard Specifications Roads and Bridges,
Adopted 2000 as modified by the current Supplemental Specifications,
Section 401 or 402 as specified in the SCO.

Item T - Cleaning & Sweeping

@ 001 per sg. yd.
Item J - Bituminous Material for Tack Coat
or Prime
All Types @ 1.00 per gallon

Material furnished and applied under Item J to be in accordance with
Section 408 of the referenced specifications, as directed by the
District Engineer/Manager.

Item X - Daytime Paving Mobilization - A Mobilization for Paving
Charge of $700.00 may be made when the purchase order
quantity per paving location iz less than 500 tons of
Hot-Mix Asphalt and nighttime paving is not gpecified.

Item L - Nighttime Paving Mobilization - A Mobilization for
Paving Charge of £ 2,000.00pmay be made when the
purchase order quantity per paving location is less than
500 tons of Hot-Mix Asphalt and nighttime paving is

specified.
Item M - Off Beason Plant Opening
@ 3,000.00 for first day
@ 550.00 for each additional day
Item N - Additional Heel-In Joints
@ 10.50 per lineal foot
Item O - Skip Pavi%? Surcharge
@ -50 per ton
Item P - Mobilization for Profiling
@ 2,500.00 per SCO
Item Q - Pavement Profiling (Milling), square
yvards per SCO
Less than 250 @ 25.00 per Sg. Yd.
250 less than 500 @ 15.00 per Sg. Yd.
500 less than 1000 @ 10.00 per Sg. Yd.
1000 less than 2500 @ 6.00 per Sqg. Yd.
2500 less than 5000 @ 3.00 per Sq. Yd.
5000 and greater @ 2.25 per Sg. Yd.
Item R - Pilot Truck and Driver
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DISTRICT TEN

BID SCHEDULE (Comtinued)

Item S -

Item T

Item U

Item V

Traffic Control Devices

@ 0.75 per Unit
Flagger 5000

@ per Hour
Arrow Beoar

@ 0.00 per Day
Rumble Strips

@ NO Bld Per LF

vendor's Plant Location Lewisburg, WV
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o4
RFQ No. 66700019

AFFIDAVIT

West Virginia Code §5A-3-10a states:
No contract or renewal of any contract may be awarded by the state or any of its political subdivisions to any

vendor or prospective vendor when the vendor or prospective vendor or a related party to the vendor or
prospective vendor is a debtor and the debt owned is an amount greater than one thousand dollars in the

aggregale

DEFINITIONS:
‘Debt” means any assessment, premium, penalty, fine, tax or other amount of money owed fo the state or any

of its political subdivisions because of a judgment, fine, permit violation, license assessment, defaulted
workers’ compensation premium, penalty or other assessment presently delinquent or due and required to be
paid to the state or any of its political subdivisions, including any interest or additional penalties accrued

thereon.

“Debtor” means any individual, corporation, partnership, association, limited liability company or any other form
or -business association owing a debt to the state or any of its political subdivisions. “Political subdivision”
means any county commission; municipality; county board of education: any instrumentality esfablished by a
county or municipality; any separate corporation or instrumentality established by one or more counties or
municipalities, as permitted by law; or any public body charged by law with the performance of a government
function or whose jurisdiction is coextensive with one or more counties or municipalities. “Related party” means
a party, whether an individual, corporation, partnership, association, fimited liability company or any other form
or business association or other entity whatsoever, related to any vendor by blood, marriage, ownership or
contract through which the party has a relationship of ownership or other interest with the vendor so that the
party will actually or by effect receive or control a portion of the benefit, profit or other consideration from
performance of a vendor contract with the party receiving an amount that meets or exceed five percent of the

total contfract amount.

EXCEPTION:
The prohibition of this section does not apply where a vendor has contested any tax administered pursuant to

chapter eleven of this code, workers’ compensation premium, permit fee or environmental fee or assessment
and the matter has not become final or where the vendor has entered into a payment plan or agreement and
the vendor is not in default of any of the provisions of such plan or agreement.

LICENSING: :
Vendors must be licensed and in good standing in accordance with any and all state and local laws and

requirements by any state or local agency of West Virginia, including, but not limited to, the West Virginia
Secretary of State’s Office, the West Virginia Tax Department, West Virginia Insurance Commission, or any
other state agencies or political subdivision. Furthermore, the vendor must provide all necessary releases to
obtain information to enable the Director or spending unit to verify that the vendor is licensed and in good

standing with the above entities.

CONFIDENTIALITY: |
The vendor agrees that he or she will not disclose to anyone, directly or indirectly, any such personally

identifiable information or other confidential information gained from the agency, unless the individual who is
the subject of the information consents to the disclosure in writing or the disclosure is made pursuant to the
agency's policies, procedures and rules. Vendors should visit www.state.wv.us/admin/purchase/privacy for

the Notice of Agency Confidentiality Policies.

Under penalty of law for false swearing (West Virginia Code, §61-5-3), it is ﬁereby certified that the vendor
acknowledges the information in this said affidavit and are in compliance with the requirements as stated.

Vendor's Name: Greenbrier Excgvatlng & Paving, Inc.

£ o o —
Authorized Signature: (,_ \} &&(&l@% Date: 4/2/07

No Debt Affidavit {Revised 10/13/06)




