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GENERAL TERMS & CONDITIONS '
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION {RFQ) AND REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL (RFP)

Awards will be made in the best interest of the State of West Virginia
The State may accepl or reject in part, or in whole, any bid.
All quotations are governed by the West Virginia Code and the Legisiative Fules of the Purchasing Division

Pior to any award, the apparent successful vendor must be properly registered with the Purchasing Division and have
paid the required $125 00 registration fee.

Alf sepvices performed or goods delivered under State Purchase Orders/Contracts are to be co ntinued for the term
of the Purchase Order/Contract, cantingent upen funds being approptiated by the Legislature or vtherwise being
made available. In the event funds are not appropriated or otherwisa available for these services of goods, this
Purchase Order/Contract becomes void and of no effect aiter June 30.

Payment may only be made afler the delivery and acceptance of goods or services

Interest may be pald for late payment in accordance with the West Virginia Code.

Vendor preference will be granted upon writien request in accordance with the Wast Vifginia Codo,

The State of West Virginia Is exempt from jederal and state taxes and wilt not pay ot telinburse such taxes.
The Director of Purchasing may cancel any Purchase Order/Contract upon 30 days written hotice 1o the sefler.

The laws of the State of West Virginia and the Legisfative Rules of the Purchasing Division shall govern all rights
and dutles under the Contract, including without limitation the validity of this Purchase Order/Coniract.

Any reference to automatic renewal Is hereby deleted The Contract may be renewed oniy upon mutual written
agreement of the partles. :

BANKRUPTCY: In the event the vendor/contractor files for bankruptcy protection, this contract is automatically
null and vold, and Is terminated wihout further order.

HIPAA Business Associate Addendum - The West Viginia Stale Government HIPAA Business Associate
Addendum (BAA), approved by the Altomey General, and available ontine at the Purchasing Diviston's web sile
(hitp:ﬂwwwAsta!e.wv.usfadmin!purchase!vrclhipaa.h!m) is hereby made part of the agreemen!t Provided that, the
Agency mests the definition of a Covered Entity (45 CFR §1 60 103) and will be disclosing Protected iHealth
information {45 CFR §160.103) to the vendor )

o ;o= W

INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS
Use the quotation forms provided by the Purchasing Division.
SPECIFICATIONS: items offerad mustbs In compliance with the specificalions, Any deviation from the spaecifications
must be clearly indicated by the bidder. Alternates offerad by the bidder as EQUAL to the speifications must be

clearly defined. A bidder offering an allernate should attach complete specifications and literature to the bid. The
Purchasing Division may walve minor devialions to specifications -

Complete all sections of the quotation form.
Unit prices shail prevail in cases of discrepancy.
Ali quotations are considered F.O B destination unless alternate shipping terms are clearly identified in the quotation.

BiD SUBMISSION: All quotations must be delivered by the bidder to the office listed below prior to the date and time
of the bid opening. Fallure of the bidder 1o dellver the quotations on time will resuit In bid disqualifications. ’

SIGNED BID TO:

Depariment of Administration
Purchasing Divislon

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

Hev. 06/21/2006
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2015 Washington Street East :
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e RFQ COPY :

" TYPE NAME/ADDRESS HERE DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
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N Camden Materials LLC BY ORDER :
§ 2950 Charles Ave.

Dunbar, WV 25064

s DATERRINTED TERMS OF:SALE s REL :
10/30/2006 NET 50 TRUCK , NET 30
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WRITTEN CONSENT OF THE! SPENDING UNIT AND VENDOR,
SUBMITTED TO| THE DIRECTOR DF PURCHASING THIRTY (30)
DAYS PRIOR T THE] EXPIRATION DATE. SUCH RENEWAL SHALL
BE IN ACCORDANGCE WITH [THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF THE
ARIGINAL CONTRACT AND SHALL BE LIMITED, TO TWO (2) ONE
(1) YEAR PER|IODS.

CANCELLATION: THE| DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING RESERVES THE
RIGHT TO CANCEL THIS CONTRACT IMMEDIATELY UPON WRITTEN
NOTICE TO THE VENDOR IF THE COMMODITIES AND/OR SERVICES
SUPPLIED ARE| OF AN INFERIOR QUALITY OR| DO NOT CONFORM
TO THE SPECIFICATIONS [OF THE BID AND CONTRACT HEREIN.

OPEN MARKET CLAUSE: THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING MAY
AUTHORIZE A [SPENDING UNIT TO PURCHASE DN THE OPEN
MARKET, WITHOUT THE FILING OF A REQUISITION OR COST
ESTIMATE, ITEMS SPECIFIED ON THIS CONTRACT FOR
IMMEDIATE DELIVERY IN EMERGENCIES DUE [TO UNFORESEEN
CAUSES (INCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED TO DELAYS IN TRANS-
PORTATION OR| AN UNANTICIPATED INCREASE{ IN THE VOLUME

OF WORK.?

QUANTITIES: QUANTITIES, LISTED IN THE REQUISITION ARE
APPROXIMATIONS ONiLY, BASED ON ESTIMATES SUPPLIED BY
THE STATE SPENDING UNI[T. IT IS UNDERSTOOD AND AGREED
THAT THE CONTRACT| SHAL|. COVER THE QUANTITIES ACTUALLY
ORDERED FOR PELIVERY DURING THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT,
WHETHER MORE| OR LESS THAN THE QUANTITIES SHOWN.

ORDERING PROCEDURE: SPENDING UNIT(S) SHALL ISSUE A
WRITTEN STATE CONTRACT| ORDER (FORM NUMBER WV-39) TO
THE VENDOR FOR COMMODITIES COVERED BY [THIS CONTRACT.
THE ORIGINAL!{ COPYl OF THE WV-39%9 SHALL BE MAILED TO THE
VENDDR AS AUTHDRIZATION FOR SHIPMENT, A SECOND COPY
MAILED TO THE PURCHASING DIVISION, ANI} A THIRD COPY

RETAINED BY [THE SPENDING UNIT.

PRREVERSE $1 EJE FOHTERNS AND'TONDITIONS e e e e T T

e (L e SO 5047680733 P 11/22/2006

Managl' g ' P {0»4662043 ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE
WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPAGE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'
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%0G~B58-2402

T ADD 0

] RFQ COPY

| TYPE NAME/ADDRESS HERE DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
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& Camden Materilals LLC BY ORDER .
2. 2950 Charles Ave.

R

Dunbar, WV 25064
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,;MHL'Z”Hb IR ¥ol
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BID PENNGDATE: BiD OPENING TIME ___ G1:30PM

BANKRUPTCY: | IN THE EVENT THE VENDOR/CONTRACTOR FILES
OR BANKRUPTICY PROTECTION, THIS CONTRACT IS AUTOMATI-
CALLY NULL AND VOID, AND IS TERMINATED WITHOUT FURTHER

ORDER.

THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS CONTAINED IN [THIS CONTRACT
SHALL SUPERSEDE ANY AND ALl SUBSEQUENT] TERMS AND
CONDITIONS WHICH MAY APPEAR ON ANY ATTACHED PRINTED
DOCUMENTS SUCH AS| PRICE LISTS, ORDER FORMS, SALES
AGREEMENTS OR MAINTENANCE AGREEMENTS, [INCLUDING ANY
ELECTRONIC MEDIUM SUCH AS CD-ROM.

REV, 06/11/2001

PURCHASING CARD ACCEPTANCE: THE STATE] OF WEST VIRGINIA
CURRENTLY UT{ILIZESS A VISA PURCHASING CARD PROGRAM WHICH
1S ISSUED THROUGH A LDCAL BANK. THE SUCCESSFUL VENDOR
MUST ACCEPT {THE STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA VISA PURCHASING
CARD FOR PAYMENT [OF ALLL ORDERS PLACED BY ANY STATE

AGENCY FOR ORDERS| THAT| ARE LESS THAN $2,500 AS A CONDI-
TION OF AWARD.

VENDOR PREFERENCE CERTIFICATE

CERTIFICATION AND APPLIICATIONx IS HEREBY MADE FOR
PREFERENCE IN ACCORDANCE WITH WEST VIRGINIA CODE,
5A-3-37 (DOES NOT| APPLY TO CONSTRUCTION CONTRACTS) .

A. APPLICATION IS MADE FOR 2.5% PREFERENCE FOR THE
REASON CHECKED:

¢ > BIDDER| IS AN INDIVIDUAL RESIDENT, VENDOR AND
HAS RESIDED CONTINUDUSLY IN WEST VIRGINIA FOR FOUR
(4) YEARS IMPEDIATELY PRECEDING THE DATE OF THIS

A e AEVERSE SI0E EOF TERNG,AND GONDITONS 1 1+ 1. ot 0

EEOE T a0s768.0733 | L1/22/2006

"ME Managing Member FEN 0 0-4662043 ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS il SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR
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1.  SPECIFICATIONS:

The following sections of the West Virginia Department of
Transportation, Division of Highways' Standard Specifications
Roads and Bridges, adopted 2000 and the current Supplemental
Specifications, shall apply to the administration of this
Contract: Sections 101, 102.4, 102.5, 105.1, 105.3, 105.4,
105.10, 105.11, 1¢5.12, 105.13, 106.3, 106.4, 106.5, 106.6,
106.7, 106.%, 107.1, 107.2, 107.3, 107.14, 107.1%, 107.20,
ip8.8, 109.1, 109.2 and 10%.20. :

The requirements of the West Virginia  Department of
Transportation, Division of Highways', Standard Specifications
Section 109,20, PRICE ADJUSTMENT FOR LOAD LIMIT VIOLATIONS shall
apply to all material supplied under this contract. This. will
include material loaded by the wvendor into Division of nghways
owned and/or rented trucks.

"Contractor" and "Vendor® used in the above specifications of
this contract are interchangeable. Contractor shall mean Vendor
and Vendor shall mean Contractor.

West Virginia Department of Transportation, Division of Highways'®
Standard Specifications Roads and Bridges, adopted 2000 and the
current Supplemental Specifications may be obtained from:

West Virginia Division of Highways
Contract Administration Division

1200 Kanawha Blvd., East

Building 5, Room A-725

Charleston, West Virginia 25305-0430

DESCRIPTION

The patching material shall be composed of a suitable aggregate
plant mixed with a liquid bituminous material and chemical
additives. The bituminous material with additives shall be
capable of coating the aggregate without stripping. The material
ghall maintain adhesive qualities for all molsture conditions in
the patched areas, except those having standing water.

MATERIALS




Aggregate

The coarse aggregate shall consist of crushed stone, crushed
gravel or slag, meeting the requirements of the Division of
Highways' Standard Specifications gubgections 703.1, 703.2 and
703.3 respectively. Fine aggregate shall meet the reguirements of
the Division of Highways Standard Specifications meet the
requirements of the Division of Highways' standard Specifications
subsection 702.3. The gradation of the final mixture shall be the
same as the Vendor's currently approved plant mix formula for Type
1 Hot-Mix Asphalt Wearing Course when Standard Winter Grade
Bituminous Patching Mix is being produced, or as recommended by
the supplier of the liquid asphalt with additives when Modified
Winter Grade Bituminous Patching Mix is being produced.

The gradation shall be determined in accordance with AASHTO T-27
and T-11.

The aggregate fraction of the £inal mixture, in addition to
meeting the requirements of 703.2.2, shall have a majority of all
particle sizes crushed. Questionable aggregates shall be tested
as per MP 703.00.21, except the No. 8 sieve will be used.

Bituminous Material

1. standard Winter CGrade Bituminous Patching Mix
The Pituminous material shall be a liquid asphalt with
chemical anti-stripping additives conforming to the
requirement of the West Virginia Division of Highways'
standard Specifications, Subsection 705.1.

or,

2. Modified Winter Grade Bituminous Patching Mix
The bituminous material shall be ligquid asphalt with’
chemical anti-stripping additives conforming to the
requirements of ASTM D 1664 and ASTM D 2027 modified as

follows:

Flash Point: 79°C (175°F) Minimum
Kinematic Viscosity at 60° (140°P) CST 250-800
Water: 0.2% Maximum
Distillate Test:

‘ To 225°C {437°F): None
To 260°C (500°F): 0-15%
To 318°C (600°F): 15-75%




Rezidue at 360°C (680°F): 75% Minimum

Regidue Tests:
Penetration at 25°C (77°F): 150-300
Ductility at 25°C (77°F): 100 cm. minimum
Solubility in trichloroethylene: 99% minimum

The test results for the ligquid asphalt with chemical anti-
stripping additives shall be presented to the respective
Division of Highways District Materials Engineers/Supervisors
for review prior to production of Modified Winter Grade
Bituminous Patching Mix.

COMPOSITION OF MIXTURE

The aggregates and bituminous material shall be combined in such
proportions that the composition by weight of the finished mix
shall meet the requirementg of the plant mix formula.

The aggregate fraction of the mixture shall be evaluated in
accordance with MP 401.02.23, except material failing to meet
specification requirements on the No. 200 sieve shall not be

accepted.

The asphalt fraction of the mixture shall be within the master
ranges when Standard Winter Grade Bituminous Patching Mix is being
produced, or as recommended by the supplier of the liquid asphalt
with additives when Modified Winter Grade Bituminous Patching Mix

is being produced.

Plant Mix Formula

The plant mix formula for Modified Winter Grade Bituminous
Patching Mix shall be in accordance with the recommendations of
the supplier of the liquid asphalt with additives. A plant mix

formula Ffor Standard Winter Grade Bituminous Patching Mix shall be

developed in accordance with MP 401.02.22, and the Marshall Test
Procedure described in AASHTO T-245. Initial submission of the
proposed plant mix formula for Standard Winter Grade Bituminous
patching Mix will not be considered wunless accompanied by
sufficient test data developed by supplier to indicate that the
formula being proposed can be met. As a minimum, this test data
shall include: three separate gradations of samples taken from
the hot bin, or separate gradations from cold bins or storage
facility, the percentage of each material to be used and the
calculated combined gradation. The test data submitted shall have
pbeen developed from material that is to be used in the proposed
mix. Additional data which shall be submitted includes that
described in MP 401.02.22. This data will not be required to meet
the limits given in Table 401.02.22A and Table 401.02.22B. The
air void content for Standard Winter Grade Bituminous Patching

Material shall be 5-7 percent.

10




The proposed plant mix formula shall be documented on Department
Form T-400 and together with plant calibration test data set foxth
above shall be forwarded to the  District Materials
Engineer/Supervisor. The T-400 shall then be transmitted to the
Materials Control and Testing Division for final review and

revigion.

Changes in Plant Mix Formula

Should the producer at any time propose to change the scuxce of
aggregate in the mix, the definite asphalt content or change the
gource of the bituminous material, the provisions of the Divisgion
of Highways' Standard Specifications subsection 401.4.2 shall

apply.

Quality Control Testing

Quality control is the responsibility of the contractor. Quality
control testing shall be done in accordance with MP 401.02.23.

Acceptance Testing

Shall be as stipulated in Section 401.7.1 of the Division of
Highways' Standard Specifications.

PREPARATION OF MIXTURE

The aggregate shall be heated to insure that it is surface dry at
the time of mixing, however, the aggregate shall not be heated in

excess of 180°F.

The asphaltic binder shall not be heated to a temperature greater
than 165°F. Care shall be taken to prevent local overheating.
The aggregate and bituminous material shall be measured separately
and accurately to the proportions in which they are to be mixed.
After the aggregate and binder have been combined, they shall be
thoroughly mixed until the particles of aggregate are coated. At
no time shall the finished mixture be at a temperature greater

than 175°F.

WORKABILITY

The mixture shall be stockpiled on the vendors site for 14 days or
until the internal mix temperature is withdin 10° of ambient
temperature without stripping and when taken frxom a gtockpile,
shall be capable of being shoveled, raked, spread and compacted.



The aggregate and liguid asphalt intended for usage shall meet the

95% coating requirement in ASTM D 1664 before utilizing the

materials.

When tested in accordance with ASTM D 2489, modified to perform
the test at the end of the stockpiling period on the producer's
yard, the total amount of not coated particles shall not exceed

. 10%.

If the material fails to conform to the regquirement of the
specifications the producer may rework the existing material or
provide new material.

STORAGHE

The mix shall be maintained on the producer's property in
stockpiles not exceeding a height of four (4} feet until the
internal mix temperature is within 10° of the ambient temperature.
In addition, the top of all stockpiles shall be leveled to

eliminate any peaked areas.

2. BIDDING INSTRUCTIONS

The purpose of this contract is to provide for the
delivery of WINTER GRADE BITUMINOUS PATCHING MIXTURE
Standard/or Modified) to the various locations and in
the esgstimated guantities set out in the bid schedule.

Actual quantities to be delivered to each location will
pe specified in a State Contract Purchase Order {8C0)
which will be issued by the Division of Highways at the
time delivery is required.

Vendors may bid to deliver the estimated gquantities of
either or both types of material at any or all of the
designated delivery sites.

Any qualification of bids, or any modification of the
specifications or conditions governing the bids may be
cause for their rejection.

3. CONTRACT AWARD

The Division of Highways will consider Vendox's
performance history in the award of this Purchase Order

Contract.
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Qualified Vendors who submit a wvalid bid "F.O.B.
Division Storage Site" will be awarded a contract for
those locations for which their bid is low fox Standard
Winter Grade Bituminous Patching Material and for which
their bid is low for Modified Winter Grade Bituminous
Patching Material.

In the event a Vendor fails to conform to the
requirements set out in this contract document, the
State Contract Purchase Order or the governing
gpecifications, the Purchase Order Contract may be
cancelled and awarded to the next low biddex.

SAMPLING AND TESTING

Upon award of contract, the vendor shall inform the
Division of the location of Vendor's storage sites so
that materials may be sampled and tested prior to
shipment. Information shall be directed to the
respective Division of BHighways District Materials
Engineers/Supervisors.

WEIGHING MATERIALS DELIVERED BY TRUCK

Material delivered by truck shall be weighed in
accordance with Section 401.9.3 of the West Virginia
Department of Transportation, Division of Highways’
Standard Specifications.

SUPPLYING OTHER ORGANIZATIONAL ENTITIES

County Courts, Municipalities, School Boards, other

political subdivisions and governmental entities, etc.,
may have a need for these materials, and Vendors may
wish to sgupply that need. Accordingly, bidders may
wish to extend their contract prices to these other
entities. If the bidder wishes to supply these other
entities, but with prices different £from those gquoted
for the Highway Department, the bidder shall include a
set of bid schedules clearly and unambiguously marked
for the express use of entities other than the Division
of Highways. Failure by the bidder to include a set of
bid scheduleg for other entities will be taken to mean
that the bid schedules extended to the Division of
Highways will also be extended to these other entities.

13




In the event any Vendor does not wish to extend the
prices, terms and conditions of this bid and subsequent
contract to other entities o©of the State, he must sgo
indicate in a clear and unambiguous manner in his bid.
This indication does not prejudice the award of the
contract. If a Vendor does not indicate his refusal to
extend the prices, terms and conditions of his bid to
other entities of the State he is bound to extend them
upon issuance of a purchase order by these other
entities. '

Other organizational entities using his provision of
the contract shall do so without any involvement of the
Division of Highwayvs; that is, the entity shall make
its own purchase arrangements with the Vendor and shall
make its own arrangement for payment.

7.  BASBIS OF PAYMENT

The quantity, determined in accordance with Section
Number 5, will be paid for at the delivered price per
ton, which price and payment shall be full compensation
for furnishing and  Thandling all the material
incorporaked in the mixture and delivering the mixture
to a designated storage site.

8. PRODUCTION SCHEDULE

Vendor should produce material within two weeks of
receipt of SCO.

9. VENDOR'S INVOICES

vVendor's invoices must be submitted in original and one copy
containing the following:

a. Divisgion of Highway's State Comtract Purchase
Order Number, and this Contract Number.

b. Total quantity and unit price with the total
cost of the material furnished.

Note: Under no circumstance will the West Virginia
Division of Highways accept, or pay for, quantities of
material in excess of the quantity stated on the State
Contract Purchase Order.




KOTE: Vendor should type price

BIDDING SCHEDULE

WINTER GRADE BITUMINCUS PATCHING MIXTURE

DISTRICT 1
STANDARD MODIFIED
DELIVERED DELIVERED
ESTIMATED " PRICE PER TON . PRICE PER TON
COUNTY DELIVERY SI1rE NEEDS (TONS) ¥OB DIV. FOR DIV,
STORAGE SYTH ‘ STORAGE SITE

. Boene Rock Creek o No Bid No Bid
Baone Seth o No Bid ' No Bid
Boone Clinton ¢ No Bid No Bid
Clay C.R 11 75 No Bid No Bid
Clay Maysel Lot 0 No_Bid No Bid
Kanawha North Charleston 0 No Bid No Bid
Kanawha Elkview 50 No Bid No Bid
Kanawha Chelyan 35 No Bid Ko Bid
Kanawha st. Albans 50 No Bid No Bid
Mason Point Pleasant 100 Ko Bid ‘ No Bid
Putnam Red House | 75 No  Bid ) No Bid
Putnam Hurricane 75 No Bid No Bid
I-64 Sec. 2 Scary . o No Bid No Bid
I-54 Sec. 3 Rt 119 & Penn. Ave. 0 No Bid No Bid
I-79 gec. 6§ Amma 20 No Bid No Bid
Corridor ¢  Ruth o No Bid No Bid

I-77 Bec. 3 Sissonsville 45 No Bid , No Bid




10.  BIDDING SCHEDULE

WINTER GRADE BITUMINCUS PATCHING MIXTURE

DISPRICT 2
STANDARD MODIFIED
PELIVERED DELYVERED
ESTIMATED PRICE PER TON PRICE PER TON
COUNTY DELIVERY SITE NEEDS (TONS FOB DIV, FOB DIV.
STORAGE SITE STORAGE SITE
cabell Barboursville 250 No Rid . _No Bid
Linooln Wegt Hamlin 9 No Bid Ne..Bid
Lincoln Yawkey ¢ _ No Bid _ No Bid
Logan Chapmanville 100 _ No Bid No Bid
& Corridor & ’ ‘
Logan " Wilkinson H) 100 No Bid No Bid
Logan Man Substation 80 No Bid No_Bid
‘Mingo Millers Creek HQ 100 o Ko Bid ‘ No Bid
Mingo Gilber 100 No Bid No Bid
wayne Wayne 300 No Bid No Bid
Wayne Kenova 100 - _No Bid No Bid
Wayne Crum 100 No_Rid No_Bid

I-54 Huntington 80 No_Bid Mo Bid




10.  BIDDING. SCHEDULE

Camden Materials LLC
202 Hickory St.
Parkersburg, “WVIZ6%E01

WINTER GRADE BITUMINOUS PATCHING MIXTURE

DISTRICT 3
STANDARD MODIFIED
: DELIVERED DELIVERED
ESTIMATELD PRICE PER TON PRICE PER TON
COUNTY DELIVERY SITE NEEDS (TONS) FOB DIV, FOB DIV.
STORAGE SITE STORAGE SITE
Calhoun Millstone 200 No Bid 75.75
No BRid 73.00
Jackson Ripley 300
Pleasants 5t. Marys .
{(Colin-Anderson Lot) 75 No Bid 70.50
Ritchie Ellenboro 75 Ne Bid 72.75
" Roane Spencer 225 No Bid 75.00
Roane WV 38 Left Hand 75 No Bid 78.00
Wirt Elizabeth 75 - No Bid 70.75
Wood WV 95, Parkersburg 300 No Bid 59,00
Corridor D Greenwood ) No Bid 69,00
I-77 . Mill Run Road 35 No Bid 70.00
I-77 Sec. 2 Medina 20 No Bid 70.00
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Camden Materials LLC
202 Hickory St.

Parkersburg, WV 26101.

10.  BIDDING SCHEDULE
WINTER GRADE BITUMINOUS PATCHING MIXTURE
DBISTRICT 4
STANDARD CDIFIED
DELIVERED DELIVERED
ESTIMATED PRICE PER TON PRICE PER TON
COUNTY DELIVERY SITE NEED3 ('TONS) FO8 DIV, FOB DIV.
STORAGE SITE STORAGE SITE
Doddridge Smithburg 100 No _Rid 75,00
Harriscn Gore 300 No Bid No:Bdd
Marionm Fairmont 150 No Bid No Bid
Marion Mannington 100 No Bid No Bid
Monongalia Sabraton 150 No Bid No Bid
Monongalia Pentress 75 No Bid No Bid
Preston Albright 100 No Bid No Bid
Preston Bruceton 50 No Bid No Bid
Preston . Terra Alta 50 No.Bid No Bid
Preston Fellowsville 50 No Bid No Bid
Preston Aurora 50 No Bid No Bid
Taylor Pruntytown 200 No Bid No Bid
APD-50 Punmel Hill 50 Yo Bid No Bid
I-68 Coopers Rock 50 No Bid No Bid
- XI-79 Lost Creek Yard 100 No Bid No Bid
I-79 Goshen Road 50 No Bid No Bid
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10". BIDDING SCHEDULE

WINTER GRADE BITUMINOUS PATCHING MIXTURE

DISTRICT 5
STANDARD MdDIFIED
DELIVERED DELIVERED
ESTIMATED PRICE PER TON PRICE PER TON
COUNTY DELIVERY SITE NEEDS {TONS) FOB DIV. ‘ FOB DIV.
STORAGE SITH STORAGE SITE
Berkeley = Martinsburg & I-81 300 No Bid . No Bid
Grant Petersburg 75 No Bid Ne Bid
Grant Mt., Storm 50 Ne Bid Ne Bid
Hampshire  Romney 50 , No Bid No Bid
Hampshire  Capon Bridge 30 No Bid No Bid
Hampshire  Slanesville 50 No Bid No Bid
Hardy Moorefield 75 No Bid No Bid
Hardy Bakex 75 No. Bid No Bid
Jefferson Charles Town 100 No Bid No. Bid
Mineral New Creek 75 No Bid No_Bid
' Mineral Sky Line 50 No Bid No Bid
Mineral Short Gap 50 No Bid No Bid

Morgan Berkeley Springs 250 No Bid : No Bid




10. BIDDING SCHEDULE

WINTER GRADE BITUMINOUS PATCHING MIXTURE

Camden Materials LLC
202 Hickory St,
Parkersburg, WV 26101

DISTRICT 6
STANDARD MODIFIED
BELIVERED DELIVERED
BESTIMATED PRICE PER TON PRICE PER TON
COUNTY DELIVERY SITE NEEDS (TONS) FOB DIV. FOB DIV.
STORAGE SITE STORAGE SI'TE
Brocke Wellsburg 100 No Bid. 83.50
Hancock New Manchestexr 200 No Bid 86.00
Marshall Cameron 175 No Bid 82.50
Marshall Glen Dale 300 No Bid 85.75
Ohio Triadelphia 150 No Bid 82.50
Tyler Centerville 100 No Bid 84.75
Tyler - sisteraville 8¢ No Bid 83.25
Wetzel Hundred 100 No Bid 86.00
Wetzel New Martinsville 100 Neo Bid 85.00
Wetzel pine Grove 100 No Bid 86.75
I-70 Woodland (Elm Grove) o No Bid 81.25
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10.  BIDDING SCHEDULE

WINTER GRADE BITUMINOUS PATCHING MIXTURE

DISTRICT 7
STANDARD MODIFIED
DELIVERED DELIVERED
ESTIMATED PRICE PER TON PRICE PER TON
COUNTY DELIVERY SITE NEEDS (TONS) FOB DIV. FCB DIV.
STORAGE SITE ) STORAGE SITE
Barbour Philippi 70 No Bid . _No Bid
Braxton Laurel Court 150 No Bid No Bid
Gilmer Glenville HQ 60 No Bid No Bid
Lewis Weston ioo No _Rid No Bid
Upshur Buckhannon 75 No Bid No Rid
Webster Cherry Falls . 25 No Bid No Bid
Webster Cowen 25 No Bid No Bid
Webster Hacker Valley 25 No Bid No Bid
I-7% Sec. 4 Burnsville 25 Ne Bid No Bid
I-79 Sec. 5 Coon Knob 25 No Bid No Bid




10. BIDDING SCHEDULE N

WINTER GRADE BITUMINOUS PATCHING MIXTURE

DISTRICT 8
STANDARD MODIFIED
DELIVERED DELIVERED
) ESTIMATED PRICE PER TON PRICE PER TON
COUNTY DELIVERY SITE NEEDS {TONS) FOB DIV. ‘ FOB DIV.
STORAGE SITE STORAGHE SITHE
Pendleton Franklin 100 Na Bid : No Rid
Pocahontas Maylinton 25 No. Rid No_ Rid
Randolph Elkins 100 _Ng Bid No_Bid

Tucker Parsons . 60 Ne Bid No Bid




10.  BIDDING SCHEDULE

WINTER GRADE BITUMINOUS PATCHING MIXTURE

DISTRICT 9
STANDARD MODIFIED
DELIVERED DELIVERED
ESTIMATED PRICE PER TON PRICE PER TON
COUNTY DELIVERY SITE NEEDS (TONS) FOBR DIV. OB DIV.
- STORAGE SITE STORAGE SITE
Fayette Oak Hill 75 No Bid No Bid
Fayestte Lockout 60 No Bid No Bid
Fayette Glen Ferris 20 No Bid No Bid
Fayette Cor. L, Oak Hill 0 No Bid No Bid
Greenbrier Lewisburg 80 No Bid No Bid
Greenbrier Crawley 100 No Bid No Bid
Greenbrier I-64, Harts Run 20 No Bid e Bid
Monroe Union 75 No Bid No Bid
Monroe Peterstown 50 No Bid No Bid
Nicholas Summergville 160 No Bid No Bid
Nicholas Curtin 0 No Bid No Bid
Summers Co. HQ 100 No Bid No Bid

Sunmers

23
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10.  BIDDING SCHEDULE

WINTER GRADE BITUMINCUS PATCHING MIXTURE

DISTRICT 10

STANDARD MODIFIED
. DELIVERED DELIVERED
ESTIMATED PRICE PER TON " PRICE PER TON
COQUNTY PELIVERY SITE NEEDS (TONS) FOB DIV. FOB DIV,
STORAGE SITE : STORAGE SITE-
McDowell Havaco 100 Ne Bid . No _Bid é
Mebowell Johnny Cake o No Bid . No_Rid
MeDowell Yukon o No Bid ) No Bid
Mercer Mercer Co. HQ 200 No Bid ~_No Bid
Raleigh Raleigh Co. HQ : 200 No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid

Wyoming Still Rum 100




Camden Materials LLC

202 Hickory St.
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Camden Materials LLC
202 Hickory St.
Parkersburg, WV 26101
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RFQNo 66700012

AFFIDAVIT

West Virginia Code §5A-3-10a states:

No contract or renewal of any contract may be awarded by the state or any of its polifical subdivisions to any
vendor or prospective vendor when the vendor of prospective \endor or a related party to the vendor or
prospective vendor is a deblor ang the debt owned is an amount greater than one thousand dollars in the
aggregate

DEFINITIONS: .

"Debt” means any assessment, premium, penalty, fine tax or other amount of money owed to the state or any
of its political subdivisions because of a judgment, fine, permii violation, license assessment, defaulted

workers’ compensation premium, penalty or other assessment presently definquent or due and required to be
paid to the state of any of its political subdivisions, including any interest or additional penalties accrued

thereon

"Debtor’ means any individuai, corporation, partnership, association, limited liability company or any other form
or husiness association owing a debt fo the staie or any of its politicai subdivisions

“Political subdivision” means any county commission; municipality, county board of education; any
instrumentality established by a county or municipality, any separate corporation or instrumentality established
by one or more counties or municipaiifies, as permitted by law: or any public body charged by law with the
performance of a government function or whose jurisdiction is coextensive with one or more counties or

municipalities

“Related party” means a party, whether an individual, corporation, parinership, association, limited lability
company or any other form or business association or other entity whatsoever, related to any vendor by blood,
marriage, ownership or contract through which the party has a relationship of ownership or other interest with
the vendor so that the party will actually or by effect receive or control a portion of the benefit, profit or other
consideration from performance of a vendor contract with the party receiving an amount that meets or exceed

five percent of the total contract amount

EXCEPTION:
The prohibition of this section does not apply where a vendor has contested any tax administered pursuant to

chapter eleven of this code, workers' compensation premium, permit fee or environmental fee or assessment
and the matter has not become final or where the vendor has entered into a payment plan or agreement and
the vendor is not in default of any of the provisions of such plan or agreement

LICENSING:
The vendor must be licensed in accordance wnth any and all state requirements to do business with the state of

West Virginia

CONFIDENTIALITY:
The vendor agrees that he or she will not dlSClOSE to anyone, direcfly or indirectly, any such persona!!y

identifiable information or other confidential information gained from the agency, unless the individual who is
the subject of the information consents to the disclosure in writing or the disclosure is made pursuant to the
agency's policies, procedures and rules. Vendors should visit www.state.wv.usfadmin/purchase/privacy for

the Notice of Agency Confidentiality Policies

Under penalty of law for false swearing {West Virginia Code, §61-5-3), it is hereby certified that the vendor
acknowledges the information in this said affidavit and are in compliance with the requirements as stated

Vendor's Name: Camden Materials LLC

Authorized Signature: W Ste: 11/22/2006

Na Debt Affidavit
Revised 02/08/06




