State of West Virginia Request for ———mowomeer L PAGE o
Department of Administration  Quotation 66TCOD06 1
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East T TADDRESS CORRESPONDENCE TOATIENTIONOR ™=
Post Office Box 50130
Charfeston, WV 25305-0130 JOHN JOHNSTON

Alla~-5R8-26G02

T 2011643422 306-768-9733 T
SOUTHERN WV ASPHALT 1 DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

Y{ PO BOX 544 ] VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED

N | BY ORDER

0| DUNBAR WV 25064 T

(| DATEPRINTED | o TERMSOFSALE /ol if SHIRVA e e o e e FOB. o0 b T FREIGRT TERNS 7

08/07/2006 TRUCK DESTINATICN NET 30
A > ——-.BI1D _OFENING TIME _ 01l:50PM.
0001 TN 770-06

1

STONE AND AGGREGATE

OPEN END CONTRACT

TO FURNISH MATERIALS, EQUIPMENT, AND LABOR TO SUPPLY
STONE AND AGGREGATE TO| THE WEST VIRGINIA DIVISION OF
HIGHWAYS, DISTRICTS ONE THROUGH TEN ATl THE LOCATIONS
AND UNDER THE CONDITIONS SPECIFIED HEREINAFTER.

NOTE: 1. VENDORS DO NOT NEED TO SEND IN BLANK PAGES,
(IE. SITES YOU ARE NOT BIDDING ON.)
2. VENDORS SHOULD STAMP EACH PAGE AT THE 70P
WITH COMPANY NAME AND NUMBER PAGES
CHRONGLOGICALLY [THAT YOU ARE SUBMITTING.
5. VENDORS |SHOULD TYPE PRICES I¥| POSSIBLE.
4. NUMBER 12 - BiIDDING SCHEDULE VENBORS MAY
MAKE DUPLICATES OF THESE PAGES IF QUOTING
DIFFERENT SITORAGE SITES.

SEE ATTACHED
EXHIBIT 3

LIFE OF CONTRACT: THIIS CONTRACT BECOMES EFFECTIVE ON
................. .+« AND EXTENDS FOR A |PERIOD OF SIX (6)
MEONTHS OR UNTIL SUCH "REASONABLE TIME" THEREAFTER AS I
NECESSARY TG OBTAIN A NEW CONTRACT OR RENEW THE
ORIGINAL CONTRACT,. THE "REASONABLE TIME™ PERIOD SHALL
NOT EXCEED TWELVE| (12)] MONTHS. DURING THIS "REASONABLE
TIME™ THE VENDOR MAY TERMINATE THIS CONTRACT FOR ANY
REASON UPON GIVING THE| DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING 30 DAYS

WRITTEN/ﬁQ?TRE.

N T SEE REVERSE SIDE FOR TERMS AND CONDITIONS - o oo o
SIGMNATURE i TELEPHONE DATE
\L Jad) Lo 304-768-9733 08/30/3006
TITLE £
PRESIDENT N 55-0714092 ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDOR'
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. DATEPRINTED " | ¢ . TERMS OFSALE " -~ 1. oo GHIP VIA R Lk RO {0y FREIGHTTERMS 0

08/07/2006 NET 30 TRUCK DESTINATION NET 30

BID OPENING DATE. 08/30/2006 _ BI1D OPENING TIME 01 SBPM

UNETL | OUANTIT‘{ e ‘?\J‘g : TEM NUMBER “g?EA\nGUNT S

UNLESS SPECIFIC PROVIS|IONS ARE STIPULATED ELSEWHERE
IN THIS CONTRACT DOCUMENT, THE TERMS, [CONDITIONS AND
FRICING SET HEREIN ARE} FIRM FOR THE LIFE OF THE
CONTRACT.

RENEWAL: THI|S CONTRACT| MAY BE RENEWED UPON THE MUTUAL
WRITTEN CONSENT OF THE| SPENDING UNIT AND VENDOR,
SUBMITTED TO] THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING THIRTY (30)
DAYS PRIOR TO THE| EXPIRATION DATE. SUCH RENEWAL SHALL
BE IN ACCORDANCE WITH [THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF THE
ORIGINAL CONTRACT] AND |[SHALL BE LIMITED TDO TWO (2) ONE
(1) YEAR PERIODS,.

CANCELLATION: THE] DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING RESERVES THE
RIGHT TO CANCEL THIS CONTRACT IMMEDIATELY UPON WRITTEN
NOTICE TO THE VENDOR IF THE COMMODITIES AND/OR SERVICES
SUPPLIED ARE, OF AN INFERIOR QUALITY OR| DO NOT CONFORM
TO THE SPECIFICAT|IONS OF THE BID AND CONTRACT HEREIN.

OPEN MARKET CLAUSE: THE DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING MAY
AUTHORIZE A [SPENDIING UNIT TO PURCHASE [DN THE OPEN
MARKET, WITHOUT THE FILING OF A REQUISITION OR COST
ESTIMATE, ITEMS SPECIFIIED ON THIS CONTRACT FOR
IMMEDIATE DELIVERY IN EMERGENCIES DUE |TO UNFORESEEN
CAUSES C(INCLUDING, BUT NOT LIMITED TO DELAYS IN TRANS-
PORTATION OR| AN UNANTICIPATED INCREASE| IN THE VOLUME
OF WORK.?

QUANTITIES: QUANTITIES| LISTED IN THE REQUISITION ARE
APPROXIMATIONS QNLY, BASED ON ESTIMATES SUPPLIED BY
THE STATE SPENDING UNIT. IT IS UNDERSTOOD AND AGREED
THAT THE CONTRACT| SHALL COVER THE QUANTITIES ACTUALLY
ORDERED FOR DELIVERY DURING THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT,
WHETHER MORE| OR LESS THAN THE QUANTITIES SHOWN.

1

_'SEE REVERSE SIDE FOR TERMS AND CONDITIONS -

SIGHAT URE e TELEPHONE NG CEEE .‘f5 féf3””f-'f*‘l! e
o \UaJ Uff]u\/ 304-768-5733 ™" 08/30/2006

TTLE FEIN
PRES{DEN‘]‘ 550714092 ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED 'VENDCR'



U RFONUMBEHR

667C0006 3

L PAGE -

Request for

State of West Virginia :
Quotation

Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

AGDRESS COBBESPONDENCE TOATTENTION OF "

JOHN JOHNSTON
ANG-Kh8-2602

BID OPENING DATE:

DPENING TIME

Dl SUPM

1 ¥20116%422 304-768-9733% -
| SOUTHERN WV ASPHALT I DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
g PO BOX 5449 *ﬁ VARIOUS LOCALES AS INDICATED
y L1 BY DRDER
o DUNBAR WV 25064 T
O
- DATEPRINTED. O TERMS QF SALE" 0 Eo | i I SHIPVIAL L P T s RO L FREIGHT TERMS
08/07/2006 NET 33 TRUCK DESTINATION NET a0
08/30/2006 BID

CLINE

QUANTTY

TugR

ITEN NOBER.

' 'GNITF’RICE

s AMOUNT RS

ORDERING PROCEDURE :
WRITTEN STATE CONTRACT

SPENDING UNIT(S) S

ORDER (FORM NuM

THE VENDOR FOR COMMODITIES COVERED BY

THE ORIGINAL; COPY

OF THE Wv-39 SHALL B

VENDOR AS AUTHORIZATION FOR SHIPMENT,

MATLED TO THE PURCHASING DIVISION,
THE SPENDING UNIT.

RETAINED BY

BANKRUPTCY:

FOR BANKRUPTCY PROTECTION,
AND IS TERMINATED

CALLY NULL AND VO
ORDER.

AND

IN THE EVENT THE VENDOR/C

THIS CONTRA

THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS CONTAINED IN
SHALL SUPERSEDE ANY AND ALL SUBSEQUENT,

CONDITIONS WHICH
DOCUMENTS SUCH AS

MAY APPEAR ON ANY ATT
PRICE LISTS,

DRDER F

AGREEMENTS OR MAINTENANCE AGREEMENTS,

ELECTRONIC MEDIUM

REV. 0a/11/2001
PURCHASING CARD A
CURRENTLY UTILIZE
18 ISSUED THROUGH
MUST ACCEPT |THE S
CARD FOR PAYMENT
AGENCY FOR ORDERS
TION OF AWARD.

CERTIF N AND

PREF

AT T

SUCH

CCEPTIANCE :
S A VIISA PURCHASING C
A LOCAL BANK.
TATE
OF ALL ORDERS PLACED
THAT

AS CD-ROM,

THE STATE

THE S
0OF WEST VIRGINIA

ARE LESS THAN $

VENDOR PREFERENCE CERTIFI

APPLIICATION»* IS HERE
ENCE IN ACCORDANCE WITH WEST VIR

HALL ISSUE A
BER WV-39) TO
THIS CONTRACT.
E MAILED TO THE
A SECOND COPY

A THIRD COPY

ONTRACTOR FILES
CT IS AUTOMATI-
WITHOUT FURTHER

THIS CONTRACT
TERMS AND
ACHED PRINTED
ORMS, SALES
INCLUDING ANY

OF WEST VIRGINIA
ARD PROGRAM WHIC
UCCESSFUL VENDOR

VISA PURCHASING
BY ANY STATE
2,500 AS A CONDI-

CATE

BY MADE FOR
GINIA CODE,

/\\SA- -37 (DUE% NOT| APPLlY TO CONSTRUCTION CONTRACTS).
N ,\. IR j : _SET REVERSE-SIDE FORTERMS AND CONDITIONS o7 70 - 7o S
SIGRATURE \ U@ P TELEPHONE 304-788-9733 ATE 08/30/2006
PRESIQ&NT 55-0714092 ADDRESS CHANGES TO BE NOTED ABOVE

WHEN RESPONDING TO RFQ, INSERT NAME AND ADDRESS IN SPACE ABOVE LABELED VENDOR'
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Southern West Virginia Asphalt, Inc.

1. SPECIFICATIONS

The following sections of the West Virginia Department of Transportation, Division of
Highways Standard Specifications, Roads and Bridges, adopted 2000, as modified by
the current Supplementai Specifications, shall apply to the administration of this
contract: Sections 101, 102.4, 102.5, 105.1, 105.3, 105.4, 105.10, 105.11, 105.12, 105.13,
106.3, 106.4, 106.5, 106.6, 106.7, 106.9, 107.1, 107.2, 107.3, 107.14, 107.19, 107.20, 108.8,
109.1, 109.2, and 401.9.3,

The requirements of the West Virginia Department of Transportation, Division of
Highways, Standard Specifications, Roads and Bridges, Section 109.20, PRICE
ADJUSTMENT FOR LOAD LIMIT VIOLATIONS shall apply to all material supplied under
this contract. This will include material loaded by the vendor into Division of
Highways owned and/or rented trucks. ‘

The terms “Contractor” and “Vendor” used in the above specifications of this
Contract are interchangeable. Contractor shall mean Vendor and Vendor shall mean
Contractor.

West Virginia Department of Transportation, Division of Highways’ Standard
Specifications Roads and Bridges, adopted 2000, and the current Supplemental
Specifications may be obtained from:

West Virginia Division of Highways
Contract Administration Division, Room 729
1900 Kanawha Boulevard, East, Building 5
Charleston, West Virginia 25305

MATERIAL SPECIFICATIONS ARE AS FOLLOWS:

WVDOH STANDARD
SPECIFICATION

MATERIAL (NOTE 1) SECTION
Fine Aggregate 702 (Note 5)
Coarse Aggregate 703 (Note 5)
Riprap 704.2

Stone for Gabions 704.3

Shot Rock 704.8
Abrasives (Note 2) Note 3
Aggregate for Base & Subbase 704.6 {Note 5)
#8 Modified and #9 Modified Note 4

NOTE 1:  Fine aggregate on the bid schedule shall be considered to be fine
aggregate for portland cement concrete or mortar sand, the particular
type to be specified in State Contract Purchase Orders (SCO’S).
Coarse aggregate on the bid scheduie is identified by an AASHTO
standard size; e.g., AASHTO Size No. 1, AASHTO Size No. 467, etc.
Aggregate for base and sub-base on the bid schedule is identified by
class; e.g., Ciass 1, Class 2, and Class 9, etc.



Southern West Virginia Asphalt, Inc.

NOTE 2: CINDERS WILL NOT BE CONSIDERED in this Purchase Requisition.
NOTE 3:  Abrasives shali conform to the following specifications:

A. Quality

1, Crushed sandstone shali not be used as an abrasive.

2. The liquid limit shall not exceed 25 and the plasticity index shall not
' exceed 6.

3. Total deleterious substances including but not limited to metal, glass,
ciay, shale, and thin or elongated pieces shall not exceed 3% of the dry
weight of the total sample. Deleterious content shall be determined on
that fraction of material retained on the U.S. Standard #4 (4. 75 mm)
sieve.

4. When gravel is used as an abrasive, the material retained on the #8,
sieve shall have a majority of crushed particles.

B. Gradation

1. The material shall conform to the following gradation requirements
determined in accordance with AASHTO T-27.

SIEVE SIZE % PASSING BY WEIGHT
Standard Modified

1/2 inch 100 100

3/8 inch 85 - 100 85— 100

#100 D-10 0-4

NOTE 4:  In addition to meeting the gradation requirements of AASHTO #8 and
#9 aggregate in table 703.4, Modified AASHTO #8 and Modified
AASHTO #9 aggregate shall have a maximum of 2.5% passing the
#200 sieve as determined by AASHTO T-11 and T-27. Modified
AASHTO #8 and Modified AASHTO #9 aggregate shall meet all other
requirements for AASHTO #8 and AASHTO #9 aggregate.

NOTE 5:  With exception of the following contract items, grading on all
specified sieve sized for material furnished shall be determined by
AASHTO T-27 (Dry Test Only} or by AASHTO T-27 with AASHTO T-11:

Item |, AASHTO #7

item J, AASHTO #8

item K, AASHTO #9

ltemn R, AASHTO #8 Modified
Item S, AASHTO #9 Modified

The grading for the above items shall be determined by AASHTO T-27
and AASHTO T-11.



Southern West Virginia Paving, Inc.

2, BIDDING INSTRUCTIONS
Vendors may bid any or all items on the bid schedule. Vendors shall provide the
information requested in Subsection 12.1 & 12.2, paragraphs (a) and (b) on the bid
schedule. Failure to provide required information will be sufficient grounds to
invalidate the bid.
Any quatification of bids or any modification of the specifications or conditions
governing the bids may be cause to reject bids.
The Division of Highways may purchase aggregate and stone F.O.B. Vendor's
Storage Site. The bid price F.0.B. Vendor's Storage Site shall include the loading
of Division of Highways’ trucks by Vendor. |
Vendor shall have the capacity to deliver a minimum quantity of 300 tons per day
to any designated site when directed by the District Engineer/Manager.
3. DETERMINING LOW BID
Bids will be evaluated by the Division on the basis of cost per cubic yard F.Q.B. at
the designated site. Cost per cubic yard will be determined by multiplying the
Vendor's bid price in dollars per ton by a “Tons per cubic yard factor” which is
listed in the following table.
TONS PER CUBIC YARD FACTORS*
TYPE QF MATERIA BLAST FLIRNACE
ITEM LIMESTONE SANDSTONE | GRAVEL SLAG STEEL SLAG
Class 1,2, 9 1.46 1.46 (2920) 1.46 (2920)|1.36 (2720)] 1.81 (3620)
AASHTO 1.30 (2600) 1.30 {2600) 1.30 (2600) 1.04 (2080) 1.61 (3220)
Sizes #1
thris #7
AASHTO 1.32 (2640) 1.32 (2640) 1.32 (2640)| 1.20 (2400) 1.61 (3220)
Sizes #8
thru #10
Gabions 1.31 (2620) 1.31 (2620) 1.31 (2620)
Shot 1.31 (2620) 1.31 (2620)
‘Rock,
Riprap
Fine 1.40 (2800) 1.40 (2800) 1.40 (2800)|1.36 (2720)] 1.77 (3540)
Aggregate ,
Abrasives 1.36 (2720) 1.36 (2720) 1.36 (2720):1.28 (2560) 1.75 (3500)

*Numbers in parenthesis are pounds per cubic yard

4. CONTRACT AWARD

All qualified Vendors who submit a valid bid “F.0.B. Vendor’ Storage Site” will be
awarded a contract to establish a unit price for those items bid (See Subsection

12.1):
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Southern West Virginia Asphalt, Inc.

a. A State Contract Purchase Order (SCO) specifying Division of Highways pick up
or Vendor delivery to project site will be issued to the low bidder when a specific
type and quantity of material is to be purchased for use on a designated project,

b. A Blanket State Contract Purchase Order (SCO) specifying Division of Highways
pick F.0.B. Vendors Storage Site, may only be issued when material for routine
highway maintenance operations at various locations is to be purchased. When
material is secured on an SCO of this nature, the District Engineer/Manager shall
take those steps necessary to assure that material is secured from the Vendor
which results in the lowest cost to the Division. Factors to be considered shall
include, but are not limited to; bid price of material, haul cost at $1.50 for the
first ton-miie and $0.25 for each additional mile.

Qualified Vendors who submit a valid bid “F.0.B. Division Storage Site” will be
awarded a contract to establish a unit price for those locations and items for which
their bid is low based on cost per cubic yard (see Subsection 12.2). A State
Contract Purchase Order (SCO), with the required delivery schedule, will be issued

. for the actual quantity of material to be delivered to the location specified. If the
Vendor is unable to furnish material in accordance with the specified delivery
schedule the District Engineer/Manager shall be advised in writing within five (5)
working days of the reason for failure to conform to delivery requirements.

a. All qualified Vendors who are awarded F.0.B. Division Storage Sites must have
the awarded items available for delivery 30 days after the contract award date.

In the event a Vendor faifs to conform to the requirements stated in this contract
document, the State Confract Purchase Order (SCO) or the governing
specifications, the State Contract Purchase Order (SCO) may be cancelled and
reissued to the next lowest bidder.

The Vendor is not authorized to ship, nor is the Division authorized to receive
materials prior to issuance of an (SCO).

SUPPLYING OTHER ORGANIZATIONAL ENTITIES

In accordance with Chapter 5A, Article 3, Section 9 of the Code of West Virginia the
commodities or services contracted for herein shail be available to all local
governmental bodies in accordance with the same prices, terms and conditions
afforded to the State of West Virginia.

In the event any Vendor does not wish to extend the prices, terms and conditions of
his bid and subsequent contract to all political sub-divisions of the State, he must
so indicate in a clear and unambiguous manner in his bid. This indication does not
prejudice the award of the contract. If a Vendor does not indicate his refusal to
extend the prices, terms and conditions of his bid to political sub-divisions of the
State he is bound to extend them upon issuance of a purchase order by these other
entities.

17
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Other organizational entities using this provision of the contract sha!l do so without
any involvement of the Division of Highways. That is, the entity shall make its own
purchase arrangements with the Vendor and shail make its own arrangement for

payment.
HAULING AGGREGATE TO STATE PROJECTS BY CONTRACTOR

The most direct suitable route from the Vendor's aggregate storage site to the
midpoint of the project will be determined by the Division and used to compute haul
distance for the purpose of determining low bid, and also for the purpose of
determining payment. The Contractor shall deposit aggregates at the project site at
the locations and in the manner directed by the Division of Highways. This may
inciude tailgating the aggregate into an aggregate spreader or onto a roadway, or
dumping the aggregate into a stockpile.

WEIGHING MATERIALS DELIVERED BY TRUCK

Material delivered by truck shall be weighed in accordance with Section 401.9.3 of
the West Virginia Department of Transportation, Division of Highways Standard
Specifications Roads and Bridges, adopted 2000, as modified by the current
‘Supplemental Specifications.

WEIGHING MATERIALS DELIVERED BY MODES OF TRANSPORTATION OTHER
THAN TRUCKS

Materials delivered to the designated site by barge, or other non-truck modes shall
have their weight determined by a means acceptable to the Division, and the
weights of materials so shipped shall be certified, by the Vendor or his authorized

agent, to be correct.

The minimum barge delivery requested will be approximately 6,500 tons per SCO.
When barge delivery is required contract item will be ordered in 1500 ton
increments. '

SAMPLING AND TESTING

Sampling and testing for quality of all items furnished in this contract will be the
responsibility of the Division. Minimum frequency of sampiing and testing for
quality on all materials (other than those sources already covered by the Division's
“commercial source” approval) will be at least one sample every six days of
shipment (or if tested during production, at least one sample every six days of
production).

Other minimum frequencies shall be in accordance with the following:

Property Frequency
Gradation-Delivered Material One sample per each day of

shipment (or if tested during
production, one sample per each
day of production). See Note 1
below.

12
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Gradation-Division Pick-up (Division pick up; A-1 Source)
One sample per each week of
shipment per MP 700.00.52; or if
tested during production, one
sample per each day of
production. See Note 1 below.

(Division pick up; A-2 Source)
One sample per 250 tons shipped
and a minimum of one per week
of shipment.

Moisture Content (See Note 2)

All samples taken by the Vendor shall be by a Certified Aggregate Sampler or
Certified Aggregate Inspector. Tests shall be performed by a Certified Aggregate

inspector.

NOTE 1: The Vendor wili be responsible for providing test resuits

attesting to the gradation of materials delivered. Gradation
results from the production source will be acceptable.

NOTE 2: In the event visual inspection of the aggregate indicates excess

10.

or unusual moisture beyond that normally expected in the
aggregate, the Division reserves the right to determine the
moisture content by standard methods. If this becomes
necessary, the net weight of the portion represented will be
adjusted utilizing the test results obtained by the Division in
accordance with MP 700.00.22. items “N” & “O” {Abrasives) will
be considered fine aggregate outlined in MP 700.00.22.

ACCEPTANCE PLAN

Material failing to comply with the quality requirements will not be accepted.
Acceptance for gradation shall be on the basis of test results, provided and certified
by the Vendor to be true test results and representative of the material supplied to
the Division, on consecutive random samples from a lot. A lot shall consist of a
quantity of material represented by an average value (not to exceed 5 sublots). A
sublot shall consist of the quantity of material represented by a single gradation
test. In the case where only one sample is taken to represent the total quantity, the
sublot and lot will be considered the same. Frequency of sampling and testing shall
be in accordance with the Vendor's quality control plan outlined in MP 700.00.51.
The Vendor shall provide the gradation test resuits to the Division within 72 hours.

Gradation test resuits shali be averaged in accordance with MP 300.00.51. When
the average falls outside the applicable limits, the lot of material represented
thereby will be considered nonconforming to the extent that the last of its sublots is
nonconforming. When a lot of material is nonconforming, then the last sublot
contained therein shall have its degree of nonconformance determined as set forth

below.
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14

When a sublot of material is to have its price adjusted, the percentage point
difference between the nonconforming test vaiue and the specification limit shall be
determined for each sieve size determined to be nonconforming, and this value
shall be multiplied by its appropriate multiplication factor as set forth in Table I.

JABILE |
NONCONFORMING MULTIPLICATION
SIEVE SIiZE FACTOR

Plus #40 1

#40 1.5 -

#50 1.5

#100 2.0 (1.3 for

abrasives)
#200 2.5

The total measure of nonconformance of an individua! sublot is the sum of all
nonconformances on the various sieve sizes of that sublot. In no case, however,
shall a sublot of material have its price adjusted more than once, and the first
adjustment which is determined shall apply.

When the total degree of nonconformance has been established and it is 12 or less,
the material will be paid for at an adjusted contract price as specified in Table 2.

JABLE 2
DEGREE OF PERCENT OF CONTRACT
NONCONFORMANCE PRICE TO BE REDUCED
1.6 T0 3.0 2
3.1T0O5.0 4
51TO8.0 7
8.1 TO12.0 ‘ 11

Greater than 12

*The Division will make a special evaluation of the material and determine the
appropriate action.

In the event a Vendor delivers a specific quantity of material from a stockpile, and
said quantity is less than the total quantity contained in the stockpile, and it has
been determined from his certified test data that a nonconforming sublot(s) is
contained in said stockpile, the price reduction shall be calculated for the specific

quantity as follows:

The percent price reduction shall be determined as set forth above for the
nonconforming sublot. The quantity represented by the nonconforming sublot shall
then be caiculated as a percent of the total (total material contained in the
stockpile). To determine the price reduction on the specific quantity delivered,
multiply the percent of nonconforming material contained in the stockpile by the
quantity delivered, and reduce this quantity by the percent price reduction as
determined.
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Example:

11.

If it has been determined that a stockpile of 100 tons contains 10 percent failing
material, and said material is to have its price reduced by 4 percent, then the actual
quantity delivered, say 15 tons, will be multiplied by 0.10 (10 percent failing

PQn ‘
TD 1- .| =AP{price to be paid
100Qxt after adjustment)

material) which equals 1.5 tons. This 1.5 tons will thus have its price reduced by 4
percent. The remaining 13.5 tons will be paid for at fuli contract price.

WHERE T: = tonnage delivered -
P = percent price reduction
D = costperton
Qn = quantity of nonconforming sublot{s)
Qt = quantity of total stockpile

If two (2) sublots are nonconforming within the stockpile, calculate each separately
for the adjusted payment on the quantity delivered (as above). Add these two
adjusted payments together and subtract from the total the price to be paid before
adjustment for tonnage delivered (TD). If three (3) subiots are nonconforming,
calculate each separately and subtract twice the price to be paid before adjustment
for tonnage delivered, and so on. Example:

(AP1 + AP2) — TD = Final price to be paid after adjustments
OR
(AP1 + AP2 + AP3) - 2 TD = Final price to be paid after adjustments

Where: AP = price to be paid after initial adjustment for one nonconforming
sublot determined by the above equation.

T = tonnage delivered
D = cost per fon

In the event material is delivered from a continuous stockpile, that is, a stockpile

which is continuously being replenished while also having material removed for
these applications, certification shall be based on the shipment samples.

VENDOR’S INVOICES

-Vendor’s invoices must be submitted in original and one copy and contain the

following:

a. Al weigh ticket numbers for material delivered during the
invoicing period. _

15



NOTE: Vendor should type Bid Schedule 16
‘ Southern West Virginia Asphalt, Inc.

b. Division of Highways’ State Contract Purchase Order (SCO)
number and this contract number.

c. Total quantity and unit price with the total cost of each type of
material furnished. (Total quantity invoiced shall be scale
weights (supported by weigh tickets) adjusted in accordance
with Section 9, Note 2.)

NOTE: Under no circumstances will the West Virginia Division of
Highways accept, or pay for, quantities of material in excess of
the quantity stated on the State Contract Purchase Order.

12. BIDDING SCHEDULE

12.1 Bidding F.0.B. Vendor's Storage Site

a) SOURCE OF MATERIAL (State all sources for which bid prices
apply) (e.g., Quarry location if Sandstone or Limestone;
dredging or pit focation if Gravel; production plant name and

location if Slag)
Southern West Virginia Asphalt, Inc.

Rt. 33 Kelly Mountain Road
Elkins, WV 26241

b} EXACT LOCATION OF VENDOR'S STORAGE SITE(S) A
separate bid schedule must be submitted when bid price varies

between Vendors storage sites.
Southern West Virginia Asphalt, Inc.

Rt. 33 Kelly Mountain Road
Elkins, WV 26241

Con-
Tract Description of Bid Price Per Ton
item Aggregate F.O.B. Vendor's Storage Site
LIMESTONE BLAST
SANDSTONE, FURNACE STEEL
GRAVEL, SAND SLAG SLAG
A Class 1 Aggregate 5.50 NO BID NO BID
B Class 2 Aggregate 2.0 AU BID NY BV
c AASHTO #1 Aggregate 6.75 NO BID NO BID
D AASHTO #3 Aggregate 6.75 NQ _BID NO BID
E AASHTO #4 Aggregate .75 8O BID NO_BID
F AASHTO #467 Aggregate 6£.75 NOLBID NO BID
G AASHTO #57 Aggregate 71.25 NO_BID NO..BID
H AASHTO #67 Aggregate 7.25 NO BID NO _BID
| AASHTO #7 Aggregate 13.00 NO _BID NO _BID
J AASHTO #8 Aggregate 7.90 NO BTN NO BID
K AASHTO #9 Aggregate 8.75 NO RID NGO BID




Southern West Virginia Asphalt, Inc.

BIDDING SCHEDULE (Continued)

12.1

Cc ~uxpvozEr

Bidding F.O.B. Vendor's Storage Site (Continued)

Stone for Gabions 6.75 NO BID NO BID
Fine Aggregate 9.00 NO BID NO BID
Standard Abrasives 7.90 NO BID NGO BID
Modified Abrasives 7.90 NO RBID NO BID
Riprap 7.90 NO BID NOQ BID
Shot Rock 8.80 NO BID NGO BID
AASHTO #8 Modified 8.00 NO BID NO BID
AASHTO #9 Modified - 9,00 NQ BID NO BID
Pea Gravel 21.00 NO BID NO BID

Haul by Vendor (Except ltems Q and P);
@__1.25 $ for First Ton-Mile
@ W17 $ for Each Additional Ton Mile

Haul Ey Vendor {items Q andfor P):
@_ %73 $ for First Ton-Mile
@ .20 $ for Each Additional Ton-Mile
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| 12. BIDDING SCHEDULE

PDISTRICT SEVEN

12.2 Bidding F.0.B. Division's Storage Site

I¥

Southern West Virginia Asphalit, Inc.
Rt. 33 Kelly Mountain Rd.

Elkins, WV 26241

Estimated Location of Bid Price ($/Ton) F.O.B.
Contract Description Quantity DOH DOH Storage Site
item of Aggregate (TONS) Storage Site
T LIMESTONE BLAST
BARBOUR COUNTY SANDSTONE FURNACE | STEEL
GRAVEL, SAND SLAG SLAG
A Class 1 6000 Philippi 12.25 NO BID NO BID
B Class 2 3000 Philippi 12.25 NO BID NO BID
C No. 1 500 Philippi 12.25 NO BID NO_BID
3} No. 3 500 Phifippi 12,25 NO BID ¥O BID
F No. 467 2000 Philippi 12.25 NO BID NO BID
G No. 57 1000 Philippi 12,25 NO BID NO BID
J No. 8 2500 Philippi 13.10 NO BID NO BID
K No. 9 1500 Philippi 13.75 NO _BID NO BID
L Gabion Stone 500 Philippi 12.75 NO BID NO BID
N Standard Abr. 1000 Philippi 13.25 NO BID NO BID
O Modified Abr. 500 Philippi 13.25 NO BID NO BID
Q Shot Rock 500 Phitippi 18.00 NO BID NO BID
BARBOUR COUNTY
A Class 1 2000 Belington 9,50 NO BID NO BID
B Class 2 2000 Belington 9.50 NO BID NO BID
c No. 1 500 Belington 10.00 NO BID NO BID
D No. 3 500 Belington 10.00 NO BID NG BID
F No. 467 500 Belington 10,00 NOQ BID NO BID
J No. 8 2000 Belington 11,00 NO BID NO BID
K No. 9 1000 Belington i2.060 NO BID NO BID
L Gabion Stone 200 Belington 10,20 NO BID NG BID
N Standard Abr. 1000 Belington 11.00 NO BID NO BID
O Modified Abr. 500 Belinglon 11.00 NO BID NO BID
Q Shot Rock 500 Belingion 18.00 NO BID NO BID
BRAXTON COUNTY
- A Class 1 26000 Laurel 19 50 NGO BID NO BID
B Class 2 5000 Laurel 1950 NO BRID NO BID
c No. 1 500 Laurel 19.50 NO BID NO BID
D No. 3 4000 Laurei 19.50 NO_BID NO BID
F No. 467 500 Laurel 19.50 NO BID NO BID
J No. 8 4000 Laurel 19.50 NO BID NO BID
K No. 9 2000 Laurel 19.50 NO BID NO BID
N Standard Abr, 500 Laurel 19.00 NO BID NO BID
O Modified Abr. 500 Laurel 19.00 NO BID NO BID
Q Shot Rock 1000 Laurel 26.00 NO BID NO BID




12. BIDDING SCHEDULE

DISTRICT SEVEN

12.2 Bidding F.O B. Division's Storage Site (Continued)

Estimaled Location of
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Bid Price ($/Ton) F.O.B.
Contract  Description Quantity DOH DOH Storage Site
item of Aggregate {TONS) Storage Site
LIMESTONE BLAST
BRAXTON COUNTY SANDSTONE FURNACE | STEEL
GRAVEL, SAND SLAG SLAG
N Standard Abr. 500 (Gassaway 18.50 NO BRID NO BID
0 Modified Abr. 500 Gassaway 18.50 NO BID NO BID
BRAXTON COUNTY
N Standard Abr. 500 Heaters 18.50 NO RID NO BID
0 Maodified Abr, 500 Heaters 18.50 KO BID NO BID
BRAXTON COUNTY (I-79)
A Class 1 500 Burnsville 18.00 NO BID NO BID
J No. 8 4000 Burnsville 18.50 NO BID NO BID
K No. 9 500 Burnsville 18.50 NO BID NO BID
N Standard Abr, 500 Burnsville 18.50 NO BID NO BID
O Modified Abr. 500 Burnsville 18.50 NO BID NG BID
BRAXTON COUNTY (I-79)
A Class 1 500 Coon Knob NO BID NO RID NO BID
J No. 8 500 Coon Knob NO BID NO BID NO BID
K No.9 500 Coon Knob NQ_BID NO BID.._ {NO BID
N Standard Abr. 500 Coon Knob NO BID NO BID NO BID
0] Modified Abr. 500 Coon Knob NO BID NO BID NO BID
GILMER COUNTY
A Class 1 7000 Glenville 17.20 NO BID NO BID
B- Class 2 3000 Glenville 17.20 NO BID NO BID
C No. 1 1000 Glenville 17.20 NO BID NO BID
D No. 3 2500 Glenville 17.20 NO BID NO BID
F No. 467 2500 Gienville 17.20 NO BID NOQ RID
G No. 57 500 Glenville 17.20 NO BID NO BID
J No. 8 2000 Glenville 18.00 NO BID NO BID
K No. 9 500 Glenville 18.00 NO BID NO BID
L. Gabion Stone 200 Glenville 17.50 NO BID NO BID
N Standard Abr. 2000 Glenville 18.00 NO BID NO BID
0O Modified Abr. 500 Glenville 18.00 NO BID NO BID
Q Shot Rock 5006 Glenville 23.00 NO BID NO BID
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12. BIDDING SCHEDULE DISTRICT SEVEN

12.2 Bidding F.O.B. Division's Storage Site {(Continued)

Estimated Location of Bid Price (§/Ton) F.OB.
Contract Description Quantity DOH DOH Storage Site
item  of Aggregate  (TONS) Storage Site
LIMESTONE BLAST :
LEWIS COUNTY SANDSTONE | FURNACE| STEEL
GRAVEL, SAND SLAG SLAG
A Class 1 10000 Bendale, Weston 12.25 : NO BID NO BID
B Class 2 10000 Bendale, Weston 12.25 NO BID NO BID
C No. 1 1000 Bendale, Weston 12.75 NO BID |NO BID
D No. 3 2000 Bendale, Weston- 12.75 NO BID NO BID
F No. 467 5000 Bendale, Weston Al 12,75 ¢ NO BID NO BID
H No. 67 500 - Bendale, Weston - 12.75 NO BID [NO BID
J No. 8 5000  Bendale, Weston ad 1e.25 NO BID |NO BID
K No. 8 2000 Bendale, Weston 12.75 NO BID NO BID
L Gabion Stone 500 Bendale, Weston 12.75 NO BID NO BID
N Standard Abr. 1000 Bendale, Weston 12,40 NO BID NO BID
O Modified Abr. 500 Bendale, Weston 12.40 NO BID NO BID
Q Shot Rock 500 Bendale, Weston 21.00 NO BID {NO BID
LEWIS COUNTY (CORIDOR H)
N Standard Abr. 1000 Mudtick 13,50 NQ BID NO BID
O Modified Abr. 500 Mudlick 13.50 NO BID [NO BID
UPSHUR COUNTY
A Class 1 10000 Headquarters 9.75 NO BIP |NO BID
B Class 2 5000 Headguarters 9,75 NO BID {NO BID
C No. 1 1500 Headquarters 11.25 NO BID NO BID
D No. 3 1500 Headquarters 11.25 NO BID NO BID
F No. 467 4000 Headquarters 11.75 NO BID NO BID
J No. 8 2000 Headquarters 11.75 NO BID |[NO BID
K No. @ 1500 Headquarters 13.25 NO BID NO BID
L (abion Stone 500 Headquarters 10.95 NO BID NO BID
N Standard Abr. 2000 Headquarters 11.75 NO BID {NO BID
O Modified Abr. 500 Headquarters 11,75 NO BID [NO BID
Q Shot Rock 500 Headquarters 17.00 NO BID |NO BID




12. BIDDING SCHEDULE

12.2 Bidding F.O.B. Division's Storage Site (Continued)

DISTRICT SEVEN

Estimated Location of
Contract  Description Quantity DOH
ftem of Aggregate  (TONS) Storage Site
UPSHUR COUNTY
A Class 1 2500 Kanawha Head
B Class 2 2500 Kanawha Head
C No. 1 500 Kanawha Head
D No. 3 500 Kanawha Head
F No. 467 2500 Kanawha Head
J No. 8 500 Kanawha Head
K No. 9 500 Kanawha Head
N Standard Abr, 500 Kanawha Head
@] Modified Abr. 500 Kanawha Head
Q Shot Rock 200 Kanawha Head
WEBSTER COUNTY
A Class 1 2000 Parcoal
B Class 2 2000 Parcoal
C No, 1 500 Parcoal
D No. 3 500 Parcoal
F No. 487 500 Parcoal
J No. 8 2500 Parcoal
K No. 9 1000 Parcoal
L Gabion Stone 500 Parcoal
N Standard Abr. 2000 Parcoal
o Modified Abr. 500 Parcoal
Q Shot Rock " 500 Parcoal
WEBSTER COUNTY
A Class 1 3000 Big Ditch Lake
B Class 2 2000 Big Ditch Lake
C No. 1 1000 Big Ditch Lake
D No. 3 500 Big Ditch Lake
J No. 8 2500 Big Ditch Lake
K~ No. 9. 1000 Big Ditch Lake
L Gabion Stone 200 Big Ditch Lake
N Standard Abr. 2500 Big Difch Lake
O Modified Abr. 500 Big Ditch Lake
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Bid Price ($/Ton) F.O.B.

DOM Storage Site

LIMESTONE BLAST
SANDSTONE FURNACE STEEL
GRAVEL, SAND SLAG SLAG
15.00 NO_BID NO _BID
15,00 NO_BID NG BLD
15.85 NO BID NG BID
15.85 NO BID NG BID
15.85 NO BID NG BID
15.90 NO BID NO BID
15.90 NO BID NO BID
15.90 NO BID NG BID
15.90 NO_BID NG BID
21.00 NO EBID NO BiD
NO BID NC BID NO BID
NO BID NG BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NOQ BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
RO BID NO BID NO BID
RO BID NO BID NO BID
NG BID NO BID NO BID
NG_BID NO BID NO BID
NG BID NO BID NO BIB
NO BID NO BID NO BID
NG BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BiD NO BID
NOBID NO BID NQ BID
NG BID NQ_RID NO CBTD
NG BID NQ BID NO_BID
RO BID NO _BID NG _BID
NO_BID NQ. BID NO BID
NO BID NO_BID NO _BID
NQ BID NG BID KO_BID
NO BID NO BiD NO BID
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12. BIDDING SCHEDULE DISTRICT SEVEN

12.2 Bidding F.O.B. Division's Storage Site (Continued)

Estimated Location of Bid Price (3/Ten) F.O.B.
Contract Description Quantity DOH DOH Storage Site
ltem  of Aggregate  (TONS) Storage Site
T LIMESTONE BLAST

WEBSTER COUNTY SANDSTONE FURNACE STEEL

GRAVEL, SAND SLAG SLAG

A Class 1 3000 Hacker Valley NO BID NOQ BID NO BID

B Class 2 1000 Hacker Valley NO BID NO BID NO BID

c No. 1 500 Hacker Valley NG BID NO BID NO BID

D No. 3 500 Hacker Vailey NO BID NQ BID NO_BID

F No. 467 500 Hacker Valiey NO BID NO BID NO RID

J No. 8 1000 Hacker Valley NO BID NGO BID NO RID

K No. 9 500 Hacker Valley NO BID NO BID NO RID

L Gabion Stone 500 Hacker Valley NO BID NO BID NO BID

N Standard Abr. 1500 Hacker Valley NO BID NO BID NO BID

O Modified Abr. 500 Hacker Valley NO BID NO BID NO BID




12. BIDDING SCHEDULE

DISTRICT EIGHT

12.2 Bidding F.0.B. Division's Storage Site

Estimated Location of
Contract Description Quantity DOH
ltem of Aggregate (TONS) Storage Site
PENDLETON COUNTY
A Class1 2500  Franklin (US 220N)
8 Class 2 2700 Franklin {US 220N)
C No. 1 1000 Franklin (LS 220N)
G No. 57 1000  Franklin (US 220N)
H No, 67 1000  Franklin (US 220N)
J No. 8 950  Franklin (US 220N)
K No. 9 2000  Franklin (US 220N)
L Gabion Stone 135 Franklin (US 220N)
N Standard Abr. 2400  Franklin (US 220N)
O Modified Abr. 4400  Franklin (US 220N)
PENDLETON COUNTY
A Class 1 275  Franklin (US 2208)
B Class 2 1160 Franklin (US 2208)
C No. 1 1000  Franklin (US 220S)
G No.57 500  Frankkin (US 2205)
H No. 67 500  Frankiin (US 2208)
J No. 8 700  Frankin (US 2208)
K No. 9 2000  Franklin (US 2208)
L Gabion Stone 500  Frankiin (US 2208)
N Standard Abr. 2400  Frankiin (US 2208)
O  Modified Abr. 1300  Franklin (US 2208)
PENDLETON COUNTY
A Class 1 1000 Judy Gap
B Class 2 1000 Judy Gap
H No. 67 500 Judy Gap
J No. 8 1000 Judy Gap
K No. 9 1000 Judy Gap
N Abrasives 4000 Judy Gap
O Maodified Abr. 3300 Judy Gap

Southern West Virginia Asphalt, Inc.

Bid Price ($/Ton) F.O.B.
DOH Storage Site

LIMESTONE BLAST
SANDSTONE FURNACE STEEL
GRAVEL, SAND SLAG SLAG
NQ BID NQ. BID NO _BID
NO BID NGO BID NO BID
NO _BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NGO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NC BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
NOQ BID NO _BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO RID NO BID NG BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NOQ BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
NGO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NGO BID NGO EBID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
NG _RID NGO _BID NG BLD
NG . BID NG _BID NGO _BID
NGO _BID NO BID NO _BID
NQ BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NG BID NO BID
8O BID NO BID NO BID
NG BID NQ BID NO BID
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12. BIDDING SCHEDULE

12.2 Bidding F.O.B. Division's Storage Site {Continued)

DISTRICT EIGHT

Estimated Location of
Contract  Description Quantity DOH
ftem of Aggregate {TONS) Storage Site
PENDLETON COUNTY
A Class 1 1000 Onego
B Class 2 1000 Gnego
H No. 67 500 Onego
J No. 8 1000 Onego
K No. 9 1000 Onego
N Abrasives 3000 Onego
O Modified Abr. 2200 Cnego
PENDLETON COLUINTY
A Class 1 1000 Brandywine
B Class 2 450 Brandywine
H No. 67 500 Brandywine
J No. 8 1000 Brandywine
K No. 3 1000 Brandywine
N Standard Abr. 2000 Brandywine
6] Modified Abr, 1600 Brandywine
POCAHONTAS COUNTY
A Class 1 3000 Marlinton
B Class 2 5000 Marlinton
H No. 87 1000 Marlinton
J No. 8 6000 Marlinton
K No. 8 1000 Mariinton
8] Modified Abr. 3000 Marlinton
POCAHONTAS COUNTY
A Class 1 1500 Green Bank
B Class 2 2500 Green Bank
H No. 67 300 Green Bank
J No. 8 2000 Green Bank
K No. 9 500 Green Bank
O Modified Abr. 1500

Green Bank

Southern West Virginia Asphalt, Inec.

Bid Price ($/Ton) F.O.B.
DOH Storage Site

LIMESTONE BLAST
SANDSTONE FURNACE STEEL
GRAVEL, SAND SLAG SLAG
NO_BID NOQ _BID NO BID
NO_BID NO B1D NO_BID
NQ _BID NO BID NO_BID
15.00 NO BID N0 BID
16.00 NO BIB |NO BID
15.00 NO BIPD |NO BID
16.00 NO BID KO BID
NO BID NO BID [NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID |NC BID
NO BID NO BID |NO BID
NO BID NO BID |NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
NG BID NQ BID KO _BID
NO _BID NO _BID KO BID
KO BID NO _BID KO BID
NO BID NO BID | NO BID
NO BID NO BED | NO BID
NQ BID NO BID | NO BID
NO BID NO BIB | NO BID
NO BiID NO BID { NO BID
NG BID NO BID | NO BID
NG BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BiD
NO BID NO BID NO BID
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12. BIDDING SCHEDULE

12.2 Bidding F.O.B. Division's Storage Site (Continued)

DISTRICT EIGHT

25

Southern West Virginia Asphalt, Inc.

Bid Price ($/Ton) F.O.B.
DOH Storage Site

Estimated Location of
Confract  Description Quantity POH
ftem of Aggregate (TONS) Storage Site
POCAHONTAS COUNTY
A Class 1 1500 Hillsboro
B Class 2 5000 Hillsboro
H No. 67 1000 Hillsboro
K No. 9 1000 Hillshoro
POCAHONTAS COUNTY
A Class 1 1500 Thornwood
B Class 2 1000 Thornwood
J No. 8 1000 Thornwood
] Modified Abr. 4000 Thormwood
POCAHONTAS COUNTY
B Class 2 1000 Linwood
J No. 8 1000 Linwood
K No. 9 500 Linwood
O Modified Abr. 2500 Linwood
POCAHONTAS COUNTY
H No. 67 300 Seebert
J No. 8 2000 Seebert
O Modified Abr. 4000 Seebert
RANDOIL PH COUNTY
A Class 1 500 Coalton
B Class 2 500 Coalton
H No. 67 500 Coatton
J No. 8 3000 Coalton
K No. g 2000 Coalion
RANDOLPH COUNTY
A Class 1 1000 Mill Creek
B Class 2 1000 Miil Creek
H No. 67 500 Mill Creek
J No. 8 5000 Mill Creek
K No. 8 500 Mill Creek

LIMESTONE BLAST
SANDSTONE FURNACE STEEL
GRAVEL, SAND SLAG SLAG
NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
NG.BID NO_BID NO_BID
NQO _RTD NO.BID NG_BID
NQO_RID KO RID NG RID
NO.BID NO. BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
N0 RID NO.BID NO RID
NO_BID NG _BID NO _RID
NQ _BID NO BID NO_BID
16.20 NO BID NG BID
10.20 NO BID NO BID
10.70 NO BID NO BID
11.95 NO BID NO BID
11.95 NO BID NO BID
11.00 NO RTD O RID
11.00 NO BID NO.BID
11.00 NGO . BID NO BID
11.50 NO_BID NO _BID
12.00 NO_BID NQ BID




12. BIDDING SCHEDULE

12.2 Bidding F.O.B. Division's Storage Site (Continued)

Contract  Description
ltem of Aggregate

Estimated
Quantity
{TONS)

DISTRICT EIGHT

Location of
DOH

Storage Site

RANDOLPH COUNTY

A Class 1 1500
B Class 2 1500
H No. 67 1000
J No. 8 1800
RANDOLPH COUNTY
A Class 1 1000
B Class 2 1000
H No. 67 500
J No. 8 3500
K No. 8 5000
RANDOLPH COUNTY
A Class 1 100
B Class 2 1000
H No. 67 500
J No, 8 4000
RANDOLPH COUNTY
A Class 1 1000
B Class 2 1000
H No. 67 1000
J No. 8 3500
TUCKER COUNTY
A Class 1 2000
B Class 2 4000
J No. 8 5000
K No. 9 1200

Pickens
Pickens
Pickens
Pickens

Elkins
- Elkins
Eikins
Elkins
Elkins

Harman
Harman
Harman
Harman

Valley Head
Valley Head
Valley Head
Valley Head

Parsons
Parsons
Parsons
Parsons

26

Southern West Virginia Asphalt, Inc.

Bid Price ($/Ton)} F.O.B.

DOH Storage Site

LIMESTONE BLAST

SANDSTONE FURNACE | STEEL
GRAVEL, SAND SLAG SLAG
15.00 NO _BID NO BID
15.00 NO BID NO BID
16.00 NO BRID NO BID
16.00 NO BID NO BID
8.40 NO BID NO BiD

8.40 NO BID NO EID

9. 40 NO BID NO BID
10.15 NO BID RO BID
10.40 NO BID RO BID

11.25 NO BID NG _BID

11.25 NO _BID NO BID

11,75 NO BID NO BID

12.45 NO BID NO BID

NO BID NG BID NOBID

NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NG BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID

M| 10.50 NO BID NO BID
n 10.50 NO BID NO BID
7 12.45 NO BID NO BID
4 12.50 NO BID NG BID




12. BIDDING SCHEDULE DISTRICT EIGHT

12.2 Bidding F.O.B. Division's Storage Site (Continued)

Estimated Location of
Contract  Description Quantity DOH
Hem of Aggregate {TONS) Storage Site
TUCKER COUNTY
A Class 1 1300 Thomas
B Class 2 1500 Thomas
J No. 8 6000 Thomas
TUCKER COUNTY

J No. 8 2500 Canaan Valley Pk.

Southern West Virginia Asphalt, Inc.

Bid Price ($/Ton) F.O.B.
DOH Storage Site

27

LIMESTONE BLAST
SANDSTONE FURNACE | STEEL
GRAVEL, SAND SLAG SLAG
14,00 NO_BID 0_BID
14,00 NO BID _ NO BID
14,00 NO BID NO BID
[ 14.00 { NO BID O BID |




Southern West Virginia Asphalt, Inec. 28

DISTRICT DELIVERY ADDRESSES

District One Office
1334 Smith Street
- Charleston, West Virginia 25301-1492

District Two Office
801 Madison Avenue
Huntington, West Virginia 25712-0880

District Three Office
624 Depot Street
Parkersburg, West Virginia 26102-0308

District Four Office
179 & Meadowbrook Road
Clarksburg, West Virginia 26302-2570

District Five Office
Route 50
Burlington, West Virginia 26710-0099

District Six Office
1 DOT Drive
Moundsville, West Virginia 26041-1605

District Seven Office
255 Depot Street
Weston, West Virginia 26452-1228

District Eight Office
US 219 North
Elkins, West Virginia 26241-1516

District Nine Office
103 1/2 Church Street
Lewisburg, West Virginia 24901

District Ten Office
270 Hardwood Lane
Princeton, West Virginia 24740-2737
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RFQ No. 66700006

AFFIDAVIT

West Virginia Code §5A-3-10a states:
No contract or renewal of any contract may be awarded by the state or any of its political subdivisions to any

vendor or prospective vendor when the vendor or prospective vendor or a related party to the vendor or
prospective vendor is a debtor and the debt owned is an amount greater than one thousand dollars in the

aggregate,

DEFINITIONS:
“Debt” means any assessment, premium, penalty, fine, tax or other amount of money owed to the state or any

of its politica! subdivisions because of a judgment, fine, permit violation. license assessment, defaulied
warkers' compensation premium, penalty or other assessment presently delinquent or due and reguired to be
paid to the state or any of its political subdivisions, including any interest or additional penalties accrued

thereon.

“Debtor” means any individual, corporation, partnership, association. limited liability company or any other form
Or business association owing a debt to the siate or any of its political subdivisions. '

"Political  subdivision” means any county commission; municipality; county board of education; any
instrumentality established by a county or municipality; any separate corporation or instrumentaiity established
by one or more counties or municipalities, as permitted by law: or any public body charged by law with the
performance of a government function or whose jurisdiction is coextensive with one or more counties or

municipalities.

"Related party” means a party, whether an individual, corporation, partnership, association, limited liability
company or any other form or business association or other entity whatsoever, related to any vendor by blood,
marriage, ownership or contract through which the party has a relationship of ownership or other interest with
the vendor so that the party witl actuaily or by effect receive or control a portion of the benefit, profit or other
consideration from performance of a vendor contract with the party receiving an amount that meets or exceed

five percent of the total contract amount,

EXCEPTION:
The prohibition of this section does not apply where a vendor has contested any tax administered pursuant to

chapter eleven of this code, workers’ compensation premium, permit fee or environmental fee or assessment
and the matter has not become final or where the vendor has entered into a payment plan or agreement and
the vendor is not in default of any of the provisions of such plan or agreement.

LICENSING:
The vendor must be licensed in accordance with any and all state requirements to do business with the stale of

West Virginia.

CONFIDENTIALITY:
The vendor agrees that he or she will not disclose to anyone, directly or indirectly, any such personally

identifiable information or other confidential information gained from the agency, unless the individual who is
the subject of the information consents to the disclosure in writing or the disclosure is made pursuant to the
agency's policies, procedures and rules. Vendors should visit vsmrw.state.wv.us/admin/purchase/privacy for

the Notice of Agency Confidentiality Poiicies,

Under penaity of law for false swearing (West Virginia Code, §61-5-3). it is hereby certified that the vendor
acknowledges the infor atiﬁxn in this said affidavit and are in compliance with the requirements as stated.

Vendor's Name: _ gy hern wmcr/ﬁ]-i-rginin? Asphalt., Ing

Authorized Signature; \é\}ﬂ’\_J (;:{4 f,. Date: August 30, 2006

W

No Debt Affidavit
Rewvised 0 2/08/06



