
From: Whittaker, Frank M <frank.m.whittaker@wv.gov> 
Date: Tue, Nov 18, 2025 at 3:48 PM 
Subject: Re: Emergency Purchase Request for SDU 
To: Hustead, Crystal G <crystal.g.hustead@wv.gov>, Greenhowe, Althea M 
<althea.m.greenhowe@wv.gov> 
Cc: Tara L Lyle <tara.l.lyle@wv.gov>, Alisha S Pettit <alisha.s.pettit@wv.gov>, Greg Clay 
<gregory.c.clay@wv.gov> 

 
 

Althea, 

 

Your emergency request for a 6 month contract for the State Disbursement Unit's banking 
needs is approved. Should the agency not be able to solicit and award a new contract 
within 6 months of the expiration of the current contract (CMA CSE19*01) the agency may 
execute an additional 6 month renewal. This is not an approval for any specific provider or 
product. Please follow all emergency procedures outlined in the Purchasing Division 
Procedures Handbook and return the completed contract and all supporting documents to 
this o?ice within 30 days of this approval.    

  

 

 

On Tue, Nov 18, 2025 at 8:53 AM Hustead, Crystal G <crystal.g.hustead@wv.gov> wrote: 

Pleases see the attached revised emergency purchase request  

 
 

 

Crystal Hustead, CPPB 

Senior Buyer 

Purchasing Division 

304-558-2402 │Crystal.G.Hustead@wv.gov 



2019 Washington St. E., Charleston, WV 25305 

 

 

 

 

---------- Forwarded message --------- 
From: Greenhowe, Althea M <althea.m.greenhowe@wv.gov> 
Date: Mon, Nov 17, 2025 at 2:56 PM 
Subject: Fwd: Emergency Purchase Request for SDU 
To: Crystal G Hustead <crystal.g.hustead@wv.gov> 

 

She wrote up a new memo.  We also updated the request to be a 6 month emergency with a 
6 month renewal.  They've estimated the transition time between vendors, if needed, to be 
6 months. 

---------- Forwarded message --------- 
From: Greenhowe, Althea M <althea.m.greenhowe@wv.gov> 
Date: Tue, Sep 30, 2025 at 12:57 PM 
Subject: Fwd: Emergency Purchase Request for SDU 
To: Virginia G Hill <virginia.g.hill@wv.gov> 
Cc: Robert L Price <robert.l.price@wv.gov>, Bryan D Rosen <bryan.d.rosen@wv.gov>, 
Kimberlie K Debolt <kimberlie.k.debolt@wv.gov>, Heather M White 
<heather.m.white@wv.gov> 

 

I've added the current contract number and expiration date to the form.  Feel free to add to 
the answers I've provided to the first 2 questions and answer the 3rd question please. 

 

---------- Forwarded message --------- 
From: Hustead, Crystal G <crystal.g.hustead@wv.gov> 
Date: Tue, Sep 30, 2025 at 12:48 PM 
Subject: Re: Emergency Purchase Request for SDU 



To: Greenhowe, Althea M <althea.m.greenhowe@wv.gov> 
Cc: Robert L Price <robert.l.price@wv.gov>, Bryan D Rosen <bryan.d.rosen@wv.gov>, 
Kimberlie K Debolt <kimberlie.k.debolt@wv.gov>, Heather M White 
<heather.m.white@wv.gov> 

 

Frank has reviewed and asked the that the current contract number and expiration date be 
added to the form along with the answers to the below questions: 

 

*Why hasn't the agency re-solicited?  - We are currently working on the solicitation to 
replace the current contract that will expire in November. 

 

*Why can't they re-solicit now since it doesn't expire for two months? - We are currently 
waiting on approvals of the RFQ for the resolicitation. 

 

*Before time became an issue, what circumstances contributed to the need for an 
emergency 

 

 

 
 

 

Crystal Hustead, CPPB 

Senior Buyer 

Purchasing Division 

304-558-2402 │Crystal.G.Hustead@wv.gov 

2019 Washington St. E., Charleston, WV 25305 

 



 

 

 

 

On Tue, Sep 30, 2025 at 11:39 AM Greenhowe, Althea M <althea.m.greenhowe@wv.gov> 
wrote: 

Good afternoon, 

 

Our Child Support O?ice is requesting an emergency purchase for a 3 month contract with 
a 3 month renewal period for their banking services.  The current contract is CMA 0511 
CSE19*1 and expires on 11/30/2025.  The specs for the new contract have been approved 
by the Treasurer's O?ice this week and are currently awaiting MIS/OT approval. 

 

Please let us know if you need additional information. 

 

Thanks, 

Althea 

 

-- 

 

Althea Greenhowe 

Procurement Specialist, Senior 

O?ice of Shared Administration 

West Virginia Departments of Health, Health Facilities, and Human Services 

One Davis Square, Ste 100W 

Charleston, WV 25301 



P: 304-352-3924 | dhhr.wv.gov 

 

DISCLAIMER:  The information contained in this electronic message may be legally 
privileged and confidential under applicable state and federal law and is intended for the 
individual named above.  If the recipient of the message is not the above-named recipient, 
you are hereby notified that any distribution, copy or disclosure of this communication is 
strictly prohibited.  If you have received this communication in error, please notify 
the O?ice of Shared Administration, One Davis Square, Telephone 304.352.3924 and 
discard this communication immediately without making any copy or distribution. 

 
 

 

-- 

 

Althea Greenhowe 

Procurement Specialist, Senior 

O?ice of Shared Administration 

West Virginia Departments of Health, Health Facilities, and Human Services 

 

DISCLAIMER:  The information contained in this electronic message may be legally 
privileged and confidential under applicable state and federal law and is intended for the 
individual named above.  If the recipient of the message is not the above-named recipient, 
you are hereby notified that any distribution, copy or disclosure of this communication is 
strictly prohibited.  If you have received this communication in error, please notify the 
O?ice of Shared Administration, One Davis Square, Telephone 304.352.3924 and discard 
this communication immediately without making any copy or distribution. 

 
 

 

-- 



 

Althea Greenhowe 

Procurement Specialist, Senior 

O?ice of Shared Administration 

West Virginia Departments of Health, Health Facilities, and Human Services 

 

DISCLAIMER:  The information contained in this electronic message may be legally 
privileged and confidential under applicable state and federal law and is intended for the 
individual named above.  If the recipient of the message is not the above-named recipient, 
you are hereby notified that any distribution, copy or disclosure of this communication is 
strictly prohibited.  If you have received this communication in error, please notify the 
O?ice of Shared Administration, One Davis Square, Telephone 304.352.3924 and discard 
this communication immediately without making any copy or distribution. 

 














