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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 Senior Web Application Analyst 2080.00000HOUR   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
80111608    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
4.1.1 Senior Web Application Analyst - quantity of hours listed is for bidding purposes only.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
2 Senior Web Application Analyst Optional 

renewal year 1
2080.00000HOUR   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
80111608    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Senior Web Application Analyst Optional renewal year 1-quantity of hours listed is for bidding purposes only.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
3 Senior Web Application Analyst Optional 

renewal year 2
2080.00000HOUR   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
80111608    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Senior Web Application Analyst Optional renewal year 2-quantity of hours listed is for bidding purposes only.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
4 Senior Web Application Analyst Optional 

renewal year 3
2080.00000HOUR   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
80111608    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Senior Web Application Analyst Optional renewal year 3-quantity of hours listed is for bidding purposes only.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
5 Senior Application Oracle Database 

Administrator
2080.00000HOUR 153.000000 318240.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
80111608    

Commodity Line Comments: Bidding

Extended Description:
4.1.2 Senior Application Oracle Database Administrator-quantity of hours listed is for bidding purposes only.
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
6 Senior Application Oracle Database 

Administrator Opt Ren Yr1
2080.00000HOUR 157.000000 326560.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
80111608    

Commodity Line Comments: Bidding

Extended Description:
Senior Application Oracle Database Administrator Opt Ren Yr1-quantity of hours listed is for bidding purposes only.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
7 Senior Application Oracle Database 

Administrator Opt Ren Yr2
2080.00000HOUR 162.000000 336960.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
80111608    

Commodity Line Comments: Bidding

Extended Description:
Senior Application Oracle Database Administrator Opt Ren Yr2-quantity of hours listed is for bidding purposes only.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
8 Senior Application Oracle Database 

Administrator Opt Ren Yr3
2080.00000HOUR 167.000000 347360.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
80111608    

Commodity Line Comments: Bidding

Extended Description:
Senior Application Oracle Database Administrator Opt Ren Yr3-quantity of hours listed is for bidding purposes only.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
9 Senior Application DB2 Database 

Administrator
2080.00000HOUR   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
80111608    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
4.1.3 Senior Application DB2 Database Administrator-quantity of hours listed is for bidding purposes only.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
10 Senior Application DB2 Database 

Administrator Opt Ren Yr1
2080.00000HOUR   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
80111608    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Senior Application DB2 Database Administrator Opt Ren Yr1-quantity of hours listed is for bidding purposes only.
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
11 Senior Application DB2 Database 

Administrator Opt Ren Yr2
2080.00000HOUR   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
80111608    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Senior Application DB2 Database Administrator Opt Ren Yr2-quantity of hours listed is for bidding purposes only.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
12 Senior Application DB2 Database 

Administrator Opt Ren Yr3
2080.00000HOUR   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
80111608    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Senior Application DB2 Database Administrator Opt Ren Yr3-quantity of hours listed is for bidding purposes only.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
13 SQL Server Database Administrator 2080.00000HOUR   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
80111608    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
4.1.4 SQL Server Database Administrator-quantity of hours listed is for bidding purposes only.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
14 SQL Server Database Administrator Opt Ren 

Yr 1
2080.00000HOUR   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
80111608    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
SQL Server Database Administrator Opt Ren Yr 1-quantity of hours listed is for bidding purposes only.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
15 SQL Server Database Administrator Opt Ren 

Yr 2
2080.00000HOUR   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
80111608    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
SQL Server Database Administrator Opt Ren Yr 2-quantity of hours listed is for bidding purposes only.
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
16 SQL Server Database Administrator Opt Ren 

Yr 3
2080.00000HOUR   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
80111608    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
SQL Server Database Administrator Opt Ren Yr 3-quantity of hours listed is for bidding purposes only.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
17 Help Desk Analyst 2080.00000HOUR   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
80111608    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
4.1.5 Help Desk Analyst-quantity of hours listed is for bidding purposes only.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
18 Help Desk Analyst Optional Renewal Year 1 2080.00000HOUR   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
80111608    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Help Desk Analyst Optional Renewal Year 1-quantity of hours listed is for bidding purposes only.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
19 Help Desk Analyst Optional Renewal Year 2 2080.00000HOUR   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
80111608    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Help Desk Analyst Optional Renewal Year 2-quantity of hours listed is for bidding purposes only.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
20 Help Desk Analyst Optional Renewal Year 3 2080.00000HOUR   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
80111608    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Help Desk Analyst Optional Renewal Year 3-quantity of hours listed is for bidding purposes only.
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
21 Business Analyst 2080.00000HOUR 145.000000 301600.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
80111608    

Commodity Line Comments: Bidding

Extended Description:
4.1.6 Business Analyst-quantity of hours listed is for bidding purposes only.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
22 Business Analyst Optional Renewal Year 1 2080.00000HOUR 149.000000 309920.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
80111608    

Commodity Line Comments: Bidding

Extended Description:
Business Analyst Optional Renewal Year 1-quantity of hours listed is for bidding purposes only.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
23 Business Analyst Optional Renewal Year 2 2080.00000HOUR 154.000000 320320.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
80111608    

Commodity Line Comments: Bidding

Extended Description:
Business Analyst Optional Renewal Year 2-quantity of hours listed is for bidding purposes only.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
24 Business Analyst Optional Renewal Year 3 2080.00000HOUR 158.000000 328640.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
80111608    

Commodity Line Comments: Bidding

Extended Description:
Business Analyst Optional Renewal Year 3-quantity of hours listed is for bidding purposes only.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
25 Information Systems Assistant 2080.00000HOUR 135.000000 280800.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
80111608    

Commodity Line Comments: Bidding

Extended Description:
4.1.7 Information Systems Assistant-quantity of hours listed is for bidding purposes only.
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
26 Information Systems Assistant Optional 

Renewal Year 1
2080.00000HOUR 139.000000 289120.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
80111608    

Commodity Line Comments: Bidding

Extended Description:
Information Systems Assistant Optional Renewal Year 1-quantity of hours listed is for bidding purposes only.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
27 Information Systems Assistant Optional 

Renewal Year 2
2080.00000HOUR 143.000000 297440.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
80111608    

Commodity Line Comments: Bidding

Extended Description:
Information Systems Assistant Optional Renewal Year 2-quantity of hours listed is for bidding purposes only.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
28 Information Systems Assistant Optional 

Renewal Year 3
2080.00000HOUR 147.000000 305760.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
80111608    

Commodity Line Comments: Bidding

Extended Description:
Information Systems Assistant Optional Renewal Year 3-quantity of hours listed is for bidding purposes only.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
29 Programmer Analyst 2080.00000HOUR   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
80111608    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
4.1.8 Programmer Analyst-quantity of hours listed is for bidding purposes only.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
30 Programmer Analyst Optional Renewal Year 1 2080.00000HOUR   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
80111608    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Programmer Analyst Optional Renewal Year 1-quantity of hours listed is for bidding purposes only.
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
31 Programmer Analyst Optional Renewal Year 2 2080.00000HOUR   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
80111608    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Programmer Analyst Optional Renewal Year 2-quantity of hours listed is for bidding purposes only.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
32 Programmer Analyst Optional Renewal Year 3 2080.00000HOUR   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
80111608    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Programmer Analyst Optional Renewal Year 3-quantity of hours listed is for bidding purposes only.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
33 Senior Mainframe Application Analyst 2080.00000HOUR 150.000000 312000.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
80111608    

Commodity Line Comments: Bidding

Extended Description:
4.1.9 Senior Mainframe Application Analyst-quantity of hours listed is for bidding purposes only.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
34 Senior Mainframe Application Analyst 

Optional Ren Yr 1
2080.00000HOUR 155.000000 322400.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
80111608    

Commodity Line Comments: Bidding

Extended Description:
Senior Mainframe Application Analyst Optional Ren Yr 1-quantity of hours listed is for bidding purposes only.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
35 Senior Mainframe Application Analyst 

Optional Ren Yr 2
2080.00000HOUR 159.000000 330720.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
80111608    

Commodity Line Comments: Bidding

Extended Description:
Senior Mainframe Application Analyst Optional Ren Yr 2-quantity of hours listed is for bidding purposes only.
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
36 Senior Mainframe Application Analyst 

Optional Ren Yr 3
2080.00000HOUR 164.000000 341120.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
80111608    

Commodity Line Comments: Bidding

Extended Description:
Senior Mainframe Application Analyst Optional Ren Yr 3-quantity of hours listed is for bidding purposes only.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
37 Mainframe Application Analyst 2080.00000HOUR   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
80111608    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
4.1.10 Mainframe Application Analyst-quantity of hours listed is for bidding purposes only.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
38 Mainframe Application Analyst Renewal Yr 1 2080.00000HOUR   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
80111608    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Mainframe Application Analyst Renewal Yr 1-quantity of hours listed is for bidding purposes only.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
39 Mainframe Application Analyst Renewal Yr 2 2080.00000HOUR   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
80111608    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Mainframe Application Analyst Renewal Yr 2-quantity of hours listed is for bidding purposes only.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
40 Mainframe Application Analyst Renewal Yr 3 2080.00000HOUR   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
80111608    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Mainframe Application Analyst Renewal Yr 3-quantity of hours listed is for bidding purposes only.
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WV 25305, ESTADOS UNIDOS. 

TUNABEAR RESPONSE TO RFP TECHNICAL TEMPORARY STAFFING SERVICES -
SOLICITATION #: CRFQ-0511-MIS2500000001 

 

October 31, 2024 
 

Dear Crystal and Team, 

Thank you for the opportunity to submit a proposal for RFP#: CRFQ-0511-MIS2500000001
Technical Temporary Staffing Services for the State of West Virginia (“State”). Tunabear,
Inc., dba Tunabear Consulting, is a proud, minority-owned business from Dallas, Texas
specializing in IT Professional Services in Higher Education and Public Sector.  

Tunabear is uniquely qualified to provide the requested services. We have been in the 
business of serving Higher Education and Public Sector clients for our 14+ years of 
existence and, counting our Leadership Team’s prior lives, for over 38 years. Our 
primary specializations have historically been Information Technology Services and 
PeopleSoft/Oracle EBS/Cloud systems with successful implementations, conversions, 
integrations, upgrades, internal controls assessments, and support engagements 
throughout the US. Our roles have included both technical and functional project 
leadership, design, implementation, customizations, integration, testing and support. 

A significant example of our experience is the UC Path Project for the University of 
California (UC) System. The UC Path Project is the largest PeopleSoft implementation of 
Peoplesoft 9.2 HCM and Payroll. It encompasses the entire University of California (UC) 
System, tracking and paying over one million employees. For nearly eight years, our 
Team has been integrally involved with UC Path. During the height of the project, 
Tunabear had 17 consultants working on conversions for the Campus’ HCM, Benefits, and
Payroll data into UC Path and crosswalks/integrations from PeopleSoft Payroll and 
Benefits into each campuses’ unique Financials Systems. 

We are excited to present this proposal to the State and hope you consider us in your 
search for the best Technical Temporary Staffing resources. 

Sincerely, 
 
 

Benjamin Dai, CEO/President 
TUNABEAR INC 
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EXECUTIVE SUMMARY 

About Tunabear Consulting 

Tunabear Inc., dba Tunabear Consulting Services (Tunabear), is a successful Minority Business 
Enterprise (MBE) out of Dallas, Texas. Tunabear has 14 years of experience providing information 
technology and business consulting services throughout the United States. Having worked primarily with 
the Public/Higher Education Sectors, Tunabear has a unique edge in understanding how agencies manage 
their information technology services, conduct business, and use technologies to accomplish tasks. 

Since our inception, we have engaged with numerous clients nationwide to provide implementation, 
upgrade, and support services. Our team members have been responsible for successful implementations, 
support, and business consulting at universities and public agencies throughout Texas, Idaho, North 
Carolina, Michigan, Louisiana, Alabama, Florida, Wisconsin, Colorado, South Carolina, and California. 
In addition to a 10-year MSA to provide support services to all University of California System 
institutions, health centers, and research centers, we currently hold similar contracts with the State of 
Florida, the State of New Mexico, the State of South Carolina, and the City of Kansas City, Missouri. 
Each of these contracts are for general staffing arrangements, and some also include professional 
consulting services for project-based work. 

Tunabear's excellence in delivering quality IT solutions to our clients has resulted in a large percentage 
of repeat clients and a 95% retention rate for placed candidates. These successes are due to our 
leadership’s personalized and professional handling of consultant interactions and service delivery. Our 
general service capabilities include IT Staff Augmentation and project-related roles. Examples of these 
roles include program/project management, solution design, infrastructure, development, 
implementation, migration, conversion, upgrades, integration, process improvement, automation, 
customizations, organizational change management, quality assurance, internal controls, auditing, 
security, training, monitoring, and support. 

 

Project Scope 

The State has requested Technology-related Services, which include the following tasks: 

The West Virginia Purchasing Division is soliciting bids on behalf of West Virginia Office of Shared 
Administration, Office of Management Information Services (OMIS), also referred to as Agency or 
Department hereinafter, to establish multiple open-end contracts for technical temporary staffing 
services. This contract shall cover the following classifications: 

 Senior Web Application Analyst    

 Senior Application Oracle Database Administrator 

 Senior Application DB2 Database Administrator 

 SQL Server Database Administrator 

 Help Desk Analyst 
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 Business Analyst 

 Information Systems Assistant 

 Programmer Analyst 

 Senior Mainframe Application Analyst 

 Mainframe Application Analyst 

The position classifications listed above are to provide for the technical expertise to meet the contracted 
staffing needs for all entities within the West Virginia Office of Shared Administration, West Virginia 
Department of Health, West Virginia Department of Health Facilities, West Virginia Department of 
Human Services, and Office of Management Information Services (OMIS) for support of our IT efforts. 
This includes support for all Agencies that might have the need for these specific services. These services 
would be used to develop modifications and enhancements to the computer systems for the end-user State 
agency, as well as mentor, provide technical training and support and provide "shadowing" opportunities 
for State analysts, among other tasks as defined by the end-user State agency on its Delivery Order for 
the services.    

 

Having read the requirements for each task, Tunabear is highly qualified to deliver exceptional staff for 
the following IT services: 

 Senior Application Oracle Database Administrator 

 Business Analyst 

 Information Systems Assistant 

 Senior Mainframe Application Analyst 

 

Unlike many small consulting firms, Tunabear understands the unique needs of the public sector. This 
knowledge is critically important to provide excellence in every step of each project, by leveraging our 
expertise, the County will significantly increase the success rate of keeping systems and processes 
running accurately and efficiently. However, because the listed below are not within our areas of 
expertise, we are omitting them from our proposal: 

1. Senior Web Application Analyst 
2. Senior Application DB2 Database Administrator 
3. SQL Server Database Administrator 
4. Help Desk Analyst 
5. Programmer Analyst 
6. Mainframe Application Analyst 
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DETAILED RESPONSE 

Tunabear’s Qualifications and Previous Projects 

Since 2010 Tunabear has implemented, upgraded, and/or supported systems in numerous locations 
throughout the United States. Many projects and support roles in which we have participated required 
extensive, advanced systems analysis and design work for complex and diverse application systems with 
multiple sub-systems, programs, files, databases, and users. 

The following are some excellent examples of projects demonstrating our analytics and design support 
expertise: 

 From 2017 through 2021, Tunabear had up to twenty consultants working on the University of 
California Office of the President (UCOP) UCPath Project, a PeopleSoft HCM/Payroll 
implementation serving over 250,000 employees monthly. Tunabear brought in senior consultants 
to cover for other firms’ less experienced consultants. Our consultants delivered successful 
conversions and cutovers at UCLA, UC Santa Barbara, UC Riverside, UC Merced, ASUCLA, 
UC Berkeley, UC Davis, ANR, UC Irvine, UC Santa Cruz, UC Hastings, UC San Diego, and UC 
San Francisco.  

Tunabear senior consultants were integrally involved in the success of the UCOP Ascend Project which 
focused on a centralized, common Chart of Accounts (COA) for all campuses. The financial application 
at UCOP was Oracle EBS. Our consultants analyzed and mapped the accounts for several campuses to 
the new, centralized GL chart of accounts at UCOP and distributed Payroll costs to the campuses’ 
financial applications. This work went on to include conversions, outbound integration for Commitment 
Accounting entries, and inbound integration of Payroll entries.  

 At the University of North Carolina, Chapel Hill, our senior developers were key in developing 
all custom solutions and conversions for the Financials and HCM implementations and we were 
asked to continue supporting production for over a year after the systems were deployed.  

 At Lone Star College, the Tunabear team provided technical consulting services for the 
implementation project. Our work included system analysis, project management, process and 
data mapping, specifications, design, programming, technical and functional documentation, and 
user training and support, which resulted in a successful rollout at the College. We continue to be 
asked to support Lone Star’s systems. 

 At the University of Texas at Dallas, Tunabear provided Financials, HCM, Security, and 
Hyperion implementation and support services. We designed and rolled out a complex Payroll 
bolt-on for Summer Faculty Pay. In addition, with our assistance, UT Dallas saved over $350k 
annually with the automation of security administration.  

In addition to resources supplied to the above-mentioned agencies, Tunabear provides an integral pool 
of experienced resources for numerous agencies, institutions, and consulting services partners. 
Information and references about similar projects can be found in the Client References section below. 
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Tunabear Business References 

Tunabear has 14 years of Staff Augmentation experience, accumulating many contracts in that timespan, 
and too many to reproduce here. Below is a sample of the types of contracts we have fulfilled. 

 
Name: University of California, UCOP Phone No: (510) 587-6454 
Address: 1111 Franklin St, Oakland, CA 94607, USA 
Contract Award Date: 10/01/2021 Contract Completion: Ongoing 
Contract Name/Title: UC System-Wide IT Temporary and Professional Services 
Contac Person: Pei-Ru Chao Email: PeiRu.chao@ucop.edu 
Project Description: Developed Payroll Commitment accounting and labor distribution functions for 

Multiple campuses 

 
Name: Lone Star College Phone No.: 281-290-3724 
Address: 4141 Victory Dr, Houston, TX 77088, USA 
Contract Award Date: February 4, 2019 Contract Completion: February 3, 2023 
Contract Name/Title: Deliverable Based Information Technology Services 
Contac Person: Indrani Sampathkumar Email: Indrani.Sampathkumar@lonestar.edu 
Project Description: Oracle DBA OnDemand Services, such as Database Performance Tuning and 

troubleshooting, Everyday Database Maintenance. 

 
Contact Name: Clackamas County Phone No.: 503-722-6651 
Address: Public Services Building, 2051 Kaen Road #426 Oregon City, OR 97045, USA 
Contract Award Date: April 3, 2022 Contract Completion: June 30, 2024 
Contract Name/Title: As Needed Peoplesoft Upgrade and On-Call Services Consultant  
Contac Person: Casi Potter Email: cpotter@clackamas.us 
Project Description: PeopleSoft integration, customization, data conversion, upgrade, training, 

documentation, and deployments on an as-needed basis. 

 

Summary of Applicable Capabilities  
 
Tunabear’s capabilities highlighted in the Tunabear Team Service Offering include: 

 Application Services, including PeopleSoft, Oracle Cloud, Celonis, HubSpot, and Custom Web 
Applications. 

 BI, Data, Analytics, and Automation, including Celonis BI, Analytics, Automation, and 
Robotic Process Automation (RoboCorp, Python, JSON, UiPath). 

 IT Business Consulting Services, including GRC Maturity Assessments, Change Management, 
Security Assessment, Procurement Advisory Services, and IV&V Services. 

 Project and Program Management. 
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Services and Certifications 

Tunabear is a partner with both Oracle and Celonis, and we offer services from numerous certified 
consultants. Examples of our certifications include PeopleSoft, Oracle Cloud Applications, Oracle EBS, 
Salesforce, Celonis (Solution Professional, Implementation Professional, Sales Professional, App 
Creator), HubSpot, PMI (PMP), ISACA (CISA), AICPA (CPA), and others. Each of these certifications 
requires significant training and/or experience in the field. 

Tunabear has built its business on three key principles: 

 Advocacy – committing to clients directly and acting only in their best interest. Rather than focusing 
on the bottom line, Tunabear focuses on being a true advocate to its clients and partners, ensuring the 
very best outcomes. 

 Sustainability – Tunabear has 100% positive client references and has never been removed from a 
project. 

 Accountability– Tunabear understands the importance of their work and takes pride in providing 
excellent deliverables. Our team members take ownership of anything they do. 

Employment Procedures  

Tunabear Consulting uses a structured, well-managed approach to staffing that ensures the most 
qualified, responsive, and dedicated resources are assigned to our customers. Once the Prequalification 
is awarded to Tunabear Consulting, we will assign Account Managers to work with the Customers, and 
our entire team will work diligently to meet your customers’ needs and exceed their expectations.  

Tunabear’s Strategy for Managing Project Delays 

In every Staff Augmentation engagement, we recognize the importance of ensuring project continuity, 
even in the face of potential resource unavailability. To address this concern, we have established a 
comprehensive approach that follows the three steps described below. Tunabear offers a service 
guarantee by which we will use our Best Efforts to achieve a 100% Quality of Service.  

 Immediate Resource Replacement: In the event of a resource's unavailability, we rapidly initiate an 
immediate replacement process. We propose a new resource whose qualifications and skills are 
aligned with the project's demands. The proposed resource undergoes review and approval by 
Tunabear’s recruitment team. 

 Onboarding and Knowledge Transfer: Our onboarding process includes a comprehensive knowledge 
transfer phase. The new resource receives detailed project documentation, access to existing code 
repositories, and direct interaction with the outgoing resource (if feasible). This accelerates their 
understanding of the project's context, reducing downtime. 

 Task Redistribution: Project tasks are redistributed among the remaining team members in a manner 
that maintains project momentum and prioritizes critical deliverables. This ensures that the project 
remains on track while the new resource acclimates to their role. 
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Tunabear Inc Key Personnel  

At the heart of our organization is the belief that hiring top talent is crucial to achieving success. Our 
Dream Team is made up of skilled individuals who share a commitment to excellence in everything we 
do. We believe that by working together, we can achieve anything. 

When building our Dream Team, we looked for individuals who have a passion for their work and a 
desire to continuously learn and grow. Each member of our team brings a unique set of skills and 
knowledge that allows us to offer unparalleled service to our clients. 

Our Dream Team is made up of a diverse group of individuals who bring a range of skills and expertise 
to the table. Here's a quick introduction to each of our key players: 

Company Representative: 
Name: Benjamin Dai          
Title: CEO           
Address: 11711 Hillcrest Rd. Dallas, TX 75230-3109      
Phone: 888-882-7988          
E-Mail: bdai@tunabear.com   
 
Company Representative: 
Name:  Victoria Ferrary          
Title: Director of Operations         
Address: 11711 Hillcrest Rd. Dallas, TX 75230-3109      
Phone: 888-882-7988          
E-Mail:  victoria@tunabear.com         
      
Billing Representative: 
Name: Vivian Liu          
Title: Accountant          
Address: 11711 Hillcrest Rd. Dallas, TX 75230-3109      
Phone: 888-882-7988          
E-Mail: accounting@tunabear.com     

Advantages of Selecting Tunabear  

At Tunabear, our core values shape and influence our daily decision-making: Trust, Respect, Leadership, 
and Innovation. We will always provide excellent outcomes for all our valued clients, in general, and for 
the State specifically. Our team’s character is built on impeccable integrity and reliability. We are 
committed to always following through on our word.  

Tunabear values and respects our employees, business partners, and independent consultants, and 
empowers each to make ethical business decisions. Tunabear values innovative ideas and is willing to do 
whatever it takes to get the right tasks done right. 
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