
 
 
 

The  following  documentation  is  an  electronically‐
submitted  vendor  response  to  an  advertised 
solicitation  from  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing 
Bulletin  within  the  Vendor  Self‐Service  portal  at 
wvOASIS.gov.  As part of the State of West Virginia’s 
procurement  process,  and  to  maintain  the 
transparency  of  the  bid‐opening  process,  this 
documentation  submitted  online  is  publicly  posted 
by  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing  Division  at 
WVPurchasing.gov with any other vendor responses 
to  this  solicitation  submitted  to  the  Purchasing 
Division in hard copy format. 
 



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



Date Printed: Oct 29, 2024 Page: 1 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05

Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

State of West Virginia
Solicitation Response

Proc Folder: 1530726

Solicitation Description: MVTRUCK25 - 2025 OR LATEST MODEL VEHICLE

Proc Type: Statewide MA (Open End)

Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version

2024-10-29 13:30 SR 0212 ESR10282400000003053 1

VENDOR

000000200051
MATHENY MOTOR TRUCK CO

Solicitation Number: CRFQ 0212 SWC2500000003

Total Bid: 0 Response Date: 2024-10-28 Response Time: 18:49:27

Comments:  

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Mark A Atkins
(304) 558-2307
mark.a.atkins@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X                                                                     FEIN#                                                       DATE
All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation



Date Printed: Oct 29, 2024 Page: 2 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 Vendor shall use Exhibit_A Pricing Page(s) 

for bid pricing.
0.00000 EA 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
25100000    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
MVTRUCK25 - 2025 or latest model vehicle:
Note: Vendor shall use Exhibit_A Pricing Page(s) for bid pricing. 
If vendor is submitting a bid online, Vendor should enter $0.00 in the Oasis commodity line.



















































The ACORD name and logo are registered marks of ACORD

CERTIFICATE HOLDER

© 1988-2014 ACORD CORPORATION.  All rights reserved.
ACORD 25 (2014/01)

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

CANCELLATION

DATE (MM/DD/YYYY)CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE

LOCJECT
PRO-POLICY

GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER:

OCCURCLAIMS-MADE

COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY

PREMISES (Ea occurrence) $
DAMAGE TO RENTED
EACH OCCURRENCE $

MED EXP (Any one person) $

PERSONAL & ADV INJURY $

GENERAL AGGREGATE $

PRODUCTS - COMP/OP AGG $

$RETENTIONDED

CLAIMS-MADE

OCCUR

$

AGGREGATE $

EACH OCCURRENCE $UMBRELLA LIAB

EXCESS LIAB

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VEHICLES  (ACORD 101, Additional Remarks Schedule, may be attached if more space is required)

INSR
LTR TYPE OF INSURANCE POLICY NUMBER

POLICY EFF
(MM/DD/YYYY)

POLICY EXP
(MM/DD/YYYY) LIMITS

PER
STATUTE

OTH-
ER

E.L. EACH ACCIDENT

E.L. DISEASE - EA EMPLOYEE

E.L. DISEASE - POLICY LIMIT

$

$

$

ANY PROPRIETOR/PARTNER/EXECUTIVE

If yes, describe under
DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS below

(Mandatory in NH)
OFFICER/MEMBER EXCLUDED?

WORKERS COMPENSATION
AND EMPLOYERS' LIABILITY Y / N

AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY

ANY AUTO
ALL OWNED SCHEDULED

HIRED AUTOS
NON-OWNED

AUTOS AUTOS

AUTOS

COMBINED SINGLE LIMIT

BODILY INJURY (Per person)

BODILY INJURY (Per accident)
PROPERTY DAMAGE $

$

$

$

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED.  NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.

INSD
ADDL

WVD
SUBR

N / A

$

$

(Ea accident)

(Per accident)

OTHER:

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW.  THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.
IMPORTANT:  If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must be endorsed.  If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to
the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement.  A statement on this certificate does not confer rights to the
certificate holder in lieu of such endorsement(s).

COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER: REVISION NUMBER:

INSURED

PHONE
(A/C, No, Ext):

PRODUCER

ADDRESS:
E-MAIL

FAX
(A/C, No):

CONTACT
NAME:

NAIC #

INSURER A :

INSURER B :

INSURER C :

INSURER D :

INSURER E :

INSURER F :

INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN
ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.

10/7/2024

United Security Agency, Inc.
139 W. Main Street
Bridgeport WV 26330

Carla Dobbins
304-848-2642 304-842-7321

cdobbins@unitedsecurityagency.com

ERIE INSURANCE GROUP 26830
MATHMOT-01 Erie Insurance Exchange 26271

Matheny Motor Truck Company
PO Box 1304
Parkersburg WV 26102-1304

TRAVELERS 25674
Erie Ins Co Of NY 16233
Employers 10346

1544641506

A X 1,000,000
X 1,000,000

5,000

1,000,000

2,000,000

X

Q61-0427203 7/1/2024 7/1/2025

2,000,000

A
B
B

1,000,000

X Garage Liab.

Q07-5180942 - WV
Q07-0181496
Q07-0181495 - MD

7/1/2024
7/1/2024
7/1/2024

7/1/2025
7/1/2025
7/1/2025

A
C

X 10,000,000
X

Q31-5170364
2S53238A

10,000,000

7/1/2024
7/1/2024

7/1/2025
7/1/2025

D
E

Y

Q91-5102550
EIG2887877 04 FL & KS

7/1/2024
7/1/2024

7/1/2025
7/1/2025

X WV Broad Form

1,000,000

1,000,000

1,000,000
A
B
A

Dealers Physical Damage
Garage Keepers Legal Liability
Blanket Buildings & BPP

Q07-5180942
Q07-0181496
Q61-0427203

7/1/2024
7/1/2024
7/1/2024

7/1/2025
7/1/2025
7/1/2025

Dealers Physical Dama
Included
Buildings & BPP

See below

51,297,900

Named Insured's include: Matheny Motor Truck Co., The Matheny Family Limited Partnership, Matheny Ford, LLC, Matheny Insurance Services, LLC,
Matheny B-P-G AD Group, LLC, MMT Management Company, Allied Freightliner, LLC, Allied Truck Leasing, LLC, Matheny Fire and Emergency LLC,
Hino Trucks of Williamstown, LLC, Allied Holdings, LLC, Matheny Motors, Inc., Matheny Towing & Equipment LLC, Allied Partners, LLC, Allied Limited, LLC,
BlennHaven, LLC, Allied Capital LLC, GreenPower of WV, LLC, Premier GAP, LLC

Building & BPP Blanket amount for all locations: $42,586,100
Garage Dealers Blanket Physical Damage limit for all WV locations: $2,500,000

See Attached...

MVB Bank
1000 Johnson Ave.
Bridgeport WV 26330



ACORD 101 (2008/01)
The ACORD name and logo are registered marks of ACORD

© 2008 ACORD CORPORATION.  All rights reserved.

THIS ADDITIONAL REMARKS FORM IS A SCHEDULE TO ACORD FORM,
FORM NUMBER: FORM TITLE:

ADDITIONAL REMARKS

ADDITIONAL REMARKS SCHEDULE Page           of

AGENCY CUSTOMER ID:
LOC #:

AGENCY

CARRIER NAIC CODE

POLICY NUMBER

NAMED INSURED

EFFECTIVE DATE:

MATHMOT-01

1 1

United Security Agency, Inc. Matheny Motor Truck Company
PO Box 1304
Parkersburg WV 26102-1304

25 CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE

Loc. 1: 227-233 Ann Street, Parkersburg WV includes Garage Dealers Physical Damage limit of $100,000 with $2500 per auto deductible & $12,500 max
deductible & includes Garage Keepers coverage of $800,000 with $1,000 per auto deductible and $5,000 max deductible.
Loc. 2: 112 1/2 3rd Street, Parkersburg, WV includes Garage Dealers Physical Damage limit of $100,000 with $2500 per auto deductible and $12,500 max
deductible & includes Garage Keepers coverage of $50,000 with $1,000 per auto deductible and $5,000 max deductible.
Loc. 3: 102-122 3rd Street, Parkersburg, WV includes Garage Dealers Physical Damage limit of $2,650,000 with $2500 per auto deductible & $12,500 max
deductible & includes Garage Keepers coverage of $100,000 with $1,000 per auto deductible and $5,000 max deductible.
Loc. 4: 301-399 Ann Street, Parkersburg, WV includes Garage Dealers Physical Damage limit of $5,100,000 with $2500 per auto deductible & $12,500 max
deductible & includes Garage Keepers coverage of $300,000 with $1,000 per auto deductible and $5,000 max deductible.
Loc. 5: 18 12th Street, Parkersburg, WV includes Garage Dealers Physical Damage limit of $100,000 with $2500 per auto deductible & $12,500 max deductible
& includes Garage Keepers coverage of $400,000 with $1,000 per auto deductible and $5,000 max deductible.
Loc. 6: 1375 US Rt. 52, Kenova, WV includes Garage Dealers Physical Damage limit of $2,300,000 with $2500 per auto deductible & $12,500 max deductible &
includes Garage Keepers coverage of $1,000,000 with $1,000 per auto deductible and $5,000 max deductible.
Loc. 7: 50 Matheny Ln, Mineral Wells, WV includes Garage Dealers Physical Damage limit of $2,800,000 with $2500 per auto deductible & $12,500 max
deductible & includes Garage Keepers coverage of $1,000,000 with $1,000 per auto deductible and $5,000 max deductible.
Loc. 9: 4125 1st Ave, Nitro, WV includes Garage Dealers Physical Damage limit of $1,000,000 with $2500 per auto deductible & $12,500 max deductible &
includes Garage Keepers coverage of $1,000,000 with $1,000 per auto deductible and $5,000 max deductible.
Loc. 10: 201-225 Ann Street, Parkersburg, WV includes Garage Dealers Physical Damage limit of $400,000 with $2500 per auto deductible & $12,500 max
deductible & includes Garage Keepers coverage of $100,000 with $1,000 per auto deductible and $5,000 max deductible.
Loc. 11: 207 Matheny Lane, Mineral Wells, WV includes Garage Dealers Physical Damage limit of $700,000 with $2500 per auto deductible & $12,500 max
deductible & includes Garage Keepers coverage of $1,000,000 with $1,000 per auto deductible and $5,000 max deductible.
Loc. 12: 215 Matheny Lane, Mineral Wells, WV includes Garage Dealers Physical Damage limit of $300,000 with $2500 per auto deductible & $12,500 max
deductible & includes Garage Keepers coverage of $500,000 with $1,000 per auto deductible and $5,000 max deductible.
Loc. 13: 173 Matheny Lane, Mineral Wells, WV includes Garage Dealers Physical Damage limit of $300,000 with $2500 per auto deductible & $12,500 max
deductible & includes Garage Keepers coverage of $500,000 with $1,000 per auto deductible and $5,000 max deductible.
Loc. 14: 321 Hawk Highway, Lost Creek, WV includes Garage Dealers Physical Damage limit of $500,000 with $2500 per auto deductible & $12,500 max
deductible & includes Garage Keepers coverage of $1,000,000 with $1,000 per auto deductible and $5,000 max deductible.
Loc. 15: 309 3rd Street, St Marys, WV includes Garage Dealers Physical Damage limit of $3,500,000 with $2500 per auto deductible & $12,500 max deductible
& includes Garage Keepers coverage of $100,000 with $1,000 per auto deductible and $5,000 max deductible.
Loc. 16: 215 3rd Street, St Marys, WV includes Garage Dealers Physical Damage limit of $1,500,000 with $2500 per auto deductible & $12,500 max deductible
& includes Garage Keepers coverage of $100,000 with $1,000 per auto deductible and $5,000 max deductible.
Loc. 17: 308 3rd Street, St Marys, WV includes Garage Dealers Physical Damage limit of $250,000 with $2500 per auto deductible & $12,500 max deductible &
includes Garage Keepers coverage of $500,000 with $1,000 per auto deductible and $5,000 max deductible.
Loc. 19: 257 Matheny Lane, Mineral Wells, WV includes Garage Keepers coverage of $800,000 with $1,000 per auto deductible and $5,000 max deductible.
Loc. 20: 322 Dry Hill Rd, Beckley, WV includes Garage Dealers Physical Damage limit of $500,000 with $2500 per auto deductible & $12,500 max deductible &
includes Garage Keepers coverage of $1,000,000 with $1,000 per auto deductible and $5,000 max deductible.
Loc. 21: 109 Elizabeth Pike, Mineral Wells, WV includes Garage Dealers Physical Damage limit of $1,400,000 with $2500 per auto deductible & $12,500 max
deductible.
Loc. 22: 684 Southern Highway, Mineral Wells WV includes Garage Dealers Physical Damage limit of $1,000,000 with $2500 per auto deductible & $12,500
max deductible.
Loc. 23: 652 Southern Highway, Mineral Wells WV includes Garage Dealers Physical Damage limit of $2,500,000 with $2500 per auto deductible & $12,500
max deductible.

VA Garage Dealers Physical Damage & Garage Keepers:
Location 1: 14716 Industry Court, Woodbridge VA - Garage Dealers Physical Damage limit of $3,000,000 with $2,500 per auto deductible & $12,500 max
deductible and Garage Keepers limit of $1,500,000 with $1,000 deductible per auto and $5,000 max deductible per loss.
Location 2: 4144 S. Military Highway, Chesapeake VA - Garage Dealers Physical Damage limit of $500,000 with $2,500 per auto deductible & $12,500 max
deductible and Garage Keepers limit of $2,000,000 with $1,000 deductible per auto and $5,000 max deductible per loss.

MD Garage Dealers Physical Damage & Garage Keepers:
Location: 19932 Beaver Creek Road, Hagerstown, MD. Garage Dealers Physical Damage limit of $1,000,000 with $2,500 per auto deductible and $12,500
max deductible and Garage Keepers limit of $2,000,000 with $1,000 deductible per auto and $5,000 max deductible per loss.

MVB Bank is listed as Loss Payee on Garage Dealers Physical Damage.

Allied Capital LLC is a Named Insured on all policies for Matheny Motor Truck Company.





Vendor Name: Vendor Contact: STEVE SKINNER/JACOB WADE

Manufacturer/Brand: Phone No.: 304-485-4418

Model Name & Number: Email: SSKINNER@MATHENYMOTORS.COM/JWADE@MATHENYMOTORS.COM

Vehicle Requirements:

Classification:

Drive:

Passenger seating: Standard Color Code Color Description

Doors:

GAZ WHITE

Wheelbase:   

GVWR:   

Engine:

Additional Requirements:

Vendor Bid Response:

Vehicle fuel type

Gasoline

Flex-fuel

Diesel

CNG/Bifuel

Hybrid

Options:

25.00$                                  

0.25$                                    

*Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award.

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

-$                                                   

-$                                                   

-$                                                   

FOB Dealership:  (Deduct)

The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in 

section 3.1.1.1 of the specification.

Manufacturer's Standard Available Colors

Class 20 - Automobile 

Full Size Van 

-$                                                   

42,533.00$                                       

Unit Price

MATHENY GMC

GMC

SAVANA TG23406

Full Size Van

Rear wheel

8 minimum (including driver)

5, minimum:    1 Left Front, 1 Right 

Front,   1 Passenger Side Mid Body, 2 

Rear Facing.

134 in., minimum

6250 lbs. min,    9930 lbs. max.

6 cylinder minimum for gasoline 

engines, 4 cylinder minimum for 

diesel



Vendor Name: Vendor Contact: STEVE SKINNER/JACOB WADE

Manufacturer/Brand: Phone No.: 304-485-4418

Model Name & Number: Email: SSKINNER@MATHENYMOTORS.COM/JWADE@MATHENYMOTORS.COM

Vehicle Requirements:

Classification:

Drive:

Passenger seating: Standard Color Code Color Description

Doors:
GAZ WHITE

Wheelbase:   

GVWR:   

Engine:

Additional Requirements:

Vendor Bid Response:

Vehicle fuel type

Gasoline

Flex-fuel

Diesel

CNG/Bifuel

Hybrid

Options:

25.00$                                  

0.25$                                    

*Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award.

Unit Price

42,533.00$                                       

The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in 

section 3.1.1.1 of the specification.

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

-$                                                   

-$                                                   

-$                                                   

-$                                                   

FOB Dealership:  (Deduct)

12 minimum (including driver)

5, minimum:   1 Left Front, 1 Right 

Front,   1 Passenger Side Mid Body, 2 

Rear Facing.
134 in., minimum

6250 lbs. min,       9930 lbs. max.

6 cylinder minimum for gasoline 

engines, 4 cylinder minimum for 

diesel

Manufacturer's Standard Available Colors

Class 21 - Automobile 

Full Size Van 

MATHENY GMC

GMC

SAVANA TG23406

Full Size Van

Rear wheel



Vendor Name: Vendor Contact: STEVE SKINNER/JACOB WADE

Manufacturer/Brand: Phone No.: 304-485-4418

Model Name & Number: Email: SSKINNER@MATHENYMOTORS.COM/JWADE@MATHENYMOTORS.COM

Vehicle Requirements:

Classification:

Drive:

Passenger seating: Standard Color Code Color Description

Doors:

GAZ WHITE

Wheelbase:   

GVWR:   

Engine:

Additional Requirements:

Vendor Bid Response:

Vehicle fuel type

Gasoline

Flex-fuel

Diesel

CNG/Bifuel

Hybrid

Options:

25.00$                                  

0.25$                                    

*Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award.

Unit Price

44,345.00$                                       

The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in 

section 3.1.1.1 of the specification.

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

-$                                                   

-$                                                   

-$                                                   

-$                                                   

FOB Dealership:  (Deduct)

15 minimum (including driver)

5, minimum:   1 Left Front, 1 Right 

Front,   1 Passenger Side Mid Body, 2 

Rear Facing.

134 in., minimum

6250 lbs. min,    9930 lbs. max.

6 cylinder minimum for gasoline 

engines, 4 cylinder minimum for 

diesel

Manufacturer's Standard Available Colors

Class 22 - Automobile 

Full Size Van 

MATHENY GMC

GMC

SAVANA TG33706

Full Size Van

Rear Wheel



Vendor Name: Vendor Contact: STEVE SKINNER/JACOB WADE

Manufacturer/Brand: Phone No.: 304-485-4418

Model Name & Number: Email: SSKINNER@MATHENYMOTORS.COM/JWADE@MATHENYMOTORS.COM

Vehicle Requirements:

Classification:

Drive:

Passenger seating: Standard Color Code Color Description

Doors: GAZ WHITE

Wheelbase:   

GVWR:   

Engine:

Additional Requirements:

Vendor Bid Response:

Vehicle fuel type

Gasoline

Flex-fuel

Diesel

CNG/Bifuel

Hybrid

Options:

25.00$                                  

0.25$                                    

*Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award.

The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in 

section 3.1.1.1 of the specification.

Manufacturer's Standard Available Colors

-$                                                   

FOB Dealership:  (Deduct)

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

Unit Price

37,753.00$                                       

-$                                                   

-$                                                   

-$                                                   

Rear door windows

6 cylinder minimum for gasoline 

engines, 4 cylinder minimum for 

diesel

Class 23 - Automobile 

Cargo Van  

2  minimum (including driver)

3, minimum

118 in., minimum

6250 lbs. min,   9930 lbs. max.

MATHENY GMC

GMC

SAVANA TG23405

Cargo Van

2 wheel, rear wheel, or front wheel



Vendor Name: Vendor Contact: STEVE SKINNER/JACOB WADE

Manufacturer/Brand: Phone No.: 304-485-4418

Model Name & Number: Email: SSKINNER@MATHENYMOTORS.COM/JWADE@MATHENYMOTORS.COM

Vehicle Requirements:

Classification:

Drive:

Passenger seating: Standard Color Code Color Description

Doors: GAZ

Wheelbase:

GVWR:

Engine:

Tow Package:

Bed Length:

Switches: 

Bedliner: 

Additional Requirments

Vendor Bid Response:

Vehicle fuel type

Gasoline

Flex-fuel

Diesel

CNG/Bifuel

Hybrid

Options:

25.00$                                  

0.25$                                    

*Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award.

Installed Spray-In Liner

Factory Running Boards/Step Bars, 

cab length

4 Wheel/All wheel

Standard length meeting 

specifications

Factory Complete: Includes 

integrated electric trailer brake 

controller, hitch, and wiring

2 minimum (including driver)

2, minimum

133 in., minimum

8650 lbs. min,   10,000 lbs. max.

8 cylinder minimum for gasoline 

engines, 6 cylinder minimum for 

diesel engines

Manufacturer's Standard Available Colors

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

Class 24 - Automobile 

Large Pick Up Regular Cab 

-$                                                   

FOB Dealership:  (Deduct)

-$                                                   

The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of the specification.

Unit Price

44,757.00$                                       

-$                                                   

-$                                                   

MATHENY GMC

GMC

SIERRA 2500 TK20903

Large Pick Up Reg Cab

Minimum three (3) Factory Installed 

Up-Fitter switches



Vendor Name: Vendor Contact: STEVE SKINNER/JACOB WADE

Manufacturer/Brand: Phone No.: 304-485-4418

Model Name & Number: Email: SSKINNER@MATHENYMOTORS.COM/JWADE@MATHENYMOTORS.COM

Vehicle Requirements:

Classification:

Drive:

Passenger seating: Standard Color Code Color Description

Doors: GAZ WHITE

Wheelbase:

GVWR:

Engine:

Off Road Package:

Tow Package:

Switches:

Slush/All Weather Mats

Bed Length:

Bedliner:

Sliding rear window:

Additional Requirements:

Vendor Bid Response:

Vehicle fuel type

Gasoline

Flex Fuel

Diesel

CNG/Bifuel

Hybrid

Options:

25.00$                                  

0.25$                                    

*Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award.

The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of the specification.

Large Pick Up Extended Cab

4 minimum (including driver)

4, minimum

141 in., minimum

8600 lbs. min,    10,000 lbs. max

8 cylinder minimum for gasoline 

engines, 6 cylinder minimum for 

diesel engines

Includes but not limited to: Limited 

Slip rear axle, traction lock 

differential, heavy duty engine 

cooling, skid plates, heavy duty 

suspension with gas shocks, tow 

hooks and all terrain tires.

4 Wheel/All wheel with High/Low Range Manufacturer's Standard Available Colors

Short

Minimum of three (3) Factory Up-

Fitter Switches.

Factory Running Boards/Step Bars, 

cab length

-$                                                   

FOB Dealership:  (Deduct)

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

Class 25 - Automobile 

Large Pick Up Extended Cab 

Factory Complete: Includes 

integrated electric trailer brake 

controller, hitch, and wiring

Installed on driver and passenger 

front and second row, except where 

vinyl floor covering is present. 

Installed Spray-In Liner

Not Required

46,929.00$                                       

47,029.00$                                       

55,997.00$                                       

-$                                                   

Unit Price

MATHENY GMC

GMC

SIERRA 2500 TK20753



Vendor Name: Vendor Contact: STEVE SKINNER/JACOB WADE

Manufacturer/Brand: Phone No.: 304-485-4418

Model Name & Number: Email: SSKINNER@MATHENYMOTORS.COM/JWADE@MATHENYMOTORS.COM

Vehicle Requirements:

Classification:

Drive:

Passenger seating: Standard Color Code Color Description

Doors: GAZ WHITE

Wheelbase:

GVWR:

Engine:

Tow Package:

Switches:

Additional Requirements:

Bedliner:

Vendor Bid Response:

Vehicle fuel type

Gasoline

Flex-fuel

Diesel

CNG/Bifuel

Hybrid

Options:

25.00$                                  

0.25$                                    

*Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award.

FOB Dealership:  (Deduct)

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

-$                                                   

-$                                                   

MATHENY GMC

GMC

SIERRA 2500 TK20743

Large Pick Up Crew Cab

Rear Wheel

5 minimum (including driver)

4 full doors, minimum

148 in., minimum

8,750 lbs. min,                                      

10,000 lbs. max                   
8 cylinder minimum for gasoline 

engines, 6 cylinder minimum for 

diesel

Factory Complete: Includes 

integrated electric trailer brake 

controller, hitch, and wiring

Installed Spray-In Liner

Class 26 - Automobile 

Large Pick Up Crew Cab 

Unit Price

48,313.00$                                       

48,413.00$                                       

56,664.00$                                       

The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of the specification.

Factory Running Boards/Step Bars, 

cab length

Manufacturer's Standard Available Colors

Minimum of three (3) Factory Up-Fitter 

Switches.



Vendor Name: Vendor Contact: STEVE SKINNER/JACOB WADE

Manufacturer/Brand: Phone No.: 304-485-4418

Model Name & Number: Email: SSKINNER@MATHENYMOTORS.COM/JWADE@MATHENYMOTORS.COM

Vehicle Requirements:

Classification:

Drive:

Passenger seating: Standard Color Code Color Description

Doors: GAZ WHITE

Wheelbase:

GVWR:

Engine:

Tow Package:

Switches:

Bed: 

Bedliner:

Additional Requirements

Vendor Bid Response:

Vehicle fuel type

Gasoline

Flex-fuel

Diesel

CNG/Bifuel

Hybrid

Options:

25.00$                                  

0.25$                                    

*Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award.

Minimum of three (3) Factory Up-

Fitter Switches.

Factory Running Boards/Step Bars, 

cab length

148 in., minimum

8,750 lbs. min,                                      

10,000 lbs. max                   

8 cylinder minimum for gasoline 

engines, 6 cylinder minimum for 

diesel

Class 27 - Automobile 

Large Pick Up Crew Cab 

MATHENY GMC

GMC

SIERRA 2500 TK20943

Large Pick Up Crew Cab

Manufacturer's Standard Available Colors

-$                                                   

FOB Dealership:  (Deduct)

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

Minimum 8 Ft Bed. 

Unit Price

48,499.00$                                       

48,599.00$                                       

-$                                                   

-$                                                   

The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of the specification.

Factory Complete: Includes 

integrated electric trailer brake 

controller, hitch, and wiring

4WD

5 minimum (including driver)

4 full doors, minimum

Installed Spray-In Liner



Vendor Name: Vendor Contact: STEVE SKINNER/JACOB WADE

Manufacturer/Brand: Phone No.: 304-485-4418

Model Name & Number: Email: SSKINNER@MATHENYMOTORS.COM/JWADE@MATHENYMOTORS.COM

Vehicle Requirements:

Classification:

Drive:

Passenger seating: Standard Color Code Color Description

Doors: GAZ WHITE

Wheelbase:

GVWR:

Engine:

Off Road Package:

Tow Package:

Switches:

Bed:

Bedliner:

Slush/All-weather mats

Sliding Rear Window: 

Additional Requirements:

Vendor Bid Response:

Vehicle fuel type

Gasoline

Flex-fuel

Diesel

CNG/Bifuel

Hybrid

Options:

25.00$                                  

0.25$                                    

*Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award.

Class 28 - Automobile 

Large Pick Up Crew Cab 

The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of the specification.

Unit Price

48,778.00$                                       

48,878.00$                                       

MATHENY GMC

GMC

SIERRA TK20743

Large Pick Up Crew Cab

4 Wheel/All Wheel with High and Low 

Range

5 minimum (including driver)

Installed Spray-In Liner

Installed on driver and passenger 

front and second row, except where 

vinyl floor covering is present. 

Not Required

4 full doors, minimum

Manufacturer's Standard Available Colors

-$                                                   

-$                                                   

FOB Dealership:  (Deduct)

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

57,129.00$                                       

Factory Running Boards/Step Bars, 

cab length

148 in., minimum

8,800 lbs. min,    10,000. lbs. max                   

8 cylinder minimum for gasoline 

engines, 6 cylinder minimum for 

diesel
Includes but not limited to: Limited 

Slip rear axle, traction lock 

differential, heavy duty engine 

cooling, skid plates, heavy duty 

suspension with gas shocks, tow 

hooks and all terrain tires.

Short bed

Factory Complete: Includes 

integrated electric trailer brake 

controller, hitch, and wiring

Minimum of three (3) Factory Up-

Fitter Switches.



Vendor Name: Vendor Contact: STEVE SKINNER/JACOB WADE

Manufacturer/Brand: Phone No.: 304-485-4418

Model Name & Number: Email: SSKINNER@MATHENYMOTORS.COM/JWADE@MATHENYMOTORS.COM

Vehicle Requirements:

Classification:

Drive:

Passenger seating: Standard Color Code Color Description

Doors: GAZ WHITE

Wheelbase:

GVWR:

Engine:

Off Road Package:

Tow Package:

Switches:

Bed:

Bedliner:

Snow plow prep package:

Additional Requirements:

Vendor Bid Response:

Vehicle fuel type

Gasoline

Flex-fuel

Diesel

CNG/Bifuel

Options:

25.00$                                  

0.25$                                    

*Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award.

8 cylinder minimum for gasoline 

engines, 6 cylinder minimum for 

diesel

Includes but not limited to: Limited 

Slip rear axle, traction lock 

differential, heavy duty engine 

cooling, skid plates, heavy duty 

suspension with gas shocks, tow 

hooks and all terrain tires.

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of the specification.

Unit Price

48,538.00$                                       

56,889.00$                                       

-$                                                   

Factory Complete: Includes 

integrated electric trailer brake 

controller, hitch, and wiring

Minimum of three (3) Factory Up-

Fitter Switches.

Factory Running Boards/Step Bars, 

cab length

Manufacturer's Standard Available Colors

Class 29 - Automobile 

Large Pick Up  Regular Cab 

-$                                                   

FOB Dealership:  (Deduct)

MATHENY GMC

GMC

SIERRA TK30903

Large Pick Up Reg Cab

4 Wheel/All wheel

2 minimum (including driver)

Long bed (8')

Installed Spray-In Liner

Installed

2, minimum

140 in., minimum

13,000 lbs. min,                    



Vendor Name: Vendor Contact: STEVE SKINNER/JACOB WADE

Manufacturer/Brand: Phone No.: 304-485-4418

Model Name & Number: Email: SSKINNER@MATHENYMOTORS.COM/JWADE@MATHENYMOTORS.COM

Vehicle Requirements:

Classification:

Drive:

Passenger seating: Standard Color Code Color Description

Doors: GAZ WHITE

Wheelbase:

GVWR:

Engine:

Off Road Package:

Tow Package:

Switches:

Bed:

Bedliner:

Snow plow prep package:

Additional Requirements:

Vendor Bid Response:

Vehicle fuel type

Gasoline

Flex-fuel

Diesel

CNG/Bifuel

Options:

25.00$                                  

0.25$                                    

*Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award.

Class 30 - Automobile 

Large Pick Up  Super Cab 

MATHENY GMC

GMC

SIERRA 3500 TK20953

Large Pick Up Super Cab

Installed

Manufacturer's Standard Available Colors

5 minimum (including driver)

4, minimum

140 in., minimum

13,000 lbs. min,                    

8 cylinder minimum for gasoline 

engines, 6 cylinder minimum for 

diesel

4 Wheel/All wheel

Includes but not limited to: Limited 

Slip rear axle, traction lock 

differential, heavy duty engine 

cooling, skid plates, heavy duty 

suspension with gas shocks, tow 

hooks and all terrain tires.
Factory Complete: Includes 

integrated electric trailer brake 

controller, hitch, and wiring

Minimum of three (3) Factory Up-

Fitter Switches.

Long bed (8')

Installed Spray-In Liner

-$                                                   

FOB Dealership:  (Deduct)

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

Factory Running Boards/Step Bars, 

cab length

The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of the specification.

Unit Price

49,667.00$                                       

49,767.00$                                       

57,462.00$                                       



Vendor Name: Vendor Contact: STEVE SKINNER/JACOB WADE

Manufacturer/Brand: Phone No.: 304-485-4418

Model Name & Number: Email: SSKINNER@MATHENYMOTORS.COM/JWADE@MATHENYMOTORS.COM

Vehicle Requirements:

Classification:

Drive:

Passenger seating: Standard Color Code Color Description

Doors: GAZ WHITE

Wheelbase:

GVWR:

Engine:

Torque: 

Rear Axle: 

Tow Capacity: 

Tow Package:

Switches:

Slush/All weather Mats

Bedliner:

Additional Requirements: 

Additional Requirements:

Vendor Bid Response:

Vehicle Fuel Type

Diesel

Gasoline

Options:

25.00$                                  

0.25$                                    

*Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award.

Minimum of three (3) Factory Up-

Fitter Switches.

Factory Running Boards/Step Bars, 

cab length

Installed on driver and passenger 

front and second row, except where 

vinyl floor covering is present. 

The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of the specification.

57,836.00$                                       

FOB Dealership:  (Deduct)

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

Installed Spray-In Liner

All-Season Tires, Full size spare, frame 

mounted with jack

Unit Price

49,485.00$                                       

Class 31 - Automobile 

1 Ton, Dual Rear Wheel, Super Cab

MATHENY GMC

GMC

SIERRA 3500 TK30953

1 Ton Dual Rear wheel super cab 

Manufacturer's Standard Available Colors

Installed Receiver Hitch & 7-pin 

Wiring, Trailer Tow Side Electric 

Mirrors, Factory Installed Electric 

Trailer Brake Controller 

Minimum of 765 lb. ft.
Minimum 3.73 Ratio (Gas), Minimum 

3.42 (Diesel). Must include Limited 

Slip/Traction Lock with Dual Rear 

19,000 lbs. minimum

4 Wheel Drive 

Minimum of 5(including driver) 

4, minimum 

158” – 176"

14,000 minimum         
Minimum 6.6 Liter Turbo Diesel with 

Engine Block Heater; 8 cylinder 

Gasoline



Vendor Name: Vendor Contact: STEVE SKINNER/JACOB WADE

Manufacturer/Brand: Phone No.: 304-485-4418

Model Name & Number: Email: SSKINNER@MATHENYMOTORS.COM/JWADE@MATHENYMOTORS.COM

Vehicle Requirements:

Classification:

Drive:

Passenger seating: Standard Color Code Color Description

Doors: GAZ WHITE

Wheelbase:  

GVWR:

Engine:

Torque: 

Rear Axle: 

Tow Capacity: 

Tow Package:

Switches:

Slush/All weather Mats

Bedliner:

Additional Requirements: 

Additional Requirements:

Vendor Bid Response:

Vehicle Fuel Type

Diesel

Gasoline

Options:

25.00$                                  

0.25$                                    

*Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award.

Class 32 - Automobile 

1 Ton, Dual Rear Wheel, Crew Cab

MATHENY GMC

GMC

SIERRA 3500 TK30943

1 Ton Dual Rear wheel Crew Cab

Spray-in bed liner only

Manufacturer's Standard Available Colors

Minimum of 5(including driver)

4, minimum 

158” – 176"

14,000 minimum         
Minimum 6.6 Liter Turbo Diesel with 

Engine Block Heater; 8 cylinder 

Gasoline

4 Wheel Drive 

Minimum of 765 lb. ft.
Minimum 3.73 Ratio (Gas), Minimum 

3.42 (Diesel). Must include Limited 

Slip/Traction Lock with Dual Rear 

19,000 lbs. minimum

Installed Receiver Hitch & 7-pin 

Wiring, Trailer Tow Side Electric 

Mirrors, Factory Installed Electric 

Trailer Brake Controller 

Installed on driver and passenger 

front and second row, except where 

vinyl floor covering is present. 

Minimum of three (3) Factory Up-

Fitter Switches.

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

All-Season Tires, Full size spare, frame 

mounted with jack

The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of the specification.

Unit Price

59,685.00$                                       

51,334.00$                                       

FOB Dealership:  (Deduct)

Factory Running Boards/Step Bars, 

cab length



Vendor Name: Vendor Contact:

Manufacturer/Brand: Phone No.:

Model Name & Number: Email: 

Vehicle Requirements:

Classification:

Drive:

Passenger seating: Standard Color Code Color Description

Doors:

Wheelbase:

GVWR:

Engine:

Transmission:

Torque: 

Rear Axle: 

Tow Package:

Switches:

Slush/All weather Mats

Bed:

Additional Requirements:

Additional Requirements: 

Additional Requirements:

Vendor Bid Response:

Vehicle Fuel Type

Gasoline

Options:

$

$

*Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award.

Unit Price

-$                                                   

FOB Dealership:  (Deduct)

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

Automatic

Minimum 3.73 Ratio Limited 

Slip/Traction Lock with Dual Rear 

Wheels
Towing Harness, Trailer Tow Side 

Electric Mirrors, Factory Installed 

Electric Trailer Brake Controller 

Installed on driver and passenger 

front and second row, except where 

vinyl floor covering is present. 

The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of the specification.                                    

Minimum of three (3) Factory Up-

Fitter Switches.

Factory Running Boards/Step Bars, 

cab length

Manufacturer's Standard Available Colors

PTO Take-off Provision

2 Wheel Drive 

Class 33 - Automobile 

1 Ton, Dual Rear Wheel,  Cab/Chassis, Regular Cab

MATHENY GMC

NO BID

1 Ton Dual Rear wheel Regular cab 

Must be able to accept bed body 

minimum length 9'

All-Season Tires, Full size spare, frame 

mounted with jack

Minimum of 3(including driver) 

2, minimum 

135" – 145”

14,000 minimum         

Minimum of 400 lb. ft.

Minimum 8 cylinder gasoline engine 



Vendor Name: Vendor Contact:

Manufacturer/Brand: Phone No.:

Model Name & Number: Email: 

Vehicle Requirements:

Classification:

Drive:

Passenger seating: Standard Color Code Color Description

Doors:

Wheelbase:

GVWR:

Engine:

Transmission:

Torque: 

Rear Axle: 

Tow Package:

Switches:

Slush/All weather Mats

Bed:

Additional Requirements:

Additional Requirements: 

Additional Requirements:

Vendor Bid Response:

Vehicle Fuel Type

Diesel

Options:

$

$

*Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award.

Class 34 - Automobile 

1 Ton, Dual Rear Wheel,  Cab/Chassis, Regular Cab

MATHENY GMC

NO BID

1 Ton Dual Rear wheel Regular cab 

FOB Dealership:  (Deduct)

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

All-Season Tires, Full size spare, frame 

mounted with jack

Minimum of 3(including driver) 

2, minimum 

135" – 145”

14,000 minimum         

Minimum 6.2 Liter Turbo Diesel with 

Engine Block Heater 

Automatic

Minimum of 765 lb. ft.

Minimum 3.42 Ratio.  Must include 

Limited Slip/Traction Lock with Dual 

Rear Wheels

Towing Harness, Trailer Tow Side 

Electric Mirrors, Factory Installed 

Electric Trailer Brake Controller 

Installed on driver and passenger 

front and second row, except where 

vinyl floor covering is present. 

Must be able to accept bed body 

minimum length 9'

Minimum of three (3) Factory Up-

Fitter Switches.

Factory Running Boards/Step Bars, 

cab length

Manufacturer's Standard Available Colors

PTO Take-Off Provision

The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of the specification.                                   

Unit Price

-$                                                   

2 Wheel Drive 



Vendor Name: Vendor Contact:

Manufacturer/Brand: Phone No.:

Model Name & Number: Email: 

Vehicle Requirements:

Classification:

Drive:

Passenger seating: Standard Color Code Color Description

Doors:

Wheelbase:

GVWR:

Engine:

Transmission:

Torque: 

Rear Axle: 

Tow Package:

Switches:

Slush/All weather Mats

Bed:

Additional Requirements:

Additional Requirements: 

Additional Requirements:

Vendor Bid Response:

Vehicle Fuel Type

Gasoline

Options:

$

$

*Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award.

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

Minimum of 400 lb. ft.
Minimum 3.73 Ratio Limited 

Slip/Traction Lock with Dual Rear 

Wheels
Towing Harness, Trailer Tow Side 

Electric Mirrors, Factory Installed 

Electric Trailer Brake Controller

Installed on driver and passenger 

front and second row, except where 

vinyl floor covering is present. 

Must be able to accept bed body 

minimum length 9'

All-Season Tires, Full size spare, frame 

mounted with jack

The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of the specification.                                           

Unit Price

-$                                                   

FOB Dealership:  (Deduct)

Minimum of three (3) Factory Up-

Fitter Switches.

Factory Running Boards/Step Bars, 

cab length

Manufacturer's Standard Available Colors

PTO Take-Off Provision

Automatic

Class 35 - Automobile 

1 Ton, Dual Rear Wheel,  Cab/Chassis, Regular Cab

MATHENY GMC

NO BID

1 Ton Dual Rear wheel Regular cab 

4 Wheel Drive 

Minimum of 3(including driver) 

2, minimum 

135" – 145”

14,000 minimum         

Minimum 8 cylinder gasoline engine 



Vendor Name: Vendor Contact: STEVE SKINNER/JACOB WADE

Manufacturer/Brand: Phone No.: 304-485-4418

Model Name & Number: Email: SSKINNER@MATHENYMOTORS.COM/JWADE@MATHENYMOTORS.COM

Vehicle Requirements:

Classification:

Drive:

Passenger seating: Standard Color Code Color Description

Doors: GAZ WHITE

Wheelbase:

GVWR:

Engine:

Transmission:

Torque: 

Rear Axle: 

Tow Package:

Switches:

Slush/All weather Mats

Bed:

Additional Requirements:

Additional Requirements: 

Additional Requirements:

Vendor Bid Response:

Vehicle Fuel Type

Diesel

Options:

25.00$                                  

0.25$                                    

*Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award.

Class 36 - Automobile 

1 Ton, Dual Rear Wheel,  Cab/Chassis, Regular Cab

MATHENY GMC

GMC

SIERRA 3500 TK31003

1 Ton Dual Rear wheel Regular cab 

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

All-Season Tires, Full size spare, frame 

mounted with jack

Minimum of 3(including driver) 

2, minimum 

135" – 145”

14,000 minimum         

Minimum 6.2 Liter Turbo Diesel with 

Engine Block Heater 

Automatic

Minimum of 765 lb. ft.

Minimum 3.42 Ratio.  Must include 

Limited Slip/Traction Lock with Dual 

Rear Wheels
Towing Harness, Trailer Tow Side 

Electric Mirrors, Factory Installed 

Electric Trailer Brake Controller

Installed on driver and passenger 

front and second row, except where 

vinyl floor covering is present. 

Must be able to accept bed body 

minimum length 9'

Minimum of three (3) Factory Up-

Fitter Switches.

Factory Running Boards/Step Bars, 

cab length

Manufacturer's Standard Available Colors

The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of the specification.                             

Unit Price

54,969.00$                                       

FOB Dealership:  (Deduct)

4 Wheel Drive 

PTO Take-Off Provision



Vendor Name: Vendor Contact:

Manufacturer/Brand: Phone No.:

Model Name & Number: Email: 

Vehicle Requirements:

Classification:

Drive:

Passenger seating: Standard Color Code Color Description

Doors:

Wheelbase:

GVWR:

Engine:

Transmission:

Torque: 

Rear Axle: 

Tow Package:

Switches:

Slush/All weather Mats

Bed:

Additional Requirements:

Additional Requirements: 

Additional Requirements:

Vendor Bid Response:

Vehicle Fuel Type

Gasoline

Options:

$

$

*Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award.

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

Minimum of 400 lb.ft.

Minimum 3.73 Ratio Limited 

Slip/Traction Lock with Dual Rear 

Wheels

Towing Harnes, Trailer Tow Side 

Electric Mirrors, Factory Installed 

Electric Trailer Brake Controller

Installed on driver and passenger 

front and second row, except where 

vinyl floor covering is present. 

Must be able to accept bed body 

minimum length 9'

All-Season Tires, Full size spare, frame 

mounted with jack

The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of the specification.       

Unit Price

-$                                                   

FOB Dealership:  (Deduct)

PTO Take-Off Provision

Minimum of three (3) Factory Up-

Fitter Switches.

Factory Running Boards/Step Bars, 

cab length

Manufacturer's Standard Available Colors

Automatic

Class 37 - Automobile 

1 Ton, Dual Rear Wheel,  Cab/Chassis, Crew Cab

MATHENY GMC

NO BID

1 Ton Dual Rear wheel Crew cab 

2 Wheel Drive 

Minimum of 5(including driver) 

4, minimum 

170" – 180”

14,000 minimum         

Minimum 8 cylinder gasoline engine 



Vendor Name: Vendor Contact:

Manufacturer/Brand: Phone No.:

Model Name & Number: Email: 

Vehicle Requirements:

Classification:

Drive:

Passenger seating: Standard Color Code Color Description

Doors:

Wheelbase:

GVWR:

Engine:

Transmission:

Torque: 

Rear Axle: 

Tow Package:

Switches:

Slush/All weather Mats

Bed:

Additional Requirements: 

Additional Requirements: 

Additional Requirements: 

Vendor Bid Response:

Vehicle Fuel Type

Diesel

Options:

$

$

*Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award.

Class 38 - Automobile 

1 Ton, Dual Rear Wheel,  Cab/Chassis, Crew Cab

MATHENY GMC

NO BID

1 Ton Dual Rear wheel Crew cab 

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

All-Season Tires, Full size spare, frame 

mounted with jack

Minimum of 5(including driver) 

/Cloth, Leather or Vinyl Seats

4, minimum 

170" – 180”

14,000 minimum         

Minimum 6.2 Liter Turbo Diesel with 

Engine Block Heater 

Automatic

Minimum of 765 lb. ft.

Minimum 3.42 Ratio.  Must include 

Limited Slip/Traction Lock with Dual 

Rear Wheels

Towing Harnes, Trailer Tow Side 

Electric Mirrors, Factory Installed 

Electric Trailer Brake Controller

Installed on driver and passenger 

front and second row, except where 

vinyl floor covering is present. 

Must be able to accept bed body 

minimum length 9'

PTO Take-Off Provision

Minimum of three (3) Factory Up-

Fitter Switches.

Factory Running Boards/Step Bars, 

cab length

Manufacturer's Standard Available Colors

The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of the specification.        

Unit Price

-$                                                   

FOB Dealership:  (Deduct)

2 Wheel Drive 



Vendor Name: Vendor Contact:

Manufacturer/Brand: Phone No.:

Model Name & Number: Email: 

Vehicle Requirements:

Classification:

Drive:

Passenger seating: Standard Color Code Color Description

Doors:

Wheelbase:

GVWR:

Engine:

Transmission:

Torque: 

Rear Axle: 

Tow Package:

Switches:

Slush/All weather Mats

Bed:

Additional Requirements: 

Additional Requirements: 

Additional Requirements: 

Vendor Bid Response:

Vehicle Fuel Type

Gasoline

Options:

$

$

*Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award.

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

Minimum of 400 lb. ft.

Minimum 3.73 Ratio Limited 

Slip/Traction Lock with Dual Rear 

Wheels

Towing Harness, Trailer Tow Side 

Electric Mirrors, Factory Installed 

Electric Trailer Brake Controller

Installed on driver and passenger 

front and second row, except where 

vinyl floor covering is present. 

Must be able to accept bed body 

minimum length 9'

All-Season Tires, Full size spare, frame 

mounted with jack

The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of the specification.          

Unit Price

-$                                                   

FOB Dealership:  (Deduct)

PTO Take-Off Provision

Minimum of three (3) Factory Up-

Fitter Switches.

Factory Running Boards/Step Bars, 

cab length

Manufacturer's Standard Available Colors

Automatic

Class 39 - Automobile 

1 Ton, Dual Rear Wheel,  Cab/Chassis, Crew Cab

MATHENY GMC

NO BID

1 Ton Dual Rear wheel Crew cab 

4 Wheel Drive 

Minimum of 5(including driver) 

4 Full, minimum 

170" – 180”

14,000 minimum         

Minimum 8 cylinder gasoline engine 



Vendor Name: Vendor Contact: STEVE SKINNER/JACOB WADE

Manufacturer/Brand: Phone No.: 304-485-4418

Model Name & Number: Email: SSKINNER@MATHENYMOTORS.COM/JWADE@MATHENYMOTORS.COM

Vehicle Requirements:

Classification:

Drive:

Passenger seating: Standard Color Code Color Description

Doors: GAZ WHITE

Wheelbase:

GVWR:

Engine:

Transmission:

Torque: 

Rear Axle: 

Tow Package:

Switches:

Slush/All weather Mats

Bed:

Additional Requirements: 

Additional Requirements: 

Additional Requirements: 

Vendor Bid Response:

Vehicle Fuel Type

Diesel

Options:

25.00$                         

0.25$                           

*Note - The above delivery "options" above are not evaluated as part of the award.

Class 40 - Automobile 

1 Ton, Dual Rear Wheel,  Cab/Chassis, Crew Cab

MATHENY GMC

GMC

SIERRA 3500 TK31403

1 Ton Dual Rear wheel Crew cab 

FOB Other than Metro Charleston - Per Mile

All-Season Tires, Full size spare, frame 

mounted with jack

Minimum of 5(including driver)

4 Full, minimum 

170" – 180”

14,000 minimum         

Minimum 6.2 Liter Turbo Diesel with 

Engine Block Heater 

Automatic

Minimum of 765 lb. ft.

Minimum 3.42 Ratio.  Must include 

Limited Slip/Traction Lock with Dual 

Rear Wheels

Towing Harness, Trailer Tow Side 

Electric Mirrors, Factory Installed 

Electric Trailer Brake Controller

Installed on driver and passenger 

front and second row, except where 

vinyl floor covering is present. 

Must be able to accept bed body 

minimum length 9'

PTO Take-Off Provision

Minimum of three (3) Factory Up-

Fitter Switches.

Factory Running Boards/Step Bars, 

cab length

Manufacturer's Standard Available Colors

The vehicle bid shall include the standard equipment requirements as required in section 3.1.1.1 of the specification.            

Unit Price

58,317.00$                                       

FOB Dealership:  (Deduct)

4 Wheel Drive 
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