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Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

State of West Virginia
Solicitation Response

Proc Folder: 1453543

Solicitation Description: STATEWIDE CONTRACT -TEMPORARY STAFFING SERVICES

Proc Type: Statewide MA (Open End)

Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version

2024-07-16 13:30 SR 0212 ESR07152400000000374 1

VENDOR

VS0000039921
ENTERPRISE SOLUTIONS INC

Solicitation Number: CRFQ 0212 SWC2400000006

Total Bid: 0 Response Date: 2024-07-16 Response Time: 12:23:11

Comments:  

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Mark A Atkins
(304) 558-2307
mark.a.atkins@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X                                                                     FEIN#                                                       DATE
All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 TEMPORARY EMPLOYEE STAFFING 

SERVICES
0.00000 HOUR 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
80111600    

Commodity Line Comments: Pricing Sheet attached in "Add Attachment"
Pricing sheet is locked for signature field, so we have provide name of the authorized signatory.

Extended Description:
TEMPORARY EMPLOYEE STAFFING SERVICES:
Note: Vendor must use Exhibit_A Pricing Page(s) for bid pricing and submit with bid.
If vendor is submitting a bid online, Vendor should enter $0.00 in the Oasis commodity line and attach the pricing page to their bid.



STATEWIDE COVERAGE:
Each Job Classification submitted will 
be required for vendor to provide in all 55 
counties throughout the State of West Virginia.

REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
CRFQ SWC2400000006

(CMA TEMP24)
Temporary Staffing Services

EXHIBIT_A 

Contact Person:______________________________________________________________
Phone #:____________________________________________________________________
Fax #:_________________________________________________________________
Email:______________________________________________________________________

Signature: __________________________________________________________________ Date:

________                     gov@enterprisesolutioninc.com ________________________________________________________
____  630-209-1026____________________________________________________________
______408-836-5561__________________________________________________________

                __Umesh Ghai_____________________________________________________

__       07/16/2024_____________________________________

Vendor Name:__________                      Enterprise Solutions Inc.__________________________________________________
Vendor Name:_______________________________________________________________

_______Umesh Ghai________________________________________________

Classification Worker Pay Rate Withholding Rate Overhead Rate Total Rate*

No bid -$                             -$                          #VALUE!
#VALUE!No bid -$                             -$                          

No bid -$                             -$                          #VALUE!
No bid -$                             -$                          #VALUE!

Laboratroy Assistant 3
Laborer

Mail Runner

-$                          #VALUE!
30.00$                           -$                             10.50$                      40.50$                         

30.00$                           -$                             10.50$                      40.50$                         
No bid -$                             -$                          #VALUE!

25.00$                           -$                             8.75$                        33.75$                         
25.00$                           -$                             8.75$                        33.75$                         
30.00$                           

-$                          #VALUE!
25.00$                           -$                             8.75$                        33.75$                         

-$                             10.50$                      40.50$                         
No bid #VALUE!

Administrative Services Assistant 2
Cook

Custodian
Data Entry Operator2
Executive Secretary

Groundskeeper
Health Service Worker

No bid -$                             

Office Assistant 2
Office Assistant 3

Paralegal
Parking  Attendant

Word Processor

25.00$                           -$                             

* Vendor should  enter their Worker Rate + Withholding Rate + Overhead Rate and the Total Rate box will automatically calculate.

8.75$                        33.75$                         
30.00$                           -$                             10.50$                      40.50$                         

 25.00$                           -$                             8.75$                        33.75$                         

No bid -$                             

Accounting Technician 2
Administrative Services Assistant 1

STATEWIDE Please type or write Legibly



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

CENTRALIZED REQUEST FOR QUOTE 
 

CRFQ #0212 SWC2400000006 
 

STATEWIDE CONTRACT -TEMPORARY STAFFING SERVICES 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

DUE DATE: JULY 16TH, 2024 AT 13:30  
  

PROPOSED TO: 

State of West Virginia  

 

PROPOSED BY: 

 

Email: gov@enterprisesolutioninc.com

 

700 East Diehl Rd, Suite 110, 

Naperville, IL 60563 
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COVER LETTER 
 

Attention: Mark A Atkins                         Date: July 16, 2024 
(304) 558-2307 
mark.a.atkins@wv.gov                
 
Subject: Response to CRFQ # 0212 SWC2400000006- STATEWIDE CONTRACT -TEMPORARY STAFFING SERVICES 
 
Enterprise Solutions, Inc., (ESI) is a certified National MBE firm, established in March 2000, headquartered in 
Naperville, IL with service delivery offices across America, is pleased to submit this response to CRFQ # 0212 
SWC2400000006- Statewide Contract-Temporary Staffing Services for State of West Virginia that requires qualified 
resources to provide temporary staffing services in all 55 counties in West Virginia for 17 specific Temporary Job 
Classifications mentioned in the solicitation documents. 
 

About Enterprise Solutions: 
 

Formed in 2000, ESI is a National Minority Supplier Development Council 
(NMSDC) certified MBE firm and a national, award-winning Staffing firm 
with extensive experience providing Temporary Staffing Services to the 
public agencies. We have 24+ years of experience providing Temporary 
Staffing Services at federal, State and Local levels as well as multiple 
commercial agencies across US. We have served customers in all 50 states 
and employ thousands of people. We have grown organically to a national-
scale service organization serving multiple agencies Statewide across US. 
ESI specializes in delivering qualified talent across diverse skill sets with 
varied platforms and has been adding value to its customers' recruitment 
initiatives as a trusted diversity supplier. Our focus is on solving the unique 
recruitment goals for each customer tailored to match the business 
requirements and provide a transparent, quality process that gets results. 
ESI is majorly supporting government clients, which has helped us being 
recognized as Fastest growing ASIAN AMERICAN BUSINESS in the US. Over 
the 24 years, Enterprise Solutions has witnessed an exponential record 
growth in its line of core business: Temporary Staffing Services especially 
in the Government sectors. With our deep expertise in Recruiting and 
Staffing Services we are esteemed to be recognized by our clients as true 
partners on technical human capital needs.   
 
Enterprise Solutions has successfully delivered more than $1B of employment services with over 900,000,000 hours 
of Temporary Staffing in the last 24 years. We have currently more than 2,800 billable candidates in the U.S across 
the verticals. With stable D&B Open rating and we have been successfully serving our clientele with highly skilled 
professionals whose education, skills and experience are vetted and matched to every client unique hiring need, work 
environment and their requirements. 
 
Along with ESI’s recruitment army of 150+ employees, we are currently delivering Temporary Staffing Services to 197 
public agencies across the United States. All our team members carry rich experience serving State agencies across 
the United States especially with all the position classifications mentioned in the CRFQ document. Our extensively large 
cliental base including numerous public clients generates over $171.98 Million revenue annually for Enterprise 
Solutions.  
 
As we have grown, we have operated with fiscal prudence and leverage our technology to keep our overhead low while 
providing world-class support to our customers and candidates alike. Our corporate overhead and G&A rates are 
among the lowest when compared to publicly available data. To date, we are among the Top 25 Staffing firms in the 
country, a list which contains more than 20,000 competitors. 
 

ESI's qualification to provide the requested services: 
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ESI’s established recruitment process and our customer centric approach has helped us to be consistent in delivering 
results. ESI has a team of 80+ recruiters to source, recruit, and select the best available staff for the Agency. Our 
proposed team has a cumulative experience of 100+ years in Staffing industry, including their vast experience in 
providing staffing services to various public clients throughout the US. Our recruiters have the technical expertise and 
recruitment skills that allows them to diligently locate placement consultants for hard to fill positions and due to 
adequacy in premium resources we can deliver in timely quality services to Agency. Our proposed team holds extensive 
experience in serving similar temporary staffing services and thus have gained a deep knowledge from understanding 
the requirements, sourcing, attracting, screening, and onboarding the top-notch quality candidates in the market. 
 
As outlined in the following response, ESI possesses the knowledge, expertise, capability, ability and qualifications to 
excel in all areas of Agency deems necessary for a successful business relationship and service delivery. ESI brings 
strong knowledge and qualifications to deliver services sought by the Agency. This is demonstrated by the following 
facts: 

 

❖ ESI has 24+ years of experience in providing “Temporary Staffing Services” to various public agencies all across 
US. 

❖ ESI’s Talent Pool currently comprises an ever-growing database of 12,000,000+ resumes of highly qualified 
technical talent available in the United States and around 57,372+ pre-vetted local consultants from the West 
Virginia regions sufficing each requirement of bid requirements; 

❖ A dedicated Agency Account Manager (Single Point of Contact) and delivery team who will be working on Agency 
account throughout the term of our relationship. Our Account Manager, Lynette Wilson, who conducts 
performance review meetings and scheduled touchpoints with both Agency staff & supervisors and our candidate 
base, leads this team. 

❖ Our Account Engagement Management team has a combined experience of over 100+ years in supporting 
Federal, State & Local Government on similar staffing projects. This team has proven experience in meeting or 
exceeding the compliance metrics.  

❖ Our comprehensive background screening processes encompass criminal history checks, employment 
verification, education verification, reference checks, and any relevant professional certifications. 

❖ ESI being an existing staffing vendor for various clients in WV, along with local business Presence, rich Staffing 
experience and dedicated Local Team gives us the advantage to have access to more than 57,372+ local 
candidates of State of WV. Following are ESI’s government clients in WV: • West Virginia Department of Health 
and Human Resources, • Welch Community Hospital, • West Virginia DOT, etc. 

❖ ESI has 150 seasoned internal resources (a large majority are vendor-certified & security-cleared), with average 
experience of 6 to 8 years and covering all areas detailed in this CRFQ. 

❖ Successfully delivered Temporary Staffing Services to 197 Public agencies including 70+ Statewide agencies with 
similar scope of work as required by agency. 

❖ Successful Placement of 4,300+ consultants in various areas with Government Agencies since 2000.  

❖ Dedicated 24X7 Client support staff to resolve any concern raised by our clients. 

❖ ESI is dedicated to provide quality candidates to each of its client, ensuring comfort, dignity, excellence, justice, 
compassion and with respect of all our multicultural clients. We are consistently ranked as one of the fastest 
growing companies and have won several awards including recognitions from Staffing Industry Analyst and 
Diversity Business. We have achieved this success by focus on the Recruitment model where the key drivers for 
success are (l) Coverage (2) Timeliness (3) Quality (4) Pricing, (5) Compliance and (6) Service. 

❖ We are familiar with all the terms, conditions, and local market knowledge of the State of WV. With over 24+ 
years of experience, our local recruitment team has developed extensive local reach within the state. 
Additionally, under the guidance of our highly experienced project manager and subject matter experts (SMEs), 
we are capable of providing candidates with the precise skills needed, even for hard-to-fill roles within promised 
timelines. 

 
Our Account management team and recruitment team have experience and knowledge of pre-employment screening 
procedures and post-placement quality control measures. We have developed a comprehensive vetting process that is 
followed for all its clients. However, if required, ESI. has the ability to customize its vetting and recruitment mediums 
depending upon the specific requirements of the client. 
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ESI’s Experience 

Enterprise Solutions stands as a distinguished leader with a proven track record of excellence, having successfully 
placed 357 consultants across a diverse array of public and commercial clients in the state of WV. With an expansive 
network of over 57,372 pre-vetted consultants, Enterprise Solutions boasts unparalleled access to top-tier talent 
residing within WV, ensuring that we meet and exceed all requirements set forth by Agency. 
 
Our commitment to delivering exceptional Temporary staffing services is evident in our robust portfolio of government 
clients across WV and US, including esteemed organizations which include but not limited to the following below. 
 

States Public Clients Served 

State of West Virginia:  • West Virginia Department of Health and Human Resources, • Welch Community 
Hospital, • West Virginia DOT 

State of Arizona: • Maricopa County Community College District 

State of Florida: • The State of Florida Department of Management Services 

State of Illinois: • Chicago Public Schools 

State of Iowa:  • City of Cedar Rapids 

State of Louisiana:  • State of Louisiana 

State of Maryland:  • Baltimore County Public Schools, Maryland Judicial 

State of Minnesota: • State of Minnesota's Department of Administration and Department of Information 
Technology Services (MNIT), Metropolitan Council 

State of Mississippi:  • Department of Finance and Administration 

State of Nevada:  • Clark County 

State of New Hampshire: • University System of New Hampshire, • New Hampshire Veterans Home 

State of New Jersey:  • New Jersey Schools Development Authority 

State of New York: • NYS Office of Information Technology Services, • The New York Power Authority, • 
United Nations Children's Fund (UNICEF), • NY FISA-OPA, • New York Convention 
Center Operating Corp., • The Port Authority of New York & NJ 

State of Oregon:  • CareOregon, Inc. 

State of South Carolina:  • State Procurement Offices’ (SPO) Information Technology Management Office 
(ITMO) (MSP TAPFIN Process Solutions) 

State of Texas:  • Fort Worth Housing Solutions, • Houston Galveston Area Council (HGACBUY), • The 
Interlocal Purchasing System (“TIPS”), • Dallas Independent School District 

State of Utah:  • Utah Transit Authority (UTA) 

State of California: • County of Los Angeles, Department of Public Health, • County of Santa Clara 
Technology Services & Solutions (TSS), • San Bernardino County, • County of 
Sacramento, • City of Ontario, • California Department of Veterans Affairs, • Bay Area 
Air Quality Management District 

 

ESI’s Commitment: 
 

ESI commits to provide the Services described in the CRFQ and agrees to enter into a written contract with the Agency 
for the Services. 
 

ESI complies with every requirement set forth herein this CRFQ. We accept and meet all the general instructions, 
requirements with No exceptions to Contract Terms and Conditions in the CRFQ. If you have any questions regarding 
this proposal or need more information, please don’t hesitate to contact Umesh Ghai (President) at 408-836-5561, 
gov@enterprisesolutioninc.com. 
  
As the President of Enterprise Solutions, Inc., I, Umesh Ghai is the authorized representative to bind the bidder to the 
terms of the proposal offered.  
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Thank you for your time and consideration and we look forward to working with you. 
 
Yours Sincerely,  

Signature: 
Umesh Ghai, President 
Mailing Address: 700 East Diehl Rd, Suite 110, Naperville, IL 60563 
Telephone: 408-836-5561 
Fax number: 630-206-1290 
E-mail address: gov@enterprisesolutioninc.com 
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ARFQ FORM 

  

  

VS0000039921 

Enterprise Solutions, Inc. 

700 East Diehl Rd, Suite 110, Naperville, IL 60563 

700 East Diehl Rd, Suite 110 

Illinois USA                        60563 

Naperville 

Umesh Ghai 

408-836-5561 

77-0538464 07/16/2024 
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GENERAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS AND DESIGNATED CONTACT 
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gov@enterprisesolutioninc.com  

700 East Diehl Rd, Suite 110, Naperville, IL 60563 

Umesh Ghai, President 

408-836-5561/630-209-1026 

Enterprise Solutions, Inc. 

Umesh Ghai, President, 07/16/2024 

408-836-5561/630-209-1026 

gov@enterprisesolutioninc.com  

Zoho Sign Document ID: 327A1798-EOCSVVB8KUROB-7MAYUX0MXF-_EYAFNPUIQSTSBSF_M

mailto:gov@enterprisesolutioninc.com
mailto:gov@enterprisesolutioninc.com


 

 

CRFQ #0212 SWC2400000006 

STATEWIDE CONTRACT -TEMPORARY STAFFING SERVICES 

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA  

QUOTE 

P a g e  | 24 ENTERPRISE SOLUTIONS, INC.

700 E. Diehl Rd, Suite 110, Naperville, IL 60563 
www.enterprisesolutioninc.com 

RESPONSE TO SECTION 11.1 CONTRACT MANAGER 

 
  

408-836-5561 

gov@enterprisesolutioninc.com  
630-209-1026 

Lynette Wilson 
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ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT FORM  

  

  

Enterprise Solutions, Inc. 

07/16/2024 
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Enterprise Solutions, Inc. 

07/16/2024 
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ESI’S ABILITY TO MEET THE MANDATORY REQUIREMENTS 
 

ESI’s Process for Managing Time Card: 

ESI will ensure transactions between our company, our personnel and agency to be seamless by utilizing our ATS-
CEIPAL’s feature QuickBooks. Below is our process for managing the Time Card. 
 
Our systems are robust and highly configurable with an emphasis on quality and program compliance. We have a 
dedicated Timesheet Verification, Accounting Team & Invoicing Team to track timecards, generate invoices and process 
payrolls. We utilize our CEIPAL ATS to handle thousands of transactions per week accurately and are capable of handling 
different invoice cycles as well as payroll cycles. ESI provides a systematic timekeeping process that ensures the 
accuracy of invoices generated. This system allows weekly, biweekly, or semi-monthly time entry for each consultant. 
 
 
   
 

 
 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Temporary Employee Replacement (24-28 hours): 

• ESI will proactively manage the staffing engagements to ensure seamless operations for the State Agency. In 
cases where we need to replace an existing Temporary Employee or provide a new Temporary Employee, we will 
provide at least one-week notice to the State Agency. This notice will include details of the replacement process 
and the anticipated transition timeline to ensure minimal disruption to ongoing projects. 

• In case state agency intend to replace any of the Temporary Employee, they can do so without the need to provide 
justification or advance notice. We are committed to promptly addressing such requests and will initiate the 
replacement process immediately upon receiving notification from the State Agency. Our priority is to maintain 
the highest level of service and to swiftly respond to the State Agency’s staffing needs. 

• In the event of a verifiable emergency where the State Agency requires an immediate replacement without the 
standard one-week notice, ESI will prioritize the request and expedite the replacement process to ensure a 
successful replacement within 48 hours. We will utilize our extensive network of pre-vetted local (state of WV 
based) qualified professionals to quickly identify and deploy a suitable replacement to ensure continuity of 
operations for the State Agency. 

 

 

PHASE -1 Timesheet Entry: (Within a week) 

Once, new temporary staff is placed with the client, ESI provides him/her access/login credentials of online 
timesheet solution. Our temporary staff enters regular or approved overtime working hours for each week against 
the project(s)/Task/Assignment. ESI’s Account Manager access to the online timesheet solution for reviewing the 
consultants’ timesheet. On weekly basis, ESI’s account manager submits reviewed timesheets to clients’ 
representative for approval via email. No timesheet will be processed for billing until approved. No auto approval 
exists in ATS-Ceipal.  
 

Phase-2 Approved Timesheets integrated with Invoices (Within a week) 

Once approved timesheet are received from client’s representative, ESI’s account manager enters the same in Ceipal. 
Our billing application integrates our online timesheet solution for fetching data from timesheets application to 
billing software for generation of invoices. 

 

Phase-3 Invoice Generation: (within one month after Timesheet approval from the client manager) 
Our Billing Team ensures that invoices are generated and audited accurately and never overbilled or under billed. 
Our online billing software supports a variety of invoicing formats which can be customized as per the need of the 
client. 
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ESI’s Replacement Approach: 

1. Proactive Communication: ESI will maintain open and continuous communication via weekly/monthly 
feedbacks with the State Agency to understand their staffing needs and any potential concerns with existing 
Temporary Employees. This proactive approach will allow us to anticipate and prepare for possible 
replacements. 

2. Rapid Response Team: ESI dedicated account manager team specializes in handling urgent staffing 
replacements. This team will be on standby to address any emergency replacement requests and ensure a 
swift transition. 

3. Extensive Talent Pool: ESI has an extensive pool of 57,300+ pre-vetted local highly qualified professionals 
ready to be deployed on short notice. This enables us to quickly find the right candidate who meets the specific 
requirements of the State Agency. 

4. Smooth Transition Process: ESI will implement a structured transition process to ensure a smooth handover 
between the outgoing and incoming Temporary Employees. This includes knowledge transfer, orientation, and 
any necessary training to minimize disruption and maintain productivity. 

5. Regular Updates: Throughout the replacement process, ESI will provide regular updates to the State Agency, 
keeping them informed of the progress and any developments. This ensures transparency and builds trust in 
our ability to manage their staffing needs effectively. 

For most of the skill sets within this CRFQ, the average cycle time to identify a replacement for an unsuitable hire is 24-
48 hours. Depending on the speed of the onboarding process, qualified replacement workers can be available in short 
order. 
 

ESI’s Orientation Process including Training Programs: 
 

ESI’s initiate the on-boarding and orientation process for the candidates in order to ensure the successful placement 
of the best fit with our client.  ESI’s ATS-CEIPAL facilitate our recruiting team as well as our temporary resources with 
E-onboarding. Our ATS-CEIPAL’s E-onboarding facilitate with quick features such as Create new hire paperwork on 
demand Centralized boarding, database tracking, change requests, controlled access to portal through secure 
username & password, Message back and forth with candidates to answer questions/respond to comments, receive 
automatic updates & keep receipts of completed checklist items, Map system data fields to documents, which ensure 
smooth E-on-boarding. 
 
ESI’s Employee Care and Onboarding Specialist have developed a training program. This training program addresses all 
necessary policies. ESI has a team of 10+ experts who give training to all the assigned employees:  
 
❖ At the time of joining, when candidate joins for employment.  
❖ When ESI receives any negative feedback for any individual to enhance their skills.  
❖ Upon client requests, when required. 
 
General Training Programs Includes Important Topics Including but not limited to: 
 

 
 
 

❖ Smoke Free and Drug Free Workplace Environment  ❖ Client’s Policies & Project Requirement 

❖ Work Ethics and Confidentially Information Rights  ❖ DNR orders (Do Not Resuscitate)  

❖ State and Client Applicable Regulations ❖ Cultural Diversity and Sensitivity  

❖ ESI’s Administrative Policies and benefits plans  ❖ Conflict of Interest  

❖ ESI’s philosophy, goals and objectives mission statements  ❖ HIPAA, OSHA, and Corporate Compliance  

❖ Candidate Role and Responsibilities with the Job categories ❖ Scope of Work and Agency Applicable 
Policies  

❖ Dressing Attire and Parking Facilities  ❖ ESI’s Policies and Procedures 
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Smoke & Drug Free Policy Communication to Employees: 

• ESI will ensure all employees are informed that State Agencies mandate a smoke-free and drug-free 
workplace. 

• Clear communication about this requirement will be integrated into the onboarding and training processes. 
• Regular reminders and reinforcement of this policy will be included in company communications, such as 

newsletters, team meetings, and internal memos. 

Drug Testing Requirements: 

• ESI will comply with any drug testing requirements specified by the Agency when a temporary worker is 
requested. 

• ESI has partnership with drug testing industry’s leading suppliers due to which we maintain a process for 
promptly arranging and conducting drug tests as per the provided guidelines to avoid delays in placement 

ESI’s Background Checks and Reference Checks: 
 

Background Checks: 
 

ESI has robust screening procedures to 
conduct background checks of all 
employees that are successfully placed 
at clients' locations. ESI provides its 
clients with a flexible menu of 
background screening options, allowing us to meet a wide variety of screening requirements. We always share a copy 
of the background checks of each candidate with the client. ESI has a well-defined and documented Background Check 
Policy. Under this policy, depending upon the clients' requirements, candidates are subjected to compulsory pre-
employment background checks.  The candidate is notified and is required to sign a consent and authorization form as 
per the procedures outlined in the Background Check Policy. Background Checks for temporary employees are 
conducted by our HR department. ESI has tie-up with trusted vendors such as HireRight, cFirst, IntelliCorp and 
GoodHire etc. that allow us to conduct the background check for all potential employees as per client requirements. 
ESI closely works with the client and understand the types of background check requirement and fulfilling them. We 
only consider those candidates for further process who clear all checks. Background checks are conducted before hiring 
of the employee and repeated annually. We can perform additional background checks as per the requirements of 
Agency. 
 

VERIFICATION/CHECKS  DETAILED REQUIREMENTS  

Identity Check Verifies a candidate's identity by checking the ID documents 

Immigration Reform and Control Act of 
1986: 

ESI ensures all documentation and verification processes comply with the 
IRCA requirements and are maintained accurately and up-to-date records 
of all background checks and verification documents. 

Social Security Number (SSN) 
Verification for Resident Check 

Validate that the SSN is correct and issued to the corresponding party.  

Professional Reference Checks Verification of at least the past three projects. References will be of 
immediate supervisor. A reference of peers or co-workers is not 
acceptable. Corporate telephone and email id of reference will be 
provided.  

Education  Verification of any obtained degrees where the degree is required for the 
role and the duration of the assignment will exceed two (2) weeks.  

Employment History  Verification of the most recent seven (7) years of employment history. US 
employment eligibility confirmed via E-Verify 

Federal, State, County List of General 
Services  

Confirm exclusion from the list of parties that are debarred, suspended or 
declared ineligible by agencies or by the General Accounting Office from 
certain Federal contracts, subcontracts, assistance or benefits. 

Criminal Record Check  Criminal records checks are conducted for the most recent seven (7) years 
or residence, work and school address history using the information 

ESI’s Trusted Vendor for Background Checks 
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provided by the candidate and located on the SSN verification. Criminal 
checks include County/Local Criminal Checks in county 
courthouses/indexes, looking for felony and misdemeanor convictions 
that are reportable under University and local law. State-wide Criminal 
Checks, were available and reasonable, in University databases or indexes, 
looking for felony and misdemeanor convictions that are reportable under 
University and local law. Federal Criminal Checks, in federal district 
courthouses/indexes, looking for felony and misdemeanor convictions 
that are reportable under federal, University and local law. National 
Criminal Checks, available at leading background screening companies, 
that compiles court database information, including the national sex 
offender registry, from a national perspective. 

License, Credential Verification  Verification of any professional license or credential where such license or 
degree is required for the role, including:  
(a) Validation/Existence of license  
(b) Confirmation that license is in good standing. 

Employee Financial / Credit Check  Verification of employee’s necessary financial details in compliance with 
FCRA guidelines.  

Driving record and License verification Verifies a candidate's Driving record and License 

Sex offender database Verifies offenders 

Background Check Re-verification  Annually from the date of joining of contract employee.  

 
Drug Check: 
ESI has trusted vendors such as Sterling Information Systems 
and Quest Diagnostics for drug testing as per the client 
requirements. ESI conducts electronic drug screening and 10-
panel drug test as per client requirements which includes: 

❖ Amphetamine ❖ Methamphetamine 

❖ Barbiturates ❖ Opiates such as heroin, codeine, and morphine 

❖ Benzodiazepines ❖ Phencyclidine or PCP 

❖ Cocaine ❖ Propoxyphene 

❖ Methadone ❖ THC (marijuana) 

 

Reference Checks: 
 

We carry out a thorough reference check for every candidate that is submitted for client consideration. We ask the 
candidates to provide 3-5 positive references of their previous organizations and our recruitment manager contacts 
the references to gather insight regarding the candidate. The figure given below shows the standard Professional 
Reference check form that we use for our clients unless the client has any other specific requirements or restrictions. 
 
Please see the attached reference check form on the next page. 
 

ESI’s Trusted Vendor for Drug Checks 
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ESI’s Reporting Capabilities: 
 

Enterprise Solutions understands that various reports are required through the acceptance of services orders to 
closure. Our ATS-CEIPAL facilitate extensive & relevant analytical support by enabling its Business Intelligence Feature. 
Along with our ATS’s intelligence our management has developed reporting mechanisms to cover the entire contract 
life-cycle, and we will provide defined reports as below.  
  
❖ Upon award of contract, ESI’s account manager will conduct a kick off meeting in order to understand Agencies’s 

Business intelligence reporting & Staffing Analytics requirements.  
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❖ ESI’s Account Manager will collaborate with Agency to assess the periodic reporting requirements & thereby 
generate a customized periodic report portfolio which will suffice business intelligence & staffing analytics 
requirements of Agency.  

❖ A proposed Periodic Reports Portfolio will be sent to Agency by our account manager via email or through Agency’s 
preferred way within 2 days of kick off meeting, any required changes will be made including addition of any 
reports or removing any specific matrix within the report on Agency request. 

❖ An approval for finalized Periodic Report portfolio will be taken by the Agency including report cycle for each 
report included in the Reports Portfolio. 

❖ ESI’s Account manager will submit all the periodic reports to support the Agency’s analytics via email. 
❖ Agency representative can request to add report for any specific recruiting matrix anytime, our account manager 

will adhere the same within 4 hours.  

 
ESI can provide reports on all the Recruitment matrix as requested by our clients, in general we submit the below 
mentioned reports to our client as per their respective reporting cycle: 
 

REPORTING 

Name of Report Purpose Description Reporting 
Cycle 

Temporary 
Employee Report 

To gain insight about the 
temporary employee’s name, 
department assigned, hourly 
pay rate of the candidate, total 
hours worked, total dollars paid, 
and its classification.  

ESI account manager shares this report 
to the client on the quarterly basis. 

Quarterly 

Current Resources 
Transition Report 

Status of current staff 
augmentation contracted 
resources until they have all 
transitioned to ESI. 

ESI account manager shares this report 
to the Client on the weekly basis until 
the all resources transitioned to ESI. 

Weekly 
 

Vacancy 
Report 

Identifies the date a position 
became vacant, the date the 
position was filled, and the 
number of lapsed days in 
between. 

ESI account manager will prepare this 
report and send it to the department 
on monthly basis. 

Weekly 
 

Posting OMS 
approved-to-fill 
positions 

Identifies the date Client 
granted approval to fill a vacant 
position, the date the 
recruitment advertisement 
appeared on a client approved 

ESI will get a confirmation email after 
receiving a requisition from the Client 
and post the required vacant position 
on our sources to find a qualified 
candidate resumes. Account manager 

Monthly 
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website, and the number of 
lapsed days in between. 

will then prepare a monthly status 
report on all find candidates through all 
our sources and any lapsed day in 
between 

Resume Report Identifies the date the posed 
position closed, the date 
resumes were provided to the 
Client, and the number of 
lapsed days in between. 

ESI account manager will send resumes 
reports to the client on monthly basis 
which include how many days it takes 
to find a matched resume. 

Monthly 

Turnover Report Identifies the Resource turnover 
rate.  Lists each Resource by 
Office/Unit, name, position, 
date hired, and departed date. 

ESI account manager will share 
turnover rates reports to the 
department which include each 
resources name, position title, date 
hired and end of assignment date. 

Monthly 

Travel Report Identifies the dates, location, 
purpose, and cost of Resource 
travel. 

All the resources will share the travel 
expenses receipt to the ESI account 
manager, he then shares all the 
appropriate expense on travel report to 
the Client (if needed) for approval. 

Monthly 

Discipline Report Identifies all disciplinary issues 
and actions taken on each 
Resource. 

Once candidate deployed to the client 
location, ESI regularly follows with the 
candidate performance reviews from 
the client and see if client is happy with 
the candidate performance if not we 
then compile a report and put him 
under disciplinary actions. Reports will 
be sent to the client for the same. 

Monthly 

Background Check 
Report 

Identifies the date when 
background checks were 
received by us and the date the 
background checks were 
provided to the Client. 

ESI will provide the background checks 
reports to the Client, our account 
manager will make sure reports 
included with the dates of background 
checks before sending it to the Client. 

Monthly 

 

Responding to Agency’s Ordering Procedures:  

• Upon receiving the TSCS or TSCN form from the agency, ESI’s Account Manager will acknowledge receipt via 
email within 1 -2 hours. 

• Our Account Manager will thoroughly review the staffing request to understand job roles, required skills, 
duration, and any special considerations. 

• The Recruitment Team utilizes our extensive database, job boards, and professional networks (12 million 
candidates including 57,300+ pre-vetted local candidates in the WV sufficing the requirements of required 
consultants mentioned in bid) to source potential candidates. 

• CEIPAL's advanced search filters are employed to match candidates based on required skills and experience. 
• Initial candidate screening involves resume reviews, preliminary interviews, and verification of qualifications. 
• A shortlist of qualified candidates with detailed profiles and assessments is presented to the agency for 

review within 24 hours. 
• If Agency intent they may conduct interview for the submitted candidate. 
• Once selection is made by the agency, Comprehensive background and reference checks are conducted on 

selected candidates to ensure compliance with required background checks including the Immigration 
Reform and Control Act of 1986. 

• Once the candidate clears the background checks, onboarding & training took place by ESI’s HR team and 
there by ESI finally place the selected candidate at the desired location within 3-4 days of receiving the 
requisition. 
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ESI’s Procedure for Emergency Staffing Request: 
 

Immediate 
Acknowledgment 

Upon receiving an emergency staffing request via email, phone, or Agency’s 
preferred method, ESI’s Account Manager immediately acknowledges receipt, 
confirming the urgency of the request. 

Rapid Requirement 
Analysis 

The Account Manager quickly assesses the specific requirements of the staffing 
request, including job roles, required skills, duration, and any immediate needs. 

Prioritization and Resource 
Allocation 

The Recruitment Team prioritizes the emergency request and allocates additional 
resources to expedite the process. A dedicated team is assigned to focus exclusively 
on fulfilling the emergency staffing need. 

Expedited Candidate 
Sourcing 

The Recruitment Team uses advanced search filters in CEIPAL to identify the most 
qualified and available candidates from our extensive database. Immediate 
outreach is conducted through job boards, professional networks, and our pool of 
pre-screened candidates. 

Accelerated Screening and 
Shortlisting 

Initial screenings, including resume reviews and preliminary interviews, are 
conducted on an expedited timeline. Background checks and reference checks are 
fast-tracked to ensure candidates meet all necessary criteria. 

Client Review and Feedback A shortlist of qualified candidates is presented to the agency within hours. The 
agency is provided the opportunity to conduct interviews as quickly as possible, with 
the Account Manager facilitating immediate scheduling. 

Selection and Onboarding Once the agency selects the candidate(s), the onboarding process is initiated 
without delay. Necessary documents such as contracts and compliance forms are 
prepared and signed swiftly. 

Placement and Integration 
(24-28 hours) 

The selected candidate(s) are placed with the agency as soon as possible. The 
Account Manager ensures the candidates are integrated smoothly into the agency’s 
team, providing immediate support and resources as needed. 

 

ESI’s Approach for Absent Temporary Workers: 
 

At ESI, we prioritize maintaining a seamless workflow and minimizing disruptions caused by the absence of temporary 
workers. Upon receiving notice of an absence, our Account Manager immediately contacts the absent worker to 
understand the reason and expected duration of their absence. Simultaneously, we notify the client to inform them of 
the situation and discuss any immediate needs or adjustments required. We leverage our robust ATS system, CEIPAL, 
to access a pool of pre-screened and qualified backup candidates. This allows us to quickly identify and deploy a 
suitable replacement to ensure continuity in the client's operations. 
 

ESI’s Process for Removing a Temporary Worker: 
 

Whenever a temporary employee is to be relieved of their duties, the West Virginia State Agency shall notify ESI 
promptly. Upon receiving this notification, our Account Manager will initiate the removal process in coordination with 
the State Agency to ensure a smooth transition. If the removal is due to behavior or other unacceptable issues, ESI will 
work closely with the State Agency to address the situation effectively. We will assist in retrieving any issued electronic 
pass cards or other company property, ensuring security and compliance. 
 
1. Acknowledging the notification: 

• Upon receiving notification of removing a temporary worker, ESI’s account manager will acknowledge the 
same and will communicate the termination communication to the temp ensuring transparency with the 
temporary employee.  

 
2. Reason for Removal (Optional): 

• If the removal is due to behaviour or other unacceptable issues, ESI will collaborate closely with the West 
Virginia State Agency to address the situation. The provided excerpt focuses on notification but doesn't 
mandate explaining the reason for removal.  

Zoho Sign Document ID: 327A1798-EOCSVVB8KUROB-7MAYUX0MXF-_EYAFNPUIQSTSBSF_M



 

 

CRFQ #0212 SWC2400000006 

STATEWIDE CONTRACT -TEMPORARY STAFFING SERVICES 

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA  

QUOTE 

P a g e  | 36 ENTERPRISE SOLUTIONS, INC.

700 E. Diehl Rd, Suite 110, Naperville, IL 60563 
www.enterprisesolutioninc.com 

• ESI is committed to maintaining professional standards and resolving issues efficiently. Our Account Manager 
will conduct an exit interview with the relieved employee to understand the circumstances and gather 
feedback. This information helps us improve our staffing processes and prevent future occurrences. We will 
also provide a suitable replacement from our pool of pre-screened candidates to minimize disruption to the 
State Agency’s operations. Our comprehensive approach ensures that the removal process is handled with 
sensitivity and professionalism, maintaining the integrity and continuity of our client’s workforce. 
 

3. Electronic Passcard Retrieval: 
• If the temporary worker was issued an electronic passcard for building access or any other equipment, ESI 

will ensure its retrieval. This ensures proper security measures are followed and the passcard isn't misused. 
 

4. Ensuring Smooth Transition: 
• ESI will ensure that the transition process is smooth and that all necessary procedures are followed to 

maintain security and operational continuity. 
 

5. Documentation and Reporting: 
• ESI will document the removal process and provide a detailed report to the West Virginia State Agency, 

outlining the steps taken and any pertinent information related to the removal of the Temporary Employee. 
 

ESI’s Talent Pool: 
 

ESI’s current talent pool currently comprises an ever-growing database of 12 million candidates of highly qualified 
talent available in the Unites States. There is a dedicated team of recruiting professionals whose sole task is to 
constantly keep adding to this database. This provides us with a competitive edge and ensures quick turnaround time. 
 
Our database has around 57,370+ pre-vetted consultants from the State of West Virginia. Out of which: 
 

Classification  Number of Staffs Available (West Virgina) 
Accounting Technician 2 6532 

Administrative Services Assistant 1 6374 

Administrative Services Assistant 2 6258 

Data Entry Operator 2 6824 

Executive Secretary 5619 

Laboratory Assistant 3 6472 

Office Assistant 2 6103 

Office Assistant 3 6270 

Word Processor 6245 
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