Received: 13044057574 Jul 26 2023 03:28pm POG1
O 07/26/2023 12:25 PM 13044057574 -» 13045583970 pg 1 of 10

To:  JOHNW ESTEP From: INWOOD QUARRY

Fax  304-558-3970 Pages: 10 INCLUDING COVER SHEET
Phone: 304-558-2566 Date: 07/26/23

susec: S | ONE & AGGREGATE PICK UP BY AGENCY

Message:

VENDER NAME: INWOOD QUARRY

BUYER: JOHN ESTEP

SOLICITATION NO: CRFQ 0803 DOT2400000003
BID OPENING DATE: JULY 27, 2023

BID OPENING TIME: 1:30 PM

FAX NUMBER: 304-558-3970
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g:f:;::i:m ;]f v?;"::‘inistmﬁon State of West Virginia
D |2018 Waston gton Street East Centralized Request for Quote
Fost Office Box.50130 Highways

Charleston, WV 253050130

Proc Foider: 1251511 Reason for Modification: |
Doc Description: ADDENDUM NO_1 Stone & Agg. Materials & Delivery to Est. Loc. ADDENDUM NO_1
Vendor Questions and
Responses
Revgse'd Pricir!g Pa'ges
Proc Type: Central Master Agreement Revised Specifications
Date Issued —  [Solicitation Closes | Solicitation No a Version
2023-07-19 2023-07-27 13:30 CRFQ 0803 DOT2400000003 2
BID.RECEIVING LOCATION.
BID CLERK
DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION
PURCHASING DIVISION
2018 WASHINGTON STE
CHARLESTON WV 25305
us
VENDOR
Vendor Customer Code:

Vendor Name : Iﬂwmcl (@\4&"\1 by

Address: P box (<

Street: ;7] W INHESTER AVE

City: 1 woen

State @\, Country : g Zip: 259z

Principal Contact : DL MOREAN SR

Vendor Contact Phone; Extension:

20M~229- 497/

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
John W Estep

304-568-2566

john.w.estep@wv.gov

Vend ‘
s‘?é‘na‘ZLfe X FEINE SSOMS LIS S DATE ©7 /2 6/23

4
Al offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

Date Printed:  Jul 19, 2023 Page: 1 FORM ID: WV-PRC-CRFQ-002 2020705
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Btone Aggregte, |

yto

Pricing Page. ATT A, District §

VENDOR NAME: INWOOD QUARRY
Berkebey | Grast Gramt | Hamgshire { Hummprhurc | Ham, Hardy: Hudy | Jefferson | Mimm) | Minerai | Muweral | Minces) Mongan | Mogan | M.
”:u"";“‘ Petarstung, | 481, Stoan n“‘.”"l | Stamcrvito | Romney | Baker | Moorchictd [ T | stington | New Crock | Shon Gap | Sagtine “s;':‘;’; Ladgent fesos CF
Contraet | | ueiter Bit Bid Bid Bid Bid Bid Bid Bid Bid Big Bid Bid Bid [7] Bid [T
T ipsion ‘ompoyition* | Mesgisee | Price Fricy Price Price Price | Drive Prite Price | Price Frice Prige | Prier Price Prite rice Price
] Clasy § 4 G Lissston: Ol Tens 23498 3200 $27.50 32700
| 2 [Class 1 Apcrogiase L.5GS Tew | NORID NO BiD NO BID NO 8ID
3 |Class | Aggrepaie s Tons | NG BID NO BiD NO-BID NO BID
4 |Clrs2& te Liseston Onhd | Tons 523 50 532,80 $28.60 $27.10
| 8 (Ulass 2 Apnrepate LSGS 1] Tems NO BiD NC B O B0 HO Iy
6 [Chss24 te _Istag il Tow | nOBID NO BID NOAID NO G0
7 [Clags 19 e i.8GS i] ‘tons $21.5h $32.10 $23.80 527.10
8 |AASHTOR) Aggr Limestone Onhe' | Tons $24.00 $33.25 $24.15 820.35
9 lAassTO M1 to 1L.SGS Yom | NOmD NOBIO NO BID NO BID
19 ASHTD #3 Limesone Only || Tons $24.00 $33.25 824.15 $28.00
1L |AASHYD #3 Ageresste LSGS Tons | NOBID NO BID NO 81D NO BID
12 |AASHTO #4 Agpregine LSGS Toes $24.00 383325 $24,15 23.00
|13 JAASHTO #467 A, © 1.5GS Tons | NOBID NG BID NO BID NG BID
14 |AASHTO #37 Aggryste Limustone Onlc || Tome | NOBID NOBID NO BID NO BID
15 [AASHTO #57 Aggrepsic LSGS Tosx | NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BIiD
16___|AASHTO ¥67 A Limcstone Oply | Ters | MO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
V7 JAASHTO 867 Aggngaic 1.SGS | _‘Tows | NOSID NG ED NO BID NO BID
18 IAASHTO #7 Aggropste Limestone Only | Tos | MO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID
|18 JAASHTO 47 Aggregue LSGS Tons | NOBID NOBID NO BtD MO BID
20 [AASHYO #% £ Limestone Oty || Tome | 82640 $34.00 $26.00 32925
21 |AASHYO #% Aggremte L5G8 Tone | NOBID NOBID NO BID NO BiD
22 |AASHTO #3 MODIFIED Lintestone Only | Tons $26.40 $34.00 §26.00 529.25
23 JAASHTO #% MODIFIED 18GS Tavs | NOWD NOBID NO BID NG BID
24 |AASHYO 9. Limcsione Only | Toss | NOBID NO BID NO B NO BID
25 |AASHTO #9 LSGS Tons | NOBID NO B NO BID NOBID
26 |AASHTO #9 MODIRIED Linwsionc Onlv | Tom | NOBID NOBID NO BID NO BID
27 __|AASHTO #9 MODIFIED LSGS TFons _| NORID O BID NO BID NO BID
28 [Stone for Gabions. Linwsione Onty | Tons $27.00 335,00 §27.50 $32.00
29 _|Stone for Gabions LSGS Tom | NOBID hO BID NO BID NO BID
30 [Fime S Tons | $25.50 $35.00 $25.00 $20.10
31 lLimestoe Standard Abrasives Limcstone Onby | Tous $25.23 $35.00 $25.00 $30.10
32 [Limovtone Standard Abrasives LSGS Tons | NOBID WO BID NO.BID NG BID
33 |Sandston: Standasd Abmsives LSGS. Tops | NOBID NO BiD NO BID NOBID
34 Tor SRIC. Tons | NOBID NO B NG DD NO BID
35 [Limeston: MODIFIED Abrasives  |Lismcstone Only Toms $23.50 53500 $25.00 £30.10
36___|Limcstone MODIFIED Abrasives _ ILSGS |_Tons | NOBID NO BID NO BID NG BID
|37 |Sandsion: MODIFIED Abeasives _ [1.5GS Tous | NORID NO BID NO BID NO BID
38 [Cinders Cindess |_Tons | NDBID O BID NO BID NO BID:
39 {Pea Gravel ; Yons | NOHID NOBID NO BID NO BID
40 1¥1) Limostons Abrasives .5GS Yo | NOBID NO BID NOBID NO BID
43 Waste LSG Toas | $20.60 $27.00 $20.00 $23.10
42 Ray L3GS Toms | 330.00 $52.00 $45.00 34530
43 |Shot Rok Limestons Ondy | Yo 540. §52,00 $45.00 845.50
44 [Shot Rock ILSGS Tons | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
45 |inbricard Stone LSGS Tons | NOBID NO BID NO 81D NG BID
LSGS: Limostone, Sendsigne, Grav or Sand
ATT A, Distict & Page 1 of 1

8624C002 Revised
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West Virginia Ethics Commission
Disclosure of Interested Parties to Contracts
(Required by W. Va. Code § 6D-1-2)

Name of Contracting Business Entity; 'NWOOD QUAR RY

address: PO BOX 65 INWOOD, WV 25428

Name of Authorized Agent: DL MORGAN JR Address: PO BOX 1140 INWOOD, WV 25428

co,ntractMumber:,_,,(:,’3,,‘:'19?,[53 QO_T_Z.“,OOOQQQOE —_———Contract Description: el i

Governmental agency awarding contract: WVODH

O Check here if this Is a Supplemental Disclosure

List the Names of Interested Parties to the contract which are known or reasonably anticipated by the contracting business
entity for each category below (attach additional pages if necessary):

1. Subcontractors or other entities performing work or service under the Contract
® Check here if none, atherwise list entity/individual names below.

2. Any person or entity who owns 25% or more of contracting entity (not applicable to publicly traded entities)
® Check here if none, otherwise list entity/individual names below.

3. Any person or entity that facilitated, or negotiated the terms of, the applicable contract {excluding legal
services related to the negotiation or drafting of the applicable contract)

M Check here if none, otherwise list entity/individual names below.

Signature: <__ /( Z _/”/7 Date Signed: 07/26/23

T

Notary Verification

suto o WEST VIRGINIA Gounty o BERKELEY
l, DL MORGAN JR  the authorized agent of the contracting business

entity listed above, being duly sworn, acknowledge that the Disclosure herein is being made under oath and under the
penalty of perjury.

, &3

Taken, sworn to and subscribed before me this ? G v

7~

To be completed by State Agency:
Date Received by state agency:

Date submitted to Ethics Commission:
Governmental agency submitting Disclosure:
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REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
Stone & Aggregate, Delivery to Established Locations

8.2

83

84

to the Solicitation unless a contract modification is approved in accordance with
the provisions centained in this Contract.

Vendor Supply: Vendor must carry sufficient inventory of the Contract Items
being offered to fulfill its obligations under this Contract. By signing its bid,
Vendor certifies that it can supply the Contract Items contained in its bid response.
Reports: Vendor shall provide the Agency with quarterly reports, annual
summaries, and/or monthly reports as requested by the Agency and/or the West
Virginia Purchasing Division showing quantities, total dollar value of the Contract
Items purchased, ordered, shipped & invoiced with dates in spreadsheet format as
defined by the Agency. Failure to supply such reports may be grounds for
cancellation of this Contract, '

Contract Manager: During its performance of this Contract, Vendor must

designate and maintain a primary contract manager responsible for overseeing

Vendor’s responsibilities under this Contract. The Contract Manager must be

available during normal business hours to address any customer service or other
issues related to this Contract. Vendor should list its Contract Manager and his or
ber contact information below.

Contract Manager: fRGaxy X

Telephone Number: 2eM-224- 77/

Fax Number: 3 oM-Yos-~ 2524

Email Address: Dimorcars P mor bam IR Com

Vendor shall inform the Agency in writing of any changes to the information
provided above within 10 calendar days of such changes. Failure to comply may
be grounds for cancellation of this contract.

Form Revised 10/27/2014 19  Delivery to Established Locations 6624C002 REVISED
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DESIGNATED CONTACT: Vendor appoints the individual identified in this Section as the
Contract Administrator and the initial point of contact for matters relating to this Contract,

(Printed Name and Title) DU M 0@ Gows TR PRE S pasur
(Address) Po_box /Y0 _IQWGDC/J v 2sw2ze

(Phone Number) / (Fax Number) 304-224-~ 1771 / 3oM-YoC-7857Y

(Email address) DiMorGan @ DL morGam IR. Canta

CERTIFICATION AND SIGNATURE;: By signing below, or submitting documentation
through wvOASIS, I certify that: | have reviewed this Solicitation/Contract in its entirety; that I
understand the requirements, terms and conditions, and other information contained herein; that
this bid, offer or proposal constitutes an offer to the State that cannot be unilaterally withdrawn;
that the product or service proposed meets the mandatory requirements contained in the
Soficitation/Contract for that product or service, unless otherwise stated herein; that the Vendor
accepts the terms and conditions contained in the Solicitation, unless otherwise stated herein; that
I am submitting this bid, offer or proposal for review and consideration; that this bid or offer was
made without prior understanding, agreement, or connection with any entity submitting a bid or
offer for the same material, supplies, equipment or services; that this bid or offer is in all respects
fair and without collusion or fraud; that this Contract is accepted or entered into without any prior
understanding, agreement, or connection to any other entity that could be considered a violation of
law; that 1. am authorized by the Vendor to execute and submit this bid, offer, or proposal, or any
documents related thereto on Vendor’s behalf; that I am authorized fo bind the vendor in a
contractual relationship; and that to the best of my knowledge. the vendor has properly registered
with any State agency that may require registration.

—i\ osJ Q-u&rr«-q :':9;!‘-

(Comphn) =

(Signature of Authorized Representative)

DL MoRGarn Tp Plesiwavy 07)26/23
(Printed Name and Title of Aut rized Representative) (Date)

2o -229-177) 3oY-“Yos-757y
(Phone Number) (Fax Number)

Din eGan La Ar) TR, CopA
(Email Address)

Revised 11/1/2022



Received: 13044057574 Jul 26 2023 03:31pm PO08
@ 07/26/2023 12:25 PM 13044057574 -+ 13045583970 pg 8 of 10

ATTACHMENT B (ATT B) Information Form
Stone & Aggregate with Delivery by Vendor to Established Locations 6624C002

VENDOR NAME: l ;“ HQ‘C}J G’uarru IN_L
7

Vendors Phone #, Email Address to contact for placing Orders: 30M-~224.S522

Vendors Phone #, Email Address to contact for Invoices; 3 S\ =23 9 ~ j ) [ Accomtin & DimoréaTag,

. Vendors Phone #, Email Address to contact for Payment3a4-22 9.1 /”“wﬂv«@ﬂtmw wa
: vleted and submittod with the bid and coordinate with-the Hems pricin onthe ATTA..
Vendors Sources/Plants Vendors Storage Sites
Source Name & Location (physical
address), Phone # Location (physical address), Phone #
Iw\h-'ﬂo i QQ‘U"&::’ Iumoo_(i Qg‘\.(‘eu
& U win cvesTeR AvE T winenssTee Ay |
J . k
& Toweod, Wy 25428 | Thopnd wiv 2s42 8
\-}&
)
\.°°
69
&
&
&
\Qé
o
X
il
o
e®
&
&
(}v
ATT B Source Information Page 1 of 1 Established Locations 6624C002
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WV-10 State of West Virginia

Approved / Revised

06/08/18 VENDOR PREFERENCE CERTIFICATE

Application is made for 2.5% vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is an individual resident vendor and has resided continuously in West Virginia, or bidder is a partnership, association
ar corporation resident vendor and has maintained its headquarters or principal place of business continuously in West
Virginia, for four (4) years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or,

Bidder is a resident vendor partnership, association, or corporation with at least eighty percent of ownership interest

1
-

-.-of bidder held by-anether entity that meets the applicable four year residency requirement: or,
[  Bidderis a nonresident vendor which has an affiiate or subsidiary which employs a minimum of one hundred state residents

and which has maintained its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia continuously for the four (4)
years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or,

Application is made for 2.5% vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is a resident vendor who certifies that, during the life of the contract, on average at least 75% of the employees
working on the project being bid are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two years
immediately preceding submission of this bid; or,

3. Application is made for 2.5% vendor preference for the reason checked:

[ Bidderis a nonresident vendor that employs a minimum of one hundred state residents, or a nonresident vendor which
has an affiliate or subsidiary which maintains its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia and
employs a minimum of one hundred state residents, and for purpases of producing or distributing the commodities or
completing the project which is the subject of the bidder's bid and continuously over the entire term of the project, on
average at least seventy-five percent of the bidder's employees or the bidder’s affiliate's or subsidiary's employees are
residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two immediately preceding years and the
vendor's bid; or,

Bidder meets either the requirement of both subdivisions (1)and (2) or subdivision (1) and (3) as stated above; or,

Application is made for 3.5% vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked:
Bidder is an individual resident vendor who is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard

and has resided in West Virginia continuously for the four years immediately preceding the date on which the bid is
submitted; or,

6. Application is made for 3.5% vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked:

] Bidderis aresident vendor who is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard, if, for
purposes of producing or distributing the commodities orcompleting the project which is the subject of the vendor's bid and
continuously over the entire term of the project, on average at least seventy-five percent of the vendor’s employees are
residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two immediately preceding years.

7. Application is made for preference as a non-resident small, women- and minority-owned business, in accor-
dance with West Virginia Code §5A-3-59 and West Virginia Code of State Rules.

[ Bidder has been or expects tobe approved prior to contract award by the Purchasing Division as a certified small, women-
and minority-owned business.

8. Application is made for reciprocal preference.
[J Bidderis a West Virginia resident and is requesting reciprocal preference to the extent that it applies.

Bidder understands if the Secretary of Revenue determines that a Bidder receiving preference has failed to continue to meet the
requirements for such preference, the Secretary may order the Director of Purchasing to: (a) rescind the contract or purchase order;
or (b) assess a penalfy against such Bidder in an amount not to exceed 5% of the bid amount and that such penalty will be paid to
the contracting agency or deducted from any unpaid balance on the contract or purchase order.

By submission of this certificate, Bidder agrees to disclose any reasonably requested information to the Purchasing Division and
authorizes the Department of Revenue to disclose to the Director of Purchasing appropriate information verifying that Bidder has paid
the required business taxes, provided that such information does rot contain the amounts of taxes paid nor any other information
deemed by the Tax Commissioner to be confidential.

Bidder hereby certifies that this certificate is true and accurate in ail respects; and that if a contract is issued to Bidder
and if anything contained within this certificate changes during the term @ contract, Bidder will notify the Purchas-

ing Division in writing immediately. ﬁ

Bidder: INWOOD QUARRY INC Signed: /
R
“Check any combination of preference consideration{(s} indicated above, which you are entitied to receive.

4, E Application is made for 5% vendor preference for the reason checked:
5
—

Date: 07/26/23 Titte: PRESIDENT
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ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT FORM

SOLICIT, : C . DOT240 03

Instructions: Please acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued with this solicitation by completing this
addendum acknowledgment form. Check the box next to each addendum received and sign below.
Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification.

Acknowledgment: | hereby acknowledge receipt of the following addenda and have made the
necessary revisions to my proposal, plans and/or specification, eic.

Addendum Numbers Received:;
(Check the box next to each addendum received)

[X] Addendum No, 1 [ ] AddendumNo.6
[ 1 Addendum No.2 [ 1 AddendumNo.7
[ 1 Addendum No.3 [ ] Addendum No.8
[ 1] AddendumNo.4 [ 1 AddendumNo.9
[ ] Addendum No. 5 [ 1 Addendum No. 10

1 understand that failure to confirm the receipt of addenda.may be cause for rejection of this bid. 1
further understand that that any verbal representation made or assumed fo be made during any oral
discussion held between Vendor’s representatives and any state personnel is not binding. Only the
information issued in writing and added to the specifications by an official addendum is binding,

_.-L,uu-&.& GI k? &rru_f I A
Company
Authorized Signature

07/2¢ )23
" Date

NOTE: This addendum acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite document processing,




