AL CIHERTY
EXHIBIT A Pricing Pages P

1. TRANSIT UNITS:
71 PASSENGER
230HP, FE $140,572.00
230HP, RE $163,537.00
ELECTRIC No Bid
GASOLINE No Bid
IDELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - DIESEL  $1.500.00
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WYV - ELECTRIC Not Applicable
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - GASOLINE Not Applicable
77 PASSENGER
230HP, FE $146,698.00
230HP, RE $170,216.00
ELECTRIC No Bid
GASOLINE No Bid
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - DIESEL $1.500.00
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - ELECTRIC Not Applicable
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - GASOLINE Not Applicable
84 PASSENGER
245HP, FE | $148.803.00
245HP, RE $173,378.00
ELECTRIC $429,647.00
GASOLINE No Bid
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - DIESEL 1.500.00
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - ELECTRIC $4.800.00
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - GASOLINE Not Applicable
89 PASSENGER
245HP, FE $155.319.00
245HP, RE No Bid
ELECTRIC No Bid
GASOLINE No Bid_
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - DIESEL __$1500.00
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - ELECTRIC Not Applicable
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - GASOLINE Not Afitlicable
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2. CONVENTIONAL UNITS:

24 PASSENGER
TYPEA 130P | NoBid
TYPE A LPG Fueled No Bid
TYPE A Gasoline $95.473.00
TYPEA Electric No Bid _
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV Gasoﬁ;_le $1.500.00
30 PASSENGER
TYPEA 130HP No Bid
TYPEA LPG Fueled $132.557.00
TYPEA Gasoline E} 00,445.00
TYPEA Electric $296,236.00
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV Gas/LPG $1.500.00
Electric $3,500.00
35 PASSENGER
Regular - 200HP $110.995.00
Regular - LPG Fueled $119.538.00
Regular - Gasoline No Bid
Regular - Electric No Bid
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV Gas/Diesel $1.500.00
LPG $1.800.00
47 PASSENGER
Regular - 220HP $115.312.00
Regular - LPG Fueled $120,992.00
Regular - 210HP No Bid
|Regular - Electric No Bid
Regutar - Gasoline $111,468.00
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - £/47 Diesel $1.500.00
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - F/47 Propane $1.800.00
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - £/47 Gasoline $1.500.00
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WY - F/ ELECTRIC Not i\_ppiicabie
53 PASSENGER
Regular - 220HP $117,255.00
Regular - LPG Fueled $122.931.00
Regular - 210HP No Bid
Regular - Electric No Bid
Regular - Gasoline $113,223.00
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - £/53 Diesel $1.500.00
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - £/53 Propane $1,800.00
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - F/53 Gasoline $1,500.00
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - F/Electric Not Antﬂgbie
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58 PASSENGER
Regular-220HP |  $117.545.00
Regular - LPG Fueled $124,075.00
Regular - Electric No Bid
Regular - Gasoline $113,597.00
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - £/59 Diesel $1.500.00
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - F/55 Propane $1,800.00
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - F/59 Gasoline $1,500.00
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - ¥/ Electric Not Applicable
65 PASSENGER
Regular - 230HP $120,153.00
Regular - LPG Fueled $125,932.00
|Regular - Electric No Bid
Regular - Gascline $115,187.00
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - F/65 Diesel $1,500.00
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - F/65 Propane $1.800.00
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - F/65 Gasoline $1.500.00
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - F Electric Not Applicable
71 PASSENGER
Regular - 230HP $121,491.00
Regular - LPG Fueled $129,092.00
Regular - Electric $383.377.00
Regular - Gasoline $117,196.00
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - F/71 Diesel $1.500.00
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - F/71 Propane $1.800.00
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - £/71 Gasoline $1.500.00
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV -F / Electric $4,800.00
77 PASSENGER
Regular - 2304p $130,051.00
Regular - LPG Fueled $131,081.00
Regular - Electric $384.240.00
Regular - Gasoline $118.404.00
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - F/77 Diesel $1,500.00
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - /77 Propane $l_§00.00
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - F/77 Gasoline $1,500.00

DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - F/ Electric

$4,800.00
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83 PASSENGER
Regular - 230HP No Bid
Regular - LPG Fueled No Bid
Regular - Electric No ﬁ;d
Regular - Gasoline No Bid

DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - F/83 Diesel

DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - F/883 Propane

DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - F/83 Gasoline

DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - F/ Electric
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3. SPECIAL NEEDS - CONVENTIONAL UNITS:

35 PASSENGER
200HP $121,335.00
LPG Fueled $129,264.00
Electric No Bid
GASOLINE No Bid
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - DIESEL $1.500.00
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - LPG $1,800.00
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - ELECTRIC Not Applicable
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - GASOLINE Not Applicable
47 PASSENGER
220HP $126,214.00
LPG Fueled $131,762.00
Electric No Bid
GASOLINE $121,945.00
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WYV - DIESEL $1.,500.00
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - LPG $1,800.00
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - ELECTRIC Not Applicable
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - GASOLINE $1.500.00
53 PASSENGER
220HP $128,606.00
LPG Fueled $134,197.00
Electric No Bid
GASOLINE $124.138.00
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - DIESEL $_l,-5_00.00
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - LPG $1,800.00
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - ELECTRIC Not Applicable
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - GASOLINE $1,500.00
59 PASSENGER
220HP $129.358.00
LPG Fueled $135,670.00
Electric No Bid
GASOLINE $124,712.00
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - DIESEL $1,500.00
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - LPG $1,800.00
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - ELECTRIC Not Applicable
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - GASOLINE $1,500.00
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65 PASSENGER
230HP $132.126.00
LPG Fueled $137.996.00
Electric No Bid
GASOLINE $126,597.00
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - DIESEL $1,500.00
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - LPG $1,800.00
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - ELECTRIC Not Applicable
DELUIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - GASOLINE $1,500.00
71 PASSENGER
230HP T $133.923.00
LPG Fueled $141,525.00
Electric $398,377.00
GASOLINE $128,301.00
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - DIESEL $1,500.00
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - LPG $1,800.00
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - ELECTRIC $4,800.00
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - GASOLINE $1,500.00
77 PASSENGER
230HP $142.621.00
LPG Fueled $143,982.00
Electric $399.240.00
GASOLINE $130,496.00
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WYV - DIESEL $1,500.00
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - LPG $1,800.00
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - ELECTRIC $4,800.00
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - GASOLINE $1,500.00
83 PASSENGER
230HP No Bid
LPG Fueled No Bid
Electric No Bid
GASOLINE No Bid
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - DIESEL
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - LPG
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - ELECTRIC
DELIVERY TO CHARLESTON, WV - GASOLINE




