
 
 
 

The  following  documentation  is  an  electronically‐
submitted  vendor  response  to  an  advertised 
solicitation  from  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing 
Bulletin  within  the  Vendor  Self‐Service  portal  at 
wvOASIS.gov.  As part of the State of West Virginia’s 
procurement  process,  and  to  maintain  the 
transparency  of  the  bid‐opening  process,  this 
documentation  submitted  online  is  publicly  posted 
by  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing  Division  at 
WVPurchasing.gov with any other vendor responses 
to  this  solicitation  submitted  to  the  Purchasing 
Division in hard copy format. 
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Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

State of West Virginia
Solicitation Response

Proc Folder: 1024631

Solicitation Description: ADDENDUM NO_4 Equipment Lease/Rental W/O Operator -Statewide

Proc Type: Central Master Agreement

Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version

2022-05-26 13:30 SR 0803 ESR05252200000007471 1

VENDOR

000000202582
MIDDLETOWN TRACTOR SALES

Solicitation Number: CRFQ 0803 DOT2200000164

Total Bid: 0 Response Date: 2022-05-26 Response Time: 09:10:39

Comments:  

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
John W Estep
304-558-2566
john.w.estep@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X                                                                     FEIN#                                                       DATE
All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 Aerial Bucket Trucks- Lease/Rental 0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
22101800    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Lease/Rental of Aerial Bucket Trucks and Bucket Vans

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
2 Aerial Bucket Trucks - Delivery/ Mobilization 0.00000 MILE   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
22101800    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Delivery/Mobilization fees for Aerial Bucket Trucks and Bucket Vans

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
3 Aerial Platform Lifts - Lease/Rental 0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
22101802    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Lease/Rental of  Aerial Platform Lifts with Articulating and Telescopic Booms

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
4 Aerial Platform Trucks  - Delivery/ Mobilization 0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
22101802    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Delivery/Mobilization fees for Aerial Platform Trucks,  Truck-Mounted Lifts, and Forestry Trucks

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
5 Boom Lifts Towable - Lease/Rental 0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
22101803    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Lease/Rental of Towable Articulating Boom Lifts
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
6 Boom Lifts Towable - Delivery/Mobilization 0.00000 MILE   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
22101803    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Delivery/Mobilization fees for Towable Articulating Boom Lifts

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
7 Forklifts - Lease/Rental 0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
24101603    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Lease/Rental of Rough Terrain, Variable Reach, and Warehouse Forklifts

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
8 Forklifts - Delivery/Mobilization 0.00000 MILE   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
24101603    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Delivery/Mobilization fees for Rough Terrain, Variable Reach, and Warehouse Forklifts

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
9 Scissor Lifts - Lease/Rental 0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
24101617    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Lease/Rental of Scissor Lifts

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
10 Scissor Lifts - Delivery/Mobilization 0.00000 MILE   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
24101617    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Delivery/Mobilization fees for Scissor Lifts



Date Printed: May 26, 2022 Page: 4 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
11 Aerial Platform Trucks - Lease/Rental 0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
22101802    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Lease/Rental of Aerial Platform Trucks,  Truck-Mounted Lifts, and Forestry Trucks

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
12 Aerial Platform Lifts - Delivery/Mobilization 0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
22101802    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Delivery/Mobilization fees for  Aerial Platform Lifts with Articulating and Telescopic Booms

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
13 Asphalt Paving Equipment - Lease/Rental 0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
22101600    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Lease/Rental of Asphalt Distributors, Cold Milling Machines, Recyclers, Stabilizers, and Recycler Attachments

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
14 Asphalt Paving Equipment - Delivery/

Mobilization
0.00000 MILE   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
22101600    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Delivery/Mobilization fees for Asphalt Distributors, Cold Milling Machines, Recyclers, Stabilizers, and Recycler Attachments

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
15 Concrete Buckets & Mixers - Lease/Rental 0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
22100000    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Lease/Rental of Concrete Buckets and Mixers
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
16 Concrete Buckets & Mixers - Delivery/

Mobilization
0.00000 MILE   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
22101600    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Delivery/Mobilization fees for Concrete Buckets and Mixers

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
17 Concrete Saws - Lease/Rental 0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
27112745    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Lease/Rental of Concrete Saws

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
18 Concrete Saws - Delivery/Mobilization 0.00000 MILE   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
22101600    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Delivery/Mobilization fees for Concrete Saws

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
19 Road Wideners - Lease/Rental 0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
22101603    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Lease/Rental of Road Wideners

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
20 Road Wideners - Delivery/Mobilization 0.00000 MILE   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
22101603    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Delivery/Mobilization fees for Road Wideners
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
21 Shoulder Maintainers - Lease/Rental 0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
22101502    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Lease/Rental of Shoulder Maintainers

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
22 Shoulder Maintainers - Delivery/Mobilization 0.00000 MILE   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
22101502    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Delivery/Mobilization fees for Shoulder Maintainers

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
23 Asphalt Pavers - Lease/Rental 0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
22101607    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Lease/Rental of Asphalt Pavers

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
24 Asphalt Pavers - Delivery/Mobilization 0.00000 MILE   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
22101607    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Delivery/Mobilization fees for Asphalt Pavers

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
25 Crack Sealers - Lease/Rental 0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
22101600    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Lease/Rental of trailer mounted and tandem dual 2 axle Crack Sealers.
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
26 Crack Sealers - Delivery/Mobilization 0.00000 MILE   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
22101600    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Delivery/Mobilization fees for trailer mounted and tandem dual 2 axle Crack Sealers.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
27 Mortar Mixers - Lease/Rental 0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
22101902    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Lease/Rental of 6 cu ft and 9 cu ft Mortar Mixers

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
28 Mortar Mixers - Delivery/Mobilization 0.00000 MILE   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
22101902    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Delivery/Mobilization fees for 6 cu ft and 9 cu ft Mortar Mixers

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
29 Pothole Patchers - Lease/Rental 0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
22101711    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Lease/Rental of Pothole Patcher trucks and trailers.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
30 Pothole Patchers - Delivery/Mobilization 0.00000 MILE   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
22101711    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Delivery/Mobilization fees for Pothole Patcher trucks and trailers.
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
31 Pavement Breaker Tools - Lease/Rental 0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
22101711    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Lease/Rental of Backhoe Breaker Attachments, Demo Hammers, Excavator Breakers, and Rock Hammers for excavators.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
32 Pavement Breaker Tools - Delivery/

Mobilization
0.00000 MILE   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
22101711    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Delivery/Mobilization fees for Backhoe Breaker Attachments, Demo Hammers, Excavator Breakers, and Rock Hammers for excavators.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
33 Pavement Breakers - Lease/Rental 0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
22101615    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Lease/Rental of Pavement Breakers

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
34 Pavement Breakers - Delivery/Mobilization 0.00000 MILE   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
22101615    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Delivery/Mobilization fees for 30lb., 60lb., and 90lb. Pavement Breakers.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
35 Rock Drills - Lease/Rental 0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
20102100    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Lease/Rental of hydraulic and pneumatic Rock Drills.
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
36 Rock Drills - Delivery/Mobilization 0.00000 MILE   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
20102100    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Delivery/Mobilization fees for hydraulic and pneumatic Rock Drills.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
37 Rollers - Lease/Rental 0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
22101505    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Lease/Rental of dual drum Trench Rollers and single drum, single padfoot drum, and double drum Rollers.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
38 Rollers - Delivery/Mobilization 0.00000 MILE   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
22101505    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Delivery/Mobilization fees for dual drum Trench Rollers and single drum, single padfoot drum, and double drum Rollers.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
39 Backhoes - Lease/Rental 0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
22101509    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Lease/Rental of Backhoe Crawlers, Loaders, and Track Loaders

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
40 Backhoes - Delivery/Mobilization 0.00000 MILE   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
22101509    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Delivery/Mobilization fees for Backhoe Crawlers, Loaders, and Track Loaders
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
41 Augers - Lease/Rental 0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
20121600    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Lease/Rental of Auger Bits and Core Barrels

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
42 Augers - Delivery/Mobilization 0.00000 MILE   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
20121600    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Delivery/Mobilization fees for Auger Bits and Core Barrels

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
43 Loaders - Lease/Rental 0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
22101528    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Lease/Rental of Loader Wheels

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
44 Loaders - Delivery/Mobilization 0.00000 MILE   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
22101528    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Delivery/Mobilization fees for Loader Wheels

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
45 Bulldozers & Crawler Attachments - Delivery/

Mobilization
0.00000 MILE   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
22101500    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Delivery/Mobilization fees for Bulldozers and Crawler Attachments (Ripper, Winch)
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
46 Bulldozers & Crawler Attachments - Lease/

Rental
0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
22101500    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Lease/Rental of Bulldozers and Crawler Attachments (Ripper, Winch)

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
47 Cranes - Lease/Rental 0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
24101600    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Lease/Rental of hydraulic, truck mounted, cable truck mounted, boom truck, and lattice boom Cranes.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
48 Cranes - Delivery/Mobilization 0.00000 MILE   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
24101600    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Delivery/Mobilization fees for hydraulic, truck mounted, cable truck mounted, boom truck, and lattice boom Cranes.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
49 Culvert Cleaners - Lease/Rental 0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
47000000    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Lease/Rental of truck mounted Culvert Cleaners and radio remote controlled Track Loaders

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
50 Culvert Cleaners- Delivery/Mobilization 0.00000 MILE   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
47000000    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Delivery/Mobilization fees for  truck mounted Culvert Cleaners and radio remote controlled Track Loaders
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
51 Digger Derricks - Lease/Rental 0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
20111616    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Lease/Rental of Digger Derricks

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
52 Digger Derricks- Delivery/Mobilization 0.00000 MILE   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
20111616    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Delivery/Mobilization fees for Digger Derricks

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
53 Excavators & Attachments - Lease/Rental 0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
22100000    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Lease/Rental of Excavators, Mini Excavators, Wheeled Excavators, Excavators w/Heavy Duty Augers, Excavators w/Integrated Vibratory Pile 
Drives,  Hydraulic Hammer Attachments, Plate Compactor Attachments, Swivel Head w/Ditching Bucket Attachments, Tree Mulcher Attachments, 
and Truck Mounted Telebooms,

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
54 Excavators & Attachments - Delivery/

Mobilization
0.00000 MILE   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
22100000    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Delivery/Mobilization fees for Excavators, Mini Excavators, Wheeled Excavators, Excavators w/Heavy Duty Augers, Excavators w/Integrated 
Vibratory Pile Drives,  Hydraulic Hammer Attachments, Plate Compactor Attachments, Swivel Head w/Ditching Bucket Attachments, Tree Mulcher 
Attachments, and Truck Mounted Telebooms,

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
55 Force Feed Loader - Lease/Rental 0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
22101528    
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Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Lease/Rental of Force Feed Loaders

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
56 Force Feed Loader - Delivery/Mobilization 0.00000 MILE   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
22101528    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Delivery/Mobilization fees for Force Feed Loaders

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
57 Graders - Lease/Rental 0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
22101502    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Lease/Rental of 35,000-45,000 lb class Graders

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
58 Graders - Delivery/Mobilization 0.00000 MILE   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
22101502    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Delivery/Mobilization fees for 35,000-45,000 lb class Graders

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
59 Hammer Pile Driver - Lease/Rental 0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
22101504    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Lease/Rental of Hammer Pile Drivers

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
60 Hammer Pile Driver - Delivery/Mobilization 0.00000 MILE   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
22101504    



Date Printed: May 26, 2022 Page: 14 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Delivery/Mobilization fees for Hammer Pile Drivers

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
61 Skid Steers, Track Loaders, & Attch - Lease/

Rental
0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
22000000    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Lease/Rental of Skid Steer Tire Loaders, Track Loaders, Mini Skid Steers, Skid Steer Auger Bits, Auger Power Units, and Skid Steer Attachments

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
62 Skid Steers, Track Loaders, & Attch - 

Delivery/Mobilization
0.00000 MILE   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
22000000    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Delivery/Mobilization fees for Skid Steer Tire Loaders, Track Loaders, Mini Skid Steers, Skid Steer Auger Bits, Auger Power Units, and Skid Steer 
Attachments

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
63 Material Screener - Lease/Rental 0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
20101600    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Lease/Rental of mobile/diesel Material Screeners

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
64 Trenchers - Delivery/Mobilization 0.00000 MILE   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
22101516    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Delivery/Mobilization fees for walk behind and ride-on Trenchers

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
65 Trenchers - Lease/Rental 0.00000 UNIT   



Date Printed: May 26, 2022 Page: 15 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
22101516    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Lease/Rental of walk behind and ride-on Trenchers

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
66 Generators - Lease/Rental 0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
26111600    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Lease/Rental of trailer mounted Generators

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
67 Generators - Delivery/Mobilization 0.00000 MILE   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
26111600    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Delivery/Mobilization fees for trailer mounted Generators

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
68 Heaters - Lease/Rental 0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
40101800    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Lease/Rental of indirect and towable Heaters

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
69 Heaters- Delivery/Mobilization 0.00000 MILE   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
40101800    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Delivery/Mobilization fees for indirect and towable Heaters

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
70 Pumps - Lease/Rental 0.00000 UNIT   
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Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
40151500    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Lease/Rental of Hydrostatic Test Pumps, self-priming Trash Pumps, and trailer mounted, diesel Vacuum Assisted Pumps

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
71 Pumps - Delivery/Mobilization 0.00000 MILE   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
40151500    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Delivery/Mobilization fees for Hydrostatic Test Pumps, self-priming Trash Pumps, and trailer mounted, diesel Vacuum Assisted Pumps

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
72 Light Towers - Lease/Rental 0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
39112001    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Lease/Rental of portable, diesel Light Towers

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
73 Light Towers - Delivery/Mobilization 0.00000 MILE   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
39112001    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Delivery/Mobilization fees for portable, diesel Light Towers

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
74 Traffic Control Equipment - Lease/Rental 0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
46161500    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Lease/Rental of Arrow Boards, trailer/truck mounted Attenuator & Arrow Boards, Message Signs, Steel Road Plates, Barrel Drums and Bases, 
Barriers, and portable/trailer mounted Traffic Signals
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
75 Traffic Control Equipment - Delivery/

Mobilization
0.00000 MILE   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
46161500    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Delivery/Mobilization fees for Arrow Boards, trailer/truck mounted Attenuator & Arrow Boards, Message Signs, Steel Road Plates, Barrel Drums 
and Bases, Barriers, and portable/trailer mounted Traffic Signals

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
76 Mowers - Lease/Rental 0.00000 UNIT 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
21101701    

Commodity Line Comments: Boom mower: Rental of John Deere 6110M or equivalent tractor with Alamo Samurai 20' mid-mount articulating 
boom mower with 60" rotary head or equivalent:
$787.50/day
$2275.00/week
$7850.00/month
Slope Mower: Rental of Ventrac 4500K slope mower or equivalent outfitted with 60" rough cut deck or equivalent:
$250.00/day
$725.00/week
$2500/Month

Extended Description:
Lease/Rental of Slope Mowers, Boom Mowers, and Boom Mower Brush Cutter attachments

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
77 Mowers - Delivery/Mobilization 0.00000 MILE 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
21101701    

Commodity Line Comments: Boom mower:  JD 6110M w/Alamo Samurai or equal.  $95.00 first mile followed by $6.50/additional mile
Slope mower: Ventrac 4500K w/60" rough cut.  $55.00 first mile followed by $3.50/additional mile

Extended Description:
Delivery/Mobilization fees for Slope Mowers, Boom Mowers, and Boom Mower Brush Cutter attachments

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
78 Chippers & Grinders - Lease/Rental 0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
21102200    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Lease/Rental of Brush Chippers, Track Chippers, and Tub Grinders
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
79 Chippers & Grinders - Delivery/Mobilization 0.00000 MILE   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
21102200    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Delivery/Mobilization fees for Brush Chippers, Track Chippers, and Tub Grinders

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
80 Hydroseeders - Lease/Rental 0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
21102200    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Lease/Rental of truck and trailer mounted Hydroseeders

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
81 Hydroseeders - Delivery/Mobilization 0.00000 MILE   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
21102200    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Delivery/Mobilization fees for truck and trailer mounted Hydroseeders

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
82 Pressure Washers - Lease/Rental 0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
47000000    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Lease/Rental of towable Pressure Washers

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
83 Pressure Washers - Delivery/Mobilization 0.00000 MILE   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
47000000    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Delivery/Mobilization fees for towable Pressure Washers
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
84 Sand Blasters - Lease/Rental 0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
23281703    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Lease/Rental of Sand Blasters

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
85 Sand Blasters - Delivery/Mobilization 0.00000 MILE   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
23281703    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Delivery/Mobilization fees for Sand Blasters

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
86 Straw Blowers - Lease/Rental 0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
21000000    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Lease/Rental of trailer mounted Straw Blowers

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
87 Straw Blower - Delivery/Mobilization 0.00000 MILE   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
21000000    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Delivery/Mobilization fees for trailer mounted Straw Blowers

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
88 Compressors - Lease/Rental 0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
40151600    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Lease/rental of portable Compressors
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
89 Compressors - Delivery/Mobilization 0.00000 MILE   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
40151600    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Delivery/mobilization fees for portable Compressors

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
90 Street Sweepers - Lease/Rental 0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
25101919    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Lease/Rental of ride-on, enclosed cab, and truck mounted Street Sweepers

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
91 Street Sweeper- Delivery/Mobilization 0.00000 MILE   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
25101919    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Delivery/Mobilization fees for ride-on, enclosed cab, and truck mounted Street Sweepers

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
92 Snow Removal - Lease/Rental 0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
22101710    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Lease/Rental of CDL truck Snow Plow Attachments

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
93 Snow Removal- Delivery/Mobilization 0.00000 MILE   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
22101710    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Delivery/Mobilization fees for CDL truck Snow Plow Attachments
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
94 Tree Trimming Equipment - Lease/Rental 0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
21102200    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Lease/Rental of High Reach Power Tree Shears and Knuckle Boom Cranes with Grapple Saw

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
95 Tree Trimming Equipment - Delivery/

Mobilization
0.00000 MILE   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
21102200    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Delivery/Mobiization of High Reach Power Tree Shears and Knuckle Boom Cranes with Grapple Saw

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
96 Box & Flatbed Trucks - Lease/Rental 0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
25101600    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Lease/Rental of Box-Delivery and Flatbed Trucks

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
97 Box & Flatbed Trucks- Delivery/Mobilization 0.00000 MILE   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
25101600    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Delivery/Mobilization fees for Box-Delivery and Flatbed Trucks

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
98 Dump Trucks - Lease/Rental 0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
25101601    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Lease/Rental of Articulated Dump Trucks, Crawler Carriers, Non-CDL & CDL Dump Trucks
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
99 Trailers- Delivery/Mobilization 0.00000 MILE   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
25181700    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Delivery/Mobilization fees for Dump, Equipment, Flatbed, Lowboy, Tilt, Utility, Vacuum Excavator, and Water Trailers

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
100 Pickup Trucks - Lease/Rental 0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
25101611    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Lease/Rental of 4WD crew cab Pickup Trucks

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
101 Pickup Trucks- Delivery/Mobilization 0.00000 MILE   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
25101611    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Delivery/Mobilization fees for 4WD crew cab Pickup Trucks

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
102 Trailers - Lease/Rental 0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
25181700    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Lease/Rental of Dump, Equipment, Flatbed, Lowboy, Tilt, Utility, Vacuum Excavator, and Water Trailers

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
103 Water Trucks - Lease/Rental 0.00000 UNIT   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
25101610    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Lease/Rental of Water Trucks
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
104 Water Trucks - Delivery/Mobilization 0.00000 MILE   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
25101610    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Delivery/Mobilization fees for Water Trucks

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
105 Material Screener - Delivery/Mobilization 0.00000 MILE   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
20101600    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Delivery/Mobilization fees for mobile/diesel Material Screeners

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
106 Dump Trucks - Delivery/Mobilization 0.00000 MILE   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
25101601    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Delivery/Mobilization of Articulated Dump Trucks, Crawler Carriers, Non-CDL & CDL Dump Trucks
































































