
 
 
 

The  following  documentation  is  an  electronically‐
submitted  vendor  response  to  an  advertised 
solicitation  from  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing 
Bulletin  within  the  Vendor  Self‐Service  portal  at 
wvOASIS.gov.  As part of the State of West Virginia’s 
procurement  process,  and  to  maintain  the 
transparency  of  the  bid‐opening  process,  this 
documentation  submitted  online  is  publicly  posted 
by  the  West  Virginia  Purchasing  Division  at 
WVPurchasing.gov with any other vendor responses 
to  this  solicitation  submitted  to  the  Purchasing 
Division in hard copy format. 
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Proc Folder :

Solicitation Description :

Proc Type :

Date issued Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version

Solicitation Response

Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East

Charleston, WV 25305-0130
Post Office Box 50130

State of West Virginia

739509

ADDENDUM NO.1  Vehicle Consoles, Brackets,Gun Rack & Acces.

Central Master Agreement

2020-07-07

13:30:00

SR 0619 ESR07062000000000050 1

 VENDOR

VS0000021952

DANA SAFETY SUPPLY INC

Comments:

Total Bid : Response Date: Response Time:Total Bid : 

Solicitation Number: CRFQ 0619 FIC2000000010

$0.00 2020-07-06 10:34:14

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER

Signature on File FEIN # DATE

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

FORM ID : WV-PRC-SR-001

John W Estep

(304) 558-7839
john.w.estep@wv.gov
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 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

1 Jotto Desk 9 Inch Police Equipment
Console Short Stack or Eq

0.00000 EA

25174808

Jotto Desk 9 Inch Police Equipment Console Short Stack or Eq

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

2 Jotto Desk Ford F 150 SSV/PR,
F250-550 (2018+) contour Conso

0.00000 EA

25174808

Jotto Desk Ford F 150 SSV/PR, F250-550 (2018+) contour Conso

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

3 Jotto Desk AR/ZRT Console Equal 0.00000 EA

25174808

Jotto Desk AR/ZRT Console Equal

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

4 Jotto Desk 28" Floor Plate Kit with
Brackets or Equal

0.00000 EA

25174808

Jotto Desk 28" Floor Plate Kit with Brackets or Equal
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 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

5 Console Cup Holder 0.00000 EA

25174808

Console Cup Holder

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

6 Jotto Desk Armrest or Equal 0.00000 EA

25174808

Jotto Desk Armrest or Equal

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

7 Jotto Desk Blank Faceplates 1" up to
4" or Equal

0.00000 EA

25174808

Jotto Desk Blank Faceplates 1" up to 4" or Equal

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

8 Jotto Desk Motorola APX
1500/APX4500/6500 Dash Mount

0.00000 EA

25174808

Jotto Desk Motorola APX 1500/APX4500/6500 Dash Mount Facepla



Page : 4

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

9 Jotto Desk Faceplate Brackets 2" up
to 4" or Equal

0.00000 EA

25174808

Jotto Desk Faceplate Brackets 2" up to 4" or Equal

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

10 Jotto Desk Mic Clip Faceplate Mount
or Equal

0.00000 EA

25174808

Jotto Desk Mic Clip Faceplate Mount or Equal

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

11 Jotto Desk USB X2, 12 V power
Outlets in a 2" Faceplate or E

0.00000 EA

25174808

Jotto Desk USB X2, 12 V power Outlets in a 2" Faceplate or E

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

12 Jotto Desk Storage Box w/adjustable
Armrest & Lock Floor Pla

0.00000 EA

25174808

Jotto Desk Storage Box w/adjustable Armrest & Lock Floor Pla
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 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

13 Jotto Desk Gun Rack, Dual Weapon,
Rear Floor Mounted, Vertic

0.00000 EA $441.480000 $0.00

25174808

Jotto Desk Gun Rack, Dual Weapon, Rear Floor Mounted, Vertic

Comments: Bidding Setina Dual gun lock with free-standing base. Gunlocks are 1 small for shotgun, 1 XL Universal for AR and
Handcuff Keyed override.

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

14 Gun Rack for Police Vehicles by
Setina - SINGLE

0.00000 EA $369.860000 $0.00

25174808

Gun Rack for Police Vehicles by Setina, Free Standing System - SINGLE

Comments: Bidding Setina Single gun lock with free-standing base. Gunlock is 1 XL Universal for AR and Handcuff Keyed override.

 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

15 Gun Rack for Police Vehicles by
Setina - DUAL

0.00000 EA $441.480000 $0.00

25174808

Gun Rack for Police Vehicles by Setina, Free Standing System - DUAL

Comments: Bidding Setina Dual gun lock with free-standing base. Gunlocks are 1 small for shotgun, 1 XL Universal for AR and
Handcuff Keyed override.



Dana Safety Supply, Inc
7337 Lockport Pl
Lorton VA 
703-223-9166

27-1557226 6-July-2020



No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid
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No Bid No Bid
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Dana Safety Supply, Inc

6-July-2020



























Joe Lyons
703-223-9166

N/A
jlyons@danasafetysupply.com































Joe Lyons, Outside Sales Representative

Joe Lyons, Outside Sales Representative

7337 Lockport Pl, Lorton VA 22079

703-223-9166 N/A

jlyons@danasafetysupply.com

Dana Safety Supply, Inc

Jonathan Sizemore, Bids Specialist

6-July-2020

813-348-4866 N/A

Bids Specialist




